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REESE AIRMAN
$5,000 FOR AIR

SAVING MONEY -- A1C Darnel SaulsofReeseAir Force
supportbeacon.During his first weekin theLife SupportUnit, Airman SaulssavedtheAir

Forceover$5,000by repairingseveralcondemnedbeacons.(U. S. Air Forcephotoby Ted
Houghton)
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KLBK SOLD HERE THIS
WEEK TO

W.F. deTournillon,
Executive Vice-Preside-nt

.

and spokesman for
GraysqaJnmrises,
Inc., owner of KLBK Tv
Channel 13, is proud to
announce anagreement
has beenreachedfor the
sale of Cnannel 13 to
Silver Star Communi-
cations. Silver Star
Communications princi-
pals are: John Robert
Lee, Larry Reed, Wayne
Embry, Daniel Neviaser,
and RobertDudley. The
actual application for

SHELIA LINCOLN NAMED
PREXY AT UT AUSTIN

Shelia Lincoln, sopho-
more at theUniversity of
Texas in Austin, was
recently voted vice
president of UT's
Student Chapter of
Amejan Society of
Interior Design (ASID).
Members of the UT
'student chapter chose
'Shelia for their vice
.president.

The UT chapter very
recently hosted the
Regional ASID conferen-
ce on UT campus with
five states participating.

Shelia will beadelegate
"to the National ASID
.conference in Seattle,

ON

Beginning immediate-
ly, all persons taking the
Graduate- Equvalency

examinationare
advised that the five
series tests will be
administeredwithin time
limitations. According to
Dr. Thomas E: Ande-
rson, Jr., Director.
ProfessionalSupportand

I Professional Practices,
Texas Education. Agen

:.cy, the G. E. D.
;testin s irvice has
advisedall statesthat the
time limiations placedon
:ihe G. E. D. examination
must be followcuK--

t The G, F. D. test js
comp-ise-d of five testing
areas: 0) writing sils, 1

hour; (2) social studies,1

12 hours (3) science,1 ,

transferwill be filed within
the nextsixty 'days and
approval of th FCC to
Silver jStar ,

Communica-tionsi-s

expectedsnqnly
thereafter. f'

Absolutely no

in personnelor manage-
ment is plannedby Silver
Star Communications.
Silver Star Communica-
tions feels privileged to

sucha fine facility
as KLBK TV and
especially the many fine

and knowledge--

Washigton in of
this year.

Congratulations to
the daughter of

Mr. and Mrs. Albert
Lincoln, for your
excellencein scholarship
and studentleadershipat
theUniversity 6f Texasat

Texas.
J

12 hours; (4) reading, 1

hour; and (5) mathema-itics-,

1 hour. These are
maximum time limits for
eachte

information
may . be acquired by
contacting the Lubbock
Public
Center,2013 13thStreet,
telephone 765-933- S

SUPPORT

NAACP

"NOW!!

NEW LIMITATIONS
j.n.u. run &A uiJi:iMi&

Diploma

Learning

SAVES
FORCE

Base, Terxas,works ona life

able broadcast em--,
ployees, some:of whom-wr-

with the station
frqmjts, originaLaidatein,..
1952'.

Silver Star Commun-

ications will work
with KLBK and have
plans . to becpm? even
more involved in the

community affairs in
Lubbock and anxiously
look to personal
contact with the
on the South Plains.

APRIL THRU TEXAS

MINORITIES

change

acquire

talented

August

Shelia,

Austin,

Further

Schools

closely

forward
people

' Special Olympics for
retardedchildren up to
agu 22 years will be held
on April 14, at Lubbock
Christian College Field
House. The parade of

will begin the
ceremonies on the
L.C.C. indoor track at
8r30 a.m. Eventsbegin at
9:00 a.m.

Fof.r hundred to five
hundred students repre-
sentingtheentireService
CenterRegion XVII area
are expected to partici-
pate.
leaders are Joe Porres,

From the beginning
camping has played a
major role in Camp F're
activities. As thesummer
months approach,Camp
Fire Council of Lubbock
invites young people

the agesof 6 18
to register for Summer
Day Camp arid Resident
Camp.
Day Camp Dakonya

includes nine wsek-lon- g

sessionsbeginning June
11, Activities , take place
at the Buddy Holiy
Recreation Park in
Lubbock. Eachsessionis
devoted to a particular
activity suchascanoeing,
canyoncamping,artsand
crafts, outdoor living
skjlls cowopyand Indian

end fun and
games.
Camping fee is $12.00

fpr Cam.PFire . meitlrs :

SOMEBODY IN 1979!!" 4.

SHORT PUTS TEETH IN
ANTIDISCRIMINATION
The Senate State

Affairs Committee
Monday
approved a bill by
Lubbock area State
SenatorE.L. Short that;
would allow the State"
Alcoholic Beverage
Commission to take

action
against a nightclub ot

against a nightclub or
tavern operator convict--
sA r( n I

Short told theCommit
tee the bill was prompted
by problems that
cropped up in tubbock
when some nightclub
operatorswere regularly
discriminating against,
minorities, the elderly,
and personnel.

Short stated, "This
anti-discriminati- bill
will put teeth jn the
recentlypassedLubbock
City Ordinancemakingit
unlawful for taverns Or
nightclubs to practice

12 APRIL 18, 1979 LUBBOCK,

.entrants

between

hi?J:ory

military

MONTFORD

SPECIAL OLYMPICS
FOR RETARDED KIDS

Organizational

unanimously

administrative

ABOUT NEW
; Lubbock County '

District Attorney JohnT.
Montford was guest
sneaker for the United

.Political ..Action .Leagyteisi
lumL) la'it Monday
evening, April 9, at the
Green-Fai- r Manor
Community Center.

He spoke about ways
to control crime in
LubbockCounty.Hetold
the grouppresentthaton
may 1 "Operation
Identification" will go into
effect L.id.he needed the
help of concerned
citizens. He stated that

Ballenger School, and
Jim Douglas, Big
Brothers, Big Sisters.

Organizationsinvolved
include Angel Flight,
Junior Chamber of
Commerce,Big Brothers
- Big Sisterr. Mpnterey
High School students,
Lubbock High School
students, TTU Saddle
Tramps,Boy Scouts)and
Girl Scouts.

The Coca-Col- a Com-
pany is providing
advertising and will
donate drinksto parjici:
paling students.

and $15.50 for non-member- s.

A specialday
camp designed for girls
and boys, kindergarten
first grade,is offeredJune
25-2- 9 at Maxie Park.
Registratin fee for this
camp is $10.00.
Resident Camp Mona-kiw- a

offers one-- and two-wee-k

camping sessionsin
the Northern Rockiesof
.New Mexico beginning
June 30 Outdoor
experieucesii i horseback
riding, archery, riflery,
arts and crafts, cook-outs-,

hiking, gymnastics,
games, and oVern'o'U
camping allows young
people to explore
nature, find new friends

, and develop new skills.
Girls whp have com-

pleted the first grade
ihfough the eleventh
grade, and boys who

DAY CAMP OFFERED
HERE. FOR YOUTH

racial discrimination."
Short praisedthe efforts
of the Coalition for Equal
Justicefor its persistance
in urging action by the
City Council. The
Coalition for Equal
Justice is a loosely knit
organization of repre-
sentatives from Lub-
bock's minority organi-
zations and individuals
concerned with respon-
sive governmentalaction
and human rights.

. Short's bill will allow
the Alcoholic Beverage
Commission 01 Admin-
istrator to suspend or
cancela liquor permit for
conviction of a business
related discrimination. '

While prompted by
discriminatory practices
in Luhbock, Short's bill
will have statewide
impact. "Lots of our
minority people arebeing

, discriminated against in
bars throughout the
State. It's not fair andwe
must put a stop to it,"

506 23RD STREET (806) 762-361-2

PROGRAM
"Operation Identifica-
tion" will consist of
!enaravina vour Texas
driver's license .number
9H vciuiapie nemswjua
special marking instru-
ment.

He also told the group
that moreminorities have
servedasjurors sincehis
election.

The meetingwas very
informative, accordingto
Dr. F. L. Lovivigs, UPAL
president.

UPAL will meet every
secondMonday night at 8
p.m. at the center.

have completedthe first
grade through the sixthJ

grade.may attend
Monakiwa
The fee for the one-wee-k

session is $60.00
and thetwo-wee-k session
is $110.00. A non-
refundable deposit of
$10.00 is required at the
time of registration.
Chartered buses are

used for transportation
to and from the Camp,
The busfare for the 570-mil- e

trip from Lubbockto
Monakiwa is $36. A $15
transportationdeposit is
required at the time of
registration.
S &lH Green Stamp,

books worth $2tQ0 and
Gold BondStampbooks
worth $2.50 can be
substitutedfor cash. No
partial books are
accepted.
Registration for Day

Camp and Resident
Camp begins April 2.
Adult volunteers are
neededduring the spring
and summer months.
Recruitment of new
membersand volunteers
will begin April 9. For
more information contact
the LubbockCamp Fire
Council office, 1301 N.
University, 765-639- 4.

Camp Fire is a member
agency of the United
Way;

. ,
.

Nations! NeWrf, , .

New York City, New York
In what many saN as at

least a symbolic gesture, the
rational Council of Churches
withddrew a $40,000balance

..in its checking Accont from
the ' Continental Bank be
causeot th: bank's refusal to
make a clear-c- ut statement
on loans to the apartheid

.. government of SouthAfrjca,

Short said.
Short's measure is

scheduled' f6r a vote
before the full Senate
next Wednesday,where
approval 'is expecfed.

Representative Froy
Salinas,' Lubbock's
Representative from
District 75-B- , is spon-
soring a similar measure
in the House of Repre-
sentatives,

REPUBLICAN

COMMITTEE

MEETS HERE
The East Lubbock

Republican Committee
held it's first open
meeting Saturday, April
7, 1979, at the American
Legion Post 808. The
guest speaker was past
Lubbock Mayor, Dr. Jim
Granberry. Also, among
the guest was Ruth
Schiermeyer, Lubbock
County G.O.P. Chair-
man, and Buzz Robinett.

EAST

Imam Wallace, Deen
Muhammadin his Fourth
Sunday Address, March
25; said part of the civil
righjts strugglewaswaged

3

Red Cross National
. The Lubbock County
Chapter, American Red
Cross, announcedtoday

for the
Texas National Aquatic
School being held on
June 3rd through the
13th. The location of the
schoolwill beat the Lone
Star Camp, just east of
Athens, Terxas,
The minimum age for

enrollment requires that
must be 17

years old pior to the
school starting date.
There will be no

The
enrollment fee of $125.00
covers room and board,
cost of textbooks and
teachingmaterials,useof
the and the
insignia earred. The

fee must
accompany the

forms

SENIOR CITIZENS
BUS DRIVER

Velma

.Senior Citizens at the
M&e Simmons

are proud for the
citizens of Lubbock to
know about one of our
busdrivers whohasdone

A BMI NEWSPAPER

MUHAMMAD TALKS ABOUT

CIVIL. RIGHTS STRUGGLE

RED CROSSANNOUNCES
AQUATIC SCHOOL JUNE

confirmation

applicants

exceptions.

equipment

enrollment
applica-

tion. Registration

Communi-
ty

to correct the thinking of
the African-America- n

people and for cultural
pride.

Maybe ,most of vou
HimiTiiftiH rriin'i' fin! -- f tjftimnitrn

for the school may be
obtained from the
Lubbock County Chap-
ter, 1313 Avenue L,
Lubbock, Texas. Since,,
acceptanceto the school
is By approval only,
applicantsshouldsubmit
their registrationformsas
soon, as possible. If
accepted for attending
the school, applicants
must have a ciirrent
physicalexaminationand
a current immunization
for Tetanus.
The following courses

will be available at the
Aquatic School:

First Aid
1. Basic First Aid --

Instructor; 2 Multimedia
Standard First Aid --

Instructor; ?, Standard
Firs' Aid and Personal
Safety Instructor; 4.

Continue on Page 7

Shipman

a good job. She was aj
driver for five monthsand
has been transferred.

Mrs. Shipmanis a very
lovely person, and is the
mother of four children.

EIGHT PAGES

have forgotten that our
strugglewas for cultural
pride,but, therearestill a
few Christians and
Muslims who still realize
that we haveyet further;
to go on the road to
gaining cultural pride

"TKoi-- a nvo enmo nf lie
. ;tti f ... , .'bin'44tewnowiirnevefrD&5au5Ufc:u

this old vulaar
mindedness and vulgar ,

display of mannerthatwe
. now nave prevailing in

whatyou call the African-America- n

society.I'
"There are some of us

whowon't give," declared
Imam Muhammad,"until
we seeour tongueclean,
mind clean, eyes clean,
body clean-o-ur whole
self cleanedbecauseour
struggle was to please
God and to pleasewhat
we thought was the..;,
conceptof manthatGod'
loves,'

Mujeddid Wallace
Deen Muhammadof the
World Community of
Al'Islam in the West
speaks every fourth
Sunday from Chicago.
Illinois. Hearvia National
Phone Hook-U- p at.
Masjid Muhammad 212V'
Cherry Avenue,
Lubbock, Texas, at 1 ,

p.m. . Visit Masjid,
Muhammad every Sun--'
day at 1 p.m., and
Tuesday at 7 p.m.

PERRY CLARK RAPS WITH
FORMERGOV. CONNALLY

Perry Clark, newly electedexecutivedirectorof theEastLubbdckRepublicanCommittee,
is shown"rappins"withfQrmQr GovernorJoty)Connollyonhis recentvis,it to the"Hub Qity,"

Lookingon is RaymondTapp'tyhoQfftiearptQbepayingcloseattentionto what is going6n.
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MUBY JA

rhis writer would like
to express my sii.cere
appreciationto her lovely
customers of the
"Lubbock Digest". You

7
Caprock Shoppfn.g Onter

Lubtnck, Tcxji

DAVID sbwELL"-Hom-

765 8679
Men's Department

REALTORS ANC', INSURANCE SPECIALISTS . - V Off
A 'W5T :.--, V

hiuo - nnj - une insurance m-- ,f' i'it ("!nmtnrtnhlf HiMispq iri PnrWwav nnri nil of I iihhfirk ..
W ;7jr - " il- -

.

9 $ Discounted Auto Rates for Good Drivers l
K ' Low Rstos tor Problem Drivers

K 24-H- r. Answering Service Call for Appointment

1 '
1002 Quirt Ave. at E. 10th 762-549-0 '

I

I

24 36 48
or 60

.:

aresowonderful. Oneof
the. has paid ud
until beptember, 1979. 1

love a'l of you.
wishing all of

you Happy Oh,
by theway, in

Remember
we set this day aside for
celebration.

Quirt

j

i
i-- r , Hickory Smoked j

I; SPECIAL: Soon!t

1 CHICKEN FRIDAY AliD SATURDAY. $
K CATgfUtffc SERVICE. VI

USGE OKuSMALL GRO'JFS f
I ,

& &4Mfaf STORES, INC.

4th

Batteries
- -

mo.

4. Batteries'

iuto'Electric Service

Generators

Y'S CORNER

WHA rs
'ON'

a ladv.'

Here's
a Easter.

keepChrist
Easter. why

lOEEEOOi

2510

PARKWAY DAn-B-QU- fi

For4EHnner

OSSIE CURRY

ltffQS Pffjkwyprlv,- paeil

FOOD

68feefcue

-- v New & Used

763-965-3 4

Mr. Harrison (Bull)
Davis' cousin passed
away in Slatpn, Texas,
last week. The funeral
Was held Monday, April
9th.
v

: Mrs. Maybelle McKin-rie- y

of California is
visiting hermother,Mrrs.
Mary McKinney, and the
rest of the family here.

Mr. and Mrs. John
Hunter of Odessa,
T.ex'tis, srient the
weekend visiting their
relativesandfriendshere.
As many of vou mav
know, they are. the
owners of Huntejr
Welding Company.Their
advertisement in this
newspaper each week.

Mrs. Dorothy Kinner
attended the Library
Convention in San
Antonio, Texas last
week. She reported a
wonderful and educa-
tional meeting

i

iiUf. William Goldstein
at this report, was
reportedto be quite ill at
rvietnoaist nospuai.

flMr. Clarence Ervin
Mmfered Methodist

Hospital Monday for
surgery sometimes this
week. New HopeBaptist
Churchandothersjoin in
prayer, for him a speedy
recovery.

-If-
-you love spring hats,

then go by the home of
Mrs. G.H.. Davis, 2105

flubboch ;igeet
The Lubbock Digest can
be picked up at the
following merchantsplus
streetsalespeople.

TOWN & COUNTRY
Quirt Ave. & 4th St.

DII1ARDS KWIK STOP
1710 E. 4th St.

SNAPPY SHINESPARLOR'
1110'AvenueJ.

MAIN POSTOFFICE
Avenue C. f

KWIK-- O FOOD MART
1528 E. Brdwy

BROOKS SUPERMARKET
1807 Parkway Drive

PARKWAY BAR-B-QU- E

1D5 Parkway Drive
77? WAV GROCERY

3401 Railroad Avenue
AGELS SOUL FOOD

2518 Parkway Drive
NETTIE LOU'S
BARBER SHOP
508 East23rd St.
SOWELL'S BIG

COUNTRY STORE
405 Idalou Highway

Lubbock International
Airport

Lubbock International
Airport

SPADES LIQUOR STORE
East50th Street

PINKIES LIQUOR STORE
No. 3

Buffalo Lakes Road
PINKIES UQUORSTORE

NO. I
Old Canyon Road

Foi information call 762-361-

or1 come by 506 East 23rd

H Street.

- Rebuilt

InterstateBatteries

Regulators

STARTERS GENERATORS

ALTFRNATORS
1 WKOm

LUBBOCK
Ash Avenue. The theme
this ta&t ; "Spring HAt
Ate Oh fieView.'1 the
public isitlvitadtostopby
ana make a purchase.
Ladies, you will be glad
you did. Just in time for
Easter.

This writer would like
to take this time and
space and salute ail the
young Black fellows who
are vying for "Mr.
Esquire." All of youcan't
win the title of same,bur,
all of you are winners.
Also along thoselines, let
us congratulatethe local
Delta Sigma Theta
Sorority, Inc. for
presenting a positive
meansof displayingBlack
manhood in our city.
Theseare young fellows,
and because of what
you've done, there no
telling how far these
young fellows may go.

Congratulations!!!
Congratulations!!!

Mrs. Mae D. Simmfcns.
formerly of Lubbock and
now a resident of Las
Vegas, Nevada, is here
visiting friends here.She
admits' hat she misses
hergoodold friends here.
She iSj however,able to
keep up with what is
happening each week
through the "LuBbock
Digest."

SUPPORT

THE

BUSINESSES

IN YOUR

COMMUNITY!!!

JamesMcDade 741-

BILL RAVEN
747-321- 1

if
INDIAN SWAMl

Thursday evening, April

Kt
(o--.t diu'mitv

that

DIGEST

OUTREA CM
BREAKFAST
CLUB NEWS:
Members of the

OutreachBreakfastClub
met at New
Baptist Ghurch last
Saturday morning at 9
a.m.

Scripture was taken
from Galaiians 6:7-8-;

10:12-13- ; Reveia-tio- n

22:1?, the
Living Bible).

be misled;
remember that you
can't ignore God and
getawaywith it; man
will always reap just
the kind of crop he

he sows to
pleae own,
please own wrong
desires, he will be
planting seeds
Spiritual decay ana
death.

Thought of the
Morning: , "Planting
time: What kind of
seedsare yo sowing.
Be careful you and
only you will have to
reap the harvest."

Attendance was very
good on last Saturday
morning. Breakfast was

with all things
and hot.

Thanks to our special
host,Mra. ourvery
own, for job well done.

Are you gettinghungry
physically or spiritually? If
so, comeby andeatwith
warm hearted friends.

Our guest last week
included Sister Savage,
Sister G. H. Davis, Rev.
A. L. Dunn. Come again
and be with us, because
we love people.

Our sick Jist
Mr. ShepharaRobinson,
Mrs. Pollie Smith, Mrs.
Dorothy Owens, and
Mrs. Savanah Goody.

Our heartsgo out to

0247

s C. R. ANTHONY'S
FamilyParkShoppingCenter

Men's& Boy's Apparel
We'veGot Style $ Prices$

Will Treat You Nice!
yusmanmnnaaaBnu n u imannnrnnini iiuijo imrymwuriBHrirM

mmm

If itfs Borcieii,
it's gQttobegood

Modern Is to have BILL

RAVEN join our winning sales team. Bill ha
twelve-year- s

of1 experiencein Chevrolet sales

andtwlll be glad to help.you make a now

purchaseor to help you in trading cars. Visit

with Bill at 41st Q or call 747-321-1 tor

anypf your transportcton buying needs.

MODERN CHEVROLET

a Prabudhananda,Swami-i-n Charge at
S the VedantaSocietyof Northern California, will be
3 in TubbocK for three davs. April 24-2- 7. On

! S

If

m uniianan-univtirtiui- w wiuiuiwwh'"11!"""'
mat 7:30 p.m., 210? Street.
3 "Vedanta teaches thatthe real ofhuman
u : .. n( Ut tmrtn Ufa ic in

li personalo UiUlilts UflU if iu
I a? mi in thnt

evening.

Hope

Hosea
(From

Don't

a

sows!
his wrong
his

of

served
ready piping

Dyer,
a

include

Chevrolet pleased

&

Swami

36th
nature

TO VISIT LUBBOCK

26, he will lecture at ihe

iiMiftwi.tyw w

throuah selfless work,

admissionc'lll be required.

E unflinching devotion to God, control of the Inner
S forces,anddiscriminationbetweentherealandthe

unreal. Vedanta recognizesthat truth is cne, ar.d

2 therefore, it ocCepts all religions, properly
9 understood as vaHd meansof realizing fre truth."
2 Swami Prabudhancndad topic will be
M "Freedom:Secularand Spiritual'' Contributions

the Swami here,

u ill be 'I'-cepfe-d andappreciatedid anappropriate'
time No

the

i-
, f ,' - - 'i, y wimmSuSiyM f Mir

the families bf Mrs. Edna
Watson ana Mrs Julia
Jacksonand otherswho
havelost loved one's.Just
member GUd is always
.standingby '

On Saturdaymorning.
April 14, at 3 a.m.,we will
be a special Easter
breakfast at Lybns
ChapelBaptistChurch in
the Rev. O. D. Hollins
Fellowship Hall, 1704
East24th Street.Hostwill
be Rev. and Mra. Floyd
Perry, Jr. Everyone is
welcome.

For more information,
call 763-296- 6.

Mrs. Corinc Fair
presiding vice president;
Mrs. Mary Ward is pre-
sident:andMrs. Dorothy
Hood is reporter.

lii nwf

CLARK
NAMED
Perry Clark was

named as executive
director of the East
Lubbock Republican
Committeelastweek. He
saysthat hehasnot been
a Republicanvery long,
aboutsix months. "I plan
to help suppc . Rev. M.
G. Shepharain his bid for
State Representative75-B- ,"

he said.
After a short meeting

here last week, the East
Lubbock Republican
Committee was formed.
Perry has some deep
feelings about inefficient
government spending
and inflation, and taxes.

ii

S

J
S
s
fi
m-

S 5 09

e is concernedabout
thfuto of the Black
mahinAnleriea."I feel as
though the Democrats
as a whole and nation
wide are moving in the
ifeection to desert the
Black, and this can even
be seen in the acts of
President Carter," he
says.

He feels that although
the Republicanshavenot
in the pas been very
receptive to Black, the
mood of the Republican
Party towards Blacks is
changing, and they are
trying to reach the Black
minority.

Clark says: "I feel that
"the Democrates, will
discard the Blacks and
that we need to align
ourselves with the.
RepublicanParty. I'm not
laying that all Blacks
should become Republi-
cans, becausethis is just
asineffective ashaving all
Blacks as Democrates. I

still believe in the two
party system.This is the
best way."

Mr. Clark has talked
with former governor
John Connally who is
vying for the presidential
nomination.Clark admits
he. has not committed
himself to any presiden-
tial nominee, he admits
that he wants thechance
to talk to all of them if

IN

nextto the

April 12, 1979

possiblfe. He Says he
would like to attend the
Republican National
Convention.

Clark plans to work
very closely With the
county and state
Republicans.

He was recently
electedto the CommUni
ty Service

FOR OF
SISKATIE

Memberof Mt. Calvary
Missionary Baptist
Church Service held at
St. John Regular Baptist
Association Tabernacle,
Austin, Texas, Rev. S.L
Davis, Pastor.

Her demise occurred
Sunday, April 1, at St.
David's.Hospital.

Service was helded
April 5, 1979.

A devoted Christian
shegave thirty-nin- e years
of her service as-preside-

of the usher1
board. Ms. Allen also
servedaspresidentof St.
John's Regular Baptist
Usher's Convention,
president of State
Congress,and president
of Ushers National
Baptist Convention.

Her school life:
Elementary - York

on Page8

LUBBOCK
BROADWAY
newunitedsuplrmarhet

irTheNewlywed!

weeknightsat 10:30pm j

1 JSSSSSSSSbSSSSSShbISA

YOUR FAMILY FASHION DEPARTMENT
STORE LOW BUDGET PRICESEVERY DAY

LAYAWAY NOW FOR SPRING
'NEW FASHIONS ARRIVING NOW FOREASTER

ALL THESE DEPARTMENTS FOR YOU
LADIES REJlDYTO-WEA- R SPORTSWEAR

JUNIOR FASHIONS "LINGERIE
SHOESFOR ALL THE FAMILY WATCHES

JEWELRY HANDBAGS UNIFORMS
COMPI ETE INFANTS DEPT. GIFTS

GIRlS 3-6-X AND 7--14 BOYS
MILLINERY MENS WORK CLOTHES
LEVI JEANS LUGGAGE TODDLERS

COMPLETEHOME FURNISHINGSAND LINENS

WECARRY EXTRA-LAR- GE AND tiARD TOFIND
SIZESFORMEN AND LADIES

MA THRN1TYWEAR WORK BOOTS AND SHOES

TWO LOCA TIONS
DOWNTOWN 1015

EASTFOURTH

Board.

MEMORIAN
ALLEN

Continued
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POLICE
HAPPENINGS

AROUND
LUBBOCK

CRIMINAL MISCHIEF

JOHN AGIN MU'-MI- N,

1723 East 2nd
Street, reported to
Lubbock police that

ersons unknown had
Ev

fnocked down the back
fWard gateon the fenceof
rus residences.

,It will cost approxima-
tely $60 to replace.The
gate, according to the
.'police report, was

knocked loose on the
linge side. The latchside
waschainedwith a heavy
chain.

Mu'Min has an idea
that the damage was
probablydoneby someof
the neighborhood kids.

CRIMINAL MISCHIEF

OTIS RAY HOL-
MAN, 3404 East 16th
Street, reported to
Lubbock police that he
parked his car on the
parking lot of the gym at

Dunbar l4igh School
Tuesday afernoon,
waiting for his wife.

He told police that a
young fellow pulled up
and Blocked him in the
parking lot. He said he
tried to get ourthe lot and
the young fellow got out
of his car andcameupto
Holman and tried to get
him out of the car.
Holmahagreednot to do
so.

After finding a way to
his car out of the

lockedarea,the 18year
old Holmandroveoff and
parked on the street by
the tenniscourts. This is
when this young and
fellow and another one
began to throw rocks at
Holman'scar. A brick hit
the front windshield,
cracking it.

Holman left the area
and went home. He told
police that he dosen't
want to file any chargesif
there is no more trouble

1 .PrescriptionService ijsfijRI 1 I

pE HAVE THE LATEST TAPES & RECORDSHAJ

I Children'sPermanent WJu 1

I Electric StraightenComb
KBm I I

1 r.HARI c PLANKS I 1
744 Z7I1 806 744 S032 9 S

bOti
' Repair Specializing in

M Kitchen & Hathrftom faucets Dryer Repair t
H Ho: Water Heaters $

IVORY ij
i AIR CONDITIONING & HEATIN3 SERVICE E.

I STUBB'SJSAR-B--Q I f

I Down Hom6PQ catering j

cr Pactlirtiil OrdersIn IIixxvrm i n

from theseyoung fellows.
Damageto the carwas

.belived to be $150.
j

BURGLARY OF
VEHICLE

ODESSAH. LONG,
owner and operator of
the Pleasure Music
Company of 2411 Ash
Avenue, reported to
Lubbock police that her
partner had delivered a

11 PggSi

Old FashipnefeWlPotato 1 "
I CbldsfBerm Town 8 1

you Bar-fe-d wtyjft I

I PASSPORT ID PLACEMENT 1
FAST SERVICE I

I WALLET PHOTOS I
I 2" x 3" I
I 8 $1.00 II'

PHOTCCRAFT STUDIO 1 I

H UraTAIHS L'JDDOCK. TEJtAS 704CI H i

9 SOU i
I BONEY TJRk SERVICE i
I Speclaiii ing irt Heavy EquHycnt sndTrucks i

1 Call j WIMDV
1 763--1 37 I
I Two Radio Dispatch 1 1

)in machine to a 200

I Salad

like Stubb's

fur

1

Joe
746-53- 58

Way

ball

location did have

LUBBOCK DIGEST

problem one day this
week.

She told police that he
left the van unlocked and
went inside to repair trie
pin ball machine for
operation.
, When he returned to
the van, he discovered
that his .22 caliber pistol
which" was in thebox with
the keys was missing,

This pistol was valued
at $62.

CRIMINAL MISCHIEF
JACQUELINEBRO-

OKS, 501 AvenueS No.'
D, reported to Lubbock
police that persons
unknown did scratch an
"X" shapedmark on her
vehicle.

It appeared to have
been done by a sharp
instrument.

The Black sister
believes it was done by
some kids on their way
home from school.

Therewasno estimate
as to how much damage
was done to the vehicle.

THE TOTAL FOI

ATTEMPTED
AGGRAVATED

RAPE

andbuysome food for
the other. agreeing
to go andget some
the told the

A young high school lady she would have to
student here reported play pay back since he
to Lubbock that had bought the food.
sheandanothergirlfriend He told the
were at a local disco seventeenyear girl that

!- -Li aU- I- L I i 1navmg iun one 1113111 mis ne wouia iane ner 10 nis
week. Theyneededaway to eatthe food and

andayoung fellow she couldpay him then,
agreed to carry them Although the young
home.

Both young

After
food,

fellow young

police
young

house

fellow was marked, he
ladies told the vouna Iadv his

agreedto ride with him. wife was not at home.
He took one of the girls When they got inside,
home,andofferedto stop he began to take

ANGEL'S SOUL FOOD
4

--QUE

Melvin Wiley

Parkway

H.. . . .1 . .
11 m n- - u w

university nvenue

of her by
to kiss her

to
off, but she

him
to the

the
ady out him and
ie got
and her to her

to
her to the

he her up.
She told him that the

was and he
to her off in
of her

her off,
the man left in

Shetold that she
the man

file sinceshehad
gone to with

.t ft... A iciTr-in- 1

i .

I ;1 I Good
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GLADIOLA
WHITE SWANSHORTENING .............42Oz

(IT'S

home,

counts

2518

.- .-

Y

20

advantage
trying several

tried take

fought back with
vigor.
police reportj young

fought
apparently tired
took back

residenceafteroffering
take back disco
where picked

.

disco closed,
agreed drop
front house.

After dropping
young a

hurry.
police

knew and"would
charges,

school him.
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In the nil lllustulions
Of display
Pifv iMiullkeJlww
With nmnstefHkemvs,
Pltv their urossereWons
Of pop-belli- and anti-lif- e;

Tearful liny humans
tialinft still-bor- n strife.

JameyD.Stephens

i :l
(When mankind resorts lo

abortion, really aborts

itself So. this black, pdet
believes.)

(Btaek poets, with W
wish exposure out' reading

public, may send copies of
their poetry for editing aifd,
with permission to. usefri
groupi of H poems mere,

C. May Associates, Boxx
157, Selkirk, AW 12158,

Poetryselectedshouldnoh
mall, appearwithir )2 20
weeks, liecause of stuff linfh
tations, no copies are

1 rzrinj jgpp-- jP0lR jjffi
mijljjjoijdijjjuuuiw.norm

April 10 to April 16,

rive
OPEN 8 A.M. TO 9 P.M. OPEN 7 DAYS A WEEK

PHONE 7624636
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wHrr&simNsuGmI&M. 5 :ZfSM: . .1iilS'Mffe.feWa9
WHITE SWANBISCUITS .......v... 8 Oz ...........r. ..... 8
WHITE SWAN BLEACH 12Gal
WHITE SWAN GOLDEN CORN ...... 303..:, ...lZ 7ir
WHITE SWAN 4 Oz .'.

WHITE SWAN SALT .... ..,... ..jzdll''r
WHITE SWAN MUSTARD :l.,160z. mmi4M

WHITE SWAN MARGARINE ILh. Tub... 59P
USKYDOG FOOD ,. 15 Oz. ........,,....t.v.r;A.v.V..,2iriw;.- - 6 for

aftmAT MEATS
1

WILSON'S SMOKED PICNICS
COUNTRY PRIDE FRYERS

Page

3.99
1.19

59 lb.

TYSON'S 69$Pkg

TYSON'S CHICKEN FRANKS ..." v........69Pfes.
LEAN BONELESSHAMS .... Reg-- $2.98Lb. Only .....,J.Z....$-1.98 lb.

DECKER BACON,......:,.... 12Oz 1.49

RUSSETPOTATOES

PROD
9

Lb..Bag

tim&He
herclothes

According

trlnixon'cryiiiH

'

it

to

or
to

.
to

blhcii

1979.

We
Food

FLOUR

3.69
ik tZ

for

No.
PEPPER

, for

WHOLE
CHICKEN BOLOGNA

QUALITY kg.

I i

AVOCADOES z: ....::................ ZZ.J...i,..,.,.... 2 for 39
iAUtUKNUA ORANGES .:. :...:..;:, , 3 Lbs. for $ 1.
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WHY NOT??
TiMc P, Richardson

.

J

According to syndicated radio and newspaper
columnist Carl T. Rowan,tnore Black people
phonedthe White Houseto protestthe absenceof
Black faces at the State dinner held for the
ChinescsVice-Prem-br than called to protestthe
Presidants'1980 budgetcuts.

1 Assume our Black leaders are still more
interested in setting next to white folks at the
dmn&r tableand in theclassroomthantheyare
about, developing new ideas,new strategiesand-ne-

tactics for Black Americans.
Thebudgetfor 1980 is not asfar off asit suunds. It

will take effect October 1, 1979, and will hit Black ;
folks jn the cities pretty hard. Thechilling effectwill
hit arctindthe summer,of 1980 - jusf In time tc give
all youBlack Democratstheopportunityto come
out and again vote in anotherDemocratPresident
who will then againput you on the bottom of his
agenda.Makesme kind of glad I changedmy party
.affilation in 1975.

But, the killing thingaboutthewhole sordiddinner
.affair is the fact JhatlouisMarlini, the Presidents'-.Specia-l

Assistantfor minorities submitteda list of
yblack folks who should be in attendance. Guess
?what happened? , .

Answer: The Presidents'Special AssistantJor
"

.Women, Ann Wexler, axed them out How.is.it
that for Minority' solidarity. And anyway, 'how'
:comea specialassistantfor womenis higherthena
specialassistantfor 'Minorities'. .

Let's Look BeyondThe Systems
lo the Causes!!!

S Minorities shouldstudy the'issuesbeforeforming
. .anopinion. Most legislations passedin oneway6r
another,Omits or putminoritiesat a disadvantage.
'Black people study the candidates,issues,pros,
find cons of eveiything and makesounddecisions.
:iasedon logic and not efnetions or who or what, -

,

,or what we, like" dr jdo not likee?
X: Black peoplemust beebmea iwo party peopleto "

:

hold the balance in American Life. We are the
difference or the balance for keeping both sides
responsiveto us.
J A politician is apolitician, nomatterwhattheparty
is. I heara lot of Blackssay"I havebeenademocrat
all of my life. My grandfatherwas a democrat,"
;nd thatpersonover 60 or 65, noway Blackswere '

Democrats. Electedofficials in the 1800'sandearly
i?foQ'swereRepublicans. Blacks turnedDemocrat
m ,the 30's when Franklin D. Rooseveltdefeated
JpferbertClark Hooverafter the greatdepression.
From that time on, Republicans ignored or
overlooked Blacks and at the same time, that is
whenDemocratsstartedtakingBlacksfor granted

.and ai,summing they had Blacks in their hip
pockets. -

: Now is the time for us to hold both partiesfeetto
- the fire andthink for ourselves,andmakeall parties
responsive to our needs. Why Not?!!!

DID YOU KNOW THAT
VIOLENCE SURFACES
'm KLAN ACTIVITIES

' As Black people,we had betterbe aware that
violence has been pronouncedby one major Ku
Klux Klan group, accordingto recentcopyrighted
articledappearingin theN.Y. TimesNewsService.

"This article referred that this group has "turned
.toward armed defiance, publicly, brandishing.
!sawed-of- f shotguns and submachine guns
harassing and beating activist blacks and

: intimidating public officials."
. This ib why Black people in Lubbock and the
. South Plains of Texas, as well as America, had
betterstartgetting their thing together, All of this
above mentioned information is apparently

; happeningin Mississippi andAlabama;andappears
to be generatingsignificant membershipincreases,
particularly in.northern Alabama.

Cubxjork Widest
"Dedicated to Freeman,Justice

?"
' , and Equality"
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"A opr,lyeeffort tc ijtcwaoe tnenctes !,

', ahd reduceurbanrtaata."

1
a

ILUBB&OK

ThJpersGrtblhtritlthis e'ff6f t is feijl WUHrUi. ft;of Denham Springs, La., imperial wizard ot an
- Invisib!e Empire'Knl3hts

Accordingto a federal official in Birmingham, thegroup has suchweaponsassubmachinegunsand
sawed-of-f shotguns and riot guns'They'rc
(weapons)not for rabbit hunting; theyareto waste
Pfope. And that's exactly what we'll do if We're
attacked. Our people know how to use theseweapons. We train themand someare veterans,
bo they re not going to cut loose into ascrowd ofpeople. Eut, if you attack us, that's right, you're
wasted,"" saysWilkinson.

Anyway, as Black people, we'd had betterpay
attention to what thesehind .of loons aresaying in
theprint. At thesametime, althoughAlabamaand
.Mississippijnaybeseveralstatesto (lie southeastofus,this kind of anactivity couldspreadin this partofthecountry.That'o why it's soimportantthatWeget
our act together.This is why we haveno time to
continueto play games.Thingsarehappeningandwe must be aware on what is going on

1 LEGISLATIVEaALERT
tpSJfpJjffOCUSON WHITE HOUSE ACTION

fim&- - rUK

The Congressional Black
Caucus continues to urge a
Martin Luther King, Jr.
national holiday (January
15th)anda Presidentialcom-

mitment to black and inner-cit-y

needs. The Caucusposi--'
lion follows below: ' '

Members of the Congres-
sional Black Caucus believe
that the President should set
forth a comprehensive'

eco-

nomic policy linkiilg full
.employment, urban revitaii-zatio- n

and equal opportunity
through affirmative action.
He must:

Establish clear policies
for achieving full employ-
ment;

State a commitment to
vigorous and. effective en-

forcement of the civil rights'
laws through affirmative action

and support-of-th- set-asi-de

concept;
Give greater support to

minority business develop-
ment including the com-
munications industries;

Outline additional U.S.
economic and diplomatic

,steps to move toward major-
ity rule in southern Africa;

Set forth a program to
revitalize our cities and rural
areaswith adeauate fundsto
achieve that goal; and.'x

Set forth specific policies
for advancesin such areasas
education, health, housing,
welfare reform and political
participationby minorities.

In addition, the President
should endorse the bill to
make the birthday of the late
Dr. Martin Luther King, Jr.

wm&g $ aim
Pibltcal Inspirationfat Wyt fflttb

"You will he a blessing" Genesis 12:2

t ,t i. v - tvjir ,

. What we do shapesthe
world. We are extenders,or
extensions, of God's life.
God does His work through

- us. Is your work worthy of-th-

craftsmanship of GodZ..
"That is what the Creator of

Life expects it to be. Our
work must be no lest,

2. Otlmft iire 'depending
upon ifs. If we lei our "littK-lights- '

go out, someonemay
be lost. If our "feeble ef-

forts" are ..Ot brought to
bear, the noble cause may
not be won. If our helping

"Dedicated to

This
a

J. Patterson

MINORITIES

(January 5th) a national
holiday, as requested by let-

ter from the Caucus.

You may write to your
Congressman and Senators
at: Congressional Office
Building, Washington, D.C
205IS or Office Build-
ing, Washington, D.C.
20510. cohgratulate
them for their important
work, aftd. let know
where Black America stands
on critical issues.

; TO: CONGRESSIONAL
! BLACK CAUCUS :
! 306 HouseAnnex I
! Washington,D. C. 20515

I would like to help, I

! ' Organize a "Regional
j Friendsof theCaucus" j
! group I

By enclosing a checkfor

By working with my lo- - ;
cal or nearestblack con--1

gressional S

in any way that is needed

Wgasesenaimetttera-lur-e

on tfuTdaucus)

Name.
'vi.

Address.

Tel. No..

. .

hand arid out encouraging
words are'n'ot given, then
lives may .suffer, needlessly,
Vou wMjr&bec'ome a blessing,

' '; ,i . " ' '

"'".;r., .

'
: '

3. . With Cgd's will (or
"good will") in your heart,
you will always be blessing
others. The world needs
every smile it can get, every
loving heart ll can muster,
every kindly wou, thought
and deed. As we add ours to
the world's store of good
things, itAvill be said,of us:
"You will la a blessing."

'

Freemen.Justice .

sheet made to chastiseor
madel ,eiMcatejind not

Eddie P.

and quality", '

As PUBLISHERSof this weekly newspaper,we owe. to
YOU, the reading public, to be faetual and fair. You
may be critical ot somethings'that arewritten, but at
leastyou will have thesatisfactionof khowlrig theyare
truthful and to the point.

Peoplewill reactto that which Is precise, we wl!
publish thesearticles asprecisely and factually as Is
humanly possible; and We will al&o give credit and
respect to those who are doing good things fc 7 thfe
Lubhock Area and the people We will be critical of
thosewho are not doing 3 theyhavedaid they would
do. And th:a we think is fair.

Sothis is our rescJutiin to yu: Feeff reeatany time to
call this office for information concerning this
nwspapror any other matter that Is of concern to
you.

isn't, a propaganda
yai.dlfy. This is ntwpapcr
to agibte,

T.

Senate

'Please

(Item

representative

rtlchardson
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"THE AVEBER

We jxil rememberthe his-

toric Bakke Case regarding
affirmative action. Well,
now there js a similar case
before the U.S. Supreme
Court which may be eyn
more historic and

in its implications. It is
known as the Weber Case.
Technically it is the Weber
vs. Steelworkers caseinvolv-
ing a complaint of one Bridn
F. Weber of Gramercy, .

Louisiana against,the United
Sieclworkers' union in the
local plant of the Kaissr,
Aluminum Company.

Brian Weberanda number
of, his white esociates are
contending that a training,
program, designed to up-
grade hitherto excluded
blacks, discriminates unfairly
against them and other
whites in thdr efforts and
aspirations at the Kaiser
plant.

What the Weber Case is
doing Is pu.tingto thefelt the
legality of all of the training
programs designed to help,
blacks get around the oily
slick union rules which have
kept blacks unfairly out of
many fireas of blu; collar
employment for decader.

The importance of the ;ase
rests in the fact :hat if the
affirmative action training
fograms arc srn to be

the heart of
affirmative action would bp
destroyed.The validity pf the
affirmative action effor
should be seenas evident on
the surface. When vhitc
Americans claim tt they

rC.

jr

CASE" ON

"have not maintained an ac-

tively edge"
againstblack peoplethrough- -

out ail of our nation's life,
they grossly deceive them-
selves. That is the central
point.

On the day that the U.S.
Supreme Court annQiinced
that it would hear the Weber

t
Case this spring, a white '

veteran social worker who
had been working in and
abound Harlem since the
Great Depression had this
deeply, revealing testomony
to offer. ' '

He bigan: "I cannot un- - '.'

derstand for the life'6i me
any'wHtc persons Who say
that they have not been ad-

vantaged
in either someor many way
at the expense of black
people.

"When I did social work In,

Harlem during the Great
Degression, blacks were riot

; evei) allowed to serve the
mJds of their fellow b'lac'ks
except at the lower rungs of
the social "vork scale. I went
to wor' as the supervisorof
b)scks who ought me what
to do."

His storycontinued. "HVen
before 1 began doing social

ork, I gv a job at Brooks
Brothers exhibiting clothes.-Tw-

black fellows whe
worked in the stock mm
(bid me about .he Job ard
tolr me how present'',
myself andwhe. to do on the
job. ' landed that job, lhanVs
(6 my black buddies who
JoyoutJy helpedme get a job

FACTSARE HERE!

V.VtVV'.V.V.'.VVV,

BB 'mmmrnmrnmrnmrn

.V.v.v.:.y.:v. V.'.v.v.v.v....

v.v.v..x!v.v.v.v;v.v,

0UACK.

Hpmssn

unconstitutional,

RESOURCES

HARD HEARTED HANNAH

Nathaniel Weight,
RightsActivist

AFFIRMATIVE

discriminatory

disproportionately

ACTION

for which tliey could not even
apply. ; . . h 4 .u

"That story, djrectly and
indirectly, could be njuiii-plie- d

many times in my own
experience. In symbolic and
in overt or more tangible
ways, this same general pic-ui- re

:oud be painted for
white Americans as a whole.
The plain, elementary fact
was and still isthat we
white folks get opportunities
to the extent that we do fti
some part because black
folks ha.ue been denied ilieir
just opportunities.

"I cringe inside whenever I

hear a blindly :eif-scrving

vhitc person talk about
blacks 'getting the breaks': It
is only peanutsin terms of
the oppti.lunities that prac-
tically all of us who arewhite
blithely assumeand w.ich, in
actuality, represent robbery
of opportunity from blacks,
both past and pfesent."

The Weber Case presents
the U.S. SupremeCourtwith
the best opportunity,yet to
speak to this Kind of dis
crimination against rblack
Americans which Kas been
built into the very fabric cf
our nation's life. ar-- -

Black Americans should
musterevery resourceat their
disposal to get testimony

'

before, the Iiighest court
which ' will - encourage the
noun, at long last, to affirm
hsu resolution or daSt

wrongs is called for by meltns
of aggressivecourt-support- ed

affirmative, action in'all area!
of our nation's life.

April 12 1979
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Media
Reviews:

(Foryoungpeople)

ADDITION TO HISTORY

, A review of True Black
man's History, by Douglas

." Taylor and. R.P. Powell,-- .

.Philosophical.Libiary, New"
York, r?.Y., 83 pages,Hard- -

cover, $6.00.

The Philosophical Library,
is jo becommendedby black,
readersand writers as a will-
ing and open resourcefor the?
publication of often difficult-to-publi- sh

but still highly
important writings by or
concerning black Americans.

This publishing house,
located at 11 East 40th St.,1
New York, N.Y 10016, haj
given many younger bla7k
wi:ers a start and has aiso
provided a long-awaite- d rec-
ognition for older writers
who may otherwise have
nevwr found an outlet jbr
thejr creative work.

nio this latter category,
generally, True Black Man's
History nay be seen to fit.
Douglas' Taylor is a black.'
Pullman porterwith 33 years
of serviceand is still "work- -'
ing on the road." RVP. Pow--

ell,, e contemporary, is a,,
graduateof Columbia Unir
versity and js also author &i
Tm Human Sidf.ofaPeople.

The presentbook ntay per-
haps best be described as a
brief historical dictionary of
blatjk Americans whom the
authciseeashaying inspired
themselves and counties,
others.It is cltArly a lubor or
love andshouldbe of interest
to niany, espelally to YoUtSk
er peoplewho needto review?
the es and names of ,oin
heroes who are not often
recoided ejsewhere.

Cnfer,atUltionls oncemore
to the Philosophical Library
for giving still more black'
writers a place in the worlrtbf
literature.



HALL - PORTER EXCHANGE
VOWS HERE SATURDAY

the Houston School

Miss DaphneGail Halt

Miss DaphneGail Hall
and Mr. Preston Taylor
Porter, III, will be united
in marriageon Saturday,
April 14, 1979, at 7:00
3.m. at the New Hope
3a.ptist Church in
--ubbock. The Rev. A.L.
Dunn and Rev. Charles
Tanner officiated the
double ring ceremony.

We regretof the death
of Mrs. Mary Sterling and
Mrs, Vina Williams. We
extendour sympathyto
the family. They will both
be missed. Both were
with us every day.

We were glad to have
(

Mr. Ollie Johnson's
sister with us from San

2

The bride is the
daughter of Ms. Luella
Snell Hall and Mr. Leon
Hall of Lubbpck. The
groom is the Son!of the
late Mr. Preston..Taylor

Portor of Denver
Colorado and Nashville,
Term., andMs. Eleanor
RaglandandInstructor of

MAE SIMMONS NEWS

you

Francisco, California.
She wDl be with us for
three weeks. We will
surely miss hercompany
when she leaves.

Mae Simmons Seniors
are looking forward to
having a big Senior
01ympics'althelEajrPark

'Coliseum. We"1 are

0P
4

Now, morethanever, it paystc recycle:
- Cleaner

'. . Energyand
- Cash for

j

CQORS FOR

District, Houston,Texas.
She will be given in

marriageby her father,
The bride chose Cheryl
Givens as the maid of
honor and the groom
chosehis uncle,
Nathaniel Kendricks to
serve best man.

The lovely gown of the
bride is white
with an inset of French
lace designat the sleeve
and decorative inset of
lace below the neckline
and a shoulder length
veil. Her attendantswill
wear floor length soft

dresses withCink lace front trim.
The tiny girl,

Shala Nicholc Ervin, the
daughterof Mr. andMrs.
Clarence Ervin, Jr., will
wear a long white lace
dresswith a high empire
waistmatchingthebrides
gown.

The bride is a 1975
raduateof Dunbar High

and a
December candidatefor

from
View A. & M. Uni ersity,
where she is an honor
student and has main-
tained her name on the
Presidents' Roll during
her entire fouryeajsas a
studentat View.
The groom is a graduate
of BeecherHigh School.
Flint ana
attended Prairie View
A.&M.

Mi. andMs. Porterwill
live in Houston, Texas.

deciding on one of our
seniors. We

have so many, it's
hard to decide the
Olympicchampionatour
center.The Olympicswill
be held May 15 - 16.
We're hoping we can
haVe some viewers.

The Seniors are
planning a Box Supper.
i ne puouc is mviiea iu
attend. We, need your

pport. We, areplanning
afriri in June v f

ivinoyou
apayrpise

Those aluminum beveragecans stashed in your garane,
basementand backyardshedare now worth

per
environmerit )

resourceconservation

as

peaudo-su-a

chool-Lubboc- k,

graduation

Michigan

outstanding

Put a little-extr- money in your pocket. Recycleyour cans
and takecdvahtayeof your" pay raise.

CASH CANJ

flower

Prairie

Prairie

really
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MOUNT VERNON
. UNITED
METHODIST

i CHURCH

WE had a great time
last Sunday morning as
we heldYouth Sunday. It
was also Palm Sunday.
Our guestspeakerof the
hour was Mrs. A.W.
Wilson, a member of
BethelAfrican Methodist
EpiscopalChurch. She
delivered a wonderful
message. She was
introducedby Ms. Angels
Anderson.

A duetwassungby the
Pattersonsisters,Avis
Elise and Shelia Renee,
also membersof Bethel.

Let uscontinueto pray
for and visit our sick and
shut in membersof the
church and community.

NEW HOPE BAPTIST
CHURCH

Easter Sunrise Ser-
vices will beheld Sunday
morning, April 15, at 6
a.m. Let us make this a
full service with all
choirmembers and
ushers on duty and all
membersin theaudience.

Our Church Anniver-
sary will be held April 18
through 22. This will-mar-

the 52nd yearthat
New Hope has been in
the community. Each
member is asked to
participate in this effort.

The fifth Sunday,April
29th, will be under the
directions of the women
of the church. President
Ruby Jay is asking each
member to cooperate.

The L.K. Williams
Institute will be held on
the, campus of Bishop
College at Dallas, Texas
ipril 23 through .27. Let
us attend.

, 1 1 We areto serve
4

in
ttthe

Church Anniversary of
the Greater Saint Luke
Baptist Church on
Tuesday evening, April
24, at 7:30 p.m. Pastor
Dunn is askingall choirs,
ushers, and membersto
goi

The B.M.&E. State
Board is being held April
11 and 12 with the Solid
Rock Baptist Church of
Paris,Texas.

Let us not forget that
the Penticostal Holiness
Church will use our
facilities to host their
State Young People
Convention, April 26
through 28. Let us be
gracious host to the
guest.

We are to serve in the
anniversaryof Rev. and
Mrs. C.C. Peoples,
pastor and wife of the
Mount Olive Baptist
Church in Slaton,Texas,
on Friday night, April 13,
at 7:30 p.m. Choirs,
ushers,and membersare
askedto go.

The Crusade for
Christ, which is sponsor-
ed by the Baptist
Ministers Union, will be
held July 9 through 13.
The Rev.C.B.T. Smith of

ijurfi

Pastor
Roy. M. Q, Shepherd

Phone763-B6-

The Pastor I always
available for Prayer

a; o Virtual Counseling

UlllMlr ol Education
and ChurchTrrJpIng:

Rev. T. Bell ,

Bua Ministry:
Wayne Wjtklne

,
the Golden Gate Baptist
Church of Dallas, Texas, .

will serve as guest
...Evangelist. ServiceswHL.
be held at New Hone

The Lord's Supperwill
begiven on Sunday,April
15, immediately after the
closeof theworshiphour.
All membersareaskedto
partake. .

The wedding of Miss
r-- i - lILii ...:n tudpnene j, nem win ue
held here at New Hope
on Saturday evening,
April 14, at 7 p.m. An
invitation has been
received by the church
for membership atten-
dance.

Easterservicesfor the
childrenof the churchare
plannedas usual. Let us
give our support to Sunt.
K.B. Thompson and her
Sunday School staff to
make this a great affair.

Federation of Choirs
will meet Sunday
afternoon, April 22, at
2:30 p.m. Christ Temple
Church of God in Christ
is host for the month.
- Remember the sick
andshut-i- n of the church
andcommunity. Among
our sick this weekinclude
Ms. Callie Ccito, Ms.
Mattie Beaty, Mr.
Shephard Robinson, a

in West TexasPatient Ms. Lula
Virden, and Ms Susie
Williams.

Remeber the John
( lilt--s i n iiiv

prayers. Brother
Cameron'sbrother
passed away last week.

TWENTIETH
& BIRCH STREET

CHURCH OF CHRIST

Among those visited
with us recently were

..Qwen, Holder, Ella,
Sanders,DiannaHender-
son, all Of the city; Mrs
RobertL. Davis, Jr.,and
Dessina of Las Vegas,
Nevada; and Mr. and
Mrs. Don Hollins and
family of Duncanville,
Texas.

Prayers have request-
ed from Bettye Jackson,
Rita Stiggers, Roselee
Rogers, Milton Lee,
David Hightower, Dora
Russell, and Velma
Lethridge. Let's
rememberto prayonefor
another.

Among us who are on
the sick list are: Charlie
Patton, who is in
Methodist Hospital ,,

Room 826B; Sarah"
Johnpon, who is in
Ostepathic on Univer-
sity; Roosevelt Carroll,
who is in Methodist
Hospital - Room 747; and
Sister Johnson is jp
Room 110. Brother Lee
was admitted last week"
and was released. He is
home and is doing fine.
Let's rmember to go by
and see the sick and do
what we can for them;

Our sympathygoesto
Brother Gl&spie and
family in thepassingof his
brother. Let us do what

prrjrpjjssttiie papist
Yellowhouse Canyon

A SouthernBaptist Church

SCHEDULE OF
SundaySchool .............
MORNING WORSHIP
Evening Wcohlp
WednesdayWorship Service

we can for the family.
Lubock Christian

College has announced
Jr4e,offeringof a summer
sohool tuition discount
for early enrolleesfor all
summersessionsin 1979.
Tbe 15 discount is
offered to all student's
Dre-reaistcri- for at loact

: thjee hours and paying
th&ir bill ii i full diinno tUo

:
preregisiering period,
April 9 through 13. The
discount applies to ' all
chargesexcept housing.
For more information
regarding pre-regist- ra

ticn of course offerings,
contact Ricky Harman,
Registrar at (806) 792-322- 1,

ext. 207.

GREATER SAINT
LUKE BAPTIST

CHURCH

EasterPractice will be
held each afternoon at
the churchfrom 6 to 7.
The church buswill run
the SundaySchoolroute.
Eachparent who brings

andpicks upyur children,
pleasebe herewhen we
dismiss at 7.

Easter Sunrise Ser-
vices will be heldat the
churchon EasterSunday
morning, April 15,
beginning at 5:30 a.m
Come and let us
celebrate the Resur
rection of Christ Jesus
failv; Usher Board
Number Two will serve
breakfast following the
Easter dawn service.'

Our Church Anniver-
sarywill becelebratedthe.
Fourth Sunday in April"
throughtheFifth Sunday.

Our goal is $5,000.
The Junior Mission is

making plansfor aspecial
Mother's Day program.
The ladies will contact.yu
for special words of
commendations to our
Mother. -

WelcomeVisitors. We'
praythatyoumayreceive
a rich blessing in this
period of worship and
that Christ the Lord will
be more real to yu
becauseyou worshipped
here today.

Members of the
Dorcas,A.L.
Merriwether and Sarah
Cirles met in the homes
of Sisters Ann Watley,
BettyLarry, andEverlean
Allen this week. AH

reported lovely meetings.
Membersof theEunice

Circle will meet tonight
(Thursday) in the home
of Sister Lillian Duty,
3608 Cherry Avenue,
Beginning at p.m.

raver meeting is held
'at the church each
Wednesdayevening at 7
p.m. The Church and
Family that prays
together, stays together.

Let uspray for andvUt
our sick and sr.ut in
members. Among our
sick andshut in this veek
ihclude: Sisters Ida
McMorris and Thelma
Robinson, daughter of
Sister Dora 'Robinson,
SistersRoxie Reed,Mary

(iiljurclf

"Future 'Home"

SERVICES
,y, . 10 00 AM

.. ... . 11:15 PM
6:00 PM
7:30 PM

Lady Crusaders,Monday s:uu
G.A. s, Monday 6:00 PM

Junior Choir, Monday . 7'00 PM

Acteens,Tuesday 6:30. PM

Ambassadors& Pioneers,Tuesday , , 6:30 PM

Senior6holr. Tuesday' .
" v, 7t15 PM

Mission, Thursday ,..,..... .,,. 7:30 PM

Brotherhood,Saturday, , . . . . . . . 5:00 PM
B.T.U., Saturday . . ,V?V ..." . . i.V 5;00 FM

ra

Lee, Dolly Howard, and
Ellen Tillman remain ill.

Don't forget that
Junior Mission meets at
the church on Monday
nights. Young ladiest
pleaseavail yourselvesof
this opportunity to do
more mission work.

Young Adult Brother-
hood meetsat thechurch
on Tuesday nights. '"We
are having a wonderful
time in the Lord.

LYONS CHAPEL
BAPTIST
CHURCH

Services were well
attended last Sunday
Morning with our young
people doing a splendid
job. It was ,rYouth Day"
and everything was
beautiful. We are proud
of our young people.

Let us not forget that
the 29thAnnual Conven-
tion of Stokes-Parke-r

District, Texas Associa-
tion of Women's Clubs
will be held in our city at
the South Park Inn. The
pre-openin-

g program,
however, will be held at
Lyons Chapelon Friday,
April 20, 1979, at 8 p.m. It
has been requestedthat
Lyons Chapel Choir be
responsiblefor the music
on that evening.

The Young Matrons
met at the church last
Mondayeveningat7 p.m.

A lovely meeting was
held.

Let uspray for the sick
andshut-i- n of our church
andcommunity.

MOUNT GILEAD
BAPTIST CHURCH

We enter to worship,
and depart to serve:The
church where every-
body is somebody."

Let uscontinueto pray
for and visit our sick and
shut in members of the
church and community.

BETHEL A.M.E.
CHURCH

Services were well
attended last Sunday
morning with our
assistant pastor, Rev.
Jack Robinson, deliver-
ing a splendid Easter
message. Rev. Edwin
Scott, Sr. offered altar
call.

Senior Choir Number
One, under the direction
of Mrs. Lillian Struggsat
the piano and Mrs. Rose
Lincoln at the organ,was
responsible for the
music of the hour.
Brother Albert Lincoln
sung a lovely solo.

We aregoing to havea
big time this week. At
present time, the Rev.
Mrs. L.E. Moore of

THE CHHtHfH
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VICTORY THROUGH OUR LORD

CORINTHIANS 15:12-2-8

12 Now if Christ
preached as raised
from the dead, how
can some of you say
that there in no
resurrection of the
dead?
13 But if there is no
resurrection of the
dead, then Christ hns
snot been raised;
Id if Chrtst. has not
been raised, then ?ur
preacmns
andyur faith is in vain.
15 we areevenjouna
to be misrepresenting
God, because we
testified of God thathe
raised Christ, whom
he did not rcise if it is
true that the deadare
not raised.
16 For if the deadare
not rahed.then Christ
has not been raised.
17 If Christ has not
beenraised,yourfaith
is futile and you are
still in your sins.
18 Then those also
who havefallen asleep
in Christ haveperish-ed-.

19 If in this life we who
are in Christhaveonly
hope,we arcof all men
most to be pitied.
20 But in fact Christ
has been raisedfrom
the dead, the first
fruits of those who
have fallen asleep.
21 For as by man
camedeath,by man
has come also the
resurrection of the

Dallas, Texas, is
conducting our Annual
Spring Revival each
eveningat p.m. Shewill

rclose out on Sunday
afternoon at p.m.

Our Easter Sunrise
Serviceswill begin at5:30
a.m. Sunday morning,
April 15. Tr;e Rev.James
Cox, pastor of the
Seventh Day Adventist
Church here, will be our.
guest speaker. A
combined choir will be
responsiblefor the music
of the hour.

Immediately after the
morning services,
pancakebreakfastwill be
held in Fellowship Hall.
This is being sponsored
by the Sunday School
Department and Senior
Choir Number Two.
III f

1

is

a
a

8

3

a

Rev. LeonAnderson
Pastor

H
H
IPS

dead.
22 For as in Adam all
die, so also in Christ
shallall bemadealive.
23 But eachin his won
order: Christ the first
fruits, then at his
coming those who
belong tu Christ.'
24 Then comes the
end, when he delivers
the Kingdom to God
the Father after
destroying every rule
and every authority
mndpower.
25 tor he must reign
until he hasput all, his
ensmiesunderhisfeet.
26 The last enemy to
be destroyedis death.
27 "ForGadhasputell
things in subjection
under his feet." But
when it says, "All
thinas are nut in
subjection underhim."
it is olain that he is
exceptedwho put all
things under him.
28 When all thingsare

the Son himself will
also be subjected to
him who out all things
under him, that God
may be everything to
every one.

MEMORY
SELECTION

Thanks be to God,
who gives us the
victory through our
Lord JesusChrist 1

Corinthians 15:57.

Everyone is invited to
come and eat with us
after services.

There will be no ax
morning services.

The young people of
Ihe Youth Department
will have their annual
Easter program on
Sundayeveningat 7 p.m.

The Easter Egg Hunt

will be held Saturday
afternoon, April 14, at
2:30p.m. All parentsare
asked to have their
children at the churchby
2 p.m. If anyonewould
like to donate eggs,
pleasecontact Mrs. Ouie
Coleman. The eggs,
already boiled and dyed,
shoulcl be at the church
by 1 p.m., Saturday.

Texas 79407

CHRIST TEMPLE CHURCH
2411 Flr'Av.

Lubbock,Txm 79484
Phone:aos-744--

Lubbock,

OF THE GO
(Motto: C.W.F.F.)

AOS North Zenith Avenue
Bowie, Pastor

"Where Gospel Preached"

Phone744r6459

SundaySchool
Mohping Worship
Y.P.P.U
Evening Worship

Services

Everybody always welcome

Confined
PRE-HEE- D INiSUfllANGE

policies,
insurance policies. Security, Veteran's

monthly

intormaSion

PILGRIMBAPTISTCHURCH
WELCOME

WEEK

Phone:792-915-0

Lubbock.
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Morning Worship
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Bishop W. D. Hayries preachesat Christ
EachFirst and Third Sunday

Worship: 11:30 A.M.

CHURCH LSV1NG
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OBSEQUIES
Mrs. Edna Watson

;Fifial riten were read
las! Saturday afternoon
at - the Lyons Chapel
Baptist Church for Mrs.
Edna Watson with Rev.
James Judie Officiating.

Interment was held in
the City of Lubbock
Cemetery under the
direction of Jamison &
Son Funeral Home.

Mrs. Watson wa born
to Mr. andMrs. EdTaylor
on December25, 1916,in
Gonzales, Texas, where
she attended public
school and united with
the church at an early
age.

She attended Sequin
College until it was
destroyed by fire, and
thensheattendedPrairie
View A & M College
where she majored in
Home Economics. She
was a graduateof Texas

wi

I SPksAlEDITION CA.MAR0
Tunlcit Coupon From

A & M University and
was a licensedbeautician
and dressmaker.

She was the first
president of the Phillis
wheatley Elementary
School P.T.A., and
recently organized a
group of Senior Citizens
in Austin, Texas,andwas
a counselor to many.

She married Mr.
Thomas Watson, who
preceded her in death

k?ru ll held for Mrs. Vina Lee
Watson her Williams on Tuesday

murui .luveudiu, wiwus a bmnnn Ann 3. 1Q79
ever she moved. She
united with the Church of
God in Christ whereshe
worked and remaineda
faithful rSiember,.until her
homegoing.

She leaves to mourn
her passing: three
daughters, Mrs. . Erma
Aslock, Mrs. Tommie
Ervin, and Mrs. Gloria
Watson,all of Lubbock;a
son, Mr. Melviri S.
Watson of Del City,
California; six sisters,
Mrs. Lonnie M. Green,
Mrs. Lucille Ball of
Midland, Texas, Mrs.
JanieJanesof Gonzales,
Texas,Mrs. ZelmaButler
of San Antonio, Texas,
Mrs. Ollie M. Greathouse
of CorpusChristi, Texas,
and Mrs. Annie Brown of
Houston, Texas; a
brother, Mr. Ned Taylor
of Shiner, Texas;
eighteen grandchildren,
two great-childre- n, ahost
of other relatives, and
many friends.

A
mi

1 JS 1

FIRST FEDERAL
1300 BROADWAY

OFFICES: 34th AVE. W
50th & WDO
& BROWNFIELD

WIN A CAM ARC!
Courtny KtU).BIk

VinaLee Williams

Funeral services were

w.vw...w.-- y -- I -J- -

at the Lyons Chapel
Baptist Church with Dr.
Floyd Perry, Jr., pastor,
officiating.

Interment was held in
the of Lubbock
Cemetery under the
direction of Jamison &
Son Funeral Home.

Mrs. Williams wa born
December 3, 1908, in
Cleburn, Texas, to Mr.
and Mrs. Willie Griggs.
Shegrew up in Cleburne,
Texas. At an early age,
she joined the Shiloh
Baptist Church there.

She attended public

Active pallbearers were
Charles Ball, Ben
Mayberry,JamesArkdie,
Frankie Stockton, Ray
Greathouse, Sherman
Greathouse, Clydeil
Cooper, and Joe
Haynes.

Honorary pallbears
were the Deacons of
Lyons Chapel Baptist
Church,

I AGRICUL TUBE TOMORROW I
I WILL BEBETTER ... 1

i 4&7 T if wework
I gPjtf TOGETHER

I COOPERATION PAYS DIVIDENDS 1

I Plains GocbeatioeOil lUill I
2901 Ave. Lubbock Texasl

ave in me
FirstFederal )irit!

FIRST FEDERAL
SAVINGS AND LOAN

ASSOCIATION OF LUBBOCK
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school in Cleburne.
Mrs. Will iarris moved

to WestTexasatanearly
ege. She married Mr.
Willie Williams who
preceded her in death.

She always kept her
church covenant.
Shortly after moving to
Lubbock,sheunitedwith
the GreaterSamt Luke
Baptist Church. Later,
she unitedwith theLyons
Chapel Baptist Church

Executive Director' of
Business and Finance

associate uirector or
Technical,

Programmer-Analys- t

SocialWorker

HeadResident

StaffNurse

AssistantT

Secretaryllll . . ;

SecrectaryH ,

'
K

SecretaryII
(Temporary)

Clerk Typist II

Clerk Typist

Clerical

Clinic

Library Assistant

Plumber

(Part Time)

where she Worked
faithful member until
death.

She leaves mourn
threedaughters,Leonard
Mae, Daisy, and Valarie;

son, Charlie; eleven
great

grandson, neice, Mrs.
Marie Smith; cousin,
ClarenceGamble;end
host other relatives
and friends.

Active

I

II

&

I

as a

to

a
a

a
a

a
of

Clerk II
Time)

CashierII

Mail Carrier

Key Punch Operator I

Key Punch Operato i

Time) )
&

Drafting Techmciaxi I .

"4- -

Electronics Technician 'J.

Labot atory Assistant
Time) :

Custodian

h

Social Worker, Associate

'J

i4t

were t Thomas Wfgfali,
IV. Williams, L,C Hall,
Charles Brown, Lewis

Draper,' and Andrews

Honorary pallbearers

were the Deacons of
L.hapei Baptist

Baptist
Lyons
Missionary
Church.

Be To, The
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Clerk

(Part

(Part

Utility Plant

Hood.
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$ 995 per month
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.$ 577 per month

$ 539 per month
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" $ 539 per month

$ 269 per:month

$ 662 per month

,$l 379 per month

V

, 247 per month

$1,029 per month

2.85. hour
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CROSS ACQVATiG PROGRAM
Continued

Advanced First and 1. Basic in
Emergency
Instructor; 5. Cardio-
pulmonary Resuscitation
- instructor (Lecture and
Modular version)

WaterSafety
1. Water Safety Instruct-
or; 2. Basic Safety
Instructor.

Small Craft

Texas University
Tfexas University Schoolof Medicine

ApplicationsShould
PERSONNELOFFICE, ROOM i35, HALL, CAMPUS

Processing

Administrative

Specialist

Receptionist

grandchildren,

pallbeavers

Operator

THE PERSONNELOFFICE IS OPEN

WED
fromPage

Ad

Tech
Tech

Directed

.DRANE

Accounting

t
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course
Care

Wate

Canoeing; 2. Basis
course in Sailing;3. Basid
Sailing and Canoeing

To enroll in the Aid
Section, you need no
previous first aid training
to qualify as a First Aid
Instructor. No swimming
activity is in this
section.

Six to eight years of progressively responsible
administrative experience,a minimum of two
years of which must be in health carefinancial
administration. It is preferable that experience
include major responsbilitiesin a large health
professional teaching institution. A Bachelor's
degree is required; Master's level preferred in

Administration or related field.

Master'sdegree in Library Science. Eight years
experiencein acquisitionorcataloging. years
a chairperson.

Severalyears of experiencein the maintenance
and modification of OS or SVS system.

Master'sdegreein socialwork.

Bachelor's degree and working knowledge of
ResidenceHalls, preferablythroughprior living or
working experience in a dormitory.

Texas LU imse. Two years of experience.

Typing. 60 - 65 wpm. Six years of progressively
responsible clerical and office experience.

7W 60-6-5 u,pni. four years experience.

Typing 55-6-0 wpm. Two years experience.

i'
Typing 55-6-0 wpm. Two years experience.

Typing 55-6-0 wpm. Two years experience.

Typing 50-5-5 wpm.

Typing 50-5-5 wpm. Two years experience
including bookkeeping and posting machine.

Typing 50-5-5 wpm. Three years experience.

Typing 40-4-5 wpm. Two years of ; experiencein
library or relatedclericalwork.

Typing 40-4-5 wpm. Two years of bookkeeping
experience.

Typing 40-4-5 wpm, Two years of cashier and
bookkeepingexperience,

Two yearsof mail carrierclerk or other related
experience. '

One year of key punch experience.

One year of key punch experience.
Qneyearof drafting experience.

Education or experiencein; analog electronics.
Some computer programming experience!
preferred.

High School graduation. Knowledge of basic
, laboratorymethods.

Threeyears of experiencein the operationand
maintenanceof a large scale heating and air
conditioning plai t.

$ 812 per month Twp years experience, as g plumbert.

per Cdswuialexperiencerequired.
0

Bachelor'sdegreern sociql wdrk or socialwelfare.

From 8:00 a.m. until 5:00 p.m.,Monday throughFriday

--

Instructor.
First

required

Business

Five
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flj CareService,

VERLINA CARROLL

LICENSED DA Y CARE HOME
kEEPING CHILDREN FROM AT LEAST ONE

MONTH OLD TO TEN YEARS OF AGE

7 AM. to P.M. 5 Days a Week

For Information Call: 744-598- 6

2915 EastColgateAvenue

ProfessionalServices

FINANCIAL RECORDS
IlOOItlCEKPINO A TAX SERVICE

JAMES L. TAHOH
705-flOO-

803-220- 0

E. P. RieilARDSON ASSOCIATES
M.'inagerrfent,Cdrtsuitant

it .t
S013- - S7th Street--'

P.O. Box 2553

One

X
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EDDIE P. RICHARDSON

PERSONNEL SERVICES

Clements 332-629-1

Sundays appointment.

price

PILGRIM BAPTIST
CHURCH

;Thc public invited to
uforsHip with us this
S.unday and every
Sunday.

Palm Sunday com-
mences our Passion
)Meek Services with
nightly prayer service
Monday Tuesdayat
7:30 each evening. On
Wednesday, preaching
service begins. Our
evangelist be
Reverend Anatol Ford,
Pastor of The Starlight
Baptist, Church, Santa
Ana, California.
:'-Re-v. Ford very
gifted youngministerand

'I?

STRBiET

fry

Tetfas
4.

MADAM ROSEfro
This Gifted WOmBrt help and advisa
you matters

and Health. There is
great that thfc gifted woman

from India cannothelp you sojvo. She.
will tell you what ycu want know and
what you should know.
God gave her thepower help those who
cannot help

401 W. St. - Odoisa- Call
7 Days a Week - 7 anv10 pm by

? half with this

!'; is

;

a

and

will the

is a
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City,

6llVn-34T- H

Ll'nnoOK, TX 704(J7

V..

Lubbock,
806792-9261- -.

in
can

on all of LOvo, Marriage,
Business, in no
problem so

to

to
themselves.

State, A.P.O

advertisement

is at presentstudyingat
PepperdineCollege near
SantaAna. He hasbeen
in his presentpastorate
aprbftrhately 10' years.

Rev. Ford will only be
here three days,and you

.will miss a blessingif you
to hear him.

Rev. Charles Steen,
pastorof Christ Temple
Baptist Church of the
samecity will be bringing
our noon day message
each day beginning
Wednesday. Lunch will

be servedat the church.
Rev. Steen will also

bring the messagefev the
Baptist Minister's Union
on Tuesday, April 10,
1979, at 7:30. p.m., at.

3:30-4:3-0 pm

TTIXlg
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Professional Services
FINE QUALITY BUSINESS CARDS,
BROCHURES, HAND BILLS, POSTERS,
AND PALCQUARDS, MAGAZINES,
SOUVENIR BOOKS PROGRAMS.
WORK IS OF FINEST QUALITY
PRICES COMPETITIVE.

COME BY THE

23rd St.

heading super-cohost- s

taimient

AND OUR
THE AND

ARE

East

"LUBBOCK

MaleFemale
JOB OPPORTUNITIES

Psychiatrists $ OPEN
PsychologistSocialWorker $ 1259.00
Caseworker III $ 1179.00
Administrative Tech III $ 1034.00
CaseworkerI $ 794.,00
Caseworker I $ 794.00
SecretaryI $ 571.00
Clerk II $ 571.00
HouseparentI (part time) $ 325.50

FORADDITIONAL INFORMATION, CONTACT:

AKES YOUR DAY

KMC

PERSONNEL DEPARTMENT
Lubbock RegionalMHMR Center

Texas
Lubbock, Texas 79401

"'An EEOAA

Pilgrim Baptist Church.
Dr. A.L. Dunn is
President of the Baptist
Minister's Union. Come
one, come all, you are
welcome.

There will be Easter
Sun-Ris- e Servicesat 6:00
a.m., and the Morning
Worship hour will be
followed by a Grand
Easter-Eg-g hunt for all
ages. Come celebrate
The Resurrectionof our
Lord us. You will be
glad you did.

bright newseason shews your way with
andstars from the enter capital theworld.

Lubbock Tenas

o

- ' - TIME TO RENEW!!!
pleasecktqk ONE

Yes, pleasere-ne- w my subscriptionto the
"Lubbock Digest" :

Pleaseentermeasanew subscriberto the:
"Lubbock Digest."

. SUBSCRIPTION POpm
506 E. 23rd St. . Lubbock, Texas 79404

ServicePeople,Friends,Relativescankeepup with '

' ,' hfeme Town and National Happenings, with 'the
Lubbockdigest.

Name 0. . ... . . ;,.,.,,.......... f .

Address. .... 4 , ;'. . . ,

Zip,

fail

506

1210

with

ANNUAL RATES ! ( r
Subscriptions 10.00 '

lfO.50

'12.50

DIGEST'

Phone: (806) 762-361-2

(MSW)

AA

Avenue

Employer"

765-839-3

GREATER FIRST
BAPTIST CHURCH

Littlefield, Texas

Services were well
attended last Sunday
morning with our pastor,
Rev. Wilson Baldwin,
delivering a splendid
message.We encourage
our visitors to please
corne again soon.

Let usnot forgetweare
to gc to Mount Olive
Baptist Church in Slaton,
Texason Fridayevening,
April 13, to be in the

- B 4th

!. Lubbock, Texas

Jobs m-f- m

TEXAS TECH UNIVERSITY

For information regarding
employment at TEXAS TECH'

"university

CALL: 742-221- 1

"Equal Employment Opportunity
Through Affirmative Action"

FOR JOB INFORMATION
WITH THE

City of Lubbock

CALL

' 762-244- 4

"AN EQUAL OPPORTUNITY
EMPLOYER"

HEALTH SCIENCES

CENTER HOSPITAL

moro information
regarding employment
opportunities at Health
Sciences Center Hos-

pital call 743-335-

Eoual Opportunity Employer

Information concerning
employment my be

obtained by calling

765-632-1

PIONEER.
NATURAL GAS COMPANY

EqualEmploymentOpportunity

ThroughAffirmative Action'

anniversary services of
Rev. and Mrs. C. C.
Peoples.

On Sundayevening at
6:30 p.m., our ypiirig
peoplewill sponsoHthsir
annualEasterproqramto

Using

Other

Phone
r

Phone

7TT

11 im

3-1- 1 J
shifts for R.N.'s, LMN.

Nursing.
Assistants,Lab

UNIVERSITY
INC.

6610 QuakerAvenue
Lubbock, Texas 79413

"Equal Opportunity Employer"

FOR INFORMATION

CONCERNING

Employment
Weatherization

Food

CONTACT:
CommunityServices

762-641- 1

EatttUeOffice i602VandaAvemit

Downtown Office 820 Texat

DowntownOffice fOOTexasAvenue

Ext,230i

Amctt BensonOffice 1stStreet
Ext,

WBVim

$v97iUm$a?
the

of print

Since you can't predict'
when women will

suddenly buy,
it's smart advertise

with

whom shall fear. The
Lord the of
my life of whom shall
he For in of

he shall Ihide
me in his pavilion.
Psalm27.

the parents and mem--
bers. Let us support MEMORIAL....
pur young Continued Page

Let pray for all our
sick andshut in members Creed,TexuS. Later,Ms.
of tie church and Allen moved San
community well Marcos,Texaswhereshe
those who are attended high school.

the Pastor's Ms. Allen
Desk": TheLord my Samuel
light and my and Houston

UL1NDA LAWSON

Professional
Hair Weaving

The Simmon's At-Teni- on Method,

Perms And Beauty Techniques

4708 Business 793-274-6

Home 762-192-2

HELP NEEDED

OPENINGS:

Intensive Care Unit.
Experience

technicians

HOSPITAL,

Home
Emersency

Marty
irtiSicov?Srty
advantages

decide

continuity.

strength

afraid. time
trouble,

people. from

bereaved,
"From attended

Houston College
salvation Tillerson

College.
She was united

matrimony with Mr.
ArmsteadAllen.

She leaves mourn:
husband, Armstead
Allen; two sisters Effie
Hamilton (Austin) and
Dixie Hamilton (Round
Rock, Tx.); foster
daughter, one foster
grandson;and host
relatives and friends.

SUPPORT
THE

BUSINESSES

IN YOUR
COMMUNITY!!!

MotOrcfSftSE GSLBEET FLORGS, Owner

708 4th Si

STARTCRS - CARBURETORS
BEARINGS - MUFFLERS - FUEL
PUMPS - SHOCK ABSORBERS

WEfATORS ALTERNATORS SEAT SECTS --

AUTO RACING SPORTSCAR EQUIP

Z3S

ANNOUNCEMENT!!

CHURCH THELIVING GOD

MOTTO: C.W.F.F.

EASTER BANQUET
Date April Time P.M.

Location EastParkwayDrivi
Building Admission $3.00

Pastor Bowk

information, 762-589- 5"

HWflHIIQHHHtMfHQlHH!ttt(ifOI)BHHHII

HAUL FOUNDRIES

Now Hirmcj!
SteadyEmployment With A

Future
looking people

EXTENDED PERIOD Starting

presently regular reviews,

uniforms, insurance sharing,

holidays. Foundryexperienceappreciated.Accepting appli- -j

weekdays 5:30p.m. Apply person.

1230 Elm
Lubbock
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Rev, L.F.

"For call

for few top with good work record who hove proven

they can hold job OVER AN OF TIME.

wage from $220 week (50 hourj) with wage

ooid life & health with Dl, profit paid voca

tion, 7 paid
cations Bo.m. to in
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41 5 Avenue R P. 0. Box 2682

' Lubbock, Texas 79108

Phone: (806) 763-042-8

SOUTH PLAINS
BLOOD SERVICE

T"irr,?'TOT,iM7YvivIYiV

"V

Mr. Carl W, Hallfard, a new and used car
satesmChfor GeneMesserFord on 19thStreet,is
the man to talk to if you are lookingfor a new or
real cleananddependablecar. Go by andseeMr.
Hallford, andaskfor him. He will giveycu thebest

:M deal in town. Know you salesmanby name. Call
him Mr. Carl W. Hallford. He is well know in "East
Lubbock,"Most of theBlackpeoplerememberhim
when he owned Carl Motors on TexasAvenue.

Well, he is still selling good cars.Mr. Hallford ,

standsbehindhis word. Ho is presidentof the Full
GospelBusinessFellowship of Lubbock, and he
would like for you to know that you are invited
every Saturday morning at 7 a.m. at Furrs
Cafeteria.

Mr. Cart W. Hallford isarealgoodfriendofElder
P. B. Phenix. He is former assistantpastor of
Slaton Number I.

AUTO SUPPLY

Lubbock, Texas
PARTS AT DISCOUNT PltSCES

OPEN fm t t
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