
LAST RITES HELD 	ON SICK LIST 

We failed to state last week , Johnny Martin 
that Mrs, Berty C. Cowley, 80, to bed this week. 
of Rails, had passed away. 	in a hole Sunday 

She was the Mother of Mrs, his hip muscles, 
Ralph Tidwell of Ropes. 

The Plainsman, along with UNDER MEDICAL 
the Ropes community, extead, 
our deepest sympathy to the 1 Chester Stephenson has 
Tidwell's during their time of been reported on the sick lisu 
sorrow. 	 this  week suffering from ul-

cers. He is receiving medical 
care at Abilene where he and 
Mrs.  Stephenson arse staying 
with his brother. 

is confined 
He stepped 
and pulled 

CARS 

VISITS HERE 

Mrs. J L. Boone and dough- 

If there is an X in this box 
it is notice your subscription 
has expired and an invita-
tion to renew. 
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What is the poverty cycle? 

PASSES AWAY 

0 

in the community so that ex-
isting resources  in the com-
munity could be co-ordinated 
and mobilized to break the 
poverty-cycle. 

Here are the needs. If our; 
community indicates their 
concern by attendance at the, 
February 8 meeting, especially, 
if those in the poverty cycle 
care enough about helping 
themselves to come, then to-
gether we can at long last be-
gin to do something about 
breaking the cycle. Mr. 0. V. 
Fuller is  already serving on 
the County Committee and 
will be glad to supply further 
information to those who  re-
quest it. I ask you, if those of 
us who live here do not care 
enough to do something auo tt 
poverty, then who will? 

Saturday night, February 11. 
All persons are asked to 

plan to come and have fun. 
and help the Booster Club. 

We would like to join with 
the community in extending 
our deepest sympathy to Mr, 
and Mrs. Bill Carter of San 
Saba on the recent loss of her 
brother, E. W. Millsap. 

Homer Henderson 
Are you concerned about 

your community? Do you care 
about those in this community 
who because of the poverty-
cycle have not achieved full 
participation in the democra-
tic process or in the free en-
terprise system? Did you 
know that living within the 
Ropesville Public School Dis-
trict there are 13'i families  
(593 persons) whose total an-
nual income is $6000 or less')  
If your answer is one of con-
cern, then perhaps you will be 
prompted to ask one further 
question: What can be clone 
about it? 

Monday evening in the Rop-
esville Community Building, 
approximately 30 citizens of 
our community were given op 
portunity to consider this 
concern with Howard IVIaddera 
Executive Director of the 
Hockley County Community 
Action Committee, Inc, Those 
attending this open public 
meeting were both Latin and 
Anglo. Another such meeting 
Is scheduled at the Commun-
ity Building the evening of 
Wednesday, February 8. 

What is Community Act-
ion? It is a program which is 
federally financed but citizen 
ruled The program is de-
signed to give those who are 
in the poverty-cycle a chance 
to help themselves. No pro-
grams  are handed down from 
above; rather they grow out 
-of each community's needs 
and are fitted to each comma-
nity's resources. There are 
federal funds available to 
place neighborhood workers in 
communities such a s ourse 
Such a worker would be a per 
son intimately acquainted 
with the poverty group, able 
-to speak their languages, and 
able to lead them back into 
full participation in our Am-
erican way of life. This work-
er would be centrally located 

There will be a Booster Club 
meeting Friday, February 3rd, 
All members are urged to at-
tend, A bridge and forty-two 
party is being planned for 

The Tops Club met Monday 
night, January 30, with all 
thirteen members present. 

Meeting was called to order 
and the invocation was given 

.by Nellie Averill. The pledge 
and song followed. 

A short business meeting 
was held, and members were 
reminded of the bake sale to 
be held Saturday at the Ropes  
Food. Members reported a 
-very enjoyable time at the AR 
D day held in Big Spring last 
Saturday. There were eight 
attended • 

110'1ICE-- 

Dr, S. R. Byrd will be ini  
'Ropes at City Hall February 
28 (on a Tuesday) from 4:00 
to 7:00 p.m. to vaccinate pets. 

• 

IWFD MAKES RUN 

The Ropes Volunteer Fire 
Department was  called to the 
First Baptist Church Monday 
morning to extinguish a fire 
which burned the wiring out 
of an air conditioner. 

'SHOWER 
Miss Lynda Snider, bride 

-elect of Barry Hubbard. will 
be honored with a shower on 
Tuesday, February 7, from 
2:30 to 4:30 p.m. in the First 
Baptist Church. Everyose has  
a cordial invitation to attend. 

000 	 

and correct 

The Ropes PTA will meet 
Thursday (tonight) February 
2 at 7:30 p.m. in the school 
cafeteria. 

A film will be shown, and 
the third grade will sing.  Ti ie 
annual talent show will also 

ORDINANCE NO. 46 
An ordinance known as the 

Dog Ordinance Requiring that 
all dogs, must be kept contin-
ously on owners property 
SECTION I: Be it ordained by 
the City Council of the City of 
Ropesville. Texas, that any 
person or persons in the City 
of Ropesville, Hockley County, 

(Texas, wishing to keep a dog, 
must, at all times keep the 
said dog on his or her proper-
ty; this being construed to 

Short and sweet, short 
anyway, its late. 

January of this year pre-
sented two firsts for history, 
the hottest day ever recorded 
in this month, and the first 
time without any moisture 
for the entire month. 

Wednesday looked very pro-
mising, with some beautiful 
rain clouds, but they drifted 
to the north, and all we got 
was a granddaddy of a sand 
storm, At least, there is no 
sudden change, just dry. 

We think it is time that 
the Ropes community banded 
together for interests of some 

further if local interest is 
not taken, and more people 
show up at the meeting next 
Wednesday, February 8th. 

The money is waiting, fur-
nished by the Government, 
for these needy people, it will 
not be allocated to the Ropes 
community if they are not 
organized. The money V7111 
go to other places that get 
in and help, and form a 
board of directors;  and give of 
their time to thie.  program. 

If our poverty stricken 
people receive this program, 
they will be trained to read, 
write, and trained for special 
jobs, where now they kno v 
no trade. If they are trained 
they can go to work, and help 
pay taxes, pay social securi;ey 
so they will be taken care of 
in later years, and pay in-
come tax, to help the Gov-
ernment pay for this badly 
needed program, 

As it now ctands, the ma- 

be discussed, 
We would like to encourage 

everyone to attend, We have 
had very interesting programs 
this  year that would benefit' 
anyone. 

mean either penned or leash-
ed. 
SECTION II: That such said 
dog, upon being found off said 
property or running loose will 
be picked up and destroyed. 

T. J. Redman, Jr. 
Mayor 

Mrs. Bob Whitlock 
City Secretary 
(Marshall Fox asked us to 

announce that this ordinance 
will be enforced beginning on 
March 1, 1967.) 

jority of them depend on wel-
fare and handouts. This is 
not good for anyone, and 
creates no initiative in any 
human;  They must know that 
help is waiting for them, if 
they will take advantage of 
it, 

So we urge you to attend 
the meeting, and if you know 
of anyone in this bracket, an 
income of $3000 or less a 
year, urge them to coine also, 
for the program must be ac-
tually operated by them, and 
aided by others in the com-
munity. 

Take time out Wednesday 
evening and attend the meet- 
ing 	a t the Community 
Building, 

	

000 	 

Mr. and Mrs, Shelby Evans, 
is reported to be in serious 
condition in the Veterans 
Hospital in Albuquerque, N. 
Mex, About a year or so ago 
Mr. Yeager was assaulted in 
a service station at Slaton by 
burglars, and received a ser-
ious blow on the head. It is 
thought his present illness 
may be a result of this in-
jury. He would like to re-
ceive cards and letterss, so 
we are passing his ad-
dress on to you so that you 
may write to him: 
J. C. Yeager,  
Room 3027, In care of Veter-
ans Administration Hospital. 
Albuquerque, New Mexico. 

ti.ETITENS HOME 
Mrs. Lindley, mother of Dee 

Lindley, who underwent sur-
gery last week has improved 
enough so that she has return 
ed to her home. 

—000-- 

Ropes FFA mefbers, accom-
panied by advisor C. T, Mc-
Cormick and George T. Forbus 
left Wednesday for Fort Worth 
to attend the Southwestern 
Exposition and Fat Stock 
Show. Boys and their entries 
are as follows: 

Charles  Blair - 2 Hampshire 
pigs. 

Larry Don Blair - Three 
Hampshires. 

This year Nationa Boy Scout 
Week coincides with National 
Electric Week. As part of the 
observance, Southwestern Pub 
lic Service Company is con-
ducting a Boy Scout Electri-
city Merit Badge Clinic, 

This clinic is limited to 
Scouts, Second Class and up. 
It is to be held in the Reddy 
Room of our Company, 1120 
Main, Lubbock, at 7:30 p.m. 
February 9, 1967. The boys 
from your troop are invited to 
attend' 

January 28, 1967 
Dear Mrs. Morris: 

This  has been a very hectic 
month for me. I have been 
gut of town part of the time,' 
and my work in the committee 
has kept me out of my office 
most of the time. This has' 
put me *far behind with my i 
correspondence. 

This is Saturday afternoon! 

and I am free to attend to my,  
more personal correspondence. 
I have been wanting to tell 
you of my deep distress over 
the untimely passing of Troy 
Morris, As you know, Troy 
and I had been friends for 
many, many years. He was 
always friendly and he always 
sought to help me do a good ,  
job for the people of the Lev-
elland area. Troy was good 
and friendly — a pillar of 
strength—a man who will be 
missed. 

I know your friends from far 
and near have sought to be of 
comfort to you and your fam- 

VISITS PARENTS 
—000-- 

Mr. and Mrs. Hershel Wilson 
and family of Sunnevarde visit-
ed Saturday in the home of 
his parents, Mr. and Mrs.  L. E. 
Wilson. 

I "IN HOSPITAL 

Mrs. Robert Hudson was 
taken to Methodist Hospital ;  
in Lubbock last Wednesday! 
a?ci is reported in critical con- 

RAVE GUESTS SUNDAY 

Visitors over the weekend in 
the home of Mr. and Mrs. Bob 
Whitlock were Mrs, Morris  E ; 
C' c id and children, Mr. and 
Mrs. Tommy Dave Whitlock 
and family, and Don Whitlock 
and Sherry Treece, all from 
Lubbock. 

Mike Flowers  - Two lambs. 
Bill McCormick - One York-

shire; one spotted Poland 
China; two Hampshires. 

Ronny Price - Two Berk-
shires, 

Eddie Thetford - Two Cross 
breeds, 
.The animals will be weighed 

and sifted the 2nd, judged the 
3rd, and sold the 4th. 

The program is for orienta-
tion on the Electrical Merit 
Badge and final approval for 
the badge is with the Merit 
Badge Council. 

Electrical Merit Badge books  
will be given to those who at-
tend the meeting. 

Program: 
History of Electricity 
What Is Electricity? 
Common Electrical Terms 
Safety 
Career Opportunities 

ily during these sad days but 
Mrs. Mahon and I wanted, 
likewise, to pay tribute to the 
memory of your husband and 
express our deepest sympathy 
to you and all of the members  
of the family. 

May the Lord bleg.s you all 
and give you the strength to 
carry on. 

Sincerely„ 
George Mahon 

(We would like to say thank 
you to the Mahon's for their 
tribute to the memory of our 
Father, As we said before, it 
is  impossible to print all the 
much appreciated letters and 
notes the family has received. 
We also owe thanks to Sena-
tor and Mrs. John Tower for 
their telegram received Janu-
ary 6th; and also to Paul 
Harvey for his kind words on 
his newscast the day following 
the death of Troy Morris. To 
local people also for their kind 
words of sympathy expressed 
so often still.) 

ory Hobbs were Mr. and Mrs. 
J. C. Dorsett and boys frond 
Brownfield and Mr. and Mrs, 
Merlin Hobbs and family. 

--O (70 
ON SICK LIST 

Mrs, W. E, Walling was in 
Lubbock Tuesday for medical 
care, 

0 0-- 

IN HOSPITAL 

Mrs, Randy Brooks and 
children are in Clarksville at-
tending the bedside of her 
father, Charlie Hines, who 
suffered a heart attack last 
Monday evening, 

ON SICK LIST 

Mrs, Ida Forrest, mother of 
Mrs. G, C. Bevers, is at the 
University Convalscent Home 
on Quaker in Lubbock recov-
ering from in j uries received 
in a fall recently, 

an 8th grade education. 103 
of these families eypressed de; 
sire for adult education, 108, 
desired job training. 90 fami-
lies live in sub-standard hour-; 
ing. 69 expressed the need of 
supervised recreation. 53 
would like to have their pre-
school children in a head start 
program to prepare the child-
ren for the first grade. 

Booster Club to Meet 

TOPS Club News 
Inez Price won the gift for 

the most weight lost last week 
The meeting was adjourned 

and the members went to the 
Spot Restaurant in Levelland. 
Joining the group at Level-
land was guest Dixie Carter. 

Present were Iva Ree Young 
Mabel Hobbs, Odessa Walling, 
Wanda Allen, Lillian Willis, 
Nellie Averill, Billie McCor-
mick, Mayme Rasberry, Joyce 
Beaty, Betty Whitehead, Inez ;  
Price, Celeste Thomas and 
Nell Hobbs. 

CARD OF THANKS 

We would like to expresss 
our sincere thanks to the 
many people who were so  en-
couraging during my recent 
stay in the hospital. Only 
i,hose who have experienced 
it can know just how much it 
helps. It is a blessing to live 
among such wonderful friends 
and neighbors as you. 

Sincerely, 
Thelnia and Everett 

Wallace. 

In a sentence, it is fact that 
poverty breeds poverty. A per-
son born into an uneduated, 
semi-literate, poverty strickea 
family is likely to be poverty 
stricken unless something is 
done to break the poverty cy-
cle. Does the poverty cycle 
exist in our local communit i? 
Yes, according to a survey re • 
Mort mode in our School Dis-
trict, as of January 12, 1967, 

there were 137 families with expreses a desire to assist. 
an average of 4 children per 4. Knowledgable, well in-

family earning $3000 or less. formed, interested window per 
40 earned less than $2000, and sonnel to help with postal 
28 earned less than $1000. Of needs. 
the 593 persons in these 137 

 
5. Prompt, alert 

families, 93 percent of the cient service, 
Latins, 71 percent of the Ne-i 6. Competent 
groes, and 63 percent of the 
Anglos have not gone beyond 

A new "Postal Customers 
Bill of Rights" is being put 
into effect at all Post Offices 
to ,help meet President Lyndon 
B. Johnson's goal of improving 
the quality of governmLnt oer • 
vices to the public, according 
to Postmaster Flora M Martin 

A poster is on display in the 
Post Office Service Lobby con-
taining the following 10 points ' 
which specify the kind of! 
treatment customers have a 
right to expect: 

1. A neat, clean counter on 
which to transact business. 

2 Service by a well-groom-
ed, neat window employee. 

3 A friendlyt' g that 

and effi- 

PTA To Meet Tonight 

City Dog Ordinance 

Jest Some Thoughts-- 

information on inquiries. 
7. An attitude that reflects 

helpfulness, patience and con-
geniality, 

8. The courtesy and tact 
that would be expected from 
a friend. 

9. Polite referral to another 
window or individual, when 
necessary, to give the approp-
riate service, 

10. A feeling, upon leaving, 
that the post office is glad to 

• serve and help at all times. 
In addition to the points 

specifying the service custo-
mers may expect, the program 
sets  out various requests for 
co-operation by the customers, 
Those include requests that 
the customer state his needs  
clearly; have money ready and 
any necessary forms filled 
out, ready for transaction, and 
that he state his business in 
a brief and business-like man-
ner as possible, 

Attention, Boy Scouts 

From George Mahon 

ter, Mrs. Hugh Goodlett of t HAVE VISITORS 
Plainview visited recently in 

of its residents, This Com- IN HOSPITAL 	 the home of her brother, Mr 
: ' Guests  Friday evening ih, 

munity Action Program is a 	 1 -   
l, 	• good thing, but will go no .1.. C, ' Wager, son-in-law of 
and Mrs, 0. W. Dalton 	the home of Mr. and Mrs, VIA.'  

ligeWirtfN. - • . 	, 
• -1,,, Vraidef_i..". 
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LIKE THE TEXAS OUTDOORS? 
Whether you're an active outdoor sportsman, or just an 

• armchair enthusiast, you'll enjoy reading about hunting, 
fishing, camping, boating, hiking, mountain climbing, 
spelunking, bird watching, and other types of outdoor 
recreation in TEXAS PARKS & WILDLIFE magazine. 

TEXAS PARKS & WILDLIFE DEPARTMENT 
John H. Reagan Building 

Austin, Texas 78701 

A 
Interesting features, beautiful color photography, and 
helpful hints combine to make this monthly magazine a 
MUST for every outdoorsman In the STATE OF TEXAS. 

For only $2 for one year, $3 for two years, or $5 for 
I' five years you can purchase this sensational magazine. 

For a subscription (please enclose check) or further in- 
• formation, write: 

Prtfited by this newspaper as a puLlla orrim 
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High School Eagles I FIRST BAPTIST CHURCI1 

1966 -1967 	 Philip Goodrum, Pastor 

Basketball Schedule SUNDAY IviORN1NG: 
Sunday School __.... 9:45 a.m. 
Worship Service .... 11:00 a.m 
SUNDAY NIGHT: 
Training Union 	 6:00 p.m 
Worship Service 	 7:00 p.m 
Wednesday Service 	7:30 p.m 

torealip;Ne_wus 
lill 	lilt 

RETURN 1103IE 

Mrs. Everett Wallace was 
returned home last week after 
having been in the hospital 
for thirty-two days, and is re-
ported well on the road to re-
covery. 

RETURNS HOME 

Mrs. Nancy Martin was re-
turned home last, Thursday 
from West- Texas Hosphat last 
Lubbock and is reported some 
improved. Mrs. Bob King of: 
Lubbock - returned home withi 
her sister, and stayed until 
Sunday, 

..• 

2-3 	 *Wilson I-1 
2-7 	 -Cooper T 
2-14,16,17 Dist. Tourney H 
*District Games 
B Games 5:30 P.M. 
A Games 7:00 P.M. 
COACHES: 

Phil Guinn (Boys) 
Dean Andrews (Girls) 

VISIT RELATIVES 

Mr. and Mrs. Emory Hobbs 
visited a few days last week in 
Denver City with her sister, 
Mr. and Mrs. J. L. Grace, Al-
so visiting in the Grace home 
were Mr, and Mrs. Emzy Hobos 
of Littlusicld and -Mr. and 117. s. 
Darwin Hobbs and family of 
Seagraves. 

- 

VISIT BROTHER 

Mr. and Mrs W. E. 'Walling 
were in Lubooc. su .day s.t 
ing in the home of Mr, and 
Mrs. Bob Walling, 

Mrs. Donna Bevers, who 
seriously ijured in a car acci-
dent several weeks ago is re-
ported much improved, and 
expects to return to her home 
this weekend, 

HAVE VISITORS 

VISIT GRANDPARENTA 

Linda, Pattie. Waynie and_ 
Sheree. Morgan of Denver City 
spent.-the weekend with' their 
grandparents. Mr. and Mrs_ 
Dennis Rasberry. 

Mr Guests Saturday night in tne 	.and Mrs. Luther Wilson,  
Rodney and Mike were in home of ivirs, nod i‘:orris were 

-Su port our local merchants 	 J 	 Rails Sunday visiting with his Mr. and Mrs. im Brattian and and schools-this is our hornet 	 sister., Miss•:Leola Wilson .- girls of Levelland, Mr. and Mrs 

-Be sure to Jun your trash J. Cr Whitfield and Baroara of 

when you put it in your box _ 
reis. 

SCHOOL CALENDAR 
Following, Is and calendar 

for the Ropes Public Schools 
for the school year, 1966-67: 
March 3, TSTA Meeting. 
March. 24 - April a. -Easter. 

(out afternoon March 24 
begin on. April_ 3)) 

May 26, School Closes. 
Junior, High Graduation, May 

25, 800 p.m. 
High School-,Graduation, May 

26, 8:00 p.m. 

Piano Tuning and Repair-
ing. Over 30 Years Experience 
Satisfaction Guaranteed. 

ARTIST PIANO LAB 
F. L. Davis, Master Technician 

Call 562-3852 or 562-3661, 
Ropesvtlle 

Mr, and Mrs. Pete Ryals 
were in Stradford over the 
weekend 

Lubbock, and Mr, and Mrs. B. 
Thomas and family. 

es z rt., On. 

Loyd Brant was injured on 
Tuesday afternoon when the 
elevator he was riding at 
Goodpasture Grain fell with 
him, He was taken to Uni-
versity Hospital in Lubbock 
where he is receiving trc,./.,-
ment. Wednesday morning it{{ 
was stated that he .did-not 
suffer any broken bones, 

-000 v— 

Mr. and Mrs, 
Emor

y Hobbs 
and Mr.. and Mrs. J. C. Dorsett 
and boys of Brownfield attend 
ed services Sunday at the bea-: 
utEul new Primitive Baptist 
Church in Floydada. Dinner I 

Mission Baptist Church 
Bob Sena, Pastor 

SUNDAY SERVICES: 
/0:00 	 'Sunday' School 
11:00 	 Worship Service 

and Preaching 
7:00 	 Training Union 
7:30 	 Worship Service 

and Preaching 
Mission Study Mondays 7:00 

• 

IN NEW MEXICO 

were in Dallas the first part 	 • 
	. Those enjoying a sking trip. 

of the, week, . 	
was served- to appro 	ately to Red River, New Mexico this 

itwo hundred people in the .new week are Mr. and Mrs. Omer . - of. 	 I .1 ing room. 	 I Lee Dalton, Mr. and Mrs Ken- /%11:1*. and Mrs. J. C. Pointer I Afterwards they visited In 
alas Linda were in Hobbs, New neth Means, Mr. and Mrs. J 

Brownfield in the home of Mr. 
	J. 

Mexico Sunda where they 	 , T. Drake and Mr.- and Mrs. y  
visited Mr. and Mrs. Bud Crow and Mrs. Raliegh Burran. 	' James Means, Mr. and Mrs„ 
and family, and Mr.. and Mrs,' 	

o0o 	 Sammy Means returned home 
The Hardin-Simmons Une 

- 
home in Lubbock, PO 5-8541, Ext. I ie.,,a Is now at i be- 

Mr. and Mrs. Leon Yount 
EX-SERVICEMEN-

'iravei-good pay - liberal 
family allowances-fast ad-
vancement-excellent recreat 

meilities-30 days annual 
vacation-medical and dental 
bills paid-training in the heir. 
of your choice. if qualified. 

Don't let this outstanding 
opportunity slip by.-Go Navy 
-Call the U.S. Navy Recruiter 

First Methodist CFurch 
Homer Hencierson, Pastor 

SUNDAY SERVICES' 
Sunday School 	 10:00 am, 
Worship Service .... 11:00 a.m. 
Evening Service .... 6:00 p.m. 
Choir Practice 	 7:00 p.m 

Deacnine for news and ads 
to be printed in a Thursday 
Issue of the paper must be in 
by 5:00 p.m. Tuesday. Thi' 
is necessary so that we ma: 
get it set up, and the paper 
on the press Wednesday af-
ternoon in order to make the 
mail by Thursday morning. 

o0o— 
Read the ads. Almost eve-

rything you need is in Ropes! 

• . 

Church of Christ 
Buck Griffith, Minister • 1^1— Iverstty Ct.:••• ri: C' rift 'eft 	or 

wean semesters at Tech 	their annual tour January 28. REPORTED IMPROVED 
Classes  	10:00 A iv 228 or Cometo Room 204, U.S. 

Timmy Moore, small son of 
Rev, and Mrs. Gene Austin. 
Moore is still in Children's 
Hospital in Denver, Colorado 
and was reported in a very 
critical condition Monday, 

Tuesdays report stated he 
seemed to be some inThyroved, 

R C H 	 / 	 Sunday. 

Services Bunday: 
I Mike Timmons, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Herman Timmons, is 
a vocal soloists with this 
group. 

Post Office Building, Lubbock. 
,•—o0o-- 

January 28 through Febru-
ary 28 has been designated as 
Venereal Disease Education 
Month by proclamation of 
C.Toveilaor John Connally. Jesse 

0. 4 . Jr'. George, btate ttepsesei.,. - 
- 50 :ore of the 75th District and 

issall Cummings, State Rep-
resentative of the 22nd Dis-

. Wet made the presentation of 
the proclamation to Dr, Van 
C. Tipton, Director of Com-
municable Diseases, Texas 
state Health Department and 
William Powers, Vice-Presi-
dent of the Texas Jaycees, 
representing two of the organ-
izations sponsoring the Jaint 
Action Conference Against Ve-
nereal Disease in cooperation 
aith the Texas Medical Asso-
liation, the. Texas P.T,A_, and 
ti number of other key state 
organizations.. The conferen-
ce was held on'. January 28 at 
the Texas MedicaL Association 
building in Austin. 

.: —000- — 

Preston Darby was reported 
taken off the critical list at 
Methodist Hospital last week, 
lie was injured in an automo-
bile accident a few weeks ago. 

morning Wnnthtp....10:50 
Wnrsnly 	6:00 

Wednesday Night 	 7:00 
000 

rInTra of the NazRrene 

Rev. Ivy Bohannon. Past(); 
Sunday Services: 

re- 
this 
the 

James L. Mea-s is 
much improved 
She happened to 

Mrs. 
ported 
w eek. 

YOU CAN GET 
RELIEF FROM 

HEADACHE PAIN 

misfortune of falling on soniti 
rocks last week at the lake 
and broke some ribs. She stay-
a few days in Lubbock at the 
home of her da...- ghter, Mr. and 
Mrs. Edward Barbee, but is 
now at home, 

---000--- 

";1111( LIT Q hoof 
Morning worship 	 10 
NYPS 	 • 6:00 p.m 
Evening Service 	 6:30 p.m 
Wednesday Evening: 
Prayer Meeting 	 7:00 p.m 

Mr. and Mrs. Bob Drake and 
family and Mr_ a id Mrs. Mar-
vin Drake and family of Lub-
_ock, and Mrs. W. 0. Drake of' 
Ropes visited over the week 
end near Seminole with Mr 

ci tvirs. Dos.r.e Forbus, 

Oscar (Cotton ) Fanning, 41 
Advertising and Public Relate 

RETURN HOME 

' Mrs Ulys Gregg returned: 
home recently from East Tex-
as where she had been visit-
ing relatives. 

000--- 

ON SICK LIST 
Mr grid Mrs. 0, W. Dalton 

were in Lubbock Sunday where 
they visited Mrs. Ida Forrest 

is in a convalscent home 

Mrs Jim Gotcher is report-
ed to be ill this week and was; 
taken fo Brownfield Tuesday 

there, 	 I for medical care. 

ions Director of the Plains 
Cotton growers, Inc., since 
March of 1963, has been nam-
ed Executive Assistant of the 
23-county organization.. 

STANBACK gives you FAST relief 
from pains of headache, neuralgia, 
neuritis,,and minor pains of arthritis, 
rheumatism. Because STANBACK 
contains several medically-approved 
and prescribed ingredients for fast 
relief, you can take STANBACK with 
confidence. Satisfaction guaranteed! 

Test 	Soup &re( ivilh 
STANBACK 
against any 
preparation 
you've ever 

used , 

case— 

SAME ITCHING? 

PeNoERS 

Let doctor's formula stop it. 
7emo speeds soothing relief to ex-
ternally caused, itching of eczema, 
minor rashes, skin irritations, non-
poisonous insect bites. Desensitizes 
nerve endings. Kills millions of sur-
face germs, aids healing. "De-itch" 
skin with Zemo, Liquid or Ointment. 
Quick relief, or your money back! 

•1401.0-rwrosiwastnee ,..atc",..""•••• 	ada Relit 
004 Hou$clmeol~c 11.41041, IMAM 

;::; • $C 

om Q 

10¢ 250 690 98¢ 

#itwelz bcfr _dues Physician Opposes 
Institutions for Birth Defect Victims • 

Then, there's that once a month 
when a girl could use a good old-fashioned 
medicine. 

6-c.v. John Con,ally has des--
gnated the week of Feb. 6-10 
is "Farni Bureau Membership 
Week" in Texas. Maybe you feel just plain bad then. Or 

maybe a little lonely and sad, like you could use a pair of 
arms around you. 

Well, we have just the thing for this once a 
month time. Lydia E. Pinkham Tablets. They're made with 
gentle, natural ingredients, including one that works to help 
relax tightened muscles that give you cramps. Plus a little 
iron that a girl could use at a time like this. And, you don't 
run any chance of the kind of unpleasant side effects you 
could get from some of the net.vcr drugs. 

With an old-fashioned problem like this, 
couldn't you take an old-fashioned medicine. 

Lydia E. Pinkham 
Tablets and Liquid Compound 

ENJOY UTMOST_SHAVONO 
EASE AND CONVENIENce 

-Gil le ae 
Super-Speed‘RAZwilt 
WITH BLUE BLADE 

DISPENSER AND 
STYRENE CASE 

$10 
• • 

The human stampede is 
under way the moment the 
tall doctor strides into . the 
waiting room. 

With a flying tackle, a five-
year-old, born with nine birth 
defects, catches him around 
one thigh, and refuses to let 
go. A little girl, who's only four 
and has been blind since birth, 
knows instinctively he's ar-
rived and gleefully latches on 
to his belt. 

"A typical day," Dr. Paul 
H. LaMarche says cheerfully 
to a visitor a.: he peels off the 
children and sidesteps a 

of advancing mothers. 
The embattled doctor is di-

rector of the March of Dimes 
Birth Defects Center at Rhode 
Island Hospital, Providence. 
He is a pediatrician who feels 
strongly that the last place for 
a defective child,:with few ex-
ceptions, is an institution for 
the handicapped. 

NURSE COMFORTS young patient during checkup visit to March 
of Dimes Birth Defects Center at Rhode Island Hospi:.11, Providence. 

"We regard it here as part 
of the Bill of Rights that all 
of these children with birth 
defects are entitled to the best 
diagnosis and treatment, re-
gardless of race, finances or 
superstitions of the past," Dr. 
LaMarche says. 

"A d,scade ago, even five 
years ago, almost every one 
of these children would have 
been sent to some institution. 
There they would have been 
forgotten as they wasted away 
and sometimes died. These 
tragedies still happen. But 
more and more of these afflict-
ed children are with their par-
ents in their own homes, where 
they belong, learning to be-
come useful citizens." 

A tousled five-year-old yells 
"Hi, Doc!" and buries a small 
fist in the pediatrician's mid-
riff. 

"Craig lien thinks he's an-
other Jack Dempsey. Maybe 
clone day he will be. He was 
horn with a good part of his 
spinal Cord, membranes and 

gets into the usual small-boy 
mischief. He's in the stream of 
life where he belongs." 

Gilda, born without eyes, 
has a radiant smile although 
in her sightless world there 
would seem little to smile 
about. "The basic aim," Dr. 
LaMarche says, "is to get 
Gilda into nursery school as 
soon as possible. Artificial 
eyes will improve her appear-
ance, minimize comment from 
the unthinking, and help elim-
inate the stigma that cruelly 
but inevitably attaches to the 
blind." 

Thus the mending of these 
small defective bodies pro-
gresses each week at the 
Birth Defects Center in Provi-
dence, just as it does in San 
Francisco and Denver and 
Chicago and at more than 70 
other March of Dimes Centers 
across the nation. 	• 

nerves sticking out of his back. 
We repaired the opening and 
today he swings by his knees 
from the monkey bars at school 
and climbs his neighbor's trees 
to swipe apples. But most 
medical thinking at the time 
of Craig's birth was that 
a meningomyelocele always 
meant you had a paraplegic 
onyour hands-total paraly-
sis below the waist." 

Another five-year-old named 
Tommy is a classic case in the 
annals of children who have 
survived despite multiple con-
genital malformations. 

"Tommy has known just 
about every severe birth defect 
in the book," the pediatrician 
says, "from dislocated hips 
and elbows to cleft palate and 
curvature of the spine. 

"Despite all this, Tommy's 
life now is pretty much that of 
normal kids. He plays ball and 



NOTICE— 

ZIP CODE DIRECTORY 
Covers all 50 states, plus U. S. 
possessions, $1.00. See or call 
Mrs. J. R. Smith 562-3a82 2-2 

NOTICE— 

City Marshall O'Neal Fox 
stated this  week that he will, 
dispose of any stray dogs  a-
round your home if you will! 
contact him.  

You have an 
ALL-ELECTRIC 

KITCHEN 

including a modern, work-

saving electric range, plus 

other major electric appli-

ances. A Medallion kitchen 

lightens housework and gives 

the homemaker more time 
for he; family. 

"We accept burial policies of all companies" 

FRANKLIN—BARTLEY FUNERAL HOME 
GM 34th Street 	 tAbbocilt. Teas 

Phone SWift 9-3666 cded 

*mil 

roll.' 

l'jrth-Lliti-Li 1 1 1 I 1 1 I 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 

You have 
FULL HOUSEPOWER 

WIRING 

Total Electric Gold Medallion 
homes have plenty of circuits 
for present appliances, and 
for those you'll add in the 
future. Full housepower also 
means plenty of electric 
outlets--located for your 
convenience. 
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00o 	 Dear Nola - I broke my left 
FOR SATE— 	 wrist two weeks ago  and my 

h Five Pickup Campers; three hand is in a cast. I had a  
Pickup Covers; 	Wholesale term paper to hand in, so I 

dictated it to a friend who Pric,es; Will Finance Cab-Over types. Well, when I handed 
Campers. S. B. Berry, Ropes- 
vine, Texas. 	 . 	in, the teacher began to 

holler that I cheated because 

THANKS-- 	 I couldn't have typed the 
I theme with a broken wrist. 

Odessa Senior 

(Delayed) 
I want to thank each one 

for every card and every visit 

—00o-- 
CARD OF MOTES 

F
l  

purse. Should I tell her, or 
what? 

Plucked Heti 

Dear Plucked - What would 
you think if she told you that 
your child was,a,thief? I think 
you'd, better keep your mouth 
shut—and your purse out of 
reach of her children. 

not know enough -not to leave 
the baby in the bathtub alone 
Jr not to let tse older kid go 
out in the snow barefooted, I 
am a nervous wreck trying to 
work and wondering all the' 
time what muddle-headed. 
thing she's  doing at home. Do 
you have the answer for this 

Mary Lynn Gresham, by fin-
ishing first in a written home 
making knowledge and atti-
tude examinatiin for senior 
girls December 6, became the 
Ropes High School's  1967 Bet-
ty Crocker Homemaker o f 
Tomorrow. 

Mary Lynn is  now eligible 
for possible state and nation-
al , scholarship awards., Her 
test also earned her a special-
ly designed silver charm from 
General Mills, sponsor of the 
Betty Crocker Search for the 
American Homemaker or 
morrow. 

A state Homemaker of To -
morrow and runner-up will ue 
selected -from the winners of 
all schools in the state; with 
the former receiving a $1,500 
college scholarship; her school 
will be given a complete set 
of Encyclopaedia Britannica 
by Encyclopaedia Britannica, 
Inc. The runner-up will be a-
warded a $500 educational 
grant. 

The Betty Crocker 

ROPES SCHOOL 

CAFETERIA MENU 

Wednesday - Beef patties 
mashed potatoes, green pea 
salad, chocolate pudding, hot 
Lolls, butter and milk.  

Thursday - Frito pie, pinto 
beans, cabboge and carrot L ai- • 
ad, applesauce cake, corn-
bread and milk. 

Friday - Hamburgers, pick-
les, potato chips, lettuce and I 
tomatoes, Jello with fruit and 
milk. 

tistics favor regularly  schedui 

,Vrt 
MAY LYNN GRESHAM 

al: other states  and the Dis-
trict of Columbia, each ac-
companied by her school ad-
visor, will join in an expense 
paid educational tour of Col-
onial Williamsburg, Va,, and 
Washington, D.C., next spring. 

The national winner — the 
1967 All-American Homemak- 

Levelland - James C.  Steple-
ton, 22, of Lubbock joined the 
Hockley County Extension 
staff here February 1 as an 
assistant county agricultural 
agent. 

Stapleton replaced Royer: 
Samford who has held the po-
sition since August 1964, ac-
cording to the joint announce 
ment of the personnel change 
made by Hockley County Jud-
ge Hulon Moreland and Ex-
tension District Agent Billy  C. 
Gunter, of Lubbock.  

er of Tomorrow—will be ah-
nounced at a dinner in Wil-
liamsburg. She will be chosen 
from the state winners  on the 
basis of original test score 
plus personal observation and 
interviews during the tour. 
Her reward will be an inc_ ease 
in her scholarship to $5,000. 
Second, third, and fourth 
ranking national winners  will 
have their original scholar-
ship grants increased to $4,000 
$3,000 and $2,000, respectively_ 

This is  the 13th year of VI 
Betty Crocker Search for 
American Homemaker of To-
morrow, initiated in 1954-55 
by General Mills to emphasize 
the importance of homemak-
ing as  a career. More 11e: 
5,000,000 senior girls have par 
ticipated in the Search sire 
its  inception, and 1,256 win-
ners will have earned scholar-
ships totaling $1,371,500 at the 
conclusion of the current pro-
gram. 

The 581,334 girls and 14,753 
schools registering tor the 1967 
Search established a new zee-
crd for the program. 

About $9,561,500 will be dis-
tributed to Texas veterans  in 
GI insurance and dividends 
during 41967, Jack Coker, NI,-
pager of the Veterans Admi-
nistration Regional Office in 
Waco, said recently. 

Visitors  in the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. James L. Means  this 
week were Mr. and Mrs. L. 13.  
Gill of Lovington, New Mexico, 
Mr and Mts. Buck Contira, 
and Mr. and Mrs. Ulna Conley 
of Levelland. 

Nob KnowsMary Lynn Gresham Named 
71da "lb 	Betty Crocker. Homemaker 

one of you. 
Ray Martin 

NOTICE 

Am teaching beginner and 
early grade piano students in 
my home. See or call Shyrle 
Ann Harris, 562-3932, Ropes 

ivorrIrriEt 

BAKE SALE— 
The Ropes Tops  Club will 

hold a bake sale Saturday„ 
February 4th at the Ropes 
Food Store, 

-000----- 
Boil-ling League Standings 

Fonos.ving are tne standings 
this week for the Ropes HOUS3 
wives Bowling League: 

C & C Gin 
Ropes Plainsman 
Wolf forth Shamrock 
Bowers Butane 
Means Flying Service 
Mansfield's Service 
Ropes Farmer's Co-Op Gin 
G & A Grain 
Ropes Food Store 
Jackson Electric 

• Bowlers of the week were 
Velda Wilson, Nelle Dalton, 
Lola Marcy, and Anita Means, 
Alternates were Lorili An-
drews and Emma Jean Nave, 

Milner Highland 
Lodge 

$20 per week, kitchenette 
apartments, swimming poi, 
all bills  paid, laundry, W.  R. 
Townsen. 

4 	
500 EAST BROADWAY 

PO 3-2846 

from my purse after I'd been 
n her house. Well, today I 
lonned by, -.lad I knew that I. 
had precisely $1.87. When I 
left, I counted my money and 

harl $1117. This confirms 
Triv fear that one of her child-
-en is taking money from my 

THE ROPES PLAINSMAN 

Published every Thursday 
at the Plainsman Office in 
Ropesville, 	Hockley County, 
Texas. 

Celeste Thomas. 
Publisher 	Editor 

• Entered as Second Class 
Matter at the Post Office in 
Ropesville, Texas 79358, as 
under the Acts of Congress 
March 3, 1897. 

Subscription Price 
One Year     $3.00 
Classified and Legal Notice 
rates: 15c line first inser-
tion, 10c line all subsequent 
insertions. Count five words 
to line. 

I would like to express my I explained, b t she said I _ Dear Nola - My wife doesn't 
appreciation to everyone for should have written it in long-  have any sense. I love her. 
the Pod, visits and cards dur- hand. She says 	make an but she's downright stupid, 
ing my illness. I"F" on the pa,.er and an "F", You may not think this As a 

Mrs. James L. Mea zs "n the course. Is there any- problem, but try leaving your 
thing I can do? 	 kids  with somebody who does 

NOTICE— 

IRONING WANTED 	 Dear Senior - A teacher who 
$1.75 per dozen except for would rather grade longhand 

p white shirts, 30c each. Mrs, papers than typewritten ones  
J. T. Allen, 562-4521, Ropes, 	should have her head examin- 

ed. It would have been bet- 
ter had you spoken to her first 
about your plans.  Have your 
parents send a note about the 
typing arrangements  and talk one? 
to the principal, if necessary. 	 Frightened Father  

of a woman who has several married her, and you are re- I 

children. As a matter of fact, sponsible 	for bringing tr‘..f 

she is  my best friend. Several children into the world. Is you 

times. I've been almost post.. could persuade her to marry 

' ive that money was missing you, maybe you can persuade 
her to look after the tots, You 
l'Irl  better try, anyhow. Good 
luck! 

De 
er to 

Dear Cat - Not 

MOMS DEPT. STORE 

MIUSES=EMZErtiMeRECEMT-S2V---Y.T. -11e..:...44MMEELNEfac... 

Clothing and Shoes 

for Men,Women,Children 

1-4 

VVAR° 

, 4 	L 

®
Iv

"
,
4  .-▪  - 

LIVE  BETIkit" 

'qt6TRICON*N.  

• You.  are to be commended, not I  Home- 
during my recent illness. How 	 Dear Frightened - YoU've maker of Tomorrow frolimonithei; 
could we get along without punished. 	 I started to worry rather late in 

you? y
ou  state, together with those trom 

friends, May God bless  each Dear Nola - I'm very fond the game, haven't  

Following is the menu for 
ale Ropes School Cafeteria, 
Feoruary 6 through 10th: 

Monday - Barbecued feiners 
ar Nola - Is it really saf-, sweet potatoes, buttered black 
fly than go by train? eyed peas, fruit cobbler, hot 

Fraidy Cat 
 

rolls, butter and milk. 
only do sta- I Tuesday - Fried chicken. 

green beans, scalloped pota-
toes, rice krisp:e cookies, hot 
rolis, butter and milk.. 

This Gold Medallion 
emblem on your 
home means... 

You have 
ELECTRIC 

COMFORT HEATING 

Dial the temperature you 

want in each room of your 

home and modern electric 

heating provides clean, quiet, 

economical comfort. Electric 

heating is the most modern 
heating available today! 

ed airlines, but the airlines , 	  
cater to you as a passenger.  
Railroad's had rather haul 
freight, and their attitude I 
shows it. Try flying! 

Send your letters to No18 
Knows, Box 411, Temple 
Texas. For a personal reply, 
enclose a stamped, self-ad-
dressed envelope. 

I 	1 	1 	1 	1 	1 	1 	1 	1 	1 	1 	1 	1 	1 	1 

ELLIS PHARMACY 
1213 HOUSTON 	 411 AUSTIN 
Phone 894-6056 	 Phone 894-3211 

LCVELLAND, TEXAS 

ELECTRIC 

COCKROACHES - Rats, mice, 
termites, gophers and other 
household pests exterminat-4 
ed. GUARANTEED Davidson 
Pest Control, 111 First St, or 
phone 894-3824. Levelland. 

ASK YOUR PUBLIC SERVICE MANAGER 
FOR COMPLETE INFORMATION 

3-3 

.4-"Vatti 
'74 111.1,1,G,..:',4"4 
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Specials for Friday &Saturday 
PLUS GOLD BOND STAMPS 

FREE! Each week for 2 Weeks! 
"Celeste" Dinnerware With Purchase of $7.00 or More 

A FABULOUS OPPORTUNITY TO OWN BEAUTIFUL, QUALITY DINNERWARE! EACH WEEK FOR 20 WEEKS YOU WILL 
RECEIVE ONE ITEM FREE WITH YOUR PURCHASE OF $7.00 OR MORE. THIS PURE WHITE DINNERWARE IS DECORAT-
ED WITH A DELICATE LEAF DESIGN AND IS RICHLY ENHANCED WITH A GENUINE PLATINUM EDGING. "CELESTE" WILL 
LEND CHARM AND ELEGANCE TO YOU: FAIKILY'S EVERYDAY DINING. START YOUR SET TODAY! 
11.....21.1155.1021Erl 

BRER RABBIT 	 34 OUNCE 

SYRUP 
SHURFINE Cueun;ber Chips 16 Ounces 

PICKLES 	 _ .23 
16 OUNCES 

Mayonaise 	.39 
IEDIUM 	 DOZE, 

Eggs 	.39 
THREE POUNDS 

SHORTENING  	 1_ .59 
CHEER LAUNDRY 	GIANT SIZE 

DETERGENT 	• 	 1.69 
GIANT SIZE 

IVIR. CLEAN ......._. 	 .49 
NIAGARA SPRAY 	22 OUNCES 

STARCH 	 .67 
AURORA BATH 	TWO ROLL PACK 

TISSUE 	. _ _ 	_...23 
MINUTE 	 14 OUNCES 

RICE .. 	 _ 	1.43 
GLADIOLA TEN POUND PRINT BAG 

Flour 	.99 
AUSTEX BEANS WITH 	24 OUNCES 

CHILI   ,55 
SHURFINE WHOLE SWEET 21 OUNCES 

POTATOES 	 
SH URFIN E HALVES 
	

BOB SITU 

PEARS 
24 OUNCES 

GRAPE JUICE 

MEATS 
USDA GRADE A 
	

POUND 

FRYERS_  
FRESH GROUND 	THREE POUNDS 

BEEF 	 ....... . 	.... .89 
FRESII BEEF 

LIVER .. 	 29 
USDA CHOICE CHUCK 

	
POUND 

STEAK  	.49 
44191 	 POUND 

ROAST __ 	 .59 
PILLSBURY ICE BOX 

COOKIES 	" 	..... .39 

.oltztett.:FAPAL 

LiVertabee4  
TEXAS 	 FIVE POUND BAG 

ORANGES  	. 39 
POUND 

GRAPES   __ .19 
POUND 

GRAPEFRUIT    _.__.... .10 

Conveniente  FROZEN FOODS 
MORTON HONEY 

BUNS__ _ 	 .25 
BRUSSFI, 	 10 OUNCES 

SPROUTS 	 .,27 
CAL IDA FRENCH .IED 2 POUNDS 

POTATOES 
	

29 

.43 

Wednesday Is Double Stamp Day 

'Co--ES FOOD STORE 
	 1=11111nrailli!, 	 
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