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Awards Banquet Honors 
Leading MHS Students 

Outstanding students in ac-
ademics a n d athletics at 
Muenster High School were 
recognized Thursday night in 
the annual awards banquet 
sponsored by t h e Parent-
Teacher Organization. 

It was the event which re-
vealed several selections for 
top awards of the year, along 
with recognition of many 
more students for their par-
ticipation in scholastic and 
sports activity. 

For the second consecutive 
year Mark Sicking was 
awarded the Hornet Hustler 
trophy, the school's most cov-
eted prize in sports, signify- 

Graduates at TSTI 
Leila Grant, daughter of 

Mr. and Mrs. A. V. Grant, 
will graduate Saturday, May 
28, from the floriculture-hor-
ticulture program at Texas 
State Technical Institute. She 
is a 1974 graduate of Muenster 
High School. 

ing outstanding effort as well 
as good records. 

Another awaited announce-
ment by Coach Jones is the 
election of Bert Walterscheid 
and Nick Walterscheid as co-
captains of next year's Hor-
net football team. 

The coach introduced mem-
bers of the 1976 football team 
and named those who were 
selected on all district and all 
area teams. In addition he re-
viewed a very successful sea-
son in which MHS advanced 
to semi finals of the state 
playoffs, the best season ever 
in MHS history. Likewise in 
tennis and golf, Jones listed 
team members and extent of 
success in UIL competition. 

Coach Wade White did as 
much for boys and girls bas-
ketball teams. He identified 
players, named those selected 
for all district and recalled 
season records. In baseball al-
so he named team members 

(Gontinued on Page 12) 
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Fred Hennigan Sr. 
Gets Award for 
Yard of the Month 

Mr. and Mrs. Fred Henn, 
gan, Sr., were named winners 
of the "Yard of the Month 
Award" for May, when the 
Muenster Garden Club re-ac-
tivated its Yard of the Month 
program recently. 

The garden club-sponsored 
program has a two-fold pur-
pose: to call attention to es-
pecially attractive yards in 
Muenster and to motivate 
home owners to take pride 
in the beauty of their yards. 

The program is beginning 
its third summer. In 1975 and 
1976, winners were the homes 
of Leo Henscheid, Herbert 
Meurer, Richard Grewing, 
Henry Weinzapfel, Herbert 
Miller, Leonard Endres, Frank 
Zirnanerer, Steve Crewing, 
Henry Starke. Mrs. Ed Pets 
and At Felderhoff. 

Points considered include 
the general attractive appear-
ance both front and sides; 
harmony in the variety of 
plants; and evidence of much 
wo•k and care. 

The incomplete address of 
the winner of the historical 
quilt offered at Germanfest 
by the Sacred Heart Choral 
Group led members on a frus-
trating search for a full week. 

The search finally led to 
Mrs. Bill Copley, Rt. 4, Sher-
man. When Mrs. Leon Fleit-
man spoke to her on the 
phone last week Thursday she 
learned that Mrs. Copley and 
her husband had been in 
Muenster during Germanfest 
and had visited exhibits in 
the big tent. 

Their trip to Muenster came 
about when they visited a 
niece, Bobby Lynn Bruton, a 
surgery patient in Muenster 
Memorial Hospital, 

Mrs. Copley told Mrs. Fleit-
man they were favorably im-
pressed by the wonderful care 
Miss Bruton received and by 
the friendliness of the entire 
community. She was particul-
arly interested in the Choral 
Group's booth where several 
pieces of handwork were 
displayed, in addition to the 
quilt. Her husband, however, 
found the summer sausage in 
Fischer's booth more to his 
liking. 

Mrs. Fleitman, explained 
the quilt's origin and meaning 
and asked if Mrs. Copley 
would allow the group to buy 
it. The winner volunteered to 
donate the quilt, and her hus-
band suggested a "trade for a 
stick of summer sausage". 

Mrs. Copley said she was 
returning the quilt "to all 
Muenster people" in appreci-
ation for the wonderful care 
her niece received at the hos-
pital and for many kindnesses 
showered on her relatives. 

Father Placidus agreed to 
allow the quilt to be displayed 
in the lobby of the Commun-
ity Center in a suitable cab-
inet. 

The Copleys will be sur-
prised Friday with a visit 
from several grateful Choral 
Group members who will 
present a goodly supply of 
summer sausage donated by 
Butch and Johnny Fisher. 

Chamber Favors 
Study of Ways to 
Boost Muenster 

With a goal of making the 
most of opportunities to pro-
mote the community, direc-
tors of the Muenster Chamber 
of Commerce have organized 
a committee to study possible 
activities and adopt a plan 
for the year. 

John Pagel, president, an-
nounced the decision at Tues-
d a y's regular membership 
meeting, staling the year's 
only activities at this time 
are t h e Germanfest and 
Christmas parade and draw-
ing, and that other occasions 
might be developed, even 
though they are less ambiti-
ous than the present projects. 

Persons appointed to the 
committee are Directors Bill 
Bedrick. Jane Monday and 
Pat Hennigan along with 
Members Len Endres, Henry 
Weinzazpfel and Jewel Otto. 

A crowded meeting heard 
a complimentary report on 
Germanfest by its chairman 
Alvin Fuhrman. He said that 
visitors praised it highly and 
the operation throughout was 
attractive and efficient. He 
particularly praised Frank 
Luke for a fine entertainment 
schedule, Al Walter for safety 
and security and Edgar Dyer 
with FFA members for keep-
ing the place neat. John 
Pagel added that Fuhrman in 
giving credit had overlooked 
the best achievement of all. 
his own leadership as gener-
al chairman David Bright 
said that neither receipts or 
expeoditures are complete at 
this time and said the com-
plete report probably will be 
available at the next meeting. 

In direct conflict with hi 
campaign promise to stream-
line the federal government, 
President Carter has pro-
posed the creation of an Ag-
ency for Consumer Advocacy. 
He is pushing an idea that 
has been around for a long 
time and came uncomfortably 
close to enactment last year 
when it passed the House of 
Representatives but was stop-
ped by a filibuster in the Sen-
ate. 

Present signs are that the 
proposal has a better chance 
of success this year. With the 
Congress leaning heavily to-
ward the liberal side as a re-
sult of the last election, and 
with a recent change of Sen-
ate rules to make filibustering 
more difficult, it is easily pos-
sible that the bureaucratic 
monstrosity will be imposed 
on the country under the guise 
of protecting the consumer. 

Like so many brainstorms 
originating in Washington. the 
proposed bill is founded on 
two  questionable premises. 
The first one is that we the 
public don't have much smart 
and the bureaucrats need to 
take care of us. The other is 
that addition of another 
watchdog to the already over-
popuated federal kennel is 
justified because it is being 
done for our own good. Of 
course it makes no difference 
that we don't like being 
charged for services we don't 
want, and we especially don't 
want more federal snoopervis-
ion disrupting our lives. 

As proposed in this legisla-
tion. a new agency would be 
authorized to involve itself in 
any operation that "may sub-
stantially affect the interest 
of consumers . ", which means 
almost anything. With no ap-
parent limit on their jurisdic-
tion, the bureaucrats of this 
agency appear to have monu-
mental possibilities of con-
trols size and cost. The far 
reaching effect of its efforts 
could become a burden to the 
country's entire economic 
system. 

And it should not be for-
gotten that losses imposed on 
American business have to be 
recovered in price increases. 
Like taxes, the expenditures 
are not paid by business but 
passed on to us customers. So, 
we'll pay double. Our taxes 
will sustain the bureaucracy, 
and higher prices will pay for 
the harm it does. 

The idea is all the more ob-
jectionable because it is so 
unnecessary. Congress has al-
ready provided a multitude 
of watchdogs to protect us. 
We have Truth in Lending, 
Truth in Packaging and La-
beling and Truth in Advertis-
ing. These are already added 
to long established regulat6ry 
agencies such Interstate 
Commerce Commission, Fed-
eral Trade Commission, Fed-
eral Power Commission, Se-
curities and Exchange Com-
mission and others. 

Besides the official regula-
tion, the public receives also 
the benefit of self discipline 
by business firms through or-
ganizations like the Better 
Business Bureau. And finally 
we have the fact that Amer-
ican business generally is on 
the square. Most people are 
honest as a matter of princi-
ple, and some as a matter of 
policy. Admitting there are 
also some rip-offs, we doubt 
Whether they would cost the 
nation as much as the pro-
posed Consumer Protection 
Agency. 

Though due credit for an 
effort to conserve more ener-
gy, the administration falls 
pitifully short in one import. 
ant respect. It failed to re- 

(Continued on Page 12) 

Len Endres Named 
On Texoma Area 
Plan Commission 

Leonard Endres, counc.lman 
and mayor-pro-tem of the 
City of Muenster, is a new 
member of the Texoma Re-
gional Planning Commission, 
which is an association of lo-
cal governmental units within 
Cooke, Grayson and Fannin 
Counties. 

He is the representative of 
the cities of Muenster, Whites-
boro, Van Alstyne, Howe and 
Whiteveright, succeeding a 
Whitesboro man who recently 
resigned. By-laws of the com-
mission provide that cities of 
the area with less than 5000 
population may be jointly re-
presented by one person. 

Appointment of Endres took 
place last Friday in a meeting 
in Sherman of the mayors 
concerned. He was nominated 
by Bright and approved by 
all. The member must be an 
elected official and his term is 
for three years. 

Mayor Bright said that the 
membership of Endres on the 
comrnisison is fortunate for 
Muenster in that it provides a 
closer contact than before. It 
enables the city to keep bet-
ter informed on available 
services and funds. The com-
mission is an agency through 
which state and federal aid 
are channeled to governmental 
units of the area. 

Suspension of SH 
Athletic Program 
Removed by TCIL 

Athletic suspension of Sac-
red Heart teams in the Texas 
Catholic Interscholastic League 
has been removed. Coach Ed-
die Stock said Wednesday that 
the  school is eligible to com-
pete for district and state hon-
ors, however its probation will 
continue through the next 
school year. 

Stock said that Charles 
Bartush and Sylvan Walter-
scheid accompanied him to 
hearing with TCIL executive 
officers at Dallas, at which 
it was determined that the 
suspension was based on a 
misunderstanding, but also 
that any further misbehavior 
of fans cannot be tolerated. 

The officials issued a warn-
ing that adults as well as 
students have the responsi-
bility to conduct themselves 
in a sportsmanlike manner at 
all athletic events and the 
school will definitely suffer if 
another violation occurrs. 

Softball Players 
Urged to Return 
Forms by Friday 

Permission slips for the 
girls softball summer pro-
gram, are available at both 
schools and girls in grades 
3-11 are urged to sign up and 
return the completed form to 
their principal's office by Fri-
day, May 19. 

A meeting will be held Sun-
day, May 15, at 2 p.m. in the 
new Pavilion at the Park. 
All players are urged to at-
tend because teams will be 
selected at this time. If nec-
essary, there will be the op-
portunity for late signup. 

Practices will start as soon 
as school closes. First games 
will be on Tueday, May 31, 
starting at 7 p.m. 

Girls wishing to sign up but 
unable to attend Sunday may 
phone Mrs. Wayne Grewing, 
759-4119. 

Bowling Tourney 
Sponsored Sunday 
By S. H. Lettermen 

Elated with the success of 
its former bowling tourna-
ment, the Sacred Heart Let-
termen's Club is busy prepar-
ing for another which will be 
held Sunday, the 14th, starting 
1 p.m. at the Lone Star Lanes 
of Gainesville. 

The tourney will be held 
in men's and ladies' divisions, 
each further divided into 
three age groups, under 19, 
19 to 35. and over 35. Compe-
tition will be by individuals 
rather than teams and scores 
will be determined by adding 
three games. Trophies will be 
awarded to first and second 
place in each age group of 
the two divisions. Entry fee 
of $4 per person covers the 
cost of three games plus shoe 
rental. 

The previous tournament 
had 77 contestants, a figure 
adopted by lettermen as the 
goal to beat this time. 

Daniel Fette Gets 
Commission and 
Diploma at A&M 

Daniel H. Fette received a 
Bachelor of Arts degree in 
English Friday night in grad-
uation ceremonies at Texas 
A & M University. He was a 
battalion commander in the 
Corps of Cadets, held the rat-
ing of Distinguished Military 
Student, was 1976 winner of 
the Lt. Ralph E. Hill Memor-
ial Award and the 1978 Dis-
tinguished Service Award of 
the Memorial Student Center 
Council and Directorate. He 
was a member of the Fresh-
man Drill Team and a four 
year member of the A & M 
Town Hall. During the past 
semester he earned the aca-
demic rating of Distinguished 
Student for a grade point av-
erage of 3.33, Minimum re-
quirement for the DS is 3.25. 

Graduation was preceded 
by the ceremony of swearing 
into a branch of the armed 
service, the oath being ad-
ministered by his brother, 
First Lt David Fette of Fort 
Hood. Traditionally the new 
officer may be sworn in by a 
commissioned officer of his 
choice. 

The formal commissioning 
ceremony was held Saturday 
afternoon with presentation of 
conenissions by General David 
C. Jones, chief of staff of the 
US Air Force. 

All ceremonies were at-
tended by Dan's parents, the 
R. N. Fettes and by his bro-
ther and sister-in-law, Lt, and 
Mrs. David Fette. 

The young officer chose the 
field artillery branch of the 
Army. His first assignment is 
to temporary duty at Fort 
Sill, Okla., beginning May 18, 
and regular duty is expected 
to be in Germany 'beginning 
in November. He is a grad-
uate of Muenster High School. 

Another A & M graduate 
and newly commissioned offi-
cer is Thomas Gerard Koelzer 
of Hereford, a relative of the 
local Koelzer and Luke fam-
ilies. His parents are Mr. and 
Mrs. Werner Koelzer. He was 
commissioned an Ensign in 
the Navy with first assign-
ment at Pensacola, Fla. 

Eaves is well qualified by ex-
perience and special training. 
He has completed•a 520 hour 
course in general police sci-
ence at the Dallas Polio* 
Academy, an 80 hour course 
for patrol investigators at the 
Texas Regional Police Acad-
emy in Arlington, a course on 
homicide investigation at the 
North Central Texas Regional 
Police Academy, and an FBI 
course on fin4erprint classifi-
cation. In addition he has had 
a year of experience as a 
private investigator in Dallas. 
For the past two year, 
he has been self employed as 
a barber. 

Before his police work 
Eaves spent one year at El 
Centro Junior College and 
one and a half years at Sam 
Houston State University, 
then served three years in the 
Army. 

Eaves is 30 years old, mar.. 
ried, the father of a son, S 
years, and a daughter, 9 
months. The family plans to 
make its home here as soon 
as suitable living quarters can 
be located. 

Eaves said his intention is 
to keep the town orderly and 
safe in an atmosphere of 
cheerfulness and cooperation. 
His aim is a spirit of com-
munity pride and voluntary 
compliance with the law, re-
quiring a minimum of en-
forcement. Anyone with a 
problem is urged to come and 
discuss it 

Speech Students 
Enter Tournament,  

Twenty one Sacred Heart 
7th and 8th grade speech stu-
dents participated in the 
Jesuit College Prep School 
speech tournament on Satur-
day, April 30. 

Advancing to semi-final in 
original oratory were Jenny 
Felderhoff, Susie Felderhoff, 
Carol Walterscheid, Tim Voth, 
Kathy Koch and Ted Koer-
schner. Kathy and Ted ad-
vanced to finals and brought 
home the first and third place 
trophies in their division. 

Entered in duet acting were 
Donna Hess and Sheltie Wal-
terscheid; Craig Bayer and 
Dean Swirczynski, Jenny Fel-
derhoff and Susie Felderhoff. 
Jenny and Susie advanced to 
semi-finals in this division. 

In prose were Mark Miller, 
Brenda Henscheid, Diane Cap-
linger, Tina Hesse, Sam Hem 
and Troy Wolf. 

In poetry were Donna Hess, 
Tim Voth, Donna Trubenbach, 
Susie Felderhoff, Sharon Voth 
and Sherri Muller. Tim Voth 
advanced to Semi-finals. 

Dramatic interpretation was 
entered by Carol Walterscheid 
who advanced to the semi-
finals. 

Original oratory was en-
tered by Lisa Hennigan, Col-
leen Fette, Thane Caplinger, 
Kathy Each and Ted Hoer-
schner. Kathy and Ted pro-
gressed thru semis and ad-
vanced to finals. Kathy was 
first place winner and Ted 
third place winner. This was 
the first time any of this 
group was entered in this 
category. 

Competition in the tourna-
ment was against experts and 
the students performed in an 
excellent manner. They were 
back in compett;on on 
May 7 at Ursuline Academy 
in Dallas. 

Accompanying them a n d 
furnishing transportation on 
April 30 were Mrs. Charles 
Bayer, Mrs. Ted Henscheid 
and Mrs. King Koch. Judges 
were Mrs. Tom Sangster and 
Cindy Sangster. Mrs. William 
Koerschner is t b e speech 
coach. 

Checkup Scheduled 
For Canner Gauges 

Homemakers may have their 
pressure Ca nne r gauges 
checked on Friday. May 20 
from 9:30 to 11:30 a.m. at the 
Cooke County Electric Co-op. 
It takes only a few moments 
to check the gauge using a 
master gauge tester, so home-
makers may bring their can• 
nee lids anytime during the 
scheduled check. 

If gauges need to be re-
placed, or if an adjusted tem-
perature is needed, the check 
will give this information. 

The program is being spon-
sored by the County Extension 
Service. Anyone with a ques-
tion is asked to call Evelyn 
Yeatts at 665-9991. 

Award at SFASU 
As a great finale to a glor-

ious basketball season Doris 
Felderhoff has been honored 
as the outstanding athlete of 
the year at Stephen F. ,Aus-
tin State University. 

She received the Ralph 
Todd Memorial Award Wed-
nesday night of last week at 
the annual awards banquet of 
SFASU. In the 26 year his-
tory of the award she is the 
university's first lady athlete 
ever to receive it. 

Sharing the thrill with her 
were her parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Henry Felderhoff, who 
were special guests of the 
program. Their presence and 
the award both were a sur-
prise to her. With the an-
nouncement the crowd of 550 
gave her a standing ovation. 
Her reply: "So many good 
things have happened to me 
this year. I really appreciate 
the honor and I love you all." 

Doris, the 6-0 center for the 
SFASU Ladyjaeks, is a mem-
ber of the Eastman Kodak 
All American Ladies' Collegi-
ate Basketball Team for the 
second consecutive year. In 
addition she was named to 
the Hanes All American Col-
legiate Women's Team. 

She was captain of the 
ladyjacks and led them to a 
state championship and a 
28-6 season record. Her per-
sonal record includes an aver-
age of 13 rebounds and 18.4 
points per game. The shoot-
ing average was .51 per cent 
in field goals and 75 per cent 
in free throws. 

Doris will graduate this 
year and will be back to 
SFASU next year as assist-
ant coach while working on a 
master degree. 

Mrs. Teddy Oakley will be 
admitted to Westgate Hospital 
in Denton next Wednesday, 
for knee surgery on Thurs-
day. 

Winner Returns 
Historic Quilt 
To Comm* 

Ted Koerschner 
To Spell Saturday 
In Regional Bee 

Cooke County champion 
Ted Koerschner of SHS will 
compete with 26 other North 
Texas spelling champions Sat-
urday, May 14 in the 19th an-
nual Dallas Morning News 
Regional Spelling Bee. 

Live and televised compe-
tition will begin at 11:30 am. 
on Channel 8. 

The regional champion will 
win an expense paid trip to 
Washington for himself and 
a sponsor, a 30 vol. set of En-
cyclopedia Britannica, a Zen-
ith Allegro stereo sound sys-
tem, the American Heritage 
Dictionary of the English 
Language and the 1977 World 
Almanac. 

Rfinner-up will receive a 
Zenith Allegro stereo sound 
system, a Webster's Collegi-
ate Dictionary and Webster's 
Collegiate Thesaurus. All 
county champions will receive 
Zenith portable FM-AM radios. 

Ted is the 13 year old son 
of the Wm. Koerschners. 

City Swim Pool 
Will Open May 21 

The 1977 swimming season 
in Muenster will open on Sat-
urday, May 21. 

The date was announced 
this week by Dan Hansic, 
park manager, who said that 
the operation will be very 
similar to that of last year. 

Swim time is from 1 to 7 
p.m. every day except Mon-
day, however it will be avail-
able for private swim parties 
when it is .not officially open. 
This means the pool can be 
leased any time Monday and 
before or after the regular 
time on the other . six days. 
Lease charge is $10 per hour, 
incluuding the service of a 
life guard. 

Regular admission price at 
the pool is 50 cents for chil-
dren under 13 and 75 cents 
for persons 13 years and older. 

Hamric heads the pool's 
personnel as park manager, 
and Sandy Dittfurth is the 
pool manager. Donna Swirczy-
ski, Charles Fette and Connie 
Flusche are life guards and 
Bob Hatnric is the basket room 
clerk. 

Before opening, the pool 
will get its annual coat of 
special water proof paint, and 
during the season the build-
ing will get its fix-up and 
pa i nt -up. 

Doris Felderhoff 
Gets Top Athletic 

Donna McClendon 
Is UD Graduate 

Donna Rohner McClen-
don, daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Arnold Rohner and a 
graduate of SHE will receive 
a Bacholar of Arts degree in 
Art, with specialization in 
Ceramics from the University 
of Dallas on Sunday, May 15. 

Baccalaureate Mass will be 
celebrated at 10 a.m., with 
graduation ceremony at 2 
p.m. in the Maker Athletic 
Center on the U. D. Campus. 

Mrs. McClendon is partici-
pating in the Senior Art 
Show, May 1-15 in the Gor-
man Lecture Center of the 
University of Dallas by ex-
hibiting a number of pieces 
of Salt-Fired Stoneware. The 
exhibit will remain open 
through graduation Sunday 
and all are welcome. 

Donna's parents and sisters 
and other family members 
will attend both events. 

Joe Bright Will 
Graduate at VMI 

Cadet Joseph A. Bright is 
among some 200 first class-
men of Virginia Military In-
stitute scheduled to graduate 
next Sunday. May 15. 

He is a civil engineer ma-
jor, receiving a bachelor of 
science degree. He is vice 
president of the Aviation Ex-
plorer Post, a member of the 
Arnold Air Society, a second 
lieutenant in the VIM Corps, 
a graduate of Muenster High 
School. His parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. David Bright, and his 
brother, James, will attend 
the graduation. 

Mark Hess Meets 
Former President 

Mark Hess 
celebrities last week. A stu-
dent of Northwood Institute 
he was a caddy at the Byron 
Nelson Golf Classic where he 
had the distinction of meeting 
Former President Gerald Ford 
and his partner and spoke 
with them. It happened at the 
ninth hole. Besides he got 
a close look at other well 
known pros in action. 

Another occasion was his 
attendance as a guest at the 
Sales and Marketing Execu-
tives Convention where he 
met former Governor Ronald 
Reagan and Mary Kay Ashe, 
president and board chairman 
of Mary Kay Cosmetics. 

Mark, the son of Mrs. Bon-
nie Hess. is a freshman major-
ing in business management. 
He was named to the Dean's 
List for the past term. 

Jim Eaves who has oper-
ated Jim's Barber Shop since 
the first week of March, is 
the new chief of police of 
Muenster. He was appointed 
Monday night by the city 
council to succeed James Mc-
Donald who resigned here to 
accept an offer at Wolfe City. 

Along with the appointment 
David Province was returned 
to his previous status as pa-
trolman and Kenneth Storm-
er was named reserve patrol-
man. More reserve patrol-
men will be welcome, Eaves 
said, so that an adequate force 
will be available for special 
occasions or emergencies. Ap-
plications will be accepted by 
Eaves. 

Since Tuesday the new of-
ficer has been on double duty, 
doing police work at night 
and operating his barber shop 
during the day. He expects 
that schedule to end soon 
with the selection of someone 
to take over the barber shop. 

An eight year veteran of 
the Dallas Police Department, 

Local Students to 
Graduate at CCC 

Three students from Muen-
ster will receive diplomas at 
the commencement exercises 
to be held next Sunday at 
Cooke County College. They 
are Lola Bright, Gerald Wal-
terscheid and Meinrad Yosten. 

The ceremony will be in 
the Activities Center of CCC 
beginning at 3 p.m. Dr. Al-
ton Laird, president of CCC 
will confer the diplomas to 
some 80 of the school's 150 
graduates, and Dr. Evelyn 
Huey, president of Texas Wo-
man's University, will deliver 
the commencement address. 

Gel Acquainted Party 
Children entering first 

grade at Sacred Heart next 
school term are invited to a 
get-acquainted party on Mon-
day, May 16. 1:00-2:30. in Room 
I of the grade school. Proof 
of birthdate will be needed 
if not baptized at Sacred Hear 
by the children who must be 
6 years old by September 1 
1977. 

Jim Eaves Appointed 
New City Policeman 
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Mrs. Paul Fisher 
Heads Area NCCW 

Mrs. Paul Fisher was in-
stalled as president of the 
North Deanery, National 
Council of Catholic Women, at 
the meeting held in Gaines-
ville on April 21. 

Other officers installed for 

a two year term by Fa her 
Placidus Eckart, moderator, 
were Mrs. Clarence ZiMmer-
cr, Gainesville, president-elect: 
Mrs. Vickie Berend, Decatur, 
vice president; Mrs. Elizabeth 
Fels, Pilot Point, secretary; 
Mrs. Julius Hermes, Jr., Lind-
say, treasurer. 

Hosted by St. Mary's Parish 
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Inlook Outlet of Gainesville 
Formerly Wearhouse Outlet 

The In-Place for Outstanding Fashion 
Complete selection of 

Ladies' Ready-to-Wear 
3-13, 6-16, 14'2-24'i 

Special Group Ladies' Jeans 
Sizes 3-13 Only $12 

Everyday Low Fabric Prices 
Cotton 	 yd. 89c 
Jersey and Arnel 	 yd. 99c 
Polyester and Polyester Blends 	yd. $1.99 

The Inlook Outlet 
Store Hours: 9 to 5, Mon. thru Sat 

114 N. Commerce, 668-9351, Gainesville 

master charge L.,  

1. —t— 	—r—t—t—t— 	 — 
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Mr. and Mrs. George Peet Of Arlington have an-
nounced the engagement and approaching marriage of 
their daughter, Gerda, to Glenn Rohner, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Alois Rohmer of Muenster. The couple will be 
married on Saturday, May 28, at 4 p.m. in Arlington. 
The bride-elect is a graduate of Arlington High School 
and the future groom is a Subiaco Academy graduate 
and attended Texas A and M University for two years. 
Both are employed at Southland Life in Dallas. 

attended by 65 ladies from 
Pilot Point, Bridgeport, Val-
ley View, Decatur, Benton, 
Lindsay, Muenster and Gaines-
ville and by the following 
clergy, Father Harry Fisher of 
Pilot Point, Father James 
Miller of Bridgeport, Father 
Anthony Gajda of Valley 
View. Father Francis Zini-
mere', of Decatur, Father 
Placidus Eckait of Muenster 
and Father James Gillespie of 
Gainesville. 

The program was presented 
by Jackie Jones, chairman of 
the task force of the Cooke 
County Heart Association. He 
discussed heart attacks brief-
ly and gave a demonstration 
en cardiopulmonary resuscita-
tion 

Outgoing president, M r s. 
Mary Lagleder of Denton re-
ceived a gift of appreciation 
from the group. 

A salad and dessert lunch-
eon concluded the meeting, 
with Gainesville ladies, under 
direction of Mrs. Dorothy 
Barnes as hostesses. 

The next meeting will be in 
Lindsay in September. 

First Communion 
Cindy Neu, daughter of Mr. 

and Mrs. Harold Neu of Deni-
son was a member of the first 
communion class in St. Pat- 
riek'S Church on Mother's Day. 

She was one of a group of 19. 

Among those spending the 
day with Cindy and her fam-
ily were her baptismal spon-
sors, Mr. and Mrs. Bernard 
Hesse and children of Muen-
ster her paternal grandpar-
ents Mr. and Mrs. John Neu, 
Jr. of Lindsay and her uncle 
and aunt, Mr. and Mrs. Don 
Cupit of Dallas and a great 
uncle and aunt, Alois and 
Teresa Hesse of Muenster. 

They were all together for 
Mass, followed by a family 
dinner in the Harold Neu 
home. A decorated first com-
munion cake was the table 
centerpiece. 

Mrs. Don Cupit, the former 
Edna Hesse, showed pictures 
of a 3 week vacation trip in 
Germany, when she traveled 
with a sister-in-law Mrs. 
Jim Cupit, who visited rela-
tives in Germany. 

CCSIGIATUILATICNS 

CIAID817-  
and BEST WISHES from 

of Sacred Heart High 

and Muenster High 

The Hut 
Remember us for 

your jeans and tops 

Open daily 10-5. Bank Americard welcome 
Lupe Evans, owner 

"■1 

Bull Riding 

Calf Roping 

Steer Riding 

Bareback Bronc Riding 

Ribbon Roping 

Girls' Barrel Racing 

The Forestburg FFA expresses its appreciation to the following men 
chants for helping make the twentieth annual Junior Rodeo program a big 
success. 

to the Sacred Heart Lettermen's Club 

for bringing their bowling tournament to 

ALL * STAR * LANES 
Sunday, May 15, 1 p.m. 

We appreciate the patronage and 

hope all participants will have 

a great tournament 

Muenster State Bank 
Community Lumber Co. 
Tony's Seed and Feed 
Penis Texaco 
Flusche Enterprises 
Knabe Tire and Radiator 
Muenster Livestock Comm. 
Ben Franklin Stbre 	' 
The Charm Shop 
Ferd's Gulf 
Hoedebeck GMC 

Forestburg Riding Club Arena 

Oldest & Best Junior Rodeo 

In the North Texas Area 

20th Annual Forestburg FFA 

Junior Rodeo 
May 13 & 14, 8 p.m. 

Adult $1.50 

Child $1.00 
(6-12 years) 

ALL STAR LANES 
Across from Shopping Center, Gainesville 

Open 9 to 12 daily, 12 to 12 Sundays 

Bowling is a terrific way 

to keep active, a game 

anyone can enjoy. Come Ini 

Muenster Garden Center 
Muenster Milling Co. 
H & W Meat Co. 
Tuggle Motor Co. 
Fischers Market 
Hennigan Auto Parts 
Muenster Butane & Appliance 
National Building Center 
Bob's Auto Service 
Dcrnkesreiter Garage 
Hcrmric's 
Koeslers' Jewelry 

1  

I r  

(-7 

 Bose' 

Pota 

Mex 
Hoe 
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Ice Cream 
SHURFRESH 

Assorted Flavors 
1/2 GALLON 

tint 3) 69' 
) FROZEN SPECIALS  

Shurfresh I/g  gal. 

Mellorine 

43c 

Shurfine 10 oz. 

Brussels 
Sprouts 

39c 

49c 

L 

IN OUR DAIRY DEPARTMENT 	< 

VELVEETA 
2 1.1 .. $ 1 89 
Walt solo 	I MET 

CRAFT MARGARINE 

Parkay °""'" 	49 0  
Shurfresh 

Butter   lb. $1.19 
Dutch Holland Low Fat 

MILK . . . gal. $1,15 

Beef 

L. 68° "3 tits or 
Moro" 

Full Cut 

Round 

GRAIN FED 
HEAVY BEEF 

Steak 
$ 139c 

LB. 

Frozen Pikes Peak or Rump 

vest
` Shell 

No Pest 
Strip 

	

e aN 1 	REG. 

	

A' 4 	
MIS 

$ 1 9$ 

Energy 

Charcoal 
Briquets 

10 Lb. in  

99c 

FRESH FRUITS & VEGETABLES 	< 

Oranges 
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LARGE 
SUNKIST 
VALENCIA 

4 

Shurfresh Sliced 	  I BACON 
a $1.09 

Boston Butt 

Pork Roast .    lb. 79c 
Boston Butt 

Pork Steak    lb. 89c 
Shurfresh 

Sliced Bacon 	 lb. $1.09 
Shurfresh Meat or Beef 

Franks 	  12 oz. 65c 
Neuhoff 

Sliced Bacon 
Rath 

Pork Sausage 
Calf Liver 
Rath 

Dinner Franks 
AF Jumbo 

Bologna 
Hot. smoked 

Link Sausage 	______ 
Porterhouse Steak 
Fischer 

Smoked Sausage 
Wisconsin. 

Cheddar Cheese 
Perch Fillets 

Grain Fed Heavy 

SAVING SIZES 

Local News 
BRIEFS 

Mr. and Mr. Walter Huch-
ton of Bedford and their son 
and their daughter-in-law Mr. 
and Mrs. Kevin Huchton and 
baby son, Scott of Fort Worth 
were guests of Mr. and Mrs. 
Werner Yosten, and attended 
the Germanfest Sunday. Also 
visiting in the Yosten home 
at the same time were Mr. 
and Mrs. Robert Hale of Dal-
las. Mrnes. Huchton, Yos-
ten and Hale are sisters. They 
all attended the Germanfest 
together. 

Mr. and Mrs. Julius Her-
mes, Sr. and Mr. and Mrs. 
Billy Zimmerer, all of Lind-
say and Mr. and Mrs. Z. D. 
Fleitman of Muenster enjoyed 
a recent visit with Paul Flu-
sche in Corpus Christi. He 
took them on a tour of down-
town Corpus and Padre Is-
land. They later were in San 
Antonio sightseeing on the 
river walk and a boat ride, 
and then visited the Tower of 
the Americas. Returning they 
also stopped in Johnson City. 

John Steele is a patient in 
a Denison hospital for treat-
ment of critical injuries re-
ceived in an automobile acci-
dent in Lindsay on Saturday, 
April 29. 

Mrs. James Hess was the 
winner of a I/I carat diamond 
in 14 K gold filled setting ring 
at Sanders Jewelry Mothers 
Day drawing. 

Guests of Mrs. Alfons Wal-
terscheid during the German-
fest weekend and through 
Monday were her son and 
family, Mr. and Mrs. Wilmer 
Walterscheid and  children 
Scott, Dana and Gina of Col-
lege Station. Joining them on 
Sunday were Mr. and Mrs. 
John Walterscheid and Chris-
tie, Vickie and Amy of Gaines-
ville and Mr. and Mrs. Bonny 
Prescher and Bobby Joe, 
Denise and Michael of Valley 
View and Lindsay and Muen-
ster members of Mrs. Walter-
scheid's family. 

Guests of Mrs. Al Walter-
scheid over the Germanfest 
weekend were Mr. and ,Mrs. 
Walter Acker and family, 
Randy, Dayna and Ricky of 
Bartlesville, Oklahoma. 0 n 
Sunday, May 1, the family 
was together at noon for din-
ner. Guests were Prof. Horns-
ley and granddaughter Me-
linda McCann of Fort Worth, 
Bill Anderson of Decatur, Jim 
McDonald of Dallas, and Ken-
ya Hale. 

YOU CAN 

BANK 
ON IT! 

One of the things worth 
repeating is the formula for 
getting the total in your 
checkbook to agree with the 
figures on your bank 
statement. Reconciliation is 
the name of the process. 
The following steps will 
make it easier for you: 

1 - Don't wait around, 
do the reconciliation the 
day you receive your bank 
statement. 

2 - Take your checks 
from the bank statement, 
put them in numerical or-
der and compare them 
with your checkbook. Mark 
your checkbook to indicate 
which checks have cleared 
the bank (these will be in 
the statement). 

3 - Subtract from the 
balance showing in your 
checkbook any bank charges 
or draft payments n o t 
shown in your checkbook. 

4. - Now on the state-
ment, add The total of any 
deposits you've made which 
are not shown on the state-
ment to the last balance 
shown (on the statement). 

5 - From this new total, 
subtract any checks writ-
ten which are not listed on 
the statement. This should 
be the some figure as the 
adjusted total in y o ur 
checkbook. 

If your addition checks 
out but there is still a dif-
ference, come by and we'll 
be glad to help. 

Muenster 
State Bank 

AFFILIATE   

Family 	 $4.69 

King 	 $2.29 

Giant 	 $1.19 

lb. $1.39 

2 lb. $1.49 
lb. 39c 

2 lb. $1.99 

lb. 79c 

	 lb. 69c 
lb. $2.09 

lb. $1.29 

lb. $1.49 
lb. $1.45 

Beef Cuts 

Peaches  y c 
Shurfine 6.5 oz. Chunk 

Light Tuna 

Shurfine. halves or slices. 16 oz. 

Peter Pan Smooth or Crunchy, 12 oz. 

Peanut Butter 
Hunt 14.5 oz. Whole Peeled 

Folger s Coffee lb. $3.49 

3 - $1.00 

	 48c 

	 59c 

Tomatoes 	  3 - $1.00 
Delta 16 oz . 

Baby Dill Pickles 	  . 49c 
Dream Whip Topping 

Shortening 	  
Folgers Instant Coffee 
Sunshine 16 oz. Reg. or Unsalted 

Krispy Crackers 	  

ay,  GOPOErLE 

BUTP/JE 

REGULAR 11.41 	49C 

Roast lb. $1.05 

SPRAT CLEARER 

Formula 409 ;; 	 79 0  

6 oz. 99c Mrs. Ba'rd  11/' lb
. Town Talk 

 3 . sin BREAD . T. 3 4 1 00 

	

$1'39 	DR. PEPPER 
• • 	10 oz. $5.69 

or COCA COLA 
49c  32 oz, . . . 6 - $1.29 

10 oz. . . . . 8 - 79c 

Prices Good Through Wednesday 

3fithrlirre,9 	fflarkrt 
Butch & Johnny 	759-4211 

California fancy fresh 

Strawberries 	  pt. 39c 
Baker Russet 

Potatoes ....... . . . . . lb. 19c 
Green Cabbage 	 . . . lb. 15c 

Crisp Bell Pepper 	. . . lb. 49c 

Bananas 	 . . . lb. 25c 

Del Monte 17 oz. 

Sweet Peas 	  
Snowdrift 42 oz. Pre-Creamed 



A watch 

Speidel watch band 

Travel alarm clock 

Billfold 

Pen-Pencil set 

Ident bracelet 

Carm bracelet 

Charms 

Pendant 

Rosary 

St. Chris medal 

Key chain 

Earrings 

Koesler Jewelry 

■sw„.„1„.„■ 

The muskrat often builds 
bank burrows with under-
water entrances. The home 
burrow may be a complicated 
structure, with several pass-
ages and a nest chamber. 
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DIAMONDS ARE A GIRL'S BEST FRIEND 

See Jim or Randy Seed 
for all your Diamond Needs 

CLASS RINGS 

Come and See the 
New 1977 Model 

PICKUPS 

307 N. Grand. Gainesville 
Master Charge 	Bank Americard 

We Have Layaway or Credit Plans 

SEEDS JEWELERS 

Hoedebeck GMC 
759-4366, Muenster 

.0•0.4",e2.4. •..7.45...0..9•7•/..1.0•,,,0•6.0-6-0  

EHEL E R S SINCE 1089 

GMC 

GAINESVILLE, TEXAS 

Change, the one thing most 
of us want least, is the one 
thing we all need most. 

Bur, sell rent with the 
Enterprise Want Ads. 

Watches 

Rings 

Pins 

Earrings 

Bracelets 

IT HAPPENED 
40 YEARS AGO I 

April 30. 1937 

Gulf Company will erect new 
55,000 station here east of Al 
Walterscheid machine shop. 
Parochial boys defeat Myra 
team 16 to 7 in season's first 
oaseball game. The Casper 
Haverkamp family moves here 
from Tennessee to take over 
management of City Hotel, re-
placing Mrs. Joe, Schmitz, 
former manager. J. M. Tempel 
is reported improved following 
a stroke. Committeemen and 
dads join Scoutmaster Nick 
Miller and troop on outing 
Sunday. Airline Stewardess 
Lillian Fette writes her par-
ents that she helped entertain 
representatives of a German 
aerial club when they visited 
in New York, along with exec-
utives of American Airlines. 

35 YEARS AGO 
May 1. 1942 

Msgr. Augustine Danglmayr 
is named bishop; Is first Texan 
to serve in his native' diocese. 
Registration for sugar ration-
ing will be held May 4, 5 and 
6. Judge Ben Boyd will ad-
dress graduates at public 
school commencement. A week 
of rain brings 7.02 inches of 
moisture. Phillip Metzler, 76, 
dies at Lindsay. Ben Luke is 
recovering from surgery. Gar-
den Club prepares for home 
flower show and tea on May 
3. Muenster tops quota in 
Navy Relief drive. 

30 YEARS AGO 
May 2, 1947 

Local rodeo has capacity 
crowd for first showing and 
plans to add additional events 
for next week's performance. 
4-H and FFA Fat Stock Show 
has 167 calf and pig entries. 
Funeral service is held for 
Rev. Shelby West, 61, at Bul 
cher. Rainfall this week meas-
ures 2.77 ice' es. Vocations 
school memo,.., convert fire 
truck into farm sprayer. Loca 
Post Office awaits 80 new 
boxes to put an end to mai 

delivery cramp. Father He: 
man spent several days in 
Bethania Hospital for treat-
ment of flu. Meinrad Stoffels 
receives army discharge after 
serving in both the European 
and Pacific theatres. 

25 YEARS AGO 
May 2 1952 

Bishop Dangetmayr officiates 
at ground breaking ceremony 
for new Sacred Heart Church; 
some 2,000 persons including 
clergymen from North Texas 
parishes attend. Installation 
rites for Bishop Gorman are 
set for May 8. Local Lions Club 
organizes with 45 chapter mem-
bers. Soil Conservation Service 
men conduct conservation tour 
for Garden Club. Mrs. Tony 
Felderhoff has major surgery 
in Dallas. Mrs. Lee Toothaker 
undergoes major operation in 
Fort Worth. Juliana Fuhrmann 
and Steve Grewing marry in 
Lindsay. Jeanette Waite r, 
MHS and Irma Hotbauer, 
S HII, are valedictorians this 
year. Tommy Felderhoff leaves 
this week for overseas army 
duty in Germany. Rupert Hoe-
nig leaves for west coast en-
route overseas. 

20 YEARS AGO 
May 3, 1957 

Banquet and program .at 
Sherman Tuesday will honor 
soil conervation champians. 
Mrs. Will Sicking wins con-
servation award for Zone 3. 
Rain measure for April was 
12.43 inches. Mr. and Mrs. Mar-
tin Fritz and son of Bellevue, 
Ohio, are visiting her mother 
and other relatives in the Nog-
gler family. Louise Fuhrmann 
and Raymond Haverkamp 
marry at Lindsay. ETA live-
stock judging team composed 
of Bill Otto, Jerry Wirnmer 
and Ted Henscheid, accom-
panied by Glenn Hellman, go 
to A&M for state contest. 

15 YEARS AGO 
May 4, 1962 

Ceremony and open house 
held at Post Office dedication. 
Neil Huchton, 5, is recovering 
from snake bite. Distribt win 
puts Charlotte Wolf in state 
4-H dairy foods demonstra-
tion contest. Jimmy Sicking 
joins the Air Force. L. W. 
Powell's horses are winners in 
Appaloosa shows. SH Parish 
gathers to crown May Queen. 
Contract bids for hospital will 
be opened June 28. St. Anne's 
Society has reception for 14 
members. Johnny Walterscheid 
has emergency appendicitis op-
eration. Walter Becker enters 
VA Hospital at McKinney. SH 
music students practice re-
citals. Lorine Voth and Frank 
A. Sandmann marry at Lind-
say. Twenty states and Canada 
are visited by Tony Felder-
hoffs on trip. 

10 YEARS AGO 
May. 5, 1967 

Funeral services are held for 
Joe Fisher Sr., 89, pioneer and 
continuous resident here for 
77 years. Five hundred chil-
dren are in ceremonies to 
crown May Queen. Peggy 
Sicking is second in regional 
spelling contest at Dallas, and 
alternate to national spell-off. 
S. H. High School athletes at 
sports banquet. All - awards 
banquet is held at Public 
SchooL Hundreds attend dia-
mond jubilee festivities at 
Lindsay. David Haverkamp 
returns from Vietnam as civil-
ian. Donald Endreses honored 
at housewarming. MILS base-
bailers open season with win 
over Caltisburg and loss to 
Era. Muenster Library gets 
5450 as book budget for year 
Construction is under way on 
new home for Kenneth Selbys 
and new duplex for Dorothy 
Hartman and Helm Hess. Lo-
cal Baptist church gets air 
conditioning. Soil Conserva-
tion office remodeled and 
central heating and air cond. 
tinning are installed. 

5 YEARS AGO 
May 5, 1972 

Muenster Memorial Hos-
pital receives re - accredita-
tion with high rating. Msgr. 
Thomas Weinzapfel will be 
speaker at Muenster High 
School's Baccalaureate service. 
Sacred Heart High gets new 
coach when Robert J. Steele 
is hired. Mary Lou Kralicke 
is first in Texas Garden 
Clubs state competition in 
Waco. Cheryl Otto and Danny 
Fette named top students at 
Muenster High. David Yosten 
graduates a t Southwestern 
State College, Weatherford, 
Okla., Magna Cum Laude with 
pharmacy degree. Closing 
Liturgy for CCD classes will 
honor eighth grade and high 
school graduates. Annual May 
Queen Crowning is held with 
all students of Sacred Heart 
grade and high school partici-
pating. Muenster High nips 
Frisco 5-4 in 18 innings. Forty 
four kindergarten tots have 
graduation. Carra Lou Cole 
and Damien Moster say vows 
a t Mass. Jane Stoffels and 
Johnny Welborn marry at 
Lindsay. Service pins awarded 
to six teachers at Muenster 
High. New arrivals: a boy for 
the James Walterscheids: girls 
for the Ray Wimmers, W. A. 
Eldreds, Teddy Oakleys, and 
Danny Jonesses. 

Buy, sell, rent with the 
Enterprise Want Ads. 

Dorothy's 
Fashionette 

Beauty Salon 

Waiting until you can afford 
a home may mean never. 

Open Tuesday 
thru Saturday 

VICKIE KUHN 
DOROTHY MITCHELL 

665-9402 
303 S. Chestnut 

Gainesville 

' Beauty is not a Gill, 
It's a Habit." 

Muenster Pharmacy 
Boo Fels, Registered Pharmacist 

Medical Center Bldg. 

STORE HOURS 

Mon.-Fri., 8S0-8 

Saturday, 8:30-5 
Closed Sunday 

Dial 

759-2833 

* 	 --1` 'Ili/ Beach Towels  

$8.00 

4.111 E. California, Gainesville 	Jy  

The Final Touch 

GIFTS 
e 

GRAD
forth 

 

6",  Ca4kr 

Applicable tax extra 

$8.95 

Applicable tax extra 

Get Ready for Vacation 
with these Service Specials 

SAVE! with these coupons 

Shock Absorber Savings Certificate 
Includes parts and installation of a pair of Motorcraft shock absorbers. In- I 

eludes cars and light trucks. Capri not included. 

'24.00 Total Special Price, 
Parts and labor . . 

Oil & Oil Filter Savings Certificate 
Includes up to 5 quarts of oil, Motorcraft oil filter and installation 

Total Special Price, 
Parts and labor .. 

Applicable tax extra 

I—Front End Alignment Savings Certificate 
Check and adjust caster, camber and tri-ir 

1. As Described 	 
Total Special Price, 	

$ 2. 5 0 

Materials, labor, and land costs will continue to increase 
the price of homes in the future. Now is the best rime to 
buy a home and Hesperion has the know how to help 
you make the best possible buy. 

We want to help. 

HESPERIAN SAVINGS 
	

Ct 
Krou.NK 
LENDER 

MAIN OFFICE:101 East Broadway Street • Gainesville, Texas 76240. (817)665-3485 

MUENSTER OFFICE,510 East Division Street . Muenster, Texas 76252 .1817)759-2283 

ELECTRICAL 
CONTRACTING 

Fixtures 
Supplies 

Residential, Commercial 
and Oil Field Wiring 
Installations, Repairs. 
Appliance Repairs. 

Call 665-2721 
Nights call 

665-3263 or 665-4456 

Parker Electnc 
112 S. Rusk, qainesville 

r Engine Tune-Up Saving Certificate 7 
Includes installation of 6 Autolite spark plugs, Motorcraft point set and Mo-
torcraft condenser. Inspect choke throttle linkage, spark plug wires and 
distributor cap. Adjust carburetor and timing. (Fours and solid state ignition 
slightly less. Eights and Econolines slightly higher.) 

Total Special Price, 
Parts and labor . . 
	$26.07 

Applicable tax extra 

Your Ford Dealer Since 1946 

Endres Motor Co. 
Muenster, Texas 

IP 



Ms. Marlene Herr and Gary Fisher will be wed on 
June 11 in Sacred Heart Church. Father Stephen Eck-
art will officiate the marriage celebration with Mass at 
5 p.m. 

The bride-to-be is the daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Albert 0. Herr. She graduated from Muenster High 
School in 1973 and is currently attending Texas Woman's 
University's Baccalaureate Nursing Program at the Dal-
las Campus. 

The prospective bridegroom, son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Earl J. Fisher, is a 1969 graduate of Muenster High 
School. He graduated from North Texas State Univers-
ity where he received his BBA in May 1976. He is an 
insurance underwriter with Chubb/Pacific Indelmnity of 
Dallas. The couple plans to reside in Dallas. 

— Photo by Mathews Photography 

The Grad will love 

something to wear 

from 

The Charm Shop 

Lingerie 

Gift Certificate 

Ladies' Bridge Tournament 
Per person $1.50 

and Luncheon Buffet 
Luncheon buffet $3.00 

llV 
lV 

Joining family members 
here and guests of his mother, 
Mrs. Ben Luke for Mother's 
Day were Mr. and Mrs. Har-
old Luke of Arlington. Phone 
calls from the Gene Luke fam-
ily of Holbrook, Arizona the 
Al Kuhn family of St. Louis. 
Mo., Mrs. Charles Denny of 
San Antonio and Father Eu-
gene Luke of Subiaco, Ark-
ansas, were added pleasures. 

Two can live as cheaply as 
one — they usually have to. 

Muenster 
Livestock 
Auction 

SALE EVERY THURSDAY 

We offer our 

service to assist you 

In buying or selling 

of live stock. 

Bill & Mike Hamer 
Phone 759-2201 

We've gotItir' 
n49111.11 

668 7411 605 Summit Avenue, Gainesville 

Save Money! 
Save Time' 

Prescription Is Our 
Middle Nemo. 

Shop the 
Drive-in Window 

for all your prescriptions 
and drug needs. 

WATTS 
Prescription Shop 

302 N. Grand, Gainesville 

ABOUT THIS QUESTION 

"The greatest financial 

risk confronting many pros-

perous individuals or fam-

ilies is a liability suit for 

$100,000 or even $1,000,000 

for causing injury or death 

to others. Does the FMW 

agency have "excess liabil-

ity insurance to cover ex 
posed risks and excessive 

legal awards?" 

F MW  
INSURANCE AGENCY 

PH. 759-2257 

Bruns Baptism 
Motheis, grandmother s and 

great-grandmothers were hon-
ored on the baptismal day of 
infant Brandon Robert Bruns 
when Mr. and Mrs. Bobby 
Bruns chose Mother's Day, 
May 8 for the baptism of 
their son. Father Lynch offi-
ciated at 2 p.m. in St. Joseph's 
Church of Richardson. 

Baptismal sponsors were 
t 

 
Is e maternal grandmother, 

Mrs. Earle Otto and paternal 
grandfather, L. B. Brims. 

Attending the church ser-
vices and the Mother's Day 
dinner that followed in the 
Bobby Bruns home were Mr. 
and Mrs. Earle Otto, Mr. and 
Mrs. L. B. Bruns, Mrs. Eliza-
beth Bruns, Mrs. Rosalie Hoff-
man and Beverly Bruns of 
Lake Worth. 

Mrs. Earle Otto spent last 
week with her daughter and 
family. 

Germaniest Winners 
The Sacred Heart Choral 

Group has submitted names 
of winners as follows: Mrs. 
Bill Koerschner, afghan made 
by Mrs. Larry Hennigan; Mrs. 
Jane Welborn of Denton, 3 
pillows made by Choral 
Group; Louise Addington of 
Nocona, 3 pillows made by 
Mrs. Paul Endres.  Mrs. Ray 

T Hess and Mrs. Tony Hess. 
Martin McCoy, stuffed owl 
made by Mrs. Al Schmitt who 
also made the embroidered 
picture won by L. W. Culver 
of Fort Worth; Mrs. Melvin 
Voth of Lindsay, Jill Myrick 
of Lindsay, Marlene Walter-
scheid of Muenster, Pat Fish-
er of Muenster, each won 
pure silk handmade flowers 
donated by the ICralickes. 

Odus Cooke returned home 
Friday, April 29, after a stay 
in the Bowie Hospital. 

A friendly tip 

of the hat to 

Sacred Heart 
Parish 

Founded on December 8, 1889, 

it has been an outstanding 

factor in 90 years 

of community progress 

The Curtwood 
Since March 11, 1936 
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Our Gift to the Grad: 

15% Discount 
on your 
Graduation Shoes 

... or any other item purchased 

at Chapman's in May. 

Just bring the card you 

received in the mail 

'Deala Agie was the winner of 

the $25 Gift Certificate in our 

store Saturday) 

CHAPMAN'S 
No. 1 	No. 2 

111 N. Dixon 
	

Gainesville 
Gainesville 
	

Shopping Center 

Public Auction 
Farm Equipment 	Tractors 

New Tools — Jeeps 	Pick-Ups 

Friday, May 13, 1 p.m. 
ALREADY CONSIGNED: International B, H, S. M, 240, 

Ford 600. 5000, Ford Garden Tractor. 10 H.P. 

Ferguson to 20 

Large selection of New Allis Chalmers Tractors 
2-3-4 bottom rnoldlooards. 

14' Krause disc 

14' International disc 

8' Drag disc 

Side delivery rakes 

Balers 

Spring-tooth harrows 

DEALERS, NOTE: We have an $8,000 consignment of cleaners. 

paints, lubricants, pesticides, herbicides, and all manner of 

chemicals for farm and shop. 

Proffer-Wilson Tractor Co. 
West Highway 82, Gainesville 

917-665-0361 

Nocona Hills Country Club 

, Tues., May 17, 10 a.m. to 3 p.m. 1 

Why Pay More? 
SHOP HERE AND SAVE 

New Merchandise 

Arriving Daily 

Daniel Boone Discount Store 
Saint Jo 

4 wheel trailers 

Section harrows 

Jeep van 
4 wheel drive Jeep 

I 	truck 

Feed grinder 

Tool bars 

Rotary hoe 

Come and bring your bridge playing friends. 

For Reservations 
Call 987-3324 or 987-3344 

Promote Your Business 

through 

SPECIALTY 
ADVERTISING 
Pens ... Pencils ... T-Shirts 	. 

Caps . . . Calendars ... Rain Guages 

Thermometers ... Key Rings .. . 

Many Other Items 

Mike Stoffels 
Muenster, 759.4224 

We've Moved 
to 

605 Summit Ave. 
from 212 East California 

IS 

ti 

I. 



Crimp 
and 
Snip 

to 1065 N. Cedar 
from Downtown 

Kathy Tate 
owner-operator 

appreciates 

your business. 

759-4514 
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Plumbing 

Electrical — Paneling 

Roofing — Hardware 

Water Pumps — Heating 

Air-conditioning 

Police Radar-Fuzzbuster 
Reg. $109.50, Special $79.95 

Gainesville Sewing and 
Vacuum Center. 835 E. Calif. 

24-4 

PROTECT YOU and your 
house while you sleep. Smoke 
alarms available at Commun-
ity Lumber Company. 37-tf 

CONCRETE WORK: Any kind 
of a concrete job, or furnish 
ready mix concrete. Bayer 
Concrete. 28t1 

GLASS: Plate, window, auto-
mobile, furniture tops, mirrors. 
Complete glass service. We 
handle insurance claims. 
Gainesville Glass Shop 885-
3321, 311 N. Chesnut 

THANKS 
I appreciate very much the 

kindness of the wonderful 
nurses and Dr. Kralicke dur-
ing my stay in Muenster Mem-
orial Hospital. Thanks also for 
the flowers and cards; I en-
joyed all visits from relatives, 
friends and classmates. (My 
parents join me in saying 
"Thank You" 

Kimberly Walterscheid 

INSULATE for comfort and 
economy. Community Lum-
ber Co. Muenster. 52-tf See us for a low cost 

home improvement loan. 
MUENSTER STATE BANK 

Member FDIC 20-tf 

STEVENS' 
FLOOR COVERING 

Gainesville's Volume Dealer 

FOR SALE: 	ton air 
conditioner, Sears coldspot 
window unit. Contact Sam 
Endres. 	 24-3 

We can recommend cm installer ti 665-0318 
• 105 W. Broadway 

National Building Centers 
Muenster Tex. 759-2232 

USED NO-FROST 
REFRIGERATORS 

Nice, 19 cu. ft. with 
icernaker $140 
14 cu. ft. $60 

HESS FURNITURE 22-1 

Expert Steam Cleaning 
A sincere thank you to all 

who were so kind to me during 
my stay in the 9cor4pital 
Special thanks to the nurses. 
Dr. Juarez, Father Stephen 
and my family. The lovely 
flowers, gifts, visits, cards and 
prayers were really appreci-
ated. 

Nellie Martin 

FOR RENT WANTED FOR SALE: 1976 Sport 
Charger, 18,000 miles. Call 
759-4539 after 6 p.m. 24-2p 

•■■11• 	 

SAVE 
On utility bills by adding 

blown in INSULATION. 
See or call Tony Klement 

or National Building Centers 
759-2232 	2741 

For Home Delivery of 
Fort Worth Star Telegram 
or Dallas Morning News 
Call Bill Tidwell collect 

458-7828, Bs_ 548, Sanger 18t1 

BEAUTY SHOP FOR RENT 
Furnished. Bills paid. 

J. C. 'Trachta, 759-4133 	25t1 
WANTED: Hay hauling. Call 

Jim Endres, 759-4540, Claude 
Klement, 759-4579; Giles Wal-
terscheid, 759-4404; or John 
Schneider, 759-4582. After 4:00 
p.m. 759-2277. 24-tf 

CERAMIC TILE. New and 
old installation. For estimate 
call Ted Henscheid, 759-4280, 
Muenster. lid 

MOBILE HOME for rent. 2 
bedroom, fully furnished, a 
block from school on N. Wal-
nut. Ph. 759-2288, Jerome Pa 
gel. 16-ti 

We wish to acknowledge 
with thanks, the thoughtful-
ness of our many relatives, 
neighbors and friends for the 
many congratulatory messages 
that came through the mail 
and by phone and for the 
many useful gifts and for 
your presence at the Mass. 
To Father Stephen we offer 
our gratitude for the beauti-
ful service which made our 
fiftieth wedding anniversary 
one of the happiest days of 
our lives. We love you all 

Mr. and Mrs. Adolph 
Walterscheid 

MOTORS, a 11 sizes, for 
milking machines, water 
pumps, Aermotor equipment, 
etc. 

NATIONAL BUILDING 
CENTERS 	49-if 

tinkly 

C Sit 
Ic 

Front 
Autos 

Radio 

N-Ucnr 

Knc 

CUSTOM DRAPERIES 

Free Decorating 
Professional Installation 

HESS FURNITURE CO. 
41-tf 

WANTED: Painting jobs. 
Wall brush paint your home, 
interior or exterior. Also have 
equipment to spray paint 
barns and other out-buildings. 
Phone 759-4443 or see Ronnie 
Hess. , 23-tf 

SEWING MACHINES 

VACUUM CLEANERS 
STEREOS, TAPES 

Records & Accessories 

SALES & SERVICE 
ALL MAKES 

REAL ESTATE 
HOUSE FOR SALE. Form-

er home of Mrs. Mary Felder-
hoff, 4 rooms, attached gar-
age, central heat and air con-
dition, 214 N. Hickory. Sealed 
bids accepted until June 1 by 
Arthur Felderhoff, PO Box 
336. 25-3 

APPLIANCES 

Zenith TVs, Maytag 
Washers and Dryers 

and other top brands 

We service all brand/ 

MUENSTER BUTANE 
759-4411 

WRANGLERS 

Shoes — Boots 
Work - Dress • Western 

Nocona Boots 

TANKS- Sep - ic tanks, stock 
tanks, grain tanks. water tanks. 
Will install. Bayer concrete 
Phone '159-4244. Muenster. 

WANTED: Spring house 
cleaning jobs, window wash-
ing, other types of work 
needed. For more information, 
contact Sacred Heart Cheer-
leaders, 759-2948. 19-tf 

41:111=1=1•■11 

Hudgins NOCONA 
FENCE 

CO. 

203 E Calif., Gainesville 
665-2542, 665-5974 

New Kirby 
VACUUM 

CLEANERS 

Hudgins 
203 E. Calif., 665-2542 

Gainesville 

WANT TO BUY: An Allis- 
Chalmers Model 60 or 66 corn- 
bine. Call 668-8984 or 665-6175. 

24-2 

Real Estate Broker 
Bonded real estate broker 

qualified to act as agent for 
sales or rentals. 

Henry G. Weinsepfel 
759-2257, Muenster State Bank 
759-4161, 630 Weinzapfel St 0 

Miscellaneous 
TRAVEL For your convenience, Rus- 

ty Mackey has made arrange- 
ments for the sale of the 
Gainesville Register at Hof-
bauees, Ray's Drive-In Ken's 
Mobil, Muenster Pharmacy 
and Joe Trachta's. For borne 
delivery.  call Rusty Mackey, 
759-4510. 24-2 

99c a ft. buys 4 ft. wire 
line post, caps, top rail 

and wire. MECHANIC 
Associated 

Travel Agency 
of Gainesville, Tx. 

Free Information 
Any advertised travel 
you read or hear about 
is available through 
our authorized agency. 
The price is the same 
with or without our help. 

For reservations or infor- 
mation on all airlines 

call 
ASSOCIATED TRAVEL 

817-665-4181 
9:30 a.m. to 5:30 p.m. 

Terminal posts and 
gates extra 

Installation 15c sq. ft. 

Hwy, 82 E, Nocona 
825-3831 

2111 

Jobs open now for two 
auto mechanics. Full 

benefits and good working 
condition. 

Rick Wittman Ford 
Nocona, 825-3334 

22-tf 

Three bedroom brick house 
for sale, 5 years old. Contact 
Mrs. Tammy Hesse, 759-2538. 

23-ti 

J. R. Hocker 
Men's S Boys' Store 

207 N. Commerce, Gainesville 

FOR SALE: 3 bedroom 
brick dwelling with built-in 
dishwasher and range. Extra 
large and improved yard 
Less than 2 years old and in 
immaculate condition. For ap-
pointment contact H e n f y 
Weinzapfel at 759-2257. Night 
759-4161. 22-tf 

FREE ESTIMATES on 
porch railing, burglar guards, 
spiral stairs, mailbox stands, 
etc. Dale Lloyd's Welding 
Service, East Highway 82, 
Gainesville. 665-0786. 51-ti CI 

Mui 

SI 

FINE DIAMONDS 
WATCHES, JEWELRY 

WATCH REPAIR 

6•22228 HELP WANTED: Permanent 
and Full Time. Applications ' 
accepted Tuesdays thru Thurs-
days. 8 am. to 2 p.m. Russell 
Newman Manufacturing Co., 
Saint Jo. 22-tf 

FOR YOUR HOME: steel, 
vinyl and aluminum siding. 
National Building Center, 
Muenster. 22-t i Sears Is  

to  

ti  
ti  

Q 

Is  

Talk to us about a new 
home construction loan 

MUENSTER STATE BANK 
Member FDIC 20-tf 

KOESLER JEWELRY 
Muenster CHAIN LINK FENCE, 50 

foot roll, $19.95. Nocona Fence 
Co., Hwy 82E, 825-3831, No-
cona. 21tf 

HOUSE FOR SALE: 2-story 
3-bedroom. Henry Weinzapfel 
Real Estate. 759-2257 or 759-
4161. 30-tf 

Micro-Wave 
Oven 

WELDERS WANTED: Must 
be capable of laying out own 
work. Paid holidays, vacation, 
hospital benefits. Apply at 
Lloyd's Welding, East Hwy. 
82, or call 665-6882. 20-tf 

PRE FINISHED 
PANELING 

Ls. stock at 
Community Lumber Co. 

1111■11=!IIIIIII•11 FOR SALE ...Has automatic 
cooking probe. 

...Infinite power 
setting, 90 to 625 
watts 

NEW HOMES: 2, 3 and 4 
bedrooms. Priced $22,500 to 
$46,500. 95% financing avail-
able. Shag carpet, fireplace, 
ash cabinets. Frazier & Rod-
gers Construction Co., 685-
5343, Gainesville Shopping 
Center. 15-ti 

SERVICE Fabrics FOR SALE: 2 sets of grain 
boards, 1 set of cattle racks. 
All for long, narrow bed pick 
up, 759-2816. 25-tf 

APACHE 

GATES 

WANTED: Lawn mowing 
and trimming jobs. Call 759-
2887 after 5. 19tf 

Super Selection 

of Spring Fabrics 

at Super Prices 

Now of 

Modern Floors 
and Fabrics 

PLUMBING 
Installation & Repair 

Residential & Commercial 

FIXTURES, SUPPLIES, 

McDonald Water Pumps 

Robert Russell Plumbing 
759-4155 or 759-4580 

Muenster 	31-tf 

.. Easy to read 60 
minute timer. 

General office help wanted. 
Apply at Wilde Chevrolet 
Company. 15-tf 

FOR RENT: Three bedroom 
house. Contact Rufus Hen- 
scheid at 759-4227 or 759-2233. 

25-tf 

FOR SALF. 500 gal gal-
vanized water tank, 2 galva l

-nized sinks with double drain- 
boards, doors, windows, cat- 
tle guard, assortment metal 
oil drums, much, much more. 
2 miles south of Bulcher at 
Red Barn 15- 1 p 

Save $70.00 

Was $459.95 

Now $389.95 

4 through 16 foot 

lengths in stock Land WANTED: 
Rod Machina Operator 
Must be experienced 

Also helpers 
No experience necessary 

Crewing Brothers 28-1:1 

ft  

ti  

tiS  

WiI-O-Mac We got it! 

Don Flusche 
Caine, 011e 

• SWOON extra 

• Sears has a credit plan 
to wit most every need 

• Prices are Catalog prices 

PHONE 
759-2550 

Dozer Service Carpeting 
at Special 

Spring Prices 

Five SH Students 
Among Winners at 
County Art Show 

Five Muenster students 
were named among winners in 
the Art Show staged at 
Cooke County College on Fri-
day and Saturday, April 29 
and May 1. 

Seventh grade winners in-
cluded Susie Felderhoff, 
daughter of the Tom Felder-
hoffs, 2nd; Jenny Felderhoff, 
daughter of the Joe Felder-
hoffs, honorable mention. 

Eighth, grade winners in- 
cluded Nancy Sicking, daugh-
ter of the Wilfred Sickings, 
first; Shell i e Walterscheid, 
daughter of the Sonny Wal-
terscheids, third; Sharon Voth, 
daughter of the Ray Voths, 
honorable mention. 

The annual show included a 
junior division for county 
school children and an adult 
division in which 450 pieces 
were entered. Betty Huffman 
of Denton judged the junior 
d ivision. 

Trailer Parts 
and Supplies 

Structural Steel 
and Pipe 

Real Estate Broker 
& Auctioneer 

759-2832 
Call or See 

Frank Hess 
759-4249 

NEED FLOOR 
COVERING? 

Carpet 

Linoleum 

Tile 

Now at 

Modern Floors 
and Fabrics 

Open 9 to 550 
Monday thru Saturday 
Roy & Jane Monday 

759-2848, Muenster 

Junior Olympics 
Scheduled Friday 
At Sacred Heart 

SHS will sponsor the an-
nual Junior Olympics on Fri-
day, May 13, beginning at 
10:20 a.m. Everyone is invited 
to the event. Refreshments 
and baked goods will be sold 
by the 8th grade. A picnic 
lunch with hamburgers will 
Le available at noon at the 
cafeteria. 

Coach Stock and high school 
students will conduct the 
games. Grades 1-7 will partic-
pate. 
Running events include 300 

yd. shuttle run relay, 800 yd. 
rim; 25 yd. run; 50 yd. run; 
800 yd. relay; 75 yd. run. 

Field events include pull ups 
and standing broad jump. 

Saks/action Guaranteed 
or Your Money Back Automatic trans. serv. 

and overhaul, spin wheel 
balance, air cond. serv., 
auto-truck-tractor sere. 
and overhaul, brake and 
electric serv. 

Metal Sales, Inc. 
On Highway 82 

west of Gainesville Sears Drapes 
SOARS It011111CII AND CC). 

315 E. California 
Gainesville 

GAINESVP_LE 
CARPETS 

605 -2,3rnel:" 
Richard Neu 

Dorothy Barnes 

111111111==111111111111MIMI■1 
Bob's Auto Service 

759-4474 

■ONNNI■mi■  

ELECTRICAL 
INSTALLATIONS 

& REPAIRS 
AIR CONDITIONING 

REFRIGERATION 
HEATING 

Residential & Commercial 
GRIGGS ELECTRIC 

Mobile Phone 759-4810 
768-2759, after 5 

New k Rebuilt 

Kirby 
Vac-Cleaners 

599.50 up 

2Bar8IB.- 2228:=222218BIBESINI 

Call 
Dan Luke 

759-2522 
FOR 

BUTANE 
PROPANE 
FINA GAS 
FINA OIL 

Let Us Prove 
To You 

That we have the 

Best Buys 
In North Texas 

Reduce safe and fast with 
Go Bese Tablets and E-Vap 
"water pills." Muenster Phar-
macy. 21-Op KIRBY 

835 E. California 
665-9812, Gainesville 

Waiter Pumps 
Submersible 
H.P. to 40 H.P. Otts' 

Furniture 
& Appliance 

South Side 
Court HOUSE) Square 
Gainesville, Texas 

ELECTRIC MOTOR 
SALES S REPAIRS 
Oil Field Viking 
SERVICE CALLS 
Ditch Trenching 

CB Radio Installation 

Muenster Electric 
759-2581 or 759-4831 

See Jan Cain for 
MARY KAY 

products 
Free Facials 

Call 759-2748 	f 

k .......■.. 

Plastic Pipe 
A very inexpensive 
way to get water 

where you need it 

NATIONAL BUILDING 
CENTERS 
Muenster 

HELP WANTED 
Floor 

Covering 
of all types 

We need experienced help for immediate employ-
ment in the best equipped factory in the North Texas 
area 

Paid Holidays, Paid Vacations 51 years 
combined experience 

in floor covering 
Storm Shelter Old Czech proverb: It's 

dangerous to marry a woman 
who looks good in black. 

High blood presure is like 
a time bomb. It can be silent 
until it explodes into a crip-
pling or fatal stroke, heart 
disease or kidney failure. Find 
out if you are carrying a 
bomb — have your blood 
pressure checked. 

Hospitalization, Profit Sharing 
Fibre Glass 

WILDE 
East Hwy. 82 

SAVE FUEL COSTS Will hire some trainees Dale's 
Carpets JR. ELITE 

Dress Manufacturing Co. 

With aluminum storm units and Insulation. 

Inquire at 

NATIONAL BUILDING CENTERS 
meenster, 759 2232 

Dale Mice., Don Bezner 
Mike Hollinger 

319 North Commerce 
Gainesville 

LET US ADD Central Heat 
and Air Conditioning to your 
home. National Building Cen-
ters. 759-2232, Muenster. 494f 

120 N. Sycamore, Muenster 

1■11101311■1 axsain■IM 



°I Cs 
Claude 

es Rai. 
or John r Jo 

 titer 400 
24.rt 

Ig jobs. 
i home, 

60  have 
mint 

uloHgs 
Ronnie 

house 
' wash. 

If work 
mation, 

I cheer. 
1917 

it Allis- 
66 ann. 
i&-6175. 

24-2 

r two 
Full 
corking 

ord 
4 

22-t1 

nnalient 
beations 

Thus-
Russell 

erg Ca, 
12-if 

9 Bust 
out own 
vacation, 
.pply at 
st Hwy.  

2C-tf 

mowing 
all 759- 

190 

wanted 
levrolet 

15-0 

Iced 

meal 
2641 

eats 
Ts at 
tow 
students 
riners 
ged at 
on Fri-

1pril 29 

 rent i" 
IderhoS , 

 Felder-
Iderhoff , 

 Felder-

on. . 
:ers 1°- 

 danet-  
bekilgei 
ocbeid, 
ly Wei-

troth 
yotbs. 

;laded a 
county 

n adult 
 I Pteces  

lutDttut 
 , junior 

S O 

50 

li 

9 

Check Your ksoletion 

National Building Center 
Phone 759-2232 	Muenster, Texas 

Frigidaire 
Sales & Service 

Personality 
Furniture House 

Inc. 
2003 E. Highway 82 

668-8833 
Gainesville 

Hospital Notes 
The following patients were 

dismissed during the past 
week at Muenster Memorial 
Hospital. 

Tuesday, May 3: Lena Herr, 
Muenster; Mrs. Richard Sum-
merlin and baby girl, Gaines-
ville. 

Wednesday, May 4: Mrs. 
Arthur Felps, Gainesville. 

Thursday, May 5: Mrs. J. I. 
Hall, Bowie, Mrs. Carla Clark, 
Gainesville; Mrs. Rosa Bull 
and Clarence Reeves, Saint 
Jo; Mrs. Opal Thedford, No-
cona; Mrs. Hamil Sanders, 
Bellevue. 

Friday, May 6: Robert F. 
Klement and Mrs. Lawrence 
Martin, Muenster; Kent Lyons, 
Saint Jo; William F. Tuggle, 
Nocona; Mrs. Veda Magee, 
Rosston. 

Saturday, May 7: Mrs. Eva 
Padgett, Saint Jo. 

Sunday, May 8: Vicki Milli-
gan, Patrick Riley and Claude 
Lippincott, Gainesville; Olen 
Bridges, Saint Jo. 

Monday, May 9: Mrs. Lee 
Florence, Whitesboro; M r s. 
Johnny Moore and baby girl, 
Gainesville. 

Schmidlkofer Automotive, Inc. 
and Machine Shop 
The most complete and modern 

parts organization in North Texas 

Auto, Truck & Industrial Purls 

Store No. 1 
835 N. Grand 

668-7241, Gainesville 

Open 8 to 5 
Monday thru Saturday 

Glass bead machine 
Complete head service 

Block boring 
Hot vat service (about 

30 minutes) 
Hydraulic hoses 

Foreign Car Parts 

Store No. 2 
302 W. California 

665-1766 

Gainesville 

Open 8 to 8 

Monday thru Friday 

Open to 5:30 Sat. 

Your speed and 
custom parts store 

Shaft ?tow a. have 
iitrifir? v  
"SPEC/A 
May 13 and 14 

Neuhoff 

Smokies 	 pk g. $1.05 

Neuhoff Franks 	 lb 99c 

H&W Meat Co. 
Muenster, 759-2744 

American 

Cheese 	I b $1.39 

Summer Sausage lb. $1.49 

H & W Bacon 	 I b $ 1 .09 

Decker 

Canned Ham 3 lb $4.99 

Choice Beef 
from our feedlot 

for your freezer 

Quarter, Half or 

Whole Carcass 

Custom slaughtering 

and proemial:sq. 

Wedding plans of Rebecca Ann Davidson .  of Houston 
a and Thomas H. Felderhoff, Jr., have been nnouced by 

her parents, Mr. and Mrs. Charles Davidson of Route 1, 
Muenster. Parents of the future groom are Mr. and Mrs. 
Thomas H. •  Felderhoff of Route 4, Gainesville. 

The couple has chosen Saturday, June 18, for their 
wedding day in Sacred Heart at 5 p.m. 

The bride-elect is a graduate of Muenster High School, 
Cooke County College and North Texas State University. 
She teaches in the North Forest School District of Hous-
ton. Mr. Felderhoff is a graduate of Sacred Heart High 
School, Cooke County College and Texas A and M Uni-
versity and is engaged in farming and ranching. The cou-
ple will reside west of 'Muenster. 

— Photo by Mathews Photography 

Hornets Lose Last 
Chance Ball Game 
MHS Hornets missed golden 

opportunities in their show-
down game with Callisburg 
Wednesday and went down 
for a count of 4-3. 

The net result is that the 
Wildcats win the 13-A base-
ball title whereas the Hornets) 

 had hopes of tying the season 
and corning through, in the 
playbffs. 

Coach White described the 
game as a calamity. His team 
was working on 11 hits and 
4 walks, and Callisburg on 5 
hits and two walks. But there 
were other big factors. Hor-
nets failed to hit at the right 
time, and almost all runners 
died. on base. On the other 
hand Callisburg grouped hits 
better and got more help from 
6 Muenster errors. Two Wild-
cat runs were unearned. 

Tim Wolf pitched for Muen-
ster giving up 5 hits and 2 
walks and fanned 3. The op-
posing hurler • allowed 11 hits 
and 4 walks and struck out 6. 

Hornet hitters were Todd 
Richey 3 singles; Neil Wal-
terscheid 2 singles; Phil Wolf 
and Kim Walterscheid each a 
doable; Nick Walterscheid, 
Tim Wolf. Randy (Reiter and 
Curtis Pagel, each a single. 

Muenster Native 
Talks on Care of 
Cardiac Patient 

Karen Sicking Wiggins of 
Dallas daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Leo Sicking was the 
guest speaker at the Louisi-
ana State Convention of the 
American Physical Therapy 
Association in New Orleans on 
April 30 and May 1. 

She spoke on •"Rehabilita-
lion of the Cardiac Patient". 
including effects of exercise 
on heart attack victims and 
development of an inpatient 
and outpatient rehabilitation 
program. 

Mrs. Wiggins is the coordi-
nator of the Cardiac Rehabili-
tion Program at Presbyterian 
Hospital of Dallas. Karen is 
a graduate of Muenster High 
School, attended North Texas 
State University for three 
years, and graduated from the 
lInivpIrsity of Texas Health 
Science Center of Dallas. 

Also 
available 

with 
safety 
toe. 

Sirs 
1-13 

widths 
9 - D 

I RED WING N 

LOST LUGGAGE 
209 N. Commerce, Gainesville 

Mary F. Walterscheid, age 93 
Mrs. Mary Frances Walter-

scheid recently celebrated her 
93rd birthday in Yes-Ter-Year 
Nursing Home. Nieces brought 
a beautifully decorated cake 
and ice cream for all the pati-
ents and staff to share. At-
tending from Muenster were 
Mrs. Joe Knauf, Mrs. Lawr-
ence Martin and Mrs. Arnold 
Muller and two children Sher-
rie and David Muller. 

Theresa Luke is a patient 
at Muenster Memorial Hos-
pital, recovering from pneu-
monia. 

Mrs. J. J. Haverkamp is a 
surgical patient at Muenster 
Memorial Hospital for treat-
ment of a broken left leg, suf-
fered at her some Sunday 
evening. She underwent sur-
gery to pin the bone Monday 
morning. 

A Wedding 
Anniversary 

when all the family is together is an 

ideal time for a family portrait. 

As time passes it becomes more and 

more precious. 

.Aiatlzewi Photography 
625 N. Grand, Gainesville, 665-2431 

Attention Farmers & Ranchers 
Free Removal of Fresh Dead 
or Disabled Horses and Cows 

Call Collect 817-665-0763 
Call as soon as possible for prompt service 

24 hour service 	 7 days a week 

Gainesville Stock Removal Co. 
2 miles east of Gainesville on Highway 82 

New modern facilities ... Clean sanitary trucks 

1 
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Psychiatrists tell us its not 	Rubbing elbows with a roan 
good for a man to keep too will reveal things about him 
much to himself. The income] you never suspected. The 
tax people tell us the same same is 'true of rubbing fend-
thing. ers. 

Muenster Milling Company 

The Feed People 

Hours: Mon. thru Fri. 7:30 a.m. to 5 p.m. 

Saturday 7:30 a.m. to noon 

All orders should be placed 
one day in advance 

Phone 759-2287 

Safemark Tires & Batteries 
Sales and Service 

(Membership Required) 

Unidyne Battries. 6 & 12 volt in stock, from $22.95 

EZ Ride Shock Absorbers, heavy duty, late popu-
lar models in stock. $9.45 each. 

Multi-Mile Tires, some in stock 

Front End Alignment & Wheel Balancing 

Automotive Repair and Tune-up 

Radiator Sales & Service 

Michelin Radial Tires Available 

Knabe Tire & Radiator 
Phone 759-4141, Residence 759-2930 

305 N. Main. Muenster 

Back Again 

1st Time in a Year 

Cherry Rhone 

DANCE 
Sacred Heart 

Muenster Community Center 

Saturday, May 21, 9 to 1 

Sponsored by Muenster Jaycees 

You Gain Two Ways 

with INSULATION 
Your fuel bill decreases 

while your comfort increases. 

Sacred Heart 
Trust Fund 
Established 

By Frances Koerschner 
The need for an increase 

in the teachers salaries at Sac-
red Heart School was pre-
sented at a school board 
meeting by Sisters Mary John 
and Georgia. 

A group of parents, all 
members of the Sacred Heart 
Home & School Society with 
the approval of Sacred Heart 
School Board and Father Plac-
idus and aided by a school 
board committee initiated the 
idea of a trust fund to be used 
exclusively for supplementa-
tion of the teachers salaries. 

A mailing list was compiled 
of parents of children attend-
ing, alumni and friends of Sac-
red Heart School. Inforrpation 
concerning the school and its 
needs was mailed out. 

The Sacred .Heart Trust 
Fund has been established at 
the Mercantile National Bank 
in Dallas. The permanent 
members of the Board of 
Trustees consist of Mr. Ed 
Endres, Mr. Ray Voth and 
the Pastor of Sacred Heart 
Church. Elected members are 
Messrs. Angelo Nasche and 
Sylvan Walterscheid. 

Participation to date has 
been encouraging and the re-
sponse of a positive nature. 

To the Editor 
Very soon now will be the 

time to register to vote for 
the Beef Referendum, prob-
ably June 6-17. We as live-
stock producers should regis-
ter and then vote at the given 
date, probably between July 
5-15. A "yes" vote in the Beef 
Referendum can put more 
money behind research and 
promotion for beef, and there-
by avoid half-baked reports 
from being published. 

This will be the best chance 
we have had to put together 
a self help program for the 
beef industry and that way 
we will all be paying our 
share to promote the beef in-
dustry. 

The beef referendum is be-
ing backed by American Na-
tional Cattlemen's Association, 
National Livestock Feeders 
Association, Kansas Livestock 
Association and the National 
Livestock and Meat Board. 

Register to vote NOW at 
the ASCS office in the Federal 
Building then VOTE and have 
your say at election time in 
July. 

Burney Almon 

WIMMER 
DIESEL 

SERVICE 
Truck and 

Tractor Repairs 

East Hwy. 82 
759-2560 



COMPLETE 

FUNU1AL 

SIM VICE 

Nick Miller 
Funeral Home 

Gainesville 
Ford Tractors 
Jim Zimmerer 

665-6741, Gainesville 

Make Graduation 
Memorable 

with a 

BULOVA 

OMNWM11 . 1. 
 UlevoNs.sta, less 

PeeLAutomtic 
Water 
resistant 

I 

Kraft Velveeta. Limit 1 

Cheese 
2 lb: $1.89 

TV SPECIALS 

I 
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To Honor Mrs. Vie Hartman 
A cookout and picnic sup-

per Sunday evening in the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. John 
Yosten featured a family re-
union honoring Mrs. Victor 
Hartman. The party awaited 
the arrival of Mrs. Teddy 
Gremminger and her son 

Fantastic Texize bottle 

Roesler Jewelry 
Muenster 

NOTES FROM 
I THE LIBRARY 

by Mary Muster 
We have neglected our 

weekly column lately because 
so much of our time has been 
taken up 4.rth orderng new 
books and readying them for 
the shelves. 

This week we are shelving 
10 titles of the Hardy Boys 
Series and 10 titles from the 
Nancy Drew Mystery Stories. 
Some best sellers that have 
been added recently a r e 
"Raise the Titanic" by Clive 
Cussler, "Sleeping Bride" and 
"Deadly Traveler" both by 
Dorothy Eden, "Tisha" - a 
story of a young teacher in 
the Alaska Wilderness - as 
told to Robert Specht, "Nor-
ah" by Pamela Hill, and "How 
to Cut Your Hair and Any-
body glse's" by Bob Brent. 
Often called for and now 
ready is "Mother Teresa -
Her People and Her Work" 
by Desmond Doig. For the 
craftswoman we have added 
two new Better Homes & 
Gardens Books - "Crochet 
and Knitting" and "Patch-
work and Quilting." For the 
do-it-yourselfer we shelved 
Chilton's "Guide to Choosing. 
installing, and operating citi-
zens Band Radio" - new 40 
channel, for cars, trucks, vans, 
RV's. marine and base. "The 
New American Dream Mae 
chine" by Robert L. Sansom 
gives information toward a 
simpler lifestyle in an envi-
ronmental age. Already en-
joyed by some of our read-
ers is "You're Younger Than 
You Think" by Lelord Kordel. 
This is the mature person's 
guide to vibrant health. 

Library hours are Tuesdays 
and Thursdays from 8:30 to 5, 
and on Wednesdays from 3 
to 6 p.m. 

Hartman Children 
In the Limelight 

The three children of Gene 
and Judy Hartman were cited 
recently for academic and 
athletic achievements. Thir-
teen year old Jeanna was in-
ducted into the National Jun-
ior Honor Society. She was 
also chosen as a finalist for 
Congress Junior High School 
cheerleader. Pam, a 6th grad-
er, participated in the Knights 
of Columbus Freethrow con-
test in Austin. She was run-
ner-up in the 11 year old di-
vision. Eleven year old Doug 
was presented the "Key Man" 
award for his basketball team. 
The three children also play 
cr, the city league basketball 
teams. They were all "City 
Champs" in their leagues. 

Don't always give your wife 
credit; she appreciates a little 
cash, too. 

He who loses his head is 
usually the last one to miss 
it. 

Wayne of Denver. Colo., who 
were met at D-FW by the 
Mike Fedors and Teri Lynn 
and Jeff of Arlington. With 
the Fedors and Grernmingers, 
others attending were Mrs.  
Keith Tompkins and family of 
Arlington, Miss Judy Tomp-
kins of Dallas, the Gene Hart- 

man family of Denton, the 
Walter Wolf family of Gaines-
ville and the Alvin Hartman 
and Harvey Schmitt families, 
Victor Hartman and the hosts. 

Adolescence: The period in 
which children begin to ques-
tion the answers. 

MAP Observes 
Four Birthdays 

Birthday honorees at the 
Tuesday MAP meeting were 
Mrs. Al Wiesman, Mrs. Hattie 
Grewing, Mrs.. Joe Hoenig and 
John Fleitman. 

A decorated cake, baked by 

Mrs. Jerry Walterscheid was 
served with coffee to 40 sen-
ior citizens who attended. 

Table games followed un-

til 5 p.m. 

All senior citizens over 55 
years of age are reminded of 
the luncheon to be held at 
the Community Center next 
Tuesday, May 17. 

Frontier 

Paper Towels . . . 3 - $1.00 
Shurfine 151/2 oz. 

Spaghetti Sauce . . . 59c 
Heinz 4 C7 

Baby Food . . . 6 - $1.00 
F:Tritex 4 roll pkg. 

Toilet Tissue 	 59c 
Gehheardt'a 15 oz. 

Tamales . 	. . . 3 - $1.00 
Kraft 

Mayonnaise 	 99c 
letgens 16 oz. 

Cold Water Wash .... 99c 

Spray Cleaner 	99c 
FCurfm ,  32 oz . 

Bath Oil 	  89c 
Skinner 12 oz. 

Egg Noodles 	 49c 
Shurtine 12 oz. 

Corn Flakes 	 45c 
Food King 1 

Crackers 	 

Mr. Goodbar, 6 pk. 

Revlon 16 oz. Flex 

Cream Rinse 
Revlon 16 oz. Flex 

Blsm Shampoo 

Bic Lighter 

Super & Reg. 

Tampax 40 	 

Shurfine Choc. tZ gaL 

Mellcrine 

39c 

HOFBAUER'S SPECIALS 

Ns 
Old Fashion, Pure, Sugar Stick 	 Smucker 48 oz. 

Soft Candy . . . pkg. 49c Grape Jelly 	99c 
Tide, 49 oz. 	 $1.19 

Ice Cream ... ,,, gal. 69c 

Old Milwaukee bottles 

Beer 	 case $4.89 
Schlitz 	case $5.95 
8 pack, 10 oz. bottles 

39c Pepsi 	 57c 

Good through 
Wednesday, May 18 

Oranges 	 ea. 5c 
Non Dairy Creamer 22 oz . 

Coffeemate 	 $1.49 

Instant Tea 	99c 
Ortega 4 oz., 10 shells 

Taco Shells 	 55c 
Libby 5 oz. Vienna 

SAUSAGE... 3 - 88c 
Betty Crocker 18 oz. & 191/2 oz. 

Cake Mixes 	49c 
Shurhne 11/2 

Bread 	3 - $ 1.00 
Plastic lug, low fat 

Milk 	 gal. $1.15 
Shurfine 

Coffee 	lb. $2.99 
3 oz. box Gelatin 

Jello 	 5 - $1.00 
Green Giant r. 
Niblet Corn • 3 - $1. 

.7, Homo 

Milk 	 gal. $1.39 

11 oz. Asst . 

Totino Pizza 
Ida Treat 32 oz. 

French Fries 
Shurfine 10 oz . 

Corn 	 
Morton 8 oz. 

Fruit Pie  	4 - $1.00 
Beef or Chicken 

Morton Dinner 	49c 
Shut-hoe 10 oz. 

Peas 	3-89c 
Shurfine 

Ice Cream .. 69c 

Is GaisesvIllto 

Box Office Opens 7 p.m. 

Adult 52.00, Child 51.00 

Starts Friday 
1.T1 Prtto°1'17. 

"Young Frankenstein" 
Rated PG 	 Show time 7:30 & 9:30 

East Hwy. 82. 665-5201, Gainesville 

Box Office opens at 8. Show starts at 8:30 

Friday the 13th Exorcism Marathon 

4 Big Features, 1 Night Only 

"To the Devil a Daughter" 
"Emproyo" 

"Scream of the Demon" 
"Touch of Satan" 

Starts Saturday 
II Teen Age Graffiti" 

also 

"Last Summer" 
Rated PG 

MEATS 
Chuck Roast ..1b. 69` 

Chuck Steak lb. 79c 
Cube Steak 

Cutlets 	lb. $1.59 

Round Steak lb $1.49 

Rib Steak 	lb. $1.19 

Sirloin Steak lb $1.49 

T-Bone Steak lb $ 1.69 

Beef Steak lb. $1.09 

Pork Roast 	lb. 79c 

Pork Steak 	 lb. 99c 
Smoked Cheese .. lb. $1.49 

Ground Chuck . lb. $1.09 

Fryer Thighs . . . lb. 89c 

Fryer Gizzards .... lb. 89c 

Catfish Steak . lb. $1.33 

Lettuce 	 hd. I 9c 

Carrots 	 2 lb. 49c 

Tomatoes 	 lb. 49c 

Potatoes 20 lb. $1.89 

Turnips 	 lb. 39c 

PRODUCE 
Large Sunkist Valencia 

Oranges 	 ea. 5c 

Bananas 	 lb. 25c 

Grapefruit 5 lb. 69c 

Bell Pepper ea. I 9c 

Cucumbers ea. I 9c 

CABBAGE... lb. 10c 

Radishes  bag I 5c 

Gr. Onions 	bunch I 9c 

Celery 	stalk 49c 

759-4434 

 

Service -:- Courtesy -:- Price 

Hofbauer's 
Food & Locker Service AFFILIATED 
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A great selection 

for boys or girls, 

elementary or high school 

BENIFIRAN KLIN• 
Anthony and Leann Luke 

CLOSED EVERY TUESDAY 

GOOD EATING 
Rohmers is widely known for a great selection 

of fine foods. Come and treat the family to our 
salad bar, steak, sea food, barbecue or lunch. 

Rohmer's Restaurant 
Emil and Agnes Rohmor, Muenster 

Buy, sell, rent with the Enterprise Want Ads 

Gainesville's only 
pharmacy with a 
druggist on duty 

at 7:30 a.m. 

Open 7:30 a.m. to 8 p.m. 

Wafts Bros. 
Pharmacy 

Gainesville 

,,./ //  / 

/ 	 / / / 

/ 	 / / / / „ \ 
' 

This Card 
Entitles You to 
Purchase 
SAFEMARK.  
tires and batteries. Another service-

to-member program offering a quality 

product at low COSi. 

POR ADDITIONAL INFORMATION,CONTACT *Trademark Ragestand 

Fuhrmann Bros. Garage F."'  
Myra, Texas 

RE SURE TO NAVE YOUR MEMBERSHIP CARD WITH YOU) 

Banana 

"OLDSMOMENTUM" 
Spring Sales Contest 

By Popular Request 

Mystery Car Month Continues through May 

One new Oldsmobile at Johnson Motor Co. will be predesig-

nated for each day through May 31 as a MYSTERY CAR. Buy 
a new Olds while prices are LOW and trade ins are HIGH. If 
you are lucky and buy a mystery car, you get a $100.00 BILL 
and 50 GALLONS OF GASOLINE FREE. 

Each Salesman who Sells a Mystery Car will also Receive a $50.00 Bonus 

Buy a New Car Now at 

JOHNSON MOTOR Co. 
300 N. I-35, 665-3461, Gainesville 

Closeout Prices 
on our entire stock of 
Sherwin Williams Paints 

If's Time for 
Home Improvement 

Planning to give your home a face-lift? 
You may have the enthusiasm . . . but we 

have the materials and tools ... can also re-

commend skalled workers. Como and see us. 

11  Community Lumber Co. 
Jerome Pagel & Body Klement, Muenster 
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$2.00 a piece, came in three 
sizes and a variety of colors. 

Kindergarten 
Keith Element's 6th birth-

day was observed on Friday, 
May 6, with his classmates in 
the morning Class. His mother, 
Mrs. Dale Klement and his 
sister Tina brought refresh-
ments of punch and cookies. 
There were treats of balloons, 
candy and puzzles. Special 
guest§ were Carrie and Dar-
ren Russell. 

Winners Named in 
Festival Contest 

Winners were listed as fol-
lows in trike, bike, motorcycle 
and skate board events at the 
Germanfest. 

Trike, under 4:Ryan Sick-
ing, Gary Hess and Mindy 
Graham. 

Trike, 4-6: Janell Flusche, 
Keith Klement, Angela Endres. 

Bike, under 10: Scott Tay-
lor, Charld Bayer, Dino Bay-
er. 

Bike, 10-12: Mike Hess. 
Bike, 13-15: Keith Lamar. 
Motorcycle, 10-12: Craig 

Monday. 
Motorcycle, 13-15: Bob Ham- 

ric Curtis Pagel. 
Skateboard, Under 10: Stev-

en Mulkey, Brad Becker, Mark 
Becker. 

Skate board, 10-12: Tim 
Schneider, Donald Hayes, John 
Mulkey. 

Skateboard, 13-15: Stuart 
West, Gene Fuhrinan, Steve 
Hill. 

A seedy bum approached a 
lady on the street and asked: 
Ma'am, would you please 
give me 15 cents for a sand-
wich?" 
,To which the lady replied. 

"Let me see the sandwich." 

Local News 
BRIEFS 

Recent weekend visitors 
with Mr. and Mrs. Clem Rei 
ter Sr. were Mr. and Mrs 
Clem Reiter Jr. and son, 
Steve of Clinton, Oklahoma 
and Horace Elmore of Jacks-
hero, Texas. 

Visiting Mr. and Mrs. J. 
M. Weinzapfel on Mother's 
Day were Mr. and Mrs. Bill 
Birden and family of Lewis-
ville and, Msgr. Thomas Wein-
zapfel of Dallas. They were 
all together in the David 
Bright home for dinner Sun-
day evening. Father Joseph 
Weinzapfel was unable to join 
the family group because he 
officiated at the baptism in 
Arlington Sunday afternoon 
of infant Joseph Shane Hosel-
ton, son of Carmen and Jim 
Hoselton. The baby is a grand-
son of Mr. and Mrs. Hugh 
Jackson of Fort Worth and a 
great guandson of the J. M. 
Weinzapfels. Guests on Thurs-
day were Mr. and Mrs. Wil-
liam Weinzapfel of Wind-
t horst. 

Local Cub Scouts 
In First Meeting 

Den I of Muenster Cub 
Scouts held its initial meeting 
since reorganization, last Tues-
day after school. 

Members meeting in the 
Community Center were John 
Nasche, Kenny Reiter, Steven 
Whittington, , Kenneth Hesse, 
Bryan Wimmer, Glenn Reiter, 
Steven Knabe, Keith Koelzer, 
Joe Pagel and Greg Hoenig, 

Mrs. Gene Hoenig is den 
mother and Mrs. John Pagel 
is her assistant. 

The meeting opened with 
the cub scout song and craft 
time taught masking tape 
vases. 

Steve Whittington was den-
ner for the first meeting. He 
served ice cream sandwiches 
and helped with clean-up fol-
lowing the meeting. Each boy 
will take a turn at dinner. 

Information forms on the 
ChiscUm Trail Day Camp 
were sent home with the 
boys, and should be returned 
to Mrs. Hoenig by Tuesday, 
May 10. 

The surest way of estab-
lishing credit is to work so 
hard that you wont need it. 

Public School 
Happenings 

The Chemistry class of 
Muenster Public School went 
on a field trip to Gainesville 
Texas Power and Light Com-
pany, Tuesday, April 26, to 
view the plant. They were ac-
companied by Mrs. Nancy 
Perryman and Mr. Gary 
Chisam. 

The Muenster Public School 
band played at the Myra 
Community Improvement 
Judging. The band plsyed 
several marches and 'The 
Star Spangled Banner". After 
playing, the band was served 
sandwiches and tea. 

- 
The Muenster High School 

biology class went to Forest 
Park in Fort Worth, on Tues-
day May 3. They visited the 
snake and fish houses to com-
plete their studies. Mrs. Nancy 
Perryman and Mr. Carl Wal-
terscheid accompanied them. 

The F. H. A. Chapter of 
Muenster Public School held 
a babysitting service Sunday, 
May 1, from 1:00 to 5:00 p.m. 
They charged a small fee of 
50c an hour. 

The Muenster Public School 
Band entertained at the Ger-
Manfest, Saturday evening 
from 6:00 to 6:30 p.m. on the 
front steps of the community 
center. 

Drum Major Tryouts 
Majorette and drum major 

tryouts were held Tuesday, 
May 3, in the Muenster High 
Gym. Contestants were scored 
individually by an out-of-
town judge. Selected were: 
Drum Major Sandy Schnei-
der, majorettes Kathy David-
son, Marla Sicking and Cathy 
Flusche. 

Officers for the 1977-78 
school year for FHA will be 
elected Monday, May 16. Of-
fices to be filled are presi-
dent, vice president, secretary, 
reporter, treasurer, parliamen-
tarian, sergeant-at-arms, song 
leader and pianist. 

The third quarter test 
schedule has been posted for 
students of Muenster Public 
School. On Thursday, May 19, 
tests will be given for per-
iods 1, 2 and 5. On Friday, 
May 20, tests will be given 
for periods 7, 6, 3 and 4. 
Busses will run at 12:15 both 
days. 

Vocational Agriculture stu-
dents cleaned around the 
tent in the courtyard area 
during Germanfest. They were 
in charge of barrels and pick-
ing up as they passed by. 

Senior rings arrived May 
4. Seniors of 1978 received the 
rings if they paid the final 
charge. The rings were or-
dered from Balfour and the 
students,had a choice of color 
and design. 

- 
The Muenster High School 

Band sold German hats dur- 
ing GerManfest. Hats were 

On April 15, first and sec-
ond grade students visited the 
modern dairy farm of Mr. and 
Mrs. Harold Bindel. The chil-
dren watched as cows were 
fed and milked. Mrs. Bindel 
explained how the milk was 
cooled and stored. Each stu-
dent tasted raw milk and 
then received a favorite 
dairy product, an ice cream 
sandwich, before returning to 
school, as a special treat from 
Mrs. Bindel. 

- 
On May 3, the first and 

second grade students went to 
Gainesville for the end of the 
year trip. They visited Ka-
den's Florist, the Cooke Coun-
ty Library and the fire station. 

At Kaden's they toured the 
green houses and saw plants 
in various stages of growth. 
Mr. Kaden showed the chil-
dren how plants are cared for 
from ,  to mature 
plants, and how they are sold 
as potted plants or cut flow-
ers. 

At the library they saw a 
film and toured the book 
roorn.l. 

On the tour of the fire 
station, the equipment and 
how it is used was shown to 
the children. 

The two classes then went 
to Leonard Park for a picnic 
lunch and games. 

Adults going with the stu-
dents were Gwen Trubenbach, 
Janie Weinzapfel, Pat Wel-
terscheid. Carol Naegeli, Vic-
toria Huddleston, Patty Jones, 
Betty Rose Walterscheid and 
Kay Pagel. 



Lose Weight 
Safely 

with Dex-A-Diet Tablets 
Only 98c at 

WATTS BROTHERS 
Gainesville 

Gasoline. OIL 
Supplies 

For Your 
Farm Needs 

Jimmy Lehnertz 
Gulf Distributor 

665-4562, Gainesville 

Or see local dealer 

Ford's Gulf Station 

iceepsakep 
PRESERVES AND PROTECTS 

THE ORIGINAL BEAUTY OF 

YOUR WEDDING GOWN 

OR OTHER TREASURES 

Miller Cleaners 
329-31 N. Commerce 

Phone 665-3201 
Gainesv ille. Texas 

Forestburg; Dwayne Franklin, she owl 
Sunset. 	 of the 

the newest memberiHellmans' infant son Charles 
family, the JimmylDavid, born on April 11. 

Clarence Hellman Guests 
Guests of Mr. and Mrs. 

Clarence Hellman during the 
Germanfest weekend were the 
C. J. 'Hell-mans and Shawna, 
Rhonda and Christi of Hurst, 
accompanied by seVeral friends 
and Eddie Hellman of Gar-
land and Tim Hellman of 
Denton. Also here Sunday 
were Jimmy Hellman and 
children Darrell and Darla of 
Gainesville, and Miss Susie 
Hellman and Rick Phillips of 
Dallas. A recent guest of the 
Clarence Hellman was their 
daughter, Mary Nell. Mrs. C. 
J. Newman of Kansas 'City 
who spent five days visiting 
her parents here, her sister 
and family, the Monte Hell-
mans of Dallas and her bro-
ther and family, the Jimmy 
Hellmans of Gainesville. There 

ANY SIZE OF 
STORM 

WINDOWS 
AND DOORS 

We measure 
and install 

Community 
Lumber Co. 

Muenster 

Glastron and Sea Star Boats ... 

Cajun bass boats ... Deck boats 

Evinrude & Mercury motors 

all boating accessories 

North Texas Marine 
East Highway 82. 665-9331 Gainesville 

CARDS 
FOR THE GRAD- 

Congratulatory Cards 

Thank You Cards 

Party Centerpieces 

Party Favors 

Frank Dustin Office Supply 
110 N. 	C33-5594, Gainesville 

Communities that have 
built a strong, healthy 
economy know what they 
must have to keep the 
wheels of progress turning 
in the years ahead. Al-
though each community is 
different, the basic require-
ments will be the same: 

A labor force known 
for its productivity. Munici-
pal water supplies that can 
outlast a drought. A good 

transportation network. 
Diversification of industry, 
just to be on safer ground. 
Cultural and recreational 
attractions. Favorable tax 
structures. Strong leader-
ship. 

And energy to power 
assembly lines. Energy to 
heat, cool, process foods, 
lift, spin, dry, pump, drill, 
press, shape, compute or 
to use however industry 
needs it to create products 
that create jobs. 

Meet the Changing Times. 

The cheap and abun-
dant energy available here 
in years past is one reason 
this area emerged from the 
recent recessions with one 
of the strongest economies 
you'll find in the nation. 
Few others have a business 
outlook as optimistic or an 
employment level as high. 

The days of cheap en-
ergy are gone, of course. 
The cost of producing and 
distributing energy of al-
most every type has in-
creased dramatically. This, 
with the demand that ex-
ists for energy, has forced a 
sharp increase in the prices 
that you and people every-
where are having to pay 
for it. 

But the availability of 
an abundance of energy to 
keep the wheels of prog-
ress turning in this area still 
holds true. 

You Can Have What You 
Need. 

Natural gas, for exam-
ple. Lone Star's pipeline 
system now extends into 
basins that contain 50% of 
the remaining onshore gas 
reserves in the United 

WHAT WILL 
YOU NEED 

TO KEEP 
THE WHEELS 

OF PROGRESS 
TURNING 

IN YOUR 
COMMUNITY? 

States. And this puts us in 
an excellent position to 
buy enough new gas re-
serves to last all of our cus-
tomers for many decades. 

Securing these reserves 
will be essential to the fu-
ture of the communities 
served by Lone Star. Be-
cause gas not only meets 
your energy requirements 
directly, but indirectly as 
the primary fuel for gener-
ating most of the electric 
power you use. 

The new gas will cost 
more, and Lone Star will 
have to recover the actual 
cost of it on a timely basis. 
A bargain, even so? Yes. 
Because these long-term 
supplies will help your 
community build job se-
curity through business 
growth. 

And that's a bargain in 
anybody's economy. 

Lone Star Gas Company 6 
Working energetically for your area's future. 

Buy 

Ch 

Cor 
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Hornets Outlast 
Petrolia Hi 13-10 

Muenster Hornets settled 
down in the last three innings 
of their game with Petrolia 
Monday and salvaged a 13-10 
victory out of a wild and 
woolly baseball game. 

Ending the fourth inning 
they were tied at 10-10. but 
after that the IVI.HS fellows 
kept it under control for a 
3 run gain. A rough infield 
contributed toward a flock of 
errors on both sides, and 
pitchers too had troubles, re- 
sulting in the big innings. 

NMI Walterscheid and Tim 
Wolf combined to give up 5 
hits and 6 walks while fan-
ning 5. And Petrolia's two 
pitchers allowed 9 hits and 7 
walks and fanned 9. MHS 
made 7 errors and Petrolia 4. 

Muenster hitters were Todd 
Richey and Neil Walterscheid 
each a double and a single; 
Nick Walterscheid 2 singles; 
Tim Wolf, Phil Wolf and Cal-
vin Otto, each 1 single. 

The May meeting of the 
S rcred Heart senior girls 4-I-1 
club opened with a discussion 
on the pet show,requirements 
of the achievement banquet, 
poster contest, livestock rules 
and leadership camp. A slide 
presentation on record books 
followed. 

Results of election of of-
ficers are as follows: presi-
dent Brenda Voth, vice-pres-
ident Carolyn Luke, secre-
tary Laurie Walterscheid, re- 
porter Mary Luke, council 
delegate Rose Felderhoff, al-
ternate Christy Felderhoff and 
recreation leaders Rhonda En-
dres and Toni Hoedebeck. Re-
ported by Mary Luke. 

The 7th and 8th grade 
Sacred Heart boys and girls 
4-H clubs met together on 
Tuesday, May 3, for a pro-
gram of slides about setting 
up a record book. Twenty 
twq members and two adult 
leaders, Evelyn Yeatls and 
Larry Wiese attended. The 
girls club held election of of-
ficers. Susie Felderhoff was 
electer president; Jenny Fel-
derhoff is vice president; 
Kathy Koch is secretary; Gin-
ger Fleitrnan is council dele-
gate and Missy Stoffels is 
vice council delegate. Laurie 
Endres was elected reporter, 
Renee Rohmer and Janet 
Hesse w e r e elected song 
leaders. Repored by Donna 
Trubenbach. 

Dankesreiter 
Garage 

General Auto Repair 

Air Conditioner Service 

311 Division St. 

Phone 759-4521 

Hospital Notes 
The following patients were 

dismissed during the past 
week at Muenster Memorial 
Hospital. 

Tuesday, Apr. 26: Elgin Ray 
Amoroso and Eric Maned, 
Gainesville, Loyal Admire, 
Nocona; J. D. Hair, Saint Jo; 
Mrs. Alma Gordon, Thacker-
ville; 'Melton Ramsey, Whites-
hero; Toby Bagwell, Gruver; 
Teresa McCulley, Myra; Roy 
Hal, Wichita Falls. 

Wednesday, Apr. 27: Conal 
Rose and Garland Dickerson, 
Nocona; Mrs. Harvey Duke, 
Saint Jo. 

Thursday, Apr. 28: Mrs. 
Cleve Smith and baby boy, 
Nocona; James Laurie, Jacks-
boro. • 

Friday, Apr. 29: Billy Krahl, 
Muenster; Mrs. Frank Riley, 
Gainesville, Clarence Anent 
Nocona. 

Saturday, Apr. 30: Harvey 
Lamplun, Larry Master and 
Mrs. Otis Crosby, Muenster; 
Mrs. Charlie Lana, Gaines-
ville. 

Sunday, May I: Kim Wal-
terscheid, MuSister; Patrick 
Corcoran, Gainesville; Larry 
Bridges, Duncanville; Mrs. 
Richard Slide, Richardson. 

Monday, May 2: Helena 
Herr. Muenster: Lois Bewley, 

Whether life grinds a man 
down or polishes him up de-
pends on what he is'made of. 

What goons up budgets is 
yearnings out-stripping earn-
ings. 

4-H Club 
News 

A 



SPECULA. 
at the Dairy Inn 

Mon., Tues., Wed., May 16-18 

Ham and Cheese 
On a Bun 

Rspe egc. i$al1.1. 5 	 c . . 99 

The Dairy Inn 
Phone 759-4512, Muenster 

Buy, sell, rent with the Enterprise Want Ada 

Check our prices on 

• 
Levi s 

9 

before making 

a purchase 

Commerce Street Store 
Pete Briscoe, Gainesville 

MI We're RADIAL TIRE Headquarters 
• PIONT-INC ALIGNMINT • WHill WANG' f• • 11,4111-111P 

• Mt cow. wires • 9440C1 ASSOltIall • IlltAn mums 

"OFFICIAL Desptcnom PATIO*" 
108 N. Chestnut, Gainesville. 665-2731 

Still a good buy... 
all over the house. 

174 wow]  
km.s*arr  

"le,' et  

But, conserve electricity 
and save money. 
Forty or fifty years ago, the 
electric bill was most often 
referred to as "the light bill." In 
thousands of homes, Mr. 
Edison's illuminating invention 
was not the only electrically 
operated device in use, but 
people associated its benefits 
with their costs for electricity. 

Today, higher costs for electricity 
seem to overshadow the many 
benefits of electricity. 

The majority of American homes 
now have at least 14 different 
electric appliances, in addition to 

lighting: radio, television, 
refrigerator, vacuum cleaner, 
clothes washer, Iron, toaster, 
coffeemaker, mixer, range, 
frypan, bed coverings, can 
opener and some type of air 
conditioner. 
Whether you have 14 or 40 
electric appliances, we believe 
that if you will compare their 
benefits with your costs of 
operating them, you'il agree that 
electricity Is still a good buy... 
all over the house. 

Produced by Jenkins Rodeo Co. Fort Worth 

at the 

Twin Pine Indoor Rodeo Coliseum 
Muenster, Texas 

Admission 
Children under 12 free 

0.4,C70 	 0,,0,6 

EVENTS 
Bareback Riding 

Calf Roping 
Dogging 

Team Roping 

Barrell Racing 

Bull Riding 

Booked the Following Dates 

May 14 & 21; June 11 & 25 

Phone 817-244-0525 

Weekly Rodeo 
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Mrs. R. R. Endres spent Mr. and Mrs. Dick Schlei- to and Darren all of Muen-
the Mother's Day weekend in cher and Cliff and Susan of ster and Mr. and Mrs. Pete 
Fort Worth with her daugh- Fort Worth hosted a family Schleicher of Dallas. They 
ter, Margie Endres and a gathering for 'Mother's Day were all together for the 11 
friend, Mary Glade. She was that included Mr. and Mrs. J. am. Mass Sunday morning, 
their guest Friday through A. Klement. Mrs. Harold Bin- with dinner and visiting dur-
Monday. They attended the del and children Debbie, Dar- ing the afternoon. 
Summerfest in Fort Worth 
Sunday evening. 

Guests of Mr. and Mrs. 
Leonard Yosten during the 
Germanfest weekend were 
their daughters, Debbie and 
Susie of Austin, accompanied 
by Stuart Bradford. Mr. and 
Mrs. David Yosten of Plano 
were here Tuesday evening 
as guests of his parents and to 
visit with an aunt and uncle, 
Mr. and Mrs. Melvin Fisch of 
Chicago. 

Mr. and Mrs. Leonard Yos-
ten spent the Mother's Day 
weekend in Austin with their 
daughters, Debbie and Susie 
Yosten. 

Local News 
BRIEFS 

Mr. and Mrs. Steve Moste 
and Chris were in Tours over 
the weekend for the wedding 
of her cousin, Sharon Willen-
borg. The 4:00 wedding Mass 
Saturday afternoon was cele-
brated in St. Martin's Church. 
Reception followed in West 
at the Knights of Columbus 
Hall. Sunday they were din-
ner guests of cousins, Mr. and 
Mrs. Johnnie Holub and farn-
ily in Waco. 

Mr. and Mrs. R. N. Fette 
were Mother's Day guests of 
their son and daughter-in-
law, the David Fettes in Bel-
ton, after both attended the 
graduation Friday night and 
commissioning Saturday after-
noon of Dan Fette at Texas 
A and M University. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ernie Martin 
entertained twice for Mother's 
Day. On Saturday evening, 
May 7, they served a barbe-
cue supper honoring her mo-
ther, Mrs. Lavonne Reid. In 
the group were Mr. and Mrs. 
Phillip Russell, Mr. and Mrs. 
Lavonne Reid, Maschel and 
Rusty and the hosts. Family 
pictures were made. At noon 

11111111111111111111111 

In All 
The World 
No one is more 
understanding or 

more qualified 
to serve you. 

a son 

111111 11r)111 11111 

Sunday the Ernie Martins 
prepared a grilled steak din-
ner honoring his mother, 
Mrs. Lawrence Martin. At-
tending were Mr. and Mrs. 
Lawrence Martin and Miss 
Estelle Martin, Mr. and Mrs. 
Douglas Martin and children 
Russell and Pete. Group fam-
ily pictures were made of 
both events. 

Mrs. James Hess was the 
winner of the Y7 carat dia-
mond ring offered in a special 
Mother's Day drawing Satur-
day at Sanders Jewelry in 
Gainesville. 

Guests for Mother's Day 
dinner in the home of Mr. and 
Mrs. Tony Luke and family 
were her parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. J. J. Haverkamp and his 
mother, Mrs. Ben Luke. Af-
ternoon guests were Mr. and 
Mrs. Willard Zimmerer and 
family of Dallas. 

Mr. and Mrs. H

- 

ugo Lutken- 
haus were guests of their 
children on Mother's Day 
when the family spent the 
day on Lake Texoma fishing 
and boating. A turkey din-
ner was served at noon. To-
gether for the day were Mr. 
and Mrs. Sheldon Lutken-
haus Todd and Tammy, Mr. 
and Mrs. James Krahl, Brooke, 
Shelley, Trent and Cody and 
the' Hugo Lutkenhauses. The 
group also had supper together 
before returning to their 
homes., 

Mrs. Aubrey C

- 

hapman of 
Richardson visited her parr

-ents, Mr. and Mrs. Joe Wal-
ter in Gainesville Tuesday, 
bringing belated Mother's 
Day gifts and special cards 
made by her children for 
their grandmother. Joining 
them for a visit were Mrs. 
Wilfred Sicking and Mrs. Bill 
Graham. 

Mrs. Curtis Holland of Cle-
burne was a Mother's Day 
guest of her mother, Mrs. Ag-
gie Yosten Sunday. 

Mr. and Mrs. J. W. Fisher and 
Mr. and Mrs. J. A. Fisther spent 
the Mother's Day weekend 
visiting their children out-of-
town. Accompanying them 
were Ginnie, Julie and Tonya 
Fisher who visited their cous-
ins. The John Fishers and 
three granddaughters stopped 
in Austin and stayed with the 
Max Rumelhart family in 
Buda. The Joe Fishers drove 
to Houston where they were 
guests of The Neil Fishers. 

Mother's Day held a dou-
ble observance for Mrs. Tony 
Felderhoff Sunday when she 
and her husband were guests 
for brunch in the home of a 
granddaughter the  Bobby 
Zimmerers. Joining them were 
Mr. and Mrs. Albert Kubis, 
Mr. and Mrs. A. J. Felderhoff 
and Jeff, Judy, Mary and 
Cathy. 

Aftennoon visitors in the 
Tony Felderhoff home were 
the Alvin Hartman, Sylvan 
Walterscheid and Joe Felder-
hoff families. And there was 
a phone call from Charles 
Felderhoff and family of Dal-
las, who were spending the 
weekend in Houston with the 
parents of Mrs. Charles Fel-
derhoff. The Dallas family 
spent the previous weekend 
here when they attended Ger-
manfest. 

TRENCHING 
SERVICE 

Using 75 HP Diesel Unit 

We'll dig the trench and 
lay electrical, gas, water 

or sewer line for new construction, 
repairs or oil field work. 

Plumbing Work and 

Roto Sewer Cleaning 

Young Plumbing Co. 
324 S. Weaver, 665-0662. Gainesville 

HAMRIC'S 
Men's & Boys' Wear 

Ws. Place 1.0 9cs itt.0 

14and4 Ticsas know, 

Curlee, unman, Levi, 

Vcm Heiman, Wimbley, 

Melrose. Jockey, Campus 

Donmoor. Tom Sawyer 

TEXAS POWER & LIGHT COMPANY 
A tax-paying, IntAtatOt-Owned electric ublay 

24 HOUR SERVICE 

NOW AVAILABLE 

ALL STAR LANES 
Located Across from the Gainesville Shopping Center on East Hwy. 82 

PRESENTS 

American Junior Bowling Congress 

Youth Summer Bowling 
Due to Popular Demand Registration Week has been Extended to 

May 7th thru May 14th 

Each Summer League Bowler will Receive a Bowling Shirt and a Trip 
To Six Flags Over Texas — Guaranteed 

New Bowlers Joining the American Junior Bowling Congress for the 
First Time Pay a $1.50 Fee Good for One Year. 

All AJBC League Bowlers will Bowl 3 Games each Week for $1.50 per week. 

Leagues Scheduled to Bowl Are 	0 
0 

11 Years of Age & Under 
	 0 

	

Mondays 1 & 6 p.m.; Tuesdays 6 p.m.; Wednesdays 6 p.m. 	0 

12 Years of Age & Older 
	 0 

0 

Mondays 8 p m.; Thursdays 7:30 p.m. 
	 0 

0 

All Star Lanes Furnishes 
Certified instructors, Proper league supervision, 

Free balls S shoes for league bowling. 

Reserve Your Spot 	Summer Fun Out of the Sun 



101 E. California. Gainesville 

Sunday, May 15 

All Star Lanes, Gainesville 
Entry fee, $4.00 per person 

For more information phone 

759 2723, 759-2316, 759-4227 768-2767 

Fashion Comfort 

for Graduation 

FOOTWORKS 
A strap-happy wedgie to call your own on a 
stacked woodwedgel Real leather strappings 
bring it to life, but it -takes you to add the 
pizzazz! 

T & L Shoes = 
202 N. Dixon, Gainesville 

01,  

SPECIAL 
through Wednesday, May 18 

Frog Legs s3.95 
Six jumbo legs served with selection from our 
salad bar and baked or French fry potatoes. 

For your listening pleasure: "Big John" at the keyboard 
providing dinner music Friday and Saturday 

beginning 6 p.m. 

Restaurant Open to Public 
Opens 11 a.m. Monday through Saturday. Closed Sunday. 

THE MIL 
RESTAURANT AND CLUB 

665-3541, Highway 82, Gainesville 

FIRST • 
aliC719VS 

and 	Cemoao.;9n 
1020 N. Grand, 665-0316. Gainesville 

	Ce=a.r=2===)3=21=C1 

We look to 

your future with 

interest. 
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Awards Banquet - - 
 and said that they are still in 

contention for the district 
title. 

Coach Don Ostermann did 
the honors for boys and girls 
track teams. He referred to 
the personal record of each 
member and added that 
:hough the team failed to get 
the 13-A trophy it was well 
represented at regional and 
sent one member, Bryan Sick-
ing, to the state meet in inter-
mediate hurdles. 

Faye Hamric was spokes-
man for volleyball. Besides 
naming the team roster she 
said that early elimination in 
UIL made the season a very 
short one. 

Director Bob Hayes of the 
MHS Band was enthusiastic 
about his charges. In group 
and individual achievement 
their record was the best of 
the past several years. 

Students who participated 
in UIL literary events and 
their records were listed by 
teachers who coached the sub-
jects. Pat Davidson was spec-
ially praised for advancing in 
district and regional competi-
tion to the state level in ready 
writing. 

Recognitions were made al-
so in the school's several stu-
dent organizations, including 
junior and senior chapters of  

the natonal honor society, 
student council, JETS Club, 
Los Jovenes Club, class offi-
cers, annual staff, FHA and 
FFA, Organization sponsors 
spoke for each. 

Scholastic champions of the 
year were selected from three 
nominees in each department. 
In each case Superintendent 
L. B. Bruns named three nom-
inees and then revealed the 
faculty selection, after which 
Principal C. 0. CaSh made the 
department award. 

Pat Davidson headed the 
honors list by receiving five 
awards plus a nomination for 
another. Tina Mollenkopf was 
next with three awards and 
two nominations, then Sam 
Bright with two awards plus 
three horninations. Tim Wolf 
received two awards. 

In the listing here the win-
ner of each award will be 
listed in capitals and other 
nominees will follow. 

Agriculture: ALBERT ZIM-
MERER, Gary Zimmerer, Al-
len Bayer. 

Band:  PAT DAVIDSON. 
Sans Bright Tina Mollenkopf. 

Business: .  MARLENE WAL-
TERSCHEID, Shirley Mon-
day, Tina Mollenkopf. 

English: PAT DAVIDSON, 
Tina Mollenkopf, Judy Fisher. 

Home Economics: SHIRLEY 
MONDAY. Lou Dyer, Lisa 
Trubenbaeh. 

Industrial Arts: DAN FISH-
ER, Bill Huchton, Terry 
Lewis. 

Math: TINA MOLLENKOPF, 
Pat Davidson, Duane Knabe, 

Science: JACK ENDRES, 
Sans Bright., Deryl Zinumerer. 

Social Studies: PAT DAV-
IDSON, Sam Bright, Judy 
Fisher. 

Spanish: WAYNE WIMMER, 
Jack Endres, Fray Webster. 

Athletic Boy: TIM WOLF, 
Jim Koelzer, Mark Sicking. 

Athletic Girl: TRACEY 
KLEMENT. Thelma. Lewis, 
Robin Walterscheid. 

Balfour Award: PAT DAV-
IDSON. 

All Around Girl: TINA 
MOLLENKOPF. 

All Around Boy: TIM 
WOLF. 

DAR Good Citizen: SAM 

Confetti - - - 
commend an end to forced 
busing of school children for 
the sake of integration. It is 
estimated that the total out-
put of 600 average oil wells is 
wasted in supporting that 
program. Other factors are 
the waste of vehicles and 
manpower in violation of the 
wishes of a vast majority of 
American people, as well as 
a violation of the right to at-
tend the school of one's 
choice. 

America will go along with 
ideas of insulating and mak-
ing cars more efficient. Sav-
ing energy makes sense. But 
not much can be said for the 
obvious effort to penalize the 
petroleum industry. A big 
concern of the President was 
to limit profits of energy 
producers. He proposes instead 
to impose a stiff tax on oil, 
to let the government rather 
than producers get the easy 
money. 

After more than 200 years 
of experience with the free 
enterprise system, in which 
our country developed into 
the Most prosperous on earth, 
the government ought to un-
derstand that the tried and 
tested success formula is the 
best solution to our problem. 
The way to get a job done 
is to turn it over to people 
who have shown that they 
know how to do it. To tie 
their hands with regulations 
and environmental demands 
is to doom the energy pro-
gram. Meanwhile let's hope 
that people will wake up be-
fore our national security is 
doomed. 

Wallace Inghsh 
1018 N Grand 

Gainesville, Texas 
668-8566 

BRIGHT. 
Betty Crocker Homemaker 

of Tomorrow: PAT DAVID-
SON. 

Physics Award: SAM 
BRIGHT. 

Highest Grade on National 
Math Test: Tina Mollenkopf 
and Duane Knabe (tie). 

In appreciation for serving 
as master of ceremonies, the 
PTO gifted Dr. Marvin Knight 
with a set or medical books, 
which were presented at his 
office before the banquet. 

Others on the program were 
Judy Fisher in the invoca- 
tion, Tracey Klement in the 
benediction, Ken Fette in in-
troductions and the welcome, 
Sam Bright in the response, 
Urban Endres in remarks from 
the school board, and selec-
tions by the MHS stage band. 

Special after the banquet 
was a showing of highlights of 
the past Cowboy football sea-
son in the auditorium. The 
film was made available to 
Dr. Knight through courtesy 
of the Cowboys. 

Garden Club Supper 
and Installation 

The Muenster Garden Club 
will meet on Monday, May 
16, at the home of Mr. and 
Mrs. Arthur Endres for a cov-
ered dish supper. Husbands 
will be guests. Installation of 
officers will follow. 

Buy, sell, rent with the 
Enterprise Want Ads. 

DON'T 
Put your 

ts  leather coat 
away dirty! 

Let us clean 

ti 
 

& restore it 

flertE.  
CLEANERS 

401 N. Grand 
Gainesville 

Sell it Fast! Buy it Right! Usb Want Ads' 

BOWLING 
TOURNAMENT 

Sponsored by SH Lettermen's Club 

See First Savings 

about a loan on your 

vacation vehicle 

.■ 	 .• ..1.■1.■1.■1.. 	 •,••••■••••111■• 

-- I CI  

Getting  a camper or camper-trailer 
is no problem. Just come in and let 

us help you finance it ... on a 
5 year payment plan. 

Other loans available for cars, boats, home 
or farm improvements, or •any worthwhile en-
deavor .. with bank rate financing. 

We may not be full service, 
but we don't lack much. 

ti  
ti  
ti  ij 

Sb  ti  
ts  
ti  
ti  

ATTENTION! 
LITTON Microwave 

Cooking School 
Everyone Invited ... Men & Women 

Learn how to cook better on 

your own Microwave ... or experience 

the ultimate in cooking on 
The New LITTON Combination 

See all the models 
with all the features 

WHERE: 
Cooke County Electric Co-op 

2' a miles east of Muenster on Hwy. 82 

WHEN: 
Thursday, May 19, 7 to 9 p.m. 

HOW: 
Call 759-4411 for Reservation 

Space Is Limited 

Muenster Butane Co. 
East Highway 82. Muenster 
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