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Forestburg is set for 
Watermelon Festival 

THIS TREE IS ONE of the more spectacular sights 
of dozens of trees splintered like matchsticks by 
high winds Tuesday evening on the R.F. Walter-
scheid lease southeast of Muenster. Other damage 

of the area consisted principally of sheet metal 
siding and roofing torn from lease buildings and 
minor damage to Mel Walterscheid's house. 

PhoW1,,IsmicHar(man 

As the political games of the 
Potomac are going nowadays, it's 
easy to understand why President 
Reagan is getting frustrated and 
why millions taxpayers are getting 
discouraged about the tax relief 
they have been expecting. The 
country's first problem is not the 
high cost of things it needs, but 
rather its vast number of pork 
barrell appropriations whose chief 
merit is to pamper folks back 
home. And it should not be 
overlooked that the politicians 
share in the goodies by way of 
constituent gratitude expressed at 
the polls. 

We've heard many times that 
the senators and congressmen 
have a system of swapping favors. 
A votes for B's favorite bill if B 
will vote for A's.Getting results 
requires getting lots of people in-
volved, with the end result that 
lots of pet projects get approval, 
every one of which is added to the 
tax payer's bill, and the com-
bined cost of all becomes our 
typical multi-billion dollar bur-
den. 

The urgency of changing the 
system has been mentioned lots of 
times, but doesn't get the needed 
attention. It's so easy to ap-
propriate a bit of taxpayer money 
for a measure that will please a 
constituent while increasing one's 
own political influence. 

In the long run the method 
means that lots of pork barrell 
legislation gets approved only 
because a self interest lawmaker 
was buying support for his own 
project. Understandably it's dif-
ficult to influence lawmakers to 
change their ways, especially when 
everyone is doing it. They're sim-
ply reluctant to give up the ob-
vious political benefits. 

But there is a way, and it's in-
, cluded in the president's tax 
reform program. It's the line item 
veto permitting him to veto one 
item in a tax bill without affecting 
the rest of the bill. As is, a bill has 
to be approved or rejected in en-
tirety. This applies to approval or 
veto as well as original passage. 

Many bills that clearly do not 
deserve passage are added as 
amendments to important and 
deserving bills that have a strong 
chance of passing, and receive ap-
proval only because the principal 
provision is that important or that 

	

A. J . 	Felderhoff, 	55, 	of 
Gainesville, died Saturday night 
about 9 o'clock in Westgate 
Hospital, the victim of a tractor 
accident during the afternoon at 
the Albert Kubis farm north of 
Lindsay. 

There were no witnesses to 
relate the tragedy, but it was 
discovered about 4 p.m. by his 
wife, "Girlie," and his son, Jeff, 
who called for an EMS ambulan-
ce. He arrived at the Gainesville 
Hospital about 4:30 and was tran-
sferred to Westgate Hospital a 
short time later. 

Though still conscious when 
taken to surgery, Felderhoff was 
rated as critical, and X-rays in-
dicated that he had several broken 
ribs and internal bleeding. He died 
shortly after the surgery. 

His funeral service was held 
Tuesday, Aug. 20, in St. Mary's 
Church, Gainesville, with his un-
cle, Father Alcuin Kubis, of-
ficiating, and five priests con-
celebrating at a Mass of Christian 
Burial. They were Fathers 
Nicholas Fuhrmann, Cletus Post, 
Denis Soerries, Victor Gillespie 
and Joe_ Weinzapfel. 

Also participating were the St. 
Mary's Choir, and Father 
Nicholas, Victor and Cletus in 
scriptural readings and prayers of 
the faithful. Ann Flederhoff, 
Margie Klement and Helen Pulte, 
who presented offertory gifts, and 
also the pallbearers, were relatives 
and friends of the family. 

Interment was in the Lindsay 
Cemetery directed by Geo. J. 
Carroll and Son Funeral Home, 
and pallbearers were Chad 
Felderhoff, Greg Walterscheid, 
Kenny Thurman, Toby Kubis, 
Ralph Klement and Richard 
Blythe. 

Services preceding the funeral 
were rosaries recited at 4 and 8 
p.m. in the funeral home chapel. 

Father Nicholas, in his funeral 
homily, referred to A.J. as one 

MDA drive set 
Muenster Jaycees will have their 

annual door-to-door drive for the 
Muscular Dystrophy Association 
(MDA) on Thursday, Aug. 29, ac-
cording to Tim Felderhoff, chair-
man. Persons not at home then 
are asked to mail their donations 
to the Jaycees at Drawer J. 

Persons who can help in the 
drive are asked to meet in the city 
park at 6:30 to organize routes. 

A.J. FELDERHOFF 

who lived by his faith in God and 
devotion to his family. He was 
generous in love and invariably 
matched his good advice with 
good example. Likewise in his 
business associations, his 
customers were his friends, always 
knowing he wanted to help. He 
lived God's way and death comes 
as a well-deserved beginning of a 
happy eternity. 

Mr. Felderhoff was a native of 
Muenster, born Oct. 8, 1929, a 
son of Tony and Theresa 
Felderhoff. He was a farmer, a 35-
year employee of Schad and Pulte 
and lately an employee of Case 
Power and Equipment Co. He was 
married on Aug. 9, 1951 to Mary 
E. Kubis in St. Peter's Church, 
Lindsay. He was a member of St. 
Mary's Church and the Knights of 
Columbus. 

He is survived by his wife Mary 
E. (Girlie); his children, spouses 
and grandchildren: Anthony 
Felderhoff Jr. of Chanute, Kan-
sas; Steve and Donna Felderhoff 
and Bradley and Kerri of The 
Colony; Carol and Bobby Zim-
merer and Jessica, Russell and 
Kristin of Gainesville; Ron 
Felderhoff of Austin; Cindy 
Felderhoff of Austin; Mary 
Felderhoff of Arlington; Kathy 
and Karl Metzler of Denton; Jeff 
Felderhoff of College Station; and 
Judie Felderhoff of Arlington; his 
parents, Tony and Theresa 
Felderhoff of Muenster; two 
brothers, Charles Felderhoff of 
Highland Village and Joe 
Felderhoff of Muenster; and two 
sisters, Joanie Hartman and 
Theresa Mae Walterscheid, both 
of Muenster. 

The fifth annual Watermelon 
Festival and Homecoming in For-
estburg will be held on Aug. 24, 
and the red carpet is being rolled 
out by the community to welcome 
visitors, former residents, 
relatives, neighbors, hometown 
residents and area friends. Spon-
sors are members of the Forest-
burg Homemakers. 

A parade will open festivities at 
10 a.m. Lunch, featuring brisket 
and ham, will be served, starting 
at 11:30 a.m. in the NEW Com-
munity Center. Immediately 
following will be an Old West 
Gunfighters Show. 

At I p.m., games and contests 
will start, including fiddlers con-
tests, dunking booth, egg toss, 
watermelon eating contest, turtle 
decorating, tug-of-war, tricycle 
and bike races and more. 

Many free activities will con-
tinue throughout the day. Video, 
made by a Forestburg resident, 
will be shown. There will be 
movies of Indian raids, square 
dancing, craft shows and ample 
opportunities for visiting and 
renewing acquaintances. 

A children's circle with adult 
supervision will be available, to 

There's a reason why Muenster 
streets look better lately and why 
driving them is more pleasant than 
it used to be. It's because some 
umpteen thousand pot holes have 
been filled by more than 175 tons 
of hot mix cold lay asphalt since 
the first of the year. 

The material is a mixture of 
crushed rock with hot asphalt and 
is applied with shovels, then 
packed with a heavy roller. City 
employees did the work with City 
Manager Joe Fenton directing. 

Pasture fire 
clears 100 acres 

An estimated 100 acres of 
pasture went up in smoke Tuesday 
afternoon in a grass fire on the 
Felderhoff ranch located on the 
former Camp Howze northwest of 
Gainesville. 

A half dozen rural fire trucks, 
along with several farm units, bat-
tled the tinder dry grass, along 
with such obstacles as ditches and 
concrete barracks foundations, in 
fighting the flames. City trucks on 
the job were two each from Myra 
and Gainesville and one each from 
Lindsay and Moss Lake. Muenster 
was not notified. 

Evening classes 
set for Defensive 
Driving course 

An evening class in Defensive 
Driving will be offered for persons 
whose daytime jobs prevent them 

from attending the usual classes. 
Mrs. Alice Hellman, the instruc- 
tor, has announced the classes for 

Monday and Tuesday, Sept. 9 and 
10, 6:30 to 9:30 each evening, to 
be held in her home. 

Those attending must be at least 
50 years of age, or older. To 
qualify for a 10 percent reduction 
in insurance rates, both husband 

and wife must be enrolled. 
However, widows and other 
singles may also qualify for the 
reduction. 

For more information, call Mrs. 
Alice Hellman, 759-4966.  

help keep young children busy. 
At 7 p.m., the three-mile Fun 

Run will begin, with trophies for 
the winners. The day will be full of 
music and fun. There will be a 
Crafts contest and show in the 
OLD community center. A 
Watermelon Judging will be held. 
There will be a drawing for a 
beautiful and original watermelon 
quilt, a color TV and other prizes. 

At 8 p.m., Doug Martin and the 
Rustlers will play for a country 
and western dance. 

State Rep. Charles Finnell of 
the 80th House District will be 
featured speaker at the dedication 
of the new Forestburg 
Homemakers Community Center 
on Friday, Aug. 23, 7:30 p.m. 

The dedication is open to the 
public and culminates over five 
years of local fund raising activity, 
according to Charles T. Edwards, 
master of ceremonies. 

They repaired the worst places of 
every street in town. From Jan. I 
to June 25, they applied 30.75 tons 
at a rate of four tons a day when 
weather permitted. After June 25, 
the work schedule got more 
regular and they used 144.4 tons 
of mix. 

However, work is due to slow 
down after Sept. 1 when some of 
the summer crew returns to 
school. Street repair then will be 
done mostly by the sanitation 
workers who normally will be 
available only on Wednesdays. 

Budget hearing 
set at Forestburg 

The Forestburg Independent 
School District will hold a budget 
hearing on Aug. 31, 1985 at 6:30 
p.m. in the Forestburg School. 

Firemen sponsor BBQ 

Friends 	of the 	Muenster 
Firemen are reminded this week to 
mark their calendars for a benefit 
barbecue Saturday night, the 24th. 
It will be in the city park, starting 
at 6 p.m. and prices are $4.00 for 
adults and $2.00 for children. It's 
a fundraiser for new hats, coats 
and equipment. 

	

Preceding 	the 	Saturday 

	

celebration, 	a 	dedication 
ceremony will be held at the NEW 
Forestburg Community Center on 
Friday at 7:30 p.m. with State 
Representative Charles Finnell as 
guest speaker. 

For information on the Arts 
and Crafts Show, call 964-2336 or 
964-2468. For general information 
on the Watermelon Festival, call 
817-964-2436, 964-2435 or 964- 
2214. 

Rep. Finnell, Chairman for 
Budget and Oversight of the 
House Financial Institutions 
Committee, is a member of the 
Appropriations Committee, Con-
servative Coalition, and Interstate 
Oil Compact Commission, and 
serves the nine-county 80th House 
District, which includes Montague 
County. 

"IS THIS THE RIGHT WAY?' 
asks Misty Klement at t 
cheerleaders mini-camp. 

A.J. Felderhoff dies of 	175 tons hot mix 
injuries received in accident . , 

fills city s pot holes 

Finnell to speak at 
dedication of center 

Good News 
...In the Lord I take refuge; how can you say to me, 

"Flee to the mountain like a bird! 
For, see, the wicked bend the bow; they place the arrow 

on the string to shoot in the dark at the upright of heart. 
When the pillars are overthrown, what can the just  man 

do?" 
PSALM 11:1-3 

Still hot 'n dry 
Relieved by only .51 inch of rain this month and by .14 

inch in July, the community is definitely dry, and the 
year's total to date is below normal with a reading of 22.74 
inches. Meanwhile, 100 degrees plus temperatures come 
with typical August frequency. Low and high readings 01 
this week are recorded as follows by Steve Moster. V: 

Aug. 15 	  with .19 inch plus 72 and 92 
Aug. 16 	  71 and 97 
Aug. 17 	  77 and 104 
Aug. 18 	  78 and 104 
Aug. 19 	  76 and 103 
Aug. 20 	 76 and 105 
Aug. 21 	  with .12 inch plus 76 and 98 
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K to 4 registration 
set for August 30 

Public school will 
register grades 5-8 
Aug. 27 and Sept. 3 
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West celebrates 
with Westfest 

• City gets $15,315 
sales tax rebate 

S.anda c' l_ahcr 
ne 

I - miles nor n 	1-6 aco on I - 35. 
The firit tirfeit kas held in 

19-6 and oraar.iced preserve the 
Czechoslova,a.-s her -,:age of the 
cornmuruty and to 'are funds for 
community pro:ect_t. Additional 
funding front.i6es. tfeNt enabled 
the city to purchase and and con-
struct a tiea ballpark and a new 

imm  communle;.• center in past years_ 

forte, thousand people 
attend thls even: each seear. Most 

attendees come from within a 150-
mile radius, with Houston 150 
miles south of West and 
Dallas Ft. Worth 85 miles north. 

The festival kicks off with a 
street dance Friday night held in 
conjunction with the Miss West- 

St. Mary's Catholic Church and 
- e small community of High Phil. 

Texas. will celebrate their 125th 
anniversary on Labor Day 
weekend. The parish festival has 
been extended this year to include 
Friday. Saturday and Sunday. 

Bishop Charles Graliman of 
Victoria will con-celebrate the 10 
am. Sunday Mass. It will feature 
a German-style Man and sinrine 
from the famous Liederkranr of 
San Antonio_ 

St_ Mary's Church was recently 
entered in the national registry of 
historic places. A historical 
display. souvenirs and a country  

parade s he a 
—.int and a 5001- 

' 	 •:- tduled for Sunda, 
TT.: festival grounds 

open at II -130 a.m. both days 
Six bands pia, each day al -

Weszfen and folk dancers from 
around the country perform The 
music O predominantly Czec-
featuring p.oikas and waltzes 
There are also exhibitions hy she 

Sokol gymnasts. 
Twenty-eight 	food 	boorh, 

feature a .-anety of foods to ap-
pease almost an appetite. beer 
gardens to quench a thirst, and 
almost [CO arts and crafts booth; 
to browse through There is also a 
children's area with genes. rides 
and supervision. 

Admission to the esem is 83.00 
for adults and 111.00 foe children_ 
Admission is good for all dancm, 
entertainment_ exhibits and a:- 
tivities within the festival rounds 

store will add to the oc.sssior. 
Other Sunday activities include 

a checker and sten dinner with 
country sausage also available. 

Band performances are booked 
Friday night and dances on Satur-
day and Sunday. The Beethoven 
Maennerdior. the Liederkranz 
and other bands sill entertain all 
day Sunday. Another Sunday at-
traction is a COMM" auction at 2 
p.m. 

High Hill is located three miles 
northwest of Scbulenburg. about 
halfway between San Ar • -n. - and 
Houston off I1I-10 

High Hill Parish 
observes 125th 
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Beef Hindquarters 

$ 1 4$  lb. 
process included 

H&W MEAT CO.-MUENSTER 
99  Chicken Nuggets $2 lb. CUSTOM PROCESSING 

Processing Service in the Area 

Beef - All Cuts Double Wrapped 
Hamburger Patties - Custom Made 

Summer Sausage - Custom Made Fully 
Cooked Beef Sausage - Electrical Stimulation 

$299 	 The Best and Most Complete Catfish Nuggets 	lb. 

PORK 
Complete Curing-Smoking 

Regular Sausage 
Smoked Sausage 
Fully Cooked Smoked Sausage 

Bring Your Hog Or Beef To: 

HIM MEAT CO. 
5th At Mesquoe-Muenster 	759-2744 

'f  Slaughter Days: Tuesday, Thursday 

and Friday...Call Ahead 	...A\  

BEEF HALVES 
Regular Beef 	

12 
Processing included and 4 

Double Wrapped 

414g. 

We Accept 
Food Stamp 

Look No Further! 
All your building 

materials are here! 

Hardware 
	

Lumber 
Electrical & 
	

Supplies 
Home Repair 
	

Tools 

Check with us on 
Remodeling 	Building 

Painting 

Whatever you need 
If we don't hare it 	\Nell Get It! 

Community Lumber Co. 
200 E. Division, Muenster, 759.2248 

OLNEY 
SAVINGS 

We're Neighbors. You Can Believe in Us. 
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817 / 668-7292 
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ears .71go Lindsay ISD adds 
two new teachers 

New on the faculty and the graduate school credit at Mc-
coaching staff at Lindsay this year Murray. He will be a social science. 
is Steve Ratliff, formerly of the teacher at Lindsay, also assistant 
Divide Independent School and coach in football and track and' 
previously at Roby and Buena possibly in basketball. 
Vista, all of West Texas. He is one 	Another addition to the Lindsay 
of the Divide faculty which found faculty is Charlotte Murrell, who 
itself unemployed when his school taught at Groover the past nine 
was recently consolidated with years. She is a 1976 graduate of 
another school. Texas Woman's University and 

Ratliff is a native of Sweet- will teach the second grade at Lin-
water, a graduate of TCU with dsay. 

Lori Ann Wolf 
is NTSU graduate 

40 years ago 

August 17, 1945 
Japenese surrender observed 

here with ringing of church bells 
and Major Weinzapfel's 
proclamation of VJ-Day and 
closing of business houses, also 
thanksgiving ceremonies in both 
churches and a bonfire by 
youngsters. Theresia Haverkamp, 
78, resident of 55 years, dies. Six 
veterans of overseas duty visit: Joe 
Pautler, Bernard Schmitz, 
Lawrence Knabe, Adolph Knabe, 
Frank Trubenbach and Chris Fet-
te. Ray Wilde transferred from 
Germany to medics in England. 
Rhineland parish observes golden 
jubilee. 

30 years ago 

August 19, 1955 
Study by TP&L community 

development department rates 

Christopher John Fuhrmann 
and Clint Edward Fuhrmann, in-
fant twin sons of Mark and Linda 
Fuhrmann were baptized in 
Sacred Heart Church of Muenster 
on Sunday, Aug. 18, 1985 at 6:30 
p.m. by Father Victor Gillespie. 

Baptismal sponsors for 
Christopher were Jill Myrick and 
an uncle, Pat Fuhrmann. Spon-
sors for Clint were an uncle and 
aunt, T.J. and Jeannene Walter-
scheid. 

Each infant's christening robe 
of white eyelet was handmade by 
his mother. The christening 
blankets were gifts from a great-
aunt, Mrs. Albert Herr, also han-
dmade of white eyelet. 

Attending the church services 
were Jennifer, Matthew and Kyle 
Fuhrmann, the babies' sister and 
brothers; their grandparents, Ray 
and Lou Voth and Marcus and 
Cathy Fuhrmann; and uncles, 
aunts and cousins, Johnny, An-
nette, John, Kevin, Denise, Kim 

TIA hosts 
Mini- 
Reflection 

"Teens In Action," TIA Youth 
Group members of Sacred Heart 
Parish were hosts to 67 teens and 
four adult leaders from five other 
parishes for a Mini-Reflection 
Day on Thursday, Aug. 8, in the 
Community Center. 

A hamburger cookout was the 
opening event, followed by get-
acquainted songs and games led 
by Wayne Romo and Bill Hopkins 
of Fort Worth. 

A program on "Sexuality and 
Morality" was given by Debbie 
Leek, also of Fort Worth. 

The Youth Ministry team of the 
Fort Worth diocese then led the 
assembly in large and small group 
discussions on relationships, 
dating and how relationships af-
fect and influence lives. Each 
group prepared a list of questions 
which were later brought before 
the full assembly for discussion. 

Guests attended from Lindsay, 
Valley View, Henrietta, 
Jacksboro, Forestburg and Muen-
ster. 

Chairmen for the TIA project 
were Mark Rist, diocesan youth 
director, Wayne Romo, Bill 
Hopkins, Debbie Leek, members 
of the Diocesan Youth Ministry 
team, and John Walterscheid, 
Anne Poole and Linda Knabe. 

Muenster as exceptionally stable 
and progressive. Sunday set for 
swim pool opening. Council votes 
to install curb for four-lane high-
way through city. Highway 
engineer helps with plans for park. 
Mrs. Henry Wolf, 80, resident 
since 1896, dies. Hogs banned in 
city limit. Jim Harris joins MHS 
as band director. Eighteen 
Benedictine sister to staff SH 
School. Cooke County Fair to 

open Aug. 29. Births:a son for 
Mr. and Mrs. Al Hess; a daughter 
for the Joe Tempels; a daughter 
for the Bill Hunts; a son for the 
Tony Fleitmans; a son for the Leo 

J. Mosmans. Bernice Walter-
scheid marries James Mollenkopf; 
Frankie Owen marries James 
Hermes. Four take vows at OLV 
ceremony: Sisters Christina, 
Roberta, Cecile, and Francesca. 

and Corey Anderle; Willie, 
Margie, Shayne and Stephanie 
Wimmer; Danny, Janet, Debra 
and Michael Voth; Bobby, Becky, 
Sondra, Nicole and Marcie Bauer; 
Steve, Brenda, Andrea, Dee Ann 
and Dominic Fuhrmann; Tommy, 
Pam, Amy and Josh Hoberer; 
Craig Voth; Sharon Voth; 
Garland Tate; and Kenny Fuhr-
mann. 

All were guests at the Mark 
Fuhrmann home for a buffet of 
pick-up foods and a special "Bap-
tismal Cake" honoring the twin 
boys. 

Immunization clinic 
set for August 28 

The Texas Department of 
Health Region 5 office in 
Arlington announces a free Im-
munization Clinic to be held in 
Muenster on Wednesday, August 
28, 1985 at Sacred Heart Com-
munity Center from 9:00 A.M. -
12:00 Noon. 

The clinic will provide im-
munization against Diptheria-
Tetanus-Pertussis (DTP), Polio, 
Rubeola (Red Measles) and 
Rubella (German Measles). 
Precautions must be taken with 
females in the 12-18 age group to 
insure that they are not pregnant 
when they are immunized with 
Measles and/or Rubella vaccines, 
and that they do not become 
pregnant for 3 months following 
immunization. 

Immunizations are incomplete 
if a child has not received three (3) 
doses of DTP and four (4) doses 
of Polio vaccine with one dose 
administered past the fourth bir-
thday. All children under 18 years 
must have an informed consent 
form read and signed by the 
parent or legal guardian. If 
possible, the parent should ac-
company the child to the clinic. 
Immunization records should ac-
company the child to the clinic 
and be examined by the public 
health nurse who will answer any 
questions.  

20 years ago 

August 20, 1965 
First year auditor's report 

praises hospital operation and 
community achievement. 87 get 
certificates in children's reading 
program. W.F. Davidson home 
destroyed in fire caused by light-
ning. 23 Hornets start football 
practice. Sister Amora observes 
golden jubilee of her profession as 
a nun. 30 report for SH foot-
ball. Mike Sloan elected secretary-
treasurer of Texas Electric Co-op. 
Lou Ann Reiter marries Alcuin 
Paul Kubis. Ted Gremmingers 
move to Midland. Jerry Klement 
goes to Maryland for a year of 
study. Ben Luke family has 
reunion. Birth :a son for the 
Jimmy Jack Biffles. Pete Mueller, 
86, former resident, dies in 
Colorado. Norb Koeslers greeted 
at housewarming for new home. 

Lay Franciscans hold 
August prayer hour 

Secular Franciscans met Sun-
day, Aug. 18, at 3 p.m. in Sacred 
Heart Church for their monthly 
prayer hour and fraternity 
business. 

Mrs. Leo Henscheid, prefect, 
led the Liturgy of the Hours, then 
read official communications and 
distributed current copies of 
"Canticle News" which serves 
Secular Franciscans of the 
Oklahoma Region, to which the 
Muenster and Lindsay chapters 
belong. 

News notes from the area in the 
magazine included an item about 
Mrs. Teresa Hermes, Lindsay 
prefect, having suffered a broken 
hip on July 15. Although she is 
improving, members were urged 
to remember her in their prayers. 

Members received an invitation 
to attend a regional meeting in St. 
Francis Village at Crowley on 
Aug. 31. Local members discussed 
plans to attend. 

Mrs. Frank Herr, secretary, 
read minutes of the July meeting 
and Mrs. Felix Yosten gave the 
treasurer's report. 

Before adjournment, the group 
prayed the Rosary for Loretta 
Wilde, recently deceased member 
of the fraternity, and concluded 
with the Peace Prayer of St. Fran-
cis. 

Eight members attended and 
Sister Barbara Bernauer was a 
special guest. 

Come by 
.- 	 and see 

us for 
all your 

painting and 
wallpaper 

needs. 
Decorator 

Supply Center 
1110 E. California 

Gainesville. 665-0256 

LUCY FUHRMANN, daughter 
of Mr. and Mrs. Joe Paul Fuhr-
mann of Lindsay, was the first 
place winner in a statewide essay 
contest sponsored by the Catholic 
State League and the Catholic Life 
Insurance Union, entitled "What 
I Think About Prayer in the 
Public School." Because she won 
first prize, the CCD Program in 
Lindsay received a $50.00 cash 
award and Lucy received a $25.00 
personal prize. Lucy Fuhrmann is 
a student of Lindsay High School. 

Visit in Muenster 

Mr. and Mrs. Arthur Arnold of 
San Antonio were recent guests of 
her cousin, Mrs. Florence Fisher 
in Muenster. They were com-
pleting a vacation trip that took 
them to New Mexico, Arizona, 
Utah, Colorado, Kansas and 
Oklahoma. They also toured Big 
Bend National Park and spent 
some time at land they own near 
the area. Mrs. Arthur Arnold is 
the former Viola Bergman, a 
native of the Myra-Muenster area. 

Sample of college 
Jean Pagel was one of 450 

students through grade 12 par-
ticipating in the fifth annual 
"Shake Hands with Your Future" 
program at Texas Tech this sum-
mer. Its purpose is summer 
enrichment exposing students to 
advanced learning opportunity 
and to living in a university set-
ting. Jean is the daughter of the 
John Pagels, a student of Muen-
ster High School. 

Lori Ann Wolf has been em-

ployed as a teacher in the Garland 
School System. 

Attending the graduation ser-
vice were her husband Kent and 
her parents, the Ray Stinedurfs, 
her brother and her two gran-
dmothers, all of Garland. Also 
Kent's parents, the Ernest Wolfs, 
his brothers Dale, Stuart and 
Troy and his grandparents, the 

CPR classes 
Another basic class in cardio-

pulmonary resuscitation (CPR) 
will be taught here if sufficient in-
terest is indicated, according to 
Joan Walterscheid. She said that 
certified instructors are available 
and the classes would be in Muen- 

tu 

Henry Wolfs, all of Muenster. 

Lori Ann Wolf is a Cum Laude 
graduate of North Texas State 
University, receiving her Bachelor 
of Science degree in Secondary 
Education on Saturday, Aug. 17. 
The summer commencement was 
held in the main auditorium. A - 
reception followed in the Silver 
Eagle Lounge, for graduates and 
guests. 

offered  

ster, probably at the hospital. In- 
terested persons are invited to call 
the hospital, 759-2271, for infor- 

mation or to leave their names, or 
to call Joan Walterscheid, 759-
4296, after office hours. 

Fuhrmann Baptism 

FOR GOOD, LOW COST 

FIRE and STORM INSURANCE 
Contact 

Edward Endres, Secretary, 7592905. Boa 37. Muenster 

Fire Insurance Association 
Muenster Farm Mutual 

2 
3 

fml 
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Rapp Birthday, Carol Fleitman 

Why Haven't You 
Moved Your 

Checking Account To 
Olney Savings? 

You would never invest your savings in an account 
that didn't earn interest. So why allow yourself to 
have a non-interest bearing checking account? 

Think about it, and then come see us soon, or call 
and well come see you. 

1 Maybe because you didn't know that Olney 
Savings offers interest-bearing checking 
accounts. 

Maybe because you didn't know that on a 
variety of checking accounts, Olney Savings 
pays current market interest rates. 

Maybe because you are waiting for us to tell 
you that we want you to move your checking 
account to Olney Savings. We do, 



LIFESTYLE 

Photo by Mathews Photographers 

14R. AND MRS. JAMES NEWMAN of Kansas City, Mo. have an-
lounced the engagement and forthcoming wedding of their daughter, 
3arbara Kay Lane of Carrollton, to Joseph M. Bartush of Farmers 
3ranch, son of Mr. and Mrs. Charles F. Bartush Sr. of Muenster. Joe • 
Ind Barbara will be married on Sept. 14 at noon in St. Rita Catholic 
:hurch in Dallas. Father John Coury of Chicago, cousin of the groom, 
Ind Father David Lawrence, of St. Rita Church, will officiate. Bridal 
attendants will be Sue Kuhlo of Carrollton, maid of honor, Angie and 
Virginia Bartush of Muenster, sisters of the groom, Liz Ross of 
:olumbia, Mo. and Lynn Dejoy of Dallas as bridesmaids. The bride-
lect is a graduate of O'Hara High School in Kansas City, Mo. and a 
982 graduate of the University of Missouri at Columbia. She is em-
>loyed by Continental Trust Co. The future-groom is a graduate of 
sacred Heart High School and a 1983 graduate of Benedictine College 
n Atchison, Kansas. He is employed by Bartush-Schnitzius Foods 
Tompanv of Dallas. The couple plans to reside in Farmers Branch. 

Doug Walterscheid 
graduates at De Vry 

Dankesreiter 
Garage 

General Auto Repair 
Air Conditioner Service 

759.4521 

Box 25.1 
Hwy. 82 

Muenster 

 

New Arrivals 

To make the most of your money, you need a money fund that works. 

Western works. 

7.75% 
MONEY FUND 

($1,000 minimum deposit. Limited checking) 
Our 7.75% interest is compounded continuously to yield 8.17% annually. 

Rates subject to change without notice. 

Come see us now. Western Savings in 
Gainesville, 

1020 N. Grand, 665-0316. 

LA Offices throughout Texas. More than $1 Billion in assets. =I 
8. 22.1-k 

FSLIC  WESTERN SAVINGS 

R.L. ROBERTS 
	 CONSTRUCTION, INC. 

Utility Construction 

458-3147 
or 458 - 7257 

• 	Street & Road Building 

Curb & Gutter 
West Highway 35 

Sanger, Texas 

SUPER SAND INC. 
Concrete, Mortar & Cushion Sand 

Washed & Oversized Rock - Also Pea Gravel 
665-4111 	 Gainesville 

,c\e 
' °' 

	

,1/4.Bar-B-Q -Bar-B-Q . 	

 

	Smo  keout 	 
with tole slaw, potato salad, beans, pickles, onions, tee, bread 

Saturday, August 24 
Muenster City Park 

	

Adult 1 4°° 	Child 1 200  

	

Meal starts 	Free Swim 
Party 7-10 p.m. Sponsored By 	 6:00 p.m. 

Muenster Volunteer Firemen 

Help us extinguish/ 
your fire! 

Hot Summer days mean slow furniture sales, but we 
don't like slow days so we're doing something about it. 

Don't Miss this Bargain Bonanza! Now's the Time to Buy! 

20°/o OFF 
AND MORE — YES EVEN UP TO 50% OFF 

during our End of Summer Clearance Sale 

HURRY! SALE ENDS AUG. 31! 
Now isn't this the kind of sale 

you like? Furniture for every room 
in your house is on sale! 

50% OFF on selected end tables 

and discontinued mattress sets. 

40% OFF on Sealy Posturepedic 

Mattress Sets and Kirsch Mini Blinds 

30% OFF on Selected Riverside 

and Bassett Sofas & Love Seats 

25% OFF on group of La-Z-Boy' 

Recliners 

20% OFF on Broyhill Bedroom 

Suites 

*-7 12‘.)..., • 
r 

FREE DELIVERY 

759-4455 

FURNITURE CO. 

Muenster 202 W. Main 

tiL4'00.4a1 ,44,t, 
 re gell C41.0.1. 
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Local relatives attend wedding 

Douglas Walterscheid is a 
graduate of DeVry Institute of 
Technology, Irving, with a 
liploma in the electronics 
echnician program and has accep-
ed employment with Acoustics 
southwest of Irving. He is a 
;raduate of Muenster High 

Todd and Brenda Richey are 
'arms of a daughter, their first 
hild, Tiffany Lynn, born at Flow 
demorial Hospital in Denton on 
donday, Aug. 19, 1985 at 8:35 
,.m. weighing 7 lb. 2 oz. Tiffany 
..ynn is the first grandchild for 
dr. and Mrs. Ervin Henscheid 
.nd the fourth grandchild for Mr. 
,nd Mrs. Wendell Richey, all of 
duenster. The great-grandparents 
.re Mr. and Mrs. Herman Richey 
If Gainesville, and Mrs. Richard 
L'ain, Mrs. Albert Henscheid and 
'heo Miller, all of Muenster. The 
.real-great-grandmother is Mrs. 
.S. Hogan of St. Richard's Villa. 

School, a son of the Jerry Walter-
scheids. 

DeVry is one of North 
America's largest networks of 
proprietary post secondary 
technical education. The Irving 
campus is one of 11 in the DeVry 
system. 

Mrs. Todd Richey is the former 
Brenda Henscheid. 

Teresa Mills and Mark Moster 
announce the birth of their son, 
Mark Steven Moster, Jr., in 
Gainesville Memorial Hospital on 
Thursday, Aug. 8, 1985 at 2:47 
a.m., weighing 7 lb. 12 oz. and 
measuring 201/2 inches long. The 
grandparents are Charles and 
Janet Mills of Batesville, 
Mississippi, and the late Lawrence 
and Violet Moster of Muenster. 

A number of local relatives at-
tended the wedding on Aug. 10 of 
Mary Margaret Burns and 
Gregory Allen Klement in 
McAllen. 

They included the groom's 
grandparents, Mr. and Mrs. Ber-
nard Wolf and Mr. and Mrs. Nor-
bert Klement of Muenster; also 
Mrs. James Wolf, Mr. and Mrs. 
Leroy Kupper and Joey, Tim and 
Kristen, Mrs. Jim Otto and Lofie, 
Mrs. Marcy Marr, Mrs. Norma 
Cain, and Gerald Winter and Gee 
Gee. 

The bride is the daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Ted Burns of 
McAllen. The groom is the son of 
Julia and Will J. Klement, of 
Mission and formerly of Muen-
ster. 

Celebrating her seventh birth-
day a few days early on Saturday, 
Aug. 10, was a special treat for 
Julia Fleitman when her parents, 
Patsy and John Dave Fleitman, 
hosted a swim party at the pool in 
Muenster City Park at 3 p.m. Her 
actual birthday was Aug. 14. 

Guests included her gran-
dmothers, Mrs. Julius Hermes, 
Sr. and Mrs. Bruno Fleitman; 
aunts Marcella Zimmerer, Joyce 
Hermes and Sara Lester; friends 

Brian Joseph Strittmatter, in-
fant son of Joyce and James 
Strittmatter of Pilot Point, and 
grandson of Mr. and Mrs. John 
Hacker of Muenster and Mr. and 
Mrs. Joe Strittmatter of Pilot 
Point, was baptized in St. Thomas 
Catholic Church during the 
evening Mass on Aug. 14, vigil of 
the feast of the Assumption of 
Mary. 

Rev. Augustine Lucca, pastor, 
officiated and baptismal sponsors 
were Jeanne. Strittmatter and 
Steven Strittmatter. 

SNAP 
Menus 

Aug. 27, 28, 29 

Tues. - Spaghetti and meat, 
green beans, applesauce, hot rolls, 
butter, milk. 

Wed. - Wiener-wrap, blackeye 
peas, lettuce salad, jello, milk. 

Thur. - Chicken pot pie with 
vegetables, cheese sticks, tole 
slaw, pineapple, bread, butter, 
milk. 

13( 
1.11,4 

.8 rapid', 

Muenster 
Pharmacy 

Medical Center Budding 

817 759.2833 

The bride wore a formal white 
satin gown trimmed in French 
lace, with Renaissance sleeves, V-
neckline, low-pointed waistline, 
regal satin skirt graced by lace 
designs on the front and encircling 
the hem and train. Her veil was a 
gift from her sister. Her bridal 
flowers were carried in a cascade 
of white roses, tiny blue forget-
me-nots, white baby's breath and 
lace ribbons. She wore her 
mother's wedding diamond cross 
and gold chain. 

Her six bridesmaids, who in-
cluded two of the groom's sisters-
in-law, wore blue lace tea-length 
dresses and matching blue shoes. 
Each wore a wreath of spring 
flowers in her hair. 

Billie Friday and Dobe Friday; 
and classmates Jennifer Sicking, 
Carrie Hess, Misty Klement, Toni 
Trubenbach, Mary Knabe, Mindy 
Hennigan, Delana Endres and 
Andrea Klement; and cousins 
Marlene and Darlene Hess, 
Alethea and Jerry Brawner, Kelly 
Hermes and Donna Lester; and 
the honoree's brothers, Samuel 
and Jon. 

Birthday cake and ice cream 
were served for refreshments. 

Also attending were the baby's 
parents; the paternal grandparen-
ts, Joe and Margaret Strittmatter; 
a great-aunt, Marie Strittmatter; a 
neighbor, Natalie Pawl; and 
Brian's sister, Donna; and a 
cousin, Andy Strittmatter. 

Plaza 
Home Health Care 

Oxygen Therapy & Supplies 
Wheelchairs •Walkers •Crutche, 
Commode Chars •Hospital Beck 

— SALES & RENTALS — 

We Bill Medicare & 
All Insurances 

Free 
DIRECT 

24-Hour 
area-Wide 665-1507 Em,rpncy  
Delivery 1820 O'Neal St. Service 

The groom's best man was his 
brother, Michael J. Klement, and 
the groomsmen included his 
brothers, Jon and Chris Klement. 

The Nuptial Mass was 
celebrated by Father Marti Zuber 
in Our Lady of Sorrows Catholic 
Church at 3 p.m. 

A reception followed at La 
Posada of McAllen, where 
arrangements of white gladioli 
and mums decorated the serving 
tables. The three-tiered white 
wedding cake was decorated with 
silk flowers complementing the 
bridesmaids' attire. Music at the 
reception was provided by the 
Dean Canty Orchestra. 

After a wedding trip to Paradise 
Island, Nassau, the couple will  

reside in College Station where the 
groom is a junior attending Texas 
A&M University. He is a graduat 
of Sharyland High School. Th 
bride is a graduate of McAllen 
High School and is employed by 
Satelco RGV. 

Julia Fleitman 
has 7th birthday 

Strittmatter 
Baptism 

= t 
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1970 class 
reunion set 
for grads 

Muenster 	High 	School 

graduates of 19 -o and rt,rr 

	

spouses will meet I, 	 , r. 
obsersing the 15th d11111,1:1,1, 01 

their graduation on Saturday, 
Sept 28, at the home of Cliff and 
Kathy Sicking on Cherry lane in 
Muenster.  

Plans are being made for a 
hospitality hour to begin at 6 p m 
Each former classmate is asked to 
bring an item of pick-up tools 
suitable for a buffet supper. Fried 
chicken and beer will be pros 'Lied 

Also each classmate is requested 
to bring folding lawn chairs. 
school pictures, photo albums and 
Hornet Yearbooks.  

An RSVP will be appreciated.  
Call Glenda Russell, 759-4537 or 
Kathy Sicking, 759-4242, or w rite 
to Rt. 1, Box 154, Muenster, Tx. 
76252. Classmates are urged to 
pass the word along, in an effort 
to help assemble the entire glass 
And !heir spouses 

MUENSTER HORNET ('HI:ERLEADERs spon- 
sored a Cheerleader Mini-5 amp at the cit, park on 
Aug 19-21 I mix tour sol, .10,1,1,1 and !..nned 

Mao 57 Jamie Harlan 

Junior High Cheerleading Squad and the Lindsay 
Squire Junior High Squad. Despite the heat, the 
girls all agreed that school spirit and cheerinv are 
lots of fun! 

Keepsake Pak 

Preserves and 
Protects 

the original beauty 
of your wedding gown 

or other treasures 

Miller Cleaners 

i*B 

L B. Bruns was elected a director of Muenster State 
Bank in January, 1983. 

"I believe in locally controlled growth to make a 
financially sound bank and community. This larger 
board of directors gives us more input and better con-
tact with our community. That means operating with 
better in formation." he said 

He is a graduate of Gainesville High School and 
Junior College; studied engineering at Washington 
University in St. Louis: earned a bachelor's degree in in 
dustrial arts and social studies at North Texas State 
University and a master of science degree in ad 
ministration at NTSU. He also served in the armed for 
ces in WWII for three and a half years 

L.B. Bruns taught in the Muenster Independent 
School District from 1949-1954: served as principal '54 

'59; and superintendent '59-'80. As superintendent, he 
managed the school's annual budget of over $450.000 
In the 31 years he saw the school grow from a four-room 
structure to a modern plant with extensive facilities 

Bruns was married in 1942 to the former Loree Dunn 
of Saint Jo. They have a son. Robert of Dallas, and a 
daughter, Beverly of Fort Worth. and two grandchildren.  

He is a 21-year member of the Texas Assoc of School 
Administrators. a life member of the Texas State 
Teachers Assoc , a member of the Knights of Columbus 
and of the Muenster Chamber of Commerce and the 
area C of C Coordinating Board 

)11 Know Us. We Know You. 
Muenster 
State Bank 

YOU 
KNOW 

US. 

WE 
KNOW 
YOU. 

Joy's Fabric Shop 
Saint Jo, Texas 	 . 995-2390 

August Back to School 
Sa\e  10% to 30% off 

4. 
Corduroys, wools, poly-cotton prints, yarn-dyed stripes 
and plaids. Large selection of new fall & winter fabrics. 

Open Tuesday through Saturday 

9.00 a. m. to 5:30 p.m 	 Closed Monday 

r 8 

Elisa to 
compete 

ELISA ENDRES. the three-Near-
old daughter or led and Susan 
Endres 01 Gainesville and gran-
ddaughter of Ray and EMMA En-
dres of Muenster and great-
granddaughter of Sirs. Matt Neu 
of Gainessille, will represent this 
area at the National Finals of the 
Miss American Sweet heart 
Pageant Feb. 8-10. It will be held 
at Big D, the 1880's frontier town 
18 minutes from downtown 
Dallas. Winners of the 
preliminary contests from around 
the United States, ages 1 to 17, 
will be entertained in authentic 
frontier Texas welcome style. 
They will compete for more than 

525,000 in academics scholar-
ships, prizes and awards. More in-
formation is as ailable from 
American Pageant System, Inc., 
2742 Brandon St., Dallas, Texas 
75211. 

Surprise honors 
Flo Walterscheid 

A surprise birthday party for 
Flo Walterscheid was a real sur-
prise when her sister, Ann Herr, 
and her daughter, Connie 
Grewing, planned the event for 
Aug. 14, well in advance of her ac-
tual Aug. 20 birthday. 

The event was held at the home 
of Mr. and Mrs. Albert Herr at 
7:30 p.m. 

The 	birthday 	cake 	was 
decorated with the honoree's 
favorite red roses, and a colorful 
balloon centerpiece arrangement 
added to decor. A money tree was 
the principal gift. 

Attending the covered dish sup-
per were Marie and Herbie Herr 
of Gainesville; Andy and Mary 

Ann Arendt, Johnny and Sally 
Arendt, Lu Ella and Vincent 
Zimmerer all of Lindsay; Joanie 
and Albert Bauer of La Feria; Lu 
and Ray Voth, Kenny and Alice 
Walterscheid, Herbie and Margie 
Walterscheid, Ricky and Diane 
Walterscheid, Gary and Brenda 
Walterscheid, Pat Walterscheid, 
and the hosts, Connie and Glenn 
Grewing and Albert and Ann 
Herr. 

Mon., Aug. 5 - Berniece Gillen, 
Saint Jo; Timothy D. Robinson, 
Whitesboro. 

Tues.. Aug. 6 - John David 
Reiter, Muenster; John Paul 
Dauer, Panhandle. 

Wed.. Aug. 7 - Randolph Her-
mes, Kenya Endres and baby boy,  
Kyle Joseph, Muenster; Elsa T. 
O'Swalt, Saint Jo. 

Thur.. Aug. 8 - Everett C. 
Lyons (expired). Saint Jo. 

Fri., Aug. 9 - Robb Allen Cog  - 
zler, May Phillips, Saint Jo. 

Sat., Aug. 10 - Wm. Wayne 
Gray, Nocona; Carroll Ralph 
Hammond, Jacksboro; Gars 
Morgan, Thackerville, OK. 

Sun. Aug. II - Linda Moore, 
Saint Jo; Timothy D. Robinson, 
Whitesboro. 

Mon., Aug. 12 • Sha ■.ne 	rn 
Wimmer, Muenster: Stesen Holt 

Cash or C ,  • 

(,r 

Boggess, Dories Adis Blakely, 
Saint Jo 

1 ues.. Aug 11 - James Vogel, 
Muenster, James O. York, 
Game, ille. 

Wed., Aug. 14 - Michael Lee 
Hess, Mars E. Koelzer, Joe C. 
Andress, Bertha McElroy, Muen-
ster;Nlars in E .Williams. Mon-
tague. Debra Anne Robertson and 
baby boy, Chars Andrew. 
Nocona. 

Thur., Aug. 15 - George Mae 
Trachta. Nluenster; Robert P. 
Ballard, Nocona, Ronald Story, 
Compton, CA. 

Fri.. Aug. 16 - None 
Sal Aug 	Timothy Bartel, 

vluei,to °lei., I ough, Nocona. 
'; , 111 	 \11.1: 	 IS • Karen DeNise 

kr..1111 and bibs 	girl, 	Brittany 
I)k Anne. <;a uicss ills. 

Sam celebrates 1st 
Sam Bradford, son of Debbie 

and Stuart Bradford of Austin 
and grandson of Mr. and Mrs 
Leonard (Spike) Yosten of Muen 
ster, celebrated his first birthday 
on July 27 with a party at the 
home of his parents. 

A Sesame Street theme was 
carried out in decorations. Birth-
day cake and ice cream, gift 
opening and a swim party for the 

children added to the afternoon's 
fun. The chocolate birthday cake 
was made by Sam's paternal gran-
dmother, Gene Bradford. 

Children attending the party 
were Lesley and Christopher 
Bullion. Michael and Randy 
Grewing, Cas Slimp, Brooke 
Bradford and Sam's sister, 
l.auren. 

Adults attending were the gran-
dparents, Gene and Jim Bradford 
of Austin; uncles and aunts, Bill 
and Ellen Bradford of Houston; 
Diane and Jim Grewing of Muen-
ter; Susan and David Bullion of 

Austin; Robin and Eugene Brad-
ord of Austin; and Cynthia and 

Chester Slimp of San Antonio. 

James 
Boot & Shoe 

Repair 
DYE WORK 

110 North Commerce 

Gainesville 

()pen Month)) then 'Ads) 
Saturday ill noun 

MR. AND MILS. JACK C. DILL 01 Forestburg hake announced OIL 
engagement and approaching marriage of their daughter. Vatom Carol, 
to Scott Allan Selby, son of Pat Selby of Era and Wayne Selbs. tut 
Gainesville. The couple has chosen Sept. 21 for their wedding day, with 
the ceremony to be held in Forestburg United Methodist Church at 5 
p.m. The bride-elect is a 1980 graduate of Forestburg High School and 
a 1985 graduate of North Texas State Um, ersity She is a as consultant 
employed at Deloitte, Haskins and Sells of Dallas. The future-groom is 
a 1979 graduate of Era High School and is employed by Peterbilt of 
Ontnon Ihc,orf, plans to res,,le in 

Hospital Notes 

Roug ue -;' (Nis 

Balloon Greetings & 
Fruit Baskets 

// 	.1..„1 

VP°1‘•
iGrand Opening 

aid Shop \ 	SALE 
Aug. 26 ihru Aug. 31 

Seeds 
Jewelers 

40 WO off Slurs! 	,• 	le,sclis Now 

This Is The Kick-Off For 
Christmas Lay-A-Way Season 

20 % to 50 % off 
Everything In The Store 

ONE FULL WEEK 

News of the Sick 

'Mrs. Ray sicking of Nis ra is a 	Aug 16. ( girds will reach her ad- 
surgical patient at Wilson N 	dressed to Stable Sicking, Wilson 
Jones Hospital in Sherman SI,e N. Jones Hospital, Washington 
underwent s , trgers on Friday.  St., Sherman, texas 7 5090 

-******F R E E***-v--v-ist 
For FREE Classified Ads in our nest 

BEST VALUES. call 759-4311 

Remember the 

Myra Volunteer 
Fire Department 
BAR-B-QUE 

Saturday 

Sept. 7, 1985 



Forestburg 
News 

by Myrt Denham 

BELTONE 
Hearing Aid 

Batteries 

Always Fresh 

Shop the Drive-In Window 
for all your prescriptions 

and drug needs. 

WATTS' 
PRESCRIPTION SHOP 

302 N. Grand 	Gainesville 

New GMC'S 
Pickups & Trucks 

See us for expert 
Tune-ups and Air Conditioning Service 

HOEDEBECK GMC 
216 N. Main, Muenster, 759.4336 

-NI . , THE 	At 	.,... 

la 	Me 	Akaaa'9,, 
Restaurant

avuk. 
600 Fair Park Boulevard 

665.8800 	Gainesville 

HAS A WEEKEND 
FOR YOU! 

FRIDAY 

Seafood Buffet 
Featuring: 

Snow Crab Legs 
Stuffed Sole 
Fried Shrimp 
Peel & Eat Shrimp 
Catfish 
Stuffed Oysters 
Seafood Newburg 
And More... 

Served 8-10 p.m. 

$9.95 Adults 
$8.95 Seniors 
$6.95 Children 6.12 
5 and under 
EAT FREE! 

SATURDAY 

Prime Rib Buffet 

Featuring 
Fresh Carved 
Prime Rib 
Fantastic Baked 
Potato Bar 
Fresh Fruit 
Salad Bar 
Rolls and Butter 
And More... 

Served 6.10 p.m. 

$7.95 Adults 
$6.95 Seniors 
$5.95 Children 6.12 
5 and under 
EAT FREE! 

SUNDAY 

Brunch 

Featuring 
Omelettes prepared 
to your liking 
Carved Baron 
of Beet 
BBO Beef Brisket 
Chicken Fried Steak 
Catfish 
And More... 

Served 11 a.m.•2 p.m 

$5.95 Adults 
$4.95 Seniors 
$3.95 Children 6.12 
5 and under 
EAT FREE! 

THE WELLHEAD 
Lounge 

Entertainment 

Lee & Char 
8:00 

Friday 

p.m.-12:00 Midnight 

SAMPLE OF WHAT'S to be seen at the Forest-

Ntirg Watermelon Festival is this all-terrain vehicle 

with watermelon replica, the 1984 parade winner. 
They called it the "Green Machine." 

Photo by Janie Hartman 

Sale 
The longer you wait—the more you save ... 

but ... will your selection still be here? 

n  soon 
Come in 	Sportswear, Accessories, 

Lingerie, Children's Wear, Early Holiday Items 

Entire Summer Stock!  
60% OFF 

Fri., Aug. 23 	 70% OFF 
Sat., Aug. 24 	 80% OFF 

retb 
ec on the square 

Montague, Tx. 

All Sales Final 

Visa 8 MC Welcome 
894.6133 

on 
Mattress 

Box 
Bedroom 

Suits 

OTTS ,Furniturezdonlypilances , 

 Sales and Service 

Gainesville 	865.6861 115 S. Commerce 
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Miss Lois Bewley, Clyde and 
Lonnie had as their guests Sun-
day, Aug. 18 Mrs. Ima King of 
Bowie who had just returned from 
a tour of Ireland, leaving from 
DFW accompanied by her sister 
Mrs. Winona Russell and MRs. 
Verna McGaw of Palestine, Tx. 
There were 41 on the 3 week in-
teresting tour. But it rained every 
day but 3. 

The annual Sutton reunion was 
held at the Ross Point Community 
Center Sunday, Aug. 18. Lunch 
was served at noon with 101 
people attending. They came from 
New Deal, Fort Worth, Wichita 
Falls, Arlington, Oklahoma City, 
Howe, Houston, Gainesville and 
Lake Kiowa. 

Mrs. Gladys Balthrop received 
word Friday of the death on Thur-
sday, Aug. 15 of her brother-in-
law Grady Blanton of Gainesville. 
After being in ill health for some 
time. Funeral services were held 
Saturday at 10 in the Carroll 
Funeral Chapel with burial in 
Fairview Cemetery. He is survived 
by his wife Opal and one son. 
Those attending were Mrs. 
Bilthrop, Mrs. Sybil Smith of 
Texarkana, Mrs. Sandra Lahman 
of Iowa Park, Mrs. Anna Kirk, 
and Mr. and Mrs. R.B. Durham 
Jr. 

Mrs. Juanita Cote accompanied 
Mr. and Mrs. Travis Sutton on a 
week's trip to Canyon where they 
saw the play "Texas!", then they 
went to Durango, Colo. where 
they rode the train, then to Salt 
Lake City, Utah, then back home. 

Mrs. Inez Stevens and Mrs. 
Mary Ruth Kindiger spent Sunday 
at Lake Kiowa visiting Mr.and 
Mrs Bill Maddox. Other guests in 
the Maddox home were their 
daughter Mrs. Monica Lamb and 
daughter Emily of Fort Collins, 
Colo. 

Orville Morford was dismissed 
I rom the Gainesville Memorial 
Hospital Monday after having 
surgery and is reported to be doing 
well. 

Mrs. Ines_ Stevens reports that 
her brother John R.(Doe) Mosley 
of Forestburg had surgery Wed-
nesday, Aug. 14 in Veterans 
Hospital in Dallas, and is doing  

well. His wife Wilma and boys 
have been making daily visits to 
the hospital. 

Mr. and Mrs. C.W.Martin 
spent Thursday in Gainesville 
visiting with Mr. and Mrs. 
C.A.Knight and Mrs. Nona Ulmer 
and daughter Mrs. Rachel Jones 
of Tom Bean. 
Mrs. Odessa Berry was pleasantly 
surprised on her birthday Satur-
day, Aug. 17, when her sister and 
brother-in-law the Johnnie Cooks 
had a hamburger cookout dinner 
with a birthday cake and ice crean 
for her. Those attending were 
Mr. and Mrs. Lee McKown of 
Dallas, John Fletcher of Amarillo, 
Mrs. Inez Stevens and Mrs. Mary 
Ruth Kindiger. 

Mrs. Jerry McKown, Kimberly, 
Kristen and Casey of Valley View 
visited Mr. and Mrs. Jack Berry 
and James Thursday. 

Mrs. Delia Sutton of Gainesville 
returned to her home Monday af-
ter spending a few days with Mrs. 
Juanita Cote and other relatives. 

Weekend guests of Mr. and 
Mrs. W.B. Inglish were Mr. and 
Mrs. Fred Ford of New Deal, An-
drea and Harmon Fine, Lindsey, 
Erica and David, Patrica and 
Lojza Vosta, Adam, and Eva all 
of Houston. 

Miss Lois Bewley, Clyde and 
Lonnie visited Mrs. Essie Agee in 
Saint Jo Tuesday afternoon. 

Mrs. Delia Sutton of Gainesville 
and Mrs. Juanita Cote accom-
panied Ruth and Calvin Blanken-
ship of Elk City, Ok. to Memphis, 
Tenn. where they toured the Elvis 
Presley Home, then to Nashville, 
Tenn. where they attended the 
"Grand Ole Opry" then through 
Branson, Mo. where they spent 2 
days and went to "Silver Dollar 
City." They were gone 10 days. 

Sunday evening dinner guests of 
Mr. and Mrs. Jack Berry and 
James were Dr. and Mrs. Jerry 
McKown, Kimberly, Kristin and 
Casey of Valley View and John 
Fletcher of Amarillo, Mrs. Becky 
Cook and daughter Allison of 
Rock wall. 

Mr. and Mrs. C.W. Martin had 
as their guests during the weekend 
Mrs. Jackie Cravens and her sister 
Mrs. Helen Wiles of Dallas, Keith 

Martin and daughter and her 
girlfriend of Fort Worth, Wayne 
Sicking and sons, Mrs. Mary Lou 
Edwards and Lisa, Mrs. Sherron 
West, Steve and Mary Greenfield 
and Ashley of Alvord. 

W.E. Ewing spent from Mon-
day to Thursday in Dallas at the 
bedside of his daughter-in-law 
who had surgery. Then on Thur-
sday his sister Mrs. Margie Trusel 
had surgery. They are both im-
proving. 

Mr. and Mrs. Marvin Maberry 
treated themselves to dinner out 
Sunday at the Dairy Inn in Muen-
ster. Then took a drive over the 
countryside. 

Mrs. Estelle Kelley and Miss 
Sissie Kelley visited Mr. and Mrs. 
Lanny Kelley and family in Era 
Friday. 

James and Emy Brossart of 
Montague spent Friday night with 
Mr. and Mrs. Herman Hanson 
and returned to their home Satur-
day. 

Mrs. Mae Maughan visited Mrs. 
Estelle Kelley Thursday evening 
and they drove over to Forest-
burg. 

Mr. and Mrs. W.E.Ewing went 
to Stephenville Sunday, Aug. 18 
where they had dinner with Mrs. 
Tiny Bassinger who has recently 
moved from Dallas to Stephen-
ville. Then in the afternoon they 
helped relatives and friends 
celebrate Mr. Ewing's sister's 
birthday from 2 to 4. She is Mrs. 
Gladys Purvis who was 80 years 
old. All their sisters attended but 
one. 

Mrs. Becky Cook and daughters • 
Allison and Angie of Rockwall are 
visiting Mr. and Mrs. Johnnie 
Cook. 

John Fletcher of Amarillo is 
visiting Mr. and Mrs. Jack Berry 
and James this week. 

Miss Lois Bewley, Clyde and 
Lonnie went to Bridgeport Satur-
day afternoon to help Houston 
Payne celebrate his 81st birthday. 
Ice cream and cake were served. 

Mr. and Mrs. Don Kellsey and 
J.T. visited Mrs. Estelle Kelley 
Saturday afternoon. Miss Sissie 
Kelley went home with the 
Kellseys to spend a few days. 

Mr. and Mrs. Larry Brandon, 
Audrey and Chad had dinner with 
Mr. and Mrs. W.E. Ewing Satur-
day evening. The Brandons and 
Mrs. Marie Russell left Sunday for 
a vacation trip to San Antonio and 
other points of interest. 

Last reminder, folks - Forest-
burg's Annual Watermelon 
Festival is upon us - this weekend. 
Do hope you have made your 
plans to attend. 

If you attend the festival you 
might like to know that if you are 
tired, hot and thirsty, come by the 
OLD Community Center, sit 
down to rest, and have a cold 
drink on August 24. Movies of 
early Indian Raids will be shown 
at intervals through the day and at 
7 p.m. Plans are to keep the 
building open as a Hospitality cen-
ter throughout the day. 

Another reminder - this time 
about the Uz Homecoming Satur-
day, Aug. 31, at the Uz School 
grounds - under the shade trees. 
at noon so bring your dinner, eat, 
visit and relax with friends and 
neighbors - present and past. 

From time to time this writer 
does not get all the information 
concerning certain events that take 
place. One such event was the 
Landers Family Reunion at the 
New Community Center on June 
14. I have since learned that 
$400.00 was donated by those at-
tending the New Community Cen-
ter. $100.00 for stainless steel 
flatware and the rest for 5 new 
tables. Also 27 new members were 
added to the WBAP Community 
Service Club. 

It was "remembering when" 
time Monday August 12 when 
Mr. and Mrs. Fred Greenwood 
drove up from Denton to visit 

Marion and Howard Sockwell. 
he Greenwoods and Sockwells 

were neighbors for 14 years in 
Denton. 

Mrs. Bobbie Wylie and 
daughter Sheree Vannoy and 
Kimberly drove up to Mobeetie 
Monday, Aug. 12 to visit their un-
cle Foy Farmer. While there they 
all took in the museum in Canyon 
and met Louie and Betty Lourence 
of Sunset. The group also took in 
the play "Texas!" in Palo Duro 
Canyon; then returned home on 
the 14th. 

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Collings of 
Gainesville were guests in the Bar-
ney Brogdon home Tuesday, 
Aug. 13. Veda and Mrs. Collings 
nursed together in Gainesville. 

Rev. and Mrs. Chris Allen and 
children returned home Thursday, 
Aug. 15 from a two week 
vacation. The first week they were 
guests of friends in cool Colorado. 
The second week they were in 

Commercial 

Specralatng In 	P„ 

`4, SAFE-WAY a..  
HOUSE LEVELING 

Free Estimates 
15 Years Experience 

al /45511I79 P 0 lim S6 Gamin.. 

torrid Wichita Falls with their 
parents, other relatives and frien-
ds. 

Hal and Mary Hays returned to 
Forestburg on Thursday, Aug. 15 
after visiting in Tullahoma, Ten-
nessee since Aug. 7 with Hal's 
brother Gary Krause and wife Pat. 
Mary reports they got to see Ten-
nesee, visited many arts and crafts 
places plus taking in a gun show. 

Montague residents Mrs. Eva 
Crayton and Mrs Addle Mae 
Wood visited with Mrs. Crayton's 
sister - Mrs. Peggy Holland of 
Stoney Point Thursday. On 
Friday Mrs. Crayton and Mrs. 
Holland had lunch with Mrs. 
Holland's husband, Kenneth, in 
Stoney Point Thursday. On 
Friday Mrs. Crayton and Mrs. 
Holland's husband Kenneth in 
Nocona. Afterwards they visited 
their Aunt Mary Jo Simpkins and 
husband Walt. Then on Sunday 
the Kenneth Hollands, Kendall 
and Brent along with Mrs. Christy 
Rashid all had lunch with Mrs. 
Crayton and spent the after-
noon. 

"Charlie" Barclay and frau 
Gladys plus grandchildren Jen-
nifer and Shane motored to 
Mineral Wells Friday the 16th to 
spend the day with their friends 
Pearl and Otto Schuelke of Port 
Lavaca. The Schuelkes are spen-
ding some time in Mineral Wells 
where their daughter resides. 

Mrs. Jack Martin, Mackenzie 
and Andy of Austin arrived in the 
Burg Friday, Aug. 16 to visit with 
her parents - Charlene and Ken-
neth Woods. Mrs. Martin retur-
ned home Monday the 18th taking 
Andy with her but Mackenzie 
stayed here to spend a week with 
her grandparents. 

Mabel Covington of Decatur 
visited Cleo Lanier on Friday. 

Mr. and Mrs. John Hunt of 
Plainview, California have arrived 
in the area to visit with Mrs. 
Georgia Greenwood and family 
and the Joe Hunts. 

Mrs. Nell McKinney and 
daughter Misty and Nell's gran-
dson Josh McKinney of Burleson 
arrived Friday to visit her parnets 
Bert and Eula Faye Galmor. Nell, 
Amy and Josh returned home 
Saturday. 

The Dude Berrys were in Alvord 
Saturday calling on their Aunt 
Allie Scott and had lunch with 
her. Then on to visit with Bala 
Mae's sister - Geneva White. 

It was buffalo round-up time 
Friday the 16th for Jimmy Joe and 
Cleta Reynolds as their two buf-
falo decided to do some roaming. 
However, it ended up with the 
critters having to be killed and cut 
up for eating. Reckon Jimmy and 
Cleta will dine on Buffalo dishes 
sometime to come. 

Edna Merle Hill and gran-
ddaughter Amy of Bowie spent 
Sunday afternoon with Vera Mae 
McGee. 

Vatoni Dill of Denton spent the 
weekend with her parents - the 
Jack C. Dills. 
Bill Orrell of Lubbock visited with 
the Leo Orrell Family this past 
week. 

Stella Bost of Oklahoma City 
was a Sunday visitor with Mr. and 
Mrs. Tolbert Fanning. 

Mrs. Joyce Leeper of Denton 
visited with Mr. and Mrs. D.D. 
Echols of Mallard and the Buford 
Greenwoods over the weekend. 

Esther Shears is on the sick list 
and has been in Gainesville with 
her sister, Mrs. Frankie Neely, 
while undergoing medical tests. 

Mrs. Charity Boyd passed away 
Aug. 13 at the Bowie Con-
valescent Center where she had 
been a resident for many years. 
"Miss Charity" as we all knew 
her, was 91 years of age this past 
May. She had been very ill since 
February. 

Funeral services were under the 
direction of Burgess -Fry Funeral 
Home in Bowie, with services in 
the Dewey Church and burial in 
the Perryman Cemetery. 

"Miss Charity" is survived by 
one daughter Mrs. Vista Lee Car-
ter, one son Lester W. Boyd, Jr. 
two brothers, one sister, three 
grandchildren and five great-
grandchildren. 

It was a very beautiful can-
dlelight wedding for Veronica 
Edwards and Chris Greanead 
Saturday, Aug. 17 at 7:30 p.m. in 
the Forestburg United Methodist 
Church. Veronica is the daughter 
of Mr. and Mrs. Charles T. Ed-
wards and Chris is the son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Odell Greanead of 
Dallas. The wedding was followed 
with a reception in the New Com-
munity Center. 

Perryman Denham says the 
above wedding was quite different 
from the first wedding he ever at-
tended many years ago. He and 
some other lads were at Johnny 
Moore's station (now Dill's 
Garage) one Sunday morning 
when someone ran in and announ-
ced, "Laverne True is getting 
married over at "Doc" Jones 
(the Justice of Peace)." They all 
dashed down there. Perryman 
says "Doc" Jones looked at the 
marriage license and said, "Take 
the lady by the hand. By the 
authority vested in me, I pronoun- 
ce you man and wife. That will be 
two dollars, please." That was the 
short and sweet of it all. 

Rolston 
News 

  

 

by Ruth Smith 

BIG SONGS 



HORNET BACKS AND ENDS, still in their shorts Sims for route instructions on a play. 

when this picture was snapped, huddle with Coach 	 Photo by Janie Hartman 

Knights have bright prospects 

CHEERLEADERS OF LINDSAY HIGH SCHOOL attended a special 
cheerleader camp at Tarleton State University July 8 to 11 and achieved 
an excellent record, winning a number of awards. They received one ex-
cellent ribbon; three superior ribbons; won the Spirit Stick on Monday 
and Wednesday and were privileged to bring it home on Thursday. Ad-
ditionally, they were nominated for the "Award of Excellence" and 
were among the six finalists. They also received a Super-Star Squad 
ribbon for attendance at camp. Shown in the photo, Ito r, top: Christy 
Hellman, Katrinka Griffin, Minnie Hundt; front: Tammie Sandmann, 
Jolanda Wimmer and Sonya Eberhart. Photo by Janie Horton,' 

4,111157  

   

  

Fishing report 

    

Lump sum distribution 
without taking any lumps 

from Uncle Sam. 

If you're scheduled to receive a lump 
sum di: tribution from a pension or profit-
sharing plan where you work, you can 
easily set up an IRA Rollover with these 
funds. If you do, you can avoid paying 
taxes on this distribution until you retire. 
Call me today for complete deta ils.  

EARL "RUSTY" RUSSELL 
701 East California St. 

Gainesville, Texas 
(817) 665-0351 759-4942 

1,19.  Edward D. Janos E. Co. 

Mambo, Now York Stock Exchange 	 Member Socurillos Incoolor Proloction Corporation 

Gainesville Boys Club 
Health & Racquetball 

315 lend, 
Gainesville 
665 6245 

Boy's Club Kids Play Free during Boy's Club Hours 

All Types of Rackets 	 Sam tOpm Monday trade, 

Restrung 	 10 a m 4 p.m. Saturday 

I pm Sp m Sunday 

4 Racquetball Courts — Gymnasium 

Weight Room — Exercise Classes 

..,),..7.07,-,4V-IWI.GOC•00:0Y.C.C.OT.C.C.,  

A I- 
lag* ..: i.. lath, 

Walla 

H Iti W 

KOUNTRY ' 

KORNER 
West Highway 82 
Muenster, Texas iail 	759-2546 

Coke 16 oz. 
Dr Pepper 	Bottles 
Pepsi 	2 0 4 
7-Up 	38 plus tax 

Dr Pepper 	12 oz 	y 
7-Up 	cans 

6 

29 4  plus tax 	1 

Coke 
120z 384  

Coke & 
Cherry 
C6opkk eli79  

Dr Pepper 
& 7-Up 

6 ph 159  

RC & 7-Up 
12 ph. 

$298 

BEER SPECIALS 

b 
	Coors & 

Budweiser 
: 	Miller Lite 

Old Milwaukee & Old Milwaukee 

Suitcase 	$8 13  
Light 

so 	12 pack 

1075 Case 

Cools Light 	 $C71 
& Budweiser Light 

Ice Cream 	Fountain Drinks 

Summer Sausage 	Cheese Trays 
Bar•B-Que Sandwiches 

Gainesville 	 665.2431 
Closed Mondays 

300 Lindsay Street 

CM 

Low Back Pain Numbness 
Dizziness 	Headaches 
Shoulder Pain 	Nervousness 
Stiff Neck 	Leg or Hip Pain 

It Could Be A Pinched Nerve 

MURRAY 
CHIROPRACTIC CENTER 

Office: 665-7656 
504 E. Broadway 

EMERGENCIES ACCEPTED ANYTIME 
Free Exam Does Not Include 

X-Rays or Treatment 
MOST INSURANCE ACCEPTED 

!::04.::‘,!:**/.?..r.V.S..?:=,..4 44-  

FREE SPINAL EXAMINATION 

Happy 

30th 
Birthday 

August 23 OSIOAtt 

Magrew3 Pholograp4eri 

Children's Photogenic 
Contest 

Over $900 in Prizes to be awarded 

Entry Fee 580 ' 	1 (4x5) FREE 

	4 Categories of Judging 	 
Group A, 6 mos. - 2 yrs. 	Group C, 4 yrs. - 7 yrs. 
Group B, 2 yrs. - 4 yrs. 	Group D, 7 yrs. - 9 yrs. 

3 Poses will be taken with changes of clothing 
optional at no extra charge. 

Call Now for your appointment on: 

Tuesday, Sept. 3 

thru Saturday, Sept. 7 

Thursday, Open 
9:30 a.m. to 7:00 p.m. 

	Prizes to be awarded: 

Grand Prize -1 (16 x 20) H portrait 
Individual catagorles will have 3 prizes awarded: 

1st Place - 1 (11 x 14) 
2nd Place -1 (8 x 10) 
3rd Place 1 (8 x 10) 

'Prizes are from the poses taken for the contest.) 

Call Now 665-2431 
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Hornets face first test at Chico 

coordinated 	and 	have 	the 
quickness to get the jump on 
average opponents. Without any 
individual standouts, the team as a 
unit appears to have standout 
potential. 

The team will get an idea of its 
ability Friday night at Alvord. 

A stocker calves program as a 
way to increase profits of small 
grain pastures in Cooke County is 
the subject of discussion at a 
workshop, with meal and enter-
tainment as a bonus, sponsored by 
the Cooke County Beef 
Association on Wednesday, Sept. 
II, at the Hinton Ranch near 
Gainesville. 

The program headliner will be 
Buddy Farris, extension 
veterinarian of Texas A&M. His 
subjects are on Receiving Health 
Program, Growth Stimulants, 
Bloat Control and Mineral 
Programs. 

Also Buddy Smith, S-Agri 
Management Systems of Maxwell, 
will cover soil fertility in this area 
and will have a group of Blond 
d'Aquitaine cattle on tour. Ken 
Stokes, area economist, will be 
available for budgeting and 
projections. 

There's a reason why the ratings 
this year point to Lindsay Knights 
to repeat as the north zone champ 
of District 4-A. 

The response of 42 at first prac-
tice was a delight to Coach Grady 
Roller. It means a wealth of talent 
and experience and ample depth 

BRIDGEPORT: Water fairly 
clear, 90 degrees, five feet low; 
black bass fair to four pounds 
early and late off points on red 
worms in shallows, then green or 
blue worms at 12 feet; hybrid 
striper good around Methodist 
and Boy Scout camps; white bass 
good, but not much surface ac-
tivity; catfish fairly good drifting 
with shrimp crappie excellent to 
100 fish per string in 20 feet of 
water. 

for both varsity and JV teams. 
In a few respects, the boys are 

not up to last year's potential, as 
Coach Roller sizes them up. They 
are smaller, weighing about 165 
on an average, and they don't 
have the break-away speed of 
recent years. But they are well- 

MOSS: Water clear, 81 degrees, 
six inches low; black bass fair and 
small on Bayou Boogie in deep 
water; crappie slow; white bass 
fair and small on Bayou Boogie; 
catfish slow. 
POSSUM KINGDOM: Water 
slightly murky, normal level; 
black bass fair; striper fairly slow; 
catfish good to 20 pounds; crappie 
good; white bass fair to two 
pounds. 

After a week of work with the 
Hornets, Coach Dewey Sims is 
smiling. He says he likes their 
hustle as well as their progress in 
polishing up their offense, also 
that they are playing it smart in 
applying new ideas. 

He's equally pleased with the 
defense in spite of giving the lion's 
share of practice time to the offen-
se. For the time being, the defen-
ders will depend mostly on ability 
and alertness. Overall he thinks 
rite boys are in good shape after 

Tiger coaches, pleased with 
their past two weeks of practice, 
expect to get more definite ideas 
Friday night when they meet 
Perrin in a practice session. The 
action will be at Perrin starting 
about 6 p.m. 

As compared by pre-season 
data, the teams are about even. 
Sacred Heart, with nine returning 
lettermen along with normal gains 
in experience and weight, should 

be stronger in the opinion of 
Coach Jon LeBrasseur, but there 
are a few offsetting disadvantages, 
such as less speed and less depth. 
"Our first hope is to keep healthy 
and avoid substitutions," says 
Coach Jon. 

The additional attraction is 
country singer and entertainer 
Don Edwards of Fort Worth. Cat-
tlemen are invited to bring a 
spouse or other guest. 

Paint & Body Shop 
For All Your Needs 

1425 N. Grand 
Gainesville 

665.1112 

two weeks of practice, and he's 
looking forward to their first test 
in a scrimmage at Chico Friday. 

That event has the appearance 
of a toss-up, according to the 
Hornets boss. The rosters are near 
equal, and players are about the 
same size. 

Varsity and junior varsity will 
both see action, meaning both 
MHS teams will have a depth 
problem if and when replacements 

are needed. As regards the varsity, 

The report is that the opponents 
rate about equal. After last year's 
build-up year with lots of 
youngsters, Perrin has lots of 
returnees with gains in size and 
experience. 

Overall, the Sacred Heart 
coaches are pleased with their 
progress. Team enthusiasm is 
high, seniors are doing a good job  

they have strength and experience 
all they way, but Ns have to 
depend almost completely on 
freshmen. 

The action is booked for Chico 
starting at 6 p.m. They will use the 
controlled scrimmage method, in 
which the teams take turns at 20 
offensive and 20 defensive plays. 
If they can make first down yar-
dage in three tries, they keep 
going, otherwise they go back to 
the 30 for another attack. 

of leading and plays are 
developing in spite of the two-a-
day strain in August heat. 

However, the two-a-day grind 
continues only a week longer. Af-
ter school starts on the 26th, grid 
practice time reduces to once 
daily, probably after 6 until cooler 
weather. 

Cattlemen workshop 
booked for Sept. 11 

August 23 

Tigers await test at Perrin 



DISCOVER 
FOR SALE 
New Levelor 

Blinds 
250x 49/2 

;amel Color S30 each 

2 34 x 59 
labaster Color $30 

each 
1 58 x 35 

lark Brown Woodgra in 

$50 each 

Decorator 
Supply Center 

1110 E. California 
Gainesville, 665-0256 

qwyN 
rlio-coGK 

3171665-2107 
206 \ Vc:4i \ °In 

ncxxvIllc. 

Trailer Parts Parts 
and Supplies 

it ructural Steel 
and Pipe 

:omplete Line 
of Bolts and 

Miscellaneous 
Hardware 

METAL 
SALES, INC. 

On Highway 82 
West of Gainesville 

LEVIS 
Our Prices 

can't Be Beat 
kat-shrink in 

A , ) . • & Student's sizes 
Slim & Regular 

1MMERCE STREET STORE 

Schilling Fina 
Oil & Gas 

Diesel. Gasoline 
Oil and Grease 

Propane 
759-2522 

Muenster, Tx. 76252 

WRANGLERS 
Shoes - Boots 

Work Dress Western 

Nocona Boots 

J.R. HOCKER 
Men's & Boys' Store 

207 N Commerce. 
Gainesville 	.8 ' 

FOR RENT 

AFE DEPOSIT BOXES: 
Lew section of larger boxes for 
nu at Muenster State Bank. 

29-XC't 

OR RENT: FURNISHED 
iobile home, central heat and 
it conditioned. Call 759-2948. 

8 P.. 

IOBILEHOME FOR RENT: 
bdrrn. fully furnished, a 

lock from school on N. 
✓abut Phone 759-2938, 
erome Pagel. 	 1.0 

NOW LEASING 

U-Store & Lock 
Mini Storage 

759-4621 
514 E. 1st St. Muenste. 

AND 3-BIDRODIVf-
Apartments and Houses. Rent 
based on income to eligible 
elderly, handicapped, and low 
income families. Housing 
Authority of the City of Gain-
esville, 817-665-1747. Specially 
designed units for handicapped 
available. Equal opportunity 
housing 817-665-1747. 

Equal Opportunity Housing 
14,M 

KARL 
KLEMENT 

AUTO SALES 

115 North Weever Street 
Ph 668 8921 Gainesville 

AUTO FOR SALE, 

FOR SALE: 1980 GRAND 
Prix, good condition, 54,200, 
Jessie Walterscheid. Call 759-
4588. 8.22.2.G 

FOR SALE: 1978 CAPRICE 
Classic, loaded, good tires and 
body. 1118 E. California: 665-
0002 days, 665-9593 nights. 

8.22.16 

FOR SALE: 1932 CRYSLER 
New Yorker Fifth Avenue. 
Navy Blue with leather interior, 
loaded. extra clean. $8750°° . 
call 995-2297. 

I-  DR HOME DELIS 6.30 01 
I art Worth Star Telegram or 

Dallas Times Herald 
C all Virgil D. White Collect 

668-6130 or 668-6114 
P.O. Box 1256 

Gainesville, TX 76240 

Building Materials 

FOR SALE: GLASS SHOW-
er doors, tub enclosurers, mirr-
ors in all sizes. Installation 
available. Contact Ted Hen-
scheid. 759-4280, Muenster. 

IbXCI 

MARY'S 
CARPET CARE 
Circular Foam System 

Mary Alice Bayer 
759-2506 

BILL BLACK 
ELECTRICAL 

SERVICE 

Call for any 
electrical problem 

Oil Field, Industrial, Cr 

Residential 
736-2227 Myrel 

' ,WEB CALL 

736 2242 	ssnl 

The fastest growing 
manufacturers of port-
able buildings, is seek-
ing a dealer in the area 
for retail sales of port-
able buildings. Lot and 
small investment re-
quired. Excellent• op-
portunity to expand 
existing business with 
low risk. 

Contact Mike Wulf 
General Manager 

817-422-4547 

JAY TOOLEY TRIM SHOP. 
Auto and truck seat covers. 
Old Highway 77,Gainesville. 

SCHMIDLKOFER AUTO-
motive: transmission and 
engine installed or exchanged, 
668-7241, 835 North Grand, 
Gainesville. 8.1.32C0 

PLUMBING REPAIRS 
BY 

VANCE WELLS 
CALL 668-8957 

PLUMBING 
Installation & Repair 
Residential & Commercial 
FIXTURES, SUPPLIES 
McDonald Water Pumps 

ROBERT RUSSELL 
PLUMBING - 

Muenster, 759-4155  

J.R.'s 
Welding and Fencing 

Co. 
(817) 759-45910, 
Muenster, Texas 

Want Results? 
Try the Classifieds! 

G & H Backhoe 
& Dump Truck Service 

Herman Grewing, 
Bernard Hesse 

Sewer Systems, 011 Field 
and Industrial Work 

Ph. 759-4130 or 759-4304 
Mobil Ph. 759-4812 

WE SELL 
NEW & USED FURNITURE 

NEWLAND 
FURNITURE 
665 2461 665 0368 

WANTED 
HOLIDAY INN ACCEPTING 
applications for lounge 
manager/bar tender, previous 
experience in management, 
with understanding of liquor 
laws and controls a must. Ap-
ply in person only, Mon. thru 
Fri. 9 to 5 p.m., 600 Park Blvd. 
Gainesville. An mule °woman. 

ernoinfr. ,  8.33-ter 

BUS DRIVERS WANTED 

Muenster ISD needs school 
bus drivers for 1985-86 
school year. Interested ap-
plicants should cantact 
Superintendent 	Cherie, 
Coffey at the school ad- 
ministration 	building . 

Phone 759.2281. 	r, 

Part time kitchen help 
wanted. Must be 
willing to work nights 
and weekends. Apply 
in person at The Cen-
ter Restaurant. 

1.. 	  

OWN YOUR 051 .11 \\- 

Sportswear, Ladle ,  Apparel, 

Children, Large Size, Com-
bination Store, Petites, Mater-
nity, Accessories. Jordache, 
Chic,. Lee, Levi, E Z Street, 
lend, Esprit, Tomboy. Calvin 
Klein, Sergio Valente, Evan 
Picone, Liz Claiborne, Mem-
bers Only, Gasoline, 
Healthtex, over 1,000 others. 
513,300 to $24,900 inventory, 
training, fixtures, grand 
opening, etc. Can open 15 
days. Mr. Keenan (305) 678-
3639. 8 221.G 

SegionSpeciat 
Seniors: 
1/.., a yreal hone to 

make your appointment 

“.1 

The scenery is 
great. The weather's 

not too hot and 
you can still 

take advantage 
of our 

Summer 
Wallet Special 

Call today for 
your appointment 

Before time 
runs out!! 

lnalkeU, P18010yrapka 

300 S. Lindsay 
Gainesville, 665-2.t3 

LIVESTOCK 

-SIMMENTAL- 
Bulls, Cows, & Calves 

817-872-3686 
or 825-6036 

HEDDINS SIMMENTAL 
Bowie 

IN THANKS 

We want to thank all of our 
relatives, friends and neighbor, 
for the spiritual of fersing, 
flowers, food and cards sent to 
us during the loss of Our 

mother and grandmother . 
Mary E. Wiesman Koelzer . 

Special thanks to Father Denis. 
Victor and Nicholas and to 
Doctors Kralicke and Anwar. 
Also, thanks to the nurses and 
staff of Muenster and 
Gainesville Hospitals, and the 
church choir and the ladies who 
prepared food. May God bless 
you. 

Carolyn and 
Joe Henry Walterscheid 

and family 
8 2,14 

BEST VALUE 
Classified ads are 

FREE 
Call 759-4311 

GET REMITS 

 IMPROVING  
ABUSINESS  

/ 	IN TEN 
EASY STEPS 

007 

I ADVERTISE Let everyone know what you have 

to offer 

2 ADVERTISE  • Spend time thinking about pro-
moting your business. 

3 ADVERTISE • Let everybody know what you sell. 

4. ADVERTISE • Remind yourself that even though 
you've been in business a long time. customers 
will NOT automatically come to you 

S. ADVERTISE • Remember. that there are new. 
potential customers who would do business with 
you if they were reminded and urged to do so. 

6. ADVERTISE. Keep in mind that you have com-
petition trying to attract YOUR customers away 
from you. 

7. ADVERTISE Tell yourself that you get more 
out of advertising than the small cost inuolued. 

B. ADVERTISE • Don't overlook the fact that 
advertising is an INVESTMENT in selling, not 
an expense. 

9. ADVERTISE • Be sure to provide an adequate 
advertising budget for your business. 

10. ADVERTISE • Don't forget that you have to 
keep reminding your established customers tha t 
YOU APPRECIATE THEIR BUSINESS. 

We can help you with each one 
of these 10 easy steps 

MUENSTER ENTERPRISE 
817759-4311  4311 

THE 
CLASSIFIEDS! 

CALL 

 11  759-4311 

ZACHARY BROS. 
817-668.7806 

East Highway 82 
• Septic systems installed 

and cleaned. 
• Sandy loam and gravel 
• Tank and pipe sal, 
• Storm cellars 

SERVICE 

FOR SALE 

FOR SALE: ALL LACE 
wedding dress, size 24 waist, 32 
bust. Call 665-6066, Lindsay, 
Texas, after 5. 8.22-20 

LOTS FOR SALE IN BON- 
ner Hills - 2011 Stanford, 
$9,500, call 665-2550. 	8.22-3G 

BACKHOE FOR RENT: BY 
Day - Week - Month, call 665-
6741, ask for James or Edd. 

8.22-SG 

FOR 	SALE: 	USED 
vacuum cleaners, Gainesville 
Sew and Vac, 328 E. Califor-
nia, across from Post Office, 
665-9812. s 17.XG 

FOR SALE: CAKES GALORE 
All occasion cakes, weddings. 
and every kind. Sue Oakley 
759-4151. 18-XCI 

FOR SALE: 1976 WIN-
nebago Brave, Class A, 22-ft. 
mobile home. Completely self-
contained, Less than 53,000 
miles. Excellent condition. 
R.G. Mitchell, 665-1918. 

8.22-2 -c 

FOR SALE: 14 it M FOOT 
Mobile home, 1982 Brook-
wood, 3 bedroom, 2 bath. Call 
Earl Fisher. 759-2257. 7 NAG 

TARPS FOR SALE: POLY-
coat sky blue, low cost, light 
weight, 10 cents per sq. ft. at 
Community Lumber Co., 
Muenster, 759-2248. 19-XCI 

I RN THURSDAY IS 
n's Day at Lemons 

Photography. One-half price 
on session fee and finished por- 
traits! Call for appointment at 
825-6326 Tues. thru Sat. noon. 

11 , ), 

WOULD LIKE TO BABYSIT 
evenings. Call Dyan Fisher, 
759-4683. 	 8.22-1-E 

CARPENTER WORK 
WANTED 

Also odd jobs 
Reasonable rates '- 

Erne Manic, 7554665 or 4650 

Robert Fleitman 
Welding 

Portable Welding 
Our Specialty 

759.4664 " `" 

MIKE GREWING 
WELDING SERVICE 

Portable and Shop 

Welding 

Home 759-4901 

Shop 736-2294 

Septic Tank and 

Grease Trap cleaning 

M. 

159.4522 759 4156 759 2522 

MIPS! t ONTRACI1M, 
and 

LAND DEVELOPING 
24 years experience 

Backhoe and dump truck 
Licensed, free estimates 

CLAY firewood WAYNE 
995-21'2 , 	995.2966 

REAL ESTATE 

John 
Thomas 

ANC ASSOCIATE, 

(  REAL ESTATE ) 

Attention 
Property Owners 

We hove buyers In- 
terested In realdentlol, 
commercial, farm 
and ranch property in 
this area. II you have 
real estate holdings 
you want to sell. 
please contact us 

210 Melts 	 •.0.111.• 1212 
GoinoxvIti•, T•••T 76240 

(817) 668-7787 

HOMES 

I Bedrooms 1 '. Path 
4 liedroono.2 	hath 
3 Bedroom. 2 haul 

00n Flusche Real Estate 
759-2832 

Want Results! 
Try the Classifieds 

RON HESS, REAL ESTATE 
broker, land or residential. 
Phone 759-2232 or 759-4864. 

18-XC 

FOR SALE: BRICK HOUSE. 
1 full bath, 2 half-baths; 3 or 4 
bedrooms, central heat/air, 
storm windows fully insulated, 
2-car garage, fenced back yard. 
Call 759-4514. lc x152 

HOUSE FOR SALE BY 
owner. Approx. 13 acres, 3 
bedroom, brick, 1% bath, 
large fence yard, in Gainesville. 
668-7706 before 4:00 p.m. [km.: 

FOR 	SALE: 	FOUR 
bedroom brick home, 11/2 bath, 
carport, on two large lots. Call 
Chris Cain, 759-4408. 	22-NCI 

WANTED: LISTINGS 10 
acres and.up, prefer some tim-
ber in Muenster, Rosston, For-
estburg, Saint Jo area. Town 
and Country Real Estate, 665-
;875 or Jerry Raymond 817-
995-2215. 230,r I 

NOTICE 

"I will not be responsible for 
any debts of Richard 0. Evans, 
Sybil Evans." 	 8 22.3G 

THE STATE OF T \2 
COUNTY OF Cook 

NOTICE OF 
EXECUTION SALE 

OF REAL PROPERTY 

B> stnuc of an cxecutio , 
 issued out of the District Court 

of Cooke Couirl ■ , Pesos, on 
Judgment rendered in the 235i 

District Court of Cooke Cove  

Tesas on the 515 day ol 
.larch, 1984. in favor of Jam, 
IL Owen against C.H. Tuck', 
in Cause No. 83-824. styled 
James R. Owen vs. CO. 

on the docket of 111, 
, mrt, on the 9111 day a Jul, 

',8 5, 	 I 	 lc, led 	upol 	 th, 

'• 'lir ming described proper 
nate(' in Cooke Count , 

 I Jsas, as the propert ■ tri C. II 

I ticker, via, 

On the 3rd day of September. 
1985, which is the first Tuesda y 
of the month, following the 
legal publication of the Notice 
for three consecutive weeks. 
between 1000 o'clock a.m. and 
4:00 o'clock p.m. at the Cour. 
thouse of Cooke County, I will 
offer for sale at public auction, 
for cash, all right, title and in-
terest of C.H. Tucker in and to 
the above described property. 

Dated this 7th day of August, 
1985. 

John Aston 
SHERIFF OF COOKE 
COLIN I V, FE XAs 

Bute Ktokendall 
Dept. , 

 98-3)1 

Sewing 
Machines 

and 
Vacuums 

Sales and Service 
All Makes 

HUDGINS 

S.H. School Uniforms 
Available at 

HAMRIC ' S in Muenstfer , in Muenster , 

IN STOCK 

Electrical - Plumbing 
Paneling - Roofing 

Hardware - Water Pumps 
Heating - Air-conditioning 
We can recommend an Installer 

Muenster Building Center, Inc. 

Bernard J. Luke, B.A., D.D.S. 
Family Dentistry 

Our telephone numbers were omitted from 
the new phone directories. Please save this 

ad for future reference. 

Muenster 817-759-2889, 

Irving 214 2552552 

FARMERS-RANCHERS 

& AGRI-BUSINESSMEN 
Before signing any more papers, or surrender 
any more money or property to your lenders, 
STOP AND THINK. Do I know what I am 
signing? Do I know what I have signed in the 
past? Do I know what the lender really has for 
security or are the lenders just trying to save 
their own ship? Am I going to work all the year 
just to pay the lender interest? Negotiate with 
your lender. Delay and prevent Foreclosure. 
Refinance your Debt. Protect Equipment and 
Crops. Utilize the redemption period. Prevent a 
Sheriff's Sale. Write a realistic 
Reorganizational Plan. Call AGRI-
FINANCIAL CONSULTANTS INC., KS: 
(316) 266-8443; NE: (308) 237-9677; OK (405) 
348-2529 24 hours. 
FOR: Operation Review and Analysis, Stop-
ping Foreclosures and Debt Reorganization, 
Creditor Negotiations 

FOR SALE: HIDE-AWAY 
.tairways fold into ceiling, 
wood or aluminum at Com-

unity Lumber Co. 759-2248. 
Muenster. si .xct 

GLASS: PLATE, WINDOW. 
automobile, furniture tops , 
mirrors. Complete glass ser-
vice. We handle insurance 
claims. Gainesville Glass Shop, 
665-3321, 311 N Chestnut 

INTRODUCTIONS IN YOUR 
area. For fun and/or com-
panionship. Knightclub, Box 
179. Gainesville. Texas 76240. 
s 7-668-7494. a I-1G 

HI (,IsTER NOW FOR FALL 
piano lessons, beginning or ad- 
vanced students. Rosemary 
Dankesreiter 759-4372, 	20 
years experience. 	sts-to 

FOR SALE: HOMEGROWN 
tomatoes, fruits, vegetables. 
watermelons, and cantaloupes. 
Farmers Produce, 205 North 
Grand. Gainesville. Call 668-
7733. 28.XC2 

FREE MALE PUPPIES, 
part Cocker Spaniel. 759-4404. 

PRICE 	WAR! 	BEST 
flashing arrow sign, $259 com- 
plete. Lighted, no arrow $237. 
Nonlighted $189. Warranty. 

1,-, di, 	I 	 Isom 

FOR SALE: CEMETERY 
Monuments, all sizes. Reason-
ably priced. See J.P. Flusche or 
phone 759-2205 or 759-2203. 

HOLLYWOOD GARAGE xci 
Doors, residential and com- 
mercial, Muenster Building 
Center. 	 5.XCI 

TENDER LOVING CARE, HOUSE LEVELING, ROOF- 

Day Care Center, 759-4964. 	ing, hot topping, shingling, 

9-xc 	Painting inside and out. Call 
817-825-4391, Nocona. Texas. 

7.1141Ge 

a 



County Agent's 
Report 

by Craig Rosenbaum 

Market Report 
by Bill Hamer 

For the most part, Grain 
Sorghum yields have been above 
average this year. Many producers 
have made 4,000 plus pounds. 
However, with many crops, we 
still have some poor yields 
throughout the country. These are 
due to a number of factors. 

Some grain sorghum producers 
have experienced severe lodging in 
their fields this year. There are 
many reasons for lodging. Some 
that we have seen this year are due 
to fungus, high yielding varieties, 
late drought stress, and seeding 
rates. A fungal disease called 
Charcoal Rot has been observed in 
some fields. This disease is 
prevalent when late season 
droughts occur during or at head 
filling time. The fungus consumes 
the softer tissue in the lower part 
of the stalk and will cause the 
grain sorghum to go down. 

Ways to alleviate this problem 
would be through lower planting 

rates, irrigation, or selection of 
shorter, stiffer stalked varieties. 
There is no fungicide or other 
cultural practice that will help 
with this fungus. We have obser-
ved another fungus called 
Fusarium that will also cause the 
lower part of the stalk to rot and 
the maize will go down. 

These two fungus are not the 
only cause of our grain sorghum 
going down this year. Most 
varieties have a poor shallow root 
system due to the early wet 
weather that caused the maize to 
make such excellent growth. We 
have many new varieties that have 
very high yield potential, and this, 
coupled with higher seeding rates 
that causes smaller stalks, again 
will cause maize to go down. 

Even with the few isolated 
problems, sorghum yields and 
returns should be favorable for 
county producers, 

America's toughest work boots 
Full-grain, water- 
repellent leather 
and our tough- 

est sole 

Available in 
Pecos pull-ons 

0 .  \ 	or lace boots 
 with plain or 

safety toes 

• vA•A,  

Comfort Safety Boots 

Wayne's Lost Luggage 
209 N. Commerce, Gainesville 

Red Wings 

SIZES 6-14 
A, B,C D 

Endres Motor Co. 
EMU 	Sales and Service 

North Texas Rent-A-Car. Inc. 
C•R sn0 TRUCK LEASING 	 I 

82 Alu•nslw 181,15, 2244 84 •No420•0292 

,,..r,spnroders 	 Lanesc.sung Sconce 

PORI  / 
	

BL OUNT'S 

	

81Y I N.A. N 	 10,  

	

I•s4 , 	 14,82,Ar 865.55111 

We Offer FREE 
Classifieds to private 
individuals. 

Best Values 
Call us NOW! 
(817) 759.4311. 

Serving You 

for 58 years with Gates — 
Service — Rental — Leasing 

OMAC financing MIDI nnnnnn c• 
F Hey 82 Muonster.181 71759 1161 

Call roll tree from Gmne4vil1.181 1106 1109 

A Complete Line 01 Western Tack 
"At Cowboy Prices - 

er Autry's Tack Shop 
WILDE 

2001 Elea He). 82 
Gainesville, TX, 817-665-0433 

RECREATIONAL 

4-H teaches 
record keeping 

Have you ever wondered what 
you did a year or two ago? Or, 
how much something cost? With 
records you can easily find out. 

Records are very important to 
our lives. Such examples of recor-
ds we must keep up with in our 
everyday lives include: income 
tax; school records; employment; 
birth certificates; social security 
and business records. 

4-H record keeping is not an ex-
tra task but an integral part of the 
4-H program. Not everyone en-
joys keeping records, but 
developing a good habit early in 
life will be most helpful for a 
lifetime. 

Although Cooke County 4- 
H'ers have just finished up their 
calendar year of record keeping 
and have just finished up their 
forms and recordbooks for the 
1984-85 club year's accomplish-
ments this might be the perfect 
time to approach why do recor-
ds??? 

The 4-H program offers various 
opportunities, scholarships, and 
special projects. The 4-1-1 award 
program record book is one op-
portunity that a 4-H member can 
take advantage of for personal 
growth. 

Soil survey 
saves cost 

Here's 	a 	message 	for 
homebuyers: 

Before you buy or build, study a 
soil survey. It can warn of soils 
that flood, soils that have a high-
water table that can cause a septic 
system to fail, or other problems. 

For information, call the Soil 
Conservation Service, U.S. 
Department of Agriculture, 817-
668-7794 

Some ways of record keeping 
are: 

• To help a 4-H member 
develop the habit of keeping a 
record of accomplishments. 

• To help a 4-H member realize 
what he has learned and accom-
plished in a certain period of time. 

• To serve as a basis for plan-
ning a 4-H program. 

• To give a concise picture of 
overall 	project 	or 	business 
situation. 

• to help a 4-H member learn 
how to figure detail, show finan-
cial gain or loss. 

•To help the 4-H leaders and 
agents realize what members have 
learned and what additional 
challenges need to be offered. 

•To provide evaluation for 
leadership, citizenship, and award 
programs. 

• To provide evaluation for 
leadership, citizenship, and award 
programs. 

•To provide personal value for 
the 4-H member and his family. 

To ensure proper growth ... you 
need to plan ahead (as soon as 
possible for the 1985-86 year). 4-H 
records are easier to do if you have 
been keeping records of what the 
4-H member has done (is doing) 
throughout the year. So start now 
instead of next June to record all 
the 4-H activities you are involved 
in. The Cooke County 4-H calen-
dar year starts on July I, 1985 
through June 30, 1986. Which 
means, have you started your 
record keeping yet for the new 
Year? 

FARM EQUIPMENT 
REPAIRS 

SICKING 
TRACTOR 

204 Summit Ave , Gainesville 
817.885.6971 

Sale Ends August 15, 1985 
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Giant's Trailtown Restaurant 
Saint lo te.m 	 H. 	87 	 995  7'51 

OPEN 24 HOURS 

 

Germania Farm Mutual 
Aid Association 

Fire, Lightning, Theft and Extended Coverage 
insurance for your property 

Locally represented by 

Paul Fetsch 	 Frank Schilling 

Representing Local Chapter 187 

 

   

 

WHALEY'S FARMS 

 

 

P.O. Box 55 	 Era, Texas 
	

817-665-6359 

Accepting bids on this 250 acre (more or less) 
farm out of C.O.D. Gillan Survey in Cooke County. 
Located 1 mile northeast of Era just south of FM 51 
about 60 rods. 200 acres farming, ground rest in 
pasture and lots. Good fences, 2 tanks, deep well, 3 
all-steel barns, (1) 70 by 60, (1) 42 by 43 with 6,000 
bushels storage, 10-stall horse barn with tack room, 
feed bin, swinging stall dividers. Underground 
wiring, working pens with automatic waterers with 
electric heat. Two bedroom home, older 5-room 
restorable house, several trees in yard. We have the 
right to accept or reject any or all bids. 

Howard Whaley, P.O. Box 55, Era, TX 76238, 
665-6359. 

 

GO FORD 
AND 

SAVE! 
Ford introduces new Series 10 World Tractors—ten 
new models from 34 to 86-hp' with new, more efficient 
diesel engines. The average fuel economy improve-
ment is over 7.1 percent better than the previous models 

Here's what that can mean to you On a new Ford 4610 
fuel economy is improved by 9.1 percent.' If your fuel 
costs $1.25 a gallon, in a typical 8-hour day the new 
Ford 4610 will save you more than $3 in fuel over the 
previous model. 

s esrimared PTO horsepower 
'Manufacturer's esernate Under lest COndifrOns al rated ERPM 

COME IN AND SEE WHY IT MAKES GOOD SENSE TO 
GO WITH A NEW FORD SERIES 10 WORLD 
TRACTOR! 

Gainesville 
Tractors 

	Ford Tractor 
Equipment 
	

665.6741 
W. Hwy. 82, Gainesville, Texas 

The sale tally this past week at 
Muenster Livestock Auction was 
605 cattle and 28 hogs. Cows and 
bulls were $1.00 to $2.00 higher; 
stocker calves and feed steers were 
$2.00 to $3.00 higher; hogs were 
steady . 

BULLS 

Good to Choice.... $42 to $48.50 
Medium to Good 	$40 to $44 

HOGS 
Good to Choice 	 180-275 lbs. 

$38 to $40 
Good Butchers 	 125-180 lbs. 

$38 to $40 
Packing Sows 	 All Wts. 

$35 to $37 

COWS 

Good to Choice 	$36 to $40 
Medium to Good 	S33 to $36 
Canners to Cutters. 	$29 to $35 
Hard Kinds 	 $20 to $30 
Stocker Cows 	$38 to $44 
Cow with Calf at Side 
	 $420 to $535 

STOCKER CALVES 

Steer Calves 	i65 to $106 
Steer Yearlings 	 $52 to $63.50 
Steers 	2 yrs. & up $50 to $55 
Heifer Calves 	$55 to $65 
Heifer Yearlings 	$48 to $57 
Heifer 	 2 yrs. $40 to $50 

I icre's the cdstest way to save on 
our tough oil. Pick up a case of 
Gulfpride and you'll pick up 
tremendous savings on the oil 
lormulated for today's tough 
driving conditions. Offer good 
while supplies last. Prices on 
other grades and quantities will 
vary. 

Carry out a 
caseload 
of savings. 

Suggestive 	Sale 	Less 
	

lour 

List 	Price 	Rebate 

10/40 	25.95 	22.95 	3.60 
	

15.35 

30W 	23.46 	20.46 	3- 60 
	

16.86 

Herr Oil Co., Inc. 
1340 N. Dixon, Gainesville 

BUSINESS/SERVICE DIRECTORY 

249( 9/and) 
93rerbere anti Zeuelopere 

Of iFine tRegietereb 
S>ereforl) anti Commercial at, bby Gb40 

33ereforb &ova Cattle 	617 668 Slid 

FINANCIAL 

WNNEdward D. Janos D. Co. 
EStabloSne0 ran 

Aernper New York Sloch E.Gnange Inc STK 
Earl L. (Rusty) Russell 

Bus II' ',75.48.2 ,er N86,8,88, 	 701 E California 

es r8 ■ 7)669 r202 	 Gainesville, Texas 

SERVICE 

<L:riE CLEANERS 
Sarntone Certified Master Dry Cleaner 

401 N Grand. Gainesville 

Muenster Telephone Corporation of Texas 
205 N Walnut Muenster . 759 2251 

Arm% Telephones & Accessories 
Competent, Professional Service 

"The People Who Know Telephones';„ 

R.L.SCHOPPA AND SONS 	/ 1 _41 
REGISTERED PUBLIC SURVEYOR 

Route 1 Box 204 	 Phone 
Saint Jo, Texas 76265 	 1817)9952977 

	

Don, buy 4 stare 4 and maintarn 4 	RENT IP 

SALES & SERVICE 	 Home Owner 
Small Engines 	K

". 
.....„ 	Lawn & Garden & 

Chem Saws 	 lye 	Building Contractors 
lawn Mowers 	 ental 	Equipment 
Tillers & Trimmers 

I Hwy 82 	 Gsinmille. Teas. 	 6654896 

All Star Lanes 
Club - Restaurant - Pro Shop 

Lounge - Bowling 
Doug Klement 
	

Gainesville, 668-7724 

Manager 
	

East Hwy. 82 	13881725 

Oa—, Shop 

Nationally Advertised 
Brands at Reasonable Prices 

206 N Mem, Muenster, Texas, Pearl Evans, Owner 

Muenster Auto Parts & Muffler Shop 
711 E Iwo 82 Muenster, 759 4487 

LARRY GOBBLE 	 MIKE STURM 
Res. 7594551 	 Res 759-2724 

"Day or Night" 

Red River 
Cut Rate Liquor 

	

wide varier) of fine Liquors — 	 domestic and 

imported Wines" 

PARTY CATERING AVAILABLE 
lia). 82. %forager, 759-4131 

8  Beer - Liquor L  r Fine 	Wines <,,e  

Open 

H.  :v.: . .892;75-4 . .9 N 1343..  

	

- 	 4' 

We Appreciate Your Business - 

 

Boots Belts Hats 
LADIES 8 MENS NAME BRAND 

Western Apparel 
.1. 	665 7062 502 11.18 Sr.. 6e10500111 

NOCONA 
BOOTS 

 



I Ll. 	9 
CTS. 

3202. a90 
SIZE GIP 

$ 1 " 10 02 

DRAFT QUARTERSMARGARINE 

DRAFT 
 

UM1HALFMOONNORN 

CHEDDAR CHEESE 

SOLO 
	CUPS 1602. 20 COUNT 89° 

BRIQUETS 
LIMIT I WITH $10.00 PURCHASE 
EXCLUDING CIGARETTES & BEER 

C. 
LB. 
BAG 

CAMPFIRE 
CHARCOAL 

6 	  

NICE N SOFT  

TISSUE   4 ROLL P06 $ 1 19  

SUPER

ofl 

 

SECRET 

ANTIPERSPIRANT 

	1171" 

 RED. OA UNSCENTED DEODORANT 

 SECRET SOLID 

4 02. $g)39 
SIZE & 

2 OZ $9 4$ 
SIZE GI 

VIDAL SASSOON 
HAIR CAR PRODUCTS! 

• 8 02. CLEAR BODY RINSE OR SHAMPOO 
• 8 OZ. FINISHING RINSE OR SHAMPOO 
• 2 02. RE-MOISTURIZING 

YOUR CHOICE 

URGE VINE RIPE 
PERFECT FOR SALADS 

& SANDWICHES! 

1/2 GAL. 
CTNS. 

SHURFRESH 
ASST'D FLAVORS 

ICE CREAM 
ROUND CARTON 
YOUR CHOICE! 

10 ET PRO $ 2 2 9  

6 oz 79' 
30, '2" 

PAGE WHITE 

TOWELS 

JUMBO 
3100 
ROLLS 

LIMIT 
3 

ASSORTED FLAVORS! 

KOOL-AID 6 p2KE:89 ,  

MIRACLE WHIP 
KRAFT REGULAR 32 OZ. $ 79 
OR LIGHT 	JAR 

KEG O'KETCHUP 
HEINZ 	32 OZ. $ 1 19 
SQUEEZABLE 	BTL. 

SHURFINE 

APPLE JUICE 
ALL PURPOSE 

GLADIOLA FLOUR 	99,  
CONDENSED 14 OZ. 

EAGLE BRAND MILK $119  
11011100 

9" PLATES 	100 CT. 99C 
MAXWELL NOUSE e o: $'189 
INSTANT COFFEE SIZE 0 

14 02.$ 1 59 
SIZE 	I 
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FRESH—LEAN—TENDER 

GROUND BEEF 

AT FISCHER'S 
WE'RE CELEBRATING AFFILIATED'S 

At 
 

REGISTER FOR 

FISCHER'S 

GRAIN FED HEAVY BEEF 

TOP SIRLOIN 

STEAK 
$ 2 9 9  

"FAMILY 
PACK" 
1 & 2 LB. 

LB. PORK 
CHOPS 

LBsi 39 FIRST CUT 

FRESH FROSTED 

FRYER LEG 
QUARTERS Le . 

FRESH FROSTED 

URGE MEATY 
SPARE RIBS Le . 

FISCHER'S 

SMOKED SAUSAGE 1B $ 1 89  	1,  
CENTER CUT 

LOIN PORK CHOPS 	LB. $ 6 9  
CENTER CUT 

RIB PORK CHOPS 	 LB $ 1 9  

TURKEY FRANKS 	1202 38e 	 
HEFTY 8.7 INCH SAYER KINDLESS 

	BACON 	Li 9 49  FOAM PLATES 
SO COT• $ 1 29 

itieelitirieli MEATS 	Pa $ 1 29 	
PEG. 	1 

AY ifigfERFIllis
ii.$ 1 28 
PIG 	I 

FOSTER FARM 

BARBECUE 

SAUCE 
SHURFINE 

i • 	ZESH! 
• •,■\. 	FLAVORFUL! 

18 OZ. 
in c BEL• 
Ulla 

IAACI 

,-  5  9 

suRF  
g 

ptizolzo 

84 02. BOX -,- 

 

DETERGENT 

' 	Ir I 

 REMOVES 
DIRT 

ODORS! 

$ 389 

MAXWELL HOUSE 

COFFEE 
CHOICE 

. 	 OF 
GRINDS! 

1 LB. 
C1N 

$49 

SHOESTRING POTATOES 	9 02 $ 1 " 

irliTARD 	 320, 69C 
CAPRI SUN 

DRINKS 
STAR FIST 

INSTANT 

..4.- 	MORTON'S 32 OZ. 

6' 	CHICKEN BOX L 
i,:: .g FRIED 	$*99 

iii ill FANG TOPPING 	Vzz, 99,  
LEMONADE 	 60z 3 FOR 1 DO 

TREE 
	JUICE 	1201$ 1 39 

CAN 	I 
MINUTE MAID REGULAR DR 	

3t:ifs s i °°  PINK LEMONADE 

THE FRESHEST FRUITS & VEGETABLES! 

joRtilia LETTUCE 	2 . 89' 

do. 
JUICY 
	5a$1" 

PAULA RED APPLES 	3g. 99,  PRESS 
	CORN 	I Ens  $ 1 00 

Fiiiii,BERS 	5 FOR $10,  
PURPLE PLUMS Ls 49' KIWI 	3 F1 1 00  

MUSHROOMS 	990  ONIONS 6,,s`ft$410000 
OKRA 	3 49' CARROTS 4 	I 

MILLER LITE 
2 - 12 OZ., 12 PACK CANS 

4 PACK 16 OZ. 
NON RETURNABLE BOTTLES 

DR PEPPER 

$109 

Since 
1927 

Nthrilre9 Airat ftlateltrt 
304 N. Main, Muenster, 759.4211, 759-4217 "" L 'AT" Prices Effective Aug. 26 thru Aug. 31 
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