
Quitaque,Turkey 

Meet In 

Junior High Games 
The Quitaque Junior High "B" 

teams lost their games to Turkey 
Monday night. The "B" team Pan-
thers played an outstanding game 
against the Turkey "B" boys, los-

ing by only two points which the 
Turks made in the last 30 seconds 
of the game. The Turks scored 21 
to the Panthers 19 points. 

The Quitaque Pantherette "B" 
team played a good game against 
the Turkette "B" team with the 
Turkettes scoring 27 points again-
st the Pantherettes 15. 

The Quitaque "A" team girls 
lost to Turkey by 18 points, with 
the score 44 to 26. Dianna Pur-
cell, Marthia Holman, Seritha 
Helms, Martha Reed and Ruth Pur-
cell all played a good game on 
the forward end with guards Shon-
da Smith, Darlene Hendrix. Donna 
Cagle and Marthia Holman (again) 
holding up their end of the game. 

The "A" team boys did come 
out on top against Turkey, with 
the final score being 54 to 46. Al-
though they have played better 
games, this one did come out for 
the better with the Quitaque Pan-
thers remaining undefeated. 

—reported by Shonda Smith 
and Seritha Helms 

TURKEY EASES PAST 

LAKEVIEW IN FOUR GAMES 

by Mitch Vivens 
Turks won four games over the 

Eagles of Lakeview. In the "A" 
boys game the Turks won by a 
score of 66 to 17. Snotty Setliff 
fouled out about two minutes deep 
in the third quarter. Coach Mous-
er sent in the "B" team which in-
creased the margin on the Eagles. 

Receiving high point honors for 
the Turks was Ron Eudy with 18. 
Brian Wheeler hit for 15, Scotty 
Setliff 13, Barry Wheeler with 4, 
and Ross Case with 2. 

In the "B" game which the 
Turks won by a score of 40 to 14, 
Doyle Proctor hit 15 for high point 
honors. Doyle also scored two 
points for the Eagles in the third 
quarter. This was the only points 
scored for the Eagles in the third 
quarter. Also, for the Turks, Rus-
ty Ridell hit 9, Jess Ferguson 8, 
Bret Cruse 4, Rex Fuston 3 and 
Gregory Wynn 1. 

TURKEY F.H.A. NEWS 

On December 7 the Turkey FHA 
Chapter held its monthly meeting. 
Mrs. Dorothy Maxwell brought a 
very interesting program on drugs. 
It was decided to have a Christ-
mas Card Party on Tuesday, De-
cember 14. Marilyn Maxwell and 
Karen Eudy were appointed on the 
committee to take care of this. 

President Peggy Fuston adjourn-
ed the meeting. 

—Elaine King. reporter 

Mr. and Sirs. Jim Majors and 
David were in Lubbock Tuesday 
where David had allergy tests 
made. 

lir. and Airs. Lenard Lusk of 
Memphis visited in Turkey Sunday 
with friends and relatives. 

Sirs. Ermine Bray of Groom vis-
ited friends here Tuesday. 

Mr. and 'Sirs. Billy Joe Mullin 
were in Lubbock Sunday and Mon-
day for Billy Joe to have a check-
up. 

Mr. and Mrs. Keith Green and 
family attended a family reunion 
in Brownfield Sunday. 
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Governor Smith To 
Attend Turkey Affair 

Pantherettes Take 

Championship In 

Silverton Tourney 
Quitaque's high school Panther-

ettes took top honors us Use tour-
nament held at Silverton last 
weekend. They won over the Turk-
ettes of Turkey High us the finals. 

35-24 
The Panthers lost out in the 

opening round, 47-48 in overtime, 
then defeated Silverton 55-33 in 
the first consolation game, then 
were beaten 70-40 in the consola-
tion finals. 

The Pantherettes defeated Es-
telline 38-33 in the first round of 
play, then took a 46-29 win over 
the Silverton Owlettes in the semi-
finals. 

Gail Tyler and Wanda Ramsey 
were selected as all - tournament 
for their efforts in the tournament. 

This week the Quitaque and 
Turkey teams are entered in the 
Salt Fork Classic at Clarendon 
with all four teams to see action 
on Thursday. The Pantherettes 
must take on probably the tough-
est team in the tournament, the 

Canyon Eaglettes who own three 

wins over the Quitaque girls al-
ready this year, but who have an 
All-Stater out with a leg injury. 
The Pantherettes will play at 12 
Thursday. The Turkettes will play 
Memphis at 4 o'clock Thursday. 
The Panthers will play Lockney 
at 1:30 Thursday, and the Turks 
take on Memphis at 5:30. 

Tuesday night of this week the 
Quitaque Panthers took on the 
well-rated Spur Bulldogs and lost 
43-98. 

Rev. and Airs. James Smith, Mr. 
and Mrs. Odis Reagan and Eva 

Gail, Mr. and Mrs. Dwight Smith 
and Cristy, Mr. and Mrs. Jesse 

Lambright and boys attended a 
Youth Rally at the Assembly of 
God Church in Turkey Monday 
night. They report a wonderful 
fellowship together. 

Mr. and Mrs. Herbert Gipson of 
Amarillo spent the weekend visit-
ing with friends and relatives. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ronnie Eudy and 
children were in Amarillo Satur-
day Christmas shopping. 

Mr. and Mrs. Carol Byrd of 
Childress spent the weekend with 
her mother, Mrs I. D. Mullin, sr. 

Harvey Case of Lubbock visited 
over the weekend with his parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Jack Case and Ross. 

Mr. and Mrs. Pete Clark spent 
Thanksgiving with their son, Dr. 
and Mrs. B. J. Clark and children, 
Debbie, Bobby and Chris, and it 
was also Chris' third birthday an-
niversary. Mrs. Clark reports that 
they had a big turkey with all the 
trimmings. On Saturday they 
drove to Jal, New Mexico and vis-
ited with another son and his fam-
ily, Mr. and Mrs. Burl D. Clark 
and Burl, jr., Treva and Charlotte. 
They enjoyed another anniversary 
dinner with them. The Clarks re-
port a wonderful trip. 

The Pete Clarks were so happy 
to learn Jal, New Mexico Panther 
Band is rated Superior in their 
division in Class AA. The Clarks 
two grandchildren, Burl, jr. and 
Treva. are in this band. They are 
also the grandchildren of Mrs. 
Jeff Lyles of Turkey. 

Mr. and Sirs. Will Lyon spent 
Thanksgiving with her brother 
and wife, Mr. and Mrs. J. C. 
Rhodersek, in Silverton. Other 
guests were Lynn Rhoderick and 
son of New Slexico and Mrs. Jim-
my Rhoderick and daughters of 
Plainview. 

On Sunday following Thanksgiv-
ing, Mr. and Airs. J. C. Rhoderick 
of Silverton and Mr. and Mrs. J. 
C. Rhoderick, jr. and Eddie of 
Plainview visited the Lyons here.  

more Celebration will start at 5:00 
o'clock. 

Governor Smith is scheduled to 
speak during the program later 
at the auditorium and will present 
awards to citizens of the Turkey 
community who have contributed 
to the revitalization of the Tur. 
key community as a part of his 
"Texas Community Tomorrow" 
program. 

The Governor has said, "These 
awards we are being allowed to 
present on behalf of the Turkey 
community are the kind we would 
like to see being made in every 
community in Texas. 

"Our program, which we are 
working on very hard, is called 
'Texas Communities Tomorrow'. 
With the program, we hope to 
help and to encourage the revital-
ization of all our Texas commun-
ities. The heart of the success of 
such a program is citizen coopera-
lion and citizen contribution. 
Buildings refurbished, areas re-
built, recreation facilities provid-
ed —many such projects accom-
plished 'by a community's own cit-
izens by one total effort. 

"I am so grateful to be asked to 
come to Turkey and make these 
awards presentations." 

An evening of entertainment 
has been planned for the entire 
family, one that you certainly do 
not want to 71i.1S. 

Beginnng proimptly at 5 p.m. 
the schedule of events is as fol-
lows: 

5:00 to 7:00 pm.—A free Bar-
becue to be served at the school 
cafeteria 

6:30 to 7:30 — Free entertain-
ment by the Lamesa High School 
band in the school auditorium 

7:30 to 8:30—Program in the 
school auditorium 

Everyone will be especially in-
terested in the program which will 
begin promptly at 7:30 p.m., for 
Preston Smith, Governor of Texas, 
will have a special part on the 
program, and Dr. Jim Granbury, 
Mayor of the City of Lubbock, will 
be the guest speaker. 

Plan now to join Gov. Smith, 
Mayor Granbury, other dignitar-
ies and all the people of the area 
in making this first Annual Christ-
mas Celebration a rousing success. 

Mr. and Mrs. Harvey Wellman 
and children of Wellman spent the 
weekend with his parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. W. E. Wellman. 

Truman Hadaway entered the 
Veterans Hospital in Amarillo for 
a check-up and tests. 

Sir. and Mrs. Gerald Foster of 
Amarillo spent the weekend with 
her parents, Mr. and Sirs. Denver 
Anderson, and Rex. 

Mrs. Shorty Woods accompan-
ied her son-in-law, Eugene Cor-
gill, to his home in Midland and 
spent the night with her daughter 
and family, the Corgills, on Fri-
day, December 10. The next day 
they took her to Kermit to spend 
a few days with her sister's family, 
the Jimmy Zunewalts. Mrs. Zum-
walt underwent major surgery and 

Sirs. Woods stayed in the home to 
care for Danny, the two-year-old 
son of the Zunnvalts. Terry Woods 
drove down Saturday of last week, 
spent the night and brought his 
mother and Danny home. Danny 
will visit here until his mother is 
able to care for him. 

Mr. and Sirs. A. L. Morris drove 
to Plainview Saturday and did 
some shopping, then they drove to 
Levelland and spent the night with 
their son and his family, Sir. and 
Sirs. Ronnie Hutcheson and Paula. 

Robert Hamilton of Amarillo 
spent Sunday with his mother, 
Mrs. N. V. Hamilton 

Christmas Cantata 

To Be Presented 

This Sunday Evening 
The Chapel Choir and the Adult 

Choir of the First Baptist Church 
in Quitaque will join together in 
presenting the John Peterson Can-
tata, "Joy to the World," Sunday 
night, December 19, at 7:30 
o'clock. The choirs are under the 
direction of Mrs. 0. R. Stark, jr., 
with accompanists Anna Jean Tay-
lor at the piano and Donald Ram-
sey at the organ. 'Tenor soloist in 
the presentation will be Gaston 
Owens. Freddie Martin will be 
baritone soloist, with Betty Tiffin 
singing the soprano solo and Jan-
et Turner singing the alto solo. 
Narrator will be 0. R. Stark, jr. 

After the program there will be 
a reception for the choirs in the 
fellowship hall of the church. The 
Chapel Choir will then go on their 
annual Caroling Party, ending at 
the home of the 0. R. Starks for 
refreshments and games. 

Those singing in the choirs are 
Betty Tiffin, Mrs. John Rogers, 
Mrs. Sherman Conner, Donna 
Brown, Donna Douglas, Eva Cheat-
ham, Gail Tyler, Mrs. Billie Wise, 
Regina Cathey, Airs. Elwayne Tur-
ner, Airs. Cora Gragson, Mrs. 
Freddie Martin, Mrs. Ross Her-
rington, Ann Rucker, Mrs. Leon 
McCracken, Tammie Conner, Cher-
ri Brown, Seritha Helms, Shonda 
Smith Kim Ham, Cheryl Merrell, 
Connie Price, Mrs. Bennie Brown, 
Gaston Owens, 0. R. Stark, 'Fred-
die Martin, Bennie Brown, Ray 
Thompson, Gene Payne, Randy 
Stark, Bruce Patrick, Darrell Ram-
sey, Jeff Tiffin, Bruce Tiffin, Will 
Rees, Reggie Cathey, Danny Payne, 
Suzy Parker, Jane Duncan, Sirs. 
Joe Edd Smith, Mrs. Glenn Ram-
sey, Jimmy Don Davidson, Sher-
man Conner and Mrs. Willie Mae 

Turks Lose Two 

Straight In 
Silverton Tourney 

The Matadors of Matador beat 
the Turks by a score of 43 to 34 
The Turks managed to keep up 
with the Matadors in the first and 
second quarters, but could not 
hang in on the two points Ike Fer-
guson scored in the third quarter 
against the eleven scored by the 
:Matadors. 

Sam McKay took high point hon-
ors with 13, Ike Ferguson 9, Cur-
tis Polley and 'Brent Guest, 6 each. 

The Kangaroos of Kress also 
beat the Turks, 68 to 31. Kress and 
Dimmitt were supposed to be the 
best teams in the tournament. 
Kress came back (after a loss to 
Dimmitt) and beat the Turks. 

The Kangaroos outscored the 
Turks pretty good all through the 
game. Ike Ferguson, who took high 
point honors for the Turks with 
7, fouled out about three minutes 
deep in the second quarter. Sam 
McKay and Curtis Polley scored 6 
points each; Kim Coker 5, Kenny 
Setliff and Brent Guest 4 each, 
and Tony Campos 1. 

We still encourage everyone to 
come out and support us. We play-
ed some better teams and got beat, 
but now we see what was wrong 
and we are going to change so we 
can win the rest of our games. 

PANHANDLE PANTHERS 
UPSET TURKS TWICE 

The Panthers of Panhandle bad-
ly upset the Turks by a score of 
68 to 31. The Turks got off to a 
good start but started falling be-
hind in the second quarter. They 
got behind 16 points and could not 
manage to get within 16 points the 
rest of the game. Taking high-
point honors for Turkey was Cur-
tis Polley with 14. Fran Cruz got 
5, Ike Ferguson 4, Brent Guest and 
Kenny Setliff 2 each and Sam Mc- 

Quitaque Schools To 
Present Christmas 
Programs Soon 

The First and Second Grades 
of Quitaque Elementary Schools 
will present Christmas Carols for 
their parents and others who 
would like to join them in the 
auditorium Tuesday, December 21 
from 10:30 to 11:00 a.m. Mrs. 
Sherman is the First Grade Tea-
cher and Mrs. Dora Hawkins is the 
Second Grade Teacher. Mrs. Char-
les Swift will accompany the chil-
dren at the piano. 

Mrs. Nook Bedwell and the 
Eighth Grade will present a One-
Act Play, "Dust of the Road," 
from 9:00 to 10:30. There will al-
so be carols by students from oth-
er classes. 

QUITAQUE LIONS CLUB 

TO HOST ANNUAL KID PARTY 

The Quitaque Lions Club will 
stage its annual Kids Christmas 
Party Saturday morning at the 
school auditorium starling around 
10 o'clock Sacks of godies will be 
given to the youngsters and car-
toons will be shown for their en-
tertainment. All kiddoes are in-
vited to attend the party. 

Turkettes Take 
Second Place In 
Silverton Tourney 

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Lindeman of 
Plainview brought Mrs. J. E. Ew-
ing home Sunday from the hospi-
tal in Plainview where she had 
spent the past four weeks. They 
came by Silverton and got Miss 
Lizzie Gregg, who had spent the 
past two weeks with the Fulton 
Greggs. Miss Lizzie spent the first 
two weeks in Amarillo with the 
Arthur Greggs. 

Airs. W. E. Morrison returned 
home Saturday from Plainview 
where she had spent the past ten 
days visiting her daughters, Mr. 
and Mrs. Birt Lane and family, 
Sir. and Mrs. Hubert Setliff and 
Mr. and Airs. Lawrence Bedwell. 
She came home with the Murry 
Morrisons who had been in Plain-
view on business and visiting Sat-
urday. 

Kay 1. 
In the B game it was the same 

story, because the Panthers up-
set the Turk B-team badly by a 
score of 54 to 27. Brent Guest scor-
ed 9 points for high honors, Ken-
ny Setliff got 8, Noman Mullin 4. 
Kim Coker 3, Rudolph Munoz and 
Hal Fuston 2 each. 

—Mitch Vivens, reporter 

Citizens Reminded To 

Register To Vote 
Briscoe County Tax Assessor -

Collector Arthur McJimsey has is-
sued a new reminder to citizens to 
be sure to register to vote. Many 
important elections are coming up 
in 1972, from the local level up, 
and the best way to insure that 
you will be able to cast your bal-
lot then is to register now. 

All registration must be com-
pleted at least 30 days prior to the 
first election. 

A reminder was also issued con-
cerning the $1.00 fee to be collect-
ed on past-due lax receipts. Sen-
ate Bill 414 which was passed by 
the last session of the Texas Leg-
islature REQUIRES the County 
Tax Assessor - Collector to collect 
one dollar ($1.00) in addition to 
any other penalty and interest that 
may be due on EACH 1971 past-
due or delinquent tax statement 
issued after February 1, 1972. 

SICK LIST 

We have a number of local folk 

on the sick list and some in the 
hospital. Mrs. Grady Starkey went 

to the doctor Friday with what 
she termed a cold, but the doctor 
thought she was on the verge of 
pneumonia and entered her in Ni-
chols Hospital in Plainview. 

Sirs. Sid Began underwent ma-
jor surgery Saturday in Central 

Plains Hospital in Plainview. She 

came through in good condition. 
According to reports, she is doing 
well but is uncomfortable. 

W. W. Merrell entered Central 
Plains Hospital Saturday also. 

Mrs. George Owens fell at the 
home of her daughter, Mrs. Bill 
Ebbs, in Plainview Sunday mor-
ning and badly bruised herself. 
She is in Central Plains Hospital, 
room 219. 

TURKEY JUNIOR HIGH 
KEEPS ON ROLLING 

The undefeated teams met Mon-
day night on the Qultaque court 
and the Turkey girls left no ques-
tion as to who the winner was. 

Although they had many breaks 
go against them, the Turkettes ne-
ver let up as they led 11-6 at the 
end of the first period and 24 to 
14 at halftime. The second quar-
ter was very costly, however, as 
Susie Lane, who was playing a 
very good game, fouled out. 

When the quarter was over, the 
score was Turkey 36, Quitaque 18. 
After a rough and wild fourth 
period, the final score was 'Tur-
key 44, Quitaque 26. 

The Turkey girls have now won 
12 straight games. The fans have 
been real good at turning out for 
the games and this means a lot to 
the teams. 

The game was really an all-team 
effort, as all their games have 
been. Neta Landry and Mitchie 
Lipscomb each hit for 12 points, 
and Janna Turner hit for 20. 

In the B girls game the Turkey 
girls won their 'third straight 
game as they defeated the Quita-
que girls by the score of 27 to 15. 
At the end of the first period the 
score was Turkey 8, Quitaque 8. 
Quitaque was held scoreless in 
the second 'period, and it ended 
Turkey 17, Quitaque 8. The score 
at the end of three periods of 
play was Turkey 23, Quitaque 12, 
and the final talley was Turkey 27, 
Quitaque 15. 

To round out the scoring, Jena 
Mullin had her best night as she 
hit 12 points, Doris Vivens had 7, 
Joan Turner 2, Marlene Cawley 2, 
Chris DeLaGarza 2, and Doris Ann 
Vivens hit 2. 

These were both big wins and 
the girls are to be congratulated. 
The support of the fans was real-
ly appreciated. 

Sirs. E. L Hill and Bob Russell 
were in Abilene last Wednesday 
to attend the funeral of Mrs. Clara 
Daniels. Mrs. Daniels was the mo-
ther of Charles Daniels, formerly 
of Turkey. 

The First Annual Turkey Christ-
mas Celebration will be held Sat-
urday, December 18, and people 
in the area are invited to attend. 
GOV . Preston Smith will be pre-
sent at the event. 

Santa Claus is due to arrive in 
Turkey Saturday at 1:30 p.m. and 
will have goodies for the kiddoes. 

At 4:30 p.m. Santa will join in 
a parade which will start at the 
west end of Turkey and will pro-
ceed down Slain Street and will 
end at the school cafeteria where 
the First Annual Turkey Christ- 

Mrs. Reagan To Be 
Buried Here Today 

Funeral services for Mrs. Ruth 
M. Reagan, 77, who died at 10 p.m. 
Tuesday in Swisher 'Memorial Hos-
pital in Tulia, will be at 2 p.m. 
today in Calvary Baptist Church 
there. 

Officiating will be the Rev. F. 
W. Elmore, pastor, assisted by the 
Rev. James Smith of tht Assem-
bly of God Church in Quitaque. 

Burial will be in Quitaque Ceme-
tery by Wallace Funeral Home of 
Tulia. 

Born in Indian territory, Sirs. 
Reagan had been a resident of 
Tulia the past eight years after 
moving from Canyon. 

She married W. E. Reagan in 
1910 in Tucurncari, New Mexico. 
He died in 1944. 

Surviving are six sons, John T., 
Odis and Cecil, all of Quitaque, 
Andy of Silverton, Billy of Lock-
ney, and Robert of Moab, Utah; 
four daughters, Mrs. Martha Schaf-
fer of Silverton, Colorado, Mrs. 
Ruth Mortimer of Durango, Colo-
rado, Mrs. Eunice Simpson of Val-
ley Center, California, and Mrs. 
Glenna Reynolds of Tulia; one 
sister, Mrs. Lou Mariner of Tu-
cumcari; 35 grandchildren and 37 
great-grandchildren. 

JUNIOR HIGH SPLITS TWO 

WITH OUITAOUE TEAMS 

The Junior High Turks, after a 
five-game winning streak, drop-
ped their sixth game to the Junior 
High Panthers of Quitaque. 

It was an exciting game with 
Ron Eudy hitting for 27 points. 
Scotty Setliff 11, Brian 'Wheeler 5, 
Barry Wheeler 2 and Ross Case 1. 

A talk with Coach Mouser re-
vealed that Scotty and Brian were 
just off their shots. He said they 
missed easy shots that they should 
have made. 

For the Junior High Panthers it 
was Ernie Lucero with 18, Joey 
Barefield 16, Billy Morris 12, Pep-
per Jones 4 and Darrell Ramsey 
2. In the B game a last second 
toss by Lee Cruse won the game 
for the Turks. The final score was 
21 to 19, with the Turks on top. 

High point for the Turks was 
Jesse Ferguson with 9, Doyle Proc-
tor 8, Rusty Riddell and Lee Cruce 
2 each. 

For the Panthers, scorewise it 
was Jimmy Davidson 8, Reggie 
Cathey 4, Terry Williams and Jeff 
Tiffin 3, and Bruce Patrick 1. 

—Mitch Vivens, reporter 

LIONS CLUB NEWS 

The Turkey Lions Club will 
have their annual Ladies Night 
Christmas Party at Lanes Restaur-
ant at 7:00 December 20. Each 
person is to bring a gift or toy not 
to exceed $2.00. This gift will be 
given to the Turkey Fire Depart-
ment. 

A good meal will be served and 
every Lion and his lady should 
make plans to attend. 

Mitchell Vivens, reporter 

The Turkettes edged Matador in 
their first game of the tournament. 
A toss by Vicki Ham, who scored 
with about six seconds left on the 
clock, decided the game. 

It was an exciting game with the 
Turkettes outscoring the Matadors 
in the second and third quarters. 

Taking high point honors for 
Taylor. the Turkettes were Annie Polley 

with 19, Vicki Ham with 10, Me-
linda Mullin 2 and Rachael Cam-
pos 1. 

In the second game on Friday it 
was pretty much the same story 
with the Turkettes winning by 
one point, 39 to 38. The Turkettes 
were outscored in the first and 
second quarters but came back and 
outscored them the second half. 
For the Turkettes it was Annie 
Polley with 26 points, Karen Eu-
dy with 9 and Vicki Ham with 4. 

Saturday it was a different story 
with the Pantherettes beating the 
Turkettes by the score of 35 to 
24. The Turkettes outscored the 
Pantherettes in the first and se-
cond quarters, but were badly out-
scored in the third quarter. 

For the Turkettes, again it was 
Annie Polley 18 and Vicki Hans 6. 

All tournament selections were 
Doris Carlisle and Annie Polley. 



Hot 
EV( 

• NO FLUE. FITS 
ANYWHERE! 

• NO PILOT, NO FLAME! 

• CLEAN, ODORLESS! 

• QUICK RECOVERY! 

SPECIAL lO RATE 
Ask for Details 

FREE WIRING 
Normal FREE 220 volt wiring — in 
a permanently constructed resi- 
dence served by WT1.1 — for a 
qualified Venn, Wafer Heater 
010gal. or lamer) purchased from 

local dealer. Ask for dated, 

WILSON & SON LUMBER 
Quitaque, Texas 

CITY ELECTRIC—Turkey 

HIGGINBOTHAM - BARTLETT 
Turkey, Texas 

she has had many other stories 
and articles published. She lives 
in Abilene, only 17 miles from the 
Rumph 'homestead where David 
settled in 1876. 

The Valley Tribune received a 

complimentary copy of the book 
recently and as soon as the edi-
tors finish reading the most inter-
esting story of the Rumph family, 
they will present it to the school 

STORY OF RUMPH FAMILY 

IS NOW IN PRINT 

This Man David," the story of 
David Rumph, father of the late 
Dr. E. P. Rumph of Quitaque, and 
grandfather of P. P., Juanita, Thel-
ma, Gladys, Quah and Betty Mae-
belle, is now in print and may be 
purchased by anyone interested in 
reading this very interesting story. 

"This Man David" is a fast-pac-
ed biography of the life of David 
Rumph. Interwoven in its pages is 
the economic situation prior to 
and following the Civil War. The 
book tells how one man and his 
family was affected by the war, 
high taxes, loss of slave labor, a 
continuing decline in prices of 
farm commodities, and finally days 
of Reconstruction. 

By 1860, David had become a 
prominent plantation owner and 
merchant with a valued estatt of 
$200,000. 

His refusal to be defeated by 
the Carpetbag government brought 
him to Texas in 1869. His progeny 
in Texas and surrounding states 
has erected a monument to his 
memory. Among them are 20 phy-
sicians. Joihn practiced at Tecum-
seh, Post City and Tatum, New 
Mexico; Met practiced at Potosi, 
Lubbock and Orange, California; 
Gene practiced at Lawn and Quita-
que. Today Dr. Mal Rumph prac-
tices in Fort Worth, Dr. David 
Ross Rumph in McAlister, Okla-
homa, Dr. Quah Rumph in Hous-
ton, Dr. Milton Joe Moore in Ver-
non, Dr. Haskell Hestand and Dr. 
William Baxter DDS in Odessa. 

The book was written by Juan-
ita Daniel Zachary, who began 
writing during WW II. Her pub-
lished works include "Potosi The 
First One Hundred Years", and 

"This Man David" may be or-

dered from Quality Printing Co., 
library. P. 0. Box 1060, Abilene, Texas. 

SLEEPING ON A SEALY 

The children and grandchild-
ren of Mr. and Mrs. Charles Gowin 
request the pleasure of your com-
pany at their fiftieth wedding an-
niversary on Sunday, the twenty-
sixth of December, nineteen hun-
dred and seventy-one, from two 
until four o'clock in their home 
at Quitaque. 

Quitaque WSCS Has 

Christmas Party 
The warmth of a burning fire-

place and the smell of coffee and 
fruitcake was the setting last Wed-
nesday night at the home of Mrs. 
N. V. 'Hamilton for the annual 
WSCS Christmas Party. Games of 
cards and dominoes were played, 
gifts were exchanged and refresh-
ments of coffee, spiced tea and 
fruitcake were served. 

Those present were Mrs. Hamil-
ton, Mrs. Catherine Williams, Mr. 

and Mrs. Jimmy Davidson, Mr. and 

Mrs. Bill Woods, Minnie Mae Ro-

berson, Yolan Roberson, Mr. and 
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Mr. and Mrs. Tom Barbee visit-
ed their son and family, Mr. and 
Mrs. Earnest Wayne Barbee, in 
Clarendon. 

Mrs. Ann Clements and child-
ren of Amarillo spent last week 
here visiting her grandparents, 
Mr. and Mrs. 'Floyd Gilmore. 

Mrs. J. T. 'Mullin spent a few 
days last week visiting in Amar-
illo with her daughter, Gleena, 

Mrs. Jarrell Rice, 'Mr. and Mrs. 
Weldon Griffin, Mr. and Mrs. 
Grady Tyler, Delilah McFall, Mrs. 
M. E. Loving, Estelle Davidson and 
Mr. and Mrs. Dick Evatt. 

Is Like Sleeping On A Cloud 

IMPERIAL POSTUREPEDIC 

In King, Queen or Standard Size 

Exclusive Bracer Gards Give 

Reinforced Support In Vital 

Center Third 

Luxury Quilted Cushioning 

Wake Up In The Morning Feeling 

Refreshed. Never Have That Soft Bed 

Backache 

JOHNSON & SON 
Ouitaque, Texas 

1:30 P. M. 

DR. 0. R. McINTOSH 
OPTOMETRIST 

211 South Main St. 	Floydada 	Phone 983-3460 

DR. W AYNE D. MAXWELL 
Osteopathic Physician & Surgeon — Turkey, Texas 

Week-day Office Hours: 9:00 a. m. to 6:00 p. m. 

Closed Thursday Afternoons 
Office Phone 3501 	 House Phone 5721 

Your Business Is Appreciated 

FERGUSON INSURANCE AGENCY 
Phone 3121 Terhey, Texas 

For Your Convenience 

Has the following equipment in use 

20 Maytag Automatic Machines — 20f per load 
3 Duplex (double load) Machines — 35f per load 

6 Dryers -- 25e for 30 minutes 

Water Softener — Soap, Starch B Bleach Dispenser 

2 Coin Operated Dry Cleaning Machines — 8 lbs. for $2.5C 

Coin Changer 

Use Starch Machine FREE 

SELF SERVICE CAR WASH — 25f FOR 5 MH1(TES 

TIFFIN HOME LAUNDRY 

MR. AND MRS. CHARLES GOWIN 

hti * 	 * 

The Charles Gowins To Celebrate '50' Years 

ELM TREE INN 
Tulia, Texas 

Open 6:00 A.M. to 10:00 P.M. 

BREAKFASTS 

LUNCHES 

CHARCOAL STEAKS 

We are taking reservations for 

Christmas & New Year's Parties 

Call Tulia 	 995-3201 

FREE GIFT FOR CHILDREN 

HOW 
CAN 

YOU 
1. KEEP TRACK OF EXPENSES 
2. PAY BILLS BY MAIL 
3. KEEP TAX RECORDS 
4. SAFEGUARD YOUR CASH FROM LOSS 

IT'S EASY WITH A CHECKING ACCOUNT 

Peoples 
State Bank 

Member F.D.I.C. 
Phone 3531 — Turkey, Texas 

M--a,Th a-krAAM-aMa-Da 

CHRISTMAS 
SUGGESTIONS AT RICE'S 

Texsheen Lounging Pajamas 

Also In Texsheen 

Pajamas - Gowns With Matching Robes 
Blankets and Electric Blankets 
Sheets and Pillow Cases 

Permanent Press and 100% Cotton 
Stockton Pants and Blouses 
Mercury Shoes Flats and Houseshoes 

Hose and Panty-Hose - Hanes - Beauty Mist 
Ladies Coats-Sweaters - 24.95 - 26.95 - 27.95 
Housecoats 

Ladies Cowboy Boots 
Fair 

Every Purchase Made In Our Store Gift Wrapped Free 
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RICE DRY GOODS 
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GAS COOKING is preferred by almost 
all master chefs, bemuse a secret of fine cooking, 
whether it's preparing a gourmet sauce or a simple 
gravy, is fast, accurate temperature control. Only gas 
coo 'king gives you instant on-off heat and precision 
control with an infinite number of temperature 
settings.There's no wait for warm-up, no hangover 
heat, and you can see the flame to adjust it. 
Gas allows you to cook to perfection and achieve 
the fultexciting taste and flavor of your special dishes. 

See your gas appliance dealer and find out about all 
the other wonderful features of a modern gas range. 

PIONEER NATURAL GAS COMPANY 

NEED TO STAY ABREAST OF 

CATTLE SALES & PRICES? 
TWO LIVESTOCK PAPERS AND 

A CATTLE MAGAZINE ARE ALWAYS 

AVAILABLE IN THE LOBBY OF THE 

BANK FOR YOUR USE. 

MEMBER FEDERAL DEPOSIT INSURANCE CORPORATION 

FIRST 
NATIONAL 

BANK 
Phone 2141 
	

Quitaque, Texas 

list 

95 

I free 

Shower Honors 

Recent Bride 
Mrs. Bobby A. Hamner, the for-

mer Miss Gerry Anne Watkins, 
was honored with a gift tea Satur-
day in the home of Mrs. L. K. Gre-
gory in Petersburg. 

A candle bowl arrangement of 
yellow crysanthemums centered 
the serving table with crystal and 
silver appointments. Mrs. Arthur 
Miller and Mrs. Milton Sims ser-
ved yellow and white cake squares, 
yellow punch and coffee to guests. 

Special guests for the occasion 
were Mrs. Winston Watkins, moth-
er of the bride, Mrs. Charles Ham- 

ner of Turkey, mother of the 
groom; the grandmothers of the 
bride, Mrs. Vesta Edwards of Lub-
bock, Mrs. C. T. Watkins of Max-
well, New Mexico, Mrs. Winston 
Watkins, jr., and Kimberly of Pu-
eblo, Colorado; Mrs. W. L Tindall 
of Lubbock and Mrs. Elmer Lacy 
of Turkey. 

Mrs. Donald Smith registered 
the guests, and Mrs. Swain Big-
gem and Mrs. J. B. Scarborough 
assisted in the gift room. 

The hostesses were Mmes. Ho-
ward Kurklin, Bruce Davis, Udell 
Adams. Charles Featherston, Bud 
Kelley. S. D. Scott, Arthur Mil-
ler, George Willis, Gene Kurklin, 
Donald Smith, D. L. Miller, J. B. 

Scott Bolton fell as he stepped 
off the sidewalk at the corner of 
the Bank building Tuesday 
noon and received numerous cuts 
and bruises. He 'was taken to Tur-
key where Dr. Wayne Maxwell 
treated his injuries. 

Mr. Bolton's glasses broke and 
cut his face in the eyebrow hne. 
which necessitated two stitches to 
close. He has a very bruised and 
black eye from the fall. His left 
hand was also severely skinned. 

Mr. Bolton said the fall shook 
him up pretty good but he was 
thankful his injuries were not 
more severe than they were. 

Scarborough, Swain Biggers, Mil-
ton Sims. Floyd McDaniel and Mrs. 
L K. Gregory. PAULA .10 RICHARDSON 

tr * 

To Marry Soon 
Mr. and airs. Floyd J. Richard-

son of 'Memphis announce the tri-
gagement and approaching mar-
riage of their daughter, 'Paula Jo, 
to Morris B. Michaud, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Lawerence Michaud of 
Feet Fairfield, Maint. 

The couple are planning a De-
cember 30 wedding. The bride-
elect is employed at the First State 
Bank of Memphis and the pros-
pective groom is stationed at Fort 
Lilt,. Texas. 

OUITAQUE F.F.A. NEWS 

Kim Ham was elected F.F.A. 
Sweetheart out of a field of four 
candidates by the members of the 
Quitaqut F.F.A. chapter at the an-
nual banquet held recently in the 
school cafeteria. The runner-up 
was Frances Reed. 

Kim, a freshman in Quitaque 
High School, represented the 
Quitaque Chapter in the area 
F.FA. Sweetheart contest at the 
Greenbelt District Banquet held 
Monday, December 6, in Welling-
ton. Kim's parents are Bob Ham 
and Mrs. 'Ross Herrington of Quit-
aque. 

The Quitaque chapter of Fu-
ture Farmers of America held its 
annual F.F.A. Banquet recently in 
the school cafeteria. 

Those receiving awards were 
Mickey Smith, Star Greenhand, 
and Ronnie Carpenter, Honorary 
Chapter Farmer. 

Mr. and Mrs. M. E. 'Loving and 
Mrs. Keyth Tiffin of Sitverton 
drove to Dallas Sunday, November 
21, and spent the night with the 
ladies' sisters, 'Merle Austin and 
Irma Oakley. A niece and husband, 
Mr. and Mrs. Norman Cates, and 
a cousin, Mr. and Mrs. Clarence 
Stafford, also visited them. 

Monday they flew to Orlando, 
Florida to see their brother whom 
they had not seen in 10 years, Mr. 
and Mrs. Rudy Pyron. It took only 
two hours to fly from Dallas to 
Orlando. 

They went to the new Disney 
World on Tuesday. A 30-mile traf- 

fic jam on Wednesday before 
Thanksgiving on Thursday, closed 
the gates after 55,000 vacationers 
had entered, and Mrs. Loving re-
ports they turned that many more 
away. The highways were jammed 
with people running out of gas 
and having to be pushed along. 
The international highway, 1-4, was 
turned into a parking lot, with 
12,000 vehicles parked and anoth-
er 2,000 at a nearby hotel and vil-
lage area. The businesses did re-
cord-breaking business. (Mrs. Lov-

ing brought back a newspaper and 
graciously lent it to the Tribune 
editors.) 

The Lovings and the rest of 
their group went fishing on Wed-
nesday in St. John's River, mak-
ing a good catch of the biggest 
crappie they had ever seen. 

Thanksgiving day they had din-
ner with a nephew and his wife, 
Mr. and Mrs. Study Pyron, jr. On 
Friday they went sight-seeing.  
They drove up to Cape Kennedy 
Space Center on Saturday. Sunday 

afternoon they went fishing at 

Monroe Lake at Sanford. In a few 

hours they had more fish than 

they could give away. 
Monday they flew back to Dal-

las. Mrs. Loving and Mrs. Tiffin 

attended Market on Tuesday and 
Wednesday morning. They left for 

home that afternoon. 
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Shurfine 12 oz. can 

LUNCHEON MEAT _ 49c 

Shurfine Early Harvest 303 can 

PEAS 	 

18"x25' Roll 

REYNOLDS WRAP _ 59c 

GRAIN FED 

BEEF & PORK 

CUSTOM SLAUGHTERING 

TUESDAY & THURSDAY 

Please have cattle in by 11 am 

Merrel oodk•e.-. ts 

Johnson 32 oz. size 

FRUIT PIES 	69c 

Shurfine •6 oz. can 

FRUIT PUNCH _ _ - 2,49( 

TURKEY HENS _ _ _ - 4Pgn  

Bag 
	_ _ _ _ 29c 

Cello Bag 

CELERY HEARTS _ _ _ 49c 

Shurfine 23 oz. can 

'ENDER CRUST 
BREAD-P.O. 

wow.- fro.. th. 

.. Gide. 

Friday & Saturday Specials 	SPECIALS FOR DEC. 11-18, 11 

Ask Your 	"i's 
Grocer For Prize L ist 

DOUBLE BUCCANEER STAMPS WEDNESDAY ON ALL PURCHASES 

Shurfresh V2 Gal. 

MILK 	 
Gallon 

Tendercrust 1 1/2 lb. loaf 

BREAD 

SWEET POTATOES 2 R59( 

Giant Box Tide 

DETERGENT 	75c 

Tender Crust 
Coupons 

29c 

59c 
	$109 

Eldon Martin of Flomot return-
ed home from the hospital in Pa-
ducah on Friday. Ile has had pneu-
monia. He is feeling better but has 
had to stay in all week. He goes 

back for a checkup Friday. Mr. 

and Mrs. Lon McKay visited him 

Sunday afternoon. 

The McKays drove to Turkey 

and visited the Bill Lanes Sunday 

night. 

I ant reopening my Beauty Shop 

Thursday, Friday and Saturday 

next week, and will continue to be 

open on Thursday, Friday and 

Saturday each week. 

JANICE'S BEAUTY SHOP 

Quit aque, Texas 
2&lt 

Christmas Gift Suggestions! 

Timex Watches For Men, 
Women and Children 

Norelco Shavers 

Dominoes, Playing Cards, Guitar Picks, 

Lighters by Scripto, Ronson & Zippo 

Greeting Cards 

Two-Fers Hose & Pany Hose 

FREE GIFT WRAPPING 
Get Your Franklin Livestock Supplies Here 

MORRISON 
Drug and Gifts 

Turkey Hardware 

GIFTS, 

LAMPS, 

FLOWER ARRANGEMENTS 

i, Peery & Dugan Oil Co. 

Phillips 66 Jobbers 

Anhydrous Ammonia, Dry Fertilizers of All Kinds 

— Butane & Propane. Diesel. Aerial Spraying — 

Phone 8831 Johnny Peery 	Turkey Texas 



JOH.NSON.S RADIO S TV RePAIR 
Phone 1291, Turkey. 2 - tie 

ALL KINDS OF ELECTRICAL 
WIRING. Buck Lemons, Phone 2221, 
Turkey after 5 p. m. 	

21.1.1e 

MATTRESS SERVICE: New or 

renovated mattresses of all types. 
Fast and dependable service. Call 

3191 in Turkey or 3131 in Quita-
que. 35-tfc 

FOR SALE: 350 International 
Tractor, and a 21 International 

Stripper. Ph. Bean 847.4335, Sil-

verton, Martin Bean. 25-3tp 

FOR SALE' 2 bedroom house, 

wood paneling throughout and 

new ceilings and paint job inside. 

Priced for quick sale, $2750.00. Can 

furnish clear title, abstract to prop- 

erty. Contact A R. Setliff, Turkey. 

42-tfc 

BUY NOW: Columbia Greeting 

Cards. A complete line of Christ-
mas Cards now on hand. Select 

early. Mrs. Bonnie Wagnon, Ph. 

2427, Quitaque. 18-8tc 

RECEIVE SHIPPED CATTLE 

WITH NEW PURINA 

RECEIVING CHOW TO 

cut death rate 

*lower sickness expense 

*give cattle fast start 
RAY TEEPLE FEED LOT 

Silverton, Texas 

Min 
LAND 

THE LAND is one of 
man's most valuable as-
sets— we think it is prime 
collateral_ In the past 
54 years the Federal Land 
Bank of Houston has 
made almost 200,000 
loans on Texas farms 
and ranches. 

In other words, we spe-
cialize in making farm and 
ranch real estate loans—
long term loans with pre-
payment privileges. 

See us today for full 
details, no obligation 
of course. 

	

Floydada, Texas 	<X 

	

t Branch Office 	1 

	

Quitaque, Texas 	a 

	

Jake Watson, Mgr. 	1 E  Jackie Eubanks, Asst. Mgr ' 4 
 <X 
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The BEST 
Trailers 

are HALE 
A Complete Line of Horse 

and Cattle Trailers 

PRODUCERS 
COOPERATIVE ELEVATORS 

FLOYDADA, TEXAS 
800-983-2821 — Call Collect 

FOR SALE: Good registered An-
gus bulls, ready for service. Con-

tact E. J. Hamilton, Ph. 455-4807, 
Quitaque. 26-4tp 

FOR SALE: 2 20' Cotton Trailers, 

5 18' Trailers. Phone 5461, Onar 

Cornett, Silverton. 	 28-3tc 

NEED A NEW CARPET? Let one 

bring samples to your home where 

you may select your choice. I can 

measure your rooms and can have 

them installed for you. Call Leroy 
Stone, 5711, Turkey. 28-tfc 

Get your wigs and wigletts styled 

and dressed. 	Colleen Scott, Ph. 

2621, Tukey, Texas. 	28.3tc 

Nearly new spinet piano. Concert 

approved. Tremendous Bargain. 
This is your chance to own a fine 

piano, Real Easy. Just assume 
small payments. Write at once—

McFarland Music Co., 1401 W. 3rd, 

Elk City, Okla. 73644. 28-1 tp 

CARD OF THANKS! 

Words cannot express our ap-

preciation to all our friends, neigh-

bors and relatives for the many 
kind deeds done for us this past 

year during our illness. Thank 

you for the many flowers, cards, 
prayers, food, for tending our 

cows, chickens, and every kind 
word of concern when I had sur-

gery and when James had the 

heart attack. No one can truly un-

derstand until you experience it, 

how much loved ones mean to you 

in time of need. May God bless 
each and every one of you. 

James and Lucille Monk 

CARD OF THANKS! 
I would like to express my sin-

cere appreciation to the people of 

our community for your kindness 
and the favors you have extended 

me. I appreciate every kind deed 

and word you've said to me these 
past weeks and months. God bless 

you all. 

Scott Bolton 

Damon Knight visited his aunt 
and uncle, Mr. and Mrs. Buddy 

Morris, Friday for a short time. 

He was enroute home to Lancaster, 
California after he had attended 

school in Oklahoma City for the 

past six weeks. He also visited his 
cousin, Mrs. A. L Morris, while he 

was in town 

Mr. and Mrs. Amos Persons of 

El Paso spent from Tuesday until 
Friday here visiting. They spent 

Monday night in Tulia with his 

brother and family, Mr. and Mrs. 

Tom Persons and Tommy. They 
visited his father, Ray Persons, 

his sister, Mr. and Mrs. A. L. Mor-

ris, her sister, Mr. and Mrs. Jim-

my Baird, and other relatives and 
friends. They also visited her mo-

ther, Mrs. T. E. Long, in Floydada. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ralph Caster had 
Mr. and Mrs. J. D. Nance of 

verton, Mrs. W. E. Morrison and 

Shorty Woods for dinner guests 
Sunday. J. D. spoke at both. ser-

vices at the Church of Christ. Af-

ter the evening services the Car-

ters and the Nances had pie and 
coffee with Mrs. Morrison. 

Mr. and Mrs. Boone McCracken 
spent Sunday and Sunday night 

in Lubbock visiting her mother, 

Mrs. W. J. Carttr and Mr. and Mrs. 
Clyde Monk. 

Dr. and Mrs. Quah Rump of 

Giding, Texas spent the weekend 
with his sister, Mrs. Solon Owens 

and family. 

-.--------.-----------• 

Due to the increase in cost of 
supplies, we will have to 

increase our shampoos and 
sets from $2.00 to $2.50. 

JANICE'S BEAUTY SHOP 

and 

SHIRLEY'S BEAUTY SHOP 

Quitaque, Texas 

28-21 

Mr. and Mrs. Elmore Johnson 
and family of Robstown, Mr. and 

Mrs. Delos Johnson of Arlington, 
and Mr. and Mrs. Alfred Johnson 

of Del City, Oklahoma, visited last 

week with Mr. and Mrs. Arthur 

Johnson and Mr. and Mrs. C. M. 

Connor. 

Mrs. David Guest, Mrs. Sanity 
Guest and Mrs. Squint House were 
in Amarillo Saturday shopping. 

0 

Mrs. Bud Bailey visited her dau-

ghter. Mrs. Joel Wassom, and fam-

ily in Plainview Tuesday. She also 

visited her parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
T. J. Reeves. 

Boyles Oil Co. 
P. G. BOYLES 

Quitaque, Texas 
Telephone 3661 

THURSDAY, DECEMBER 16, 1971 
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Representatives for 

All Types of 

MONUMENTS 
and 

CURBING 

Seigler Funeral 
Home 

Phone 2211 — Turkey, Texas 

Wholesale Distributor for 

Mobil Products Stark Insurance Agency 
Phone 2331 
	

Quitaque, Texas 

847-4945 847-4947 

IF YOUR HOME 
Burns Tonight, Will You Have Money 

For Refurnishing 

YOU WILL 
if you've covered your property with 

up-to-date insurance 
For Your Insurance Needs See 

INRAY TEEPLE FEEDLOT;} 
PURINA BULK FEEDS, CATTLE & HOG HEALTH AIDS 

STOCKERS FOR SALE - CATTLE WORKING PENS 
AVAILABLE 

BONDED STATE INDEPENDENT PUBLIC WEIGHER 

Delivery Service On All Feeds - RALSTON PURINA 

Credit On All Approved Accounts 

Backgrounding Pens Soon Available 

CHECK WITH US FOR YOUR } EEL) NEEDS 

Ray Teeple 	Perry Brunson 
SILVERTON, TEXAS 

We Are Stocking Merchandise Regularly 
Come In And Make Your 

CHRISTMAS SELECTIONS 

and Put Them On Lay-Away. 

FARLEY'S FLOWERS & VARIETY 

• 

LITTLE OR NO 
PRE-RINSING 

thanks to powerful Frigidaire 
washing action. Scrape off 
the large scraps, then load. 

SIZZLING 151:1• 

HOT WATER WASH 
Helps sanitize dishes In 
water hotter than your hands 
can stand. Helps protect 
your family's health. 

5-LEVEL SUPER-SURGE 
WASHING ACTION 

washes up, down end all-
around, drenches dishes In 
hot detergent wash water. 

CONVERTS EASILY 

TO BUILT-IN USE 

All Frigidaire front-loaders 
convert to undercounter in-
stallation with accessory kit 
(al extra cost). 

1-year Warranty lot repair 
el ony dorsal plea 4.yre•

)  Preteellen Plan Warts entry 
Irrn fernIsnrny replecernent 
ler •ny eelach.• part In 
In* M010, earn!) end reeler 
clmulatine Iyalanr, guar, . 
Ore, Impeller. 

EXCLUSIVE 
FIVE-YEAR WARRANTY 
by Frigidaire a good wher-
ever you live or move In the 
U.S.A. Backed by General 
Motors, too. 

1 
SMART, USEFUL 

WORK TOP SPACE 
Enjoy up to 4 square feet 
more of counter surface. 
Helps when loading dish-
washer, too. 

I  

Friday & Saturday Specials SPECIALS FOR DEC. 17-18, 71 

We Slice It 

SLAB BACON 	lb. 	49e 

CorF
fi
FEE 	all grinds lb. 	79c 

Wilson's 

MOR LUNCHEON MEAT 12 oz. 59e 
Carton Of 6 	 Plus Deposit 

COKES 	10 oz. king size 	49e 
Food 

  51b. bag 	39c 

IslhAllieSPRAY 13 oz. can 	59e 
Pi6iATO CHIPS reg. 69c bag 59c 
Shurfine 

DRESSING quart 49e 
Tendercrust 

BREAD 	1 1/2 lb. loaf 	29c 
Shurfresh 

MILK 	half gal 59c 	gal 1 °9  
WM,  

IfforffErg• 
THIS COUPON IS GOOD FOR 

100 EXTRA GUNN BROS. STAMPS 
With A $10.00 Purchase At 

BARRETT'S CITY GROCERY 
Coupon Expires 12-25-71 

NECIVEHOMIEWS I fro 

!AZ ► ff 66N6Novoli) 

—14.44kit_ 
=re- ; 

	

vivirwpm 	Ivy g tit I 1111 
• Wet iftf IVItt 0000000 oe/  tf  tttttttt efst tttt 

tit 	
etIIC:,-,- 

THIS COUPON IS GOOD FOR 

100 EXTRA GUNN BROS. STAMPS 

BARRETT'S CITY GROCERY 

NO PURCHASE NECESSARY 

94— 

sposu 	  
064 1 :1:1 NI I-113 RENT T-4e-  

11)A  discim,  

Get more wife and less housewife with a 

4 FOR SALE • 

UNDERGROUND 
IRRIGATION PIPE 

Asbestos- Consent ter main line 

sprinkler pipe. All sixes plastic pipe 

for water and gas. Rhode Pipe Co., 

Phone 6401. Res. No. 3231. Silver-

ton, Texas. 

Garage Sale: A variety of mer• 

chandise to be sold on Morris 

street in Quitaque with every-

thing selling at a bargain. Come 
early and choose your choice se-

lection. Mrs. Lenora Purcell. 20.1tc 

MICHELIN STEEL CORD TIRES 

at John Young Tire 7o., Tulla, 

Testae 	 12-52r 

FOR SALE: Our home in Quita-
que: 2 bedroom, 1 bath, living 

room, kitchen, den, fenced back 

yard, located across street south 

from the school. Contact D. W. 

(Butch) Baca. IS to 29 tc 

FOR SALE: 323 acres and nice 

home. Ph. 455.4807, Quitaque. E. 

J. Hamilton. 	 18-tic 

Frigidaire 
Dishmobile 

West Texas Utilities 
Company 	

 
water-mud rempay •  

Ea al Cops I ly Employ.. 

Young's Auto 
Supply 

Phone 3461 	 Turkey, Texas 

Dependable 

Service 
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