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Election To Be Called In Quitaque, 
Turkey, Flomot School Districts 

According to Loran Denton, Su- Emu voter should avail himself 
perintendent of the Turkey Inde-
pendent School District, plans are 
underway to call an election in 
the Quitaque, Turkey and Flomot 
school districts to determine if 
the three schools are to consoli-
date. 

Petitions are being circulated in 
the three districts to be present-
ed to the county judges of Hall, 
Motley. Briscoe and Floyd counties 
for an election to be held on July 
20, 1971. 

Quitaque Methodists 

Gel New Pastor 
Arriving in Quitaque on Thurs-

day of last week was the new par-
sonage family of the Quitaque 
United Methodist Church. The 
family consists of Rev. C. Wood-
row Williams. his wife, Katherine, 
and their 13-year-old son, Terry. 

Rev. Williams and his family 
come to Quitaque from the Okla-
homa Lane Methodist Church at 
Farwell, where they have served 
for the past four years. Prior to 
that, they have served churches 
at Follett, Cotton Center, Plain-
view, St. Johns, Miami, Matador 
and Crescent Heights in Abilene, 
among others. 

Rev. and Mrs. Williams are the 
parents of seven children, five 
boys and two girls, all of whom 
are married and use in Texas and 
California. except Terry, who re-
sides here with them. 

Mr. Williams was born and grew 
up at Waco, where he received his 
public school education. After his 
call to the ministry, he came to 
northwest Texas and was married 
to the former Katherine Crable 
of Plainview. He did his college 
work at IMeMurry College and 
West Texas State University. He 
is a Mason and Mrs. Williams is 
a member of the Eastern Star. 
Terry is an active member of the 
Boy Scouts, and presently is on a 
trip to Galveston with Troop 200 
of Texico - Farwell. 

The Williams family states that 
they like Quitaque. Terry has al-
ready found friends and they say 
that everyone has greeted them 
cordially. They also observed that 
the friendliness and cleanliness of 
Quitaque is very impressive. 

The Williams invite Methodists, 
those who are active or inactive, 
to attend services and urge those 
without a church home or out of 
service to attend services with 
them. They pledge coperation with 
community programs and projects 
for the betterment of the commun-
ity. 

0 

Tribune Editor Has 
Heart Attack 

Gaston Owens suffered a heart 
attack on Friday morning, May 21, 
about 3:30 in the morning. He 
went.back to work in the after-
noon and finally got his paper out 
on Saturday. Ile kept trying to 
work and got another paper out, 
along with the end-of-school pro-
m'ams. 

He went to Groom on the fol-
lowing Monday and the doctors 
there agreed with Dr. Maxwell's 
diagnosis that be had suffered a 
heart attack. He is on complete 
rest for two weeks. He has an ap-
pointment with a heart specialist 
in Amarillo Friday, and we will 
know after that just how limited 
his activity will be. 

We want to thank everyone for 
your coperation and every way 

of all the information that can be 
had, consider the alternatives, and 
vote his convictions! 

INCENTIVE AID BILL 
SIGNED BY GOVERNOR 

(Written by 0. R. Stark, jr. for his 
monthly newsletter, "Comings, Go- 
ings & Doings." We appreciate his 
consent for it to be used by The 
Valley Tribune. —The Publishers) 

A big milestone was passed to- 
ward proposed consolidation plans 
for the Quitaque, Flomot and Tur- 
key Independent School Districts 
when Governor Preston Smith 
signed House Bill 854 on May 13, 

Turkey Has New 

Methodist Pastor 
Rev. Roy Patterson, who was 

pastor of the Lazbuddie United 
Methodist Church for the past 
three years, is the new pastor of 
the Turkey United Methodist 
Church. 

Other recent pastorates were at 
Ackerly and at St. Paul United 
Methodist Church in Pampa. Rev. 
Patterson was also pastor at Mat-
ador for four years several years 
ago. 

Three granddaughters make 
their home with Rev. and Mrs. 
Patterson. They are: Tonya, 10, 
who will be a sixth grader in 
school; Teila, 8, who will be in 
the third grade, and Teresa, 6, a 
first grader. 

Mrs. Patterson is a school tea-
cher, and taught fifth grade at 
Lazbuddie this past year. 

"We are very impressed with 
what we have found here in Tur-
key," Rev. Patterson said. "We are 
looking forward to working with 
the people in the Methodist 
Church and in the community as 
well." 

Rev. Patterson is a Lion, and 
has already become a member of 
the Turkey Lions Club. 

Mrs. Wright Buried 
At Lampasas June 1 

Mrs. Joe Wright, 91, of 601 
West Avenue A, Lampasas, Texas, 
died Sunday, May 30, 1971, in a 
Lampasas hospital after a length-
ly illness. Mrs. Wright was born 
July 18, 1879, in El Paso. She 
moved to Lampasas County at an 
early age and has been a long-time 
resident of the Lampasas area. 

She married Joe H. Wright No-
vember 4, 1896 in Lampasas Coun-
ty, and he preceded her in death 
in 1958. She was a member of the 
First Baptist Church in Lampasas. 

Survivors include a son, Charles 
H. Wright of Lampasas; a daugh-
ter, Mrs. Josephine Holloman of 
Lampasas; five grandchildren, 
Mrs. Josephine Rogers of Turkey, 
Mrs. Isabelle LeCroix of Seabrook, 
Jasper Joe Wright of Rockdale, 
Martin A. Holloman, jr. of Lam-
pasas and Larry Wright of West 
Columbia, Texas; and seven great-
grandchildren. 

Funeral services were conduct-
ed Tuesday, June 1, 1971 at 3:00 
p.m. in the Briggs-Gamel Funeral 
Home Chapel, with Rev. Adrian 
Coleman, pastor of the First Bap-
tist Church, officiating. Interment 
was in Oak Hill Cemetery at Lam-
pasas. 

you have helped us. We especially 
want to thank Charles and Mary 
Ann Sarchet for printing the pa-
per for us. Without their help, 
things would have come to a com-
plete halt. 

and it officially became a law. 
This bill was practically a must 
for the three school districts if 
they are to consolidate into one 
central school system. for without 
this special bill it would have been 
impossible to secure incentive aid 
from the State. With the passage 
of this bill, however, it will mean 
that the State of Texas will pay 
approximately half a million dol-
lars to the new consolidated school 
system over a 10-year period—and 
this will not have to be repaid by 
the district, nor will local taxes 
have to be levied 'because of it. 
It is simply an "incentive" pay-
ment made to new consolidated 
school districts as an inducement 
for them to consolidate. 

There has been a lot of confu-
sion about this bill and consolida-
tion plans as a whole, just as there 
is about any new undertaking of 
this magnitude. As a result many 
still do not fully understand what 
"Incentive Aid" is, or why a spe-
cial bill was necessary in the first 
place. So a few words of explana-
tion about this, along with some 
background information on con-
solidation, may be in order. 

First off, all or this has purpose-
ly been kept quiet, and the dis-
cussion has been limited to sohool 
board members, in order that un-
founded rumors would not be cir-
culated before the project got off 
the ground. And secondly, it now 
seems almost a certainty that 
strong legislation is coming up 
soon that will force many of our 
smaller districts to consolidate. 
This was tried two years ago in 
the Texas 'Legislature, and was fi-
nally warded off only after a hard 
and heated battle. Had the compul-
sory consolidation bill passed then 

it would have overnight consolida-
ted 865 of the 1218 small school 
districts across the State of Tex-
as. Beginning with the 1971 school 
term the Turkey school would 
have been consolidated with Mem-
phis, Flomot would now be consol-
idated with Matador, and Quita-
que pupils would be attending 
school in Silverton. It was a high 
pressure attempt by professional 
educators to ram through legisla-
tion that would have dealt a vir-
tual death blow to hundreds of 
small communities across Texas. 

Why then was a special bill ne-
cessary in order for the proposed 
school district to be eligible for 
incentive aid? The law states that 
either one of two conditions must 
be met before a school district is 
eligible. The new school must have 
a minimum of 750 students after 
consolidation, or else must consol-
idate so there will be only one 
school in the entire county. Since 
this proposal takes in portions of 

VACATION BIBLE SCHOOL 

BEGAN MONDAY AT 

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH 

The Vacation Bible School got 
off to a good start Monday mor-
ning at First Baptist Church in 
Quitaque with 97 enrolled. 

The faculty includes Mrs. Prof 
Patrick as superintendent of Chil-
dren I; Mrs. L. B. Monk, Children 
U; Mrs. Freddie Martin, Pre-
School; 'Mrs. Joe Edd Helms, Nur-
sery; Mrs. Dale Smith and Mrs. 
J. Ronald Taylor, acting secretar-
ies, and Mrs. Doyle Tiffin is in 
charge of refreshments. 

Rev. Freddie Martin is General 

four counties (Briscoe, Hall, Mot- period of 10 years. It would go a 
ley and Floyd) and involves less 
than 750 students, it would not 
have been eligible under the law 
for incentive aid. And incentive 
aid in this project is vital, so se-
veral months ago the joint school 
boards set the machinery in mo-
tion. Through the assistance of W. 
S. (Bill) Heatley and Tom Chris-
tian in the House of Representa-
tives, and Jack Hightower in the 
Senate, a special bill was passed 
last month and was later signed 
by Governor 'Preston Smith. This 
bill authorizes the payment of in-
centive aid to the new district on 
the same basis as that provided 
any other new consolidated school 
district across the state. 

The incentive aid payment to 
the new district could be as much 
as $500,000.00 over the next 10 
years. The exact amount is deter-
mined by figuring the annual bud-
get for the new school and com-
paring this with the existing bud-
"ets for the three separate schools. 
The dollar savings per year over 
the old budgets (which have been 
estimated by the State to be ap-
proximately $50,000.00 per year) 
would be the incentive aid pay-
ment made each year by the State 
to the new school district—and 
this amount would continue for a 

IT'S RED CIRCLE TIME 

AGAIN AT THE TRIBUNE 

A. M. (Dusty) Taylor 

Buried Wednesday 
Funeral services were conducted 

at 10:30 a.m. Wednesday at the 
Murphy Memorial Chapel in Clar-
endon for August M. (Dusty) Tay-
lor, 76. The Rev. Paul Hancock, 
minister of the First Christian 
Church, oficiated. Burial was in 
Citizens Cemetery. 

Donley County's oldest oak e 
born resident, Taylor died Monday 
at 10:15 p.m. at his home at Bur-
son Lakes Resort. which he estab-
lished and had operated since 
1951. 

Mr. Taylor had managed fish-
ing and hunting facilities at the 
lakes, located between Clarendon 
and Silverton in the scenic cap-
rock area. He and his wife had 
also maintained a residence in 
Clarendon. 

Mr. Taylor was born in Claren-
don, the son of Mr. and Mrs. Eff-
rum Taylor, early Donley County 
pioneers. He was married to Ann 
Little in 1917 in Clarendon. 

An honorary member of the 
Elks Club, he was a veteran of 
World War I. 

Survivors include his wife; one 
daughter, Mrs. Willard Hudson of 
Clarendon; one sister, Mrs. Easie 
Nutt of Porlales, New Mexico; 
two brothers, Henry of Walla Wal-
la, Washington and Homer of 
Clarendon; one grandson, Dr. 
Keith Hudson of Saginaw; and 
two great-grandchildren. 

ON DEAN'S HONOR ROLL 

AT TEXAS TECH UNIVERSITY 

Kathy Lou Gilbert. daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. D. M. Gilbert of 
Flomot, has been named on the 
spring semester honor list at Tex-
as Tech University in Lubbock. 

Kathy maintained a 3.38 grade 
point average while carrying 16 
hours of work. She is a 1969 grad-
uate of Flomot High School. 

•Mrs. Mike Pigg of Kress visited 
her parents, Mr. and Mrs. 0. E. 
Chandler, Sunday afternoon. 

MARQUISE STUDIOS, INC. 

A number of subscriptions are 
due this month. We start on our 
twelfth year with your newspaper 
with the next issue. We don't want 
to lose a subscriber. Please check 
the date by your name to see if 

Superintendent. yours is out. 

long way toward paying for the 
costs of a new centralized school, 
and would be provided at no addi-
tional cost to the local people. In 
fact. it is our understanding that 
as it now stands, taxes would pro-
bably remain virtually unchanged 
from their present levels if con. 
solidation plans materialize. It is 
easy to see then why incentive aid 
is so important to consolidation 
plans. 

This brings us almost up to date. 
Petitions have been drawn calling 
for a vote on whether to consoli-
date the Quitaque, Turkey and 
Flomot school districts, and attor-
neys are now at work preparing 
instruments so that documents can 
be filed and posted. In the very 
near future several public meet-
ings will be held under the direc-
tion of the three school boards, 
where consolidation plans will be 
explained and questions answered. 
There are many problem,. of 
course, that will have to be work-
ed out by a new board farther on 
down the line. But the important 
thing is that after some two years 
of work, travel and intensive study 
the three boards believe this solu-
tion will work, and are ready to 
present it to the people for their 
approval. 

After the times and places arc 
announced we urge everyone to 
attend these meetings. Only the 
bare highlights have been touched 
on here, and everyone needs to 
have a thorough understanding of 
what we'll be voting on later this 
summer. This is of monumental 
importance to everyone in this 
area; so we should make every ef-
fort possible to attend at least one 
of these public meetings. 

Enid, Oklahoma 73701 



* * * 
Engagement 

Is Announced 
Mr. and Mrs. P. J. White of Wel-

lington announce the engagement 
and approaching marriage of their 
daughter, Miss Jan White, to War-
ren Lee Merrell, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Jake Merrell of Quitaque. 

Wedding plans are set for July 

BECKY STEPHENS 
* * * 

Couple To Marry 
At Quitaque June 26 

Mr. and Mrs. Lewis J. Bedwell, 
jr. of Quitaque announce the ap-
proaching marriage of her daugh-
ter, Miss Becky Stephens, to Bobo 
Morrison, son of Mr. and Mrs. Mur-
ry Morrison. 

The couple plan a June 26 wed-
ding at 7:30 p.m. in the Quitaque 
Church of Christ. Friends of the 
couple are invited to attend. 

Mrs. H. G. Higgins is having 
tests made in a Lubbock hospital, 

SII=MMIgils=1■Emmigimimo 

Zotos, L O'real and Realistic 

Permanents 

Lona Belle 	Elaine 

LOLLA BELLE'S 
BEAUTY SHOPPE 

Phone 2481 
ISSOISEIM HOHNIgmlmsgans 
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Del mom,: B 
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YOUR NEARBY MAIL BOX IS A TELLER'S WINDOW 

WHEN YOU BANK AT THE 

Peoples 
State Bank 

Member F.D.I.C. 
Phone 3531 — Turkey, Texas 

fresh 
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spring MB 

Central 
Electric Air Coditiceing 
• Build, buy or remodel to it 

• Low cost cooling 

• See your local electric contractor 
for free estimate 

an Investor 
owned company 

AT RICE'S 

PLAYTSEXITUNIMERI  SALE 
Bra-Style no. 
Bra-Style no. 
Bra-Style no. 

Bra-Style no. 
Bra-Style no. 

Bra-Style no. 
Bra-Style no. 
Bra-Style no. 

35 regular_price $3.00 Sale 2 for $4.99 
39 regular price $3.50 Sale 2 for $5.99 
37 regular price $3.95 Sale 2 for $6.89 

38 regular price $4.50 Sale 2 for $7.99 

56 regular price $5.00 Sale 2 for $8.49 

73 regular price $5.00 Sale 2 for $8.49 

173 regular price $3.95 Sale 2 for $6.89 

183 regular price $5.50 Sale 2 for 9.49 

FREE SPIRIT GIRDLES 
No. 866 Regular Price $8.50 	 Sale $7.49 

No. 867 Regular Price $9.50   Sale $8.49 

RICE DRY GOODS 
Quitaque, Texas 

MRS. MIKE MULLIN 
* * 

McCoy-Mullin Vows 
Exchanged Friday 

Miss Patricia McCoy of Silver-
ton became the bride of Mike Mul-
lin of Turkey in a single ring cere-
mony Friday, June 5, at five 
o'clock in the afternoon at the 
Rock Creek Church of Christ. 
Earl Cantwell, minister, officiated. 

Mr. and Mrs. Hurl McCoy of 
Silverton are parents of the bride, 
and the bridegroom's parents are 
Mr. and Mrs. Billy Joe Mullin of 
Turkey. 

_ 	men in marriage by her father, 
the bride wore a gown of pink and 
white dotted swiss. She carried a 
bouquet of white carnations sur-
rounding a white orchid from 
which a shower of white streamers 
fell atop a white Bible. 

Miss Virginia McCoy of Silver-
ton was her sister's only attendant. 
She wore a white dress and car- 

MRS. GUEST RECEIVES 

DEGREE FROM N.T.S.U. 

Mrs. Alpha Joyce Guest of Tur-
key was among 1,154 students 
from 35 states and seven foreign 
countries receiving degrees at the 
81st annual spring commencement 
at North Texas State University 
recently. 

Dr. Bevington Reed, Texas' com-
missioner of higher education, de-
livered the commencement ad-
dress, and degrees were awarded 
by NTSU's Acting President John 
Carter to 962 bachelor's, 169 mas-
ter's and 23 doctor's degree can-
didates. 

Mrs. Guest, daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Horace E. Mullin of Turkey, 
received the bachelor of science 
degree in elementary education. 

Mr. and Mrs. H. B. Finney met 
her brother and wife, Mr. and Mrs. 
Cotten Cowan of Houston, at Pos-
sum Kingdom Lake near Graham 
and spent from Tuesday until Fri-
day of last week visiting. 

ried a bouquet of yellow carna-
tions. 

Ray Mullin was his brother's 
only attendant. 

Mrs. McCoy chose a pink dress 
with a white orchid corsage for 
her daughter's wedding. Mrs. -Mul-
lin wore a blue dress and also ad-
ded a white orchid corsage. 

The bride is a graduate of Sil-
verton High School. 

The bridegroom finished high 
school at Turkey, and is enrolled 
at United Electronics Institute in 
Dallas. He is employed by Strib-
ling Aerial Spraying Company, 
and the couple plan to move to 
Euless soon.  

* * * 

30 in the Wellington Church of 
Christ. 

Miss White graduated from Wel-
lington High School and attended 
Clarendon College. She is employ-
ed by Household Finance Corp., 
in Amarillo. 

Mr. and Mrs. H. B. Finney were 
in Plainview on business Monday. 
They visited their daughter and 
family, Mr. and Mrs. Ron Kaiser 
and children, while there. 

Mrs. Boone McCracken drove to 
Lubbock Thursday to spend a few 
days with her mother, Mrs. W. J. 
Carter, and to visit her niece and 
family, Mr. and Mrs. E. T. Harri-
son and children. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ray Don King and 
children of Crosbyton visited his 
grandparents, Mr. and Mrs. Bud-
dy Morris, the weekend before 
last. They were enroute to Colo-
rado Springs, Colorado to visit his 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Bill King. 
They planned to drive from there 
to Fountain Valley, California, to 
visit his uncle, Danny Morris, and 
family. Mrs. Bill King was accom-
panying them on the trip. 

Mr. and Mrs. Tommy Beck, Ar-
thur and Jackie took his parents, 
Mr. and airs. Tom Beck of Turkey 
to Clarksville to spend a few days. 
They drove down Friday and re-
turned home Sunday. 

Joey and Karen Beck spent last) 
week with their mother, Mrs. Fay 
Crosby, in Lubbock. Jackie Beck 
spent the week with his sister, 
Kathy Farley. 

Mrs. N. V. Hamilton spent a few 
days in Amarillo recently visiting 
her son and family, the Robert 
Hamilton, and her sister and bus 
band, Mr. and Mrs. W. N. Weath-
erwax. 

Mrs. George Sutliff of Turkey 
and Mrs. N. V. Hamilton visited 
Mrs. J. R. Self in Portales, New 
Mexico, Tuesday of last week. 

Mrs. Josie Johnston received a 
telephone call from her son, Sam-
mie, telling her he had accepted a 
position with the Darrouzett 
schools as head coach of the girls' 
basketball team. 

Mr. and Mrs. Lon McKay drove 
to Flomot Sunday afternoon and 
visited Mr. and Mrs. Alfred Mar-
tin. 

Gerald Bedwell of Plainview 
stopped .by to see his grandmother. 
Mrs. W. E. Morrison, Monday. He 
works for Pioneer Natural Gas 
Company and was in the area on 
business. 

Mr. and Mrs. Larry Christian 
and family visited his parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Albert Christian. The 
Larry Christians were in the pro-
cess of moving to Wichita Falls 
where he will be associate mana-
ger of SIC. 

Mr. and Mrs. Buddy Holcomb 
and family of Amarillo visited his 
mother, Mrs. Reona Holcomb, over 
the weekend. 

Mr. and Mrs. Carroll Byrd of 
Childress visited her mother, Mrs. 
I. D. Mullin, sr., over the week-
end. 
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Mr. and Mrs. M. K Loving re-
turned Sunday night from three 
weeks vacation. They spent the 
first night in Wichita Falls with 
her cousin, the Fred Morgans. 
They drove from there to Wills 
Point where they fished and visit-
ed at Lake Tawakoni for a week. 
They visited in Lindale and Tyler 
with the Clifford Bartleys, Edsel 
Lovings, and Earrol McFarland 
and family. On May 29 and 30 they 
had a family reunion at Tyler 
State Park. It was the grandchild-
ren and great-grandchildren of the 
late Mr. and Mrs. W. B. Pyron. 
There were 81 present. 

Mr. and Mrs. M. E. Loving and 
Mr. and Mrs. Keyth Tiffin went 
to their sister's place on Lake Ta-
wakoni and fished and visited the 
n ext week. 

The Lovings left there and went 
to Stephenville, Strawn, Ranger 
and Breckenridge. On Saturday 
they attended the Williams reun-
ion at Possum Kingdom. They left 
there Sunday afternoon to return 
to their home, stopping in Sey-
mour to visit Mr. and Mrs. Ira Lov-
ing, and at Matador to visit Mrs . 

R. L. Anderson. 

FLASHI 

According to a NEWS RELEASE, 
Jon David Harmon, five-month-
old son of Mr. and Mrs. Rex Har-
mon, and GRANDSON of Mr. and 
Mrs. Odis Reagan, is cutting his 
first tooth. Mr. and Mrs. R. J. Har-
mon are the paternal grandpar• 
ents. 

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Lacy visited 
last Friday night with Willie Mar-
shall in the Plainview hospital. 

Mr. and Mrs. Harvey Don Mul-
lin and family of Fort Worth vis-
ited over the weekend with their 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Hubert Mel-
ton and Mr. and Mrs. H. E. Mul-
lin. 

'Miss Paula Jo Richardson of 
Memphis visited the Joe Richard-
sons, other relatives and friends, 
Sunday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Alton Setliff of 
Canyon visited his parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Arville Setliff, over the 
weekend. 

Mr. and Mrs. Gary Johnson of 
Mineral Wells visited his parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. George Johnson, over 
the weekend. 

Miss Patricia Meacham of Lub-
bock is visiting the James Lips-
combs a few days this week. 

Mr. and Mrs. Hal House and 
daughter of Houston are visiting 
his parents, Mr. and Mrs. Winfred 
House, 

      

      

 

Your Business Is Appreciated 

FERGUSON INSURANCE AGENCY 
Phone 3121 	 Turkey, Texas 

   

      

      

      

      

 

Select Quality 
Seed Block Grown 

Lankart 611 
Paymaster 202 

Coker 4104 

Acid Denoted 

Planting Seed 
H 8H Gin 

Horace and Wayne Hunter 
	

Flomot 
P. 0. Box 107 — Phone 469-5297 

   



)1k 

actor 

,LE 
$4.99  
$5.99  
$6.89 

$7.99  
, $8.49 
. $8,49 

r $6 . 89  
01  9,49 

e  $7,49 

Phone 2141 Quitaque, Texas 

FIRST 
NATIONAL 

- BANK 

A Travelers (heck ... 

FORGIVES YOUR MISTAKES 
If You Misplace or Lose Them .. . 

Or Have Them Stolen ... 

They Are Replaced Free of Charge 

Available At 

Save 
Shurfresh 

Tender Crust 
Coupons 

FOR 
VALUABLE{ 

FREE 

Ask Your 
	PRIZES 

Grocer For Prize List 

TENDER CRUST 
BREAD - 

.n-from A. 
moo 
▪ 11. 0,1,1 
h nel 

Friday & Saturday Specials JUNE 11 - 11 

   

Tendercrust 1,/ lb. 
BREAD 	29c 
Del Monte Pineapple-
Grapefruit 46 oz can 
DRINK 	 

Del Monte 303 Can 
FRUIT COCKTAIL _ _ _ 	1 

Del Monte Blended 303 can 
SWEET PEAS _ _ _ _ 4P1 

GRAIN FED 

BEEF & PORK 

CUSTOM SLAUGHTERING 
TUESDAY & THURSDAY 

Merrell 

Instant 3 oz. jar 
NESTEA 	99c 

Shurfresh 1/., gal. 
MILK 	 59c 

Gallon 	 $109 

Shurfine French Style 303 can 
GREEN BEANS _ _ _ 5P1 

King Size Box 
OXYDOL 	$1 19  

Energy 10 lb. bag 
CHARCOAL 	 69c 

Food 

Red or White 10 lb. bag 
POTATOES 
	

69c 

Morton Frozen chick. or beef 
POT PIES _ 8 oz. _ 5i$1 

Shurfresh 1 gallon 
MELLORINE 	 39c 

DOUBLE BUCCANEER STAMPS WEDNESDAY ON ALL PURCHASES 

INTEREST COST REDUCED - 
We are pleased to announce that the rate 
charged our borrowers has again been re-
duced, effective June 4, 1971. The new 
schedule is as follows: 

Loan Balance up to $50,000 

That portion of any loan in 
excess of $50,000. 

6 1/2% 

61/4% 
For a dependable source of agricultural 
credit, contact our office nearest you. 

ROLLING PLAINS PCA 
—THE GO AHEAD PEOPLE— 

OFFICES IN 
STAMFORD 

SPUR 
	

CHILDRESS 
MUNDAY 
	

MATADOR 

THE VALLEY TRIBUNE 	THURSDAY, JUNE 10, 1971 

Someone has said: "When we I touchdown. When we play base-
play football, we want to make a ball, we want to hit a homerun. 

BOB'S MOBIL STATION 
BOB BOYLES 

Quitaque, Texas - - Phone 4221 

Wheel Balancing, Car Washing & Grease 
Mobil Tires, Batteries and Oil 

Peery & Dugan Oil Co. 

Phillips 66 Jobbers 

Anhydrous Ammonia, Dry Fertilizers of MI Kinds 

— Butane & Propane. Diesel. Aerial Spraying — 

Ithonda II. Griffin, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Riley R. Griffin, 3728 
Scarlet in Odessa. has received a 
51000 National Merit Scholarship 
from Armstrong Cork Company. 
One thousand of these scholar-
ship winners were selected from 
the 15,000 finalists in the 1971 
Merit Program. Merit finalists in-
clude about one-half of one per-
cent of the graduating high school 
seniors in the United States. The 
selections were made by the Na-
tional Merit Scholarship Selection 
Committee, a team of educators 
skilled in academic selection. For-
ty-eight of these scholarships went 
to Texas students. She will use 
the scholarship to attend Trinity 
University in San Antonio. 

When we play basketball, we want 
to be high-point man. But on the 
Lord's Team, we don't even want 
to practice!" 

This person seems to have come 
face to face with reality. There is 
often a lack of interest in doing 
well in the Lord's service. It is 
true that many of us are willing 
to play in a few big games, but 
often it is evident that we do not 
even know the rules. This is be-
cause we do not know the One 
who makes the rules, nor are we 
familiar with the book, the Bible 
which gives His rules. 

What does God say about the 
great game of life? It is fortunate 
that Bibles are available to all, 
but unfortunate that we do not 
use them sufficiently. How can we 
know about God without being 
is-tiling to hear what He says? 

Mere familiarity with the rules 
and principles, however, is not 
enough. We need to put them into 
effect. To do this takes practice—
practice every day. Then the right 
plays of life come naturally. We 
know what to do and have the 
power to do it through Jesus 
Christ our Lord. When we are on 
the Lord's team, and will prac-
tice, there is no real defeat! 

Jack Hutton 
Turkey Church of Christ 

Receives $1000 
Merit Scholarship 

Phone 8831 
	

Johnny Peery 
	

Turkey Texas 

POTTERY COOKIE JAR 
ONLY 315 

Turkey Hardware 

Field Seed 
GRAIN SORGHUM — Several Varieties 
Richardson. Funks, Hunts, DeKalb, etc. 

Forage Crop Seed and Sweet Sorghum 

Have Some 50% germ. Hegari Seed left 

Setliff Elevator 
Phone 3231 	 Turkey, Texas 

NIIIMIIIMIE11111=11■11111111111111111111111111F ' 

Byrd Pharmacy 
Fred 133)-d, Phlrnlaci,t 

Lockney, Texas 	 Phone OL 4--3353 

Where Your Dollar Buys More 

DEPENDABLE SERVICE 
. is what you get every time you bring a prescrip• 

tion to Byrd Pharmacy. A registered pharmacist fills your pre 
scriptions exactly as your doctor orders .... and with fresh 
Quality drugs. Customer confidence is our trademark. 

In the Hospital Building 

Rhonda was graduated number, 
one and valedictorian out of a I 
class of 723 seniors at Permian 
High School in Odessa. with a 
grade as-erase of 9653. She was a 
member of and vice president of 
the National Honor Society, a 
member and vice president of the 
school orchestra, a member of the 
Math and Speech clubs. Last sum. 
mer, she attended a National.  
Science Foundation Math Seminar 
for six weeks at S.M.U. in Dallas.  
She was voted most intelligent girl 
by her fellow seniors. She receiv-
ed an American Legion award as 
most outstanding girl student in 
her freshman class at Nimitz Ju-
nior High School. Rhonda has re-
ceived Kiwanis awards in math 
and English. and a Lions Club out-
standing student award. She was 
just recently elected Queen of the 
Odessa Downtown Lions Club, and 
was also honored along with 55 
other students from West Texas at 
a banquet in Midland sponsored 
by the West Texas Chamber of 
Commerce. 

Rhonda is active in the Globe 
Theatre, a semi-professional civic 
theatre, and has had lead roles in 
several plays, such as "Alice In 
Wonderland" and "Thurber Carni-
val." She is a member of the First 
Baptist Church Youth Choir and 
Handbell Choir. 

Rhonda was the girl speaker at 
Commencement exercises for the 
Permian graduates on June 1. She 
won this honor in competitive try-
outs. 

Rhonda is the granddaughter of 
Walter Kelly and the late Mae Kel-
ly of Quitaque. 

Mrs. William Proctor and child-
ren of Amarillo visited last week 
with the Boyd Lanes and the Ro-
bert Proctors. 

Mr. and Mrs. H. C. Parker of 
Fort Worth visited over the week-
end in the home of his brother, 
Mr. and Mrs. Lee Parker. On Sun-
day, Mr. and Mrs. Lee Roy Park-
er, Mark and Christi of Midland, 
Mr. and Mrs. Tom Eudy, Laura 
and Karen, an Davis and Wayne 
Gourdon joined them for dinner. 

Mrs. W. T. Brewer was taken 
to a -hospital in Amarillo Tuesday 
morning of this week. 

BEVERLY BARNHILL 

To Marry July 30 
Mr. and Mrs. Jack Barnhill an-

nounce the engagement of their 
daughter, -Beverly, to Johnny 
Grant Mars, son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Marston Mars of Friona. 

Miss Barnhill graduated from 
W7191.1 with a degree -in elemen-
tary education. -She was a mem-
ber of Delta Zeta sorority. 

Mr. Mars graduated from WTSU 
with a degree in agri-business, 
and was a member of Phi Delta 
Theta and Block and Bridle. 

The wedding plans are set for 
July 30 in the First Baptist Church 
in Turkey. Everyone is invited to 
attend. 

Wesley and Gwin Proctor of 
Childress are visiting their grand-
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Robert Proc-
tor, this week. 

Mr. and Mrs. D. M. Pickerel 
have just returned from a two 
week vacation to the -East Coast. 
They flew, their first flight, and 
report enjoying It very much. 
They visited their son and family, 
Mr. and Mrs. Robert D. Pickrel 
and children at Falls Church, Vir-
ginia, which is located about ten 
miles from Washington, D. C. They 
drove to Washington, D. C. and 
spent one entire day and part of 
two more days there. They visited 
Arlington Cemetery, Jefferson 
Memorial, Lincoln -Memorial, Ro-
bert E. Lee Mansion, Washington 
Monument and many other places 
of interest. They saw their first 
big league baseball game, which 
was between the Washington Sen-
ators and Detroit Tigers. 

They -arrived back in Lubbock 
May 23, reporting a very good va-
cation. 

Weekend visitors in the home 
of Mr. and -Mrs. E. L. Fun were 
Mr. and Mrs. Jerry Weatherly and 
family of Haskell and Mrs. Beat-
rice Baker of Follett. 

The Turkey 
Farmers Union 

Will Meet Saturday,, 
June 12, in the 
School Cafeteria 

at 8:30 p.m. 

Mrs. N. V. Hamilton has been 
vacationing. She spent a recent 
weekend with her daughter, Hope, 
in Dallas, then went to Tyler and 
spent a week with another daugh-
ter and family, Mr. and Mrs. Billy 
M. Rodgers. Mrs. H. G Gardiner 
of Nacogdoches joined them at Ty-
ler and the -two ladies visited Mr.  
and Mrs. H. W. Cross for a couple 
of days. Mrs. Hamilton returned 
home from there. 

Mr and Mrs. Robert Hamilton 
and children of Amarillo spent 
Memorial Day weekend with his 
mother, Mrs. N. V. Hamilton.  



t FOR SALE • 
UNDERGROUND 

IRRIGATION PIPE 
Asbestos-Cement for main line 
sprinkler pipe. All sixes plastic pipe 
for water and gas. Rhode Pipe Co.. 
Phone 5401. Rea. No. 3231. Silver. 
ton. Testi/. 

FOR SALE .  2 bedroom house, 
stood paneling throughout and 
new ceilings and paint job inside. 
Priced for quick sale, $2750.00. Can 
furnish clear title, abstract to prop- 
erty. Contact A. R. Setliff, Turkey. 

42-tfc 

FOR SALE: 6 room house in Quit- 
aque. Contact B. K. Blankenship, 

Ph. 4191, Quitaque. 	49-4tp 

Boyles Oil Co. 
N. G. BOYLES 

Quitaque, Texas 
Telephone 3661 

Wholesale Distributor for 

Mobil Products 

DR. 0. R. McINTOSH 
OPTOMETRIST 

211 South Main St. 	Floydada 	Phone 983-3460 

DR. W AY NE D. MAXWELL 
Osteopathic Physician & Surgeon — Turkey, Texas 

Week - day Office Hours: 9:00 a. rn. to 6:00 p. m. 

Closed Thursday Afternoons 
Office Phone 3501 	 House Phone 5721 

Friday & Saturday Specials 	JUNE 11 - 11 

Zee Assorted Colors 60 Ct. 	 Pkg. 

SUNFRESH NAPKINS 	tic 
Shurfresh 

MILK 	half gal 59c  
Tendercrust 

BREAD 	1 1/2 lb. loaf 
Capri 32 oz. bottle 

BATH OIL 
Shurfine Early Harvest 17 oz. can 

SWEET PEAS 
Shurfine 300 can 

PORK & BEANS 
Mrs. Tuckers 3 lb. carton 

SHORTENING 

PUNCH CARD WINNERS ARE: 

2,500 Stamps - April Thompson 
2,500 Stamps - Jean Cathey 
1,500 Stamps - Doyle Ramsey 
1,500 Stamps - Lil Reagan 
1,500 Stamps - Joyce Boyles 
1,500 Stamps Shirley Purcell 

500 Stamps - Conception Real 
500 Stamps - Jeff Sperry 
500 Stamps - Mary Pittman 
500 Stamps - Trinidad Garcia 
500 Stamps - Wanda Payne 
500 Stamps - P. J. Monk 
500 Stamps - Mildred Hulsey 
500 Stamps - Willie Woods 

You Still Have Plenty of Time to Punch Out 
Your Card. 

iiieei Stant  a. 
aARRETT CITY GROCERY 

QUiiTAQUF TE1AS 

BARRETT'S 

CITY GROCERY 
DOUBLE BUCCANEER STAMPS WEDNESDAY ON ALL PURCHASES 

gal s1" 

29c 

59c 

359c 

C49c 

69c 

SHOP OUR 
MARKET 

FOR 
EVERYDAY 

VALUES 
IN UlD.A. 
INSPECTED 
QUALITY 

MEATS 

CARD OF THANKS! 
I want to thank everyone of Mrs. Vollie Miller 

you who sent me 'graduation gifts 

MATTRESS SERVICE: New or 
renovated mattresses of all types. 
Past and dependable service. Call 
5511 in Turkey or 3131 in Quits-
sue. 35-tfe 

IHELIN STEEL CORD TIRES 
;'in Young TheTulia, 

12-52 ,,  

IFRIGERATOR BOX CARS FUtv 

lin Excellent for lake cabins, 
nwm shelters, and grain storage. 
Will deliver. Phone 806 355-4342, 
Amarillo. Wayne Smith Co. 

nit 
MEMPHIS SEWLNG MACHINE CO., 
Singer merhandise on truck for your 
convenience. Sales-Service complete. 
Inquire. Phone 3131 Quitaque, 5511 
lurkey. 20-tft 

FARM WANTED: Have party in-
terested in buying 160 to 320 acre 
farm, if priced right. Dry land or 
irrigated. Willis Walker, Turkey, 
Texas. 2tc 

JOHNsotv.s RADIO s TV RePAIR 
Phone 0291, Turkey. 2 • He 

SALES & RENTAL: Trailers. 
Campers and coven .  
COOPERS. Ph. 652 - 2201, Lock- 

ney. 	 30-tfe 

ALL KINDS OF ELECTRICAL 
WIRING. Buck Lemons, Phone 2221, 
Turkey after 5 p. m. 

27.11c 

FOR SALE: Lankart "57" Cotton-
seed, delinted, treated for plant-
ing. B. K. Blankenship, Ph. 4191. 
Quitaque. 51.4tp 

The Valley Tribune ran an ar-
ticle in its May 20 issue concern-
ing Jolene Hall and the garment 
she had entered in a contest with 
What's New in Home Economics 
in New York, New York, where 
site was in contest with many lar-
ger schools and many contestants. 
She was hoping to win a new sew-
ing machine, but there were too 
many contestants. Jolene did re-
ceive an honorable mention award. 

We want to congratulate Jolene 
and her teacher for this accom-
plishment. 

Mrs. Truman Merrell underwent 
surgery in Groom Memorial Hospi-
tal Tuesday morning. She came 
through fine. 

OPPORTUNITY: Spinet Piano, re-

ported like new. Party good cre-
dit may assume balance of small 
monthly payments. Interested? 
Write Mr. Hall, Box 3192, Lub-
bock, Texas 79410. 52-3tp 

Emma Jean Stidham 
Buried Last Friday 

Emma Jean Stidham. daughter 
of Mr. and Mrs. Henry Stidham, 
became ill at school on June 2, 
1971, about 11:00 a.m. The am-
bulance was called and she died 
in it enroute to the hospital, which 
was 12 miles away at Tyler. She 
lived at Bullard, Texas. 

Emma Jean was 15 years of age, 
the second daughter of four girls 
in the Stidham family. She had a 
heart murmur from birth, but it 
didn't seem to bother her and she 
had not been ill as far as anyone 
knew. 

Funeral services were in Burks-
Walker Funeral Chapel in Tyler, 
with burial in the cemetery at 
Bullard. Services were held ,Fri-
day, June 4, at 2:00 p.m. 

Mrs. Henry Stidham lived in 
Quitaque before her marriage and 
will be remembered as Meredith 
Reagan, niece of Odis, Cecil and 
John Reagan. Henry Stidham also 
lived here for several years. 

Mr. and Mrs. Odis Reagan and 
Mr. and Mrs. Jim Reynolds of 'Pu-
ha attended the funeral services. 
Mrs. Reynolds is a sister of Odis 
Reagan. 

Mr. and Mrs. C. A. Reagan of 
Silverton are the grandparents of 
the deceased, and Mrs. Lee Stid-
ham of Tulia is the other grand-
mother. 

Mr. and Mrs. D. M. Pickrel were 
called to Lubbock Saturday mor-
ning, June 5, when her nephew, 
Willie L. Scott, 46, passed away 
at 11:00 o'clock at Methodist Hos-
pital following a lengthly illness. 
Funeral services were held there 
at Butler 'Heights Baptist Church 
at 4:00 p.m. Monday. Mr. and Mrs. 
Pickrel spent the weekend with 
their daughter, Mr. and Mrs. Gar-
land 'Henderson and family, re-
turning home early Tuesday mor-
ning. 

LOST: 1 handsaw, with Will Ly-
on's name on the handle. It was 
laid on the back of the car, and 
don't know where in Quitaque that 
it fell off. It belonged to Mr. Ly-
on's father and was an heirloom. 
It had just been sharpened. Also, 
will someone please return my 
food chopper. I have forgotten 
who borrowed it. Will Lyon, Ph. 
2857, Quitaque. 

BRISCOE GRAND JURY 
BRINGS IN 10 INDICTMENTS 

According to Deputy Sheriff 
E. S. Stockton, the Briscoe County 
Grand Jury brought in 10 indict-
ments Monday. 

Eight of them were for burg-
lary and two were for theft. 

Mrs. Beulah McLendon of Aus-
tin came Sunday to spend the 
week with 'her sister, Mrs. Carrie 
Wise. 

Mrs. Jack Chandler left Wed-
nesday morning of this week to 
visit her parents, Mr. and Mrs. Jim 
Steil, in Friona. She was to take 
a bus from there to visit an uncle 
and aunt, 'Mr. and Mrs. Perrin 
Rumph, in 'Roswell, New Mexico. 
Her son, Gary, is working in Fri-
ona for the summer months. 

Representatives for 

All Types of 

MONUMENTS 
and 

CURBING 

Seigler Funeral 
Home 

Phone 2211 — Turkey, Texas 

Remember 

Father 

With A Gift 

From 

FARLEY'S FLOWERS 
8r, VARIETY 

Phone 2251 

Thanks again! 
'Brenda Brunson 

or paid on something for me. 	Services Saturday 

Ronnie Hall, 20, 
Dorwned In Arizona 

Funeral services for Ronnie Hall, 
20, son of Mr. and Mrs. Skeet Hall 
of Indio, California, and a form-
er resident of Quitaque, were held 
at 10:30 a.m. Monday, June 7. 

Ronnie, who was on leave from 
Fort Ord, died about 8:30 a.m. 
Sunday, May 30, as he and a group 
of friends were swimming in the 
Colorado River at Parker, Arizona. 

According to information given 
the young man's uncle, Vaughn 
Hall of Quitaque, the young people 
would jump into the turbulent 
water and swim to an island just 
a short distance below and then 
swim to shore. Ronnie dove into 
the water, but missed the island 
and was sucked into the swift wa-
ter. His body was not recovered 
until Friday. 

Ronnie is survived by his par-
ents and a sister. He was born at 
Quitaque, and had been in the 
Army for about two years. 

Ronnie's mother will be remem-
bered at Silverton as Florene 
Smith. Her sister was Mrs. Doc 
(Dalton) Brian, who will also be 
remembered in Silverton. Doc is 
a brother to Walter Lee Brian who 
pastored the First Baptist Church 
in Silverton for several years. 
	0 	 

Mr and Mrs. Kenneth Dossey 
and children spent the weekend in 
Lamesa visiting her mother, Mrs. 
H. A. McCullar. Her sister, Paula 
Jean. returned home with the Dos-
seys to spend this week. 

Mr. and Mrs. James Lipscomb 
attended the Amarillo Market Sun-
day. 

Mrs. Vollie L. Miller, 83, of 
1613 South Jackson in Amarillo, 
died Thursday afternoon, June 3, 
in a rest home. Mrs. Miller had 
suffered a heart attack a week or 
two before and had been taken to 
the rest home to recuperate a few 
days before entering the Eastern 
Star Home. 

Born in Tupelo, Mississippi on 
January 31, 1889, she had lived 40 
years in Amarillo, moving there 
from Lancaster, Texas. She was a 
member of the Order of the Eas-
tern Star and the First Baptist 
Church in Amarillo. 

Mrs. Miller worked for Mrs. H. 
G. Findley at the variety store in 
Quitaque for several years in the 
late thirties. She also worked for 
Mrs. Findley at the variety store 
in Silverton. She was well known 
in this area, and lived alone until 
she suffered the heart attack. 

Funeral services were with N. 
S. Griggs Saturday afternoon at 
2:00 o'clock. 

Survivors include one daughter, 
Mrs. Nell Kidwell, 2100 Ong, Am-
arillo; six sons, Charles of Lan-
caster, Roy of Carlsbad, New Mex-
ico, Aubrey of Topeka, Kansas, 
Hershel of Sintel, Oklahoma, Fred 
of Albuquerque, New Mexico and 
Roland of Odessa; one sister, Mrs. 
Neva Lowrey, Lancaster; eight 
grandchildren and 11 great-grand-
children. 

Larry (Scooter) King left as soon 
as school was out to visit his bro-
ther, Jim King, in Brattleboro 
Vermont. He will spend the sum-
mer there and work. His address is 
c/o Jim King, 39 Hight Street, 
c/o Mr. and Mrs. Westerhund, 
Brattleboro, Vermont, i° you 
would like to write him. 

Quitaque P-TA 
Closes Current Year 

The Quitaque P-TA held its last 
meeting of the school year on 
Monday night, May 10. Mrs. Fran-
ces Wise and 'her homemaking 
class modeled its projects, Leslie 
Johnson and Stachia Chadwick mo-
deled dresses made for them aLso. 
The girls did a fine job. 

Mrs. Sherman Conner's first 
grade presented a program show-
ing how they learn in school. 

Refreshments served by the 
eighth grade mothers were Kool-
aid, tea, coffee and cookies. 

New officers for the next school 
term, starting with the Septem-
ber meeting, were elected. They 
are Phyllis Cheatham, president; 
Jackie Carpenter, vice president; 
Jean Rice, program chairman; Jo 
Patrick, secretary; Mary Joyce 
Baca, treasurer; Jewel Hall, re-
porter; Judy Morrison, P-TA pub-
lications; Tena Cox, membership 
chairman; Billie Jean Griffin, 
health chairman; Mary Stark. cul-
tural arts chairman; Earnestine 
Payne, historian; Myra Brown, au-
dio-visual chairman; Betty Nan 
Tiffin, reading and library service; 
Joan Helms, legislation; Kathryn 
Setliff, safety charman; Delene Ty-
ler, P-TA life membership chair-
man; Janelle Smith, newsletter 
and bulletin chairman. 

There are several jobs unfilled. 
Anyone willing to work is asked 
to call No. 2541. 

There have been some volun-
teers for room representatives, but 
many more are needed. 

Turkey Lions flub 
Has Meeting 

The meeting was opened by act-
ing Boss Lion Jess Lipscomb Tues-
day at noon. Lion U. F. Coker, jr. 
led the Pledge of Allegiance, and 
Lion Keith Green gave the invo-
cation. The minutes were read 
and approved. 

Lion Keith Green introduced the 
guest, Rev. Roy Patterson, the new 
pastor of the Turkey United Meth-
odist Church. 

Lion Loran Denton reported on 
the progress of the school consol-
idation. He said that the date of 
Saturday, July 10, had been set 
as the date the people will vote on 
the school consolidation. 

Lion Lee Vardy gave a report 
on the year's review of the acti-
vities of the Lions Club. 

Lion Jess Lipscomb asked for 
continued support for the club for 
next year, and asked that the dir-
ectors meet next Tuesday morning 
at 6:30 to prepare a calendar for 
the coming year. 

The meeting was closed by the 
Boss Lion, Lee Vardy. 

—Keith Green, reporter 

Mr. and Mrs. J. B. Tabor of Knox 
City visited Saturday night with 
the Doc Williams and other 
friends. 

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Seal of Pam-
pa, Mr. and Mrs. 0. H. Majors and 
family of Lubbock visited over 
the weekend in the home of Mrs. 
W. A. Majors and other relatives. 

Small 	/AI in sO'N' DV "Is, 
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For Your Convenience 
Has the following equipment in use 

20 Maytag Automatic Machines — 20c per load 

3 Duplex (double load) Machines — 35e per load 

6 Dryers — 25e for 30 minutes 

Water Softener 	Soap. Starch IS bleach Dispenser 

2 Coin Garroted Dry Cleaning Machines — 8 Pos. for 52.50 , 

Coin Changer 

Use Starch Machine FREE 

SELF SERVICE CAR WASH — 25r FOR 5 MINUTES 

TIFFIN HOME LAUNDRY 

     

 

Young's Auto 
Supply 

Phone 3461 
	

Turkey, Texas 

 

     

 

Dependable 

Service 

 

Your Independent Insurance Agent 

Help when you 
need it most 

We're independent insurance agents. 

That means we'll be ready to help you 

when things go wrong. Ready to give you 

service beyond the call of duty. Call us 

today. 

Stark Insurance Agency 
Phone 2331 
	

Quitaque, Texas 
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