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April Is Child Abuse 
Prevention Month
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Thursday, April 5, The Stratford Jr. High Band is first to entertain a large 
crowd of parents, grandparents and other band supporters, with the warm-up 
concert. This concert gives the Jr. High and High School a chance to perform 
and prepares them for contest, April 10th in Panhandle. At press time we 
are told that Big Blue Band won 1st in concert, 1st in sight reading, this 
means another SWEEPSTAKE!

Tree Planted At Mary AUen School

Mayor Doug Reese is shown above signing a Proclamation, 
proclaiming April as Child Abuse Prevention Month. Steve 
Dettle, board member of the Sherman County Child Welfare 
Board observes the signing.

Mayor Signs 
Proclamation

Doug Reese, Mayor of Stratford, signs a proclamation to 
proclaim April 22 through April 28, 1990 as National Organ 
and Tissue Donor Awareness Week in the City of Stratford. 
Terry Kennedy representing the American Red Cross 
witnesses the signing.

During this April General 
Federation of Women’s 
Clubs Month, GFWC/Pros­
pectus Study Club had a 
busy day April 6. They met 
at Mary Alien School to plant 
an ash tree with all of the 
young students witnessing 
the event. Using the shovels 
were Judge Bill Fesler, Supt. 
Eiwyn Bass, Principal Steve 
Haynes while Top of Texas 
District Centennial Celebra-

tlon Chairman Marylou 
McDaniel “ directed” . Mrs. 
McDaniel spoke briefly to 
the gathering about the club 
belonging to TFWC and 
GFWC which Is celebrating 
Its 100th birthday this year.

“ I hope many years from 
now when you are a 
grandmother or grandfather 
and come to school to pick 
up a grandchild, you will 
point to this big tree and say

“ I was there when It was 
planted” , said McDaniel.

Only a few of the planned 
helium balloons were releas­
ed, so she promised to return 
Monday to have their help In 
releasing the rest. They 
carry stamped cards with 
club members names on 
them, hoping that some 
might be found and mailed 
back. Cent. On Page 3

Sherman Coimty Long Range 
Extension Program  Meeting

You are invited to 
participate In developing 
long range plans that will 
address critical issues facing 
Sherman County over the 
next four years.

We are In the process^of 
completing activities plan­
ned four years ago and must 
begin making plans for the 
future.

The purpose of our
meeting will be to develop
research based educational 
programs to the citizens of 
Sherman County in the areas 
of Agriculture and Natural 
Resources, Home Economics 
Youth and Community
Development.

The success of the
Extension’s efforts to pro­

4-Her’s Win District
Nine Sherman County 

4-Her’s participated In 
District Consumer Decisions 
Project in Amarillo Saturday 
April 7. It was held at 
Western Plaza.

These 4-Her’s must learn

how to look at 6-8 given 
situations with 4 choices. 
Then place the choices in 
order according to the best 
product for each given 
situation, they studied com­
puter spreadsheets and

vide meaningful programs 
comes from the involvement 
of interested people and 
community leaders.

The study group meeting 
will be conducted Monday, 
April 23 at 7:00 p.m., in the 
Sherman County Exhibit 
Building. You are urged to 
attend and to be a part of this 
very important meeting.

software, contact lens, auto 
repairs, service contracts, 
guarantees and warranties, 
baseball cards, shampoo, 
credit cards, records and 
tape clubs.
Cont. On Page 3

Proclamation as follows:
The Honorable Doug Reese, 
Mayor, City of Stratford.

Whereas, one of the most 
meaningful gifts that one 
human being can bestow 
upon another is the precious 
gift of life; and Whereas, the 
need for organs and tissues 
far surpasses the number 
donated each year, while 
many desperately ill persons 
including small children, die 
while waiting for suitable 
organs; and Whereas, the 
history of the transplantation 
of organs from one person to 
another dates back to the 
19th century, although, not 
until the 1960’s was 
significant progress made in 
solving the problems of 
tissue perservation, surgical 
techniques and refection; 
and Whereas, kidney, liver

and heart transplantations 
are accepted therapies which 
are performed routinely at 
specialized transplant cen­
ters saving thousands of 
lives each year; and
Whereas, by filling out an 
organ donor card and
carryingit, and by making 
our wishes for organ and 
tissue donation known to our 
families, we may give the 
gift of life to those 
individuals who so desper­
ately need 
transplants.

Now, therefore,
Rèese, Mayor of the City ol 
Stratford do hereby proclaim 
the week of April 22 through 
28,1990 as National Organ & 
Tissue Donor Awareness 
Week In the City of
Cont. On Page 9

NOTICE
NOTICE

We will be closed Friday, 
April 13 in observance of 
Good Friday. THE STRAT­
FORD STAR.

NOTiCE

it is with great regret 
that the medicai needs of 
Stratford have diminished to 
the point we find it necessary 
to ciose the Ciinic each 
Tuesday and Thursday, 
effective Aprii 3rd, untii 
further notice.

Stratford Ciinic 
Ciaude A. Hariow, M.D.

NOTiCE

A fund for George and 
Aiice Jeff coat has been set 
up at the First State Bank of 
Stratford. See Penny Boyd.

NOTiCE

Tamale Dinner 
April 22,1990 

11:00 a.m. -2:00 p.m.
St. Joseph’s Catholic Church 

515 S. Pearl 
Tickets

$5.00 adults, $2.00 children 
Preschoolers free 

Tamales $6.00 a doz.

Census testing in 
Dumas every Wednesday, 
Aprii 4, 11, 18, 25th at 9:30 
a.m. and 1 o’ciock for anyone 
wanting to test to be 
empioyed for the census.

NOTiCE

It is now time to be signing 
up for the 36th Miss 
Stratford Scholarship Pag­
eant, to be held July 21st, 
1990, High School Auditor­
ium. Pre-School up and 
including 21 yrs. resident of 
Sherman County. Stratford 
Independent School District.

Sign up sheets have been 
distributed at the Mary Alien 
School, Middle School, and 
the High School.

Applications can be picked 
up at the Chamber office.

Deadline for signing up 
and application back in, is 
June 18, 1990.

We will need escorts for 
all ages. Boys if you are 
interested contact J.A. 
Lasley at 396-2260 or 
396-5911.

Delinquent
Taxes

organ

I Doug

Discussed

Kindergarten Swimming 
Volunteers Needed

Kindergarten Swimming 
will begin Monday, April 
30th through May 18th. 
Eight Volunteers are needed 
to help 48 children have a 
fun, safe time in the water. 
Three persons have made a 
committment and several 
have agreed to substitute. If 
you could share 2V2 hours 
three times a week for three

weeks with children it would 
be much appreciated. Re­
quirements for teaching 
swimming are; smile, pat­
ience, and willing to get your 
face wet. Swimming skills 
would be helpful through not 
necessary. Please call Mr. 
Steve Haynes at Mary 
Allen School or Mrs. Don 
RIffe, Red Cross Instructor

Marillyn Albert, Chief 
Appraiser and Tax Collecter 
announced today that delin­
quent taxpayers could, in the 
near future, expect more 
assertive action in the 
collection of delinquent 
accounts.

At the most recent 
Appraisal Board meeting the 
Board reviewed delinquent 
accounts. The Board then 
directed Albert to follow up 
on collection of these 
accounts.

Unpaid taxes may be 
collected by personal suit

for more information.
Parents of Kindergarten 

children are asked to 
volunteer to help the 
swimmers dress. Putting 
socks and high tops on 
partially dry bodies requires 
grown-up help.
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Legal Notice
NOTICE OF 

TRUSTEE ELECTION

To the Registered Voters of 
Stratford, Texas; Notice Is 
hereby given that the polling 
places listed below will be 
open from 7:00 a.m. to 7:00 
p.m. on May 5 1990, for 
voting in a Schoolboard 
election, to elect two (2) 
trustees.

Location of Polling Place Is 
Stratford School.

Absentee voting by per­
sonal appearance will be 
conducted each .weekday at 
Stratford School (Adm. 
Office) between the hours of 
8:00 a.m. and 4:30 p.m.
beginning on April 16, 1990 
and ending on May 1, 1990.

Applications for ballot by 
mail shall be mailed to:
Darla Cummings, P.O. Box 
108 Stratford, Texas 79084.

Applications for ballots by 
mail must be received no
later than the close of 
business on April 27, 1990.

Issued this the 19th day of 
March, 1990.

Jerry Dyess

Published in The Stratford 
Star, Thursday, April 5, 1990 
and Thursday, April 12,
1990.

AVISO DE ELECCION

A los votantes registrados 
del Texas; Notifiquese, por 
las presente, q<ue las casillas 
electorales sitados abajo se 
abrirán desde las 7:00 a.m. 
hasta las 7:00 p.m. el 5 de 
mavo de 1990 oara votar en 
la Elección para dos (2) 
Junta de Regentes.

Dirección De Las Casillas 
Electorales, Escuela de 
Stratford.

La votación en ausencia en 
persona se llevara a cabo de 
lunes a viernes en. Esuela de 
Stratford (Oficina de Ad­
ministrador) entre las 8:00 
de la manana y las 4:30 de la 
tarde empezando el 16 de 
abril, 1990 y terminando el 1 
de mayo 1990.

Las solicitudes para bole­
tas ’ <Jüe ’ votaran en"” 
auséirtidie cófréb deberárt" 
enviarse a: Darla Cummings 
P.O. Box 108, Stratford, 
Texas 79084

Las solicitudes para bole­
tas que se votaran en 
ausencia por correo deberán 
recibirse para el fin de las 
horas de negocio el 27 de 
abril 1990.

Emitado este dia 19th de 
marzo, 1990.

Jerry Dyess

Published In The Stratford 
Star, Thursday, April 5, 1990 
and Thursday,. April 12, 
1990.

ORDER OF ELECTION

An election is hereby 
ordered to be held on May 5, 
1990 for the purpose of: 
electing: two (2) trustees.

Absentee voting by per­
soné! appearance will be 
conducted each weekday at 
Stratford I.S.D. (Administra­
tion Office) between the 
hours of 8:00 a.m. and 4:30 
p.m. beginning on April 16, 
1990 and ending on May 1,̂  
1990.

Applications for ballot by 
mail shall be mailed to: 
Darla Cummings, P.O. Box 
108, Stratford, Texas 79084.

Applications for ballots by 
mall must be received no 
later than the close of 
business on April 27, 1990.

Issued this the 19th day of 
March, 1990.

Jerry Dyess

Published In The Stratford 
Star Thursday, April 5, 1990 
and Thursday, April 12, 
1990.

ORDEN DE ELECCION

Por la presente se ordena 
que se llevara a cabo una 
elección el 5 de mayo, 1990 
con el proposito de: 
Elección: dos (2) Junta de 
Regentes.

La votación en ausencia en 
persona se llevara a cabo de 
lunes a viernes en Esuela de 
Stratford (Oficina de Admln- 
strador) entre las 8:00 de la 
manana y las 4:30 de la tarde 
empezando el 16 de abril, 
1990 y terminando el 1 de 
nlayo, 1990.

Las solicitudes para bole­

tas que se votaran en 
ausencia por correo deberán 
enviarse a( Darla Cummings 
P.O. Box 108, Stratford, 
Texas 79084.

Las solicitudes para bole­
tas que se votaran en 
ausencia por correo deberán 
recibirse para el fin de las 
horas de negocio el 27 de 
abril, 1990

Emitida este dia 19 de 
marzo, 1990.

Jerry Dyess

Published In The Stratford 
Star, Thursday, April 5, 1990 • 
and Thursday, April 12, 
1990.

NOTICE OF 
GENERAL ELECTION

To the Registered Voters 
of Stratford, Texas: Notice is 
hereby given that the polling 
places listed below will be 
open from 7:00 a.m. to 7:00 
p./n., on May 5, 1990, for 
voting in a General election, 
to elect Mayor,2 Councllmen 
(2Yr) and1 Councilman (lyr)

Location of Polling Places 
Stratford City Hall.

Absentee voting by perso­
nal appearance will be 
conducted each weekday at 
Stratford City Hall between 
the hours of 8:00 a.m. and 
5:00 p.m. beginning on April 
16,1990 and ending on May 
1, 1990.

Applications for ballot by 
mail shall be mailed to: Judy 
Diamond, P.O. Box 188, 
Stratford, Texas 79084.

Applications for ballots by 
mail must be received no 
later than the close of 
business on April 27, 1990.

Issued this the 15th day of 
February, 1990.

Dwight D. Reese 
Signature of 

Presiding Officer

Published in The Stratford 
Star, Thursday, April 12, 
199̂

AVISO DE
ELECCION GENERAL

A los votantes registrados^ 
-del Stratford, Texas: Notlfi- 
"quese, por las presente, que 

las casillas electorales sita­
dos abajo se abrirán desde 
las 7:00 a.m. hasta las 7:00 
p.m. el 5 de mayo de 1990 
para votar en la Elección 
para Alcalde, dos concejales, 
(dos ano) uno concejales 
(uno ano).
Dirección de las casillas 
electorales, el edificio de la 
ciudad de Stratford.

La votación en ausencia en 
persona se llevara a cabo de 
lunes a viernes en el edificio 
de la ciudad de Stratford 
entre las 8:00 de la manana y 
las 5:00 de la tarde 
empezando el 16 de abril, 
1990 y terminando el 1 de 
mayo, 1990.

Las sollcltúdes para bole­
tas que se votaran en 
ausencia por correo deberán 
enviarse a Judy Diamond, 
P.O; Box 188, Stratford, 
Texas 79084.

Las solicitudes para bole­
tas que se votaran en 
ausencia por correo deberán 
recibirse para el fin de las 
horas de negocio el 27 de 
abril, 1990.

Emitada este dia 15 de 
febrero, 1990.

Dwight D. Reese 
Signature of 

Presiding Officer

Published In The Stratford 
Star, Thursday, April 12, 
1990.

Second Class postage paid at Stratford, Texas, 
79084. Subscription rates are $13.00 per year In 
Sherman and adjoining counties; all other $20.00 
per year.

Martha Robertson 
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Sharon McCarver 
Shari Hudson
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obituaries... |
Lawrence Jason Wells

Funeral services were held 
Wednesday, April 4, 1990 at 
2:00 p.m. at the Marella 
United Methodist Church. 
Burial was in the Marella 
Cemetery. Services by Cim­
arron Mortuary, Boise City, 
Oklahoma.

Lawrence Jason Weils was 
born on June 2, 1903, near 
Trenton, Missouri, to John 
Chesley Wells and Carrie 
Dunfee Wells. As a six year 
old child, he came to Griggs, 
Oklahoma, in February 1910. 
His father and three older 
brothers, Ralph, Verner, and 
Paul, rode on the train to 
Texhoma In an Immigrant 
car. Carrie and the other 
children, Glenn, Norval, 
Lawrence, and Melia, follow­
ed later on a passenger train. 
John met them In Texhoma 
and. took them home In a 
surrey with fringe on top.

The family helped pioneer 
the Griggs area. They 
farmed and ranched and for 
several years operated the 
Griggs Store and post office.

Lawrence married Geneva 
Taylor on July 21, 1937, at 
Raton, New Mexico. They 
continued to farm In Griggs 
and moved to their present 

. locatiop .Jh 1.942- They had 
two children»; Joyce who lives 
at Griggs -and terry of 
Stratford, Tx.

He served on the 
Plainview School Board for 
many years and the Sampsel 
Election Board, as well as, 
the county FHA and the 
Texhoma Wheat Growers.

Lawrence accepted Jesus 
as a young man and attended 
Hornsby Chapel Church and 
the other pioneer church 
services held in the 
community schools. In later 
years he attended the Griggs 
Church of God and joined the 
Marella United Methodist 
Church at Griggs.

He was preceded in death 
by his parents, John and 
Carrie, an infant sister, 
Goldie, and brothers, Ralph, 
Verner, Glenn, Paul, and 
Norval.

Lawrence is survived by 
his wife, Geneva, with whom 
he had been married 52 
years, children, Joyce and 
Terry and his wife Ann, and 
granddaughters, Christy, 
Teresa, and Lari Wells, and 
his sister, Melia Wells of 
Hooker, and his nephews 
and nieces and their families 
and Geneva’s brothers and 
sisters and their families.

Although Lawrence was ill 
for many years, he was 
especially blessed with a 
devoted wife and family, a 
wonderful Church family, 
and a caring and generous 
community of friends and 
neighbors.

April Is
Child Abuse Prevention Month
" " ■ " ■ ^ “ COUPON

Perm Special
Starting Tuesday, 

March 13th
Clip & Bring in This Coupon for a

Perm
J ’s Cut & Curl 
Does not include haircut

Alice Jeffcoat

Alice Jeffcoat, 72 died 
Sunday, April 8, 1990.

Services were held Wed­
nesday, April 11, 1990 with 
Morrison Funeral Directors 
of Stratford Presiding. The 
Rev. John Wagoner officiat­
ed at The First United 
Methodist Church and burial 
was In Stratford Cemetery.

Mrs. Jeffcoat was born in 
Oklahoma and lived in 
Stratford for 38 years. She 
was co-owner and operator 
of the Stratford Department 
Store, which she and her 
husband, George, establish­
ed In 1952. She was currently 
the co-owner and operator of 
the Sears Catalog Store. She 
was a member of the First 
United Methodist Church.

Survivors Include her 
husband, a son, Tex Jeffcoat 
of Amarillo); a brother, Guy 
Williams of Albuquerque, 
N.M. and three grandchild­
ren.

Leonard Bryant McGavock

Tulla-Leonard Bryant
McGavock, 69 died Tuesday, 
April 3, 1990 In High Plains 
Hospital in Hale Center after 
a lenghthy illness.

Services were held at 2 
p.m. Thursday, April 5, 1990 
in Wallace Funeral Home 
Chapel with Harold 
Kennamer, minister of 
Central Church of Christ, 
officiating. Burial was in 
Rose Hill Cemetery by 
Wallace Funeral Home.

Wednesday April 11____

7:00 p.m.Upper room service 
First Christian Church 

Sponsored by CWFellowship 
SWCD Meeting

Thursday April 12______

End of 5th Six Weeks

End of 5th Six Weeks 
7:00 p.m. First Christian

Church Maundy Services

Mr. McGavock, born in 
Briscoe County, was reared 
in Sllverton. He married 
Evelyn Wakefield in 1940 at 
Sllverton. He moved to Tulla 
In 1946 and to Stratford in 
1963, but returned to Tulla in 
1984. He was a member of 
Central Church of Christ. He 
engaged in drilling and 
irrigation and was a Navy 
veteran of World War II. He 
was a former member of the 
Rotary Club at Stratford and 
a member of the Water Well 
Association.

Friday Aprii 13

School Holiday 
Good Friday 

SCOT Ceramics 
Scot Quilting 

SCOT Birthday Party 
Easter Holiday 

7:00 p.m. Good Friday 
Teanbre Service 

First Christian Church

Sunday Aprii 15

CHRiST HAS RiSEN!
EASTER

Survivors include his wife; 
two daughters, Brenda 
Kemp of Hereford and Kim 
Conkling of Houston; two 
sons, Steve McGavock and 
Biji Max McGavock, both of 
Plainview; two sisters, Mae 
McClendon and Olive Chls- 
um, both of Tulla; five 
brothers, Lee McGavock of 
Florida, Johnny McGavock 
of Tulla, Oscar McGavock of 
Iredell, French McGavock of 
Happy and J.D. McGavock 
of Sllverton; six grandchild­
ren and a great grandchild.

Giiiis Apartm ents
Is Under New Monagement

1 & 2 Bedroom Aparlments Available
Gos & Water Paid

Joan Paim er - 396-2386

D U M AS OVERHEAD  
G A R A G E D O O R S

Sa les arid Service
1-800 -336-4476

Quality Service Not

2 0 1 S . D u m & s ^ v e . T x .
Residential and Comntercial 

9 3 5 -9 4 6 1

Coon Memorial 
Home

Courtyard Wing 
Is Open 111

We^re new, tve^re open and ready
fo r  your loved one.

W e’ll give tender loving care with lots
o f activity fun,

So^please, come by to see what all we do. 

Who knows ? We could be o f assistance
to you.

For more infoimation 

contact:

Jimmie Sue Chisum 
Administrator 

Coon Memorial Home

2 10  Texas Blvd. 
Dalhart, Texas 79022

806-249 -4571



S C O T  Notes
by Timmie Brown
Happy day to you 

Sherman County Older 
Texans, Friends, Neighbors 
and Scatters this fresh 
Monday A.M . April 9th, 
1990. Local weather report at 
6:45 is 49 degrees F. 
temperature; 89% humidity; 
11 per hr. wind S.S.W. The 
moon was beautiful at 5 a.m. 
when we picked up the 
Amarillo paper.

Scatter Calendar shows 
the Birthday Party will be 
Friday, April 13th at 7P.M. 
Birthday people are Helen 
Taylor and Cecil Williams. 
Friday 14, Guymon Senior 
Citizens dance; Scot Bus 
Trip to Amarillo Thursday, 
April 19th.

These events interesting 
to Scatters added to quilting, 
ceramics, dance lessons etc. 
on a regular basis makes up 
the Scot calendar.

The Beitene Hearing Aid 
meeting at Scot Hail 
attracted enough people that 
they were moved into the 
kitchen for room to operate 
since quilting and ceramic 
classes were in session.

A near fire-tragedy at Scot 
Hall was averted Thursday, 
April 5 when assistant 
director, Dorothy Robbins, 
went to work and found a 
smoldering fire extending 
from the gas range to an 
adjoining cabinet. Dorothy 
cailed for help, the fire was 
soon extenquished and 
insurance inspectors were on 
hand. A ii’s well that ends 
well!

The Senior Citizens dance 
on March 31 drew visitors 
from Boise City, Keyes, 
Dumas and Guymon. About 
50 persons attended.

A skiff of snow feii in 
Stratford Thurs. March 5, 
but it didn’t keep Jewel 
Dovei, Corda Pleyer, Timmie 
Brown, Betty Lou O’Brien 
and Mary Peach Smith from 
meeting at Opal Bryants for 
an afternoon of “ 88” . Cleva 
Garrison was absent.

Wasn’t the Stratford Star 
good reading for local folks 
last week? Such interesting 
coverage, of loqal activities. 
Senior Citizens wish to add 
their congratulation to Mari- 
llyn Albert and Extension 
agent Susie Spurlock for 
recognition they received. 
They give so much time and 
energy to promoting helpful 
activities going on In 
Sherman County.

Wanda Riffe and former 
Stratfordite, Dot Ross, have 
lately enjoyed a vacation in 
Costa Rica. They were 
impressed with the peaceful­
ness existing in Costa Rica 
since it is surrounded by so 
much political turbulance.

Ida Crabtree, Dalhart, was 
visiting in Stratford last 
week. Betty (Mrs. Darrell) 
Lewis was visiting her 
daughter, who lives in Mo., 
this past week. Cone 
Doneison is reported to be 
recovering nicely.

The Pendleton crew; Ann, 
Tom, Lee and Bob were on 
hand to enjoy with Selma, 
father B ill’s honor of 
selection as “ Citizen of the 
Year” . Bill and Selma spent 
this weekend in Dallas.

Our delighted congratula­
tions to Janet Riffe upon the 
occasion of receiving the 
Golden Nail Distinguished 
Volunteer Award for writing 
and directing Melodramas 
for art benefits in her 
(Stratford) community. Janet 
has brought so much fun and 
laughter into the lives of all 
Sherman County Citizens, 
senior citizens especially, 
with her special ability and 
wit in writing the “ Melier- 
drammers”  she presents 
and directs each year. Our 
out-of-town folks should plan 
to be here on Stratford Day 
and attend the Old Timer 
Reunion, where such a play 
is presented for the 
enjoyment of Senior Citizens 
each year.

We welcome Bess Stone 
and Jack Dettie into the 
status of “ great-grand-par- 
ent-hood” . Master Colton 
Neff Dettie, who has lately 
arrived in the home of Neff 
and Lisa Dettie, is a great 
son of each. Congratuiation 
to Lisa and Neff, and to 
grand parents Louise and 
Gary also. Bess has other 
great-grandsons, Scott, Mic­
hael and Marcus McAlister

wno live in Stratford. Jack 
has a great-grand-daughter, 
Alexandria Brooke Baiiey 
who is the daughter of 
Monica and Justin Baiiey.

Dorothy Haiie and Sue 
Haile, Childress, attended a 
Library Conference, in 
Dailas. they visited the 
Ronnie Wiiliams famiiy, 
Plano, Tx. on Marian’s 
birthday.

Eddie Moon’s heaith 
condition is much improved. 
He is the son of Geneva 
Haile.

Patty and Timmie Brown 
attended the funeral of 
Lawrence Wells, Griggs 
Ok. Our personal and 
S.C.O.T. prayer support and

love to Geneva, Terry and 
Joyce in the loss of your 
loved one.

To George Jeffcoat, Tex 
and family, we eend 
Christian love and prayers, 
both personal and Senior 
Citizens in the death of your 
loved one, Alice. We grieve 
with you. We are thankful 
that her long struggle for 
health has terminated in 
peace. We pray you are 
consoled by that fact. God is 
Merciful. Amen.

We close Scot Notes on the 
above sad note. Alice Is an 
example of cheerful perser- 
verance to every person who 
knew her. Let us be cheerful 
and helpful to those we meet 
by passing out encouraging 
Scot shoulder pats and' a 
spoken “ luv u” In her 
memory during the days 
ahead.

b y  M a r y lo u  M c D a n ie l

Worship Opportunities
First Christian Church 

offers a full schedule of 
special worship opportuni­
ties for Holy Week and 
Easter. An Upper Room 
Supper for everyone will be 
held this Wednesday, April 
11 at 7:00 p.m. in the 
chruch’s Chapel and Fellow­
ship Hall. The meal will 
feature simple foods like 
those of ancient Israel in 
Jesus’ day. There will be a 
brief meditation and the 
Service of the Lord’s Supper 
around the tables. This 
worship experience is spon­
sored by Christian Women’s 
Fellowship, Elaine Gurley, 
President. Lynda Hauser is 
in charge of the arrange­
ments. This service is 
appropriate for everyone 
who can enter into a time of 
quiet worship.

A Maundy Thursday 
Candlelight Communion Ser­
vice will be held this 
Thursday, April 12 at 7:00 
p.m. Steve Griffith will sing 
“ I’ve Come to Serve.” An 
anthem, “ Eat This Bread, 
Drink This Wine,” will be 
sung by the Adult Choir, 
under the direction of 
Marihoward Engeibrecht: 
Nina Fedric will be the violin 
splplst.^Xhe sermon will be 
“ People of the New 
Gdmm^drnehT, ’ ’ %rkf It wl 11 
be based on John 13: 34-35. 
The service will last about 45 
minutes. Leonda Fedric is 
planning this service.

A Good Friday Tenebrae 
Service will be held this 
Friday, April 13 at 7p.m. 
This service will feature the 
lighting and extinguishing of 
candies, as appropriate 
Scriptures are read. Mary 
Pat Williams is planning this 
service. The anthem by the 
Adult Choir will be “ Watch 
The Lamb.” Claude Fedric 
will be the narrator. 
Marihoward Engeibrecht 
will present an organ solo, 
“ Behold the Lamb.”  The 
sermon will' be “ See How 
Jesus Died for Us!”  it will be

based on Matthew 27: 20-54. 
This service will last about 
45 minutes.

An Easter Sunrise Service 
and Breakfast will be held 
this Sunday, April 15 at 6:30 
a.m. This, too, is for 
everyone. The group will 
leave First Christian Church 
soon after 6:30 a.m. to go to 
the cross on the Knight 
ranch south of town for the 
service. Christian Youth 
Fellowship will lead the 
Sunrise Service. Their adult 
leaders are Linda Young and 
Susie Harlow. After the 
service, the group will return 
to the church, and breakfast 
will follow immediately.

Morning Worship will be 
held this Sunday, April 15 at 
10:45 a.m. Marihoward 
Engelbracht on organ and 
Sandy Newcomb on piano 
will play a duet, “ The Holy 
City.”  The Mari Bells will 
play ‘ ‘ How Great Thou Art. ’ ’ 
The Abba Ringers will play 
“ This Is The Day.” The 
anthem will be “ He’s 
Alive,”  with Nina Lavake as 
soloist. Marihoward Engei­
brecht will play, “ Thine Is 
The Glory.”  The sermon will 
be “ He Is Risen! Rejoice!”
It will be based on Matthew 

,28: 1-10.,^
 ̂ Everyone . is jBqrdiaUy>, 
învited to share trr these 

services, according to David 
Harker, Minister of First 
Christian Church.

in this joyous season. 
Happy Easter to everyone!

Thea James, young 
daughter of Ben Tom & 
Gayla, qualified to attend 
State in gymnastics Saturday 
at Amarillo. She was first In 
floor exercises and fourth on 
trampoline in her class, age 
5-6 advance beginners. She 
will go to Snyder, Texas, 
May 12.

Jessica and Jennifer King, 
granddaughters of Paulajean 
Wad ley King, Goodwell and 
former resident of Kerrick, 
also qualified for state in 
their classes. Jessica was 
first, floor & third trampo­
line; Jennifer, second, floor 
& third trampoline. Their 
parents are Keith & Tami

His Last Days
The First Assembly of 

God, in Stratford, will be 
showing a new motion 
picture, “ HIS LAST DAYS” 
at 6:00 p.m. this Sunday, 
April 15th. This musical- 
drama was filmed on location 
in the Middle East and 
retraces the steps of Jesus in 
a refreshing new way.

The music and story come 
alive on the screen in the 
portrayal of Jesus as He 
walked in the balance 
between God and man. It is 
this accomplishment and its 
significance that becomes 
the focal point of the film.

Hosted by Dallas Holm, 
the film features the all-time 
classic, “ Rise Again” , and 
has universal appeal to 
children, teenagers, and 
adults alike.

Throught provoking and 
sensitive, “ HIS LAST DAYS 
promises not to leave you 

, unchanged.

Proclamation 
Continued from page 1

Stratford.
I urge all citizens, heaith 

care professionals, educators 
media and the public and 
private organizations con- 

.> cerned with organ donation- 
- and tranápjantatlon to jpln  ̂

me" In supporting this 
humanitarian effort.
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Among the many who 

filled the church for services 
of Lawrence Wells last week 
were NIta Taylor, Doug 
Taylor, Franny Taylor, 
Virgie Mathews, Kenneth & 
Lynn Wells. Coming from 
Austin was Dr. Gary 
Mathews and Brenda Taylor 
came from Denver, Co. for 
their uncle’s funeral.

Fred & Marylou McDaniel 
accompanied by Jim Ham- 
mack of Boise City, attended 
the Moreland, Ok., Hamfest 
Sunday.
Study Club 
Cent. From Page 1

Regular club meeting met 
at VIAnn Reed’s for an 
Important session. They 
selected 1990 Old Timer 
King & Queen, the Senior 
Scholarship recipient, voted 
to give $100 to Coldwater 
Manor crafts, $50 to Depot 
Museum (knowing that 
many members will be 
assisting other clubs), voted 
to have 4th of July hot dog 
booth and serve at Miss 
Stratford reception.

Two new members were 
welcomed into the club, Patti 
Vincent and Deedee Zieman.

Those present for one or 
both of the activities of the 
day were Joyce Hart, Janet 
RIffe, Mary Peach Smith, 
Oline Caraway, Mary Wood­
ford Wisdom, Mattie Baskin, 
Lore Dietrich, Margaret 
Reed, Marylou McDaniel, 
Lorraine Mehner, Jimmie 
Pronger, Susie Spurlock, 
D’Lynn Reed, Linda Swain, 
Linda Haynes, VI Ann Reed.

Co-hostesses were Lore 
Dietrich and Marylou Mc­
Daniel.

King of Stratford.
Visiting this week with his 

grandparents. Hank & 
Mabel Rogers, is Ian Weems 
of Midland. Ian flew to 
Amarillo where he was met 
by the Rogerses and cousin 
Josh Rogers. He is on 
Spring-Easter break.

George & Barbara Avent, 
Bevin, Donna, April & Kodie 
Avent recently attended a 
barbeque at George’s cous­
ins, Mr. & Mrs. Bob 
Lofgren, In Amarillo.

Kenneth & Lynn Wells 
enjoyed a trip to Carlsbad 
Caverns, Juarez, and T or C 
in their T.V. They visited 
with Jim & Helen Taylor at T 
or C just before the Taylors 
returned to Stratford.
4-H
Cont. from page 1
Participants included Neal 

Hauser - Sr. level, Sara 
Graham, Holly Hussman, 
Kimberly Bouldin and Dean 
Hauser on Intermediate level 
and Kayla Helmuth, Finnan 
McClellan, Scott McAlister 
and Garret Macias on the Jr. 
level. Our intermediates won 
1st place in their division as 
a “ team” . Sara Graham won 
1st place as an individual 
intermediate. Our Sr. and 
Jr ’s scored very well in their 
areas. This project takes a lot 
of hard work by each 
individual. If you see these 
kids, give them a pat on the 
back, they represented 
Sherman County 4-H well.

Taxes
Cont. from page 1

against the owner, sheriff’s 
sale of property, or seizure 
and sale of personal 
property. Seizure can in­
clude vehicles, inventory or 
merchandise and office 
equipment, among other 
things.

Taxpayers are urged to 
contact the Appraisal Dis­
trict office at once. Payment 
plans are available in certain 
cases. For information call 
396-5566 or stop by the office 
at 402 N. Third in Stratford.

Marihoward ^Engeibrecht 
was jhe honorê l guest at a 
luncheon held at Coldwater 
Manor, Tuesday, March 27, 
for her volunteer services.

First Christian Church
Anthem “ He’s Alive” Nina 
Lavake, Soloist 
Communion “ How Great 
Thou A rt”  Mari Bells 
Offertory “ This Is The Day” 
Abba Ringers
Sermon “ He Is Risen! 
Rejoice!

^Scripture Matthew 28: 1-10 
Easter Sunday - April 15

A Powerful new Motion Picture . V

HIS L A ST  D AYS
A.

1 ' 1

' THE ULTIMATE LOVE STORY
A  dramatic musical Featuring Dallas Holm Singing “Rise Again” 

. . .  It is an experience that demands a decision.

This Sunday^ April 15th 6 :0 0 p.m,
First Assembly o f God
Corner o f Purnell &Pulton 

Everyone is Welcome

S t t e n i i  ê > e r u t t e î i
The Churches o f Stratford Welcome Your Family

FIRST BAPTIST
Dr. Derrel Lewis 

702 North 3rd 
Sunday School 9:45 am 
Morning Worship 10:50 am 
Church Training 6:00 pm 
Evening Worship 7:00 pm 
Wednesday Bible Study 
7:30 pm

FIRST UNITED METHODIST
Rev. John Wagoner 

520 N. Main
Sunday School 9:40 am 
Morning Worship 10:50 am 
Junior High UMY 5:30 pm 
Senior High UMY 6:00 pm 
Evening Worship 6:00 pm

CHURCH OF CHRIST
Minister John Wearden 
N. 3rd & Chestnut St. 

Sunday School 10:00 am 
Morning Worship 11:00 am 
Evening Worship 6:00 pm 
Wednesday Bible Study 
7:30 pm

ASSEMBLY OF GOD
Rev. Terrance Fred 

Corner of Purnell & Fulton 
Sunday School 9:45 am 
Morning Worship 10:45 am 
Evening Worship 6:00 pm 
Wednesday Bible Study 
7:30 pm
ST. JOSEPH CATHOLIC

Father Arturo Meza 
Phone: 396-2119 

Mass 9:p0 a.m. Sunday

CALVARY BAPTIST
David Jones 

302 S. Main St. 
Sunday School 10:00 am 
Morning Worship 11:00 am 
Evening Worship 6:00 pm 
Wednesday Prayer Service 
& Bible Study 7:00 pm

FIRST CHRISTIAN
Rev. David Harker 
5th & N. Main St. 

Sunday Coffee Fellowship 
9:00 am
Sunday School 9:45 am 
Morning Worship 10:45 am 
Evening Worship 6:00 pm 
Wednesday, Adult Choir 
8:00 pm

Believing that the process 
of turning to God and 
becoming a Christian in the 
truest sense is not a matter 
of legal technicalities and 
magic formulas, but a matter 
of becoming involved in a 
dynamic relationship be­
tween ourselves and a loving 
God. A loving God who gave 
his only begotten that we 
who truly depend on Him 
might enjoy eternal life. As

we think of Christ at various 
seasons we need to examine 
and then re-examine our 
relationship with the one 
who wants to give us life and 
give it abundantly. John 
10:10

Then make any corrections 
necessary to be found well 
pleasing to our loving God.

John Wearden 
Church of Christ

Stratford Grain Co. 396-5541 
Lflutz 769-4485 

Thriftwoy 396-5586 
ElBe M 's 396-2092 
Consumers Co. 396-2261 
Stratford Star 396-5885

C & C Toxoco Stotion C & C Texoco Products 396-2131 

Wiliams Repair Service 396-5330 396-2547 
North Ploins Sovings & Loon 396-5534 

Walter Lesley & Sons, Inc. 753-4411 

Smith A  Smith W ei Co. Inc. 396-2111
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If your news Is not in 
this weeks paper, Be 
Patient, it WILL t̂  in next 
week.

A baby shower was given in honor of Cierra Dyess and mother 
Rene, at the First State Bank by the bank employees, 
Saturday, March 31st. Pictured with them is Grandmother 
Natacha Dyess.

Open House

Mr. and Mrs. David Hass of Texhoma, Oklahoma and Mr. 
and Mrs. Don Ray Knight of Stratford, Texas are proud to 
announce the engagement and approaching marriage of their 
daughter, Darci Hass and son, Galen Knight. Darci is a 1988 
graduate of Texhoma High School and is presently employed 
at Coidwater Manor Nursing Home. Galen graduated from 
Stratford High School in 1988 and currently works for Keener 
Oil Co. Darci and Galen plan to be married on August 11, 
1990 at the First Christian Church in |Texhoma, Oklahoma. 
After their marriage, the couple will live in Lubbock, Texas in 
order to continue their education at Texas Tech University.

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Pendleton would like to announce the 
engagement of their daughter, Ann to Roy D. Jones. Roy is 
the son of Mr. and Mrs. Bill Jones of Papalote, Texas. They 
are planning a June 9 wedding in Stratford. Ann graduated 
from Texas A&M University this past December with a BS 
degree in Applied Math. She is currently employed by 
Federal Home Loan Bank of Dallas. Roy will graduate from 
Texas A&M in May with a BS in Computer Science.

Open House at the Depot Museum, Sunday, April 1, was 
given in honor of these people who displayed their art work or 
collections In the past few weeks. Pat Boren, Bonnie Borth, 
Ruby McNeal, Bill & Selma Pendleton and Marihoward 
Englebrecht.

ELECT
V I C K I  G O R E

C andidate  F o r  
TRUSTEE, STRATFORD 

INDEPENDENT SCHOOL 
DISTRICT

Your Vote Will Be Appreciated on May 5, 1990

Pd, Pol. Adv.. Pd for by V ick i Gore. Stratford. TX 79084

A bridal shower was given in the home of Sharon Wilson, 
April 7 for Amy Holifield, bride elect of Seth Sawyer. Pictured 
with Amy is Seth’s mother, Gena Sawyer.

President’s 
Honor Roll

Sharon Meyer (interior 
design technoiogy) of Strat­
ford recentiy was named to 
Texas State Technicai insti­
tute’s president honor roti 
with a 4.0 grade point 
average for the winter 
quarter.

India is the seventh largest country in the world.

Bchool lunch menu

April 16-21
1

Monday - Fish krispies, 
tarter sauce, Mac/cheese, 
green beans, salad, rolls, 
applesauce cake.

Tuesday - Hamburger Pizza, 
tossed salad, blackeyed 
peas, peach cobbler.

Wednesday - Burrito/Chill, 
cole slaw, spinach, cowboy 
bread.

Thursday - Hamburger/che- 
ese, lettuce/tomatoes, onion 
pickle slices, tator tots, fruit 
cups, cinnamon rolls.

Friday - Smothered steak, 
M/potatoes, W K  corn, 
salad, rolls, pudding.

Saturday - Corn dogs, 
Mac/saiad, english peas, 
fruit cup, cowboy bread.

Brooks Video ^ ^ ^ ^ 
"Introductory Sale"

for RCA
April 11th thru 18th

RCA - CC 2 60  Camcorder
* 9 5 9 ,^  Reg. »999.“®

^RCA 2 7 ’ P̂ortable Stereo TV
with remote F27159WN

$635.^  ̂ Reg. *675.»»
G.E. VCR With RemoteVR 7500

«279,®® Reg. *299.»»

RCA 2 6 ” Stereo, Color Trak
2 0 0 0  Remote G 26359HP

•759.'’® Reg. *799.»»

A wedding reception was given March 24 for Duane and 
Stephanie Gillenwaters. The event was a Mexican supper at 
Kerrick Community Center, with hosts the Bevin Avents, 
George Avents, Kayo McDaniels, Jim Wrights, Terry 
Schoonovers. The George Aliens also were hosts but could not 
attend. Money was clipped on a barbed wire fence with a 
horse tied to the hitching post, aii in minature, of course, 
except the money. Present were the bride’s parents, Reia and 
Don Lenhart of Freedom, Okie, and the groom’s parents, 
Donna and Bill Gillenwaters. Others attending were the Dale 
Oyiers, Waiter Lesleys, Phillip Bains, P.J. Prongers, Jeff 
Prongers, Keith Waters, Jim Allisons, Blake Sladeks, R.J. 
Hills, Richard Greys, John McDaniels, Mike McDaniels. Also 
Patti McDaniel, Sarah & Kristen Powell, Ann Weils, Brady 
Schoonover, Derrek Weiis, Kathy Altman, John Wagoner, 
Franny Taylor, Annette Hampton, Ralph James Hampton. 
And the Ralph Hamptons, Ted Irlbecks, Richard Jameses, 
Hank Rogerses, Kenneth Wellses, Fred McDaniels. Pictured 
are Reia and Don Lenhart, Duane and Stephanie and Donna 
and Bill Gillenwaters.  ̂ m w w mm

 ̂ The Golden Needle is * 
now located at 319 N. 9th < 

 ̂ St. in Stratford. Hours are 
from 8 a.m. to 5 p.m. Mon.
- Fri., Sat. 8-12 a.m. 
396-2326.

We are now offering a 
discount to all S.C.O.T. 
members.

Come in and see us at our 
new location!

Easter Greetings

M ay the coming of this holy day lift 
your spirit and bring joy to your heart.

ol StioitpyuL
S T R A T F O R D ,  T E X A S  7 9 0 8 A

5 YEARS PARTS & LABOR PROTECTION PLAN- 
NO EXTRA CHARGE ON EVERY RCA COLOR TV 
VCR AND CAMCORDER WE SELL.

Guaranteed Nationally 
by EWC Electronics

396-2845  
219 N. Main

Energy Efficient 
Irrigation Engines

Can you afford not to invest in your future?
ENER'TECH oi Amarillo, Texas has developed the most cost effective 
irrigation engine available on today’s market.

WE OFFER: • Fuel Savings of 25 - 40%
"12  Month Limited Warranty 
■ Horsepower Ranges of 50-250
• On-Site Installation
• 24-Hour Service

In order to remain cost eifecUve. today's Agri-businessman must consider 
the most dopondable, fuel efficient engine on the market.

Call Us .„W e have what you're looking for!
3410 Rllmore 806-372-2078

Amarnio,Tx79110 FAX 806-372-2081

1- 800- 766-9699 ENER-TECH
IS THE FUTURE!
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U IL  literary Competition

Heather Carter, Marsha Diamond, Mindy Rendon, Carie 
Switser, Matt Brotherton and Shannon Norris.

SHS placed third in UIL 
Literary competition at 
Panhandle Saturday. Reg­
ional qualifiers are Carie 
Switser - 1st, Newswriting; 
Marsha Diamond - 1st 
Headlines; Shannon Norris - 
1st Accounting; Darren 
Pittman - 1st Informative 
Speaking; Heather Carter - 
2nd Prose; Wayne Stacy - 
2nd L.D. Debate; Jeb 
Brotherton - 3rd Informative; 
Jennifer Haynes - 3rd 
Poetry; Mindy Rendon - 3rd 
Headlines; Wayne Stacy -

3rd Literary Criticism; Jamie 
Randall - 4th Prose Alternate 
Michael Brooks - 4th L.D. 
Debate.

Finalists not advancing 
include Josh Marshall and 
Clint Parsons - 4th Cx. 
Debate; Cathy Corbitt - 5th 
Prose; Emily Graham - 5th 
Persuasive; Alan Gore - 5th 
Calculator; Greg Vandiver - 
6th Number Sense; Heather 
Husmann - 5th Poetry; Alan 
Gore - 6th Persuasive; Carie 
Switser - 6th Poetry; Toby 
Diamond and Tyler Donelson

- 5th Cx Debate; Sue Baeza 
and Teresa Presley - 6th Cx. 
Debate; Emily Graham - 5th 
Newswriting, 6th Editorial; 
Greg Vandiver - 6th Number 
Sense; Carie Switser - 6th 
Poetry; Jenny Carter - 6th 
Accounting.

Other participants include 
Chandra Jackson, Elizabeth, 
Kirkham, Tina Kirkpatrick, 
Donny Gray, Buffy Ellison, 
Irene Ramos, Lily Cano, 
Shannon Blake, Brandie 
Lavake, and Lisa White.

Middle School - Academic Meet
Stratford Middle School 

competed in the UIL 
Academic Meet in Pan­
handle on March 30th and 
31st. The Middle School 
placed 3rd In overall 
competition with 126 points. 
The 5th Grade Music 
Memory placed 3rd In 
competition. Those team 
members include Janeli 
Pronger, Dusty Palmer, 
Susan Dewees, Aaron Rob­
erts, and Hillary Frank with 
Coach Tammy Rose leading 
the team.

Placing in the 7th and 8th 
Grade Number Sense com­
petition were Sarah Graham, 
1st place, Marcus Lavake 
2nd place, and Oscar Baeza 
6th place. Michael Meil 
placed 5th In the 4th, 5th, 
and 6th division. Larry 
Norris is Number Sense.

Placing in 7th and 8th 
Grade Oral Reading were 
Kaci Wight 2nd, Stacy Reese

3rd, and Elly Rhoades 4th 
place. Barbara Haile is 
coach. Kaci Wight also 
placed 6th place in Impromp­
tu Speaking.

Placing 1st in Modern 
Oratory was Sarah Graham 
followed by Kimberly Boul- 
din who placed 6th. Terri 
Teig is coach for Impromptu 
as well as Modern Oratory. 
Cara Lavake placed 1st in the 
4th, 5th, 6th Grade Ora! 
Reading. Rinda Allison is 
coach. Wendy Palmer placed 
6th in 7th and 8th Spelling. 
Sonja Kendrick is coach.

Klm|3erly Bouldin placed 
1st in 8th Grade Science 
followed by Hollie Husmann 
who placed 6th. Science is 
coached by Mike Brownlee. 
Jim Taliaferro said he was 
pleased with the individual 
results as well as the team 
effort. Congratulations stu­
dents.

Your Right 
T o K ^ o w
By Terry Kennedy

It is good to be back home 
again! Two schools, back to 
back, took half of March 
away.

With help from the
Sheriff’s office, we are going 
around the countryside
interviewing the residents, 
and assigning them a 911 
location. It will take awhile, 
but we are learning where 
everyone lives. Finding out if 
there is a battery operated 
radio or scanner and 
flashlight is another question 
we ask. This questioning is 
to make people aware of the 
fact that it is tornado time! 
For personal safety, do not 
try to outrun a tornado in a 
car. If there is no storm 
cellar or basement, get into a 
small area in the middle of 
the house and cover your 
head.

We have several good 
videos of tornadoes and 
would be happy to show 
them to any organization at 
any time of the day or night. 
Please give us a call at 
396-2021.

The now-extinct ancestor of the 
horse eohippus, had a short neck 
and stood no higher than a medium­
sized dog.

Jennifer Haynes, Jeb Brotherton, Darren Pittman and Wayne 
Stacy.

Stacy Reese, Sarah Graham, Kaci Wight, Eiiy Rhoades, 
Wendy Paimer, Hoiiie Husmann, Marcus Lavake, Oscar 
Baeza and Kimberiy Bouidin.

Michaei Meii, Cara Lavake, Dusty Paimer, Hiiiary Frank, 
Janeii Pronger, Aaron Roberts and Susan Dewees.

Business
Directory

Call ThfiiSttatford Star 
396-5885

l u m i Moorman Mfg. Co.
Tommy R. Ames

Sales R epresentative

Will be in Stratford every Wednesday.

Phone:
806-249-4796

BOX 204
DALHART, TX 79022

THIS SPACE AVAILABLE 
Call 396-5885

Stratford A uto Electric 
Speciaiiie in Starter, Alternator & 

Magneto Repair
AUTOMOTIVE ir TRACTOR ir IRRIGATION

Check with us for traitor wiring 
Champion & Stitt Sparkplugs 

119 South Wall 396-5941

S tn ä tp in d

806-3%-5371

m  PRINTING
•  OFFICE SU PPLIES! FURNITURE
•  COMPUTER SUPPLIES

CoQfn A Fai Machin««

sswintec,
Typawntara A Calculatora

208-211 N. MAIN ST. 
STRATFORD. TEXAS 79084

All Occasion Cakes 
B yjanis Tillery

3 9 6 -2 5 0 8
Holiday Anniversary Birthday

OGLESBY 
INTERNATIONAL, INC.

PARTS & SERVICE 
EQUIPMENT SALES & LEASE

806-935-4104 - Office 
800-458-4836 - Watts

Hwy. 287 N. 
Dumas, Texas 79029

Mungia's
Heating & Air Conditioning

We  Also Do Hot Water Heater Replacement, 
Remodeling, Plumbing & Roofing

Payne396-2007 
If No Answer Cal 

396-2403 nmmielCOOiJNG^i 206 N. Main

806-396-2031  
396-2379yoorrl 'itm tnce§jKae.H T

"  SM ITH AGENCY
In s u ra n c e  

319 N. Main 
S lta t iQ £ il- lX  79084

S H A R O N  BR O W N  M ILES SMITH
Hom e 806-396-2356 Hom e 806-396-2540

dT
AMERICAN SPRAYERS 

OF STRATFORD 
Aerial Ag. Service For Farm and Ranch 

CHARLEY & VIRGINIA LAMB 
(808) 396-2036 Stratford, Texas

Elite’s
and M ’s Meet & Eat
For all your gift and floral needs

Baby & Bridal Registry
2 0 9 S. Main 396-2092

BROOKS MOTOR

COMPANY

396-2470

o

802 S. 1st

ELK PHARMACY
317 N. Main 

Stratford. T X  79084 
8tS-39fi-SS0S

We Honor . . . P.C.S. P.A.I.D. BC/BS Texas Medicaid
Gifts & Decorative Accessories •  Helium Balloons

•  UPS Shipping Center •
•  One-Day Photo Processing ^  gaby Shower Registry

V isa  and M asterCard  W elcom ed *

Airline - Cruises - Rail - Tours - Hotels - Cars

PAT JOHNSON JOAN BELL
Travel Consultant 400 E. First Travel Consultant

806-396-2243 Dumas, Texas 79029 806-396-5958
Stratford, TX 790 Stratford, TX 79084

□ m c jn FTWAY
Rig Town Selection ir Small Town friendliness 

W tia Sahcthn froien Food 
Qoo%  foods Fresh Produce

Hwy 54 lost 396-5586

Golden Spread Implement 
Com pany, Inc.

A Fresh Team for Today's Farmer
396-5520 396-55»

•  t *  l A S l f f  «  f  

y  INC. "
THEFeedyard

Since 1953  
753-4411

THIS SPACE AVAILABLE 
Call 396-5885

J’s Cut & Curl
Sun Glitzing Manicures

Perms Pedicures
We carry a com píete com píete line o f  

ISexxus hair care products for all types o f  hair 
Sat. by appointment only

Shop - 396-2520 Res. 396-2139

Stratford Grain Co. 
Stratfod 396-5541 

Lauti 769-4485

4 North Main

4 The ANen Agency

HooMi bisuranco Specialist 

302N.Moia 396-5810

North Plains 
Savings & Loan

4 0 1 N. 3rd

Stratford - 396-5534
Dumas 935 -4184  
Dalhart 249-5513

Consumers Company

396-2261

Hw y2S7!54 MORf

Brown’s Meat Locker
Custom Wholesale & Retail Meat

Federally Inspected

H u y  2 8 7  South 396-2513
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One A One-Act Play 
‘‘The House At Pooh Corner”

4-Hers Place At District Contest

The Public is Invited to see the One Act Play, “ House At Pooh Corner” , 
Thursday, April 19th at 8:00 p.m. Free Will donation, proceeds will go 
toward Speech Camp the kids will be attending.

Shane Sawyer and Trisha Tillery - 1st place winners of the 
Junior Beef Symposium at 4-H Roundup.

Trisha Tillery and Shane 
Sawyer captured First Place 
In the Junior Beef Sympos­
ium division at 4-H Round- 
Up held Saturday, March 31, 
at Frank Phillips College in 
Borger. Trisha and Shane 
will be representing Sher­
man County and District I at 
State 4-H Round-Up to be

held in June at College 
Station. Ellen Tillery served 
as coach for the team.

Saturday, April 7, nine 
Sherman County 4-Her’s 
competed in the District 4-H 
Consumer Decision Making 
Contest in Amarillo. The 
Intermediate Team of Sarah 
Graham, Kimberly Bouldin, 
Holly Hussman, and Dean 
Hauser won top awards and 
Sarah Graham was named 
Intermediate division high 
point individual. Other 
4-Her’s representing Sher­
man County at contest were 
Neal Hauser, Garrett Macias 
Scott McAlister, Finnan 
McCellan, and Kyla Hel- 
muth. Cara Dawn Macias 
served as the Consumer Life 
Skills project leader and 
prepared the 4-Her’s for the 
event.

Congratulations to these 
young people.

“ House At Pooh Comers” cast members Shannon Blake 
[Eeyore] was named to the All-Star Cast and Heather 
Husmann [Kanga] received Honorable Mention All-Star Cast 
at last week’s One Act Play Contest In Boys Ranch. Plays 
advancing to Area were Boys Ranch, West Texas High and 
Panhiandle

“ The House At Pooh 
Corner”  competed at district 
One-Act Play contest March 
27, but did not advance.

Shannon Blake, “ Eeyore” 
won an All-Star Cast award, 
and Heather Husmann, 
“ Kanga” , received an 
Honorable Mention All-Star 
Cast award.

The play will be performed 
for the public at a later date.

Other cast members

include: Aunt Rabbit , - ,, 
Charissa Bryson, EaVlV "  
Rabbit - Elizabeth Kirkham, 
Late Rabbit - Lori Blair, Roo 
- Emily Graham, Pooh - 
Jamie Randall, Owl 
Heather Carter, Piglet - 
Carle Switser, Christopher 
Robin - Josh Marshall, 
Tigger - Trisha Tillery, and 
Voice - Angie Gore. Brenda 
McClellan sponsors the play.

DRIP SYSTEMS and Accessories

For all your windbreak trees, flowers and 

vegetable gardens. Saves money, and 

water

G ill R exS lad eka^ 9 6 -2 3 7 4

COUCH 
PUMP SERUICE

• P u m p  p u l l i n g  a n d  s e t t i n g  

• R e p a i r s  on  a l l  m o k e s  o f  p u m p s  
a n d  g e a r h e o d s

American Turbine - Simmons Pump Dealer

" 2  6  V  e  a  r s  E  K  p  e  r i  e n e e "

966-5658 Days 
935-5883 Nights

2 2 0  P o p l a r  E t t e r ,  T e n a s

Need Cattle?

Call, West Texas Cattle Co. 

Bill Roberts

915 672-4906 or 673-7865
Home 676-4409

HAIL SEASON IS HERE!

Our Agency Represents
Three Major Crop Hail 

Companies

"B est Discounts Avoilable"

Call: Miles Smith 
Sharon Brown 
806-396-2031  

396-2379

Smith Agency
Stratford, Texas

Track
District Track Meet heid at Spearman on Friday April 6th 

and Saturday April 7th.
Cherisa Davis, Charissa Bryson, Sasha Browning and jolina 

Garoutte placed 2nd in the 400-Meter Relay with a time of 
52.37.

Jolina Garoutte placed 2nd in the 800-Meter Run with a 
time of 2:40.60.

Charissa Bryson placed 1st in the 100-Meter Dash with a 
time of 12.69 and Charise Davis placed 4th with a time of 
13.21.

Sasha Browning, Jolina Garoutte, Sunny Lesley and 
Cherlse Davis placed 2nd in the 800-Meter Relay with a time 
of 1:52.32.

Sunny Lesley placed 1st in the 400-Meter Dash with a time 
of 60.33 and Teresa Presley placed 4th in the 400-Meter Dash 
with a time of 63.27.

New SCHOOL RECORD set by Sunny Lesley.
Charissa Bryson placed 1st in the 200-Meter Dash with a 

time of 26.69 and Sunny Lesley placed 2nd in the 200-Meter 
Dash with a time of 27.60 and Sasha Browning placed 4th in 
the 200-Meter Dash with a time of 28.05.

Jolina Garoutte placed 5th in the High Jump with 4’8” .
Charissa Bryson placed 3rd in Long Jump with 15’07” .
Buffy Ellison placed 5th in Discus with 77’10” .

Cards of Thanks
The Stratford High School 
Rodeo Club would like to say 
“ THANK YOU” to all those 
who participated, one way or 
another, In our rodeo 
Sunday, April 1, 1990.
Parents and friends who 
gave so much of themselves 
(by working so hard!!) to put 
this rodeo on; merchants of 
Stratford who donated goods 
food, etc; JACK  GILLEY & 
TED ALLEN who so 
generously donated the ALL 
Around Cowboy & All 
Around Cowgirl belt buckles 
Lisa White for singing the 
National Anthem on such 
short notice. We really, 
appreciate all the support we 
have been given this year.

Thanks again.
Stratford High School 

RodeaClub

PS Thank you to anyone who 
boarded horses, etc. for the 
kids for their overnight 
stay!! I’m sure It was 
appreciated by them tool!

W om en’s  Health Center
Normal and high risk pregnancies 

Gynecologic cancer screening 
Breast cancer screening 

Infertility and family planning 
Menopause and hormone problems

Dr. Turhan i. B qjkon  M .  D

Specia liz ing  In

OBSTETRICS-GYNECOLOGY
201 South Bliss Monday-Friday 9a.m .-6p.m

Appointmcnis 935-6599  
Emeigcncic s 93 :~-7i7i

iawj im

The top
heating and cooling dealers 

reconmiend the 
Dual Fuel Heat Pump 

above all the rest.

Johnny Mungia 
Mungia's Htg. & A/C  

Stratford, TX

W'ith every type of heating and 
eooling system to choose from, 

the top specialists recommend the 
Dual Fuel Heat Pump to their cus­
tomers. It's electric, but works with 
gas -  making the most efficient use 
of both. As a result, you heat and 
cool more economically, dependably 
and cleaner.

Contact your nearest 
Dual Fuel Heat Pump dealer.

H e e t P w n p < r ; 0 ^ l

V
> SPS 1990
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Student Of The Week U IL  Results

TEAC-IER STJDEMT COMETS

RIMDA ALLISON H illarv  Frank Excellent student; nice nersonalitv

LYNDA HAL'SZR Olay Whppipr___________________
Is  sponsoring our Science Class to 
"adopt a manatee"

LINDA SWAIN Cara T̂ avakp._____________________
D istr ic t  1st place winner in 5th and 6th Oral 
Readine: a iov to have in class

TEKRI TEIG Ben Pignan______________________ For takine more resTXJnsibility for his actions

BARBARA HAILE Heather Zinck__________________ Doine a eood iob at diaeranming

NIKE BRa'NLSE Kimberly Bouldin______________ 1st place in UIL Science

DWAYNE PLLNK Lisa Jurado_____________________ Pleasant: smiles a lo t ,  works hard

SONJA KENDRICK Noel Baeza__________ ;___________ A au iet. coonerative student

LARRY NORRIS Olea Torres i'forks hard; quiet, always hanny
i

BETTY INGHAM Shi îping________ _̂__________ A eood c la rin et nlayer 'vdio is  wDrkine hard

, 4

MARY ALLEN STUDENTS WENT TO UIL IN PANHANDLE ON FRIDAY, 
MARCH 30TH. ALL OF THESE PARTICIPANTS WORKED VERY HARD FOR 
WEEKS IN ADVANCE IN PREPARATION FOR THIS EVENT AND THEY DID A 
WONDERFUL J O B .

STORY TELLING
Grade 2

1. Lvn^: Browning 

2 « Melissa Helton

3. Cody Hamilton 

Kaleb Lunt

STORY TELLING

FOR 'M'ry':'  OF M̂ r. iqqn

LENTIA SWAIN I.Misty Sruns___________________
’lepresented 
and w ill be

Stratford at Globe New Spelling Contest 
in UIL Sneliine Contest

BARBARA HAILE Ashley Parsons________________
First student to receive extra credit tor finding 
conparative adiactive error on a current TV catmercial

DWAYNE PLLNK Clint Craie Good student , pleasant, cheerful

Grade 3
I. Laura Norris 

? • Lori Young - 3RD PLACE

3̂  Tai Ann Brownlee

Maryssa Su tt er fie1d

Love Your 

Kids

Vote For

Ken Wight
Stratford Independent School District Trustee

M eySth

Your vote sincerely appreciated
Pd. Pol. Adv. by Ken Wight BX 1227, Stratfordf; Tex 79084

SPELLING
Grades 3-4

Lindsay Whiteside

2» J p n n i f p r  King
PERSONAL WRITING

Grades 3-4
1. Jessica Sikora - 6TH PLACE

?  •___4 t h  p l a c e

-» PICTURE MEMORY’

3. Tami Davis

Mark Meil

1ST nPLACE
3̂  Anna Montoya 

Dan Jackson

Grades 4-5 

1. Ashley Stoy

__Maggie Acevedo

___Kyi a Hplmuth

Wpnfly Cray________

He Put All His

Little Children

In Our Hands

THIS TEAM TOOK 2ND r, i „
PLACE. 5. Megan Baskin

Casey Switser

a11. _ _ _ _ _ _

Dr. Mike Flores
is proud to announce

Hie April 16th opening of ' 
his practice of Chiropractic 

in assocoation with 
Dr. IGrk A . Proffitt at the

Chiropractic Heolth Center
224 S. Bliss Dumas

For Appointment Call 935-4026

Check Our Prices on Herbicides & 
Insecticides
2,4 - D Amine 

2,4 - D Low Yol. 6 
AA Trex 
Bladex 
Dual

Landmaster BW 
Landmaster II 

Activator 
Round Up 
Lorsban

Others Also Available

Liscense Required for Purchase

$ A 9 ®

Sole Ends April 18 Furniture Fashions
APACHE CENTER DALHART, TEXAS 79022

Consumers Company
Hw y287 & 54  

396-2261
MORI fiHW®
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IT PAYS TO LO O K IN I T H E

Star
i f  For Safe i f

Now is the season for 
Crabgrass control. Come to 
The General Store. Free use 
of the spreader with 
purchase.

_________________ 3-8TFN

For Sale: 1929 Model “ A ” 
Ford “ V ic to ria ”  partia lly 
restored call 384-2261 day 
384-2242 after 6. 
________________ 3-15TFN

For Sale: Lowery Organ-llke 
new and antique piano good 
condition. Call 396-5971 day 
396-2128 after 6.
________________ 3-15TFN
For Sale: 25 ft. Travel Trailer 
Holiday Rambler-Excellent 
condition. Brand new awn­
ing full length call 396-5971 
during day 396-2128 after 6. 
________________ 3-15TFN
We now have 4 inch and 6 
inch Beaver tails and all your 
chisel points and sweeps at 
THE General Store. 
_________________ 3-29-tfn

Spring fever! Ready to 
fertilize and plant. THE 
General Store has what you 
need for lawn and garden.

3-29-tfn

Bark! Bark! THE 
Store doesn’t bite 
have tree bark.

General 
but we

3-29-tf bn
For Sale 10x16 Morgan 
building, insulated, paneling 
and carpet with air condi­
tioner and heater. $2,250.00. 
396-2118 or 396-5617.

4-^a

For Sale 1973 Dodge, club 
cab pickup. Good condition. 
Call 396-2405, ask for Ed. 
___________________4-12-c
Plano For Sale: Wanted: 
Responsible party to assume 
small monthly payments on 
piano. See locally. Call credit 
manager 1-800-447-4266.

4-19-p

James F. Haves 6  Co.
320 acres irrigated farmland. 
Priced to sell. Contact 
Buyers Exclusive Agent, 
James F. Hayes & Co. Ds. >̂d 
Davidson, Office 874-3546
Home 874-3242.

2 young red, golden 
pheasant for sale. Last 
years hatch. Day 935-6090 
Night 935-5521, ask for 
John.

4-19c

20% off New Spring 
shirts at C ’s Male Box.

knit

4-12c

Tamale Dinner, April 22, 
11:00 - 2:00 at St. Joseph’s 
Catholic Church, 515 S. 
Pearl. $5.00 adults, $2.00 
children and preschoolers 
are free. $6.00 a dozen for 
tamales.

4-19c

i f  Services if
Decorated Cakes by Janis 
Tillery. Call 396-2508.

2-1TFN

> CLASSIFIEDS
‘T H E  B E ST  S A L E SP E R SO N  A R O U N D ’

Phone 396-5885 to place your Star classHled ad

Mise, if

For Sale: two matching day 
beds, one full maple frame 
with box springs, one 10 
Speed Murray racer. Cali 
396-2857.

4-19p

DUMAS TRAVEL CENTER
For your convenience, Wd 
pow have a new 800 number 
1-800-635-8415. Call Toni or! 
call Jack Vincent at 
396-5388.
________________ 1-19-tfn
Call your Local Used Cow 
Dealer for 7 day a week dead 
Stock Removal Toll Free 
1-800-692-4043. 20 years of 
Service to the Texas 
Panhandle.
_________________9-22-tfn

For Termite Control 
Call Leo Russell 

at 1-383-7075 Amarillo. Have 
been working Stratford for 
28 years. Have City and 
State License for the City of 
Stratford.
_______________  4-24-tfn
THE General Store has 
bridal selections for Tim and 
Toni Waters with free 
delivery to the shower.
_________________  4-26C

Briidal Selections are at 
Ellle ’s for Tim and Toni 
Waters. We have free 
delivery to the shower.

____________________ 4-26C

VETERANS-needing assist­
ance In applying for 
pensions, schooling, burial 
benefits and other VA  
benefits. Call Max 
Stephenson, CSC at 396- 
5348.
___________________4-26-p
National Farm Life In­
surance Company agent for 
Stratford, Texas, Molly 
Griffin Phone 396-5612.
______________  ^7^-C
The Community Birthday 
Band Calendars are now on 
sale, if you are interested, 
contact any Band member or

We have bridal selections for 
Tim and Toni Waters. We 
deliver gifts to the shower. 
The Girls Next Door.

____________________ 4-26C

20% off dresses perfect for 
Easter at The Girls Next 
Door.

___________________ 4-12c
Remember your loved ones 
and friends at Easter time by 
giving a Memorial Gift in 
memory or In honor of them 

, to Sherman County Public 
Library Endowment Fund. 
Gifts are accepted at the 
First State Bank or Sherman 
County Public Library.

___________________4-19c

Check for your Easter gifts 
and clothing at Susanah’s In 
Kerrick.

______________  4-12c

If you need Secret Pal 
presents or Wedding Gifts, 
check at Susanah’s at 
Kerrick. We also have a new 
supply of Estate Glass. 
Tuesday we have Senior 
Citizen Lunch Specials.

4-12TFN

» .
A— rie— Opw trir 

AuociaMn

Family Vision 
Car«

Specialists

D rJ.W . McCormick 
Dr. David Riddlesporger 

OPTOMETRISTS

Special - Jeans washed, 
starched and pressed, $1.50 
each. Stratford Poly Clean. 
396-2151

______________ 11-16TFN

For your convenience we will 
be open 7 to 5 Monday thru 
Friday Including Noon hour. 
Stratford Poly Clean. 
396-2151.

_________ %_______2-1 TFN
Come by for a free Halón fire 
extinguisher demonstration. 
I’ve also got smoke detectors 
for your home. Call or come 
by Bill RIffe 396-5541. 
_________________ 3-1 TFN
For the lowest fares 
available anywhere. Call 
Joan at 396-5958 or Pat 
396-2243. Let us make your 
travel plans at no cost to you.

._________________ 3-8TFN

The Community Birthday 
Band Caiendars are now on 
saie. if you are interested, 
contact any band member or 
caii 396-2231.

M— Sri-t-lt

i f  For Rent if
Apartments for Rent: Fur­
nished 1 bedroom apartment 
All bills paid. Contact Mike 
O’Brien 396-2261 or 396- 
5656.

12-14-tfn

Apartment
396-2102.

for Rent: Call 

12-21-tfn

-k Classified Ad Rote ^

^  16* per word after 25 words 
$4.00 minimum up to 25 words 
16 cents ooch additionol word t in t  week 
8* per word on subsequent insortions 
$1.00 discount if poid in odvanco

For Rent: 1 bedroom 
furnished apartment, clean 
and neat. 6th and Fulton. 
Call Bill RIffe 396-5541 to 
look.
_________________ 2-22-tfn
House for Rent, 519 N. 
Fulton, Very Clean. Caii 
753-4430.

*
-k
k
k
k
k Deadline Noon Mondays

k
k
k
k
k
k
k

4-12 TFN

i f  BUSINESS if  
OPPORTUNITIES
M A KE  MONEY taking 
orders from friends and 
relatives for AVON. No 
intital Investment. Call Billie 
Simmons, 857-3772, Fritch, 
Tx.

5-17c

We have bridal selections at 
the Elk Pharmacy for Tim 
and Toni Waters. Give us a 
call and let us help you with 
your selections. We have 
free delivery to the shower. 
___________________ 4-26C

i wiii not be responsible for 
any debts other than my 
own.

Nancy Herring.
4-12-p

The Community Birthday 
Band Calendar’s are now on 
sale. If you are interested, 
contact any band member or 
call 396-2231.

ATTENTION: Excellent In­
come for Home Assembly 
Work. Info. Call 504-646- 
1700 Dept. P4666

_______________ 4-12p

^W ANTED ★
Want to buy. Good, sturdy 
trampoline or frame only. 
Call 396-5810 office or 
396-2393. Ask for Carolyn.

___________________ 4-12c

i f  TOGIVEAWAY if
To give away to a good 
home. Blonde male Cocker 
Spaniel, 9 mo. old. Call 
396-2411.

_______  4-19^

I

I
I

SIGNUP DEADLINE 
APRIL 16,1990

Multiple Peril I
I¡Crop Insurance!

T ^ For !

I

I

Com Milo I
♦

I
I
♦

Allen Insurance Agency
rirst State Bank Bldg. 396-5513

Catherine D, Taylor 
Certified Public Accountant

I
, North Plains Building

4 0 1 N . 3 r d  396-2435

Monday-Friday 9a.m.-5p.m.

i f  i f i f  i f  i f  i f  if 'if  Vf V f i f  i f  i f  if
if  Homes For Sale if  if  Help Wanted if

I
Dumas-935-6491

1 Eyewear Visual Analysis
C o n ta c t L en ses  
and  S up p lie s

Dr. McCormick wiM be in the Stratford Office:

Thursday, Apr. 12th A  26th 935-6491

r Office Hours: 10:30 to 4:00 396-5516

Williams Repair Service 
Phone 3 9 6 -5 3 3 0  or 2429  

Ditching & Backhoe Work 

Plumbing & Supplies

Eddie Willioms Res. 396-5330

For Sale: 3 bedroom house 
on 3 lots with shed. $16,500. 
Call after 6:00 p.m. 
396-2042.

___________  ^ p

2 bedroom house for sale, 
$12,000.00 Call 396-2042. 
___________________4-19-p

2 bedroom trailer house 
(needs work) on 2 lots. 
$3,500.00 call 396-2042. 
___________________4-19-p
House For Sale: 3 Bdrm, 2 
bath. Brick, Central Heat 
& Air-assumable note, low 
equity 1308 Putnam 396- 
5660.

4-19-p

C O N S U M E R
P R E F E R R E DIh*■ Service,

Qua/itv & Fair Va/u
F amily restaurant

Headquartérs 
Restaurant

Fish Fry Friday Night
Sunday Buffet 
Orders To Go

396-2120
Tues.-Sat. 6 AM-9 PM 

Sun. 6 AM-2 PM

FEATURED ON YOUR 
■WHITE & GREEN PHONEi 

BOOK COVER

ATTENTION-HIRING!
Government jobs-your area. 
Many immediate openings 
without waiting list or test. 
$17,840-$69,485. Call 1-602- 
838-8885, Ext. R17671. 
_______  4-26-p
ATTENTION: EARN
MONEY TYPING AT HOME
32,000/yr Income potential. 
Details, (1) 602-838-8885
Ext. T- 17671.

__________ 4-26-p

HELP WANTED

Experienced irrigation water 
well servicemen roughneck. 
Call Dalhart Butane 249 
4585.
___________________4-12-c

•Church organist, Sunday 
a.m.& p.m. duties with 
occasional week day duties. 
Salary negotiable. Call 
249-4143 after 6:00 p.m.

___________________ 4-19c

Secretarial position open. 
Contact Jack Barton 
396-2270, an EOE Employer.

4-19c

Stratford 
Appliance Repair

Repairs to Electric and 
Gas Ranges, Refrigerators, 
Freezers, Washers and 
Dryers.

W AYNE MERRILL
396-2129_____

No. 874 
BILL COX

WamMpful Master
ThÍMiTliandoy 

8p.in.

P. O. BOX 779 

212 N. POPLAR 

STRATFORD.TEX AS 79004 

(006) 396-5665

n>an J 4 . J iovin ^ , 2).2) .^
GENERAL DENTISTRY
HOME: (806) 381-22 1 2

S'.
G EN ERA L DEN T ISTRY

HOME: (806) 935-9086

2 1 2 S. BLISS 
DUMAS.TEXAS 79029 (006) 935*921 2

c R e, m  J 1  a n  ä C o .
710 S. Dumas Ave. 

935-7364
287

ms
Prime business location Hwy 54 and Hwy 
intersection, if you need location with large showroom̂  
and storage—work rooms—and high number
traffIc-This is It! Call for details.
Vary nlca-3 BR brick. Jir^PjJ««* 
bath^merrfanca-coverqtf patio. $88,800.00
New listing, 3 bedroom. LARGE garage, corner lot,
$39,900.

' 1,840 acres grass, located north of Clayton. Offered in 
cooperation with New Mexico Real Estate Broker. Call
Pat or Tom.

Marty Bain 
396-2053 Tom Ferguson, Broker

Pat Johnson 
396-2243


