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Voters Can Begin Casting Absentee Ballots 
Wed. Feb. 21 ,1990
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Voters Can Begin Casting 
Absentee Baiiots Wed. Feb.
21,1990 at the County Clerks 
office between the hours of 
8:00 a.m. until 5:00 during 
the regular office hours.

Voters in Sherman County 
can begin casting absentee 
ballots for upcoming primary 
races on Wednesday. Absen­
tee baiiots can be cast in two 
ways. Any eligible voter can 
vote by personal appearance 
Voters meeting certain 
requirements may cast their 
ballots by mail.

Solid Waste 
Discussed 
At City
Council
Meeting
I Stratford City Council met 
in regular session, Thursday 
Feb. 15, 1990 at 7:30 p.m. 
w ith Mayor Doug Reese 
presiding and the following 
Council members present: 
Wanda Riffe, Claude Harlow 
R.J. Hill, Wayne Merrill and 
Ronnie Pickens, City Attor­
ney, Kyle Lewis was Also 
present.

M inutes of the last 
meeting were read and 
approved as read.

Doug Reese, representing 
Southern Union Gas Co., 
met with Council to request 
renewing the ir franchise 
with the City for twenty-five 
(25) years. Wayne made a 
motion and R.J. second to 
renew Southern Union Gas 
Co. franchise for twenty-five 
(25) years. Motion carried.

P.J. Pronger met w ith 
Council to request permis­
sion to apply for a federal 
grant In the City’s name. 
Wanda made a motion and 
R.J. second to grant the 
request as long as there is no 
liability or cost to the City. 
Motion carried.

R.J. made a motion and 
Ronnie second to appoint 
Karen Perrin as presiding 
Judge, Valerie McAlister as 
Alternate Judge and Donita 
Robertson, Keri Knight and-. 
Shari Hudson as counters for 
the City Election May 5, 
1990. Motion carried.

Solid waste was discussed. 
Wayland is to get more 
Information on closing the 
landfill and specs for a trash 
truck. Sherman Co. judge. 
Bill Fesler, was in attend­
ance.

Council was in agreement 
to let bids for seal coat. 
Council also agreed to 
purchase one pager for the 
utility department.

Financial statements were 
reviewed. Wanda made a 
motion and R.J. second to 
approve the financial state­
ments. Motion carried.

City bills were reviewed 
for payment. Ronnie made a 
motion and Wayne second to 
pay all bills. Motion carried.

A motion was made to 
adjourn, motion carried, 
meeting adjourned.

To cast a ballot by 
personal appearance, voters 
must show the ir voter 
registraion card. To vote by 
mail, an individual must 
have an application mailed in 
to the County Clerk by the 
close of business on March 
6. Mail voting applications 
may be obtained by 
contacting the County Clerks 
office.

Also, voters must meet 
one of the following criteria 
to cast ballots by mall: be 
more than 65 years old, have 
a religious belief that keeps 
them from voting on election 
day, be disabled or expected 
to be absent from the ir 
voting county during the 
period allowed for voting by 
personal appearance.

Landfill Issues And 
Regulations Discussed

On this the 12th day of 
February, 1990 the Commis­
sioners Court of Sherman 
County convened in Regular 
session being open to the 
public, at the regular 
meeting place In the 
Courthouse in Stratford, 
Texas, with the following 
members of the court 
present: W.C. Fesler, 
Wayne Cummings, Boyd 
Spurlock, Dale Hamilton, 
Darrell Cotney, and M.L. 
Albert. Absent none. The 
follow ing elected offic ia ls 
were also present: Letha 
Batis, Jack Barton, Jack 
Halle and Linda Keener. The 
above constituting a quorum 
the fo llow ing proceedings
w ere had  to «.i**

Motion was made and 
seconded that the minutes of 
the previous meeting be 
approved as read. All ayes. 
Motion carried.

Motion was made and 
seconded that the monthly 
reports of all elected off leal 
be approved. A ll ayes. 
Motion carried.

Motion was made and 
seconded that the monthly 
b ills  be examined and 
approved for payment. All 
ayes. Motion carried.

The following bids were 
received and opened for a 
vehicle for the S heriff’ s 
Dept.: Edwards Chrysler- 
Plymouth-Dodge, 1990 Dod­
ge Ramcharger $17,884.00. 
Plains Chevrolet, Silverado 
1990 Chevrolet Blazer 
$18,147.63. and a Scottsdale 
1990 Chevrolet Blazer 
$17,033.66.

Duncan Chevrolet 1990 
Chevrolet, $18,300.00, John 
Chandler Ford, 1990 Ford 
Bronco 4 X 4  $17,381.00 
Moore Implement Co. 1990 
GMC Jimmy $18,479.76 and 
1989 SLE Jimmy $19,276.06. 
Frontier Dodge 1990 Ram­
charger $20,060.00 and a 
1989 Ramcharger $17,600.00 
less $2,000 rebate 
$15,600.00

Motion was made and 
seconded to accept the bid of 
Edwards Chry-Ply-Dodge- 
Jeep Eagle, Inc. for a 1990 
Dodge Ramcharger at a cost 
of $17,884.00. Commissio­
ners Cummings, Spurlock, 
Hamilton and Judge Fesler 
Ayes. Commissioner Cotney

Meeting was recessed for 
lunch at 12:00 noon.

Scott Buckles representing 
the Hospital District met 
with the court to discuss the 
dispatcher salaries. No 
action taken.

W.D. Brannan met with 
the Court to discuss use of 
the County maintainers to

clear snow from the 
ambulance build ing and 
clinic. Commissioner Cotney 
stated that Precinct 4 had 
been clearing snow at these 
locations and would continue 
to do so.

P.J. Pronger met with the 
court to request a new 
projection screen for the 
County Barn. Motion was 
made and seconded to buy a 
new projection screen for 
$600.00 All ayes. Motion 
carried.

Kevin Glovier met with

»,

I

Robert Williams trys for 2 points against Vega, Saturday in a 
Practice Game player here. Score for this game Stratford 36 
and Vega 52. Another practice game was played against 
Adrian at-Boys Ranch Monday, Fob. 19 Stratford 70 and 
Adrian 58. Friday, Fob. 23rd the Elks play Quanah at Randall 
High School at 8:00 p.m. in a Bi-District Game.

Teachers Contracts Reviewed
The Stratford Independent 

School Board met In Regular 
session on Feb. 8, at 7:00 
p.m. The Board approved 
the minutes of the previous 
meeting and reviewed and 
paid the bills for February.
, In other business the 

Board nominated three 
people to serve on the

appraisal review board. They 
are Gary Hudson, W .E. 
(Bill) Cummings and Billy 
Bell.

The Board approved the 
selling of two old busses at 
bus auction to be held In 
Abilene In May. The board 
also set Back to School Week 
as March 5-9. Open House at

all schools w ill be on 
Tuesday night, March 6 from 
7:00 until 9:00 p.m.

Superintendent Bass gave 
reports on the meeting he 
attended in Austin during 
January, reported that tax 
collections were at approxi­
mately 96% collected for the 
year, and reported on the
January basketball tourna­
ment.

Absentee by personal 
appearance begins Feb. 21, 
1990 until March 9, 1990. 
Sherman County Voters with 
questions about voting may 
call the office of County 
Clerk, Mary Lou A lbert 
(Shorty) at 396-2371. Elec­
tion day for Primary is 
March 13th. Please remem- 
er to vote.

the court to discuss handicap 
access to the Courthouse. 
Motion was made and 
seconded to engage Kevin 
Glovier and Assoc, to finalize 
and submit plans for 
handicap access to the state 
for approval. A ll ayes. 
Motion carried.

Richard M. Glascy, West 
Texas Area Manager for 
AGC of Texas met with the 
court to discuss Landfill 
issues and regulations.

Sherman County Person­
nel Policy was discussed. 
Motion was made and 
seconded to add an employ­
ment agreement to the 
County personnel policy. All 
ayes. Motion carried.

Motion was made and 
seconded that the
grievance committee consist 
of the following people: H.D.
Lunt, Priscilia  Fleming, 
Sheriff Jack Haile, Tax 
Assessor/Collector Zelda 
Pickens, Treasurer Linda 
Keener, County Clerk M.L. 
A lbert, County Attorney 
Jack Barton.

The court recessed and 
went Into executive session 
at 4:25 p.m. Executive 
session was electronically 
recorded. Executive session 
was adjourned at 4:45 p.m. 
The public meeting was 
reconvened and announced 
that no action was taken in 
the preceding executive 
session. The court was 
adjourned at 4:48 p.m.

M.H. Brown 
Seeks Your 
Support

M.H. Brown
I take this means to 

announce my intentions to 
run as an Independent 
Candidate for Commissioner 
Precinct 4, Sherman County.

The people of Stratford 
and Sherman County have 
always come through for my 
family in good or bad times, 
for which I can never repay.

As a taxpayer the main 
issue is the spending of your 
tax dollars effectivelv and 
to ail taxpayers, to maintain 
and improve the county, and 
to abide by the rules and 
regulations of the County, 
State and Federal govern­
ment.

It would be a great honor 
to serve you as your 
commissioner. Your support 
and vote for M.H. Brown In 
the General Election Novem­
ber 6th w ill be valued 
gratefully.

Paid Pol. Adv. Paid for by 
M .H . Brown, Sherman 
County, Texas.

Suspects Crash After 
High-speed Chase

" f f e

Editors Note:
Taken from The Amarillo 

Globe News.

Boise City, Okla.
Boise City, Okla.-Two men

in a stolen vehicle were 
Involved In a car accident 
Tuesday afternoon following 
a high-speed chase with 
police, a spokeswoman with 
the Oklahoma Highway 
Patrol said.

According to reports, two 
20-year olds one from 
Council, Bluffs, Iowa, and 
another from Grand Junc­
tion, Mich., were fleeing 
north on U.S. 287 in a 1985 
Ford Mustang.

Stratford, Texas law 
enforcement authorities pur­
sued the pair at speeds in 
excess of 140 miles per hour, 
the report said. ___

STRATFORD
VS

QUANAH 
Feb. 23 
8 p.m.

At Randall High School 
Amarillo 
GO ELKS

In other business the 
Board reviewed the contracts 
of Jim Taliaferro, Middle 
School Principal; Steve 
Haynes, Elementary Princi­
pal Delvin Howard, Assist­
ant High School Principal; 
and Dwayne Gray, Athletic 
Director.

The Board adjourned at 
10:30 p.m.

The Mustang crossed Into 
Oklahoma with the Texas 
units still in pursuit, the 
spokeswoman said.

About 20 miles south of 
Boise City, the Mustang 
attempted to pass a 
northbound 1989 Volvo 
truck, driven by James E. 
Braden, 41 of Commerce 
City, Colo. The Mustang, 
which had attempted to pass 
In the right side ditch, struck 
the trailer of the Volvo and 
traveled 600 feet before 
stopping on the east side of 
the roadway. It sustained 
major damage, the report 
said.

Both suspects were taken 
into custody without further 
Incident, the report said. The 
accident occurered at about 3 
p.m.

Preschool 
Screening 
To Be Held

The Stratford Independent 
School District will conduct 
its annual preschool screen­
ing on March 2 (Friday) In 
the Mary Allen Elementary 
School. The hours will be 
from 9:00 a.m. until 1:00 
p.m. All residents of The 
Stratford Independent 
School District are encourag­
ed to participate. If you know 
of any children ages 3-5

NOTICE
The U.S. Census Bureau is 

still taking applications for 
temporary work. The census 
work will last between two 
and eight weeks for most 
workers.

Applicants must be 18 
years old or over, a U.S. 
Citizen. You must bring your 
original Social Security card, 
a valid drivers license and 
take a written test. Veterans 
with discharge papers will 
receive Veterans preference. 
Those wishing to apply may 
go to St. Joseph’s Catholic 
Church Activity center every 
Monday at 10:30 a.m.

NOTICE

The Stratford Hospital 
District election is scheduled 
for May 5th. If you are 
interested in running for 
Hospital Board, the filing 
dates are March 6th through 
April 5th.

NOTICE

The deadline for filing 
for a place on the Stratford 
Independent Schoolboard is 
March 21, 1990 with filing 
beginning on Feb. 19, 1990. 
Forms to file for a position on 
the Schoolboard may be 
obtained at the Superintend­
ent’s office at the school. 
Doug McBryde and Steve

be Jerry Dyess, Jack 
Rhoades, Margaret Reed, 
Linda Spurlock and Rick 
Relnart.

NOTICE

Monday, Feb. 19 Is the 
First day you may sign up to 
run for City Councilman. 
Last day is March 21st.

NOTICE

QUARTERLY BREAKFAST 
EVERYONE WELCOME 

“ DUTCH TREAT” 
Tues: Feb. 27,1990 
M ’s Meet and Eat 

Program: Solid Waste” 
Learn more about Stratford 

and Sherman Countys 
“Trash and Solid Waste 

Sponsored by: 
Chamber of Commerce 

7 A.M.

NOTICE

Order your Stratford 
School year books. Feb. 12, 
thru March 23, 1990. Price 
$22.00.

NOTICE

February Dance 
at

SCOT HALL 
Sat. Feb. 24th 
8p.m.-11 p.m.

Music Provided by 
Dennis Howley 

of
Trinidad, Colo.

Adults are invited 
Admission $4.00 each

NOTICE

STORY TIME AT 
SHERMAN COUNTY 

LIBRARY 
3-4 year old 

EACH WEDNESDAY 
11 a.m .-12 noon

years of age please inform 
the ir parents of this 
screening opportunity.

The DIAL-L (Developmen­
tal Indicators for the 
Assessment of Learning, 
Revised) w ill be the 
Instrument used. The DIAL- 
L Is an untImed, team 
administered. Individual as-

Cont. On Page 2
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Legal Notice
REQUEST FOR BIDS ON 

TEXAS HIGHWAY 
CONSTRUCTION

Sealed proposals for .047 
miles of preventive mainte­
nance on various structures 
on US 87, FM 296, FM 1727, 
FM 808, FM 807, FM 1879, 
SH 354, US 385, US 54, FM 
767, RM 3296, FM 998, US 
287, FM 119, FM 1913, FM 
1060, FM2232 & FM 2677 In 
Dallam, Hartley, Moore and 
Sherman Counties covered 
by CPM 40-1-26, CPM
40- 3-41, CPM 790-1-17, 
CPM 794-1-11, CPM 1141-1- 
18, CPM 1141-1-17, CPM 
1141-1-16, CPM, 1141-2-12, 
CPM 1141-2-13, CPM 1142-t
12, CPM 1811-1-6, CPM
41- 3-14, CPM 41-3-15, CPM 
41-3-16, CPM 226-1-6, 
CPM 238-1-18, CPM 238-1- 
17, CPM 238-2-24. CPM 
1108-1-13, CPM 1108-1-14, 
CPM 1108-2-6, CPM 1622-2-
13, CPM 66-4-45, CPM 
66-4-49, CPM 66-4-48, CPM 
66-4-46, CPM 66-4-47, CPM 
66-4-44, CPM 66-5-42, CPM 
66-5-43, CPM 66-5-46, CPM 
66-5-48, CPM 66-5-41, CPM 
66-5-44, CPM 66-5-47, CPM 
66-5-45, CPM, CPM 727-1- 
22, CPM 1244-2-14, CPM 
66-3-27, CPM 66-3-28, CPM 
238-5-24, CPM 727-2-10, 
CPM 727-2-9. CPM 1244-3-7 
CPM 2222-2-5,CPM 2803-1- 
5 & CPM 2803-1-6 will be 
received at the State 
Department of Highways 
and Public Transportation, 
Austin, until 1:00 p.m., 
March 6, 1990 and then 
publicly opened and read.

Plans and specifications 
including minimum wage 
rates as provided by Law are 
avaiiable for inspection at 
the office of Henry L. 
Gallegiy Resident Engineer, 
Dai hart, Texas, and at the 
State Department of High­
ways and Public Transporta­
tion, Austin, Texas. Bidding 
proposals are to be request­
ed from the Construction 
Division, D.C. Greer State 
Highway Building, 11th and 
Brazos Streets, Austin, 
Texas 78701. Plans are 
clal printers in Austiny 
Texas, at the expense of the 
bidder.

Usual rights reserved.
Published in The Stratford 

Star Thursday, February 22, 
1990 and Thursday, March 
1, 1990.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS

NOTICE IS HEREBY 
GIVEN that original Letters 
Testamentary for the Estate 
of Lola Eggers, deceased, 
also known as LOLA 
SELCHAN, also known as 
LOLA WARD, were issued 
on the 16th day of February, 
1990, in Docket No. 1833, 
pending in the County Court 
of Sherman County, Texas, 
to MARY LOVETT.

The residence of the 
Executrix is In Sherman 
County, Texas. The post 
office address is:
* C /0  Homer A. Davis

Davis & Cunningham 
P.O. Box 1110 

Dalhart, Tex. 79022

All persons having claims 
against this Estate which is 
currently being administered 
are required to present them 
within the time and in the 
manner prescribed by law. 
DATED the 16th day of 

Feb. 1990.

DAVIS & CUNNINGHAM 
P.O. Box 1110 

Dalhart, Texas 79022 
806-249-6402

By Homer A. Davis 
Attorneys for the Estate

Published in The Stratford 
Star, Thursday, February 22, 
1990.

Need help out on the road? 
l-SOO-525-5555

Second Class postage paid at Stratford, Texas, 
79084. ^bscrlp tlon  rates are $13.00 per year In 
Sherman and adjoining comtles; all other $20.00 
per year.

Martha Robertson 
Janis Tillery 
Sharon McCarver 
Shari Hudson

T U

Editor &  Publisher 
Darkroom & Advertising 
Darkroom & Advertising 

Bookkeeper
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Thursday, Feb. 22
Monday, Feb. 26

9:30 a.m. Fit for Life
1:30 p.m. Fit For Life
5:00 p.m. Fit For Life

Friday, Feb. 23

Scot Ceramics
Scot Quilting

End of 4th 6th weeks

Sunday, Feb. 25

Scot Ceramics 
Scot Quilting & 
Dance Practice

Tuesday, Feb. 27

PRAISE GOD!
Full Moon

Scot Games' 
SouthsideHDClub

Wednesday, Feb. 28_____

ASH WEDNESDAY
Scot Ceramics 
Scot Quilting. 

FCL Training-Amariilo,

S ftattBTBtodeBdtar...1

A message from this newspaper and the 
Texas Department of Public Safety

LETTERS TO THE EDITOR 
POLICY FOR PUBLICA­
TION: All letters will be 
accepted, provided they are 
not anonymous and a 
bonafide address Is given. 
We will not print statements 
that are obscene or libelous 
per se. This paper assumes 
no responsibility for content 
and all views are strictly the 
views of the writer. Copies of 
letters which have been 
submitted to other newpa- 
pers will receive a low 
priority for publication. The 
newspaper reserves the right 
to edit ietters with respect to 
length or potentially libelous 
material.

Dear Readers:

The fourth grade social 
studies classes of Edgewood 
Elementary are studying the 
geography of Texas. To 
make this study come alive 
and have more meaning, 
please send us a picture 
postcard of geographical 
interest from your area of 
Texas.

Evelyn Stewart 
Edgewood Elementary 

Fourth Grade 
P.O. Box 6 

Edgewood, Texas 75117

Cont. From Page 1
sessment of motoric, con­
ceptual, and language skills 
for children ages three to 
five years old. (The 
approximate time for each 
child is 40 to 50 minutes. 
Please be advised that this 
time varies with the age and 
responsiveness of the indi­
vidual child.)

A vision and hearing 
screen will also be provided 
for all children. We feel this 
is a beneficial service for the 
preschool population (ages 
3-5 years) and their parents 
or guardians. We encourage 
your participation in the 
program.

If you have any questions 
concerning the preschool 
assessment program please 
contact Chris McAdams, 
DIAL-L Coordinator; or 
Steve Haynes, Elementary 
Principal at 396-5305.

Mark March 2 (Friday) on 
your calendars for the 
DIAL-L Preschool Screen. 
We will look forward to 
serving you and your child.

One Mans Vision 
Became A Reality

The squid escapes from his enemies
hitcf enemy^s'tace.* ¿ea^fVflTj^t' 
enemy in the dark, the squid maíces 
his getaway.

Four years ago Judge Bill 
Sheehan attended a Judicial 
conference in Corpus ChristI 
Texas & returned to his 69th 
district with a vision. He had 
learned of a program 
designed to help children 
through court procedures- 
humanely and expeditiously. 
The Judge was anxious to 
implement this type of plan 
within his district. His vision 
became reality as he worked 
with community leaders to 
create the first, and to date, 
the only rural CASA 
program of 366 nationwide 
organizations. CASA stands 
for Court Appointed Special 
Advocate and is a plan 
providing trained community 
volunters to serve as 
advocates for children whose 
home placement is being 
decided by a court. These 
young people have usually 
been removed from their 
natural homes and placed in- 
foster homes. The CASA 
volunteer fills a gap in our 
Judical system by giving 
support to a frightened child 
and providing additional 
Information to the court.

The stress of day to day 
living Is difficult for some 
parents .to handle. All too .. 

r^ r^qen tjy  tneir frustrations ^ 
are vented upon the ir 
children. Neglect and or 
abuse verbal, physical or
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Roger Gower Automotive
Specializing In 

Automatic Transmissions

Foreign and Domestic Four Wheel Drive

fron t Wheel Drive

RV's
A ll Makes and Models 

1 Year Warranty
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^  Law Office Of Strafford
4  New office hours 220 North Main
O  Jack Barton, Attorney
4  Downtown Stratford office win be open 
^  9:00 am to 1:00 pm
^  Monday through Friday except Holidays.

^  By appointment, anytime. Just call396-5874
Ooen thru the noon hour for vour eonvonionre.

TOYODB
m E a T i n i « .

I f  your wheat needs more nitrogen, 
now's the time to put it on. Wheat and 
other small grains need nitrogen after 
win ter dormancy to se t deep, s trong ' 
roots. Topdressing nitrogen now will 
increase your yield and lower your cost 

per bushel, because the nitrogen goes directly into boosting 
grain production. For complete details, stop by or give us a 
call. When it comes to Keeping Crops Profitable, we're 
ready to help now.

Owners
Roger & Wanda Gower

27 years Experience 
Toll Free Number 
1-800-825-5813

SHERMAN COUNTY
I 3 M

GRAIN CO.

sexual-often result. Child- 
abuse is a complex problem 
in our society today-in Rural: 
america as well as in our 
cities. Judge Sheehan was 
familiar with the complexi­
ties of child abuse problems 
and was also concerned that 
courtroom decisions were 
being made with inadequate 
information and without total 
regard for the best interests 
of the child. CASA 69, Inc. 
was created from the 
Judge’s concern for abused 
children and encompasses 
his Judicial D istrict of 
Dallam, Hartley, Moore and 
Sherman Counties. It is a 
non-profit organization that 
operates on private contribu­
tions, funding from Its four 
county commissioners courts 
and State and Federal 
grants. Since its inception in 
1985, it has served 92 
children. CASA is officed In 
the Dallam courthouse and 
has a part-tim e director, 
Stacey Urbanczyk, who helps 
recruit, train, and supervise 
the volunteers. There are 21 
active volunteers at this time 
and 14 who recently 
completed training.

A CASA volunteer is 
appointed to a court case by  ̂
tjhe presiding Judge. The 
role of these unpaid workers 
is many-sided: To assess 
progress through Interviews 
w ith the child, natural 
parents, foster parents and 
all concerned parties; to 
keep abreast of developing 
problems: To attend court 
proceedings dealing with the 
case; to submit an assess­
ment and recommendation 
to the court concerning 
permanent home placement 
for the child; to help the 
child through a frightening 
and confusing ordeal by 
explaining the court process 
to the youth and interpreting 
the young person’s needs 
and interests to the court. 
Case workers, foster parents 
attorneys and judges may 
change over time, but the 
CASA volunteer remains a 
constant for the youth 
throughout the duration of 
his or her stay in the court 
system.

The primary goal of CASA 
69, Inc. is that a child’s right 
to a safe, permanent home* 
is acted on by the court in a 
sensitive and expedient 
manner. CASA is working 
toward this goal “ one child 
at a time’ ’ . What does Judge 
Sheehan say today about his 
vision? “ Few things in life 
live up to our expectations, 
but CASA has exceeded my 
expectations.’ ’

There will be a dinner 
honoring the 69th district 
Judge on Friday, March 9, 
1990 at the Moore County 
Community Building. When , 
his staff broached the 
subject of a public acknow- I 
lodgement of his career and 
retirement, the Judge finally 
agreed with one condition: 
That ail money above the 
cost of the meal be 
contributed to CASA 69. 
Judge B ill Sheehan is 
retiring this spring, but the 
work of CASA will continue a 
living, working memorial to 
one man’s vision.

ÎLARRY JONESe

i P . O .  B o x  4 8 5 =
i T E X H O M A ,  T E X A S  7 3 9 4 9 :

: ( 8 0 6 ) 8 2 7 - 7 6 3 1  =

1717 S. Bliss Dum as, Texas 9 35 -7252 The residents of Alaska move from |  
one home to another more often |  
than residents of any other state.  ̂ I
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SCOT Notes
b y  T i m m i e  B r o w n

Happy day to you 
Sherman County Older 
Texans, Friends, Neighbors 
and Scatters this overcast 
Monday A.M. Feb. 19,1990. 
The temperature is about 27 
degrees F., humidity 73%, 
wind 12 m.p.h. Chilly for 
Senior Citizens.

Special Scot events this 
week included Scot Dinner, 
Thurs. Feb. 22 at noon. 
Hosts are Baskin, Betty, 
Timmie Brown, Jack Dettle, 
Opal Bryant, Sue Smith, 
Bessie Palmer, Bob Burgess 
and Levi Worley. Special 
guests are Judge David 
Lewis and Louis Dubuque 
who w ill be speaking 
po litica lly . Sue and Gary 
Hudson will bring special 
music. ALL Scatters will be 
on hand, bringing cheery 
greetings, interesting con­
versation exchange, AND 
delicious food. We expect 
and hope to see a goodly 
group from Coldwater Man­
or as well as other Scatters.

On Sat. Feb. 24, 1990 at 
Scot Hall, Scot Dancers will 
host surrounding area dan­
cers. Music will be furnished 
by Mr. Hawley playing 
dinner music on the organ.

Enjoying games Fri. 
Evening at Scot Hall were 
Ass’t director Dorothy Rob­
bins, Lillie Galloway, Dicy 
Stephenson, Gladys Arnold, 
Corda Pleyer, Jewel Dovel, 
Opal Bryant, Clarence W ill- 
man, Rowena W illiam s, 
Geneva Bell and Timmie 
Brown.

Corda Pleyers guest Feb. 
13 were Ethel Alley and 
Edith Stanfors, Niles, Ks. 
B illie  and Dayle Terre ll 
Dumas, Bertha Oquin and 
Timmie Brown.

Ora Reynolds reports that 
former Sherman County 
Older Texan, Freda Dortch is 
is now a guest at Lindale 
Nursing Center, 215 Mar- 
great, Lindale, Tex. 75771. 
Freda’s, son Richard et al, 
and daughter Doris et al live 
in Lyndale. Ora is improving 
health wise each day.'* ’

M r. and M rs.'"D avid  
Henderson & Tashea wel­
comed little Miss Chanel 
Tana’ into their family Jan. 
30, 1990. She weighed 8 lbs. 
9 ozs. Grandparents are Mr. 
and Mrs. John Henderson, 
Stratford & Mr. and Mrs. 
Jim Barnes, Guymon, Ok. 
Paternal great grandmother 
is Mrs. Maurine Henderson 
D im m itt; Maternal great 
grand parents are Mr. and 
Mrs. Herman Ralstin, Guy­
mon, Ok..

Mildred Ottinger, former 
Stratford citizen and teacher, 
is living in Eldorado, Ks. 
quite near her son. Greg 
W right owns M ildreds 
former home.

Former S tratfordites 
Chas. and Dorthea (Beall) 
Riggs live in Denver. Chas is 
very ill. We understand the 
Riggs are members of 
Eastern Star here.

Sunday Feb. 17 dinner 
guests with the H.L. Halles 
were Alan, Patty, Nathan,

Marc and Christian Lorel 
Haile, Friona; Loreiyn and 
Joy Powers; Dorothy Haile. 
“ Chris”  was introduced to 
relative and friends at the 
Baptist Chruch. Loreiyn will 
undergo eye surgery Wed. 
Feb. 21st.

Maurine Plunk and Mae 
Williams were in Amarillo. 
While there they attended to 
some business for World 
War I veteran Sid Anthus, 
uncle of the late B ill 
Berkstresser.

Betty Lu O’Brien enter­
tained the “ Smith related 
singles” , Mary Peach Smith, 
Jack Smith, Wayland Green 
and Tommy Brown at a 
Valentine luncheon.

Welcome to the Minister 
of Church of Christ John, 
Betty and Joel Wearden 
from S.C.O.T., Scotters and 
writer Timmie Brown.

John Bass, graduate of 
S.H.S. ten years ago has 
been elected Supt. of Schools 
at Mart, Texas. Mart is a 
large 2A school near Waco, 
Texas. S.C.O.T,s and per­
sonal congratulation to John 
and his parents Supt. E.L. 
and Johnetta Bass.

Others to whom the 
S.C.O.T. and personal con­
gratulation are sent as 
Scotters Ruby McNeal and 
Pauline M artin , a real 
sweetheart and to Stratford’s 
“ rising-star”  Christi Blake. 
Our “ luv”  and best wishes 
to ail.

All Stratfordites send love 
and a wish for happiness 
with Jim and Hazel Webb as 
they leave Stratford for their 
new home in Canyon, Tex.

Scotters wish to express 
an interest in & appreciation 
for the reports of S.A.F.E.

Hi way survey. The areas of 
community concern covered 
by these reports are of vital 
importance to every citizen.

The Boise City dancers 
hosted an area-wide benefit- 
dance for 14 years old Teri 
Kelly, Keyes, Ok. who is to 
undergo Kidney liver trans­
plant surgery soon. The 
Keys Gamblers furnished 
the music. Attending this 
heart warming event were 
from Stratford the R.J. Hills, 
the Baskin Browns, the 
Warren Miilers, The Arthur 
Judds, the Jack Gores, Joyce 
Brooks and Norman Mal- 
comb.

At the pre-nuptiai party 
honoring Laura Lee Tharp 
and Brian Kendricks, among 
the guest we were fortunate 
to meet were Mr. and Mrs. 
Chas R. Tharp, Las Cruces, 
New Mex. parents of Laura 
Lee. Others we met were 
Craig Kendrick, Lubbock; 
Nell Ingham, 1310 Smiley 
Amarillo (Nell and Jim have 
lately moved to Amarillo) 
Barbara (DeBord) Hudson 
and daughter Stacey) Ethel 
DeBord and daughter Uvette 
Coom; all of Amarillo; Ann 
Pendleton and guest, Roy 
Jones, Bryan, Tex (?);Lynda 
(Sutton) Hauser who told us 
that construction workers are 
busy restoring their house 
which was damaged by fire 
during the holidays.

The Bill Riffe’s hospitable 
home, where this event was 
hosted, overflowed with 
guests bringing best wishes 
and love to Brian and Laura 
Lee who will be married 
March 17, 1990.

At the Sherman County 
Depot Museum on Friday, 
Feb. 16, 1990 this writer had 
a “ Ball” ! The building was 
warm and well lighted and 
firs t off we viewed the 
displays. W hile enjoying

M’s Meet & Eat 
Closed Friday 

Feb. 23rd fo r Remodeling 
New Hours 

8:00  ■  ■  8:00 
Beginning Mon. Feb. 26th 

Featuring
Lunch & Dinner Specials 

Mexican Food 
Pizza 

and
Steaks a fte r 6:00 

Friday Night Mexican B uffe t

6 : 0 0 -  8 : 0 0

We have added a Private Dining Room 
 ̂ for meetings and parties.
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Proof For THE 1990's....
PROVEN LEADERSHIP....
WAYLAND BROWN has proven, through his service in state and 
local positions that he has what it takes to do the ¡oh and do it right!

★ PROVEN C H A R A aE R ....
WAYLAND BROWN has proven through his day to day actions that 
he has a solid foundation and mature judgment.

^PROVEN COMMITMENT.. . .
WAYLAND BROWN has proven that making a commitment is not 
always easy hut once made, he completes the task.

i r  PROVEN CONCERN.. . .
WAYLAND BROWN has proven his concern for the taxpayers of 
Stratford and Sherman County and pledges to continue to save tax 
dollars where possible and to spend wisely when required to do so.

Wayland
FOR

Brown County Commissioner
Precinct 2

Pd. Pol. Ad., Pd for by Wayland Brown, 
P.O.Box 7, Stratford,TX. 79084

b y  M a r y lo u  M c D a n ie l

If you ever bowled you’ll 
know how exciting were the 
games Stratford Grain bowl­
ed Feb. 12. The team was 
bowling Blue West who were 
four points behind. Blue 
West is composed of Arta 
Muir, Wanda Weller, Mary 
Reese, Joyce Brooks and 
Yvonne Bowen and they 
were bowling good with Arta 
having a 508 series. BUT the 
Stratford Grain Team rolled 
games of 881-915-836 for a 
2632 scratch series! Team 
members were Betty Henry, 
Ann Woolley, Minnie Reed­
er, Roberta Gregory and 
Peggy Byrd. (I sat out and 
was scorekeeper and cheer­
leader!) Roberta rolled 
221-205-203 and Peggy 
192-200-210. Boys and Girls, 
that’s good bowling for even 
men! The team w ill be 
bowling June 2-3 in Tampa, 
Florida, at Women’s Inter­
national Bowling Tourna­
ment. Boys, if they could do 
that again, they could take 
their class!.

Pancake
Supper

First Christian Church
Scripture Matthew 8:18-22 
Sermon “The Joys and the 
Challenges of Following 
Jesus! ’ ’
Anthem “ Jesus Paid It all” 
Adult Choir, Jo June 
McDaniel, Soloist.

Kerrick EH Club had a 
delightful New Orleans Style 
Luncheon Tuesday, Feb. 13 
at Jo June McDaniel’ s. 
Members prepared recipes 
Marylou McDaniel received 
at a leader’s training. Mabel 
Rogers brought red beans 
and rice, Lynn Wells made 
chicken jambalaya, Joyce 
Irlbeck fixed a green salad, 
Franny Taylor made bread 
pudding with whiskey or 
carmel sauce, Marylou 
McDaniel brought French 
bread and Jo June furnished 
the beverages of tea or 
coffee. They invited club 
member Minnie Hampton to 
just come.

Marylou presented the 
program as the group ate. 
Following lunch Joyce con­
ducted the business session. 
Franny brought information 
about a “ Living W ill” .

The next meeting will be a 
trip to Amarillo on Wed. 
March 21 for lunch and a 
visit to the Discovery Center. 
Marylou is hostess and will 
make arrangements.

Don’t forget Community 
Supper Friday night, Feb. 
23, 7 p.m. Blood pressure 
clinic, covered dish supper. 
Hosts are the Bevin Avents 
and Alvin Harrises.

Shrove Tuesday, Pancake 
Supper (Free Will Offering) 
will be Tuesday, February 
27, 1990 from 5:30 p.m. to 
7:30 p.m. at the Fellowship 
Hall of the United Methodist 
Church, 520 North Main.

SH RO VE T U E S D A Y , 
means to shrive, to confess 
one’s sins on this day in 
preparation for the holy 
Lenten season. Shrove 
Tuesday, is the day before 
Ash Wednesday (the first 
day of Lent.)

Pancakes are served on 
Shrove Tuesday, made of 
milk, eggs, and fat, which 
were not allowed to be eaten 
during Lent. Lent is a time to 
“ get right”  with the Lord 
and everyone else we know.

Lent comes from the 
Middle English word LENTE 
and the Old English word 
Lengten, meaning spring. 
Lent has been set aside as a 
time of preparation and 
remembering. The first Lent 
lasted 40 hours, as a 
reminder of the time Jesus’ 
body lay in the tomb. But in 
the 6th Century Gregory the 
Great set aside a 40 day 
period of fasting, penitence 
and prayer. Sundays are not 
counted in the 40 days of 
Lent, because all Sundays 
are feast days and never fast 
days.

itomi) etuittó
The Churches of Stratford 

Welcome Your Fomily

$T. JOSEPH CATHOLIC
Willie Artho 

515 S. Pearl Street 
Sunday Mass 9:00 a.m. 
Sunday Spanish Mass 11:00 
a.m.
Saturday Evening Mass 7:30 
p.m.

FIRST BAPTIST
Dr. Derrel Lewis 

702 North 3rd 
Sunday School 9:45 am 
Morning Worship 10:50 am 
Church Training 6:00 pm 
Evening Worship 7:00 pm 
Wednesday Bible Study 
7:30 pm

FIRST CHRISTIAN
Rev. David Harker 
5th & N. Main St. 

Sunday Coffee Fellowship 
9:00 am
Sunday School 9:45 am 
Morning Worship 10:45 am 
Evening Worship 6:00 pm 
Wednesday,Adult Choir 
8:00 pm

CALVARY BAPTIST
David Jones 

302 S. Main St. 
Sunday School 10:00 am 
Morning Worship 11:00 am 
Evening Worship 6:00 pm 
Wednesday Prayer Service 
& Bible Study 7:00 pm

> 1 n c  e !

CHURCH OF CHRIST
Minister John Wearden 
N. 3rd & Chestnut St. 

Sunday School 10:00 am 
Morning Worship 11:00 am 
Evening Worship 6:00 pm 
Wednesday Bible Study 
7:30 pm

FIRST UNITED METHODIST
Rev. John Wagoner 

520 N. Main
Sunday School 9:40 am 
Morning Worship 10:50 am 
Junior High UMY 5:30 pm 
Senior High UMY 6:00 pm 
Evening Worship 6:00 pm

ASSEMBLY OF GOD
Rev. Terrance Fred 

Corner of Purnell & Fulton 
Sunday School 9:45 am 
Morning Worship 10:45 am 
Evening Worship 6:00 pm 
Wednesday Bible Study 
7:30 pm

Kindness
1 walked through life in darkness 
Until there came a day,
1 found a friend in Jesus 
To lead and show the way.

My feeling of sheer hopelessness 
And, too, the hand of fear,
Became replaced with hope and faith 
Because I found Him near.

My life is far more brighter,
More rich in every way,
E’er since I met dear Jesus 
And walk with Him each day.

Harold F. Mohn

A little word in kindness 
spoken,

A motion, or a tear.
Has often healed the heart 

that's broken
And made a friend sincere.

A word, a look, has crushed 
to earth

Full many a budding flower.
Which, had a smile but owned 

its birth.
Would bless life's darkest hour.

Then deem it not an idle thing
A pleasant word to speak;

. The face you wear, the thought 
you bring,

A heart may heal or break.

John Greenleaf Whittier

iM .
X X ,'

C & C Texaco Station 
C & C Texaco Product» 

396-2429

Thriftway
396-5586

Consumers Co. 
396-2261

Williams Repair Service 
396-5330 396-2547

North Plains Savings 
&Loan

396-5534

Stratford Grain Co. 
396-5541 Loutz 769-4485

Smith & Smith Well Co. Inc. 
396-2111

Heodquorters Restaurant 

396-2120

EllieM'S
396-2092

Stratford Star 
396-5885

W alter Lasley & Sons, Inc. 
753-4411
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A pre nuptial shower for Brian Kendrick and Laura Tharp was 
held in the home of Mr. and Mrs. Bill Riffe, Saturday, Feb. 
17. Pictured are Laura’s parents, Mr. and Mrs. Charles 
Tharp, Laura, Brian, Mr. and Mrs. Cagle Kendrick and a 
brother Craig Kendrick.

Tops 897
T.O.P.S. #897 Stratford, 

met February 15, 1990 at 8 
a.m. in the Sherman County 
Barn for a NO GAIN 
meeting. We lost a total of 6 
pounds, 4 members in 
attendance, Geneva Bell won 
the fruit basket for most 
weight iost.

Plans are being made by 
four of our members to 
attend the State Recognition 
Days to be held April 27th 
and 28th in Austin. Besides 
the workshops, awards and 
other programs, several 
tours are planned; one to the 
LBJ Ranch, and one to the 
Capital and governor’s 
mansion.

Myrtle Starker gave an 
interesting program about 
exercises that can be done
Scot News 
Cont. From Page 3

Ruby McNeal’s picture 
exhibition, we marveled at 
her creative ability, hidden 
under the necessity of 
making a living for so many 
years, and later developed 
by study under Dord Fitz! 
Then, gazing at Bonnie 
Berth’s Madonna Collection 
we wondered if there is 
another such collection in the 
Texas Panhandle. The third 
collection on display is 
composed of plates. Mari- 
howard Engelbrecht has 
loaned her mothers collec­
tion of plates which range 
from Norman Rockwell 
selections, thru states and 
cities to Palo Duro Canyon. 
We did not count how many! 
The Selma and Bill Pendle­
ton plate collection is their 
own. It is highlighted, for us, 
by the Indian plates. We had 
never seen any such.

Jewel Dovel and Corda 
Pleyer visited as did Glen 
Ford M clver and son 
Bradford Billington Mclver 
who is 18 months old. We 
began a FIRST. An 18 mos 
old person bearing the 
Billington name registered 
at Sherman County Dept. 
Museum. J.A .’s grandson? 
Surely! among the Stratford 
Stars given by former editor

while in a car.
On Feb. 13, 1990 our Club 

hosted a “ Homecoming”  in 
honor of our past members. 
The Welcome was given by 
M yrtle  Staker, leader. A 
skit, “ A Valentine Varia­
tion” , introduced by Pauline 
M artin, was presented. 
Starring were Genevieve 
Wilson as Sweet Tooth Sue, 
Rose Wells as “ Trying Hard 
Terri, Geneva Bell-Slim Sally 
and Joyce Harper as Dieting 
Donna. Members were 
presented charms by Weight 
recorder Geneva Bell. 
Charms are awarded for 
monthly queens, perfect 
attendance, being an officer 
and various other things. 
Elsie Lesley was a special 
honoree who reached KOPS 
status 14 years ago after 
being a member for one year 
and she never went above 
her goal. _

Dave McReynolds, we found 
the issue of Feb. 16, 1950. 
We selected the following 
items to whet YOUR 
interest. NEWS: Mrs. Mar­
guerite Wilson & son John 
Marvin spent the weekend in 
Pampa visiting Mr. and Mrs. 
John Schnider, Mr. and Mrs. 
Harold Bennett returned 
from Florida. Mr. and Mrs. 
Ernest Lovelace and Mr. and 
Mrs. Van Boston attended 
the Hardware Convention in 
Amarillo. Mr. and Mrs. B.A. 
Donelson are home after a 
visit to their daughter Mrs. 
Wayne Wherry of Houston. 
Headline: The Sam Wohl- 
fords are on a three weeks 
tour of South America. 
SOCIETY: Inter Se met Feb. 
3, 1950 with hostess Mrs. 
Joe Brown Guest list was 
Mdms: Hattie Flores, Joe 
Duby, H.L. Vincent, Nannie 
O’ Brien, Floyd W iginton, 
H.L. Haile, Wm Hart, R.C. 
Buckles, Royal Pendleton, 
Agnes Foster, Earl Riffe and 
A.L. King who won high 
score. ADS: Ross Bros Dry 
Goods; Bonar Pharmacy; 
Consumers: G & G Grocery; 
TOC Motors; Palace Cafe 
Prop. Russell Beall;Garrison 
Motor Co. Lettuce 13 cents 
per head; sliced bacon, 29 
cents per lb; apples 10 cents

P. O. BOX 7 7 9  
2 1 2  N. POPLAR 

STRATFORD. TEX AS 7 9 0 8 4  
(0 0 6 ) 3 9 6 -5 6 6 5
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G E N E R A L D E N T IS T R Y  
HOME: (8 0 6 ) 381 -2 2 1 2

GENERAL DENTISTRY
HOME: (806) 935-9086

Music Qub
Love 

for a
The SUGAR of 

Ballads is the title 
program on Cole Porter and 
his music for Stratford 
Federated Music Club as it 
meets Tuesday, Feb. 27, 2 
p.m. at the home of 
Marihoward Engelbrecht. 
This is a change of meeting 
place.

Marylou McDaniel is 
program director and there 
will also be a sing-a-long of 
Porter songs.

This is Parade of Ameri­
can Music Month.

Janice Sladek, third from ieft, and severai iadies from the 
First United Methodist Church are busy sewing items that 
Janice wiii be taking aiong to Honduras March 2nd thru 
March 13th. Janice is going with the “ Feed The Chiidren” 
program and wiii be working in the Dentai Ciinic assisting a 
dentist from Minnesota. Aprroximately 40 are going. This is 
Janice’s 6th trip. She has previousiy made three trips to 
Guatamaia, one to Honduras and one to Ei Saivador.

Chamber Chatter
l i y J . A .  I j a s l e y

Qiamber Accepting 
Nominations

The Stratford Chamber of 
Commerce is accepting 
nominations for the 1989 
Citizen of the Year, Business 

Person of the Year and 
Farmer of the Year awards. 
Thèse awards w ill be 
presented during the annual 
Chamber of Commerce 
Banquet on Tuesday, March 
27, 1990.

These awards are given

annually and recipients are 
selected from nominations 
submitted by Stratford and 
area residents. Individuals 
subm itting nominations 
should include information 
about their nominee which 
reflects continuing contribu­
tions and achievements in 
their respective fields.

Individuals honored as 
Citizens of the Year include 
Walter Lesley, Joan Bell,

Public Hearing Rural 
Economic Development

A public hearing to gain 
input from area residents on 
rural economic development 
is scheduled in Amarillo at 
1:00 p.m. on Feb. 27. The 
meeting will be held at the 
Panhandle Regional Plan­
ning Commission, 2736 West 
Tenth Avenue.

A Rural Economic De­
velopment Commission was 
created by the 71st Legisla­
ture to generate legislative 
recommendations and speci­
fic solutions aimed at 
revitalizing rural Texas. The 
members, appointed by 
Governor Clements, are Dr. 
Zerle Carpenter of College 
Station who will chair the 
Commission; Rep. Dick 
Waterfield, R-Canadian; M 
Marjorie Kastman of Lub­
bock; Carlos Barrera of 
Brownsville; Maxie Davie of 
Fort Worth; Mike Harrison 
of Pecos; Brad Helbert of 
Abilene; Robert Parker or 
Paris; and Joe Cook of 
Perryton.

The Commission members 
have appointed three task 
forces to assist with the 
initial information gathering 
process. Task force members 
from the Panhandle region

per lb. cheese 53 cents per 
lb. Ah, me!

Have a good week. See 
you Thursday, Scatter 
“ Luv”  and shoulder pats!

are Jay Johnson, County 
Judge in Swisher County; 
and Cheryl Pink with SPS 
Company in Amarillo.

The Rur'al Econoniic 
Deve10p meht Com m ission 
will report its findings to the 
Legislature in January 1991.

A . E. Pronger, Jr., B ill 
Sladek, Janice Sladek, Don
Riffe, Gaynelle Riffe, Shirley 
Plunk, H.T. Galloway, Fern 
Gupton, Cindy Crabtree,
B. A. Donelson, LeRayne 
Donelson, Marihoward 
Engelbrecht, Lorraine Meh- 
ner, Timmie Brown, Linda 
Spurlock and Max Stephen­
son.

Farmer of the Year 
honorées have included: 
L.B. Blake, Ronald Engel­
brecht, Ronnie Pickens, Billy 
Bell, Jimmy Chesher and 
Joe Everett.

Businessperson of the 
year recipents have included 
Ole Olson, J.A . Lesley,. 
Ronnie and Esther Fergu­
son, Debbie and Gayland 
Vandiver, Betty and Baskin 
Brown, and Bill and Don 
Riffe.

Nominations should be 
delivered or mailed to the 
Chamber of Commerce by 
Friday, the 16th of March.

Your Right 
To Know
By Terry Kennedy

The State Emergency 
Management Conference in 
Austin was most Informa­
tive. The big emphasis was 
on the testing of Emergency 
Plans locally. Examples were 
given on the earthquake in 
California and Hurricane 
Hugo. Both the hurricane 
scenario and the earthquake 
scenario were tested within 
six weeks of the actual event. 
Many thanked God for the 
exercises!

We are getting ready for 
our first table top exercise. 
The exercise will be the first 
one using the Emergency 
Plan for Sherman County. In 
an exercise like this, the 
people who are responsible 
for the health and safety of 
the citizens get together and 
are given a problem. The 
problem will cover what the 
jobs of the local officials and 
volunteers would be in the 
event of a tornado. The 
desired outcome is the 
proper functioning of all the 
organizations in the face of a 
disaster that strains the 
forces of all the agencies 
involved. We will critique 
the exercise after it is over, 
and determine what went 
right and what needs to be 
corrected. All of the people 
involved should be better 
qualified to handle the real 
emergency if and when it 
happens.

An English highway boasts the 
smallest underpass in the world— a 
tunnel one foot w ide which was 
constructed to perm it badgers to 
get to the other side of the road.

Stick cinnamon, used as a spice, 
is the rolled inner bark of a small 
East Indian tree.

D & S Heatiri^ i i  Air Conditioning

We specialize in all your heating 
and air conditioning needs.

Owner: David Mungia

396-2250
If no answer call

396-2027
Texas License

Women’s Health Center
N orm a l a n d  h igh  r isk  p re g n a n c ie s  

G yneco log ic  ca n ce r  sc reen ing  
Breast cance r  sc reen ing  

Infertil i iy a n d  fa m i ly  p la n n in g  
M en op au se  a n d  h o rm o n e / ) ro b lc n )s

D r .  T u r t i a n  1 B o y k c a i  M  D

S p c c i n l i z i n t j  In

OBSTETFUCS-GYNECOLOGY
201 South  Bliss M ondoy-F r ic iay  g a . t ic  -r>p.m

AI ̂ niiinimcnis n.tP-()5og 
i jni'ue ngg 7Ì71

2 1 2 S. BLISS 
DUMAS. TEXAS 7 9 0 2 9 (8 0 6 ) 9 3 5 -9 2 1 2

When justice in the 69th District 
hangs in the balance...

JUDICIAL EXPERIENCE 
MAKES THE DIFFERENCE!

^  Court at Law Judge since 1986 
'A Over 1000 District-Level cases tried

VOTE MARCH 13 FOR

JUDGE -
DAVID G. L E ^ S 69th DISTRICT JUDGE

Pd. for bv the Com. to Elec* Judqe David G. Lewis. E. Jordan Mills. Treas., Box 1474, Dumas, TX 79029
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From Our Home 
To Yours

1 #
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. f t
Opal Bryant was the honred 
guest at a luncheon at 
Coldwater Manor.

Birthday kids at Coldwater Manor for February are Edith 
Houston, John Campbell and Opal Bufkin.

The first graders of Mary Allen School visited Coldwater Manor Tuesday to 
entertain at the monthly birthday party. They sang 3 songs under the 
direction of Miss Rose and finished by singing Happy Birthday to Edith, John 
and Opal.

Out The lib ra ry
By Dorothy Haile

Are you Retired? Would 
you like to travel and learn? 
Welcome to ELDERHOSTEL

From Cicero to computers, 
politics to poetry,.from  
Maine to Manitoba..Wollon­
gong to Wales..Its all here in 
the pages of your ELDER- 
HOSTEL catalog. ELDER 
HOSTEL offers you the 
opportunity to take an 
adventure of the mind, body 
and s p ir lt- th a t’s why the 
participants say “ Studying 
there is half the fun.”

ELDERHOSTEL is an 
educational program for 
older adults who want to 
continue to expand their 
horizons and develop new 
Interests and enthusiasm... 
We’re for elder citizens on 
the move, not just in terms of 
travel, but In terms of 
intellectual activity as well. 
Our commitment is to the 
belief that retirement does 
not represent an end to 
significant activity for older 
adults but a new beginning 
filled with opportunities and 
challenges.

Interested? Come to the 
Sherman County Public 
Library and check out the 
catalog. Two catalogs arrive 
each year. The new 1990 fall 
one is here.

The library has a number 
of forms for filling income 
tax returns. Should you need 
more forms or instructions to 
go with them you might find 
these at the library. We also 
have some that may be 
photocopied at 25cents per 
copy.

The week of Feb. 12 
through 16 was a busy but 
fun week at Coldwater 
Manor.

We started with a honored 
guest luncheon on the 13. 
The staff and residents, 
honored Opal Bryant, a 
longtime resident of Strat­
ford. Opal has been a 
volunteer at Coldwater 
Manor since the fac ility  
opened. She was a member 
of “ The Manor Friends”  
prior tct 1 " . „ v/’l t

O uf^rriM utfly bli^fhday" 
party was held on the 13th. 
The birthdays for this month 
were John Campbell, Edith 
Houston, and Opal Bufkin. 
We were honored by the 
presence of the first grade 
music class of Mary Allen 
School. They sang and 
handed out Valentine Cards. 
We want to thank the 
children and the school 
faculty. We enjoyed the 
program very much.

Wed. Feb. 14 we 
celebrated Valentines day 
with a lot of goodies. The 
Manor friends provided the 
cookies, fam ily members 
chips and dip, the nursing 
home sandwiches and 
punch.

Beulah Farris and Cowboy 
McBryde were crowned
King and Queen by vote of 
other residents and staff.

The music was provided 
by Dee Brannan. Along with 
the music Dee brought some 
of his dancing friends to 
dance for us and with us.

The King and Queen of 
course had the first dance. 
We had a great time and by 
now we have eaten until we 
are about to pop but wait, 
there is more.

Thursday Feb. 15th was 
Jan Sells last day of work at 
Coldwater Manor. The 
residents and staff gave her 
a going away party to the 
tune of a baby shower. Her 
baby is due in 3 weeks. Jan 
and Stacy are moving to 
Dal herj ., 4^f e... aca go tag -  to 
nflsa -̂ 3lam%a§ a’ g r ^ t  
asset to our facility. We wish 
them a lot of luck and we 
can’t wait for her and the 
baby to be able to come and 
visit us.

Friday Feb. 16, the 
Employees had a bring your 
own dish inservice. More 
food. I ’ m glad that the 
weekend came around when 
it did because I’m stuffed.

One of our residents was 
quoted as saying “ One thing 
about it we sure eat good 
around here.”

The activ ity program
would like to start an adopt a 
grandparent program. Our 
residents have a lot of love 
and history that they would 
like to share with the 
children of Sherman County. 
If any club such as Brownies, 
church groups or Individual 
children would like to adopt 
a grandparent please par­
ents contact Kay Stedham, 
activity director at Coldwater 
Manor 396-5568.

Farmstead Windbreaks
Planting trees and shrubs 

to form a windbreak around 
your home can add beauty 
and protection to your 
farmstead. As a bonus, a 
well-planned windbreak can 
lower your utility bills by as 
much as 30%.

When planning a farm­
stead windbreak, location is 
first cohsideration.., Prevail­
ing winds in Sherman 
County originate from the 
southwest. A windbreak 
planted on the south and 
west side of your farmstead 
would break most winter 
winds. In the summer, the 
shade provided by your fully 
grown windbreak can lower 
the temperature around the 
windbreak area by 25 
degrees.

There are some things to 
keep In mind in planning a 
windbreak. First locate your

By Mary Wilder, SCS

trees no closer than 100 ft. 
from driveways and build­
ings. Also, avoid creating 
blind corners by planting 20 
ft. or more from the main 
road. And th ird , avoid 
placing your trees under 
power or telephone lines.

The local Soil and Water 
Conservation D istrict In 
Stratford has trees for sale. 
Many trees and shrubs 
available are suitable for 
farmstead windbreaks. For 
further Information on the 
tree sale and for windbreak 
planning, call Grade at 
396-5517 or visit the office 
located at 418 N. Fourth 
Street.

Your Vote and Influence will be Appreciated 

RE-ELECT

BOYD SPURLOCK 

County Commissioner 

Precinct 2> Sherman County
Pd Pol Adv by Boyd Spurlock HCR 1, Bx 248, Stratford, Tx

Democratic Primary March 13th

FmH A Housing Money 
Targeted To Counties 
That Need It Most

Temple, 2-7-1990, Rural 
Housing funds are being 
targeted to 100 counties in 38 
states across the nation that 
need it the most, including 
Colorado, Frio, Maverick, 
Presidio, and Zavala, accord­
ing to J. Lynn Futch, State 
Director for the Farmers 
Hom e A d m in s i t r a t lo n  
(FmHA).

FmHA, rural credit ser­
vice of the U.S. Department 
of A gricu lture , regularly 
funnels millions of dollars 
annually In housing funds 
into the small towns and 
rural areas of Texas.

“ Our efforts to provide 
safe, decent, and adequate 
housing for rural residents 
have been successful, and 
yet, some areas are still 
desperately in need of 
housing assistance,”  Futch 
said.

“ We have identified 
counties that need additional 
FmKA housing assistance

and we are starting a 
demonstration program to 
target an additional $840,000 
for multi-family housing and 
$1,436,000 for single family 
housing to them,”  he said. 
The counties involved are 
still fully eligible for the 
regular single family and 
m ulti-fam ily  allocations of 
housing funds the state 
receives.

Counties were identified 
as eligible for the program 
on the basis of a high 
percentage of very-low 
income households and 
substandard housing. After 
analysis of the volume of 
FmHA loan and grant 
making in fiscal years 
1986-1988, counties identi­
fied as both “ needy”  and 
“ underserved’ ’ by FmHA 
housing programs were 
selected for the program.

Applicants for assistance

Oont. On Page 7

C a t h e r i n e  D. T a y l o r  

Certified Public Accountant
North Plains Building

401 N. 3 rd 396-2435

Monday - Friday 9 a.m . - 5 p.m.

Gorst Corn Seed
New lower prices 

for
new customers

Call

Jess Willard 
727-4827

Dee Brannan, Ambulance manager, Zola Brannan and Terry 
Kennedy gave a program to the Stratford Lions Club, Feb. 
12th at their weekly noon meeting on the EMT procedure and 
tested blood pressure and used the heart monitor on club 
members.

District 1-2A Girls

Jolina Garoutte

Freshman Jolina Garoutte 
was named to All Distriqt in 
1-2A Girls Basketball. Jolina 
averaged 10.6 points per 
game; 6.5 rebounds per 
game; 1.4 steals per game; 
and 1.1 assist per game.

Stephanie Gray was nam­
ed Honorable Mention in All 
District. Stephanie averaged 
5 points per game; 6 
rebounds per game; 2.6 
assist per game and 2.45 
steais per game.

Charissa Bryson was also 
named to Honorable Men­
tion. Charissa averaged 4.1 
pts. per game; 2.0 rebounds 
per game; 2.7 assist per 
game and 2.1 steals per 
game.

Members of the A ll 
District Girls team for 1-2A 
are Jolina Garoutte, Strat­
ford; Amy Throgmorton- 
Panhandle; From Spearman- 
Laura Pearson, Vonda Ben­
son, Michelle Cook and Kyla 
Nelson. From Highland 
Park, Melissa States and 
Tricia DeSpain. West Texas 
was Autum Moss and 
Panhandle Merldeth Woop 
and Leslie Ware.

Stephanie Gray

Charissa Bryson

Overtime Chili 
2 1/2 lbs. ground beef

1 cup chopped onion
1 cup chopped green 

pepper
4 cloves garlic, minced
5 tablespoons chili 

powder
2 teaspoons ground cumin
1 teaspoon dry mustard
2 teaspoons paprika 

1/4 teaspoon crushed red
chili peppers

2 16-oz. cans tomatoes 
with juice

1 2-lb. can kidney beans, 
drained

1 15-oz. can pinto beans 
1/2 teaspoon pepper
Brown beef. Stir in onion, 

green peppers, garlic and cook 
until peppers and onions are 
soft. Drain grease from mix­
ture. Add seasonings and to­
matoes. Cover and simmer one 
hour. Remove cover and add 
kidney beans and pinto beans. 
Simmer uncovered for one more 
hour. Serve with corn or tor­
tilla chips.

Ask About Our 
Individual

IRA

IRA
Retirement Accounts
Remember, you can still make deposits for 1989 until 
April 16th, 1990.

Stritt-BoRfe 4
S T R A T F O R D , T E X A S  7 9 0 8 A
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Business
D irectory

lam  STILL SOWING GRASS &doing 
Custom Farming & can sell you the

grass seed at competitive prices.

Call 727-4455 Bert Hernandez Sr. 
or 727-4694Bert Hernandezjr.

Big Town Seleefion it Small Town Friendliness

Wkh Sskcfion froisn food 

QooBfy Foods . Prosh Produco

H w y  5 4  Post 3 9 6 -5 5 8 6

Susanah^s Cafe and Gift Shop
Mondoy-Soturdoy 9:30 am - 8:00 pm

family Dining - Lunch & Supper Including Steaks

Southwest Clothing and Collectables^ Crafts

For more biformation call 7274680

Flea M arket 2nd Sat. of eoch 
month Starting in March

Kerrick
Texas

ELK PHARMACY
317 .N. Main 

Stratford. TX 79084 
806-396-SS0&

We Honor . . P C S. P.A.I.D. BC/BS 
Texas Medicaid

•  Baby Shower Registry Gifts t i  Decorative Accessories •  Helium Balloons
r  ni oi. _ •  Bridal Registry•  Toys •  UPS Shipping Center

•  One-Day Photo Processing

Visa and MasterCard Welcomed

J ’s Cut & Curl
Sun Glitzing ' Manicures

Perms Pedicures
^  We cgrry^compytecomplete Ime o f .  

N e x x u s ta t r c a r e p r o S u c ts fS ^ lh y p M ^
Sat, by appointment only

Shop ■ 396-2520 Res. 396-2139

All Occasion Cakes
By J'anis Tillery

Birthday " "  Anniversary Holiday

396-2508
North Plains 

Savings & Loan 
Stratford - 396-5534

401N, 3rd
Dumas 935-4184  
Dalhart 249-5513

Jl/lungia's
Heating & A ir Conditioning

•i.
We Also Do Hot Water Heater Replacement, 

Remodeling, Plumbing &  Roofing

Payne396-2007 
If No Answer Call 

396-2403 HEATING MeTemVel

206 N. Main
P.O. Box 1253 

Stratford, Texas 79084

AMERICAN SPRAYERS
OF

STRATFORD
Aerial Ag. Service For Farm and Ranch 

CHARLEY & VIRGINIA LAMB 
(806) 396-2036 Stratford, T exas

Elite’s
and M’s Meet &Eat
For all your gift and floral needs

Baby ̂ Bridal Registry
2 0 9 S. Main 396-2092

Student Of The Week
1

7C7. ■■,Ez: :7 • Keh. 12, 1990
TEAQTR ■ - STJDE:!! CCT^^ETTS

,
RIMDA AU.IS0N Tv Youns; Hard worker: urcat atLitude

LYNDA KA.USZR David M e r r i l l ______________ Great attitude: fun t:o he around•
LDTCA J ^ i g t i  Downing________________ Eniovahie student in class

TERRI TEIG Cecelia Beltran______________ For bavins: hish soals

BARBARA HAILE Cobv Seaton Doing verv well with diagramning

:iQ<E BRCI'.TEEE Aaron Griffith For his hard work and continued imnrovenent

mAYtTZ PLUNK Alicia Beltran Quiet, studious, verv nleasant

SONJA KEE)RiaC Lisa Jurado Works to correct her work when necessary

LARRY NORRIS Ryan Wanner Just keens on quietly nluggin' away

BETTI INGHAM Shane Watson Is imnroviag daily on his baritone____________

Jump Rope For Heart

Kindergarten Jumpers, Monday, Feb. 19.

First Grade Jumpers Monday,
The children at Mary 

Allen will be jumping rope 
this week for the “ Health of 
It” . This event Is being 
sponsored by the Texas 
Association for Health, 
Physical Education, Recrea­
tion and Dance and our 
school to benefit the 
American Heart Association.

Feb. 19th.
The money raised by the 

Jump Rope for Heart event 
w ill allow the American 
Heart Association to contin­
ue providing educational 
programs and materials at 
no cost to our school; and it 
will ensure the continuation 
of the research efforts to 
fight heart and blood vessel

GWffin Arrives For Duty In South Korea
Army Pvt. Chase P. 

Griffin has arrived for duty 
in South Korea.

G riffin  is a tactical 
satellite/microwave system 
operator w ith the 307th 
Signal Battalion.

He is the grandson of 
Way land E. and Betty J. 
Brown of 605 S. Main, 
Stratford, Texas.

The private is a 1989 
graduate of Stratford High 
School.

You^^eptndtii\
806-396-2031

396-2379

SMITH AGENCY
Insurance 

319 N. Main 
Stratford, TX 79084

SHARON BROWN 
Home 806-396-2356

MILES SMITH 
Home 806-396-2540

Airline - Cruises -  Rail - Tours -  Hotels -  Cars

PAT JOHNSON
Travel Consultant

806-396-2243 
Stratford, TX 790

400 E. First 
Dumas. Texas 79029

JOAN BELL
Travel Consultant

806-396-5958 
Stratford. TX 79084

diseases, including stroke 
and heart attack.

Last year 117,(X)0 children 
in over ^,500 Texas schools 
raised $2.9 m illion. To 
celebrate the 10th Annlver;- 
sary of Jump Rope for Heart 
in Texas, the American 
Heart Association is hoping 
to raise over $3 million in 
1989-90.

Watercolor Oass 
To Be Offered

There will be a watercolor 
class offered through Frank 
Phillips College starting 
Feb. 27. It will be a six week 
course taught by Cindy 
Russell. Classes will begin at 
7:00 and last 3 hours. Two 
hours of continuing educa­
tion credit will be received. 
Basic to intermediate water- 
coior, watercolor pencils, 
and pen and ink w ith 
watercolors will be taught. 
Supplies will be available 
during class.

For more information call 
Cindy at 727-4677 or come 
Tues. night.

To members of the 
Contributors Fund of the 
Sherman County Fat Stock 
Show. Thank you for 
purchasing my iamb, i 
appreciate your donations 
that made the fund possibie.

Sincereiy,
1st Year 4-H’er 

Daniei Hunsaker

Cards o f 
Thanks

A speciai thanks to 
everyone for the food, 
fiowers and many prayers 
during my surgery, many 
thanks aiso to aii my friends 
for heiping with the cattie. 
Gordie thank you for doing 
my Beaver Freight, and to 
everyone for the rides and 
visits. God Biess....

Wayne & Daria

i wouid iike to thank the 
4-H contributor’s fund for 
reimbursing me for the ioss 
of my pig.

Amber Wooisey

We wouid iike to take this 
time to say a speciai thanks 
to the peopie who were 
invoived in the Sherman 
County Stock Show. We 
wouid iike to say thanks to 
Jim Aiiison for his support in 
the 4-H program, and to Mr. 
Carter, and Mr. Hembree for 
heiping the FFA program. 
We appreciate aii the peopie 
in the community who have 
heiped support the stock 
show. We feei iike we have 
iearned a great deai and 
hope to continue next year.

Thank you
Stephanie, Donny and

Wendy Gray

i wouid iike to take this 
time to thank many peopie 
who heiped me as i 
competed in the Miss 
Amariiio Schoiarship Pag­
eant. First of aii a big |hanks 
goes to my sponsors who 
contributed to my sponsor­
ship entry. They are First 
State Bank, Thriftway, 
Howard Naugie and Duncan 
Chevroiet, Famiiy and 
Friends, Eik Pharmacy, 
Stratford Chamber of Com­
merce, The Miss Stratford 
Schoiarship Pageant, and 
Dairy Queen. Thanks aiso to 
Leah Washburn for styiing 
my hair and to aii the peopie 
who came to support me in 
the pageant, it reaiiy means 
a iot to iook out and see two 
rows fiiied with my famiiy 
and friends who are behind 
me. i wouid iike to especiaiiy 
thank Cheryi and Krisann 
Reese, Tami and Coach 
King, Jode Lasiey and Poe 
Keener for the items they 
provided, i want to thank my 
famiiy for their encourage­
ment and iast but certainiy 
not ieast thanks so much to 
Joyce Ann 'Lasiey for her 
heip, patience, iove and 
support, it is so nice to know 
i ’m representing such a 
caring and supportive com­
munity.

1989-90 Miss Stratford
Dawn Gray

i wouid iike to thank 
everyone who made the 
Sherman County Stock Show 
a success. A speciai thanks 
to A & i Parts for donating 
the buckie for Grand 
Champion Swine, Consu­
mers for donating the buckie 
for Reserve Grand Champion 
swine and to Lynn Aiien and 
Mooreman Feeds for the 
coat donated to Grand 
Champion swine, i wouid 
aiso iike to thank B.A. 
Doneison for buying my pig 
and donating it to the Big 
Biue Band. Aiso Wesiey 
Spurlock and Goodners 
Livestock for the add ons. 
Last but not ieast. Thank you 
Mr. Hembree, Mr. Carter, 
and Mr. Aiiison for aii your 
heip and support. You have 
given so generousiy of 
yourseives to teach me to be 
the best that i can be. Your 
iessons wiii aiways remain a 
part of me. Thanks to you aii 
for making the 1990 Stock 
Show speciai to me.

Jason Spuriock

The Rodriquez Famiiy 
wouid iike to thank everyone 
who heiped the Gaiindo 
famiiy of Mexico Thank you.

i wouid iike to thank 
everyone who contributed to 
the contributors fund that 
bought my iamb, it is nice 
for you aii to contribute to 
the purchase of the animats. 
Thank you again for 
supporting the stock show.

Sincereiy, Shane Watson
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Basketball

7th Grade Girl Basketball Team. Back row, Kelly Grimes, Amy Tillery, Patsy 
Cruz, Shelia Fedric, Katie Norris, Misty Zaricor, second row Tammie Burton. 
Lea Shuping, Sarah Ortega, Mandy Mires, Patti Porras, front row, Christy 
Weils, Lisa Ramos, Ford, Ashley Parsons and Wendy Palmer.

7th Grade Boys Basketball Team Back row, Clint Craig, Lawerance Aguilera, 
Marcus Lavake, Tracy Welland, Ben Pigman, Michael Gonzalez. Second 
Row, Junior Licon, Jose Brajas, Jeff Rickerson, Clint Vincent, Aaron Griffith 
front row, Ryan Wanner, Brian Husmann, Kirk Swain, Rhea Chumley and 
Colby Seaton.

8th Grade Girls Basketball Team. Back Row, Brandy Ross, Shawnda Blake, 
Kaci Wight, Jam! Allen, Elly Rhoades, Courtney Dettle, Monica Teasley, 
second row, Taryn Silva, Susan Goodwin, Ceciia Beltran, Sarah Graham, 
Cathy Ortega, Yvette Rodriquez, front row, Angelica Ortega, Victoria 
Montoya, Christie Tobias and Stacy Randall.

8th Grade Boys Basketball Team. Back row, Adam Gonzalez, Dean Hauser, 
Colby Wheeler, Kyle McAdams, second row, Chan Smith, Fred Powell, 
Jeremy Brooks, Heath Starnes, front row, Ray Martinez, Adrian Aguilera, 
and Nick Phelps. Not pictured Shane Watson.
Cont. From 
Page 5
under the demonstration 
program must meet all the 
eligibility requirements for 
FmHA’s housing programs.
Information on applying for 
housing assistance from 
FmHA can be obtained from 
any FmHA office. Applica­
tions for single family home 
ownership and housing 
repair programs are proces­
sed at FmHA county offices.
Applications for rental hous­
ing are processed at FmHA 
district offices.

1990 u iL Business
Music Contest B irsc  to vy

r 
1 

1 

I

------------------------------------------ ----------------------------- 1

FREE VOLUNTEER I 
TAX ASSISTANCE I

j I-800-424-I040 I
I
L

ASK FOR SITE NEAREST YOU.
I

J

On Feb. 3, 1989 several 
Stratford Jr. High and High 
School students went to 
West Texas State University 
and competed In 1990 UIL 
Music Contest. These stu­
dents received a I rating on 
their solos; Sarah Graham- 
french horn Ray Martinez, 
baritone solo, Oscar Baeza- 
tuba solo, Christie Tobias, 
flute solo, Amy Martinez, 
flute solo, Yvette Rodriguez 
flute solo, Kirk Swain, alto 
sax solo. The brass sextet 
from Stratford Jr. High also 
received a I. Those In this 
group were Wendy Palmer, 
Holly Husmann, Sarah 
Graham, Julian Licon, Rlck- 
Garza, and Oscar Baeza.

Monica Teasely Received] 
an excellent rating on her 
flute solo as well as Jason 
Varner on his cornet solo.

Abandoned
Wells

By Bill Mires

The Sherman County Soil 
and Water Conservation 
District and the North Plains 
Water Conservation District 
are working together In an 
effort to locate and cover any 
abandoned wells within the 
district.

Every owner or operator 
of any land within the North 
Plains Water District, upon 
which is located any open or 
uncovered well Is, and shall 
be, required to close or cap 
the same permanently with a 
covering capable of sustain­
ing weight of not less than 
400 lbs. except when said 
well is in actual use by owner 
or operator; and no such 
owner or operator shall 
permit or allow any open or 
uncovered well to exist In 
violation of this requirement.

The above law was 
written and passed by the 

57th Legislature of the State 
of Texas In 1961. :

Due to the CRP program, 
many wells will not be In use 
for the next 10 years and 
have had the pumps pulled 
and are setting open.

These abandoned wells 
could present a potentially 
dangerous situation to small 
children, also small animals 
may find there way Into 
these holes. This could have 
effect on the water quality In 
that area.

If you have or know of this 
situation you should take 
care of it as soon as possible.

Rifle & Pistol 
Club News

The Stratford Rifle and 
Pistol Club held an approved 
1800 Conventional Pistol 
match Sunday Feb. 18,1990. 
They had competitors travel­
ing from Liberal, Kansas, 
Amarillo, Tex. and Dalhart 
competiting for top honors.

The novice class had real 
close competition again, with 
Roy McAlister from Strat­
ford winning the class with a 
score of 671-6x out of a 
possible 900.

Jeff Kautz from Stratford 
last months novice class 
winner, moved to Marksman 
class, winner with a score of 
1401-Sx out of a possible 
1800. Toby Kautz was 
Sharpshooter class winner 
with a score of 1622-18x out 
of possible 1800.

The match winner was Lee 
Tarver from Stratford, with a 
score 1636-15X out of a 
possible 1800. Lee usually 
competes In Marksman 
class, but with a score like 
this may move from 
Marksman to Expert, with­
out stopping at sharpshooter 
The next match will be the 
19th. National Indoor Con­
ventional Pistol match held 
March 3 and 4, 1990 at the 
clubs range In Stratford.

The highest denomination coin is a 
$2,500 Bahamian gold coin contain­
ing a pound of 22 carat gold.

The AHen Agency

H»dth Insmmee

302N.Mam 396-5810

I BUM I Moorman Mfg. Co.

Tommy R. Ames
Sales Representative

W ill be in Stratford every Wednesday.

Phone:
806-249-4796

BOX 204 
DALHART, TX 79022

QuIitHtr
Copiers A Fs« Mochines

806-396-5371

e  PRINTING
• OFFICE SUPPLIES A FURNITURE
• COMPUTER SUPPLIES

sswlntec
Typewriters A Caicuieiofs

208-211 N MAIN ST. 
STRATFORO. TEXAS 79064

Br€>wn̂ 8 Meat Locker
Custom Wholesale & Retail Meat

Federally Inspected

Hwy 28 7  South 3 9 6 2 5 1 3

BROOKS MOTOR 

COMPANY

396-2470 802S.1st

Golden Spread Implement 
Company, Inc.

A Fresh Team for Today's Farmer
396-5520 396-5529i

V ” IMC. '
THE Feedyard

Since 1953 
753-4411

Stratford Grain Co,
Stratford 396-5541 

Uwtx 769-44S5

4NorlhMaÍN

Stratford Auto Electric 
Speddiie in Starter, Alternator & 

Magneto Repair
AUTOMOTIVf ★  TRAaO R i r  IRRIGATION

Check with us for traitor wiring 
CliompiM A Stitt Sparkphts 

H 9  South Wall 396-5941

Consumers Compmiy

396-2261

Hwy287S54 g m  Stilli f it  nil-
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IT  PAYS TO LOOK IN I T H E

Star CLASSIFIEDS
‘T H E  BEST SALESPERSON A R O U N D ’

Phone 396-5885 to place your Star classified ad

irFORSALiir
For Sale: 12 ft. by 22 ft. 
Morgan building, paneled 
and carpeted w ith A ir 
Conditioner, $3500.00. Cail 
396-5588.

____________________ 2-22C

For Sale, 1986 250 R4 Trax 
Honda 2 stroke, excellent 
condition. 396-5939 after 5 
p.m.
__________________ 2-22-c
Bridal selections are at Ellies 
for Donald Crownover and 
NitaTown. Stop in and let us 
help you with your selections

____________________2-22C

The Elk Pharmacy has baby 
shower selections for Monica 
and Alexandria Brooke 
Bailey. Give us a call and let 
us help you with your 
selections. We have free 
delivery to the shower Feb. 
24th.
__________________2-22-c

Bridal selections for Donald 
and Nita Crownover. We will 
deliver your g ift to the 
shower on Feb. 25th at G irl’s 
Next Door.

__________________ 2-22-c

The Elk Pharmacy has baby 
shower selections for Jan 
Sell, Give us a call and let us 
help you with your selections 
We have free delivery to the 
Shower Feb. 24th. 
__________________ 2-22-c

Ladies Lee jeans $5.00 off at 
The Girls Next Door. 
_________________ 2-22-c

For Sale: Lowery Organ-like 
new and antique piano good 
condition. Call 396-5971 day 
396-2128 after 6. 
________________  2-22-c

^  CARS FOR SALE ̂
ATTENTION-GOVERN­
MENT SEIZED VEHICLES 
FROMTSTO. Fords, Merce­
des, Corvettes, Chevys. 
Surplus Buyers Guide. 
1-602-838-8885. EXT. a 
17671.

3-8-c

★  SiRvias ★
Decorated Cakes by Jan Is 
Tillery. Call 396-2508.

2-1TFN

DUMAS TRAVEL CENTER
For your convenience. We 
now have a new 800 number 

*1-800-635-8415. Call Toni ori 
call Jack Vincent at 
396-5388.

1-19-tfn

Inventory Reduction Suie. 
Prices to V2 of V2 and less 
continues at C’s and Girls 
Next Door.
__________________ 2-22-c

For Sale: 1929 Model “ A ”  
Ford “ V ic to ria ”  partia lly  
restored call 384-2261 day 
384-2242 after 6.

2-22-c

Call us for all your Travel 
Arrangements at no cost to 
you call Joan at 396-5958 or 
Pat at 396-2243.

9-7-tfn

Call your Local Used Cow 
Dealer for 7 day a week dead 
Stock Removal Toll Free 
1-800-692-4043. 20 years of 
Service to the Texas 
Panhandle.
_________________ 9-22-tfn

For Termite Control 
Call Leo Russell 

at 1-383-7075 Amarillo. Have 
been working Stratford for' 
28 years. Have City and 
State License for the City of 
Stratford.
______ __________ 4-24-tfn

SERVICES

Home Repairs, Electrical 
work, and odd jobs 

Call 396-5671 Stratford 
GEORGE LOVETT 

AND SON
_____________  12-14-tfn

Come on out and take 
advantage of our year end 
close out sale price on 935 
and 945 Wranglers and Levi 
Saddleman boot Jeans at 
THE General Store.

1-4-tfn

NEED A HOUSEKEEPER? 
Call 396-5904 after 4:00 p.m. 
__________________ 2-22-p

THE General Store has 
bridal selections for Donald 
and Nita Crownover. We 
have free delivery to the 
shower Feb. 25th. 
__________________ 2-22-c
VETERANS-needing assist­
ance In applying for 
pensions, schooling, burial 
benefits and other VA 
benefits. Call Max 
Stephenson, CSC at 396- 
5348.

, ____________ 4-26-p

We have baby shower 
selections for Jan Sell at 
Ellies. Free delivery to the 
Shower Feb. 24.

2-22-c

Each cigarette you smoke increases your risk of cancer. When you smoke 
on a regular basis, you are ten to 20 times more likely to die of lung cancer.

I
I u i ir®
I Amerkaa Optea«<ric 

AsMcialion

11%
iiir .

Family Vision 
Care

Specialists

D rJ.W . McCormick

ktan.̂ rl eSMOO
" 1

Dumas-935-6491

: Eyewear 
Visual Analysis
Contact Lenses 
and Supplies

Dr. David Riddlespurger 
OPTOMETRISTS

Dr. McCormick wiil be in the Stratford Office:

Thursday, Feb. Mb & 22nd coii 935-6491

ro ffic e  Hours: 10:30 to 4:00 396-5516

Williams Repair Service 
Phone 3 9 6 -5 3 3 0  or 2429  

Ditching & Bockhoe Work 

Piumbing & Suppiies

Eddie Williams Res. 396-5330

★  Mise ★
Special - Jeans washed, 
starched and pressed, $1.50 
each. Stratford Poly Clean. 
396-2151

_______________11-16TFN
VETERANS-Needing assist­
ance in filing  E lig ib le  
Verification Reports (EVR), 
applying for pensions, com­
pensation, hospitalization, 
land and housing purchase. 
Contact Max Stephenson, 
CSC, at 396-5348.

__________________ 2-23-p

For your convenience we will 
be open 7 to 5 Monday thru 
Friday including Noon hour. 
Stratford Poly Clean. 
396-2151.

_________________2-1 TFN

All winter boots and clothing 
on Sale 25% off at THE 
General Store. 
_________________ 2-15-tf n
Come by for a free Halón fire 
extinguisher demonstration. 
I’ve also got smoke detectors 
for your home. Call or come 
by Bill Riffe 396-5541.

_________________8-24-tfn
1st of 2 notices. Delinquent # 
2 storage. VO’s M ini 
Storage.
__________________ 2-22-c
We have baby shower 
selections for Monica and 
Alexandria Brooke Bailey. 
Free delivery to the shower 
Feb. 24. Ellle’s.

2-22-c

lost and roiHid|

Found female Siamese cat 
wearing a flea collar: call 
396-2019 after 6 p.m.
__________________ 2-22-p

Lost: 2 strs SE of Stratford 
f^L-Hip Steve Dettle. 
__________________ 2-22-c

Lost: 2 hfrs SW of Stratford 
^L-h ip  Everett Bros.

2-22-c

ir FOR RENT ir
REASONABLE RENT, fresh 
paint, clean two bedroom. 
Call 396-5566 or 396-2251.

________________ 1-18TFN

Gillis Apts: 1 and 2 Bdrm. 
Unfurnished. All utilities 
paid except electricity. 
Reduced rates. Call 396-2450 
________________ 8-10-tfn

Apartments for Rent: Fur­
nished 1 bedroom apartment 
All bills paid. Contact Mike 
O’Brien 396-2261 or 396- 
5656.
________________ 12-14-tfn

Apartment for Rent: Call 
396-2102.
________________ 12-21-tfn

For Rent or Sale 3 Bedroom 
large home. Call 396-2542.

________________ 1-11TFN

For Rent: unfurnished 2 
bedroom apartment w ith 
washer and dryer hookups. 
Call 396-2374 after 5 p.m. 
_________________ 1-18-tfn
For Rent: Nice 3 bedroom, 2 
bath, house w ith double 
garage w ith openers. Be 
available March 1. Call 
727-4263.

_________________ 2-1 TFN

For Rent: 3 bedroom, 1 bath, 
brick, fenced yard, and 
storage building call Janice 
Brown after 5:00 at 2487. 
__________________ 2-8-tfn

For Rent: Small 2 bedroom 
house 420 S. Wall, Call 
806-827-7612. Ask for Mar­
garet.

__________________ 3-22-c
For Rent: 2 bedroom trailor 
house 4 miles west of town 
on pavement. $245. west of 
town on pavement. $245.00 a 
month all b ills paid TV 
hookup. Call 727-4664 after 
5:00 p.m.
_______________________2-2X-C

For Rent: 1 bedroom 
furnished apartment, clean 
and neat. 6th and Fulton. 
Call Bill Riffe 396-5692 to 
look.

2-22-tfn

SUBJECT TO THE DEMOCRATIC PRIMARY MARCH 13

V O TE  FO R

BILLY BELL
Candidate For

COUNTY C O M M IS S IO N E R -P R E C IN C T  4 
SHERMAN COUNTY

Your Vote Will Be Appreciated
Pd. Pol. Adv. Pd. for by Billy Bell, Stratford, TX 79084

COON MEMORIAL HOSPITAL AND HOME

Located in a clean rural environment close to metropolitan area and easily 
accessible to the ski slopes of Colorado and New Mexico.

STAFF POSITIONS AVAILABLE:

R.N. - $12.00 to $18.00 per hour.

L.V.N. - $7.50 to $10.50 per hour.

Individual salary rate based on experience and prior tenure.

DIFFERENTIALS:

Weekends - $3.00 per hour for R.N. and $1.00 per hour for L.V.N. 
Nights - $1.75 per hour for R.N. and $1.00 per hour for L.V.N.
ACLS - 20 cents per hour for both R.N. and L.V.N.
Call Pay

FULL TIM E BENEFITS:

Paid annual leave up to 20 days per year.
Extended illness of 7 days per year.
Long-term disability insurance.
Life Insurance.
Health Insurance.
Dental Insurance.
Assistance with continuing education.

Relocation allowance for household goods over 50 miles is $3.00 per mile up 
to $1,000.00.

Send resume or call Zella Powell at:

COON MEMORIAL HOSPITAL AND HOME 
1411 DENVER AVENUE 

DALHART, TEXAS 79022 

[806] 249-4571 ext. 248

■K Classified Ad Rate ^
k̂

 16  ̂per word afte r 25 words 
$4.00 minimum up to 25 words 
16 cents each additional word first week 
8̂  per word on subsequent insertions'
$1.00 discount if poid in advance

¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥

¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥Deadline Noon Mondays 

★  HOMES R)R SALE ★ HELPWANTED^
ATTENTION-GOVEBN- 
MENT HOMES from $1 
[U-repair]. Delinquent tax 
property. Repossessions. 
Cail 1-602-838-8885. Ext. GH 
17671.

3-8-c

For Sale or Rent or Trade, 
House at 201 N. 3rd, 
Kathryn Crabtree. Call 
396-2146.

____________________ 2-22C

For Sale, 14 x 70 trailor 
house 3 bedroom, IV2 bath 
call 396-5630 after 6:00 p.m.

3-1-c

T H IS  B & S IN E S S  IS
C O N S U M E R
P R E F E R R E D

Service, 
Quality & Fair Valu

C hamber of commerce

Stratford

Chamber of 
Commerce

806-396-2260
FEATURED ON YOUR 

• WHITE & GREEN PHONEi 
BOOK COVER

r Stratford I
I Appliance Repair |
I Repairs to Electric and } 
I Gas Ranges, Refrigerators, ! 
I Freezers, Washers and [  
I Dryers. !
I WAYNE MERRILL i
I__ __396-2129^____ J

A T T E N T IO N -H IR IN G !*
Government jobs-your area. 
Many immediate openings 
without waiting iist or test. 
$17,840-$69,485. Cail 1-602- 
838-8885. EXT R17671. 
___________ ________3-8-c
Permanent position open-LP 
gas truck driver. Apply at 
Stratford Butane Company. 
501 S. Poplar. 396-2309. 
__________________ 2-22-c

EARN $7.75 HR.
We need assistance in 
evaluating and responding to 
daily work report submitted 
by our agents throughout the 
state. No experience neces­
sary; Paid to complete 
training. Work at home. For 
information send self-ad- 
dressed, stamped envelope, 
9V2 inches long to: AWGA, 
Dept. E, Box 161189, 
Atlanta, GA 30321.

2- 22-p
JOB OPENING 

BID BASIS

First Baptist Church has a 
job opening that will be filled 
through the bid method. The 
job available is for lawn, 
yard, and parking area care, 
and is for the entire year. 
Pay based on the accepted 
bid is paid in 12 equal 
monthly payments per year. 
Job description and bid 
forms are available at the 
office of F irst Baptist 
Church. A ll bids to be 
considered must be in the 
church office no later than 
5:00 p.m. on Monday, March 
12, 1990. First Baptist 
Church reserves the right to 
reject any and ail bids.

3- 8-c

No. 874 
BILL COX 

Worshipful Master
Thioi Thursday 

8 p.m.

PASTURE -  CAHLE -  STORM

INSURANCE 
See Us For NO

DEDUCTIBLE

FARM BUREAU INSURANCE
JOE FLORES

396-5538 Nights 396-5389

(cRem J la n d  d o .
710 S. Dumas Ave. 

935-7364
■•MS/ urnmmms

MIS
Prime business location Hwy 54 and Hwy 287 
intersection. If you need location with large showroom 
and storage—work rooms—and high number
traffic-This is It! Cali for details.
Very nice-3 BR brick, fireplace, built-ins-2 
bath-corner-fence-covered patio. $69,500.00 
3 Bedroom, 2 Bath, close to school, older home. 
$28,000.00
Beautiful 3 BR. 2 'P'ac®- New exterior
paint-motivated cO“  .,»o*i ,900.

Commercial
5 Lots on HWY 287, water and gas on premises.

Marty Bain 
396-2053

□
Tom Ferguson, Broker

Pat Johnson 
396-2243


