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Shootin'
Straight

By Dave Thompson

IT’S SHOWTIME!
Well, Friday night is 

almost here and that means it 
won’t be long before the 
Maines Brothers Band from 
Lubbock comes rolling back 
into Knox City for another 
night of country western en­
joyment!

Never heard of the Maines 
Brothers? Where have you 
been hiding all of your life??? 
This spectacular group from 
Lubbock is now ‘ heard 
nationwide on the Mecury 
Record label out of Nashville. 
They have appeared twice 
before here in Knox City and 
have completly thrilled the 
audience during both 
previous shows. This very 
talented group of young men 
goes all out to insure a family 
type of show that will be 
pleasing to all. The band also 
contacts other entertainers 
for each show and always 
manages to bring along 

..several other musicians and 
singers that add trem en­
dously to the concerts.

This year the show here in 
Knox City is being co­
sponsored by the Knox City 
Chamber of Commerce and 
the Pink Ladies of the Knox 
County Hospital Auxiliary. 
Both groups are working very 
hard to make the show a suc­
cess. A lot of fundraisers ask 
for your money without 
anything to give in return, but 
that’s not the case with this 
show. In return for your help 
by purchasing a ticket, you 
are being treated to a night of 
entertainm ent that is 
professional and top quality. 
This is the same show that 
appears hi Lubbock on a 
regular basis and the fans 
there insure that the Civic 
Center is filled to capacity for 
each show because they know 
what a good show really is. 
This is not a commercial ven­
ture where the sponsoring 
agency can depend on any 
number of thousands of 
residents to buy tickets. This 
show is a FUND RAISER 
that needs the complete sup­
port of a small community to 
insure its total success.

Those who are in attendan­
ce at the show this Friday 
night will have a good time, 
the Maines Brothers will see 
to that! Our hats off to the 
many who have purchased 
their tickets ahead of time. 
We certainly appreciate your 
support. Advance ticket sales 
have given us an excellent 
picture of where we stand in 
our financial planning of the 
show and the projects that the 
funds raised from the show 
will go towards. To those who 
will purchase their tickets at 
the door the night of the show, 
we also thank you and look 
forward to seeing you there.

M ore SH O O T IN ’
STRAIGHT next week, after 
the show......

THE MAINES BROTHERS BAND
...on Mercury Label

Maines Brothers Opry 
To Unfold Friday

Employee Of Month 
Program Changed

A change has been made in 
the Chamber of Commerce’s 
“Employee of the Month’’ 
program.

E ffective im m ediately , 
anyone wishing to nominate 
an employee may do so by 
calling the Chamber office at 
658-3442. Nominees will be put 
on a master list and presen­
ted to Chamber directors at 
their regular monthly 
meeting. Directors will then 
vote on the current month’s 
recioient.

Weather
FURNISHED BY PLANT 
MATERIALS CENTER 

4 Miles NW of Knox City
Date Low High Rain
5-22 70 99
5-23 67 84 .27
5-24 69 96
5-25 74 100
5-26 64 93
5-27 67 100
5-28 59 78

After several weeks of 
reading newspaper stories 
and hearing advertisements 
on the radio, the time has 
finally arrived for Knox City 
and area residents to enjoy a 
night of country western 
music with the Maines 
Brothers Band from Lub­
bock.

To be held this Friday night 
at 7:30 o’clock in the School 
Auditorium, the Maines 
Brothers Opry will be held as 
a fundraiser for both the 
Knox County Hospital

Auxiliary and the Knox City 
Chamber of Commerce.

Arriving in town on Friday 
at lunchtime, the members of 
the band and other enter­
tainers will also be attending 
the salad, soup and sandwich 
luncheon being held in the 
school cafeteria as a fun­
draiser for next year’s Knox 
City High School Scarlet 
Belles Drill Team. After the 
lunch the band will spend the 
afternoon setting up equip­
ment and practice session for 
the other entertainers who

Hospital Board 
Members Sworn In

Members Present; Vernal 
Zeissel, Bernard Brown, Ray 
Lynn Hardin, Benny Grill, 
David Perdue, Buster 
Lowrey, Maurine Redder.

Others present: Randy 
Abernathy and Dr. W.F. 
Thompson.

The April meeting of the 
Knox County Hospital 
District Board of Directors 
was called to order by Vernal 
Zeissel. Randy Abernathy 
then presented a tally of all 
votes cast in the April 7 Board 
Election. The tally sheets of 
the election judges were 
available for board member 
review. David Perdue made a 
motion the election results be 
accepted as canvassed. 
Buster Lowrey seconded the 
motion which passed 
unanimously.

Randy Abernathy then ad­
ministered the oath of office 
to the newly elected mem­
bers, Vernal Zeissel and 
Maurine Redder, and the 
most recent appointed mem­
ber Benny Grill. Nominations 
were then taken for president 
of the board. David Perdue 
made a motion that Vernal 
Zeissel be elected by ac­
clamation. Bernard Brown 
seconded the motion which 
passed unanimously. Ber­
nard Brown then moved 
Buster Lowrey be nominated 
vice-president of the board by 
acclamation. Maurine Red­
der seconded the motion 
which passed unanimously. 
Ray Lynn Hardin made a 
motion that David Perdue be 
secretary of the board by ac­
clamation. Maurine Redder 
seconded the motion which 
passed unanimously.

Under old business 
discussed, Bobby Hutchinson 
of the Munday Ambulance 
Service requested $30.52 
monthly to subsidize ad­
ditional personnel one 
weekend per month. Vernal 
Zeissel ask that board mem­
bers Ray Lynn Hardin and 
Buster Lowrey gather further 
data and present it at the next 
regularly scheduled board 
meeting.

Other old business was the 
need to repair the roof over 
the kitchen and nurses 
station. Randy Abernathy 
presented bids of $3,225 and 
$3,950 from Danny Payne and 
Queen’s Roofing Co. respec­
tively. Bernard Brown made 
a motion that the bid be 
awarded to the cheaper con­
tract pending validation of 
their bond and job perfor­
mance Maurine Redder

seconded the motion which 
passed with no opposition.

Randy Abernathy then 
presented the 1983 fiscal year 
audit report. After a lengthy 
discussion, David Perdue 
moved the audit be accepted 
as presented. Bernard Brown 
seconded the motion which 
passed with no opposition.

Randy Abernathy then 
presented a contract from the 
law firm of McCreary, Huey, 
and Veselka to collect 
delinquent hospital taxes. 
Abernathy explained that 
delinquent tax collection con­
tracts were now negotiated 
between the taxing entities 
and the law firm independen­
tly. David Perdue made a 
motion the hospital enter into 
the contract. Benny Grill 
seconded the motion which 
passed.

Other old business 
discussed was the recent fur­
niture gift from Burnett Ran­
ches. Randy Abernathy said 
a bill for the moving expenses 
would be forthcoming in the 
near future. He further ex­
plained the moving cost 
would be covered by 
donations and any additional 
funds needed would be 
provided by the hospital 
auxiliary.

Under new business, 
physician recruitment was 
discussed at length. Randy 
Abernathy presented several 
options available for securing 
an additional physician. 
Abernathy explained that ad­
ditional Medical Staff was 
needed for additional ad­
missions in order for the 
hospital to function in a break 
even or profit status. After a 
lengthy discussion board 
president Vernal Zeissel 
requested the administration 
check into available can­
didates and requirements 
and the topic be tabled until a 
later date.

Other new business was the 
need to present Richie Smith 
and Stanton Brown plaques of 
appreciation for their years 
of service and dedication. 
David Perdue made a motion 
the plaques be given to Richie 
and Stanton. Bernard Brown 
seconded the motion which 
passed with no opposition.

A lengthy financial report 
was then given by Randy 
Abernathy of March 
business. He covered the 
profit and loss position, cash

See Board,
Page Three

Dr. Thompson 
Receives 
CME Credits

FORT WORTH -  W.F. 
Thompson D.O. of Knox City, 
received 22V2 Continuing 
Medical Education (CME) 
credits while attending the 
85th Annual Convention and 
Scientific Seminar of the 
Texas Osteopathic Medical 
Association May 10-12 in 
Houston.

The American Osteopathic 
Association requires that its 
physicians earn 150 hours of 
CME credits through 
seminars and post-graduate 
courses every three years. 
Among the topics discussed 
at the three day meeting were 
radiology, orthopedics, der­
matology and treatment of 
elderly patients.

During the meeting Royce 
K. Keilers D.O. of La Grange, 
was installed as president of 
the 1,600 member group. He 
succeeded Robert G. Maul 
D.O. of Lubbock.
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are also scheduled to appear 
on the show. The auditorium 
will be closed to the public 
during practice.

Other entertainers on the 
show with the Maines 
Brothers will be trumpet 
player Tommy Anderson of 
Lubbock, saxaphone player 
Don Caldwell of Lubbock, 
gospel singer Buddie Lytle of 
Anson, the Angle Sisters, and 
10 year-old Clay Hewitt of 
Lubbock. Each entertainer 
appearing on the show with 
the Maines Brothers has done 
so many times before, in 
Oprys both in Lubbock and on 
the road.

Tickets for the show are 
being sold for $8.00 each in 
advance for reserved seats 
and $9.00 each at the door the 
night of the show. Tickets are 
still being sold at all four 
locations: the Hospital
Auxiliary Thrift Shop, the 
Chamber of Commerce office 
in City Hall, The Knox County 
News, and at the Music Box 
record store in Haskell. 
Ticket sales in advance of the 
show have been good, as 
many who are planning on at­
tending the show have pur­
chased ahead to reserve their 
seats.

With the proceeds of the 
show and bake sale auction 
going toward the two 
organizations, both groups 
will raise funds for projects to 
help out Knox City. The 
Hospital Auxiliary .group 
plans on using their share of 
the funds for the purchase of 
an ice machine to be donated 
to the Knox County Hospital 
while the Chamber of (Com­
merce plans on using their 
proceeds for printing costs 
involved in making up a 
brochure that will promote 
Knox City. When finished, the 
brochure will be sent out in an 
effort to attract more in­
dustry to Knox City.

Remember to plan ahead 
and reserve your seating by 
purchasing your tickets for 
the show early. There will be 
tickets available at the door 
for those who may be unsure 
of their plans prior to the 7:30 
starting time on Friday night.

Join The 
Parade

By NANCY MCGREGER

Parade lovers, this is for 
you! Benjamin is planning its 
1984 Homecoming for June 1, 
2 and 3. The festivities in­
clude a parade which will 
take place at 3:00 p.m. on 
Saturday, June 2. The parade 
theme is “Fiesta’’!

For those of you who love 
parades, we would like to in­
vite you to participate either 
as a spectator or a clown. Or 
come drive an antique car, 
ride a horse, or enter a horse- 
drawn wagon.

We would be thrilled to 
have a band, large or small, 
marching or mariachi. Drill 
teams and cheerleaders are 
cheery and colorful Kids, 
decorate those bikes. And no 
parade is complete without 
floats!

Trophies will be awarded. 
Dub and Jo Cartwright will 
again award the best entry 
with $100.00.

Questions? Call (817) 454- 
2081 or 454-3921.

Remember To 
Vote Saturday!

Voters are reminded that 
Saturday, June 2, will be elec­
tion day for the Democratic 
runoffs.

Only one polling place will 
be used for the June 2 election 
-the Knox City Community 
Center and polls will be open 
from 7:00 a.m. until 7:00 p.m. 
Serving as election judge will 
be Arche Lieb.

The main Democratic 
statewide runoff race is for 
Senate, where U.S. Rep. Kent 
Hance of Lubbock squares off 
against state Senator Lloyd 
Doggett of Austin. Also, 
runoffs will settle the

ME Churches 
To Begin 
Bible School

An exciting program has 
been prepared jointly by the 
First United Methodist Chur­
ches of Knox City-0’Brien 
and Benjamin for Vacation 
Bible School to be held June 4 
through June 8. Jesus Is My 
Answer is the theme for the 
school, to be held each week­
day from 9:00 to 11:00A.M. at 
the Knox City Methodist 
Church.

Classes will be provided for 
two years through grades five 
and six. All area youth are 
cordially invited to attend. A 
nursery will be provided.

A back-to-basics approach 
to Christian living is offered 
in VBS. Students will be 
challenged and involved 
through activities of Bible 
study, music, recreation and 
crafts to show that Jesus Is 
My Answer.

The challenging lessons are 
centered on the parables of 
Jesus and the ways the Bible 
teachings provide answers to 
life’s problems.

There will be fun, 
fellowship and spiritual 
growth for all at Vacation 
Bible School.

Moisture,
Tho Small,
Is Welcome

Even though the amounts 
were sparse, the showers that 
dampened the area Wed­
nesday of last week were 
welcomed by everyone. The 
.15 received locally was not 
enough to hamper wheat har­
vest, but was enough to give 
everyone hope that “maybe 
there’ll be more to come in 
the near future.’’

Areas to the south and east 
received slightly more but no 
significant amounts were 
noted in town. As much as 
one-half inch was recorded 
southeast of Knox City. 
Several area farmers are 
dry-planting cotton.

nominee for Justice, Court of 
Criminal Appeals Place 2 
between incumbent Bill 
Davis and Roy Greenwood, 
and Place 3 between Thomas 
B. Thorpe and Bill White.

Absentee voting for the 
Saturday election ended 
Tuesday and as of the News' 
deadline, only five had voted.

Black
Retires From 
Exxon Co.

Thurston H. Black with 
Exxon Company, U.S.A. 
retired on May 1,1984 with 36 
years of service. He was 
assigned as field superinten­
dent in the Midcontinent 
Division, Production Depar­
tment, Midland District, in 
the Bateman area.

In 1948, he joined the Com­
pany in Magnolia, Arkansas, 
as a roustabout. Production 
field assignments with in­
creasing  responsib ilitie s  
followed in various locations 
in the Southeast Division. In 
1973, he transferred from 
LaFayette, Louisiana, to 
Midland, and early the 
following year transferred to 
the Bateman area as field 
s u p e r in te n d e n t .  His 
hometown is McNeil, Arkan­
sas.

For the present time, Mr. 
and Mrs. Black continue to 
make their home in Knox
Citv.

Officials are hopeful that this 
is not indicative of the turnout 
for Saturday’s election. Even 
though Knox County does not 
have any runoffs, everyone is 
being encouraged to remem­
ber to vote Saturday and give 
their support to the candidate 
of his or her choice.

Haskell County will see 
Johnny Mills and Jack Whor- 
ton on the ballot for county 
sheriff and the winner is vir­
tually assured of succeeding 
Garth Garrett as sheriff since 
there is no Republican 
nominee.

In Baylor County, incum­
bent Don Mooney and Wes 
Hollar are running for 
sheriff. Hollar was the 
leading vote-getter in the 
May prim ary. Incumbent 
G.C. I^ney and Bud Slaggle 
are candidates for Precinct 1 
commissioner.

Please remember to ex­
press your preference Satur­
day.

City Pool Will 
Open This Friday

For those readers who have 
been anxiously awaiting the 
opening of the City Swim­
ming Pool in City Park, it’s 
only one more day! The pool 
opens Friday, June 1, and 
hours are from 2:00 until 6:00 
Tuesday through Saturday 
and from 2:00 until 5:00 p.m. 
on Sunday.

Brenda Correll will again 
manage the pool.

First Wheat 
Harvested 
Last Week

The area’s first wheat was 
harvested here last week.

Jimmy Albus brought in 
the first load to Knox City 
Grain, according to manager 
Billy Mitchell. The wheat 
weighed 60 pounds, and the 
moisture content was 11.2. 
The yield on the Northup 
King 812 dryland wheat 
averaged 41 bushels per acre.

David Albus brought the 
first load in to Charlie Myers 
Grain Elevator. According to 
manager Dave Oxford, his 
wheat weighed 59 pounds, 
moisture content was 9.9, and 
the Bona dryland wheat 
yielded an average of 33 
bushels per acre.

MAKING FIRST PURCHASE of the new shipping bag Imprinted P&W 
Mesquite, 128 North Second (West), Knox City, Texas 79529 is Mayor Buddy 
Angle, at left, who is quite proud of the new industry for Knox City. The 
labels previously had carried the Denver, Colorado, address of the firm until 
details had been worked out locally for an assembly line for the mesquite 
products. Owner Ray Pennington makes the sale.



Page Two THE KNOX COUNTY NEWS
Knox City, Texas, Thursday, May 31,1984

W I l i T
All Classifieds Must Be Paid In Advance Except For Established Accounts

REAL ESTATE

FARM LAND

★ NICE COUNTRY Home Site: 16 
Acres, 5 miles east cif Rochester. 
Water well, nice trees. Set up for 
Mobile Home, $20,000.00.

120 ACRES excellent farm land 
southeast of Knox City. Some 
water available. Old house.

HASKELL COUNTY Farm - 16u 
acres-excellent soil-2 irrigation 
wells w/o pumps. Approximately 1 
mile East of O’Brien, $850.00 per 
acre. OWNER FINANCING 
AVAILABLE.

31 ACRES east of Greyhound Stadium. 
All cultivated.

14 ACRES south of Knox City, woula 
do for Texas Veterans.

207 ACRES 1 mile north of Knox 
City. Has assumable loan for $60,000. 
Saltwater disposal well pays $100.00 
month. $900.00 ner acre.

PHONE 658-3211 TODAY

ALMOST NEW- 3 bedroom J jj 'y ^ o m e . Beautifully 
appoM M jnd[H ||st(^bM  C i ^ ^ p t o  see this one to 
belie>«® ®e I j l^ a R lP B s ^ f te  Roger Norton home. 
1.25 a J S ^ 8 7 ,500.00. An excellent buy. Appointment 
only.

THREE OR FOUR bedroom, living room, kitchen, 
1V2 bath, utility room. 711 Aspen. Good Buy!

ASBESTOS S I I^ G  - 3 or 4 b§^room super location. 
Fireplace, den, ^ n i t i e s .  Excellent buy
at $35,000.00.412^ th F o u r th .

NEW THREE Bedroom. Large den with fireplace. 
Brick home in Southfork Addition. Elegant Appoin­
tments. Ready for occupancy. 601 South 8th. Builder 
said sell.

★  THREE BEDROOM, one bath, new kitchen. Corner 
lot, nice cellar. 411E. Main. Excellent Buy at $20,000,

♦

TWO BEDROOM - Near City Park. Vinyl siding with 
big trees in backyard. Good buy at $13,500.00. 210 South 
3rd.

LIKE NEW - Three or four bedroom country estate. 
Located 4V2 miles north of Knox City on 10.44 acres. All 
the extras. Jus{ a super buy at $89,900. Owners are 
being transferred. Additional acreage available. Ap­
pointments only.

ALMOST NEW - 4 Bedroom Show Place. Vaulted 
ceiling, fireplace, 2 baths. Sunken tub in master 
bedroom area. Terrace. Double garage. Super well in­
sulated. Beautiful home - 605 South Ave. E., $134,000. 
No way to duplicate at this price.

—RESIDENTIAL LOTS—

ONE LOT, 50x100.202 North Avenue C.

EXCELLENT BUILDING Lots in Southfork Addition.

I REAL ESTATE

FOR SALE BY OWNER - 
Brick home in excellent con­
dition. Three bedroom, walk- 
in closets, living room with 
fireplace, kitchen, dining, 2 
bath, large utility room with 
sink, double garage with 
storage room. New carpet, 
central heat and air, plenty of 
storage. Nice back yard with 
patio, garden, redwood fence. 
708 Aspen, $78,000, shown by 
appointment. Call Coach 
Rogers, 658-3894. 4-26 tfc

HOUSE FOR RENT - 3 
bedroom, modern kitchen, 
carpeted, utility room/pan- 
try, corner lot, 411 East Main. 
Tom Haden (817) 559-6749.

5-314tp

COUNTRY HOME For Sale- 
Three bedroom, two bath, 
living room, den with 
fireplace, new carpet, patio, 
game room, barn and cellar, 
large backyard with rock 
fence. Shown by appointment 
only. Call Don Bunton, 658- 
3431. 3-15 tfc

F U R N IS H E D  T H R E E  
bedroom house with four 
acres in O’Brien for sale. 
Reduced to $12,000. 658-3172.
_________________ 5-10 tfc

FOR SALE By Owner -  
Large two story Victorian 
home in excellent condition. 
West of school building in 
Benjamin. Four bedroom, 
four lots, fenced, two car 
garage, storage room, shop, 
two out buildings. 454-2701 or 
454-2961. . 5-24 6tc

REAL ESTATE

HOUSE FOR RENT-Call
(817) 743-3513.______ 5-31 2tp

NEW 1984 Mobile Home for 
sale -  Complete, unfur­
nished. Jimmy Jack, 658- 
3778. 5-3 5tp

II MISCELLANEOUS 
FOR SALE

MISCELLANEOUS 
FOR SALE

IF YOU need some extra 
clean gravel for sale, call 658- 
3740 or 658-3957. 5-10 4tp

FOR SALE - Grain Storage 
Tanks and related items. See 
Lupe Lerma at the former 
White Feed Mill, 128 North 
Second (West), Knox City. 
P&W Mesquite Co., 658-3958 
or 658-3063. 3-22 tfc

FOR SALE - 1979 iviobiie 
Scout travel trailer, 29 ft. 
Rally M aster, heating, 
cooling, stove, refrigerator, 
good clean condition, 
$6900.00. Citizens State Bank, 
658-3527. 5-17 tfc

NEW SEARS Hide-A-Bed 
sofa for sale. In very good 
condition, $100.00. Plaid, 
green, beige, yellow tones. 
See Becky Rocha or Sue 
Wright. 658-3218. 5-24 2tp

FOR SALE -  Two large used 
hog feeders. Call 658-3290.

5-31 4tc

FOR SALE - G.E. white 
washer, Tappan built-in oven, 
electric Frigidaire 20 cu. ft. 
refrigerator with bottom 
freezer, frost-free. All are in 
excellent condition. City 
Hardware, 658-3222. 5-31 Itc

WHEATLAND - SWEEPS - 
Duckfoot & Spikes, Planting 
Busters and Cultivator' 
Sweeps 4” to 36” , Bearings 
for Rolling Cultivator, San- 
dfighters, one way tandem 
plows. Also for cars, pickups 
and trucks - oil, fuel and all 
filters, Delco batteries, water 
pump & fuel pumps, brake 
pads & brake shoes. Gates 
belts, A.C. & Champion spark 
plugs. Exchange starter & 
alternators, U-joints - bolts 
V4” to 1” . Egenbacher Im­
plement, Inc. 6-16 tfc

ANTIQUE AUCTION- Round 
oak table, pie safes, 4 oak 
chairs, large oak map case, 
oak shoe shine stand with 
marble and 4” brass caps, 
crocks, pitchers, post office 
boxes and window, mirrors, 
kitchen cabinets, crystal, 
china, depression glass, 
wicker buggy, church pew, 
trunks, cream cans and items 
too numerous to mention. 
Barbershop Antiques inven­
tory that has been stored for 5 
years. 202 S. Ave. D, Haskell, 
Texas. View merchandise 
8:00 a.m. Auction starts at 
9:00 a.m., June 2,1984. Lunch 
available. 5-31 Itc

FRESH BALED Alfalfa Hay- 
Allen McGaughey, 658-3782.

5-31 Itc

][ AUTOS-TRUCKS
TRAILERS

I
AUTOSTRUCKS-

TRAILERS

MISCELLANEOUS
SERVICES

1981 CHEVROLET, one-ton 
flatbed pickup, $5800; 16 ft. 
Gooseneck grain tra iler, 
$4,000. Craig Carver, 658-3813.

5-10tfc

NEED REPAIRS? Jon’s 
Automotive can take care of 
all your automotive needs. 
See us for repairs, tune-ups, 
brake adjustments, air con­
ditioning service, etc. 
O’Brien Highway. 658-3606.

5-17 5tc

MISCELLANEOUS
SERVICES

CRAIG CARVER Custom 
Haybaling and Cattle 
Hauling. 658-3813. 5-10 tfc

WATER WELL Drilling: 
House, Stock Irrigation 
Wells, Test Holes. Call W.P. 
Hise (817) 864-3727, Haskell, 
Texas (day or night) 864-3348.

2-16 tfc

CUSTOM FARMING and hay 
baling (round baling only). 
Call Ed Daniel after 5, 658- 
3196. 4-19 tfc

TW IRLING LESSO N S: 
Parades! Recital! For more 
in fo rm a tio n ,  c o n ta c t  
Peggilee at 658-3078. 5-31 Up

BRIGGS - STRATTON 
engines, parts, sales and ser­
vice. Factory aifthorized ser­
vice dealer. We can take care 
of your warranties. City Har­
dware, 658-3222. 5-31 Itc

HOUSE WELLS, Test Holes, 
Irrigation Wells, Sales and 
Service on pumps. Call after 
5, Leonard Drilling and Pump 
Service, 997-2132. 9-8 tfc

BAYLOR MILLING CO., 
T hrockm orton  Highway, 
Seymour. Custom mixing- 
pelleting-your grain or ours. 
Range cubes, creep feeds, 
start to finish. 817-888-5595. tfc

II OPPORTUNITY

OWN YOUR own Jean- 
Sportswear, Ladies Apparel, 
Combination, Accessories, 
Large Size store. National 
brands: Jordache, Chic, Lee, 
Levi, Vanderbilt, Izod, Gunne 
Sax, Esprit, Brittania, Calvin 
Klein, Sergio Valente, Evan 
Picone, Claiborne, Members 
Only, Bill Blass, Organically 
Grown, Healthtex, 300 others. 
$7,900 to $24,900, inventory, 
airfare, training, fixtures, 
grand opening, etc. Mr. 
Loughlin (612) 888-6555. 5-31 Itp

LEGAL NOTICE

THAT IN ACCORDANCE 
WITH SECTION 30.05 OF 
THE PENAL CODE TEXAS 
CRIMINAL TRESPASS 
(SENATE BILL 111 PASSED 
BY THE 62nd
LEGISLATURE), NOTICE 
IS HEREBY GIVEN THAT 
POSTED EXCEPT WHERE 
WRITTEN PERMISSION IS 
GIVEN TO COME UPON 
THE SAME.

CHARLES M. PRATHER 
TRUSTEE

The Knox City-O’Brien 
CISD is seeking bids on 
business and instructional 
computer equipment. Infor­
mation may be obtained from 
the administration office, 400 
North 4th, Knox City, Texas. 
Bids will be considered at the 
board’s regular meeting June 
19,1984. 5-24 2tc

I NOTICE 1
I GARAGESALE

EMPLOYMENT 1
WEEKEND RN N eeded- 
T h ro c k m o rto n  C ounty  
Memorial Hospital, Throck­
morton, Texas. Work two 14- 
hour shifts, paid for 40 hours. 
Call Kathy Massey, (817) 849- 
2151.______________ 5-24 2tc

WANTED - Boys or girls to 
operate fireworks stand in 
Knox City June 24 thru July 4. 
Write to Box 2013, Wichita 
Falls, Texas 76307. Give 
name, address, and phone 
number. 5-24 3tc

WANTED

GARAGE AND Yard Sale -  
Thursday and Friday, 9:00 
a.m. to 6:00 p.m. only. Fur­
niture, chairs, tables, 
mirrors, children’s clothes 
and toys, potted plants, etc. 
307 Main. 5-31 Itc

GARAGE SALE -  Friday
and Saturday, 1102 South 
Fourth. Curtains, bed­
spreads, children’s clothing, 
misc. 5-31 Itp

GARAGE SALE -  Thursday 
and Friday only. Lots of kids’ 
clothes and odds ’n ends. 1107 
South Third. 5-31 Itc

GIANT GARAGE SALE- 
Clothes, all sizes baby 
clothes, coffee tables, dishes 
and other merchandise. All 
items must go. Turn right 
from Church of Christ in 
Rochester, the third house. 
May 31-June 1, 9:00 a.m.-5:00 
p.m. 5-31 Itp

THREE FAMILY Garage 
Sale-701 North Second. 
Friday and Saturday, 8:00 
a.m. to 3:00 p.m. 5-31 Up
GARAGE SALE - Saturday 
till 5:00. Baby and all size 
clothes and misc. Peggy 
Estrada, 704 E. Main. 5-31 Itp

GARAGE SALE - 1009 S. 5th. 
Friday 9:00-6:00. Clothes, 
kitchen things, a few baby 
things, and misc. 5-31 Up

HOT & THIRSTY? Cool off 
with a delicious sno-cone 
from a variety of flavors. 
Only 35'. Open 4:00 to 9:00 un­
til June 1. Then from 1:00- 
9:00. Clay’s Sno-Cone Fac­
tory, 303 South Third. 5-17 tfc

FOR LEASE: A portion of a 
318 acre tract of land, for­
merly the J.E.F. Quisenberry 
property located in Throck­
morton County, Texas. All 
lease proposals must be sub­
mitted on or before June 30, 
1984. For further information 
on this land lease contact 
Pete Beecher, General 
Manager, at the office of Nor­
th Central Texas Municipal 
Water Authority, 135 N. Mon­
day Ave. Monday, Texas.

5-312tc

CARD OF THANKS

We would like to thank each 
and every member of the 
Knox County Hospital staff 
for the excellent care my 
mother, Oleta Welch of Ben­
jamin, received during her 
stay in the hospital.

A special thanks to the two 
fine doctors for their care and 
concern.

We are so fortunate to have 
these facilities and extraor­
dinary care available to us.

Harold Welch 
5-31 Up

HOME IMPROVEMENTS 
SCAMS AFFECT ELDERLY

While consumer frauds are 
widespread and pervasive, 
the elderly are special 
targets for these abuses, says 
Nancy Granovsky, a family 
re s o u rc e  m a n a g e m e n t 
specialist with the Texas 
A&M University Agricultural 
Extension Service. According 
to research conducted by the 
U,S. Senate Special Commit­
tee on Aging, home repair 
and improvement frauds 
were the most frequent type 
of frauds committed against 
the elderly, she explains. 
Nationwide, 71% of the 
elderly own their own homes. 
The majority of these homes 
were built before 1940. This 
combination of the number of 
elderly who own homes and 
the age of the dwellings is 
especially attractive to phony 
repairm en, notes the 
specialist.

NEWS DEADLINE 
10:00 A.M. 
TUESDAY

WANT TO MOVE - Old house, 
either move or tear down. 
Call 658-5080 after 5. 5-24 2tp

VOTE
SATURDAY

BARNEYARNOLD 
REAL ESTATE

200 N. 2nd Street 
658-3509

FOR SALE: 2 B/R 1005 S. 2nd St., needs a lit­
tle work but priced to take care of repair bill.
3 B/R 1002 S. 4th St., good buy, real nice. Has 
assumable loan.

EXCLUSIVE: The Don Bunton house S.E. part 
of Knox City, 3 B/R Brick, 1V2 acres. T.V. 
cable. Beautiful, lots of outside bldgs. Need 
to see to appreciate. Shown by appointment 
only.

NICE LOT 60x140 feet on South 4th St. A nice 
investment or to build on.

1
FOR SALE -  1979 Mazda 
GLC wagon. Good radial 
tires, new battery, excellent 
c o n d itio n . R e a so n a b ly  
priced. Call 658-3141 or 658- 
3654. 5-3 tfc

FOR SALE -  1981 Ford- 
Ranger F150 pickup, LP Gas 
System with 100 gallon tank. 
35,000 miles, white sport 
wheels, clean, $7,000.00. Greg 
Clonts, 658-3249. 3-15 tfc

FOR SALE -  1972 Chevrolet, 
six cylinder pickup, with 
rebuilt motor (not used 
much), good work pickup, 
good gas mileage. Call after 
5:30 p.m., 658-5028, Marie 
Rushing or see David Clounts. 
__________________3-15 tfc

1977 CHEVROLET pickup for 
sale. Heavy duty ton with 
Silverado package. Side 
mount tool box. $3,500, price 
firm. Call 658-3142 or 658-3131 
after 5:00. 5-31 tfc

MAKE OFFER on 1980 Ford 
Fairmont 4-door sedan. V-8 
engine, AC, PS, PB, AM-FM 
radio. Runs but needs some 
work. Call Dave Thompson at 
658-3142 during the day or 658- 
3131 after 5:00 p.m. 5-31 tfc

W H E N  YOU H A V E
■ ■ ■ I

THE M O N E Y  

BUT N O T  
THE T I M E . .  .

Our convenient Drive-In win­
dow is the answer. We’re 
open Monday through Friday 
from 9:00 A.M. to 3 P.M. So 
when you’ve got more money 
than time, give our quick 
friendly window a try!

D R IV E  I N . . .

Citizens 
State Bank

Member F.D.I.C. - Insured to $100,000
Knox City, Texas
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flow, cash disbursements, 
accounts payable, insurance 
report, census report, bank 
report, and the personnel 
report. After lengthy
discussion, Benny Grill 
moved the financial report be 
accepted as presented. Ber­
nard Brown seconded the 
motion which passed
unanimously.

With no further business to 
discuss the meeting adjour­
ned at 11:20p.m.

Vernal Zeissel, 
President of Board 

David Perdue, 
Secretary 

Minutes Submitted by 
Randy Abernathy

See (Js F o f
McPherson's BRIDE .& GROOM 

Wedding Stationery

INVITATIONS
ACCESSORIES

NAPKINS
RECEPTION ITEMS 

ATTENDANT’S GIFTS
Trained Consultants 

You May Check Out Books

The Knox County News

D r in k in g
llRIVING
D eath

A Combinat ion we  
CAN T LIVE W IT H !

Six Ffags Party To 
Feature Merle Haggard

Arlington-Country music 
legend Merle Haggard will 
appear in concert at Six 
Flags Over Texas on Satur­
day, June 2.

^Haggard, who has had 
more than fifty songs on the 
country music charts since 
the mid-1960’s is experiencing 
fresh success with his recor­
ding of “ Someday When 
Things Are Good.” Two mon­
ths after its release, the song 
is nearing the top of Billboard 
M agazine’s Hot Country 
Singles listing.

Two Haggard albums are 
selling strongly across the 
nation. One is titled “That’s 
The Way Love Goes.” The 
second, recorded with Willie 
Nelson, has become a country 
classic. It is titled “Poncho 
and Lefty,” and record 
buyers have been grabbing it

VISIT FAMILY-
Mr. and Mrs. Neil Perdue 

visited relatives last week in 
Port Arthur and Lufkin.

They visited Mrs. Perdue’s 
aunt, Mrs. E.I. Welch in Port 
Arthur and also visited their 
daughter and family, Mr. and 
Mrs. Duane Seay, Shelly and 
Kim in Lufkin. While in 
Lufkin, they attended com­
mencement exercises for 
Shelly. Also visiting the Seays 
were another daughter and 
family, Mr. and Mrs. Don 
Chandler and Jenny of 
Snyder.

up for more than a year.
H aggard’s perform ance 

will highlight Six Flags’ an­
nual All-Night Armadillo 
Party. The park will be open 
from 10 a.m. until 2 a.m.

Seating for the show will be 
on a paved asphalt surface. 
Park visitors may bring their 
own blankets or cushions for 
added comfort.

There will be a $2 concert 
fee in addition to the park’s 
usual $13.95 ticket. Children 
age five and under are not 
subject to the concert fee.

BARNETT VISITORS
Visitors of Mrs. Ida Barnett 

last week were Othella Bales 
of Fort Worth, Doris Jones of 
Seymour, Mr. and Mrs. Ted 
Johnston, Mr. and Mrs. J.D. 
Hollis, Mr. and Mrs. George 
Hodges and Mrs. Ida Pack of 
Knox City.

Mrs. Bales is Mrs. Bar­
nett’s sister.

New Dies 
Friday In 
Wichita Falls

Graveside services for 
form er O’Brien resident 
Esker New of Wichita Falls, 
uncle of Alex Godsey of 
O’Brien, were held Sunday 
afternoon, May 27, at two 
o’clock in the Truscott 
Cemetery. Rev. Bill Trice, 
pastor of O’Brien Baptist 
Church, officiated.

Mr. New, 82, died Friday 
afternoon. May 25, at two 
o’clock in a Wichita Falls 
nursing home.

Born September 11,1901, in 
Wayne County, Kentucky, he 
married Ella Mae Thompson 
in 1929 in Truscott. Mr. New 
was a Baptist. She preceded 
him in death on January 8, 
1959.

Survivors include two sons, 
Charles Mayfield of 
Albuquerque, New Mexico, 
and Billy Benjamin of 
Chapeack, Alaska; three 
daughters. Celeste Gray of 
F a y e tte v il le ,  A rk an sas , 
Wanda Yvonne Sells of 
Wichita Falls, and Barbara 
Jean Kincade of Farmington, 
New Mexico; and a brother, 
Delbert New of California.

IMPORT AUTO SERVICE
Most All Parts for Volkswagen 

Tune-Up Parts for Datsun-Toyota 
All Types Welding

Including Heli-Arc for Aluminum & Stainless Steel 
Licensed Aircraft and Powerplant Mechanic 
For General Aircraft Repairs & Maintenance 

Airplane Rental & Instruction
Covey’s Garage & Aero Service

817-658-3831
P.O. BOX 2552 O’BRIEN, TX 79539

NOW OPEN
at

Owens Radio & Electric
512 N. 1st, Haskell

VCR Movie Club 
Movies & VCR Rentals 

—VMS—
Call (817) 864-2536 

for details

Pasta Salad For 

Healthy Backyard Meals

It’s that time of year again 
when we find ourselves head­
ing outdoors and thinking of 
healthier foods.

Salads are a natural part of 
today’s lighter eating habits. 
Especially a salad that’s filled 
with good nutrition and is a 
snap to prepare. After all, who 
wants to spend time in the 
kitchen when the great out­
doors is beckoning?

Thinking healthy and eating 
lighter is a great way to head 
into summer with more vi­
tality. And serving Summer­
time Pasta Salad will help you 
get on the right track.

High-energy carbohydrates 
from pasta and body-building 
proteins from cheese are com­
bined with red-ripe tomatoes 
in this deliciously nutritious 
salad. Summertime Pasta Salad 
relies on a zesty herb-mustard 
vinaigrette for its distinctive 
flavor. And because Hunt’s® 
No Salt Added Whole Peeled 
Tomatoes are used, it’s not 
packed with unnecessary so­
dium. In fact. Summertime 
Pasta Salad contains a mere 79

milligrams of sodium per 
serving.

Using Himt’s No Salt Added 
Whole Tomatoes means con­
sistently good flavor and con­
venience, too. The tomatoes 
are vine-ripened and picked 
at their peak of flavor, then 
peeled and packed in less 
than 24 hours after coming 
off the vine.

If you’re having difficulty 
adjusting to a lower sodium 
cooking style, you can add 
your own salt at the table. 
You’ll find that salt added at 
the table hits your taste buds 
first, giving a more intense 
salt flavor than salt mixed 
into a recipe.

This idea, and many others, 
is contained in The Hunt’s® 
Plan, a 32-page color booklet 
with special cooking tech­
niques and recipes to guide, 
you to a tasteful but more 
healthy way of eating. Also in­
cluded are $1.00 worth of cou­
pons good on any of Hunt’s No 
Salt Added Tomato Products, 
plus a mail-in offer for an

% cup oil
Yz cup rice vinegar
1 tablespoon each: lemon 

juice and Dijon-style 
mustard

2 teaspoons sugar
1 teaspoon each: fines herbes 

seasoning and garlic 
powder

Yi teaspoon pepper
1 pound shell pasta, cooked 

and drained

small red onion, sliced 
and separated into rings
(14}4-oz.) can Hunt’s®
No Salt Added Whole 
Tomatoes, drained and 
chopped
cup chopped fresh parsley 
cup chopped celery
cup shredded Cheddar 
cheese

In a large bowl, blend together first 8 ingredients. Add 
remaining ingredients and toss to coat. Marinate 2 - 4 hours 
or refrigerate overnight. Serve on a bed of lettuce. Makes 6 - 8 
servings. Per serving: 319 calories, 5 gm protein, 24 gm carbo­
hydrates, 23 gm fat, 79 mg sodium.

New Wildlife Prints
By Wyman Meinzer 
In Stock Now For 
FATHER'S DAY

at
Art Stall & Frame Shop

KC Mini Mall 658-3957

REMODEL
YOUR

KITCHEN
AND

BATHROOM
CUSTOM

TILE
WORK

QUALITY
CRAFTMANSHIP

GUARANTEED
WORK

NAME BRAND MATERIAL

Compare & Save

Sonny’s Plumbing
10% SENIOR CITIZENS DISCOUNT

658-3162

Joe Earp 
Is Buried

Bob Jarvis 
Is Buried

Here Sunday In Munday

THE KNOX COUNTY NEWS Page Three
Knox City, Texas, Thursday, May 31,1984

News Deadline 
Tuesday 10:00 A.M.

Funeral services for 
Joseph Perry (Joe) Earp of 
Knox City were held Satur­
day, May 26, at 11:00 a.m. in 
Gillespie Baptist Church with 
Rev. Lyndol Cypert of­
ficiating. Burial was Sunday, 
May 27, at 9:30 a.m. in the 
Knox City Cemetery with 
Smith Funeral Home in 
charge of arrangements.

Mr. Earp, 73, died Tuesday, 
May 22, at 8:00 p.m. after a 
brief illness.

Born August 3, 1910, in 
Eastland County, he came to 
Knox County 27 years ago 
from Floydada. He married 
Opal Irene Moore on Decem­
ber 7, 1930, in Seymour. Mr. 
Earp was a retired farmer 
and a m ember of the 
Gillespie Baptist Church 
where he was music director. 
He also taught a Sunday 
School class for many years.

Survivors include his wife. 
Opal of the home; two sons, 
Wesley and James Bradley, 
both of Denton; two 
daughters, Jo Boggs of 
Mildenhall, England, and 
Molly Stringer of Floydada; a 
brother, John of Haskell; two 
sisters, Mrs. Bernice Jackson 
of Eastland and Ruth Mid­
dleton of Rising Star; ten 
grandchildren and two great­
grandchildren.

Pallbearers were Joe 
Warren, T.J. Partridge, Cecil 
Welch, Johnny Earp, and 
J.D. Hollis.

VISIT HERE
Kenny Lawson of Wichita 

Falls and Tom Robert and 
Hazel Campbell of Utopia 
were here visiting the Ken 
Lawsons over the weekend 
and helping them move into 
their new home.

Funeral services for Mun­
day resident Richard R. 
(Bob) Jarv is  were held 
Saturday afternoon. May 26, 
at two-thirty o’clock in the 
Church of Christ in Munday. 
Officiating were Larry Swan, 
church pastor, and Payne 
Haddox, DeLeon minister. 
Burial was in the Johnson 
Memorial Cemetery in Mun­
day under the direction of 
Smith Funeral Home.

Mr. Jarvis, 75, died Thur­
sday, May 24, at 10:45 p.m. at 
,his residence after a lengthy 
illness..

Born February 17, 1909, in 
Munday, he was a retired 
farmer. He married Laura 
Williams on July 10, 1937, in 
Graham. Mr. Jarvis was a 
member of the Church of 
Christ in Munday.

Survivors include his wife, 
Laura of the home; a son, 
Howard Thompson of Mun­
day; a daughter, Helen 
Cooper of Newcastle; two 
brothers, Woodrow Jarvis of 
Tucson, Arizona, and Luther 
Jjarvis of El Freda, Arizona; 
six sisters. Ruby Stice of 
Midland, Mary Welch of 
Munday, Ruth Hunter of Iowa 
Park , Lelia Morton of 
Clarendon, Margaret Ellis and 
Prudence Newsome, both of 
Fort Worth; seven g ran­
dchildren and seven great­
grandchildren.

P allbearers were John 
Rayburn, Gary Wilde, 
Howard Myers, Jerry Myers, 
Harold Partridge, Ray Har­
din, and Dick Moore.

FIRST UNITED METHODIST CHURCH 
406 teuth Second-Knox City, Texas

VACATION 
BIBLE SCHOOL

Theme: “Jesus Is My Answer”

JUNE 4-8 
9:00-11:00 A.M.

All Area Youth Invited 
Knox City, O’Brien, Benjamin

NURSERY WILL BE PROVIDED

BIBLE STUDY-RECREA TION 
MUSIC-CRAFTS

IN WHITE HOME
Guests recently in the home 

of Mrs. Myrtle White were 
Mr. and Mrs. Jack Wetzel of 
Lamesa and Mr. and Mrs. 
Gib Lowrey of Mabank.

Swimming
Pool

Opens June 1
Tuesday Thru Saturday 

2:00 P.M.-6:00 P.M. 
Sunaays

2:00 P.M.-5:00 P.M.

Brenda CorrelL Manager

additional $1.00 in coupons. For a copy of The Hunt’s Plan, 
plus savings up to $2.00 on any Hunt’s No Salt Added Toma­
to Product, send 50 cents with name and complete address 
to: Hunt’s Plan, P.O. Box 82595, St. Paul, Minnesota 55182. Please 
allow 6 weeks for delivery. Good only in U.S.A.

SUMMERTIME PASTA SALAD

BEVERLY CHANEY

has returned to

MINI MALL 
BEAUTY SALON

Call or Drop In 
658-3957 

or 658-3086

STOP EXPENSIVE PAINTING
United States Steel Siding

UNITED STATES VINYL SIDING 
ALUMINUM REPLACEMENT WINDOWS

100% FINANCING AVAILABLE

C.W. “Dutch” Benson Construction
BENJAMIN Authorized Dealer PHONE 817-454-3991

ALLSUPS
CONVEIilENCE STORESj

THERE'S OME HEAR YOU

PRICES EFFECTIVE
MAY 31 JUNE 2

OPEN 24 HOURS-EVERVDity-ICE-MONEV 
ORDERS GROCERIES-COOKED FOODS 

WHILE SUPPLIES LUST
THERE'S ALWAYS SOMETHINO GOOD COOKING 

FOR YOU AT ALLSUPS

ASSTO. FLAVORS 
ALLSUPS

6 Pack 
12 Oz. Cans

ICE
CREAM

TRY OUR HEW MERU ITEMSI
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News Notes 
from the . .

Brazos Valley Care Home
By Rena

Sunday School was held 
May 20 with Ozelle Stephens 
as teacher. The song leader 
was Joe Marion and the piano 
player was Peggy Guinn. Joe 
Marion and Peggy Guinn 
sang a special. There were 27 
present.

Church services were held 
Sunday afternoon with the 
Church of Christ officiating. 
Philip M. Burcham was the 
m inister. There were .60 
present.

Monday May 21 we had our 
Happy Hour with K.E. 
Woolley as minister. The 
pianist was Oliver Woolley 
and Doyle Graham as song 
leader. There were 22 
present. Special songs were 
sung by Rena Tankersley, 
Doyle Graham and Oliver 
Woolley.

Tuesday we had Rhythm 
Band with June Tankersley 
at the piano. The residents 
play along on their in­
struments and a good time is 
had by all. There were 23 
present.

Mid-week Volunteer prayer 
service was held Wednesday, 
May 23. The minister was 
Jimmy Rogers. The pianist 
was Kay Rogers. There were 
45 present.

Thursday we had Bible 
class with Linda Pierson as 
teacher. We had 20 present.

Friday we had exercise 
class with Linda Pierson as 
our instructor. We had 10 
present.

Friday afternoon Lois 
Smith dropped by to visit with 
all of us. She played the piano 
as we sang-a-long. We always 
enjoy Lois’s visits.

Janie Wilkinson', C.N. and 
Mae Harrison, Milt and 
Frances Begham of 
Lakewood, California, Van- 
nah Carmack, Neva Epley, 
M attie Bales, Dennis 
Grossman, Raymond and 
Phama Lou Wilhite and Jim 
Wilkinson visited E aster 
Hastey.

S yb il G reen w o o d , 
Raymond and Phama Lou 
Wilhite, Dennis Grossman, 
Mattie Bales, Edna Eubank, 
Lorena Burleson, Dewey and 
Marie D.arr, Bertha Wilde, 
Edwin Wilde, Pearl Gage, 
Lucille Abbott, Mary 
Ledesma, Jimmy Quintana 
and Jimmy Rogers visited 
Mae Flowers.

Ozelle Stephens, Phama 
Lou Wilhite, Mattie Bales, 
Edna Eubank, Remain Stub­
bs, Clay Hewitt, Gwen and 
Mark Decker of Lubbock and 
Billye Angle visited Bea 
Benedict.

Mrs. Qualls, Mrs. Pierson 
and daughter, Romana 
Helms visited Hazel and 
Waynell Clark.

Jimmy Quintana visited 
Juanell Strickland.

Pearl Gage visited Blanche 
Neatherlin.

Joe Marion, Lucille Abbott 
and Jimmy Quintana visited 
T.C. Carter.

USAF Seeks High 
School Graduates

Wichita Falls, T exas- 
Young men and women 
graduating from high school 
can enlist in the Air Force 
and delay their entry into ac­
tive duty for as long as 12 
months, according to Staff 
Sgt. McFarland, Air Force 
recruiter here.

“This Delayed Enlistment 
Program lets a person reser­
ve a guaranteed specialty 
months in advance. A 
graduating senior, for instan­
ce, can reserve an enlistment 
date today and still have 
some vacation before leaving 
on active duty,” he said.

“Research shows one prin­
cipal attraction the Air Force 
offers a person is technical 
training. And the Air Force is 
one of the largest technical 
educators in the world 
today,” McFarland stressed.

The Air Force has 
established several enlist­
ment options to offer sharp 
young people. These options 
include early promotion, 
guaranteed training, and 
more. Additionally, college 
credit for technical training 
is applied towards an 
associate degree from the 
Community College of the Air 
Force.

For further information 
about Air Force technical 
training, readers may con­
tact McFarland at (817) 691- 
6234.

Joe Marion, Edna Eubank, 
Lucille Abbott and Jimmy 
Quintana - visited Zollie 
Thomas.

Jimmy (Quintana, Deanna 
Dasfz, Dimples Eddington, 
Mother and Daddy, Edna 
Eubank, Diana and Justin 
Vasquez visited Kelton 
Smith.

Bobby Jee visited Minnie 
Reeves.

Jimmy Quintana visited 
Ruth Papworthand Elizabeth 
Lauderdale. _

Ruth Dozier, Raymond and 
Phama Lou Wilhite, Mattie 
Bales, Jimmy Quintana and 
Rhonda Hudspeth visited 
Frances Hudspeth.

Ruth Dozier, Virgil Mit­
chell, Regina O’Neal, Opal 
Collier, Raymond and Phama 
Lou Wilhite, Mattie Bales, 
Mildred Stubbs, Dennis 
Qualls, Ophelia Qualls, Audie 
Kempe, Laudie Qualls, Bar­
bara Thomas all of Fort Wor­
th and Jimmy Rogers visited 
Bertha Trimmier.

Marvin and Barbara Jones, 
Jewel Bailey, Beatrice King, 
Mildred Hodges of Lamesa 
and Joe Marion visited Ben 
Snelson.

Joe Marion and Jimmy 
Quintana visited Roy Oliver.

Kate Wheeler, Birdie 
Helton, Nora Culp, Mattie 
Bales, Phama Lou Wilhite, 
Raymond Wilhite, Remain 
Stubbs, Pearl Gage, Burney 
Camp visited Minnie Reeves.

Edna Eubank and Louise 
Finley visited the Clay 
Hoges.

Edna Eubank, Raymond 
-and Pham a Lou Wilhite, 
Dennis Grossman, Jimmy 
Quintana and Louise Finley 
visited Mary Lou Foshee and 
Dora Followill.

Edna Eubank, Jimmy 
Quintana, Raymond and 
Phama Lou Wilhite and Bill 
Baker visited Marjorie Baker 
and Corinne Qi§t,„.

Louise FjjQley', Ozelle 
Stephens, Edna Eubank, 
and Ophelia Qualls visited 
Vida Williamson and Athleen 
Owens.

Louise Finley and Lorena 
Burnison visited Horace 
Finley.

Brett Collier, Skeeter 
Feemster, Dollie Feemster 
all of Ha'skell, Mildred 
Hodges and Beatrice King 
both of Lamesa, George and 
Mozelle Hodges, Raymond 
and Pham a Lou Wilhite, 
Pearl Gage and Aaron Lewis 
visited Blanche Hodges.

Ida Barnett and Jimmy 
Quintana visited Dicie 
Singleton and Mary Sim­
mons.

Raymond and Phama Lou 
Wilhite visited Eda Faye 
Pounds.

STREAMS IN 
DESERT PLACES 

By OZELLE STEPHENS

“But we are all as an un­
clean thing, and all our 
rightousness are as filthy 
rags, and we all do fade as a 
leaf; and our iniquities, like 
the wind, have taken us 
away.” (Isiah64:6).

In looking at the facts of life 
and death, it says, man’s life 
is but a few days and full of 
troubles, in this world. So we 
have a short time to live here 
and make preparation for life 
after death. We must not 
neglect these most important 
things of this life on earth. 
God has given us His Word, 
the Bible, in it we find out 
about these vital matters. 
They are plain and simple, 
even a child can understand 
them.

Jesus said, “ I am the way 
the truth and the Light, no 
man cometh to the Father, 
but by Me.” The Bible also 
says. Not by works of 
rightousness which we have 
done, but according to God’s 
mercy He saves us. Titus 3:5 
says, “But when the time 
came for the kindness and the 
Love of God our Savior to ap­
pear, then He saved us-not 
because we were good enough 
to be saved, but because of 
his kindness and pity-by 
washing away our sins and 
giving us the new joy of the in 
dwelling Holy Spirit whom he 
poured out upon us with won­
derful fu llness-and all 
because of what Jesus Christ 
our Saviour did so that He 
could declare us good in 
God’s eyes-all because of his 
great kindness; and now we 
can share in the wealth of the 
eternal life he gives us.”

Seymour Invites Folk 
To See Olympic Torch

VISIT CHILDREN
Mr. and Mrs. Eddie Shaver 

were in Tyler several days 
last week visiting their 
daughter and her family, Mr. 
and Mrs. John Muller, Annica 
and Edward. They also 
visited their son and family, 
Mr. and Mrs. Brack Shaver, 
Braxton and Nolan in Denton.

While in Tyler, they atten­
ded a piano recital for An- 
hica.

The City of Seymour, 
Baylor County and the 
Seymour Chamber of Com­
merce wish to extend an in­
vitation to the citizens of your 
city and county to visit 
Seymour to see the Olympic 
Torch as it passes through 
our city.

The Torch is due to arrive 
in Seymour Friday, June 15, 
1984, at approximately 12:45 
p.m. on its journey from New 
York to Los Angeles for the 
Los Angeles Olympics. The 
caravan will travel Hwy. 114, 
coming from Olney and 
heading toward Lubbock. Of-

Kevln White To 
Attend Ranger Camp

On June 10, 1984, Kevin 
White will attend the South­
west Basketball Camp at 
Ranger Junior College in 
Ranger. This camp was the 
first overnight camp in 
Texas.

The camp was started 15 
years ago with 30 students 
and growing to one of the 
most attended camps in the 
Southwest.

The camp features some of 
the state’s leading coaches 
and some of the nation’s top 
coaches as guest lecturers. 
The Southwest camp is con­
ducted by Ron Butler, the 
camp’s original founder.

The camp stresses fun­
damentals in every phase of 
the game along with team 
play and sportsmanship.

Kevin is the son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Jimmy White.

FROM CISCO 
Mrs. Judy Price, Kristi and 

Timmy of Cisco spent the 
holiday weekend here with 
her parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Doug Meinzer.

Retired Teachers 
Close Out Year

The Knox County Retired 
Teachers Association met 
Tuesday, May 22, for a 
covered dish luncheon 
followed by games of various 
kinds. This was the last 
meeting of the club year.

Rowena Lane and Zoy 
Risinger were guests.

Hostesses were Mary J. 
Lankford, Tess Wall, and 
Margaret Siecke.

NURSING SCHOOL
The Seymour Hospital Authority School of 
Vocational Nursing is accepting app Heat ions 
for the September enroiiment from now until 
June 29th. For more information contact 
Ameiia Tayior, R.N. Schooi Director or Jenisu 
Morris, R.N. Director of Nurses at (817) 888- 
5572.

S e e  U s  F o r  A l l  Y o u r . . . .

Cotton Seed & Fertilizer Needs
W e  H a v e  I n  S t o c k . . . .

Certified Cascot B2, BRi, C-13
Cam D & Select Lankart 611

SPECIAL OF MONTH

Certified 37H..........  12.50 Per Bag

MILO SEED
Warner Taylor-Evans Franks R, C. Young Seeds

SPECIAL OF MONTH

Stockman’s Pride 1  ^
Hybrid Sudan........................ d l l  Per Bag

For Hay or Baling. . . .
Kow Kandy Red Top Kandy Red Top Cane

FERTILIZER
Custom Application  —  Liquid or Dry

Good Supply o f  all Fertilizer A Iso Micro Nutrients
Anhydrous Ammonia NZN-Zinc, Copper, Iron, Maganese

Zeissel Bros., Inc.
FERTILIZER & SEED

ficials, visiting our city, have 
advised us no one will be 
allowed to join the caravan as 
it passes through our town.

Seymour folk will be using 
the American Flag and State 
Flag to decorate our city and 
it is our goal to have most 
spectators waving flags to 
cheer the Torchbearers on 
their way.

Residents encourage folk to 
bring flags, banners or any 
type of sign to advertise your 
city or organization.

Small hand flags will be 
available, free of charge, at 
the stores in Seymour.

A review stand will be 
located on the east side of the 
courthouse, with cold drink 
stands located on the north 
side of the courthouse.

Come to Seymour June 15 
to see this once-in-a-lifetime 
event.

Burleson 
Rites Are 
Held May 16

Funeral services for 
Rochester resident Dwain 
Burleson were held Wed­
nesday afternoon. May 16, at 
two-thirty o’clock in the 
Church of Christ in Rochester 
with Owen Aiken, minister, 
officiating. Burial was in the 

.Rochester Cemetery with 
Smith Funeral Home in 
charge of arrangements.

Mr. Burleson, 85, died 
Monday, May 14, at his gran­
ddaughter’s residence in Ir­
ving after a lengthy illness.

Born March 17, 1899, in 
DeLeon, he was a retired 
farmer. He married Lavada 
Hanson on June 4, 1922, in 
Haskell. Mr. Burleson was a 
member of the Church of 
Christ.

Survivors include his wife, 
Lavada of the home; three 
grandchildren. Fern Walker 
of Irving, Lora McCormick of 
Eastland and Gale Burleson 
of South Carolina; and nine 
great-grandchildren.

He was preceded in death 
by a son and a grandson.

Pallbearers were Bobby 
Hanson, Ivan Harris, Aubrey 
Burdine, Barton Freeman, 
J.C. Halliburton, Manford 
Reid, and James Reid.

Jack Dozier 
Services To 
Be Thursday

Funeral services for S.S. 
(Jack) Dozier will be held 
Thursday afternoon. May 31, 
(today) at two-thirty o’clock 
in the First Baptist Church in 
O’Brien. Officiating will be 
Ben Charlie Chapman and 
the Rev. Bill Trice, church 
pastor. Burial was to be in the 
Rochester Cemetery with 
Smith Funeral Home in 
charge of arrangements.

Mr. Dozier, 83, of Lake 
Stamford died Tuesday, May 
29, at 4:00 a.m. in Methodist 
Hospital in Lubbock after a 
brief illness.

Born August 19, 1900, in 
Haskell County, he was a 
rancher and farm er. He 
married Evie Hicks Fannin 
on June 6, 1962, in Knox City. 
Mr. Dozier was a veteran of 
World War I and was a mem­
ber of the Church of Christ in 
Rochester.

Survivors include his wife, 
Evie of the home; five 
daughters, Ida Dean John­
ston of Knox City, Annette 
Holmes of Odessa, Wynelle 
Meek of New Orleans, 
Louisiana, Merlene Johnston 
of Austin, and Gerri Whit­
mire of Albuquerque, New 
Mexico; two sons, H.D. (Bud) 
Dozier of Morgan and Melvin 
Fannin of Rule; four sisters, 
Lorene Franklin of Haskell, 
Velma Williams of Quartz 
Hills, California, Hazel Mc- 
Caleb and Avis Lynch of Cor­
pus Christi; 22 grandchildren 
and 23 great-grandchildren.

He was preceded in death 
by two brothers.

Pallbearers will be gran­
dsons.

Clay’s Sno-Cone Factory
303 SOUTH THIRD'

Variety Of Flavors only 35̂  Each
OPEN 4:00-9:00 Till June 1 

AFTER JUNE 1 OPEN 1:00-9:00

Iauto
BOOX

V fO W

Windshields • Wheel Aligning 
Door Glass - Frame Straightening 

24-Hour Wrecker Service

Lewis Paint & Body Shop
658-3342 Sterling Lewis, Owner Nights 658-3330

Comptroller Rep.
To Visit Munday

A representative of Com­
ptroller Bob Bullock’s office 
will be in Munday, June 12, at 
the City Hall.

Hours for the represen­
tative will be from 1:30 until 
3:30 p.m.

BENJAMIN
FERTILIZER

Special On 
Seed

Haygrazer BAG 

Funk’s G-623GBR Milo

ON SALE
STOP BY & CHECK WITH US 

ON ALL YOUR FERTILIZER NEEDS

Benjamin Fertilizer
West of Railroad Tracks On North Side 

Of Road In Knox City

Munday Airport 
817-422-4517

CidU4toC8eR AVIATION, INC
Our Tenth Year Providing A Service’
HELICOPTER - FIXED WING 

Spraying • Seeding 
Predator Control 
Cattle Roundup 
Field Checking

Call Collect 
Stan Wojcik

Phone 422-4606 2 miles west of Rhineland on FM 2534

ANNOUNCING ANOTHER 
OLNEY SA/INGS 

BREAKTHROUGH;

11.25 EFFEC TIV E  
„  A N N U A L  
7o Y IE L D

1-Year Certificate of Deposit, $1,000 minimum.
When you invest in a 1-year 
Certificate of Deposit, you want 
to earn the highest interest 
possible. So, Olney Savings has 
come through again with a 
1-year CD that pays 10.8% 
interest compounded quarterly 
with an effective annual yield of

11.25. ($1,000 minimum deposit 
required, substantial penalty for 
early withdrawal.)

If you are in the market for a 
1-year CD that pays big, it will 
pay you to come see us at Olney 
Savings, or call and well come 
see you.

O L N E Y
S / J / I N G S
Member F.S.L.I.C.

M E

Olney Seymour. Jacksboro, Bridgeport, Nocona, Weatherford, Azie. Graham, Archer City, Wichita Falls, 
Brownwood Bowie, Vernon, Decatur, Boyd, Throckmorton, Albany, Anson, Coleman. Cisco, Holiday. Crowell 
and Gainesville. Also Ranger Savings in Ranger, Eastland Savings in Eastland, and Electra Savings in Electra.

All Divisions of Olney Savings.



Students 
Participate 
At Stamford

Thirty-one students of Mrs. 
Zoanne Felts were entered 
and participated in the 
National Guild of Piano 
Teachers Guild Auditions on 
Friday, May 18, and Satur­
day, May 19, in Stamford.

Students entering and win­
ning in the National Division, 
which is ten memorized 
pieces on their individual 
level, were Tressie Boyd, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Shelton Boyd; Starla 
Whitaker, daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Hiram Whitaker; 
Stephanie Pepper, daughter 
of Mr. and Mrs. Steve Pep­
per; Lori Boston and Robert 
Boston, children of Mr. and 
Mrs. Jon Muncrief; April 
Tankersley, daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Jimmy Tankersley, 
Jennifer and Johnny Grin- 
dstaff, children of Mr. and 
Mrs. Sam Grindstaff; Leah 
Rauch, daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Walter Rauch; Angie 
Staggs, daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Larry Staggs; Amy 
Deering, daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Larry Deering, all of 
Knox city; Kate Grill, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Benny Grill; Rebekah Duke, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Dennis Duke and Jody 
Moorhouse, daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Tom Moorhouse, all 
of Benjamin. Also, April Of- 
futt, daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Dan Offutt, Chris and 
Laura Burnett, daughters of 
Mr. and Mrs. Bobby D. Bur­
nett; Beth McPherson, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Jim 
Edwards; Amy Hosea, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Robert Hosea, Susan Whit- 
temore, daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Kenneth Whittemore; 
Tonya Kuehler, daughter of 
Mrs. David McGaughey and 
Greg Kuehler; Doug 
Edrington, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. James Edrington; Lynn 
and Ann Parker, daughters of 
Mr. and Mrs. Doug Parker, 
and Misti Zeissel, daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. Wayne Zeissel, 
all of Munday.

Students entering and win­
ning in the District Division, 
(six memorized pieces) were 
Jed Moorhouse, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Tom Moorhouse of 
Benjamin;. Trisha Roberts, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Don 
Roberts of O’Brien; Kacy 
Longan, daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Bill Longan and Amy 
Parker, daughter of Mr. and 
Mrs. Doug Parker, both of 
Munday. .

Nathan Staggs, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Larry Staggs of 
Knox City, was a winner in 
the Social Music Category.

Guild Auditions are an An­
nual ̂ National piano-playing 
event. The students receive a 
gold pin for National and a 
bronze pin for district. They 
also receive a beautiful cer­
tificate with their ad­
judication and a years mem­
bership in the National 
F ratern ity  of Student 
Musicians.

NEWS DEADLINE 
10:00 A.M. 
TUESDAY

Insurance Discount Offered 
On Completion Of Course

THE KNOX COUNTY NEWS Page Five
Knox City, Texas, Thursday, May 31,1984

AUSTIN -The State Board 
of Insurance has granted a 
10% discount, effective May 
1, on liability premiums for 
the private passenger 
vehicles of drivers who com­
plete a new Professional 
Driver Improvement Course 
now offered through Texas 
Safety Association, according 
to George R. Gustafson, 
Executive Vice President of

SERVICES OF THE 
CHURCH OF GOD 

IN CHRIST

The United D istrict 
Auxiliaries Convention was 
held at the Bethel Church in 
Abilene six nights of last 
week.

On Monday night, Supt. 
Bennett preached from St. 
John 4:7 and other verses of 
this chapter, a great 
message.

On Tuesday night, the three 
lady officials. Sister Annie L. 
Jackson, Sister Hilda Ward, 
and Missionary Melinda 
Robinson each brought great 
messages.

E lder George Blue 
preached from Rev. 1:9,10, 
and Rev. 2:10 on Wednesday 
night.

On Thursday night all of the 
speakers brought very good 
messages beginning with 
Minister James Washington 
from Psalms 121 and a great 
message was brought by 
Minister Greg Williams from 
Joshua 24:15, I Kings 18:21, 
and Matthew 7:13,14.

On Friday night Ass’t. 
Supt. Ward preached from 
Luke 10, “I Want To Be A 
(jrood Samaritian.”

Saturday night Elder John 
Blue of Kansas preached a 
good m essage, “ What Is 
Truth?”

Sunday school and morning 
service were held here.

A district appreciation ser­
vice was held at Southside on 
Sunday afternoon in behalf of 
our district Missionary, Mrs. 
Nettie M. Ward, it was a 
blessed service.

TSA.
“We believe that this will 

be welcome news for 
professional drivers in terms 
of the escalating costs for 
personal automobile insuran­
ce,” said Gustafson.

“While this discount ap­
plies to personal automobile 
policies, the course is a 
positive option for the 
manager trying to control ac­
cident-related fleet costs. 
This is a timely management 
issue since rates for com­
mercial lines have just in­
creased 17%,” he said.

“The manager who is faced 
with this up-front high cost of 
accidents will be looking for 
ways to reduce the com­
pany’s own accident inciden­
ce which carries with it an 
additional price tag in terms 
of productivity, equipment, 
and personnel. The 
specialized training of the 
PDIC is one of the steps such 
a manager can take,” he 
said.

Approved by the Texas 
Department of Public Safety, 
the PDIC is a modular 
classroom program  that 
requires only 8 hours, 
covering the following essen­
tial topics:

★  C o llis io n  av o id a n c e  
techniques.

★  Vehicle m aintenance, 
care, and inspection.

★  Driver awareness, aler­
tness, and ability.

★  Backing the big ones-how 
to avoid the fixed-object 
collision.

★  C o llis io n  r e p o r t in g  
procedures.

★  T r a n s p o r ta t io n  of 
dangerous goods.

“The Professional Driver 
Improvement Course, which 
was developed by the Canada 
Safety Council, is similar to 
National Safety Council’s 
t im e -p ro v e n  D e fen s iv e  
Driving Course, with the ad­
vantage of instruction 
tailored to the needs of 
professional drivers,” said 
Gustafson.

“The course is designed to

help them develop the good 
judgment they must exercise 
every minute on the road. 
The objective is to teach the 
drivers to foresee problems 
and drive to avoid the 
mishaps that can endanger 
their lives and the company’s 
assets,” said Gustafson.

Texas Safety Association in 
Austin (512/451-7421) and its 
affiliates the Safety Council 
of Greater Houston (713/523- 
2228) and the Safety Council 
of Greater Dallas (214/351- 
3236) are offering the course.

Locals Return 
From Fun Trip

Mrs. Elaine Lewis, Mrs. 
Larry Deering, Amy and 
Traci, Mrs. Danny Lewis and 
Brandon and Misty Hudson 
have returned from a fun- 
filled trip to the Dallas-Fort 
Worth metroplex.

The group visited Six Flags 
on Monday of' last week and 
while there saw the taping of 
“Country Crossroads” with 
hosts Bill Mack and Jerry 
Clower. During the filming. 
Misty was the lucky one to 
have Mack and Clower sing 
“Jesus Loves Me” to her, as 
well as interview her. The show 
is to be shown in the fall. Guests 
on the show included David 
Houston; a gospel quartet 
from Dell City, Oklahoma, 
“Promise” ; and the “Tum­
blin’ Creek” trio, which has 
appeared on the Grapevine 
Opry.

On Tuesday, they visited 
points of interest in Dallas.

Another highlight of the 
trip was when Mrs. Deering 
was the seventh call winner 
of a contest sponsored by 
radio station KSCS FM. The 
prize Mrs. Deering won was a 
chauffeur-driven limousine 
ride to Six Flags to the Merle 
Haggard concert on June 2 as 
well as a chance to win two 
twin Mercury Cougars. Mrs. 
Deering gave the trip she had 
won to a friend, Belva Pen­
man of Arlington.

ATTENDS MARKET 
Dessie Egenbacher, owner 

of The Lady Bug Shoppe, at­
tended market Sunday in 
Lubbock and visited with her 
son and his wife, Randy and 
Ann Egenbacher.

IN HOLLIS HOME 
Visiting Sunday in the 

home of Mr. and Mrs. J.D. 
Hollis were Mr. and Mrs. Roy 
Burgess of Snyder and Mr. 
and Mrs. F.C. Stanley of 
Lubbock.

for pe»»on to person.’hetHH

E q u ip m e n t  D e s ig n  ft R e p a ir

O iLfi& Ld ^ea^noloqu
!2^. c f^ iz a n

PH O N E  8 1 7 /6 5 8 - 8 0 2 3  
H O M E  8 1 7 /6 5 8 - 8 0 3 7

R O U TE  1. BOX 166  
KNO X C IT Y , TEXA S 7 9 5 2 9 .

Brian Burgess" 
864-3250

ATTEND GRADUATION 
Mr. and Mrs. David N. 

Perdue and Kristen were in 
Georgetown Friday night to 
attend commencement exer­
cises for their daughter, 
Robin Perdue. While there, 
they visited with Robin and 
Forrest Perdue. From there, 
the Perdues went to Lufkin 

1 where they visited Mr. and 
Mrs. Duane Seay, Shelly and 
Kim and Mr. and Mrs. Don 
Chandler and Jenny, who live 

, in Snyder.

FOR SALE

Three bedroom, two bath Brick Veneer, 2626 
Sq. Feet 1824 Sq. Ft. - Heating & Cooling

1V2 Mi. East On KC-Munday Highway

Prices, Terms, Etc.

SEE OR CALL 
Mat Verhaien, 817-658-3780

1951

W e've  
come a 
long w ay  
SINCE 1951

Whether you 
hove 0 house 
and path, or a 
house and both, 
we will meet 
your plumbing 
needs...

Guinn Sheet Meta! & Plumbing
< z H e ^c itL n ^  c / f i x  - C o n d i t i o n i n g

P h o n e  6 5 8 - 3 3 4 1 K N O X  C IT Y . T E X A S

K̂ iRMAN

S f " '
3/$20

510 N. 2nd /  HASKELL 864-3640

Felts Students 
Present Recital

Students of Zoanne Felts 
were presented in spring 
recital, Sunday, May 20, at 
3:00 p.m. in the First Baptist 
Church in Knox City.

Students participating in 
the recital were Tressie 
Boyd, Stefani Stephens, 
Suzanne Stephens, Jaclyn 
Tankersley, Heather Tilson, 
Sharon Jimenez, Doug 
Edrington, Andrea Longan, 
Amanda Gulley, Laura Bur­
nett, Kammi Haynie, Jody 
Moorhouse, Amy Deering 
and Alesha Rutherford.

Also, Jed Moorhouse, 
Trisha Roberts, April 
Tankersley, Lori Boston, 
Kacy Longan, Tonya 
Kuehler, Misti Zeissel, Susan 
Whittemore, Jennifer Grin­
dstaff, Angie Staggs, Johnny 
Grindstaff, Kate Grill, 
Rebekah Duke, Chris Bur­
nett, Beth McPherson, Tony

Fun Night Planned
Plans are underway for a 

County-Wide Fun Night, 
sponsored by the Knox Coun­
ty Unit of the American Can­
cer Society. The event will be 
held in late June and is plan­
ned to be held in Benjamin.

Hunter, April Offutt, Dixie 
Reid, and Amy Hosea.

Also, Stephanie Pepper, 
Ann Parker, Lynn Parker, 
Amy Parker, Jennifer 
Shaver, Starla Whitaker, 
Leah Rauch, Lawri Tanker­
sley, Robert Boston and 
Nathan Staggs.

Presenting duets were 
Lawri Tankersley and Robert 
Boston and Nathan Staggs 
and Robert Boston.

Certificates were presented 
to the Guild Audition winners. 
A certificate of merit was 
presented to all other music 
students.

Special honors went to 
Robert Boston for being a Six 
Year National Winner, Starla 
Whitaker and Leah Rauch, 
Five Year National Winners 
and Angie Staggs, Four Year 
National Winner. Each of 
these students received a 
Trophy.

Nathan Staggs, a 
graduating senior was 
honored with a trophy for his 
eight years of piano lessons. 
The last five years were con­
secutive years of study with 
Mrs. Felts.

Many out of town guests, 
parents and friends were 
present for the annual recital.

NOTICE
SUMMER HOURS 

11:30 to 3:00 
6:00 to 10:00

Tortilla Flat

BROTHERS AUTOMOTIVE
Electronic & standard ignition parts 
All types of automotive belts 
Batteries •
Chevrolet 4x4 parts in stpck
We can make all types of air conditioner hoses
& have sizes Va” to 5/8” in stock.
We also have GM and Ford Air Conditioner 
compressor seals, freon & compressor oil.
We can order any parts needed for auto air 
conditioners

STATE INSPECTION STATION—
Craig Brothers, Owner 

- 908 E. Main, Knox City
Phone 658-5031

Cindy Reynolds
WILL BE WORKING AT

THE HAIR STATION 
Tuesdays thru Saturdays
658-3284 Knox City

REVIVAL
Ceiebrating Pentecost

with

Evangelist Bili Jeynes

m

SUN DA Y THRU WEDNESDA Y 
JUNE 10-13 7:00 P.M.

FOURSQUARE CHURCH
Rev. Dave Stone, Pastor
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Your Vote Is Important! 
Please Remember To Vote Saturday!
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[STAMPS I

^ fR IfN W Y
AFFILIATED 

SUPER MARKETS
KNOX CITY

TEXSUN

GOOCH'S
BLUE
RIBBON ^ i . L b . P k g :

BACON r
K raft Singles

'A'American 
Pimento 

★ Swiss

1 2 -o z . Pkg.

GRAPEFRUIT 
JUICE

SPECIALS GOODTHURS., FRI., 
SAT., MAY 31, JUNE 1-2
We Reserve The Right To Limit Quantities!

UNSWEETENED 
SOFT DRINK MIX

—  2 QT. ENVELOPES

6 / !

DELTA
Bathroom Tissue
4-Roll Package................. .............

Treesweet Frozen Orange

Juice
6-oz. Can.

Aiaour Star Vlenaa

SAUSA6E
5-oz. Cans..................................  ^0

NABISCO

CHIPS
AHOYI
19-oz. Pkg.

Towels ^

Limit one with SI 0.00 or more purchase J

Chenies
Fresh
Bing

BAKER
RUSSET

Potatoes

FREE-FREE  
Free Groceries!

To Be Given Away 
SATURDAY, JUNE 2,6 P.M.
FIRST PRIZE$50.00-SECOND PRIZE $25.00! 

Need Not Be Present To Win 
LAST WEEK’S WINNERS

Ida Pack, KC, $50.00 
Edna Eubank, KC, $25.00

CELLO BAG

HADISHES
or Fresh Qrssn

ONIONS
Mix or Match!

\ M

Carrots
Fresh 2-Lb. Bag

4 9 0

P57I

DEL MONTE  
Cut or French Styie

GREEN
BEANS

Regular or No Salt

16-oz.
Cans

(Limit 3)



Kent Hance 
Endorsed By 
Gib Lewis

Fort Worth - Democratic 
Senate candidate Kent Hance 
recently received a major 
boost for his campaign when 
Texas House Speaker Gibson 
D. “Gib” Lewis endorsed his 
candidacy for the June 2 
runoff.

Speaker Lewis said Hance 
is the most qualified can­
didate Democrats could 
nominate for the general 
election in November. “Kent 
Hance has a strong record of 
leadership in Washington, 
and as a State Senator in 
Austin,” Lewis said. 
“ Congressman Hance has 
run hard on the issues, and he 
is standing firm  on his 
record,” he added.

The Speaker also said, “I 
think Kent Hance best 
represents the political 
philosophy of most Texans. 
He is independent, and 
willing to stand up for what 
he believes in. I’m convinced 
that Kent Hance will fight for 
the interests of all Texans on 
the floor of the United States 
Senate.”

House Speaker Lewis ap­
peared with Congressman 
Hance at an afternoon news 
conference where a majority 
of the T arran t County 
Democratic State delegation 
also endorsed the Hance can­
didacy. State Senator Bob 
Glasgow, and State 
R ep resen ta tiv es  C harlie 
Evans, Mike Millsap, Bruce 
Gibson, Roy English, and 
W.G. “Bill” Coody added 
their support for Kent Hance 
in the June 2nd election. State 
R e p re s e n ta t iv e  C h arlie  
Evans is Chairman of the 
Tarrant County delegation, 
and he also chairs the House 
Administration Committee.

Noting such strong support 
from T arran t County, 
Speaker Lewis said that Kent 
Hance has a proven record of 
effectiveness Texas voters 
can be proud of. “Kent Hance 
has been involved in some of 
the major legislative battles 
of the last six years in 
Washington,” Lewis said. He 
added, “Congressman Hance 
has shown he has the ability 
to get things done and to fight 
for what is best for Texas. We 
need Kent Hance in the 
Senate.”

In welcoming the endor­
sement Hance said, “The 
backing of Speaker Lewis is 
especially gratifying because 
he is so closely attuned to the 
thinking of most Texans. But 
endorsements alone won’t 
win this election. That’s why I 
look forward to continuing to 
talk about the issues and 
telling voters about my 
record. Once Texans see how 
clear the choices are in this 
runoff. I’m convinced they 
will agree I can best 
represent the Texas 
philosophy in the U-S 
Senate.”

WEEKEND VISITORS 
Visiting over the Memorial 

Day weekend in the home of 
their parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Henry L. White, were their 
son Adam, student at NTSU 
in Denton, and their daughter 
Jane, who is the head of the 
computer service a t the 
University of the Permian 
Basin in Odessa.

ENGAGEMENT ANNOUNCED •• Mary Louise 
Williams of Rochester is announcing the 
engagement of her daughter, Neicole Michelle 
to Gerald Eli Ward, son of Nettie Mae and Leon 
Ward. The couple will exchange vows June 10 
at 2:00 p.m. in the Church of God in Christ in 
Rule.

Last Call! 
May

Renewals 
Due Now!

Postal regulations require 
that all subscriptions be paid 
in advance. Local rates 
(within a 50 mile radius) are 
$8.50, within Texas $10.00 and 
out-of-state $12.00.

Larry Bearly, CO 
Stamford Coca Cola, Stam­
ford
Clyde Day, Lubbock 
Hardy Day, CA 
Mozelle Fletcher, Rochester 
Mrs. Nomah Francisco, Fort 
Worth
Terry Hester, Graham
Ken Lawson Jr., Wichita
Falls
Mr. Ken Le Forge, Abilene 
Brooks E. Lemond, Hurst 
Joseph R. Martinez, MI 
Ben Moore, Knox City 
Greg Oliver, Knox City 
Jerry Rav. Knox City 
H.A. Rpeves. Munday 
Mrs. M.I. Shipman, 
jamin
Jackie Snailum, Plano 
Pearl Stephens, NM 
Janie Wilkinson, Knox City 
Ronnie Worley, CO

Ben-

LOOK WHO’S HERE
Mr. and Mrs. Adrian Gon­

zales of Austin are the proud 
parents of a baby boy born 
Monday, May 14, at 6:00 p.m. 
in Seton Medical Center in 
Austin. The young lad has 
been named Adrian Daniel 
and he weighed in at six 
pounds, eight ounces, and 
measured 20 inches in length.

Paternal grandparents are 
Mr. and Mrs. Celsp (Jonzales 
of Knox City, and Mr. and 
Mrs. Manuel B arrera of 
Premont are maternal gran­
dparents.

Paternal great-grandfather 
is Lazaro Chapa of 
Benavides

TERMITES - RDACHES - TICKS

PEERING EXTERMINATING
Commercial - 9iesiele/Uial

817-658-5000

LARRY DEERING FREE ESTIMATES
1107 SOUTH THIRD INSURED & LICENSED
KNOX CITY, TX 79529 TEXAS PCL #5054

"IF BUGS YOU'RE FEARING - CALL DEERING”

Services Are 
Held Monday 
For Duncan

Funeral services for 
Rochester resident R.C. 
(Junior) Duncan were held 
Monday afternoon. May 28, at 
two o’clock in the First Bap­
tist Church in Rochester with 
the Rev. Truett Kuenstler, 
pastor, officiating. Burial 
was in the Rochester 
Cemetery with Smith 
Funeral Home in charge of 
arrangements.

Mr. Duncan, 60, died 
Saturday, May 26, at 10:05 
p.m. in a Haskell hospital.

Born May 2, 1924, in 
Eastland County, he moved 
to Haskell County with his 
parents, Raymond and Shada 
Duncan as a child. He 
married Dorothy Webb on 
February 1,1945, in Rule. Mr. 
Duncan was an operation 
foreman for §ohio Petroleum 
Company. He was a World 
War II veteran, a member of 
the VFW, Post #7208 in 
Midland, a member of the 
Masonic Lodge in Rochester, 
and a member of the Baptist 
Church in Rochester.

Survivors include his wife, 
Dorothy of the home; and a 
daughter, Shirley Lemley of 
Amarillo.

P allbearers were Bill 
Neeley, Larry Beauchamp, 
Herbert Williams, Roger 
Webb, Terry Carter, and Clif­
ton Duncan.

Honorary pallbearers were 
David Epley, Son Webb, Shot 
Webb, Burl Duncan, and em­
ployees of Sohio Petroleum 
Company.

Jane’s News Notes
By Jane Locknane

THE KNOX COUNTY NEWS Page Seven
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In cooking, think about 
what the salt in a recipe will 
contribute before you add it 
automatically. Reducing or 
eliminating the salt from 
home baked goods, including 
breads, will not affect rising 
or texture.

The same is true for that 
“pinch of salt” you are told to 
add to beaten egg whites and 
to cooking w ater for 
vegetables or pasta. It won’t 
contribute much to taste or 
texture, but a generous pinch 
may contain more sodium 
than a whole day’s recom­
mended intake. By the way, 
what is recommended? Doc­
tors call 2 grams of sodium or 
5 grams of salt per day a 
moderate sodium restriction.

Our doctors have told us. 
Time magazine has told us. 
Consumer groups and gover­
nment experts have told us: 
Our bodies don’t need as 
much salt as we use. Salt, or 
more accurately the sodium 
in salt, seems to contribute to 
high blood pressure (HBP) in 
some people.

Doctors believe that some 
people can cut their chances 
of getting HBP by cutting 
down on the salt they con­
sume. With their doctor’s ad­
vice, some people who 
already have HBP can

Second Quarter 
Estimate Due

Some wage earners and 
other individuals who have 
income other than wages 
may be required to make 
estimated tax payments, the 
Internal Revenue Service 
says.

Generally, if you have in­
come, with no tax withheld, of 
more than $500 and you ex­
pect to owe at least $400 on 
this year’s return, you are 
liable for filing a declaration 
of estimated tax and for 
making payments.

Just like withholding by 
employers, the IRS says, 
estimated taxes are paid in 
advance of the actual tax 
return. Form 1040, due for the 
year. Estimated taxes are 
normally paid in four in­
stallments.

For 1984, the four estimated 
tax installment dates are: 
April 16, 1984; June 15, 1984; 
September 17, 1984; and 
January 16,1985.

ODESSA CREW WINS
Phil Robinson of Odessa, 

son-in-law of Janie and Jim 
Wilkinson, competed last 
Saturday and Sunday in the 
Oil Field Olympics, and ac­
cording to the Wilkinsons, his 
crew won first place in the 
double decker pulling unit. 
They competed against 
Oklahoma, Kansas, and 
Texas entries.

Phil, who works derrick 
and the members of the 
fourman crew, each won gold 
belt buckles plus money, Mrs. 
Wilkinson said.

CUSTOM
DESIGNED

SPRINKLER
SYSTEMS

AUTOMATIC
CONTROLS

MANUAL
MANIFOLDS

EQUAL CONTROL OF WATEI) TO LAWN

' ' S  fSONNY’S
RAINBIRD

PLUMBINGI
TORO

POP UP HEADS

ALL WORK INSTALLED BY 
LICENSED PLUMBER

658-3162

reduce the amount of 
medicine they need or lower 
pressures to healthy levels 
without using drugs at all.

The first step in cutting 
back on your salt intake is to 
take the salt shaker off the 
table. Next, eat fewer foods 
that taste salty. These 
changes will help, but as a 
salt-wise shopper and cook, 
you can do more.

We all need to be aware 
that nearly all processed 
foods are much higher in 
sodium than fresh foods. On 
package labels, many dif­
ferent words mean that the 
product contains sodium: 
salt, monosodium glutamate, 
sodium benzoate, and di­
sodium phosphate are some 
examples. If a label does not 
give the exact amounts, 
remember that ingredients 
are listed in order of quan­
tity; those cutting down on 
sodium might avoid buying 
products when a sodium word 
is among the first three 
ingredients listed.
Une teaspoon of salt contains 
2.3 grams of sodium. A diet 
moderately restric ted  in 
sodium should contain no ad­
ded salt, because naturally 
occurring sodium is already 
present in many foods.

Take heart. Most people 
find that the less salt they 
use, the less they want. You 
have to give it a chance so try 
it for a couple of weeks.

SALT SUBSTITUTE
1 teaspoon chili powder
2 teaspoons ground oregano 
2 teaspoon black pepper
1 tablespoon garlic powder (not 

garlic salt)
2 tablespoons dry mustard
6 tablespoons cmion powder (not 

onion salt)
3 tablespoons paprika
3 tablespoons poultry seasoning 

Mix all seasonings 
together and put in your salt 
shaker.

Mitzi Welch 
Is Jr. High 
Valedictorian

Mr. and Mrs. Lloyd 
Waldrip were in Crowell 
recently to attend the eighth 
grade commencement. Mitzi, 
their granddaughter, and 
daughter of Martha Kay and 
Don Welch was valedictorian 
with a grade average of 98.28. 
The salutatorian was Jonna 
Block with a grade average of 
97.40. Other honor students 
having grade averages in the 
high 90’s were Karen 
Hopkins, Brandi Todd, Lance 
Ayers, Leesa Manard and 
Leann Johnson.

Mitzi has had a very active 
year which includes her par­
ticipating in 4-H activities. 
This year, she won alternate 
to State in the food division. 
In the Foard County 4-H and 
FFA project show her lamb 
was reserve champion. She 
also won the showmanship 
award of the lamb show. In 
the senior public speaking 4- 
H contest, she won third place 
and was reporter for the 4-H 
Junior Leader. Mitzi also won 
second place in the 
“Abraham Lincoln” essay 
contest, sponsored by the 
VFW.

In UIL, Mitzi won second 
place in number sense. She 
was secretary of the eighth 
grade and participated in 
basketball and track.

Besides her school, Mitzi 
has found time to be 
president of the Junior High 
United Methodist Youth and 
enjoys playing piano for her 
church and school activities.

E L E C T R IC R L
FEDDERS SALES & SERVICE

^Oil Field ^Industrial ^Repair 
if Wiring ir Irrigation if Commerical 

Buy An Air-Conditioner With Efficiency 
Rating Of 8.5 Or Above And 

Get A Rebate From WTU

Collins Electric
Willie R58-3921 Tommy

* ^ o y d “
Welding 
Service

Backhoe Service 
Available

24 Hr. Service
Shelton Boyd I
(817)658-3639 J ll

1
E
■
■

Ex-Coach Visits 
Here Thursday

A former basketball coach, 
Craig Walling, and his wife 
Fern of Las Cruces, N.M., 
visited friends here last 
Thursday. It was the first 
time Walling had returned to 
Knox City since he finished a 
year’s coaching in May 1939 
prior to his enlisting in the 
U.S. Air Force.

The Wallings were en route 
to Sherman, Texas, due to a 
death in the family.

When your 
water system 

lets you 
down. . .

CALL

lYN N  ELECTRIC 
MOTOR CO., fflC. 

658-0511
YOUR JACUZZI DEALER!

SOUTHWEST INSULATION
Blown Insulation-Cellulose- Rockwool-Fiberglass 

Spray on Metal Building

Tracy Cartwright, Owner 
Benjamin, Texas

817-454-3071 P.O. Box 197

For Checking Accounts,
Can Believe In 

Olney Savings.

The Olney Savings/Checking Account 
The Olney Savings/Check Club 

The Olney Savings/Super Checking Account 
Commercial Checking

OLNEY
SA/INGS

For (details, come see us soon, or call and well come see you.
Member FSLIC

Olney, Seymour, Jacksboro, Bridgeport, Nocona, Weatherford, Azie, Graham, Archer City, Wichita Falls, 
Brownwood, Bowie, Vernon, Decatur, Boyd, Throckmorton, Albany, Anson, Coleman, Cisco, Holliday, Crowell 
and Gainesville. Also, Ranger Savings in Ranger, Eastland Savings in Eastland, and Electra Savings in Electra.

All Divisions of Olney Savings.
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Smart girls per IJQNOHORN STYLE .& MATUMl \  N
^CHEDDAR CHEESE

KRAFT HALF MOON

C H EES E
10-oz Pkg.

GENERIC COUNTRY FRESH

BREAD
2 LITER
No Return

BOTTLES

'BigDip
I C f milk;

MEDIUM

ROLL

With 1 Super Discount booklet With 1 Super Discount booklet

T-BONE
279
SIRLOIN 
STEAK

GLADIOLA

FLOUR

■ ® a s i

G A LLO N  JU G
With 1 Super Discount booklet

KOotSlD
With 1 Super Discount booklet

V a-G ol.

With 1 Super Discount booklet
DOZEN

With 1 Super Discount booklet

ASSORTED FLAVORS 
REGULAR 

FOR

SUGAR SWEETENED

HORMEL Market Sliced

Pressed Ham
KRAFT
PHILADELPHIA 
CREAM CHEESE 
DRESSINGS 8 0Z. 

BOTTLE

HOT DOG 
SAUCE

WOLF BRAND

10 OZ. 
CANS

KRAFT DINNER

niAGAROm & CHEESE 2 7 % -O i.
Boxes

5-Lb.
Bag

GLADIOLA CORNBREAD, PANCAKE m  «

P O U C H  M IX E S  4 -. L

KRAFT

^Miracle Whip Light
REDUCED
CALORIES

SALAD
DRESSING 32 OZ.

BEEFiBE***

Kraft

GRAPE I  e C  
JEllY ■•0 ®

vam FOR

F8QZEN TC»STER fILAUr
W affles

3-LB. JAR

Mazola
OIL 48-Oz. BHe.

T ujellqI
^  i h s t a n t ]

PUDDING & PIE RLUNG

U p t o n
mjS) _____

tea bags
24 Count Family Size

5 0z. 
Pkg. 
FOR

MRS. SMITH
2-Count Package

Sheik i .09

m
PETER PAN

PEANUT BUTTER
28 OZ 
JAR

(a o jM M m r.

10.5 Ozs.

RALLARD
CAHHED BISCUITS

Hunts
TOMATO SAUCE

MAXWELL HOUSE

COFFEE a x l c
»K1*UT OlW lOfO W«»utoiunti(BPa)»w«“*^

8 0z. 
Cans

15 OZ. CANS

M B . CAN

■<

Imperial NABISCO PREMIUM

CRACKERS 1-Lb. Box

1.6
CANfALOUPE

33(
POTATOES

US#1 I FQ
10-Lb. Bag

CALIFORNIA RED

PLUMS 59> Pound

FLORIDA

TOMATOES 390

WRIGHT’S
MARKET SLICED

SCRATCH! MATCH! N...

i

ueiie
1 l E F IBUD oil 9̂ '""' I com

with any led0a»|how,ng,ne3amepnze
save ALL HALVES

«IGHT HALF

SEE DETAILS IN  STORE!

CONTINUED LIST OF WINNERS

ELSIE LAWSON, KNOX CITY 
ALTON HESTER, KNOX CITY 
JOHN MILFORD, KNOX CITY 
NETTIE JOHNSON, KNOX CITY 
FREDDY ROQUE, KNOX CITY (2WINS) 
L.G. VASSAR, KNOX CITY (2WINS) 
AMILEE WILSON, KNOX CITY JANIE WILKINSON, OBRIEN 
JOSEPHINE HERPACHE, OBRIEN 
GRETCHEN COLEHOUR, KNOX CITY 
SUE STEPHENS', OBRIEN 
ROY POSEY, KNOX CITY 
LIDA ARNOLD, KNOX CITY 
NICALOSA HERNANDEZ, KNOX CITY 
EDNA LARGE, KNOX CITY 
RAFAEL PEREZ, KNOX CITY 
BILL HEPLUTH, SAN ANGELO 
ROY LEE MAYS, KNOX CITY 
T.C. POSEY, KNOX CITY 
ODELLE HITCHCOCK, KNOX CITY 
EDNA McCARTY, KNOX CITY 
EVA FLORES, KNOX CITY 
MANUEL SAENZ, KNOX CITY 
BILLY JOHNSTON, KNOX CITY 
ORA LEE HALMS, KNOX CITY 
VIVAIN HENDRIX, KNOX CITY 
LEROY DAVIS, KNOX CITY 
ELSIE PIERSON, OBRIEN 
LEROY WEST, BENJAMIN 
LILLIE ELLIS, KNOX CITY 
LEEALTUS HARRIS, KNOX CITY 
LEWIS FLYE, KNOX CITY (2WINS)

BOB'S SUPER SAVE
109 Ave. A Knox City, Texas 79529 658-3214
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save, save
MPS

...d WEDNESDAY
DOUBLE STAMPS


