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As we enter our third week 
of SHOOTIN STRAIGHT, I 
would like to thank all those 
who have had some very 
positive comments about the 
column so far! Last week’s 
column seemed to have made 
a hit with a lot of you. 
Everyone seemed to have a 
chuckle or two on me!

This week, I want to men­
tion a little about something 
that all of us seem to take for 
granted in our modern, fast- 
paced world. Whenever we 
turn the radio on, we expect 
that we will get instant music 
for our ears For those who 
are choosy, a turn of the dial 
brings many different types 
of music for whatever fits our 
fancy

Ever stop to think about 
what goes on behind the 
music? Whether the tunes are 
live or are recorded, there is 
an immense amount of hard 
work to bring the music to 
life, and to your ears.

It could all start with long 
road trips to get to singing 
locations or recording 
studios. It seems that every 
place is a great distance 
away. Then comes the heavy 
work of unloading equipment 
and setting it all up, tuning it 
to make sure that it all works 
well for the paying public. 
Then the “ fun” begins! Ever 
see an entertainer trip over a 
microphone cable on a live 
TV show? Chances are that 
you won’t ever see that 
during a performance 
becaus^e all the tripping was 
already accomplished during 
endless hours of practice 
sessions! Singers and band 
members show up in all sorts 
of weird clothing and attire, 
most enjoy working together 
and most are reuniting with 
some other entertainers that 
they haven’t seen or worked 
with since similar shows in 
other locations.

As the practice sessions 
progress, singers joke and 
poke fun at one another - all in 
an attempt to put off those 
twinges of nervousness that 
accompany live stage per­
formances. Songs and lyrics 
are repeated over and over, 
until both the singer and the 
band are satisfied with how it 
will be presented to you, the

See ‘Shootin’
Straight; Page Four

Absentee Voting 
To End Friday

Voters have until Friday at 
5:00 p.m. to cast their absen­
tee ballots in the District and 
County Clerk’s office in the 
Knox County Courthouse at 
Benjamin.

According to the clerk’s of­
fice Tuesday afternoon, only 
ten persons had voted absen­
tee and sixteen ballots had 
been mailed out.

Mail-in ballots may be 
received until Tuesday noon, 
Gloria L. West, District and 
County clerk, said.

Tax Assessor-Collector 
John A. Smith reported to the 
News office Tuesday after­
noon that a total of 2,972 
voters had registered in Knox 
County.

Benjamin Carnivai 
Set Saturday Night

The annual Benjamin PTO 
Halloween Carnival is set 
Saturday night for all of the 
area spooks and goblins.

The carnival begins at 6:00 
p.m. and will continue until 
8:00 p.m. with booths galore, 
games, bingo, and a cake 
walk. The food booth will 
feature sandwiches, drinks 
and homemade pies.

Following the carnival, a 
program, The Fall Follies, 
will be presented with kin­
dergarten through high 
school students participating 
and the annual coronation 
will conclude the evening’s 
activities.

PROUDLY STANDING BESIDE the long awaited 1982 GMC fire truck for the 
Knox City Fire Department are assistant Fire Chief Rob Harrison^ ieft, and 
Fire Chief Craig Wiiiiams, center. At right is Charles Auburg, city mayor.

1982 GMC

At Last! New 
Fire Truck Arrives

By ROB HARRISON

Have you noticed the 
firemen in Knox City grin­
ning the past few days? They 
have a reason to, they finally 
got the new fire truck.

After many months of 
planning, letter writing, 
bydget meetings, and 
checking specifications, it 
rolled into Knox City at 7:30 
p.m. last Thursday night. Jim 
Farmer of Sunfire Equip­
ment and Apparatus of Fort 
Worth was met at the fire 
station by fire chief Craig 
Williams, assistant chief Rob 
Harrison, Ken Lawson, 
Roland Marion and Billy Bob 
Reynolds and they are still 
grinning about it.

As soon as the equipment

inventory was verified. Far­
mer put the fire truck and the 
firemen through their paces 
in learning to operate the new 
truck. These men will in turn 
teach others in the depar­
tment how to operate the new 
truck.

And what a truck it is! At 
first glance, it appears quite 
awesome and somewhat 
complicated. But with a little 
understanding, it isn’t nearly 
so bad.

The heart of the new 1982 
GMC truck is the 1000 gallon 
per minute pump, manufac­
tured by John Bean Pump 
Company, and is capable of 
high volume water, or high 
pressure water with ease of a 
few minor adjustments to the 
controls. There are four in­

take suctions and nine outlet 
discharges, seven of which 
are individually gauged. 
There is 750 gallons of on 
board water for quick attack 
situations.

The apparatus is manufac­
tured by FMC, which is a 
subsidiary of the company 
that builds Link Belt cranes. 
Bean pumps and railroad 
cars to mention a few of their 
ventures.

The department feels it has 
purchased a superior piece of 
equipment and mentioned 
that several of the larger 
cities are starting to convert 
to FMC equipment, from the 
old standbys, such as 
American Lafrance, Pierce 
and other well known com­
panies.

Royalty To Be Crowned

Coming Home 
Game Friday

This Friday night, the 
Greyhounds meet Asper- 
mont, at Greyhound Stadium 
in one of the most important 
games of the year, as both 
teams are undefeated in 
district play.

Friday night also is the an­
nual Coming Home Game, 
complete with mums, ex­
students and crowning of high 
school royalty.

Pre-game activities include 
the pep rally beginning at 
3:30, mum sales through 
Thursday, and a pre-game 
show starting at 7 p.m. before 
the ballgame.

Nominees for football

Masons Receive 
25 Year Service Pins

The annual Masonic family 
night of Orient Masonic 
Lodge No. 905 was enjoyed by 
a large group on Tuesday 
night, October 19, at the 
Masonic Fellowship Hall.

John McGaughey of Stam­
ford presented a very in­
teresting and enlighting talk 
on “ Family Life” .

J.D. Wilson, Deputy 
District Grand Master, 
presented Masonic lapel pins 
in honor of 25 years’ active 
service to Otto Lawson, 
Charles Clark, Jerry Ray, 
A.T. Holcomb, A.A. Cox, J.O. 
Hamm, L.R. Walker, John 
McGaughey and Ward 
Cooksey of Seymour.

sweetheart are senior Karae 
Beason, granddaughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. V.F. Thomas; 
and juniors Daveine 
Holcomb, daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Bill Holcomb, and 
Michelle Bateman, daughter 
of Mr. and Mrs. Charlie 
Bateman.

Band beau nominees are 
seniors Tyke Meinzer, son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Doug Meinzer, 
and James Eaton, son of J.C. 
Eaton and Pearl Stephens. 
Candidates for band 
sweetheart are all seniors: 
Kristi Boone, Lisa Thompson, 
Missy Valaski, and Karae 
Beason. The girls’ parents 
are the Joe Boones, W.F. 
Thompsons, Joe Walaskis, 
and Vic thomases.

Sweethearts and beau will 
be crowned during halftime 
ceremonies.

Time Goes Back At 
2:00 A.M. Sunday

Knox City and area 
residents are reminded that 
Daylight Savings Time will 
end for the next six months 
Sunday morning at 2:00 
o’clock.

Readers should turn their 
clocks back one hour bef.)re 
retiring Saturday nigh!.

Butter Surplus 
To Be Distributed

Government surplus of but­
ter to be distributed by Small 
Business Development Cen­
ter of Aspermont will be 
given away on Friday, Oc­
tober 29, from 3:00 to 6:00 
p.m., and will need to be 
picked up by the head of 
household.

Locations where the butter 
will be available include 
Knox City, Precinct #1 Barn; 
Benjamin, Courthouse; Mun- 
day. Community Center; 
Goree, Community Center; 
Gilliland, Community Cen­
ter; Rhineland, KCF Hall; 
Truscott, Community Cen­
ter; Vera, City square.

Did You Know...
that James Harris, 2902 Plan­
ters, Sugarland, Texas 77479 
subscribes to The Knox Coun­
ty News?

Our Hounds 
‘Top Dogs’; 
Win 27-0
By DAVID COUNTS

The Knox City Greyhounds 
used up the larger part of 
three quarters before taking 
charge of the Throckmorton 
Greyhounds defeating them 
27-0 Friday night at Knox 
City’s Greyhound Stadium.

The night was a little cool 
for the fans but just right for 
the players. The slight breeze 
was not a factor in the game.

Knox City got several 
breaks in the game and on 
most were unable to do 
anything with them. The first 
was early in the game when 
the ball was snapped over the 
head of the Throckmorton 
punter gi ig Knox City the 
ball on Ihrockmorton’s 13 
yard line. Four plays later, 
Throck took over the ball at 
their five yard line when a 
first down could not be made.

Throck not able to run the 
ball out on two plays had a 57 
yard quick kick on third 
down.

Knox City starting on their 
own 38 had a pass interferen­
ce call move the ball to 
Throck’s 16 yard line. James 
Earl Stafford ran the ball 
four times to the one before a 
good rush caused a loss of 
eight yards. The next play, 
Dwayne Watkins passed nine 
yards to Wayne Hutchinson 
for the touchdown on the first 
play of the second quarter.

A kick try for the extra 
point was no good so the score 
was 6-0.

Joe Rocha and Steve 
Oudems led the Knox City 
defense to stop the Throck­
morton Greyhounds. An ex­
change of punts led to the 
only good play Throckmorton 
had all night turned to disap­
pointment when after a 22 
yard pass completion Wayne 
Hutchinson stripped the ball

See ‘Hounds’ ,
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‘Hightower’ 
Presented 
To School

Knox City Schools has ad­
ded something truly unique to 
their school collections as 
C on gressm an  Jack  
Hightower has graciously 
donated a painting entitled 
“ The Hightower” to hang in 
the new school cafeteria.

“ The Hightower” , which is 
a commemorative painting to 
the Congressman was pain­
ted by Kenneth Wyatt of 
Tulia, who is a western artist. 
Wyatt. painted “ The 
Hightower” as a tribute to 
Congressman Hightower and 
dedicated the painting to him 
as he felt that Jack 
Hightower, like the windmill, 
plays an important role in the 
growth and development of 
this area. Hightower chose 
the windmill as his 
trademark early in his 
political career and now 
Kenneth Wyatt brings the 
windmill to the area in this 
limited edition, “ The 
Hightower”

“ The Hightower” , em­
blematic of a means of sur­
vival for pioneers on the High 
Plains and a symbol of this 
area’s U.S. Congressman. 
The windmill, a basic piece of 
machinery, performed and 
still performs a vital function 
in the development of the 
High Plains in which we live 
today.

Wyatt, one of this area’s 
most respected and qualified 
western artists has captured 
the windmill as a towering 
structure. It keeps constant 
vigil and provides support for 
all facets of life on the High 
Plains. The double platform, 
as seen in the painting, has 
been raised to a higher level 
to accomodate the more 
modern blade design of the 
windmill; a symbol of “ the 
old” and “ the new” .

“ The Hightower” is the fir­
st in a series of limited edition 
Hightower prints. Only 1,000 
have been printed. Each print 
has been inspected by'the ar­
tist and has been signed and 
numbered sequentially by 
Wyatt.

Wyatt’s dedication to his 
work and his lifestyle has led 
him to an interesting career 
that includes religion, public 
speaking, writing and art. He 
pastured a church at the age 
of 14. Since then, his 
pastorates have included a 
total of nine churches bet­
ween 1944 and 1967. He is an 
ordained deacon and an or­
dained elder. Wyatt is a 
graduate of Stephenville High 
School, John Tarleton Junior 
College in Stephenville, Mc- 
Murry College and did 
graduate work at Baylor 
University in Waco, and at 
Iliff School of Theology in 
Denver, Colorado. Wyatt 
holds a dectorate of fine arts 
from McMurry College.

Weather
FURNISHED BY PLANT 
MATERIALS CENTER 

4 Miles NW Of Knox City
D ate . Low High Rain
10-19 50 86
10-20 36 62
10-21 46 55
10-22 41 65
10-23 40 71
10-24 41 75
10-25 42 75

DISPLAYING THE PAINTING “The Hightower”, a commemorative painting 
to U.S. Congressman Jack Hightower, are Hightower’s local coordinator, 
David Counts, right, and School Superintendent W.R. Baker. The painting, 
donated by Congressman Hightower, will hang in the new school cafeteria.

Bloodmobile 
Collects 
59 Pints

Sixty-three persons presen­
ted themselves and 59 pints 
were drawn during the 
Bloodmobile visit last 
Tuesday at the First 
Christian Church.

According to Barbara Bar­
nard, Bloodmobile chairman, 
the local quota is still 70 pints, 
falling short of the set goal. 
Appreciation was expressed 
to donors for their faithful 
support as well as to the new 
donors. Knox City has had 
heavy usage of the blood bank 
during the last six months. 
One recipient, Jan Watson, 
stated that eight persons had 
come to replace what she 
alone had used and this is 
something for everyone to 
think about, Mrs. Barnard 
noted. Mrs. Watson worked 
all day at the local blood­
mobile and according to 
reports is doing great.

Donors adding to their 
grand totals included R.P. 
Barnard, 73 pints; David 
Counts, 21 pints; Richard P. 
Barnard, 25 pints; Ruth 
McElroy, 24 pints; David 
Albus, 27 pints and Bruce 
Campbell, 32 pints. Melba 
Pharr received a one gallon 
pin, Barbara J. Barnard a 
tw'o gallon pin; and Ruth 
McElroy a three gallon pin.

First time donors were 
Steve Rutherford, Chayo 
Garcia of LaFeria, Ava 
Covey of O’Brien, R.B. 
Mayes of Knox City, Douglas 
Brown, Louis Estrada, Ran­
dy Engbrock and Jimmy 
Redwine of Benjamin, Rita 
Ramos and Nancy Stone.

Other donors were Payton 
Tankersley, Earl Webb, 
Richard Ferguson, Don 
Brothers, Olga Magana, J.O. 
Brothers, Leon W’atson, 
Jimmy Ray Albus, Stepheny 
Stenberg, Peggy Grindstaff, 
Kristi Boone, Gaylon Albus, 
Joe H.B. Barnard, Mary 
Ledesma, J.M. Emerson, 
Charles Auburg, Bill Stewart, 
Apolonio Estrada, John E. 
Helms, Eulalia Hearn, 
Virginia Lieb, Deborah 
Bishop, James C. Dillon, 
Craig Brothers, Jessie 
Roberts, Aliene Groves, 
Sammie Ashcraft, Toby

See ‘Bloodmobile’ ,
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Please Vote 
Next Tuesday

Both Texas Democrats and 
Republicans are pleading for 
voters to go to the polls next 
Tuesday and cast that all- 
important ballot.

The turnout has become the 
big issue in both Democratic 
and Republican camps in the 
closing days of one of the 
state’s hottest gubernatorial 
contests.

Democratic State Commit­
tee Chairman Bob Slagle 
said, “ We lost the governor’s 
race in 1978 by three votes a 
precinct. We Democrats can­
not take it for granted that 
Democratic voters will get 
out and vote.

Republican Gov. Bill 
Clements says he must have 
at least as many votes from 
independents and ticket- 
splitters, plus devout 
Republicans, as he got in 1978 
when he became Texas’ first 
GOP governor in 104 years.

Also making the race for 
governor are David Hut- 
zelman of the Libertarian 
Party and Bob Poteet of the 
Citizens Party.

Incumbent United States 
Senator Lloyd Bentsen is op­
posed by Republican Jim 
Collins, Libertarian John E. 
Ford and Citizens Lineaus 
Hooper Lorette.

Incumbent United States 
R e p re s e n ta t iv e  Jack  
Hightower of District 13, is 
opposed by Republican Ron 
Slover and Libertarian Rod 
Collier.

Incum bent Lieutenant

Governor Billy Hobby is op­
posed by Republican George 
W. Strake Jr. and Libertarian 
Laurel Kay Freeman.

Seeking the office of Attor­
ney General are Democrat 
Jim Mattox, Republican Bill 
Meier, and Libertarian 
Katherines. Youngblood.

Incumbent Comptroller of 
Public Accounts Bob Bullock 
is opposed by Republican 
Mike Richards and Liber­
tarian Janet Tlapek.

Candidates for the office of 
State Treasurer are 
Democrat Ann Richards, 
Republican Allen Clark, and 
Libertarian Alma Kucym- 
bala.

Seeking the office of Com­
missioner of General Land 
Office are Democrat Garry 
Mauro, Republican Woody 
Glasscock, and Libertarian 
Charles S. Fuller.

C om m iss ion er  of 
Agriculture candidates are 
Democrat Jim Hightower, 
Republican Fred Thonberry, 
and Libertarian Stanley 
Keen.

Incumbent Railroad Com­
missioner Jim Nugent is op­
posed by Republican John 
Thomas Henderson, Liber­
tarian Dick Bjornseth, and 
Citizens Bob Russell.

Justice, Supreme Court, 
Place 1 candidates are 
Democrat Ted Robertson and

See ‘Vote’,
Page Nine

Goblins To Have 
Halloween Saturday
Since Halloween falls on 

Sunday, October 31, this year 
“ Trick or Treaters”  are 
asked to observe the holiday 
on Saturday, October 30, in 
Knox City, according to Knox 
City Chamber of Commerce 
officials.

Major C.W. Bell, Region 5 
commander for the Texas 
Department of Public Safety, 
cautions motorists and 
parents to take precautions to

protect children and prevent 
disasters this Halloween.

He further suggested that 
small children be accom­
panied by older children or 
adults and trick or treating be 
confined to their own neigh­
borhoods.

By observing Halloween 
1982 on Saturday, this will not 
interfere with Sunday church 
activities, officials said.
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LEGAL NOTICE ]

-DWELLINGS-
NgED LOTS of room? Four bedroom, utility, kitchen, living room, cellar. Needs a little work 
but-excellent potential. 1206 South Third, $26,500.00.
T^O OR THREE Bedroom, kitchen, IV2 bath, individual room airconditioner^ Small^house 
in back for storage or rent. 805 South Second. Good buy, $32,500.00. K  ^  D • 's* T 
ALMOST NEW-Energy efficent three bedroom, two bath home. Kitchen, den, family room 

' with firenlace. Excellent buy. Available for occupancy now. 904 South Aspen. $67,500.00.

2 BEDROOM, one bath, kitchen, den, carport. Fence, 1 water well, cellar. Excellent buy. 
Extra clean. 1102 South 2nd. $30,000.

MORTGAGE MONEY^for housing is now more readily available to those who need 
housing and have not been able to buy. Smaller down payment and low interest on 
qualifying houses. Come see us,_____________________________________________________

SOUTH OF ROCHESTER just west of Hwy. 6 - 60 acres with beautiful three bedroom, two and 
one-half bath, two story brick home with large den/kitchen, formal dining room. Lots of ex­
tras. Will sell house separately. Eight years old. Call for appointment. Great buy at $115,000.
IN MUNDAY • Super nice, super large home. Must see to appreciate. 3 Bedrooms, 2 Baths, 
Living Room, Dining Room with expandable partition. Sun Room, Utility, Den. Loads and 
loads of storage. Two central units, carport. Great buy at $55,000.00. 810 N. Munday - FHA 
Approved.
IN MUNDAY -  Large four bedroom, two story house, corner lot, garage with store room, 
mostly remodeled. Needs some work upstairs, super buy, 261 South Ninth, $25,000.
IN MUNDAY - Three or four bedroom frame older house has been remodeled. Large corner 
lot. Needs some work but priced so you can enjoy the appreciation. Lots of room. Need to see 
to appreciate. Call for appointment. $35,000. 260 South Seventh.

g m , LET’S GO GREYHOUNDS!
COUNTRY HOME! Just what you always wanted. Three bedroom, two batli, kitchen, 
dining/living room. Located on paved road. 50 acres of land and two barns. Close to town. 
$100,000. Shown by appointment only.
I HAVE SEVERAL listings not advertised - three nice homes. Ask me about them - $40 to $80 
thousand.
BENJAMIN -  New home, 1288 sq u ^ e ^ ^ tg ^ r^  b ^ r o g j i^ ^  bat^vaulte(|^^in^.^Need 
to see to appreciate at $35,000.00 < «.

-RESIDENTIAL LOTS-

E X C E L L E N T  B U ILD IN G  Lots in Southfork Addition.

ONE LOT, 50x100.202 North Avenue C.
LOT IN Shannon Addition.

•c o m m e r c ia l -
o n e  OF THE BEST locations in Knox City, former Mobile Station - with or without equip­
ment. Excellent buy, $20,000.
INVESTMENT REAL ESTATE - Texaco Service Station with 28,000 gallon storage. Good 
location. Priced to sell.

•FARM LAND-

FOR SALK -  Portable 
Westinghouse dishwasher, 
one year old, white with cut­
ting board top, $200.00. Call 
658-3575., 10-28 Itc

PUMPKINS for sale -  Four 
miles east of Knox City on 
Munday highway. Donald 
Johnson, 658-3144. 10-7 tfc

FOR SALE -  TV tower, ap­
proximately 100 feet, two an­
tennas, remote control, also 
window screens, 36 x 39. Call 
658-3067. 10-212tp

GOOD DRY firewood for 
sale. 658-3407. Will deliver.

10-28 Itc

P'OR SAI.E “  30 inch stove, 
several braided rugs, glass 
showcase. See Johnnie Smith, 
658-3547. 10-28 Itc

FOR SALE -  90 sheets of 
used sheet iron, call 658-3933.

10-28 tfc

FOR SALE-Two glass 
display cases, six feet and 
five feet long, good condition. 
Reasonably priced. Phone 
658-3059. 10-28 Itp

FOR SALE - Sweet Potatoes, 
Pumpkins, Cantaloupes, In­
dian Corn. Call (817) 658-3736 
after 5:00 or 658-3702. 9-16 tfc

FOR SALE -  Velvet sleeper 
sofa, queen size and chair. 
Call after 4:00 p.m., 658-3614.

10-28 Itc

CHOOSE YOUR Leanin' Tree 
Western Tradition Boxed 
Christmas Cards early for 
best selection. Wildlife and 
Ranch Scenes. Knox City 
Florist, 658-3581. 10-7 tfc

acre, southwest of Munda r \f j
MISCELLANEOUS

SERVICES

207 ACRES - One mile west of O’Brien. Two bedroom, two irrigation wells, row watering. 
Some of the best land in Haskell County. $1,000 per acre. Owner financing.
179.3 ACRES Haskell County 41/2 miles west of O’Brien. Approximately 80 acres cultivated. 
Buildings, fenced and cross-fenced. $340.00 per acre. Make an offer. Owner needs to sell.

14 ACRES south of Knox City, would do for Texas Veterans loan.

341̂  ACRES with nice large, older 3 bedroom house, central heat. House could be sold 
separate with small acreage. Some out buildings, fruit trees, close to town.

HASKELL COUNTY Farm-160 acres-excellent soil-2 irrigation wells w/o pumps. Ap­
proximately 1 mile East of O’Brien, $850.00 per acre. Must sell to settle debts-Loan available.
120 ACRES excellent farm land. Salem Hutchinson farm southeast of Knox City. Some water 
available. Old house.
207 ACRES 1 mile north of Knox City. Has assumable loan for $60,000. Saltwater disposal well 
pays $100.00 month. $900.00 per acre.
74 ACRES - 2 miles south of Knox City. Irrigation well. Good land. $1,000.00 per acre.

- falior '

DAVID COUNTS
INSURANCE AND REAL ESTATE 

102 N. Ave. A Knox City 
(817) 658-3211

REAL ESTATE I REAL ESTATE I I FOUND

B E A U TIF U L FOUR 
BEDROOM, two bath rock 
home for sale. Central heat 
and cooling, carpeted, close 
to church, school, post office, 
carport. Price reduced. 
Shown by appointment only. 
Cross Real Estate, 
Rochester, Texas, 743-3425.

10-28 2tc

FOR SALE-1978 model 14 x 
76 Centurion mobile home, on 
large cornet* lot with water 
well and storage building. 
Call 658-3439, Flint and Deb­
bie Richardson. 8-19 tfc

THREE-BEDROOM Brick, 
small acreage, in country. 
Dewey or Marie Darr, 658- 
3868. 10-14 tfc

FOR SALE - 3 Bedroom 
home, carpeted, IV2 bath, kit­
chen, living room, pantry, 
utility, lots of closets, garage. 
Fenced backyard, fruit trees, 
garden, cellar, water well, 
s to ra g e  b u ild in g ,
refrigerated air conditioner, 
floor furnace. Wired, plum­
bed for washer & dryer. 
$33,000. Call (817) 658-3396 for 
appointment. 10-21 tfc

HOUSE FOR SALE -- 9.55 
acres, garage, three car car­
port, horse barns, hog pens, 
concrete cellar, two 
gran^iries. Four and one-half 
mile^ NW of Rochester and 
4‘ 2 miles SW of O’Brien. Call 
658-3933 after 6:00 p.m.8-19 tfc

FOR SALE -  Two bedroom, 
one bath house, fenced 
backyard, priced low enough 
for owner to make im­
provements. 112 South 
Second. Call 658-3813. 10-21 tfc

FOUND -  The solution to 
high utility bills. Quality Lite 
insulating windows and 
storm doors. Buy direct. 
Alton Hester, 658-3072. 10-21 4tp

CUSTOM BUILT Steel 
Buildings & Corrals. Also 
Pre-Fabs. Ed Daniel, (817) 
658-3196. 1-14 tfc

CUSTOM FARMING-See Ed 
Daniel or call (817) 658-3196.

WATER WELL Drilling:
House, Stock Irrigation 
Wells, Test Holes, Call W.P. 
Hise (817) 864-3727, Haskell, 
Texas (day or night). 2-15 tfc

CUSTOM COMBINING and 
hay baling. Carver Bros. Call 
Craig at 658-3813 or Fred at 
454-3431. 10-21tfc

BAYLOR MILLING CO.,
Throckm orton Highway, 
Seymour. Custom mixing- 
pelleting-your grain or ours. 
Range cubes, creep feeds, 
hog feeds, start to finish. 888- 
3921.  ̂ tfc

LISTER AND Planting 
Furrows, parts for tractors, 
plows, trucks, and cars. 
Bearings, oil filters, belts, 
batteries, plugs, points, air 
and fuel filters, chisel spikes, 
duckfoot, sweeps and 
busters, Jervis shredder and 
Krause plow parts. Egen- 
bacher Implement, Inc.5-6 tfc

I WANTED

'WANTED-Wheat pasture by 
gain, hundred weight or.mon 
thly basis. Herb Propps, 4.54- 
3641, Benjamin, Texas. 10-7 4tc
WOULD LIKE to lease your 
farm land. Reasonable price. 
Contact Craig (’arver, 658- 
3813. 10-21tfc
W.ANTED - Guar and milo to 
cut. Have small and large 
headers to do good job and 
satisfy customers Dude 
Meister. North End ol \ve. 1 
Knox City. 10-28 4tp

r BUSINEj>o
OPPORTUNITIES

OWN YOUR OWN Jean- 
Sportsvveai Infant-Preteen 
or Ladies Apparel Store. Of­
fering all nationally known 
brands such as Jordache, 
Chic, Lee. l,(>vi. Vanderbilt. 
Calvin Klein Wrangler over 
200 other brands. $7,900 to 
$16,500 includi'- beginning in­
ventory, airfare tor one to 
Fashion Center, training, fix­
tures, grand opening 
promotions. Call Mr.
Loughlin (612 ) 823-1304̂  itp

Margaret’s
802 EAST MAIN

Weekend Specials
Good Thors. ■ Fri. - Sat.

We reserve the righ t to lim it.

LAY’S (ASSORTED FLAVORS) Q

POTATO CHIPSaeg «29 0 U ^
SUNBEAM

COOKIES . . . .  Reg. 39't )  I  - I

FOLGER’S QQ
COFFEE
12 0Z.CAN

SUNKIST.SUNKIST e - |  C Q
Dl ET & COCA-COLA e Pak J .  ”
U.S.#1 RUSSET < ) > A C

POTATOES .OLbBag l̂'^®
PorH rthof^s. T-Bones, Rib-Eye Steaks 

Carl's Pork Sausage 
Club Steaks and Cured Hams

THAT IN ACCORDANCE 
WITH SECTION 30.05 OF 
THE PENAL CODE TEXAS 
CRIM IN AL TRESPASS 
(SENATE BILL 111 PASSED 
BY THE 62nd
LEGISLATURE), NOTICE 
IS HEREBY GIVEN THAT 
ALL LANDS OF W.T. 
WAGGONER ESTATE ARE 
POSTED EXCEPT WHERE 
WRITTEN PERMISSION IS 
GIVEN TO COME UPON 
THE SAME.

CHARLES M, PRATHEi, 
tfc TRUSTEE

LEGAL NOTICE

THAT IN ACCORDANCE 
WITH SECTION 30.05 OF 
THE PENAL CODE TEXAS 
CRIM IN AL TR ESPASS 
(SENATE BILL 111 PASSED 
BY THE 62nd
LEGISLATURE), NOTICE 
IS HEREBY GIVEN THAT 
ALL OIL AND GAS LEASES 
OPERATED BY TIM 
BREWER INC. ARE 
POSTED EXCEPT WHERE 
WRITTEN PERMISSION IS 
GIVEN TO COME UPON 
THE SAME.

ROBERT RADFORD 
PRODUCTION SUPT.

9-2 tfc

THE STATE OF TEXAS 
To: ABB STEPHENS, ET AL

You are hereby comman­
ded to appear by filing a writ­
ten answer to the Plaintiff’s 
petition at or before ten 
o’clock A.M. of the first Mon­
day after the expiration of 
forty-two days from the date 
of the issuance of this 
citation, same being Monday 
the 29th day of November 
1982, at or before ten o’clock 
A.M. before the Honorable 
District Court of Knox Coun­
ty, Texas, at the Court House 
of said County in Benjamin, 
Texas.

Said Plaintiff’s Petition 
was filed in said court, on the 
13th day of October A.D. 1982, 
in this cause, numbered 6899 
on the docket of said court, 
and styled, C.G. Clarke 
Plaintiff, vs. Abb Stephens, 
ET A1 Defendant.

The names of the parties to 
the cause are as follows: C.G. 
Clarke are Plaintiffs and Abb 
Stephens and wife, Dolly 
Stephens, R.H. Weaver, Susie 
Lindsey, Vesta Brock, Jessie 
Rutledge, Luther Stephens, 
Carl Stephens, W.R. 
Stephens, Joe^ Stephens, 
Ausey Stephens, Emitt 
Stephens, Jim Stephens and 
Virgle Stephens, and the 
unknown heirs and legal 
representatives of Abb 
Stephens and wife, Dolly 
Stephens, R.H. Weaver, Susie 
Lindsey, Vesta Brock, Jessie 
Rutledge, Luther Stephens, 
Carl Stephens, W.R. 
Stephens, Joe Stephens, 
Ausey Stephens, Emitt 
Stephens, Jim Stephens and 
Virgle Stephens, are Defen­
dants.

A brief statement of the 
nature of this suit is as 
follows, to wit: Trespass to 
try Title on: Being Lots Nos. 
ten (10) and eleven (11), in 
Block Four (4), Bettie G. 
Davis Addition to the Town of 
Knox City, Knox County, 
Texas, more fully described 
as follows:

BEGINNING upon the 
Southwest corner of said 
Block four (4), of the Bettie 
G. Davis addition to the town 
of Knox City, Knox County, 
Texas, and then fifty feet 
(50’.) West of said point of 
beginning to the beginning 
corner of said lots ten (10) 
and eleven of block four (4) of 
the Bettie G. Davis Addition 
to the Town of Knox City, 
Knox County, Texas, the 
boundary is as follows, to- 
wit:

BEGINNING with said 
Southeast corner of said lots 
and North for 140 feet, which 
describes the East boundary; 
THENCE West for 100 feet, 
which describes the North 
boundary; THENCE South 
for 140 feet, which describes 
the West boundary; THEN­
CE East for 100 feet, which 
describes the South boundary 
to the point of beginning of 
the description of said lots, as 
is more fully shown by Plain- 
tif’s Petition on file in this 
suit.

If this citation is not served 
within ninety days after the

date of its issuance, it shall be 
returned unserved.

The officer executing this 
process shall promptly 
execute the same according 
to law, and make due return 
as the law directs.

Issued and given under my 
hand and the Seal of said 
Court, at office in Benjamin, 
Texas, this the 13th day of Oc­
tober A.D. 1982.

Attest:
Gloria L. West Clerk, 
District Court, Knox 

County, Texas 10-213tc

AUTOS-TRUCKS 
TRAILERS Ll

NOTICES

CHRISTMAS SPECIAL-- 
Beautiful knife sets, guaran­
teed, Christmas delivery, 
also steak knife sets. See at 
City Cleaners, call 658-3203, 
or any Eastern Star member.

10-214tc

PINK LADIES Dollar Day 
Sale -  All ladies’ pantsuits, 
dresses and men’s suits. No 
layaways, all sales final. Now 
underway at Pink Ladies 
Thrift Shop, downtown Knox 
City. 10-212tc

REWARD -  Lost Red Irish 
Setter, male dog with tags. 
Last seen October 14 south of 
Knox City on Haskell high­
way. Call 658-3015. 10-28 tfc

COUNTRY Club Bridge 
Tournament 9:30 November 
6, $6.50 each, lunch-style 
show 12:00. Register before 
November 1. (817) 888-3960.

10-212tp

QUALITY LITE insulating 
windows and storm doors. 
Will cut your heating cost this 
winter. Buy direct from fac- 
torv- Alton Hester. 658-3072.

FOR SALE-1979 Buick 
LeSabre, power loaded, 
AM/FM stereo tape/CB, one 
owner. Call David Perdue, 
658-3509._____________ 10-7 tfc
1978 COUGAR for sale -  
AM/FM radio, cassette 
player, bucket seats, low 
mileage, electric windows, 
electric seats, T-tops. Call 
658-3933. 10-28 tfc
1974 DODGE, ton Club Cab 
for sale. Good 318 and tran­
smission. Body needs work, 
$800.00. Call 743-3220 after 
6:30. 10-28 2tp

FOR SALE ~ 1981 Chevrolet 
1-ton, dually-flat bed. 20,000 
miles, $7500.00. Call 658-3813.

10-21tfc

FOR RENT

RENT “ The Rug Doctor”  
from Kuehler Lumber and 
Supply, A True Value Dealer, 
Knox City, 658-3416. 10-28 4tc

TWO HOUSES for rent. See 
Dewey or Marie Darr or call 
658-3868. 10-28 2tc

CARD OF THANKS

I would like to take this op­
portunity to say a special 
thank you to Dr. Thompson, 
Dr. Neufeld and the hospital 
staff for the wonderful care 
given to me while a patient 
there for two weeks.

The nurses were so patient 
and caring and the Pink 
Ladies made each day 
brighter.

Again, thank you for your 
many kindnesses.

Vi Peters
10-28 Itc Seymour, Texas

BARNEYARNOLD 
REAL ESTATE

ARNOLD INSURANCE BUILDING
Phone (817) 658-3509

The Real Estate Market is picking 
up some. We have cheaper finan­
cing. Come by and check with us 
for your needs. We have a won­
derful sales organization and will 
appreciate your business.

Barney Arnold Pat Gonzales Esther Conn

TO EACH HIS OWN DREAM OF 
A LIFE A H E A D . . .

Let Us Help A 
Distant Vision 
Become A 
Certainty 
Tomorrow

Your child’s dream of the future can be an obtainable goal, aided with a savings account started 
today by you. Provide hi ^ith the financial help he’ll need for that future. A well-planned, 
federally-insured savings account can earn top return from day of deposit to day of withdrawal. For 
expert guidance come in today and secure a dream. The child will thank you for your farsightpd 
wisdom.

CITIZENS STATE BANK
Member F.D.i.C.-lnsured To $100,000 

Knox City, Texas



GARAGE SALE-TWO blocks 
south of Baptist Church in 
O’Brien. Friday, Saturday, 
9:00 a.m.. Ivies, Stewarts, 
and Poe. 10-28 Up

BIG, BIG, Garage Sale -  
Thursday and Friday, Oc­
tober 28 and 29. Dishes, 
glassware, silverware, dinet­
te suite, suitcases, Tupper- 
ware, small electrical ap­
pliances, heating stoves, 
quilts, and lots and lots of 
knicknacks. Items too 
numerous to mention. 501 
Avenue A, Knox City, Peggy 
Grindstaff. 10-28 Itc

GARAGE SALE—Corner of 
South Eighth and Aspen. 
Several families, Thursday, 
one day only, 9 to 5. 10-28 Itc

CARPORT SALE-412 South 
Fourth, Thursday, 8 to 1. 
Baby bed, swing, flower 
arangements, iron, makeup 
mirror, toaster oven, coffee 
pot, cake canister, misc.

10-28 Itc

G A R A G E  S A L E --B a b y  
Stroller, luggage, toys and 
games, humidifier, toaster 
and lamps, light fixtures, 
stereo and silverware, cart, 
bedspread and drapes to 
match, rug, men’s, women’s 
and baby’s clothes. Friday 
only, 9 to 5. One mile east and 
one mile north of Knox City, 
James Albus residence. 
________ __________ 10-28 Itc

GARAGE SALE -  Furniture, 
sheets, bedspreads, crocks, 
clothes, other household 
items, toys, one new bicycle. 
Across from Co-op Grain 
Elevator, Rochester. 10-28 Up

Halloween Safely 
It’ s unfortunate that 

Halloween, for all its fun 
and frolic, should be a 
time o f  potential danger to 
youngsters. But, such are 
the times that parents must 
be alerted to warn their 

.. youngsters to never enter a 
.stranger’ s hom e when 
trick-or-treating and to 
bring their ‘ ‘ loot”  home 
for careful checking be­
fore they eat it. Discard 
any unwrapped or loosely 
wrapped food; wash fruit 
and cut it up into small 
portions to make suFe 
nothing has been added.

Boyd’s 
Welding 
Service

Backhoe Service 
Available 

24 Hr. Service 
Shelton Boyd 
(817)658-3639

TAMALES 
FOR SALE

SATURDAY,
NOVEMBERS

The Women Of The 
Santa Rosa Church 

will be taking 
orders in advance.

For those who 
want to place 

their orders now,

CONTACT

Elva Gonzales 
idella Escobar 

Eva Flores

—i_ii~ii_ ~ii
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O’Brien Happenings
By AUDIE JOHNSTON

HERE AND THERE 
Mr. and Mrs. Ranzy 

Herring spent the weekend in 
Junction with Mr. and Mrs. 
Aderle Herring and family 
and in Houston sightseeing.

Gail Rowan of Lubbock 
spent the weekend with her 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Ivan 
Rowan and brother, Wayne.

Mr. and Mrs. Oscar John­
son spent last week in 
Bonham with their daughter, 
LaQuita Morris and family. 
The Morrises returned them 
to their home here over the 
weekend and visited Mr. and 
Mrs. Johnnie Peysen.

Butch Stephens returned to 
his home here last Tuesday 
night after spending a week 
with his mother, Janoma 
Stephens, in the Mayo Clinic. 
He will rptnrn there this week

and come home with his 
mother and father. Janoma 
underwent surgery while 
there.

Mr. and Mrs. Dwight 
Gothard were in Highland 
Sunday to help their gran­
dson, Brandy, celebrate his 
birthday along with his 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Paul 
Gothard and brother.

Mr. and Mrs. Eddie 
Bryant, Jennifer and John of 
Levelland were recent 
visitors in the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. Claudale Barnard 
and also visited the Don 
Roberts family.

Mr. and Mrs. Charlie Smith 
of Monday and Mr. and Mrs. 
Claudale Barnard spent a few 
days in Lubbock last week.

Mr. and Mrs. Ross

WTU inters Gas 
Purchase Agreement

West Texas Utilities Co. 
has entered a gas purchase 
agreement with Haskell 
Gathering Co. which could 
result in lower fuel costs at its 
Paint Creek Power Station.

WTU has begun taking a 
small volume of low BTU gas, 
and is expected to take more 
when the gathering firm’s 
pipelines are extended to ad­
ditional wells in Haskell and 
Throckmorton counties. The 
Paint Creek plant is on Lake 
Stamford in southeastern 
Haskell County.

The gas is cheaper than 
WTU’s main supply, but is of 
lower quality, according to 
Walter Meller, WTU’s 
manager of system produc­
tion.

“ Because it is a lower BTU 
gas, it must be blended with 
other gas before it can be 
burned in our boilers,”  
Meller said. “ But we are 
doing everything we can to 
buy gas where there is a price 
advantage.”

He said WTU is in the 
process of negotiating for lot 
BTU gas at some of its other 
power plants. The company’s 
contract with its principle 
supplier, which was 
renegotiated this past year, 
permits WTU to purchase gas 
from other sources, and WTU 
does so when it is available. 
The Company has eight 
major power plants, all of 
which burn natural gas as the 
primary fuel.

Walsworth and grandson 
Brian of Albany spent some 
time at their home in O’Brien 
and the C.B. Banners last 
Monday.

Lynn McAda visited his 
brother, John McAda and 
family in Fort Riley, Kansas, 
recently.

Mr. and Mrs. Gene Hunt 
spent the weekend in Fort 
Worth with Mr. and Mrs. 
Chris Jiminez and family.

Mrs. Linda Underwood was 
in Denton Sunday to visit her 
grandmother, Mrs. Bessie 
Williams, who is ill in a 
hospital there.

Mr. and Mrs. J.W. Gifford 
of Zepher visited Mr. and 
Mrs. L.A. Covey and family 
and Mr. and Mrs. John Covey 
recently.

Mrs. Carol Godsey hosted a 
Sunday School class party in 
her home Monday night, Oc­
tober 18. Those enjoying the 
covered dish supper other 
than the hostess were Sue 
Stephens, Linda Large, Linda 
Underwood, Trudy Hunt and 
Dorothy Harrison.

Mr. and Mrs. Lincoln 
Reynolds of Colton, Califor­
nia, are here for a few weeks 
visiting their cousins, Mr. 
and Mrs. Oather Poe and 
family and Mr. and Mrs. 
Oscar Johnson.

Mrs. Pearce Manning and 
Christi were in Hamlin over 
the weekend to visit her aunt, 
Mrs. Mary Hollis.

Shane and Corrie Sue 
McKinney of Haskell visited 
their grandparent's, Mr. and 
Mrs. Wayne McKinney, over 
the weekend.

“ Purchasing Power -  
Americans must be getting 
stronger. Twenty years ago, 
it took two persons to carry 
$10.00 worth of groceries out 
of the store. Today a child can 
do it.” (Lacey)

FROM FREDERICKSBURG 
Jimmy Lea of 

Fredericksburg visited his 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Ulric 
Lea, last week while Ulric 
was a patient at West Texas 
Medical Center in Abilene 
and returned home with 
them.

FROM SAN ANTONIO 
Mr. and Mrs. John Clay, 

Johnny and Kimberly of San 
Antonio visited John’s gran­
dmother, Mrs. Myrtle White, 
and his uncle and his wife, 
Mr. and Mrs. Henry L. White 
a few days last week.

GREG THORN
...ex-O’Brien resident

Greg Thorn
Receives
Scholarship

Gregory Michael Thorn, 
son of Mrs. Betty Thorn of 
Henrietta and Charles Thorn 
of Abilene, has been selected 
as recipient of the 1982-83 Lila 
Fern scholarship award 
presented by Texas State 
Association of City Clerks 
and Secretaries.

Persons eligible for the 
$1,000 scholarship must have 
sixty college hours and be a 
son or daughter of a city clerk 
or secretary. His mother, 
Mrs. Thorn, is Henrietta city 
secretary.

Thorn graduated from 
Henrietta High School in 1979 
as valedictorian of his class. 
He attended Hardin-Simmons 
University in Abilene during 
the spring semester of 1981. 
He is currently classified as a 
senior at Abilene Christian 
University in Abilene 
majoring in geology and 
business.

Thorn is a licensed 
salesman by the State of 
Texas Board of Real Estate 
and was a member of the 
Hardin-Simmons University 
Geological Society. He is ac­
tive in intramural basketball 
and track at ACU. He is a 
member of the Baptist chur­
ch.

The former O’Brien 
resident is employed as a 
photographer for Abilene 
Board of Realtors, is 
associated with Martha 
Thorn Realtors and is a 
photographer for Home and 
Land Management.

Sales Tax 
Rebates Up 
11 Percent

State Comptroller Bob 
Bullock sent $35.6 million to 
967 Texas cities as their share 
of the one-percent city sales 
tax for October.

The 1982 statewide total so 
far this year is up 11 percent 
over the 1981 total up through 
the same date of last year. 
This payment reflects 
taxable sales made in August 
and reported to the state by 
the end of September.

Knox City’s net payment 
for this period was $3,468.49 
as compared to $2,742.99 for 
the same period last year. 
Payments to date in 1982 are 
$55,961.79 reflecting a 9.49% 
increase over 1981’s paymen­
ts to date of $51,110.21.

Monday’s net payment was 
$2,098.76 as compared to last 
year’s $2,932.63. Payments to 
date in 1982 are $37,683.45, a -
I. 59% decrease over 1981’s 
$38,293.19.

No monthly ' totals were 
given for Knox County’s two 
other towns but payments to 
date in 1982 were $2,089.53 for 
Benjamin, reflecting a -
II. 36% decrease over 1981’s 
$2,357.44. Goree’s payments 
to date this year have been 
$3,317.24, noting a 36.77% in­
crease above 1981’s $2,425.39.

Other area towns’ paymen­
ts for this period include 
Crowell $591.51, Haskell 
$6,480.38, Rochester $1,280.72, 
Rule $822.37, Stamford 
$5,808.10, and Seymour 
$4,537.40.

Totals for the year to date 
for O’Brien and Weinert 
were, respectively, $979.88 
and $1,370.38.
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The telephone number listed în the 
directory for O’Brien Fire Department 
has been discontinued.

TO REPORT A FIRE 
DURING BUSINESS HOURS, CALL

658-3819 (Tri-State Chemical) 
658-3321 (Penman Propane)

EVENINGS, WEEKENDS, AND 
HOLIDAYS, CALL

658-3302 (Carlos Casillas) 
658-3103 (L.A-Covey) 
658-3165 (Dale Turner)

•••
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It’s Not Too Early 
To Plan Ahead For 

Those Christmas Gifts 
With A Personal Touch

Come By and Place 
Your Orders Now For

PERSONALIZED
LETTERHEADS

ENVELOPES
NOTES

WANTED
LVN

Someone special needs 
you. Try Geriatric nursing. 
Will be a rewarding ex­
p e r ie n c e . P o s it io n s  
available from 7 to 3 or 3 to 
11. Excellent pay with paid 
holidays. Excellent major 
medical with life insuran­
ce. Apply in person at 1000 
N. Broadway, Aspermont, 
or call (817) 989-3526.
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W a l l a c e  M o o r h o u s e  I n s u r a n c e
"Your Protection Our Profession”

INSURANCE REAL ESTATE APPRAISALS
“ We are just as close as your telephone”

P.O. Drawer 9 Miinday, Texas 76.371 Ph: (817) 422-4341

Thursday 6:00 to 8:00 P.M.

Sale Lasts 
Only 2 Hours!

FREE
TRICK

OR
TREAT

GOODIES!

T h e  L a d y  B u g  S h °P P ®  
w ill  b e

O n e  BacK
$ 5 0 0

O n e BacK
$ 3 0 0

•\

o n e  Group c-tAOO 
L e v i ’ S® B e n d o v e r s

T h e  A r t  S ta ll
w ill  b e  o f f e r in g

s e le c te d  Group

and
s p e c i a l p R 'C ^ -

, Browse and see our
B rass -  p te u e is

S e a s o r r e d P o p c o ^ ^ ^

The Lady Bug Shoppe 
Art Stall & Frame Shop

Knox City Mini Mall 658-3957

AUSUP’S

ICE CREAM 
$ 1 5 9Vi a u . - K  

RD.CTH. I

KRAFT

VELVEETA
UB.
BOX

PRICES EFFECTIVE OCT 28-30.1982 
WHILE SUPPLIES LAST __ ^

KRAFT AMERICAN CHEESE

SINGLES
i ! i i . S 1 9 9
PKG. i

14 OZ.
BX6

BORDEN’S

Buttermilk
BORDEN’ S ASSORTED

DIPS

Vi GAL. 
GTN.

8 0Z. 
CTM.

CLOVER CLUB REG. $2.29

w  PouTO Chips
$ 1 7 91 LG. H

PKG. ■

KR AR

CABAMELS
KRAFT

M iracle W hip ” 1111
RATH PURE PORK

SAUSAGE
RATH

FRANKS
U.S. NO. 1

POTATOES

UB.
ROLL

12 OZ. 
PKG.

10 LB. 
BAG

KRAFT HALFMOOM LONCHORN

CHEESE 
8 9  ^

—
.. N̂ATURAL

Mil ̂ CHEESE

'tod

I

S ttil TRWT

ALISUP'S HALLOWEEN ^

DRAB BADS ^
r,V

■V*

EACH

CONVENIENCE STORES
WE HAIE A LAR8E SELECTION OF HALLOWEEN " " m  CSIfOT I.09R FOR OUR SPECIALS
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Benjamin News
By GLADENE GREEN

TRA IN H A M  GET
TOGETHER

The Trainham family 
gathered Sunday, October 10 
for a reunion at the Benjamin 
Memorial Building. Lots of 
visiting, re-newing old times 
and good food was enjoyed by 
all present.

Those attending were Mr. 
and Mrs. Sam Shipman, Lona 
Feemster, Maurine and 
Weston Parris, Franc.es and 
Olen Coffman, Janie and 
Wayne Sutton, June, Jarrell 
and Minka Trainham all of 
Vera; R.J. and Grace 
Trainham of Roy, New 
Mexico; Lottie Trainham of 
Maxwell, New Mexico; 
Mozelle Tilley of Stratford; 
Mac Trainham of Santo; 
Robbie and Floyd Hill of 
Stephenville; Paulette and 
Billy Richards of Garland; 
Kelly Boatman and Logan of 
Garland; Ruby Trainham 
and Mr. and Mrs. Charles 
Trainham and family of 
Holiday ; Rita, Dana and Joe 
Lewis of Wichita Falls; Lola 
Scott and Sammie and D.A. 
Chapman of Seymour; 
Walter Hertel of Munday; 
Mr. and Mrs. Kenneth 
Trainham and family of 
Dallas; Donna Sue Van 
Deusen and family of 
Coleman and Joy and Charles 
Jones, Bobby Trainham, 
Bobby and Philomae Rober­
son, Justin Waldron and Tres 
Pierce, all of Benjamin. Also 
attending were Rev. and Mrs. 
K.E. Woolley and Juanita 
Burnett, also of Benjamin. 
MUSTANGS WIN AGAIN!

The Benjamin Mustangs 
have done it again. Friday 
night they defeated Weinert 
74-56. Randy Engbrock 
opened the scoring for Ben­
jamin on a two yard run. He 
finished the night with 3 more 
TDs on runs of 21, 14, and 31 
yards. Troy Oxford had 3 TDs 
of 8, 39 and 59 yards. Alan 
Baty connected with James 
Propps on a 68 yard TD pass. 
Propps also caught a fumble 
in mid air and returned it 8 
yards for a TD. Alan Baty en­
ded the scorine with a 23 yard

S TR E A M S  IN  
D E S E R T PLACES  

By OZELLE STEPHENS

“ 0  Lord God, to whom 
vengeance belongeth; 0  God, 
to whom vengeance 
belongeth show thyself. Lift 
up thyself, thou judge of the 
earth: render a reward to the 
proud.”  (Psalms 94:1-2).

Vengeance is punishment 
given in retaliation for an in­
jury or offense. It is getting 
even, taking an eye for an 
eye, a tooth for a tooth was 
not a ticket for revenge, but a 
legal limit to prevent people 

' in anger from going far 
beyond.

The New Testament is ex­
tremely clear that for 
believers in Jesus, who have 
themselves experienced the 
unmerited forgiveness and 
love of God, vengeance is not 
to be sought or desired. Good 
is to overcome evil, 
forgiveness is to bridge 
broken relationships, and 
love (even for the enemy) is 
to follow the pattern of our 
Lord and demonstrate to the 
world the newness of life in 
Christ Jesus. (Read Matthew 
38-48, also Romans 12:17-27).

Remember this fact. 
Vengeance is for God alone. 
(Hebrews 10:3). The Word of 
God plainly says, “ Owe no 
man anything but Love” . 
That means our enemy too. 
(Jod’s grace is sufficent, try 
it, for the peace of God in 
your soul.

Get Set for 
Trick or Treat

When trick-or-treaters 
com e calling this H al­
loween, make sure that 
your porch and driveway 
are well-lit and free o f  
obstacles, for their safety 
and your peace o f  mind.

K eep in m ind that 
goodies such as small, 
hard candies, peanuts and 
.sunflowers seeds can cause 
sm aller youngsters to 
choke, so avoid giving 
these out to children below 
the age o f  six.

run. The Mustangs will host 
the Miami Warriors Friday 
night at 7:30.
HERE ‘N THERE

Charles and Joy Jones 
returned home Friday from a 
week’s vacation in Ruidoso, 
New Mexico.

Visiting the Bobby Rober­
sons last week was Mr. and 
Mrs. Travis Boone of 
Sacramenton, California. 
Weekend visitors in the 
Roberson home were Corrine 
Parrish of Franklin, Mr. and 
Mrs. Bobby FeemstCr of 
Brownwood and J. and Rob­
bie Feemster and Lona 
Feemster of Vera. »

Recent guests of Bobby 
Trainham were R.J. and 
Grace Trainham of Roy, New 
Mexico and Robbie and Floyd 
Hill of Stephenville.

Rickie and Diane Herring 
of Munday and Gordon and 
Debbie Taylor of Paducah 
were visitors of their parents. 
Van and Gladene Green 
during the weekend. Mattie 
Bullion of Truscott also drop- 
pd in Saturday morning for a 
visit.

Sheila Jones of VRJC was a 
weekend guest of her parents, 
Charles and Joy Jones.

Jack and Mary Young of 
Lubbock spent Thursday 
night with her parents, H.T. 
and Kathleen Melton. They 
were enroute to Arlington for 
a weekend visit with their son 
and his wife, Jackie and Cin­
dy Young.

DeeAnn and J.D. Lamb of 
Holiday were weekend guests 
of her parents, Dutch and 
Imogean Young.

Betty Parker of Aspermont 
visited the Leroy Wests and 
the C.B. Clowers last Wed­
nesday.

Pete and Kay Lindsey of 
Dickens, who are former 
Benjamin residents visited 
friends here last Friday night 
and attended the Benjamin- 
Patton Springs ballgame.

Visiting Ozelle Kilgore and 
Galen last week were Bar­
bara Kilgore of Los Angeles, 
California and D.G. Kilgore 
and daughter, Christina, of 
Des Moines, Iowa.

Mr. and Mrs. Raymond 
Yandell of Safford, Arizona 
are visiting her mother, Lora 
Hall and her brother and 
family, the Hes Hall this

week.
Juanita Burnett, Gladene 

Green, Philomae Roberson, 
Kathie Waldron and Judy 
Conner of Truscott were 
among the many who atten­
ded a coffee Saturday mor­
ning honoring Mr. and Mrs. J. 
Winston Feemster in the 
home of Mrs. Claudell Brat­
cher in Vera.

Scott Hertel of Wichita 
Falls and Craig Hertel of 
MSU were weekend guests of 
their parents, the Don Her- 
tels.
MEINZER FUND

As was mentioned in last 
week’s News, a fund to aid 
the Pate Meinzer> family to 
help defray Pate’s medical 
expenses has been set up at 
both banks in the county.

I urge each of you to dig 
just a little deeper in your 
pockets and help this family 
out. Any amount will be ap­
preciated.

They have always done 
their share to help others in 
time of need.

Shootin'
Straight

From Page One

public.
Lights and background 

equipment are set and tuned, 
volunteers are recruited to 
help with all the odd jobs and 
finally the show is ready to 
begin! Here in Knox County 
we have all been very for­
tunate in the past few years to 
have had several first rate 
Country Music Shows 
brought to us instead of us 
having to drive those endless 
miles to see the performers at 
some other location.

The first big production 
here in Knox County was in 
September of 1979 when 
Chisai Childs and the 
Grapevine Opry appeared in 
Benjamin to benefit the Ben- 
ja m in  E x -S tu den ts  
Association. Chisai later 
returned to Knox County in 
1980, this time the Grapevine

Opry went to Munday for a 
show that benefitted the Knox 
County Hospital Auxiliary. 
Then another Country 
Western Production was held 
in Munday to benefit the 
Munday Ambulance EMS 
Service. Last, but not least 
was the recent West Texas 
Opry that performed here in 
Knox City at the new Knox 
City High School Auditorium 
with a benefit for the Pink 
Ladies of the Knox County 
Hospital Auxiliary.

Just before the last show, 
there were those that com­
plained about the price of the 
tickets for the show. When 
they told their side of the 
story, the complaints did 
seem to be valid. But, when 
the other side of the story 
comes to light, the tickets 
were actually low. If you had 
to add up all your expenses to 
drive to Lubbock or to 
Abilene or to some other 
location and then had to pay 
to get into a show, you would 
be able to see in black and 
white that the performances 
held locally are a real 
bargain for the money!!

STEPHENS VISITORS 
Weekend visitors in the 

home of Mrs. Ozelle Stephens 
were Mr. and Mrs. Wyndol 
Stephens of Farmington, New 
Mexico, Mr. and Mrs. Randy 
Stephens of Phoenix, 
Arizona; Mr. and Mrs. Rod­
ney Stephens of Eunice, New 
Mexico; Mr. and Mrs. Royce 
Lummus Sr. of San Antonio 
and Mr. and Mrs. Royce 
Lummus Jr. of Fort Worth.

IN DUMAS
Mr. and Mrs. Ken 

Crownover visited in Dumas 
over the weekend with their 
daughter and her family, Mr. 
and Mrs. Barney Beesley, 
Holli, Brett and Jill.

a n n u a l p t o

HALLOWEEN
CARNIVAL

Sat., Oct. 30,6 to 8 
Benjamin School

Booths, Bingo, Cake Walk
Enioy our Food Booth
Sandwiches, DrinKS, 

Homemade P ics

HALLOWEEN
“The Folhes
SCHOOL AUDITORIUM

coronation Concludes
Evening’s Events

e v e r y o n e  WELCOME.

STOP EXPENSIVEl>AINTING
United States Steel Siding

UNITED STATES VINYL SIDING 
ALUMINUM REPLACEMENT WINDOWS

100% FINANCING AVAILABLE

C.W. “Dutch” Benson Construction
'BENJAMIN Authorized Dealer PHONE 817-454-3991

Lone Star Specialist Pam H acker uses a hot-air balloon to get 
her message across. The message is that new high-efficiency'*' 
gas water heaters can help you  stretch you r‘energy dollars.

We used a hot-air balloon to make 
a point about hot-water efficiency.

77,000 cubic feet.
That’s how much gas.this balloon holds.
That’s enough gas for 7,700 fiverminute 

showers. That is, if your water heater was built 
ten years ago.

With a new higl^-efficiency* water heater, 
77,000 cubic feet of gas goes a lot further. . .  
more than 20% further.

You can still take 7,700 five-minute showers. 
With the gas left over, you can wash 1,022 loads 
of dishes and dry 785 loads of clothes.

Gas has always been your most efficient fuel. 
High-efficiency appliances make it go even 
further.

If you’d like to stretch your energy dollar, 
talk to your local appliance dealer. Find out 
how much a high-efficiency water heater could 
save you.

6 Lone Star Gas Company
Gas. First in energy efficiency.

Efficiency ratings based on results o f  test procedures established by the Department o f  Energy.

To apply a dollar figure to a 
production held locally, one 
has to take into account the 
amount of expense that it ac­
tually takes to bring singers 
to Knox County. Most groups 
have a set price range that 
has to be met, and that has to 
be accomplished before any 
profits can be realized to 
benefit local civic groups. 
With extras such as bake 
sales during the inter­
missions, these shows have 
been successful in the past 
and hopefuly, will be so again 
in the future.

That last word was the 
golden one, the reason for this 
column, that word: 
“ Future” . I have it on good 
authority that the residents of 
Knox County can look for­
ward to another great show 
just after the first of next 
year. A show that will be 
spiked full of fun and good 
Country Music for area fans, 
this next show will benefit a 
group here in the county 
that are citizens who 
represent the past as well as 
the future! That is about all 
than I can let out of the bag 
for now, but you can be sure 
that I’ll get you more infor­
mation on this next show just 
as soon as I can. So, until 
later....

M ore SHOOTIN
STRAIGHT next week.

r Let’s Get Acquainted

SPECIAL
Oct. 14 to Nov. 11

Shampoo & Set $5.50
Permanent (Reg. $18.50) $-| 5.00
Permanent (Reg. $22.50) $20.00
Eyebrow Arch $3.00

—New Operator Doty Eaton—

LATE APPOINTMENTS ACCEPTED

1

P 6!
Barbara’s Beauty Shop

6S8-3939 O’Brien, Texas 658-3083

0 ^ 4 1 ^

^ O il Field ★ Industrial ★ Repair 
★  Wiring ★ irrigation ★ Commerciaf

DEPENDABLE INSTALLATIONS

C&R Electric
658-3921 - Nights 658-3836 '

rOMMY COLLINS BILLY BOB REYNOLDS
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^FRItNWY

T R I C K ^
ALL OUR

AFFILIATED 
SUPER MARKETS

KNOX CITY

WEDNESDAYS
Witt) the purthase of $3.00 or more.

SPECIALS GOOD THURS., 
FRI., SAT., OCT. 28-29-30

S T R IK E  O R  N O  S T R IK E !

A F F I L I A T E D

C0WB07
T H E^ K S T R W T B R U  
6R M E  IN TOW N./
★  GRAND PRIZE TRIP FOR 2 TO THE 

PRO BOWL IN HAWAII

WINVS
$ 1 0 0 0

SHURFRESH

Sausage
2-Lb. Pkg.

PARKAY
Margarine
1 -Lb. Quarters

GEBHARDT

CHILI
1 9 -oz. Can

Charmin
Bathroom Tissue

Nabisco Premium

Crackers
1-Lb. Box

Limit2 with $10.00 or more 
grocery purchase excluding 
cigarettes and beer.

S P A M
Luncheon Meat

12-oz.
Can

Betty Crocker

CAKE
MIXES

Assorted Flavors

M l PURPOSE 
ENRICHED FIOUR

Gold Medal

FLOUR
Campbeirs Tomato

SOUP
10.75-oz. Cans

Limit one with $10.00 or more 
grocery purchase excluding beer 
and cigarettes.

PALM OLIVE LIQUID ForDish0S....22-oz. Bottio 1
FISHER BOY Frozen Fish Sticks..............................8 -o z . Pkg. 59^
ROTEL T o m a to e s  and C h ilie s   ...10-oz. Can 2 for 89<
3 M INUTE OATS ....Q u ick  or Old Fash ion .... 18-oz. Box 89«
VEG -ALL Mixed Vegetables.........................le -o z . cans 2 Fori *00
YO P LA IT  YO G U R T .A ss t Flavors.......8-oz. 2 (or 89^

Tomato

CLOROX
L I Q U I D  B L E A C H

O V z - R a l a a

i l l

4 6 - o z .  C a n

Hamburger Helper

8 9 °
Assorted

Kinds
Each

Mayonnaise
3 2 -oz. 9  5 9  

Jar I

70-Ct. Size

AVOCADOS
Firm
Green

Lb.

CARROTS Crisp.......................... ...................M b . Cille Bag 39«
Green Onions or Radlsbes . 5 F . r 1 .00

\M



Knox City, Texas, Thursday, October 28,1982

MINUTES OF THE
KC-O’BRIEN ISO MEETING

The Knox City-O’Brien 
CISD Board met on this date 
for a regular meeting with 
the following members 
present: Henry J. Jones, J.M. 
Emerson, Allen McGaughey, 
Doug Meinzer, J.B. Ruther­
ford, John Gillispie and Don 
Roberts. Supt. W.R. Baker 
was also present.

The opening invocation was 
given by J.B. Rutherford.

A motion by Doug Meinzer 
seconded by Allen 
McGaughey that the minutes 
of the August 17, 1982 regular 
meeting and the September 9, 
1982 meeting of the Haskell- 
Knox Advisory Board be ap­
proved. Motion carried by 
unanimous vote.

A motion by John Gillispie 
seconded by J.M. Emerson 
that the following bills be ap­
proved for payment. Motion 
carried by unanimous vote. 
GENERAL OPERATING 
FUND:

Texas School Book 
Depository 97.02, Houghton 
MiHlin Co. .104.15, Xerox 
E ducation  P u b lica tion s
292.90, Frey Scientific Co. 
259.36, Pender’s Music Co. 
211.23, Kathy Anderson 
129.72, National Geographic 
World 8.95, Knox County 
News 28.15, Exxon Co. 24.49, 
Gothard’s Texaco 10.00, 
Owens Auto Supply 17.69, 
Stanton Brown 15.00. Mc­
Creary, Huey & Veselka 
202.29, Top Five Business 
Products 45.00, Powell Office 
Supply 48.75, IBM 42.54, W.R. 
Baker 242.48, Extra Work- 
Activity Fund 1,152.00, Hunt 
Ford Tractor Co. 240.01, 
Covey’s Garage 128.90, Lynn 
Electric 69.96, C&R Electric 
112.55, O’Brien Water Dept. 
237.53, Knox City Water Dept.
212.00, General Telephone Co. 
453.40, West Texas Utilities 
1,613.96, Lone Star Gas Co. 
137.81, Martin Linen Supply
5.80, School Specialty Supply
92.00, Madison Bionics 131.18, 
City Hardware 23.64, Byrd’s 
Lumber & Hardware 1,521.73, 
Troy Brown 50.00, Penman 
Conoco Service 8.54, Texaco 
89.12, Conoco 85.52, 
Teprom ark International 
65.51, Callaways 75.60, 
Wichita Glass & Mirror Co.
210.80, Morrison Supply Co. 
591.75, Goldblatt Tool Co. 
39.32, Sun Supply Corp. 
858.25, Caldwell Music Co. 
2,424.79, Kuehler Lumber & 
Supply 597.57, Brenda Correll
25.00, Sequoyah Reynolds
25.00, Eileen Sickels 30.00, 
Sherry Turner 37.50, South­
west School Book Depository
104.77, Holt, Rinehart & Win­
ston 38.66, Lone Star School 
Book Depository 165.12, Scott, 
Foresman & Co. 3,476.41, Ac­
tivity Fund 49.36, UIL 95.00, 
Activity Fund 673.72, M 
System 60.27, The Munday 
Courier 37.95, Osborne’s
190.91, B&G Auto 5.00, 
Haskell Clinic 15.00, J. 
Patrick Hooker, M.D. 140.00, 
Knox City-O’Brien Teachers 
Assn. 2,690.88, TASB 138.00, 
Clayton’s 1,315.35, White Auto 
Store 18.87, Riverside 
Chemical Co. 75.50, Pum­
pers Supply & Equipment
17.77, Quality Implement
3.00, Clonts Hardware 31.15, 
Activity Fund-Extra Work 
738.50.
DESIGNATED PURPOSE 
FUND:

Beckley-Cardy Co. 365.88, 
Beckley-Cardy Co. 351.62, 
Junior Arts & Crafts 17.25, 
Hoovers 168.35, Music 
E^ducators Book Society 13.20, 
Davis Welding Supply 224.92, 
Kuehler Lumber 9.59, Alton’s 
Sewing Machine Go. 13.75, M 
System 5.32, Perry Brothers 
27.71, Clonts Hardware 2.95, 
Jim Dillon 211.75.

A motion by John Gillispie 
seconded by J.M. Emerson 
that the superintendent 
execute an inter-local 
agreement with the Haskell- 
Knox Advisory Board, for 
which this district is the 
managing agent, for special 
education services for the 
1982-83 school year. Motion 
carried by unanimous vote.

The board then reviewed 
policy updates provided by 
the Texas Association of 
School Board Policy Service 
Division and current job 
descriptions for all classes of 
employees.

A motion by Doug Meinzer 
seconded by Allen 
McGaughey that the policies 
update 17 and 18 be adopted 
without change and in that 
order and that job descrip­
tions currently issued be ap-

September 14,1982 ★
proved. These job descrip­
tions are to remain in effect 
for an indefinite period or un­
til amended. Motion carried 
by unanimous vote.

It was noted that there was 
no public comment presented 
concerning the 1982-83 budget 
and tax rate.

A motion by Allen 
McGaughey seconded by Don 
Roberts that the superinten­
dent be instructed to enter in 
to a school year 1982-83 con­
tract with the Education Ser­
vice Center Region XIV to 
provide the district services

in the following areas: 
Guidance, Health, Learning 
Resource Centers, and In­
s tru c tio n a l L ea d ersh ip  
and/or Technical Assistance. 
Motion carried by unanimous 
vote.

A motion by Don Roberts 
seconded by Allen 
McGaughey that the meeting 
adjourn. Motion carried by 
unanimous vote.

Henry J. Jones, 
President 

ATTEST: J.M. Emerson, 
Secretary

V .

H I  A l A f  H l f B

Texas Department of Public Safety

C li ’U8toC8eii AVIATION. INC.
"Providing 4 Service'

HELICOPTER — FIXED WING 
Spraying - Seeding 
Predator Controi 
Cattle Roundup 
*̂ ield Checking

National 
Farmers Union u  Insurance Companies

CHARLES R. THORNHILL
LIFE • HOME • BUSINESS  
BLUE CROSS/BLUE SHIELD

P.O. Box 121 
522 S. 2nd
Haskell, Texas 79521

Office: (817)864-2842  
Home: (817) 864-3511

Munday Airport 
422-4517

Knox City Airport 
658-3716

KITCHEN & BATH

REMODELING
Kitchen Cabinets-Bath Vanities 

New Doors and Drawers For 
Older Cabinets-Any Style

STOKER FURNITURE & FIXTURBCO.
658-3420 After 5:00

712 E. Main Knox City

^ E ’RE CAUGHT WITH TOO MUCH MERCHANDISE

^  LIQUIDATION
TJa ©

STRATOLOUNGER 
RECLINER

NYLON VELVET 
SOFA AND CHAIR

S A L E  $19988 ( S A L E  $48888
Reg. $399.95

S A V E  $20087
i

FANTASTIC VALUE ON THIS COMFOR­
TABLE RECLINER UPHOLSTERED IN 
DURABLEVINYL FABRIC.

QUEEN
SOFA SLEEPER
S A L E  $39988

Reg. $799.95
S A V E  $40007

WOOD TRIM QUEEN SIZE SOFA 
SLEEPER UPHOLSTERED IN DURABLE 
HERCULON FABRIC.

Both
Pieces

Reg. $999.95
S A V E  $51187

SOFA AND MATCHING CHAIR 
UPHOLSTERED IN DURABLE NYLON 
VELVET FABRIC.

7 PIECE 
BROYHILL

DINING ROOM
S A L E  »988»«

Reg. $1999.00 
S A V E  $101012

7 PIECE DINING ROOM INCLUDES 4 SIDE 
CHAIRS, 2 ARM CHAIRS, OVAL TABLE 
AND DARK PINE FINISH. ,■

RESTONIC
BEDDING SALE

REG. NOW

$149.00 TWIN $ 6 9 8 8 EA.
PC.

$169.00 FULL $ 7 9 8 8 EA.
PC.

$229.00 QUEEN 9 9 9 8 8 EA.
PC.

WHILE THEY LAST /

CURIO 
CABINET

S A L E  $19988
Reg. $399.95

S A V E  $20087

LIGHTED CURIO CABINET WITH UPPER'^ 
AND LOWER CABINET DOORS.

PECAN FINISH '

OCCASIONAL
TABLES

S A L E  $7988
Reg. $169.00 To $249.00

SPECIAL SELECTION OF OCCASIONAL 
TABLES.

SOLD ONLY IN SETS

TRADITIONAL
SOFA

S A L E  $36988
Reg. $799.95

S A V E  $43087

ATTRACTIVE SOFA UPHOLSTERED IN 
NYLON VELVET FABRIC, FULLY SKIR­
TED AND ATTACHED PILLOW BACK.

A

M /

■.■■J
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TERMS:
VISA
MASTERCARD
12 MONTHS FREE INTEREST 
WITH APPROVED CREDIT

H O U R S :

BYNUM’S
Furniture Gallery,Inc.

8:30 - 5:30 
DAILY

HASKELL AND MUNDAY 

ALL ITEMS SUBJECT TO PRIOR SALE

“ W h ere you alw ays g e t a q u ality 
piece o f fu rn itu re  at a fa ir 
price and se rvice  a fte r  the s a le .”

ffIfINiililii
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KC School News
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THE KENNEL
FRESHMAN CLASS NEWS 

' By Danny Balis
The first nine weeks of 

; school is over. We received 
our report cards last week, 

; and most of us are doing quite 
\ well in our first year of high 
;  school.
\ The Junior Varsity fell to 
' Hamlin in the final seconds of 
‘•the game last Thursday 
{ evening, completing their 
 ̂season for the year. Some of 
the JV’s will be suiting up 
with the Varsity hoping to see 
some action with the 
Greyhounds.

I failed to mention Becky 
Underwood as being a par­
ticipant in '  volleyball this 
year in my last article. A 
thousand pardons, Becky!

KEY CHAPTER NEWS 
By Celia Whisenhunt

Wednesday, October 20, we 
had our first Key Chapter 
FHA meeting. It turned out 
real well. Entertainment was 
provided by Mrs. Reid’s 
class, they did a few skits 
about safety in the kitchen 
and treats for Halloween. The 
class I was in, which of cour­
se was Mrs. Newton’s class 
provided the eats. We had 
brownies, sausage balls, 
smores, and Kool-Aid and 
Coke for the drinks.

I  can already tell the im­
provement in our class. We 
enjoy Homemaking a lot, and 
would like to thank our ad­
visors for their help.

Houndette
News
By Dale Wainsc'ott

The Houndettes are 2 and 0 
with 2 to go, that is in district 
play. Volleyball is rounding 
up and soon we’ll be hearing 
about playoffs. We hope we 
don’t just hear about them we 
hope we’re in them.

A week ago Tuesday, 
Aspermont travelled to Knox 
City to play the Houndettes 
first district match. The 
Houndettes won 15-5, 15-11. 
Aspermont is our toughest 
opponent because of this 
there is still the chance that 
we split the district. So this 
past Tuesday, October 26 will 
have decided who won first 
and who won second. This is 
important in the bi-district 
play-offs because it decides 
who plays whom for the bi­
district championship.

A week ago Thursday, we 
travelled to Weinert and 
defeated them. The game 
was played at 3:30 p.m. 
because of the football games 
scheduled the same day. This 
week is the same as far as 
times. This is the first time in 
a few years we’ve had district 
opponents so it’s a new ex­
perience for these girls. At 
present, the season record for 
the Houndettes stands as 22-4.

PEP CLUB NEWS 
By Diane Helms 

Add another win to the list. 
So far this district season has 
gone our way. We would like 
to ask you, the fans, to keep 
coming to the games and 
supporting our Greyhounds. 
The Homecoming game is 
Friday. The Pep Club has 
been selling mums, we hope 
that everyone has bought one 
for girlfriends, sisters, and 
mothers. Don’t forget, all the 
games start at 7:30, so come 
out and watch our Greyhoun­
ds play their best. ‘ ‘You ain’t 
Bad and You ain’t cool. You 
can’t beat the Number One 
School!”
GREENHAND NEWS 
By Danny Balis 

In fourth period vocational 
agriculture, instead of doing 
class work, we have been 
going to the ag farm and 
working. We hoed, raked, 
moved panels, and cleaned 
up. Most of us have already 
decided what we will choose 
for our projects this year. The 
majority chose feeder and 
show pigs, and broilers. The 
pigs and sheep may be kept at 
the ag farm. Make note, 
Greenhands, that you need to 
get your dues in to Mr. Dillon. 
They are six dollars this year. 
BAND NEWS 
By Sarah Jones 

MARCHING CONTEST! 
Yes, marching contest! This 
important event occurs next 
week when the Greyhound 
Band travels to Wichita 
Falls. We are all working 
hard and hoping for a good 
rating. We all really ap­
preciate the people who 
remain in the stands during 
halftime to watch us march. 
Thank you for supporting us!

FROM SAN ANTONIO 
Dr. Royal B. Lea of San An­

tonio visited his uncle and 
aunt, Ulric and Jewell Lea, 
over the weekend.

Freshmen, 
JVs End 
Season

The Freshman and JV 
teams ended their season in 
defeat when they traveled to 
Colorado City last Tuesday 
night. However, coach An­
derson credits each team 
with successful play. She 
feels the girls played their 
best games of the season.

Outstanding player for the 
JV game was Michelle 
Bateman. She has been the 
setter and team leader 
throughout the season. 
Michelle was also high scorer 
with 6 points. Next was Kathy 
H. with 3, Paula C.-2 pts, 
Eloise A.-2 pts., Kathy R.-l 
pt., and Cindy H.-l pt.

Their matches carried 
scores of 8-15 and 6-15.

Outstanding players for the 
Freshmen were Paula 
Chambers, Kathy Hernandez 
and Eloise Agraz and Kathy 
Reynolds.

High scorer was Eloise A. 
with 6 points, Paula C. with 5 
points, Kathy H. with 4 poin­
ts, Christie 2 points, Becky 1 
point.

Their matches carried 
scores of 8-15,10-15.

Honor
Roll
First Nine Weeks

First Grade: Virginia Ber­
nal, Tammy Brothers, 
Gilbert Casillas, Denise 
Dudensing, Marc Espinosa, 
Cris Lee Hacker, John Head- 
stream, Debra Ledesma, 
April Lehmann, Luke Lorenz, 
Kindra McKinney, Laurie 
Nevarez, Kim Posey, Trisha 
Roberts, Mario Sigala, April 
Tankersley, Dawn Walker, 
Jessica Williams.

Second Grade: Lori Boston, 
Mike Bunton, Amy Carver, 
Chris Casillas, Melanie 
Chaney, Jacy Dillon, Jay Bob 
Eaton, Donnese Fritsche, 
Ruben Garcia, Lezlee Hearn, 
Misty Hudson, Cody Man­
ning, Kristi McKinney, Ran­
dy Roberts, Trisha Rios, 
Estella Rocha, Alesha 
Rutherford, Hanna Williams,. 
Julie Gentry.

Third Grade: Shelly Balis, 
Tami Brewer, Paul Casillas, 
Kim Chambers, Aimee Ford, 
Abel Johnston, Roger
Marion, Karla McKinney, 
Kandon Sloan, Will Vacek.

Fourth Grade: Joy Gentry, 
Johnny David Grindstaff, 
Paula Large, Sara Lorenz, 
Mitzi Marion, Stephanie Pep­
per, Angela Staggs, Andy 
Williams.

Fifth Grade: Marci
Berryman, Sarah Ivie, Billy 
Wayne Large, Leah Rauch, 
Brian Rogers, Karomy Sloan, 
Boyce Tankersley.

Sixth Grade: Kim
Bateman, Lucinda Casillas,
Ann Diaz, Trina Fry, Kacye 
Nemir, Patricia Sanders, 
Beth Underwood, Patrick 
Wupperman. ^

Seventh Grade: Robert 
Boston, Kim Moore, Christy 
Mowery, Glendon Sanders, 
Lawri Tankersley.

Eighth Grade: Ray
Casillas, Denise Diaz, Angela 
Donaldson, Kim Gillispie, 
Robbie Large, Jessie 
Ledesma, Shane Lewis.

Ninth Grade: Danny Balis, 
Leah Boone, Paula Cham­
bers, Michael Rauch, Tam­
my Rogers, Becky Under­
wood, Ricky Wupperman.

Tenth Grade: Missy Pier­
ce, Linda Mayes.

Eleventh Grade: Michelle 
Bateman, Kevin Eaton, Dan­
te Gutierrez, Sarah Jones, 
Steve Rutherford, Greg 
Skiles, Nathan Staggs, 
Peggilee Wupperman.

Twelfth Grade: Karae
Beason, Kristi Boone, Jerri 
Buerger, Ava Covey, Teddy 
Espinosa, Toni Hewitt, Joe 
Rocha, Lisa Thompson.

SCHOOL
LUNCHROOM

MENUS

BREAKFAST MENUS: 
November 1-5,1982 
Monday: Peach Slices, Cin­
namon Toast, Chocolate Milk 
Tuesday: Orange Halves, 
Muffins, Chocolate Milk 
Wednesday: Grape Juice, 
Scrambled Eggs, Buttered 
Toast, and Jelly 
Thursday: Apple Juice,
Sausage, Buttered Toast, and 
Jelly
Friday: Applesauce, Cin­
namon Toast, Chocolate Milk

LUNCH MENUS:
November 1-5,1982 
Monday: Chicken and
Noodles, Green Beans, 
Pineapple Cobbler, Cornmeal 
Sticks, Bread, and Milk 
Tuesday: Pigs in Blanket, 
French Fries, Buttered 
Carrots, Cake, and Milk 
W edn esd ay : E n ch ila da  
C a s s e ro le , T ossed  
Salad/Dressing, Pinto Beans, 
Pudding, Hot Cornbread and 
Butter, and Milk 
Thursday: Roast and Gravy, 
Creamed Potatoes, English 
Peas, Hot Rolls, Butter and 
Honey,'Milk
Friday: Taco, Lettuce,
Tomato and Cheese, Green 
Lima Beans, Cinnamon Rolls

Hospital
News

Patients In Hospital 
As Of October 22, 1982

Knox City: Ida Reynolds, 
W.N. Bishop, Dave Whitford, 
Roy Reynolds, Alestine Flye, 
Susan Grissom, Peggy 
M cG a u gh ey , G eorge  
Jackson, Ozella Thomas, 
Mae English
Monday: Susie Trammell, 
Gil Wyatt, Ina Wyatt 
Crowell: Elmer Taylor 
Wichita Falls: F.M. Kotulek

Patients Dismissed 
As Of October 15,1982

Knox City: Willie Aldridge, 
Betty Aldridge, Elzie Marion 
Monday: Dockins Baby Girl, 
Larry Kuehler, Glenn Maston 
O’Brien: Rachel Catano 
Seymour: Viola Peters 
Rochester: Stacia Reyna 
Brownwood: Ben Palmer

Study Club Hears 
Two Local Women

The Knox City Study Club 
met Thursday, October 21, in 
the Knox City Community 
Center at 2:30 p.m.

Charlotte Patterson sang 
‘ ‘America, the Beautiful” . 
Mrs. Patterson and Mrs. 
Lena McGee presented in­
teresting reports of their 
travels across America, after 
which the other club women 
joined in a lively discussion of 
places of interest in America.

Winifred White and Marie 
Reeves served coffee and 
cake to Elizabeth Wilson, 
Charlotte Patterson, Mary 
Groves, Lena McGee, Sudia 
Cash, Opal Hutchinson, and 
Exa Penman.

Saturday, October 23, 
Winifred White, Sudia Cash, 
Mary Groves, Lena McGee 
and Exa Penman attended 
the all-day Mesquite District 
Board meeting and workshop 
in Stamford.

Following a coffee 
visitation, numerous reports 
of club activities were given.

After a delicious lunch of a 
variety of salads, the Stam­
ford Pierian Club entertained 
the group with a skit, por­
traying four women of Texas, 
Cynthia Ann Parker, Molly 
Bailey, Mrs. Sam Houston, 
and Clara Driscoll.

The next meeting of the 
club will be November 11 at 
2:00 p.m. There will be a 
short meeting in the Knox 
City club room after which 
the group will go to Benjamin 
as guests of the Sorosis Club.

SCHOOLAND 
COMMUNITY 
CALENDAR

Thursday, October 28 -  
Seventh, eighth and JVs at 
Haskell, 5:00, 6:00, 7:30; 
District volleyball, here, 
Weinert, 3:30, JV and varsity.

Friday, October 29 -- Asper­
mont, here, 7:30 p.m., coming 
home game; Crowning of 
Football Sweetheart, Band 
Royalty

Monday, November 1 -- Band 
UIL Marching Contest, 
Wichita Falls
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PLUMBING-HEATING  
AIR-CONDITIONING
Jerry’s Plumbing

658-3322 202 East Main Knox City

Lowrey's

SERVICES OF THE 
CHURCH OF GOD 

IN CHRIST
Services were held each 

evening throughout last week 
at the Knox City Church.

Sunday school had a good 
attendance with Supt. Manuel 
in charge.

During the morning ser­
vice, Minister Landers of 
Abilene preached powerfully 
from Galatians 5:1.

The Union Joint Meeting 
was held at the Rule Church 
on Sunday afternoon. Elder 
R.L. Williams preached 
mightily during that service 
from Psalms 37:3,5.

YPWW was the last service 
of the day here.

Elder Vernon Session is 
preaching during a revival at 
the Knox City Church this 
week. Everyone is invited.

B&G
AUTO SERVICE CENTER

1003 East Main

Transmissions, Transfer Cases, 

RearAxie Assembiies, Air Conditioning 

Tuneups, Brakes, Overhauls 

AH Minor and Major Repairs

Craig Brothers -  Jon Godsey 
817-658-3606

campus
LEAD A DOUBLE LIFE •• Zip Off The Jacket Sieeves 
And You Have A Vest! Good Selection in Both Men’s 
And Boys’ Jackets.

OLNEY SAVINGS

One 11 X 14 Color P o rtra it $1.50
Your choice o f  fam ily group or individual 

One special o ffer p er fam ily, one per person

MINI MALL
T h u r s d a y ,  N o v .  4

Ph ot o  H o u r s: 10:00 a .m .  - 4:00 p .m .
b_3 KNOX CITY, TX

Order Christmas Pictures Now! >0« O gOOO IQQIl
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' News Notes 
from the

Brazos Valley Care Home
By Rena Tankersiey

M “

Social changes in American 
Life have contributed to a 
negative belief about the 
elderly. Family ties have 
loosened and individuals who 
were once leaders in com­
munity affairs are no longer 
familiar and well known. 
Sometimes, we avoid the 
elderly because it reminds us 
of our owh mentality. It’s 
much easier for most people 
to generalize supposed 
characteristics for the 
elderly as a class.

Most aged people have 
some form of security, either 
in their own homes or in a 
nursing home. This security 
seems to isolate the elderly 
from their normal lives. 
Along with a loss of sight, the 
hearing is not as good and the 
reaction is not as fast as it on­
ce was. The circle they 
traveled seems to get smaller 
and smaller. What we should 
not ignore is a vast storage of 
knowledge and wisdom that 
most elderly have.

The staff of Brazos Valley 
Care Home does not believe 
any notion that “ you can’t 
teach the old new tricks” . We 
do not stereotype our residen­
ts into a class of the elderly. 
Our activity program and 
nursing care are given on an 
individual basis and we want 
each resident to continue his 
or her maximurn potential for 
a happy, normal life.

October 19, June Tanker­
siey played the piano for 
Rhythm Band and Bro. John 
Gillispie played the guitar 
and we had as our special 
guest, Randy Pierce, who is 
the visiting song leader for 
the Baptist revival this week. 
He played the guitar and sang 
some special songs. 
Everyone enjoyed having the 
three of you for musical 
therapy. There were 31 
present.

Elsie Pierson and Mabel 
Hollis taught the sewing class 
October 20. There were 12 
present. It was fun for all 
visiting and working, 

f Jimniy Rogers brought the 
Mid-W^k message October 
20: Pauline Myers played tne 
piano for group singing. Ken­
neth Myers and Bill Johnston 
assisted Jimmy and Pauline. 
There were 24 present. 
Everyone received a 
blessing.

Nancy Stone, JoAnna and 
Danya and Corinne Barnes 
were in charge of Exercise 
Class October 22. There were 
22 present for the exercises.

Sunday School, October 24, 
w a s , taught by Ozelle 
Stephens. Pianist was Vernell 
Tankersiey and Jack Tanker­
siey led the song service. 
There were 17 |)ersent.

The Church , of Christ was 
incharge of Church Services 
Sunday, October 24. A.B. 
Martin brought the message 
and Charles Durham led the

song service. There were 40 
present for the service.

Bingo Winners, October 20, 
were Weeper Aldridge, 
Allibel Tremmier, Mary Lou 
Foshee, Eda Faye Pounds, 
Lena Dabney, Charlie 
Collier, Hazel Clark, Ruth 
Harden and Commie Mon­
tgomery.

Blackout Winners were 
Easter Hastey, Charlie 
Collier, Idoma Chowning and 
Mary Lou Foshee.

Visiting Mae Flowers have 
been Dewey and Marie Darr, 
Greg Donaldson, Pearl Gage, 
Lorena Burnison, Raymond 
Wilhite, Alben Lowrey, Dean 
Worley, Ozelle Stephens, 
Earlene Meinzer, Jean 
Thomas, Bessie King, and 
Lillian Hester.

Pama Lou Wilhite, 
Raymond Wilhite, Mabel 
Hollis and Elsie Pierson 
visited residents of the Care 
Home this week. Also Lena 
McGee, Louise Graham.

Posey Parris of Granfield, 
Oklahoma, Evelyn Boyd, Jo 
Parris of Frederick, 
Oklahoma, Kate James, Gus 
Cowart, Emma Chronic and 
Henry Chronic of Bridgeport 
visited Mary Lou Foshee.

Ruth Dozier and Evelyn 
Balls visited Easther Brad­
ford and Dicie Singleton.

Betty Aldridge visited 
Weeper Aldridge.

Evelyn Balls visited 
Athleen Owens.

Thelma Williamson visited 
Vida Williamson.

Anne Neskorik and Mabel 
Hollis visited the Clay Hoges.

Carney Glover visited Lillie 
Burleson.

Earl Alvis, Temple Alvis 
and Carney Glover visited 
Nena Alvis.

Mrs. Earl Alvis, Maude 
Newberry, Clara Hodges and 
Irene Sanderson visited 
Allibel Trimmier.

Ruth Dozier, Mildred Stub­
bs, Oleta Welch, Mabel 
Hollis, Corinne Barnes, 
Eugene Jones, Linda Oliver 
and Bessie King visited Ber­
tha Trimmier.

Judy Shipman, Oleta 
Welch, Beth Welch, Pearl 
Gage, Ruth Dozier and Nell 
Hudson visited Bessie 
Russell.

Pearl Gage and Carol 
Godsey visited Horace 
Finley.

James Wilkinson, Bessie 
King, Ray Thomas, Donna 
Thomas, A.A. Pierson, J.W. 
LaDuke, Jim Benton, James 
Benton, May Belle Benton, 
Eugene Jones and Charles 
Durham visited Zollie 
Thomas.

Bessie King visited Minnie 
Robertson.

Joe Strickland visited Cliff 
Elliott.

May Belle Benton, Jim 
Benton and James Benton 
visited Mammie Benton.

Doris Jones, Ruth Dozier, 
Neva Epley, Vannah Car­
mack, Daisy Johnson, Sibyl 
Chandler, John Chandler, 
Rita Searl, Dean Worley, 
Jewel Worley, Joe Hastey, 
Maxine Hastey, Kelly 
Hastey, Bessie King, Maude 
Newberry, Clara Hodges and 
Mr. and Mrs. Guffy of Mon­
day visited Easter Hastey 
and Eda Faye Pounds.

Vic Thomas and Raymond 
Wilhite visited Hazel and 
Waynelle Clark.

Jewel Bailey, Elisha Speck 
and Harvey Reynolds of 
Abilene visited Ruth Harden.

Couple To 
Repeat Vows 
November 20

Lisa Turner Grothe and 
Gary Alan Gould announce 
their engagement and forth­
coming marriage.

The bride-elect is the 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Ar­
thur H. Turner of Cherry 
Valley, California, and Treva 
Gould of Huntington Beach, 
California, and Bob Gould of 
Plano are parents of the 
prospective bridegroom.

She is a graduate of Rider 
High School in Wichita Falls 
and Technical Training Cen­
ter VOE. She was a Rider 
Rangier for three years and 
was in the queen’s court. She 
was also OEA president at 
Technical Training Center 
^nd was recording secretary 
of FTA. She is employed by 
Wildcat Supply, Inc. in Knox 
City.

Gould attends the West 
Central Texas Council of 
Government Police Academy 
in Abilene and graduated 
from Inglewood High School 
in Inglewood, California. He 
is employed by the Knox City 
Police Department.

The couple will be married 
Saturday, November 20, at 
the First Baptist Church in 
O’Brien.

Mrs. Ida Voss 
Celebrates Birthday

Attending a family reunion 
in the home of Mrs. Leola 
Stockton, Saturday, October 
23, and honoring their mother 
and grandmother, Mrs. Ida 
Voss of Munday, on her 97th 
birthday included Mr. and 
Mrs. R.J. Walling of 
Seymour, Mr. and Mrs. Lon­
don Walling of Munday, Mr. 
and Mrs. Randell Walling of 
Safax Tenesia, North Africa, 
Mr. and Mrs. Joe Voss of 
Grayford, Mr. and Mrs. 
Howard Voss of Munday, Mr. 
and Mrs. Cecil V6ss of Burk- 
burnett and Mr. and Mrs. 
Clyde Voss of Knox City.

Also, Mr. and Mrs. Jerry 
Benson, Leann and Marilyn 
of Knox City, Mr. and Mrs. 
Verlin Voss of Stephenville, 
Mrs. Leola Stockton of Knox 
City, Mrs. Gladys Loeer of 
Munday, Mr. and Mrs. Troy 
Lewis and Justin of Knox 
City, Joni and Jodi Penman 
of Rochester, Mr. and Mrs. 
Tommy Gage, Stacy and 
Sharon of Rockwall, and Mr. 
and Mrs. Ray Lynn Hardin 
and Lisa of Mundav.

Guinn Sheet Meta! B Plumbing
KNOX CITY, TEXAS

LENNOX Air Conditioning

Central Heating

Plumbing Servici
r e s id e n c e  a n d  s h o p  p h o n e  658-3341

Baas^^sBBssafcasssssa^fsssssM sss

DAN DOTSON, M.D.
CONSERVATIVE

LIBERTARIAN
for

STATE SENATE 
District 30

“More Freedom 
And

Lower Taxes 
Through

Less Government'

PD. POL ADV 
PD By Dan Dotson 

Printed m Graham, Texas

Mr. and Mrs. Bobby J. 
Helton celebrated their 
Twenty-Fifth Anniversary 
with a reception in their 
honor Saturday, October 16, 
at their residence at 208 South 
Fifth. Hosting the event was 
the couple’s daughter, Mrs. 
Tammie Huff of Winnsboro, 
who greeted guests at the 
door.

Receiving guests were the 
couple and their mothers, 
Grace Helton of O’Brien and 
Minnie Reeves of Farwell.

The register table, atten­
ded by nieces of the couple, 
Shawnda and Andrea Adkins 
of Sweetwater, was covered 
with an ecru cloth with em­
broidered flowers. The cloth 
was made by Barbara Bar­
nard, who was an attendant 
to the couple 25 years ago in 
their wedding. An 
arrangement of yellow 
daisies in a crystal vase ac­
cented the table.

The serving table was 
covered with a yellow cloth 
overlaid with a white cut 
work cloth which belonged to 
the late Mrs. Edna Yar­
brough, a close family friend. 
Appointments were of crystal 
and silver. The white cake 
was decorated with yellow 
rosescascading down the 
sides with silver leaves. Nuts 
and yellow mints were also 
served. The centerpiece was 
a crystal footed compote 
belonging to another close 
family friend, the late Opal 
Egenbacher, which contained 
yellow carnations, white 
spider mums and greenery. 
Serving at the table were 
Mrs. Charimon Sparkman of 
Moore, Oklahoma, niece of 
the couple and Mrs. Kevin 
Corley of Mineola.

Assisting Tammie with 
hostess duties, showing 
guests through the home and 
registering gifts were Bar­
bara Barnard and sisters of 
the couple, Mrs. Penny 
Adkins of Sweetwater, Mrs. 
Ruth Routon of Farwell and 
Mrs. Faye Corley of Mineola.

Auxiliary
Fund

Donations have been made 
to the Knox County Hospital 
Auxiliary’s fund in memory 
of:

Bill Anderson
by Mr. and Mrs. David Albus, 
Mr. and Mrs. Stanton Brown, 
Mr. and Mrs. Bob Harrison, 
Mr. and Mrs. Allen 
McGaughey, and Mr. and 
Mrs. John Crownover;

J.C. McGee
by Mr. and Mrs. David 
Albus; Mr. and Mrs. Stanton 
Brown; and

Mrs. Lois Wells 
by Shari and Doug Brown.

Out of town guests 
registered from Lubbock, 
M orton* S w eetw a ter , 
Rochester, Mineola, Moore, 
Oklahoma, Lewisville, Hart, 
Keller, Irving, Farwell, 
Grand Saline and Temple.

Halloween History

Halloween was original­
ly a Druid festival celebrat­
ed at the Celtic year’ s end. 
Bonfires were lit at this 
time to frighten o ff  evil 
spirits.

Eventually, this pagan 
festival became Christian­
ized into All Hallow Even, 
that is, the eve before All 
Hallow Day, or All Saint’s 
Day.

News Deadline 
Tuesday Noon

K MOTEL
ir Untier New Management
■A Low Daily & Weekly Rates

ir Clean, Comfortable Rooms

'k Color Cable TV (In Most Rooms)

ir  Heating & Air Conditioning

ir  Friendly Service

A^Only For Daily

WITH THIS AD $5.00 OFF 
FROM OCT. 1 THRU OCT. 31,1982

Keep Utility 
Biiis 

Down
With Insulating Storm 

Doors & Windows
BUY DIRECT FROM FACTORY!

—Call For Free Estimate—

QUALITY LITE 
WINDOWS

DAYS
658*3449

NIGHTS
658*3014

TJ

You can't buy 
better protection.

A n tif reexe and Coolant
(fiSnoeS^ Allyear̂ pioieclion 

cagotnsf freeze-ups, 
botlovers,arxl rust

Help prevent boilovers 
this summer with 
Conoco's Antifreeze 
and Coolant. And get 
year-round corrosion 
protection, too.

$ 1 9 7 4

Penman Conoco 
Service, inc.

gal
■IS

S I  7*658*3513

It ’s Time For Fall Stocking -  
Channel Catfish, Large Mouth Bass, 
Hybrid Blue Gill, Crapple, and Fathead 
Minnows.

The Hybrid Blue Gill will reach the weight of 2V2 to 3 
pounds. We furnish your hauling containers. Delivery 

is Saturday, October 30, at the following towns & locations:

Snyder*Ezeii*Key Feed Store (915) 573*6691,8 to 9 A.M. 
Sweetwater*Ei Rancho Feed Co., inc. (915) 235-5474,10 to 11 A.M. 

Anson-Mitcheii’s Feed Store (915) 823*2871,12to1 P.M.
Haskeii-Nine Point Grain inc. (817)864*2011,2 to 3 P.M.

Knox City-Farmers Grain (817) 658*3642,4 to 5 P.M.

CALL YOUR LOCAL FEED STORE TO PLACE YOUR ORDER OR CALL COLLECT

Dunn’s Fish Farm

'A

(405) 777-2202
P.O. Box 85 Fittstown, OK 74842



HOUNDS
From Page One

r
'KC
1̂2 FIRST DOWNS

Throck
3

'112 YARDS RUSHING -60
p YARDS PASSING 41
:i0of 18 PASS COMPLETED 5 of 10
3 PASS INTERCEPTED 0

FUMBLES LOST 2
.3/25 PUNTS 5 for 36
' 1̂0/75 PENALTIES 4 for 30

frwn the receiver and then 
recovered the fumble.

l^ ox  City was not able to 
talje advantage of the tur­
nover and punted the ball 
a\^y. Chris Whitaker stop­
ped the Throck runner for no 
gain. Throck then tried a pass 
bul Kevin Eaton came 
through on the right side and 
blindsided the quarterback 
kn^king the ball loose and 
St^e Oudems recovered on 
Tlwock’s 37. The offense on 
foi^ downs were not able to 
make a first down.

On the last play of the first 
half, Wayne Hutchinson in­
tercepted a pass but was 
unable to get it into Jthe end 
zone.

Knox City got three breaks 
in last of the first half but 
were unable to take advan­
tage of them.

Letters To 
The Editor

Dear Billye,
I just wanted to share this 

with everyone in Knox Coun­
ty-
Dear Knox County Friends:

I just wanted to share with 
you a very special blessing 
that has come into our lives. 
Johnny and I now have a 
daughter, Dayna Michelle, 
who was born on October 9, 
Saturday. She weighs 7 lbs. 
and 5 oz. and we are very 
proud of her. Her head is full 
of dark brown hair and was a 
big surprise to us all!

I think of the many friends 
and acquaintences I left 
behind so often. I don’t think 
that I will ever live in a place 
that will mean as much to me 
as,the friends I have in Ben­
jamin, Munday, Knox City 
and Truscott and Gilliland. 
Your warmth, kindness and 
generosity toward me during 
my two years as county agent 
will always be remembered.

Much love, 
Sharon (Book) Barmore, 

; Johnny and Dayna

As the second half started, 
Throck tried an onside kick 
that did not work. KC started 
on their own 38. They moved 
down to the 19 of Throck but 
was unable to make a first 
down.

After Throck got the ball, 
Wayne Hutchinson intercep­
ted a pass on the second play 
returning it 12 yards to the 
Throck 24. Dwayne Watkins 
then passed 23 yards for a 
touchdown. Hutchinson then 
kicked the extra point. Score 
13-0.

The Knox City Hounds took 
charge of the game from this 
point on. The defense led by 
Chris Whitaker, Chad 
Whitley, Mike Oliver and Joe 
Rocha shut down any offense 
Throck might have had.

Ricky Gutierrez set up the 
next score with runs of 8, 3 
and 15 yards. Tyke Meinzer 
caught a 10 yard pass before 
Hutchinson caught a pass for 
a 12 yard touchdown. Then he 
kicked the extra point, 20-0.

Hutchinson added more 
when he returned a punt 58 
yards behind a great line of 
blockers to set off KC’s last 
touchdown when Stafford 
bulled over from three yards 
out.

The remainder of the game 
was totally dominated by KC 
led by Mike Oliver, George 
Rocha and Joe Rocha. Rod­
ney Dever intercepted a pass 
to keep Throck from moving 
anywhere.

This week will be the 
biggest game of the year for 
the Hounds when they enter­
tain the Aspermont Hornets 
in Greyhound Stadium at 
7:30. The Hounds have been 
waiting for this one a full 
year. Last year, a shaky start 
caused the Hornets to win the 
only game the Hounds lost in 
district? Both teams are un­
defeated in district play tliis 
year. It is going to be a great 
game. Don’t miss it!

October 
Renewals 
Due Now

In an effort to curb mailing 
expenses, the News office has 
begun a new procedure in 
notifying subscribers that 
their renewals are due.

The following is a list of 
subscribers whose subscrip­
tions expire in October.

One year subscriptions 
within a radius of 50 miles of 
Knox City are $7.50, for 
readers elsewhere in Texas, 
it is $9.00, and for out-of-state, 
the rate is $10.00.

As postal regulations 
require that all subscriptions 
must be paid in advance, 
readers must renew by the 
last day of October in order to 
continue to receive their 
papers. We don’t want to lose 
a single subscriber, so better 
hurry!

Daniel Banner, Littlefield 
Barney Beesley, Dumas 
Frances Birkenfeld. Munday 
Claudale Bratcher, Vera 
Don Brothers, City 
Shadie Clark, Dallas 
Jack Coffman, City 
Mrs. Dexter Covington, Nor­
th Carolina 
Mark Daniel, Abilene 
Jerry Eaton, City 
Ken Hickman, Wilson, Okla. 
E.R. Hodges, San Juan 
Jimmy Howell, Iowa Park 
Sylvia Irvin, Fort Worth 
Terry Keener, Childress 
Millard Lain, Waco 
David Lorenz, City 
James Manning, O’Brien 
M.H. Mansfield, Munday 
Jim Melton, Quitaque 
Bruce Perry, Colorado 
Grady Phillips, Munday 
Charles Reeves, Oklahoma 
Billy Bob Reynolds, City 
Claude Roberts, Oklahoma 
Yolanda Roberts, City 
J D. Rowell, Amarillo 
Elmo Stephens, Plainview 
Fred Stephens, Arizona 
Hazel Stockton, Benjamin 
Sherrill Stone, Dallas 
Melvin Strickland, Munday 
Wymon Tidwell, Houston 
John Thomasson, Sudan 
David Turner, Andrews 
Earl Webb, City 
E.H. Wheeler, City 
John Wilde, Munday 
Coleman Wright, Rochester

Church School 
Morning Worship 
Evening Worship

10:00 
11 m  
6:00

Doug Stenborg, Pastor
V
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Family Boutique
-Estelle Hawkins-

Vote
(From Page One)

Republican John L. Bates.
Judge, Court of Criminal 

Appeals, Place 2 candidates 
are Democrat Chuck Miller 
and Republican Ray Moses.

Incumbent State Senator 
Ray Farabee of District 30 is 
opposed by Libertarian Dan 
Dotson.

State R epresentative , 
District 78 candidates are 
Democrat Steven A. Carriker 
and Republican C.A. Jenkins 
Jr.

Democratic candidate Mrs. 
Marge West is being opposed 
by Republican Zoel G. Allen 
for Member, State Board of 
Education, District 13.

Knox County Democrats 
who are unopposed in the 
General Election include 
County Judge Homer T. 
Melton, District and County 
Clerk Gloria L. West, Sheriff 
(Unexpired Term) Morris E. 
(Gene) Nix, County 
Treasurer J.T. Cypert, Coun­
ty Commissioner, Precinct 2 
bobby Roberson, Justice of 
the Peace, Precinct 2 Pate 
Meinzer and Constable, 
Precinct 2 (Unexpired Term) 
LeRoy Davis.

Six proposed constitutional 
amendments will appear on 
the ballot and voters will cast 
their ballots in favor of or 
against: 1. The constitutional 
amendment repealing the 
state property tax. 2. The 
constitutional amendment to 
authorize the Legislature to 
provide assistance through 
the appropriations process to 
needy persons and to place a 
ceiling on payments for 
needy dependent children at 
one percent of the state 
budget. 3. The constitutional 
amendment exempting im­
plements of a husbandry 
(agricultural machinery and 
equipment) from ad valorem 
taxation. 4. The contitutional 
amendment authorizing the 
Legislature to provide terms 
not to exceed four years for 
members of governing boar­
ds of certain water districts 
and conservation and 
reclamation districts. 5. The 
constitutional amendment to 
abolish the office of county 
treasurer in Tarrant and Bee 
counties, and 6. The con­
stitutional amendment in­
creasing the maximum in­
terest rate allowed on state

general obligation bonds to a 
weighted average annual in­
terest rate of 12%.

Knox City and area voters 
in Precinct 1 will vote 
Tuesday at the Community 
Center in Knox City, while 
voters in Precinct 2 will cast 
their ballots at the City Hall. 
Polls will be open from 7:00 
a.m. to7:00p.m.

Santa Rosa Women 
To Sell Tamales

Readers are in for a treat 
again soon as the women of 
the Santa Rosa Catholic 
C!hurch are planning to make 
tamales for sale to the public 
on Saturday, November 6.

More details will appear in 
next week’s News, but for 
those who would like to order 
in advance, they may do so by 
contacting Elva Gonzales, 
Idella Escobar, or Eva 
Flores.
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TRICK T/?EAT ^

D. H. (DUSTY) HSK

Fisk Construction
701-B MalnStreet •  Knox City. Tx 79SM •  (817) 658»3292

General Contracting Services

-4F'
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X  C a » « k e r
Steven A

“ f o f

pest 0 « lc«  »* •

f a
, is  Che dey

f Tuesday* j neop^ , _
ctioT^- ery S°°Jroud to  D®

t v  VOh  ̂ ^
n l r c h a r v o u ^ ' = - ^ '  is  and sunpocC

IP paccy .  ̂ „ i i n  „  e a r t '; ,
Viesc

tnot>- 20 to  " c

t̂ ovi i t  ^ evety ^
^omineea o fa ce  do'J", tjemoocaca

' ^ % ^ U r h W ^ i : « r v f \ t a d e ^  3 0 's .

fa rcy  nov. V .feT h a P ' £^1^ *
We sitiahd in   ̂ £or us ■ . ies i®

f l s  ten c°  , r i c  Governor . ^  , in  c « ° /^ i j e n c .
a a r o S r e s s . ^ ''n en ooiacio  ”  ^oce

r u r ?  r f e . o c c a P ^ r c ^ ? , f r a \

y o u r v o te  -luesdaV
Democra sit^^erely. , y

Simpson
Electronics

TV & Stereo Repair 
10 Avenue D 

Haskell

Bobby Simpson 
(817)864-3111

»  ■ • '^"'’ rexas
^  Anson.Loaor.

^  KLMEJKBER...
VOTE FOR STEVEN A. CARRIKER

NoTember 2nd

Difficult times demand wise decisions. . .  and 
strong decision-makers like L t. Gov. Bill Hobby.
Texans are facing some difficult times. Now, more 
than ever, we need experienced, compassionate 
leaders in our state government.

We need a leader like Lt. Gov. Bill Hobby who has 
our interests at heart. Here’s how Hobby stands on 
the issues concerning Texans:

JOBS.
HOBBY is working to create more and better 
jobs for Texans. He is making sure jobless 
Texans receive their full unemployment bene­
fits. He is working to increase the efficiency to 
the Texas Employment Commission. He is 
stimulating economic growth and new jobs 
through responsible state spending and one of 
the lowest tax rates in the nation.

EDUCATION. CRIME.
HOBBY will not be satisfied until our education system is the best 
in the nation. His efforts to improve the quality of public education 
for your children and grandchildren begin in the classroom. He is 
for improving teacher salaries and benefits. He is for giving more 
control to local school districts.

HOBBY is for strong laws and certainty of punishment 
of criminals, backed by better training and pay for our 
police officers. He is helping upgrade our courts to 
speed up trials of accused criminals. He is for improv­
ing our prison system and parole system.

Re-elect

H8bby
c

. . .  A STRONG 
LT. GOVERNOR, 

HONESTLY.

tica l A dvertisem ent pa id  to r by the Re elect 
Gov. B ill Hobby Com m ittee, P.O. Box 567, 

Austin, Texas 78767

li
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^moke-Out 
is Set For 
November 18
;!The Knox County Unit of 
me American Cancer Society 
itJet for a salad supper, 
Tuesday, October 19, at the 
E'^st United Methodist Chur­
ch in Munday.
'/K a th erin e  S m ith , 

{^sident, was in charge and 
'.^inutes were read and.ap- 
lltoved and reports were 
^ e n .  A film, “ The Priceless 
Ciift”  was shown by education 
dtfrector Frances Coffman. 
;^ a in  topic of planning was 

fhe Great American Smoke- 
Out on November 18. Bertha

fO m m m m m m

Faye McKinney will serve as 
chairman. She reported that all 
Jaycees and Future 
Homemakers of America in 
Texas have agreed to help 
with this day. Officers of 
these organizations in our 
area will be contacted and 
pledge cards will be in every 
town’s bank and post offices., 
Also poisters and buttons will 
be available besides Larry 
Hagman’s Snappy Rubber 
Bands.

The treasurer’s report 
collected by this unit for 1982 
was $6,068.00.

The unit also welcomed Dr. 
J. Patrick Hooker and visitor 
Erma Feemster from the 
Baylor unit.

Motion was made and 
seconded that the club meet

on November 16 and dismiss 
for the month of December.

Louise Kemletz, a new 
member from Knox City, 
reported having contacted 
the Boy Scout leader and they 
had agreed to help with the 
Crusade ’83. Terri Rushing, 
district leader, was unable to 
attend.

Attending were Shirley 
Amerson, Ruby Roden and J. 
Patrick Hooker from Mun­
day, Louise Kemletz of Knox 
City, Katherine Smith, Loyd

Clark, Frances Coffman and 
Bertha Faye McKinney from 
Vera and Erma Feemster of 
Seymour.

Bloodmobile
From Page One

Whisenhunt, Betty Collins, 
Birdie Helton, Billie Jean 
McAuley, John Crownover, 
Eva Flores, Irene Flores, 
Barbara Ann Barnard, 
Donald J. Sanders, Susan F. 
Kuehler, Dennis Grossman, 
Fred McGregor, Leonard L. 
Phipps and Jonathan E. God- 
sey.

Registrars were Barbara 
Ann Barnard, Virginia Lieb 
and Mandy Tankersley. Jan 
Watson assisted with vitals 
and Ann White, Peggy Grin- 
dstaff and Joyce Crownover 
prepared blood bags. Donor 
walker, canteen assistant and 
blood bag deliver was Sue 
Marion.

Mrs. Barnard expressed 
further appreciation to the 
Rev. and Mrs. Ken Sickels 
and the members of the First 
Christian Church for their 
help and use of their

facilities; to the Rev. and 
Mrs. David Stone and the 
ladies of the Foursquare 
Church for the work and food 
provided for the canteen; to 
Melba Pharr and the 
professional help from the 
Knox County Hospital; to 
Lesley Tibbets and R.P. Bar­
nard for unloading the truck; 
to Joe Barnard and Payton 
Tankersley for reloading the 
truck and getting the church 
facility back in order; to 
Payton and Mandy Tanker­
sley for donating the ice for

the canteen; to the Knox City 
Florist for providing the 
traditional red rose bud vase 
which is much enjoyed by 
everyone; and to The Knox 
County News for all their 
coverage and space donated 
to this worthy cause.

DANCE
Saturday, October 30 

I CHARLIE SNYDER BAND'i.

UNDER 14-FREE WHEN
^ ACCOMPANIED BY RESPONSIBLE ADULT
\  BENJAMIN MEMORIAL CENTER
9 to 1 r Adm. S5

SHUGART COUPON
Tuesday, Nov. 9 

Bob’s Super Save
19 9
WALLET SIZE 

COLOR PORTRAITS

994
Extra charge 

for
GROUPS

Learn To Fly
PRIVATE PILOT GROUND SCHOOL 

AT STAMFORD AIRPORT 
STARTING OCT. 28, 7 P.M.

STAMFORD 
FLYING SERVICE

915-773-3392

Top of the Line 

20% RANGE CUBE

$ 1 0 5 0
per 100

KNOX FEED LOT
817-658-3748 Nights 658-3741

r
I
K.

KNOX CITY GREYHOUNDS

NO. NAME POS, WT.

10 Dwayne Watkins QB 167
12 Tyke Meinzer QB 1.55
20 Ricky Gutierrez B 150
22 Willie Robinson F 123
28 Wayne Hutchinson F 167
32 Steve Oudeins B 165
33 Sammy Johnson B i;i4
41 Jesse Agraz F 131
44 James Earl Stafford B 210
51 James Evatt C - 195
60 Joe Rocha G 1.50
61 Chris Whitaker G 160
62 Ronnie Reece G 1.56
64 Lupe Rios T 185
65 Teddy Espinosa G 1.50
68 Kevin Eaton G 1.55
70 Alex Espinosa T 165
74 Chad Whitley T 170
75 Mark Waiaski T 1.55
80 Craig Watson E 1.55
82 Mike Oliver E 165
88 Rodney Devers E 185

FOOTBALL 
SCHEDULE 

For Knox City Greyhounds We They

WILLIE ROBINSON
...Soph, fullback

JESSE AGRAZ
...Junior fullback

Sept. 3 Albany H, 8:00 18 27
Sept. 10 Seymour H, 8:00 27 6
Sept. 17 Munday T, 8:00 31 6
Sei t. 24 Open

DISTRICT GAMES

Oct. 1 Chillicothe H,7:30 41 0
Oct. 8 Crowell T,7:30 39 6
Oct. 15 Rule T, 7:30 33 14
Oct. 22 Throckmorton H,7:30 27 0
Oct. 29 Aspermont H,7:30
Nov. 5 Jay ton T, 7:30
Nov. 12 Motley Co. T,7:30

JUNIOR VARSITY BULLIES We They
Sept. 2 Albany T,6:00 6 28
Sept. 9 Seymour T,7:30
Sept. 16 Munday H,8:00
Sept. 23 Aspermont T,6:30
Sept. 30 Munday T, 7:30
Oct. 7 Crowell H,6:30
Oct. 21 Hamlin H ,7:30
Oct. 28 Haskell T, 7:30

COACHES: Jimmy Rogers, Tommy Sloan, Ronnie Cox 
MANAGER: Dante Gutierrez 
COLORS: Red and Blue

SUPERINTENDENT: W.R. Baker 
PRINCIPALS: Don Fritsche, Charles Reed 
BAND DIRECTOR: Dick Wupperman

HOUNDS VS. HORNETS 
Friday, October 29, Here

DRUM MAJOR: Becky Smith 
ASSISTANT DRUM MAJOR: Missy Waiaski 
MAJORETTES: Kristi Boone (head), Karae Beason, 

Peggilee Wupperman
CHEERLEADERS: Sarah Jones (head). Missy 

Pierce, Michelle Bateman, Sandy Sutton 
DRILL TEAM: Diane Helms (captain), Toni Hewitt, 

Amber Berryman, Daveine Holcomb, Adela Rocha, 
Tonya Averitt, Vera Sweat, Angie Norton

THE FOLLOWING MERCHANTS SPONSOR THIS AD AND ASK FOR YOUR SUPPORT FOR THE ‘HOUNDS

“M” SYSTEM
S&H GREEN STAMPS 

DON RAILSBACK, Mgr. 
658-3715

PERDUE
INSURANCEAGENCY
David & Judy Perdue-Peggy Guinn

YOUFtfmdependent 
Insurance §  j/KOENT

S E R V E S  Y O U  F I R S T

PERDUE
INSURANCE AGENCY
David & Judy Perdue-Peggy Guinn

MARGARET’S 
HOMEGROCERY

Margaret & E.J. Ward

CITIZENS STATE BANK
Insured to $100,000 

Member F.D.I.C.

KNOX COUNTY 
FERTILIZER

The Herbert Bellinghausens 
658-3817

THOMPSON ENTERPRISES
Dave and Stacy Thompson

Wholesale Used Police Cars 
Stamford, Texas Knox City, Texas 
915-773-5463 817-658-3142

KUEHLER 
LUMBER & SUPPLY

True Value Dealer 
658-3416

JERRY’S PLUMBING
Jerry & Peggy Guinn 

658-3322

, PACSHACK 
DON & MARLA HAWKINS

KMA
WELL SERVICE

GUINN SHEET METAL 
& PLUMBING

Heat & Air Conditioning 
658-3341 L.C. and Amerolis

ROLLING PLAINS 
WELL SERVICE 

AND TANK TRUCKS
817-658-3990

LOWREY’S
The Henry L. Whites 

658-3230

PENMAN CONOCO 
SERVICE, INC.

658-3513

CHRISTENSEN AVIATION
J. M. Christensen,

658-3716

WHITE AUTO STORE
Frances & Tommy Kent 

658-3133

QUALITY LITE WINDOWS 
OF KNOX COUNTY

658-3449

JONES PHARMACY
Henry J. Jones - Don Bunton 

658-3215

THE LADY BUG SHOPPE 
LI’L BUG SHOPPE 
THE ART STALL

6S8-3957

FAMILY BOUTIQUE
Estelle Hawkins 

658-3262

CLONTS
HARDWARE &FURN.

658-3113

LYNN ELECTRIC
The Jimmy Lynns 

658-3511

EGENBACHER
IMPLEMENT

The John Egenbachers
658-3242 >

SMITH
FUNERAL HOME

658-3251

CITY CLEANERS
Ken & Lorene Bradford- 

658-3641

KNOX CITY FLORIST
Joe and Barbara Barnard 

658-3581

O’BRIEN CO-OP GIN
Thomas Noren, Mgr. 

658-3631

WAYNE’S
66 SERVICE STATION

The Wayne Watsons 
658-3814

CITY HARDWARE
The Lawsons 

658-3222

OWENS AUTO SUPPLY
658-3323

CABLEVISION 
OF KNOX CITY

FOR TV ViEWING AT ITS BEST 
656-3613

C&R ELECTRIC
Tommy Coliins-Billy Bob Reynolds 

658-3921

BRIDGES OIL CO.
WHOLESALE & RETAIL 
Fina Petroleum Products 

658-3875

O’BRIEN FOOD STORE
The Coy Hewitts 

817-658-3951

THOMASSHOESHOP
Walter & Mary

SPEEDY’S
OIL FIELD' SERVICE, INC.

Transport Trucks - Hot Oiler 
658-3751

SKILES
EXXON STATION

658-3122

PUMPERS SUPPLY 
& EQUIPMENT

Terry Carter Donnie Bowies 
817-658-3260 817-997-2361

LEWIS
PAINT & BODY SHOP
Sterling-Danny-Troy-Todd-Shane

658-3342

OIL PATCH CAFE
The Pete Williams 

658-3754

TORTILLA FLAT
The Tony Rochas 

658-3460

FARM AND GARDEN 
STORE
905 E. Main 

658-3151

KNOX CITY GRAIN
Billy Mitchell, Mgr. 

658-3712

KNOX COUNTY 
FARM BUREAU

Don Welch-Terry Alexander
Insurance Agents 

817-422-4555

MARION
CONOCO STATION

658-3424

JANIE’S BARBERSHOP
Janie Wilkinson

Barber & Hair Styling 
Closed Mondays

PENMAN PROPANE, INC.
Bill Penman 

O’Brien-Rochester 
817-658-3321

COVEY’S GARAGE
IMPORT AUTO SERViCE 

658-3831 O’Brien

KNOX COUNTY NEWS
The Buddy Angles 

658-3142

BOYD’S WELDING SERVICE
SHELTON BOYD 

658-3639

LARSON’S PHARMACY
The Larry Staggs 

658-3210

FARMERS GRAINlCO.
Charlie Groves, Mgr.

' 658-3642
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No. 000000 GENERAL ELECTION
{ELW CION  GENERAL)

(Condado de) Knox County, Texas 
November 2, 1982 (2 de noviembre de 1982)

SAMPLE BALLOT
(BOLETA DE MUESTRA)

INSTRUCTION NOTE: (NOTA DE INSTRUCCION:)
Vote for the candidate of your choice in each race by placing an “X” in the square beside the candidate’s name. You may vote a straight ticket by 
placing an “XT in the square beside the name of the party of your choice at the head of the party column. (Vote por el candidato de su preferencia 
para coda candidatura marcando con um “X” el cuadro at lado del nombre ^ l  candidato. listed puede votar por todos los candidatos de un solo 
partido marcando con una “X* el cuadro al lado del partido de su preferencia a la cabeza de la columna para parHdos.)

Candidates for:
(Candidatos para:)

0

1 1 R epublican  Party
1___ [(Tartido Republicano)

1 1 D em ocratic Party
1___ {(Partido Democrdtico)

j 1 Libertarian Party
1___ \ (Partido Libertariano)

j------- j Citizens Party
1 \ (Partido de Los 
-------Ciudadanos)

W rite-In
(Voto Escrito)

United States Senator
(Senador de los Estados Unidos) 1 1 Jim Collins 1 1 Lloyd Bentsen 1 [ John E. Ford 1 1 Lineaus Hooper Lorette

United States Representative, District 13
(Representante de los Estados Unidos, Num. del Distrito 13) 1 1 Ron Slover 1 1 Jack Hightower 1 1 Rod Collier

Governor
(Gobemador)

1 1 William P. Clements, Jr. 1 1 Mark White 1 1 David Hutzelman j 1 Bob Poteet

Lieutenant Governor 
(Gobemador Teniente)

1 j George W . Strake, Jr. 1 [ Bfll Hobby 1 1 Laurel Kay Freeman

Attorney General
(Frocurador General)

1 [ Bffl Meier j j  Jim Mattox 1 1 Katherine S. Youngblood

Comptroller of Public Accounts 
(Contralor de Cuentas FUblicas)

1 1 Mike Richards 1 1 Bob Bullock 1 j Janet Tlapek
--------------------------------------------------------------- *

State Treasurer
(Tesorero Estatal)

1 1 Allen Clark 1 1 Ann Richards 1 j Alma Kucymbala

Commissioner of General Land OfBce 
(Comisionado de la Oficina General de Terrenos)

1 I Woody Glasscock 1 j Garry Mauro j 1 Charles S. Fuller

CfMnmissioner of Agriculture 
(Comisionado de AgricuUura)

1 1 Fred Thomberry 1 1 Jim Hightower 1 j Stanley Keen

Railroad Commissioner 
(Comisionado de Ferrocarriles)

1 1 John Thomas Henderson j James E. (Jim) Nugent 1 1 Dick Bjomseth 1 1 Bob Russell

Justice, Supreme Court, Place 1 
(luez, Corte Suprema, Lugar NCm. 1)

1 1 John L. Bates 1 1 Ted Robertson’

Justice, Supreme Court, Place 2 
(Juez, Corte Supremo, Lugar N6m. 2)

1 1 Bill Kilgarlin

Justice, Supreme Court, mace 3 
duet, Corte Suprema, Lugar Ndm. 3)

1 1 Charles W . Barrow •

Presiding Judge, Court of Criminal Appeals 
(Juez Presidente, Corte de Apelaciones Crimindles)

1 1 John F. (Jack) Onion

Judge, Court of Criminal Appeals, Place 1
(Juez, Corte de Apelaciones Crimindles, Lugar Ndm. 1)

1 1 Charles F. “Chuck”  Campbell, Jr.

Judge, Court of Criminal Appeals, Place 2
(Juez, Corte de Apelaciones Crimirudes, Lugar Ndm. 2)

1 1 Ray Moses j j Chuck Miller

State Senator, District 30
(Senador Estatal, Num. del Distrito 30)

1 1 Ray Farabee 
1----- • ^

1 1 Dan Dotson * ...  ̂ ^
.......' -i -v-

. J* V

State Representative, District 78
(Representante Estatal, Ndm. del Distrito 78)

1 1 C. A. Jenkins, Jr. 1 1 Steven A. Carriker

Member, State Board of Education, District 13 . 
(Miembro de la Junta Estatal de Instruccidn Pdblica, Ndm. del 
Dikrito 13)

1 1 Zoel G. Allen 1 1 Mrs. Marge West

Chief Justice, Court o f Appeal^ l ld i  District
(Juez Presidente, Corte de Apelaciones, Ndm. del Distrito 11)

1 1 Austin McCloud

County Judge
(Juez del Condado) j 1 Homer T. Melton

District and County Clerk 
(Secretario del Distrito y Condado)

1 1 Gloria L. West

Sheriff (Unexpired Term)
(Sherife) (Tdrmino no completado)

1 j Morris E. (Gene) Nix

County Treasurer
(Tesorero del Condado) 1 1 J- T. Cypert

County Commissioner, Precinct 2
(Comisionado del Coridado, Precinto Ndm. 2)

j 1 Bobby Roberson

Justice of the Peace, Precinct 2 
(Juez de Paz, Precinto Ndm. 2)

1 1 Pate Meinzer

Constable, Precinct 2 (Unexpired Term)
(Condesttwle, Precinto Ndm. 2) (T4rmino no completado)
>

1 1 Le Roy Davis

V,

PROPOSED CONSTITUTIONAL AMENDMENTS
(ENMIENDAS PROPUESTAS A LA CONSTITUCION)

INSTRUCTION NOTE: (NOTA DE INSTRUCCION:)
Place an "X” in the square beside the statement indicating the way you wish to vote. (Marque con una "X” el cuadro al lado de la frase que indica la 
manera en que quiere usted votar.)

N o .l

No. 2

No. 3

□
□
□
□
□
□

FOR (A FAVOR DE) 

AGAINST (EN CONTRA DE)

FOR (A FAVOR DE) ' 

AGAINST (EN CONTRA DE)

FOR (A FAVOR DE) 

AGAINST (EN CONTRA DE)

The constitutional amendment repealing the state property tax.
(La enmienda constitucional que revoca el impuesto estatal sohre la propie- 
dad.)

The constitutional amendment to authorize the Legislature to provide assist­
ance through the appropriations process to needy persons and to place a 
ceiling on payments for needy dependent children at one percent of the state 
budget.
(La enmienda constitucional que autoriza a la Legislatura proveer asistencia 
por el proceso de asignacidn a necesitados y establecer un Umite sobre los 
pagos para ninos dependientes necesitados de un por ciento dei presupuesto 
estatal.)

The constitutional amendment exempting implements of husbandry (agri­
cultural machinery and equipment) from ad valorem taxation.
(La enmienda constitucional que exenciona los Implementos de produccidn 
agricola (maquinaria y equipo agricultural) de la imposicidn de impuestos 
vor avaluo.)

No. 4

No. 5

No. 6

□
□
□
□
□
□

FOR (A FAVOR DE) 

AGAINST (EN CONTRA DE)I

FOR (A FAVOR DE) 

AGAINST (EN CONTRA DE)

FOR (A FAVOR DE) 

AGAINST (EN CONTRA DE)

The constitutional amendment authorizing the Legislature to provide terms 
not to exceed four years for members of governing boards certain vrater 
districts and conservation and redamation districts.
(La enmienda constitucional que autoriza a la Legislatura prooeer plaxos de 
no tnds de cuatro anos para los miembros de las juntas goberrumtes M  ciertos 
distritos de agua y distritos de conservacidn y redamacidn.) —

The constitutional amendment to abolish the ofiBce of county treasurer in 
Tarrant and Bee counties.
(La enmienda constitucional que anula el oficio de tesorero del condado en 
los condados de Tarrant y Bee.)

The constitutional amendment increasing the maximum interest rate allowed 
on state general obligation bonds to a weighted average annual interest rate 
of 12%.
(La enmienda constitucional que aumenta la tarifa mdxima de interds que se 
permite en los bonos generates estatcdes de obligacidn a un p rom e^  ponde- 
rado de 12% de interis annual.)



Fage lwHx*- I M F K V n V  = \  ; ,
Kno\ Citv, Texas, Thin s<la\. (>t tin- i‘: ‘

"V7 «T? fo *  G3/ao.[i®ffljiMa

ROUND
STEAK L b .

> R A F f :

Cheese Whiz 8-Ox

CHUCK ROAST

AMERICAN

K R A F T

Cheese
Slices

8-0 1.

FRESH GROUND

ER1«

S U N K IS T
LEMONS

LH
/(/

zn rrrn u n iifrin jT iT T i^^^

RED

DELICIOUS
APPLES lb.

K U 5 5 n

POTATOES
10-Lb

F O O D

TEXAS RUBY RED

^!»PR A PEFR U IT

LONG GREEN

CUCUMBERS

LA SAUCEHershey’s
Assorted A O E A
Cake Frosting 1 9  ™

WHOLESU.V

RANG E JUICE 3
T

fh u n J  ( /lAc'

'V. A A -

SARA LEE

POUND
CAKE

•11/4-OZ. SIZE-

AllKA SELTZER 
PLUSCOLD^
M EDICINE

20 Ct.

^  GREEN BEANS
3  'c‘ .S  $ 1 0 9

F I"'" Laijcrx
" /  S ,,!h :rss

/
AURORA

inf

T O ILET  TISSUE

4 "

GEBHARDT’S
Tamales

28 Oz.

TIO SANCNO TACO SHELLS 10 ct.

C o m fl

6 9 *

Tonnsu
POUCH 5 o  $1110
MIXES

CIACKERS 79*
LB. BOX

22 Oz.

WAGNER  
FRUIT DRINK

quart

|̂ lp3 DOG FOOD
65<23 V2 Oz.

26 Oz.

HAIR SPRAY

9 0 Z ^ 1 6 9

A P P LE
JELLY 7̂

18 OZ.

O I A O I O L A

w IilL  S10AO  p u f c h M t

FABRIC SOFTENER

if  99
40 ct.

i
31b een

MilSt
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