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County 4-H 
Youth Win At 
Fort Worth

Knox County 4-H’ ers 
results of the Fort Worth Fat 
Stock Show have been 
released according to County 
Extension Agent Jim 
Mazurkiewicz.

Placings and divisions are 
as follows:

Swine -- Lori Griffith, fifth 
place York, fifth place 
Duroc; Amy Griffith, first 
place Hampshire, fifth place 
Berkshire; Becky Griffith, 
sixth place Spot, fourth place 
Chester; and Troy Pratt, first 
place, Chester White.

Steers -- Julie Partridge, 
fifth place Angus; Angie Par­
tridge, sixth place Hereford;
Ronnie Brown, eighth place 
Shorthorn; and Shannon 
Ryder, third place^ereford.

Heifers -  Doug Brown, 
second place Spring Heifer 
calf, second place Junior 
Heifer calf, second place 
Spring Yearling Heifer; and 
first place Junior Yearling 
Heifer; and reserve cham­
pion Junior Heifer.

hioundettes Scouts Accepted To
Comanche Wichita Faiis Lodge

The Knox City Houndettes, 
who have won District 18-A 
round robin, were in Baird 
Monday night to play Coman­
che, winners of District 8- 
AAA, 42-37.

Mary Albus was high point 
with 16, Sharon Roberson had 
12, Kay Howell 6, Mindy Hut­
chinson 6, and Diane Helms 2.

The girls will finish district 
play Friday night when Knox 
City hosts Paint Creek, ac­
cording to coaches, Steve 
Mcllhaney and Dale Wain- 
scott.
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ACCEPTED INTO the Order of the Arrow Lodge No. 35 in Wichita Falls last 
month are these scouts and their leader. From left, back row, Andy Correll, 
James Evatt, and Scoutmaster David Albus. Front row, left to right, David 
Thompson and Michael Albus.

KC Has Champions 
at Fort Worth Show

Four local Boy Scouts and 
their Scoutmaster recently 
completed the “ Ordeal”  and 
have been accepted into the 
“ Order of the Arrow” Lodge 
Number 35 in Wichita Falls.

Completing the initiation 
were Scoutmaster David 
Albus, Life Scout and Patrol 
Leader James Evatt, Star 
Scout and Patrol Leader An­
dy Correll, Life Scout and 
Senior Patrol Leader Michael 
Albus, and Life Scout and

Assistant Senior Patrol 
Leader David Thompson.

The winter ordeal was held 
at Perkins Scout Reser­
vation, north of Wichita 
Falls. To belong to the Order 
of the Arrow is a great honor 
for a Scout. He has to excell in 
his leadership ability as well 
as camping and other 
scouting skills.

These scouts were voted on 
by the members of Troop 161 
in Knox City and were “ tap-

Hounds Up Record 
With Two Victories
By Coach Tommy Sloan

The Greyhounds won the 
round robin by beating Old 
Glory and Rochester last 
week. The Hounds still have 
one round robin game 
remaining with Paint Creek. 
Next week, the Greyhounds 
must compete in the district 
tournament at Haskell, 
February 19 and 20.

Knox City defeated Old 
Glory by a score of 83-29. 
Defensively, the Hounds were 
led by Rickey Gonzales with 
nine steals-recoveries and 
Andy Barnard with 13 
rebounds. Offensively, the 
leading scorer was Adam 
White with 17 points followed 
by Andy Barnard with 16 
points.

Scores by quarters:
Knox City: 25, 20, 16, 22 =  83 
Old Glory: 10, 6,7,6 =  29 
Scoring for Knox City were 

Adam White 17, Andy Bar-

Ten FFA’ers At 
San Antonio Show

Ten Knox City FFA’ers will 
be in San Antonio February 
15 through 20 exhibiting swine 
at the annual stock show.

According to Leon 
Burkham, ag advisor, Andy 
Barnard, Steve Rutherford, 
Kevin Eaton, Kristi White, 
Daniel Godsey, Kelley Boone, 
Kevin Leach, Mike Oliver, 
Ray Farmer, and Bobby D. 
Burkham will be attending.

*

nard 16, Rickey Gonzales 13, 
Daniel Alsides 10, J a y » 
Rutherford 8, Ricky 
Gutierrez 8, Kevin Leach 6, 
Kelley Boone 3, and Arturo 
Rocha 2.

The Hounds used a strong 
offensive first half to defeat 
Rochester by a score of 49-22. 
The defense which held 
Rochester to 22 points was led 
by Jay Rutherford with 10 
steals-recoveries and Andy 
Barnard with six rebounds. 
On the offensive side, Adam 
White had 16 points followed 
by Andy Barnard with 12 
points.

Scores by quarters:
Knox City: 16,15, 4,13 =  49 
Rochester: 8,4,6,4 = 22 
Scoring for Knox City were 

Adam White 16, Andy Bar­
nard 12, Jay Rutherford 8, 
Kevin Leach 8, Rickey Gon­
zales 2, Kelley Boone 2, and 
Ricky Gutierrez 1.

ped out” at scout camp last 
summer. Each had to suc­
cessfully complete the “ Or­
deal” before becoming mem­
bers of the Order of the 
Arrow. Eagle Scout Mike 
Oliver is also a member of the 
Order.

The Greenbelt District 
Spring Camporee will be held 
in Knox County this year. Ac­
cording to Scoutmaster 
Albus, the camporee will be 
held in early April on the big 
timbers section of the League 
Ranch. He further commen­
ted that he and the local 
scouts are looking forward to 
hosting the event.

With this past Sunday being 
“ Scouting Sunday” , the 
leaders and scouts of Troop 
161 expressed a big “ thank 
you” to the members of the 
local American Legion Post 
for the use of the top floor of 
their building as a meeting 
place as well as a place to 
store their equipment.

Thanks was also expressed 
to Joe Clonts and the many 
other persons in Knox City 
who have helped the Scouts 
with donations of money, 
transportation, and their 
time.

Kelly Cowart, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Gus Cowart, 
exhibited the champion 
Yorkshire barrow in the open 
show at the Fort Worth Fat 
Stock Show, while Tyke 
Meinzer, son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Doug Meinzer, showed the 
champion Yorkshire barrow 
of the junior show.

Placings of other exhibitors 
included Kelley Boone, 5th 
medium weight Berkshire; 
Karomy and Kandon Sloan, 
5th light weight Berkshire; 
Kristi White, 2nd and 6th light 
weight Chesterwhite, and 8th 
medium weight Angus steer; 
Dan Godsey, 2nd heavy 
Hampshire, 5th heavy cross, 
and 9th medium weight 
cross; Craig Watson, 3rd 
light weight Hampshire; Jay 
Rutherford, 2nd heavy weight 
Hampshire; Steve Ruther­
ford, 7th light weight Ham­
pshire; Kevin Leach, 6th 
medium weight spot, 8th 
heavy weight spot, 10th heavy 
weight Yorkshire; Kelly 
Cowart, 1st medium weight 
Yorkshire; Bobby Don 
Burkham, 4th light weight 
spot, 8th light weight cross; 
Kevin White, 8th light weight 
spot; Tyke Meinzer, 1st 
heavy weight Yorkshire; J. 
Emerson, 30th light weight 
Yorkshire; Justin Emerson, 
8th heavy weight cross; Kyle 
White, 7th medium weight 
Yorkshire; Jeff Reece, 12th 
heavy weight Yorkshire; and 
Kevin Eaton, 8th heavy 
weight cross. Other

exhibitors were Chris 
Whitaker, Mike Oliver, and 
Wayne Hutchinson.

Parents who helped in get­
ting the exhibitors to Fort 
Worth and who also helped 
with preparing the animals 
for the show ring included 
Susan and J.M. Emerson, 
Bobbie and Doug Meinzer, 
Eloise and Leon Watson, 
Hiram Whitaker, Gayle and 
Jimmy White, Marie and Gus 
Cowart, Gloria and Charles 
Durham, Leona Burkham,

and Sharon and J.B. Ruther­
ford and Alesha. Joining the 
White family were her sister, 
Carolyn Griffin of Springtown 
and his parents, Mattie and 
D.I. White. Also joining the 
Knox City group were Sue 
and Jimmy Hackney and 
family of Fort Worth.

There were 1436 barrows 
entered in the show this year, 
according to vo ag advisor 
Leon Burkham, who super­
vised the group while in Fort 
Worth.

Three Terms To 
Expire At Benjamin

In the upcoming City of 
Benjamin election, three 
terms are expiring, including 
those of Mayor Vernon D. 
(Butch) McCanlies and coun- 
cilmen Dennis Duke and 
Steve Conner, all two year 
terms.

Holdover offices are those 
of Buddy Tolson, Weldon 
Gideon, and Claude Stockton.

As of press time, no one had 
signed up for any of the races.

Did You Know...
that Ilene Turner, 1953 Cindy 
Sue Apt. #3, Las Vegas, 
Nevada 89106 subscribes to 
The Knox County N ew s l

At Haskell Gym

District Tourney 
Set Feb. 19-20

The District 18-A Basket­
ball Tournament has been set 
for February 19 and 20 at the 
Haskell Gym.

Seven schools make up 
District 18-A including Rule, 
Rochester, Weinert, Lueders- 
Avoca, Old Glory, Paint 
Creek, and Knox City. 
District 18-A basketball is 
played in two parts, a round- 
robin followed by a district 
tournament of the top four 
teams.Knox City Greyhounds

Hosptial Auxiliary 
To Meet February 16

The monthly meeting of the 
Knox County Hospital 
Auxiliary will be next Mon­
day night, February 16, at 
7:00 o’clock in the hospital 
cafeteria.

P eg g y  M cG a u gh ey , 
auxiliary president, urges all 
members and other in­
terested persons to attend.

Houndettes, 
JV’s Win

KC Teams Do Weil 
In Weekend Tourney

KNOX CITY businessman E. Hob Smith 
displays a beautiful quilt presented him by the 
Rochester Hobby Club last week. He had given 
the club a number of men’s ties from which the 
quilt was made. The club honored Hob and his 
wife, Lois, at a luncheon prior to the presen­
tation.

By Coach Randy Ivy
The freshman and JV boys’ 

basketball teams competed 
in the Knox City tournament 
this past weekend with both 
teams doing a fine job.

The Freshmen beat Stam­
ford in their first game by a 
score of 38-25. Wayne Hut­
chinson pumped in a game 
high 20 points although 
missing several other 
golden scoring opportunities. 
Chad Whitley added 7, Junior 
Grindstaff five, Dante 
Gutierrez four and Kevin 
Eaton two points.

Chris Whitaker didn’t score 
a point against Stamford, but 
his last second shot from 35 
feet out banked in to win the 
championship game over a 
tough team from Goree 35-33. 
Chris’s desperation shot at 
the buzzer came after Knox 
City had stalled the last 36 
seconds off the clock only to 
throw the ball away with five 
seconds left in the game. 
However, on Goree’s inbound 
pass Dante, who had thrown 
the ball away with five 
seconds left, tipped the pass

causing Goree to double drib­
ble with three seconds left. 
Chris then hit the winner. 
Hutchinson again was high 
point with 14, Whitley eight, 
Whitaker six, Gutierrez 
three, Eaton and Grindstaff 
two each.

The JVs didn’t do quite as 
well although they played one 
of their best games all year in 
the championship game 
against Munday. They 
reached the championship by 
beating Stamford in a close 
game 43-36. Rodney Dever 
played his best game all year 
and led all scorers with 20. 
Joe Rocha added nine. Tyke 
Meinzer seven, Dell Guinn 
four, Craig Watson two and 
Steve Lynn one.

Against Munday, the 
Junior Varsity led sparingly 
through the game but came 
up short at the end by a score 
of 33-26.

I’m very proud of both 
teams for their efforts 
throughout the year. Let’s get 
one more victory by whipping 
up on Aspermont.

By Coach Steve Mcllhaney

Last week, the Houndettes 
won the district round robin 
with victories over Old Glory 
and Rochester. On Tuesday 
night, the Houndettes 
defeated Old Glory 54-18 and 
Friday, they won 53-23 over 
Rochester.

Against Old Glory, the girls 
played one of their better 
games. Our defense was good 
and our full court press 
produced many turnovers. 
Our rebounding was good 
which allowed us to get our 
fast break going which 
resulted in some easy 
baskets.

Against Rochester, it was 
really hard to tell how well we 
played because the game was 
real physical with few fouls 
called. Our defense was good 
as a whole although we did 
not start out well and allowed 
some easy shots early. 
Rochester had 17 points at 
halftime, but we held them to 
only six for the second half.

By winning, the round robin 
this means the Houndettes 
will be the number one seed 
in the tournament and will 
play the fourth place team in 
the first round. It also means 
that if we are beaten in the 
tournament we will have 
another chance in a one game 
playoff. The Houndettes 
district record is now 11-0 and 
season record 17-8.

Knox City 
Old Glory

54
18

Kay Howell 14, Mary Albus 9, 
Mindy Hutchinson 2, Patty 
Durham 8, Diane Helms 3, 
Sharon Roberson 14, Delores 
Stafford 2, Karae Beason 2. 
Knox City 53
Rochester 23
Albus 17, Hutchinson 10, 
Durham 6, Roberson 13, Staf­
ford 5, Beason 2.

Last week, the JV and 
freshmen teams won four out 
of five games. On Tuesday, 
the two teams combined to 
defeat Jayton 28-17. Then 
they split up to play in the an­
nual Knox City JV and 
freshman tournament.

Both teams won their first 
games as the freshmen 
defeated Stamford 47-4 and 
the JV’s defeated Stamford 
46-20. The freshman won their 
division by defeating Haskell 
12-4 in the championship 
game. The JV’s lost ot 
Haskell in the championship 
game 28-19.

Both teams played well at 
times in the tournament 
especially on defense. We did 
not score well in either of the 
championship games but part 
of this was due to the fact that 
we had split up into two 
teams and had not worked on 
offense together very long.

The combined record for 
the year now stands at 10-5. 
Knox City 28
Jayton 17
Nedria Oudems 8, Toni 
Hewitt 4, Adela Rocha 6, 
Angie Quintana 9, Daveine 
Holcomb 1.

and Houndettes have won the 
round robin.

Tourney games will begin 
at 4:00 Thursday with the #2 
Rule and #3 girls teams, 
followed by Rule and Roche­
ster boys at 5:30. Knox City 
girls #1 will play the H  girls 
at 7:00; girls still vying for 
the #2 and #3 positions are 
Lueders-Avoca, Paint Creek, 
and Old Glory. Knox City 
boys finish the evening 
against #4 Lueders-Avoca at 
8:30.

Championship games will 
be Friday evening at 7:00 
girls, and 8:30 boys. If the 
Knox City teams should also 
win the tournament, they will 
be declared District 18-A 
winners. If any other team 
wins the tourney, there will 
be a playoff game or games 
Saturday evening at the 
Haskell gym between win­
ners of the round-robin and

winners of the tournament, 
to decide District champs.

District 18-A winners will 
play 17-A champions Ben­
jamin girls and Harrold boys 
at places to be announced 
later. Girls’ bi-district ball is 
set for February 23 or 24; 
boys will be March 9 or 10.

Weather
FURNISHED BY PLANT 
MATERIALS CENTER 

4 Miles NW of Knox City

Date Low High
2-3 23 58
2-4 30 41
2-5 30 41
2-6 30 49
2-7 37 48
2-8 34 54
2-9 37 55 .20

AMONG THOSE Knox County Auxiliary ‘Pink 
Ladies’ who assisted in moving the Thrift Shop 
from its former location to the new one at 110 
South Central, just south of the Masonic Lodge 
Building, are, from left, Stella Ferguson and Ar- 
nell Denton. The new location has much more 
space and persons are urged to take their good, 
used clothing, furniture, or other articles to 
them.
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GLOXINIA FOR VALEN­
TINE’S DAY “  Six inch pot, 
$5.00 H o rticu ltu re  
Greenhouse. Knox City Cam­
pus, 1 to 3.

2-12 Itc

SH AK LEE PR O D U C ­
TS----- Cheryl Daniel, 658-3196

12-25 tfc

SEE Y ^ R  m o n u m e n t s  
before you buy. More than 50 
designs to choose from. Also 
curb work. J.C. McGee. tfc

GLOXINIA FOR VALEN­
TINE’S DAY -  Six inch pot, 
$5.00. H o rticu ltu re  
Greenhouse, Knox City Cam­
pus, 1 to 3.

2-12 Itc

BOXSPRINGS AND mattress 
for three quarter bed for sale 
-  Good and clean. Call 658- 
3701.________________ 1-29 tfc

GLOXINIA FOR VALEN­
TINE’S DAY “  Six inch pot, 
$5.00, H orticu ltu re  
Greenhouse. Knox City Cam­
pus, 1 to 3.

2-12 Itc

BREAKING PLOW Shares 
and Shins, parts for tractors, 
plows, trucks, and cars. 
Bearings, oil filters, belts, 
batteries, plugs, points, air 
and fuel filters, chisel spikes, 
duckfoot, sweeps and 
busters, Servis shredder and 
Krause plow parts.
E G E N B A C H E R  IM ­
PLEMENT, INC. 1-29 tfc

We want to thank our frien­
ds for their cards, visits, 
phone calls, and all acts of 
kindness shown us during 
Willis’ stay in the hospital. 
Also, thanks to Dr. Howell 
and the hospital staff.
2-12 Itp Willis and Elizabeth

NOTE OF APPRECIATION
We want to express our 

heartfelt thanks and ap­
preciation to all of our frien­
ds, neighbors and acquain­
tances for helping to make 
our Golden Wedding An­
niversary such a special day. 
We appreciate so much the 
cards, telephone calls, gifts 
and, most of all, every ex­
pression of love extended to 
us.

Of special significance to us 
was the representation of all 
the churches at our reception. 
Every one of you had a very 
special part in making this 
one of the most memorable 
days in our lives.

Having lived in Knox Coun­
ty all our lives, we have lear­
ned the true value of friends 
and your expression of love 
and friendship to us on this 
occasion made our Fiftieth 
Wedding Anniversary a day 
we shall always remember 
and treasure. For this, we 
thank you.
2-12 Itc Curtis & Opal Coates

CARD OF THANKS
I want to express my ap­

preciation to all who ex­
pressed concern for me while 
I was in the hospital here and 
in Wichita Falls. Thank you 
for your calls, cards and 
prayers. A special thanks to 
Dr. Thompson and the 
hospital personnel for the 
good care they gave me.

BUDDY TOLSON WELDING 
SERVICE- Portable welding 
on farm and ranch. Will build 
pens and barns. Phone 454- 
3231, Benjamin. tfc

RIVERSIDE CHEMICAL, 
Knox City, would like to help 
you with all your fertilizer 
and chemical needs. .Call 
(817) 658-3841. tfc
INCOME TAX SERVICE - 
Federal taxes done quickly 
and reasonably. Trained by 
H&R Block, had several 
years’ experience. Charleen 
Miller, 658-3213. 1-8 tfc

BAYLOR MILLING CO., 
Throckm orton Highway, 
Seymour. Custom mixing- 
pelleting - your grain or ours. 
Range cubes, creep feeds, 
hog feeds, start to finish. 888- 
3921.____________________ He
W ATER W ELL
DRILLING:House, Stock, 
Irrigation Wells, Test Holes. 
Call W.P. Hise (817) 864-3727, 
Haskell, Texas (day or 
night). 2-15 tfc

CUSTOM FARMING and 
welding, Ed Daniel, 658-3196.

12-25 tfc

AUTOS, TRUCKS 
TRAILERS

1978 PONTIAC Sunbird. 
13,000 miles on engine and 
transmission. $2,000.00. Call 
(817) 658-3995. 2-12 4tc

FOR SALE -1972 Chevrolet, 
good condition. 658-3172.

2-12 Itc

FOR SALE -  1971 Ford V2 ton 
pickup, long wheel base, 390, 
fo u r -sp e e d . 658-3168.

2-12 Itp

RED TAG SALE - Through 
February. A big savings on 
furniture, glass and other 
items. Some very fine and 
rare pieces. Please come by 
and prowl through. Gray’s 
Antiques, 831 West Main, 
Munday, Texas. 2-12 Up

WATERCOLOR CLASSES, 
starting February 16, 7-10 
p.m. The Art Stall, Knox City 
Mini Mall, phone 658-3957.

2-12 Itc

ARTISTS -  Now introducing 
Pam Elmore teaching 
classes in oil landscapes to 
beginners and intermediates. 
Classes are now being 
organized at Happiness Is 
Homemade, Munday, (817) 
422-4027. 2-5 2tc

FOLK ART CLASSES each 
Monday a.m. and Tuesday 
p.m. Enroll now at The Art 
Stall, Knox City Mini Mall, 
phone 658-3957.

2-12 Itc

NOTICE - The Hospital 
Auxiliary Thrift Shop has 
moved to its new location, 110 
South Central, south of the 
Masonic Lodge Building and 
is now open for business.

2-12 tfc

U k e f W )
♦ s to c k  
i D ^ ^ n e r i c a .

2-12 Up John Milford

NEW COU 
2V4 baths, 0 
Highway, E*rKir

amily Room, 
|ter, Munday 

eat Buy7^75,000.

rWO BEDROOM, living room, kitchen, one bath, garage. 
New carpet, roof - corner lot. Priced to sell, $21,000. 1109 
South Third.

THREE BEDROOM Brick, Living Room with fireplace, 
kitchen, fenced backyard, laundry room, storage room, 
two-car carport. 606 South Central $45,000.00 Appointment 
only.
I'HREE OR FttU^^BedioonM^% bath, fully carpeted, 
central heat Shown by appointment
only. 1006 SouthFifth.

REMODELED -  Vinyl sided, 2 bedroom, 1 bath, living 
room, dean with wood burning stove. Central heat and air. 
Large storage shop, carport. Available with or without ap­
pliances. Owner will finance, good terms. Good location,' 
409 South Third Street.

O’BRIEN -  Three bedroom, large kitchen, living room, 
one bath, cellar, two lots. Good price.

THREE BEDROOM, 1-3/4 bath, living room, kitchen. 
Assumable loan. South Second. $25,000,00.

RESIDENTIAL LOTS

IN MUNDAY -  Four very nice home building lots on Gail 
Street between South 11th and 12th. Excellent neigh­
borhood. Paved street.

TWO EXCELLENT lots on North Third and Avenue B.

THREE EXCELLENT lots in Warren Addition. Old 
house. Excellent buy at $5,000.00.

LEASE OR RENT
WE HAVE two houses that owners would lease on long term
Kq Cl o

COMMERCIAL
NICE BUSINESS with excellent potential. Bad health is 
forcing retirement. Good financing available. Norma’s 
Leather Express. If you have wanted your own business 
and have a little money, this may be what you have been 
waiting for. Call us!
INVESTMENT REAL ESTATE - Texaco Service Station 
with 28,000 gallon storage. Good location. Priced to sell.
DhIRY m a r t  p r o p e r t y  - Corner lot, new roof on 
building. Lot 114x140. Excellent location.

FARM LAND
160 ACRES of the best farm land in Haskell County, close 
to O’Brien. 2 irrigation wells without pumps. $1,000 per 
acre with '/a minerals.

IS
REALTOR'

DAVID COUNTS 
Insurance and Real Estate 

102 N. Ave A 
(817) 658-3211

TO BE MOVED -  Five-room 
house, bath and utility in good 
condition. (817) 422-4496, 
Munday. 2-12 4tp

FOR SALE: Three bedroom, 
two bath, three walk-in 
closets, kitchen, utility, 
dining and den brick veneer 
home. 1,683 sq. ft. including 
single carport and storage. 
Located in Shannon addition 
in Knox City. Call (817) 658- 
3780 or 658-3660. 1-29 3tp

Need To 
Sell or Buy?

USE THE CLASSIFIEDS

RN SUPERVISOR, evening 
or night shift, 7 days on, 7 
days off, 10 hr. shift. Seymour 
Hosptial Authority, Box 351, 
Seymour, Texas 76380. (817) 
888-5572. 2-12 2tc

American 
Heart 
Association

WE'RE FIGHTING

FOR YOUR LIFE

Margaret’s
802 EAST MAIN

W e e k e n d  S p e c ia ls
Good Thurs.-Fri.-Sat.

We reserve the right to limit.

GOOCH SUGAR CURED Q Q

B A C O N
ONE GALLON PLASTIC JUG $ 0 1 0

P R E S T O N  M I L K
0

PRESTON ONE GALLON PLASTIC JUG Q K

L O W  F A T  M I L K

S E E D  P O T A T O E S  Lb 2 5 «
TEXAS SWEET ^  A

O N I O N  P L A N T S  Bunch I
REGULAR Bunch 39<’
O N I O N  P L A N T S  „̂ 3/$i

LOCAL INVITATION 
TO BID

ON HIGHWAY MOWING _
Sealed proposals for ten 

separate mowing contracts in 
Hardeman, Childress Hall, 
Donley, Knox, and Wheeler 
Counties will be received at 
the State Department of 
Highway and Public Tran­
sportation District Office at 
1700 Avenue, F, N.W., P.O. 
Box 900, 79201, until 2:00 P.M. 
February 20,1981.

Proposals will not be con­
solidated for bidding pur­
poses. Bidders must submit 
individual bids for any of the 
following separate highway 
mowing proposals:

PROPOSAL NO. 1 (1
Year): Hardeman County, 
U.S. Highway 287, from F.M. 
268 to Wilbarger County line 
to include all of F.M. 925, 
length 30.56 miles, ap­
proximate area 540.12 acres.

PROPOSAL NO. 2 (1
Year): Hall Childress, and 
Hardeman Counties U.S. 
Highway 287, from Estelline 
to F.M. 268, to include all of 
Loop 328 and F.M. 2466, 
length 34.88 miles, ap­
proximate area 502.62 acres.

PROPOSAL NO. 3 (1
Year):Donley and Hall Coun­
ties, U.S. Highway 287, from 
Hedley to Estelline, length 
26.25 miles, approximate 
area 339.04 acres.

PROPOSAL NO. 4 (1 Year) 
Donley County, U.S. Highway 
287, from Armstrong County 
line to Hedley, length 27.35 
miles, approximate area 
355.04 acres.

PROPOSAL NO. 5 (2
Year): Knox County, U.S. 
Highway 82, from King 
County line to Baylor County 
line, length 30.75 miles, ap­
proximate area 195.00 acres.

PROPOSAL NO. 6 (2
Year): Knox County, U.S. 
Highway 277, from Haskell 
County line to Baylor County 
line to include F.M. 266 from 
U.S. 82 to Goree, length 26.15 
miles, approximate area 
209.58 acres.

PROPOSAL NO. 7 (2
Year): Wheeler County, U.S. 
Highway 83, from Hemphill 
County line to Collingsworth 
County line, length 31.95 
miles, approximate area

232.36 acres.
PROPOSAL NO. 8 (2 

Year): Wheeler County, In­
terstate Highway 40, from 
Gray County line to North 
Fork of Long Dry Creek, 
length 11.10 miles, ap­
proximate area 306.54 acres. 
PROPOSAL NO. 9 (2 Year): 
Wheeler County, Interstate 
Highway 40, from North Fork 
of Long Dry Creek to Station 
1150 plus 00. To include all of 
F.M. 3075, F.M. 1547 
(Wheeler Co.) F.M. 2474 and 
F.M. 2168, length 19.20 miles, 
approximate area 340.94 
acres.
PROPOSAL NO. 10 (2 Year): 
Wheeler County, Interstate 
Highway 40, from Station 1150 
plus 00 to Oklahoma State 
line to include all of F.M. 1802 
and Spur 30, length 9.92 miles, 
approximate 314.29 acres. 
Proposals, plans, and 
specifications may be ob­
tained at the Department Of­
fice of the following Mainten­
ance Construction Super­
visors: John W. Rothwell, 
Jr., Childress; Albert B. 
Johnson, Jr., Clarendon; 
Gene R. Crabtree, Quanah; 
Terry L. Keener, Munday; 
Joe B. Hall, Shamrock; or 
District Office, Childress.
A pre-bid conference will be 
held with Mr. Lewis H. 
White, District Engineer at 
the District Office in 
Childress, Texas at 10:00 
a.m. February 20, 1981. Per­
sons interested in bidding on 
any of the above proposals 
should attend this pre-bid 
conference. Following the 
pre-bid conference bids will 
be open at 2:00 p.m., 
February 20,1981.
The State Department of 
Highways and Public Tran­
sportation, in accordance 
with the provision of Title VI 
of the Civil Rights Act of 1964 
(78 Stat. 252) and the 
Regulations of the U.S. 
Department of Transpor­
tation (15 C.F.R., Part 8), 
issued pursuant to such act, 
hereby notifies all bidders 
that it will affirmativley in­
sure that the contract entered 
into pursuant to this adver­
tisement will be awarded to 
the lowest responsible bidder 
without discrimination on the

ground of race, color, or 
national orgin._______ 2-5 2tc

LEGAL NOTICE 
THAT IN ACCORDANCE 
WITH SECTION 30.05 OF 
THE PENAL CODE TEXAS 
CRIM IN AL TRESPASS 
(SENATE BILL 111 PASSED 
BY THE 62nd
LEGISLATURE), NOTICE 
IS HEREBY GIVEN THAT 
ALL LANDS OF W.T. 
WAGGONER ESTATE ARE 
POSTED EXCEPT WHERE 
WRITTEN PERMISSION 
IS GIVEN TO COME UPON 
THE SAME.

KILLEN M. MOORE 
tfc TRUSTEE

LEGAL NOTICE 
Advertisement For Bids

Sealed proposals will be 
received by the Knox City- 
O’Brien Consolidated In­
dependent School District, 
400 North Fourth Street, 
Knox City, Texas at the of­
fices of the Superintendent at 
2 P.M. C.S.T. on the 27th day 
of February for the construc­
tion of an Auditorium.

Separate proposals will be 
received on the following 
items:

1) General Construction
2) Auditorium Seating
3) Heating, Ventilating, 

and air Conditioning
4) Electrical Work

5) Plumbing Work
6) Floor Coverings

at which time and place the 
proposals will be publicly 
opened and read aloud. Any 
bids received after closing 
time will be returned 
unopened.

Copies of all plans,, 
specifications, and other Con-i 
tract Documents are on file' 
and available for public in­
spection in the office of the 
Architect, Fred W. Heatpn,' 
Jr., 205 E. Neches St., Suite 
103, Palestine, Texas 75801, 
and may be obtained upon 
receipt of a $30.00 deposit. .

Bid security is to be fur­
nished by each bidder in the 
amount of 2% of the bid, bŷ  
cashier’s check, certified 
check, or a bid bond.

No bid may be withdrawn 
for a period of 30 days from 
the scheduled closing time. ■

Knox City-O’Brien Con­
solidated I.S.D. reserves the. 
right to reject any or all bids 
and to waive formalities.
/s / J.M. Emerson, Secretary 

2-5 2tc

arnold insurance 
and real estate

(817)658-3509
FOR SALE at 1206 South Third -- Three bedroom, two 
full baths, storm cellar, garage, completely refur­
nished inside and out, storm windows, part carpeted, 
new kitchen and dining area, linoleum, all new plum­
bing and wiring. Priced reasonable.
THREE BEDROOM, two bath home, located on large 
corner lot with carport. Trees and good location to 
school.
BENJAMIN-What you have been looking for. Four 
bedroom colonial type home, nice condition, has been 
well kept, 40x60 all metal shop or storage building, also 
other nice buildings located on a full block of land, 
reasonably priced. Shown by appointment only.
WE STILL HAVE one lot, ready for your new home on 
South Fourth in Knox City.
208 ACRES all cultivated, five miles north of Rule. 
Front one miles on Highway 6, one-fourth of mineral 
rights. Owner financed. Possibility of underground 
irrigation.
LOOKING FOR A small business site? 115 Central 
Avenue in Knox City may be what you have been 
looking for.
O’BRIEN “  14x60 trailer house, located on 24 acres of 
irrigated land. Some farm equipment available, 
located five miles west of O’Brien.

Contact
IBarney Arnold Barney B. Arnold
Pat Anderson Esther Conn

M O N E Y  M A R K E T  
C E R T IF IC A T E S

1 4 . 6 8 0

$10,000 Mininnum ■ Term 182 Days
Effective February 12-18

Substantial Penalty For Early Withdrawal

N E W  C .D .  A V A I L A B L E
30-Month Maturity 
$1000.00 Minimum

WE PA Y HIGHEST INTEREST PERMITTED BY LA]/\t

11.75%
Interest May Be Compounded, Deposited To Your Account 

Or Paid Directly To You 
SUBSTANTIAL PENALTY FOR EARLY WITHDRAWAL

C IT IZ E N S  
S T A T E  B A N K

Member F.D.I.C.-lrisured to $100,000 
KNOX CITY, TEXAS



HAPPY SECOND Anniver­
sary, Carmen and Wayne, 
February 14. Love you. Mom 
and Louis. 2-12 Itp

ROSES ARE red, violets are 
blue, girls are sweet and boys 
are too!

Love to my four: Danny, 
Troy, Todd, Shane, you too, 
Patricia!

HAPPY VALENTINE’S DAY 
to my wonderful wife, Betty, 
All my love, David.

2-12 Itc

LOVE TO my other four 
valentines Amy, Traci, 
Brandon and Justin.

TO MY last three 
valentines, I love you too, 
Patti, Pam, and Larry!

TO BILL- The last 14 years 
have been the happiest of my 
life. Thanks, may we have 
many more-I love you. Hap­
py Valentine’s Day. 2-12 Itp

HAPPY VALENTINE’S DAY 
to our every day favorite 
customer -  you know who you 
are! The News gang.

^  ( T c x o l )  ^

HAPPY VALENTINE’S 
DAY to Lori and Joey in 
Sweetwater.

TO MY ANONYMOUS phone 
caller -  say somethin’ -  I 
know who you are!

cJLC/vS

BABY -Thank you for all the 
love you’ve given me and for 
always being there. Happy 
Valentine’s Day. Love, San­
dy. 2-12 Itp

TO THE TWO most impor­
tant people in my life -  Keith 
and Wade. I love you both. 
Lynda Brooke

HAPPY V A LE N T IN E ’ S 
DAY, G and C! We love you!

2-12 Itnc

HUGS AND KISSES to the 
‘Vegas’ gang - 1 miss you all! 
From “ one fool to another” !

HAPPY V A LE N T IN E ’ S 
DAY, We love you, Roy.

Kay, T a m m y ,  E r i c .

'SS Representative 
Visit Feb. 19

>; A representative of the 
I'Vernon Social Security Office 
“̂ will be in Knox City Thur- 
fsday, February 19, from 1:00 
/until 2:30 p.m. at the City

Hall.
The representatives will be 

on hand to assist persons in 
filing an application for

Social Security Retirement, 
S u rv iv o rs ,  D i sa b i l i t y ,  
Medicare, or Supplemental 
Security Income benefits.

Statement Of Intent 
To Change Rates

^"General Telephone Company 
> o f the Southwest, in accor- 
;*dance with the Rules of the 
vPublic  Utility Commission of 
‘ITexas, hereby gives notice of 
♦;the Company’s intent to im- 
I^plement a new schedule of 
;«rates in Texas e ffec tive  
• ' February 27, 1981.

!*The proposed changes in 
• ' rates will affect all customer 
*- classes and are designed to 
^ in c r e a s e  the  C o m p an y ’s 

gross annual revenue derived 
I '  from local service by 23%.

A complete set of revised rate 
schedules has been filed with 
the Public Utility Commission 
at Austin, Texas, and is 

'< available for public inspec- 
^  tion in each of the Company’s 
I* Business Offices in the State 
;♦ of Texas. A summary of the 

Company’s rate filing has 
also been sent to the Mayor’s 

^  O ffic e  of each a ffe c te d  
>- municipality.

I  S O
> GERERAL TELEPHORE

> The Knox 
:County News
<  (USPS 903-920)

P.O. Box 7
Knox City, Texas 79529 

♦r Telephone (817 ) 658-3142
<Billye B. Angle...........Publisher/Editor
^jStacy Angle.................. Assistant Editor
ITPublished at Knox City, Texas 79529,
: every Thursday. Second Qass Postage 
-paid at Knox City, Texas 79529.

V SUBSCRIPTION RATES
;'One Year Subscription Within

50 Miles of Knox City.........................$7
One Year Elsewhere in Texas............$8
One Year Out of State.......................... $9

 ̂NOTICE - Any erroneous reflection 
upon the character, standing, or 

•frjeputation of any person, firm, or cor- 
cjoration , which may appear  ̂in the 
;’^ lu m n s  of this paper will gladly be 
“xorrected upon notice of same being 
^•brought To the attention o f the 
'publisher.
‘ Postmaster: Send change of 
; address notice to The Knox 
«tounty News, Box 7, Knox 
!City, Texas 79529.

FARMERS & RANCHERS
GOT GREENBUGS IN YOUR WHEAT?

Call Howard Thatcher At 
Allied Sprayers Inc.

And I Will Check Your Fields

KNOX CITY

915-773-3392 Days 
915-773-2585 Nights STAMFORD

A t  B i g  C o u n t r y ,  w a t c h  t h e  

l i t t l e  g e t  b i g .  A n d  t h e  b i g  

g e t  b i g g e r .

Effective Feb. 5-18

1 2 . 0 0 0 %
12.940%

Annual

Annual
yield

E a r n e d  o n  t h e  

m i n i m u m ,  2 V i  

y e a r  C . D .

This is an annual rate. The rate 
r - - ■ ■ is subject to change at maturity. 
i E 3 K  Substantial penalty for early 

-i withdrawal.

$100

Effective date Feb. 12-18

14.680%
15.394%

Annual

Annual
yield

E a r n e d  o n  t h e  

$ 1 0 , 0 0 0  m i n i m u m ,  

6  p i o n t h  C . D .

BIG COUNTRY 
SAVINGS

Stamford, Haskell, Quanah and 
38CO South Clack, Abilene. 

(Formerly First Federal of Stamftird.)

This is an annual yield. The rate is 
subject to change at maturity. And  
federal regulations prohibit the com­
pounding of interest during the term of 
the account. Substantial penalty for 
early withdrawal.

O’Brien Happenings
By AUDIE JOHNSTON
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the way home, they visited 
the Jerry Hodges family in 
Graham.. Donna Underwood 
and Mark Childre of Waco 
met them all in Fort Worth. 
John John Morrow went 
home with her for a visit.
BITS OF WISDOM 

“ Following the course of 
least resistance is what 
makes rivers and some men 
and women -  crooked.”

HERE AND THERE
Mr. and Mrs. A.A. Pierson 

spent a few days in Abilene 
last week visiting their son, 
Ken Pierson and wife Linda.

Andy Hines, student at 
Texas Tech in Lubbock, 
visited his grandparents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Ranzy Herring, last 
week.

Mrs. Sue Stephens, Scott 
and Suzanne, Mrs. Dessie 
Egenbacher and Mrs. O.S. 
Johnston spent last Wed­
nesday in Lubbock. Suzanne 
had to see an ear specialist 
and Mrs. Johnston visited her 
sister Lynell.

Mr. and Mrs. Ronnie Lusk 
and boys of Shallowater spent 
the weekend with Mr. and 
Mrs. John Covey and Mr. and 
Mrs. L.A. Covey, Ava and 
John.

Sam Johnston visited Don 
Johnston and family in 
Slaton, Jim Johnston and 
family and Shirley Duncan 
and girls in Lubbock Friday 
and Saturday.

Mr. and Mrs. Orval Man­
ning visited their son, Royce 
and wife Peggy and son Brad 
last Wednesday in Abilene.

Visiting Mr. and Mrs. 
Dwight Gothard Sunday were 
their son, Paul Dean and 
family of Highland.

Mr. and Mrs. Keith Rowan 
of Stephenville spent the 
weekend with Mr. and Mrs. 
Ivan Rowan and Wayne.

Mr. and Mrs. Preston 
Manly of Bonham came by 
Monday to check on Mrs. 
D.T. Elmore’s home and to 
visit the Burton Elmores. 
Mrs. Elmore is in a care 
home in Bonham.

Mrs. Anna Johnston was 
dismissed from the Knox 
County Hospital Saturday af­
ter spending several days in 
and out of traction for a leg 
condition.

Mr. and Mrs. A.A. Cox 
spent last week in Fort Worth 
babysitting their son, Bobby 
Cox’s two children, while 
they were skiing in Colorado. 
They also visited Mr. and 
Mrs. Wallace Cox and bovs

and saw their grandson, 
Terry, play basketball.

Don Roberts was in 
Amarillo last Tuesday atten­
ding to business.

Mr. and Mrs. Sam Johnston 
were in Lueders last Tuesday 
and visited with Rev. Bill 
Trice and wife while they 
worked on their home there.

Ruth and Anne Underwood, 
Sharon and John John 
Morrow visited in Fort Worth 
last week in the home of 
Lucille Collins, Murray Un­
derwood and Wayne Wright 
and families. Wayne Wright 
had just gotten over a heart

attack and was home. They 
visited Buster Corley in a 
nursing home in Fort Worth 
and he is much improved. On

Call In Your News 
658-3142

C SANDBLASTING 8i PAINTING »

J Willie Carrington
J Seymour, Texas *
U
I* (817)888-2592

Call After 5:00 P.M.

Dr. C.L Cromwell
OPTOMETRIST

Phone

(915)773-3542

STAMFORD

stained
Glass

Classes
ALL TOOLS AND 

MATERIALS 
FURNISHED. 

*40.00
SIX SESSIONS 

658-3113 or 658-3950

-k DANCE
to all your favorites at the 

Guthrie Young Homemakers’

“COUNTRY DISCO”

FEB. 14,9:00 P.M. 
GUTHRIE COMMUNITY CENTER

Breakfast will be served 
following the dance at 1:00.

Admission Includes Breakfast

$4.00 each or $7.00 couple

STOP EXPENSIVE PAINTING
United States Steel Siding

UNITED STATES VINYL SIDING 
ALUMINUMREPLACEMENT WINDOWS

100% FINANCING AVAILABLE

C.W. “Dutch” Benson Construction
Authorized Dealer

BENJAMIN PHONE 817-454-2281

ULSUrS XSSTD.

ICE CREAM
$1 38

BD.CTN. 1
RE6./ELEC. PERK/DRIP

FOLGER'S COFFEE

ICE
CR»M A l l S U P ’S

CONVENIENCE STORES

"THERE’S ONE NEAR YOU ”
PRICES EFFECTIVE FEBRURRY 12-14.1981 

SUPPLIES LIMITED - WE ACCEPT FOOD STAMPS

LARGE SELECTION OF CANDY

VALENTINE HEARTS
99<>PRICED FROM TO

SHURFME
TOMATOES

2  89^

SHURFINE CUT

GREEN BEANS

3  is, 9 9 ^

ASSORTED

BORDEN’S DIPS

SCHILLINB BLACK 0  i i  i |  Q

PEPPER
SUNSHINE

CHIP-A-ROO’S
S I  29

12 OZ. ^  ■
PKB. ■

MORTBN BEEF/CHICKEN J

POT PIESSiM®®
SHURFINE WHOLE KERHAL

CORN

3c’.v s 9 9 ^

SHURFINE PINK

SALMON
S I  7 9300 ^  ■

CAN ■

SHURFRESH

CRACKERS
.  5 9 c

SHURFRESH BM/SM

BISCUITS

4 . 6 9 ^

EARLY JUNE
SHURFINE PEAS
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The
Kennel

SOPHOMORE CLASS NEWS 
By Kristi Boone

In the Knox City JV tour­
nament, both the junior var­
sity teams came in second. 
Sophomore girls par­
ticipating on that team were 
Adela Rocha, Toni Hewitt, 
Angie Quintana and Kristi 
Boone. Sophomore boys were 
Joe Rocha, Craig Watson, 
Dell Guinn, Mike Oliver, 
Rodney Dever, and Tyke 
Meinzer.

Many sophomores are par­
ticipating in UIL literary ac­
tivities and are getting ready 
for an upcoming mock meet. 
FFA NEWS 
By Jeff Reece

This past week, we were in­
volved with the Fort Worth 
Fat Stock Show. The chapter 
did well with Tyke Meinzer 
and Kelly Cowart winning 
breed champions. We took 35 
hogs dnd four steers. The 
members that were down the 
whole time were Kelly 
Cowart and Jeff Reece. The 
others all got down Thursday.

We would like to thank the 
many people who really 
helped when they were 
needed: Mr. Emerson who 
took a whole day off to pull a 
trailer down for us, Mr. White 
who was there the whole time 
and helped everybody, Alex 
Godsey who helped enor­
mously in getting everything 
ready to go. And our respect, 
admiration and thanks to Joe 
Godsey without whose help 
we couldn’t have been able to 
show all the different 
animals. Joe took off a whole 
week so he could help us out. 
Thanks, Joe. We would also 
like to thank the many paren­
ts who came and supported 
us. And a very special thanks 
to Mr. Burkham who put up 
with us the whole time and 
was smiling all of the time, 
with one exception.

Screening Clinic 
Set February 17

A screening clinic spon­
sored byr tine Texas Depar­
tment of Health will be held 
at the Knox County Aging 
Center in Knox City on 
Tuesday, February 17, from 
9:00 a.m. until 12:00 noon.

Screening tests will be of­
fered for blood pressure, 
diabetes, anemia, skin disor­
ders, height and weight. If an 
abnormality is found, the 
person will be referred to the 
physician of their choice.

O’Brien Girls 
Defeated 
By Crowell

O’Brien’s seventh and 
eighth grade girls met up 
with Crowell’s seventh and 
eighth grade girls with the 
score being 14-17. The girls 
put up a really good fight 
coming out on the losing end. 
Paula Garza and Vera Sweat 
played well though they 
didn’t score. The top scorers 
were Tammy Rogers with 10 
and Eloise Agraz with four.

The last game was Monday 
against Haskell, playing both 
seventh grade and eighth 
grade games.

SCHOOLAND 
COMMUNITY 
CALENDAR

Thursday, February 12 — 
Junior varsity girls and boys 
at Aspermont, 5:00 p.m.; 
Lions Sweetheart Banquet, 
7:00 p.m.; Lincoln’s Birthday 
Friday, February 13 -- Knox 
City and Paint Creek, here, 
7:00 p.m., girls and boys 
Saturday, February 14 — 
Valentine’s Day 
Monday, February 16 -  San 
Antonio Livestock Show 
begins
Wednesday, February 18 -  
Noon Lions Club, Masonic 
Fellowship Hall

MENUS
BREAKFAST MENUS: 

February 16-20,1980 
Monday: Sliced Peaches, 
Cinnamon Toast, Chocolate 
Milk
Tuesday: Orange Halves, 
Muffins, Chocolate IV^ 
Wednesday: Grape Juice, 
Scrambled Eggs, Buttered 
Toast, Jelly, Chocolate Milk 
Thursday: Apple Juice,
Sausage, Buttered Toast, 
Jelly, Chocolate Milk 
Friday: Applesauce, Cin­
namon Rolls, Chocolate Milk 

LUNCH MENUS: 
February 16-20,1980 

Monday: Pigs in Blankets, 
S c a l l o p e d  P o t a t o e s ,  
Blackeyed Peas, Fruit Salad, 
Milk
Tuesday: Frito Pie, Corn, 
Apple Cobbler, Batter Bread, 
Butter, Milk
Wednesday: CharBurgers, 
Lettuce, Tomato and Pickle 
Slices, Potato Rounds, Cake, 
Milk
Thursday: Stew, Cheese
Slices, Crackers, Lettuce 
Wedges, Cinnamon Rolls, 
Milk
Friday: Chicken Fried
Supreme, Whipped Potatoes, 
Green Beans, Hot Rolls, But­
ter, Honey, Milk

STREAMS IN 
DESERT PLACES
By OZELLE STEPHENS

“ What happiness for those 
whose guilt has been 
forgiven. What joy when 
sins are covered over. What 
relief for those who have con­
fessed their sins and God has 
cleared their record.”  
(Psalms 32:2)

and Daivd said, “ There 
was a time when I wouldn’t 
admit what a sinner I was. 
But my dishonesty made me 
miserable and filled my days 
with frustration. All day and 
all night your hand was heavy 
on me. My strength 
evaporated like water on a 
sunny day until I finally ad- 
rtiitted all my sins to you and 
stopped trying to hide them. I 
said to myself, “ I will confess 
them to the Lord” . And you 
forgave me and all my guilt is 
gone.”

Now I say that each 
believer should confess to 
God when he is aware of 
them, while there is time to 
be forgiven. Judgment will 
not touch him if he does.

Remember God is your 
hiding place from every 
storm of life. He will keep 
you from getting into trouble. 
He will surround you with 
songs of victory. He will 
guide you along the best 
pathways of your life and 
never leave you alone. 
(Psalms 32).

d o w n . . .
CALL

LYNIU ELECTRIC 

MOTOR CO., INC. 
658-3511

YOUR JACUZZI DEALER!

I

★  JV, Freshman ★  
^ Tourney Results it

GIRLS 
First Round 
Freshmen 
Haskell 
Munday

Knox City 
Stamford

46
20

17
14

Toni Hewitt 6, Adela Rocha 
10, Kristi Boone 8, Angie 
Quintana 21, Missy Whitley 4.

Knox City 47
Stamford 4
Michelle Bateman 4, 
Daveine Holcomb 9, Marilyn 
Benson 4, Cindy Hernandez 6, 
Tina Alsides 4, Nedria 
Oudems 9.

Consolation
Munday
Stamford

25
21

Consolation
Munday
Stamford

Championship 
Knox City 
Haskell

19
10

12
4

BOYS

Holcomb 2, Hernandez 2, 
Oudems 8

First Round
Goree
Haskell

31
15

First Round 
Junior Varsity 
Haskell
M iin H p v

31
15

Knox City 38
Stamford 25
Wayne Hutchinson 20, Kevin 
Eaton 2, Chad Whitley 7, 
Junior Grindstaff 5, Danta

Benjamin School Has 

New Lunch Guidelines
The Benjamin Independent 

School District has received 
guidelines for free and 
reduced-price lunches.

Supt. Kenneth Roberts said

that if any parent feels that 
their child or children 
qualify, they should go by the 
superintendent’s office and 
fill out an application.

INCOME POVERTY 
GUIDELINES

FAMILY SIZE 
1 
2
3
4
5
6
7
8

Each Additional 
Family Member

FREE MEALS 
$0-5,700 
0-7,220 
0-8,750 
0-10,270 
0-11,800 
0-13,320 
0-14,850 
0-16,370

$1,530

REDUCED-PRICE
MEALS

$5,700-8,350 
7,220 -10,730 
8,750-13,110 

10,270-15,490 
11,800-17,870 
13,320 - 20,250 
14,850-22,620 
16,370-25,000

$2,380

Texas Awarded Grant 
For DOE Program

Use The 
Classifieds

Boyd’s 
Welding 
Service

Backhoe Service 
Available

24 HR. SERVICE 
Shelton Boyd 
(817)658-3639

9
W h e n  y o u r  |  

w a t e r  s y s te m  |  

le t s  y o u  I

DALLAS - The State of 
Texas has been awarded a 
grant of $2,345,936.00 to con­
tinue implementation of the 
U.S. Department of Energy’s 
(D O E )  W eath er iz a t i on  
Assistance Program for Low- 
Income Persons in Texas, it 
was announced today by G. 
Dan Rambo, Regional 
Representative for DOE.

The grant will allow Texas 
to continue weatherizing 
homes of low-income residen­

ts under the FY 1981 plan 
developed by the Texas 
Department of Community 
Affairs. This will be the fifth 
year that weatherization 
assistance has been provided 
to low-income Texans under 
the DOE Weatherization 
Program which has resulted 
in the weatherization of more 
than 11,800 homes.

The Texas program is part 
of a nationwide effort to 
reduce energy consumption

GRANNY’S PLACE
Special Of The Week

Thurs. ■ Fri. - Sat.

Bowl Of 
Chili 99

CLOSED SUNDAYS
MON. • FRI. 7 A.M. ■ 7 P.M. SATURDAYS 7 A.M. • 8 P.M.
658-3858 SOUTH CENTRAL Knox City

Get the chain saw  
with something extra

McCulloch’s Pro Mac 610 has always offered you extra 
power and extra features. It’s got dependable Solid State 
Electronic Ignition for easy starting, Automatic and 
Manual Oiling, Wraparound Chain Brake/Hand Guard, 
a rear handle design with boot loop and a powerful 
3.7 cubic inch engine with choice of 16" or 20" bar and 
chain. Now, the Pro Mac 610 is an even better value 
because we’re packing an extra loop of chain in every

carton. Get the 
McCulloch Pro Mac 
610 with extra 
chain. It’s an extra 
good deal.

IlMcCULLOCHWfm CHAM WlAICE

Kuehler
Lumber & Supply

Gutierrez 4.

Consolation
Haskell
Stamford

31
30

Championship
Knox City 19
Haskell 28
Hewitt 2, Rocha 7, Boone 5, 
Quintana 4, Whitley 1

Championship
Knox City 35
Goree 33
Hutchinson 14, Eaton 2, 
Whitley 8, Whitaker 6, Grin­
dstaff 2, Gutierrez 3 
Junior Varsity
Munday 41
Haskell 22

Knox City 43
Stamford 36
Craig Watson 2, Tyke Mein­
zer 7, Rodney Dever 20, Dell 
Guinn 4, Joe Rocha 9, Steve 
Lynn 1

Mr. and Mrs. Tommy Guy 
Waldrip of Rolla, Kansas, 
proudly announce the birth of 
a seven pound, six ounce 
baby girl born in Morton 
County Hospital on January 
5 at 3:47 p.m. She has been 
named Anna Marie and was 
the first baby born in the 
hospital in 1981.

Waiting at home for her 
was her brother, Byron, who 
is six and one-half years old.

Maternal grandparents are 
Mr. and Mrs. Frank Elgin of 
Liberal, Kansas, and Mr. and 
Mrs. Tommy Waldrip of 
Knox City are paternal gran­
dparents.

P ate rna l  g reat-
grandparents are Mr. and 
Mrs. L.G. Waldrip of Keller.

Consolation
Stamford
Haskell

Championship 
Knox City 
Munday

39
31

26
33

Meinzer 9, Dever 2, Guinn 6, 
Lynn 3, Rocha 4, Watson 2.

Slnfipson
Electronics

TV & Stereo Repair 
10 Avenue D 

Haskell

Bobby Simpson 
(817) 864-3111

TOWER 
DRIVE-IN

RULE, TEXAS
Box Office Opens 5:30 

Show Starts 6:30
Fri.-Sat.-Sun.
Feb. 13-14-15

‘MY 
BODY 

GUARD’
Story Of 
Teenage 
Couple

Rated PG

Ml

ForAmbulance Service
please call 658-3535.

(Knox County Hospital)

FRUIT TREES
S ’ m VARIETIESPEACH,4to5’

STRAWBERRY PLANTS S  /  -
ALL RED PLUM, 3 to 4’
THREE VARIETIES GRAPES, ONE YR. OLD PLANTS 
FRUITLESS MULBERRY, 6 to 7’
WEEPIHO WILLOW, 0 lu 4'
OnCPC M¥nTLC,-«’

Horticulture Class
Monday-Friday 1 to 3 

658-3115
KNOX CITY SCHOOL CAMPUS

Low rey 's

Suggests For 
Your Valentine

U

Beautiful Lingerie

SELECTED
GROUP

M

\

658-3416



Delta Kappa Gamma 
Meets A t Aspermont

Beta Chi Chapter of Delta 
Kappa Gamma met Saturday 
afternoon, February 7, at 2:30 
^.m . in the Aspermont 
Methodist Church with 
Aspermont members as 
hostesses. Twenty chapter 
"members were present.

Chapter president Donnie 
Fincher called the meeting to 

|t^der and led the group in 
repeating the Delta Kappa 
;Gamma “ Collect” . 
y  In her “ Moments of 
;Meditation” , Grace Mullen 
;read an inspiring poem, a 
passage from Psalms 24, and 
jA number of other literary 
^passages on the subject of 
'“ Fear” . In her comments, 
.she noted the various types of 
fear.
< Corresponding secretary 
■Katrina Robinson made an- 
*houncements and read 
Jf^Thank You”  notes from 
various members.

:< In her membership report, 
‘"mem bersh ip  ch a i r m a n  
LaRue Reeves read 
resignation notes from two 
chapter members, one 
request for a change from ac­
tive to reserve membership, 
and membership recommen­
dations for twelve new active 
and two new honorary mem­
bers. The chapter accepted 
the two resignations, granted 
the request for a change in 
type of membership and will 
vote on recommendations of 
Jiew members at the March 
chapter meeting. New mem- 
l>ers will be initiated in April.
> Mary Martin told of the 
recent death of a longtime 
feskell Delta Kappa mem- 
i)er and a much loved chapter 
; worker, Louise Lemmon.

Accompanied by Susie 
Flowers at the piano, Thelma 

t̂ Smith gave a life sketch of 
music director, Clara Scott, 
and directed the group 
singing of the song, “ Open 
My Eyes That I May See” , 
written by Clara Scott.

Program chairman Mary 
Martin introduced the 
program by the Professional 
Affairs Committee. Sammie 
Carpenter on the subject of 
“ Research”  and Mauryse 
Stone on the subject of “ Per­
sonal Growth and Services” 
gave very interesting 
discussions based on 
material from the book, 
“ Future Shock”  by Alvin 
Toffler, and from articles 
found in Delta Kappa 
Bulletins.

With Mary Martin at the 
piano, Dana Martin led the 
group singing, “ The Delta 
Kappa Gamma Song” .

Amidst pretty Valentine 
d e c o r a t i o n s ,  de l i c i o u s  
refreshments of dainty san­
dwiches, roasted nuts, cherry 
tarts, candy and coffee were 
served.

Sammie Carpenter, Exa 
Faye Reed, and Sudia Cash 
represented Knox City at the 
afternoon meeting.

The next meeting will be 
March 7 at 2:30 p.m. in the 
Benjamin Memorial Center 
with Truscott and Benjamin 
members as hostesses.

Couple To Wed 
Valentine’s Day

Mr. and Mrs. C.D. Castle of 
Garland announce the 
engagement and approaching 
marriage of their daughter. 
Shannon DeeAnn Castle to 
Mark Alan Reeves, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. William M. Reeves 
of Saint Jo.

Shannon is the gran­
ddaughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Carl Chafin of Knox City.

The couple will be married 
February 14 in Saint Jo.

N A j^riH V

Happy
Birthday
Tammy

From Mom, 
Dad and Eric

DA VID HAJEK
ANNOUNCES THE ASSOCIATION OF

TOM SCHRANDT
(former Wichita County Attorney) 

for the

General Practice of Law 
at 100 South Washington 

Seymour, Texas 
Phone 817-888-5549

UMW Discuss 
1981 Projects

The United Methodist 
Women met February 3 for 
their regular bi-monthly 
meeting with twelve mem­
bers present.

In the absence of UMW 
president Charlotte Patter­
son, vice-president Ruby 
Robinson presided over the 
business session.

Several projects for 1981 
were discussed, but all were 
tabled until a later date. 
Final plans for the Senior 
Supper on March 2 were 
made.

Lena McGee brought an in­
spiring devotional by reading 
excerpts from “ Moment by 
Moment” and “ Growth in 
Love” by E. Stanley Jones. 
The program, “ Love Made 
Visible Through People in 
Mission” with emphasis on 
how our local community 
could get involved in energy 
conservation was led by 
Mamie Watson. Assisting her 
with the program were Peggy 
McGaughey and Mary Beth 
Smith.

Emma Watkins dismissed 
the meeting with prayer.

Retired Teachers 
Meet January 27

T a k e *  W i
. s t o c k V s f t O ^
m ^ ^ ^ erica .

The Knox County Retired 
Teachers Association met 
Tuesday, January 27, at 2:30 
p.m. in the Knox City Com­
munity Center.

Hostesses Louise Finley, 
Exa Faye Reed, Hazel Long 
and Margaret Siecke served 
delicious sandwiches, roasted 
almonds and pecans, olive 
balls, cookies and coffee to 
sixteen members and guest.

President Hazel Long 
called the meeting to order 
and introduced special guest 
Byron V. Newberry, assistant 
director for the Texas 
R et ir ed  T e a ch e r s
Association.

Newberry and his wife live 
in Hamlin and both of them 
are retired teachers.

Newberry read a letter 
from E.L. Galyean, chair­
man of TRTA legislative 
committee, concerning plan­
ned raises for retired 
teachers. He said there is 
plenty of money available to 
take care of the raises. He 
reminded us, too, that these 
raises could be a tremendous 
help in the present time of in­
flation. After discussion the 
pay raise bills with 
legislation chairman Ila 
Boyd, Mr. Newberry 
suggested all retired teachers 
could help by writing their

state representatives and 
senators concerning the pen­
ding legislation.

Since Colonial Penn Insur­
ance will be taken over in 
July by Prudential Insuran­
ce, members who have 
Colonial Penn Insurance 
were advised to hold onto it.

Newberry encouraged all 
retired teachers to join RTA 
organizations and let their 
memberships serve as votes 
to help in better legislation. 
He said those who do not sup­
port RTA are sitting back let­
ting someone else do their job 
and get their raises for them. 
He further encouraged RTA 
members to take advantage 
of NRTA/AARP Catalog 
Pharmacy Service.

All members, especially 
incoming RTA officers, were 
encouraged to attend up­
coming workshops in 
Abilene, Thursday, May 14 or 
in Wichita Falls, Friday, May 
29. Further information for 
these workshops will be 
received later.

Mauryse Stone gave a very 
interesting review of “ Early

Days in Munday” from the 
town’s first settlement until 
the present time.

Sammie Carpenter amused 
the group with first hand 
reminiscences of her years in 
Knox City from 1906 to the 
present time. She discussed 
schools, pioneer families.
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churches, hotels, wagon yar­
ds, early transportation, the 
old city well, business houses, 
entertainments and many 
more things of interest.

The next meeting will be 
Tuesday, February 24, at 2:30 
p.m. with hostesses Mary Jo 
Lankford, Lois Smith, and

Sudia Cash.

At that time, Mrs. Weldon 
Norman, will show slides and 
share with us her trip to 
China. Mrs. Norman is a 
retired teacher who lives in 
Rule and is an extensive 
traveler.

N O T I C E
Knox City - O’Brien Taxpayers

Persons who are eligible for Residence Homestead, Additional 
Elderly, Disabled, and/or Disabled Veterans’ exemptions are reminded 
to submit application at the district tax office.

It is the district’s intent to grant all possible exemptions; however, a 
properly executed application is necessary. j ^

ri;
The district tax office is located at 310 Ave. A, Knox City, and is open 
from 8:00 a.m. to 12:00 noon weekdays. This is the former site of 
Oscar’s TV. '*

The district Tax office’s telephone number is 658-3054. Please contact 
the Tax Office for additional information and assistance.

Your Valentine w ill Love
our New Gingham Hearts

>>

i

ANNOUNCING

ROCK’N ROLL 
JAMBOREE

March 11
BRAZOS VALLEY CARE HOME

Residents will be rocking in their 
rockers and rolling in their wheel chairs 

to help the Heart Fund

Volunteers will be making the 
rounds to secure sponsors.

Let’s all help!

Filled with delicious chocolates 
and creamy butter bons, our 
gingham hearts are 
available in pink, 
yellow, or blue, 
with matching 
silk flower.
We also have a 
wide selection 
of traditional red 
foil hearts as well 
as many beautiful 
satin hearts.

S t a v e s

f  pr//

.̂1

12 oz. $8.25

C A N D i E s  H-M JON ES PH ARM ACY in c .

' k ' k ' k ' k ' k ' k ' k ' k ' k ' k ' k ' k ' k i f ' k i r i f i r ' k ' k ' k i f ' k ' k ' k ' k ' k - k ' k

!: 5 t h

J
12.000%

Effective date Feb. 5-18

RATE

I 2 J 4 7 % . .

On the $1,000 minimum, 2V2 year C.D.
Effective Feb. 12-18

1 4 . 6 8 0 %

On the $10,000 minimum, 6-month C.D.
This is an annual yield. The rate is subject to change at maturity. And federal regulations prohibit the 

compounding of interest during the term of the account.

Eveiything’s going to be all right, 
with the Money Market CD.s.

O L N E Y
SAVINGS

OIney, Seymour, Jacksboro, Bridgeport, Nocona, Weatherford, Azie and now Archer City. And Electra Savings 
in Electra, Ranger Savings in Ranger, Eastland Savings in Eastland. All divisions of OIney Savings.

Come see us soon. Or call and we’ll come see you. 'Cause it’s the OIney way to save.

- k

¥

¥

¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥
¥

\ 5 >

<o^ ANNIVERSARY
SALE

STARTS THURSDAY, 9 A.M.

Ladies’, Juniors’, and 
Children’s Dresses
50 ■ 60 % off

Many Year-Round Fabrics

City Girl 
Pants & Tops
60% off

Nurses’
Uniforms

50% Off

Ladies’ ; 
Handbags ^
50% off

Ladies’

Bendover
Pants
$1400

Men’s

Western Suits
Nu-Look

2 & 3 Pc. Suits
.Q/70C tn ^0

$7998 50% Off

Shirts and 
Fashion Jeans

50% off

Regular Bells 
and Big Bells 

$1100

Queen Size 
Pillows

50% off

FAMILY BOUTIQUE
-Estelle Hawkins-

¥

¥
¥
¥
¥
¥

-  ¥  

¥  
¥  
¥  
¥  
¥  
¥  
¥  
¥  
¥  
¥
¥  
¥
¥  
¥  
¥  
¥  
¥  
¥  
¥  
¥  
¥  
¥  
¥  
¥  
¥  
¥
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& SUPER SAVE
I A R K E T S

CASSEROLE PINTO 4 LB. BAG

BEANS

69

25 LB PURNIA

D O G  C H O W

A L L  PURPOSE

GIADIOLA
FLOUR

25 LB. 
B A G

Cm

m

^  MARYLAND CLUB

I  C O FFEE

2 1 ®
CHEER

DETERGENT
4 9 -oz . B ox

1 . 7 9

4  r o l l

C r O N T A O IN A  WHOLE PEELED

TOMATOES

o 89

HORMEL

amales
15  o z .

FILL YOUR 
FREEZER

B IG M

YIELD 2
225-275 LB. AVG. WT. 

CUT WRAPPED & FROZEN 
TO YOUR SPECinCATION

G O O C H
mmnrusDA

HEAVY BEEF

SIDES
.at*’

L 'V Pond Cako

Gooch
Good’n Tender 

Beef
ROUND

Patented 
electronic 
process 
guarantees 
you more 
tenderness. 
Naturally, 
no chemicals!

G O O C H
WRIGHT SLICED SLA

GOOCH
STILLWELL BREADED m  ^

CUT OKRA ,--  69^

i

s tiK

CHUCK ROAS
Boneless

M f R I f Z

PIE SHELLS
FRESHWATER

CATFISH LB,

PLEASINGLY

r f O’,rt*eO

46 Oz.

CLOROX BLEACH
1-G a l. Btle.

WHITE SWAN act 
SWEET OR BUTTERMILK

We Redeem

nmnj
FEDERAL 

FOOD 
COUPONS

Dinty Moore
BEEF STEW

9 We Redeem

H ERSHEY 
Chocelcil*  S y ru p

$ 1|4 9

KING 
COLA

B K CUnS
M a zd a  

O IL

179

8 0Z 
CAN

TEXAS RUBY WED

GRAPEFRUIT

FEDERAL 
FOOD 

COUPONS

32 Oz.

1 7 0  Ct.

Pound

ORANGES c 99^1
R U S S ET

ED DFi iriOl K w

u p e r
a v i n g s Vaseline

RED DELICIOUS

a p p l e s
10 oz.

39f
cabbagT "

DECORATOR JAR 

27 oz.

FIRM GREEN 
HEADS

' e .A 4 tV 9

C O M
Mibtets

WHOLE
GOLDEN COPf*

VEG.
A L L

16 OZ.
cans 7 9 ^

I  IN S TA N T T FAI
1  iinon 1  KEEBLER

4  A
I  3 0 Z.H  iAD ■CRACKERS

.19
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Benjamin News

FFA NEWS 
By Eric Redder

Paul Bowers, Director of 
Student affairs and Don 
Lamb, Dean of Students for 
VRJC came to Benjamin 
High School to give a presen­
tation to the Juniors and Sen­
iors on career opportunities 
at VRJC.

The gentlemen gave a slide 
presentation and told about 
financial aid, student ac­
tivities and areas of 
curriculum. There will also 
be a tenative carreer day on 
April 1 at VRJC.

The Junior and Senior 
classes are very grateful to 
these young men for 
bringing these programs to

Canfield 
Rites Held 
in Stamford

Funeral services for Stam­
ford resident Russell B. Can- 
field, step-grandfather of 
Benny Williams of Rochester, 
were held Saturday after­
noon, January 31, at five 
o’clock in the Central Baptist 
Church Chapel in Stamford. 
The Rev. Clyde Cook, 
pastor, officiated and burial 
was in the Highland 
Cemetery in Stamford under 
the direction of Smith 
Funeral Home.

Mr. Canfield, 78, died Thur­
sday, January 29, at the 
Teakwood Manor Nursing 
Home in Stamford.

Born February 5, 1902, in 
Colby, Kansas, he was the 
manager of the Houston 
Yacht Club and the 
Beaumont Country Club 
before his retirement. He 
married Maurine Gamblin in 
1961 in Beaumont. Mr. Can- 
field moved to Stamford in 
1966 from Beaumont. He was 
a Baptist and a member of 
St. John’s Masonic Lodge #53 
in Tyler. He was preceded in 
death by a stepdaughter, An­
na Paul Williams on Decem­
ber 25,1979.

Survivors include his wife, 
Maurine of Stamford; a step- 
grandson, Benny Williams of 
Rochester; a step- 
g r an d d a u g h te r ,  Alana 
Greenwood of Burkburnett; 
and two step-grandchildren.

Area 
Oil News

KNOX COUNTY

» Tony F. Black Oil Company 
of Wichita Falls staked well 
No. 6 on 105 acres of E.F. 
Whitten “ B” Lease, 330 feet 
from south line and 1,752 feet 
from east line of Sec. 83, Blk. 
2, D&WRR Survey, A-494, to 
go to 2,300 feet IV2 miles north 
of Knox City.

Jet Drilling Co. completed 
well No. 6 on Mamie-Ward 
McFaddin “ A”  Lease, 990 
feet from southeast line and 
1,650 feet from southwest line 
of Sec. 31, Blk. 13, H&TC Sur­
vey, A-1, yielding 97 barrels 
of 36 gravity oil per day from 
total depth of 2,698 feet, 12 
miles northwest of Knox City.

ByGLADENEGREEN

U S .

BASKETBALL NEWS
Its’ many down and two to 

go in District play and the 
girls still remain unbeaten. 
Last week, the teams saw ac­
tion only one night and they 
were victors in both games. 
The girls score was 54-43. 
Shannon Ryder had 15, Stasy 
Carver 12, Wendy Pollock 13, 
Kim Conner 7, Mickey Smith 
5, and Michelle Bufkin 2.

The boys also won 54-42. 
Mark Oxford had 16, John 
Kinnibrugh 12, Eddie Romo 
11, Jim Mancille 9, Kent Her- 
tel 4 and Eric Redder 2.
HERE N THERE

Mildred and Gary 
Hamilton of Azle spent the 
weekend here.

Mr. and Mrs. Leroy West 
and Edith West spent the 
weekend with the Wayne 
Wests in Cisco.

Mr. and Mrs. David 
Belknap of Sherman were 
Monday night guests of Mr. 
and Mrs. James Klutts.

John David Wharton of

Greenwood 
Rites Are 
February 5

Funeral services for Mrs. 
Eva Mae Greenwood of Cross 
Plains were held Thursday 
afternoon, February 5, in the 
Weinert Foursquare Church 
with the Rev. Roy Herricks, 
First Baptist minister, and 
the Rev. Kathryn Byrd, 
pastor, officiating. Burial 
was in the Rochester 
Cemetery with Smith 
Funeral Home in charge of 
arrangements.

Mrs. Greenwood, 64, died 
Wednesday, February 4, at 
1:05 a.m. in the Knox County 
Hospital following a brief 
illness.

Born December 15, 1916, in 
Paris, Texas, her parents 
were the late James and Cora 
Story. She married T.F. 
Greenwood on January 20, 
1945, in Benjamin. Mrs. 
Greenwood was a member of 
the Baptist Church.

Survivors include her 
husband, T.F. (Buck) 
Greenwood of Cross Plains; 
three stepsons, J.W. of Azle, 
R.W. of Munday and Tommy 
of Goree; three step­
daughters, Mrs. Mae Mc- 
Culleb of Abilene, Mrs. Esa 
Dene Corley of Burleson and 
Mrs. LaFern Dunlap of Mun­
day; a brother, Theo Story of 
California; two sisters, Hat­
tie Swafford and Faye 
LaCross, both of Sacramento, 
California; 21 step- 
grandchildren and 14 step- 
great-grandchildren .

Step-grandsons served as 
pallbearers.

Arlington was a guest in the 
Bobby Roberson home during 
the weekend. Other guests of 
the Robersons were Corrine 
Parrish of Franklin and Jay 
Winston Feemster of Vera.

Diane Green and Dennis 
Grand of Haskell and Debbie 
Stamps attended the Merle 
Haggard Concert in Abilene 
Saturday night.

Chris Stone of Snyder was a 
guest in the Van Green home 
Friday night.

Mr. and Mrs. Van Green 
and grandchildren Becky and 
Cody Stamps spent the 
weekend with Van’s mother 
in Denton.

Mr. and Mrs. Butch Duke 
and Marian were weekend 
guests of his mother, Mrs. 
Clodell Duke.

Dee Ann Young of Wichita 
Falls spents the weekend 
with relatives here.

Debbie Stamps and Cody 
and Linda Parker were in 
Abilene Monday on business.

People
of all ages die of 
heart disease 

and stroke.

American 
VA? Heart 

V Association
WE RE FIGHTING FOR YOUR LIFE

ALTON HESTER, MANAGER  

817-658-3081 
817-658-3072 Nights

KNOX COUNTY IRRIGATION 
SERVICE & SUPPLY CORPORATION

"IRRIGATION SPECIALISTS"
WEST HWY. 222, KNOX CITY, TEXAS

PVC PIPELINES 
INSTALLATION & REPAIR

CENTER PIVOT AND  
SIDEROLL SPRINKLER SYSTEMS

iw 1111:  mmm
QUANTITIES
LIMITED

Master
MECHANIC® 
CURVED 
CLAW HAMMER
With a durable, flame- 
treated hickory handle 
triple-wedged into 16-oz. 
head. Properly balanced 
for effortless use.BIGMM

' M M I t ’

News Notes 
from the

Brazos Valley Care Home
By Laura Ivie

Hospital
News

Patients Dismissed 
Since January 31,1981 

Knox City: Patti Lewis, 
Brian Burt, Pete Escobedo, 
Noba Oliver
Truscott: Dimetrio Moya,
A. E. Propps
O’ Brien: Gabriel Bernal, 
Nellie C. Jones
Munday: Arlee Bruce,
Thelma Hendrix, Virginia 
Smith, Cara Celeste Phillips, 
Maurice Jennings, William
B. Greenwood, Lola Green­
wood, Wanda Zachary, Mar­
tina Navarrette 
Benjamin: Lurie Jones 
Rochester: Judy Wolsch and 
Baby Girl, Paul Melton 
Goree: Eva Greenwood
(deceased), Edd Bowman 
Haskell: Wanda Briggs

Patients In Hospital 
As Of February 7,1981 

Knox City: Gene Clonts, 
Willis Hines, C.E. Johnson, 
Kay Reynolds, Nettie Wilcox, 
Gail Tilley and Baby, Ben 
Snelson
Benjamin: Aaron Lit-
tlecreek, L.C. Brown, 
Elizabeth Roberts 
O’Brien: Annah Johnston 
Munday: Gladys Valencia, 
Ray Moore, Delores Wilde, 
Ellen Ball, Lala B. Morgan 
Rochester: Raymond Butler 
Aspermont: Arlinda Andrade 
and Baby Girl 
Leveiland: Thelma Hilbers

F E B . '81 T .O .M .
KUEHLER 

LUMBER & SUPPLY

Sunday morning, February 
8, Ozelle Stephens taught 
Romans 7. There were 19 
attending Sunday School. 
Peggy Guinn played the 
piano.

The afternoon service was 
conducted by the Rev. Posey, 
pastor of the First Christian 
Church at Benjamin. The 
message was “ The Sermon 
On The Mount” , Matthew 33. 
The subject was “ Seek Ye 
First The Kingdom of God 
and his righteousness and all 
these things shall be added 
unto you.” It was a very 
spirit-lifting sermon. There 
were 35 attending the service.

The Ronnie White family 
sang several special songs 
including “ Blessed Jesus 
Hold My Hand” and “ Home 
of the Soul” . Mrs. T.E. 
Moorhouse played the piano.

The Rock ‘N Roll Jamboree 
has been postponed until a 
later date. My volunteers and 
myself will still be taking 
donations but the actual 
Jamboree will take place 
later.

Tuesday’s Bingo winners 
were Mrs. Williamson, 
Wayne Harden, Ruth Harden, 
Mr. Fredrickson, Hallie 
Barrington, and Waynell 
Clark. The blackout winners 
were Mr. Fredrickson and 
Mrs. Williamson.

Thursday’s Bingo winners 
were Weeper Aldridge, Bo 
Strickland, Eda Faye Poun­
ds, Commie Montgomery, 
and Wayne Harden. The 
blackout winners were 
Wayne Harden and Bo 
Strickland.

Bea Mays and Mr. and Mrs. 
J.D. Hollis visited Mr. and 
Mrs. O’Pry, Charlie Collier, 
Mary Bigham, Grace Cyr,

Hallie Barrington, Mrs. 
Lowry and Charlie Hughes.

Lillian Brothers and 
Geneva Erwin visited 
Chessie Jackson and Dicie 
Singleton.

Carl Murrell and Battle 
Mac enjoyed their visitors 
Beulah Battle, Bea Mays, 
Amelie Wilson, Florence 
Rhodes, James Moore, Betty 
Moore, Beulah Moore, Gwen­
dolyn Y. Lee and Bernice 
Lee.

Virgie Tankersley and Vida 
Williamson welcomed their 
company Phama Lou Wilhite, 
Elsie Pierson, Estelle 
Hawkins, Betty Taylor, Mrs. 
Wall, Eddie and Virginia 
Adkins, Mildred Draper and 
Peggy Guinn.

Nita Edwards, Carmoleta 
Graham, Linda Sklower and 
Alma Swearingen visited 
Lillie and Opal Dennington.

Mae Flowers enjoyed her 
company Maude Newberry, 
Edna Eubank, Evelyn Boyd 
and granddaughter (Tressie 
Boyd), Carl Chafin, Nelda 
Lusk and Kevin, Nola Covey, 
Dewey and Marie Darr, 
Jewel Matura, Pearl Gage, 
Romana Helms and Dean 
Worley.

Betty Aldridge, Loyd and 
Darlene Howeth, Bessie 
Clower, and Kenneth and 
Louise Burt visited C.C. 
Strickland and Willie 
Aldridge.

Nelda Lusk, Nola Covey, 
Elsie Pierson, Phama Lou 
Wilhite, Amelie Wilson, and 
Florence Rhodes visited 
Hazel and Waynell Clark.

Mr. and Mrs. J.D. Hollis, 
Bea Mays, Mary Burleson, 
Neva Epley, Vannah Car­
mack visited Eda Faye 
Pounds and Zona Guffey.

C h u rc h  S c h o o l 10 :00

M o rn in g  W o rs h ip 11:00

E v e n in g  W o rs h ip 6 :0 0

Jam es P. P atterson , P astor

F/RSr UNITED METHODIST CHURCH
406 S. Second Knox City, Texas

PLUMBING — HEATING 
AIR-CONDITIONING

Jerry’s Plumbing
658-3322 202 East Main Knox City

658-3416

Make sure your 
next loan is easier 
to pay back

A good loan should be one you 
can manage on your income.

The Federal Land Bank can 
tailor a payment plan to fit your 
income patterns and cash flow. The 
long-term feature of Land Bank loans 
helps keep your payments 
manageable.

At the Land Bank, we want to 
make sure your loan is as easy to 
pay back as it is to get in the first 
place. Stop by and see how we can 
help.

The Land Bank 
The Bank Generations

FEDERAL LAND BANK 
ASSOCIATION OF HASKELL

JOE HARPER, Manager 
Offices at Haskell, Anson, and Seymour 

Haskell (817) 864-2062; Anson (915) 823-1142
Long-time Loans on Farms and Ranches 

In Haskell, Jones, Baylor, and Knox Counties

H.E. Wall Sr. enjoyed his 
visitors, Mr. and Mrs. J.D. 
Hollis, Buddy and Flora 
Tankersley, Lou Sikes and 
Barney Arnold.

Mr. and Mrs. Malrey 
Penick, Mrs. Daugh 
Sessums, Bea Mays, Bessie 
King, J.L. Thomas, Diane, 
Chris and Jeremy, Beatrice 
Ellis, Mildred Draper, Ruby 
Sparks, and Charles Durham 
visited Mr. and Mrs. Thomas.

Edna Eubank, Maude 
Newberry, Phama Lou, Elsie 
Pierson, Bea Mays and Tyke 
Meinzer visited Nina Alvis.
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Willis Hines Home 
After Hospital Stay

Willis Hines is recuperating 
at home after spending five 
days last week in the Knox 
County Hospital.

Hines has been employed 
by the school tax office, but 
due to health reasons, does 
not plan to return to work, he 
said.

News
Deadline
Tuesday

Noon

SERVICES OF THE 
CHURCH OF GOD 

IN CHRIST

On the first Monday night 
of this month, Bible band 
joint meeting was held at the 
Munday Church, with the 
pres.. Sis. Manuel in charge.

Sister Angel Dockins 
brought the lesson scripture 
that night from St. John 
4:13, 14. We were blessed as 
different ones discussed the 
lesson.

Usher board meeting was 
held on Tuesday evening. 
Purity class and choir prac­
tice on Wednesday. Mission 
on Friday night, and Sun­
shine Band on Saturday 
evening.

Sunday school had a partial 
attendance with Asst. Supt. 
Manuel in charge.

In the morning service 
Pastor Bennett preached 
from Luke 11:1, 4, II Cor. 3:4, 
5, Romans 8:26, Matthew 
23:8, 9, and I Cor. 10:13, A 
wonderful message.

The Abilene District Con­
vocation will be in session 
Monday through Saturday 
night of this week. Lords 
willing, at the Southside 
Church in Abilene.

A N D  B O D Y  W O R K

Painting • Repairing • Rebuilding 
Windshields • Seat Covers • Door Glass 
FRAME STRAIGHTENING - WHEEL ALIGNING 

24-Hour Wrecker Service

Lewis Paint & Body Shop
Sterling Lewis, Owner 
Knox City, Texas

Telephone 658-3342 
Nights Dial 658-3330

BEVERLY 
CHANEY
is now at the

STYLING STALL
Mini Mall

WED.-THURS.-FRI. 
For Appt. Call 

658-3957 or 
658-3086 res

NOTICE OF INTENTION TO ENGAGE IN 
WEATHER MODIFICATION ACTIVITIES WITHIN 

THE STATE OF TEXAS
January 23, 1981

NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN that IRVING P. KRICK, 
INC. OF TEXAS, 748 Vella Road, Palm Springs, Cali­
fornia 92264, holder of License No. 81-2 of the State of 
Texas, intends to engage in an operation to change or 
attempt to change by artificial methods the natural de­
velopment of appropriate atmospheric cloud forms or 
precipitation forms which occur in the troposphere, for 
and on behalf of COTTON COUNTY SERVICES, INC., 
Route # 1 , Randlett, Oklahoma 73562. An application 
will be filed with the Texas Department of Water Re­
sources to conduct a program of weather modification 
to increase useful precipitation by means of a ground- 
based silver iodide dispenser network.

1. The area in which the dispenser network will be 
operated includes the Texas Counties of Archer, Bay­
lor, Clay, Foard, Hardeman, Knox, Wichita, and Wil­
barger.
2. The target area includes all of Cotton County, Okla­
homa and the adjacent portion of Tillman County, 
Oklahoma, east of Highway 54 (extended south to the 
Texas border).
3. The area adjacent to the target area which may be 
subject to the effects of the operation are within the 
Stale of Oklahoma and in general within 15 to 20 miles 
of the target area. The maximum intentional effect is 
in the target, but some downwind effect may occur in 
Oklahoma mostly to the immediate northeast of the 
target. There would be no significant intentional effect 
in Texas from the operation o f these dispensers.
4. The materials and methods to be used in conducting 
the operation are silver iodide electric arc ground-based 
dispensers that have an output in the range of V2 to 2 
grams per hour per dispenser.
5. The person who will be in charge of the operation 
is Mr. Martin Derus.
6. The period of the operation is expected to begin 
when the state permit is granted and to continue for 
four years thereafter.
7. A Texas Weather Modification License was issued 
to Irving P. Krick, Inc. of Texas on April 20, 1972, 
and has been renewed each year through 1981.

Individuals or organizations interested in the proposed 
operation may contact the Executive Director, Texas E)e- 
partment of Water Resources, P.O. Box 13087, Austin, 
Texas 78711.

C h ’iid fe ic d e ic  a v i a t i o n , me

Munday Airport 
422-4536

'P rov id ing  A Service' 
HELICOPTER — FIXED WING 

Spraying ■ Seeding 
Predator Control 
Cattle Roundup 
Field Checking_______

Knox City Airport 
658-3716

J E n e r g y  S a v in g  tip s  o n  
E le c tr ic  H e a tin g .

V .

Check your ther­
mostat setting.
Recommended tem­
perature setting for 
w in te r  h e a tin g  is 
6 8 ° .  R e m e m b e r, 
the low er you set 
the the rm osta t in 
the winter the lower 
your energy cost.

Have your heating system checked regularly!
Proper servicing is good preventive 
maintenance.

Keep fitters clean. Check the filter every 30 days on forced-air 
systems. If filter is permanent, clean it by manufacturer’s d irec­
tions, if it’s disposable, replace when dirty.

Have your home properly insu­
lated! A dequate hom e insula­
tion keeps the warmth in, cuts 
energy use . . . can pay for itself 
by lowering heating (and cool­
ing) costs.

Use the warmth of the sunshine!
On sunny days open the drapes. 
The sun shining through the glass 
will supply additional heat at no 
cost.

WEST TEXAS UTILITIES COMPANY

Remember, Reddy Supplies the Energy, 
only you can use it wisely!

r
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**̂PR|[NDIY
AFFILIATED 

SUPER MARKETS
KNOX CITY

B n

B i
WEDNESDAYS
W ith the purchase of $2.50 or more.

SPECIALS GOOD THURS., 
FRI., SAT., FEB. 12-13-14

See Our Large 
Selection of Candies 

and Valentine’sll
CHIFFON SOFT STICK

MARBARINE
1-Lb.

Quarters

RIOHT
RISIRVID
TO UNIT

W R IB H rS  SLICED SLAB

BACON STEAK

SH U R FIN E
Duncan Hines Assorted

CAKE MIXES

Limit 1 with 10.00 
grocery purchase or more

BOX

We Have a Good 
Selection of

GARDEN SUPPLIESII
SH U R FIN E

Tomatoes

i I I

79«i
KRAFT

Crisco Oil Mayonnaise
I 4 8 - o z .  Bottle fc -o z . Jar

j O ' * *  1 6 9  I

16-oz. Cans  
(L im it 3)

1
00

COKE, TAB 
or MR. PIBB

Large No Deposit 
2 -L ite r B ottle

EACH 1 19
★ HEALTH AND BEAUTY AIDS^

8ERIT0L TABLETS ___ 40-Count, 4.45 Value 2 . 9 9
PONDS COLD CREAM . 3.5-oz. Ja r , Reg.-Peach-Lemon 1 . 4 9  
KEOPECTATE e . z D , « i e  , 2.55 Value 1 . 5 9

U.S. NO. 1 RUSSET

POTATOES
1

AVOCADOS
S J -70Ct.

Cello Bag Radishes 
or Green Onions

6- 1“
MIX
OR

MATCH

ORANGE JUICE
SHURFINE

FROZEN
6-oz. Can

ZE E  ASSORTED FAM ILY

NAPKINS
360K;t. 4  R Q  

Pkg. g

Campbell’s Chicken Noodle

SOUP
New Shurfine Chocolate

SYRUP

LUCHY LEAF CHERRY

PIE FILLING 
191

CALGONITE
DISWASHING
DETERGENT

1.69


