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THE MUCH-NEEDED rain came to the area last 
Thursday morning with reports of from three to 
seven inches within a 25-mile radius of Knox 
City. The Brazos River bridge west of Knox City 
is shown above Friday afternoon and the 
swirling waters crossed the road west of the 
bridge causing some damage to the road 
shoulders and making it necessary for highway

officials to spend most of the night at the site. 
The rain was a blessing to farmers and stock- 
men as the dry weather was becoming a cause 
of great concern in this farming and ranching 
area. No hail, strong winds, or stormy weather 
were associated with the rainfall which began 
early Thursday and continued until afternoon. 
(Adam White Photo)

At Eight O ’clock

Commencement Set 
Saturday Evening

High school commen­
cement for the graduating 
class of the Knox City- 
O’Brien Consolidated In­
dependent School District 
will be held Saturday 
evening, May 24, at eight 
o’clock in the sanctuary of the 
First Baptist Church.

Commencement speaker 
will be local faculty member, 
Mrs. Kenneth (Mary Jo) 
Lankford, who taught many 
of the students during their 
junior high years.

The processional and 
recessional will be played by 
Carolyn Sloan and Linda Un­
derwood and Russel Hacker 
will give the invocation.

D e liv e r in g  the
salutatorian’s address will be 
Gerri Watson followed by 
Angelia Reid with the 
valedictory.

At this time, special music 
will be presented by Angelia 
Reid and Ruthie Trice.

Cyle Clayton will introduce 
the speaker, and Superinten­
dent W.R. Baker will make 
the presentation of awards. 
Bill Holcomb, high school 
principal, will present the 
class and Henry J. Jones, 
school board president, will 
present diplomas to the thirty 
-two graduates.

Kyle White will give the 
benediction.

Members of the graduating 
class are Nina Alsides, 
Deborah Berryman, Gaylynn 
Burkham, (3yle Clayton, 
Maxine Casillas, Simone 
Cobb, Kenny Cornwell, 
Robert Espinosa, Lupe 
Figueroa Jr., Elda Garcia, 
Joseph Godsey, Russel 
Hacker, Tammie Helton, 
Joyce Hernandez, Dwayne 
Johnson, and Scott Lynn.

Also, Olga Magana, Diane 
Martinez, Greg Oliver, 
Angelia Reid, Shelton 
Rhodes, Sid Richardson, 
Danny Rios, Toni Rios, Steve 
Rumley, Brett Tackitt, 
Ruthie Trice, (5erri Watson, 
Kelly Watson, Kyle White, 
Sam White, and Greg Whit­
ten.

Class sponsors are Leon 
Burkham and Bill Holcomb.

Awards to be announced at 
the exercises are Most

Kindergarten To 
Graduate Today

Kindergarten graduation is 
set for Thursday, May 22, 
(today) at 1:00 p.m. in the 
Kindergarten room.

According to Mrs. Sherry 
Hacker, teacher, everyone is 
invited to attend.

Physically Fit students. High 
Ranking (academ ica lly ) 
Boy and Girl for the 1979-80 
school year, students who 
have not been absent nor tar­
dy for the entire year, and 
students who have made the 
Honor Roll all year. The 
traditional loving cups will 
also be presented to the Best 
All-Around Boy and Girl.

Many Knox City-O’Brien

First Piaynight 
Rescheduied Sunday

Knox City’s first piaynight 
of the season, which was 
scheduled for Friday night. 
May 16, was rained out and 
has been rescheduled for 
Sunday afternoon at 2:30 
o’clock.

Calf and steer riding will be 
featured in addition to goat 
de-ribboning and potato 
racing and the regular 
barrel, pole and flag events.

There are three youth age 
divisions and an adult 
division in this year’s 
piaynight.

Trophies and ribbons will 
be awarded in all events.

students were on hand to 
receive honors Saturday 
night when the twelfth annual 
University Interscholastic 
League and Activity Banquet 
was held in the school 
cafeteria.

Due to the time element in­
volved, individuals in various 
activities and their honors 
were not announced but in­
stead, appeared in a printed 
program which listed school 
activities including Annual 
Staff, Band, Boys Basketball, 
Junior Varsity, Girls’ 
Basketball, Houndette Junior 
Varsity Basketball, Beta 
Club, Choir, Football, Junior 
Varsity Football, Future 
Farmers of America, Future 
Homemakers of America, 
Boys’ (Jolf, the Kennel Staff, 
Literary Events including 
Debate team. Spelling and 
Plain Writing, Science, Jour­
nalism, Ready Writing, Shor­
thand, Prose Reading, Poetry 
Interpretation, Persuasive 
Speaking, Number Sense, 
Typewriting, One-Act Play, 
Pep Club, Drill Team, Ten­
nis, Track, Junior Varsity 
Track, Girls’ Track, and 
Volleyball.

City Council Members 
Have Varied Agenda

Sales Tax 
60% Above 
Last Year

AUSTIN -  State Com­
ptroller Bob Bullock Monday 
said May rebates to Texas 
cities of the one-percent city 
sales tax will amount to $38.7 
million.

Knox City’s net payment 
for this period is $4,424.13 as 
compared to $798.05 for the 
same period last year. 
Payments to date in 1980 are 
$21,531.53 as compared to 
$13,448.12 in 1979, reflecting a 
60% increase.

Other area towns and the 
amount of their checks for 
this period include Munday 
$1,740.90; A sp erm on t 
$2,722.66; Anson, $4,467.96 
Crowell, $1,129.70; Haskell 
$8,834.88; Hamlin, $5,325.26 
P a d u ca h , $4,017.49 
Rochester, $2,952.84; Rule 
$1,059.59; Seymour, $8,183.89 
S ta m ford , $8,176.24 
Throckmorton, $5,312.37.

Bullock said that while 
most cities will receive a 
larger check this month com­
pared to the same period last 
year he doesn’t believe it’s 
because the state’s economy 
is growing at a robust pace.

“ We’ve been tinkering 
around with our processing 
system to improve it over the 
past few months and as a 
result fund allocations and 
rebates have shot up from 
time to time because of im­
proved handling of tax ac­
counts,”  he said.

Bullock said overall sales 
tax collections from the first 
of the fiscal year through 
April are up only 21.5 percent 
compared to last year.
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KC News 
Dedicated To 
‘80 Graduates

This week’s edition of The 
Knox County News is 
dedicated to the 1980 
graduating classes in this 
area.

Merchants and individuals 
from Benjamin, O’Brien, and 
Knox City are extending their 
best wishes and 
congratulatory messages to 
these fine students who have 
helped make history in their 
respective schools.

The achievements of these 
graduates have called atten­
tion to our particular area of 
Texas, and we are very proud 
of all of them.
The News staff joins with 

these others in wishing each 
and every graduate a very 
happy and successful future.

During the regular meeting 
of the City Council Tuesday 
night of last week, a proposal 
submitted by Ernest L. An­
drews, consulting engineer, 
to study the city’s drainage 
problems was considered. In 
order to secure accurate in­
formation and to prepare a 
detailed report with recom­
mendations, a field survey 
crew would have to secure 
elevations all over town, in­
cluding the fringe areas, ac­
cording to city manager Faye 
Railsback. Then a contour 
map could be prepared from 
which existing drainage and 
proposed drainage could be 
re co m m e n d e d  w ith 
estimated costs. Mr. An­
drews estimated the cost of 
the study to be $4,0(X).00 to 
$5,000.00.

City officials are hopeful 
that residents will express 
their feelings regarding long- 
range plans for accom ­
plishing drainage and flood 
control for the city and 
especially to secure feelings 
of thes citizens regarding the 
immediate plans for a study. 
Mrs. Railsback asks that per­
sons advise city officials of 
their feelings vila letter in or­

der mat uic city may have the 
records in its files.

Other business considered 
was the purchase of a new 
backhoe loader. Delivery of 
the new machine is expected 
in approximately one week, 
Mrs. Railsback said.

The council re-appointed 
Joe M. Clonts to serve as a 
director of the North Central 
Texas Municipal Water 
Authority. Other directors 
are Leon Burkham of Knox 
City, Tom Watson and R.C. 
Couch of Haskell, Lee Bruce 
and Clint Norman of Munday, 
and Jack Beaty and W.B. 
Neighbours of (Joree.

The public hearing on the 
city budget and revenue 
sharing funds was held prior 
to adopting an ordinance ap­
proving the budget for the 
City of Knox City and levying 
taxes for the support of the 
municipal government.

Several interested persons 
met with the council to 
discuss possible uses of the 
Atchison, Topeka and Santa 
Fe Railroad Depot which has 
been donated to the city for 
civic use. Plans are currently 
underway to move the 
building onto city property, 
Mrs. Railsback said.

Stores To Close 
Monday, May 26

Memorial Day, one of the 
holidays chosen by the Knox 
City (Chamber of Commerce, 
will be observed Monday, 
May 26, and many Knox City 
businesses will close, accor­
ding to Mrs. Doris 
C row n ov er , s e c r e ta r y -  
manager.

Since the holiday falls on 
Monday, The Knox County 
News office will be open and 
readers are asked to call in 
their news or advertising.

Commencement To 
Be On Channel 4

Commencement exercises 
for both mid-school and high 
school students, which will be 
held at the First Baptist 
Church, will be televised on 
Channel 4.

According to church 
pastor, the Rev. John 
Gillispie, mid-school exer­
cises will be held Thursday 
night. May 22, beginning at 
7:30 o’clock with high school 
ceremonies scheduled for 
Saturday night. May 24, at 
8:00.

O’Brien To 
Raise Rates 
On Water

The water system connec­
ting the Qty of O’Brien to the 
Millers Creek Water 
Authority is nearing com­
pletion.

Because of the increase in 
cost to the City for pur­
chasing the Millers Creek 
water, it will be necessary to 
increase the water rate from 
75 cents per one thousand 
gallons to $2.25 per thousand 
gallons for aU water above 
the minimum charge. The 
minimum charge will remain 
at $4.00 for the first one 
thousand gallons.

The price change will go in 
effect the first complete mon­
th the Millers Creek water is 
used by the City, officials 
said.

Honor Grads Named

Exercises Set 
For Mid-School

Flouridation 
Grant Is 
Approved

Joe Clonts, a director of 
’̂ orth Central Texas 
Municipal Water Authority, 
received a letter recently 
from Pete Beecher, manager 
of NCTMWA, that he had 
received approval on the 
grant for the flouridation 
program.

The Dental Association had 
discussed the low flouride 
contents of the water from 
Millers Creek with Board 
members and said that it was 
necessary to install equip­
ment to add flouride. The cost 
was estimated at $15,000 for 
the “ turnkey”  job.

“ After many pages of 
paper work in the office on 
the negotiations in acquiring 
the grant, it was finally ap­
proved. TTie “ turnkey”  job 
which the engineers proposed 
was greater than the Grant 
funds would allow, but by 
doing most of the installation 
with the personnel of the 
Authority and by using the 
guidelines and blueprints of 
the engineers, we will be able 
to do the work,”  Mr. Beecher 
said.

Clonts stated that he knew 
that the people of Knox City 
would be glad to know of the 
grant’s approval.

Did You Know...
that Mr. and Mrs. Timothy 
Alan Averett, 511 North 
Avenue F, Olney, Texas, sub­
scribes to The Knox County 
News’!

Honor graduates for the 
O’Brien Mid-School have 
been announced. Steve 
Rutherford was named 
valedictorian with a 98.11 
average while Sarah Jones is 
salutatorian with a 96.72 
average. Steve is the son of 
Mr. and Mrs. J.B. Ruther­
ford, and Mr. and Mrs. Henry 
J. Jones are Sarah’s parents.

Additional honor graduates 
are Nathan Staggs, who 
posted 'a 91.78 average and 
Michelle Bateman whose 
average was 91.67. Their 
parents are Mr. and Mrs. 
Larry Staggs and Mr. and 
Mrs. Charlie B. Bateman.

Graduation exercises for 
the mid-school students will 
be Thursday night. May 22, in 
the sanctuary of the First 
Baptist Church beginning at 
seven-thirty o’clock.

Speaker for the commen­
cement will be District Attor­
ney W.H. (Bill) Heatly of

Cancer Drive
Reported
Successful

Cornie King, Knox City 
chairperson for the annual 
Cancer Crusade, reported to 
the News this week that the 
1980 drive has been com­
pleted with the exception of 
three kits which have not 
been turned in. Total was 
$1,404.28 plus a $15 memorial.

Mrs. King said that persons 
responded “ wonderfully well 
as usual” , and she expressed 
her thanks to each worker as 
well as those who contributed 
to the American Cancer 
Society.

Workers were Roy Stewart, 
Ray Goodrich, Dave Thom­
pson, Wretha Fitzgerald, 
Curd Sisters, Doris McNulty, 
Ora Lee Helms, Merill 
Bishop, Amell Denton, Cleo 
Collins, Betty Skiles.

Also, Bobbie Meinzer, Kay 
Pepper, Alice Wilson, Er- 
valene Beason, Ann Darr, 
Faye Railsback, Sharon 
Newton, Molly Friske, Betty 
Albus, Jerry Smith, Jean 
Thomas, Stella Ferguson, 
Pam Bloxham, Estelle 
Skiles, Sue Emerson, 
Charlene Manuel, Mary Beth 
Smith, and Alestine Flye.

RTAToEnd Year
The Knox County Retired 

T each ers  A sso c ia t io n ’ s 
closing meeting will be a noon 
luncheon on Tuesday, May 27, 
at the Community Center.

Program director will be 
Sammie Carpenter.

Hostesses for the covered 
dish luncheon will be Virginia 
Casey, Sudia Cash, and 
Idoma Chowning.

Weather
FURNISHED BY PLANT 
MATERIALS CENTER 
4 Miles MW of Knox City

date low high rain
5-13 55 80
5-14 54 79
5-15 56 65 6.33
5-16 52 75
5-17 54 88
5-18 60 73
5-19 53 81

STEVE RUTHERFORD
...valedictorian

Paducah.
Heatly was appointed to the 

office of District Attorney of 
the 50th Judicial District in 
February 1970 by former 
(Governor Preston Smith to 
fill the unexpired term when 
the office was vacated by 
Clyde Whiteside on his ap­
pointment to the Board of 
Pardons and Paroles. In 1972, 
Heatly ran for election 
without opposition and has 
held the office since that 
time. During the recent 
primary election, Heatly won 
in a close contest with Larry 
Evans of Childress for his re- 
election to office.

Born February 11, 1944, in 
Wichita Falls, Heatly moved 
to Paducah in 1947, where he 
now resides. He graduated 
from Paducah High School in 
1962 and after graduation 
from PHS, Heatly attended 
Baylor University and the 
University of Colorado. He 
graduated from Baylor 
University in 1966 with a BBA 
degree and from Baylor 
University School of Law in 
1967 with a JD degree.

After his graduation from 
law school, Heatly worked as 
assistant district attorney in 
the office of District Attorney 
Frank Coffee in Tarrant 
County from January 1968 un­
til February 1969, when he 
returned to Paducah to prac­
tice law with his father, W.S. 
Heatly.

Heatly is married to the 
former Betty Burris of Weir, 
Mississippi, and they have

SARAH JONES
...salutatorian

three daughters, Johnnie 
Green, Karen Lynn, and 
Marianne. He has served as 
District Attorney for the 50th 
Judicial District which in­
cludes Cottle, King, Knox, 
and Baylor Counties for the 
past nine years.

Eighth grade class mem­
bers are Jesse Agraz, Tina 
Alsides, Tanya Averitt, 
Michelle Bateman, Marilyn 
Benson, Amber Berryman, 
Kevin Eaton, George 
Espinosa, James Evatt, Joe 
Paul Flores, Teresa Garcia, 
Junior Grindstaff, Cindy 
H ern an dez , D a ve in e  
Holcomb, and Wayne Hut­
chinson.

Also, Nancy Jones, Sarah 
Jones, Roy Lerma, Greg 
Melin, Angie Norton, Nedria 
Oudems, Rita Ramos, Lupe 
Rios, Steve Rutherford, Greg 
Skiles. Becky Smith, Nathan 
Staggs, Dwayne Watkins, 
Lou Ann Weatherall, Chris 
Whitaker, Chad Whitley, 
Kevin Johnson, and Carlos 
Torres.

KC Schools To 
Dismiss May 22

All grades within the Knox 
City-O’Brien Consolidated 
Independent School District 
will dismiss classes for sum­
mer vacation Thursday, 
May22, (today), according to 
school officials.

Friday, May 23, has been 
disignated as a teacher 
workday.

KNOX CITY Firemen won the 2-Man Hose Race 
Sunday at the semi-annual Fire Convention at 
Archer City. They tied with Holliday and Win- 
dthorst for first but in the playoff came in 
second. Ten teams competed. Placing second 
were Billy Bob Reynolds, center, and Roland 
Marion, right. Danny Speck, left competed with 
the others in water polo, but failed to place. 
(Fire Dept. Photo)
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For Fast Results, Call (817) 658-3142, Today!

RIVERSIDE CHEMICAL, 
Knox City, would like to help 
you with all your fertilizer 
and chemical needs. Call 
(817) 658-3841. tfc

SEE YOUR MONUMENTS 
before you buy. More than 50 
designs to choose from. Also, 
curb work. J.C.McGee. tfc

HYDRAULIC HOSE and 
Hydraulic hose repair, Knox 
Builders Supply, 658-3416.-8 3tc

 ̂ WHOLE HOG Sausage. 
Frozen 2 pound package, 
$2.50. Call for delivery. Ron

< White, 611 S. 4th, Phone 658-
l- 3345. 3-6 tfc

PLANTERS PARTS AND 
Catface Busters -- all sizes.

< All types of Chisel Sweeps, 
I* Plow Discs, Krause Plow

Parts, Servis Shredder Parts, 
% Bearings, Oil Filters, Belts, 

Delco Batteries for Tractors, 
Pickups and Cars, also Plugs 
and Points. EGENBACHER 
IMPLEMENT. TNC. .3-27 tfc

BOOKS -  Half price, Ave. J 
and Main, at City Motel. Now 

j* open 12:30 to 5:00, Tuesday- 
Saturday, 658-3541. Trades 

* also. 5-8 4tp
'i SPECIAL PRICES on 
> closable window shutters, 
? some sizes, price. Also 

specials on paneling, Knox 
Builders Supply, 658-3416-8 3tc

AM WAY Products: See us>' 
for all your AM WAY needs. 

i  Joe and Auta Marion, 658-
* 3986. 5-15 2tc

MAIZE SEED Taylor-Evans 
YIOIR, T-E Haygrazer, Knox 
Builders Supply, 658-3416.8 3tc

FOR SALE - Refrigerator in 
excellent condition. Call 
Wyman Meinzer, 817-454- 
3311. 5-22 tfc

FOR SALE: GMC PICKUP: 
Horse Shoes and horse 
shoeing equipment. 658-3369. 
Roy Montgomery. 5-22 Itp

FOR SALE -  Kenmore 
washer and dryer, sofa and 
chair, Kirby vacuum cleaner 
with attachments, lawn- 
mower. Call after 5,658-3495.

5-22 Itp

FOR SALE: Hammond
organ, just like new. Call af-

* ter 5:00 p.m. 658-3249. 5-15 2tc

CHAIN LINK or wood fen­
cing. For estimate call Terry 
Keener at 658-3567 after 5:00 
p.m. 5-15 tfc

SHAKLEE PRODUCTS-For 
all your Shaklee needs call Ed 
Daniel, 658-3196. 4-24 tfc

STOCK TANKS special, five 
: year guarantee, Knox 

Builders Supply, 658-3416. s 3tc

STOCK REDUCTION SALE: 
30% off every item in store. 
Special racks 60% off. Ladies’ 
Levi Bendovers $16.95. Men’.*? 
3-piece suits Va price. 
Bootioue. 5-15 2tc

Boyd’s 
Welding 
Service

Backhoe Service 
Available

24 HR. SERVICE 
Shelton Boyd 
(817)658-3639

TOWER
DRIVE-IN

RULE, TEXAS 
Show Starts 8:45 
Admission $2.50 

Children Free 
FRI.-SAT.-SUN. 

MAY 23-24-25

JAMFi? BROUN Ir ] 
MARGOT KIDDER 

and ROD STEIGER

THE
AMITWILLE
HORROR

FARM AND RANCH Welding 
-  Will build barn and corral 
also. Ed Daniel, 658-3196. 
____________________3-20 tfc

BUDDY TOLSON WELDING 
SERVICE - Portable welding 
on farm and ranch. Will build 
pens and barns. Phone 454- 
3231, Benjamin. tfc

LET US SPRAY your pecan 
trees with insecticides and 
zinc sulfate. Call for free 
estimate, Jim Dillon, 658- 
3605, or Dwayne Johnson, 658- 
3144. 5-22 tfc

WATER WELL DRILLING:
House, Stock, Irrigation 
Wells, Test Holes. Call W.P. 
Hise (817) 864-3727, Haskell, 
Texas (day or night). 2-15 tfc

BAYLOR MILLING CO., 
Throckm orton H ighway, 
Seymour. Custom mixing - 
pelleting - your grain or ours. 
Range cubes, creep feeds, 
hog feeds, start to finish. 888- 
3921. tfc

AUTO FINANCE 8% - 36 
month annualized 14.55%. 
Avoid the danger of losing 
your valuable crop. Protect 
them against hail now pay at 
harvest time. Call us for ter­
ms.
Leo Fetsch Insurance, 422- 
4974, Munday. 3-27 tfc

WATER WELL DRILLING:
House wells, stock wells, test 
holes and irrigation wells. 
Leonard Drilling and Pump 
Service. Call after 5 p.m. 
(817) 997-2132. 3-20 tfc

OSCAR’S TV SERVICE - 
Zenith dealer. Zenith 

Ohromacolor II and B/W, 8- 
track tape and auto tape 
decks. In-shop service. Phone 
658-3647. tfc

CARPORT SALE Saturday 
9:00 to 2:00, 412 South Fourth. 
Toaster, coffee percolator, 
throw pillows, bedspread, 
one bar stool, maternity pan­
ts, an etch-a-sketch and much 
more. Three families. Priced 
cheap to sell. 5-22 Itp

GARAGE SALE - Two 
family-Thursday and Friday 
at 311 North 3rd. Kids clothes 
and miscellaneous items.

AUTOS, TRUCKS 
TRAILERS

FOR SALE: 1978 Mercury 
(^ugar, two-door, good con­
dition. Call Alton Fitzgerald, 
658-3865. 2-28 tfc

AUTOS FOR SALE -  The 
following vehicles are 
available at these prices. 
Jeeps - $59.50, Cars - $48.00, 
Trucks - $89.00. Call for in­
formation, (602) 941-8014, 
Ext. 205. 5-15 4tc

FOR SALE: 1979 Delta 88 
Oldsmobile, loaded. Only 8500 
miles. Call after 5:00 p.m. 
658-3249. 5-15 2tc

FOR SALE: Ford Fairmont 
Futura, 9,000 miles. Still un­
der warranty. Loaded. Call 
743-3319. 2-14 tfc

RESIDENTIAL
EXTRA LARGE HOUSE, can be 2, 3, or 4 bedroom, 1V2 
bath, 2 car garage, large den, nice corner lot, good cellar, 
storage house. 801 South Second.
LOTS OF ROOM, close to school, 3 bedroom, IV̂  bath, kit­
chen, living room, den with fireplace, two car garage, lots of 
extras. Priced to sell quick, 311 North Third.
THREE BEDROOM, living room, kitchen, one bath. 
Garage. Central heat and cool, fenced back yard. 1106 
South Fourth. $29,000.00.
LARGE TWO STORY HOUSE. Three bedroom, second 
playroom upstairs. One large bedroom, office, family 
room, kitchen, bath downstairs. Vinyl siding. Needs a little 
fixin’ but priced right. 211 N. Ave. A. Call for an appoin­
tment.
THREE OR FOUR Bedroom, 1% bath, fully carpeted, cen­
tral heat and air, good location. Shown by appointment 
only. 1006 South Fifth.
TWO BEDROOM, den or third bedroom, utility room, vinyl 
siding, carport, patio, one bath. 1105 South Third.
BENJAMIN -  Older home, two bedroom, remodeled, three 
blocks from school, three large lots. Central heating.

OLDER HOME- Partially remodeled, 2 Bedrooms, 1 Bath, 
Living Room, Large Kitchen with refrigerator. Carport. 600 
South Second.

REMODELED-Vinyl sided, 2-bedroom, 1 bath, living 
room, den with wood burning stove. Large storage shop, car­
port. Available with or without appliances. 409 South 3rd St. 
Good location.
FOUR BEDROOM - Custom Built Home. Den w/fireplace, 
formal living room. Big walk in closets, cellar, double 
garage, water well, yard sprinklers. So many extras. Ex­
cellent location Large Comer lot. 612 South Fourth. Excellent 
buy in todays market. Shown by appointment only. $85(X)0.00
IN O’BRIEN- Nice older house with three lots. 3-bedroom, 
kitchen, 1 bath, living room, cellar, garage. One block North 
of school. Excellent buy.

^  TWO BEDROOM, living room, kitchen, bath, window air  ̂
conditioner units. New paint, 1202 South Fourth. 
$14,000.00. T

RESIDENTIAL LOTS
MUNDAY ~ Four very nice home building lots on Gail 
Street between South 11th and 12th. We will remove the 
cement. Excellent neighborhood. Paved street.
SHANNON ADDITION now open, few choice lots are left. 
THREE NICE LOTS on the corner of North 2nd and Avenue 
J. Cellar-plumbing for trailer house.

COMMERCIAL
DAIRY MART PROPERTY - Corner lot, new roof on 
building. Lot 114 x 140. Excellent location.
INVESTMENT REAL ESTATE - Texaco Service Station 
with 28,000 gallon storage. Goiki location. Priced to ̂ ell. 

FARMLAND
160 ACRES of the best farm land in Haskell County, close to 
O’Brien. 2 irrigation wells without pumps. $1,000 per acre 
with V2 minerals.
400 ACRES, sub-irrigated, all cultivated, V2 minerals now 
with the other half in a few years if no productions. East of 
Rochester.

™ _  DAVID COUNTS 
I  U  Insurance and Real Estate 

102 N. Ave. A
REALTOR® (817) 658-3211
=K= =M=

Card of Thanks
(

We would like to thank all our 
\ friends who called and visited during j 

Ray’s hospital stay.

 ̂ A special thanks goes to the doctors,  ̂
the nursing staff, and other hospital 

; employees for their care and kindness, j

Ray and Idella Escobar

FOR SALE 
OR TRADE

1977 DODGE % ton pickup, 
4-wheel drive, power, air, 
super cab, V-8 automatic. 
1960 FORD pickup, late 
model, V-8 eng., automatic 
trans., dual exhaust, wide 
tires, clean and nice.
1972 PONTIAC LeMans, air 
and power, real clean, runs 
good, 2-door hardtop, 
sharp.
1976 CHEVROLET Impala, 
4-door, small V-8, power 
and air, nice.
1976 FORD LTD, 4-door, 
small V-8, power and air, 
good and clean.
1972 and 1973 DODGE,
small V-8, air, power. 
Several other cars and 
pickups.

Don Hertel 
Benjamin, 454-2691

Margaret’s
802 EAST MAIN

Weekend Specials
We reserve the right to limit.

Good Thurs. • Fri. - Sat.

CRISCO BLbcan l̂^®
USN0.1

POTATOES ...10 Lb. bag O v

CABBAGE
ONE GALLON PLASTIC JUG Q C

PRESTON MILK ^1^®
PRESTON ONE GALLON PLASTIC JUG f f  ^

LOW FAT MILK H
MEATS

Pork Chops, T-Bones, Rib-Eye Steaks,
Carl’s Pork Sausage 

Club Steaks and Cured Hams

I

sa%

THAT IN ACCORDANCE 
WITH SECTION 30.05 OF 
THE PENAL CODE OF 
TE X A S C R IM IN AL 
TRESPASS (SENATE BILL 
111 PASSED BY THE 62nd 
LEGISLATURE), NOTICE 
IS HEREBY GIVEN THAT 
ALL LANDS OF W.T. 
WAGGONER ESTATE ARE 
POSTED EXCEPT WHERE 
WRITTEN PERMISSION IS 
GIVEN TO COME UPON 
THE SAME.

KILLENM. MOORE 
tfc TRUSTEE

NOTICE

GOODWILL CLUB’S AN­
NUAL DINNER WILL BE 
June 22. Serving begins at 11 
a.m. $3.00 adults, $1.50 
children under 12 years.

5-22 5tc

Effective First Billing 
Period after receiving use of 
the Millers Creek water, 
water rates will increase.

Minimum 1,000 gallons 
$4.00. All above minimum 
(per 1,000) $2.25.

Sewer rates will remain 
unchanged.
City of O’Brien 5-22 Itc

PUBLIC NOTICE 
Any check payable to the 

City of Knox City which is 
returned for any reason will 
necessitate a $5.00 additional 
charge against the writer.

Charles S. Auburg, 
5-22 Itc Mayor, Knox City

PUBLIC NOTICE 
The City of Knox City, 

Texas, hereby gives notice 
that the City’s adopted 
budget, including Revenue 
Sharing Funds is available 
for inspection at the City Hall 
during regular business 
hours. 5-22 Itc

PUBLIC NOTICE
Pursuant to TEX. REV. CIV. STAT. ANN. 

art. 1446c ;j43(1975), Lone Star Gas Company 
hereby gives NOTICE of the Company's intent 
to implement a new schedule of rates effec­
tive on the latter of 1 5  ̂ 1 9 3 0

or such other date as new rates become 
effective in the City of O'Brien, Texas
to be charged for natural gas service to resi­
dential and commercial customers in the en­
virons areas (outside incorporated limits of

O'Brien, Texas .)
The rate schedule is expected to furnish a 
. 80 % increase in the Company’s gross 

revenues in the environs of O'Brien, Texas.

A Statement of Intent has been filed with 
the Railroad Commission of Texas and is 
available for inspection at the Company's
business office located at 222 North 
Washington, Seymour, Texas.

Any affected person desiring to contest 
such changes in rates can file a complaint 
with the Director of the Gas Utilities Division. 
Railroad Commission of Texas. P. O. Drawer 
12967, Capitol Station, Austin, Texas. 78711.

6Lone Star Gas Company

WORKERS NEEDED, good 
pay. Write c/o P.O. Box 446, 
Knox City, Texas 79529.5-13tc

NEED BABY SITTER in my 
home for six year old girl. No 
housework, 7:45 a.m. to 5:30 
p.m., five days a week. Call 
658-3001 after 5:30. 5-22 Itc

CAREER OPPORTUNITY -
National Farmers Union In­
surances, a multi-line com­
pany has career openings for 
established agency for 
Haskell and Knox Counties. 
Guaranteed salary up to $300/ 
week, plus commissions, plus 
company benefits and com­
plete training program. Call 
Ron Knobel, Regional Sales 
Manager, at (817) 776-4700 or 
send resume to P.O. Box 7069, 
Waco, Texas 76710. An Equal 
Opportunity Employer. 5-8 4tc

SEWING MACHINE
operators. Good pay, good 
benefits. Apply in person:’ 
Russell-Newman Mfg. Cpi'i: 
23̂   ̂ No. Washington^ 
eyraour, Texas. 4-10 tfc

A special thanks to Dr. 
Thompson and Dr. Neufeld 
and the nursing staff and 
other hospital employees for 
the care they gave me while I 
was in the hospital with 
surgery.

Thanks to all my friends 
who* called and visited me 
and thanks for all the 
beautiful flowers and cards.

Your kindness made my 
stay in the hospital more 
pleasant.

Rena Stone 
5-22 Itp Dallas, Texas

arnold insurance 
and real estate

FOR QUICK SALE, the Carrie Belle Benedict house, 601 
S. 4th St., Historical appraisement. Needs some work but 
priced reasonable. Nice location, can be made into a won­
derful place that anyone would be proud to own. Better 
hurry if interested. Owner Finance.

1976 FORD % ton pickup, low mileage, good condition. 
Priced for quick sale.
NORMA’S SHOES for sale, located at 104 S. Central. Stock 
and Building. Reasonably Priced. Finance Available.

NICE RESIDENTAL lot 60 X 140 ft. Located on South 
Fourth.

FOR QUICK SALE, brick business building, below value. 
Located on Central downtown.

COMPLETELY remodeled. Two bedroom and bath. 
Owner finance.

(817) 658-3509 Knox City, Texas

Barney B. Arnold
B. Arnold

Pat Anderson

STOP EXPENSIVE PAINTING
United States Steel Siding

UNITED STATES VINYL SIDING 
ALUMINUM REPLACEMENT WINDOWS

100% FINANCING AVAILABLE

C.W. ‘Dutch’ Benson Construction
Authorized Dealer

BENJAMIN PHONE 617 454-2261

WE WISH YOU 
SUCCESS!

%

There is no better time to open a 

savings account than at graduation 

time. Savings add up quickly and you 

let your savings work for you. Those 

who were fortunate enough to realize 

the value of saving money at a young 

age are generally the people on top 

today. Make your future bright — take 

their advice.

We Will Be Closed Monday 
In Observance of Memorial Day

CITIZENS 
STATE BANK
Member F.D.I.C. — Insured to $40,000 

Knox City, Texas
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SENIORS
Remember When?

1980 GRADUATES
Nina Alsides 

Deborah Berryman 

Gaylynn Burkham 

Maxine Casillas 

Cyle Clayton * 

Simone Cobb 

Kenny Cornwell * 

Greg Elston 

Robert Espinosa 

Lupe Figueroa, Jr, * 

Elda Garcia 

Joseph Godsey 

Russel Hacker * 

Tam^ie Helton 

Joyce Hernandez 

Dwayne Johnson 

Scott Lynn *

Olga Magana 

Diane Martinez

Greg Oliver

Tony Quintana

Angelia Reid *

Shelton Rhodes

Sid Richardson

Danny Rios

Toni Rios

Steve Rumley

Brett Tackitt

Ruthie Trice

Gerri Watson *

Kelly Watson

Kyle White

Sam White *

Greg Whitten 
* Honor Graduates

BACCALAUREATE
First United Methodist Church 

Sunday, May 18, 8:00 P.M.

Processional....................................Dottie Lowrey
Invocation ......................................... Stuart Miller

W elcom e.....................................James Patterson

Scripture..........................................John Gillispie

Prayer .................................................... Bill Oden
Sermon.....................................................Bill Trice

Benediction................................John Crownover
(Please remain seated)

Recessional.....................................Dottie Lowrey

KNOX Q TY 
-O’BRIEN 

HIGH SCHOOL
Graduation Exercises 

1980

COMMENCEMENT
First Baptist Church 

Saturday, May 24,8:00 P.M.

Processional.....................................Carolyn Sloan
Linda Underwood

Invocation......................................................Russel Hacker

Salutatorian’s Address.................... Gerri Watson

Valedictorian’s Address..................Angelia Reid
M usic.................................................Angelia Reid

Ruthie Trice
Introduction of Speaker........... ..........Cyle Clayton

Commencement Address ..Mrs. Kenneth Lankford
Presentation of Awards .....................W. R. Baker

Presentation of Class......................................... Bill Holcomb

Presentation of Diplomas............... Henry J. Jones
Benediction...................................... :. .Kyle White

Recessional.........................................Senior Class

Hospital News

Patients Dismissed 
Since May 10,1980 

Knox City: Glenda Johnson, 
Jewell Culberson, Elaine 
Lewis, Yolanda Casillas and 
Baby Girl, Rena Stone 
Benjamin: Manuel Barrien­
tos, L.C. Brown 
Monday: Stacia Cook, Grace 
Gallehon Clara Wilde, Henry 
Sosa, Virgil Kirklin. Elmer

Bruce, Dwight Mitchell, L.A. 
Wilde
Rochester: Alice Moreno, 
Katherine Adkins 
Goree: Josephine Luna 
O’Brien: Charlene Brothers 

Patients Admitted 
As Of May 17,1980 

Knox City: Bill Echols, John 
Box, Elaine Lewis, Ina 
Reynolds, Glen Smith, Laver- 
ta Carver, Elizabeth Moody, 
Truman White
Munday: Ressie Ratliff, John 
Fruewirth, Gladys Valencia, 
Glenda Washington, Baby 
Boy Washington, Baby Girl 
Washington 
Vera: Nora Townsend 
R o c h e s te r : C la ren ce
Jackson, Eulalia Hearn 
Truscott: Matti Bullion

Boutique
cstelle HawKins

To A Very Special 
Graduating Class!

May the things for which you have worked 
iive beyond you to serve man 

and bring our worid cioser to a better'way of iife.

Guinn Sheet Metai and Piumbing
L.C. and Ameroiis Knox City

ABILENE 
MARINE
Serving The 
Big Country 

For Over 16 Years 
We invite you to come 
by and see the all new 
1980 Ranger Skeeter, 

Bass Boats, Checkmate, 
Magnum and Baja 

Ski Boats.
We have several factory 
closeout specials in stock 
of brand new 1977-78-79 
Ranger, Invader, Baja, 
Eldcraft, Hydrasports, 

Marquire, Stinger, 
Chrysler Boats. 7%% 

Bank Financing Up To 
48 Months. 10% Down. 
Complete Parts And 

Service - Over 150 
Used Boats In Stock.

915-673-7325

An original Texas Hamburger
come on in and enjoy a "Hungr-buster” 
an original Texas Hamburger, cooked to your 
order with your choice of lettuce, tomato, onion, pickle 
and mustard or mayonnaise, at regular price and get a 

DO MALT or SHAKE FREE!
Regular size. Your choice of available flavor.

D a ir g  
Q u e e n

Monday, May 19 
 ̂ thru

Sunday, May 25
Offer good only at 

Texas Dairy Queen Trade Association 
Participating Stores

took for the name "Hungr-buster” on the wrapper.

Smith Funeral Home
The Paul Claytons

Y. TEXAS
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Benjamin News
By GLADENE GREEN

From FmHA

HERE ‘N THERE
Mr. and Mrs. Dutch Young 

enjoyed a fishing trip over the 
weekend on the Brazos River. 
They were joined by Mr. and 
Mrs. Jackie Young of Lub­
bock, Mr. and Mrs. Jack 
Young Jr. of Arlington and 
Butch and Sammy Young of 
Grand Prairie.

Philomae Roberson and 
Jonnye Williams attended a 
seminar on Title Insurance in 
Fort Worth Friday and 
Saturday.

Mr. and Mrs. Van Green 
and grandchildren, Becky 
and Cody Stamps, visited 
Van’s parents in Denton and 
Jackie and Diane Daniel of 
Saginaw last weekend.

Ozelle Kilgore and Galen 
Kilgore accompanied by their 
daughter and sister, Barbara 
Kilgore of Los Angeles, 
California, ^sited their son 
and brother, the Gerald 
Kilgores in Des Moines, Iowa, 
recently. They also visited 
the living history forms, 
historical museum and 
botanical gardens in Des 
Moines, the Harry S. Truman 
Library and Museum in In­
dependence, Missouri and 
Cowboy Hall of Fame in 
Oklahoma City, Oklahoma.

ATTEND WEDDING 
Among those from out of 

town attending the wedding 
of Betty Glower and Roger 
Parker recently were Mr. 
and Mrs. Wayne West of 
Cisco, Mr. and Mrs. Blake 
West and Michael of 
Springtown, Mr. and Mrs. 
Bud Glower, Vicki and 
Christie of Lubbock and Mr. 
and Mrs. Austin Tomlinson 
Jr., Penny, Diana, Jody and 
Sam of Seymour.
SENIORS ENJOYING 
FLORIDA TRIP 

The Benjamin Seniors left 
Thursday (in the rain) 
enroute to Dallas-Fort Worth 
Airport where they boarded a 
plane for Orlando, Florida. 
Seniors making the trip were 
Jimmy Redwine, Jimmy 
Robinson, Jesus Estrada, 
Billy Carl Benson, Debbie 
Lindsey, Sheila Benson, 
George Ann Abbott, Lisa 
Carlyle, Craig Hertel, Mary 
Barrientez and sponsors 
Debbie Sosolik and Tracy 
Baty. They will return home 
Wednesday eagerly awaiting 
graduation May 26.
AWARDS BANQUET 

The annual Awards 
Banquet was held Tuesday 
night. The menu was lemon

GOOD
WORK
GRADS

In a grand old-fashioned way, we send 
our good wishes to each of you who 
are graduating. M ay this event herald  
the beginning o f a successful and  
happy career.

A.P. Denton Gro. & Station
A.P., Ruth & Bill

Knox City, Texas

chicken with all the trim­
mings. Awards earned 
throughout the year were 
given. Highlight of the 
evening was the presentation 
of cheerleaders for the 
coming year. They were 
presented by Debbie Lindsey 
and Sheila Benson, outgoing 
senior cheerleaders. Those 
chosen were Stacia Carver, 
Shannon Ryder, Rhonda 
Redwine, Kim Conner and 
Twylah Pierce. They are the 
daughters of the Fred Car­
vers, Donny Ryders, James 
Redwines, Bud Conners and 
Jimmy Pierce Srs.

Moody Rites 
Held Monday 
In Benjamin

Funeral services for Hud­
son Elizabeth Moody, 76, 
were held Monday, May 19, at 
2:00 p.m. in the United 
Methodist Church in Ben­
jamin with the Rev. James 
Patterson, pastor, officiating. 
Mrs. Moody died Sunday, 
May 18, at 2:55 a.m. in the 
Knox County Hospital after a 
brief illness.

Burial was in the Benjamin 
Cemetery with Smith 
Funeral Home in charge of 
arrangements.

She was born on October 9, 
1903, in Coleman and married 
Fred Moody in 1948 at 
Weatherford. The couple 
moved from Wichita Falls to 
Benjamin in 1977, then to the 
Brazos Valley Care Home in 
Knox City in June 1979. She 
was a member of the 
Methodist Church.

Mrs. Moody was a former 
Wichita Falls resident where 
she taught school for twenty- 
five years.

Pallbearers were Tom B. 
Hudson, Buddy Tolson, 
Daniel Hudson, Bobby Hud­
son, Jerry Don Hudson, and 
Danny Max Hudson.

Survivors include her 
husband, Fred of Knox City 
and several cousins.

Bea Agraz 
Is Buried 
Here May 16

Funeral services for 
Librada “ Bea”  Agraz, 77, 
were held at 2:00 Friday, 
May 16, at 2:00 p.m. in the 
First Baptist Church with 
Rev. Paul Garza and the Rev. 
John Gillispie, pastor, of­
ficiating. Mrs. Agraz died at 
10:05 p.m. Wednesday, May 
14 in the Brazos Valley Care 
Home after a brief illness.

Burial was in the Knox City 
Cemetery with Smith 
Funeral Home in charge of 
arrangements.

Mrs. Agraz was born on 
April 17, 1903, in San Angelo. 
She married Alfredo Agraz at 
Anson in 1925 and he 
preceded her in death in 1967 
at Merkel. Mrs. Agraz atten­
ded the First Baptist Church.

Survivors include a son, 
Rudy of Knox City; five 
sisters, Francis Rodriquez of 
Abilene, Santos Garcia of 
Abilene, Koqua Luna ofd 
Sweetwater, Juanita Rosas of 
Merkel, and Lillie 
Castanyata of San Antonio; 
five brothers, Tom Luna of 
Merkel, John Luna, Enis 
Luna, and Sam Luna all of 
Abilene, and Tony Luna of 
New Mexico; and five gran­
dchildren.

Emergency Loans 
Are Available

Emergency loans for far­
mers and ranchers are 
available through the Knox 
County office of the Farmers 
H om e A d m in is tra tio n  
(FmHA), according to Joe T. 
Boone, FmHA county super­
visor.

Boone asked that those who 
need farm credit as a result 
of drouth from August 1,1979, 
through May 5, 1980, make 
their needs known at the 
Farmers Home Ad­
ministration office at 1101 
East Main in Knox City.

Applications for assistance

Neighborhood 
Watch Is 
Continuing

The Knox City-O’Brien 
CISD Mid-School faculty and 
eighth grades will be 
cooperating with the National 
Sheriffs’ Association, Local 
Law Enforcement Agencies, 
and the Knox City Study Club 
to promote the National 
N e igh b orh ood  W atch 
Program.

The program began locally 
with a fall of ‘79 meeting 
called by Lena McGee of the 
Knox City Study Club. The 
meeting was attended by 
local law enforcement per­
sonnel, Chamber of Commer­
ce officials, and City and 
School officials. Plans called' 
for appearances by Mrs. 
McGee and law enforcement 
officials before various civic 
and school groups.

This year’s activities will 
conclude with the school 
groups’ distributing Neigh- 
borhool Watch Program 
material to each home and 
business in Knox City and 
O’Brien.

Everyone is encouraged to 
use the material with the 
hope that the efforts will help 
to reduce crimes in our area.

Lions Club 
News

By Joe M. Clonts

5-14-80
Lion John Turner was 

presented his membership 
packet.

Lion Bill Baker reported on 
the State track meet in 
Austin.

The Ladies’ Night banquet 
will be June 26.

Don Sanders with the Corps 
of Engineers gave a slide 
program and answered 
questions about the Truscott 
salt water control project.

J.C. McCJee was present 
and his name was drawn for 
the door prize.

FROM TULIA

Mrs. Wynelle Roberts of 
Tulia was here Saturday, 
May 10, to attend the funeral 
services of Lynn Tankersley.

She also visited in the home 
of her mother, Mrs. Ozelle 
Stephens, over the weekend.

RETURNS HOME

Mrs. B.P. Horton of Dallas 
has returned to her home af­
ter a two week visit with her 
sisters. Cliff and Blanche 
Elliott, and Mrs. M.E. 
Strickland of Munday.

have a
BRIGHT FUTURE

G R A D S !
D a ir if  

Q u e e n
KNOX CITY

WE WILL BE OPEN MEMORIAL DAY 
Cornelia Tolleson, Manager

in the disaster stricken coun­
ty will be accepted by FmHA 
until February 18, 1981, for 
physical losses and produc­
tion losses.

FmHA loans covering ac­
tual physical and production 
losses may be used to replace 
installations, equipment of 
buildings, induing homes, 
lost through this disaster. 
Funds may be used to buy 
feed, seed, fertilizer, 
livestock or to meet interest 
and depreciation payments 
on current real estate and 
chattel debts. Other loans, 
beyond actual losses, can be 
made for annual operating 
expenses or to make major 
adjustments in a farming or 
ranching operation.

“ Funds can be used for 
essential operating and living 
costs,”  the county supervisor 
said.

Loans covering actual 
losses are made at an interest 
rate of five percent (5%) and 
are scheduled fo r ! 
repayment as rapidly as 
feasible consistant with the 
applicant’s reasonable ability 
to pay. Loans beyond actual 
losses have various 
maturities, depending on the 
purpose of the loan.

The interest rate for short­
term loans for farm 
operating purposes is four­
teen percent (14%). Long­
term loans are being made at 
an interest rate of fourteen 
percent (14%), also.

To be eligible for an 
emergency loan, an applicant 
must have suffered losses 
from the disaster and be 
unalbe to get credit from 
other sources.

Emergency loans can be 
used to help the farmer 
restore damaged farm 
operations and additional 
loans, based on the emergen­
cy designation, can be used to 
reorganize the farm for 
greater efficiency and better 
production.

Lightfoot 
Rites Held 
In Childress

Funeral services for Mrs. 
Alpha Lightfoot, mother of 
Knox City resident Raymond 
Wilhite, were held Friday, 
May 9, at two o’clock in 
Newberry Chapel with W.R. 
Craig, minister of the Church 
of Christ of McCloud, 
Oklahoma, officiating. Burial 
was in Childress Cemetery.

Mrs. Lightfoot, 87 died 
Tuesday, May 6, in a 
Childress hospital.

Born August 2, 1892, in 
Arkansas, she was a longtime 
Childress resident and a 
member of the Church of 
Christ,

Survivors include six sons, 
Calvin and Dick Wilhite, both 
of Amarillo, Ed and Grover 
Wilhite, both of Elk City, 
Oklahoma, Raymond Wilhite 
of Knox City, Everett Wilhite 
of Hayward, California; a 
sister, Mrs. Fanny McDowell 
os Snyder; 11 grandchildren 
and several great­
grandchildren.

Pallbearers were Charles 
Rogers, Raymond Stiner, Lon 
Ray Morris, Pat Sneed, Bud 
Coats, and Troy Wilks.

Responses 
To RCA 
Understudy

More than 68,000 in­
dividuals and organizations 
have provided written com­
ments on the Resource Con­
servation Act to the Response 
Analysis Center in Athens, 
Georgia, according to Carl 
Hutcherson, district conser­
vationist for the U.S. Soil 
Conservation Service at Knox 
City.

The written responses are 
in addition to statements 
made at public meetings held 
in Texas during the 60-day 
public review period of the 
draft RCA documents which 
ended March 28, Hutcherson 
said.

All responses are to be 
analyzed sometime in May. 
After all comments have 
been studied by USDA of­
ficials, a recommended soil 
and water conservation 
program will be developed 
and presented to the public 
for review this summer. The 
USDA coordinating commit­
tee is preparing a schedule of 
activities that will be 
released as soon as it is com­
pleted.

Mrs. A.W. McBeth 
Celebrate Birthday

Those visiting in the Lloyd 
Waldrip home Sunday to Help 
Mrs. Waldrip’s mother, Mrs. 
A.W. McBeth, celebrate her 
89th birthday were the 
honoree’s son and wife, Mr. 
and Mrs. Charles McBeth of 
Amarillo, daughters, Mrs. 
Margie Woodward, Mrs. 
Sammy Scott, and Mrs. 
Delbert Corley, all of Fort 
Worth. Others helping her 
celebrate were her gran­
dchildren, Dr. and Mrs. 
A.C. Sharp, Trendy, Mark 
and Sue of Abilene and Mr. 
and Mrs. Don Welch, Mitzi 
and Mandi of Crowell.

Mrs. McBeth also received 
many “ Happy Birthday”  
greetings frqm relatives and 
friends by telephone calls and 
drop-in visitors. She reported 
a very wonderful day.

Local Wins At 
Vernon Art Show

Melanie Whitley was in 
Vernon Sunday to attend the 
annual Vernon Art League 
Art Show. Where she won a 
second, one honorable men­
tion, and one purchase 
award.

Making the trip with her 
were her daughter, Melissa 
Whitley and her mother, 
Lillian Rae Verhalen.

ATTEND SERVICES
Mr. and Mrs. Sam Tanker­

sley and her mother, Mrs. 
Rae Eastland, all of Stam­
ford, and Don Tankersley of 
Seminole attended the Satur­
day, May 10, funeral services 
of Sam and Don’s uncle, Lynn 
Tankersley.

They also visited in the 
home of their parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Jack Tanker­
sley.

IDr. C.L Cromwell
OPTOMETRIST |

Phone 

(915)773-3542 

STAMFORD
I

J

You’ve come a long way 
and your future is bright.

Jerry’s Plumbing
Knox City, Texas

^  —  >

W e Wish You The Best Things 
Life Can O ffer, Grads . . .

Health, Happiness and 
Success.

arnold Insurance & real estate
4^  the barney b. arnolds 
^  peggyguinn

the barney arnolds 
pat anderson

ip ip ip ip ip ip ip ip ip ip ip ip ip ip ip ip ip ip ip ip ip ip ip ip ^ ip ip ip ip ig iip ip ip ip ip ^ ip ip ip ip i^



W IS H E S

BENJAMIN
SENIORS

1980

SCBCX$K

MARY

GRADUATES!
COLLINS MOORHOUSE 

GARAGE
FAYTEEN & COLLINS Benjamin, TX

HONORStoALL
Congratulations on that di> 

ploma. It’s the key that’ll un­
lock many opportunities for you. 
Higher education. A fulfilling 
career. That feeling of self ac­
complishment. Enjoy our praise 
... good wishes for your future.

Sweetwater 
Pump and Supply

Knox City

SENIORS

LUCK

As you receive your diploma, 
we hope you continue to look 
^head and plan for the future ... 
and we hope the future holds 
much for you.

C & C Electric
Willie Collins 

Knox City, Texas

GEORGE ANNE ABBOTT 
was born to the proud paren­
ts, Sammy and Marlene Ab­
bott on August 19, 1962. She 
first attended school at 
Gilliland grade school for her 
first five years.

She then attended the 
following schools-Munday 
Junior High for three years 
and also her freshman year of 
high school. During these 
four years, she participated 
in band.

Her freshman year, she 
participated in FHA and 
FTA. Her sophmore year, she 
moved to Tatum, New 
Mexico, where she par­
ticipated in band and was a 
member of National Honor 
Society and FHA. Her junior 
year, she moved to Lovington 
where she attended the first 
half of her junior year and 
was on the honor roll. She was 
also nominated to run for 
Miss Teenage New Mexico 
because of her academic 
ability. The last half of her 
junior year she moved back 
to Gilliland and started to 
school at Benjamin High 
School. She participated in 
UIL One Act play her junior 
and senior years. She was 
also a member of FHA and 
her senior year she served as 
an officer for FHA. Her 
senior year, she served as 
class treasurer.

Her future plans are to at­
tend college but is undecided 
as to where she will go.

MARY BARRIENTEZ was 
born to the proud parents of 
Mr. and Mrs. Raul Barrientez 
onAugust 21, 1962 at Knox 
City. Mary attended Knox 
City Schools until the middle 
of her fourth grade year. She 
then moved to Crowell where 
her education continued. Her 
eighth grade year she was an

l i t

blly sernm

f?08iNSt»<

honor student.
During high school, she was 

in FHA all four years and 
held offices. She ran track 
her freshman and sophmore 
year she was elected class 
doll.

She then moved to Ben­
jamin where her junior year 
she was class vice-president, 
awarded the Typing II award 
and was on the honor roll. Her 
junior and senior year she 
was in UIL One Act play and 
a member of the FFA Chap­
ter. Her senior year, she was 
secretary of the senior class.

Her plans are to attend 
college but she is still un­
decided on where to go.

BILLY CARL BENSON is 
the son of Mr. and Mrs. Billy 
Ben Benson. He was born 
August 27,1962, and has lived 
in Benjamin all of his life. He 
has attended Benjamin 
School all of his 12 years.

While in high school, he has 
participated in football four 
years, basketball four years, 
track three years, tennis two 
years and golf one year. Billy 
made second team all-district 
in football his senior year. In 
UIL, he has participated in 
number sense two years, the 
science contest two years, 
and debate one year. He has 
been in FFA for four years. In 
FFA, he was reporter for two 
years and president for one 
year. His sophmore year he 
was class favorite. He won 
second in his school’s essay 
contest for two years.

Billy likes to ride his 
motorcycle, fish, hunt and 
water ski. His future plans 
are to attend VRJC in the fall 
of 1980.

SHELIA BENSON was bom 
to the proud parents of Mr. 
and Mrs. Billy Ben Benson

WE WISH 
YOU SUCCESS!

You’re a great group 
and we’re proud 

of your achievements.

Lady Bug Shoppe
MINI MALL

DESS/E EGENBACHER

July 1, 1962, in Big Spring, 
Texas. She has attended Ben­
jamin School all twelve 
years.

She was a cheerleader two 
years in junior high and three 
years in high school.

Shelia participated in 
basketball for four years, 
track two years and tennis 
three years. She was fresh­
man and junior class favorite 
and was class president her 
freshman, sophmore and 
junior years and vice 
president her senior year. 
She was a member of FHA 
four years and was president 
of FHA her senior year. She 
has also been a member of 
FFA three years and was 
elected FFA Sweetheart her 
sophmore and junior years. 
Her senior year she was elec­
ted Miss BHS, Football 
Sweetheart, selected all 
district first team in basket­
ball and was in Who’s Who 
Among American High 
School Students for 1979-80.

Her future plans are to at­
tend Vernon Regional Junior 
College in Vernon and major 
in business administration.
LISA CARLYLE is the 
daughter of Mrs. James 
Welch of Gilliland and Ken­
neth Carlyle of Seymour. She 
was born June 12, 1962, in 
Seymour at 3:45 a.m. She at­
tended Seymour elementary 
and junior high. The summer 
of her freshman year, she 
moved to Gilliland and has 
attended Benjamin High 
School for four years.

She participated in basket­
ball and track two years, 
girls basketball bookkeeper 
one year, and was a member 
of the pep squad for four 
years. She participated in 
UIL three years in Prose 
Reading. This year, she won 
second at district. She has 
been in FHA four years, FFA 
three years and 4-H three 
years. She was on the horse 
judging team this year. She 
showed hogs in. FFA at 
several stock shows. To name 
a few~Fort Worth Fat Stock 
Show, Houston Livestock 
Show, and the county stock 
show where she did ex- 
treamly well. Her junior 
year, she was class treasurer 
and class favorite her senior 
year.

Her plans for the future are 
to attend Vernon Regional 
Junior College in Vernon.

-JESSIE ESTRADA, son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Apolonio 
Estrada, has attended Ben­
jamin School for twelve 
years. He participated in 
football, basketball and 
track. He has been in UIL 
one-act play for four years. 
He received honorable men­
tion for all-star cast for two 
years. In UIL, he also par­
ticipated in Prose one year, 
journalism one year and 
debate for three years. Two 
years he advanced to state 
level. He has been a member 
of FFA for four years and 
was class favorite his four 
high school years.

Jessie plans to attend 
Western Texas College in 
Snyder this fall.

CRAIG HERTEL is the son of 
Mr. and Mrs. Don Hertel. He 
has lived in Benjamin all of 
his life and has attended Ben­
jamin School all twelve 
years.

While in high school, Craig 
has participated in football 
three years, basketball four 
years, receiving all-district 
honors twice, tennis for two 
years, golf one year, and 
track for three years. He was 
a member of the one-act play 
cast all four years, receiving 
individual honors. He 
debated for three vears, ad-
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vancing to state competition 
twice. He also participated in 
p o e try  in te rp re ta t io n , 
spelling, number sense and 
journalism contests during 
high school. Craig has won 
the school’s Soil and Water 
Conservation Essay Contest 
four years.

Craig has enjoyed his 
school years and has many 
plans for the future. He plans 
to attend Midwestern State 
University in the fall.

DEBBIE LINDSEY was bom 
to the proud parents of Mr. 
and Mrs. Brice Lindsey on 
November 22, 1961. She 
moved to Benjamin when she 
was five. She has attended 
pre-school, elem entary, 
junior high and high school at 
Benjamin. She moved from 
Guthrie.

In junior high, she was 
elected cheerleader for three 
years. In high school, she was 
elected vice president of the 
freshman class, elected 
treasurer of the sophmore 
class, and reporter of the 
class her junior year. She has 
been a head cheerleader for 
three years. Her sophmore 
year she was elected football 
sweetheart. She has been an 
FHA officer all through high 
school and also participated 
in basketball for three years. 
She was in the One-Act play 
for three years and received 
All-Star Cast honors her 
sophomore year and 
honorable mention All-Star 
cast honors her senior year.

Debbie’s freshman year 
she won first place in oral 
reading, her sophomore year 
she won second place in 
district in poetry, her junior 
year she won first place in 
poetry and was an alternate 
for the state UIL meet in 
Austin. Her senior year she 
won first place in poetry. She 
was also sophomore favorite. 
Her senior year she was elec­
ted best all-around and she 
was also elected Miss School 
Spirit for two years in high 
school. Her junior and senior 
year she was* chosen to be in 
both editions of “ Who’s Who 
Among America High School 
Students’ ’ . She participated 
in track for two years and is 
undecided where she will at­
tend college.

LYNDA BROOKE HUDSON 
PIERCE, the daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Tom Brooke Hudson 
of Benjamin, has attended 
Benjamin Schools all of her 
twelve years.

She was on the annual staff 
four years, cheerleader four 
years and was in FHA three 
years. Lynda Brooke par­
ticipated in tennis three 
years, basketball three 
years, was a member of FFA 
for three years, and was class 
secretary her freshman, 
sophomore and junior years 
of high school.

Lynda Brooke was also in 4- 
H for eight years and has 
received numerous awards 
for her achievements in the 
organization. She par­
ticipated in UIL three of her 
high school years and 
qualified for regional her 
sophomore year in infor­
mative speaking. She also 
was on the one act play cast 
for one year.

Her future plans are to at­
tend Panhandle State 
University in Goodwell, 
Oklahoma, with her husband, 
Keith, and to major in 
medical records.

JIMMY WAYNE REDWINE 
was born June 7, 1962, to the 
proud parents of Mr. and 
Mrs. James Redwine at Knox 
City.

He has attended Benjamin 
School for five years, and has
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participated in football, Oklahoma.
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Cartwright Grocery
Dub, Jo, and Tracy Benjamin, Texas

basketball, track, golf and 
tennis all through his high 
school years. He has received 
many honors such as all 
district first team his junior 
year and all district second 
team defense and offense in 
football. His Senior year he 
received all district in 
basketball. He was voted 
most athletic and Mr. BHS 
his senior year. He was also 
in UIL events and FFA. He 
will participate in the All-Star 
Football game at Tarleton 
State University in Stephen- 
ville in July.

His future plans are to at­
tend Vernon Regional Junior 
College in Vernon.

JIMMY ROBINSON was 
bom to the proud parents of 
Jim and Alice Robinson, on 
January 19, 1962, in Hobart,

He started high school at 
Benjamin and participated in 
football, basketball and 
track. His sophomore year, 
he moved to Wyoming where- 
he participated in track and 
wrestling. His junior year, he 
went to school in OUahoma 
where he was a member of 
T. and I. His senior year, he 
entered school at Benjamin 
where he played football and 
basketball.

Jimmy has been a member 
of FFA four years, was 
nominated fo^ Chapter 
secretary this year and was a 
member of the Radio Skills 
Team.

Jimmy likes to fish, hunt, 
snow sM and snow mobile. 
His future plans are to attend 
VRJC in Vernon this fall.

McGaughey To Speak 
To Benjamin Grads

Former Benjamin High 
School graduate John N. 
McGaughey, who is director 
of the special education Tri­
county Coop in Stamford, will 
address the eleven graduates 
of the Benjamin Schools 
during commencement exer­
cises set for Monday, May 26, 
in the high school gymnasium 
beginning at 8:30 p.m.

McGaughey, the son of the 
late Mr. and Mrs. Merrick 
McGaughey, longtime Ben­
jamin residents, is married to 
the former Barbara Johnston 
of Knox City, and they are the 
parents of three children, 
David of Canyon, Jodie and 
Barbie.

Providing the processional 
and recessional will be Linda 
Griffith while Debbie Lindsey 
brings the invocation.

Billy Carl Benson will 
present the salutatory ad­
dress followed by Craig Her­
tel with the valedictory.

Shelia Benson will in­
troduce the speaker and 
following McGaughey’s ad­
dress Superintendent Ken­
neth Roberts will present 
awards. Benjamin School' 
Board president LaMbyne 
Patterson will then make the 
presentation of diplomas.

Ushers will be Mickey 
Smith, Clem Rodriquez, Ed­
die Romo, Greg Collins and 
John Mark Kinnibrugh.

Stage attendants are 
Shannon Ryder and Mark Ox­
ford while Becky Welch, 
Stacy Groves, Stasia Carver, 
and Michael Giolden will be in 
charge of programs.

Benjamin senior class 
members include George An­
ne Abbott, Mary Barrientez, 
Billy Carl Benson, Shelia 
Benson, Lisa Carlyle, Jessie 
Estrada, Craig Hertel, Deb­
bie Lindsey, Lynda Brooke 
Pierce, Jimmy Redwine and 
Jimmy Robinson. Sponsor is 
Deborah Sosolik.

k RANCHHOUSE
WE WILL BE CLOSED MAY 25 THRU MAY 28.

W e  S a lu te  Y o u -

Our congratulations to you 
fora  job well done!

BUD CONNER E)$̂ ON
BUD, VON, AND KIM 

Benjamin, Texas

A World of opportunity 
and challenge awaits you!

Knox Builders Supply
Tommy, Derreil, Tad, Flint, & Sid
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Saturday, May 17

Awards Presented 
At UIL Banquet

GIRLS ATHLETES receiving special awards 
were, left, Ruthie Trice, the 3 A’s for , adap* 
tability, attitude, and appreciation, and Mindy 
Hutchinson, as the most outstanding leader in 
girls’ sports.

CHOSEN FOOTBALL captains for this school year were, from left, Scott 
Lynn, Dwayne Johnson, and Robert Espinosa. (School Photo)

CHEERLEADERS elected to serve during the 1980-81 school term are, from 
left, head cheerleader Angie Bateman, Mindy Hutchinson, Michele 
Bateman, and Sarah Jones. (School Photo)

HEADING UP the Greyhound Band next year will be newly-elected twirlers 
and drum major, who are from left, twirlers Karae Beason and Kristi Boone, 
drum major Missy Whitley, head twirler Kay Howell and twirler Bonnie 
Stewart.

MOST ATHLETIC Boy and Girl Awards went to 
Kay Howell and Dwayne Johnson.

ANNOUNCED DURING banquet activities Saturday evening as next year’s 
Drill Team members were, from left, Toni Hewitt, Mary Garcia, Kimberiy 
Whitley, Daveine Holcomb, Mary Albus, Diane Heims, Angie Quintana, and 
Amber Berryman.

v.i.p ;s
Con^ratnlations

We’re proud of the Seniors. Their endea­
vors and acheivements make them very 
important peopie to us. We take the 
greatest pride in offering to them our 
sincerest congratulations.

First Christian Church

WITH A RED FACE, Coach Jimmy Rogers iistens as banquet entertainer 
Stacy Angie sings, “i Honestiy Love You”. His wife, Kay, carefuiiy observes 
the action. (Schooi Photo)

GERRI WATSON
...recipient of John  

Phiiip Sousa band award

AWARDS FOR the most improved giris in three 
sports were presented, from ieft, to Missy 
Whitiey, Deiores Stafford, and Karae Beason.

W ell Done 
Qrads!

You’ve worked hard, and 
i t ’s a job well done. 

Best wishes for more 
success in the future!

Owens Auto Supply
Knox City

BEST WISHES TO 
ALL THE GRADUATES!

KMA Well Service, Inc.
COMPLETE WELL SERVICING

Knox City, Texas Wichita Falls, Texas
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More UIL Awards

NAMED TO the elite Letterman’s Club were Tim Roberson, Scott Lynn, 
Dwayne Johnson, Rickey Gonzales, Jay Rutherford, and Chuck Hutchin­
son.

ELECTED TO serve as band officers for the coming year were, from left, 
president Chuck Hutchinson, vice president Kay Howeli, secretary- 
treasurer Sarah Jones, and reporter Mindy Hutchinson.

n ic tw

OUTSTANDING BAND member awards went to 
Steve Rumley and Kay Howeli.

BEST ALL-AROUND honors were awarded 
Saturday night to Scott Lynn, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Jimmy Lynn, and Ruthie Trice, daughter of 
the Rev. and Mrs. W.L. Trice of O’Brien. Studen­
ts were nominated for this eiite award by 
faculty members.

Best All-Around 
Revealed At Banquet

Congratulations on this great step 
in your life -  Seniors

May you continue to ask the Lord 
to guide in future steps.

“The Steps of a good man 
are ordered by the Lord. ”

Psalms 37:23

[ First Baptist Church ]

The son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Jimmy Lynn, Scott has been 
mostly involved in athletics 
during his high school years. 
He participated in basketball, 
football, and track. He was 
also a member of FFA, one 
year; FTA, two years; and 
Beta Club. His junior year, he 
was nominated to “ Who’s 
Who Among American High 
School Students”  and “ The 
Society of Distinguished 
American High School 
Students.

Best All-Around Boy and 
Girl at Knox City-0’Brien 
High School were announced 
during the Saturday night. 
May 17, UIL Banquet.

The honors were presented 
to senior students, Ruthie 
Trice and Scott Lynn.

Ruthie, the daughter of the 
Rev. and Mrs. Bill Trice of 
O’Brien, has participated in 
many activities during her 
high school years. Basketball 
has been a four year activity 
for her and she also par­
ticipated in volleyball for two 
seasons. She has been in­
volved in FHA for three years 
and band has been in her 
schedule for two years. This 
year, she was elected Band 
Sweetheart by members of 
the Greyhound band. Tennis 
in one of her favorite sports 
which she played for three 
years. She also participated 
in the track program for 
three years.

★  ★ ★ ★ ★ ★  ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★

To Our
GRADUATES

John Egenbacher Impl.
KNOX CITY
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A tip of the cap to our

Stand Up and Take 
A Bow!

Bridges Oil Co.
Knox City, Texas

★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★

ONLY ONE-TENTH of a second away from a 
gold medal was Dwayne Johnson, senior hur­
dler who Is pictured here with his silver medal 
for a close second In state track.

RECEIVING RECOGNITION at the UIL Banquet 
was Donald Johnson, at right, for 25 years’ ser­
vice to the KC athletic programs. Supt. W.R. 
Baker makes the presentation. (School Photo)

T o m o rro w , You Can  
A im  fo r  th e  S tars .

But to d ay?

You A re  th e  S tars .

H o p e  You H a v e  A  
G re a t  D a y

Pumpers Supply 
& Equipment

On Call 24 hrs. a day (817) 658-3260
KNOX CITY

W ell
Done

Qrads I
We wish you much 

success and happiness.

O’Brien Food Store
The Coy Hewitts

C o i \g r a t u la t io i \s ,

. . . S e n i o r s !
R.G. Howell M.D. 
and Associates

TO THE

SENIOR CLASS
Graduation Day! It’s a proud 

moment for every Senior; a 
culmination of years of work 
and study and steadfast pur­
pose.

Our thoughts and good 
wishes are with the Seniors at 
this special time. With esteem 
and respect we wish them a fu­
ture of success and happiness.

Knox City Grain Co., inc.
Billy Mitcheil, Mgr.
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The
Kennel

KC School News

FAREWELL TO
KNOX CITY HIGH KENNEL
By Kelly and Gerri Watson

The editors of the Knox City 
Kennel Staff are sad to say 
that this short year has come 
to an end. We have made 
many happy memories, but 
also a few sad ones. 
Sometimes we giggled so 
much that we cried!

A memory that comes to 
mind is typing the news every 
week. Elda Garcia’s was one 
to really remember. It was 
always the hardest to type 
because it had so much en- 
tursiasm in it. Then, there 
was the fun of getting 
everything typed in between 
laughs before the newspaper 
called wondering where the 
news was.

Mrs. Watson always had 
“ wonderful”  ideas for us. 
One of them was to write 
editorials for the newspaper 
such as this one. We always 
gave her a hard time, but we 
would always write one. This 
is the saddest one because it 
is the last one we will ever 
write. It is our farewell to the 
paper.

We have enjoyed this year 
more by being editors for the 
paper. We liked to help 
everyone know what is hap­
pening in the school. We hope 
that next year’s editors will 
be as great as we were! 
SENIOR CLASS NEWS 
By Ruthie Trice

The Seniors had a great 
time in Galveston. They 
visited the State Track Meet 
in Austin on their way. They 
pulled in to Galveston about 
8:00 and got settled in the 
motel. Some of the activities 
were ferry boat riding, bay 
fishing, a trip to the 
Astrodome and of course the 
BEACH! They drove by the 
Huntsville Prison on their 
way home, and got to Knox 
City about 8:00. Everyone 
seemed to have the time of 
their life.

Last Sunday was Bac­
calaureate and Saturday, 
May 24 will be the big day for 
the thirty-four graduating.
SOPHOMORE CLASS NEWS 
By Mindy Hutchinson

School is out now and there 
sure are a bunch of happy 
people.

Tuesday, the Sophomores 
had a party in Coach Sloan’s 
Geometry class. This ended 
the year nice. On the other 
hand, we had a nice surprise. 
This quarter not one person in 
Geometry class has to take 
their quarter finals.

The Homemaking II girls 
turned in their sewing projec­
ts and completed their Level 
II of encounter.

Miss Waltrip will be 
leaving us and we’re sorry to 
see her go. We had a party 
Tuesday also. “ Miss Waltrip, 
we aU hope you find what 
you’re looking for and that 
you’ll always be happy.”

Our English class com­
pleted our year with a test 
over our prose section of our 
literature book.

The Sophomores and 
Juniors held a party last 
week in athletics and what 
coach Mcllhaney and Coach 
Underwood left the Fresh­
men snapped up in a ZIP. We 
did have a nice time and this 
has really been a super great 
year for all of us.
BAND NEWS 
By Gerri Watson

The 1979-80 year of the 
Greyhound Band came to an 
end last Tuesday. The band

SCHOOLAND 
COMMUNITY 
CALENDAR

Thursday, May 22 -  Last Day 
of school; Kindergarten 
graduation, 1:00 p.m.; Grade 
School graduation. First Bap­
tist Church, Knox City, 7:30 
p.m.; Little League games. 
Cards vs. Tigers 6:30 p.m. 
and Red Sox vs. Dodgers, 
7:30 p.m.
Friday, May 23 -  Teacher 
Workday
Saturday, May 24 ~ High 
School graduation. First Bap­
tist Church, 8:00 p.m.
Monday, May 26 -  Memorial 
Day, Little League games. 
Dodgers vs. Tigers, 6:00 
p.m.. Red Sox vs. Cards, 7:30 
p.m.
Wednesday, May 28 -  Noon 
Lions Club, Masonic 
Fellowship Hall 
Thursday, May 29 -  Little 
League games. Cards vs. Red 
Sox, 6:00 p.m.. Tigers vs. 
Dodgers, 7:30 p.m.

set out at the beginning of the 
year to accomplish many 
goals. They did not always 
come out on top of the 
ratings, but they did their 
best and they can be proud of 
that. __

Several awards were 
presented by Miss Waltrip 
last Saturday night at the UIL 
Banquet to several students. 
Most Valuable Players were 
Mindy Hutchinson, Kay 
Howell, Gerri Watson, Steve 
Rumley, Cyle Clayton, and 
Chuck Hutchinson. Those 
named for Who’s Who in 
Music were Barry Sutton, 
(Jerri Watson, Kay Howell, 
Steve Rumley, Cyle Clayton, 
Ruthie Trice, Gaylynn 
Burkham, and Chuck Hut­
chinson. Most Outstanding 
Girl was Kay Howell 
and Most Outstanding Boy 
was Steve Rumley. The John 
Phillip Sousa Award was 
given to Gterri Watson.

The band gives their thanks 
to the Band Booster and 
parents for their support 
through the year. The band 
really appreciated the fun 
trip to Six Flags.

The band also gives a 
special thanks to Miss 
Waltrip for all of her hard 
work. She was always there 
to help us when we needed it, 
and she helped us learn many 
things.

A farewell party was given 
to Miss Waltrip last Tuesday 
by the band members. It was 
to show the band’s ap­
preciation for her, and to let 
her know that she will be 
missed by everyone next year 
since she will not be returning 
to Knox City.

Your record is outstanding, 
your future unlimited.

CITY HARDWARE
Knox City, Texas

FHA Winds Up Activities
By Mindy Hutchinson

It’s time to wind up this 
year which has been very ex­
citing for all of us. We have 
many memories of good 
times we all had this past 
year. Several members of our 
organization attended the 
Area and the State conven­
tion and we have all enjoyed 
having Angelia Reid as our 
president.

For the coming year, the 
newly-elected FHA officers 
for 1980-81 will be Kay 
Howell, president; Stacy 
Eaton, vice-president of 
programs; Angie Bateman, 
vice-president of Encounter; 
Patty Durham, vice- 
president of projects; Amber 
Ashcraft, vice-president of 
recreation; Mindy Hutchin­
son, vice-president of public 
relations; Kim Whitley, 
secretary; Angie Quintana, 
treasurer; Maggie Curd, 
typist; Karae Beason, 
historian; and Kristi Boone, 
parlimentarian.

Parents night was held 
recently and Mindy Hutchin­
son, Maggie Curd and Missy 
Whitley received awards for 
Level II in Encounter which 
is the Scroll level. Gaylynn 
Burkham and Angie 
Bateman achieved awards in 
Level III, which is the Torch 
level.

These girls worked very 
hard to obtain these awards 
in such areas as community 
and school activities, goals to 
achieve and various things 
which helped in preparing us 
to be better future 
homemakers.

All of the members have 
enjoyed having two very nice 
and helpful homemaking 
teachers, Vetta Reid and 
Vera Newton . These ladies 
have done a very fine job 
especially since there are 40 
FHA girls.

IN CYPERTHOME
Visiting recently in the 

home of Mr. and Mrs. J.T. 
Cypert were their son and his 
family, Mr. and Mrs. Lyndol 
(Jypert, Tim and Lance of San 
Antonio and Mrs. Cypert’s 
niece and her husband, Mr. 
and Mrs. Mike Hamer of 
Grapevine.

They were here to attend 
the funeral services for their 
uncle, Lynn Tankersley.

Mrs. Elaine Lewis 
Undergoes Surgery

Mrs. Elaine Lewis, who 
recently underwent surgery 
in the Knox County Hospital 
is doing well, but will be con­
fined to the hospital for 
another two weeks, according 
to family members.

Her family is taking care of 
her Abilene and Wichita Falls 
paper deliveries, and those 
who are delivering her 
papers ask the indulgence of 
her customers until her 
return.

WE WISH YOU

IN LUBBOCK

Mr. and Mrs. John Egen- 
bacher visited their son and 
his wife, Mr. and Mrs. Randy 
Egenbacher in Lubbock, over 
the weekend and attended 
market.

INCOMING OFFICERS of the Future Homemakers of America were recen­
tly installed at the Parents’ Night banquet. From ieft are Karae Beason, 
historian; Angie Quintana, treasurer; Mindy Hutchinson, vice-president of 
pubiic reiations; Patti Durham, vice-president of projects; Stacy Eaton, vice- 
president of programs; Kay Howeii, president; Angie Bateman, vice- 
president of Encounter, Amber Ashcraft; vice-president of recreation; Kim 
Whitiey, secretary;Maggie Curd, typist; and Kristi Boone, pariiamentarian. 
(KC Schooi Photo)

Benjamin Intersection 
Will Be Two-Way Stop

CHILDRESS -  The State 
Highway 6 and U.S. Highway 
82 intersection in Benjamin is 
being changed next week 
from a four-way stop to a two- 
way stop, according to 
District 25 Maintenance 
Engineer Alvin D. Alexander 
of Childress.

“ We feel that the intersec­
tion will be safer and more ef­
ficient by having only a two- 
way stop on S. H. 6.”  Alexan­
der said. “ Drivers on S. H. 6 
should be aware that U.S. 82

Brenda Roberts Is 
Council Treasurer

Brenda Roberts, eighth 
grade student at Mann Junior 
High in Abilene, has been 
elected to serve as Student 
Council Treasurer for the 
1980-81 school year. She was 
also inducted into the Junior 
National Honor Society.

In order to be accepted into 
the Society, a student must 
attain a grade average of 87 
or above, be of good charac­
ter, and well rounded in all 
phases of school activities. 
Brenda has participated on 
the basketball, volleyball, 
and soccer team, and plays 
coronet in the Falcon band.

Brenda is the daughter of 
Kay Roberts of Abilene and 
V.R. Roberts of Rochester 
and the granddaughter of 
Annie Roberts of Knox City 
and Bert Davis of Snyder.

traffic will have the right-of- 
way.”

The changeover will in­
volve removing the overhead 
flashing four-way stop and 
installing new stop signs on S. 
H. 6 at junction with U.S. 82.

“ Advance flashing warning 
signals will be stationed on 
U.S. 82 several hundred feet 
away from the intersection.”  
stated Alexander. “ This 
should give adequate war­
ning for motorists on U.S. 82 
to slow down.”

In discussing the work 
Alexander emphasized that 
change always has some 
temporary danger.

“ Right after the 
changeover will be the most 
dangerous time.”  he said. 
“ We certainly hope that 
drivers will be extra cautious 
during this most critical 
period.”

The work is expected to get 
under way sometime next 
week.

Alexander will be super­
vising the work which is to be 
done by highway department 
employees.

Ray Thompson 
Receives Degree

Travis Ray Thompson, son 
of Mrs. La Verne Thompson of 
Knox City and the late Travis 
Thompson, received his 
bachelor of business ad­
ministration degree Sunday 
afternoon. May 11, at three 
o ’clock during the fifty- 
seventh commencement con­
vocation of McMurry College.

The commencement was 
held in Radford Auditorium 
on the college campus and 
speaker was Dr. Stephen K. 
Mittelstet, president of 
Richland College in Dallas.

Ray, who was valedictorian 
of his 1976 graduating class 
here in Knox City, graduated 
cum laude and is also a 
member of the James Win- 
ford Hunt Chapter of Alpha 
Chi.

Rochester Woman 
Receives Nurse’s Pin

Fifty second-year nursing 
students from Midwestern 
State University were pinned 
during the ceremony on 
Saturday, May 17, at 10:00 
a.m. at the' MSU Hardin 
Auditorium in Wichita Falls.

Among those receiving pins 
was Marietta L. McWhorter 
of Rochester.

W IS H E S

Norma’s
Norm a and Gene Sutton

City Cieaners
The Ken Bradfords Knox City

Rochester Tractor Co., Inc 
Phone (817) 743-3525 

Rochester, Texas

Genuine John Deere 
Parts and Service

Lennis T ibbets, Mgr.

..... lr?L
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Let the world 
know the Class 
of 1980 is ready 

to do greater 
things.

First United 
Methodist Church

JAMES PATTERSON, PASTOR

Congratulations  

T o  E v e ry  

S e n io r

B e s t  o f  lu c k  
to  e a c h  

a n d
e v e r y  o n e  

o f  y o u !

H.JONES
PHARMACY

Phone 658-3215
INC.

Knox City, Texas
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Awards Presented

To FFA Students

Knox City-O’Brien Future 
Farmers of America honored 
their parents and other 
guests with a dinner held 
Thursday, May 8, at 7:30 p.m. 
in the school cafeteria,.

. The opening and closing 
ceremonies were conducted 
by chapter members and 
Greenhand officers held the 
honorary member ceremony 
making the presentation to 
J.M. Emerson.

Receiving Chapter Farmer 
Degrees were Kelly Cowart, 
Daniel Alsides, Kevin Leach, 
Ranee Hacker, Todd Lewis, 
and Jeff Reece.

FFA Foundation Awards

were presented to Daniel 
Godsey, diversified livestock 
production; Kelley Boone, 
dairy production; Kyle 
White, beef production; 
Gaylynn Burkham, sheep 
production; Ray Farmer, 
crop production; Joe Godsey, 
agricultural m echanics; 
Greg Whitten, farm safety; 
Daniel Godsey, Chapter Star 
Farmer; Joe Godsey, Qiap- 
ter Leadership; Kelley 
Boone, Chapter Scholarship; 
Jay Rutherford, Claud Reed 
Memorial Trophy; Kyle 
White, swine herdsman 
award; Kelley Boone, 
showmanship awards: and

We like boosting obout our grads! We're proud 
of their work and effort. We’re proud of the invest­
ment in their future that'll pay high iiividends of 
success ond happiness. They should be proud, tool

Margaret’s
MARGARET &E.J. WARD 

and Employees

Graduation 
is a real 
feather 
in your cap!

SKILES E)^ON STA.
Knox City, Texas

SITTIN’ PRETTY!
You’ve earned your credits, 
grads. We congratulate you 

on this very special day.

MARION’S 
MOBIL STATION

RECIPIENT OF the Claud E. Reed Memorial 
Trophy is Jay Rutherford, at right. Advisor Leon 
Burkham congratuiates the FFA junior,- son of 
Mr. and Mrs. J.B. Rutherford. Mrs. Reed made 
the actuai presentation during the banquet. 
(Schooi Photo)

STAR GREENHAND award was presented to 
Tyke Meinzer, right, by Greenhand advisor Jim 
Diiion. (Schooi Photo)

DeKalb Award Joe Godsey.
Certificates of Merit were 

awarded to Joe Godsey, ag 
mechanics and leadership; 
Sid Richardson, wood 
working; Kyle White, swine 
production ând leadership; 
Greg Oliver, swine produc­
tion and leadership; Kelley 
Boone, grass judging and 
swine showmanship; Jay 
Rutherford, grass judging 
and public speaking; Glenn 
Hedgecoke, Todd Lewis, 
Steven Lynn, and Jeff Reece, 
shop.

Lone Star Farmer awards 
were presented to Greg 
Oliver, Jay Rutherford, 
Kelley Boone, Gaylynn 
Burkham, Ray , Farmer,

DANiEL GODSEY
...S tar Chapter Farm er

M "" M

A bushel 
o f best wishes 
to the Seniors.

They’re The Pick Of The Crop!

First Baptist Church
O’Brien

GRADUATING SENIOR Joe Godsey, center was 
the recipient of the DeKalb Agricultural Award 
presented each year to the outstanding ag 
student. Jim Dillon, left, and Leon Burkham are 
advisors. (School Photo)

banquet.
Two teams that par­

ticipated in the Miller Brazos 
Soil and Water Conservation 
District program were also 
recognized. The second place 
winning grass judging team 
of Mike Oliver (second high 
individual), David Lankford, 
Tyke Meinzer, and Teddy 
Espinosa, was recognized as 
was the third place team of 
Joe Rocha (fifth high in­
dividual), Robert Sutton, 
Craig Watson, and Ricky 
Gutierrez.

Mike Oliver, Teddy 
Espinosa, and Robert Sutton 
also received recognition as 
participants on the poultry 
judging team.

Leon Burkham and Jim 
Dillon are local FFA ad­
visors.

JUNIOR FIGUEROA
...Outstanding  

Horticulture Student

Shelton Rhodes, and Kyle 
White.

Gaylynn Burkham was the 
winner of the Area IV sheep 
proficiency award while 
Mary Ann Albus represented 
the Oilbelt District at the 
area convention.

Students in the agriculture 
I class were recognized in­
cluding Star Greenhand Tyke 
Meinzer, leadership award 
winner David Lankford, 
swine proficiency award 
winner Mike Oliver, Alex 
Espinosa, Teddy Espinosa, 
Dell Guinn, Ricky Gutierrez, 
Eddie Ramos, Joe Rocha, 
James Earl Stafford, Craig 
Watson, and Robert Sutton.

Horticulture class mem­
bers also recognized were 
Greenhouse Management 
award winner Junior 
Figueroa, Sales and Service 
award winner Brett Tackitt, 
Amber Ashcraft, Stacy 
Eaton, Greg Elston, Robert 
Espinosa, Rickey Gonzales, 
Tammie Helton, Dwayne 
Johnson, Tony Quintana, 
Shelton Rhodes, Sid Richar­
dson, Tim Robinson, Greg 
Whitten, and Jack Vaden.

The Junior Chapter Con­
ducting team of David Lank­
ford, Teddy Espinosa, Dell 
Guinn, Ricky Gutierrez, Joe 
Rocha, and Craig Watson was 
also introduced at the

IN REASON HOME

Visiting in the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. Leo Reason over the 
weekend were their children, 
Mr. and Mrs. Lynn Reason 
and Bill of Lubbock, and Ray 
Reason of Fort Worth; their 
g ra n d d a u g h te r , K arae 
Reason; their mothers, Mrs. 
Bessie King and Mrs. Myrtle 
Reason; and Mrs. Reason’s 
sister, Mrs. Frances King.

The group enjoyed visiting 
and celebrating Karae’s 15th 
birthday.

Simpson 
Electronics

TV & Stereo Repair
Now Associated With 
BOGGS & JOHNSON 

HASKELL

Bobby Simpson
(817)864-2346

l O O U R

GRADS!

W e wish you much success 
and many happy tomorrows

Knox County 
Farm Bureau

Don Welch-Curly A w ait 
Munday, Texas

CONGWVTlilAriONS
from

Tackitt Enterprises

O
658-3374

Distributor for

Drive'
.. FOR HORSES, “ the nearest thing 
to guaranteed nutrition.

KNOX CITY

OlongratulattonH to Q̂itr
e n i o r s

for

■>*»»•...«». -

DR. W.F. THOMPSON 
and Associates

feeling 
nine 
feet

Graduation is one o f the m ost 
m em orable of all days. We 
salute you.

Tri-State Chemical
JOHN CROWNOVER, MGR.
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News Notes 
from the

Brazos Valley Care Home
By ELLEN NEELY

,1 w- sH: 4
Sunday, May 11, Ozelle 

Stephens taught Bible study 
at 9:00.

Wynell Roberts played the 
piano and the Ronnie White 
family sang “ Sing and Be 
H appy” . T w enty-seven  
residents were present.

There was no church group 
present for our 3:00 service. 
On May 4, th O’Brien Baptist 
Church conducted services. 
Rev. Trice brought the ser­
vice on Psalms 1: 8-10. Thirty 
residen ts  p a r tic ip a te d . 
Communion was held at 4:00 
in Henry and Lena Dabney’s 
roon. Five residents were 
served.

Monday, May 12, marked 
the beginning of our activities 
for National Nursing Home 
Week. Our residents had a 
shocking awakening as it was 
staff VTacky Day’ ’ . Some of 
our staff, especially the 3:00- 
11:00 shift consisting of 
Bessie Duncan, Grace 
Helton, and Johnnie Brown 
were outrageously dressed.

Churches who hold services 
as well as individuals and 
groups who hold our monthly 
birthday parties were 
honored with certificates 
from the Texas Department 
of Health.

Monday night, ladies were 
honored in our home with a 
buffet dinner. For those 
ladies whose families could 
not attend or had no family, 
staff members adopted them. 
Thirty-six people were ser­
ved.

Tuesday at 10:00, ten ladies 
were emaculately dressed for 
our fashion show and the 
crowning of “ Miss Brazos 
Valley Care Home’ ’ . At 5:00, 
staff and residents enjoyed a 
hamburger supper followed 
by a hilarious employees’ 
volleyball game.

Residents really got quite a 
few laughs out of some of our 
collisions and several staff 
members were rubbing sore 
muscles with Deep Heat the 
next day.

Edith Hobart from the City- 
County Library in Munday 
was here to show residents a 
film entitled “ Journey 
Together’ ’ .

Wednesday at 2:30, the 
Rochester High School stage

band presented an outdoor 
concert. Residents throughly 
enjoyed their performance.

The KC Kutters presented a 
square dance and prepared 
four freezers of ice cream for 
residents. Bessie Duncan 
prepared two cakes and 45 
were in attendance.

Thursday, our picnic was 
moved inside due to our damp 
weather.

Bingo was held at 3:00. 
Winners were Eda Faye 
Pounds, Waynell Clark, Fan­
nie Hughes, and Odessa Lieb. 
Blackout winner was Waynell 
Clark.

Thursday night was Family 
Night and Open House was 
held. Music was provided by 
Paul Bullion from Truscott. 
Cookies and punch were ser­
ved.

Friday at 4:00, Zoanne 
Felts brought her piano 
class and residents enjoyed 
listening to their music very 
much.

The public’s participation 
in National Nursing Home 
Week is greatly appreciated. 
The staff also deserves a big 
Thank You because without 
them our week could not have 
been successful.

Allyne Culpepper, Bea 
Mayes, Loyd and Gladys 
Stephens, Aleene Waldrip, 
Marvin and Barbara Jones, 
Mildred Hodges, Lloyd 
Waldrip, Margaret Hill, and 
Jessie Teague visited Ben 
Snelson and W.F. Waldrip.

Alice White, Evelyn and 
Shelly Balls, Top White, 
Alma Swearingen, Otis Har- 
bert, Manuel Rios, Eldora 
Gray, and Myrtle Leach 
visited Ben and Esther Brad­
ford.

Bessie Clower, Darlene 
Howeth, Betty Aldridge, 
Mary and Tony Manuel, and 
Bessie Large visited Bo 
Strickland and Weeper 
Aldridge.

Margaret Urbanczyk, Toni 
Urbanczyk, Chester Jackson 
and James and Charlotte 
Jackson visited Chessie 
Jackson.

Leota and Otto Lawson, 
Louise Finley, Mabel Hollis 
and Dave and Bessie David­
son visited Effie Chandler 

t and Eda Faye Pounds.

A ll the way, grads -- and we really  
think you’re great. Your talents, 

energy and enthusiasm  can help the 
com m unity grow and prosper. Good luck!

White Auto Store
TOMMY KENT

W t i r i t i f ' k i t i r i t i r i e i t i r i f i r - k - k ' k - k  ★ ★ ★ ★ ★

Nita Edwards, Leon Ed­
wards, Otto and Leota 
Lawson, Arche and Virginia 
Lieb visited Odessa Lieb and 
Lillie Dennington.

Otto and Leota Lawson 
visited Clay and Libbie Hoge.

Mrs. H.E. Wall, Otto and 
Leota Lawson, Louise Finley, 
Jessie Teague, Ozelle 
Stephens, Lorena Burnison, 
Blanche Elliott, Clifford and 
Thelma Williamson and 
Jewell Little visited Vida 
Williamson and Ada Hill.

Frances King, Mary and 
Tonya Manuel, Kate 
Wheeler, Mr. and Mrs. Z.I. 
Smith, Willie Mae Banner, 
Bessie King, Chester Jones, 
Edna Eubank and Jessie 
Teague visited Kelton Smith.

Mrs. H.E. Wall, Louise 
Finley, Bea Mays and Wayne 
Watson visited Beatrice Wat­
son.

Willie Mae Banner, Lorata 
Johnston, Velma Graham, 
Bessie King, Ada and Grover 
Durham, Ray Thomas, 
Darrell and Donna Thomas, 
Claudale and Jean Barnard, 
Edna Eubank and Aleene 
Waldrip visited Zollie and 
Blanche Thomas.

Leona' Strickland, Willie 
Tibbets, Donnie Tibbets, 
Mary and Tonya Manuel, 
Maude Newberry, Edna 
Eubank, ' Ronnie White 
family, Mamie Emerson, 
Melvin Strickland, Blanche 
Elliott, Mr. and Mrs. Glenn 
Smith and girls, Mrs. Milton 
Rowan, Edrie Gothard, Willie 
Mae Banner, Bessie King, 
Mrs. Billie Horton and Jo 
Strickland visited Clifford 
Elliott.

Jessie Teague visited 
Carrie Dunham.

Lorena Burnison, Cleola 
Ware, Mary and Tonya 
Manuel, Bessie King, Mamie 
Emerson, Laura Benson, 
Willie Mae Banner, Ramona 
and Diane Helms, Karen and 
Cami West, Lucille Carter, 
and Wayne and Ruby Clark 
visited Hazel and Waynell 
Clark.

Dewey and Marie Darr, 
Sam 'and Pat Lusk, Pearl 
Gage, Jessie Teague, Bessie 
King, Dean Worley, Minnie 
Reeves, Alice White, Mrs. 
Tom Thomas, Lucille Carter, 
Blanche Elliott, Velma 
Graham and Mattie Bales 
visited Mae Flowers.

Joy and Julie Gentry, Mrs. 
Floyd Bailey, Rev. and Mrs. 
Stuart Miller, Sam Basden, 
Pearl Eaton, Wanda Phipps 
and Bud and Sequoyah 
Reynolds visited Wayne and 
Ruthe Harden.

John Gillispie, H.R. 
Beauchamp and Mrs. H.E. 
Wall visited Elmer Wall.

Bea Mays visited Fred 
Moody.

Mary Margaret Campbell 
visited Mary Bigham.

Leona Strickland, Willie 
Tibbets and Donnie, Ozelle 
Stephens, Gerline Pool, H.R. 
Beauchamp, Mabel Hollis, 
Jessie Teague, Aleene 
Waldrip and Monty Penman 
visited Eva Penman.

Bea Mays visited Mary Jo 
Fulton.

Mary and Tonya Manuel, 
Bea Mays and Narsio Gon­
zales visited Onefro Gon­
zales.

Cleola Ware, Mary and 
Tonya Manuel, Edna Eubank 
and Bea Mays visited Delphia 
Jones.

Olga Alvis, Edna Eubank, 
Mr. and Mrs. Mitchell and 
Regina O’Neal visited 
Charlie Collier.

Loreta Johnston visited 
Abb Johnston.

Edna Eubank, Bea Mays, 
Norma Lowry and Lewis Kay 
visited Hallie Barrington and 
Clara Lowry.

Edna Eubank, Kanova 
Espinosa, Evelyn Balls, Pete 
Espinosa, Jennifer Reynolds,

KC Colored 
News-Events

(Last week’s news)
Mrs. Dorothy Alexander 

sponsors a Mother Day 
program. For her guest were 
Mt. Olive Stamford Rev. &i 
Sister Clay children and 
grandchildren. Church of (xod 
in Christ Seymour Elder 
Session who was the speaker 
for the evening.

(This Week’s News)
St. Paul had a good atten­

dance for Sunday school. Supt 
in charge the session was 
taught by the teacher and 
reviewed by the pastor, for 
morning service the pastor 
preach from 1 corin 13. 1-5 
“ 'The Silver Tongue.’ ’ in the 
afternoon St. Paul were in 
Munday at the Methodist 
Church for their 3rd Sunday 
Musical every choir in their 
place no night service.

I am asking our friends to 
help us please by buying your 
tickest early this year, 
because we need your 
cooperation. It just four 
members and we can pull this 
off if you help us. Thank You 
the Gwd will club.

SERVICES OF THE
CHURCH OF GOD 

IN CHRIST

A two night meeting was 
held at the Munday Church 
last week, in behalf of the 
Sunday school work headed 
by Missionary Laura Blue. 
Each service was blessed.

Missionary Wilson taught 
greatly on Tuesday night 
from Col. 4: 2 and other scrip­
tures on prayer.

The Rule Church 
celebrated their seventeenth 
church anniversary one night 
of last week and Sunday 
evening.

Deacon Weatherton gave 
the history of the Rule church 
and Elder Cox preached Sun­
day evening from Psalms 127, 
Matthew 7: 24 and other 
scriptures, a wonderful 
message.

Sunday school had an ex­
cellent attendance with Supt. 
Smith in charge.

In the morning service. 
Sister Manuel brought a 
stirring message from 
Proverbs 3 and Chapter 22, a 
few verses from each 
passage.

Bill Lankford and Leland and 
Pat Moffett visited Fannie 
Hughes.

Bill Reynolds, Jennifer 
Reynolds and Evelyn Balls 
visited Dicie Singleton.

Jewell Haynie, Neva 
Epley, Vannah Carmack, 
Raymond Wilhite, Laura 
Benson, Earl Alvis, Bill 
Oden, Edna Eubank, Maude 
Newberry, Willie Mae Ban­
ner, Remain Stubbs, Mattie 
Balls, Mary Alice Thompson, 
Dean Worley, Mrs. H.E. 
Wall, Owen Aiken and Vic 
and Jean Thomas visited 
Ollie Berryhill and Zona Guf­
fey.

Louise Finley, Carney 
Glover, Jerry Smith, Mary 
Michael, Earl Alvis, Mildred 
Hodges, Allyne Culpepper, 
Joyce Crownover, Bea Mays, 
Bobbie, Doug and Tyke Mein- 
zer, Leta Stubblefield and 
Sandra Bradley and boys 
visited Agnes Floyd.

Carney Glover, Elaine 
Glover, Mary Michael, Earl 
and Temple Alvis, and Bea 
Mays visited Nena Alvis.

Jessie Teague, Leona 
Strickland, Willie and Donnie 
Tibbets and Raymond Wilhite 
visited Henry and Lena Dab­
ney.

TO ALL THE 
♦ HIGHFLYING

:»
♦
>
♦
♦
♦
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Go forth. Grads, to find  
your place in the sun, 
to earn your share of 
life ’s many rewards.

CHRISTENSEN
AVIATION

Success and 
Happiness 
be with you

Look 
Who’s 
Here

Mr. and Mrs. Frederick 
Washington of Munday are 
the proud parents of a set of 
twins born Saturday, May 17, 
in the Knox County Hospital.

A boy, Latony Jamaal, 
arrived at 1:40 a.m. and he 
weighed in at six pounds, 
eleven ounces. His sister, 
Latasha Juanita, made her 
arrival at 1:44 a.m. weighing 
five pounds, eleven ounces.

Helping welcome the twins 
home will be big brothers, 
(Jene, who is five years old, 
and Micheal, who is three.

Maternal grandparents are 
Ira and Bonnie Shields of 
Munday and Mr. and Mrs. 
Willis Washington of Gid- 
dings are paternal gran­
dparents.

M atern a l g r e a t ­
grandmother is Lola Jones of 
Munday.

Dr. W.F. Thompson, who 
attended Mrs. Washington, 
reported that this is the first 
set of twins born in the local 
hospital in a number of years.

West Texas Opry 
Tickets On Sale

Tickets go on sale Friday, 
May 23 for the 12th West 
Texas Opry slated June 21 in 
Lubbock M em orial 
Auditorium.

Tickets are available at all 
four Flip Side Record Stores 
in Lubbock.

The Angle Sisters will join 
the Maines Brothers, Jim 
Fullingim, Latrell Houk, 
Zella Ellison, Cecil Caldwell, 
and other entertainers for the 
show.

STREAMS IN 
DESERT PLACES
By OZELLE STEPHENS

“ Wisdom is the principal 
thing; therefore get wisdom: 
and with all thy getting get 
understanding.”  (Proverbs 
4:7).

Solomon, the son of David 
gives us Proverbs. They are 
the words of wisdom, we get 
great teachings from them. 
Wisdom crieth without; rhe 
uttereth her voice in the 
streets: she calls to the 
crowds in the streets and to 
the judges in the courts, and 
to everyone in the land: “ You 
simpletons” , she cries, “ How 
long will you go on being 
fools? How long will you scoff 
at wisdom and fight the fac­
ts? Come to me and I will 
pour out the Spirit of wisdom 
on you, and make you wise. I 
have called you often, but you 
have spurned my counsel and 
reproof. Some day you will be 
in trouble. Storms of terror 
will surround you, you will be 
engulfed by angish and 
distress, then I will not an­
swer you for it will be too late 
though you search for me 
ever so anxiously.”

“ For you closed your eyes 
to the facts and did not choose 
to reverence and trust the 
Lord; That is why you must 
eat the bitter fruits of having 
your own way, and experien­
ce the full terror of the path­
way you have chosen. For 
you turned away from me--to 
death: your own complacen­
cy will kill you. But all who 
listen to me shall live in peace 
and safety, unafraid. 
(Proverbs 1:23-33).

m il DW

Top awards go to a ll our grads for a iob  
well done! Good wishes and happy 
hopes come their way for the best of 
everything and a successful future.

Penman 
Propane, Inc.

O’Brien • Rochester

Concrete Work
—  Any Type—

Patios - Sidewalks 
Driveways - Slabs 
Curbing • Porches

FOR FREE ESTIMATE, CALL

GREG KUEHLER
658-3057 After 5:00 P.M.

Backhoe Servicet- Dirt Hauling 
Fill Sand - Gravel 

Brick Sand

OUR GRADUATES
Our best wishes go with you in 

your efforts for continued success.

THOMASSHOESHOP
Mary and Walter Thomas

to our

Graduates!
We congratulate you

Knox City Florist
Spurgeon, Helen, and Ellen

ON  DIPLOM A
DAY.

R IV E R S ID E
Rivers ide serves agr i cu l tur e A g r  cu-ti.-r-' e . e ' yc nr -

KNOX CITY
Phone 817 658-3841 Hiram Whitaker, Mgr.

Lynn Electric Motor Co.
 ̂Sandi & Chris Connie & Gary Knox City, Texas

Best Wishes 
In The Future

Church of Christ
KNOX CITY, TEXAS



O’Brien Happenings
By CHARLENE BROTHERS

The winners of the door 
prizes at the gin meeting 
were as follows: Wynell Wad- 
zeck, Sammy B. White, April 
Tankersley, Charlotte Albus, 
Betty Albus, Coy Hewitt, 
Clyde Covey, Jimmy Tanker­
sley, Demp Emerson, Mrs. 
Joe Lynn Phillips, Gayle 
White, Eugene Jones, Cindy 
Brothers, and J.O. Brothers. 
I heard that this drawing 
went kinda of funny. It seems 
that no matter who Charles 
lets draw, they would draw 
the name of the person sitting 
right next to them. I think 
some thought it could have 
been set-up, but there is no 
way when they were shaking 
the box very good before 
anyone would draw. Things

just happen this way some of 
the time.

How did you like the rain? 
It was great. At least we 
know now it can still rain. It 
was beginning to look dreary 
for the farmer before this 
rain came. I think everyone 
will feel better now. It should 
take some of the germs out of 
the air. I hope the stomach 
germ that so many were 
having will leave the country. 
The ones of us who were 
irrigating can now turn off 
the motors for a while 
anyway. It was getting to be 
pretty expensive to run the 
motors as much as we were 
having to.
HERE AND THERE

Mr. and Mrs. David Hunt

Wild West Show To 
Benefit Aimee Pratt

An old time Wild West Show 
will be re-inacted at 
Justiceburg Saturday and 
Sunday, May 24-25, and all 
p r o c e ^  from the show will 
go to benefit Amie Pratt, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Jim 
Pratt of Benjamin, who for­
merly lived at Justiceburg.

Miller Brothers, ranchers 
of Borden, Scurry and Garza 
counties and Bobby Estes, 
rodeo producer and showman 
of Callahan County have ob­
tained some of the nation’s 
top talent for their Memorial 
Day weekend.

Miller Bros, and Lone Star 
Wild West and American 
Heritage Show will be held 
both days from 2:00 to 4:00 
p.m.

Among the top talent on 
hand will be Jesse Knight, 
world champion Indian bronc 
rider and recent winner of the 
Houston Stock Show Rodeo 
who is currently in seventh 
place for the world cham­
pionship; Howard Hunter, 
Kyle, South Dakota, curren­
tly in fourth place; Tom 
Miller, Faith, S. Dak.; Jim 
Himes, Pueblo, Colo.; Gold 
record holder and country 
and western singer Johnny 
Seay of Cleburne Texas; J.W. 
Stoker of Weatherford, 
Texas, champion trick rider 
and trick roper; Louie Thur­
man of Burleson, Texas, high 
school horse act, Brahma bull 
and mule act performer; 
Dixon Palmer, Anardarko, 
Okla., twice world champion 
Indian war dancer and Kiowa 
group.

The Wild West show will in­
clude a Buffalo stampede 
with 40 buffalo, a longhorn 
cattle drive, a Mexican 
mariachi band, bucking hor­
ses, bucking longhorn bulls 
and steers, stage coach 
holdups, Indian dancers, 
trick roping and trick riding, 
clown act, country and 
western singing, and a buf­
falo barbecue.

The rodeo is being derived 
from early day wild west

ATTEND FUNERAL
Mr. and Mrs. O.C. Poe and 

Betty Poe attended the 
funeral of Mr. Poe’s aunt, 
Mrs. Nettie Leach, in 
Marrilton, Arkansas, on 
Wednesday of Last week. The 
Poes returned home Thur­
sday.

The Knox 
County News

(USPS 903-920)
.P .O .Box 7

Knox City, Texas 79529 
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shows and with this show, 
promoters hope to recall the 
glamour and exhibition 
quality of the old wild west. In 
the wild west show the only 
competition is between the 
man and the animal.

Justiceburg is located on 
U.S. Hwy. 84, 15 miles 
southeast of Post. Admission 
is $4.00 per person per day 
and children under 12 are 
free.

and Amy of Midland visited 
during the weekend with their 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. L.A. 
Covey, Greg, Ava and John 
and Mr. and Mrs. E.W. Hunt.

Mr. and Mrs. James Man­
ning and Cody and Mr. and 
Mrs. Cyle Carver Jr. and 
Amy of Knox City visited Six 
Flags during the weekend.

Christie Manning, daughter 
of Mr. and Mrs. James Man­
ning, spent the weekend in 
Hamlin with Mary Hollis.

Floyd Wingrove of Waco 
visited in the home of Vicki 
Hewitt and her parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Coy Hewitt and Toni 
during the weekend.

Mr. and Mrs. Dick Dickson 
of Electra visited in the home 
of her parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
A. A. Cox during the weekend.

Mr.and Mrs. Butch
Stephens, Scott, Stefani and 
Susanne were in Plainview 
and Hale Center visiting with 
the Elmo Stephens and the 
Carl Marshall families. They 
attended the funeral of Steve 
Marshall, son of the Carl 
Marshalls.

Craig Brothers and Don 
Brothers were in Abilene last 
Friday conducting business.

Mr. and Mrs. Eugene Jones 
of Wichita Falls visited 
recently in the home of his 
mother, Clyde Jones.

Mr. and Mrs. Claudale 
Barnard were in Lubbock last 
Thursday for Claudale to see 
the doctor.

Basic Cake Class 
Enrollment Open

Enrollment for the basic 
cake decorating class is still 
open to interested adults. The 
class is sponsored by the 
Knox City Homemakig 
Department and will be 
taught by Evelyn Herring of 
Munday.

An error of dates was 
reported last week, classes 
will meet Tuesday, May 27, 
Thurs(Tay, May 29, and 
Tuesday, June 3, from 7:00 
p.m. to 9:30 p.m. in the high 
school homemaking depar­
tment.

For more information con­
cerning the enrollment fee 
and instructions for the first 
session, contact Vera Newton 
or Veeta Reid. During school 
hours, call 658-3521 or Mrs. 
Reid after 4:00 p.m. at 658- 
3895.

Leah Boone Wins 
At Abilene Show

Leah Boone showed her 
paint mare. An Apache 
Beauty, at Dyess Air Force 
Base open spring horse show 
in Abilene last Saturday. She 
won second in showmanship, 
third ill trail and fourth in 
western horsemanship.

Leah is the daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Joe Boone.
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Memorial Day 
S ^ A ^ L ^ E

We’ll Be Open Ail Day, 
MONDAY, MAY 26
Come and see our 

‘Bang-Up’ Specials!
Ask about our new weight control vitamins!

The Lady Bug Shoppe
Mini Mall-658-3957
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V a l u e ,  Q u a l i f i e d  S e r v i c e
And Frigidaire Dependability... 

W hy settle for less?

S  Frigidaire

Laundry Pair

Washer offers dependable 
cleaning power — even lets you 
conserve hot water and detergent.

•  No need to waste hot water. This 
Frigidaire Washer features a Water 
Level selector that lets you match 
the amount of water to the size of 
your washload.

•  Depend on Frigidaire to keep lint 
from settling back on your clothes 
with the Lint Filter which snaps in 
and out for easy cleaning.

•  New hori mtal cleaning action 
passes cic thes under the 
recirculating filter 8 to 14 times 
each cycle. The new system is 
equally effective for small, average 
or large loads.

Dryer puts big drying 
capacity within easy reach

For easy loading and unloading, the 
big oversize door opening — one of 
the largest in the industry — is 
positioned a comfortable 18 inches 
off the floor.

For efficient drying, without hot 
spots that can damage fabrics, 
Frigidaire gently pulls air through 
your clothes.

I For big-family wash loads this 
Frigidaire dryer provides gentle 
fabric care for up to 18 pounds of 
laundry.

See a Demonstration 
TODAY!

WEST TEXAS UTILmES COMPANY

A Member of The Central and South West Sysiei

Sudden Illness Fatal 
To Steve Marshall, 23
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IN SLATON
Mr. and Mrs. Raymond 

Wilhite visited his uncle, 
Johnny Trussell, and 
cousin. Tommy Trussell, in 
Slaton Sunday and Monday of 
last week.

En route home, the Wilhites 
visited in Girard with former 
Knox City residents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Travis Boyd.

Funeral services were con­
ducted Thursday, May 15, at 
2:00 p.m. at the First Baptist 
Church in Hale Center for 
Steve Marshall, 23, grandson 
of Mr. and Mrs. G.C. Mar­
shall of O’Brien and Mr. and 
Mrs. Elmo Stephens, for­
merly of O’Brien who now 
live in Plainview.

Officiating was Dr. T.J. 
Ozbun of Gonzales, 
Louisiana, formerly of Hale 
Center, who was assisted by 
Don Jones, minister of Main 
Street Church of Christ in 
Olton.

Burial was in the Hale Cen­
ter Cemetery.

Steve apparently died in his 
sleep about 4:30 o ’clock 
Tuesday morning at the home 
of his parents, Mr. and Mrs.

EMS
Report

Tuesday, May 13, 6:28 p.m. 
-  John Box from Brazos 
Valley Care Home to Knox 
County Hospital. EMT’s were 
John and Ilene Turner.

Wednesday, May 14, 2:40 
p.m. “  Glen Smith from 
Brazos Valley Care Home to 
Knox County Hospital. 
EMT’s were John and Ilene 
Turner.

Friday, May 16, 9:00 p.m. -- 
Elizabeth Moody from 
Brazos Valley Care Home to 
Knox County Hospital. 
EMT’s were John and Ilene 
Turner.

Carl Marshall. His father 
found the body about 7:00 
a.m. Tuesday. Steve became 
ill Monday evening and 
received hospital treatment 
but was able to return home 
with his parents for the night. 
Reports indicated the trouble 
re-occurred a few hours later 
while he was sleeping, 
leading to his death.

A resident of Hale Center 
all of his life, Steve graduated 
from high school there. He 
luas an outstanding 4-H boy, 
and also participated in spor­
ts, band, and the Hale Center 
FFA Chapter.

Following graduation from 
high school, he attended 
Texas Tech University.

He was past master coun­
selor of the Plainview Chap­
ter of the Order of DeMolay 
and was a member of the 
Hale Center First Baptist 
Church and the local Wood­
men of the World 
Organization.

Survivors in addition to his 
parents and grandparents, 
include a sister. Melody 
Campbell of Hale Center; and 
a great-grandfather, B.B. 
Brown of Azle.

Attending services from 
this area were Mr. and Mrs. 
G.C. Marshall and Mr. and 
Mrs. Butch Stephens and 
children, all of O’Brien, and 
Mr. and Mrs. O.D. Pool of 
Rochester. Several other 
couples started to Hale Cen­
ter, but turned back due to 
water over the highway in 
places, following Thursday 
morning’s big rain.

COUNTRY MUSIC’S living legend Willie Nelson 
made a surprise visit to the Grapevine Opry 
Saturday night where Opry owner Chisai Childs, 
pictured with Neison, deiighted the fans with 
news of his arrival. Nelson is currentiy recor­
ding in Daiias with Phii York, recording 
engineer at the Opry.

Dance At Rhineland
POST OAK BAND

^  Featuring ^
Susan & Kenny Mayo, Vocals 

Raymond Edwards, Fiddle

Sat. Night, May 24 ^  

Rhineland Gym
9 t o 1 Adm. $5

T & O U R

GRADS'

We wish you much success 
and many happy tomorrows.

CableVision
G.E. Williams Knox City, Texas

AILSUPS
CONVENIENCE STORES

WE RESERVE THE RIGHT TO LIMIT 
PRICES EFFECTIVE MAY 22 -24 .198 0  

SPECIALS GOOD WHILE SUPPLY LASTS - LIMITED SUPPLY

OPEN
MEMORIAL DAY

ALL FLAVORS REG. 99

FRITO-LAY
DORITOS

V  REFRESHING

ALLSUP’S 
ICE BAG

SHURFRESHm FRANKS

DELICIOUS

SHURFRESH 
DOLOGNA '

BORDEN’S

FRUIT 
DRINK au

CLOVER CLUB REG. CRINKLE CUT

Qualified Factory-Trained Servicemen Offer You The Finest In Appliance Service

PDTATD
CHIPS REG. SI .49 

PNG.

89C

19

V.

COOKED FOOD SPECIAL OF THE WEEK

99<
BAR-B-QUE

Sandwich REG. $1.25
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F̂R|[NDIY
AFFILIATED BI6 WEEKEND
KNOX C ITY m

D O U B L E
S & H GREEN STAMPS

W E D N E S D A Y S
With The Purchase
01 $2.50 Of More

SPECIALS GOOD 
THOR., FRI., SAT., 

MAY 22-23 -24

S IZ  FLAGS
OVER TEXAS. . . TICKETS GOOD ANY DAY DURING 1980 SEASON

SAVE 2̂°° ON A REGULAR 9̂’  ̂TICKET

TIDE
DETERGENT

84-OZ. K ING 
SIZE BOX

We Will 
Be Closed 

All Day 
Monday, 
May 26 

Memorial 
Day

Canister Snacks..................... .......... SHURFINE, CAN 6 9 0
Vienna Sausage....... ......... SWIFT, 5-oz. CAN 2 / 7 9 0
Pickles..................  .......Rainbow Hamburger Dill Sliced, 32-oz. Jar 6 9 0
Hot Dog Sauce............ .......WOLF, 10.5-oz. CAN 3 / 1 . 0 0
Die Dutane Lighters......................  ........... EACH 4 9 < s

*

FIRM GREEN

CABBAGE
IB. ^  ^ 0

U.S. NO. 1 RUSSET

POTATOES

UPTON
INSTANT

TEA
3 D Z .
JAR

ARROW

CRARCOAL
BRIQDETS

10-LB. BAG

■ B U I

FISHJER RDY FRDZEN

FISH
STICKS

2-LB. BAG

DOUBLE Q

PINK
SALMON

15.5-O Z. CAN

MEXICO

LIMES
1.00

YELLOW

SQUASH
1.00

2.1911.79
LIGHT CRUST RANCH STYLE

FLOUR BEANS [ UBll j

5-LB.
BAG 0

15-OZ.
CANS

30-OZ. SIZE POLY

TUMBLERS....................... ...............EACH
DENDREX DANDRUFF

SHAMPOO
COLD CREAM

. . . . .4 -o z . ,  Reg. 2 .85  

POND’S .............. . . .3 .5 -o z .,  Reg. 2 .15

5 9 «
2 .0 9
1 .4 9

CASCADE
DISHWASHIN6 DETERGENT

CNICKEN OF TNE SEA

05-0Z.
DOX 2.59

FRESH

OKRA
,001 REYNOLDS C / \ H I  

ALUMINUM r  W I  L
12x25 
ROU

SMOKED

PICNICS
IB  0 5 o

FRESH

LIVER

FLAT
CAN

SHURFINE

PIZZAS
ASST.

EACH

NORTNERN TOILET

TISSUE
4-ROLL PKG.99«

W E S S O N
Pure Vegetable Oil

Bottle ^

HILLSHIRE FARM

SMOKED
SAUSA6E

LB.

CUTLETS
‘̂ 1 .5 9

LB. 1.59
1 .̂. -

■ j
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MRS. DAVID GRAHAM ANDERSON
...the form er Laura Kay Lynn

V S atu rday  a f te rn o o n  
marriage vows uniting Laura 
Xay Lynn and David Graham 

, -Anderson were read in the 
I '^nctuary of the First Baptist 
'Church. The Rev. John 

Gillispie, church pastor, per­
formed the two o ’clock 
peremony.

Draped cascades of 
spangerii ferns and silk 

> flowers in the bride’s chosen 
i ;Colors formed the altar set- 
i ting along with brass candle 

trees flanked by enchantment 
' lilies and roses in the bride’s 
Colors.

Church pews were marked 
With silk flowers and 
spangerii fern.

 ̂* The bride is the daughter of 
■’ Mr. and Mrs. Jimmy R. Lynn 
of Knox City and Mr. and 
Mrs. Percy G. Anderson of 
Casper, Wyoming, are the 
"t>arents of the bridegroom.

Grandparents of the bride 
‘̂ are George Henderson of 

'5:Knox City and Mr. and Mrs. 
t jf.B. Lynn of Wichita Falls.

Providing traditional wed- 
; i^ g  music at the organ was 
Mrs. Melvin A. Lowrey, who

also accompanied soloist Pat­
ti Counts of Lubbock. Vocal 
s e l e c t i o n s  w ere
“ Evergreen” , “ The Wedding 
Song” , and “ Longer” .

Given in marriage by her 
father, the bride wore a gown 
of white Chantilly lace trim­
med in pearls. The gown was 
Empire style with an organza 
skirt which swept into a 
chapel train. Her veil of ivory 
illusion was edged in lace and 
held by a Chantilly lace cap. 
Her bridal bouquet was a 
cascade of pearls with sonia 
roses, stephanotis, gyp- 
sophilia, and lilies of the 
valley.

Mrs. Mark Daniel of 
Abilene attended the bride as 
matron of honor. She was at­
tired in an apricot colored 
gown with spaghetti straps, 
wrap skirt, and jacket. Her 
bouquet was a silk rose 
surrounded by mixed 
flowers.

Bridesmaids were Toni 
Howse of Oklahoma City, 
Mrs. John Martinez of 
Abilene, and Jan Mason of 
Denton, who were dressed

identically to the honor at­
tendant except in lilac, 
yellow, and blue respectively.

Best man was Steve Evans 
of Hamlin and groomsmen 
were Mark McClure of 
Albuquerque, Gary Harris of 
Dallas, and Terry Overton of 
San Marcos.

The bridegroom’s brother 
Alan Anderson of Casper, 
Wyoming, and the bride’s 
brothers, Jimmy, Scott, and 
Steven Lynn, seated guests. 
Scott and Steven were also 
candelighters.

Mrs. Lynn chose for her 
daughter’s wedding a light 
blue Qiana gown with a sheer 
cape and she wore a white 
rose corsage.

The bridegroom’s mother 
wore a mint green gown and 
also a white rose corsage.

The male attendants wore 
gray tuxedos with coor­
dinating shirts matching the 
feminine attendants’ gowns. 
Their boutonnieres were 
white roses tipped in the 
bride’s chosen colors.

Mrs. Dale Bloxham 
presided at the guest registry

QQR VERY BEST 
W ISH ES TQ 
ALL THE

Knox County News
Buddy, Billye, Stacy  

Bill, Deborah, Bea

Local Garden Club 
Enjoys Noon Luncheon

ENGAGEMENT ANNOUNCED -- Mr. and Mrs. 
Charles Durham Sr. of Knox City announce the 
engagement of their daughter, Tammie Jean, to 
Terry David Jobe, son of Mr. and Mrs. Alford 
Jobe of Adrian. The couple Is planning an 
August 8 wedding at the Church of Christ In 
Knox City. Miss Durham Is currently a junior 
business education major attending West 
Texas State University where she Is a member 
of PI Omega PI. The prospective bridegroom Is 
presently employed by the Cactus Farm 
Operation In Benjamin. The couple will reside 
In Canyon.

Eighteen Knox City Garden 
Club members and five 
guests enjoyed luncheon at 
the Community Center on 
Tuesday, May 13. Guests 
were Louise Finley, Emma 
Watkins, Mary Beth Smith, 
Winifred White, and Mrs. 
Baird.

Hostesses for the luncheon 
were Mrs. J.C. McGee, Mrs. 
H.E. Wall and Mrs. W.B. 
Hudson.

Members brought food, 
spring flower arrangments, 
and horticulture plants which 
were used for decorating the 
tables and the Community 
Center.

Following the luncheon, 
members heard Charlotte 
Patterson, accompanied by 
Elizabeth Wilson at the piano, 
sing “ Carry Me Back To Old 
Virginny” .

Club members answered 
roll call with suggestions for 
programs for next year.

A business meeting was 
conducted by club president 
Mrs. Ottis Cash.

Summer committees for 
selecting the “ Yard of the 
Month”  appointed were Mrs. 
Ottis Cash and Mrs. Joe 
Averitt for May, Mrs. Idoma 
Chowning and Mrs. Bonnie 
Coats for June, Mrs. Melvin 
Cowan and Mrs. Arthur 
Crownover for July, and Mrs. 
L.E. Groves and Mrs, Lula 
Hammons for August.

The local Garden Club 
voted to help the Munday

Garden Club sponsor the zone 
meeting at the Munday 
Community Center on 
November 10. In addition to 
assisting the Munday club, 
the Knox City club members 
will have a “ White Elephant 
Sale” .

Gladys Reed, flower show 
chairman, made interesting 
comments on the many 
flower arrangements and 
gave directions for making 
special types of flower 
arrangements.

Jewell Lea took club mem­
bers and guests on a trip 
down “ Memory Lane”  with a 
display of scrapbooks and 
other club materials. All of 
these materials have been 
placed in the Garden Club 
file.

Mrs. Joe Averitt and Mrs. 
Ottis Cash selected the Oliver 
Eells yard and garden on 
South Seventh Street as 
“ Yard of the Month” for May 
for its beauty, arrangement, 
and pleasing display.

FROM ABILENE 
Karman Robinson of 

Abilene visited here several 
days with her grandmother, 
Mrs. Ruby Robinson.

%

BEST WISHES TO 
ALL THE GRADUATES!

Foursquare Church
Stuart Miller, Pastor

which held a bud vase of 
roses and gypsophilia.

The bride’s parents were 
hosts for. the reception which 
followed in the fellowship hall 
of the church. A white cloth 
covered the refreshment 
table which held an 
arrangement of mixed spring 
flowers. The bride’s cake was 
ivory accented with apricot 
flowers and iridescent 
grapes. Reception assistants 
were Amy Anderson, sister of 
the bridegroom, and Mrs. 
Bloxham.

Rehearsal dinner was 
hosted by the bridegroom’s 
parents in the church 
fellowship hall on Friday 
night.

A graduate of Knox City 
High School, the bride atten­
ded Hardin-Simmons Univer­
sity and McMurry College. 
She in employed by the 
Department of Highways and 
Public Transportation in 
Abilene.

The bridegroom graduated

from Klein High School in 
Spring and received a 
bachelor of science degree in 
chemistry from McMurry 
College. He is employed by 
KRBC-TV in Abilene.

Following a wedding trip to 
South Padre Island, the 
couple will reside in Abilene.

Clarke-Averett 
Marriage Announced

Mr. and Mrs. Timothy Alan 
Averett are at home at North 
511 Avenue F in Olney after 
their marriage in Graham on 
Wednesday, May 14, at 3:30 
p .m .^

Mrs. Averett is the former 
Jeanette Clarke, daughter of 
Estelle Hawkins and J.G. 
Hawkins, both of Knox City.

Mr. Averett is the son of 
Billy Averett and Mrs. Terry 
Williams, both of Olney. He is 
in the construction business 
with his father in Olney.

Out-Of-Town Guests 
Register Saturday

Among the out-of-town 
relatives and friends 
registering at the Saturday 
afternoon marriage of Laura 
Kay Lynn and David Graham 
Anderson in First Baptist 
Church were Mr. and Mrs. 
I.B. Lynn of Wichita Falls, 
grandparents of the bride; 
Mr. and Mrs. Roy Sanderson 
of Blackwell, Mr. and Mrs. 
Edward Badon of Groves, 
Mrs. Leroy Nelson of Little 
Rock, Arkansas, and Mrs. 
H.L. Kjeldgaard.

Also, Mr. and Mrs. Bobby 
Sanderson and James of 
Blackwell, Mrs. E. Harris of 
San Angelo, Mr. and Mrs. 
Jack Blanchard of Sweet­
water, and Mr. and Mrs. 
Homer Olsen of Midland.

LARSON’S
Prescription Pharmacy

LARRY STAGGS, PHARMACIST

n i

OUR

L o w r e y ’s j

RUSHiNG REPAIR
Marie and Jimmy Chock and James

Knox City, Texas

Hard ea filed 
Well ea filed

Wallace Moorhouse 
Insurance

Wallace, Katharyn and Jan 
Munday, Texas

\

SUCCESS to our
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OB’S SUPER SAVE
Know City, T«xas 79S29

SPINACH 2 'Ŝ .' 6 9

FABRIC SOFTENER 1 9 8 ^  
TOiAATO CATSUP 7 9

6 9

Del Moilte ^  . 0 ^  m
16-Oz.

HUNT'S S L IC E D  j o i J lA  I ^ E S

D E L I

j n m u s

SEVEN SEAS » - O i .

Salad D ressing
Pinto Beans 
Cole Slaw

9 *
6 9 '

Barbecued Beef ¥*■ $ 2 .2 9
k k r iCh Smoked '

SAUSACC^^^^^

RUSSET

POTATOES

HORMEL BLACK LABEL

BACON
29PktS 1

HOT
LINKS

C M c r s  c u m a n

S A U S A G E
*1.39

3  i1 “ >
......S T A L K  ■

Lettuce EACH 4 9 '
CALIFORNIA SUNKIST ^  J I A a

LEMONS '«4 9 ^

4 9 *
HELL PEPPERS 5  9 9 '  

J :'.;. cok 5 M «

GROUND BEEF
Ranch Brand BONELESS — FULLY

MM H A L V E S
Spiced Market Sliced

Luncheon Meat

15' OFF LABEL

CAT FOOD

JOHNSON'S BABY

SHAMPOO 7-oz
ANTISEPTIC 

__  6 0z___Listerine

SUI!ER DISCOUNT SPECIALS
WITH FILLED B U C C8 n C C r  DISCOUNT BOOKLETS

PH anZN W BBH

PIE SHELLS
2 - C t .
Pkgs.

Foremost

l e e  C r o n i

WHITE SWAN

WHIPPED TOPPING
59̂

■/a fiAL. OB. CTH. >149

MORTON'S MINI
9tZ;

79^


