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Pats Take Victory In Two Overtimes
Number 4

By Nanalee Nichols
It has to have been one of 

the most exciting games 
ever witnessed at Prairiland 
High School. In double 
overtime, the Prairiland 
Patriots took a two point 
victory from arch rivals, the 
North Lamar Panthers.

While many games have 
put fans on the edge of their 
seats, this one had most of 
them standing up for the last 
30 seconds of the fourth, 
quarter, and for the entire 
two overtimes.

The win put the Patriots is 
the lead for the second half of 
district. If they win against 
Clarksville on Friday night, 
they will have cinched their 
district. If they should lose 
then they would be tied with 
Pittsburg for the second half 
of district playoff. North 
Lamar has now lost the 
second half, but will be in the 
playoffs since they won the 
first half.

Carl Vaughan opened the 
scoring with two points 
within the first 30 seconds of 
the game. A foul put

Prairiland with a three point 
lead, but it didn't last for 
long. The Panthers went 
down the court to score, and 
the stage for the evening was 
set.

At no time did either team 
take more than a six point 
lead, and each time that lead 
lasted for mere seconds 
before retaliation from the 
opposition.

At the end of the first 
quarter, the score was 12-14. 
At the end of the second the 
score was tied, 27-27. 
Prairiland had the edge after 
putting on a burst of scoring 
right before the end of the 
third quarter, 43-39.

Action really got hot 
during the fourth quarter, 
Mith the score bouncing back 
and fourth, and the two 
teams utilizing a full court 
press.

With only seconds on the 
c lo c k , P r a i r i l a n d ’s 
Greyhound Williams a t­
tempted to break the tie and 
win the game, but the shot 
bounced off the rim and the

game went into overtime 
with the score tied at 54-54.

The first overtime bounced 
the score back and fourth, 
neither team ever taking 
over a four point lead or 
keeping it.

Again in the closing 
seconds. Greyhound a t­
tempted to break the tie. The

shot connected, but officials 
ruled that the buzzer had 
sounded and the shot was no 
good. The game was again 
tied, 58-58.

It took some time for 
Prairiland fans, who had 
poured onto the court 
thinking the game was over, 
to clear the court for the

second overtime. When they 
did, the second overtime 
commenced to be the same 
as the rest of the game.

One team would score, the 
other would score. The 
Patriots pulled ahead when 
Williams made two free 
throws, and then, once more 
in the closing seconds of the

Dump Day Set
A Dump Day has been 

scheduled for this coming 
Saturday in Deport. The city 
dump will be permanently 

I clos^, and residents are 
urged to take this op­
portunity to clean up their 
houses and yards before use 
of dumpsters goes into ef­
fect.

Anyone with pickups are 
urged to be at the Deport 
Fire Department on 
Saturday, February 28 to 
help with the trash pickup.

The volunteer firemen, 
community men’s club and 
volunteers are helping in the 
project.

Anyone with large objects 
such as old refrigerators, or

Methodist 
Set Goal At 101

Have you been seeing this 
in the paper and wondered 
what it meant? Has it 
created any interest on your 
part? The Deport United 
Methodist Church prays that 
it has, and you will be 1 of the 
101 on 3-1-81.

The church has a goal of 
having at least 101 in Sunday 
School on 3-1-81. All mem­
bers of the church are being 
urged to attend, and those 
that have been attending 
regularly are being asked to 
help reach this goal by 
contacting those that have 
not been attending. The only 
way any church can survive 
is like anything else, it must 
be supported. If you are 
Methodist and have not been 
attending Sunday School and 
Church, won’t you be a part 
in helping to have more than 
101 on 3-1-81?

The Deport Methodist 
Church urges you to attend a 
church of your choice each 
Sunday. If you are not at­
tending w affiliated with 
some church in this area, 
you will be most welcomed to 
worship at the Deport United 
Methodist Church.

piles of brush, or anything 
that they cannot put in bags 
on the front curb, are urged 
to call 652-3875 and make 
arrangements to have the 
items picked up.

Everyone is urged to 
participate in this wor­
thwhile project, which will 
result in a cleaner, neater 
community for everyone, at 
a cost to no one.

CHEERING THEM on. 
Hie Prairiland Varsity 
C h e e r le a d e rs  w ere 
vigorous in their cheering

at the basketball games 
at Prairiland lately. Here 
they do a routine in which

they pass pom-poms from 
c h e e r l e a d e r  to  
ch eerlead er. (S taff 
Photo)

Newspaper Fights 
‘‘Gag Order” Attempt

A motion to impose a “Gag 
Order’’ and deny the motion

m i d
TIE BALL—Ju n io r
Varsity player Larry 
Box, 23, and Jeff Ballard, 
12 and a Pittsburg Pirate 
tied the ball in last week’s

game. Number 11, Barry 
Ballard and Mark Reily 
were ready to help. (Staff 
Photo by Britt Barnard)

Fund Established For Duane White
further surgery on the leg. Friends wishing to con- 
and is expected to be there tribute to the fund may do so 
for some time yet. at the bank.

There has been a special 
account established at the 
First National Bank of 
Deport for Duane and Betty
White. The fund will go to 
help defray expenses during 
his lengthy stay in 
Presbyterian Hospital in 
Dallas.

White, a long time Deport 
resident, lost his leg just 
below the knee in an accident 
at work an January 8. He 
was moved to Dallas for

Deport Brownies Have Box Supper
The Deport Brownie 

Troops 14 and 73, under the 
leadership of Mrs. Diana 
Spears, held a box supper at 
the Deport School gym 
Monday night, February 23.

The supper was held to 
honor Founder’s Day, in 
behalf of Julitte Low, who

was the founder of 
Scouts in the U.S.A.

Girl
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Ten members and their 
families attended.

Special awards were
presented to the top three 
members who each sold over 
100 boxes of Girl Scout 
cookies during the cookie 
sales which ended January 
31. Award winners are Tonya 
(XuTins, 158 boxes, Angie 
Bratton with 124 boxes and 
Anita Fisher with 100 boxes.

The troops wish to extend 
their thanks to Betty 
Rodgers, Fay LaRue and 
Ann Fisher and Ndl Wdf for 
their help with the troops.

to disqualify Austin Guest 
and Hardy Moore as at­
torneys in a Red River 
County Police Brutality Case 
has resulted in the filing of a 
plea of intervention being 
filed by a Tyler law firm on 
behalf of Robert W. Wright, 
publisher of the Bogata 
News to keep the order from 
going into effect.

In response to a motion 
filed by Attorney Jim D. 
Lovett for plaintiffs Gene 
9iadid and Peggy Mitchell, 
attorneys HafSy Moore and 
Austin Guest, who represent 
the City of Clarksville and 
City Police Officer Donald 
Parks, are filing a motion in 
Federal District d!ourt to 
impose a “gag order” and to 
have their disqualification 
denied.

The motions which should 
be filed on Friday, February 
27, 1981, establish
precedence that no conflict 
of interest exists between the 
C t̂y of Clarksville and Of­
ficer Parks, and that the 
motion for disqualification 
be denied.

Further, and perhaps 
even more important was a 
motion regarding trial 
publicity. This motion asks 
“ That throughout the 
remaining course of the 
litigation, all attorneys 
would strictly observe the 
letter and spirit of 
Disciplinary Rule 7-107(G) 
and would make no public 
statement relating to 
evidence regarding the 
occurrence or transaction 
involved, the character, 
credibility or criminal 
record of a party, witness, or 
prospective witness, the 
performance or results of 
any examinations or test or 
the refusal or failure of a 
party to submit to such, or 
his opinion as to the merits of 
the claim or defenses of any 
party, except as required by 
law or administrative rule or 
any other matter likely to 
interfere with a fair trial of 
the action.”

Lovett is expected to 
respond to this motion soon 
after it is filed.

(deem ing the “gag or­
der” , Publisher Robert W. 
W ri^t, owner of the Bogata 
News, said, “Any action 
which restricts or limits the 
sources available to a news

Buy, Sell or Rent 
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media abridees the first 
amendment right to free 
speech and freedom of the 
press. This particular case is 
within the circulatim scope 
of our paper, and we feel 
obligated to take this action 
on behalf of all newspapers.” 

“The only other paper 
considering intervening, to 
our knowledge,’’ Wright 
stated, “is the Texarkana 
Gazette.”

game sank two points. The 
Panthers tore down the court 
with the clock running out, 
scored, but found that it was 
too late, there was no more 
time for another shot for 
anyone.

J u b ila n t  P r a i r i l a n d  
Patriots and fans found 
themselves with sore throats 
and happy hearts as they 
avenged their (xily loss of the 
season.

Leading the scoring, and 
seeming to have made the 
shots when the Patriots 
needed them most was Steve 
Crawford, who had a total of 
25 points. Brad Burks had 
also proven invaluable with 
16, Williams with 10, and 
Carl Vaughan with seven.

Randy Connot, who fouled 
out in the fourth quarter, had 
contributed six points, and 
some impressive ball han­
dling. Jeff Kennedy scored 
two points, but again his 
defense and ball handling 
were invaluable.

North Lam ar’s much 
touted David Birdsong 
scored only 12 points for the 
game, but Coco Williams had 
24 points. Birdsong finished 
the game with four fouls, and 
several North Lamar 
players were fouled out.

The Junior Varsity boys 
also fared well, defeating the 
Panthers earlier in the 
evening by 55-42. Leading 
scoici for that game was 
Mark Reily with 16 points, 
Jeff Ballard with 12 and 
Barry Ballard with nine.

BURKS scores two points 
against the North Lamar 
Panthers, in spite of star 
player David Birdsong’s

attempt to block the shot. 
(Staff Photo by Britt 
Barnard)

Nichols
Worth

lave a 
nice weekend..

By Nanalee Nichols 
On Sunday evening, the 

urge to go fishing just up and 
slapped me in the face! Now, 
for a whole lot of folks that 
isn’t too strange. Many 
people succumb to that urge 
almost weekly, some auoost 
daily. But that is probably 
the second or third time such 
a desire has overtaken me in 
the last ten or fifteen years.

We were just driving by 
our pool, and as I looked at 
that smooth, placid surface, 
I had the overwhelming need 
to sink a hook down and see 
what was under the surface. 

However, since there

wasn’t so much as a hook 
line or bait anywhere 
around, I had to forego the 
opportunity, and by the time 
I could have gone fishing, I 
didn’t want to go anymore.

The whole point is, though, 
that If I wanted to ish just 
how bad do the fishermen 
have it? TTiis spring they’ve 
promised us lots of storms, 
but my prediction is that 
we’re going to see lots and 
lots of poles, rods and reels 
and stringers of fresh fish. In 
between storms, no doubt!

Happy spring time, 
everyone.

SHADES OF the old west! 
Tied to the “hitching rail” 
in front of Gifford’s Food 
Store this week was a non­

gasoline means of 
transportation. Mayor 
Charles Foster, Kenny 
Gifford and Tara Gifford

observed the horse, while 
his owner, Britt Skid­
more, went inside for a 
snack. (Staff Photo)

S S And Income Tax Will Eat Raises
s ta te  Comptroller Bob 

Bullock recently said Social 
Security and income taxes 
will eat up most of the 5.1 
percent pay raise state 
employees expect in 
February paychecks.

“There will be a lot of 
disappointed employees at 
the end of the month,” 
Bullock said of the 
emergency pay raise ap­
proved by the Legislature.

“For most employees, the 
so-called raise amounts to a 
little more than a dollar a 
day.”

Bullock said “most of our
professional people-like my 
auditors-will be insulted.

Ihe situation is even worse 
for the 60,0(X) employees who 
are so lowly paid that they 
will get a fiat $50 raise in­
stead of the 5.1 percent in­
crease.

“A typical employee in the 
$50 category will take home 
$1.17 a day more,” Bullock 
said.

“Do you call $1.17 a pay 
raise?”

Bullock said it’s a sin that 
employees will get so little 
from a pay raise that will 
cost the state so much-$86 
million for just seven months 
from February through

WMU Meets At Church

August, the end of the state’s 
current budget year.

“We spent $86 million in 
seven months and the state 
worker gets $1.17 a day,” 
Bullock said. “ That’s a 
disgrace.”

The First Baptist WMU 
met at the ch u r^  on Mon­
day, Feb. 23 with 11 ladies 
attending.

The meeting was called to 
order by Mrs. Mary Geer, 
president. Mrs. Alma 
Hensley gave the opening 
prayer.

The lesson, “A Buddist 
Becomes a Baptist” and 
“My American Friend” was

Buy, Sell or Rent 
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given by Mrs. Mae Ran­
dolph: “ My Christian
Friend” by Mrs. Alma 
Hensley; “ My Sister in 
Christ” by Mrs. Grace 
Griffin; “My Fellow Bap­
tist” by Mrs. Joe Hawkins; 
“ Things to Know about 
Buddhism” by Mary Geer 
Willie Mae Spears, Gladys 
Wright, Linnie Bailey; and 
“My Baptist Friend” by 
Johnie Warren.

Mrs. Virgie Wright gave 
Call to Prayer from Acts 
16:25-34. Prayers were of­
fered for each missionary 
having a birthday.

The meeting was closed 
with the WMU watchword.

Dear Editor:
Although I left the Lamar 

County area about 35 years 
ago, I still enjoy hearing 
from “home.”

The Deport limes makes a 
good “ letter from home” 
that I look forward to each 
week.

Dennis Temple

Dear Newspaper Editor:
I am writing to ask you to 

help me and my school get 
the armadillo to be the of­
ficial state mammal of 
Texas. We think the ar­
madillo would be good 
because most people like 
them, they are interesting, 
they build good homes, and 
they eat fire ants. They have 
a tough hide-like a cowboy’s 
boot.

Resolution HCR 53 is in 
Austin now and we need help 
to get it passed. Would you 
please ask your readers to 
write to their Representative 
and Senator and ask them to 
vote for it.

If any school kids or 
teachers want more in­
formation, they can write to: 
Armadillo in ’81, Oak Creek 
E l e m e n t a r y ,  3975 
Giaderidge, Houston, Texas, 
77068, and we will send some 
things.

Yours Truly,
Sloan Childers, Age 10 
President-Armadillo Council

Editor's Quote Book
So live that you 

wouldn’t be ashamed to 
sell the family parrot to 
the town gossip.

Will Rogers
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" A lv in  Wood 
> Alvin Wood, age 72, died 
C Wednesday evening at the 
_ Red River General Hospital 
„ in Clarksville.
“ Funeral services were 

Friday, February 20 at 2 
p.m. in the Bogata United 

■Z Methodist Church. The Rev. 
: Carroll Caddell officiated 

C; and burial was in Bogata 
Cemetery. Arrangements 
were under the direction of 
Bogata Funeral Home, 

s  He was bom February 16, 
1909 in Walls, Texas, a son of 

•' Walter V. and Beth Harbison 
C Wood. He married Ruth 

Craddock on October 29,1933 
/ in Hugo, Okla. He was a 

lifelong resident of Red

River County and a retired 
cattleman.

His survivors include his 
wife, Mrs. Ruth Wood of 
Bogata and one niece, Mrs. 
David Hayes of Paris.

HomuHih I I1o|)h <hmI
F'uneral services for Mrs. 

Rosalind Hopwood were 
scheduled for Saturday, 
F'ebruary 21 at 2:30 p.m. in 
the Talco Church of Christ 
with Raynard Screws of­
ficiating. Burial was in Talco 
Cemetery under the 
direction of Bates-Cooper- 
Weems Funeral Home of 
Mount Pleasant.

She was bora December

Still honored 
and remembered 

today
His grandson never saw him. But his memory 

lives on through his memorial A sturdy.quiet sym­
bol of the fine old man who was and always w ill be 
a part of their family.

A distinctive granite memorial is a link between 
the past and the present that kindles family memo­
ries and fosters family pride. «

Is such a link lacking in your 
family? If so, see us now for a / ^ | ] [ |^  
memorial tht will give your love : or J
everlasting expression. ^  G E S /

Johnson Monument 

Company
1800 Church 784-4335 Paris, Texas

19, 1891 In Hunt County, 
Texas, a daughter of Joseph 
and Dora Watson. Mrs. 
Hopwood had been a resident 
of Talco most of her life.

Survivors include one 
brother, Elwood Jones of 
Talco, and a daughter-in- 
law. Mrs. Betty Ruth Hop- 
wood of Broken Arrow, Ok.; 
two grandchildren, Barry 
Lee Hopwood of Broken 
Arrow and Mrs. Wendolyn 
Norman of Tulsa, Ok.

Pallbearers were Harold 
Bonham, Rusty Jones, Ken 
Love, Fred Blackard, Farris 
Brown and F.A. Jones.
M rs. R iley  H erro n

Mrs. Riley Herron, for­
merly Nannie Scudder of 
Blossom, died Monday at St. 
Joseph’s Hospital.

Funeral services were 
held Wednesday at 2 p.m. in 
the Fry & Gibbs Funeral 
Home Chapel with the Rev. 
Raymond Smoot of Honey 
Grove officiating. Burial was 
in Knights of Honor 
Cemetery at Blossom.

She was born March 19, 
1906 in Windmn, a daughter 
of the late George H. 
Baldwin and Cora Mae Wall. 
She attended public schools 
in Windom and Honey 
Grove. She married Ralph 
Scudder of Blossom on Sept. 
22, 1928. He died on Aug. 30, 
1966. She later married Riley 
Herron on Nov. 16, 1972. 
They resided in Reno before 
returning to Blossom. She 
was formerly an employee of 
Perkins Brothers and Belk 
Department Stores before 
retiring some 30 years later. 
She was a member of the 
Baptist Church

Survivors include her 
husband, Riley Herron of 
Blossom; one brother, 
William J. Baldwin, Madill, 
Ok.; two nieces, Mrs. 
Thomas Dwight Perkins of 
Bridgewater, N.J., and Mrs. 
Bill Thomas in Virginia; 
three step-daughters, Mrs. 
Alma Net Morris, Midwest 
City, Ok., Mrs. Opal Miears, 
Dallas and Mrs. Polly Ann 
Verkler of Blossom; two 
step-sons, Horris Herron and 
Mac Herron, both of 
Blossom; and several step- 
grandchildren, including 
Mrs. Loretta Weddle of Paris 
and James Robert Young of 
Texas City.
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POLY 440
SlZI P4ICI F IT -

F7 8 -M ...............$32.03................ $2.19

G78-14...............$33.28................ $2.34

G78-15...............$33.31................ $2.42

H 78-15...............$35.62................ $2.m

178-15...............$39.11................ $2.91

K o  RANALS
SIZES P«ICI FIT-

FR78-14............... $49.05............. $2.34

GR78-14...............$51.65............. $2.49

GR78-15...............$51.95............. $2,m

HR78-15...............$53.70............. $2.12

LR78-15...............$58.39............. $3.00

★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★

RKOiSTlR HERE!
M A R A U D E

tin
16014.. 
160 I S . . 
MSO-14 
NSO IS .

fwa
552.41. 
$S4.41
557.41. 
$S9.41

Also Savings On Our Dual Tracka 
Sal# Prlcaa Qood For LImItad Tima.

COME IN AND SEE US TODAY!

HARDY OIL COMPANY

Dating Has Changed Since 
Horseback Days

f tk..

a
FIRE PLUG-Thls fire 
plug was made in 1900, 
and is still in use. It Is

CARD OF THANKS 
I wish to exfx-ess my love 

and appreciation to friends, 
neighbors and relatives for 
the many expressions of 
sympathy and concern 
during the last four years of 
Alvin’s illness. ’Hiank you for 
the food, beautiful flow«'s 
and every act ol kindness 
shown us. A special thanks to 
Dr. E.E. Brooks and his 
staff, and the nursing staff of 
Red River General Hospital. 
RutilWopd.____________

CARD OF THANKS 
I wish to express my 

thanks to everyone for the 
cards, gifts, flowers, 
telephone calls and every 
expression of love and 
kindness extended to me 
while I was a patient in the 
hospital and since 1 have 
been home. A special thanks 
to my Sunday School class 
for the delicious meals that 
were prepared and brought 
to my home each day while I 
was recuperating. Aim Cody.

CARD OF THANKS 
It is with grateful hearts 

that we wish to thank all of 
you who were so kind to us 
during the loss of our loved 
one. 'The staff at the nursing 
home. Dr. Brooks, flowers, 
food, cards, phone calls. 'The 
comforting words and 
prayers spoken by Bro. 
Caddell and Bro. Posey were 
all greatly appreciated. The 
Family of Ernestine Houck.

CARD OF'THANKS 
We wish to express our 

sincere appreciation for the 
food, flowers, cards and 
other gifts of love received 
by our family during the 
recent loss of our husband 
and father. Each expression 
of concern and support has 
been of great comfort to us. 
The Family of Gordon 
Simmons.

CARD OF THANKS 
We wish to thank the 

Bogata Fire Department, 
C.D. Glass, Top Elrod and 
the two ladies who called the 
fire department for us when 
our p i^up  caught fire and 
burned. Carl & Blanche 
Childres.

CARD OF THANKS 
Thank you for the cards, 

calls and other expressions 
of concern while I was in the 
hospital and since I’ve been 
home. Vera Grogan.

located Just off the square 
in Paris on Bonham 
Street. (Staff Photo hy 
J.W. Hood)

By John W. Hood 
I was at the store today 

and saw some young fellows 
starting out on their Sunday 
night dates. I got to recalling 
my old courting days.

I used to get all cleaned up, 
polished my saddle, get the 
horse all curried and the 
cockleburrs out of his tail, 
and set out. I always wanted 
to make a good impression 
on the young lady that had 
agreed to let me call on her.

Most of the time we would 
sit in the front parlor and 
talk, unless we had a country 
party to go to. I tied my 
horse to the fence, and we 
walked to the party. We 
played games, and square 
danced some, but the best

^Taith Alive” Weekend 
Set In Mt. Pleasant

DON’T FIGHT 
HEADWINDS

Strong headwinds can 
effect gasoline consump­
tion. By slowing down 
you can reduce the effects 
of the extra wind resis­
tance. A car that gets 
13.9 mpg with no wind 
will get 11.6 mpg with an 
18 mph headwind.

F o rt Worth banker 
Charles Landelius will lead a 
team  of E piscopalian  
laymen conducting a “Faith 
Alive” weekend at St. 
Mark’s Episcopal Church in 
Mt. Pleasant ^ iday , Satur­
day and Sunday, Feb. 27, 28, 
and March 1, 1981. The lay 
l(raderSj all from the Fort— 
Worth.area, are expected to 
arrive in Mt. Pleasant late 
Friday afternoon, and will 
be house guests of members 
of St. Mark's Church.

The weekend will begin 
with a “pot luck" supper at 
St. Mark’s Parish Hall at 
6:30 p.m. Friday, Feb. 27, 
1981, followed by an evening 
of singing, several short 
talks and sm all group 
discussions.

Saturday’s activities will 
include neighborhood cof­
fees, luncheons for men and 
women, and an afternoon of 
v isita tion  of shut-ins.

Fulbright
News

By Betty Rodgers
Mr. and Mrs. Kyle King 

and Nicole, Dick and Jeff 
King of Paris and Mr. and 
Mrs. Kerry King and 
Jeramie of Bogata were 
supper guests Wednesday of 
Mr. and Mrs. Travis King.

Mrs. Betty Rodgers, 
Melissa and Monte, Mrs. 
Ann Fisher and Anita at­
tended the ballgame bet­
ween the Dallas Cowboys 
and Lamar County coaches 
at Paris High gym Saturday 
night.

Gina Braddock visited her 
grandmother in Plano 
Wednesday until Sunday.

Maxie Roberts of South 
Texas was a visitor of his 
family here for a few days 
this week. He is employed 
there.

Mr. and Mrs. Freddie Furr 
and family of Mount Vernon 
were Sunday guests of her 
mother, Mr. and Mrs. Arthur 
Fisher and Anita.

Betty Rodgers was a 
patient in Clarksville 
General Hospital Tuesday 
until Thursday.

Mr. and Mrs. Duane King 
of Paris visited Friday night 
with Mr. and Mrs. Travis 
King.

Mrs. Ann Fisher am) 
Anitg,- Betty" Rodgers, 
Melissa and Mbiifeliliended 
a box supper at Deport 
School Monday night to 
honor the Deport Brownie 
Scouts. Anita received an 
award for being among the 
top three for selling over 100 
boxes.

Mr. and Mrs. Scott Wdfe 
and son and Mr. and Mrs. 
Steve McFarland and son of 
Paris were visitors during 
the weekend of Mr. and Mrs. 
Carl W(gfe and boys.

Mrs. Tommy Massey of 
McKinney has been visiting 
her mother and sister, Mrs. 
Marie Massey and Elizabeth 
for a few days.

Mrs. Jeanette Weddle, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Twyman Baker, is a patient 
in McCuistion Medical 
Center in Paris.

Buy, Sell Or Rent 
With Classined Ads

Corner of 6th and Lamar 784-7731

TSO is in 
Pciris, 1 exas

15 A  EAS'I PLAZA
(DOVVNIOVVN)

T e x a s  S t a t e  o .  ^ IC A JL l
(214) 7 8 4 -3 3 7 1

Another pot luck supper will 
begin in the Parish Hall at 
6:30 p.m. Saturday, with 
singing, talks by visitors and 
discussion groups to follow.

The lay visitors will be a 
part of the regular service at 
St. Mark’s at 11:00 a.m. Sun­
day, March 1,1981.

-  -The —‘F aith  A live” 
weekend was originated 
about 15 years ago by Ben 
Cam pbell Johnson, a 
Methodist clergyman. The 
weekends were called Lay 
Witness Missions in the 
Methodist Church, and a 
s ta n d a rd  fo rm at was 
developed and has been used 
in thousands of churches of 
many demoninations. In 
1970, a group of Brotherhood 
of St. Andrew men. their 
w ives, and o ther 
Episcopalians who had been 
witnessing in Methodist 
Churches, established an 
Episcopal led fellowship to 
help Episcopal parishes take 
better advantage of this new 
approach.

All Episcopalians and in­
terested persons from all 
other demoninations are in­
vited to attend all or part of 
the Faith Alive Weekend at 
St. Mark’s, according to the 
vicar, the Rev. John Arthur 
of Mt. Pleasant.

More information may be 
obtained by calling the Rev. 
Mr. Arthur at (214 ) 572-4650.

Aircraft Fuel
Aircraft presently account 

for nearly eight percent of 
the total petroleum con­
sumption in the United 
States. Demand for jet fuels 
is increasing with the growth 
of air transportation. Pres­
ent commercial jet engine 
fuels are grades of kerosene 
tailored to air transport 
industry specifications.

part of the party was when 
the girls all went into a room, 
and then us boys would go to 
the door and knock. The girl 
that answered the door went 
for a walk with you.

The part of the wliole deal 
that I disliked was when I got 
on my horse and started 
home. I was only about 15 or 
16, and those dark country 
roads always seemed to be 
out to get me. The world 
seemed to be just waiting to 
pounch on me. I always 
thought someone would 
jump out and rob or kill me. I 
never stopped to think that I 
didn’t have a single thing 
anyone would want, and my 
horse was no great shaker 
other.

When I got home, the 
scarey part was trying to put 
my horse up in the dark old 
bam. All the “boogers” in 
the world were in it as far as 
I was concerned. I would 
have to get my mother to 
come to the bam with me 
and put up the horse.

You have all heard that 
things are not built as good 
now as back in the old days, 
and I guess this reminded

Energy Plants
After screening more than 

2,900 native Texas plants 
for bio-mass energy poten­
tial, the researchers say they 
now have those few that 
“ look best on paper.”  The 
next step, and it is a big step, 
is realizing the commercial 
energy benefits of some of 
Texas’ more exotic plant 
species.

Leading the list of bio­
mass candidates are mes- 
quite, sweet sorghum, sun­
flowers, rabbit bush, salt 
bush, Kochia, tumbleweeds 
and a petro-plant called 
euphorbia that can be con­
verted into gasoline.

me of that when I was 
Paris the other day.

I came upon an old fire 
plug. It’s on Bonham Street, 
and was built in 1909. The old 
fire |dugs don’t look the 
same as they did back then, 
as you can see from the 
picture here, but city boys 
used to tie their horses up to 
them when they went 
courting, which they weren’t 
supposed to do.

Anyhow, I think the old 
plug is still in use. Now that 
is a lasting piece of equip­
ment.

Gardens
More than 43 percent of 

the 34 million households 
in the U.S. produced some 
or all of their own vege­
tables in backyard gardens 
in 1980.

lave a 
n ice  w eekend ..

‘78 Ford Fairm ont, 6 
cylinder station wagon, 
auto, air & 
power...13095.00

‘79 Impala, 4-door, little 
V-8, automatic, air & 
power...t3795.00

‘78 Granada Ford, 4-door, 
auto, air & 
power...13095.00

‘77 Malibu Classic, 
automatic. Little V-8, air 
& power...$2795.00

Several 6 cylinder 
Pickups to Clioose From.

NORRIS
M cDo w ell

USED CARS
900 N. Main 
Paris, Texas 

784-7331 After Hours

RODGERS - WADE
Manufacturing
Custom Cabinets 

Counter Tops Stock Cabinets
Available Rnished Or Unfinished 

Complete Line Of Roper Appliances 
FREE ESTIMATES

Call Collect (214)785-1619 Or Come
^  By Our Display Room At 1401 3rd S. W. 
^  Paris

★

SHELTON‘S A

W IM 30 -

S w i v ^  R o c k e r

SALE
Just Arrived 
New Shipment

Relax in Comfort— 
Choose the style 
an(j fabric to fit 
your decor.
All in luxurious 
velvet at a price to 
fit you budget.
O ther s t y l es  
available at great 
savings in velvet 
and nylon covers.

*177
Sale Ends 

Saturday At 6:00 p.m.
Colors Available:

Java, Champagne, Aztec,
Fern, Blue, Mint

Use Our Comfortable 
Revolving Charge Or Master Charge

S h e lt o n ’s

tl9lr<cWumatm.
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Deport Locals
By Rena Noble*

Carl Vidcers of Lone Star 
was a guest of his sister, 
Mrs. Robert Mitchell, 
Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Bruce 
Temple and Nicole of 
Houston came Saturday for a 
week’s visit with his mother, 
Mrs. Robert Temple and 
other relatives. Ms. Beth 
Randle and Ryan spent the 
weekend with them.

Mrs. Millie Shiver had as 
luncheon guests Sunday, her 
niece and her family, Mr. 
and Mrs. Donald Ware, 
Julie, Jason and Tina of 
Paris.

Mr. and Mrs. Ira Norman 
of Edmond, Ok. spent the 
weekend with her mother, 
Mrs. O.B. Rhodes and other 
relatives.

Mr. and Mrs. Walter 
Wright of Houston spent part 
of last week with his parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Roy Wright 
and attending his grand­
mother, Mrs. Martha 
Wright, who is ill in Mc- 
Cuistion Hospital.

Mrs. Sterling Tatum 
returned home Sunday after 
spending the week with her 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Wayne McGill in Houston.

Mr. and Mrs. Gary Pirtle 
and Kimberly of Paris ac­
companied Mr. and Mrs. 
John Denison and Dm to 
Kennard spending the 
weekend with the ladies 
sister and family, Mr. and 
Mrs. Jimmy Garrison and 
children.

Mrs. John Newman of 
Dallas was here Friday on 
business and spent some 
time with her aunt, Mrs. 
Ruby Brittian.

Mr. and Mrs. Don Allen of 
Blossom were Thursday 
guests of Mrs. Jessie Griffui.

Raymond Pruitt of 
Brookins, Oregon will return 
home Saturday after 
spending two weeks with Mr. 
and Mrs. Charlie Joplin.

Other visitors were Billy 
Wayne Joplin and family, 
Wesley Joplin and Joe, and 
Jerry Crockett and son, all of 
Paris and Mrs. Patsy 
Perkins of Clarksville.

Mr. and Mrs. Ned West­
brook and grandson. Matt 
Hanna, of DeKalb were 
Thursday visitors with Mrs. 
Lelia Westbrook.

East Post 
Oak News

By Mrs. Howard Crawford
We all were glad of the 

rain we got the past week. 
Several have gardened some 
and planted their potatoes.

Mr. and Mrs. Danny Babb 
and Kyle visited relatives 
here and in Paris over the 
weekend.

Twenty-one attended a 
birthday dinner at Mr. and 
Mrs. Howard Crawford’s 
Sunday, given for Mr. 
Babb . Attending were Mr. 
and Mrs. Steven Foster and 
children, Mr. and Mrs. Roy 
Martinez and Josh of 
Greenville, Heath, Colby and 
Cristi Tow of Greenville, Mr. 
and Mrs. James Crawford 
and family and Mr. and Mrs. 
Ben Tow and Joe of Paris.

We will have our regular 
quilting here Tuesday at the 
C o m m u n ity  C e n te r .  
Everyone is invited to come 
and bring a covered dish and 
spend the day.

Mr. and Mrs. James 
Sutton of Fort Worth visited 
friends here over the 
weekend.

Merle Crawford had open 
heart surgery Friday at 
Baylor Hospital in Dallas. 
He is doing fine. We wish him 
a speedy recovery.

Mr. and Mrs. B.E. 
Ladymon and Mrs. Eula 
Mitchell had dinner with Mr. 
and Mrs. Butler Stevens on 
Sunday.

GREYHOUND scores 
again. Richard Williams, 
number 22 for the 
P ra lr lla n d  P a trio ts , 
number 20, Brad Burks, 
and 14 Steve Crawford, all

contribu ted  heavily  
toward the winning score 
the Pats racked up 
against the Pittsburg 
bunch last week. (Staff 
Photo by Britt Barnard)

Washington Trip 
Awarded To Winners

WHENEVER
Our Services A re Needed

WHEREVER
You Happen To Live

We Are As Near To You 

As Your Telephone

An Immediate Call Will Make Available

OUR A D V ICE  
OUR H E L P

GRANT FUNERAL HOME
D EPO R T 4S2-319S

Monday, March 2, is the 
deadline for entries in the 
essay competition being 
sponsored by the Lamar 
C o u n t y  E l e c t r i c  
Cooperative, according to 
Qiarles Christian, member 
services manager.

The eventual winner of the 
competition will receive an 
all-expense paid trip to 
Washington, D.C., in June.

All high school
Presbyterian 
Women Meet

Presbyterian Women met 
Monday afto'noon at the 
church with eight members 
present.

Mrs. Farris Read, 
presiding, opened the 
meeting with a devotion 
using Psalm 103, the Mo-cies 
and Love of God, all praying 
the Lord’s Prayer.

After business and reports, 
Mrs. Russell Lawler 
reviewed chapters five and 
six from the Bible Study 
“Sing a New Song” by Isabel 
Rogers, followed by 
discussion.

Mrs. Rena Nobles read 
names and places from 
Yearbook for Prayer and 
offered prayer. Group 
dismissed with Mizpah 
Benediction.

Ride out those rough financial times with First 
National of Deport.
We can help.
Drop in and see us today.

The First National Bank
OF D EPORT

Sm pom itot lf i« u r« 4  m  $40,0CD

F E M E
MotiAi p tp o v t ■«siut*wci coePQtailOH

sophomores and juniors in 
the system’s service area 
are eligible to enter the 
contest. Schools considered 
to be in the service area 
include Paris, North Lamar, 
Prairiland, Delmar, Ck»per, 
Roxton, West Lamar, 
D e tro i t ,  C la rk s v i lle ,  
Rivercrest and Avery.

Contest entrants, C^istian 
says, are required to submit 
a 500-word or less essay on 
the subject “Electric Power 
Supply-Issue of the 80’s.” . 
Cmtest rules and resource 
m aterials that may be 
helpful to contestants are 
available from the 
cooperative’s office in Paris 
and from their school, ac­
cording to Cliristian, who is 
in charge of the contest.

Essays are to be judged on 
the basis of knowledge of the 
subject, originality, com­
position, neatness and 
grammar. Finalists will be 
selected to appear for in­
terviews by a committee of 
judges.

Approximately 1,000 Youth 
Tour participants from 
across the nation will meet 
during the week in 
Washington for a special 
program coordinated by the 
National Rural Electric 
Cooperative Association. 
'Die program, according to 
Christian, will feature 
congressional leaders and 
high government officials. A 
visit to the White House and 
a banquet will highlight the 
week’s events, he says.

Last year’s winners were 
Pam Sansing of Cooper High 
School and Joey Williams of 
Rivercrest High School.

Buy, Sell or Rent 
With Classified Ads

Clardy News
By Sondra Martin

Friends and relatives were 
saddened to learn of the 
death of Frank Grigsby of 
Pharr, who passed away 
Friday. Burial will be here 
on Tuesday. He was reared 
in this community and was a 
step-brother to Alvin and 
Roland Ballard. He married 
the former Margie Parker. 
Sympathy is extended to the 
family.

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Jenkins 
and Stace were in College 
Station last weekend to visit 
their sons, Vance Jenkins 
and Mr. and Mrs. Shawn 
Jenkins, also to celebrate 
Vance’s birthday.

Alvin Harris, who is still ill 
this week, enjoyed visits 
from Mr. and Mrs. Raymond 
Foinroy of Paris, Keith 
Stone, Gary Abbott, Mr. and 
Mrs. Lewis Clement, Rant 
Stone, Rev. John Dunn, 
Leonard Butler, Sam 
Skidmore, Mr. and Mrs. L.T. 
Clement, Virgie Ballard, 
Rev. L.C. Stout, Mrs. Mary 
Stone and Paula Pomroy, 
Frank Malone and David 
Harris.

Mr. and Mrs. Hershel 
Stone spent Tuesday until 
Thursday with her daughter, 
Mr. and Mrs. Harold Dillard 
of Duncanville.

Bainham Skidmore spent 
the weekend with his father, 
Chirtis, and grandparents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Clayton 
Skidmore.

Mr. and Mrs. Rant Stone 
were visitors Thursday of 
Mr. and Mrs. Mike Stone of 
Paris and Melbum Tucker of 
Cherry Street Annex.

T.D. Humphrey of Houston 
spent a few days with Mr. 
and Mrs. Lewis Gement.

Elbert Boren spent part of 
last week with Audie and 
James Dudley.

Mrs. Alvin Ballard of 
Clardy and Mrs. Ruby 
Hudson of Jennings enjoyed 
lunch in Deport Friday.

Mr. and Mrs. Lewis Arm­
strong of Dallas spent the 
weekend visiting Mr. and 
Mrs. Roy Davidson and 
Mike, also Mrs. Mae Arm­
strong of Deport Nursing 
Home.

Mr. and Mrs. Bobby 
Oement and Dustin of Paris 
enjoyed supper Tuesday 
evening with his parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. L.T. Clonent.

Dana Dority and Amber 
Short of Paris spent Friday 
night with their grand­
parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Kenneth Short .

Mrs. Sam Skidmore has 
been a patient at McCuistion 
Hospital. Relatives and 
friends ahve been visiting 
her.

Mr. and Mrs. Hershel 
Stone of Clardy and Mr. and 
Mrs. Harold Dillard of 
Duncanville spent Wed­
nesday in the home of Mr. 
and Mrs. Garland Hargis in 
Fort WwTh to visit Mr. 
Stone’s aunt. Add Ward, who 
is 98 years old and fell and 
broke her hip in January. 
She is in serious condition 
and was taken back to the 
hospital Saturday.

Mrs. Madge Skidmore was 
ill during the weekend.

PUBLIC NOTICE
Pursuant to TEX . REV . CIV. STAT. ANN 

an. 1446c ^43(1975), Lone Star Gas Company 
hereby gives NOTICE of the Company's intent 
to implement a new schedule of rates effec­
tive on the latter of March 2, 1981
or such other date as new rates become 
effective in the City of Deport, Texas
to be charged for natural gas service to resi­
dential and commercial customers in the en­
virons areas (outside incorporated limits of
Deport, Texas.)

The rate schedule is expected to furnish a 
12.94 % increase in the Company's gross
revenues in the environs of Deport, 
Texas.

A Statement of Intent has been filed with 
the Railroad Commission of Texas and is 
available for inspection at the Company's
business office located at 150 1 s t S .E .>  
P aris , Texas.

Any affected person desiring to contest 
such changes in rates can file a complaint 
with the Director of the Gas Utilities Division. 
Railroad Commission of Texas P. O. Drawer 
12967, Capitol Station, Austin, Texas, 78711.

6Lone Star Gas Company

Mr. and Mrs. R.R. Stone 
were in Paris Saturday to 
see Mrs. Minnie Brown, who 
is ill in St. Joseph’s Hospital.

Mr. and Mrs. Bobby 
Harrell of Jennings were in 
Greenville on Saturday to 
sing for a funeral.

Visitws this week of the 
Gene Martin family were 
Mr. and Mrs. Bill Bowman, 
Mrs. Lucille Webster and 
Mrs. Irene Bennett of Paris, 
Mr. and Mis. Earl Martin 
and Paul of Bogata and 
Derek Hart of Blossom, Mr. 
and Mrs. Carl Kuhle and 
April of Clarksville and 
Stanley Francis and Cory of 
Greenville.

Dawson Ballard of Camp 
Maxey was out several times 
last week to help his father, 
Alvin Ballard, fix a water 
syston.

Jack Parker of San Sayver 
was here during the week for 
the funeral of Frank 
Grigsby.

Mr. and Mrs. Rant Stone 
wwe visitors of Mr. and Mrs. 
Buck Slaton of Halesboro 
Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Alvin Harris 
enjoyed a birthday cake 
Saturday in honor of their 
recent birthdays, by their 
daughter, Mrs. Betty 
Gement of Blossom and 
g ra n d d a u g h te r ,  K elli 
Gement of Dallas. Pictures 
were taken.

Mr. and Mrs. Boyce Stone 
of Denton spent the weekend 
with his parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Weldon Stone, Jeff and 
Brad, and enjoyed the 

Ibasketball game between the| 
Dallas Cowboys and Lamar 
County coaches. Several 
others around also enjoyed 
the game at Paris High 
School gym Saturday night.

Leonard Butler of Clardy 
is a patient at McCuistion 
Hospital. He is reported 
better.

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Jenkins 
and Stace were in Pecan Gap 
for the wedding anniversary 
of Mr. and Mrs. C.B. Johnson 
Saturday.

Mrs. Louise Clement had 
minor surgery at Paris 
TTiursday of last week. She is 
doing fine.

Mrs. Bertie Hadaway and 
Mack McKinley of Kilgore 
spent Sunday with her sister, 
Mrs. Hershel Stone

A beautiful baptismal 
service was observed at 
Bethel Baptist Church 
Sunday evening.

BUSINESS DIRECTORY
MT. VERNON 
TRADE DAY 
AUCTION

Every Sat. at 7 p.m.
Located 2 miles North Of

Mf. Vernon On Hwy. 37.. Col. Buddy Stringfellow, 
Auctioneer.

Also Available - 
doors and Trim. 

James Diggs, Ph. 632-4505

Shipp's Grocery

6 Station
On High way 271 
Phone 652-3520 

•GRIXERIES  
•GAS & OIL

Open 7:00 a.m.-8:00 p.m.
7 Days A Week

S M  at* m STHMtRS

NATION BROS.
LIAAE SPREAD 

SEED 
982-5831

JAMES & B. D. NATION 
BLOSSOM, TEXAS

LOOP FINA 
TRUCKSTOP

We Carry A Full Line Of 
Fina Products 

We Also Fix Flats and 
Give Rood Service 

We Are A Full 
Service Station 1 

Ph. 785-8218
Loop® 286 Poris, Tx.

Income Tax 
Service
Fronk Mowery

(Toll For Appointment Or 
(!ome By.

9 o.m. til 3 p.m Mon.-Fri. 
All Day Saturday. 

Fairview Sf. Blossom 
982-5573

Joe's hlydraulic Service
Cunningham, Texas 

652-5003
Hydraulic Jacks And Lifts, 

Air Compressors, 
Grease Guns,

Air Tools, Battery Charger,

ond Steam Cleaners.

~ HubbLBTAN 
GROCERY

Every Thurs., Fri., Sot.
Borden's Milk-^ î --  $^09

Mrs. Baird's Bread--- CTRSta-Fresh
Biscuits- Porod.--- 2/39^

Canned Drinks------$189All Flexors 1
R. C .--10 oz. Bottin--99̂

Round Steak--- ib. — 2̂̂

SALVAGE CARPETS
785-8317

2448 Lamar Paris 
Open 3-5:30 

Mon. Thru Fri.
9- 12-Sat.

We Have 1st Quality 
Carpet & Linoleum.
We Buy Direct For 

Big Savings.

THIS SPACE 
CAN MAKE

YOU MONEY 
CALL

652-4205

Announcing The Opening

B&NTRUCKSTOP
Formerly The Blossom 

Truck Stop.
Cafe Operated By 

MRS. MARY WOODALL. 
Serving Breakfast, Lunch, & 
Dinner.

Fish Fry Every Friday.
Mr. y/allace Woodall -Mgr. Hwy 82 E. 4S2-S80S g

Mini-Ads 3 Weeks For $3

Some people joke about 
their wives, but not me. I 
decided against it the first 
time 1 saw her Shake ’N 
Bake a 3S pound turkey in a 
Hefty Bag.

BLACK PEPPER Griffin's 4 oz. 89
SAUSAGE Owen's 2 Lb. $ 0 8 9

FUDGE CREMES Keebler 12oz. Pkg. 79
BREAD Mrs. Baird's Pull Apart 1 Lb. 79
COFFEE

Polger's 1 Lb.

$ 2 5 9

CHIU
Armaur Texas Brand

15 oz.

9 9

MILK
Borden's

Gal.

$209

SAUSAGE
Carl's 2 Lb.

$ 2 8 9

SYRUP
Griffin's Crystal White 32 oz.

8 9

CAKE M IX Generic 2/»l
AIR FRESHENER Glade Spray 

7 oz. 79
INSTANT POTATOES 2 9

We Reserve The Right To Limit Quantities Speoals Good Thurs Sot

&ftw(fs Food
Deport A .G .A . 652-3925
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Deport Nursing
Mr. and Mrs. Howard 

Flower and children from 
Maud, Tully Temple of 
Milton, Mutt Harvey of 
Milton all wo-e Mrs. Zona 
Moore’s weekend guests. 

Frank Malone of Pat-

have a 
nice weekend..

Home Locals
tonville visited his wife, Mrs. 
Allie Malone through the 
week.

Mrs. Eva Matlock of 
Fulbright visited her 
husband, Hwace Matlock 
Monday.

Mr. and Mrs. Thomas Ray, 
Mr. and Mrs. J.R. Ray, Mr. 
and Mrs. Melvin Webb, all of 
Blossom, were recent guests 
of Mr. and Mrs. Tom Ray.

Mrs. Charlie Boren of East 
Post Oak, Mrs. Roy Riggers 
of Blossom were recent 
visitors of Mrs. Maudie 
Baxter.

Deanna 9iephard, John 
Shephard and Kenneth 
Shephard, all of Dallas, were 
weekend guests of Mrs. 
Angie Shqphard.

Recent visitors of Mrs. 
Zelpha Anderson were Mr. 
and Mrs. Raymond 
Bullington of Tyler and 
Lucille Nash and Helen 
Northam of Paris.

Tully Temple of Milton 
visited his mother, Mrs. 
Georgia Temple Sunday.

Mrs. Faye LaRue of 
Deport visited her father 
Monday, Wallace Thompson.

MACKEY & 
PIERSON

THE INSURANCE 
STORE

We Are Insurance 
Professionals As 
Close As Your Phone 
Consult Us For The 
Best Coverage At A 
Cost To Suit Your 
Pocketbook.

1705 Lamor Paris 
Phone 784-4341

CLOCDDSODDCB
, considerate service  

w ith  a
sensible level o£ charge.

S IB IM N O M A S
^ iu te n a l J lo 4 fte

Dial 214 784 6623 2601 LAMAR AVENUE

BARRY BALLARD cuts 
around a Pittsburg Pirate 
In the Junior Varsity last 
week. The Patriots lost to 
the Pirates, but came

back from way behind to 
come within three points 
in the closing seconds of 
the game. (Staff Photo by 
Britt Barnard)

Cunningham News
By Bemiece Wyatt

A special invitation is 
extended to everyone to hear 
Jess Davidson of Grant, Ok. 
speak at the Baptist Church 
at 6:00.

Mrs. Aimer Ncx^ood, Mrs. 
Eugene Norwood, Otto 
Baker with Danny Norwood, 
were in Bonham Thursday to

Potato Facts
Potatoes produce some 

4,800,000 calories an acre, 
or about five times as many 
as rice and 10 times as many 
as wheat, the National Geo­
graphic Society says. An­
other evaluation: One acre 
of potatoes alone could feed 
a family of six for a year.

Buy, Sell or Rent 
With Classified Ads

I^etliehillsand valleys 
out of your electricbills...

JAN. FEB. MAR. APR. MAY JUN. JUL. AUG. SEP. OCT. NOV. DEC.

The unexpected hills £m.d valleys of your electric bills 
can he a jolt to your budget. Help smooth out those 
highs and lows, with the Average Billing Plan. The 
Average Billing Plan malces hill paying and budget­
ing more convenient, since you will know about how 
much of an electric bill to expect each month. Your 
total ajinual electricity expense w ill be about the 
same. If you’d like to smooth out your electric hills, 
just give us a call.

Thla la how your averaie bUliiii amonnt Is f l^ e d :
nBSTMOHTH
MOST RECENT AVERAGE
12 MONTHS + 12 =  BILLINQ 
ACTUAL USE AMOUNT
lACH  MOHTH T H B U A IT U
MOST RECENT 18% OP
12 MONTHS 12 -f- ACCmfULATBD 
AIDTUALUSE DIFFERENCE'

*15% of accumulated differ­
ence is added when prior to 
the current hill, the  calcu­
lated amount for electricity 
used la more than  the accu- 

AVERAOE mulated amount hilled 
= BILLINO under the Average Billing 

AMOUNT Plan

HOTB; If you have less than 12 months history at your present 
address, the “average" will be based on the number of months 
available.

COMMUNITY PUBLIC SERVICE
Vour Lghf & F ĵwsr Company

visit Roscoe Baker, who is a 
patient in Veterans Hospital. 
While there, Otto Baker 
suffered a heart attack and 
was admitted to a Bonham 
hospital. He was able to be 
moved to McCuistion 
Hospital in Paris Monday. 
We wish him a speedy 
recovery.

Mr. and Mrs. Weldon 
Smith of Bogata spent the 
weekoid at their home here 
and attended services at the 
Methodist Church Sunday.

Blaine Smith of San An­
tonio spent the weekend with 
his parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Bruce Smith.

Joe H. Bell of Houston, 
Larry Bell, Rodney and 
Jeffery Jones of Paris and 
Mr. and Mrs. Bob Allen of 
Blossom were weekend 
visitors with Mr. and Mrs. 
Fred Allen.

Mrs. Dorothy Dean Baker 
of Longview and Mrs. Mike 
Hawks of Wasken visited 
CKto Baker in the Bonham 
hospital Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Ronald 
Kelsoe of Naples spent 
Friday night with Mrs. Allie 
Rees.

Mrs. Faye Black visited 
her son, Thomas Black in 
Jones Hospital in Sherman 
Monday.

Mr. and Mrs. Eugene

r
a C H O O L

M r i u i
Deport School

(
Menu 

March 2-6,1981 
Monday 

Breakfast:
Oatmeal
Bacon
Bread
Lunch:
Taco salad
Corn
Fruit
Bread
Milk

READ-a-thon REGISTRATION

J
S T U t >EN'rs  Pl A M E

‘-/o
P A R I E N T S N A M E

S T R E E T  A D D R E S S

M
A P T .  N U M B E R C I T Y

Tuesday
Breakfast:
Doughnuts
Lunch:
Turkey & dressing 
Swc3i potatoes 
Green beans 
Bread 
Milk

Wednesday
Breakfast:
Cereal
Lunch:
Meat loaf 
Creamed potatoes 
English peas 
Hot rolls 
Milk

Thursday
Breakfast:
Cinnamon rolls 
Lunch:
Veg or chicken soup 
Pimento cheese sandwiches 
Milk

Friday
Breakfast:
Eggs
Sausage
Bread
Jelly
Lunch:
Pizza burgers 
Chips

Z IP
□

G R A D E T E L E P H O N E  N O .

I want to  help solve the m ystery of M ultiple Sclerosis...............
Please enroll me as a Mystery Sleuth in the MS READ a-thon.

My Teacher's Name 1$:

S ch o o l:______________

M. S. Read-A-Thon 
Runs Through March 20
The M.S. Read-a-thon, a 

nati(Hiwide reading program 
for boys and girls 6 to 14

begins in Northeast Texas 
area February 9 and runs 
through March 20. The Read- 
a-thon motivates school

Ice cream 
MUk

" I t  seems that all we do is Just fight and make up, fight and 
make u p ...’

children to read books in an 
effort to raise money to help 
find a cure for Multiple 
Sclerosis.

Young participants, called 
Mystery Sleuths, read books 
for pleasure and ask 
relatives and friends to 
donate a certain amount for 
each book completed. This 
donation provides funding 
for M.S. research, patient 
services, and public 
educatitxi programs.

Since the program ’s 
initiation in 1974, more than 
34 million dollars have been 
raised nationwide for M.S. as 
millions of children have 
read more than 30 millitxi 
books.

Gil Gerard, s ta r of 
television’s “Buck Rogers in 
the 25th Century’’ is the 
National Celebrity Chair­
man.

Parents and educators 
interested in starting a M.S. 
Read-a-thon in their area 
should contact their school 
or the local M.S. chapter at 
214-357-1571.

Multiple Sclerosis, of 
which there is no known 
cause or cure, is a chronic, 
often disabling neurological 
disease of the central ner­
vous system that most 
frequently strikes young 
adults 15-40.

Interested children can fill 
out the registration card 
below and return it to the 
M.S. Regional Office at 9990 
Monroe Drive, Suite 202, 
Dallas, TX 75220.

HARD GAME—The 
P ra ir ila n d  P a trio ts  
discussed strategy with 
coaches Lloyd Simmons 
and Ronnie Baker, when 
they played one of the

Norwood honored their son, 
Frankie, with a birthday 
supper Monday night. 
Guests were Mr. and Mrs. 
Aimer Norwood, Mr. and 
Mrs. Odis Watson, Mr. and 
Mrs. Billy Ray Oats, 
Brandon and Georjeana, and 
Mr. and Mrs. Scott Norwood.

Mr. Joe Williams spent 
Sunday night with Hazel 
Desha zo of Paris. On 
Monday they visited Mr. and 
Mrs. Hugh Capperton of 
Cooper.

Mr. and Mrs. Delano 
Dunlap and family of Dallas 
spent the weekend with Mr. 
and Mrs. Willie Joe Fowler.

Mr. and Mrs. Ronnie 
Merchant and family of 
Bogata were Saturday 
supper guests of Mr. and 
Mrs. Alfonzo Smith.

Mrs. Della Howe and Joe 
Ladd were dismissed from 
Paris hospitals last week.

Haskell Booth and the 
Davidson Sisters of Blossom 
sang at the Life Tabernacle 
Church Saturday night.

Mr. and Mrs. Brit Phillips. 
Lindy and Bonnie of Lone

hardest games of the year 
against the North Lamar 
Panthers Tuesday night. 
Die Pats defeated the 
Panthers by two points in 
double overtime. (Staff 
Photo)

Pattonville Locals
By Ann Crossland

Ray Bryant of Greenville 
v isit^  Mr. and Mrs. Melvin 
Bryant and Ruby Thursday.

Hollis and Edna Towers 
visited Mr. and Mrs. Melvin 
Bryant and Ruby Thursday 
night.

Mr. and Mrs. Buster 
Crossland and Ann visited 
Mr. and Mrs. Buck Slaton, 
Billy and Boyd of Halesboro 
Monday night.

Mary Van Culer of 
Ashland, Oregon is visiting 
Mr. and Mrs. Floyd Salter, 
Mr. and Mrs. Grover Fen- 
dley and C.H. Hoover.

Mr. and Mrs. Doyle 
Higdon of Duncanville, Mr. 
and Mrs. John Rushing of 
Bonham, Mr. and Mrs. 
Grover Fendley of Blossom, 
Mr. and Mrs. C.H. Hoover, 
M argaret Fowler and 
Melonie had dinner Sunday

with Mr. and Mrs. Floyd 
Salter.

Mr. and Mrs. Willie 
Oossland and Mike and 
Diane Weddle of Paris were 
supper guests of Mr. and 
Mrs. Buster Crossland, 
Travis and Ann Friday 
night.

Dallas Dickson of Reno 
visited Mr. and Mrs. 
Clarence Williams Monday.

Mrs. Lucille Archer, Mrs. 
Shelia Gallaway and 
daughter of Fort Worth 
visited Mr. and Mrs. George 
Humphrey Thursday.

Clarence Jopes of 
Bakersfield, Ca. and Audrey 
Gillis of Bogata visited Mr. 
and Mrs. George Humphrey 
over the weekend.

The Baptist Church had 
good attendance at church 
Sunday.

Don Russell of Jennings 
visited Travis Crossland
Diursday.

Mrs. Norman Honored
star and Jesse Justiss of ^  J
Bellville were supper ^ e s ts  i-Wl O O tfl t H lr n C la y  
(rf Mr. and Mrs. William ^nd Mrs. Odis Watson 
Cooper Sunday night. honored her mother, Mrs.

Mr. and Mrs. Norman Sain 
of Talco spent Friday with 
Mrs. Ida Deshong.

Clarence Jopes of 
Bakersfield, Ca. visited Mr. 
and Mrs. Joe B. Williams 
Friday.

Mr. and Mrs. Orel Bennett 
of Fort Towson, Ok. spent 
Sunday with Mr. and Mrs. 
Tommy Pressley.

Berchie Norman of Paris, 
with dinner Sunday on her 
88th birthday.

Guests attending were Mr. 
and Mrs. Alton Moore of 
Marshall; Mr. and Mrs. Ira 
Norman, Ted, Sue and Cody

hav« a
nice weekend...

A SPECIAL INVITATION TO ATTEND
FAITH BAPTIST CHURCH

Downtown Deport 
A Southern Baptist Congregation 
Sunday Sorvicet; Sunday School-10:(X) o.m. 
Worship-11 :(X) o.m. Church Training-6;(X> p.m. 

Worshlp-7:00 p.m.
Wednesday: Bible Study 7:(X) p.m.

of Norman, Ok.; Mrs. Jo 
Trout, Mr. and Mrs. Zealous 
Trout and Edith Trout of 
Bonham; Mr. and Mrs. 
Raymond Perry of 
Ravenna; Mrs. Lucille 
Sinclair and Mr. and Mrs. 
Johnny Murill of Sherman; 
Mr. and Mrs. Hollis Jenkins 
of Bonham; Mrs. Elsie 
Roddy, Mr. and Mrs. Jerry 
Frierson, Mrs. Edith Smith 
and Mrs. Gene Frierson of 
Paris; Mr. and Mrs. Delbert 
Norman, Mr. and Mrs. Dana 
Norman, Mrs. .Abigail 
Strickland, Phillip and Amy 
of Deport; Linda Duncan of 
Blossom; Mr. and Mrs. 
Eugene Norwood and 
Frankie, Mr. and Mrs. Scott 
Nwwood, Mr. and Mrs. Billy 
Ray Oats, Brandon and 
(jeorjeana, Mr. and Mrs. 
Johnny Musgrove, Stacy and 
Zarinska, and Mr. and Mrs. 
Dean Watson, Jarvis, 
Deana, Brad and Bruce.

Gas does not contain poisonous ingredi­
ents. If most, or oil, the air in o room were 
replaced with gas. however, o person 
would suffocate from lock of oxygen. It 
would be like drowning.

So you con detect the presence 
of gas, should there be o leak, we put a  
harmless odorant in gas.

If you smell gas in your home, 
ventilate your house immediately by op­
ening doors and windows. Do not turn on 
any light switches or appliances.
CALL ARKLA GAS Immediately.

Natural gas has a better safety record  
than any other form of energy.
Please help us keep it that way.

Arkla

(trth m a senes of safely information ads by Arkla Gas)

«  •
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Thursday, February 26,1981

WANT ADS

*

FOR SALE—Nice lot on west 
side of F irst Baptist 

Church, Deport. Contact 
Murl Roach, Johnnie 
Dawson or Raymond 
Crawford, tfc

HEREFORD BULLS-Good 
selection yearlings thru 3 

years old. CHAPMAN 
HEREFORD FARM, M. 
Lynn Chapman (Tira 
Community), Route 3, 
Sulphur Springs, Texas. 
Phone 214-M5-2446. (tfc)

FOR SALE---- In Deport,
Excellent location: Frame 

house on large lot, three 
bedrooms, two bathrooms, 
formal living and dining, 
den, kitchen, utility, large 
rooms, double garage, large 
storage house. 652-2398 or 
652-6715. 3-12

A  FOR SALE-----1977 6600
^  Ford tractor, 70 hor­

sepower, low hours, 15 ft. 
shredder, hydraulic lift. 632- 
5817 after 6:00. 2-26

Backhoe Work 
Water Lines 

Septic Systems 
Ditch Cleaning 

Pool Work 
FRtE ESTIMATES 

KOEHN BACXHOE 
SERVICE

674-2381 Detroit, Tex.

DR. JAMES J. NAPLES, 
Foot Specialist, is pleased 

to announce the opening of 
his practice at 103 E. 16th, 
Mount Pleasant, TX 572-8736. 
3-5

SPEIR & Speir Upholstery 
now open. All work 

guaranteed. Prompt service. 
149 N. Main, BogaU. 632-4535 
or 4484. tfc

FOR SALE—Johntown
Baptist Church P ar­

sonage. Four bedrooms, 
brick, 2 baths, fully car­
peted, utility room, central 
heat & air, lots of storage, 2- 
car garage, deep well. 
Bogata 632-5493, 632-5051. tfc

JEEPS, CARS, TRUCKS— 
a v a i l a b l e  th ro u g h  

government agencies. Many 
sell for under $200. Call (602) 
941-8014, ext. 615 for your 
directory on how to pur­
chase. 1-15

THINKING OF 
BUILDING 

A NEW HOME? 
-Think how beautiful 

a Full Log Home would 
be. Logs finished on 

3 sides. Extremely 
reasonable prices. 

For information coll 
Charles Guests 

632-5011

FREE TO GOOD HOME— 
Labrador, M Walker tree 

dog, 5 mo. old pup. Call 652- 
4205 or 652-5823, Deport.

COOPER HORSE SALE
Fri. Nite, Feb. 27,1981 

Sole Time-7;(X) p.m. 
Misc. Sale Every W .  

at 6.30 p.m. 
Contact Gorckm Huie,

COASTAL BERMUDA grass 
sprigs. No sand burrs. Dan 

Kelley, Johntown, 632-4437. 
3-12

MISSION MANOR Nursing 
Home is interested in 

acquiring services of oc­
cupational therapist and 
speech pathologist. In­
terested persons should 
contact Kittie Julian Wynn 
at 537-4424. 2-26

ALL
KINDSBULK GARDEN SEED 

FRUIT &
i PECAN TREES

Recommended For This Area

PEHY'S NURSERY
Hwy. 37 N. Clorksville Ph. 427-5564

B u c k ’s Rolling Homes
324 Feguson Rd.

Mt. Pleasant, Texas

24' Wide Double Wide, 3 BR, 2 Full 
Bath, Total Electric, Fireplace, Air.

On Special This Week. Must See To Appreciate!

14x80 Balcony Kitchen Or Balcony Bedroom With 
Fireplace, Special This Week 

S a v e *1,000.00

All Homes Reduced 
To Sell

Financing Available Caih Welcoma

We’re banking on you, America, with
AGRICULTURAL LOANS

Qualified applicants to American Midlands. 
Inc. can receive assistance for;

$ Farm Purchases 
$ Livestock and Machinery 
$ Farm Refinance 
$ Conversion from short term 

to long term 
$ Leasing

MINIMUM; $150,000

Call Toll Free  
1 -800-228-2702

(In Nebraska call 402/334-51CXD)
American Midlands. Inc.

2945 S. 132nd St. • Omaha. NE 68144
Member NAFCX)

With offices in Los Angeles. Dallas, 
Minneapolis. Denver and Knoxville

Public Notice

PUBLIC NOTICE 
The election of the City 

(rfficials for the City of Talco 
will be held on Saturday, 
April 4, 1981. The terms of 
Mayor Joe B. Morse, 
Councilman Leo Roberts and 
Councilman Ellis Brown are 
expiring. Candidates who 
wish to have their names 
placed on the ballot tor the 
election of Mayor or 
Councilman, may do so by 
signing and filing an ap­
plication at the City Hall by 
4:00 p.m. on March 4, 1981.

PUBLIC NOTICE
Board of Director’s 

Election, Region VIII 
Education Service Center 
Persons desiring to have 

their names placed on the 
ballot for the Region VIII 
Education Service Center 
Board of Director’s election 
to be held in May 1981 are to 
file a written application at 
the headquarters office of 
the Center, 100 North Riddle, 
Mount Pleasant, in person or 
by certified mail between 
March 1 and March 20.

Positions to be Tilled at the 
election are Place 2, 
representing Delta and 
Lamar Counties, and Place 
5, representing Red River 
County, for three (3) years 
each on the Board of 
Directors.

Application forms are 
available in the Executive 
Directw’s office.

PUBLIC NOTICE 
The term s of Council 

members Morris Foster, 
’Travis Hale and (^arlie 
Lewis will expire in April.

Anyone desiring to file for 
these offices, contact the 
City Hall in Bogata, for the 
proper forms.

John W. Hood 
Mayor of Bogata

F l r m i n  F l i g h t  S e r v i c e

Grady Flrmin 
Owner

Ml. Pleasant Municipal Airport

5729875

Flight /n$tfuctlon •  Aircraft Aontaf •  Aircraft Sa h a  p 24-Hour Sarvfca

ARE YOU BORED? Would 
you like to have good, 

clean fun? Come to the 
Square Dance Lessons in 
Paris. 785-2465 . 2-26

PATIO SALE-509 N. Main, 
Bogata, Thursday and 

Friday, 9 a.m. to 6 p.m. 2-26

FO R SA LE—F e m a le  
Doberman, 11 mos. $35.00, 

632-4353, Bogata. 2-26
FOR SALE—One horse, 

s ing le-ax le  Stidham  
trailer. Needs minor repair, 
pulls excellent. Call 632-4593 
or 652-4205.

BEFORE YOU TAKE 
ANOTHER DAY OF RISK, 

REMEMBER THIS...

HEREFORD 
BULL SALE 

Saturday, Feb. 28, 
1981,12:00 Noon 

WINONA, TEXAS 
Branch Valley Ranch 

Invitational Sale, Selling 
42 registered Hereford 
Bulls, including 14 Herd 
Bull Prospects. Con­
sisting of 4-3 yr. olds, 7-2 
yr. olds, 3-long yearlings; 
28 Range Bulls of ex­
cellent quality. Also, a 
comi^ete dispersion from 
the Summers Ranch of 25 
Registered Hereford 
Cows and Calves. For 
free catalog and in­
formation, contact Gayle 
Ingram, Sale Manager- 
Auctioneery, P.O. Box 
579, Quitman, Texas 
75783, 214-878-2225 or Ray 
Branch, Owner, Branch 
Valley Ranch, 2430 
Woodhaven Drive, Tyler, 
Tx. 75701. Home: 214-566- 
0060, Ranch: 214-877-3324.

NO MATTER WHAT 
HAPPENS BETWEEN NOW 

AND HARVEST, 
WE’LL GUARANTEE YOUR 

YIELD AND PROTECT 
YOUR INCOME.

That’s the promi.se behind All-Risk 
F ederal Cron iH.surana-

Wliat does it m ean for you? Plenty. 
Because by l(x kin>r in a guaranU'ed yield 
tn iJ  income, you cover the risk of lossts 
from natunvl disa.s'.crs such tis drouth. 
fliKxl. insects and dis<‘a.s«*.

How do you get All-Risk Kederal 
Crop lasurance? Simple, .lust apply for 
insurance with your^iearest FC'lt' 
representative. Select the yield coverage 
level—u p to 7.“)% of you r cou nty average. 
Then pick one of three price level.s—up 
OO’̂ iof projected market price.

For more information, call the FCK' 
representative in your area. All-Risk 
Fe<leral Crop Insuraneo. In goixi years 
and bad. it pays off.

All-Risk
Federal Crop Insurance

CAPPS INSURANCE AGENCY 
BRYSON INSURANCE AGENCY

Bogato ond Clorksvill*
632-5711 427-2850

Gorald Capps «

Come Regardless Of Weather
CRA ANNUAL

Championship

RODEO
MARCH

67
1981
8KK) p.m . 
Prom pt

Sat. Night Only
A lle n , Jr.

7  B ig
E V E N T S

Com RopMs

C A LL : Morah 4 
214-tS2-4tt3

TICKETS:
nav AUam, J r .

FRIDAY
Advttt • 13 00 ChtWron. 13 4 |3  00

SATURDAY
O ATi

$10.00
AOVANCi

$9.00

17.00 tlMch.r, $6.00
ChiMron •  4 wnJar |4  00

ADVANCE TICKETt
HESS FSUNITUWS Ml F laaM nt, T a ia *

Tka  Waatam  d ata 
IwtoraRara M  Woof 

7awaHtar%a B S S S ilf

Ca«ae-B««rr « i  SmaaSna
Tamarkana

oattam m-sms

ClariitMMa
427-41M 

KETCH FEN 
Idabal. Ohlt

171

3 Weeks, 3̂
PAINTING-----20 years

experience, by houi or 
contract. Roland Burson, 
632-4546, Bogata. MA 2-26

FEEDER & STOCKER 
Heifers & Steers. Brah­

man-Cross replacement 
heifers. Norris Ballard, 
P aris, Tx. 214-785-0192, 
after 9 p.m. MA tfc

CALL MRS. BEN WARREN 
for all your flower needs. 

Robinius Greenhouse, 652- 
2211. MA tfc

HOUSE FOR RENT on 
Circle Drive., Bogata. Call 

632-5385. MA tfc

INCOME TAX Retums-$10 
and up. Richard W. 

Garrison, 632-4346 or 632- 
5307, Bogata. MA tfc

FOR HOME REPAIR— 
Roofing or remodeling, 

reasonable rates. Call Bobby 
Martin, 632-4576, Bogata. 
MA 3-5

ROSALIE LODGE No. 527 
stated meetings on fourth 

’Thursday of each month at 
7:30 p.m. MA tfc

INCOME TAX Service after 
4 p.m. and weekends. 

Bonnie Huddleston, 301 
Circle Drive. 632-5238, 
Bogata. MA tfc

DEPORT FARM SUPPLY 
has seed potatoes, sweet 

society onions, cabbage 
idants, bulk garden seed, 
lime, fertilizer and 
Evergreen feeds. 652-5845 
MA 3-5

WANT TO BUY or lease 
small acreage in Bogata. 

632-5663 or 5611. MA 3-5

FOR SALE—House, 2 bdr.
and bath on 2 acre lot at 

Cunningham. Ph. 652-5003 or 
Mesquite 285-7023. MA tfc

FOR SA LE-----New ly
remodeled 2 bedroom 

home, $9,500. 350 S.W. 632- 
5663 or 5611, Bogata. MA 3-5

LET ME DO YOUR ex­
terminating. Good work 

done, low prices. Work 
g u a ra n te e d . 632-5903, 
Bogata. MA tfc

FORSALE 
houses. Call 

Bogata. MA 3-12

Cedar Martin 
632-5781,

FOR SALE-----Simmental
bulls, one and two years 

old. H. Drue Pirtle, 632-5051 
or 632-5302. MA 3-12

WILL DO YOUR house 
cleaning. Monday through 

Friday. 379-7771. M.X 3-12

FOR SA LE-----G eese ,
Guinneas, Bantams and 

other chickens. Call early 
a.m. or late p.m. 632-4358, 
Bogata. MA 3-12

FOR SALE-----500 bales
prairie hay, $.75 a bale. 

Payment and arrangement 
for pickup may be made with 
Octavis Westbrook. MA 2-26

FOR SALE-----Channel
gravel, delivered. C.L. 

Malone 785-3920 or 785-5065. 
MA 2-26

FOR SALE----- 4̂ bedstead,
good condition. Mattress, 

s{xings, new lounge chair. 
632-5689, Bogata. MA 2-26

FOR SALE---- 1975 Dodge
S w i n g e r ,  2 - d o o r ,  

automatic, air conditioned, 
low mileage, 632-5932, 
Bogata. MA 2-26

FOR SALE-----1977 Sierra
Grande, GMC Vt T. pickup, 

fully equipped, low mileage. 
632-5499, Bogata. MA 2-26

FOR SALE-----Rabbits.
Highway 37S. Last house 

before crossing Sulphur. 632- 
4422, Bogata. MA 2 26

FOR RENT—One and two 
bedroom apartments. Call 

652 4650 after 5 00 p.m. MA 
tfc

D E T R O I T  M e a t  
Processing—Custom 

killing, processing, and 
wrapping. Also feed lot beef 
available. 674-6911 or 674- 
5712. MA tfc

FLOWERS for all occasions.
Call Mrs. Gordon Allen, 

Representative. Clarksville 
Florist MA tfc

FOR SALE---- 1976 Ford 250
LWB pickup, 4-speed, 

$1850. 632-5857, Bogata. MA 
2-26

L IF E  INSURANCE— 
Woodmen of The World. 

Whole life-Term-Aniiuity.
F rank Herring 652-6972.

G E R M A N I A  F A R M 
MUTUAL—Low cost in­

surance. Homes, rent 
houses, farm buildings and 
machinery. Frank Herring, 
652-6972. MA tfc

BEST WISHES to all of my 
friends for a happy, 

healthy, prosperous 1981. 
Frank Herring Insurance. 
MA tfc

A R C H E R ’S HOUSE 
LEVELING and Foun­

dation Repair. Fix dragging 
doors. Work Guaranteed. 
Free estimates. Call 785-5829 
or 982-54’22 MA tfc

ED WILLIAMS, 632-5404 and 
Jim Bond, 632-4408, are 

buying house furniture and 
appliances or anything of 
value. MA tfc

SEE INEZ’S Beauty Shop for 
your Watkins Products, 

632-5139, Bogata. (MA 1-9)

LIFE INSURANCE: Or­
dinary Life; Mortgage 

Protection; Term. Garrison 
Insurance Agency, Bogata/ 
632-4346 or 632-5307. MA tfc

LOANS—For any purpose, 
any amount, $2,000 or 

more. Quick reply. Call (214) 
379-5661. MV MA tfc

IDO PROFESSIONAL tree 
trimming and removing 

service. Work properly done, 
g u a ra n te e d , 632-5903, 
Bogata. MA tfc

NICE BUILDING lots on N.
Main, Bogata, $3,000 and 

up. Maxie Lewis, 6^-5864. 
MA 3-12

FOR SALE---- 1976 Ford 250
LWB pickup, 4-speed, 

$1850. 632-5859, ^ a t a .  MA 
3-5

FX)R SALE—820 John Deere 
diesel tractor, disc, blade 

and hay hauler. 379-3063 
after 4:00. MA 3-12
IN TALCO, BOGATA and 

surrounding area—For all 
your plumbing needs call 
Rose Enterprises, 379-4531, 
Talco. MA tfc

FOR RENT—Lot for mobile 
home in the country, west 

of Talco. 379^063 after 4:00. 
MA 3-12

WANT TO BUY Browning or 
Remington Autimiatic shot 

gun. 632-5706, Bogata. MA 2-

WANT TO RENT OR 
LEASE farm or pasture 

land. Wendell Reeder, 632- 
4271, Bogata. MA 1-29

FOR SALE-----Kenmore
dishwasher and Kenmore 

compactor, 632-5143, Bogata. 
MA 3-5

LIKE A GOOD Neighbor, 
State Farm is there. For 

car, home, life and health 
insurance call; Harold 
Sheppard, 401 E. Main, 
Clarksville. 427-5614 after 
5:00, 427-3923. MA 9t

H E A T E D  A R E N A WMO R O M O  CO -
Mini Ads

WIMO ROOtO CO-RroOwoof I H B M  I  WMO R O M O  CO -RroAM or ■  ■ A
lo<ofton Ortva NarfK frofft OoKolb okoul M mil* on O f) I  m  I  Q 2maimii JSa I 3 Weeks, *3
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Blossom 
School News

By Paula Farmer 
and

Tonya Burdine
In Mrs. Gerringer’s room, 

they had a Valentine’s 
Party. They are going to 
have a numberfacts contest 
with Mrs. Wright’s room 
Wednesday.

In Mr. Jackson’s room, 
they had a party. They made 
Valentine mailboxes.

Mrs. Sugg’s 5-2 and Mrs. 
Singleton’s 5-1 both had 
Valentine partys Friday.

The 7th graders are having 
to leatn the countries flags 
and foreign states.

Mrs. Salter’s 6th grade 
gym class are getting ready 
to start with basketball. 
Good Luck!

In Mrs. Kessler’s 3rd 
grade room, they had a 
Valentine party. 'They made 
Valentine boxes. Winners 
were: first, Debbie Hurst; 
2nd, Donna Curry; 3rd, 
Leslie Fendley; most 
original, Ella Gene Reed; 
honorable mention, Dana 
Bradford, Damon Clement, 
Christy Townsend and Susan 
Richey.

In Mrs. Head’s 4th grade 
room, they have been 
waiting anxiously for some 
of their butterflies to hatch, 
which finally happened. 
TTiey wrote to their penpals 
in California. They also had 
a Valentine party. Their 
winners were: 1st, Missy 
Grissom; 2nd, Jeffrey 
Willcoxen; 3rd Byron Ayres; 
4th Angie Smith; honorable 
mention, P.G. Morrison.

42  Oiib Mĉ els
As stated in last week’s 

paper, Mrs. Johnnye Clayton 
won high score when the 
Tuesday 42 Club met, rather 
than Mrs. J(^nnie Warren. 
We regret the error.

The 7th and 8th graders 
played Pittsburg this past 
Thursday, Feb. 12. The 8th 
grade girls came out on top 
with a score of 35-15, the 7th 
grade girls and 7th and 8th 
grade boys fell short. 'This 
was the last game of the 
Blossom Junior High 
basketball season. The 7th 
and 8th grade boys coach 
was Bobby Rater. The 7th 
and 8th grade girls coach 
was Mrs. Rita Walter, whom 
the 8th grade girls would like 
to thank very much for a 
wonderful basketball season. 
The 8th grade girls won first 
in district.

O O  L

 ̂Lunck Menu.
Prairiland School 

Menu
March 2-6,1981 

Monday
Burritos
Chili and cheese
Green beans
Dessert
Bread
Milk

Tuesday
Ham and Cheese on bun 
Lettuce, tomatoes 
Potato rounds 
Dessert 
MUk

Wednesday 
Fried chicken 
Creamed potatoes 
Green beans 
Gravy 
Rdls 
Milk

Thursday
Pizza
Pinto beans
Salad
Dessert
Bread
Milk

Friday 
Hamburgers 
Lettuce, tomatoes 
Chips
Ic e  c re a m

[.illmar ('om niissioners Court Meets
received the designation the Sheriff’s Office budget byThe Lamar County 

Commissioners’ Court met 
last week for their regular 
February meeting.

Following the minutes. 
T reasurer’s report, and 
approval of a bond, the court 
considered three competing 
bids for designation of a 
County bank depository.

Paris Bank of Texas

with a bid of 16.26 percent, 
which was over three per­
cent higher than either of the 
other bids. The vote was 
unanimous with the ex­
ception of Precinct 3 Com­
missioner J.E. Buster, who 
abstained.

On a 3-2 split vote, the 
Court approved increasing

Hijshway Iniprovenients 
Hids Expected In February

BIG FISH—Dan Barnard, 
left, and Jerry Loven 
displayed a stringer of 
fish they caught at Pat

Mayse lake over the 
weekend. The irony of the 
picture is that the fellow 
who caught the most of

the fish, John Gifford, 
wasn’t present to have his 
picture made. (Staff 
Photo by Britt Barnard)

Milton News
By Mrs. Tully Temple

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Up­
church spent last week with 
his uncle, Mr. and Mrs. Jack 
Corley at Edinburg.

Mr. and Mrs. Donald Day 
and children visited Mr. and 
Mrs. James Brockway and 
son at Paris Saturday night.

Frank Lee visited his 
father, Jim Lee at Red River 
Haven Nursing Home 
Sunday.

Saturday guests of Mrs.

Irene Harvey were Mrs. 
Jack Hale and Mr. and Mrs. 
Ĉ ecil Roberts of Reno, Mrs. 
Fred Morphew of Paris and 
Mrs. Raymond Hoover.

Mr. and Mrs. C.M. Hobbs 
and Mutt Harvey were 
dinner guests of Mr. and 
Mrs. Buddy Malone at 
Deport Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. H.R. Up­
church of Fort Worth spent 
the weekend with Mr. and 
Mrs. Bill Upchurch.

Mrs. Jessie Lee Allen of

Deport and Mr. and Mrs. 
Don Driggers and boys of 
Reno were Sunday guests of 
Mr. and Mrs. Kenneth H. 
Allen and family.

Dale Williams of Faught 
spent the weekend with his 
grandparents, Mr. and Mrs. 
James Holt. Sunday guests

Bids for various highway 
improvements in Paris and 
for reconstruction of Farm 
to Market Road 905 are 
expected to be received in 
February by the State 
Department of Highways 
and Public Transportation.

District Engineer Robert 
S. Thomburrow said work in 
Paris will consist of resur­
facing the following high­
ways: Loop 469, from 6th 
Street S.E. to 20th Street

were Mrs. Greg Parks and 
Timothy of Faught and Mr. 
and Mrs. Johnny Holt, 
Christopher and Renea of 
Deport.

Mrs. Neal Yancey and 
Neva Yancey of Paris spent 
Sunday with Mr. and Mrs. 
Fern Rees.

S.E., a distance of 0.8 mile; 
FM 79, from Bonham Street 
to Loop 286, a distance of 1.4 
miles; FM 137, from 
Bonham Street to Loop 286, a 
distance of 1.6 miles.

FM 905 will be recon­
structed and resurfaced 
from one mile north of 
Clardy southward to FM 
1497, a distance of 7.1 miles.

$34,000 to hire four new 
jailers, bringing the total 
annual budget for the 
Sheriff’s Office, vehicles, 
and jail to approximately 
$400,000.

Voting in favor of the 
expenditure were Com­
missioners Doyle Childers, 
J.E. (CJene) Buster, and 
James C. Wheeler.

Voting against the funcfe 
were Commissioner Jimmie 
Sparks and (hunty Judge 
Brady Fisher.

The (hurt also heard from 
three groups requesting 
funding from the Chunty’s 
revenue sharing funds: 
Human Resources Council, 
Early Childhood Develop­
ment Program , and 
Association for Retarded 
Citizens.

In other busines,s the 
(hurt approved office ex-

Richard L. Stauter, penses for Precinct 3 Justice 
s u p e r v i s i n g  r e s i d e n t  of the Peach, authorized 
engineer in Paris, is the purchase of a heat pump, 
departm ent’s engineer in and two typewriters, and 
charge of the work. af^roved claims.

Be One Of The 101 On March 1 '81 In 
Sunday School At 

Deport Methodist Church.

llnm arried Taxpayers Must 
List D ependents

eligible to file as heads of 
household and if they do not 
qualify as surviving widows 
or widowers, they file under 
single status and use the 
corresponding tax table.

Mini-Ads 
3 Weeks For $3

j n r T T T r o  r e » »r r »^ T 'n rrr» T T i' T r r r r r r»TTnnr;

DEPORT
INSURANCE AGENCY
For All Your Insurance Needs

Local Independent Agency
a u t o  - FIRE - 

: HOME OWNER - FARM - BUSINESS; 
CALL 652-6211 Office 

Carlos Ladd Home 652-5635 
\ Kola Barnard Home 652-4650 

YOUR HOME TOWN AGENTS
egg l e ea a a a a a a a a a i a a a a a i t A . i a a a A A J i a

A common error of tax­
payers claiming head of 
household filing status is not 
listing the name of a 
qualifying dependent or 
child, and this can lead to a 
refund delay.

hoSehS CONSUMER VCHECKLIST
be unmarried and provide 
more than half the cost of 
keeping up a home that is the 
main home for his or her 
dependent or child. An un­
married child who qualifies 
the taxpayer as head of 
household must live with the 
taxpayer but need not be his 
or her dependent. Other 
qualifying persons must be 
the taxpayer’s dependents.
They generally must live 
with the taxpayer. However, 
the taxpayer’s dependent 
parents may qualify, even 
though they live elsewhere, 
if the taxpayer paid more 
than half the cost of keeping 
up their home and is eligible 
to claim one or both parents 
as dependents.

Unmarr ied  includes 
single, legally separated, 
divorced and widowed 
persons, the IRS said.

Without a child or 
qualifying dependent, un-

VELVET BLAZERS
To restore velvet pile 

after it begins to took 
crushed and shiny, hang 
the garment in your bath­
room while you take a 
steamy shower, then 
brush the velvet nap up 
with your hand or a soft 
brush.

-v>;

 ̂-"have a 
I nice weekend...

H ealth N e e d s 
F ille d  Fast

BRAD BURKS scores 
again. The Prairiland 
Patriots defeated the

and are still working 
toward a District 
Championship. (Staff

We Promise You 
Reliable Service
Your health is our 
prime concern. We 
can supply you with all 
your medicinal, vita­
min and first aid 
needs.

Come in!

CITY 
DRUG

P irS o v a r^  #

MUSTARD GREENS 3/$1 2/8 9 ’
J Folger's Instonf 10 oz. Jar

CRYSTALS 4
PORK AND o/$1BEANS Parade 16oz Can

MARGARINE ^04
Parhay Lb. 4 Stick » R eamer GREEN BEANS 3/$1

Porade Blue Lake Cut 16oz. Can w ®
TURNIP GREENS 0/$1

Parade Chopped 15 oz. Con 1
SALAD n!' 

DRESSING
LIMIT ONE WITH 
$10 OR MORE

PURCHASE ÂLL OTHERS
Qt. Jar pgQ. pnij-g

SWEET PEAS
Q /$1Parade 17 oz. Con a  ■

CORN MEAL
Aunt Jemima White or Yellow 1 2^̂ 

S Lb. Bag |
ROUNDSTEA K

^  $ 1 9 9^  y y W f  CHOICE b e e f "

TOWELS
O fKBounty Assorted Jumbo Roll •

RADISHES .
Fresh Red 3 oz. Pkg.

DEL MONTE Yellow

PEACHES
.........................

BISCUITS . . t |
Parade Homesfyle Can of 10 m 1

$109
Pratt's Shank Portion Cured Lb. 1

HAMS
PRATT'S SMOKED

$ 1 3 9
Cured V> or Whole

TAMALES
Wolf Brand 15 oz.

S T E W M E A T ^ ^
Leon Boneless Beef Lb. 1

TISSUE
CHARMIN

Assorted 4 Roll Pkg.

$ | 0 9

CAT FOOD .
Puss N Boots , 5 „  Con X / ^ 1  

FISH 1

SIRLOIN STEAK
$039Choice Beef Lb. ’

REFRESHING

PEPSI 
DIET PEPSI 

M O U N TA IN  DEW
$ 1 0 9

2 Liter Bottle

INSTANT TEA^
$099Nestea 3 oz. Jar ' ^

T-BONE STEAK
Choice Reef Lb.

TUNA OQ,
Starkist Chunk Style 

5 ’/t oz. Con

HAM
Center Sliced 

Smoked Cured

$]99

Store Hours; I H I ^ H  M R  Prices Good

B L w S S v M A
7 o.m. - 7 p.m. Welcome Food Stomp Shoppers

M B  We Reserve The

12 Noon-7 p.m.

i m u c t
Fresh Crisp Head

ONIONS ° ^
Fresh Green

HAM $ R 19
Prott s Butt Portion Cured Lb. ^

mm ngO B


