
Ju l 2 1 ,CJC Ubrarv
Rt 3  Bov; 3

m \ ner memorial library
CISCO JUNIOR COLLEGE

è

Cisco TEX 76437

THE CISCO
Hom e of 

C isco Jun io r  
C oliege PRESS Hom e of 

H ilton's First 
Hotel

The New s Of A Proud City Reported By Your Hom etow n Paper
Volum e 81 
N um ber 84 W eekend Edition 2 5 '

USPS No 113700
_  . Cisco, Texas 76437
S U n d e y )  O c t o b e r  Z 1 , 1 9 9 U  01990 EasHand county Newspaper^

The Cisco Lobo Band will 
be selling magazine subscrip­
tions beginning Oct. 30. The 
funds raised will be used for 
band activities and trips. If 
you have a subscription that 
needs renew ing or if you want 
to order new magazines, 
please contact a Lobo band 
member or call Yvonne 
McFadin at 442-3380 and 
she'll sec that a band member 
gets in touch with you.

More items for our Found 
Department. Keys were found 
at Lake Cisco recently and 
were turned into us. And 
someone found a Texas li­
cense plate, and we have it 
here, also. If you’re missing 
either of these, check with us 
during regular office hours.

The Cisco Junior College 
Wranglers were scheduled to 
play Tyler Junior College at 
7:3()p.m. Saturday atCitesley 
Field. You still have umc to 
make plans to attend the game. 
While there, don’t forget to 
check nut the Band Boo.ster’s 
Concession Stand.

Benefit Bake 
Sale Friday 
At Bank

ITtcrc will be a bake sale at 
First National Bank on Fri­
day, October 26, beginningat 
9 a m. to raise funds for Billy 
Boles to attend the Congres­
sional Youth Leadership 
Conference in Washington 
D.C. in Feburary.

This conference is by invi­
tation only and a small per­
centage of high school stu­
dents arc nominated Billy 
has been selected as one of 
the representatives forCi.sco 
and Texas. He will be a part 
of the legislative pixKess and 
attend several official func­
tions while in Washington.

Any donation of cash or 
bake gotxis will very much 
appreciated.

B illy is the son of Jerry and 
Cecelia Boles. Jerry works 
for the City of Cisco and 
Cecelia is employed by First 
National Bank.

Clothing Bank 
Now Open At 
Wesley Methodist

The First United Method­
ist Church and Wesley Mcth 
odist Church clothing bank is 
open at Wesley Methodist 
Church, located at East 11th 
Street and Avenue A.

The c loth ing bank has good 
warm clothing available for 
all members of the family. 
They also have several good 
coals which can be distrib­
uted to those needing them, a 
church spokesperson .said.

The Cisco Ag Boosters 
Club is selling memberships 
to the organization. They will 
have a called meeting at 7:30 
p.m. Tuesday in the high 
school ag department to dis­
cuss this. All members need 
to be there.

Cisco Scouts 
Taking Orders 
For Popcorn

Cisco Boy Scouts and Cub 
Scouts arc contacting indi­
viduals and busine.sscs tak­
ing orders for Trails End 
Popcorn. Orders for the pop­
corn will be taken through 
OcL 30, and it will be deliv­
ered during the second week 
of November, according to a 
report.

The Scout’s popcorn sale 
helps to provide supplemen­
tal income to finance Scout­
ing activities.

A bucket of Trail’s End id 
S5.

A 5-pack microwave box 
of Trail’s End is S5.

A 12-pack microwave box 
of Trail’s End is SIO.

A decorative canister of 
Trail’s End Caramel Com is 
$6.

M ake A M iracle  
H as Speakers 
Available Here

Make A Miracle OTTA 
(Organ Tissue Transplanta­
tion Awareness) was formed 
in March, 1990. Application 
into the coalition on Organ 
Tissue Transplantation 
Awareness of the Dallas and 
Fort Worth metroplex was 
submitted in May, and accep­
tance into the Coalition was 
granted in June.

The local organization was 
the first of its kind to be 
granted membership into the 
Coalition, another first for 
Cisco. Cisco’s organization 
is referred to as the first Satel­
lite.

Nelson and Mildred Geist 
of Scranton recently attended 
the Coalition Speakers’ Bu­
reau Training held at the 
Southwest Organ Bank in 
Dallas. It was a very informa­
tive program. Speakers arc 
available for school and civic 
organization programs. For 
anyone interested in cncac- 
ing a speaker, arrangements 
can be made by contacting 
Mildred Geist at 442-1528 or 
Penny Fields at 442-3535.

Dr. C.M. Cleveland Honored 
By Church Of The Nazarene

DAVID CRAIN

David Crane Will Lead 
Revival At East Baptist

CWF Will Sponsor 
Traditional Event

The traditioiuilly Christmas 
Bazaar annually offered by 
tiK First Christian Church 
Women’s Fellowship will be 
held the first Friday and Sat­
urday of November this year.

The special event was 
begun in 1%9, an idea pro­
jected by the late R.L. 
Medford, deacon of the local 
congregation. The aim was to 
assist with a fund toward 
building a new house of 
worship for the church fol­
lowing the condemnation of 
the former building which 
was to be razed due to a shift­
ing strata allowing the build­
ing to crack and become 
hazardous.

Before the idea of a bazaar 
congealed, the congregation 
had received substantial do­
nations augmented by pro­
ceeds from various events 
such as rummage sales, en­
chilada suppers, etc.

Among the early .support­
ers of the project w ere Norinc 
Guiles, Ruby Huffman, Bess 
Henry, Ethel Mae Lord, 
Johnie Cheshire, Flora Mae 
Lee, Virginia Hogue, Della 
McCarroll, Opal Moore and 
many others all now decea.scd, 
and Ruby Tullos, Ada 
Mobley, Reba Steffey and 
Nona Stevens continue their 
efforts along with many who 
have come into the congrega­
tion since. Mabel Fletcher is 
currently president of the

CWF and Hattie Weathers, 
bazaar chairman.

The tenure of Almon Mar­
tin, pastor, saw the fund dra­
matically enhanced and when 
the building debt had been 
absolved the funds were di­
rected chiefly to missions.

E.A. Sherwood was pastor 
when the new building was 
started.

An outstanding conuibu- 
tion to the new structure was 
the sale of a home bequeathed 
to the church by long-time 
members Jim and Mozelle 
Flournoy, deceased.

Aside from an interesting 
collection of items and baked 
goods offered for sale, the 
bazaar will include breakfast 
and lunch both days. The 
menu for breakfast will in­
clude sausage, eggs, biscuits, 
jam and coffee; the lunch 
fcaturing stew and combread.

Everyone is invited to at­
tend.

The East Cisco Baptist 
Church is cxc ited to announce 
the upcoming revival begin­
ning Sunday, October 28th 
and going through Wednes­
day, October 31st EasiCisco 
Baptist, under the pastoral 
leadership of Larry Linam, is 
seeking to invite each pcrsoii 
in Cisco to attend this revival 
meeting. The church has been 
instrumental this year in help­
ing to bring some moving and 
powerful spiritual events into 
Cisco. This again, is another 
effort to do the same; move 
and affect Cisco for Jesus 
Christ. Larry Linam, pastor 
of East Cisco Baptist, says, 
“This has been the biggest 
part of my vision and reason 
for coming to Cisco, Tx.; 
Which is to win souls to Jesus 
Christ, the answer to life’s 
perplexing times.”

David Crain is a high-en­
ergy, dynamic musician and 
speaker who will inspire and 
challenge you to live for 
Christ. He has several al­
bums on the market. His 
music is known for it’s vari­
ety of style. David has minis­
tered to thousands in the past 
several years in conferences, 
concerts, revivals, youth ral­
lies (like the youth Evangeh im 
Conference in Dallas where 
more than 5,(XX) attended), 
and youth camps. David 
makes his home in Grand 
Saline, Texas with his wife

Betty and two sons, Joshan 
and Caleb.

The revival schedule is as 
follows: Sunday morning is 
“Super Sunday” beginning at 
9:45 a.m. with Sunday Bible 
Study and revival services at 
10:50 a.m. and 6:30 p.m.

Monday thru Wednesday 
the services begin each night 
at 7:30 p.m. with a nursery 
provided each night. Also 
each night has a “special 
emphasis.”

S unday and Tuesday n ights 
we will have youth fellow­
ships after the services.

Monday night ischildren’s 
night with a fellowship be­
fore church time at 6:30 p.m. 
A Hot Dog Fiesta! Wednes­
day night will be family night 
with a coffee and cake fel­
lowship to follow the con­
cluding services. Make your 
plans to attend and come 
ready to receive a blessing 
from God!

Ag Boosters 
To Have 
Called M eeting

The Cisco Ag Boosters 
Club will have a called meet­
ing at 7:30p.m. Tuesday,Oct. 
23, at the high school ag 
department. The club is cur­
rently selling memberships 
and this project will be dis­
cussed. All members arc 
urged to attend.

Cisco High School Honor Roll Announced

Russell Newman To 
Open Outlet Store

Some exciting things are 
happening at the Russell 
Newman factory, according 
to Plant Manager James Laird.

A portion of the front of the 
'building i.s being sectioned 
off for an outlet store, Mr. 
Laird said. The outlet store 
will offer a wide selection of 
Items m anufactured by

Russell Newman and also 
some imported items.

Russell Newman has pur­
chased the Cypress Robe Co., 
which imports luxury robes, 
and these will be available at 
the outlet in addition to all

(Continued)

The Cisvo High School 
honor roll for the first six 
weeks period has been an­
nounced by Principal Phil 
Warren as follows:

FRESHMEN 
“A” Honor Roll 

Kerslin Gcrhardt, Brody 
Honea, Ann Hounshcll, 
Sandy Ingram, Christi Man­
ning, Anna Odom, Stephen 
Reich, Ginger Rhyne. Matt 
Scheafer, and Annie Wright. 

FRESHMEN 
“A-B” Honor Roll 

No more than 2 “B”s 
Am> Anderson, Carrie 

Conger, Rebecca Elliott, 
Angie Garvin, Shala Hilt, 
Ja.son Houghton, Brent Lee, 
Brenda McFadin, Andrew 
Moore, Emily Moyer, Bren­
dan Odom, Veronica Patton, 
Chad Pettigrew, Shane Th­
ompson, Connie W'ciscr, 
David Wil'- Ti 1'  ‘ ► in

Zeihr.
SOPHOMORE 
“ A” Honor Roll 

Holly Ritchie
SOPHOMORE 

“A-B” Honor Roll 
No more than 2 “ B”s 

Rickey Agnew, Melissa 
Battcas, Hiram Beckett, 
Angie Boyd, Jason Hunt, 
Tamara Lee, Lisa Moore, Jay 
Nixon, Cullen Rabcl, Jeremy 
Rhodes, Willie Sanchez, 
Robert Smith, and Tommy 
Thompson.

JUNIOR 
“A” Honor Roll 

Henry Ingram, Rachel 
Ingram, Curtis Lacy, Brandi 
McCulloch, Janccka Stroebcl, 
Daniel Summers, and Tiffany 
Thomas.

JUNIOR
“ A-B” Honor Roll 

No more than 2 “B”t  
C harity C oslett, Shilo

Sunday, September 30, a 
Homecoming was held at the 
Cisco Church of the Naza- 
rcnc to observe the 80th anni­
versary of the founding of the 
church in Cisco and to honor 
a long time member, Dr.C.M. 
Cleveland.

When Dr. Cleveland ar­
rived at the services he was 
unaware that the members, 
former pastors and their fami­
lies, and friends had come to 
show their appreciation for 
the many years of faithful 
service to the church.

Dr. Cleveland, a native sr>n 
of Cisco, had grown up on a 
ranch ten miles north of Cisco. 
He graduated from Cisco 
High School and spent a short 
time aflcrhisgraduation help­
ing his parenLs, Grover and 
Ella Cleveland, “work the 
soi I.” A desire to .sec the world 
lead him to join an older 
brother at Southern Nazarenc 
University in Oklahoma City. 
After completing three years 
atthc university in Oklahoma 
City he transferred to the 
Luscombe School of Aero­
nautics in Dallas. He was then 
employed as an Inspector 
Supcrvi.sor by Glenn L. Mar­
tin Aircraft, Baltimore, Mary­
land. While in Baltimore he 
married Josephine Cleveland, 
a native of Nebraska.

In 1944, Charles entered 
the U.S. Air Force as an avia­
tion cadet and a year later 
received his wings and was 
commissioned as an officer. 
After the war, he entered the

Northern Illinois College of 
Optometry in Chicago. Four 
years later he graduated with 
scholastic honors. With his 
degree in hand he returned to 
Cisco with his wife and small 
son.Chorles Bruce. His plans 
were to visit his parents and 
then find a location some­
where in Texas to practice his 
chosen profession.

While visiting in Cisco, tJtc 
local Optometri.st came to the 
ranch and asked him to take 
over his practice as he wished 
to relocate. After considera­
tion he opened his practice in 
1949 in The Reynolds Build­
ing. He practiced there until a 
new office was built at its 
present location.

Along with his work, he 
began to assume more rcspon- 
sibilities. He and his wife’s 
lives were enriched by the 
birth of a daughter, Carolyn 
Cleveland Knippers. He and 
his family also united with 
Cisco Nazarenc Church. His 
mother, Ella, was a charter 
memberof the church and her 
husband, Grover, joined the 
church after their marriage, lu .  
was here that he and his broth­
ers and one sister were intro­
duced to Christian principles.

Charles early training was 
to shape his life. He served 
well his church for 40 years. 
Five years were spent super­
vising the youth program. 
Later, Charles was elected 
Sunday School Superinten­
dent and served in this capac­
ity for 35 years. He resigned

this position in April, 1990. 
Concurrently he served on the 
Church Board of Directors. 
Along with others, he assisted 
in the planning and building 
of the present church at the 
comer of 10th and Avenue N.

Dr. Cleveland soon became 
known to many in the church 
and community as“ Doc.” He 
became a friend, helper and 
counselor to many. Members 
of the church often come to 
his home to share with him 
their concerns and to seek his 
couascl.

His interest in the young 
pcx>ple lead him and his wife 
to establish a scholarship fund 
for young people at the 
church. This enabled them to 
begin their education. .Some 
became ministers and arc now 
serving faithfully in their 
pastorates.

In I981, Dr. Cleveland 
received the Outstanding 
Laymen’s Award from the 
West Texas District of the 
Church of the Nazarenc.

During the Homecoming 
services. Dr. Cleveland was 
presented by the local church 
the Distinguished Service 
Award issued from the dem­
onstrations headquarters, 
Kansas City. Ks.

Dr. Cleveland has not lim­
ited his time only to his local 
church but is currently a 
member of Gideon Interna­
tional. He isaGidcon speaker,

(Continued)

Denison, Jim Bob Maples, 
Tina Rakes, Amy Saunders, 
Mary Solis, Jimmy Williams, 
Lori Yowell, and Sarah Zell.

SENIOR 
“A” Honor Roll 

Lcla Beckett, Kammie Fee, 
Michael Gosnell, Dicira 
Heamc, Clay Lorance, Misty 
McCi’lloch, Amanda McGin- 
ness, Kelly Rhodes, Keith 
Stowe, and Tammy Sullivan.

SENIOR
“A-B” Honor Roll 

No more than 2 “ B”s 
Billy Boles, Brack 

Dempsey, Phillip Gattis, 
Christy Holt. Kerrie Jessup, 
Marlena Trice, and Roy 
Worley.

R E A D  T H E  
C L A S S IF IE D S

DR. C.M. CLEVELAND was honored during the homecom­
ing at Cisco Church of the Nazarine on Sunday, Sept. 30. He was 
recognized for his many years of faithful service to the church. 
Shown in the above picture are Rev. Gary Pettigrew, pastor. Jack 
Roberson and Dr. (Cleveland.

Homecoming Parade Winners
The Cisco High School 

Student Council would like 
to thank everyone who helped 
to make this year’s Home­
coming Parade a huge suc­
cess. Every entry was appre­
ciated and enjoyed.

The winners for each divi­
sion were:

Civic Organization— Sen­
ior Citizens Rhythm Band

Commercial— Eastland 
County Crimc.stoppers

Student Organization— 
Cisco 4-H

Antique C ars— Roy 
Barnhill

Equestrian (G roup)— 
Ea.stland County 4-H HOrse 
Club

Equestrian (Individual)— 
Tessie Ingram

Classes of CHS (K-6)— 
First Grade

Classes of CHS (7-12) and 
Best Overall— Junior Class 

Originality— Senior Class 
Individual— Carl Whitley 

and Musicians 
Best Decorated Bicycle— 

Randy Little
The parade would not have 

been possible without the man 
volunteers who worked be­
hind the scenes to judge, line 
up and organize the parade. 
We would like to thank these 
people at this lime. The judges 
for the parade were Ruby Lee 
Pirtle, Mary Bob Leveridge 
and Jim Fitzgerald. Also judg­
ing antique cars were Rick 
Payne, Gary Rabel and Dick 
Scott. Tiffany Thomas, Jan-

ecka Stroebel and Rachel 
Ingram judged the decorated 
bicycles. Brad Kimbrough 
and Mike Thiberville loaned 
their golf carls as transporfi- 
tion for the judges, and Joe 
Wheatley furnished a trailer 
for the judges stand. Rex 
Fields, Emma Watts, Gail 
Summers. Amy Saunders, 
Kelly Rhodes and Kari Hull 
organized the entries. Con­
vertibles were furnished by 
OIin Odom, Sam Justice, Dan 
Dixon and Robert Kamon. 
We would also like to give a 
special “thank you” to Jim 

' Puryear for annowKing the 
parade entries.

Eris Ritchie served as our

Continued
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From Page 1

Cleveland
funnerly a  Oiaplain of the 
local Gideon Camp and is 
pieaently serv ing as President 
of the Gideon Camp which 
com prises five towns in 
Eastland County.

Charles joined in with many 
others to assist in any way he 
could to make Cisco a better 
place to live. He is a member 
of the Cisco Lion’s Club; a 
member and former Director 
of theChamberofCommcrce; 
son/eá on the CJC Board of 
Regents; the board of the 
Cisco Independent School 
District; and for several years 
Chairman of the Cisco Com­
munity Chest drive; besides 
being a former member for 
several years of the Cisco 
Hospital Board.

He IS also a member of the 
Texas Optoiuetric Associa­
tion. In l^W  the Amencan 
Optometric A.ssociauon rec­
ognized him for his contribu­
tion to the Field of Optometry 
and presented him a life 
membership.

A rugged man, endowed 
with the ancestral family traits 
of hixiesty. and a desire to do 
right toward his fcllowman 
has endured Dr. Cleveland to 
many. Mrs. Tnidc Pettigrew, 
lo ca l pastor’s wife, slated 
before the presentation that 
the poem written by William 
Dromgoolc in 1934 could 
well be the summary of Dr. 
Cleveland’s life:

“On old man, going along a 
highway.

Came at the evening, cold 
and gray,

to a chasm, vast and deep 
and wide

Through which was flow­
ing a sullen ude.

The old man crossed in the 
twilght dim;

The sullen stream had to 
fear for him.

But he turned when safe on 
the other side 

And built a bridge to span 
the tide.

‘Old man,’ said a fellow 
pilgrim near,

‘You arc wasting strength 
with buildings here;

Your journey will end with 
the ending day;

You never again must pass 
this way;

You have crossed the 
chasm, deep and wide;

Why build you the bridge 
at the eventide?’

The builder lifted his old 
gray head.

‘Good friend, in the path 1 
have come' he said,

‘There followeih a youth 
who must pass this way.

The chasm that has been 
naught to me.

To the faired-haired youth 
may a pitfall be.

He, too, must pass in the 
twilight dim;

Good friend. I’m building 
this bridge for him’."

MORAN NEWS
By Mrs. Luke Huskey

From Page 1 
Homecoming
grand marshall. We were 
pleased to honor Mr. Ritchie, 
who has worked hard over 
the years to promote Cisco 
and to serve its citizens.

Thanks, again, to all those 
named and the others too 
numerous to mention.

From Page 1
Russell Newman
types of lingcne and other 
goods made by Russell New­
man, Mr. Laird said.

The tentative opening date 
is scheduled for Friday. Nov. 
9. Plans call for the outlet 
store to be open Tuesday 
through Saturday from 9a.m. 
until 6 p.m.. according to Mr. 
Laird.

The plant is also enclosing 
a new break area for employ­
ees, Mr. Laird added

Boss Mfg. Co.
To Hold Reunion

The Boss Manuiactunng 
Company’s fourth annual 
reunion will be held Satur­
day. OcL 20, in the Corral 
Room on Conrad Hilton 
Avenue. Cisco. Registration 
will begin at I0a.m .

Garage Sale!!! 
Call 442-2244 For 

Classified Ad!

Business Services
MARY KAY 

Cosmetics
Martha Shirey 

707 W . 7 
442-4777 cio.

Fort W orth S u r  Tele 
gram delivery is Gary 
Fink. Call 442-3349 for 
a subscription.

C105

ALTON FRAZIER 
CONSTRUCTION 

New Homes. Remodeling. 
:«rpei.T ile. Airleis PeiniiiK^ 

' Cabinets
442-3130 Leave Message 

cn

DOZER SERVICE
T an k in g , b ru sh  push ing  
and  all types of d ir t work. 
$3S.OO & $45.00 per hour. 
M inim um 4 hours. Call Bob 
H allm ark, 442-2127. ^los

MINI V.'AREHOUSE 
STORAGE

.\s low as $25 month. Call 
442-3640. Cisco.

C102

HOLLIS WILLIAMS 
CONSTRUCTION 

Blown cellulose insula­
tion, metal construction, 
new homes, concrete, 
electrical worh and other 
remodeling nftds.

442-1933 or 44MB80

N OTICE: For home 
delivery of the Abilene! 
Reporter News! If  you 
live north of 8 i t  Street 
orW eslofAvcnueN,ca.l 
Morgan Fleming. 442-1

TIM BARTON 
CONSTRUCTION & 

INSULATION 
New homes, *dd-ons, 
cabinets, metal const^ 
concrete, electrica! work 
8i btwon cellulose insu­
lation. Call 442-3727 
after SiLB«. .  C104

The
Cisco Press 

wants to report 
your visitors, trips, 

awards

BIRTHDAY CLUB 
Eighteen members of the 

Moran Birthday Clubcnjoyed 
the October meeting at the 
Ridge Cafe in Breckenridge 
on Tuesday, Oct. 9. Remi­
niscing was enjoyed about old 
cars, gasoline, dates, and good 
limes of “our” early life.

The “ Happy Birthday" 
song was sung to Mrs. Ray 
Spurgeon and Lucion Brooks, 
who celebrate birthdays in 
October. Mr. and Mrs. Marvin 
Kays celebrated celebrated 
their 40lh wedding anniver­
sary on Tuesday. Congratu­
lations to the birthday hon­
orées and the anniversary 
honorées. Mr. and Mrs. Bud 
Brooks stated that they had 
been married 64 years. The 
birthday honorées were pre­
sented miniature cakes with 
one candle by the cafe.

those present were Frances 
Green. Elma May Huskey, 
Mac Dcllc Jones, Mildred 
Smith, Mr. and Mrs. Lucin 
Brooks, Mr. and Mrs. Bud 
Brooks, Imo Hilt, Mr. and 
Mrs. Ray Spurgeon, Mr. and 
Mrs. Marvin Kays, Modcllc 
Greene,Rena Brooks, Mr. and 
Mrs. James Garrett and C.L. 
Miller.

The club meets the second 
Tuesday night of each month 
at the Ridge Cafe in Brecken­
ridge, and you are invited to 
attend and enjoy an evening 
of fun and fellowship. The 
next meeting will be Novem­
ber 13 at 6 p.m.

Mr. and Mrs. Alvin Finn of 
Navasoia visited with her 
mother, Mrs. Lcla Moore, last 
week.

Remember the Moran 
Country Musical will be held 
on Friday night. OcL 26, at 
the Moran Community Cen­
ter with Sid Vickof Brecken­
ridge as Mastér ofCcremo- 

• riies.xAII area musicians are 
invi ted to attend and uke part 
in the musical. A concession 
stand will open at 6p.m. with 
sandwiches, homemade pics, 
tea, coffee and soft drinks.

Remember the Moran 
School Halloween Carnival 
will be held on Saturday nighL 
Oct. 27, at the Moran School. 
The carnival will start with 
the Spook Parade at the Moran 
Community Center. Follow­
ing the parade, food will be 
served in the school carnival. 
Various games and activities 
will follow. Come and enjoy 
the carnival land help the 
school.

Mr. and Mrs. J.R. Collins- 
worth are visiting relatives in 
East Texas.

Bryant Edwards received

treatment in Humana Hospi­
tal, Abilene.

Oliver Hock received ueat- 
menl in Humana Hospital, 
Abilene.

Thursday and Friday nights 
even though they got beat. 
Newcastle beat the Junior 
High Puppies by 78 to 33. 
Suawn beat the Bulldogs by 
40-10-8. Better luck next lime, 
boys.

Sara and Rebecca Bridges 
of Abilene spent the weekend 
with their grandparents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Wade Roberts.
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PIANO,
KEYBOARD, VOICE 

LESSONS
Beginner thru advanced 

Susan Wester
4 4 2 - 4 0 9 ^ _____________
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Mr. and Mrs. L.D. Ham­
mons visited with their daugh­
ter, Mrs. Charles Landsdale, 
and family in Victoria last 
week.

Mrs. Ruby Wiginglon of 
Midland and Kenneth Wig- 
ington of Lincoln, Neb., vis­
ited with their brother and 
uncle, Lucion Brooks, and 
Mrs. Brooks one day last 
week.

Mrs. Wilbur Mitchell is 
recuperating from an illness 
in the Blue Bonnet Nursing 
Home in Albany, and would 
enjoy having friends visit her.

Mrs. Estelle Harris and 
W ilton Hudman of Fort 
Worth spent the weekend with 
their brother, W illiam 
Hudman, and Mrs. Hudman, 
and attended the Deep Creek 
Picnic.
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Mrs. Ola Mac Funderburg 
of Breckenridge spent the 
weekend with her daughter, 
Mrs. Bill Shack, and Mr. 
Shack.

Mr. and Mrs. Marvin Kays 
arc representing Moran Chap­
ter No. 591, OES, at the Grand 
Chapter Session in Amarillo 
this week.

Gladys Briggs of Kent, 
Washington, and Hazel Rudd, 
of Mapel Valley, Washing­
ton, are spending the week 
with their brother. Dale Tol- 
lefson, and Mrs. Tollefson.

Mr. and Mrs. Alvin Hus­
key and grarzldaughier, PJ., 
visited withhersisters, Sandy 
Huskey, Pal Kinnison. and 
Mrs. Don Boycit and Mr. 
BoyelL Sunday.

Mr. and Mrs. Hubert 
Brewster of Eden were greet­
ing relatives and friends in 
Moran Saturday and attended 
the Deep Creek Picnic.

Sixty-nine people regis­
tered for the Deep Creek 
Picnic Saturday held at the 
R.W.Brooks Picnic grounds. 
Much remini-scingand games 
were enjoyed. David Pamsh 
received the award for being 
the oldest person prescnt.Mrs.
Ura Mac Wood traveled the 
furthcrest to attend. Nathan 
Tonne of Breckenridge was 
the youngest person present. 
Each received an award. 
Towns represented were 
Cisco, Breckenridge, Green­
ville. Eden, Albany, Hamil­
ton, Kaufman, Houston, 
Burkbumclt, Abilene,Moran 
and Fort Worth.

The Moran Junior High 
football team and the Moran 
Bulldogs played good games

Bill Howard of Midland 
spent the weekend with his 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Jim 
Howard.

Lutherans To 
Have Bake 
Sale Saturday

Redeemer Lutheran Sun­
day School is sponsoring a 
bake sale to help defray 
medical expenses which were 
incurred by Brad Fleming 
after his automobileaccident.

The bake sale will be at 
Wal-Mart in Eastland Satur­
day, Oct. 20, beginning at 9 
a.m. Anyone wishing to make 
a donation of cash or baked 
goods has been asked to bring 
them to Redeemer Lutheran 
Church on Friday between the 
hours of 1 and 3 p.m. or con­
tact Janice Winge at 442-1550 
or Donna Reich at 442-1422.

As always Wal-Mart will 
match all funds made at this 
sale.
Benefit Garage 
Sale To Be 
Held Saturday

The employees of Mott’s 
Variety Store will hold a 
benefit garage sale for Barry 
Pointer’s kidney fund on 
Saturday ,OcL 20, from 8 a.m.
until 6 p.m. at 612 West 11th 
SuecL Cisco.

Some of the items offered 
will include bar stools, rock­
ing chair with foot stool, gar­
den tools, curtains, bed­
spreads, clothes, shoes, jeans 
and many other items.

Shower To 
Honor Coxes

The Women of the Couples 
Class at East Cisco Baptist 
Church arc giving a baby 
shower honoring Baby 
Heather and mother, Deona 
Cox. All friends arc invited 
to attend. The shower will be 
Sunday, Oct. 22. from 8 to 
9:30 p.m. in Nance Hall on 
Cisco Junior College Cam­
pus.

For further information 
contact Karen Frazier, 442- 
4288, after 6 p.m. or Jenny 
Lawrence, 442-4733, after 6 
p.m.

CISCO HIGH SCHOOL Lobo Marching Band was to par­
ticipate in the District 1)1L Marching Contest at Shotwell Sta­
dium in Abilene Saturday, Oct. 20. The band was to line up at 
12:18 p.m. and march at 12:23 p.m. Wayne White is band 
director. Shown in the above picture is the 1989 Lobo Band 
during rehearsals for the marching contest last year.

( hiirch Services
Redeemer Lutheran 

Church

^ou And Your Living Fait^

Our worship service at 
Redeemer Lutheran Church 
begins at 8 a.m. Pastor 
Mangone’s message is en­
titled “Can This V incyard Be 
Saved?” and is based on Isaiah 
5:1-5.

Sunday School and Bible 
Class begins at 9:15 a m. 
Today the LWML/LLL Fall 
Rally will be held here at 
Redeemer starling at 2:30 
p.m.

Monday, First year Confir­
mation is at 3:30 p.m. Sec­
ond ycarConfirmation at4:30 
p.m. and Adult Instruction 
Class is at 5:30 p.m.

W ednesday, Nursing 
Home Worship is at 10 a.m. 
Choir practice is at 7 p.m.

Saturday, At 6:30 p.m. Big 
Country Lutherans will hold 
a 100 year Celebration Ban­
quet at the Sweetwater Coun­
try Club. Cost is $10 per 
person.

Next Sunday. The Circuit 
Convocation will be held at 
Zion Lutheran, Abilene at 4 
p.m. with a catered meal at$5 
per person.

NEWSPAPER 
DEADLINES: 

Monday 5:00 p.m. 
(For Thursday Paper) 

And
Thursday, 5:00 p.m. 
(For Sunday Paper)

f  USE IHE I
ICiAssinEDsJ

TH E ' 
CISCO PRESS 

• hunday, 
October 21,1990

ikitnbrougf) jFuneral Jhoint
Brad Kimbrough -Director

442  1211
Monuments 300 W. 9th Street
Pre-Pald Funeral Contracts 
Burial Insurance
Cisco. TX 76437 P.O. Boic 1191

^Painting Storm Doors 
Concrete Storm Windows

Cisco, TX 76437 
817/442-2346

Benton Lacy
t o t a l I i o m e  b u i l d i n g

AND REMODELING
t il e  v in y l  s id in g

V.CABINETS CIO« ADDITIONS ,

HARGRAVE INSURANCE 
AGENCY^

t a '

1106 CONR AD HILTON 
CISCO, Tex.

Personal Sales & Service For 
Home Insurance 
Car Insurance

Coinmerical Business Insurance 
Mobile Home Insurance 

& Travel Trailers 
Boat Insurance 
Life Insurance 

Bonds of All Kinds

Shirley A. Hargrave 
442-2337 ^

£
% Dental
■ ^ Dialogue

^  by Cone C. Rice, D.D.S.

Dental Emergency
Q.Whu ii contidered t  mie denul 
emergency?
A. BeiiceUy there ire three: when a 
pMicni expehencee tuddoi revere 
pain.whenaloolh hat been knocked 
complelely out, or when there ii un- 
unidly heavy Ueeding after dental 
(urgeiy. In there ittuatiant you are 
enblled lo inuncdiale atlention by 
your doitiu, even if il bappeni to be 
Uie weekend. Of colare, if you've 
had pain for reveral dayi ano doni 
gel around to calUng your denuai 
until Sunday morning, you may not 
gel much lympathy. But moat den- 
UMi will work you into their week­
day ichedulet, or, if il'i a weekend, 
make arrangemenla lo open i h ^  
office for you. Someiintca a pain 
preacfipiKn can tae you through O ld 
Monday when the office ti open. If 
you heve an emergency ana cani 
read! your dentil*, go lo the naareM 

dlaiemthoaili I emergency room.,<ag w

Ih ii cohotm ia prerenled ki the 
inlereit of belter danlal health. If 
you have any dental queatiani 
you would like aniwered, pleare 
ccntact die office of 
Dr. Con« C. Rica 
M3 Em I Main Str.
EaailaiMl, Tasat 
Pirene; S17-624-3M3

Here is anoiJicr article about 
you and your living faith. 
Today we will show you some 
words about the Word per­
taining to the fact that God 
created us body and soul.

Some hold the mechanistic 
view that human beings arc 
basically only physical. They 
would reduce us to creatures 
with only a body. But God 
created Adam and Eve with a 
body and soul.

As for the body that God 
gave our first parents and 
through them to all of us, wc 
agree with the psalmist that 
wc are “fearfully and won­
derfully made." We have a 
brain by which wc think,eyes 
that see, cars that hear, a heart 
that heats. These members of 
the body cannot be duplicated 
in laboratories.

Built into the body is a 
mind, and with it a soul, or 
spirit. These arc closely 
united; they constitute one 
complete human being. In 
the Bible the word “soul” 
sometimes denotes the whole 
person. When the Virgin 
Mary began her Magnificat 
with “My soul magnifies the 
Lord," she was saying “1 
magnify the Lord.” At the 
same time “soul” also stands 
for a spiritual, immortal 
component of the human 
being, as Jesus’ words show: 
“Don’t fear those who kill the 
body but cannot kill the soul; 
rather fear Him who can de­
stroy both soul and body in 
hell” (Matt. 10:28).

The above soul-body dis­
tinction is a dechotomy, that 
is, a two fold division of 
human nature. The Bible also 
uses trichotomy, as does St. 
Paul: “May you spirit and 
soul and body be kept should 
and blameless at the coming 
of our Lord Jesus Christ” 
(Thess. 5:23).

Soul, SpiriL mind, and heart 
(seat of emotions) are closely 
related, Jesus tells us to love

God with all our heart, soul, 
and mind.

With death comes the part­
ing of body and soul, to be 
reunited in the resurrection. 
Through the shedding of His 
blood and His rising again, 
Jesus Christ redeemed total 
persons, and it is total per­
sons, with glorified bodies 
like His own body, that He 
wants to have with His in 
eternal life.

Interested more about your 
living faith and your living 
God? Then lake lime in your 
life and attend the Christian 
Church of your choice. Take 
lime to praise and worship 
our God. Father. Son and Holy 
Spirit whocreated you—body 
and soul. (Read Psalms 139). 

Rev. Charles Mangonc 
Redeemer Lutheran 

Church

First Christian 
Plans Visitation 
Sunday Oct. 28,

First Christian Church of 
Cisco is planning a V isilation 
Sunday October 28 to extend 
to the community an invita­
tion to worship.

Special music and fellow­
ship are planned and CJC 
students are especially ex­
tended an invitation.

“Wc feel the church needs 
to reach out more to spread 
the word, and those that seek 

peace and happiness in their
lives can tnily find it in God’s
House,” according to the 
pastor, Dick Summers. Rev. 
Summers is preaching from 
the Book of Acts at this lime 
and it is exciting and reveal­
ing. “Just uy it and give God
achance to work in your life!”

I Need Your 
Vote Nov. 6! 

Reggie Pittman

Garl D. Gorr 
Real Estate Brokerage 

807 Conrad Hilton, Ave., Cisco 
442-3642 or Night 442-1642

Three bedroom, two b«th, in very good condition, good location, 
priced right and anxious to tell.
6 ^  acres good ranch land, good location, 1 minerals ind  price 
is r igh t
Another three bedroom, two bath frame dwelling, plenty ground 
with it and you will like it and the price.
90 acre# good g ru s  and timber, cloae to paved road and not far 
from town.
Attractive two bedroom cottage, paved tireet and good location. 
Two bedroom frame, very gowl. central air and heat. If  price has 
anything to do with it you'll buy this one.
We have a three bedroom place with acreage.
Nice two bedroom dwelling with yard lull m  beautiful oak trees. 
Two bed room, living room, dining room, kitchen on paved street 
eb se  to store. #
Two bedroom, livable dwelling on paved itreet, make an offer 
and we m itó t juat lot you have It.
Near new hrick dwelling with land. If you want a fine place this
is i t
Anodter fine brick dwelling with lota of extraa, tom e land to. 
295 aciea o f good p a ta  land, ooniider offer.
Good commercial building, situated good for moat busineaa'a. 
400 acres good huntme and good grass.
A nice unique type o f  commerical building, located good for 
many buaineaa’s.
Large rock dwelling with plenty of room inaide, would like an 
offer.
Look, three bedroom two bath on paved Street would consider just 
»aUIws«  tK* fXAvmMitR v n ii r>M*t thftL

some minerala.
______________________ ________ ________ Iota o f uaea.
435 Acre* »o«J grasa land. . . . .
One o f thè fineat frame dwellinga in Cisco, inaide and out. You 
caratot help but like i t
Wa bava nearly SO housca m d  iraets of land fai m d  around Cisco 
Naturally we want U> aell them and we arell

Come On In!!!
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Classic Film At Majestic Sunday Thru Tuesday Mushrooms at Last! 4-H Rough Riders
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The Eastland County 4 H 
Ruff Riders met Sc|Hember 
17, IddO for the first meeting 
of the year. New oft leers were 
installed hy Teresa Ingram, 
Adult Iw'aik'r Offieers forthe 
new year are President, 
Rrxky Ingram, Second Vice 
President, Michael Rabh; 
Third Vice President, Iracy 
Ingram; Secretary, Dena 
Rogers; Council Delegate, 
Chance Bush; Treasurer, 
Tessie Ingram; Reporter, 
Clayton Carnuk k; Parlimen- 
tarian, David Williams; llis- 
Uwian, Holly (ireenwinKl

Rrvky Ingram, FTesident, 
read the club by-laws since 
tlKTC has K’d i such an in 
rease in club membership 

Reports were given concern 
ing parades the club lias par­
ticipated in. Ilie riders have 
traveled to Ciorman, Rangci 
and Easihuid. placing at Cior 
man and Ranger.

A play day has Iven si lk’d 
uled for Satiinkiy, (Xtobi'r 
2t), to begin at one o ’cliKk 
This w ill be Ik'ld at die R;inger 
Rikk’o Arena

('layton ('a rn ia  k.
Re|H)rier

An experiment in growing mushrooms on logs is coming to fruition for Dr.j 
Charles and Anna Barnes. The mushrooms are in flower on logs implanted withi 
the seed several months ago at the Cabo Ranch northwest of Rising Star. »

( isco I’ress - lùislland relegraiii
Kaii îtT rimes

Suniiay, October 21, 1990

Priscilla Lanegives Cary (¡rant a good swift kick when she finds out there's 
insanity in his family in Frank Capra'.s, "Arsenic and Old Lace."

How about a Halloween 
movie - scary, yet sophisti­
cated and funny?

All lhc.se things arc in­
cluded in the Warner Bros. 
Cbssic movie “Arsenic and 
Old Lacc," showing at the 
Majestic Theatre in Eastland 
Sunday,Oct. 21 at2p.m.,and 
Tuesday, Oct. 23 at 7:30 p.ni.

Tickets will be S4.iX)at the 
box office, or you may still 
cnroilforihc 1990-91 classic 
sca.son for S30.(X). This en­
titles you to 12 tickets to be 
used any way you wish.

“Arsenic and Old Lacc" 
stars Cary Grunt, Priscilla 
Lane, Raymond Massey, 
Josephine Hull and Jean 
Adair. Therc^ arc alst) pthef' 
character parts and “bit” play^'

ers who add a lot to the mo v ic. 
The picture was directed by 
Frank Capra.

“ Ibis film is one of my 
favorite movies,” says Ed 
Allcorn, Manager of the 
Majestic Theatre. “ It was 
ctMnplelcd in 1942. but not 
released to movie Theatres 
until 1944, due to the conuo- 
versy surrounding rtic film’s 
subject matter.

“At that time it was consid­
ered sh<Kkiiig...to think that 
tw o sweet litticold maid aunts 
would lure men into their 
parlor and give iJiem Elder­
berry wine laced with |H ) i - 
son...”

The film opens with the 
■ words: “1 his is a Halloween 

( -tale ui UriMiklyn wtk rc ony-

IMPORTANT--PLI:ASK RKAI)
W e l A  (hal y»Ki please c h n k  yiiur ad the firs t day *4 p u h lk a tio n  
and re p o rt to the  Kastland f 'o u n ty  Nes%spapi'rs any ern»rs or 
c<NTelh»ns a t th a t lim e. H ours are  K:00-5:00 M on.-Fri. I’h e c o r re i-  
liiHis will he m ade in the next issue. ! he Kaslland ( ’»Hinly Newspa­
pers will he rcsponsihle for only tme in n u rv il  insiTtion with liahil- 
ity lim ited to tha t p<»rti<»n(»nhead>erlisemenl alTei le d h ) the e rro r . 
Ri*<|ucsts fo r ad justm en ts «»r eo rreslions <»n hiart*«*s m ust he m ade 
within 30 days o f the ad*s expiration .
INihllshers liability o r  dam ages resullinK from  e rro rs  in any adsiT- 
tisinK th a t is published shall he liiniled lo the am ount ailua lly  
received by the l*luhlisher lo publish the adsertisen ien t in question 
It shall not he resptm.sihle fo r any oaiseq u en tia l damapt*s siiflered 
hy any p a rt.
T he K-astland (bounty N ew spapers r e s tr s e s  the r k h t  lo reject any 
and all ads considered hy the P ublisher to he o fjed ional in siihjesi 
malUTt phrase<»lo^y,or op|Htsed the  public in terests «»r the pidiey of 
the  new spaper.
T hcad>erlis.ser and /o r adserlisln^» ayency will pay f»»r the atto« ne> 
fees and pay fo r any Judgem ents a^alnsl the p u h liih e r  that are 
caused hy the publication  of any ad^erlisem enl suhinittt'd  hy <»r 
published at the d irection  of the ad vertiser a n d 'o r  adverllsinj; 
agency.
N i)TIC K : acceptance of th is M'i*diile also con.stiluli*s an ageemeiif 
th a t all unpaid  balances will he subject to an 1 1/2^/t per nom lh tale 
charge am ounting  to IH% Al*R. In the event of default in paym ent 
term s, advertiser agrees lo pay all reaw m ahle collection charges 
an d /o r a ttorney fees. All accounts due hv the lOih.

Kasllund Telegram 629-1707 
Cisco Press 442-2244 

Ranger Times 647-1101

KING INSURANCK AGENCY 
REAL ESTAI E

207 Main Ranger 
647-1171

PAMPERED AND PETTED, inside and out, newly 
decorated inside, built-in GE microw ave, abundent storage 
and built-ins, large back yard, with pecan and fruit trees, 
BR 3 BR, 2 bath, CH A, fireplace, brick dwelling. Reduced 
to $57,500.00
3 BR, 1 RATH, living RM, dining rm, 2 lots, frame 
dwelling, new nraf, $20,(XX).(X)
2 BR, 1 BATH, living Rm, dining RM, kitchen with 
builtins, fireplace, large storage, workshop, 1 car garage, 2 
car carport, fenced back yard, CH A
3 BR, 1 BATH living Rm, den, kitchen, 5 loLs, Reduced 
to $12,000. Make offer.
BEAUTIFUL COUNTRY LI VIN(i on 60 wtxxlcd acres,
2 stock tanks, very nice B V dwelling, 2 BRs, 2 baths, large 
living-dining area with fire place, large den (or extra BR, 
plenty of closet space, CH A, 1.2 miles from city limits, 
GOOD HUNTING
3 BR, 2 Bath, CHA, fenced yard, 3 carport, fruit trees, 
storage bldg. Rea.sonably priced.
4 BR, 2 Bath, large Family RR, Utility rm, carport

OPAL KING-BROKER LEE RUSSELL
«47-1171 «47-13X3

NEED LISINTGS TR Y US

thing can hap|X'n - and it 
usually dix's!”

Cary Grant is a New York 
Drama Critic - a symbol of 
bachclorhixHl who has writ­
ten a Nx)k tilled “Marriage, 
A Fraud and a Failure.” 

Nevertheless, he is aNiui 
to marry Priscilla Lane, a 
Vicar’s daughter. He slyly 
obUimsaniarriiigc license and 
gix's home to find his two 
dear old Auiius up to their 
favorite tricks. The help 
“lonely old men find ix'acc” 
by feeding them poisoned 
wine, and ihen have their 
brother dig graves 

Ihiiigs gel pretty compli­
cated before a great sur|irisc 
ending. It you’re a first-time 
viewer, you’ljneverguess die 
outeomei ■ .■

Eight months alter the seed 
(spahn) was implanted in 
Rising Star o;ik and pecan 
logs, the harvest ol mush- 
riHiiiis has bcgnii lor Dr. 
Cluirles aiul Aiiii;i Barnes at 
their Cabo Ranch northwest 
ol town.

This cx|xriiiieni began m 
February and it w asn’iknow n 
precisely how long it would 
take for tlic mushrixinis lo 
grow to (lowering maturity. 
Harvest should (xcuron these 
logs s|X)radically for the next 
four years.

These particular mush- 
rtxims are of Japanese origin 
and known us Shiiuikc, or 
Golden Brown variety. The 
Barnes’ say they taste won­
derful and the quality is cx-

YOU ALWAYS HIY 
YHI MARK WlYH

THE CLASSIFIEDS

Attn: Eastland Weight Watchers

Weight Watchers in Eastland changing 
to coninuinity meeting for more infor­
mation come to First Christian Church 
on lucsday, Oct. 23rd at 5:45 p.m. No 
ohiigation.s. For more information call

1-800-792-1126
UV m usi hare 20 pre paid members to 

eovtinue in Eastland

' ^ A T T E N T I O N ' '
(■round School & C ertified  
Flight Instruction starting soon 
for more info contact Billy Ly erla 
639-2538 after 6:00 p.m. or come 
by Eastland Municipal.

ChRt7

Rescue
Line
For Women

RuthSlewart, M.Ed.
Q . Wh»l »rc ihe four su g e t of the pcraontlily idcnuficirtion 

p n x c ii?
A.Thcre ire  f p tthw tys lo idciuity:
I . Icienlily l-orcclosuFc occurs when the individual lives according 

to standards and goals set fonh by ihe parents Family tic . and stong 
rcligiiws affiliation usually predominate The partiUs have spent a great 
deal of quality lime with the child and then in adolescence and early 
adulihsHKi these expccuticns are carried out. Peer influence is not as 
strung as family and religious regulauons. The type of penon who hat 
Idnemy i-oiccloure does not experience identity crises a t compared lo 
■he other pathways lo identity

2. IdenUly Achievement is Ihc process o f testing options Once they
...........  . . .  inaividti ' ...... ' ' '■

:nisi 
he c 
ouraged

to  find out for themselves what tney liked

have been personally tested the individual commits lo a way of living 
T hrie  individuals may have had pa rents who were absent or unabailable 
for comments about tl
also ihai the parents may have encouraged the child's own decision

aw...aw.wa aaiw. MMivawwaH X.\m
lay have had parents who w____
I the dcicmm in the child's early yean. It iipossiblc 

; child's own ifcciti
making to  fin'd out for themselves what they liked

} Moralonum is the active ex p lo ra lo ry ^ a ic  Peer picssurct cause 
much cxpenmemalion wiht morabty, dnigt or religions. There is a lack 
of cs'mmiUticnl. There is often a lack of follow through. These individu 
als aiT usually easily persuaded to  try new things

4. Identity IXffusHm ii neither crisii or oommitment. Childhood 
lesolutioni are abandoned, hut there if a drifting or avoidanoe of the 
idefitification task. SOURCT, l utding llen c lf  Ruthellen Jossd ion

Questions should be addressed to:
Rescue Line 
P.O. Box 269

{'i.sco, Texas 76437 ctrkm

ccIL’ni.
Thoorclivally each log 

shouUI produce about Sit) 
worth ol iitushrtHtms each 
year \tiih iitiminiiut labor on 
the [tari of ihe lamier. Trees 
are cut during ilie tv inter and 
it tikes alxnil 10 ittimiies lo 
implanl ihe spahn in each 
long. Since many lariiis biill- 
do/e our shiiinery oak trees lo 

'clear fields, there slxtuld be 
an ample supply of logs in 
this aea. Logs mast be kept in 
the shade while nialuring. 
Barnes also kepi his wei w iih 
a sprinkler lo kevp ihe sum­
mer iemper;ilures down.

County Tiger 
Cubs To Meet

Ea.stluiid County Tiger 
Cubs will meet at 7 p.m. 
Monday, Oct. 22, a the T U 
Electric Reddy Room in 
Eastland. The young boys will 
have Halloween activities and 
interested boys are invited lo 
attend.

F*uni|)kin carving and fel­
lowship will be pan of the 
agenda.

F'lcasc bring a pumpkin lo 
pariicipalc in the activity or il 
not one will be provided.

IMeasc coniacl Sylvia 
New ion 442-4144 or Sharon 
Rixlriciuc/ 629-2757.

I . »  >
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CAR CARE
For:
* Safety
* E conom y
* Value
You Can Depend On 
the Factory 'frained, 
F u ll-S e rv ice , T otal 
Car Care Center, At 
C ald w ell’s

A Good 
Investment

110 HI II M \IN | F>iAN< I Uf  ̂t M l( I AH 4 aii ».im ' ««ai tim«-. M4m«*« «n«l

Factory Authorized Service From 
Certified Mechanics Who l ake Pride 
In Pleasing Their Customers. c» eat

SEE u s  TODAY!
ON ALL MAKES HERE!

JIM CALDWEIvL 
MOTORS

Highway 80 K
Faslland - 817-629-2636 motors Hurrs

Olds - Cadillac - Pontiac - lUiick - GMC

Read 1 he ('lassifieds

"Find The Fake" Contest
RacIt Wcck a “l;tkc” adver- 

lismciii w ili ho placai in oiir 
('lassifiod Scclion. One Ma- 
jcslic pass Wall bc gi ven away

lo lite tirsi person, w ho clii’s 
the ad oui and hi mgs ii in lo 
the office nearest you.

NO PHONE CALLS will 
bc accepted.

escue Cine
Battered, abused, alcoholism, suicidal, 
divorced, troubled marriage, etc.

There is free help for 
Eastland County Women
Listen to KVMX 97 FM. 442-4479 

6:00-7:00 Monday night cerkm

Æk. *
/ A  i l .
m iirn iLW.VTV

Introducing broasted chicken ai 
The Store

520 West Main, Ranger 
Call in order welcome 

647-5265

21 piece bucket chicken 
with broasted potatoes 

and rolls for $12.88

THE BEST 
OT THE YEAR ARE HERE

On All Remaining 1990 Model's
* 1990 Oldsmobile 98's Reduced

$4,000.00 ♦
* 1990 Oldsmobile 88's Reduced

$3,500.00 ♦
* 1990 Oldsmobile Calais SL Re­

duced $3,000.00 *
* 1990 Cadillac's All Reduced 

$5,100.00 ♦
* 1990 Pontiac (irand Prixs 2 & 4

door Reduced $3,000.00 *
* 1990 (iMC Suburbans Reduced *

$3,600.00 ♦
Plus (jiiant Discounts on every 90 in 

Stock PLUS
YOUR TRADE IN WELCOME 

♦ Includes Factory Rebate Assigned 
to Dealer*

JIM CALDWELL 
MOTOR CO.

(':idillac-()l(ls-Hiiick-Poiitiac-(»M C  

Ihty. SOF. Eastland

629-2636



Anniversary

Honran ami R»ih lUunil- 
UW1 will bc homifoil 
nxcpiion on ihoir M)ih wcd- 
ilinj; annivo'rsary SumLiy .(Xi. 
2 11roti! 2 p.m. lo4 p m. al ihc 
WtMiion’s Club in hasilaml.

Hi)si'> ili bc ihcir son ami 
(laui;hu'r in law, Owi>;ht and

Belinda Har.a'.ton ot F^stland 
and ihc ir grande hi lilrcn. Rieh- 
anl, James, Chris(ophcr and 
K. e . Hamilton of Eastland 
ami Mr. and Mrs. Everett 
Wtxxlsof Abilene.

The couple invite e'ach of 
their friends to share this 
happy time with them.

Hible.s C elebrate 50th A nniversarv

Mr. and Mrs. Ernest Bible 
celebrated their 50ih Wed­
ding Anniversary Oct. 14, 
Id^O at Calvary Baptist 
Church. Rev. Ronnie Shack­
elford performed the repeat­
ing of their marriage vows. 
Their children, family and 
friemLs had a wonderful time.

The cake read “Happy 50th 
Anniversary Mom & Dad, W'c 
laivc You.”

The fellowship hall was 
ilecoratcd in gold streamers 
ami a pair of wedding bells. 
The bibic .scripture read for 
the (Kcasion was Psalms 
127:3-5andallof Psalms 128.

A woiiderlul dinner fol­
lowed at Sherry Purdoms. Mr. 
Nonnan and Mrs. Audio Bible 
Hardin^ Mike and Sherry 
Bible Purdom their daughter, 
hosted the anniversary. 
G randdaughters, Melissa 
Vass, Tiffany, and Crystal 
Purdom decorated the build­
ing.

The other children attend­
ing were Mr. fXin and Chris 
Bible, Mr. and Mrs. Jim Bible, 
Mr. and Mrs. Mark Bible, 
Derrick and Brent, Larry 
Bible, Ricky Bible, S;indra 
and Bobby Bible.

We thank the Lord for giv­
ing us this special day.

jRanger Auction Reporl̂ j
The Market at Ranger 

Auction was steady on stocker 
calves and feeder yearlings. 
Cow & calves and springers 
sold fully steady on a run of 
750 head of cattle at its sale 
Thursday according to Jackie 
Genuy Reporter.

COWS; Choice, 52-56; 
Good, 57-61; Canners, 42- 
52; Stockers, 600-750a head.

BULLS; Bologna, 62-71; 
Stockers, 70-77; Utility, 50- 
60.

STOCKER STEER 
CALVES: Choice; 2(X) .300 
lbs, 1.15-1.37; 3(K)-4(X) lbs, 
1.05-1.15;400-.5(X) lbs, l .(XI- 
1.05; 500-600 lbs, 95-1 (X); 
600-700 lbs, 90-95.

STOCKER HEIFER
CALVES; Choice; 200-.300 
lbs, 1.05-1.15; 300-400 lbs, 
1.00-1.05; 400-5ÍX) lbs, 95- 
1.00; 500-600 lbs. 90-95; 600- 
700 lbs, 85-90.

COW & CALVES: Good. 
700-950. Plain. 600-700.

Owner Transferred - 
MUST SELL!!

3 bdrm, 11/2  bath brick. Corner 
lot, workshop, carport, privacy 
fence. A steal at $42,500. Call 
Town & Country Real Estate, 

817-629-8397
____________________  CER91

Rough Riders To 
Host Horse Show  
In Ranger Arena

The Eastland County Ruff 
Riders 4-H Horse Club will 
hold the Eastland County 4- 
H Horse Show Saturtkiy.CXt 
20,at the Ranger Rodeo Arc'nu 
in Ranger.

The Horse Show is open to 
all 4-H members and mxi 
members but they must at­
tend school in Eastland 
County.

Opening at 12 noon, the 
show will start at 1 p m and 
will have the following 
events: showmanship, west­
ern pleasure, western horse­
manship, western riding, flag 
race, stakes race, barrel race 
and pole bending.

The show will be divided 
into aee eroiins: 8 and under;

9-13 yc^rs; 14-18 years; and 
19 and over (ages as of Jan. 1, 
1990). Trophies will be given 
in each age group for high 
point. The group for 19 and 
over will be open.

For more information call 
Dorothy Rogers at 442-3980.

N utrition
Program

We base had this an­
nouncement in this column 
scseral times, but we want 
everyone to remember the 
dates. The dates: CX tobcr 25 
IS very important as that is the 
Eastland Count) Health Fair 
Date. You should play to 
attend, le;un more about the 
health programs throughout 
the County and Big Country 
Area The dtnirs op̂ -n at 10 
a III. and close at 4 p in. you

O ’Briens Honored On 
65th Anniversary In Lamesa

A reception was held on Oct. 7 from 2-4 p.m. in 
the First Baptist Church parlor in Lamesa to honor 
Mr. and Mrs Cecil O'Brien on their 65th wedding 
anniversary.

O’Brien and the former Irene Durham were 
ir.amed Oct. 2, 1925 in Tahoka. Cecil is retired 
from farming and ranching. He served as trustee for 
Klondike schools, county commissioner of Pre­
cinct 4 and is a member of the Lamesa Rotary Club. 
The couple are members of Friendship Baptist 
Church.

Children of the couple include Joe and Betty 
O'Brien of Lamesa and Don and Kay Spears of 
Midland. They have six grandchildren and eight 
great-gratidchildren.

Special guests included Cecil’s brother, Harl and 
('larice of F.astland; sister Mayme Lee of Denton, 
Velma of Bledsoe and Vera Harp of Welch; and 
Irene's sister, Faye Kelley of Dallas.

Mr. & Mrs. Herman Hamilton

Pharmacy
Topics
Bv Bub Mueller

It's flu-shot sca.son. Almost 50 million Americans arc at
risk -  especially those over 65 and the chronically ill.

» * •
New drug to dissolve bkHxl clots after a heart attack -  
anisirepla.se — is said to work faster than other cloi- 
busicrs. The injectable drug is now being U’sicd at the
University of Utah Medical School.

• » *
Heavy alcohol consumption by fathers in the months 
bcfivrc ctxK'eption mH only produces smaller babies (as a 
University of Michigan study lound), but seems to result 
in slowcr-leaniingoffspring. New research, on rats,comes
from Washington University in St. Louis.

• •
Short-pulse ultrasound seems to he effective in helping 
heal wrist and leg fractures, researchers found at Mount 
Sinai Schtxil of Medicine in New York Therapy aims
waves through a liny hole in the cast.

• «»
Combinauon regimen ”  shori-U'rm use ol drug, clulmnaic, 
followed by long-tcnn cak ium  use -  can strengthen the 
bones of e lderly  women and reduce the risk of spinal 
fractures, a Danish .study reported.

When your doctor recommends calcium or other 
nutritional supplements, check out the wide selection 
available at Wal-Mart l‘harmacy, Hwy. 80 East, 
Eastland, 629-3347. tcnhKM

Rodger's Appliance Repair 
647-3187

Parts & Service, M ost 
Popular Brands, W ashers &  
Dryers, Vacuum Cleaners, 

Sew ing M achines

Cisco Press • Ka.stland Telegram 
Ranger Times

____Sunday, October 21, 1990

TRUMAN GREGORY 
INSURANCE

112 S. Seaman Suite 315 
F,astland, Texas 76448 

(817)629-1078

KINDS OF INSURANCE SOLD 
Universal - Whole - Term - Life 

Accident • Health • Major Medical 
Disability Income • Annuities 

IRA's - Cancer - Dreaded Diseases 
Medicare Supplement 

Individual or Coup Rates 
Long Term Convalescent Care 

Crop Insurance - Farmers 
Home Owners ■ Fire 

"AllCompanies *A*Rated"

will find an opixirtunily for 
chole.strol check (S5). blixid 
pres.surc screening, the unit 
for X-rjys for Brca.st Cancer 
w ill bc in front on the build­
ing. The cost for a Mam- 
mogrjphisS64. Do y ou know 
w hat kind of equipment is 
available and you are encour 
aged to tell your friend.s about 
te Eastland County Health 
Fair...(Xiobcr 25.

Many people arc aitcndiiu’ 
the Senior Centers seeking a 
balance diet for a luncheon. 
Call your regisuaand iiuike a 
reservation: Cisco- 442-1557 
and Ea.slland- 62 9-1382.

Cisco programs for the 
week were: AARP held the 
regular meeting and covered 
dish. Blood pres-ure was 
taken bV Mablc Thciford. 
Dinner music by I .ois Holder, 
Martha Shircy. Senior Cen­
ter Band and Choir enter­
tained. The S/C and Band 
participated in the Homecom­
ing Parade and was awarded 
first place in the Civic CX- 
gani/aiion Division.

Eastland programs were: 
Dinner music by the Senior 
CcnicrChoir, La Rue Brous­
sard and Ruth Kendrick.

Menus for the week 10-22 
thru 10-26

Monday— Pepper Steak 
with rice. Potatoes Au Gratin, 
Peas and Carrots, Canned 
Peach Halves with cottage 
Chec.se, Banana Cake, Bread 
and Butter and Milk.

Wednesday— Ham, Lima 
Beans, Tossed Salad, Apple 
Chcc.se Cri.sp, Bread, and 
Butler and Milk.

Friday- Oven Fried Fish, 
Cole Slaw with Carrots,Oven 
Fried French Fries, Pinto 
Beans, Cornbread. Butter. 
Milk and Pear Cubes.

Eastland County 
Hass Club Report

The Eastland Cininiy Bass 
Club Mini-Classic will be 
hcldCXi. 20-21. The lakes U) 
be fished ;irc laikc PriKlor 
and Hubbard Creek. All an­
glers who are in the lop 16 
have been notified and should 
meet at Tincr’sRc.siauraniby 
4:.30 a.m. on CXi. 20. At this 
lime the lopcighl boaters w ill 
draw from the eight non- 
iHiaters as this is a draw tour­
nament. Fishing hours will 
then bc set. On Sunday, Oct. 
21, wc w ill draw again.

The ECBC .sponsored Guys 
and Dolls event will bc held 
at Sowell Creek Park on Lake 
PrtKioronCX'i. 28. Thiscvcnl 
is open to anyone, w hether a 
ECBC member or not. w ho 
want to come join us. There is 
no entry fee and there will be 
hamburgers and all the fix­
ings provided by the ECBC. 
Fishing hours arc from 8 to 
12 and from 2 to 6. From 12 to 
2 wc will have lunch and our 
awards for the past year will 
bc given out. The only re­
quirement for the Guys and 
Dolls event is that there bc u 
man and woman in each boat. 
The ECBC would like to 
invite everyone to come join 
us for this fun day and meet 
the other anglers in yourarca. 
If you would like more infor­
mation on this event or about 
the ECBC all Gary Horton at 
647-3888 or Butch Willing­
ham at 442-3142.

The next weekly ECBC 
sponsored jackpot will be on 
Sunday, Oct. 21. Anglers 
should meet at Chock-0- 
Block at Lake Leon. Fishing 
hours arc from 5 to 8 p.m. 
This is a three fi.sh, 14" mini­
mum loumamcni that pays 
for first and second placer. 
Anyone who w anes to fish is 
welcome a.s this is an open 
jackpot.

Also the jackpot scheduled 
for Oct. 25 has been canceled 
due the ECBC sponsored 
Guys and Dolls event.

Eastlaiiu 
County Is
oPEn

For Business

Delta Kappa (îamma Meets
Lorciu,' Oliver and IXirothy 
Ann Fisher.

I hc Bela Upsilon Cliaincr 
of Delta KappaG;imma Soci­
ety Inicrnalional niot on tX- 
tober 13 at 9 a.m. at the First 
Christian Church in Ci.sco. 
The group is ci'm|iosetl of 
women cd u ca io i' liom  
Eastland ;uul Callahan I 'oun- 
ties.

Eight new meniK'rs were 
initialed. They areaslollows’ 
Jeanette Morren, Barbara 
Jones, Dorothy Fi.sher, Cyn­
thia Bilby, Sherry Phillips. Jo 
Ann ILiiion, Alice Saunders, 
and MiKIred Turner (honor­
ary). Mary Sehusiereit and 
Glenda Dennison were un­
able to attend and w ill bv' im- 
liaied ai a fuiure dale.

In ihe absence of Presidem 
Kaihi Siapp, Paili Dolen, 1 irsi 
vice presidem, presided. A 
slide prcseniaiion of ihe 
Founders of Della Kappa 
Gamma was part ol the iheme 
“Remembering the Pasi, Ini­
tialing the Fuiure.”

Rcfrcshmcnis were sersed 
in the Fellowship Hall by 
hostesses Olga Fay Parker, 
Ruby Lee Pirile, Louise Tay­
lor, Lois Whilakcr, Janice 
Shepard and Oleia Shirley.

Several members wore 
clothing from the ’Vintage 
Years’ and Patti Dolen re­

ceived u pri/.e from Sixial 
Chairman Jeannic Grilfin for 
being the ‘Best Drcs.scd.’ 
Several antique items were 
centerpieces for the tables.

Members present arc as 
follows: EASTLAND — 
Diane Upc hurch, Sherry Phil­
lips, Cynthia Bilby, Opal 
Lillie. Linda Bixtse, Paili 
Dolen, Jcannic Griffin and 
Imogcnc Haun; CISCO — 
Ruby Lee Pirile, Ruth Ste­
wart, Miriam BledsiK', (Jlga 
Fay Parker, Lois Whiuikcr, 
Bernice Carter, Louise Tay­
lor, Jeannette Morren, Alice 
Saunders and Lcia Lloyd: 
CROSS PLAINS — Marie 
Suimbaugh, Frances Tyson, 
A/alcc Womack and Juanita

Shaw; and RANGER — Jo 
A nn H at ton, M ari 1 y n J ac k son. 
Marilyn Henderson, llene 
Bock, Maria da Rtxha, Bar- 
b;ira Jones. Marv Jane Lillie.

Social Security Notice
Due to problems w ill! ihe Federal Budget, Travel Funds 

for all SiK’ial Security offiees have been reduced.
Until fu.'ilier notice, the Abilene .Six iai .Security o llm  

is aiilhori/ed to travel only to FUislIaiul. Ilreckenriilge, 
Sweetwater and Haskell.

The schedule lor those lowi . is shown below
llrcckenridge: Courthou.se WediK'sday, 9 30 a in 

(Xl. 24; Nov. 14, 28; Dec. 12.
Eastland: Park Hill Senior Ciii/.en Ceiuer, Tuesday . 

9:30 a.m., (X t. 16; Nov. 6, 20; Dec. 4, 18.
We regiei ihe inconveniences and will keep you in 

formeil as changes iveur.
M. Glyn Hammolns 

Disuiet Manager 
SiK’ial Securilv Admin.

]^ /|A IESTiC THEATRg
629-1322

-TWO THUMBS UPl-
-BRILLIANT'

-MAGNIFICENT"
V  •• • ■*

“ASTONISHING" 

IH c: '

Eri. • Sat. • Sun. • Mon.
All Shows; 7:30 p.m. - *3."”

W'c Now O ffer 5-Adini.ssioti (lift I’as.ses • $10

Majestic Classic Film Series
uiY rusctiu

GRANT LANE

'' ARSENIC M
0IDLAŒ

■Sunday, O c t .  21 2 :00  p .m . $ 4 .0 0
T u esd a y , O c t .  23 7 :30  p .m . $ 4 .0 0

Hardware

•  5 s t a r * * * * *

Latex $ 8  97
Flat Wall 
Paint
•  on« ro«l covftf.Tgp
•  washflhlo •  colot Iasi
•  non yntlowing
•  spoE tesismni

GAL. 
R E G . 
$ 1 3 .7 5

L^tfaWK,Wall Patii

ACRYLIC

Our Best 7-Star F la t La tex  
H o u s e  P ain t

$ 1 1 .® ®
KEG.
$19.49

one COM covvrag« 
low spatter no mess 
tj.year durability

GAL.

•  scrubbabte
•  stain resistsnt
•  (»tortasi Cul ORI Caia*« Higher

★  ★ ★ ★ ★ ★ ★
Our Best 7-Star 

S e m i-G lo s s  La tex E n a m e l

$ 1 3 .® ^
REG. GAL
$19.49 *  on« coat coverage

•  12-year durability
•  scrubbable e low spatter 
a stain resistant
•  non-yePowing

Hardware
•and Garden C enter  4

C«i«om Cr̂ wtHiglw

O P iN
7 0« y f  AWm C

504 EAST MAIN • EASTLAND, TEXAS 76448

8 1 7 -6 2 9 -3 3 7 3
HOUIM : 8  00A M to 6 00 PM Monday • Saturday 

100 PM to a 00 PM Sunday
wf HL«V(
M *Mfaic*i

\



■lave You Seen
These Children?

NICOLE HEVENER
DOB: 07 /07/78  
Date M issing: 09 /15/82  
From: Staunton, Virginia 

I Age at tim e of d isappearance:
4 years old

I Race/Sex: White/Female 
Eyes: Brown 
Hair: Brown 
Height: 3'
W eight: 31 lbs.
C ircum stances: Child kidnapped by 
non-custodial mother.
Augusta County S heriff’s Dept. 

(Virginia)
M issing Persons Unit 
1-703-885-7253

KELLI AMANDA DOMINIQUE BARR

/ i

DOB: 07 /24 /84
V  Date M issing; 02 /04 /88

From: Cleveland, Tennessee 
Age at tim e of d isappearance:
3 years old
Race/Sex: White/Female 
Eyes: Blue 
Hair: Blonde 
Height: 3 ’
W eight: 35 lbs.
C ircum stances: Child kidnapped by 
non-custodial step-father.
Bradley C ounty S h e r if fs  O ffice  

(T ennessee)
M issing Persons Unit 
1-615-476-0672

MELISSA LEE BRANNEN
DOB: 04/13/84  
Date M issing: 12/03/89  
From: Woodside Apartments,
Lorton, Virginia

Age at tim e of d isappearance:
5 years old
Race/Sex: White/Female 
Eyes: Blue 
Hair: Dark Blonde 
Height: 3’ (approx.)
W eight: 38 lbs. (approx.)
Identifying Information: Bum scar on right forearm. 
Navy blue sweater with yellow Big Bird applique, blue 
and red plaid skirt, red tights, black patent leather 
shoes with gold bows: pink-hooded jacket. 
Circumstances: Disappeared from apartment clubhouse 
during a Christmas party around 10:30 p.m.
Fairfax County Police Department (Virginia) 
Missing Persons Unit 
1-703-691-2131

JASON MADJDI AMINI

* ■

DOB: 05/14/74  
Date M issing: 02 /25 /82  
From: Ventura, California 
Age at tim e of d isappearance:
7 years old
Race/Sex; White/Male 
Eyes: Brown 
Hair: Blonde 
Height: 4 '6”
W eight: 75 lbs.
C ircum stances: Child kidnapped by 
non-custodial father while on visitation 
in Cajifornia. Warrant issued in Ventura 
Courity, California.
Ventura C ounty D istrict A ttorney’s 

O ffice (C aliforn ia)
M issing Persons Unit 
1-805-654-3487

TRICIA J. KELLETT

3

DOB: 05/31/73  
Date M issing: 05/07/82  
From: Chicago, Illinois 
Age at tim e of d isappearance:
8 years old
Race/Sex: White/Female 
Eyes: Blue 
Hair: Blonde 
Height: 4 ’
W eight; 70 lbs.
Identifying Inform ation: Child has a 
space between her front teeth. 
Circum stances: Child was last seen 
playing in the street near her home. 
C hicago Police D epartm ent (Illinois) 
M issing Persons Unit 
1-312-744-8266

ADRIAN EMMANUEL LAINEZ
DOB: 01/18/82  
Date M issing: 02 /01 /86  
From: Pasadena, California 
Age at tim e of d isappearance:
4 years old
Race/Sex: White (Hispanic)/Male 
Eyes: Brown 
Hair: Black 
Height; 3 ’6 ”
W eight: 60 lbs.
Identify ing Inform ation: Green- 
brown birthmark on lower left leg. 
Circum stances: Child kidnapped by 
non-custodial father.
Pasadena Police D epartm ent 
1-818-403-4511

The National Center fo r M issing and Exploited Children has set up a 
toll-free hotline. If you have any inform ation that cou ld  lead to  the 
location and recovery o f a m issing child, p lease call th is num ber:

1-800-843-5678
In a non-emergency situation, anyone seeking information about the problem of missing and 

exploited children, or anyone wishing to contribute information can write to the following address:
National C enter fo r M issing and Exploited C hildren  

2101 W ilson Bivd. Suite 550  
Arlington, VA 22201

Eastland/Callahan County Newspapers

(
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October Calendar Of Events
F o r  A d d H i o n s ,  

Q i o n g e t ,  

M o t i o n s , . 

P l e o s o  C o l l  

F o y o  S p u r l o n  A t

T h o  M o l e s t i e  

629-2102

A  P u b l i c  S e r v i c e  O f  T h e  M o j e s t i c  

T h e o t r e  A n d  E o s t l o n d  C o u n t y  

N e w s p o p e r s
- t r

1 t o  5  p . m .

SUNDAY. OCT. 21
2«0CLASS1C MOVIE ARSE­

NIC ANDOLD LACE MAJESTIC 
THEATRE

S:00-8:00 Jtekpot Fishing, 
Chock-o-Block. I ^ e  Lake

7:30 DARKMAN RATED R 
MAJESTIC THEATRE

8:00 Alcoholics Anonymous, 
Cisco

■**■

MONDAY, OCT. 22 |
8<X)-4;00SensorCibans,ll 30 |  

noun meal |
10:00 Eastland CowilyCoinmu- |  

sianenCaun,CofnsTUSsianenCaM- j 
rocsn I

12:00 Roury, Eastland |
3:30 4-H aub,R «iger |
3:00 City Commissioners, j 

Ranger j
6:00 Rescue Line, KVMX |  
6:00-10:00 Eastland County |  

Defciuivc Driving Clast, Cisco |  
6 00 Dutnci 8 4-H Gold Sur j 

Banquet, Hamilton |
8:00Narcotics Anun)TnausOpen |  

Meeting, lUslland |
I
I
I
I

TUESDAY, OCT. 23
9:00 Chamber of Commerce 

ReuU Meeting, Eastland 
12:00 Liont, Eastland 
3.13 Weight Watchen, EutlanJ 
3:30 TOPS, EMU 
600 City Council, Cisco 
6:00-10:00 Eastland County 

Dciensive Driving Class, Cisco 
6 OORctired Federal Employees, 

Eastland
7:OOQuaiterbsck Club, Eastland 
7:00 Volunteer Fire Dept., 

Ranger
7:30CLASSIC MOVIE ARSE­

NIC AND OLD LACE MAJESTIC 
THEATRE

7.30 Bulldug Boosters, Ranger 
8:00 Alcoholics Anonymous 

Closed Meeting, Eastland 
8 00 Al Anon, Eastland

, - s f -  -**-—
WEDNESDAY, OCT. 24 
7:00 Kiwanas, Eastland 
8:00-4:00ScmorCiti/cns, 11:30 

noon meal
9:13-11:13 Community Bible 

Study, First Baptist Church, Eastland 
12:00-1 00 Community Bible 

Study, First Methodist Church, 
Eastland

12:00 Kiwanas, Ranger 
3:30 Overeaten Anonymous, 

EMH

—w *-
THUKSDAY.OCT. 25
8 00 5 00GED Testing, CIC 
10:00 4:00 Eastland t ounty 

Health Fair
12:(X) Lions, Ranger 
7:00-8:lH> Cisniniunily Bible 

Study, First Mclhodtsl ('hurch. 
Eastland

7:00-9:00 E'apccianI Parent 
CTasscs, H.MIl

7:00 l-àisilaiid C'ouiily Disabled 
Veterans Chapter 92, Olden

7 30.MAJES I1C niEA lREOE 
THE AIR REAS THE .StlAlXJW 
PRELUDE TO TERROR

8 00 Fall Dinner Iheaire, Cisco 
8:00 Narcotics Anonymous

Closed Meeting, liasiland

EKIDAY, OCT. 26
4 II Shooting Sports l.cadcr- 

Coach rraining Workshop, Oct 26- 
28, KerTville

8 (X) 4:0()SeniorCili/cns, 11:30 
luxm meal

7:30 MY BLUE HEAVEN 
RATED Ki 13 MAJFISIIC THE 
AIRE

8:00 Fall Dinner Ihcalre, Cisco 
8'00 Alcoholics Anonymous, 

Cisco

I

SATURDAY, OCT. 21 
Texas 4-H Rubbil Show, 

Angletun |
8:00 12 OOTri-County Cow Calf 

Clinic, Livestock Show Grounds 
6.(XJ Hallelujah Patty (Cisco 

children K-6lh), Calvary Baptisl 
Oiurch, Cisco

6:(X)-8.00 Fall F'esUval, Eastland 
7:30 MY BLUE HEAVEN 

R ATED PG 13 M AJ ILS nC  1 11 E- 
AIRE

8:(X) Fall Dmner Thi^re. Cisco 
8:00 Alcoholics Anonymous 

Open Meeting, Eastland 
8.(X) Al Anon, FlasUand

-TT-- -'O»---- - V —

Pilgrims To 
Pioneers

^  Jeane Pruett j
Volume 1990-Foity Two: 

Sunday, 21 October 1990 
MRS. W H.

CRAWFORD.P.O. Box 252, 
Pak) Pinio, TX 76072 is anx- 
uxis lo hear from anyone who 
may have informalion con­
cerning LEVI M.
CRAWFORD, stxi of Davis 
Teriy CRAWFORD and 
Mary (BARRON)
CRAWFORD.hoihdecciiscd 
1852 m Choc law County, MS 
buried in unmarked graves in 
ihe CRAWFORD Family

graveyard, Wmsion County, 
MS. Twochildrens graves on 
cither side of what is bcl ic ved 
lobe D.T. and Mary’s graves 
arc felt almost certainly arc 
those of Pcicr and Ociavy 
CRAWFORD, also children 
of D.T. and Mary. (Ftx un­
known reasons, this grave­
yard was changed to ihc 
BLACKWOOD CEME- 
TF.RY about the lum of ihc 
ccnlury)

1850 FctJcral census, Chtx:- 
law County, MS shows D.T. 
CRAWFORD 22 born GA. 
wife Mary 21 bom ALA and 
the followingchildrcn: James 
12. Mary 8. Pcicr B 6, Nancy 
4 and Ociavy 2 .ill bom MS. 
A Mississippi High Court

Híggínbotham-Bartiett 
Lumber Co.
629-1311 CHURCH DIRECTORY

Perkins Implement Co.
629-2665

Vicki's Beauty Shop
629-2032

Dr. J.O. .lolly, Dentist
629-2033 or 629-2432

R.M. Sneed Contractor
629-1756

White Elephant Restaurant
442-9957

Eastland County Newspapers
629-1707

case lists children of deceased 
parents Mary and Davis T. 
CRAWFORD; James: Mary: 
Nancy; Levi M. 
CRAWFORD. Thus family 
conclusion is Levi M. 
CRAWFORD was not bom 
when 1950 census taken but 
before 1852 as both parents 
died in that year. Who took 
this infant? Is it possible that 
Uncle Solomon BARRON 
(mary’s brother) took him lo 
Texas?

Also need informalion on 
D.T.’s brother, WILLIAM 
H CRAWFORD who was last 
found on 1880 Oktibbeha 
County, MS census. Wife 
Jane buried CRAWFORD 
CEMETERY 1880. Where 
did William go? Sincerely

appreciate AN Y HELPon this 
family.

•  »*

...Mrs. Glenda DURR. 
9535 Acer. #908, El Paso 
Texas 79925 seeks informa­
tion on George W. DA KAN 

■ county surveyor, Eastland 
Counly, TX 1890-1891, 
There were also DAK,\N & 
SCOTT Real Estate Agents 
althis.samc time. Was George 
W. DAK AN also a real estate 
agent?

My grandfather, Russell 
Bean WILLIAMS lived in 
Eastland County and married 
Lanic DA KAN 1906. Eraih 
Couniy, TX. Could George 
W. DAK AN be related lo my 
grandm other? Would be

happy to hear from an) one 
having information about this 
family.

...From Family Trees: “ In 
continuation of the coverage 
of Bolivar County, MS, be­
gun in 1988 with the piihlica- 
iionof Volume 1.1836-1861, 
Bolivar Couniy, Miss., Vols 
2&3 covering 1866-1904 are 
now released. Containing 
probate. Chancery. Deed, 
Minute B(M)ks, Marriage 
Rccortls, PiKkcls, and with 
full index, Vol. 2 has 243 
pages, soli cover and ct'si 
S30.00. Vol. 3 has 243 pages 
is soflcovcralsocosts $30.00. 
And as a supplemenuiry aid 
there is an 1870 Census Boli-

var Co., MS indexed. 60 
pages, for S7.5Ü. Composite 
indexes of Bolivar Co. Vol­
ume 1,2,3 and the 1870 cen­
sus costs only S2..50 These 
volumes may be onlcred from 
katherine Rranion, Rt. 1 Box 
349. leland, MS 38756; or 
from Alice Wade, Box 96, 
Grace. MS 38745. Please send 
SI..50 lor first b<x)k, postage 
and handling, 50 cents for 
each additional one. (They 
also have published records 
ol Washingion b^aiiuena 
Cos. ,-\sk about ihein.)

» * »

...NOVA LEMONS, 12206 
Brisbane, Dall.is, l .\ 75234- 
6528 wiMild like loknow: w ho 
are paienis of lemiiel Wil­
liam PRYOR? I.enuiel was

horn cirva 1826 in Tennes.scc 
uid nurried on 19 January 
18.54 in Smith Co., TX lo 
Eli/aheih HARDEGREE of 
georgia. Is he related lo any 
of the Pryor’s in SmiihCouniy 
and Rusk Couniy? He died 
circa 1878 in Smith County. 
Their childten were: Phillip 
Jackson (18.54-1936); Mary 
F,.; William: John Buchanon;

George; Hiram; and Bculo 
PRYOR. Would like lo com­
pare PRYOR families of 
Smith and Risk Counties. 

»»»
■...Send queries and notices; 

Nxiks and other materiaf for 
review to pilgrims To Pio­
neers, P.O. Box 99. Ranger, 
T X 76470.

Have Somelhing To 
Sell, Call The Classifieds 

Ci.sco 442-2244, Eastland 629-1707 or 
_________Ranker 647-1101,_________
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CISCO CHURCHES EASTLAND CHURCHES RANGER CARBON

Cisco Funeral Home
442-1503

U-Save Pharmacy
629-1166

Thornton Feed Mill
442-1122

J & J Air Conditioning
629-2251

TACLB002300C

Kimbrough Funeral Home
442-1211

Maxwell Appliance 
Service & Parts

442-1439

HKST rVANCKIJCAL 
VIKTI10DISTCIIi:iK'll 
John W. rUiilaii, Pailar 

llw y.M W ,
AcroM Frofn

Sunday School 10:00 «.m.. Momm|t 
Wookhtp IHIO am ; Rvenui| W«M»h«p 
7 (Ml p m.. Wodneaday Youth and Aduh 
HiMe (rUta 7:0t) p.m.

I AI.VAKY B A m S T C ||t1 c : i l
Rev. RoiMk Sliodirlfard 

fMlor
18(h and Ctmnd IHMom Chvo

Sunday School 9:30 a.m.; Mominf Wo^ 
ahtpl0;45a m ,Trainin|Uraovt5:30p.m.; 
Rvnunf Wonhip 6 30 p.m.; Wedneaday 
Prayer Meeting 700 pjn.

MMROD BAPTIST C lltR C ll 
UMIlea SW aiCtece 
Rav. T.D. WMielioni 

Sunday School tOOO ajn., Sunday Serv­
ices 1 l .OOa m..TrainingUnion6Á)pjn.: 
Evening Scrvic« 700 pjn.; Wednesday 
Senacea 7:00 pm

NEW U EE TABERNACLE 
SB7 W. 17th S t  • r i m  
Rev. W.M. (Bill) Bailey

Sunday School 10 a m.; Wonhtp 11 am. 
(Iltxir of Power); Old Faahion ^ y e r  
umc 6 p.m., Evangsliatic Service 6:30 
pm  Bible Study 7;1S p.m. We^waday.

CREATER ST. MARK BAPTIST 
(T ItR C H

Rev. Lnrenio Chriesmaii, PaHor
Sunda> School 945 a.m.; .Morning Won 
ship 11 00 a.m., Evening Worship 600 
p m. Wedneaday Prayer Service 7 OOpm

M ITrilELI. BAPTIST r itl .B C ll 
S. of naco  off llwy. 266 

Rev. Jcaalt Bigbee 
Paalor

Sunday School 10:(W a.m.. Ppuching 11 
am., Sunday Night 700  p.m.. Prayer 
Service W'edneaday 7:00 p.m

n i l  RCII OF THE NAEABENE 
Rev. Ai Gary Pettlgrt«

Sunday School 9:45 a.m.; Morning Wiw 
ahip 1045a.m . EveningWarship6p.m.; 
W edneaday Prayer Meeting 7 pm.

n i l  RCHOFCRIIIST 
Jim Yates, MUibler 

Ave.N .. Cisco
Sunday Bible Claaaea 9:30 a.m.; W'orthip 
Service 10 30a m.; Evening Service 6:30 
p m , Wedneaday Service 7:30 pm. I.a- 
dies 1000 a.m. Tuetday.

FAITH BAPTIST rilL R C II 
W. imhJk Ave.XCiaco 

Funds menial 
Dr. M. II. ('larlt, Paalor

Sunday School 10(iO am.. Preaching 
ServTcea at M a m a-d ? p.m . W’ecbiea- 
day Evemrg Scmcc at 7 30

r o i  R T H '¡T R rrr  c iitR C H  
OF CHRIST 

761 W. 4(h S t
Sunday 10:30a.m. Evani-.g5O0p.m.

ASSEMBLY OF YAHWEH 
Weteome

Worship 11OO a m. Saturday.
Only 10 milea South of Ciace on U S. 
Highway 113

MOUNTAIN TOP CHtBCH 
666 E. Itk  S t (OW Nwy. gf) . O ko  

Paalor Jobe C. Jomo 
Pbone 442 4479

Praiaa In Word 10:30ajn Stmday; Evan- 
fclifi Service 6 pm. Sunday; BtMa Study 
7:30 p.m. Wednesday.

PR IM m V E BAPTIST CHURCH 
Jamm t. Robertson, |r ^  Mbilüer 

Services In  Sunday eachmemb; S v ^ g  
10-30 a.m ; Preaching 11:00.

GOSPFX AVSFMBLY 
16M Ave. A and Eaal IMh • Cbcn 

442-1227
Krnnetb Welalime 

Mtnteler
Sunday 11KY) am.; Tuesday 7:30 p.m., 
Thursday 7:30 p.m.

EAST CLSC'O BAPTLST C H U R ril 
REV. I.erry iJnam 
566 F . . l l tb - Claco

Sunday School 9:45 am.; Morning Woi  ̂
di ip 1030 a m ; Tra in tng Uninn 5:30 p. m ; 
Evening Worship 6:30 p m ; Wedneaday 
Evening Worship 7*00 p.m.

FIR5rr CHRISTIAN CHURCH 
303 W .S th

Dick S w n m e n , Pastor 
Church School 9:40a.m.; Moming Wor- 
dtip 10*30 am.; Bible Study 6:30 pm.; 
Wednesday Bible Study 7 p.m.

CATIIOUC CHURCHES 
Pastor: Fr. Tbomas H. Tartar 

%L Francis, Eaiüand. 6:30 pm. Saturday; 
St Rita. Ranger. 9:45 a.m. Sunday. St. 
John Suawn, 1:00 am.. Sunday; Holy 
Roaary. Cisco 11:30 am. Sunday

HRST UNITED METHODIST 
CHURCH 

Rev. David Leach 
465 Weal ttb . Once 

Sunday School class 9:45 am.; Nuiseiy 
class provided; Worship aervice 10*30 
a.m.; Evening Worship 7 p.m.

HRST PRF.SBYTERIAN CHURCH 
566 W. Mh S t . Cisco 

Rev. Robert E. Crumley 
Sunday School 9:45 am.. Morning Serv- 
tea 11:00 a.m.

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH 
262 W. MK, Claco 

Jim Manning
Sunday School 9:30 a.m ; Moming Wor 
ship 10:50 a.m.; Church Training 600 
p.m.; Evoning Worship 7:00 pm.: Wed­
nesday Prayer Meeúng 7:30 p.m.

FAITH CHAPEL FULL GOSPEL 
CHURCH

366 W'esi lUh . Claco 
Rev. James Harris

Sunday Morning 9:43 am.; Sunday Eve­
ning 7 rOO p.m.; Wednesday Evening 7:30 
pm

nR ST A.SSKMBLY OF COD 
Rev. James Morris

367 W. Tih S t . Cbco 
Phone 442-1561

Sunday School 9:45 a.m.; Mommg Wor­
ship 10:45 a.m.; Sunday Night 6:00 p.m.; 
Wednesday Night 7:00 p.m.

BIBLE BAPTIST CHURCH 
Fundamental 

Avt. C. al 17 S t - Claeo 
Rev. BHI Fee

SundaySchoellOK)Oa.m.;MomingScrv- 
tea 11:00a.m.; Evonifi|Sarvice7.00p.m.. 
Wednesday Worship Service 7:30 p.m.

REDEEMER LUTHERAN 
CHURCH

Rev. Charlea Mangón«, Intertum 
Conrad HIHon A E. IBlIi - Cisco 

Sunday School 9’ 15 a.m.; Worahip Serv­
ice l<)0a.m.

WESLEY UNITED METHODIST 
CHURCH 

Rev. Devid Laach 
Ava. A. •Claco

^doming Wonhip9:00a.m.; Family night 
2nd Thursday each month

HOLY TRINITY KPI.STOPAI. 
I 'lll.K t II 

Falht r Sieve .'«milh 
915-356-2907 
710 S. Seaman

Sumiay Service 9 (M) a m ; (?nmmunHwi 
Services

FIRST BAPTISTCHI KCH 
716 North Seaman 
Rev. Danny Bruwn

Sumiay School 9:30 am.; Mfrplng Wqt- 
akip 11 00 a m.; Baptist Training Unitip 
6 (M> pm  ; Evening Worship 7:00 p m. 
Wedneaday Night Service 7:00 p m

THE n i l  RCH OF JFSl S ( IIKIST 
OF LATTER DAY SAINTS 
Chapel Phone: I I 7-629-1383 

OpeningExercitc9a m . Kebef Society 9 
• 9.50; Pneathood 9 • 9.50; Primary 9 
10:40; Sunday School 10 - 10:40; Sacra­
ment Mtg 10:50 • 12:00.

BrsiKh President 
EToyd A. AHdrcdge 

Route 1 Box 166 
Ranger, Texas 76476 

647-3127

EASTLAND UNITED PFNTFC'OS- 
TALCHURCH 

206 N. IBxfe
Rev. Bohhy Hart, Pastor 

Sunday School 10:00 a.m.; Mommg 
Worship 11:00 a.m., Evening Worship 
7*00 pm  ; Wednesday Service 7:300 

p.m.

HRST BAPTIST UIIUKril 
Dr. Koberl Jeffresk 

Sunday School 9:45 a.m.; Moming Wor­
ship 11 K)0 am.. Evening Worship 7.(M) 
p.m.

BF.THFL BAPTIST CHUR( II 
Rev. Dewey V. l^m b 

Sunday School 9:45 a.m.; Morning Wor­
ship 11:00a.m., Evening Worship 6 :00 
p.m.; Wedneaday prayer meeting 
6 30 p.m.

HRST UNITED METHODIST 
CHURCH

Dr. Vaughn Baker, Pa.ttor 
Sunday School 9:45 a.m.; O icht lYacuce 
10:30 a.m.; .Morning Worship 11:00 a.m.; 
Evening Worship 6:00 p m

c a l v a r y  BAPTIST
Rodger Ashley

Sunday School lOOO a m., Moming 
W'orship 11:00 a.m.; Prayer Class 6 30 
p.m.; Evening Wonhip 7 00 n m.; Wed- 
neadsy Night Prayer Service 7 30 p.m.

CHURCH O FC ^D  
613 W. Main • E'astland 

629-3129 
Rev. Jim Oglesby

Sunday School 10:00 a.m.; Evening Serv­
ice 7 (X) p.m.; Wednesday Service 7:30 
pm.

NORTH OSTROM CilU R ni OF 
CHRIST 

H.S. UwU 
Phone 629-2219 

Church Phone 629-2116 
Services Sunday 10;30a.m. and S:00p.m ; 
Wedneaday 6:()0 p.m.

PLEASANT HILL BAPTIST 
CHURCH

Pleaaanl HIM Community 
Joe PhMpott, Paalor 

Sunday School 10:00 a m.; Mnmmg 
Wonhip 11 -OOa.m.; EverungServiceS:30 
p.m

SOUTHSIDE PENTECOSTAL 
167 New Street • Eastland 

Sunday School 9:45 a.m.; Sunday Eve­
ning 700 p.m . Midweek Service 7:(X) 
p.m. Thuradsy

CHURCH OFCHRLsr 
Gary Montgomery 

Minister
Sunday School 9:30 a.m.; Morning Wor­
ship 10:20 s.m.; Evening Worship 600 
pm.; Wednesday Wonhip 7:30 p.m

LAKE LEON BAPTIST 
JohnC . Taylor. 629-2356 

Sunday School 9:45 am.. Sunday 
Moating Service 11:00 am.; Sunday 

NigN Sarvice 5:30-6:30 pm.; 
WediMaday Night Smvke 7:00 • 1.00 

pm .—

ASSKMItl.V (>Kt;OD 
Kvnt

|<*0M W. t 'o rn m ertr  • Ea^llamt
Sundiy Sch«K»l 9 4 3 a m . Morrtng Wor 
ship II Ik» am . I vcning Service 6(X» 
p m , Wc*lnc9Miay Sight 7:00 p m

FIRST PRI ^H\11RIAN 
Dr. Hill KadtlilT

Sunday SchtMxl loo t) am .. Mt»mng 
Wt-rship.ll 0 0 a m

FIR^;| (TIHIs i i a S  ( h i  k r i l
(DUcipIrx f»r (h rM )

S. I.am ar 4L Ohve - FavOand 
Rev, Kandy ( iM»k

Sunday SchiHil 9.45 a m , Worship Serv­
ice 10 :30 a m

330K I10FM FF 
561 S. I^amar 

Robbie VliMHe, Paxtor 
Sunday Mommg 10:13 a m ; Wedneaday 
Evening 7:(X) p m.

INSPIRATION CIIURCH OF GOD 
Rev. Douhlaa Fraser 

Camp Inspiration Box 167
Sunday School 9:45 a.m.; Moming Wor­
ship 10:45 a m ; Evening Worship 6:00 
p.m . NV’edncMlay Service 7:00 p.m

( ATHOLK i  HURCII 
Paster: Fr. Thomas II. Teexar 

647-3166
St Francis, FUsiland, 7.(H) p m. Saturday; 
St Kiu, Ranger. 10:30 a m Sunday: St. 
John Slrawn, 8:30 a.m., Sunday Holy 
Rosary, Cisco, 5 DO p.m. Saturday

EASTLAND CHRISTIAN SC IEN dl 
s o t  IE IY

Sunday .Morning Wor.-ihip U;(K) a m . 
Service on First Wednesday of the Month 
7.30 pm.

All Are Welcome

PRIEMERA U:LF:s IA BAUTISTA 
EASTLAND, TEXAS 

(First .Mexican Baptist Church) 
Pastor Fiddle tkmrales 

Located at Ringling Lake Road 
SundaySchool 10.00a.m.; Sunday .Morn­
ing Worship 11 (X) a.m.; Evening Service 
700 p .m., Wednesday T(¥) p m

K A ir ilH \P n .S l ( IH RCII 
105 U. Plummer, FaslUnd 

653-2438
Pa.stor K.l... O'Quinn 

SundaySchool i0.(K)a m.; Sunday .Morn­
ing Service 11:00 a m., Sunday Evening 
Service #>30 p.m.

MARANATHA BAPTIST 
InJi'pindeni • Fundamental 

Pa.stor M IL Jones 
Rt. 2Hox57H,Cisco, Texas 
ilwy. HO Weat of Fiaslland 

Sunday School 10.00a.m.; WorshipHour 
11:(X) a.m., lYiycr Classca 6 00 p.m.; 
Worship Hour 6 30 p.m.; Wedneaday 
Sc.-vicei 7:30 p m.

SOUTHSIDE BAPTIST MISSION 
(S.B.C., Mangum Sponsors)

1509 South Seaman 
l^ rry  Briley, Pastor 

Sunday School 10:00 a m ; Sunday Wor- 
»hip 11:00 a m.. 7:00p.m ; Wedneaday 7 
pm

UHLRCH ON THE WAY 
Pastor Ron Allman 

Meets For Every Service Al 
305 W Plummer

Sunday Mnmmg 10:30 a.m.; Sunday 
Night 6 30 p m., Wednesday Night 714 

p.m.

FIRST PENTECOSTAL t'HURCH 
311 S. l^m ar 

Dr. D.P. SadowkkI 
Sunday Mommg 10 a m Sunday 

Evening 6 p.m Wedneaday evening 7 
p.m.

EASISIDF HAPTISTCTIUKt'll 
4 & Young SL < Ranger 

647-1478
Davey |  ruilt-Paslor

Sunday Sc1vm>| IODO a m ; Sunday Serv­
ice 11 (Dam,; Sunday l\vemng7:(8)p.m 
Wedneaday 7:00 p.m. 
fTiilJrcn's Misoon (noups 7.00 pm. 
Youth f*hoir 6 (8». Nursery IVovided.

1 HUHt IIO EV H K IST '
J  V 263 Vlesquite • Ranker

x6Íf-;^25 , ^
bon G rüner. Minister

Sunday HiMe Class 9:45 a.m . Sunday 
Worship 10.4.3 j.fn.; Sunday Evening 
Service 7.00 p.m.; Wednesday Service 
7:00pm.

CHURCH OF GOD 
661 Pershing • Ranger 

647-U36 
Rev. D«>n Speck

Sunday Mommg Service 10:00 a m.; 
Sunday Mommg Worship 11:00 a.m., 
Sunday Children's Church I IDO a.m.; 
Sunday Evoning 6:30 p.m.; Wedneaday 
Service 7:30 p.m.

CHURCH OF GOD OF PROPHECY 
North Oak - Ranger 

(■eorgf Parker, Pastor 
Sunday Mommg Service 9 45 a.m.; Sun­
day Mommg Worship 11:00a.m.; Sunday 
Children's Church 11:00 a.m.; Wednes­
day Service 7:30 p.m

FIRST RAPTIST CHURCH 
Walnut at Mariton • Ranger 

647-3261 
Rev. Bill Ownes

Sunday Moming RiMe Study 9:45 a m.; 
Sunday .Mommg Worship 10:50 a m.; 
Sunday Evening Worship 5:00 p.m.; 
Wedneaday Bible Study Prayer Mecimg
6:30 p.m.

FIRST CHRISTIAN CHURCH 
404 W. Main • Ranger 

647-3251
Rev. James Upshaw

Sunday School 10:00a.m.; Sunday Serv- 
i:e 11.00 a.m . Wednesday Bible Study 
7:30 p.m.

FIRST UNITED METHODIST 
CHURCH

411 F'lm .St. Ranger ' 
647-1124 

Bill Reed, Paalor
Sunday School 9 45 a.m.; Worship Serv­
ice 10:50 a.m.

SFXOND BAPTIST CHURCH 
Commerce and Pine St. • Ranger 

647-3271
Rev. Ja.$per Mas.%egee

Sunday School9:45 a.m.; Sunday Service 
11:00 am.; Sunday Evenmg Service 6:00 
p.m.; Wedneaday Prayer Meeting 6:00 
p.m.

FIRST PENTECOSTAL CHURCH 
Caddo Kd. • Ranger

Paator Kenneth Coiegrove 
Sunday Service lODOa.m.; Sunday Eve­
nmg Service6:30p.m . Wedneaday Bible 
Study 7:30 p.m.

ST. RITA'S CIIURCH 
1109 Blackwell Rd.- Ranger647-3167 

Paator: Fr. Thomaa II. Teciar 
Sl Francu. HasUand, 7:00 p.m. Sai.;St 
Rita, Ranger. 10:30 a.m Sun. St. JMui 
Strawn, 8:30 a.m., Sun.; Holy Roaary. 
Cisco 5:00 p.m. Satur.

FT;i.Lt;ospEL
Pastor Jimmy .Maples

P.O. Box 423 I-
llw). 6 al Caution Light, Carbppi

CARBON CHI R C H O FC H R ISr 
Randy Miaidy

Bible Study 1000 am.; .Mnmmg Wovyhip 
11 (Y> a.m.. Evening Worship 6 00|>.m . 
Wedneaday Night Service 7:30 p.m.

v.FTRST BAPTIST CHURCH CARBON 
T'* Rev. George W. Weeks

SurWaF'SchoollOOOa m .'Miwmng Wor­
ship 11:00 a.m., Trammg Union 6 00 'pm., 
Hvenmg Worship 7:00 p m., Wedn^day 
Night Ihrayex .Mccung 7DU p m. •

LIGHT OF GOD CHURCH " 
Hwy. South 102 Short St.

Carbon
Pastor ITmcr H. Sullivent
FIRST UNITED MFTHODIST I 

Rev. Luther Helm
Sunday School 9:30 am.; Mommg Worship 
10:30 am.

OLDEN
OLDEN RAPTIST CHURCH 

David Fldwarda. Pastor 
653-2261

OMen, Texas 76466
Sunday School 9:45 a m.; Moming Worship 
10:50 a.m.; Evening Worship 700  p.m . 
Wednesday Worship 7:00 p.m.

UGHTIKIUSE CHURCH 
Stephen Allen, Pastor 

629-3661
(?rirner of F'a.st & North StrecU in Olden
Sunday SchoM 10:(X) a.m.; Sunday Mommg 
11:00 a m.; Sunday Night 6:(Y) p.m.; Wed­
nesday Night 7 :00 p.m.

OLDEN CHI.HCH OF CHRIST 
Minister Roy Haley

Bible Cass 10:00 a.m.; Moming Worship 
10:30 a.m.; Evening Worship 5 00 p.m.

AREA

ST. PALI. BAPTIST 
S«1 Cherry SL, Hanger, Teiaa

Sunday .Schnol 10:00a.m.; Wonhip Serv­
ice 11:00 am ; Wedneaday 6:30 pm. 
Prayer Servicea, Miaaion Study 

Rev. Alldry Wetky, Paalor

MERRIMAN BAPTIST CIIURCH 
Merriman Rd. - Ranger 

P u lo r Leater Swan
Sunday School 10:00a.m.; Sundty Serv­
ice 11 00a.m.; Sunday Night Service6:30 
p.m.; Wedneaday Night Service7:00p.m.

t a b e r n a c ij : o r  fa t tii
Cyprcaa

Ranger, Teaaa 7647*
Thuradiy evening aetvicea 7 pjn.; Seur- 
day 7 p m.; Sunday 7 p.m.

RIDDIX STREET BAPTIST 
PaatOT! Rev. Robert Dunkeraon 

Sen. Mom. S«rv. U sjn.; Snn. aigU S:30»jn. 
___________Wed, eigit 6.-0Q pjg.

FLATWOOD CHURCH OF CHRIST 
Jim Hatcher 639-2549 

Mnmmg classes 9:45 a.m.; Bible classes 9:45 
a.m.; Moming Worship 10:30 a.m.; Sunday 
Evenmg 5:00; Wednesday Evening 7D0

KOKOMO BAPTIST CHURCH 
Rt. 1 Gorman 

Clarance Wilson
Sunday School 10:00 a m.; .Morning Wor­
ship 11:00 a.m.; Evening Wonhip 6:00 p m.; 
Wednesday Evening 7:00 p m.

m a n g u m  b a pt ist
Inkrim  Pastor. Melvin Fields 

Sundsy School 10 00 s.m.; Morning Wor­
ship 11:00 s.m.; '’’rsining Umon 6 00 p m 
Evening Worship 7:00 p.m.; Wednesday 
L rening Worship 7:00 p.m.

UNION CENTER BAPTIST CHURCH 
Charles E. (Red) Chamberlain 

3 milea north of Rising Sur on Hwy. Jg3 
S-ndsy School 10 s.m.; Worship Servide 11 
• m.; Wedneaday Prayer Service 8 p.m.

CORINTH BAPTIST CHURCH 
■Midway between Claeo and Eaalland 

Exit North fratn Hwy. gd at Amphlthra-^

Benny Hagan
Servicea Sunday 10 00 and 11.00 a m 6 00
and 7:00 p.m ; Wedneaday 7:30 p.m

GUNSIGHT BAPTIST CHURCH 
P.O. Box S72 

Eaalland
Paalor Rex Boggs

Sunday Services 10 s.m. and II a m. .Sunday 
and Wedneaday 7 p.m.

HARMONY BAPTIST CHl RC If 
Morton Valky ^

OX. Rodger, Paalor 
Sunday School lOOO a m.; Moming Wor 
ihip ll.<X)ajn.: Sunday evening 7:00 pm 
Wedneaday evening wonhip 7:00 p.m

!Vi



Guest Slot
byHVO

THIS TIP night help the 
Honorable Federal Budget-Writers, 
and heavens knows they need all 
the help they can get, as they tnrestle 
with the age-old problen of trying 
to match the inccaie to the outgo, 
and factoring in the much~in~arrears 
federal deficit.
 ̂ THINK FIRST, we'd suggest, of 

the many who have laid down their 
lives for this country and the great 
number «rho stand ready today to do 
likewise.

CONSIDERING THESE, and patterning 
statesmanship action with the valor 
that has been and is being displayed 
by the brave vrho defend our country, 
just might make it easier to conduct 
the governing of this country 
correctly. When a service person 
is asked "To lay do«m a life for 
the country," that service person 
in a sense, first forsakes family, 
friends, career, to go where
protectors are needed, and then 
bellies up to the fact that, if called 
upon, will make the supreme sacrifice.

SHOULD A governing official 
do less?

President Bush, Senators Bentsen 
and G r a ^  and Cong. Stenholmt

"You are our spokesmen in
Washington, and it's not right for 
us to criticise without offering 
solutions but it does seem that
a lot of time has been wasted trying 
to develop an operating budget for
our country, and that's part of 
your job. It's really a bit sad. 
We don't hold you four personally 
responsibily, only in that you are 
our direct link, and the ones to 
whom we must look first.

WIH-M WILL special interests 
be forgotten? Racing for adjournment, 
will the party labels continue to 
block visions? Just once, couldn't 
we all in one accord, say. This we 
believe is best and move forward 
together so that the American people 
could believe in you and sosiething 
and get with the program. Will the

booze tax be increased? Probably 
not. Tobacco? Doubtful. Gasoline? 
Probably} it gets just about everyone 
and doesn't have as strong a lobby.

Cut Medicare? That could play 
havoc with the 98% re-election of
incui^nts, couldn't it, and Novembt,r 
hth isn't far away,

THIS IS surely a dumb question, 
but has anyone in their wildest 
imaginzation and flights of fancy, 
ever once considered the possibility 
that one way to reduce the federal 
expenese could be to cut out some 
federal dead wood? what to cut? 
Sacred Cows? , Untouchables? Tough 
question, hughT Granted, but let's 
not lose sight of the fact that you 
are elected and paid handsome salaries 
to make those kinds of decisions. 

r e m e m b e r, HARRY'S admonition:
"If you can't stand the heat, 

get our of the kitchen." Some have 
even suggested that maybe we should 
just let Gramm-Rudnkin kick in, and 
see how many bureaucrats we could 
in fact do without.

DEAR ELECTED official, wouldn't 
xt be nice to think that maybe once 
again, you're running the government 
and not the hired hands.

This week's Newsweek has a cover 
cartoon of the President and the 
two party leaders in tattered baseball 
uniforms, with this caption: "BUSH 
LEAGUE: The President Stumbles,
Congress Bumbles. Boooo!" Not a bad 
depiction, but the thing that grabbed 
us was the fact that the three are 
shown in matching uniforxis, which 
seems to us a misnomer. Sometimes 
you wonder if they're even playing 
on the saxie team.

An inside article points out 
that things could be a'changing come 
•92, a presidential election year, 
the rcapportionment based on the 
*90 census and a record number of 
’̂ ®tix’®*onts. This could result in 
some 70 or 80 open seats, the news 
magazine suggests.

And concludes that citizens 
could also be blaming themselves 
because special interests could be 
drotirned out by greater voter 

xcipation in all elections.
The writer concludes that we 

all must be willing to pay the bills 
for the roaring '80s that helped

put us in the mess we're 
SO WE'RE waiting 

to lead, and then we
in today, 
for leaders 

all, like so
many others, must be willing to lay 
down a little personal sacrifice 
to make it happen for the good of 
the country.
AMiaiICA DESERVES patriots today.
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Fulien Motor Co.
305 East Main Eastland 629-2676

Ranger Jaycee Annual Turkey* 
Shoot November 15, 16, & 17

The Ranger Jaycces will 
sponsor ihcir Annual Turkey 
Shoot starling Thursday 
November ISandconunuing 
through Saturday November 
17. The shout will begin on

---------- 1
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O r A / \1 F M I C A

t r u c k s
1988 Chevy 1/2 Ton 
Silverado Loaded

$7,500.00

1986 Ford Conversion Van 
Extra Clean - Low Miles

$8,250.00

1985 Jeep Cherokee 
V6-Aulomatic 

Only 53,000 Miles
$6,500.00

1988 SIO Pickup 
V6-5 Speed

Excellent Fuel Economy
$6,750.00

1985 (iMC Safari Mini Van 
V6-Automatic 

This Week's Special
$6,000.00

TODAYS
CHEVROLET

CARS
1986 Pontiac Pari.sientie 

4 dr. Sedan-Locally Owned 
Excellent Condition \  8-.\ulo 

0NLY-$6,995.(M)

1985 '98 ()ld.s 
Fully Equipped-Leather 

Interior Only 59,(MM) Mik>s 
$6,250.(81

1984 Caprice Classic One 
Owner, Extremely Nice

()NLY-'$2,750.(8I

1983 Chrysler Sth Avenue 
All The Equipment 
Special Sale Price

$4,750.(K)

1981 Ruick Lesabre Coupe 
Super T ransportation

()NLY-$L850.(M)
lUtl
LDUNITIY 
c iiH v ito i u r

Call Collect 817-629-2676. Open Monday- Friday 8 a.m. (ill 6 p.m. 
Closed Saturday and Sunday

Thursday and Friday at 6;00 
p.m. and end at 10:00 p.m. 
Saturday’s shoot will begin 
at 10:00 a.m. and continue 
through 10:00 p.m.

A rifle will be given away 
again this year. It is a Model 
70 Wine Hester Deer Rifle 22- 
250caliber. Tickets are $ I .(X) 
donation and can be pur­
chased from any Ranger Jay- 
cce.

Don't miss out on the fun 
and action this year. Mark 
your calendars and win your­
self a Thanksgiving Turkey ■ 
and maybe a Deer Rifle too!!!.

Hometown
News

Navy Seaman Recruit 
Daniel R. Moser, sonofAddic 
E. Moser of Route 1, Gor­
man, has completed recruit 
training at Recruit Training 
Command. Great Lakes. III.

During Moser'scight week 
training cycle, he studied 
general military subjects 
designed to prepare him for 
further academic and on-thc- 
job training in one of the 
Navy’s 85 ba.sic Oclds.

His studies included sea­
manship, close order drill. 
Naval history and first aid. 
Personnel w ho complete this 
course of inst/uctiixi arc eli­
gible for three hours of col­
lege credit in Physical Edu- 
catKMi and Hygiene.

He is a 1990gradualcol Dc 
Ixon High Seh(K>l.

n e w s p a p e r
DEADLINES:
Monday, 5:00 p.m. 

(Fur Thursday Paper) 
And

I hursday, 5:00 p.m. 
(Fur .Sunday Paper)

Eastland Office Supply/Radio Shack Dealer
111 W. Main

Eastland, Tx.76448 817/629-8942

l ' \  r

j I
Y  /  /  1 W  i■ y  ,

CIP AND SAVE ■

Uniball Micro 
Black Pens 

Reg. $1.39 -

C R S A T IN C  N e w  
S T M N O N R D S  

RCLIABLt Q U ALtTY
O v »  1500 •n o fw ers  and lachnirians davalop 

avakiaw and laat lo out a iaclm g  s tan d a id i
Nobody Comparo* 
PROM PT SERVICE

O w  7000 drop on  po<nls nahonwidn ir ,u ta  
* T * " f ’|5** »»nnea lo youf M m laclion Ovat 

1.000.000 ap a rt parta a lod iad  W eta tv ira  
wlial <M aaH

Nobody Comparo*

Radio Shack Prices Are The Same Nationwide

WHY WAIT FOR CHRISTMAS SALE
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HOM ES HOM ES FOR RENT H ELP W ANTED

HOUSE FOR SALE: 3 BR, 
living room,dining room, 
kitchen and den, sprin­
kler system, plus work­
shop.
Call-629-2345 after 5p.m. 
_________________TM

57 ACRES, 7 mile Cisco, 
most timber, deer/turkey/ 
birds, road front, $400. ac. 
300 ACRES Sipe Springs 
area, partially timbered, 
good deer, turkey, sandy 
loam soil, good fences, 
$400 per acre.
161 ACRES Lots bottom 
land, pecans, 60 tillable, 
well fenced, 1/2 mile 
Sabanna, good deer 
hunting, lots big oak, 
pecans. $550 ac. Agent 
owned.
58 ACRES, Several big 
trees, 2 tanks, some 
coastal, most new fences, 
lots road front. $550 ac. 
E-ZZ terms.
80.5 ACRES, 7 mi NE 
Rising Star, 30 Coastal, 
app. 1/2 cultivation, well 
fenced, lots road front­
age $560.00 per acre.
72 ACRES on Hwy. 36,6 
mi. E. of Rising Star, well 
fenced, coastal & native 
grasses, 2 tanks, some 
timber. Asking $550 per 
acre cash or assume Tex. 
Vet loans.
1000 ♦ ACRES S of Car­
bon. Native, coastal pas­
ture, 13 pastures, 13 
tanks, co op water, lots 
road frontage, deer lease 
brings over $10,000 per 
yr. $495.00 per acre.
70.3 ACRES 7 mi E of 
Rising Star Hwy 36. Some 
coastal, well fenced, 3 co­
op water taps applied for, 
fair barn, 2 tanks. $500 
per acre, cash or assume 
$21,600 Gl loans.
95.43 ACRES, 20 culti­
vated. 3/1 frame home, 4 
mi of Carbon, good barn, 
native grasses. House 
partially furnished; sev­
eral cows included. 
$70,000, $14,000 down, 
10% interest.
We WANT your listings 

35 Yrs. in Business 
COGBURN REALTY 

DE LEON 893-6666
893-5898 893-2642

RS105

FOR SALE BY OWNER: 3 
bedroom brick, IV, bath, 
large fenced yard in 
Cisco. 442-2237 or 442- 
1553, anytime.

C104

PRICE REDUCED-Nice 2 
or 3 BR, 1 1/2 bath, cen­
tral heat and air, new 
storm windows and 
doors,good location, 502 
W.7; Cisco. Was $24,500, 
now $13,900 or best of­
fer. Owner financing 
available. Call 915-646- 
0289 (collect).

Cl 04

FOR SALE: Two story 
house on Conrad Hilton 
Avenue in Cisco. $14,000. 
Financing available with 
small downpayment and 
approved credit. Call 442- 
2211.

Cl 04

HOUSE FOR SALE: De­
lightful house for sale, big 
enough to accommodate 
a large family. Unusual 
architectural design, re­
sembles a high top Ree- 
bok. Best offer is a ‘shoe 
in'. Hurry before it is 

. ‘soled’. Call 555-HEEL. 
Ask for the lady of the 
house.

T84

3 BR, 1 3/4 B, CH/A built- 
ins, F.P., Carpet, Satel­
lite, storage, carport, fru it 
trees, garden on 5 ac., 
one mile from Eastland. 
629-8170.

T89

FOR SALE: 3 Bedroom, 2 
bath pave street, nice 
neighborhood at Kinglett 
Dr., Cisco. Call 442-1408.

C104

FOR SALE: House on cor­
ner with 2 lots located at 
711 E. 13th. Needs work- 
to sell as is. We guaran­
tee a quick clear deed. 
$3000 plus transfer of 
title. 442-2010 or 442- 
2311.

C85

FOR RENT: We have a 
wide range of apart­

ments and houses. One 
to fit every need. Fur­
nished or unfurnished 
by the week or month. 

Call and ask for Darlene 
or DeeAnn first for 

clean modern living and 
low, low prices. 629- 

2805 or 629-2851.
T104

1 AND 2 bedroom; like 
new; carpet and drapes; 
frig, dishwasher, range 
and disposal; water, trash 
pickup and tv cable paid. 
Furnished apt. available 
weekly or longer. Choice 
neighborhood. See and 
compare Royal Oaks 
Apartments, 1304 Royal 
Lane, Cisco, 442-3232.

C104

FOR RENT: 2 bdrm de­
luxe apts., appliances, 
fenced back yard, extra 
storage, $210 per month. 
Call Ron Butler Sr. at 647- 
3234 or 647-3511 after 
5;00 p.m.

R104

COLONY II APART­
MENTS One and two 
bedroom. Furnished and 
unfurnished. Move in 
now!! Designer deco­
rated, energy efficient 
with modern appliances, 
central H/A, Laundry, 
large play area. Conven­
iently located near 
schools, churches, shop- 
ping. Resident mgr. 
Family living at its best, 
in a quiet neighborhood! 
500 Sadosa, 629-1473, 
Equal Housing Opportu­
nity.

T104

FOR RENT: No deposit 
with utilities paid. 3 or 2 
bedroom mobile home. 
Refrigerator, stove, 
washer, dryer furnished. 
Sunshine Valley. Leona 
Morton, 442-1365.

Cl 04

AHENTION: If you are 
looking for a clean and 
attractive newly remod­
eled apartment at a rea­
sonable rate try Flamingo 
Apartments In Cisco. 
Fully furnished kitchen­
ettes. All bills paid. Start­
ing at $45 per week. Must 
see to appreciate. Call 
442-9902 or 629-2805.

T104

FOR RENT-2 BR trailer, 
carport. In Olden. Refer­
ences required. Call 653- 
2407.

T104

MAVERICK APTS. Under 
New Management. 1-2 & 
3 bedroom available with 
W/D hookups. Close to 
all Eastland Schools call 
Diana Underwood at 629- 
1913 for details.

T104

FOR RENT: Nice, small 2- 
bedroom house with 11/ 
2 baths, carpet, central 
heat/air. Good neighbor­
hood. References, de­
posit required. Especially 
suitable for retired couple 
or lady. Call 442-2265.

C104

FOR RENT: Nice and 
clean, small 1 BR Mobile. 
Completely furnished, C/ 
H air, all bills paid. $225 
mo. No pets. Call 629- 
1188.

T104

FOR RENT: Available 
Nov. 1-Nice 2 BR mobile 
home. Stove, refrigerator, 
washer/dryer, or com­
pletely furnished if 
needed. Water paid. No 
pets. $225 mo. Call 629- 
1188.

T104

FOR RENT: 2 Bedroom- 
furnished apt., c/h air, 
water paid.$190.00.442- 
3130 leave message after 
6:00 p.m. 915-675-6225.

C104

FOR RENT: Furnished, 
one BR, garage apt. All 
utilities paid. $45.00 per 
week. Call 442-1806 after 
6:00 p.m.

C104

FOR RENT: Small fur­
nished apt. Ideal for one 
person. No pets. All bills 
paid. $175.00 month. 
$75.00 deposit. 442-1249.

C104

FOR RENT: Extra nice 2 
BR, apartment in 
Eastland, with central 
heat and air. Kitchen fur­
nished with refrigerator, 
microwave and cooktop 
and dishwasher. Water 
and cable paid. Call 629- 
1315.

T84

FOR RENT: As new, 3 
bedroom, and 2 bath, (ex) 
mobile home - dish­
washer, disposal, range, 
refrig.-freezer, carpeted 
and mini blinds - central 
air and heat - perfect lo­
cation with privacy at 
2006 W. Commerce, be­
hind KVMX radio station- 
only $295.00with $100.00 
deposit - 629-1417.

T104

deeded full time LVN, 
paid holidays, insurance, 
vacation, 3 day weekend 
off every third weeks. 
Apply at 700 S. Ostrom, 
Eastland.

T105

We are now accepting ap­
plications for relief cook, 
apply in person at West­
ern Manor nursing home.

R104

HELPWANTED:lfyouare 
a registered nurse and 
interested in working at a 
nursing facility with good 
working conditions and 
competitive pay. Apply in 
person at Western Manor, 
460 W. Main, Ranger.

R104

AnENTION:3-11 & 11-7 
LVN needed at Valley 
View Nursing Home, 700 
S. Ostrom, Eastland. 
Apply in person, ask for 
Zona Smith, DON.

T104

RN-DON
61 bed nursing facility in 
Rising Star is accepting 
applications for RN Direc­
tor of Nursing. Contact 
Russell Gray 817 643- 
6700.

RS104

POSTAL JOBS 
$11.41 to $14.90 hr. For 
exam and application in­
formation call 219-769- 
6649 ext. TX232. 8 a.m.- 
8p.m. 7 days.

T91

Russell Newman is now 
taking applications be­
tween 8 a.m. and 4:30 p.m.

T104

HELP WANTED: Cisco 
Dairy Queen is now tak­
ing applications for man­
ager and assistant man­
ager. Apply Monday 
through Friday, 2-4 p.m.

C104

ATTENTION NURSE 
AIDES NEEDED AT VAL­
LEY VIEW NURSING 
HOME, 700 S. Ostrom, 
Eastland. Apply in per­
son, ask for Zona Smith, 
DON.

T104

R N Needed for Director 
of Nursing position apply 
in person. Peggy Pryor 
or Zona Smith, Valley 
View Lodge, 700 S. Os­
trom, Eastland, TX, EOE.

T104

Employment 
Opportunity: 

Part-time secretary/re- 
ceptionist needed. Must 
have some experience in 
real estate. License pre­
ferred. Call Barbara, 
Town & Country Real 
Estate 629-8391.

T104

HELP WANTED: Accept­
ing applications for 
LVN's, nurses aids. Pre­
fer certified nurses aids, 

.but will train. Apply in 
person at Western Manor, 
460 W. Main, Ranger.

R84

Positions available for 
RN’s for full and part time. 
Competative wages. 
Many benefits available 
such as health and den­
tal insurance, vacation 
and holiday pay, three day 
weekend every third 
week, retirement and 
stock plan and much 
more. If you are interested 
in a rewarding, steady 
career in long term care 
and desire to work in a 
clean, established facil­
ity please come by 1405 
W. Commerce for all the 
details.

C104

HELP WANTED: Cook 
wanted, excellent bene­
fits, Valley View Lodge, 
629-1779. Apply In per­
son.

T85

HELP WANTED: Cleaning 
lady once every week or 
two. Must be strong and 
have references. 629- 
2413.

TF

H ELP W ANTED SER VIC ES FO R SALE FO R SA LE

NEEDED. Competent, 
caring LVN’s who are 
interested in furthering 
their career in nursing. 
Available to you are an 
established program for 
RN School, competative 
wages, vacation and holi­
day pay, health and den­
tal insurance, retirement 
plan stock plan three day 
weekend every third week 
and much more. If you 
are interested in a steady 
career in long term care 
and desire to work in a 
clean, established facil­
ity please come by 1405 
W. Commerce for all the 
details.

T104

ACCOUNT MANAGER 
TRAINEE

TV and appliance store 
needs an account man­
ager trainee. Duties in­
clude delivery and instal­
lation of TV’s, appliances 
and furniture, collection 
work on past due rental 
accounts and detail pa­
per work. Person we hire 
will be honest, hard work­
ing, dressed neatly and 
be interested in a perma­
nent job. We offer base 
salary. Bonus plan paid 
holiday and vacations. 
Group medical Insurance 
and etc. Please apply at 
957 E. Main, Eastland.

T84

HELP WANTED: Con- 
struction worker’s for: 
Home & Commercial. 
Must be 18 years old or 
older. Reference’s must 
be verifiable, we go 5 
years background check. 
Will train right person for 
the Insulation Dept. Con­
tact Jere Wooley. MUST 
BE BONDABLE. 
Supervisor’s welcome. 
Women welcome. We 
need salesmen & 
Estimator’s. A to Z Enter­
prises, 200 W. Commerce, 
Eastland, 817-629-2268.

T87

If you have recently lost 
your job or if you are 
having problems with 
your current employment 
because of Alcohol and/ 
or Drug use we may be 
able to help you. Call 
Wesley at 800-628-3265.

T100

LVN
Provide duty position 
available today. LVN 
needed to staff case with 
large health care agency. 
Pediatrician experience 
helpful, paid wages 
hourly, position in 
Eastland area. For your 
opportunity to join our 
winning team call 915- 
676-2668 or 817-629-1268, 
Girling Health Care Inc. 
EOE.

T85

HELP WANTED: To sit 
with elderly, light cook­
ing and house keeping. 
Call 647-1961.

R87

HELP WANTED: RN 
needed to serve incapac­
ity on DON. Excellent 
benefits. Apply in person 
at Canterbury Villa in 
Cisco. 1404 Front Street.

C82

UP TO $17,500.00 low 
interest home remodeling 
loans to Texas Vets. Call 
(817) 734-2755 to apply. 
Clark Const., Inc.-Gor- 
man. VA approved lend­
ers for Erath, Comanche 
and Eastland Counties.

T104

LAWN MOWING large or 
small. Light hauling. Odd 
jobs. Call 442-3903.

C104

WORK WANTED: House 
painting, clean yard, 
mowing, transplant tree, 
trimming, hauling and 
small repairs. Bobby 
Garrett, 442-2285 or 442- 
3144.

C104

YARD WORK WANTED - 
In Cisco : Mowing, edg­
ing, trim shrubs, light 
hauling. Also repair lawn 
mowers, edgers & tillers. 
Call 442-2004.

T104

CENTER POINT ENTER­
PRISES INC: Free Esti­
mates. Builders & Devel­
opers, Metal Buildings, & 
Remodeling. Joe Mayn­
ard, 629-8568, or 629- 
1013.

T104

Tree Trimming & removal. 
Landscaping and garden­
ing services, 11 years ex­
perience. Degreed in 
Horticulture. Call Ivan 
Hurley. 442-4881.

C104
TYPING DONE: In my 
home, I will type resumes, 
books, papers, etc. Quick 
accurate work and rea­
sonable rates. Call 
Deanna 442-3757.

C86

$5,000 GOLD CARD 
Guaranteed approval! No 
deposit. Cash advances! 
Also no-deposit Visa. No 
credit check! 1 (800) 234- 
6741, anytime.

R85

BULLDOZER WORK 
WANTED. Grubbing, rak­
ing, tanks etc. Glen Hub­
bard, 629-1300 or Ken 
Bostick 629-1109.

T89

Conservative 
Plumbing Service 

Do your pipes need to 
be winterized, replaced, 

repaired or checked? 
653-2235 629-2918

T84

Gold Credit Card 
Visa/Mastercard Guaran­
teed. Cash advances. 
$2,500. credit line. 1-900- 
446-0040. $25. fee.

RS90

ALL TYPES HAULING: 
Wood, hay, etc. Tree 
removal/trimming; yards 
mowed, anywhere. Also 
wood for sale: Oak or 
Mesquite. 442-3716 any­
time, 442-1397 after 9:00 
p.m.

C94

I Read the 
^Classifieds j

FOR SALE: Practical of­
fice supply Items; books, 
and much, more. At this 
newspaper office.

T104

FOR SALE: Quality busi­
ness and/or personal
cards. Order at this news­
paper office.

T104

THE ALMOST 
NEW SHOPPE 

811 East Walker 
817-559-9677 

Breckenridge, Texas 
Open 10-5 Monday-Fri- 
day, 10-12 Saturday. 
Appliances, 30 day guar­
antee, stoves, washers, 
dryers beginning at $50, 
refrigerators $75, also 
furniture, tools, etc.

T104

BOOKS FOR SALE at 
Eastland Telegram. 1/2 
price, different varieties.

T104

FOR SALE: Garage Build­
ing in Cisco. Corner 
Conrad Hilton Ave. (Ave. 
D) and East 6th St. Call 
(817) 442-3120. after 5 
p.m.

C87

CARBON TRADING 
POST

Quality used and new 
furniture and sizes reno­
vated mattress sets and 
frames at affordable 
prices. Master Card and 
Visa accepted. Hwy 6, 
Carbon, blue building at 
flashing light. We buy and 
sell used furniture and ap­
pliances. 817-639-2216.

T104

FOR SALE: Square bales 
of hay. Call 653-2407.

T104

FAMOUS COPYRIGHTED 
Stop-Smoking for Good 
Personal Letter sent di­
rect to you or to a loved 
one. It’s working for thou­
sands. $5. (total). Write 
Smoking, Box 29, 
Eastland. TX 76448.

T104

VALUABLE, HISTORIC 
Tapestry Paintings in this 
area? All over Southwest. 
Book tells story and what 
to look for. $17.00 (total). 
Write Paintings, Box 29, 
Eastland, TX 76448.

T104

FOR SALE: Appliances, 
stoves, refrigerators, 
dishwashers, washers, 
dryers. 629-2252.

T86

FOR SALE: STEEL 
BUILDINGS - Must sell 2 
Quonset-style steel build- 
ings from cancellation. 
One Is 40x40. Brand new. 
Adam 1-800-527-4044.

T91

6 Cubic ft. chest freezer 
& avocado - cook stove. 
32 inch boys bicycle. 647- 
3400. 1984, F I50 Ford, 
pickup.

T85

Barracks 5-In stock now - 
AK47/$500;SKSType56/ 
$165; M-1 Carbine w/ 
scope mount/$190; H&R 
12 ga. single/$80; H&R 
copy 12 ga. single/$70; 
Clock 22 .40 cal./$450; 
Bersa 83 w/extra mag. & 
case/$200; Raven .25 
Chrome/$50; Hensen 
.22LR/S1.35 box; Norinco 
7.62x39/$3.50 box or $30 
for 10 boxes; custom 
order guns, ammo, arch­
ery, fishing, and outdoor 
gear.

C91

REDUCE: Burr, off fat 
while you sleep, take Opal 
tablets and E-Vap Diuretic 
available at City Drug.

C86

LOT 350x156; Old mobile 
and house hull, fair ga­
rage and storage. 
$11,950.00. Call 817-386- 
3431.

C84

FOR SALE: ’87 Oldsmo- 
bile Cutlass Calais, 4 
door,whitewithdarkblue 
interior. AM/FM cassette, 
electric door locks, 
cruise. Day 629-1595 ask 
for Sherri. Evenings 647- 
3814.

T86

FOR SALE: ’80 Pinto. 
$650. ’75 lmpala-$750. 
442-2253.

C84

FOR SALE: 1972 Maver­
ick. Good running condi­
tion. Call 442-2281.

C85

1984 Silverado, tool box, 
headache rack, power 
windows & locks, AM-FM 
cassette, cruise, tilt, A/C. 
$4,200 OBO. 647-3326 
after 4:00.

R86

M O B ILES

FOR SALE: 8’x30’ Sun­
downer Mobile Home. ’71 
Model but recently re­
modeled. 817-647-3571.

T84

MOBILE HOME: 12x60 2 
BR, good condition with 
or without furniture. 
Priced to sell. 629-2468 
or 629-1074.

T104

Garage Sale: Sat., North 
Service Rd in Olden, 
books tools, carpet rugs, 
jewelry, brass, glassware, 
& lots of mise, items.

T86
Garage Sale: 3 Families 
Sat. only. 8 til? Refrigera 
tor, bedroom suite, fumi 
ture and lots of goodies 
700 W. Sadosa. W. D 
Culpepper.

T84

ESTATE SALE: 504 W. 
7th, Cisco. Saturday, Oct. 
20,8 a.m. - 6 p.m.; Sun­
day, Oct. 21,12 noon - 5 
p.m. Little bit of every­
thing.

C84

Garage Sale: 2 Family • 
Sat., Oct. 20 - 8 a.m. till 4 
p.m. 512 South 
Daughterly, Eastland. 
Lots of good clothes, men 
& ladies, dishes, electiic 
skillet, 11/2 gal. electric 
ice cream freezer (like 
new) odd cha irs, portable 
television, guns, alumi­
num ladder, lots more.

T84

Garage Sale: Fri. & Sat. at 
714 §. Dixie, 10 speed 
bike, swivel rocker, bar 
stools, TV/Stereo stand, 
kitchen Items, formals, 
clothing.

T84



Two Family Garage Sale: 
' End of summer sale. Lots 

of children clothes 0-2T, 
mens'shirts and jeans, 
womens clothes, two for­
mais, two flutes, water- 
bed, chair and otherodds 
and ends. 1509 W. Plum­
mer, Eastland, Sat. Oct. 
20.8:00-4:00 only.

T84

2 Family Garage Sale: 
19th & 20th. Trash and 
treasure lots of goodies, 
everything from A to Z. 
507 S. Oakiawn.

T84

Garage Sale: Friday and 
Saturday. 8 till 6. 511 W. 
5th, Cisco.

C84

Porch Sale: Sat., Oct. 20. 
1208 Ave. M, Cisco. 9:00 
to 5:00. Boys clothes size 
5,6,10,12, Girls size 4,5; 
brown rocker, Whirlpool 
deep freeze upright, frost 
free $250 firm; Home in­
terior, lots of goodies.

C84

f -  ■"

NOTICES Í
/ V *  it vif'

NOTICE: FUND RAISING 
for your church, club or 
organization can be easy 
and profitable, selling a 
local product at a good 
commission rate. If inter­
ested, describe your or­
ganization in a letter to 
LOCAL SALES, Box 29, 
Eastland, TX 76448, with 
name of person to con­
tact.

T104

NOTICE: Now’s the time 
to check for winter dam­
age; hedges, shrubs and 
ornamentals. Call Jackie 
Hallmark fora free evaula- 
tion. Hallmark Garden 
Center, 600 W. Main St. 
Eastland, 629-8616.

T103

FOR SALE: Antique glass 
and furniture and other 
collectibles. “We Buy 
Estates.” The House of 
Antiques, 908 S. Bassett, 
Eastland, Texas. Open 
every day.

T104

FOR LEASE: 2 trailer lot 
spaces. Call 653-2407.

T104

SHARE LEASE 235 acre 
ranch and fruit farm with 
house and storage build­
ings located 3 miles from 
Rising Star. Some trac­
tors and farm equipment. 
Will share lease to re­
sponsible family. Call

817-643-5300.
T86

Signed Letters 
to the Editor are 
welcomed at local 
newspaper office

■ • FREE Estimates •
• All W ork (iuaranteed •

• Hot f a r  & (¡ravel ('omposition • 
Shingles* • T-Locks • • V\o«»d .Shingles • 
25 Years Experience In Eastland Area 
Paul Williams Carhon, Texas 

817-639-2330
If No Answer call X17|-629-l020 hk»«

CONOCO CONVENIENCE
STORE & RE.STAURANT

1-20 Putnam For Lease

New (ias Tanks, New Air & Heat, 
New Vault Unit

915-854-1760 or 915-675-6688
CERRSB

Desdemona News

AKC COCKER SPANIEL 
PUPPIES. Born Labor Day 
ready for new homes on 
10/15/90 just in time for 
Halloween surprise. Call 
for more Information: 
(817) 559-9977 after 5:00 
p.m.

T84

Eastland
Memorial Hospital 
October 16, 1990 

Admissions 
Craddock, Alma I. 

Rice, Alma S. 
Dismissals 

Callard, Frances B. 
October 17,1990 

Admissions 
Dendy, Mildred D.

Faires, Sheri 
Faires, Baby Boy 
Hawkins, Palsy 
Lindsey. Sharon 
Smallwood, Eula 
While, Frank G. 

Dismissals 
Duncan, Charles C. 
Leach, Lyman W. 
October 18, 199C 

Admissions 
none

Dismissals 
Faires, Sheri M. 

Faires, Baby Boy 
Rowers, Dorothy R. 

Magar, Delbert C.

Make plans to attend a 
meeting on Monday, October 
22, 7:00 p.m. at the Desde­
mona Community Center to 
plan the annual Thanksgiv­
ing Supper. This has been an 
annual affair since the end of 
World War 11. 1946 when a 
big Thanksgiving Supper vs as 
given for the returning solid- 
ers.

Our "get well” wishes goes 
out to Eloisc Lewis who is a 
patient in the Sicphenvilk 
Hospital at this lime.

Chris Johnson of Andrew s 
recently visited a few days 
with his grandparents. Bob 
and Merlcne Wisdom. Mcr-

lene taken Chris back to 
Andrews over the weekend

G e t  A l l .  
i n S c H e t y

Tly Vonriie Guthrey
and visited her daughter, 
Marsha Johnson and Billy.

Carolyn Me Kill ip Rogers 
has opened a Craft Shop in 
De Leon called “Carolyns 
Creations." Located in the R. 
D, Bellcomcr building. Hours 
are 8:30-5:30 Monday thru 
Saturday. She would appre 
ciaie all her friends and neigh­
bors dropping by for a visit.

Carson and Oma Lee Hold- 
ridge of Cisco, Bernard and 
Ann Keith spent the weekend 
in Siephenville attending Blue 
Grass ^estival at the MeUxly 
Mountain Ranch. Other 
friends attending Aiih diem 
were Kirby and Sue Fears of 
Stephenville, Dennis and 
AIcne Gotten of Springtown.

Call C rim estoppers 
For Fast Fifty

Maislialls and iliey have put 
on .siMiie .skits, wealing ■ 
lunu's aiHl gun . Iroin the ( )ld 
West.

Eastland County C ri­
me stoppers reminds people 
that if they see someone shop­
lifting in an Eastland County 
store, to gel a description and 
possibly a car license plate 
number, or the person ’ s name 
if known, and contact the 
police or store manager 
immediately. If the wiuiess 
also calls Crimestoppers at 
629-TIPS, he or she may 
receive a fast fifty dollars. If 
the person confesses or is 
cimv idl'd as a result of the 
wiiiu-'i' •'»Torts and a call 
was also made to Crimestoji 
pc'rs, the w itiwss can receive 
fifty doihus. But a call must 
be made to Crimestopivrs or

Budde Up!
Texas C oalition for Safety Belts

LOST: Ladies Seiko 
White-Gold Watch with 
gold trim. Lost Monday in 
the vicinity of First Na­
tional Bank. Pho. 442- 
1100. Reward.

C84

Black, white face cow, 
near calving strayed from 
Mahan place on Piedmont 
Road at Lake Leon. Call 
629-1584.

T85

LOST: White and light tan 
Chihuahua, answers to 
“Georgio.” $50.00 Re­
ward. Call 442-4717 or 
442-4517.

C84

FOUND: Lady’s jacket 
found recently on Hwy 80 
between Cisco and 
Eastland. Owner may 
identify and claim at The 
Cisco Press office.

C84

WoodtyOMlIor 
CiMn Water

Give a hoot. 
Don’t pollute.

Forrs« Servite, U 5.D A . U l

Read The 
Classifieds

General Dentistry
Dr. Easley Dr. Clark
1004 W. Main

Cosmetic Bundint; 
Cosmetic Bleaching 
Surgery
Crowns, Bridges

Eastland

• Implants
• (ium Treatment
• Braces
• Dentures

Experience Combined w'ith genuine concern

629-8581 CERKM

MOBILE
HOME

TRANSPORTING 
Complete Moves 

& Setups 
Moving

Throughout Texas 
• Tie Downs 

• Blocking 
& Leveling

* Licensed
* Bonded
* Insured

18 Years Experience
817-893-6753

REVIVAL
East Cisco Baptist Church 

October 28-31
Hear David Crain, A High 
Energy, Dynamic Musician 
and Speaker Who Will Inspire 
And Challenge You To Live 
For Christ.

DAVID CRAIN
OCT. 29: SUPER SUNDAY

Sunday School 9:45 a.m.
Revival Services 10:50 a.m. & 6:30 p.m.

OCT. 29-31: Revival Services 7:30 p.m.

YOU ARE INVITED
Rev. Larry Linam, Pastor 
East Cisco Baptist Church

506 East 11th Street Cisco 442-1679

ACCREDITED BY THE AMERICAN COLLEGE OF RADIOLOGY

BREAST CANCER DETECTION UNIT
a v a i l a b l e  to  a r e a  w o m e n !

THURSDAY. OCTOBER 25th  
EASTLAND COUTHY HEALTH FAIR 

CISCO. TEXAS

 ̂Call ^-2222 for appointment
A cco rd in g  to  th e  A m e r ic a n  C an cer S oc ie ­

ty, o n e  out of ten  w o m e n  w ill d e v e lo p  
b re as t can cer s o m e tim e  in h e r life t im e . It is 
c u rre n tly  e s tim a te d  

th o t o v e r  3 7 ,0 0 0  w o m e n  d ie  eac h  y e a r  os o resu lt of b re as t c a n c e r.
N in e ty  p e rc e n t o f b re a s t c an cers  a re  d ia g n o s ed  by w o m e n  o r th e ir  physic ians f in ­

d in g  a  lu m p  in th e  b re a s t. W o m e n  w h o  a re  d iag n o sed  w ith  a lu m p  lo rg e  e n o u g h  to  
fe e l h o ve  o 50  p e rc e n t f iv e  y e a r  s u rv iv a l ro te . A  w o m a n  w h o  is d ia g n o s e d  os h av in g  
b re a s t c a n c e r by m a m m o g ra p h y , b e fo re  a  lum p con be fe lt ,  has a 9 7 %  five  y e a r  s u r­
v iva l r a t e o n d o 9 0 %  10 y e a r  su rv iv o l ro te .  The cost Is o n ly  $60. (DO + $A.50 ^ H .

A mammogram can detect a concer this smoll,« even before it con be felt.

DONT OVERLOOK 
VOUR INSURANCE NEEDS

Serving Eastland County Since 1919

CONTACT

1

D.L. KINNAIRD 
GENERAL INSURANCE

629-2544
Salile  K innaird Lamar

629-8606 
M ike Perrv

R&R 
CARPET 

CLEANERS
• Carpet •

• Car Upholstery •
• Furniture •

to \ r  Headliners •
*  1. • Offering Scotch

Pam Rogers, Owner Guard •
• Water Extractions 
or Water Damage •

For Free Estimates
Call Collect

647-1211

the reward cannot be paid.
Crimestoppers has had a 

float in the Old Rip Parade 
and the Cisco Homecoming 
Parade lately. And the lloal 
won its division and received 
a nice trophy at Cisco.

The Boat became a lHH>ih 
at the Old Rip Fe.st and nu'rc 
than S4(X).00 w as raisc'd for 
Crimestopivrs, a non profit 
organization which uses the 
money to pay revs aids lor 
information which le.ids to 
the sohing of crimes With 
the IxHMh \ isiiing Rising Star, 
Gornuin, Ranger .iiul 
Easlliiul, ncatl> S I200 has 
been raised for Crmicsiop 
[X'rs.

Memivrs of the 1 egeiuls 
of the U'csi base Iven \ olun 
leering as C'riincstopper

Use  The 
d o s s i  f l ed

CISCO PRESS - EASTLAND IL I EUR \M - 
RANCKR TIMES 

Sunduv, October 21, 1990

had a busy day? i 
call us 
for yoiir' 
dinner

one ()uick |)lii>-K I ,ill .lint 
you'll have |uicy, golilcn

BROASTED
CHICKEN
ready tor your i.ible., 
in jiisi tniniiles

You don't have to lilt a linger (cm . pi to di. . 
647-5265!)...Quick as a wmk, all the liisuou 
BROASTED CHICKHN youi lamily can e u 
will ready for you ..Juicy .md lender.. A ursi 
delight...flavored the way everyone lows n 
best!
Let your telephone do tin. (mking nmight

T he Store 
520 W. Main

Ranger, TX 647-5265 ,

y t r / 6 2 9 - ) 6 3 t CMN • 2 , $ r
$.\T » 00 i> f

l d > ^ n u : s s  i * i n > t \ )
SAME DAY PHOTO PROCESSINU 

COLOK. HACK ft WHITE. PHOTO ^OOnCTiOH

k i l l  CUlVEftHOUSI 
OWNlft

*01 w  u • ■
$A$TiAMD lA )*«*«

Di^^bach
108 W. 6th Cisco

ONE STOP SERVK’E CENTER 
E kctrka l - A/C Heating - Appliances 

All Work & Materials Guaranteed 90 Days 
Call Now 442-2060 

Free Estimates or Rids chrio*J

Vic's Welding
323 N. Commerce Ranger, TX 76470

• Heliarc & Wire Feed Aluminum 
Welding - Heavy or Light 

• Portable & Shop Arc Welding 
• Custom Fabrication
Call 817-647-5120

Phone answered 24 hours, 7 days
Owner: Vic Huerta

»

iRRKM

J
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Kokomo News
By Z ddu Jordan

W hji a boauiiful fall Browning, Ouis Gritliih, 
V. .iificr wc*ire having. Great Waixla Rainey,Leona Wilson 
lor ittc {vanul hiirvesi. and Oren and Non\ia Webb 

•Ihc 'iTcual music at the with Wynclle Brown at the 
K Jkomo Bjptisi Chuah on piano.
Sunday morning was ren- Glynda Bond also rendered 
J. red by ihe choir, Joe and s[X'cial music on the organ.

,nda Bund, WiKhJrow and 
•len Browning, Ciary

Visitors were Steve and 
Kim Gilbert of San Antonio

and Ima Boles Clyde.
Steve and Kim Gillvrt ol 

San Antonio visited during 
the weekend w ith his grand­
mother, Mrs. Bcineice Rixlg- 
crs. Other visitors on Satur 
day were John and luiTonne 
Rodgers of Carbon and a 
friend of Steve and Kim, 
Shannon Burket of Ste[>hcn 
ville.

Vance, Donna, Kllcn anil 
l.auren L.aminack and friend. 
Ryan of Fort Worth were in 
Gorman on Friday night for

□
lU A H O R

James W. Ratliff
RKAl/rOR-

BROKKR
111 K. Main St. Ranker, Texas 

Office 647-1260 
Home Phone 

647-1667

REALTOR

. k Ih ii • u .liikiiiis, 1 1'2 halhs, very 
■I i i 'in j  I -oni. dining riMim, ciinililna- 

it riiUii< II iih pli'iity of labiiK ls,d ish- 
;i ' • ; -r Jilt buiiOings in back yard,

i-iiis, funs, .ind many o ther 
ti'uul this home. ILtO 1 ornar 

I .■Ialini V  shiiukt I- II \  liitjualified

.u : ■ h imi vsith 2 baths,bcdriM im s, 
• . illninu riMim, kitchen with

i-i d is h v .j 'h tr . diaihk- wail usen. 
I lots »nil mcr garden spot. This 

njsnew  (liubiiig.ncw windows.ineUi

■n acr -s north <> Kanger on ('wddo llwy. 
< >lder home with Iwo bedroom s,one hath, 
kilt hen. iiwngriMim, dining riMim.

siuk tti 2 hedriHitiis, I bath, iiving rmim, 
diiiiiig rii>>m,utiiilv room , garden spot, car 
p./i t ■ to  I lierr) St.

\ pprux 2 12 acres w ith m odular home, 
brdriMHii V 2 baths, IX X .tO carpurt,central 
heal and \ i r  I h isisa  sery atiracliveplacc.

On Ihe co rner two lots, two bedroom s, one hath 
well kept home, dinning riMini or den as it is 
used now. Very attractive hiHiie. h lh  Young 
Street. Let us show you this place.

O lder home on I I '2 lots in \o u n g  Addition, 
sou can repair home to ren to r  clear ju s t for the 
lots. Make us an offer.

Itric k four bedroom s, I I 2 baths, liking room, 
separate dining naim , kitchen, sun riaim or 
office. Double garage, two lots, in very good 
neighborhoodSpace heaters and several w in- 
dow refrigerated  units.

Kock trim  home un Kastland Hill or M orton 
Valley hwy. 2 bedPMims, I bath, living room, 
storage riMiin, several appliances stav with 
house. I his is 4 I 2 kits, approx. 75 X .fOO ft.

45 acrijs with house 12 miles north  of Ranger 
on Ihe Highway. I hree bedriMinis, one hath, 
utility riHim, kitchen liv ing riHtm. I his place is 
on Staff M atcr, 1 2 m inerals go w ith lliis place.

I.A M ) FOR S \ l> ;

,f2K acres of land west of Ranger

G ^ u r i f t y

Moving lo KasUtnd ('uunty ' Or 
«nywhcic m I S A Call Toll 1‘iue 1 - 
KlK* 52S K*i 4365 for
inlofmaticvi (No RenkaU Please)

f i f A i  ESTATE

l;.iiKtr,i I ove, IiK. Highway XO Fla.sl
Bioker l-astloiul, Texas 7644X

(»29-1725 629-S391
KXSM AM»

r ( KÌ H.'SiOt'ntial Lots Only $ 10 000 00 E 11 
( 'f-<L V $ 10 000 00 fof this 3 BR. 1 bath trame on S 
O' iiiian Con h a. Netxis some work E7 
P HIC E has boon reduced on this 3 Br 2 B Cresiwood 

Beaulitul kit, sunken Lr E36 
rO ! IB..E WIDE 3BR. 2 bath on corner lot Cov 

1!. ni.ichod carport E2
I Ml',; i .urge 3 BR 2 bath frame has a lot to oberi 

I loads of sto game room i  beautifully land 
ip.-<t Only $45 000 E3

'L lutiMI Home' 3BR 2Bath formal livmg room,
.iiji-cl<;n In nico subdivnsion E l2
■ m t 13 4 bath frame Small don. endosod porch
Nio cMi r neighborhood E5
VAGAN I Lut uommercial Area near downtown
f ronl.ige on N Lamar, access from Paltorson Si
O w nc will firvjnin E30
DRASTIC HEDUCIION - 2BR, 1 bath on shaded 
I >1 Cen Moat stq bidg E6 
NEWLYWEDS' ?BR 1 bath trame horrve m neat 
ri'inhhorhood Fk’.usonably priced E15 
OVVNER FINANCING on this 3BR 2 B f

rated bay m DR. patio doors to cov patio show 
place HAS
Throe Year Old Brick with country charm on 2 7 
acres Bay windows. F P, decorator touches HA12 
CARBON 3 6 acres with frontage to Hwy 6, a 
14X64 mobile homo ONLY $ 1 2 .» 0  0 0 'KA20 
3 BR Fr.imo ON 11 85 acres, near Lake Leon 
Frontage on 3 sides Some klein orass HA22 
COUNTRY LIVING on 28 ac 3BH,  ̂2 bath 4 yr old 
rock home Loadi.'d with extras HA6 
CARBON 3 BR tranfvo homo on 36 576 acres 
Cultivation with quota, minerals HA24 
Country Living at its best' Spacious 3 BR. 2 V2 bath 
brick on 5 7 ac Tank out buildings HA17 
2BH, 1 bath frame home on 66 ac Bam. roping 
pens stock tank HA7
100 a a e  Pecan Orchard Highly productive - Bur 
kett & Indian varieties 2 homes farm equip , 23 Ac 
w'dnp irrigation Good Income'HAO 
PERFECT Sol Up 3BR mobile home or, approx 4 
acres edge of Carbon Beautilul yard, scattered 
oak trees, coastal Atfordable'HAIO 
16 ACRESS 3BR, 1 3r4B mobile home City water, 
exc corvd HA11

,\( RKAtIK

29 ACRES within city limits of Cisco Hwy. frontage 
oak trees A10
LAKE Leon Excellent Ffecreational or Building Site' 
Approx 4 acres highway frontage & lake Irontage 
Ttoes'AI
GORMAN 82 9 ac ,45ac coastal w/balance pas 
tu'e Stock tank, 2 wells Minerals' A4 
TWO Buildmg Site Approx 3 acres each with water 
meters Highway frontage A5AA6 
EDGE of Eastland, 3/4 acres homesito - oak trees, 

hum iinnori C'ly uuliiics available A2 
Of upper c a r b o n  Area 118 5 Ac Fenced & cross fenced

1 'iVO BE DROOM 1B frame on corner lot Peach 
.md pivan Itoos dbl carport EtO 
► RICE I oworedon 3BR. IB frame with brick trim 
C M A Iroshly painted Only $19,500 00 E22 
iHI'o Cti.uinirig 2 BR. 1B frame (could be 3 BR) 
r.i row Odd floors & lots olcabmct space Single Gar 
,A C P E.'>4
l o w e r e d  p r ic e  on large 4BR 3 bath home 
Beaulilul yard E27
PRICE reduction iMBWWffffci Two story 4BR's, 2 
1 2 B A be.vutitijl ^ 1 4
GREAT Neighbor hood lor growing lamily 3BR, 2 B 
buck F'P dnjpes 4 built ins Gamaroom Sunroom 
A well kepi home E 17
OAK Hollow Addition' 3 BR 2 B brick Patio doors 
from Kitchen 4 LR to cov patio, built ins Priced in 
the $60's E16
CRESTWOOD Add n 3BR, 2 bath home with wot 
O ar, F/P cov patio Good tainily home E18 
ONLY4yr$ Old'3Br's. 2 baths Lotsotkit cabinets 
S l a ^  closets Arealfam ilyhom e' E23 
FAiRVTale SettiW SW jR iB hfram e.convenien t 
to all downtown B iM M U IB h x e  E25

3 Links. 4 equip shod Some minerals A19 
224 AC So ol Carbon Part brush, approx 30 ac

Victorian Beauty' in perfect location Recently up­
dated, 3 chandaliers stained glass in parlor Deco­
rator touches E28
3BR, 2B brick, C/H A corn lot Nice E4 

OT HF K
FtANGER Syr old brick 3 BR, 1 3/4 B Central h4a 
8 X10'stg bldg A nice place 014 
OWNER Translorrorf' SBR, 1 1/2B brick Storm 
wdows ncwappliances4 More' $36 (XX) 00 ^  
CARBON Shaded corner lot with frame home 
Oenor finanarte w/approvedcredil O il 
LAKE LEON Summer's Comming. Be Ready' 2 
BR, 1 B cabin, good waterfront, tishing/swirTvming 
dock Affordable'012
CARBON 2 BR, 1 B frame home Some furnishings, 
detached garage Only $12,000 00 01 
LAKE Cisco. North Side Add'n. 1 BR, frame cabin 
Cov patio 4 new roof ONLY $6,000 00 0 3  
LAKE LEON trees shade this large lot with 2BR 
furnished mobile home, boat dock 4 stg bldg 06  
CISCO large residential lot with mobile home 
hookups O10
CISCO Approx 5 ac. good for commerciai or resi­
dential Financing avaiteble 013 
CISCO Rock home, partially remodelled Only 
blocks from school 4 downtown 01 5  
LAKE CISCO - (North Shore) ■ Approx 11 yr old 
home on leased n t - good water - front. 2BR. 1 3/4 
baths, plus 2 separate guesi quarters O vner fi­
nancing to qualified buyer 016  
GORfA n Numerous listings, $8,000 $45.000 
Can for detailsi

HOI SE A  ACRKACF.
OLDEN - 3BR, 1 3/4 B brick on 1 8 acres Fruit 4 

trees, garden area  4 2 weHs HA2
____ N -  i .s a c 4 ■ v n r n i > 'i < ^  f /p .

windows, covered p .W ii i l l t I f  B-IA1S 
PRICE Reduced on this large 2BR, 2 B home situ 
ated on 14  Ac HA14
196 ACRE S with earfy 1900's home joins Eastland 

knits Excellent to Subdivido nwy 
trees HA8

OLDEN 1 1/2 Story on 69 acres 3Br, 1 1/3 baths 
In need ol some repairs HAS 
FAMILY wants to movxe: small almost new SBR 
tcama on 1 1683 acres in Olden Reduced to 
$15,000 00HA1
CXECUtiVt Home on 5 5 a a e s  Beautifully deco-

4 equip 
So o tC

coastal 2 Links fenced 4 cross terveed Some 
minerals A20
320 AC. Carbon improved grasses 4 cult Fenced
4 cross lenccd, 5 tanks Some minerals A21 
h e r e  It is' 16 Ac on pavement near Eastland 
Fenced, beautiful oak trees Be Ouick'A 11
296 AC North of Cisco Native pasture with Hwy 4 
Cnty Road frontage 3 tanks good hunting'A26 
GOOD Location 2 Ac tract in Pogue Industrial 
Park A28
So OF RANGER 61 894 ac with county road 
frontage Producing oil and gas. will convey 1/4 
minerals AI5
LAKE Front Lots Lake Leon Four lots to choose 
from' A30
9 ACRES In the City Limits' Nice building site A31
5 5 ACRES Approx 1m N otOklen Mostfydeared. 
tew trees Partially fenced A3
E Of Carbon 65 Ac with approx 21 acres in cull 
on paved road S a n ^  land 4 some minerals A7 
16()ACRES NW ol Eastland Approx 90 acres of 
improved grasses, remainder native pasture with 
scattered trees 2 tanks A9 
327 Acres Wot Carbon Approx 75 ac in cult Some 
improved grasses 4 wooded pasture Peanut
tuola A13

2 A aes NW of Gorman approx 1/2 in cult Small 
tank hand dug wells Minerals A t4 
245 ACRES So ol Carbon Approx 67 a a e s  in 
cu lt. balance m improved grasses Underground 
irrigation, large barn w shetf 12'X70' mobile home 
on property Minerals 4 Quota'AS 

C'OMMKKriAl.

SOLD

CISCO Commeraal bldg 
Conrad Hilton Ave Pncea 
VERSATILE coni

rl $20.000 00 _____
_ . LLENT LoSSTOÏÏ 
kitchen. Con H/A 5 tri

excellent location on 
to Sell' C20 
Lildino' Central h/a car

“ tore with 1680 sq  ft 
spaces located in baoi on 

seperate meters w all utilities C7

City Lknits
rusw

storm

frontage.

NICE Rental Property Bnck duplex unit 2BR's 4 1 
1/2 baths to each unit Cen h/a. good location C3 
FANTASTIC Location Next to Skinny's 24x14 off 
bldg sitting on 60X 160 paved 4 fenced lot Cl 
O n Ihe Square-Two story bldg . m good location 
Some equip 4 booths Needs some repairs C4 
CISCO Excellent office bldg 5 rooms. 2 restrooms
Soncrete parking area In good location C5 

ISCO 1-20 30 wooded acres, over 5()0 ft frontage 
on Norp Access Rd east of aty  limits C6 
RANGE R - Two story bldg .in need of some repairs 
1 St floor has Irg . open area w retroom 4 kitchen C8 
1-20 25 Acres. 1 rmle from E Eastland exit Beau 
tiful homesite permanent 4 overnight trailer spaces 
Some minerals and production C9 
CISCO - Beauty shop 4 stations. 8 hairdryers, nice 
interior Atphafl parking ClO 
CISCO - Frame office bldg 3 offices, reception 
area On corner lot C 12
CISCQ - Vacant corner lot at E 8th 4 Ave C C13 
CISCO - Mim-mall Over 4.000 sq ft in this metal 
b l ^  located on mam ihoroughlare C14 
CISCO Large, metal bldg on mam thoroughfare 
Concrete floor, office K1 front 30'x50'stg bkte CIS 
1-20, Baird, Approx. 2 J0 0  sq ft mesquite B B-0 
chippmg factory, on 30 a a e s  Equip can be pur 
chased also Ci i
NEAR DOWNTCjPWWRxy brick bldg on corner 
lot C 1 6 ______
-20 ACCESS FRONTAGE 2 5 a a e s  4 office C 17

area concrete 4  asphalt paving
largalot 
ing C l9

BARBARA LOVE 
*47-1 J*7

riNDVE rOBTER 
*29-9127

MIEI-LY RKTIIEY 
*2*3*14

ROSEMARY FE lU il 
*S3 237

pump

SON

the ballgaiiic uiul visiU'd with 
Cullen and Ava Rotlgers al- 
ler (he gatne. Ruth Spenecrol 
Bocme viSned with ihc Rixlg- 
ers on Saturday. Bcrncicc 
Rixlgers also visited in the 
Rixlgers home.

Jininiyand Verna Lav l ittle 
sjvnt Friday and Saturday 
night in Arlington with Tim, 
Nclda, Cixly and Jaa'd Fails, 
and attended Cotly’s “High­
landers" lixithall game on 
Saturday morning.

James and Jill Little joined 
them on Saturday to help 
Cody eelehrate early his lOih 
birthday, w tiieh w ill Iv CX to 
Ivr 21.1 lie birthday eake w as

inscribed “Happy Birthday 
Cixly” and had 10 candles. 
There was also party hats for 
everyone and gifts for Cody.

Jimmy and Vema Lee Little 
attended a ceramic show in 
Fort Worth on Sunday.

Mrs, Allx'rt Hendricks vis­
aed in Clyde on Saturday, 
Get. 1.̂  w iih Roy, Sylvia and 
Yaney Buchanan and cele­
brated Sylvia's birthday w ith 
her.

Jix' and Gl) nda and Bond 
ailended a hirthikiy celebra­
tion for her mother Mrs 
Glynn Wilson at Ranger on 
Sunday.

Mrs. Dora Garrett h.is re-

C'iso) 1’rt‘ss - K astland lek 'tira in  
U anjicr l imes 

Sunday, O ctober 21, 1990

'Pax-PV‘e Municipal Bonds.

7.50%*
M im ici|ial Ixiiids aro 11X1% fivp o f  Frxh'ral in ro m e  
tax, and  som»’ an> f n v  o f  sta to  and  locai laxos.
1/Ot ino show  yiMi how  to  pul tax  f n v  M unk 'ipals 
lo  Work for yoii now, ('.all liMlay.

Kobort Sifod
107 W. M ain, Fa.slland, TX.

(8171629-3851 
1-800 441-5282

Lj Edward I). Jones & Co.'
W«w*w> iWf* «MX* I «wB ■*»  ̂BIR«IH CR»»R»«*»w
Vr kn«'« n«ir cuMiimrrt ««Il t« wr knnw nut mvTMmrfiii 

• . M fWM to Mito«». «Mrttof :• I» to ••tototoW» Mr» totoMM •Wto»! «W Mtotol lito l*B«MtoÉ»fBM«M towMMfto» mAà toM<toN|

iS 8 è

• .Marble (lift Item s
• M onum ents W holesale & Retail
• C ran il & Bronze m arkers
• Cemetery 1/ettering
• H lstrorical M arkers
• Sigas
• C urbing & Slone Cleaning

STERLING MQNUMENT CO.
t'rrr Crmrlrry Spaces »Uh purchase of Premeed Memumemts

South Access Road between Faistland & Ranger
__  _ 653-2361________ ^

ROYAL NKIGHBORS 
OK AMERICA

J

SU PREM E OFFICE 
ROCK ISLAND. ILL.

COvtÍPLETE FRATERNAL LIFÉ INSURANCE 
FOR THE ENTIRE FAMILY

O M N I - P L U S  ( U n iv e r s a l  Id fc )

A n n u ities  and  IR A ’s -H ig h ly  C o m p e titiv e  In te r e s t  R a te s  
Contact

THELMA POWELL 
District Deputy

Ranger, Texas 76470 C < 817-647-3307

ANN WILLIAMS 
REAL ESTATE

610 Conrad Hilton Ave., Cisco
442-1880

Business & Home Phone
ICISCO HOMES

Instan t Home O w ner! $700. down with ow ner financing 
|o n  this 3 HR fram e home.

Budget S treU her Buys! .Many 2 o r 3 BR homes under 
|$I9,5(M). Several under $12,500.’ with possible ow ner fin.

.Affordable, Well Kept 2 BR home, ca rp o rt, 2 storage 
Ih ld g s ., fenced yard  near Klem. School.
I M ate r well and city w ater, rem odeled 2 BR brick, CH/CA, 
|4  lots.I Kind Familv Kun 3 BR, 1 1/2 bath , CH/CA , storm  win- 
|dovis, covered deck, garage, privaev fenced yard , $29,500.
I M ake Y our Paym ents C ount on this 4 BR,1 l /2 b a th b r ic k  
|hom e, ( 'H /C A , garage, fenced yard.
I KH/\ .Appraised at $31,000! 3 BR, 2 bath  new er home, 
|CH/(-'A , energv efficient, 2 lots.
I Klhow Roorh In & Out! 3 BR, 2 baths, large utility riK>m, 
Idouble ca rp o rt with storage shed.
I (¡rea l Lix'ation i  S I/e lT B R , 2 bath hrick, LR, DR, den, 
IgameriMim, CH/C’A, KP & woixl heater, ow ner fin.
I Shows Like A Dream Home! 3 BR, 2 bath  brick, form al 
|l)R /L R , den, CH/CA, KP & wiaid heater, beautiful fenced 
Ivard .

Reduced to $24,000 with 90% fin. available, 2 story home, 
|6  BR, LR, DR, den, on approx, acre of land.
I Spacious 2 storv, 4 BR, 2 baths, l.R , DR, viny l siding, well 
1 insulated, Onlv $23,900.
I Y esteryear, iO room , 2 bath , lovely 2 story hom e, 2 flre- 
Iplaces, free shaded yard .
I Large Privacy Fenced Y ard . 2 story w ith basem ent, 2nd 
|s to rv  needs restoration , nice shop.
I V ictorian C harm  su rrounded  by beautiful oak trees! 3 
I b R, 2 b a th s  DR, LR, den, g reat w orkshop.
I FOR RKNT: Large 2 story brick home.

ll.AKE CISCO AREA
Several cabins to choose from  under $19,500.
Trl-l/cvel 3 BR, 1 1/2 bath  furnished lake home, 3 decks, 

■dock, m any trees large, p a rk in s  area.I Inspiring  View! l.ovely 2 BR, 2 hath  home, C H /C A ,over- Isized double garage, covered deck and boat dock.

ICOMMERCIAL PROPERTIES
R educed to $9,500. - M etal building on 4 lots.

. S ta rt Your Own Basines* - 2 com m ercial bldgs, to choose 
|from  on C onrad Hilton Ave., $14,500 o r SI7,9o0.

Trem endous Business O pportunity! O utstand ing  Re 
Itau ran t on 2 a c re s  In t. 20 frontage, with o r w ithout equi 
|m en t and fu rn itu re , p rk e  and te rm s are  very negotiable

SMALL & LARGE ACREAGE
A pprox. 9 acres near R ls ln j^ t a r  call for info.
Nestled In Trees! Spacious .tB R , 2 bath home on approx. 

|3  a c re s  $25,000, ow ner financing available.
I W ant Privacy? Roomy 2 BR, 2 bath  mobile hom e, C H / 
IC A , garage, horse barn , tank , ru ra l w ater, approx 5 acres. 
1 t/ovely, Spacious 3 BR, 2 bath  rock home, CH /CA , den 
ILR, office, sunroom , on 4 acres.
I Remodeled 3 BR, 2 bath  brick, C H /C ^  tree  shaded Iff need yard , garage, ru ra l w ater plus well, 8 acres.

Im provem ents (ialore! 200 acres of coastal, love grass & 
' '  ‘ pens, w orking chute, severalIcu ltlvation , good fencing, P<HS 

¡outbldgs., 1 ta n k s  ««B, 2 bath  home.

luincil home from u w.'ii wiih 
Mr. and Mrs. Jury llalltiiork 
in San Angelo. M r uairelt, 
Mr. and Mrs. Jim Bemiettaiid 
Mr. and Mrs. Jimmy Little 
visilcd with Mrs. Ora Mac 
Jordan in Eastland on Sunday 
night.

“Happy Anniversary” to 
my husband, Glenn Joidaii. 
October 18 will be our 44th 
wedding anniversary .

Ima Boles ol Clyde visited 
during the w eekend w iih her 
mother, Mrs. Mamie Little.

Mr. and Mrs. J. L. Morrow 
and Mr. and Mrs. Charles 
Elston ot Huekabay met at 
the home of a brolher-in-law, 
Mr. Meiun l.ogan at Dublin 
on Friday to help Mels in 
celebrates his ‘HUh birthday. 
Mrs. Morrow baked his binh- 

day eake and punch was 
served w ith the eake. Mr, ,ind 
Mrs Jiv Charles Morrow of 
Houston arrived late in the 
evening for the celebration

Mr and Mrs. Larry Mor­

row, Layiic and Lenny ol 
Plains met Lance Morrow of 
Texas A & M here for a visit 
with Mr. and Mrs. J. L. Mor­
row and Mr. and Mrs. Paul 
Noiris, and Mr. and Mrs. 
Ronnie Pack, Cory and l.acy.

Cuticle Students, « 
Friends Away • 
would love a * 

subscription to loca( 
newspapers •

For Kent
21IR . 7 0 5  W  8Ui 1 65  t t )  6  m o n th  lease
3 B R . R is in g  S ta r  llw y -3 1 5 .(X ) .6 n u ) ir th  le a se
1 -20  È. C o m m c ric a l l* ru p c n y , p a v e d  f ru iu , e a sy  a c c e s s  t 'A l . l .  l O  S liL  
Acreage-
A prv 'x . 167 a c re s  W . u l C is c o , I-M 2 9 4 5 , o w n e r  f in a n c e  w ilh  t / 3  d o w n  
5.10.1X) |XT aca-
H o m e  o n  5 a c re s  3H r, 1 1/2 b a lh , l i ie p la c e ,  la rg e  g a m e  rix jtn , 'V c s tfx x in d  
W a le r , O ld  A b ile n e  I t  vs y 27tXX).00 O w n c r /a g e n i 
A p ro x . lO a c re s S o lC 'i s c o ,2 H K  M o b ile  I l ix n c .C ix m lry  l i v i n g  I8,(XK).(X) 
S e e n ic -S e c lu d e d  ap ro x . 157 a c re s , 4  t / 2  m ile s  N o f  M ay , E o f  l lw y  183, 
4 H R , S a i c l l i l c  d i s h ,  2  M e la i  b a r n s .  P K A C K I 'U l.  V A L l . t iY  IN  
M o i M i A N S ,  si;i: TO APmuciA'ii-: uo.txxr.oo
I Io n ic s '
190 7  A v e . " t ~  1 HR h o u s e . 2 » R  m o b ile  h o iiic , 8 lo ts , M A K E  A N  O F IT 'J t  
O v sn c r/a g c n l
K in g le t D r . - :  Y rs o ld , 41fR , 2 -1 /2  >aih, 3  f .r e p la c e s ,  lo la l c lc c ln c  
A p (x u x . 321X) sq. fi. N ic e  N c ig h h o rh ix d  R E tH IC E D  TO 85 ,(X )0 .00   ̂
ta sv e ly  iw o -s io ry  b o u se  ssn c o n ie r  lo l , 4  H R , 2 1/2 h a lb , H A V E  IX) I'..S1*. 
A l’IM EX’IA T E  3 0 0  W  5 ih  s i 95,(XX).(X)
KXM W . I l l h  SI 2 H R. la rg e  b a c k y a rd  ( 'A l  l .  I 'O S E E  20.1XX) (X) 
l a k e  Ciscsv- IH r , I b a lh . S m all CcX tagc IaM #.17 I 'R IC E D  IT) S M  I 
7,5(XUX)

McMillitin Real Estate 
You voline M cM illian-Broker 

Klh & C. Ilillon Ave.-Cisco, Texas 442-.»846 
_________Nancy Bacon. As-sin iale 442-2679 ci KI04

PAT MAYNARD REAL ESTATE
WE APPRECIATE YOUR BUSINESS!!

629-8568  MAYNARD BUILDING HWY. 80  EAST EASTLAND. TEXAS
s d B K « S E a g m e » U S r *  ................... J-AX|-:.i. k
.1.77 HiMHied acres, apprux. 3,000 sq. ft.

- - silualcd
■>n .1.77 HiMHied acres, apprux. .i.lKKl sq. It, of fabu- 
liius liv ing space. All II,e ammeniiles. Call fur ap- 
piHiitmenl In six*!

$1.10,000 - 4 bedruom, 4 hath. Lag home on 5 sc., 
abt. 2,500sq. ft., ennerpt living area ss/cnxy Hreplace, 
above ernundjMMil, separate gucst/playhouse, nice!

Siis.OOO • Two year old country home on 8.6572 
acres, approx. 2,825 sq. ft., like new, professionally 
divnraled, spacious den w/spiral staircase to kift, 
great master suite!

$IOS.O<M-3bedr<Mim,2 bath, brick home on abt. 
7 1/2 acres, apprux. 1,400 sq. (t. w/bcauliful view 
from hilltop, hits of extras induding rock nreplacc, 
Jacuni in Slasler

$91.000.3 bedriMsm, 2 balh, brick, sop. Using 
areas, large gameriMim/sunriMim. cumfurtable dm  
w /nreplacc, approx. 2 300 sq. ft., prtv acy fence, curbed 
How er beds.

$86,500 • 3 bedriMim, 2 balh. brick home on 5.1 
acres, approx. 1,830 sq. ft., fully landscaped, 
springkliT system, 81 tree pecan orchard for extra 
income,popular hHilion!

$X6,.sOO ■ 3 brdriMim, 2 balh. Mission Rrlck, abt. 
2,471 sq. ft., rock nreplacc, beamed ccling. wet bar, 
garden tub & sep. shower In master, Oak Hollow 
Addition.

$78,500 ■ 3 llcdrmim, I 3/4 Bath, Brick home on 
2.67 acres, carpel, drapes, builllns, central heal 4k 
air, nrcplaee, n'iling fans, palio/deck, gazebo, large

Mancha Area.$2,500lu$l2,000-l)ce
$4,500 each • Two SO' X 200' walerfrunl lots. 

Providence Rd.
$6,000 each • four deeded lots near l.aMancha, 

water frontage.
$I8,SOO-Nke2bedruom, 11/2 balh mobile home 

un 5 ac., central heat 4k air, carpel, deck, storm cellar, 
carport. Staff Meter, Good Hunting, creek.

$23,500 • Iwo deeded hits on Island at LaManeha 
K sla l^  Staff Meter, Septic System 4k Meiirieily
already in place, boat dtuk. 

$25,OM.?

Trailer Included
deep

Near ('uunlry Club, 2 deeded hil^gtMid 
waterfront. Staff Meter, Nke Arra, Travet

cui­
re 4k

shed, privacy fence.
$69,000 • 3 to 
1 shad 
rowi'

privacy fence, 4k more!
$68300 • 3 bedroom, 2 1/2 balh, frame w/slding.

brdriMim, 2 balh, brick, carpet, 
eplace, builllns including Jnn-ali 

mkruwBvc, isolated master w/whirlpuul bath, patio.

$28,000 • Staff .Area, Cozy Lake House on large 
deeded waterfront kit, eompielHy fenced, deep wa- 
ter. Staff Meter,cuncrelc boat ramp, screened |Mirch, 
Cm tral Heal.

$30,000 • 2 bcdrwHn, I balh, frame home un 
7S'XI25' waterfront tot, I.eaway Road, Pump House 
w/lake pump, Good Water.

$31300 . Providence Road, IOO'X400' water­
front kit w/2 bcdriMun mobile home wilh house-type 
roof, plus another 2 rnmn, I bath, bouse, 2-rar car­
port w/slor., patio.

$55,000 - Lee Lane, 2 bedriMim, 2 balh, mobik- 
home w/prclly sunrmim add on, situated on Iwo deep 
deeded waivnroni lot-s central heal 4k refrig. air, 
ehalnllnk fence.

$81,500 - 2 bedroom, 2 balh, frame w/siding, on 
approx. 75'X200'deeded lot.carpel, builllns, drapes, 
central heal 4k air, fireplace, ceiling fans. Staff meter, 
workshop, salelllle dish, elec, garage door opener, 4k 
more! OflUc could be -Ird BiC

on 6.2 V 
sep. dining 

$65,r"

wooded ac.,carpel, buillini, central heal 4k air, 
ining rm., abt. 1,90(1 sq. ft., cumptelely updated. 
5,(MN) • 3 BedroiHn, 21<aih, Brick home on 9.7 

acres, carpet, fireplace, utility rm., central heal 4k 
air, formal dining area, staff Meter, Ideal location 
near l.one Ccxlar.

$65,000 • I'wo-Slory, I.arge 4 bedroom, I 1/2 
hath, approx. 3,000 sq. rl., beautiful wallpspcr, for- 
mal dining, sep. living areas, sunrimm, ufilce, de- 
laehed studio. Must Sm!

$64,900.3 Bedroom, 2 Balh, on 12.9 ae.coastal, 
fenced A crossfenced, central heal 4k air, woo­
dburning healer, city water plus well, big shop bldg, 
w/elec. I

$58,500 - 3 bedroom, I 3/4 balh, brick, nice 
carpel, builllns, central heal A  air, 2-car garage w/ 
aulomalic opener, scrccncd-in back puich/palio, 
KxccllenI Location!

$58,000 -Two-Story, 4 bedroom, 2 1/2 bath, abt. 
2,400 sq. n„ carpel, drapes, builllns, central heal 4k 
air, formal dining area, large corner lot, detached 
ufTke, Wurth the money!

$49,900 - 3 bedroom, 2 balh, frame home on large 
1/2 ac. hit, carpet, builllns, central heal 4k air, formal 
" ling area, isolated ma.ster, covered palio 4k stor­

age, r  ulc!
$45,000 - 1/Ovrly Ruck Home, Completely refur­

bished, Six spacious rooms, beautiful carpel 4k wall­
paper, central heat A air, even wiring, plumbing 4k 
roof are new!

$45,000 - 3 Bedrixim, I 1/2 Balte Brkk, near 
sehtMils, carpel, drapes, central heal A  air, privacy 
fence, barn 4k ^ n s , fake A Look.

$40,000 • I.arge 2 bedroom, 2 balh, mobile home 
w/huill-on den A  ofllcc, carpet, builllns, central heal 
4k air, ceiling fans, on 20 scenic ac. w/prclly oack 
trees.

$37,000 • 3 bedroom, I 3/4 balh, frame home, 
carpel, builtins, central heal 4k air, ceiling fans, new 
privacy fence surrounds big backyard, freilily painted 
exterior, Nke!

$36,000 • 4 bedroom, frame, comer kit, formal 
dining, breakfast area In kitchen, bright 4k cheerful, 
non-qualifying KHA loan to assume!

$33,000 • 3 bedroom, 1 3/4 bath, frame, on ap- 
rox. 1 1/2 acre lot, formal dining, breakfast area la 
lichen, unbcHevcable closet space, 2 double car- 
ort-s patio, tank, pens.

$32,000 - 3 bedroom, 2 balh, modular home on 2 
luLs, central heat 4k air, carport, storage rm., fenced 
backyard, utility rm., storm windows, carpet, appli­
ances.

$30,000 - 2 bedroom, brick, ccnlri heat A  air, 
carpet, drapes, ceiling fans, fireplace w/heat-o-later,

OLDKN, CARBON, (¡ORMAN, 
RANiJKR, CISCO

Oiden • ENsimer post ofTke bldg., plus house next 
door. Just $12,.500 for both.

Olden • Cute 2 bedroom mobile home on 3/4 ac. 
kiLcenlralhcat 4k air, appliances, some furnilurr in­
cluded, horse bsrn, pipersil fence, $19,500.

Olden • Nice 3 bedriMun, 2 balh, home on 1/2 ac. 
kit. Isolated Master BR, Formal Dining Area, cov­
ered palki, large storage shed, $49,900.

( irbun • Izively 3 bedroom, 2 bath, brkk home, 
on corner lot, flrepUcc, carpet drapes, builllns, 
central heal 4k air, 2-car itaragc, like new!

Carbon • I3S'XI72' Rcsidintial last Big Pecan
Trec& $3300 .

Carbon - 3 BedriMim Frame w/.siding,Mvrral 
lots. Island Bar In KiU-hrn, Carpet, Pecan Trees, 3 
stw a»sheds. Windmill 1'ower, W'aliT Weil w/Pump,

arbon - 3 B^room , I Bath, on 2 hits, C a rp ^
$12

r» c s
,300 .
Carh

Drapes, Dish
^ a i r &  Peach Trees, $15,000.

iwashcr, (.’oncrcle t'ellar. New
Vtolf ww 8 w toV 0» m I to *
Cormaa • 3 bedroom, 1 1/2 bath, approx. 1,890 

sq. ft., on 7 acres, cnctral heat Ik air, carpel, drapes, 
phis another 2 bedroom home on properly. $60,000.

Gorman, 3 Bedroom, 1 1/2 Bath, on jmprux. 3/4 
ac.. Carport, Nm' RimiC, Pecan 4k <>ak Trees, RF- 
duced Price! $29300.

Gorman • 3 bedroom, 1 1/2 balh, office, central 
lical 4k air, carpel,custom drapes, ceiling fans, beamed 
ceilings, i  lotC$i8,500.

Ranger • Two-.SIory on Main Slreel 5 BedriMim, 
3 Bath, 2-Car Garage $45,000.

Ranger - Neal 2 BedriMim Frame,Central Heat, 
2-Car (farage, l*Kan Trees, $16,(100

Ranger - Nice 3 Bedrmim,Brick Home, Central 
Heal 4k Air, C arpel Assume Loan, $25,000.

Ranger • 3 licdroom, on 10 lots, covered front

Air, Buillins.i.arge l.iving Area.Scp. Dining, Break­
fast Nook oirr Kitchen, Fenced Yard, $39,500.

LAND: FARM.S, RANCHE.S 
& SMALL ACREAGE

12.9« ac , I 1/2 mile F-. of Carbon.all in rulliva- 
tion, good fences. Has a 3 bedriMim.l 3/4 balh, brkk 
home, approx. 1,900 sq. f t ,  $69,000.

15 ac , near Fastlind, County Rd. frontage on 
two sides, $12,500.

20 ac.. Big Oak Trees, w/2 bedruom, 2 bsih 
mobile home w/20'X20' attached den and I2'XI2' 
office, CH/CA, carpel fireplace. Westbound Water,

i ,, m aav, hkv ■'•uf,- F'encod, $40,()(j0.
bedroom, 2 bath, frame w/ 20 ac , Hwy. frunlitee, klinc gra.s.s, tank, fenced, 

■* ' '  • ■■ ■ • Owner Ffnanecs $20,0()0.
40 ac . Heavily wooded, can be divided, seller will 

finance, $3^000.
40 ac . Grass A  Trees, very secluded, goiMl hunt­

ing, 1/8 minerals, fenced 3 skies, $425 per ac.
40 ac . Native Pecans, water well, good fences, 

some minerals, $600 per ac.
50.6 ac . Creek, heavily wooded, two tanks, pens. 

Pretty Place! $750 per ac.
78 ac . Just Usied! Ideal location near Kastland

double c a r^ r l  w/sturage, plus extra storage bldg.
$29,50tl ■ Updated 3  bedroom, 2 bath, frame w 

siding, centrralneal 4k air,formal dining riMim, large 
workshop, comer lot, possibk owner finance as­
sumption.

$31.400 ■ 2 bedroom, I bath, frame, refrigerated 
air, dishwasher, cookslove, detached garage, fenced
backyard, situated on 4 iota w/prettylrees.

$Z8,0()0 - Assume Loan payments of $333 per 
mo., neat 2 bedroom, frame home, close in, large 
backyard, fence, approx. $750 total down payment 
A  closing cosls, why rent?

$27,(100 • 3 bedroom, 1 3/4 balh, frame, comer 
lo l oak A pecan trees, cnalnlink fence, detached 2- 
car garajte, storage b lag , large living/dlnlng combo.

{23,(8)0 - 3 bedroom, 2 bath, dobukwide, central 
heat 4k air, freshly painted, carpel bculltins, car* 
poi I  secluded location w/W s of Dig trees.

$21300 ■ Attention Investors! This large 3 bed­
room, 1 1/2 bath, frame home has central heal A  air, 
plus added bonus of garage apartment that stays 
rented, Two Rentals fur price of one!

$20,000 ■ I.arge 2 bcciroom, dining room, refrig- 
eraled air, carpel ceiling fan, fenced backyard, 

t A stori 
1,000 -  2 

garage, pecan 
meUI bulldini

trees scattered throu;
id, go

room house w/sep. livi 
ri<-3

of bottom land
o u i huge pecan trees on s l ^

ing n  ’ ‘ ■ ■
ice'! $47,500.

Fini
ass, plus very llvaMe 2 hi 

A den. This won't last

carport A storage, big kitchen 
$20,000 - 2 b '  

pel
ing.

$ i 9300 - 2 bedruom, 2 bath, movtk home, carpel

edriMim, 1 bath, frame w/sIdIng, 
4k pear trees, fence, large 2S'X40'

rv.l wi 
extra nice!

$1930 0  • 2 bedroom mobik home on approx. I 
acre lot, central heal 4k air. carpel appliances, pretty 
yard, horse bam, pipcrall fence, storage bldg.

$16,000 • 3 bedroom, separate dining room, all 
rooms nke 4k large, roof needs te be replaced, byl 
priced accordingly.

$16,000 • Very neat 2 bedroom frame w/siding, 
carpel freshly painted interior, pull-down a tlk  stor­
age inside house, appliances, detached garage w/ 
storage.

$14,000 ■ Beautiful 1 acre lot with lots of giant 
pecan trees, fenced In back, w/2 bedroom, frame w/ 
siding house, detached car abed 4k ceillar, dose to 
Kastland.

$ 1 2 ,^  • Two 8 room houses side by side, each 
h u  2 living areas, 4 bedrooms, 2 baths, utility 
hookups.

$7,000 • 2 bsdroom, frame, ca rpo rl 2 storage 
sheds, washer hookup, new roof, large rooms, looks
good!

$1230 0  • Near EasUand U k t,  large 14'X72' 
Fleetwood mobik home on wooded 3/4 ac. M l fenced, 
Westbound Water Meter Included. Would tell lot by 
itself.

Residential Lota: Oak Hollow Addition • $ 8 ,M ; 
hllkrest addition • $I0.0W: West Plummer St. • f  lots 
in aH • $2300  to $53(i0; Nartb U m ar St. 1 $3,000; 
Two S0'XI40' lots with tr te t > owner wIM finance • 
$2,500; 48'X 110' lot on South U m a r St. • cMy 
utilities • $.13(W.

HUD HOMF3 • Call any broker, Induding this 
agency for appt. to sec. Equal Houdng Opportunity, 

a t : .  (lUCK) WHEAT KAViAIUtV
SaOKCB ASSOCUTB

«zasM

with frontage on Hwy. 80 and Spur 490, large oak
‘through ---------------------------- -
I, good 
sep. liv

ions at this price! $4'.
146 ac.. Pasture land,oak trees, tank, Hwy. front 

age, fenced, some minerals, $450 per ac.
249J ac., Sibana River, 2 tanks, 1/2 minerals, 

oak & j>ecan trees, 140 ac. cullivsiion, $395 per ac.
I60 ac.,Somc cultivation, mostly wooded 4k pas­

tu re  corrals, goiMl fences, road frontage on two sides, 
$551) per ac.

COMMERCIAL PROPERTY
1-20 4k Hwy. 80 East area, Wonderful location 

next to major fast food chain, this 1/2  ac. lot has a
4k dryer, carporl storage shed, «*■( 8k air units.

15.5 acres, ipprox. 1 m ik frim  Eastland on 1-20
Servlet Rd. toward Olden,City waler,CydoneFencc, 
"  X40' metal bldg, w/siab Jk 

g. opea on 2 siaci
40'X40' metal bldg, w/siab 4k bath, 9ii'X76' metal 
Mito. opcB on 2 sides, $125,000.

20 acres, main Olden Inicraectlon on 1-20, road 
frontage on 2 sides. Ideal location for servke staiMn, 
con vcfiWnce store, etc., $4,000 per ac. or would sell off 
1 to 5 ac. tracts for $t0,0(>0 p it  ac

Hkhway* 4k 1-20 Area, U stland, I80'X150' L ol 
$20|0d0. Extra acreage avallabk.

Brkk Building on 1-20, Eastland, approx. 2,500 
tq. ft., carpel restroom,sflttingrooms,onicc, storage 
rm - Mved one-half acre lot, $96,000

Metal Bldg. w/LlvIng Quarters, approx. 5,000 sq. 
ft., siluated on 38.693 sc., 1-20 frontage, Eastland, 
$160,000

h.xchisive Retail A  W hokask business, High Prof- 
ha, Establisbed Contacts, Serious Inquiries y 
call for further dctalla.

New U undrom al on Hwy. 80 East near new 
apartment compkx, good potential, $90,000

Up to 50 ac. prime commercial devciopmeni 
property In Eastland, Priced to Sell!! $4,000 per ac  

One of Ihc few rtmainlng^commerdal lots on

pkssc

Hwy. 80 East near howling alley 
Ideal Mcalkm, already wirM A  ^urobed, $30,000

commercial
4k footbaU fleid.

We Welcome 
Your Listings!

WAYI«I vnUNMJti 
AMOCUn 

lu - tm

DCMU MAYNARD 
ASROCUTt
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Fishing Outdoors
By Terry L. Wilson

Big Scam 
At Big Sam?

When docs $500,000.00 
turn into$200,000.00forfish- 
ing? When only 2,921 en­
trants showed up for the l ^ e  
Sam Raybum Big Bass Super 
Derby. The Dallas-based 
Eventerprises which pro­
moted this event and the 
$500,000.00 or $250,000.00 
prize depending on the 
bracket entered estimate a loss 
of$l million dollars. The lone 
investor in Eventerprises has 
filed for bankruptcy.

This can only give an up­
hill road fur future big bass 
events promisint; vast riches.

And a special black eye to the 
angler who was to receive 
$500,000.00 for his winning 
fish DeWayne Morrison of 
Deer Park. Mr. Morrison has 
stated that he did receive 
$200,000.00 plus two post 
dated checks for $ 150,000.00 
each for Dec. 7, 1990 and 
Feb. 7, 1991. According to 
legal sources we contacted, 
legally the post dated checks 
can only be as good as wall­
paper.

The total number of con­
testants who is checks were 
bad was not available.

I wonder if the portion of

each entry fee that was to be 
' ear marked for ihe Lone Star 

Hatchery will be turned over? 
I will continue to puss along 
any information concerning 
this event.

Cruising is the most popu­
lar form of pleasure boating, 
but it also is responsible for 
more accidents than any other 
boating activity.

In 1989 there were 126 
cruising accidents reported in 
Texas, 277 boating accidents 
in 1990 of which 42 were 
water hazards while cruising.

Boating accidents can be 
divided into two categories; 
vessel casualty and personal 
casually. Vessel casualty 
includescollisions with other 
vessels, fixed or floating ob­
jects, capsizing, sinking, 
grounding and flooding. Per-

cvents prom isint; vast nenes.  ^

S h E C I

Hwy.80 Kast "As Fast As Fresh Can Be" Ea.stland

Tender Dinner
4 Chicken tenders, gravy, mashed potato 

or french fries, roll or puff
$2.89

Tender Pack
15 tenders 4 puffs or rolls, large gravy $7.95

Specials good Saturday thru Friday, Oct. 20-Nov. 2 
Open 7 days a week 11 a.m. - 9 p.m.

to Pcs. Chicken
large mashed potatoes, small gravy, 

large slaw, 6 puffs or rolls
...................- ................ ------------------------------------------------------------------------- - - ...............

$9.95
For Fa.ster Service At Our Drive thru Window

Call 629-8981

sonal casualties involve death 
by drowning and disappear­
ance. Personal injuries are 
represented by falls over­
board, falls in a boat, bums 
and hit-by-prop.

More than 90 percent of 
deaths in boating accidents 
are drowning incidences 
while 80 pcccnt of drowning 
victims were not wearing a 
personal flotation device.

Factors that will help re­
duce the risk of water hazards 
incl ude having a nautical chart 
and knowing how U) navigate 
with one. Charts are your road 
maps. Most a r^ s  have gov­
ernment or locally prepared 
charts available that give 
water depth, show navigated 
aids, major landmarks and 
underwater danger areas, as 
wellas shorelines, waterways 
and harbor areas.

Another preparatory factor 
is knowing navigational aids 
on your right while heading 
upsueam, or from seaward, is 
a fundamental example of 
proper navigation. The 
phrase, ‘red right returning* 
helps boaters remember this 
rule.

Other equipment that will 
help you navigate the hazards

are acompass,piloting skills, 
tide and lime tables, range 
markers, lighthouses and 
knowledge about currents. 
Also, weather conditions, 
excessive speed, no proper 
lookout, overloading, im­
proper loading, restricted 
vision, alcohol use, faulty 
hull, machinery and equip­
ment are other causes of 
boating accidents and death."

The operation of a vessel 
must submit an accident re­
port form to TPWD, 4200 
Smith School Road, Austin, 
TX 78744, for any accident 
in which a person dies; a 
person is injured; or property 
damage is more than $500.00. 
This report must be submit­
ted within 30 days of the 
accident.

A vessel operator involved 
in an accident must render all 
practical and necessary assis­
tance possible to the victims 
without seriously endanger­
ing his own vessel or persons 
aboard. The operator shall 
give his name, address and 
vessel identification to any 
person injured or to the owner 
of any property damage in the 
accident.

Till next week remember

the examples we wi will be 
the molds for tomorrows 
ouldoorsmcii.

Terry L. Wilstm

Scholarship
Deadline

High school students who 
arc interested in applying for 
SI,(XX) college scholarships 
should request applications by 
December 14, 1990 from 
Educational Communica­
tions Scholarship Foundation, 
721 N. McKinley Road, P. O. 
Box 5002, Lake Forest, IL 
60045-5002. To receive an 
application, students should 
send a note staling their name, 
address, city, state, zip code, 
approximate grade point 
average and year of gradu­
ation. All requests for appli­
cations will be fulfilled on or 
about January 15, 1991. 
Seventyfive winners will be 
selected on the basis of aca­
demic performance, involve- 
mentincxuacurricular activi­
ties and need for financial aid.

Use The Classifieds

NatuialkMl Ijfc 
ANewIM.

Merrill Lynch invites you to a free seminar on..

“Today’s Market- 
What’s Going On?”

At this seminar we’ll discuss what has happened in the 
financial markets and what investment opportunities are available 
for both conservative and higher risk-oriented investors.

There will be ample time for questions and, if you wish, to 
arrange an appointment with a Financial Consultant to discuss your 
personal situation.

For more information and reservations, giv.- ns a call at the 
number below, because....

Mow is no time to go it alone.

DATE: Tuesday, October 23rd

TIME: 2:00 p.m.

PLACE: K-Bob's Restaurant
lH-20 
Eastland

SPEAKERS: Natalie Woods and Randy McCarver, 
Merrill Lynch Financial Consultants

RSVP: Bess Carter at 1-800-825-0101

Mall to: Merrill Lynch. Pierce. Fenner A Smith Inc.
3401 Curry Lane, tat Floor, Abilene, TX 79606

□  No, I cannot attend, but please send me more Information. 

Nww _ A d d r f

BustriMi Phon« ( "i City.

Homi« Phon« ( \

MorrlU Lynch cKantt, plMM 0¥t mm# and ofltc« «ddíMt at your Plnandal Contullant: I

•  MfH» UfWcK ñtnm. ê fcwWh Iwe. il>wO>a> MPC.
Merrill Lynch
A tradition of trust.

liu'Ciift
Wi(liAnv&i.7()
MLitNimiaii
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Ix^ivs wiihlicalllTy 
skin f tv w iix k x k x l

Nctv U sik U Mills 
wiilisnlukitAtrsaixl 
<kini ;m‘(\MiUkib> AikI 
US lux wiih.im fli.SO

ih ivc^xxia l 
U ixivaathaixvtlt'ait;
I'mxkxi.s
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skin,|xiixiringufi)r(lx’ 
st^xT n* Msuirizing it m 
dukMXTstifliixivalXn  
t;aiiK‘ After that, 
Luxival.K|iiklCmix- 
RxiixtaiHMi willghv 
ytxiraMn|ikxkMia 
ixiixth lliwk'ss finisit.

.SiOMixintoNkrlc
NiMman.wtx'ivüx'
New Ltmkisaiuuirtl

m6RL€ nORíBRÍl. /
C O S M E T I C  S T U D I O S

East Main - Eastland 
629-3533

Cisco Press - Eastland Telegram 
Ranger Times

____ Sunday, October 21, 1990__

Your Special Invitation...

If you like to hear about...^

T he p as to r, and  In lem atlonaJ sp eak er, J o h n  
C. J o n e s  p r e s e n ts  th e  liv in g  C h ris t  
th ro u g h  the  m essage of "faith weekly. Tlie 
congregation  Is a  Inter-denom ination wor- 
ahlp cen ter w here people from all w alks of 
life a n d  re lig ious experience com e to s tu d y  
G od's Word.

A Church O f "Signs & Miracles "

Service Times
Sunday 10:30 a.m. 6:00 p.m. 

Wednesday 7:30 p.m.

"Where going to church is fun "

This week. Join those who drive from a 100 
mile radius each week to attend a churrh 
that Is "Delightfully Charismatic."

Ph. 442-2673 608 £. 8th 
Cisco, Texas

Ph. 442-4479

LAWRENCE BROS

Open Mon • Sun. 7-9 p.m.
Hwv. 80 East Eastland 629-3305

FRESH PRODUCE DAILY 
PRODUCE SALE

Lettuce
2 /S l.O O

r '

y

Pinto Beans
Bulk

39C lb.

Cabbaee
19C lb. «

J
Cilantro

3 / $ 1.00 lb.

Cucumbers
5 / $ l . 0 0 ea.

_________________________________

Jalapeno Chile
69 C lb.

Avocados 
3 / $  1.00  ea.

White Grapes 
69C ea.

—

Bananas
4 / $ 1.00 lb.

Russet Potatoes’ 
10 lb.

$ I *49 bag 

LAWRENCE BROS

iy _ru Tue.
J



Obituaries Andrew C. Poe Lois Moore Allan J. Shrader

Lora M. Graham
HASTLAND - Lora M. 

Ciruhain, 90. died Monday, 
Oi iobcr 15, 1990 at a local 
nursing home.

Services were heldat 2 p.m. 
Wednesday, October 17 at 
Bakker Funeral Home Chapel 
with the Rev. Archie 
Robertson officiating. Burial 
was in Fastland Cemetery.

Mrs. Graham was bom in 
Frath County, she had lived

in the Kokomo community 
for 20 years before moving to 
Eastland in 1964.

She was a homemaker and 
a member of Gorman Primi­
tive Baptist Church.

She was the widow of 
Whitlow Graham.

Survivors include a sister, 
Emma Overstreet of Califor­
nia; and several nieces and 
nephews.

BEN WHEELER - Andrew 
Clifford Poe, 79, died Tues­
day, October 16 at a Dallas 
hospiuil.

Graveside services were 
held at 2:30 p.m. Thursday, 
October 18 at Pleasant Hill 
Cemetery in Cisco with the 
Rev. James Poe officiating, 
directed by Eubank Funeral 
Home of Canton.

Mr. Poe was bom in Cisco 
and had lived in Ben Wheeler 
for the past four months, prior 
U) that, he had resided in 
Terrell. He was a retired

maintenance worker, a mem­
ber of First Baptist Church 
and was a U.S. Army Air 
Corps veteran of World War 
II

He was the widow of Angie 
Poe.

Survivors include two sons, 
the Rev. James D. Poe of Ben 
Wheeler and Charles Donald 
PiK‘ of Novice; a daughter, 
Judy Martin of Plano; a sis­
ter, Ada Alton of Eastland; 
nine grandchildren; 13 great­
grandchildren; and several 
other relatives.

DE LEON - Lois Mcxire, 
81, died Tuesday,Oct. 16ata 
local hospital.

Services w ere held at 2 p.m. 
Thursday, Oet. 18 at First 
Baptist Church with Tom 
Saiterwhite officiating, as­
sisted by Jackie Auvenshine. 
Burial w as in De Leon Ceme­
tery. directed by Nowli 
Funeral Home 

Mrs Moi're was bom in 
Gorman and had lived in 
Comanche County most of 
her life. She wasamemberof

First Baptist Church, a home­
maker and w as the w idow of 
Estel Weaver and Frank 
Mixirc.

Survivors include a son. 
James Weaver of Granbury; 
a ilaughier, Johnnie Walker 
of Ballinger; two stepsons, 
Frank Moore Jr and Derrell 
Mtxire, both of Comanctie; a 
stepdaughter, Wanda Emfin- 
ger of Penw ell; a brother, Jack 
Mauney of Gorman; four 
grandchildren; si.x great­
grandchildren; and three 
great great-grandchildren.

A.J. Rogers Jack Powers Eutura Glenn
RANGER - A. J. “Jack” 

Rogers, 84, died Monday, 
(X;U)bcr 15, 1990 at a Gor­
man nursing home.

Services wcreheldai2p.m. 
Wednc.sday, October 17 at 
Second Baptist Church with 
the Rev. Darrell Dossey offi­
ciating, assisted by Curtis 
Maiuicss. Burial was held in 
Alameda Cemetery, directed 
by Fdwards Funeral Home.

Mr Rogers was a lifelong 
resident of Eastland County, 
attended Salem schools and 
was a retired farmer.

He was a member of Sec­

ond Baptist Church where he 
was a deacon and served on 
the Alameda schixil board in 
the 1940s.

Surv Ivors include his wife, 
Lucy Inc/. Rogers of Ranger, 
two sons, Fred Rogers of 
Gorman and Alton L. 
“Buddy" Rogers of Ranger; a 
daughter, Lugcnc Morris of 
De Leon; a brother, Billy Joe 
Rogers of Ranger; a sister, 
Della Galloway of Ranger; 
nine grandchildren; 14 great­
grandchildren; and a great- 
great-grandchild.

Helen E. Packwood
R ANGER-Helen E.Pack- 

wixxl, 93, of Denton, died 
Tuesday, October 16 at a 
IX'iiton hospital.

Services were held at 2 p.m. 
Thursday, October 18 at 
Eastside Baptist Church. 
Bunal was held in Evergreen 
Cemetery, directed by Ed­
wards Funeral Home.

Mrs. Packwood was bom 
in Chambers County and 
moved to Denton in 1988 
In nil Ranger.

She was a member of 
Denton Baptist Temple 
( hurcli, a longiinK* nrember

of Eastside Baptist Church 
where she was active in all 
phases of the church. She was 
a pa.st president of the Ranger 
Parent-Teacher Association 
and a member of the Eastern 
Star.

She was the widow of 
Homer Packwoixl.

Survivors include two 
granddaughters, Dana 
MaxwellofDcntonand Vicki 
O ’Donald of Wylie; a grand­
son, Sam Summers of Fort 
Woith; and five great-grand­
children.

Jack Powers of Vidor, 
Texas passed away at his
home September 19, 1990.

Funeral services were held 
at Pine Forest Baptist Church 
at 2:00 p.m. Friday, Septem­
ber 21, 1990 with burial fol­
lowing at ResUawn Memo­
rial Park, umler the direction 
of Memorial Funeral Home 
of Vidor.

Jack was bom June 27, 
1924 in Lorenze, Texas, 
raised in Dc.sdemona, Texas. 
He moved to Beaumont in 
1942 and was employed at 
Magnolia Refinery, which is 
now known as Mobil Oil. He 
was retired from Mobil with 
42 years and 5 months as an 
Instrument Mechanic. He

retired from OCAW Local 
No. 4-243 after 15 years as 
Secretary-Treasurer and 28 
years as a member of the 
Work man’s Comm I itee .Jack 
was a Vice-President of the 
Texas AFL-CIO and a Presi­
dent of the OCAW Mobil 
Council. He was very active 
in the Dcnuxratic Party. Also 
a long-time member of Pine 
Forest Baptist Church and a 
four year World War II Vet­
eran.

Survivors include his wife, 
Margie Powers, and his son, 
Paul both of Vidor; daugh­
ters, Carolyn Russell of 
Orangcficld and Schcry Lou 
Bellcfeville of Channel View; 
three grandsons: and one 
granddaughter.

R.ANGER - Eiura Glenn, 
84, died Thursday, October 
18 at a lixal hospital.

Services were heldat 2 p.m. 
Saturday, October 20 at 
Mesquite and Rusk Street 
Church ol Christ with Ron 
Greiner officiating. Burial 
was in Mcrnman Cemetery, 
directed by Edwards Funeral 
Home

Mrs. Glenn was born in 
McLennan County, moved to

Ranger in 1918 and attended 
Crossroads schvxils. She was 
a homemaker, a member of 
Mesquite and Rusk Street 
C'hurch of Christ for 55 years 
and was the w idow of James 
A. Glenn.

Survivors include two 
daughters, Vivian (M rs. 
Raymond) Hart ofRangerand 
Virgie (Mrs. Ed) Boatman of 
Sug;irland; and two grand­
sons

Ellen N. Wright

L IT  W E

.« iS J B g t/
Is currently fur Sale at Ea.stland Telegram, 

Cisco Press, and Eastland Drug for
$9.95

Ellen Nora Wright, 75, ol 
Abilene, died Thursday, Oc­
tober 18 at a kxal nursing 
home.

Services were held at 2 p.m. 
Saturday, CXtober 20 at Elli- 
ott-Hamil Funeral Home, 
Chapel of M emories, 
Abilene. Burial was in 
Oaklawn Cemetery in Gex- 
man.

Mrs. W'righi was bom in 
Proctor and attended school 
in Rising SLir. She lived in 
Eastland for several years.

She moved to Abilene from 
Odessa in 1990. She was a 
homemaker and a member of 
the Hoincss Church. She was 
the widow of Walter Warren 
Wright.

Survivors include two sis­
ters, Helen L. Scale of Odcs.sa 
and Orjiah Lee Adams of 
Abilene; four brothers. Jack 
Timothy Wilson of Abilene, 
Jim Cotton for Carbon, Al- 
bcrlCoUonofLingcrville,and 
Jay Cotton of Hasscy; and 
several neiccs and nephews.

USE THE 
CLASSIFIEDS

M. H. Perry 
Insurance

104 N. Lamar 
Eastland, TX

Phone 629-1566

• 1 jfe Insurance

• Hospitalization

• Group

• Cancer

• Supplement

• Medicare

CER t04

FULL-SERVICE 
PLUMBING 

58 Years And
Three Generations of Service:

SMITH PLUMBING
Roy Lee, James and Mike 

Master Plumhing Supervision 
200 N. Walnut-629-2995

Eastland c er k m

z'--------------------------^' Hug ,  D on 't H it
Prevent

Child Abuse

- <  R E T I R E M E N T '^RETIREMENT
H O T E L

401 North Oak 
Mineral Wells. Texas 76067

"A Retirement Residence for over 25 years"
Single................................................. $455.00
Double................................................$580.00
Suite................................................... $655.00
Double Suite....................................... $780.00
Rates Include all meals, utilities, and maid service.

1-800-637-6078 CM95

PICKRELL REAL ESTATE 
Residential-Land-Commercial 

817-647-3582
111 W. Main St., Ranger, Tx. 76470

Kiogtr PruBtrlY
2bd, I balh, nice cxrpcl, new nwf, central air/gas fumaoc, melai tHling 
with ficfh paint, ceiling Fani, I car garage, ntor covered patio, pecan, 
apple, oak Ircea, uwner/agcni 
g lou in Meadowbrtwk addiUun owner/hrokcr 
22 lou in Oakhill Subdiviairai owner/agcni
tak e  laon-amall cabin with cxcellcnl lol and enclosed b o ti htiusc, 
suFf water.
2 bd, I baih, 3 lots Frame house $14,500.00 
4 bd, 2 bath, carport. Frame house $I8,0(X).00 
Yellow Rose Irailcr park -spaces available For rent 
Hastland Pnincrtv
12 residential lots between ilalbryan ind Rassctl street, uwncr/agent
Acrtitt
177 acres north o f Kangcr-3 hd, 2 bath, house, new ham and conals, 
nice new garage. 3 ponda, water well, water meter, minerals. I.uts uF 
wildlife, excellent deer hunting. $116,000.00 Stephens County 
79 Acres south of Kangcr-lxon River runs through middle, large  field 
and pecan trees, water well and pond. Mineral rights $58,(XX).00. 
l-astland County
too acres west of Ranger, coastal, large uink, good cattle pasture or 
home site. $90,000.(X) l-astland County
DKKR HUNTKRS 160 actcs-l well stocked pond, post oak-native 
pecan-elm, approxunaicly 50% wooded, 1/16 mineral, producing oil 
and gas well, vciy good deer and turkey hunung $550.00 per acre 
l-astland County
Check with us for Faim/ranch and hunting property listings.

David D. Pkkrell, II
RKALTOK-Broker 

(817) 647-SI41 
.Shawn Wells 

REALTOR-A.S.SOCIATE 
(817) 647-3009

CEillCM

Mildred Pkkrell 
REALTOR-Bruker

Gilbert Meredith 
REALTOR-ASSOCIATE 

(817) 647-5141

Legal Notice
LEGAL NOTICE 

The Eastland lmlc|x:ndeni 
School District Board of 
Trustees is accepting bids on 
18 (eighteen) 286/12 com­
puter systems. For specifica­
tions contact Keith Watkins, 
su|X'rinlcndcnl, Eastland ISD, 
9(X) W. Plummer, P. O. Box 
31. Eastland, TX 76448(817) 
629-8221. The board reserves 
the right to accept for reject 
any ix all bids.

Bids should be submitted 
by 4:(K) p.m., November 2, 
1990, to Keith Watkins, 
superintendent.Eastland ISD, 
9(K) W. Plummer, P. O. Box 
31. Eastland. TX 7M48. FAX 

#817-629-3677. 
(10-21, 10-25.10-28, 11-

1)

•  CHILD ABUSE *
•  24 HOUR HOTLINE *
,  1-800-252-5400 •

Eastland Telegram - 
Ranger Times - Cisco

S unday,

October 21,1990

S y l N T y l  F E  H A X l l  CO.
20041-20 East Ea.slland 629.1505

èNow Open Under New M anagement
-----------Open 8:00 a.m. till Late.............

C om plete Fam ily Hair C are Featuring:
Regular & Spiral Perms Mens & Womens Blow Dry Cuts

M air« & Clairol Hair Colors M«"* Regular Hair Cuts
Sun Glitz & Diamond Glitz French Braiding & Add in Braids

Hair Extensions & Weaving
Pamper You Hands and Feet with Our FuUtunr Manicurist -

Sherri Christesson
Manicure Special Hot Oil - $12.00 & Regular $10.00 

New Set Sculps $30.00 or Fiberglass $40.00 
Pedicures - $15.00

.lanet Messenger
Kara Williamson Lewis

Terri Hanlon
Dianne Barton

Will be Available for All Your Hair Needs
Also Featuring Electrolysis <'«!• "L

TIm  Ouljr P em im n l Hair Removxl Of JUSt COme 111. 629-1595

EASTCO REALTY
107-A Main St. 

Ranger, Texas 76470

647-1302
BUttlOBB

Opportunity
RANGER

ildow Brook Addition - Beautiful Brick 3 
BR, 3 3/4 bath. CH/A, fenced backyard, 2 stor­
age buildings. Priced to sell.
700 Foch - 3BR 2B 2CarGar., Fireplace CH/A 

Newer Home - Completely renovated.
309 Elm - Remodeled - 3 apts. - Possible owner 
finance • Good income property.
454 Pine - Older home, but priced for anyone's 
budget - Some furnishings included. Needs some 
TLC.
414 Mesquite - Remodeled - Good location - 
Ceiling Fans - fenced yard.
403 Blundell - 3BR - Ceiling Fans - Beautiful 
Yard - Fantastic location - large storage building 

Fenced - Owner Finance 
1213 Lamar - 3 BR 1 1/2 Bath - Brick - CH/A - 
Great neighborhood.
Hcxlges Oak Park Add. - Nice Frame - 3 BR -1 
bath - CP Fenced - Priced Right.
Approx. 1 Acre - with very comfortable 3 BR 
Home - Just out of the city limits.
Highland Heights - Oakhill Sub. - 10 Residen­
tial lots for sale.

Shirley GrifTith 647-1635

EA.STLAND
S. Seaman - Nice Frame 3 BR 2B - CH - Fireplace
- Built-ins - Comer lol.
N. Oaklawn - Brand new home on a beautiful, 
wooded lot. Terms available.
LAKE LEON
Lee Road waterfront - 2BR - IB - staff water - 
deeded lot - Boat dock.
5.3 Acres - 3 garden spots - fruit tress - extra nice 
doublewide - staff water - fireplace - 2 bath - CH/A 
includes tillers, riding mower, satellite dish, they'll 
even throw m a pick-up. Too many extras to list - 
Come see it.
ACREAGE
223.79 acs. - 2160 sq. ft. - goegeous home - 3 BR, 
2 3/4 Bath - Native Stone fireplace - Big Porch - 
only 4 yrs. old. Land is Partial Coastal - Great 
hunting - 8 tanks - near Carbon.
39 acs. - Near Ranger • wooded & some cultivation 
80 acs. - 5 Irrigation wells, pit, irrigation equipment
- 2 gas wells - good fences.
Call us about the g rea t values available on-HUD 
owned homes In E astland C ounty. .Some with 
low down paym ents & HUD Insured financing 
available

Bobby L. Little 639-2288 
Ellen Bollinger 647-3160 
D.B. Cozart Jr. Broker

CERI04

CISCO— Memorial serv­
ices for Allan Jackson (Jack) 
Shrader, a graduate of Cisco 
High Sch(X)l and Cisco Jun­
ior College, were held Thurs­
day. 0:1. 18, 1990, at U);30 
am . at Weed-Corley Funeral 
Home Chapel in Austin.

Mr. Shrader died Monday, 
O l .  15, 1990, in an Ausiin 
hospiuil follovungadiree year 
illness.

Born Sept. 25, 1947, in 
Buird, he grew up in ihe farm­
ing cominunily of Sciaruon, 
where aliended elementary 
sdKxil. Mr. Shrader aliended 
Texas Tech University for 
(wo years alter graduation 
from CJC.

He was named direeior ol 
the Faculty Ceitier and Six*- 
eial Services at die Univer­
sity of Texas in Austin in 
1975. He held dial |x>siiion

until a few days before his 
death.

Mr. Shrader was a found­
ing member of the Associa­
tion of Faculty Clubs, a na­
tional organization of univer­
sity faculty centers in the 
United States. He served as 
vice president of the group in 
1987-88.

He was a member of the 
First Baptist Church of 
Austin.

Survivors include his 
inoiher. Bobbie, formerly of 
'isco and now of Austin; a 

brother. Bob; a sistcr-in-law, 
Sue; and a niece, Elizaihclh; 
all of Austin.

The family requests memo­
rial eonlributions be made to 
a lavoriic charily.

Arrangcmcnls were by 
Weed-Corley Funeral Home, 
3125 N. l,ainar, Ausiin.

Edwin P. Schaefer
CISCO — Edwin Paul 

Schaefer, 52, died Thursilay, 
Oct. 18. 1990, at Easiland 
Memorial Hospital.

Services were scheduled 
for 4 p.m. Saturday, Oct. 20, 
1990, at Cisco Funeral 1 lomc 
Chapel with the Rev. J. Doyle 
Roberts officiating, assisted 
by Rev. Ted Avanis. Burial 
was to be in the May Ceme­
tery.

Mr. Schaefer was born 
Aug. 4,1938, in Nimrtxl. He 
was a charter member of 
Temple Baptist Church of 
Cross Plains. He received a 
Slate Farmers Degree in FFA

in 1956 and ho graduated from 
Rising Star High Scluxil in 
1956.

He married the former 
Zclma Marie Bell on March 
11, 1973, in Rising Star.

Surv ivors include his wife, 
Zclma Marie Schaefer of 
C isco; three sons, John 
Schac fer of Jacksboro, Robert 
Allen of Wichita Falls, and 
Richard Allen of 
Brownw txxl; four cUiuglUcrs, 
Mary Davis and Deborah 
Thomas, both of Cross Plains; 
Bridgclie Green of Snyder 
and Paula Keeney of Clyde; 
and 15 grandchildren.

Charles Stenholin Named 
'Guardian of Small Business'

U. S. Rep. Charles Sicnholm has been named a "Guardian of 
Small Business" by the National Federation of Independent 
Business, which has more than 500,000 members in all 50 
states, including more than 41,(X)0 in Texas.

Rep. Stcnholm’s small-business voting record during the 
lOlslCongrcss, rated on the 20 recorded votes, was 85 percent. 
Is.sucs deemed crucial by NFlB's members included cutting 
government spending, reducing taxes, mandating benefits, 
limiting federal regulations and balancing the federal budget.

NFIB is a non-profit, non-partisan organi/aiiion which lob­
bies on behalf of small finns in all state capitals and Washing­
ton, D.C. The typical company reprc.scnicd has 5 employees, is 
run by the owner-manager and has a gross annual income of 
about S250,0(X).

R em o d e lin g  - S id in g  
Windows and Doors 
Jobbers for All Side 

Reynolds, Mastic and B.M.D. 
Siding, Windows, and Doors 

Also Remodeling & Add-Ons. 
Cover Facers and Overhang 
on Brick Homes. All Work 

Guaranteed.
Call For Free Estimate.
Butler & Fox

Phone 629-2149 or 629-2814

BIG COUNTRY 
REAL ESTATE

1101 1/2 W. 12TH 
Cisco. Tx. 76437*'

Penny 442-1707 
Chester D. Beaird, Broker 

FEATURE: 3bd on .Simms, FP, fence, patki, nicc-$42k 
HOMES, resident or rentals, all terms avaialble 
ACRES NOHOME: 7 ,62, 97,160,200, Cisco & Areas 
3bd bk, shop, pool, ONLY $65k, also 2bd rcntal-$6k 
Frame 2bd on 8th, rented, needs some repalrs-$tSk 
Mobile Home A lot, carport, $2975, or best offer 
RENT-TO-OWN. 2bd-E 11th, Garage, nice $11,500 
165 acs, bk home, tanks, hunt, fish, o/carry-$14Sk 
400 acs, lovely 3bd Bk, well water, flelds-$235k 
COMMERCIAL BUILDING on W 8lh corner-$l2k or offer 
LAKE ClSCO-nke home, cent H/A, may o-carry-$37500 
1-20 So. at Hw 206, #  IS acs/2 tracts-$100k or offer 
1-20 at Sonic, o/carry, good commercial spot-$lSk 
RISING STAR-3bd on Main, large rooms, ccllar-$20li 
-W E  HAVE MORE LIS’nN G S - WE HANDLE RENT ALS-

?..



' LETTERS TO EDITOR
De&r Editor.
The front page article in 

the OcL 14th issue on the 
Hospitaî tax rate was sure the 
best magic show and sleight 
of hand act I ’ve seen. First the 
tax on a $18,347 house at .SO 
per $100 is $91.74, not 
$19.74. (Editor’s Note: This 
newspaper made a typo­
graphical error in the amount 
of tax. The correct amount 
was on the orginal copy sub­
mitted by the Hospital Board. 
We ^  a correction in the 
next issue of the newspaper.) 
Second, $18347 is only an 
average; what about the folks 
who live out of town and own 
several hundred acres? They 
may be a retired couple still 
living on a family farm worth 
over $100,000. Their simple 
arithmetic is for simple minds; 
to tell us that the difference 
between what was tried to put 
on us first and what they are 
try ing to put on us now is only 
$22.83. The difference be­
tween what? Do they mean 
the difference between the .28 
per $ 100 they tried to get and 
the .50 per $100 they want 
now? Well, we are not stupid, 
we know the difference is 
really between the. 14135 per 
$100 and the .50 per $00 
which is .35865 per $100. 
Next that statement that there 
are voters who can vote but 
don’t have to pay any taxes; 
is that suppose to get them to 
vote for the tax increase, to 
get something for nothing? 
Well, let them beware, if they 
don’t own a house, then they 
have to rent. If taxes go up on 
their landlord’s house and on 
the rent house, where do they 
think the landlord is going to 
be able to get the money to 
pay the extra taxes with? He 
is going to raise your rent, 
thaïs where, and he isn't going 
to get no tax breaks cither on 
that rent house. The facts arc 
this, with the hospital closed 
we arc not stranded 40 miles 
from « or a doctor.

Eastland is only 10 miles 
away and there is at least 3 or 
6 doctors in Eastland. If Dr. 
Cermin decides he can not 
remain in Cisco and treat 
patients at the hospital in 
Eastland, that would be a loss, 
but not the life threatening, 
gloom and doom we are led 
to believe. The hospital is not 
profitable, the hospital is not 
used by hardly any of the total 
population of the district, only 
higher and higher taxes would 
keep it open. Using our tax 
money to guarantee one or 
two doctors they will make 
$90,(XX) to $100,000 a year is 
nothing more than socialized 
medicine. Even the leader of 
the Soviet Union realizes that 
socialism doesn’t work, it just 
destroys every thing it 
touches.There arc people who 
are afraid to speak out for fear 
of their jobs or some kind of 
economic realiation, but they 
can speak out at the ballot 
box; that is where they have 
nothing to fear.

Thank you, 
Clifton W. Lacy

Editor,
If you will, please reprint 

this. It is from a micro-film at 
CJC. We thought it would be 
of much interest to all. It was 
printed in The Cisco Press in 
1967.

Thanks, 
Louise Nelms

(Editor’s Note: The follow­
ing is an article that appeared 
in this newspaper January 26, 
1%7, entitled “Hospital Au­
thority Is Created To Study 
Building Feasibility.’’)

“A Cisco Hospital Author­
ity was set up Tuesday night 
by the City Commission for 
the purpose of investigating 
the feasibility of creating a 
hospital with the aid of a 
federal grant.

“Seven mcmbcrschosento 
make up the Authority were 
Dr. E.E. Addy, Dr. Merrill 
Wallach, Banker Bob Ham-

. W
dheck The Date On Your 

Mailing Label On Thé 
Front Page Of Your Copy 

Of The Cisco Press 
To See If Your 

Subscription Is Out!
Mail Or Bring Your Check To 

The Cisco Press 
700 Conrad Hilton 
Cisco, Texas 76437

T-1. Irrigation Co.
Center-Pivot, 

/¿Hydrostatic Drive 
Can He M oved  

In M inutes
Sales and Service At

O ucltlv 's  P liin ih iii}; 
&  A p D lia iic p

112 N. Main Rising Star
817-643-7312 RSS3<in04

Chickin Fano Stia k  Sandwich 
SoNic's Famous O nion R ings

P I US  TAX

mett. Chamber of Commerce 
Manager Jim Smothers, Phar­
macist Lloyd McGrcw, Res­
taurant Owner J.D. Yardley 
and Car Dealer Charles Gra­
ham.

“The Authority elected Mr. 
McGrcw president. Ap­
pointed to the committee to 
select a site fora hospital were 
Dr. Wallach, Mr. Graham and 
Mr. Smotiiers. The commit­
tee that will contact out-of- 
town foundations for contri­
butions is composed of Dr. 
Addy, Mr. Hammett and Mr. 
Yardley.

“Working with the Hospi­
tal Authority is the Parker- 
Crosion architect firm of Fort 
Worth. This conspany will 
make a survey of the Cisco 
area to determine the size and 
type facility needed.

“Parker-Croston, once the 
survey and Authority’s study 
is fini.shcd, will file an appli­
cation with the Texas Slate 
Department of Health for a 
Hill-Burton federal grant for 
half the amount of the deter­
mined cost.

“To be considered for a 
grant under the Hill-Burton 
Act of 1954, an area must be 
in the 1-A priority category 
of hospital financing, ex­
plained Mr. Smothers. Cisco 
isinihisclassification.andis, 
thcrcforccligible for the grant. 
Application for the grant must 
be made by May 3 1 ,1%7, to 
be considered in the coming 
year’s appropriations under 
the H-B Act.

“To help cover the other 
half of the cost, A.C. Edwards 
& Sons, bondmen and mem­
ber of the New York Slock 
Exchange, was contracted by 
the Authority to issue small 
interest revenue bonds to out- 
of-town companies. These 
bonds would be retired by 
profits from the “non-profit” 
hospital. It will be non-profit 
in the sense that the money 
made will be used for mainte­
nance, payroll, etc. Extra 
income will be used to retire 
the bonded debt and eventu­
ally for expanding.

“M r., Smpihprs ,an4, the, 
Parker-Croston representa­
tives emphasized that should 
the hospital plan be carried 
out, no taxes will be required 
from the citizenry, and the 
city will have no cost obliga­
tion whatsoever. Though 
most of half of the cost of

POLITICAL
CALENDAR

The following candidates 
have authorized this newpa- 
pers to list their names as 
candidates for the November 
General Election.

County Commis.sioner
Precinct 4

Billy Bacon, Jr.
(Write-In)

Reggie Pittman
Democratic

District Clerk
Marie Rabel

Republican

building a hospital will be 
sought through revenue bond,
individual and organizational 
contributions will be asked to 
cover one-third of that 
amount.

“The architect and bond 
men told the Commission that 
they recommend that the 
Authority purchase the pres­
ent Graham Hospital and 
include it in the program if 
possible.

“In reply to questions, it 
was brought out that the city 
will be under absolutely no 
tax burden as a result of the 
revenue bonds. The only lo­
cal obligation would be to 
raise one-third of one-half of 
the cost through contribu­
tions.

“A Tuesday night’s meet­
ing, three commissioners 
voted “yea” for the establish­
ment of the Authority, while 
Water Commissioner C.F. 
Coals opposed the move, 
saying that he was not against 
it, b u t..... over before com­
ing to a decision. Voting for 
the establishment were Com­
missioners Al Fannin, who 
made the motion.C.H. Housh 
and L.E. Booth. Mayor Pro 
Tern Don Rupe presided in 
the absence of Mayor W.W. 
Sawyer.”

THE
CISCO PRESS

Sunday,
October 21, 1990

Cisco Homecoming Parade

I i  * ‘

Junior Class float wins first place Shannon Anderson

Kammie Fee Dietra Hearne 
Lela Beckett

Misty McCulloch, Amanda McGinness, 
Marlena Trice

j - •. ;

Senior Float Sophomore Float

HAPPY HOUR
3-4 p.m. Mon.-Frl
1/2 Price Fountain Drinks

Use The Classifieds

FREE PROSTATE 
SCREENINGS

November 2 ,16,30

Harris Methodist Erath County 
Hospital Community Room.

Sponsored by H arris M ethodist 
Erath C ounty H ospital, Stephenville.

Call for appointment 817-965-1599.

Dr. A.T. Deshmukh M.D., Board Certified 
Urologist, will be conducting the screens.

A member of the Harris Methodist Health System.
CE59

8:30-5:30

MOTT'S
Elmer's 

Large Asst. 
Of

Hair Bows

16 L ount
Football

Mum
Supplies

Caps
2 for $3.00

Wrangler
Jeans

New Shipment 
O f

Picture Frames

T-Shirt 
Ribbing 

$6.49 yard

Large Fabric Asst.!

T 'jù L T cm : g^L 0% i5^.
^  120 8th . Cisco. T;c a

442-1066 or 442-4281

Brass Wedding 
Equipment 

Check Out Our 
Complete Line of 
Brass Wedding 

Equipment 
Archway & 
Candelabra

Balloon Staffer 
Machine 

Large Selection 
ofAnimals or Floral 
Arrangement To Use 

Inside Our Balloons or 
Bring Your Own & We 

Will Stuff It.

JXL



CISCO HIGH SCHOOL CHEERLEADERS-- Leading the cheers for the Cisco High 
School Loboes are, left to right: Rachel Ingram, Tiffany Thomas, Josie Flores, Misty 
McCulloch and Marlena TYice. The above picture was made during the Homecoming 
Pep Rally at Chesley Field. (Staff Photo)

City Council To M eet
Notice is hereby given that 

the regular meeting of the 
governing body of theCity of 
Cisco will be held on the 23rd 
day of October, 1990, at 6 
p.m., in the Board Room of 
Hilton Community Center at 
which time the following 
subjects will be discussed, to 
wit:

CALL TO ORDER:
INVOCATION:
MINUTES:
ITEM I: Regular meeting 

of Sept. 25,1990. and regular 
meeting of Oct. 9.1990.

REPORTS:
ITEM I: Quarterly report 

of municipal court judge.
ITEM II: Financial report 

for September, 1990.
ITEM III: City Manager 

report
NEW BUSINESS-
ITEM I: Presentation of 

proposed rate increase by 
Lone Star Gas Company and 
consider approval of a reso­
lution of the City of Cisco, 
Texas, suspending the opera­
tion of proposed rate sched­
uled filed by Lone Star Gas

Company for a period of 
ninety (90) days beyond the 
date on which such schedules 
would otherwise go into ef­
fect.

ITEM II: Consider ap­
proval of financial status 
report of Hotcl/Motcl Occu­
pancy Tax monies by Cham­
ber of Commerce for fiscal 
year 1989-90; and consider 
approval of the Chamber of 
Commerce Hotel Occupancy 
tax budget for fiscal year 
1990-91.

ITEM III: Consider ap­
proval of financial status 
report of Hotcl/Motcl Occu­
pancy Tax monies by the 
Conrad N. Hilton Memorial 
Park and Community Center

for fiscal year 1989-90; and 
consider approval of the 
Conrad N. Hilton Memorial 
Park and Community Center 
HotclOccupancyTax budget 
for fiscal year 1990-91.

ITEM IV: Consider ap­
proval of an ordinance of the 
City of Cisco. Texas provid­
ing for the repeal of Articles 
I, II, III, and IV of Chapter 6 
“Building and Building Regu­
lations” of the City’s Code of 
Ordinances; Declaring Same 
to be Null and Void; estab­
lishing an effective date, and 
declaring an emergency.

ITEM V: Consider ap­
proval of an Ordinance of the 
City of Cisco, Texas Amend­
ing Chapter 6 “ B ui Idi ngs and

SHOP OUR 
EVERYDAY 

LOW PRICES....
WE APPRECIATE YOU!

AlisuPS

Shurfine Tomato 
Sauce 8 oz. 5/$1.00

Shursaving Vanilla 
Sandwich Cookies

32 oz. $1.79
Shurfine Green 
Beans 3/$1.00

SHURSAVING OR SHURFINE

ENRICHED 
FLOUR 1̂ 089«
SHURSAVING

FACIAL
TISSUE 150 CT. BOX 69«

Nice & Sort Bathroom 
Tissue 4 Roll Pkg. .890

SAUSAGE, 
EGG AND 
BISCUIT EACH 79«
IN WATER

STARKIST
TUNA 6%  0 2 . 

CAN 69«
Decker Bologna 

12 oz. .990
FILLED WITH YOUR 

FAVORITE FOUNTAIN DRINK

TALLSUP
BIG 

32 02. 
SIZE

i
COOKED FRESH 
2« HRS A DAY HOT FOODS M ENU All

AVAILARU AT ■
AUSUrS lOCATUINS | P

October 20 thru 
October 26 

Cisco, Texas

BARBECUE BEEF n n c
SANOWICH 3 9
BARBECUE 1 0  Q Q
PORK RIBS (18.1 9 . 9 9
BARBECUE WHOLE « 0  Q O
CHICKEN 9 . 9 9
AUSUP-S i d c

I  BURRITO / 9
]  BREAKFAST

BURRITO 9 9
] BURRITO

BEEF B SALSA # 9
I  DELICIOUS - i Q t
j  CHEESEBURGER # 9

CHICKEN COJ FRIED STEAK 1 . 9 9
] 3  COUNT 1 «  a n

CHCKEN STRIPS 1 . 4 9
Iw /P O T ATO WEDGES/ 1 1  O Q
I  CHICKEN a  PCSIBtSeWT 1 . 9 9

CALUM  OROtRS m iC O M E

9 PIECE BOX 
CHICKEN 
BEEF b CHEESE 
CHIMICHANGA 
IMEAOl 
CORN DOG 
DELICIOUS 
HAMBURGER 
WILSON 
HOT LINKS 
SAUSAGE 
ON A STICK 
SAUSAGE b 
BISCUIT 
SAUSAGE. EGG b BISCUIT 
SAUTEEYA 
SAUSAGE 
(C O U N T 
STEAK FINGERS

CHECK OUR WEEKLY 
SPECIALS

Building Regulations" of the 
City’s Code of Ordinances 
by adopting a revised plumb­
ing and gas code; establish­
ing an effective date; and 
declaring an emergency.

ITEM VI: Consider ap­
proval of a resolution of the 
City of Cisco authorizing the 
Mayor to execute a fire fight­
ing contract with Eastland 
County.

C IT IZ E N -C O U N C IL
DISCUSSION.

NOTICE OF MEETING
Notice is hereby given that 

Eastland County Commis­
sioners’ Court will meet at 
10:00 a m. on October 22, 
1990, in the Eastland County 
Commissioners’ C ourlroom, 
Eastland. Texas, to consider 
the following agenda items:

1. Rcad and Sign Minutes
— County Clerk.

2. Consider Fire Fighting 
Contracts with Cities of 
Eastland and Cisco.

3. Renewal of Software, 
Maintenance and Develop­
ment Agreement with Harley 
Gwyn.

4. Consider Authorizing 
Computer Equipment Acqui­
sition and Participating 
Agreement with Texas Ex­
tension Service — County 
Agent, Agriculture, Tunmirc.

5. CIarification of Court’s 
Order to Close Part of County 
Road #397 in 
Commissioner’s Precinct #3.

b.Continuing Discussion of 
County Road Signs and 
Mapping.

T.Discuss Letter fiom Esco 
Elevator Company.

*8.Discuss Homestead 
Exemption and Tax Matters
— Bertha Wilson

9. Jail Standards and Jail 
Inspection Report and Com­
pliance.

10. Budgetary and Appro- 
priative Matters.

11. Bills, Claims and Ac­
counts.

Posted by order of Eastland 
County C om m issioners 
Court.

*1:30 p.m.

Cisco Lions 
Club Report

The Lions of Cisco would 
like to thank all the citizens in 
and around Cisco for the 
support of this past weekend’s 
Big Annual Fish Fry held at 
Cisco’s Elementary School 
Cafeteria. The fish was ex­
cellent, and companionship 
was supreme, the price cheap 
and there was no extra charge 
for what some may call sing­
ing provided by Lion Larry 
Linam.

Many hours of hard work 
by many local Lions, were 
given to the event with spe­
cial thanks to the main organ­
izer Lion Ivan Webb and to 
the Head Chefs Lion Eddie 
McMillan and Lion Brad 
Kimbrough for the proper 
preparation of the selected 
fish. Of course they had their 
helpers who did the dirty work 
better known as pulling KP 
(Kitchen Police). One point 
of confusion was that four 
Lions all named John were to 
serve between 6and 7:15 p.m. 
and only Lion John McGuire 
was present. Needless to say 
Lion McGuire had litUe time 
to enjoy the festivities. All 
the participating Lions had a 
great time and the time given 
was well worth the effort due 
to the profits going to assist 
the less fortunate in and 
around the Cisco area, the 
Lions hope you enjoyed the 
Fish Fry and again want to 
thank you for tyour contin­
ued support.

At the weekly meeting on 
Oct. 17 the Lions received an 
extremely interesting and 
informative presentation from 
Fred Foy of Texas Monu­
ments out of Abilene. He 
provided slides and discus­
sion of what to look for in 
purchasing a quality tomb­
stone, the proper care of a 
marker, as well as the process 
in making a beautiful head­
stone from granite from many 
parts of the world.

The Lions have delayed the

Hennington Is 
Found Guilty

Shortly before 5 p.m. 
Wednesday, a 91st Di.strict 
Court jury found Thomas 
Howard Hennington guilty of 
m urdering Leslie Renee 
Roberts of Ranger.

Miss Roberts body and her 
car were found last February 
on an unpaved street in a 
remote spot on the ea.st side 
of Ranger. She had been shot 
three times, according to tes- 
timon>.

Randy Lee Wells, a con­
victed felon, testified against 
Hennington in a plea bargain 
arrangement. He is to receive 
a 12 year sentence for rob­
bery.

After further deliberation, 
the jury imposed a 99 year 
prison sentence and a 
S10,(XX). fine, the maximum 
possible sentence, on Hen­
nington. He had been given 
probation on two previous 
felony convictions, one for 
burglary and one for felony 
D.W.l. and both time the 
probation was revoked.

Assistant District Attorney 
Dill Dowell prosecuted the 
case and Ken Tarlton was the 
defense attorney.

Tid Bits
By HVO

The menus for Cisco Pub­
lic Schools for the week of 
October 22-26 have been 
announced as follows:

MONDAY
Breakfast— Rice, toast, 

fruit juice and milk.
Lunch— Hamburgers, 

French fries, catsup, lettuce 
and pickles, and mixed fruit.

TUESDAY
Breakfast— Toast (2), 

jelly, apple juice and milk.
Lunch— Taco casserole, 

refried beans, Mexican com, 
sliced bread and 1/2 orange. 

WEDNESDAY
Breakfast— Scrambled 

eggs, toast, orange juice and 
milk.

Lunch— Baked fish, tartar 
sauce, cole slaw, tatcr tots, 
catsup, buttered roll and 
manager’s choice cookies.

THURSDAY
Breakfast— Cinnamon 

toast (2), pineapple juice and 
milk.

Lunch— Barbecue bun, 
pork and beans, potato chips 
and diced peaches.

FRIDAY
Breakfast— Biscuit, sau­

sage, gravy, apple juice and 
milk.

Lunch— Pork chops, 
gravy, whipped potatoes, 
green beans, buttered roll and 
frosted cake.

annual Mop and Broom sale 
which was scheduled for this 
coming weekend. The qual­
ity and number of items 
needed to properly organize 
the sale was not in place so 
the decision was made to 
postpone the sale until in the 
November time frame. The 
date in November will be 
announced soon.

The local Lions are sad to 
sec'iie departure of Lion Gary 
Wilson from the Cisco area. 
It has been announced that he 
and his beautiful family have 
been transferred to Childress, 
Tx., effective November 1. 
Lion Wilson has been a very 
active member of the Cisco 
Lions to include being the 
program chairman for the past 
five months. We hate to sec 
such a good man depart the 
local area but be assured we 
wish you and your family the 
best of luck and God’s speed. 
We Serve! _ _
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YOU COULD co«e from any direction 
and start anywhere on the Shinnery 
Tour, a really serendipity visit 
to Eastland County's historic sites 
and cordial hospitality, wherein 
many exciting things will pop up 
for fun and entertairunent.

Most are marked but others abound 
just to be found and enjoyed by locals 
and visitors from far and near.

FALL FOILAGE in all its glory 
is much in evidem*e ail over the 
county and visitors are finding that 
driving the town streets, country 
roads and even the main highways 
is a visual delight. Coise the 
holidays season, there's likely to 
be a unified seasonal tour with 
welcoming symbols of wreaths, candy 
canes and other trappings of the 
season.

WHY SHINNERY Tour? Why not? 
It's unique, and it fairly rings 
of the exciting possibilities just 
waiting around every corner. Metro- 
plex visitors could speak highly 
of "Going to the Shinnery for the 
weekend." They'd Love it. And our 
area is the jumping off place to 
the prairie heading %#est, and the 
beginning of the «roodlands going 
east. And Shinnery sorta has a myster­
ious ring too, don't you think?

ONCE LAUNCHED seriously, and 
joined into enthusiastically, it 
could attract money-spending visitors 
all year long, with thesies organized 
and attractions planned that %Yould 
just delight those hard-pressed souls 
who are dying to get out of the rat 
races, kick back and enjoy real folks 
again. We're selfish not to share, 
and there's store to be gained by 
going it together than trying to 
hack it alone down those' long, 
lonesome rows. Each of the exciting 
towns in our county could be busy 
putting together its best tour of 
attractions, comsionly marked,
identified, unified and even 
amplified, all keyed to the central 
thesie so that visitors vrouldn't get 
lost or confused as they stake a day, 
a weekend, or even «reeks of visiting, 
touring and spending n»ney here. 
It's an industry that WE CAN HAKE 
NOW.

COMMON SYMBOL: What about a 
grapevine-type «rreath (of any and 
all sizes) that could be made out 
of our cooinon material: scrub oak, 
briars, sustletoe, sea-cane, and/or 
even grapevine. These then, could 
be decorated as the season dictates: 
spring and sussser blossoms, fall 
foliage. Thanksgiving corn shucks, 
Christmas holly berry, etc., etc., 
subject only to the artists and the 
individual's fancy. Our artist friends 
could be busy designing logos and 
copyrightable items that would be 
ours alone, to help sell us to 
visitors. Many other places, some 
with less to offer than we, are 
proving that visitors will come, 
if they're invited and made easy 
for them to visit. Either of our 
attractions won't do alone; but 
together «ys could be a magnet.

CONING FROM the South, visitors 
on State 36 could hit the Early 
Settler Park at Rising Star; from 
State 6, Shinoak Springs Park at 
Gorman; hit Fort Blair in that area; 
north to Ellison Springs for some 
real Indian and settler action; on 
north to Ranger and the Roaring 
Museum, the extra-special center 
that truely tells the boom-time story, 
and go on out to the Nccleskey Well 
where the wildcat started it all.

WITH INT.20 running through 
Ranger, Eastland ¿uid Cisco, visitors 
from the east would hit Ranger first, 
make headquarters or do and go to 
other sites. From the West, folks 
would hit Cisco to find Conrad 
Hilton's original hotel, site for 
the infamous Santa Claus Bank Robbery 
and that story.

FROM CISCO, or Eastland, next^ 
stop could be Kendrick's Asiphitheater 
where regular pageants are held and 
a religious diarama is open 
year'round, with camming facilities 
available and other attractions in 
the building stage.

IN EASTLAND, visitors will find 
Old Rip, the long-sleeping homed 
toad, the Doc Scurlock Grave and 
The Archives, ' a hi story-treasure
trove.

‘ VISITORS TRULY “ would need a 
detailed sap to find all the goodies, 
not to mention food, fuel aixl 
lodgings, and thay'd shop our stores 
and utilize our services.

Let's get it goingl


