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As we celebrate this holy 
season, may you rejoice 

in the light of His love

Don Underwood Seeks 

County Sheriff Position

Don Underwood stated this 
week that he wants to be 
your sheriff for the next four 
years. Don believes that he 
can show the people of 
Eastland County a great 
change in the number of 
crimes committed, by carry- 
uig out the duties of Sheriff 
of Eastland County as he has 
been trained. By usuing 
qualified help, by good in­
vestigation, by presenting 
accurate and factual cases 
to the Grand Jury, and by be­
ing experienced in court pro­
cedure and capable of testi­

fying of facts in court.
Don believes it is unimpor­

tant who makes an actual ar­
rest and which department 
gets the credit as long as the 
case is solved in a legal man­
ner. Meaning, no loop holes 
for a guilty person to crawl 
through and be free on a 
technicality.

Don has proven that he is 
capable of this by his record 
as Sheriff of Nolan County. 
During Don’s first year in of­
fice there, 13 murders oc- 
cured, not from his failure to 
protect, but because of 
growth of the county and 
former convictions. All 13 
murders were solved and 
found guilty in court. The 
last year Don served as 
Sheriff of Nolan County they 
had only 1 murder. Don 
believes that he can bring 
this help to your county and 
his.

Don Underwood is a native 
of Eastland County. Don was 
born in Carbon in 1941, 
where he attended school 
graduating from Carbon 
High School in 1959. Don is 
the son of the late Heitry 
unflerwood and Mrs. Sibyl 
Underwood, now of 
Eastland. Don has one

Cisco Folklife 
Festival Plans

SHERRY WHATLEY is demonstrating Tin 
Punch which was used on cupboards and pie 
safes early in the century. This fascinating art 
is becoming popular again for cabinets and 
specialty pieces. You can see tin punch being 
mmonstrated on May 5 & 6 during Cisco 
Folklife Festival sponsored by Cisco Civic 
League.
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A MISTAKE was made in 
this column last week con­
cerning the name of one of 
the persons g iv in g  a 
testimony at the Alleluia 
Cantata held Sunday even­
ing at the First Baptist 
Church. Mrs. Bernice Carter 
gave a testimony, instead of 
Bernice Gorr as stated.

I apologise for any Ah 
convenience caused by this 
error.

A BEAUTIFUL handmade 
quilt was being shown at 
Altman’s one day a few 
weeks ago which was made
by Della McCarroU, 89, of
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CISCDKm 
CARWASH 

3rd St. and Ave. E 
Where Most Peoplel 
Wash. Wash yow  veM-| 
Uan blinds, throw rufs, 
motor, c-63

Cisco. She had made the 
king-size quilt top at her 
home and the ladies of the 
F irst Christian Church 
quilted It and are planning to 
sell it.

The group has sold several 
of the quilts which were stit­
ched by Mrs. McCarroU.

SEVERAL LOCAL church 
groups went to Six Flags 
Over Texas on Friday, since 
this weekend was Christian 
FamUy time. Groups known 
of which attended from Cisco 
were the First Evangelical 
Methodist and East Cisco 
Baptist Church.

'The youths of the churches 
were oa vacation from 
school since their Easter 
break started when classes 
dismissed at 2:30 p.m. 
Tharsday and w ill not 
resume until Wednesday.

HAPPY ElASTER!

Cof C Presidency Is 

Passed To Morgan
The presidency of the 

Cisco Chamber of Com­
merce passed from Gene 
Gwinn to Jerry Morgan, 
pictured at left above, dur­
ing the past week as Mr. 
Gwinn resigned the position. 
Mr. Gwinn was honored at a 
reception at the CofC offices 
last Tuesday afternoon.

brother, Milton Underwood, 
of Eastland. Don is married 
to the form er Dolores 
Foster, daughter of the late 
Dick Foster, at one time an 
Eastland County Commis­
sioner, and Mrs. Velda 
Foster of Gorman. Don’s in­
fluence in law enforcement 
and working with young peo­
ple has affected his own 
family. Dolores is a certified 
reserve deputy and certified 
jailer. Bolores is currently 
employed as a dispatcher for 
Eastland County Police 
Dispatch. Don’s brother-in- 
law, Brent Foster, is a cer­
tified officer and also involv­
ed in politics. Don’s oldest 
son, L yn da ll, recen tly  
received his permanent cer­
tifications as a peace officer 
from the State of Texas. Don 
and Dolores also have 2 
more children, Greg is 
employed by Texas-New 
Mexico Power and Light and 
resides in Clifton, Texas. 
Daryl is a junior at Carbon 
High School, where Don is 
very much involved in work­
ing with his class on many 
projects. The Underwood’s 
also have twin grandsons, 
Jady and Jody. Don has all 
these reasons for wanting to 
continue the battle against 
drugs and for the protection 
of life and property. Don 
Ijelieves that the protection 
of Ufe and property are the 
main issues as Sheriff of 
Eastland County. Don is ful­
ly convinced that drugs and 
drug related crimes are a 
definite threat to our society 
as citizens of this county.

Don has, in the past, been 
a member of many local 
organizations including 4-H 
and coaching little league. 
At the present time he is ser­
ving on the board of direc­
tors for the West Cetral 
Texas Law Enforcement 
Association where he has 
abo served as President and 
Vice-President. Don is a 
member of the Sheriff’s 
Association of Texas, and 
has been since 1976 where he 
has served on the Education 
and Training Committee, as 
V ice-Chairm an o f the 
Legbbtive Committee. Don 
b  abo a member of the 
ElasUand County Law En­
forcement Association and 
the N ationa l S h e r iff ’ s 
Association. Don began 
working with the EbsUand 
County Fair Association bst 
fall. Don and hb family wor­
ship with the Church of 
Christ at Carbon.

During the bst 17 years- 
Don spent 2 years as Nolan 
County Juvenile Officer and 
Truant Officer, 6 years as 
Texas Highway Patrdman, 
1 year and Investigator for

Annual Easter Pageant 
Set Sunday At 3:30 A.M.

Mr. Gwinn, plant manager 
here for Otb Engineering 
Corporation, was transfer­
red to the Hrm’s Carrolton 
pbnt as the local facility was 
closed. He had been here 
four years. At Carrolton, he 
will be assigned to a super­
visory position.

Mr. Morgan, executive 
vice president of the First 
National Bank, took office 
bst January 1 as first vice 
president of the CofC. He b  a 
native of Cisco.

Officers and directors of 
the CofC were hoste for the 
reception.

Mr. Gwinn and hb wife 
Janie will move to the DaUas 
area when they dbpose of 
their home at Nimrod. ’They 
are the parents of two 
children -  a son, Scott, 23, a 
graduate of Texas Tech liv­
ing in Lubbock and in com­
puter sales, and a daughter, 
Gayle, who b  the wife of 
Shane Hunt of Stephenville 
where he b  a college stu­
dent.

“ Living and working in 
Cisco has been a real rewar­
ding experience for me and 
my family,’ ’ Mr. Gwinn said. 
“ As we leave, we wish for 
the community all good 
things.”

the Ebstland Police Depart­
ment, and 7 years as Sheriff 
of Nolan County, where the 
last 2 years of office, Sweet­
water was rated in the top 3 
percent of Texas in felony 
crimes solved and prosecu­
tions made in those crimes.

Don has over 1000 hours of 
specia lized  tra in ing in 
numerous areas of Law En­
forcement. All of which are 
beneficial to: Jail Ad­
m in istration , choosing 
qualified personnel. Finger­
print, Search and Sebure, 
Civil Process, riot coiitrol. 
Crime Scene Protection and 
gathering evidence, Traffic 
Law, Accident Investigation, 
Recognizing and Detecting 
DWI’s (driving while intox­
icated), and Recognition of 
various drgus. Don abo 
holds an advanced cer­
tificate in the Law Enforce­
ment Code of Ethics.

As a Law Enforcement Of­
ficer, my fundamental duty 
b  to serve mankind; to 
safeguard lives and proper­
ty; to protect the innocent 
against deception, the weak 
against oppression or in­
timidation, and the peaceful 
against violence or disorder; 
and to respect the Constitu­
tional righb of all men to 
liberty, equality and justice.

I will keep my private life 
unsullied as an example to 
all; maintain courageous 
cbim  in the face of danger, 
scorn or ridicule; develop 
self-restraint; and be con­
stantly mindful of the 
welfare of others. Honest in 
thought and deed in both my 
personal and officbl life, I 
will be exempbry b  obeying 
the bws of the land and the 
regubtions of my depart­
ment. Whatever I see or hear 
of a confidentbl nature or 
that b  confided to me In my 
officbl capacity will be kept 
ever secret unless reveb-

The 20th annual Easter 
Pageant will be held at the 
Kendrick Amphitheater on 
U.S. Highway 80 midway 
between Cisco and Eastland, 
beginning at 3:30 a.m. Sun­
day, April 22. A brge crowd 
was expected for the event.

A cast of some 35 persons 
will present some 60 scenes 
in depicting the life of Christ. 
Director of the annual event 
all of the years has been Phil 
(Shorty) Kendrick, and he 
will be on the job again thb 
year, as will Mr. J.H. (Mom) 
Kendrick at the organ and 
Pierre Kendrick as the nar­
rator.

The annual spectacle has 
used the same basic theme 
and format over the years 
with occasional changes in 
scene interpretations. The 
program will open with 
scenes of Mary and Joseph 
and the Wise Men.

Highlighb in the life of 
(Christ, including Hb birth, 
Hb baptism, Hb healing ex­
periences, Hb preaching, 
Hb sermon on Uie mount, 
the bst supper, the Garden 
oi Gethsemane and the scene 
of the agony and betrayal of 
Christ through the cruclflx- 
ion and the resurrection, will 
be presented b  the program 
of some two hours duration.

The pageant’s ending b  
timed to be most effective b  
the new light of Ebster mor­
ning appears on the eastern 
horizon.

One family, Mr. and Mrs. 
George Brieves and two sons 
and one daughter of Gor­
man, will be appearing b  the 
pageant for the 15th con­
secutive year. Their oldest 
son, Kent, 22 started as a 
child. He pbys the part of 
Jesus thb year.

The David Lowrance fami­
ly of Scranton will be in their 
5th annual pageant.

The camel Curley, who 
took over three years ago 
after Sugar’s death, will be 
b  the show agab thb year 
as will Bridget, a mbbture 
donkey.

During the 19 years that 
the Kendrick family has 
presented the Easter 
Pageant, there has never 
been an admission charge. A

free-will offering b  taken 
each year to help defray the 
expenses. Crowds have 
varied from 5,(XX) to 20,000.

The Religious Diorama, 
wbch b  part of the am- 
pitheater complex, was to be 
open all day Saturday and 
until 1 a.m. Sunday, giving 
visitors an opportunity to see 
the numerous biUical scenes 
there. Tours will be on the 
hour during the day and 
evening.

Fingerprints Program Will Resume
Fingerprinting through 

the “ Flngerprbta on FUe”

resume after the Easter 
holidays on Wednesday, 
April 25. Junior High and 
High School studenb may be 
fingerprinted with parental 
consent only.

Any consent forms not yet 
retunied may be returned on 
Wednesday. Sbdents should 
take those signed forms to 
police officers when they go 
to be fingerprinted. Forms 
will abo be avaibble at the 
high school on Wednesday.

Pre-schoolers are schedul­
ed for fingerprintbg beginn­
ing at 9 a.m. on Wednesday. 
It b  important for parents to 
reaUze that ideal prinb can­
not be taken of children of a 
young age, due to their bek 
of development, but the ser­
vice of fingerprmting for 
youngsters b  bebg oRered 
to pre-schoolers.

Students who have missed 
fingerprmting are scheduled 
for make-ups, the time will 
be announced at their 
respective  schools. 
Transportation to the high 
school for make-up finger- 
printmg will be provided.

tions b  necessary b  the per­
formance of my duty.

I will never act officiously 
or permit my personal feel­
ings, prejudices, animosities 
or friendships to influence 
my deebions. With no com­
promise for crime and with 
relentless prosecution of 
crimmab, I will enforce the 
law courteously and ap­
propriately without fear or 
favor, mailice or ill will, 
n ever em ploying un­
necessary force or violence 
and n ever accepting 
gratities.

1 recognbe the badge of 
my office as a symbol of 
public faith, and I accept it 
as a public trust to be held so 
long as I am true to the 
ethics of the police service. I 
will constantly strive to 
achieve these objectives and 
ideals, dedicatbg myself 
before God to my chosen pro- 
fession...bw enforcement.

Don b  abb to perform 
ALL of the duties of the of­
fice of Eastland County 
Sheriff to the benefit of the 
future of Eastland County. 
Don b  asking for your sup­
port and asking you to 
remeber to vote Don Under­
wood for Ebstland County 
Sheriff on May Sth.

The Cisco Day Care Center 
c h U A ^

sent, at the Onter on Mon­
day, April 30. Consent forms 
will be avaibble at the 
Center.

The Cisco Service Gub b  
working with the Cisco 
Kiwanb Gub b  assisting the 
local Police Department b  
fingerprinting a ll Cisco 
youths, with parental con­
sent. The sole purpose of the 
fingerprinting will be for the 
purpose of identifying youths 
in the event they are 
discovered missing.

Of the thousands of 
children reported missing 
each year b  the United 
States, approximately nbe- 
ty percent return home, 
leaving stili thousands unac­
counted for. It b  with thb 
fact in mind that the finger- 
prbt program, is motivated.

The club sponsors of the 
“ Fingerprints on File”  pro­
gram, would like to stress 
the fact that no child will be 
fingerprinted without paren­
tal permission. Likewise, no 
copies of the prints will be 
kept’  on file, anywhere

besides with the individual.
In tiM event

should be turned over to bw  
enforcem ent authorities 
when making the report.

Fingerprbb are an effi­
cient tool for identification 
no matter bow much time 
has bpaed between the child 
being reported missing and 
the possibility of the child be- 
b g  found. Fingerprbb re- 
mab the same all through 
life.

The program can only bo

tiftite cunfinunl- 
ty, school o ffiebb , parents 
arid guardians with the ef­
forts of the Sherriffs officers 
and local Police Depart­
ment.

For more information, call 
442-2655.

CofC Plans 

Breakfast On

Students Given Wednesday At 7 

Easter Holiday
The Easter recess began 

for students of the C i ^  
Public Schoob as classes 
were dismissed an hour ear­
ly at 2:30 p.m. Thursday, 
Supt. James Couch reported. 
Gasses will resume at the 
regular hour Wednesday, 
April 25.

Cisco Junior College 
studenb were given Friday 
off as an Easter weekend 
holiday. They will be back b  
the ebss rooms Monday.

The Cisco Chamber of 
Commerce will be having ib  
quarterly breakfast meeting 
Wednesday, April 25, at the 
Colony Restaurant, at 7
a.m., according to an an­
nouncement by the CofC 
Breakfast Committee.

R eserva tions fo r the 
breakfast may be made by 
calling the Chamber office, 
44^2537.

The Steerbg Conmiittee of 
the Cisco CcrfC will be b  
charge of the program for 
the breakfast

First Baptist In Eastland Hold Service 

In New Building Easter Sunday
NEW WORSHIP CENTER AWAITS-Memben, friends and guests of the 
First Baptist Churdi, Eastland, wiU worsl4> ^  the first tim e Sunday, 
April 22, in the new facilities Just completed. The BasHisid Sunday aep> 
vices will be the first in the new building, but formal dedimrtfon servicea 
will not be held until neict Sunday, April 29,

This wedc has been “moving we<dc” for tile coafregation, relocating in­
to the new building. The new organ is due to arrive in Eakland Monday 
for installation and it is hoped that it will be playable fOr the April 29 ser­
vices, Formal dedicatii» of the wgan will not be held until May 15 
however. The paator. Rev. Jim Hooten, ha; invited the public to Join in 
the worship in the new building.
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NOTICE

C NOTICE

C. W KABKI. LS Bl Il.niNC. 
HOMK.S ready to move onto 
your site or will sitebuild. 
Custom homes, barns. 
Harases, decks or add-ons. 
Call C.ary or I.loyd at 
442-41H7 or 442-3430. c-52

Kt»rl Worth Star 
TeleRram deli\erer is 
(;ury Fink. Call 442-3349 
for a subscription, p-104

TIM BARTON 
Coilstruetioii 
& Insulation 

New Homes, add-ons. 
eahiiiets, metal roust., 
eonerete. e lec trica l 
work & blown rellulose 
insulation. Call 442-3727 
a fter 5. 442-4049
daytime, r-52

“ Hollis Williams 
Construetion"

Hlown (-rlluloN«* in«ulation. 
fiH'Ui nHiNtm« tiim. m'w homo. 
«'UNioni 4'uhuii‘ts. 4on«rt't<*. rtt*«- 
trit ai work and iMhi’r ri’ni«>drt' 
in$: nn*ds.

HMm t-s;

NOTICF,; For heme delivery 
of the Abilene Reporter 
News! If you live north of 8th 
Street or west of Avenue N 
ca ll Morytan Fleminy;, 
442-3031 p-104

DOZER SERVICE 
Tanking, brush pushing 
and all types of dirt 
work. $35 per hour. 
Minimum 4 hours. Call 
Bob Hallmark. 442-2127. 
c-52

POLITKAL
CALENDAR

The following persons 
have authorized this 
newspaper to announce that 
they are candidates, subject 
to action by the .May 
Democratic Primary;

COUNTY SHERIFF: 
Don Underw ood 
Johnny Morren 

( re-election i 
Albert Biggs

CONSTABLE:
(Precinct 4)

Ted J Parrish

JUDGE. 91st DIST.COURT 
Jim Wright 
( rc=<lection i

U S. CONGRESS 
17th DISTRICT 

Charles Stenholm

CASEY’S CAKF.S 
Wedding. Birthday, 

Anniversary, All Occa­
sion Cakes.

$7.50 & up 
442-1183 e-52

JACKSON HOME 
MAINTENANCE & 
IMPROVEMENT

SPECIAl.TY: 
Concrete, Cemetery or 
Kesidential. Call (or 
E.stimates 442-4930 p-38

BABYSITTING 
In my home, fenced 
yard. Hot lunch, & 
T .L .C . Keasonable 
rates. Call 442-4568 p-42

Gcnealogtat aecklaf 
rontact wM iM cwteata
of the James B. Smith 
lam lly, (w ife: Sadie 
'Yhomas Smith) believ­
ed to have lived in the 
Eastland Co. area in 
early 1900’s.

P lea se  contact: 
Roberta Lee Lawrence, 
P.O. Box 714, Orange Ci­
ty. FU. 32763 p-M

Need several reliable 
enthusiastic people in 
Cisco. Baird and sur­
rounding areas who 
desire a good income 
and business right from 
home. Come sec for 
yourself what i now en­
joy! No investments, no 
gimmicks. Call week­
days 9:30-1:30
(1-915-672-2127) p-34

K^TAB
Covers The Big Country— 

not )ust Abilene
EARN AN EXTRA S50-S100 a 
week Exciting opportunities 
await you in our new Party 
Plan Co. One of our Com­
pany's sales leaders will be 
in your area this week. Call 
now to arrange an appoint­
ment. Call co llect 
1-817-4K0-4447. {>-33

xperfenced clerical 
personnel seeking 

Jem ploym ent in 
Eastland Co.- reee^p., 
typist, dispatcher, book­
keeping. auto Ins., eo. | 
payro ll. Im m ed iate 

^em ploym ent term s 
ifnegotUble. 442-4812 or 
¡•442-1912 p-39 „

Will do yard work & 
mow lawns. Call 
442-4268. ask for Keith. 
p-38

N O T IC E : I buy
aluminum caas. 30 cents 
a {wund. 203 E. 7th. 
Cisco. |>-42

Will do babysitting in 
my home. Monday- 
Friday, ChrlstUn home. 
442-4709. Cindy Yeata 
(Burch) p-39

SEPTIC 
SYSTEMS 

INSTALLED  
' FREE  

ESTIMATES 
DON WALLACE 

442-4627
p-40

Handyman will do any 
type of genera l 
household repair, pain­
ting, and installation. 
For assistance call 
442-4881 or 442-1072. p^O

C
to GIVE AWAYJ

FREE Cl TE LITTLE D(Ki-
GIE Small female dog. very 
lovable, good with children, 
good watchdog to be given 
away. Call 442-2757 p-44

FOUND: Nearly new mat­
tress. Call Rudolph 
Schaefer, 442-2376. p-34

LOST - Two Great White 
Pyrenees dogs southwest of 
Easltand. I f  seen call 
629-1809 or 629-8062 or 
629-1661. T34

the fam ily  of Lane 
Ciilmore wishes to express 
our gratitude for your 
thoughtfulness in so many 
ways. Perhaps you sent a 
lovely card or .sat quietly and 
whispered a prayer, perhaps 
you spoke the kindness of 
words that so many loyal 
friends do. perhaps you sent 
food for our needs, or you 
were not there at all just 
thought of us through the 
days, perhaps you sent a 
memorial in his name or 
flowers to bring sunlight 
through the shadows. 
Whatever you did consoled 
us. We thank you so very 
much w hatever the part that 
brought warmth to our 
hearts.

We wish to thank all our 
friends for thier kindnesses 
extended to us in our recent 
sorrow. May God Bless each 
of you as you minister from 
time to time to those in need 
of your sup{K)rt. We would 
also like to express our ap­
preciation to Drs. Cermin & 
Addy as well as the nurses at 
the Cisco Hospital. We know 
they did all they could.

The family of H.M. (Jack) 
Stephenson.

WANTED: I will clean 
houses, also experienced in 
office cleaning. Call 442-4682. 
{>-39

WANTED: Lawns to mow. 
Call before 8 or after 5. 
(442-1729 Jackie Simmons. 
p-48

c FOR SALE

WANTED: Bird lease. 
500 to 2500 aeres. Local 
referenres available. 
P.O. Box 5726. Arl­
ington, Tx. 817-640-1193, 
rail rolleet. (>-35

FOR SALE: 7-year old Aqha 
Mare with new blaze face fil­
ly colt. Also 2 Aqha yearling 
fillies and 2 Aqha yearling 
horse colts. 442-3760 or 
214-942-4088. {>-39

HOMEMADE 
TAMALES

For Sale, $3.50 per doz., 
also fresh country eggs. 
Call around noon, 
442-1511 or 442-4543 c-52

FOR RENT: Clean, modern 
mobile home, 12 X 65. 2 
bedroom, I**« bath, furnished 
or unfurnished, all bills {>aid 
610 W 12th. $75.00 per week. 
Call 442-1269. Fam ilies 
welcome. (>-33

For Rent: building with 
4 offires. ample storage,
2 bathrooms, central 
heat/air, plenty of (>ark- 
ing, 813 Ave. D. Call 
G.R. Nance, 442-1472 
(>-37

FOR RENT - 2 bedroom 
completely furnished - New 
Carpot $200 month $150 
defwist, water (>aid, adults 
only-No pets. 442-1249. T35

For Sale- 1977 - 1066 Int., 
tractor, cab, air, duals, 
WTS., Irrigation pipe, 
peanut drier, 12 ft. aU 
cut disc. 3 pt.. Also have 
1972 Chev. 1 ton, truck, 
new 12 ft. steel bed. Call 
442-3667 p-35

U N W A N T E D
H A IR

ON FA C E  ARMS and LEG S

R E M O V E D
Q U IC K LY  and PER M A N EN TLY '

m m
rrical 3 
ik ing 3

A(uirtment for Rent: 
CaU 442-4217 p-39

M INI WAREHOUSE 
STORAGE as low as $25 
month. Call 442-3340. 
Cisco, c-52

Ronnovo Unwantod Hair by 
e |Licensed Electrologiit.

Coll for Privoto 
Appointment. No Obligation

Elite Beauty Shop 
442-1265 

Janet Eaton
p-36

J
DRINKINC AND MIVINC 

CAN ADO UP.

Tdidd D«p«rim«nl of Public Sofity

FO R  R EN T
Furnished Mobile Homes with 

Washer & Dryer Bv the Week or 2 
Weeks with Utilities Paid. (No Deposit 
Required) Parking Spaces at *2®®a Day| 

Sunshine Valley Mobile Home Park 
442-1365 P*  ̂ Leona Fay Morton

FOR SALE: 4 x 4  pickup. 
1969 Chevy *2ton. LWB. has 
1976 4-speed transmission 
and transfer case. Almost 
new clutch, pressure plate, 
ca rr ie r  bearing, front 
driveshaft, u-joints. master 
c\ linder. chrome wheels and 
li-15 tires. 0\er $3,CC0 in it. 
asking $’2500 or best offer. 
Call (8171 442-2757 or (817) 
442-2244 p-52

WELDING SUPPLIES 
Oxygen, acetylene tor­
ches, welding machines, 
every th in g  fo r the 
welder.
BEST WELDING SUP­

PLY & GARAGE 
1309 Conrad Hilton 

Cisco, Texas 
817-442-1305

Hours- 8 a.m. to 5:30 
p.m.

Saturday- 9:30 to 12

FOR SALE: Hale. 2-horse 
tra ile r . New tires , 
thoroughbred size, brakes, 
mats, extra good. 442-1710.

FOR SALE: 1973 Puiiliae, 
2-door, hardtop, (>ower, air, 
tilt-wheel. AM-FM, 76,000 
miles. Runs good. 442-4455 
after 6:30 p.m. {>-35

FOR SALE: 1982 F250 »4 ton, 
assume payments, Call 
442-1446 after 5. c-52

CONSTRUCTION

Ramod*ling, Add-ons, New Homes, 
Cabinets, Electricol Etc Free Estimotes

[DAVIES MONUMENT W ORKi
Completed In Our Shop 

Also Last Dates, Curbing

Harold Davies Owner
401 West 5th St. 

442-4082 442-3523

Good solid frame dwelling in good location, need to 
sell now. $9,500.00

Three bedroom, very nice, best of locations with two 
car garage and pecan trees.

Very beantiful three bedroom frame, two bath, a two 
room and bath servaat quarters in rear, fenced back 
yard and sitting on about two blocks of land, large shed 
and worth the money.

Attractive brick, best part of town, paved street. You 
wiU like it.

block of ground with nice large house and two 
houses not so good. Paved street and the price seems 
like a steal.

Attractive frame, close in to |>ost office and down 
town. Solid but needs some attention inside but only 
$10,000.00

Need to settle estate, three bedroom rock veneer 
with two car garage. We will listen to any reasonable 
offer.

Five room frame solid and upright. A steal.
Very beautiful brick on (laved street, chain link fence 

around the yard and around the garden. Very good well 
for water.

Not too old brick duplex in good location.
Beautiful four bedroom brick and frame two story, 

l>aved street, nice large yard, location right where you 
would want it and we need to sell it.

We have some very low priced property, some com­
mercial property , you name it.

Three lots on Avenue D. Close in, very good for 
, business location or dwelling. Priced right.

807 Ave. D., Gteo

Gaii D. Gorr 
Real Estate Brokerage

I Three soles men to ossist in aN phases 
of the work. 442-3642 or, night 442-1642

BAIRD
BEEFMASTERS 

7th
ANNUAL  

PRODUCTION 
SALE

Saturday,

April 28, 1984

SELLING 110 LOTS:
70 Females -  Pairs, 
bred & Open Heifers 
40 Bulls -  All service 
age & fertility tested.

Brownwood Cattle 
Auction

Brownwood, Texas 
Sale Time -  1:00 P.M  

Lunch Available 

Sale Day Phone  
915-646-7591

Transportation will be 
provided from airport. 
“ Raising Range
Tested Beefmasters 
For Over 30 Years”

For Information Con­
tact:
B A IR D  B E E F ­
MASTERS 
B.E. (Bob) Baird 
Rt. 1
Mullin, Tx. 76864 
915-966-3320 
O.R. Baird 
Priddy Star Rt. 
Ckildwaite, Tx. 76844 
915-948-3515

Glenn Baird 
Rt. 4, Box 4514 
Belton, Tx. 76513 
817-939-1959 
Sales Mgrs. & Auc-i 
tioneers
Ruben Reyes & An­
thony Mihalskl 
( T X E - 1 3 0 - 0 9 2 2  ) 
(TXE-111-0911)
118 W. Nakoma
San Antonio, Tx. 78216
512-349-2185

FOR SA LE : Rem brant 
mobile home, 10X50 on lake 
lot at Brownwood Lake. Set 
up and ready to move in. 
$4,950. Call Citizen State 
Bank, 1-725-6141 between 
8:00 and 4:00, Monday thru 
Friday. (>-34

J iiiiiiim iu iiH iiii i i iM iM iiiii i i:
S 10 Acres, 2 miles south =  
i  1-20 on 183. Has west- z 
§  bound water, telephone = 
r  hookup, septic tank, = 
E Call 442-2527 after 5 p.m. = 
1 (>-35 =

FOR SALE: Newly remodel­
ed mobile home on city lot in 
Cross Plains. 12x60, 2 bd.. 2 
full bath. $8,950, with lot. 
Call Citizen State Bank, 
Cross Plains, 1-725-6141 bet­
ween 8:00 and 4:00, Monday 
thru Friday. {>-34

FOR SALE: 33.34 acres of 
land in Brown County with 
some mineral rights. Land is 
equipped with electricity 
and septic hook up for 
mobile home. Good grass 
cover and trees. CaU Citizen 
State Bank, Cross Plains, 
1-725-6141 between 8:00 and 
4:00, Monday thru Friday. 
p-34

FOR SALE ; 7-room 
house. 3 bedroom and 
den. $15,000. Fenced-in 
yard and carport, fruit 
trees, pecan trees, 
garden space. Within 
walking distance of 
grocery stores, school 
and main town. 442-3137 
or 442-2161.1006 Ave. F. 
p-36.

FOR SALE; One bedroom 
house, living room, kitchen 
and den. On large lot. 704 
East 12th, Cisco. Call 
442-4670 c-52

2 Bd., house for Sale. 
$12,000 cash or on terms 
10% interest. Lon Dun­
can 911 W. 4th, 442-2096 
p-36

3 Bedroom House For 
'Sale By Owner, Phone 
442-4217 p43

House For Sale on cor­
ner lot in Rising Star. 
Also, house on comer lot 
in Baird . Call 
915-854-1877 p-38

FOR SALE: 3 bd. house. 
Large fenced comer lot, 
wood heater, new ash 
cabinets. Must see to 

I believe. $25,500. 408 W. 
{ 12th. Call 442-4568. p-41

$500 down, 2 Bedroom 
home, close-in. For Sale 
by Owner In Cisco. CaU 
44M18S between 9 a.m. 
and 9 p.m. p-33

TERRIFIC BUY
Up(>er teens, family 

size home.

THIS HOME HAS 
BEEN BEAUTIFULLY 
REMODELED.

3 Bd., 2 bath, sun 
room, energy efficient, 
up(>er $30s.

Priced for immediate 
sale.

TOP QUALITY
Cisco home has it all, 

with extra lot and huge 
workshop. Mid $20s.

Willowood Pn){>erties 
913-695-8580

Nights, 817-442-1446, 
B.J. p-39

FOR SALE
60 Acres in cultivation, 
northwest of Cisco, has 
deep water weU, $525.00 
per acre . Call 
214-592-2685 p-42

House for sale: 
owner, 3 or 4 bedrooms, I 
1 bath, kitchen, den, I 
car(>eted, large fruit 
trees, near town. Will 
sell as is for $17,000. 
Located at 107 E. 14th, 
Call 442-3143 or come by. I 
Natalia Vasllio ¡>-34

ClASlilFIEDAI 
a supermarket 
for everything.

New Brick Home
from *33,500*

In Klmbtr Lm  btofts
Building Sites For Sole 

Your Plans or Ours
CliS Construction 

442-3148 : 442-15B0

Older Home
Mce Locotion 
1700 sq. feet 

2 Bath, 2 Bedroom, 
living. Dining & Don 

Meo Troos

Chomnots RooHor 
I42-314B : 442-1144

i



Bass C lu b  R epo rt
T e r r y  L . W ilso n

Children aren’t alone at 
this Easter time. Anglers 
are enjoying perhaps the 
largest egg hunt ever held. 
The hunt for those spawing 
black bass. Each year begin­
ning as early as mid 
February on some impound­
ments until as late as July on

other lakes anglers are try­
ing to coax those large 
female bass into taking the 
bait. There are actually 
three periods during a 
spawn. Pre spawn, nesting, 
and post spawn, probably 
the most frustrating of the 
three periods would be the

actual nesting period, which 
normally covers 7 days. Dur­
ing this period anglers can 
actually bump the females 
on the nest and perhaps not 
recieve a strike. The females 
will often simply blow a bait 
from the next, never inhal­
ing the lure. The single most

EASTLAND ELECTRIC
Undsey Stewart • New

SUPPLY
Manager

BffOU YOU BUY COMPARl OUB MtKlSI 
T.V. Dish, Refrig,, Washer t  Dryers, Air Conditioners
rigidaire. Sharp Microwave Ovens, Kithchen Aid Dish-

Washers. A Full Line CROSLEY
Economicol, But WarwitlMl (locd Saks A Strvict)

Mfe Hav9 Air Conditioners That Qualify for 
TiSCO's $100 Robato.

Boctrieal Sapphos for Homo A Industry
629-3315

One Thing After Another -

. . . .  can and may happen to land titles in the passing of 
moments. During the time it takes you to read this ad, 
something could happen to your title that would change 
your whole financial structure, or indeed it could alter your 
plans and aspirations for generations to come. The 
abstracter, in a sense, is your land title guardian, for he 
keeps the records day by day as you or others make them. 
Advise with him often about your title.

Eastland County Abstract Company

productive lure at this time 
would be a lizard, presented 
within the next area. 
Lizards, or salamander are 
recognized as a natural 
enemy of the eggs which the 
female will be laying. A 
direct cast bringing the bait 
directly into the nest will 
almost always bring a reac­
tion, even still this may only 
be to blow the intruder from 
the nesting area and not ac­
tually take the bait. Our area 
lakes are fortunate in that 
normally we cannot actually 
see these nest, but nest cast 
repeatedly during a days 
time, thereby reducing the 
harvest of large female bass, 
which replenish our supply 
of America’s most popular 
game fish ' The Elusive 
Bass."

Area lakes are producing 
quite well with our own 
backyard Leon, giving up 
some real nice stringers. 
Our dedicated might be 
fishermen during the part 
full moon have enjoyed some 
exce llen t evenings. A 
number of fish in the three to 
six pound range have been 
taken. A few of these fish are 
heavy with eggs. Lake 
Daniels still producing nice 
crappie and bass. Proctor 
slow for bass, but crappie

and channel cat are picking 
up.

Rem em ber those

youngsters next time out 
they’ll have a ball. Good 
fishing.

W orld’s Shortest 

Trailride Set May 5
•'The World's Shortest 

Trailride’ ’ sponsored by 
Cisco Junior College w ill be 
held Saturday, May 5. 
Gerald Bint, coordinator for 
the event, invites anyone in­
terested in participating to 
contact him ahead of time at 
(8171442-2567, extension 151.

Breakfast will be served to 
participants from 7:00 to 
9:00 a.m. at the l.ake Cisco

Park. Trailriders will leave 
at 9:00 to join the downtown 
Cisco Fron tier Jubilee 
Parade w hich begins at 10:00 
a m. It is not imperative that 
you ride in the trailride to en­
joy the breakfast and 
fellowship In case of rain 
breakfast will be served in 
the college cafeteria. Prizes 
will be awarded at the end of 
the trailride and parade

DON’T FORGET TO VOTE
With absentee voting for 

both the Democrat and 
Republican primaries to 
close May 1, there has been a 
vey light absentee turnout so 
far reports County Clerk 
Joann Johnson.

If you are going to be out of 
the county on election day, 
you may vote absentee at the 
County Clerk's office in the 
courthouse or by mail after 
writing for a ballot. Persons

Plans Being Made 

For Cisco Jubilee

R . P a tM U k ir

112 W. Commerce, 
Eastland, Texas

Aaoellc B. Miller
TC

Plans are being made for 
the annual Cisco F'rontier 
Jubilee Parade to be held 
Saturday, May 5, at 10:00 
a.m.

Organizations, groups, in­
dividuals -  everyone -  is in­
vited to participate. Divi­
sions include floa ts , 
automobiles, bands, mar­
ching and perform ing

groups, riding clubs, a 
children’s division and much 
more. Trophies will be 
awarded.

P'or more information or to 
enter contact Olin Odom at 
Cisco Junior College 
(817)442-2567.

Make plans to be a part of 
the parade and Frontier 
Jubilee festivities

-tf-  -ti" -tf- >

*

The Beouty Connection
is offering "F R E E"

Color Analysis.
CoH 629-8032 for oppointments 

* — CertIfM Color ConsyltanU-
’ Peggy Robinson A Mory Ann Johnson

«

over 65 or ill individuals may 
also vote absentee.

But remember, there is 
not much time left and your 
vote counts.

Owners Of The 

BeautyConnectio 

Complete Semina
Mary Ann Johnson and 

Peggy Robinson owners of 
The Beauty Connection, 
have completed a seminar in 
color analysis by Beauti Con­
trol.

Beauti Contol’s Certified 
Beatui Care & Color con­
sultants are carefully train­
ed to analyze individual skin 
type and color pigmentation 
to determine a highly per­
sonal program of skin care 
and cosm etic/wardrobe 
selections.

The Skin Care and Color 
analysis is offered free of 
charge by the Beauty Con­
nection. Call 629-M32 for an 
appointment.

(V "" «A» ■■ "  «O* ■ •T40-

FOR SALE 
SS-galkn 

Ink
barrels
wtthUds

at the Tetctram
ia Eastlaad,

T h i s
M a y
Be
Y o u r
S p o t

BECAUSE we are dedicated to quality li\ ing, we otter PERSON.AL 
CARE —  an alternate litestyle tor tliose wlto have reached a turninji 
point in their lives.

BECAUSE it is yiHir lite, you set the pace. The independence and 
privacy ot all personal care residents are maintained while they enjoy the 
security and services ot a well run home.

BECAUSE Personal Care is desij^ned tor the person who requires a 
little extra care, hut not the constant supervision ot a nursing tacility, you 
decide whether or not you want to join in the many well planned 
activities.

BECAUSE we know your needs —  maid, laundry, and linens are 
provided. Personal laundry assistance and well balanced meals are avail­
able,

BECAUSE ive are the people who cure about people.
Call and ask about Personal Care —  the attordable alternative.

E A S T LA N D  M A N O R
1405 W. Qimmercc •  Eastland, Texas 76448 •  (817) 62^-2686

J2 1

WAL-MART

* 3

A lim ited tim e offer on the 
portrait deal of a lifetim e.

2-8 X 1 Os, 3-5 X 7s, 15 wallets
20 portraits for just

IICOUPONI
Present this coupon to our pho­
tographer with 95< deposit on 
your portrait collection One 
coupon per family. Not volid 

with any other offer $1 sitting fee for eoch additional subject in 
some portrait. Satisfoct'on olwoys or your money refunded Offer 
valid only on dotes ond at locations listed.

$3 OFF
These Days Only I 
April 24 - 28, 1984 
Tuesday - Saturday 

10 A M . - 8 P.M. 
EASTLAND

WAL-MART

C ß u n S ty
MUliSTÂTt

629-I72S 62M391
. ,  ,  HIGHWAY 80 EAST

Barbara L o v e ,  In c .  e a s t l a n d , TEXAS 76448,
BFROKCF*

EASTLAND
TUCKED AW AY in
good area, 2 BR, cen. 
H/A fireplace, oaks.Ell 
LARGE FAMILY-small 
pocketbook? See this 14 
story 3 or 4 bedroom. E13 
N ICE  B E G IN N E R S  
HOME, 3 BR, 1 bath 
completely remodelled, 
cen h/a. E4

CLOSE TO TOW N. 
Remodelled 3 Br., 1 bath
frame/carport.E6
CORNER LO T 2
bedroom home with cen 
h/a, garage with 
storage. E7
GOOD LOCATION. 3 
BR 2 bath older frame 
home, possibilities. E8 
LOVELY HOME sur­
rounded by stately oaks, 
large 2 BR, many ex­
tras. E14
ALMOST NEW 3 BR 14 
bath brick home
assumable loan, car- 
port/patio. EIS 
CAREFREE LIVING in 
this like new 2 BR brick, 
small yard. E17 
NEW UNIQUE ROCK 
HOME in Oakhollow, 
energy efficient 3 BR 2 
bath, wet bar,
gam eroom , deck, 
skylites. E18 
MOBILE HOME 14 x 65 
bricked 3 BR 14 bath, 
landscaped, patio. E19 
NAME YOUR TERMS, 
choice of financing on 
neat 3 BR, central h/a. 
E23
LITTLE CASH NEED­
ED to move in this 2 BR, 
cen. heat, fenced yard. 
E24
A REAL DELIGHT, in­
spect this spotless 3 BR 
brick home with family 
rwomr-Vwe*ar twt—fc - 
patio ElO

CLOSE IN - 4 BR. 2 
bath. Remodeled frame 
E16.
BEGIN OR RETIRE 
HERE • 2 BR Stucco, 
garden space, walk to 
town.E12.
NO Q U A L IF Y IN G , 
assume and naove In 3 
BR. Cen H/A. E5. 
PRICE REDUCED! No 
city taxes. Brick 3 BR, 
14 bath, cent. H/A.E22 
BE AU TIFU L D EAL! 
Seller will finance this 
neat 2 BR, 1 bath.El 
ACREAGE
SMALL HOUSE, small 
ffaym ent, insulated 
siding, neat & cozy.E2.

OTHER
LAKE LEON: 2 BR with 
den or 3 BR, 2 deeded 
lots. S ta ff w ater, 
trees.07
CISCO-NICE 3 Br., 2 
bath. Brick home/swim- 
ming pool.09 
GORMAN, energy effi­
cient 2 BR with garage 
apt., large lot, trees. 03 
GORMAN, 2 BR with 
carport and stg. garden 
spot, fruit trees. 05 
GORMAN, 2 3 BR,
beautiful’. 'aped,
patio, meU,.uidg. 06 
RANGER - FHA AP­
PRAISED U rge  3 BR 
home on 2 corner 
lots.OlO

GORM AN, E.Z. TO 
BUY! Assumable loan,
2 BR, cellar, well, 
garden spot.04

LAKE L E O ^  1 BR fur­
nished a jS l^on  rustic 
deeded i , uock. 08

OLDEN, large tree 
shaded lot with 4 BR 2 
bath older home.Oll 
GORMAN, custom built 
3 BR, 2 bath bride on 2 
acres, many

amenities

HOUSE WITH 
ACREAGE

CUSTOM DOUBLE 
W IDE with added 
den/dining, bricked, on 
one acre. HA2 
EXECUTIVE HOME, 
spacious 3 BR, game 
room, all amenities, on 2 
acres on Hwy. 8, Gor­
man. HA6
HOME IN COUNTRY, 
3 4  m iles from  
Eastland, 12.9 acres 
coastal. HAS 
MORTON VALLEY 2 
BR cen. h/a, on 55 
acres. HA»

CISCO • S-Yr. Old 3 Bd. 
brick. M  S AC.HAIO 
BIT O’ THE COUNTRY
Enjoy these 3 acres with 
lo ve ly  3 BR brick 
home.HA7
CISCO • Hwy. 183, 2 
acres with 3 BR home, 
orchard, garden. H All

ACREAGE
m  ACRES Hwy 8 Deer 
k Turkey A21 

232 ACRES with 3 BR 
home, 2 mi. So. of Car­
bon, Hwy. 6, cult, 
coastal, timber. Will 
divide.AS
220 ACRES, FM2S26,14 
miles west of Carbon, 
road frontage three 
sides, good land, 
coastal, city water, SO 
ac. cult., minerals. A2 
2$ ACRES and 40 acres,
5 miles SE of U ke I>eon. 
Tex. Vet.A9
159 ACRES E. of Car­
bon, fronts FM 2526, 75 
clut. some coastal. 
Aasumable loan.AlS

bottom. Fronts 3 hwjrs., 
owner financing. A20 
64.4 ACRES with 2 BR 
rock house, 3 tanks, 
well, scattered trees, 
close-in A3

81 ACRES 5 mi. N. of 
Gorman, fronts FM 2689 
2 sides, water wells, 
coasta l, trees at 
hom esite. 4  min A19 

20 ACRES, 34 mi. SE of 
Eastland, fronts on FM 
570. Will Tex Vet.A6 

124 ACRES, 9/10 mi. 
South of U k e  Leon 
dam, on pvmt. Staff 
water. A7
78 ACRES, near 
W ayland, Stephens 
County, 40 ac. field, 
timber. A ll
38.15 ACRES, approx. 5 
miles West of Eastland, 
Hwy 80 frontage. A12 
SO.I ACRES, NW of 
Elastland, 2 tanks creek, 
some pecan trees. A13 
187.5 ACRES, 2 tanks, 
water well, fenced and 
cross-fenced, 70 ac. 
cultivation, creek. A14 
30.87 ACRES, FM571, 9 
miles North of Gorman, 
2 tanks, fenced and 
cross fenced, scattered 
trees. A15
93 ACRES, toUl seclu­
sion, just off Hwy 6 S, all 
heavy timber.A1

COMMERCIAL
LOCATION IM PO R ­
TANT? Then see this 
Main Street retail outlet 
or office bldg.06

B R E C K E N R ID G E  
BUILDING dock, office, 
also old service sta- 
tion.C7
PR IM E  COM M ER- 
C IA L / IN D U S T R IA L  
SITE-64 Ac. 2 mi. East 
on pvmt. near 1-20, 
railroad spur C4

Moving to Eastland Coaaty? er anywhere la 
U.S.A. CaU TeU Free 148MIM81B B i t  4388 
lor intennatlea. (No 1

BARBARA LOVE 
647-1397

EIJMER FOSTER 
620-1972

HAZEL UNDERWOOD 
828-1188

ROGER AUTREY
443-8345



County Classified
Sunday. Aoril 22.1984

BUILDING M ATERIALS 
FOR SALE  - Lumber, 
plywood, siding, moulding 
and much more. Visit our 
sales office for prices. Hours 
8 a.m. to 4 p.m. Mon. thru 
Fri. Open Saturdays 9 a m. 
til noon. Morgan Building 
Corp. Hwy. 69 North, 
Eastland, Tx. T35

FOR SALE - Antique Glass 
and Furniture, and other col­
lectibles. ‘We buy Estates. ’ 
The House of Antiques 908 S. 
Bassett, Eastland, Texas. 
Open Every Day. T44

First Baptist Church in 
lUistland needs a part- 
time nursery worker for 
Sunday and and some 
week-days approximate­
ly 10 hrs a week. Must 
have own transportation 
and phone. Reference re­
quired. Apply at First 
Baptist Church office. 101 
Ml. Plummer. Monday- 
Friday9-5. TF

For Sale; one 
and 1 table 
44M303.

desk lamp; 
lamp call 

TF '

FOR SALE: Used General 
E le c tr ic  Autom atic
Dishwasher $100. Call 
629-2413 TF

For Sale; large oak anti­
que china cupboard, ex­
cellent condition, has 
lock & 4 wood shelves, 
$800, Call 442-3578. 
p-24tfc

FOR SALE • Handy Spot 
Grocery Store in Ranger, 
Contact J erry  Bragg 
<117)647-5337, Ranger. T34

FOR SALE • 1979 KZ 650 with 
farring and radio. Call 
629-1448 after 6:00 p.m. 3̂5

FOR SALE - 7 year old gen­
tle horse, very good with 
kids $550 639-2401. rJ3

FOR SALE • ITKO Ferguson 
Tractor. Good condition 
$1850. Can be seen at 
Lakeside Country Club. Call 
653-2432._______________TO

FOR SALE: 1978 Dodge 
“l^doaman Van, fully load­
ed, good gommion, new tircii. 
Call 629-1797 before 5 p.m. 
and 647-3691 after 5 p m. and 
on weekends TO

P IA N O  FOR SALE : 
Wanted' Responsible party 
to assume .small monthly 
payments on spinet/console 
piano. Can be seen locally. 
W rite : (In clude phone 
number) Credit .Manager, 
P.O Box 478 Lockhart, 
Texas 78644-0478 T37

FOR SAIJC - 198.3 Chevrolet 
1-lon pickup, red, with dual 
wheels. Call 639-2316 after 5 
p.m. T36

FOR SALE - Ciixxl student 
upright Maynard piano. 
Come by 106 MeWood or call 
629-1225 T3;t

FOR SALE ■ 1978'25 ft., hoad 
Ranger, fifth wheel, travel 
trailer. Completely self- 
contained. heat & air. extra 
clean, hitch included. Call 
442-1508 or set' at 1204 Park 
Drive T'4

HELP WANTED: Combina­
tion welder-mechanic. Tools 
and equipment furnished. 
.Salary plus commission. Ap­
ply in person HEM Drilling 
Co., Hwy 6 South of 
F]astland. T33

IMMEDIATE OPENINGS -
Carpenters, fram ers, 
roo fers , finshers. Ex- 
[x'rience desirable, but not 
ni*ces.sary. IX>pendabilitj a 
mu.st Incentive pay system, 
with good tx'nefits package. 
Apply in person to .Morgan 
Building Corp., Highway 69 
North, Ea.stland, Texas TO

.SUPER DLPER is taking 
applications for part-time 
Dell Clerk Hours must be 
flexible. Individual must be 
willing to work hard. Apply 
111 person at Plastland Super 
Duper. T33

ATTENTION R.N. - Full 
time position available in 
following counties - Brown, 
Comanche, Colem an, 
Eastland and McCullough. 
RN Community Health Nur­
sing position available for 
RN interested in Direct Pa­
tien t Care, Supervisor 
capacity. Great house and 
benefits. Salary negotiable. 
For more information call 
Linda Echols (915) 
643-5525 T37

M

FOR SALE; 3 hd . 2 bath, 
fireplace, fans, under 3 acs., 
metal shop, paved road, 
hookup for mobile home, 
a.ssume V A. Big Country 
Real Estate, Office 442-1693, 
after 5 p.m , 442-3958. p-17tfc

FOR SALE - 2 bedroom 
home, living and dining 
room, large bath with 
shower, kitchen, fireplace, 
pecan trees 629-1726 or 
629-1495 TO

FOR SALE - 1 acre lots at 
lakeside Country Club. City 
water, some financing. 
653-2432 ’^ F

FOR SALE - Choice uuilding 
site; retail, industrial, com­
mercial. Right in the heart of 
the action, just off East Main 
St., Eastland, Texas 76448. 
Contact site Box 29, 
Eastland, Texas. TF

FOR S A LE ; 1979 
Harley, 1280 c.c., with 
extras, in excellent con­
dition. $3,500. Call 
442-1148 in Cisco, bi't- 
ween 5-7 p.m. p-4’2

COMMERCIAL PRO­
PERTY For Sale 

Building approximately 
1700 q. feet 2 bedroom 
apt. above 3 bed house 
on corner lot. A steal of 
a deal 629-1544 or 
512-659-0085 T64

REPORT OIL FIELD THIEVES
1-800-OIL-COPS

TOLL FREE • REWARD

B & S Construction Co.
Nq m b  • B vidhg 

iemedefcig - iBpoirt 
PaHot • Cm Porti

No Job Too Largo or Too SmèU 
Cdl BmI Ned
447-5339 or 647-1551 M 2 9154^304

EASTLAND SELF i GRACE
In Pogu* Industrial Pc.iK

Available Spaces 7^X7'/it.....l0X10
10X15___ 10X20..,.. 10X30
Start at 26.50' and up.

Mrs. Dale Maston, Manager 
629-2102

We Alao Have Boat And Recreational 
Van Storage TV

SACRIFICE- By owner ap­
prox. 38 acres. Lovely Rock 
Home- Large barn. 16 stalls 
training track, wild game 
Near Eastland all im­
provements. Call 629-1528 or 
629-8626_________________ TO

FOR SALE: 3 bedroom 
frame house $18,000. 203 S. 
Connellee. 629-3460 TO

900 MINERAL ACRES 2,636 
acres near Eastland. Lease, 
sell or trade land or 
m inerals. Holton
912-432-9316 T37

For Rent

FOR RENT - Trailer house, 
2 bedrooms, 1 bath, washer 
and dryer connections. 
Located in Olden. Shown by 
appointm ent only.
629-1084. T33

FOR RENT - Large 3 
bedroom house, 2 blocks 
north of courthouse. 
Carpeted, washer and dryer, 
very nice inside, $275. Also 1 
bedroom, $240. Efficiency, 
$•200.629-2805. T34

FOR RENT: Furnished 
Trailer House in Olden. To 
single or couple. $250.00 
month bills paid. Call 
653-2226 T33

FOR RENT: Furnished or 
unfurnished apartments 
Royal Oak Apartments, 1304 
Royal I,ane, Cisco. Call 
442-3232 c-104

CENTURY 21-Eastco Inc. 
Several Houses for rent. 
647-1302 or 647-1635. TEC

M o b i le  Huniew

MOBILE HOMES: Move, 
set up and tie down. We also 
service mobile homes. C^U 
817-893-6753 day or night.
___________________ TO

O p p o rtu n itie s

GOOD O P P O R T U N IT Y :
Openings for automobile 
mechanic and mechanic’s 
helper. Contact: W.C. 
(C h eck ) Sm ith, Smith 
Brothers’ (Chevrolet, Gor­
man, Texas. (817 ) 734-22,33. 
p-33

AMBHGAN

STANDING AT STUD: My 
Siggy Bar AQHA, sorrell, 
blaze, four stockings. Fee by 
private treaty. Roping and 
cutting horses trained. 
Rogers Training Stables, 
Fielding (Bozo) Rogers,Star 
Rt. Carbon. 643-3328. rs34

CH ILD S W ELSH pony 
w/saddle and bridle $3̂ 1.00. 
Registered Gelding 10 yrs. 
old $1200.00. Has had cutting 
horse training. Call after 
6:00 p.m. All day weekends 
442-3430. T

(lani O f Thanks

CARD OF THANKS 
The family of Enid Tucker 

extend deep appreciation to 
all our friends and relatives 
who did so much for us dur­
ing our recent loss. The 
many beautiful expressions 
of sympathy, were most 
helpful. Thank you for all the 
cards, visits, and food.

Jack H. Tucker

Business Services

O i l  F ie ld

WANT TO BUYm m  
Marginal, shallow pro­
duction (1500’ or less) 
with acreage  o for 
d e v e l o p m e n t .  
Call: 442-2669 ( Days) 
or 442-3647 (Nights) p-52

Au<*tions

SHORTY SQUIRF.Sis selling 
out. Tucker Auction Service 
will conduct an Auction at 
Shorty’s Place on May 5 
10:00a.m. Call629-1956. TO

JVIiiMjellaneout»
ANTIQUES; Old, original, 
printers, type trays, with the 
authentic ink stains. 
Available in limited supply 
at the Eastland 
Telegram. TF

TYPEW RITTER: ribbons, 
thermal calculator tape, S-C 
ca rtidges. A ll at the 
Telegram. TF

A HANDFUL 
OF CASH 
IS BETTER 
THAN A 

-FUI 
OF STUFF

Jax Electric
ItfidBirtiol ComBMrdal 

Nbw  Sb t v ìm  InstBlBtioiis; R tw lrting , 
B rttliB r Ru lr  M ov«d or R opiK od; Now 

Rm 0O , Drior, W otlior Hookups, otc.

C d l Jw k  Taylor 447-5390

f
U-Save Phormacy

Enjoy Our
Drive-In Window Service 

Convenient Coll Ahead 
Good Parking

Open 8-6 Weekday« 
8-1 Saturday

201 S. Daugherty 
629-1166

ELROD’S MOBILE L(K:K 
SHOP • Keys made, locks 
changed or repaired. Auto, 
Residence and commercial. 
Bonded Locksnuth. 423 W. 
Main, Ranger, Texas 76470. 
Phone 647-3444 T44

WANT TO BUY used 
furniture. S&K Sales. 
515 E. Main, Eastland 
Call 629-8382 or 629-2241.

T44

Northviaw Workthop 
Wood Craft Workshop 

Woodan Gifts ortd Toy* 
For Sola 629-?A24.

' ■fr
647-3197 '  ^

or 653-2397
Doyle Squiers 

Built up roofs and 
sh ingles new work 
guaranteed.

Roofing Contractor 
T44

M.H. PERRY 
Southland Life Ins. Co. 

offers protection 
•Life -Cancer 

•Hospitalization 
•Group Plans 

•Accident/Sickness 
104 N. U m ar -  629-156« 
Evenings: 629-1095 T44

CALL us nnsT
for all aurUoa nr«ds; 
TUCKER AUCTION CO. 

Rt. l.Boa N  EaiUaod. TX 7S44S

CaU CallMl T44

WE C AR E  ABOUT 
YOUR HEALTH 

Specialising in physical 
ailments related to the 
spine and nervous 
system.

Dr. Geo. G. MrPhaui 
Chiropractor 

Telephone 647-3821 
454 Piue Street Ranger 
Please Clip &.Save. T44

SCHOOIJMASTEi; 
ANTIQUES

639-2228 
Carbon USA 

Buy Anything from 
Cameras to Churns

• “ A V o i T t

1648-39341
DESKS. CHAIRS, files, 
safes, cash and earry. 
Save 20-50 percent. 
U rge  selection. 9-5:30 
weekdays. Value City 
1030 Butternut, Abilene.

T44 _

T S t t w ^ s u l a TO R "
Blown In cellulose 
Fiberglass bath 

Accoustiral ceilings 
Free estimates 

817-725-6683. 74-tfc

Mowing, Edging,
Tree Trimming,

Odd Jobs 
Coil 647-1694

M A X W E LL  WOOD­
WORK 

Remodeling 
Formica Tops 

Custom Cabinets 
629-8387 TIW

DUSKE & SON DOZER 
WORK, pits, tanks, 
fence rows, land leveling, 
3 hour minimum. Call 
734-2111 or 893-6130. T44

NOTU'F: Dokf Jifhnson
('«nlrt4’lor-Rrrat»d«*liu||. 
crelp. Flrclrical, PlumbinK. 
FfncÉng. Btiat l>ock, Houw 
I.evrliufE ('a ll 447-3442 or 
447-347». Tt'

T44

Bookkeeping and Tox Service " II

LAWN PROBLEMS? 
For complete tree and 
lawn maintenance or in­
stallation, call Oasis 
Undscaping. 442-4881 
or 442-1072 e-44

Ken PofTock
305 E Main. Ranger. 647-3023 

)) 6 North Seaman. Eastland 629-864)

INCOME TAX RETURNS 
MONTHLY AND QUARTERLY

REPORTING FOR BUSINESS
Individual. Partnership, and Corporation Tox Returns 

C.T3 D C

Steinman Fencing
Commercial-Residential 

Chain Link-Wood-Farm-Ranch
IM-AJW----
vfMnWip

Metal Buildings-Car Ports-Corrals- 
Cattle Guards

No Job Too Small or Too Large.  ̂
L e r o y S t e in m o n ^ ^ ^

SmaUey Fence Company
647-3873

A Fence For Every Need
Chain Link— Wood— Industrial— Farm —  

Decorative— Landscape— Wrought Iron—  
Ballparks— Tennis Courts— P o g  Runs

And More

CISCO RADIATOR SERVICE
7 E. 6th (Bre<
Cisco, Texas

207 E. 6th (Breckenridge Hwy.)
817-442-1547

•  Cleonlng-Rodding-Repoiring
•  Auto-Truck-Troctor Radiators 
A New-Recored-Rebuilt Rodiators-Hoatars
•  Exchonge Rodlotors
•  Auto

* Open Mondoy-Frldoy 8:00a.m.-5:30p.m.
I Over 25 Years ExperierK# Rodlotors Are Our Business

M a j e s t i c  T h e a t r e
Eastland ‘ 
629-1220

R a n g e r  D r iv e - I n  
T h e a t r e

Ranger 647-3802
On# Showing Only Each Evening 

1 Open 7:30 Show Starts At 7:50 P.M.
One Showing Only Eoch Evenkig 
Open 7:̂ 0 Aowtime 8:00 P.M.

1 S u n d r.y  L a s t  D a y  
Bargain Night Sunday. 

All Seats $1.50

 ̂ S u n d a y  L a s t  D a y

L rom tlie author of CARRIE, |
See A Ibtally ̂ »aced Adventure! TUCSHiniMQ, 

THE DEAD zone, 
andCMRISTiriE..

An adult 
nightmare.

N e x t F r i., S a ts  S¿ Su n . . ,

Mhenilit l4ui Imi « ioti
!heg cjnt iMfldle

•fitg oetd 0 mor outsiüe !ht l«u

fl ̂ .'■a*» kK;
ÎOAStUUK #
m sim m  lAUMMMuuofi m w  “
mmm xkm(íaibuto ihmm nmam
. kMCn éjB VO. «BMP . >4'KJ hBr.lU«»

mitt
nfitmcTse ZS O

[Ü ! j. —

S t e p h e n  k i n g ^  

C h ild r e n  of  the  C o r n
Atxl a child sli.ill lead llu iti ... 

STeptiEM MMcrs CHii DRrn or itir cori3
luMn.PtTER tiORTO(3 I.IPIDA ttAMll.TOM 

•s...„vu,h,Gr,CTRriE CiOl.IXSMITM
u(¥>n thr by .STEPHEN RING ..... . JONATHAN ELIAS

EA R L  G I.IC R  C H A R LES  .). W L B f  R 
r..,d».dh, DONA1.D P BO R C H ER S  T E R R EN C E  R IR BY  

ER ITZ  R IERSCM  NEW W ORLD P IC T U R ES
(Wf*ci ih>- ShÎ I PanritvatK] I'tmis hiun . i, sV..’. , i,

LSaHifHtOetK .tMmm jsa<i.st>h 1 rir^ nairiwcTto jnVatf A.'Vii »Tm'».*. H. ,.H.K J | •./•■ i ’

N e x t F r i., S a t . Si Su n .
JASON IS BACK AND THIS IS THE ONE 

VOUVE BEEN SCRE AMING FOR

THE FINAL CHAPTER

ow «cn«____
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C o u r t h o u s e  R e p o r t
MARRIAGE UCENSE 

Junes CUyton Bitms and Dana 
Kathleen Kuhn

Artemio l^nda and Mary l.ynn 
Keyna.
INSTRUMENTS FILED - CO 
CIJCRKS OFFICE 

Hlanche Anderson - To Sun Eaplor 
k Pord. Co.. OGL.

Jon Mark Arnold and wife • To Cram 
MortitaK« Serv • D/T.

Kathryn H Anderson and others ■ To 
Roy Don Porter and wile - W/D 

Advance Exploration - To Gary 
Mack Jones • As({n OGL.

Charles Arnett and wile • To L L. 
Asche and wife - Warranty Deed 

Amarillo Co Inc - To Ridite Oil Co. 
Inc. ■ Ratit & Amend ol OGL 

Billy H BoitKs ■ To Hanvey Prod. Co. 
a ;  MI«
Maude Butler To Sun Explor k 

Prod Co -ail.
Norman Boiuis and others ■ To B & 

R Petroleum Co. • (XIML.
Harry Bevers ■ To Ann 1. Everst • 

Asitn fXlMI.
Harry Heavers - To Noble James 

Taylo - A.sitn fXlL.
Harry Heavers • To IXinald Stone • 

Asitn (XII.
Harry Heavers ■ I'o I.ane Newbert • 

Asitn (XII.
Harry Heavers To E J iGene Me- 

Cianci • Asijn tXlL 
Harry Heavers • To Richard H 

Brotherlon • (Xil,
W D Heitiis • To Douitlas M Crani 

and wife - Kel of Ijen 
J H Burton - To John I) Clark and 

wife • Warranty Deed 
Robert T Hruwn - To So Sav A I ai 

Assn. • l)/T
BG Brown Const Co. - to Marcus 

N Harris and wife - Kel (X lien 
Majorie la-e Butts To Omelia 

Mimrats Inc -IXIMI 
Madite Bearden and others 

OiiH'ita Minerals liH- ■ 1X11.
► aris B Bower dba - To .tacky I) 

Hallmark - Abstract of Judit 
JanH-s D Barton and iXhers 

.Michael A. .Martin and others • W/D 
Celia Kac Hcsk • To Compressor 

Rental Serv • R/W Auree 
IxMibelle Hu.sh Byrd • To Ridile Chi 

Co Inc (KIML.
He.ster Butler - To AMV Operatini; 

Co -1X11«

Ball Producing Co. • To Philip E. 
Oabomc and others - A/J.

Comm. Energy Corp. • To Eugene T. 
Ford • Aagn

Chem-Drill Mud Inc. - To Mike 
White dba • A/J.

John H Craven • To Ray C. 
Dunaway and wile • W/D.

Center Point Enterprises Inc. • To 
Robert T. Brown and wife • W/D 

Victor Cornelius • To Mornson 
Energy Co. • OGL 

Paul A Cawley and wife • To 
Southeaster Resources -OGML 

Melba R. Carter - To S 0  Operating 
Co Ltd • OGL

Donald Mark Cougar and wife - To 
Juanita E Willumson - W/D 

Jane Dunn Cochell • To Thomas C. 
King - OGMI..

Steve Coiart - To Moran Natl Bk • 
Transfer of Ijen

Cordia L. Clark ■ To Chase-.Mann 
Petra Inc. • Extending of OGL.

To

To

Jimmy Dool Est by Ind Ex's - To 
Verda ShaWNELL Dool ■ Warranty 
Deed

Jimmy Dool E.st by Ind Ex's - To 
William Nathan Dool - Warranty 
IX̂ ed

Elaine C Dixon - To OIney Sav 
Assn. • D/T

Emmett B Doherty and others ■ To 
Sun EIxplor k Prod Co. - OGI«

Gaston Washington Dixon - To 
Steven G. Schooling and wife - W/D 

Jerry Don Douglas and wife • To 
Jack G Sandefer and wife ■ W/D 

Jerry Douglas and wife • To Jim 
Walter Homes Inc - Sub Agree.

Robert C IXidley and wife - To 
IXiyle G Holdridge • W/D 

la  Verne Davis-To ARK Resources 
liK (XI.ML.

Ronny D Dawson and wife - To Paul 
D Thomas and wife Warranty Deed 

(iirl Alexander IXtmore Est - To 
Kathleen M Ditmore - Corr QCO 

H H Dun ham - To Cewnpressor 
Rental Serv. • R/W Agree 

Betty lau IXiebbler - To Ridge Oil 
Co. Inc - F«stm

Nancy Hemson IXirham and others - 
To Ridgeway Exco Inc (XII.

EAS Petroieum Inc. - To Canadian 
Commercial Bk Assumption of notes 
D/T • F/S

Opal Edwards and wife - To Dene

Rogers • (XIL.
Eastland Natl. Bk • To Myrtle 

Elvina Bourland and husband • Rel of 
Lien.

Tony W Embrcy and wife • To Cram 
Mortgage Serv Co. ■ D/T.

Eastland Co. Farm Bureau • To 
Eastland Natl Bk • D/T

R H Erwin and wife - To BAL 
Operating Co. ■ CXIL.

T R. Elrod • To Compressor Rental 
Serv • R-W Agree

Eastland Natl Bk • To Max D Hen­
son and w ife ■ Rel D/T.

Opal Edwards and husband - To 1st 
Natl Bk. Gorman • D/T A Asgn of 
Prod

William Hugh Forman and others - 
To Dale L. Schuvier and wife • Rel of 
D/T

First Natl Bk , Cisco • To Billy Joe 
Taylor and wife • W/D

Robert W Fox and wife - To 
Petroleum Corp of Texas ipetcoi • 
Adj of I.ease

First Natl Bk Cisco • To Ayres R 
Cermin and wife ■ Kel of D/T

First Natl Bk. Gorman ■ To Ixivena 
Kinser • Rel of Lien

Fed Id. Bk of Texas-To Bar H Bar 
Inc and others • Sub of I jen to (XIL.

Michael Wayne Fraley and wife • To 
Donnie Lee Fsaley W/D

FirstSt Bk Ranger-ToScott Miller 
• Rel of D/T

First Natl Bk Cisco ■ To Timothy A 
Barton and others • Partial Rel D/T

First Natl Bk. Gorman • To Ixivena 
Kinser • Rel of luen.

Fed. Id. Bk of Texas ■ To Bar H Bar 
Inc and othrs - Sub of Lien (XIL 

Michael Wayne E'raley and wife - To 
Donnie l.ee Fraley W/D 

First St Bk Ranger - To Scott Miller 
- Kel of D/T

Fust Natl Bk Cisco • To Timothy A 
Barton and others • Partial Rel D/T 

YinonaFutch-ToRonaldE Parkin­
son and others • Deed 

First Natl Bk Cisco • To AAB Oil 
Co. - W/D

Eastland Co Sheriff • To HEF 
Oilfield Supply • Sheriff's Deed 

Jonathan Lm  Gehm - To David W 
Kerr and w ife - Quit Claim Deed 

Goldome FSB • To Hugh Porter 
Barry Jr and wife • Deed Red D/T 

Ijxa Graham by A/F • To A D 
lasater and wile - Release of Uen 

Alma Ruth Bums Gilmore - To The 
Public - Affed

Michael K Gray - To .Mark Arnold 
and wife - W/D

G..M Graham and w ife • To David A 
Graham and wife - W/D 

W V Gregg and w ife - To William 
Partick Gregg and wile ■ W/D 

Paul Thomas Goins - To Sun Explor. 
A Prod Co • OGL.

Alvin L. Hargrove and w ife - To Dar­
rell L. Hargrove and others - W/D 

Bill Harrison - To The Public ■ Ailed 
Ijrry Hunt • To Sun Explor A Prod 

Co - OGL
Randale Hale and wife - To Onicy 

Sav. Assn. - Deed of Trust 
Houston Oil A energy and others - To 

Houston Oil A Energy Inc - Partial 
Asgn (XIL.

Hondo Energy Inc. - To Sunbelt Well 
Serv Inc F/S

Higgintbotham-Bartlett Co. - To Ray 
IXinn - Abstract of judg 

Ben E Hamner. dee d by Ind Ex's - 
To James E Adams and wife - W/D 

James P Hamilton and others - To 
R W Nixon Jr • OGL.

Lottie I,eora Holirun - To Omega 
Min Inc. - (XIL.

Herbert S Hilbum Est. - To Wayne 
Mav - R/W Agree

Hairsions Bros ■ To Compressor 
Rental Sen'. - R/W Agree

John L Hagaman - To Ridge OU Co. 
Inc. - Esmt

Partick H Harringan - To Ride (XI 
Co. Inc. - Esmt

Susan S. Hall - To Carla Petroleum 
Inc -OGML

Robert B Harrell ■ To Sun Explor A 
Pord Co. - (XIL

Interfirst Fist Bk. Stephenville NA - 
To Investor s Inc. - Transfer of Uen

W C Ivie - To Lynn Bint - Farm 
lease

L H Jones Treustee - To Sundown 
Cons Inc. - W/D

Shirley leuise Jones and husband - 
To James R Martin and wife - W/D

Jimmie Dee Johnson and others - To 
Ranger Drilling Corp - R/W Agiee

E.A. Lancanter and wife - iu l.yiui 
Koenig - Warranty Dead.

Jerry D. Lowronce - To Compreator 
r.ental Serv. - R/W Agree.

A C. Lane • To Ridge OU Co., Inc. • 
Asgn (XIL.

Anita Laird and others - To Sun Es- 
plor A Prod Co - (XIL.

Jane Gregory Marichal - To (ieo. S. 
Hcyer Jr. and others - Dead A Aagn.

Harold D. Meek, dec'd - To The 
Public - Certified Copy Probate.

Harold D Meek, dec'd - To The 
Public - Certified Copy Probate.

Modelle Overcast Maule and others - 
To Cimarron Roy alty Corp. - (XIL.

lem Matthews and others - To 
Way ne Msy • Deed ot Trust 

Gertie M Means-To Wands L. Van- 
dnek - Power of Atty 

Mornson Energy Co. - To 0 L. Mor­
nson - ORR Conveyance 

Mornson Energy Co. - To Alva Jen-

aon and others - 1^. Aagn. (X2L.
Mamien Eaargy Co. - To Bud oda 

Baca • Par. Alfa (KL.
Merriaon Energy Co. - To W.J. 

WooUn • Pom Aagn (XIL.
Morrison Energy Co. • To SyWaMor 

Glaatr - Par. As0 i (XIL.
Morriaon Energy Co. • To Stephen J. 

Ptrricont - Par. Aagn (XIL.
Morriaon Energy Co. • To Somrocli 

Inc. • Partial Agin. (XIL.
Morrison Entrgy Co. - To Robort D. 

U  Suevtr • Portlol Aagn (XIL 
Morriaon Energy Co. - To R. Jamos 

Smcti - Partial Aagn OGL 
Morriaon Energy Co. • To Mlchaol 

Panic and others - Par Aagn (XIL.
Mornson Energy Co. - To Marvin 

Palmer • Par Aagn (XIL.
Momaon Energy Co. - To Mac 

Ander Ltd • Par. Aagn (XIL 
Morriaon Entrgy Co. - To Jun 

Heyw'ood - Par Aagn OGL.

Morriaon Energy Co. • To James C.' 
Dulaan ■ Par. Aagn Ogl.

Morriaon Energy Co. • To Jomao 
Eriefcaon • Par. Aagn OGL 

Morrifoo Energy Co. - To BBOD In- 
voatmonti - Par. Aoga (XIL 

Morriaon Eaargy Co. • To Glon Block 
• Par. Aagn (XIL

Morriaon Eaargy Co. - To Etbia G. 
McMoidian Trust - Par. Aagn OGL 

Morriaon Energy Ce. - To Ed 
Kuntefce Par. A i^  (XIL 

Morriaon Energy Ce. - To Dan Odan 
- Part. Aagn OGL 

Morriaon Energy Co. - To dwrlaa 
McLood and otlwn - Par. Aagn (XIL 

Cathryn Virginia MUltr and hue- 
band - To (Xnega Min. Inc. - (XIML 

J O. May and wife - To BMWB lac. - 
Warranty Deed.

Michael A. Martin and «than • Ta 
James I. Barton and wife - D/T.

Doiuta Monctni - To Rhodoa Dlig. 
Co. and others • OGML

Noema R Johnson - To S 0 
Operating Co Ud - (XIL.

E C. Johnston and others - To Com­
pressor Rental Serv. - R/W Agree

Roy Dale Jones - To Ridge (XI Co. 
Inc - Partial Asgn OGL.

Perry Johns - To Ridge (XI Co Inc ■ 
Asgn C)GL.

Frances Fontauie F King to Ed­
ward Jerome W'righI Jr. ()C of Int in 
Uen

Clay Kellar and others - To Burrows 
Pipelin Padding Co. - (Xled Uen

David Kerr and wile - To Rosellen 
Kerr Quick - W/D

Lvnn Koenig - To Strawn Security 
Bk IVT

Alvin ninton Keller - To Com­
pressor Rental Serv. Co. - K/W.

Ralph E Kizer and others - To DBA 
Investments me. - (XIL.

Elizabeth R Kempner - 'i'o Sun Ex­
plor k Prod. Co. - CIGL.

Mary Helen Ixiwe and husband - To 
(Xnega Muierals Inc - (XIMI

1
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EASTER BUFFET
THE DEPOT

HOMES
3 BD fenced corner lot. new kitchen, newly wired & plum bed. Franklin fireplace 
3 BO wfth formal dining room and carport O N L Y  $15.000 
H U O  R E P O  405 West 13th - Call tor more details 
8 ROOM  house near post office, owner carry with $ 1.00 0 down 
3 BO 2  Bath Brick, fireplace, built-ins and garage P R IC EO  TO M OV E.
3 BO Brick covered patios. S O LO  lace, garage t  apartment G IA N T  trees'
3 BO F R O N T  S T R E E T , large private lot. garage, workshop XTRA N EA T 
3 BO Cent H / A , spacious living/dining room with fireplace, fenced yard
3 BO home near Primary school, paved street, fenced yard. $18.500
4 BO 2 Bath, on 3 lots. G R E A T  master bedroom-bath combo O N L Y  $32.500 
2 BO B U L L A R O . Spotless, remodelled, on 2 lots
2 BO. F IX -U P  formal dining room, large lot. Owner carry JUST $7,500 
2 BO Fram e, formal dining room, needs work O N L Y  $ 1 1 ,5 0 0 , $ 1,5 00 down 
2 BO large shady corner lot. parquet floors. Great location.
M O B ILE  • 2 B O . on 2 lots. Cent. H / A . garden spot. O N L Y  $10.500 
M O B ILE  • 3 B O , 2 Bath, built on living room, storage 2 lots $14,0 00 
R IS IN G  STAR • 2 B D . 1 Bath, with carport, only $10.500 

LOTS AND ACREAGE

R&R Carpet Ham, Turkey, &  Sirloin Steak

Cleaning |ĵ
Randall Rogers, Owner

FOR FREE ESTIMATE
Call 629-1121 

Over 8 yeers
service In this

M asked Potatoes & G ravy, Baked Potatoe, 
G reen Beans Brocolli, C orn, Carrots, Salad Bar, 

Desert, Easter Bread, Easter Eggs 

& Coffee or T e a .

$ .

3 AC. Scranton, 2 plus B D . home. 2 wells.
49 Plus AC. Nim rod, 2 mobile homes.horse barns, well improved, minerals.
73  AC. 3 B O  2 Bath, w /office, fire p iK e , poof, many X-tra features $ minerals.
2.68 AC. fenced, out buildings, carport, lovely. 2 B O  home with room to expand 
10 AC. with 3 BD home, needs some finish work Owner carry $3,000 Down
4 Lots on West 14th. $4,500
3 AC. 3 B D  2 Bath home, with large shop on HWY 3 1 0 1 . Five miles north Eastland

COM M ERCUL PR O PE R TY

P R IM E  DOW NTOW N LO C A TIO N - 2 Homes ideal for Business or Rental $42,500 . 
C O N R A D  H IL T O N  B O U LEV A R D  - Approximately 3,000 square feet partially remodelled

'5-95
i c

C K ild re n  under la - *^.oo
415 E . M a in — Eastland—

T33
OFFICE 44MW3

442>lMtShar(mWfic<nen D w aG oosoi, Broker 4 tt-3 in
44M707 Penny A. Reay Jeffery Wklteside 1-CU-112S

^  . i t  -  I. I O m C K I K M J I U k V t V J » .

III
E a t H a n d

C o a n ly

Hm. M  C§t

I diet frail 442-2244 
EaiNaad Takfran

629-H07
iRanfar Tinai 647-ff8l

n m m
Ckmài$ à

SjfttUbt áv Jttá
Sèi É t Itim i

moomùffof
419-3151

« . I W a

i8hp iihadd d4Mr
M  M U k  ^  1------- 1 ^ .
n  w n f  ww t/wmwmw
t m  È t t f  A n f

}§éé$C9mm
M af JiMalry
120 8 Naia

647-16

701W. Mala 
629-8202 

11 a.n. - 8 y.M.

CM S Farailiia 
'ShCta IM mv 

h t

« IM A M

WS 1  Snmm
E*illa*4

n m iM N C k LOYAL PEST
eoNmoi

Stiff È Rutalif

RiharlMii'i TV SalM
8  Uhim

SeS 1¥ • iñém Sk$ 
P kfm àSIm  

I SpftítSnki JWidp 
109W.

629-1628

SU rnm f
1001. Mala

EaMlaod
629-1786

t k  Ì f u M m  6

Tmmfi a M

á íf44SÍ 
M . Sm Sèi 

b S M

m  S M

Tha HiMr Slwy 
2071.481 

dna 
442-4M
w W m iw m m

r m n m i
Ih

sesmnasì/ì

Yaa Caa Rial 
TUi Sfata hi 
TN M  Nfarig 

data Fi m i , 

Eaillaad Talasraai 
A

R M g i r l l M t .

O N U 'SfM

o o n iM ii 
8 Rifair
M S

V S m jn rn k i
Jawia'i Frawa 8filliM V l

WON. Mai*
EwHwittMOW

M t r .  K m lm  K èke

629-1682 
610«. Mahl 

hSktÀ

MICROflEX 
T.V. 8 darai 

Rairial
TYi - Simm

600 « . Mahl 
629-8182
EatHand

kr im  tf Sm
n

mUiSmpk 
Smm iWta

ssm m B i

wWSW9 WWm

1 - 2 0 - 1 »
dna

-1846

ORMI
seses

m a rn i
Otdjf

4r
sièèè StmiÈké

s Smifff*
emsomn

Sm ss

M m  Matti Ca. 
888 E. Mata

Stftom

Mnñnikm
4M 9 dt» 
S S C m M  Ih i

smsomi
h r ß S f m

4 P H 9 Ì

é i a i
O m w  1  O d h i i  8

m i
f m C m i S m i S f i

StfMéStSm

s is n s M
Ihiir im Utf 

hr.

CaB Vioi lital

tm iu m ir  
» 4

Hmt Itm!



District Meet Is Won By Eastland
The Eastland Public 

Schools won all divisions of 
the annual District 9-AA 
track and field meet at the 
Cisco High School facility 
last Wednesday. Some 400 
athletes were m Cisco to par­
ticipate in the district meet.

Results in the varsity, 
junior varsity, 8th grade and 
7th grade divisions were an­
nounced by Director John 
Parchman as follows . 

VARSITY
Discus: 1. Gooch, Hawley;

2. K vap il, W inters; 3. 
Maniré, Cisco; 4. Munns, 
Baird; 5. Stamey, Jim Ned; 
and 6. Fain, Jim Ned.

Shot Put: 1. Gooch, 
Hawley; 2. Munns, Baird; 3. 
.Maniré, Cisco; 4 Rains, 
Cisco; 5. Elliott, Eastland; 
and 6. Seaboum, Cisco.

High Jump 1 Howard. 
Baird; 2. Jes.sup, (Usco; and
3. Joiner, Ka.stland.

400 M Relay: 1 Eastland;
2. Cisco; 3. .Anson; 4 Jim 
Nt-d, 5 Baird. S Winters; 
and 7. Albany.

110 Hurdles 1. Jack.son. 
Eastland, 2 Mays, .Anson; 3. 
Cooper. Albany; 4 Harris, 
Baird; 5. Gonzales, Aason. 
and 6 Hood, Winters 

:I200 M Run. 1 Grafton, 
Plastland : 2. Salas, An.son; 3. 
Cerda, Baird. 4 Patterson. 
Albany , 5 Allen, Ci.si-o, and 
6 Bentancur, Jim Ned

Pole Vault: 1. Tankersley, 
Jim Ned; 2. Ivy, Albany; 3. 
Phelps, Eastland; 4. 
Graham, Baird; and 5. 
Perry, Cisco.

Long Jump: 1. Kent 
Billups, Winters; 2. Tutt, 
Jun Ned; 3. Ivy, Albany; 4. 
W right, Eastland; 5. 
Howard, Baird; and 6. Hud­
son, Jim Ned.

800 M. Run: 1. Turnbow, 
Baird; 2. Baker, Winters; 3. 
Bentancure, Jim Ned; 4 
W irsdorfer, Albany; 5 
Cooley, Hawley; and 6 
Rodriquez. Anson.

100 M Dash 1. Perry, 
Cisco; 2. Goven, Eastland; 3. 
Tuerk, Baird; 4. Jackson. 
Eastland; 5. Hendricks, 
Cisco; and 6. Ramos, Anson 

400 .M Dash 1. Garcia, 
Anson: 2 Wright. Eastland;
3. Tollerson, Anson; 4 
Tankersley, Jim Ned; 5. 
Joiner, Ea.stland, and 6 
Wirsdorfer, Albany 

200 M Dash 1. Perry, 
Cisco; 2. Tuerk, Baird; 3. 
Govan, Eastland; 4 
Villanueva, Anson; 5. Tutt. 
Jim Ned, and 6. Hogan, 
Cisco

1600 M Relay, 1. An.son. 2, 
Eastland, 3 Winters, 4 
Baird, 5. Jim Ned, and 6. 
Hawley

300 Int. Hurdles: 1. .Mays, 
An.son, 2. Ivy, .Albany; 3 
.Sherman. Ci.sco; 4 Guevara

Tile Osco Prest Sunday, 
April 22, 1984

Winters; 5. Graham, Baird; 
and 6. Harris, Baird.

1600 M. Run . 1. Crafton, 
Eastland; 2. Certa, Baird; 3. 
Salas, Anson; 4. Kvapil, 
Winters, 5. Bentancur, Jim 
Ned; and 6. Sosa, Anson.

Team Totals: Eastland. 
112; Anson, 89; Baird. 85; 
Cisco, 74; Jim Ned and 
Winters, 49 (tie); Albany, 
37; and Hawley, 24.

JUNIOR VARSITY
Shot Put: 1. Rattan, 

Eastland; 2. Price, Baird; 3. 
Higgins, Baird; 4. Svhmidt, 
Hawley; 5. Insal, Jim Ned; 
and 6. Garcia. Jr., Anson.

3200 M Run 1. Clever, 
Jim Ned; 2. G rafton , 
Eastland; 3. Gonzales, 
Baird; 4 Jiminez, Anson; 5. 
Wade, A lbany; and 6 
Seabourn, Eastland.

High Jump: 1. Sullivan, 
Hawley ; 2. Ramos, Anson; 3. 
Sanders, Eastland; 4. Petty, 
Ea.stland; 5. Gray, Jim Ned; 
and 6 Soliz, Anson 

400 M Relay: 1 .Anson, 2. 
Cisco, 3. Baird, 4. Hawley, 
and 5. Jim Ned.

110 M Hurdles, 1. Sedillo, 
Eastland; 2. Petty , 
F'astland; 3. Foster. Jim 
Ned; 4 Parker, P'astland; 5. 
Pate. Baird; and 6. Petree, 
CLsi'o.

Pole Vault: 1. Griggs, An­
son; 2. Middlebrook, Anson; 
and 3. Brown, Eastland.

Ixmg Jump: 1. Sanders, 
Eastland; 2. Green, Baird; 
3. Washington, Eastland; 4. 
Kearney. Cisc"o; 5. Garcia, 
An.son- and 6. Gonzales,

YOU NEED A TV CABLE CONNEaiON 
• for complete felevitioii enjoyment 

★  ★  ★
¡Southern Television Systems Corpi

ServNif Gsco, E i t l i d, Rongcr 
Cali us for complete mformotion

 ̂ Mory Kay Cosmetics
é -

i
^ 0

V-

Now available la Cisco. For a private, 
compllmeotary facial or reorder call

V i i f i e  G r e f «

Profeiiiend Beoifty ConsiiHoiit 
442-3460 ^

DAVIS UPHOLSHRY
REI EttkMtM (local)

21 Tears Experience 
Foctory Trained

Owners A Operators 
610 W. 2nd TC ckerles A See Dnvb

Charies & Sue Davis 
4 4 2 4 7 1 2  TC

HARGRAVE INSURANCE 

AGENCY
1106 Ave. D 
Gsco, Tex

Personal Soles A Service For 
NOME Insurance

-  Car Insuronce
-  Commerciol Business Insurance
-  Mobile Home Insuronce A Travel TroRers
-  Boot Insuronce 
^ life Ittsurence
^  Bonds Of All Kinds

SkiHey A. Horgrove 
442-1477 Or 44M059

Cisco.
Discus; 1. Rattan, 

Eastland; 2. Clark, 
Eastland; 3. Higgins, Baird;
4. Insal, Jim Ned; 5. Price, 
Baird; and 6. Reeves, 
Eastland.

800 M. Run; 1. Marr, 
H aw ley; 2. G arrett, 
Eastland; 3. Anderson, Jim 
Ned; 4. Housson, Eastland;
5. Simmons, Eastland; and 
6 Abbott, Cisco.

100 M. r ash: 1. Davis, Jim 
Ned; 2. Sanders. Eastland: 
3. Sullivan, Hawley: 4. 
Griggs, Anson; 5. Payne, 
Eastland; and 6. Green, 
Baird.

300 Int. Hurdles: 1 Sedillo, 
Eastland; 2. Martin, Baird;
3. Pryor, Anson; 4. Petty, 
Eastland; 5. Foster, Jim 
Ned; and 6 Phillips, Anson.

200 M. Dash: 1. Garcia, 
Anson; 2. Kearney, Cisco; 3. 
Sanders, Eastland; 4. Berry, 
Cisco; 5. Payne, Eastland; 
and 6. l.ewis, Eastland.

1600 Meter R e la y  1. 
Eastland, 2. Anson, 3. Baird.
4. Cisco. 5. Hawley, and 6. 
Jim Ned

400 M. Dash: 1. Rattan, 
Eastland; 2. Kanady, Baird; 
3. Barry, Eastland; 4. Bar­
ron, Anson. 5. Soliz, Anson; 
and 6. Webb. Eastland.

1600 M. Run: 1. Guver, 
Jim Ned; 2. G rafton , 
Eastland; 3. Gonzales, 
Baird; 4. Mata, Anson; 5. 
Jiminez, Anson; and 6. 
Wade, Albany.

Team Totals: Eastland, 
183; Anson, 103; Baird, 85; 
Jin Ned. 59; Cisco, 43;

COME GET ACQUAINTED! 
D.6.'t INCREDIBU EDIBLES

at G ty Drug

LUNCH: Mob. Odekeo FYted Stk., Staffed PotatMs 
Toes. Pasta
Wed. Homemade Soap or Stew 
Thors. Mexkaa Food 
Frt. Chickeo
Homemade Clan. Rolls, Cakes, Cookies k Pies Made Dai­
ly-
For Bakery Ordara, CaU 4«t-UU or 44X-SU7
Toes. Happy Hour 2:30-3:30 All Drinks 4  price with $1
Food Purch.

Remodel - Repair 
Tile - Plumbing 

Elertriritv - Additions
CaU Richard 4 4 2 -4 7 9 1  P-36

City Glass
I l l s .  Mulberry 

629-3177

WintUhieUh  ̂tabletttps, windowgla»», 

mirrors^ heavy equipment,

Htore front», shower doors & 

re screen screens.

Hawley, 42; and Albany, 3. 
tth GRADE

Long Jump: L Fletcher, 
Anson; 2. Collins, Eastland;
3. Gonzales, Anson; 4. Hise, 
Albany; 5. Garcia, Albany: 
and 6. Duncan, Baird.

Shot Put; L Livingston. 
Eastland; 2. Rasor, Anson;
3. Hise. Albany; 4. Rains, 
Cisco: 5. Ritter, Eastland; 
and 6. Snapp, Eastland.

Pole Vault: 1. Gray. An­
son; 2. Mannke, Eastland; 3. 
Sharp, Eastland; 4. Watson. 
Winters; 5. Rich, Winters: 6. 
Garcia, Winters.

800 M. Run: 1. Roe, 
Hawley; 2. Gray, Anson; 3. 
C hristie , Eastland; 4. 
Bowles, Eastland; 5. Mon­
tgomery, Jim Ned; and 6. 
Hood, Winters.

100 M. Dash: 1. Wagnon, 
Cisco; 2. Maley, Jim Ned; 3. 
Gonzales. Anson; 4. Ramos. 
Anson; 5. Lee. Winters; and
6. Hise, Albany.

High Jump: 1. McGinness, 
Cisco; 2. Poehls, Winters; 3. 
Fletcher, Anson; 4. Jeffcoat. 
Cisco; 5. Dacus, Jim Ned; 
and 6. Wagnor, Cisco.

Discus: 1. G arcia ,
W inters; 2. R itte r , 3. 
Alvarez, Anson, 4. Rains. 
Cisco; 5. Collins, Eastland; 
and 6. Berry, Cisco.

400 M. Relay; 1. Albany, 2. 
Cisco, 3. Anson, 4. Jim Ned,
5. Eastland, and 6. Hawley.

110 Meter Hurdels. 1. 
Odom, Eastland; 2. Starr, 
Eastland; 3. Dacus, Jim 
Ned; 4. Torres, Anson; 5. 
Watson, winters; and 6. 
Shelton, Albany.

400 M. Dash: 1. Garcia, 
Albany; 2. Wilson, Eastland; 
3. Poehls, Winters: 4. Roa, 
Hawley,; 5. Jiminez, Anson; 
and 6. Pope. Jim Ned.

300 Int. Hurdels: 1. Dun­
can, Baird; 2. Woody, Cisco; 
3. Starr, Elastland; 4. Odom, 
Eastland ; 5. Campos, 
Hawley; and 6. Dacus, Jim 
Ned.

1600 M. Run: 1. Bowles, 
Eastland: 2. Rosa. Albany; 
C hristie , E astland : 4. 
Ix)zano, Anson; 5. Campos, 
H aw ley ; and 6. Mon­
tgomery, Jim Ned.

200 M. Dash: 1. Fletcher, 
Anson; 2. Collins, Eastland;

■ 3. McGinness. Cisco; 4. 
Rose, Jim Ned; 5. Gonzales, 
Anson; and 6. Hise, Albany.

1600 M. Relay: 1. Anson, 2. 
Jim Ned, 3. Eastland, 4. 
Albany, 5. Cisco, and 6. 
Winters.

Team Totals: Eastland, 
131; Anson, 118; Cisco, 674 
Albany, 61; Jim Ned, 494 
Winters, 38; Hawley, 20 
Baird, 11.

7Ui GRADE
High Jump: 1. Roe, Jim 

Ned; 2. Nelson, Jim Ned; 3. 
Cortez, Winters; 4. Scott, An­
son; 5. corn, Baird; and 6. 
James, Eastland.

Shot Put: 1. Bonilla; 2. 
Strickland, Eastland; 3. Nor­
man, Anson; 4. Barnett, 
Winters; 5. Morrison, Baird; 
and 6. Carillio, Winters.

Long Jump: 1. Sharp, 
Elastland; 2. Goundie, Jim 
Ned; 3. Rattan, Eastland; 4. 
Ysa, W inters: 5. Corn, 
B a ird ; and 6. Cortez, 
Winters.

800 M. Run: 1. Lujano, 
Eastland; 2. Shaw, Cisco; 3.

I’’

FARM BUREAU INSURANCE CO S
PtBSO N ALiZEO  SERVICE

DEE WILSON
AGENT

ncrm cM EN T p l a n s PO SOV 4«)
l i f e  l ia s i l i t v E a S K A N D  TEXAS ^«448
AUTO h e a l t h Oflica 817/629 1704
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Now OPEN SUNDAY 1-5

In Our Flower Shop...
AZALEAS

.9 9  ( ' l l ”  Dreoaed)
• 9

Hydrangeas 

SUk Flowers

ALSO
Mums

Custom Arrangements

In Our Gardpn Center...
St. Augustine Grass Bulbs

Roses Bedding Plants

Lilies Landscape Asaleas HoUy

Indian Hawthorn Pyraentha
Boxwood Wax Leaf Euonymus

Fruit Tree* Shade Trees

THE POTTING SHED
Garden Center Flower Shop 

1502 Park Drive 442-1249 Cisco 
Hours: 8 a.m. - 6  p.m. Mon. - Sat.

Campos, H aw ley ; 4. 
Williamson, Eastland; 5. 
Young, Cisco: and 6. Wort- 
man, Eastland.

100 M. Dash; 1. Rattan, 
Eastland; 2. Roe, Jim Ned; 
3. Reyna. Winters; 4. Rodri­
quez, Albany; 5. Ramos, An­
son; and 6. Norman, Anson.

D iscus: 1. Bon illa, 
E astland ; 2. Reves, 
Winters: 3. Ysa, Winters; 4. 
Baladez, Anson; 5. Nelson, 
Jim Ned: and 6. Miller, 
Eastland.

Pole Vault; 1. Scott, An­
son; 2. Smith, Winters; and 
3. Wilson. Cisco.

400 M. Relay: 1. Eastland.
2. Winters. 3. Anson, 4. Jim 
Ned. 5. Cisco, and 6. Albany.

110 M. Hurdles: .. Scott. 
An.son; 2. Walker, Eastland; 
1. Simpson. Anson; 4. Atkin­
son, Eastland; 5. Cortez. 
Winters; and 6. Wilson. 
Cisco.

400 M. Dash: 1. Sharp. 
Eastland: 2. Rives. Winters;
3. Rodriquez, Albany; 4. 
Kleiner. Eastland; 5. Bur­
ton, Cisco; and 6. Baladez, 
Anson.

.100 Int. Hurdles: 1. Scott, 
Anson; 2. Atlinson, 
Eastland; 3. Del A. Cruz; 4. 
Tollctt, Cisco; 5. Walker, 
Eastland; and 6. Sanchez, 
Winters.

1600 M. Run: 1. Rodriquez, 
Anson, 2. Shaw, Cisco: 3. 
Foster, Winters; 4. Certa, 
Baird; 5. W ortm an, 
Ea.slland: and 6. Melder, 
Eastland.

200 M. Dash; 1. Ixizano, 
Anson; 2. Rattan, Eastland; 
3. Ysa, Winters; 4. Marshall, 
Eastland; 5. Parviri, Jim 
Ned: and 6. Flores, Cisco.

1600 M. Relay: 1. Anson, 2. 
Eastland. 3. Winters, 4. Jim 
Ned, 5. Cisco, and 6. Albany.

Team Totals: Eastland. 
1574; Anson, 107; Winters, 
100; Jim Ned, 544; Cisco, 
40; Albany, 14; Baird, 10; 
and Hawley, 6.

T h *  BoarJ o f Regents

o f

C isco  Jun ior C o lle g e  

requests tlie Konour o f your presence 

at tke D edication  Cerem onies 

for

Rudolpfi Scfiaefer H « H

Saturday afternoon, tfic twenty-eigfitli o f A p r i l  

nineteen hundred and eig fity»four 

at two o ’ clock 

C isco  Junior C o lle g e  

C isco , Texas

Reception follow ing

In M a  ner M e m o r ia l L ib ra ry

e je  Dedication
Is Set April 28

The public has been in­
vited to attend dedication 
ceremonies for Rudolph 
Schaefer Hall at 2 p.m. 
Saturday, April 28, at Cisco 
Junior College.

The occasion will be the 
naming of a building for Mr. 
Schaefer, member of the 
board of regents since 1960. 
He was recently reelected 
for a new six-year term of of-

fice.
Dr. Norman Wallace, col­

lege president, will serve as 
master of ceremonies for the 
event. The program will in­
clude music by the In­
termediate School Choir and 
a solo by Wyley Peebles, 
head of the music depart­
ment at the college.

A reception will follow in 
Maner Memorial Library.

When Our Ti’ees  ̂
Go Down In Flames, 

Our Dollars Go 
Up In Smoke.

Second Grade Students Present 

‘Springtime Frolic’ Program  Thurs.
Second grade students of 

Rhonda Walker and Betty 
Odom presented a program 
“ Springtime Frolic”  before 
school was dismissed Thurs­
day for the Easter Holidays.

Announcer for the pro­
gram was Mike Reynolds.

The poem “ Easter Time" 
was recited by Tony Muncy, 
John Gaeta, Jared Jones, 
Veronica Martinez, and 
Stacey Watson.

“ little  Birds”  was recited 
by Shala Hitt, Patricia Tira, 
Juan Garza, Reagan Pence, 
Stacey Wheeler, and Mike 
Harrison.

“ All The little Ducklings”  
was recited by Lucinda Har­

ris, Dennis Hutt, Jeff Me- 
Gintock, Daniel Bray, Mike 
Speegle, Sonny James, and 
Jeff McCoy.

A play, “ Professor Long 
Ears Saves the Day,”  was 
presented. The cast was as 
follows: F lu ffer, Annie 
Wright; Jack Rabbit, Linda 
Martin; Cherry Chickadee, 
Katie Keyes; Cuthbert Tur­
tle, David Williams; Hop-A- 
Long F rog , Mandi 
Senterfett; and Professor 
liOng Ears, Matt Schaeffer.

The entire group sang 
“ The Bunny Clock Song.”

Instruments were played 
by Connie Weiser and Becky 
Elliott.

The dance. “ Bunny Hop,”  
was by the Bunny Dancers, 
C arrie  L iv in gston , Ty 
Roberts, Carrie Wilkerson, 
Carrie Conger, Walt Tollett, 
Tony Housh, Jenn ifer 
Autrey, and Stacy Boersma.

Mrs. Walker and Mrs. 
Odom said the students had 
worked very hard on the pro­
gram and they were proud of 
their performance.

The program  was 
presented to the other 
students of Primary School, 
teachers and parents.

CLASSinED ADS 
GET RESULTS
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i



in

».
rs,
ry
}n,
itt.
er
la.
rs.
ad
ro-
lof

as
ler
lOl,

Oil Facts
A 4,000-ft. developmental 

well is planned by Investek, 
Inc. of Wichita Falls at a 
drillsite 11 miles southeast of 
Breckenridge. The location 
is in a 100-acre lease in the 
T&PRR Survey. W elt’ s 
designation is the No. 5 D. 
Sikes “ F ” . It is in the Sikes 
Field.

McBride Oil Co. of Wichita 
Falls has filed for permit to 
drill the No. 3 A Fambro 
“ A A ” , a 2,350-ft. 
developmental well 11 miles 
southeast of Breckenridge 
Ix)cation is in an 80-acre 
lease in the Stephens 
Regular Field , T&PRR 
Survey.

Eastland Youth Is One Of 43 Band Members

H-SU Cowboy Band Will 
Travel Overseas May 8-24

R idge Oil Co. of 
Breckenridge has revealed 
plans to drill a 3,300-ft. 
developmental well in the 
Stephens Regular Field. The 
operator has 20 acres leased, 
with drillsite in the lunatic 
Asylum I.and survey and has 
designated the venture as 
the No. 1 T.A.B. et al. Ix)ca-

The Hardin-Simmons 
University Cowboy band will 
travel overseas for the first 
time in 21 years. May 8-24, 
taking both religious and 
secular music to four coun­
ties in Europe with a Baptist 
eveangelistic emphasis.

Vance O’ Brien, senior 
(trombone) of Eastland, son 
of Mr. and Mrs. H.V. 
O’Brien, 1201 S. Seaman, 
F'astland, will be one of 43 
members of the band who 
will be traveling to Europe, 
directed by Bill Woods, im­
mediate past president of the 
5,000 member Texas Music 
Educators Association . 
Bandsmen w ill leave 
Dallas/Ft. Worth Airport, 
Tuesday, May 8 at 5:25 p.m. 
and leave Frankfurt on May 
24, arriving back at DFW at 
3:25 p.m. on May 24.

Porgram s w ill be 
presented in Ix>ndon on My 
10-11; Paris, France, May 
12-13; D ijon, May 16; 
Lucerne, Switzerland, May 
18; Strasbourg, France May 
20; Cologne, Germany, May 
20-21; Rhine Marine Air 
Force Base and Wiesade, 
Germany, May 22-23.

Sponsors of the trip in­
clude the Men’s Department 
o f th Baptist World 
Allicance; the HSU Cowboy 
Band Foundation; and HSU. 
Band members will be pro­
viding $250 each to help 
finance the trip.

A concert fetu ring 
Maynard Ferguson, interna­
tional jazz artist, will be held 
on May 3, at HSU Behrens

Chapel to help raise funds to 
finance the trip also.

A man instrumental in the 
band’s last overseas trip in 
1963 to Japan as a part of the 
“ New l i fe  Movement’ ’ is Dr. 
W.H. (Dub) Jackson, Jr., 
Fort Worth, a form er 
Southern Baptist missionary 
and Cowboy Band ex who is 
now director of the Men’s 
Department of the BWA.

Director Bill Woods said 
that intensive rehearsals 
have been underway for both 
religious and secular music 
that will one of the main 
features of the dedication of 
the British Rail Inaugura­
tion program at Gatwick 
Airport, Ix)ndon.

“ The band is looking for­
ward to giving is music 
testimony," said Woods.

Dr. Jessee C. Fletcher, 
HSU president, expressed 
pleasure that the bandsmen 
will be making the trip and 
said, “ I am pleasured that 
the Cowboy Band Founda­
tion, the young men who 
make up the band and thier 
parents, several friends of 
the University, and in- 

. dividual churches as well as 
HSU are making it financial­
ly possible for the band to 
make the overseas trip."

Fletcher said that Dr. 
Rufus Spraberry, director of 
church relations for HSU, 
will travel with the band­
smen and speak in several 
churches. Mrs. Spraberry 
will also be a part of the 
traveling party.

Others who will be accom-

panying the the trip in ad- 
diton to Woods and his wife 
are: Dr. and Mrs. Wesley 
Coffman (he’s dean of the 
HSU ) School of Music ), their 
daughter, Becky; I,awson 
hager, former director of the 
Cowboy Band and now a 
member of the School of 
Mu.sic faculty, who will be a 
part of the band; and 
Charles Richardson, direc­
tor of news for HSU. Coff­
man w ill be the ad­
ministrative officer on the 
trip. Dr. Fletcher reported.

tion from the nearest town 
was not available.

A Houston-ba.sed operator 
has staked location for the 
No. 64 Walker-Caldwell, a 
developmental well to be 
located two miles east of 
Breckenridge. With pro­
jected total depth of 3,150 
feet, the well is in a 
2,713-acre lease in the 
Stephens Regular Field, 
T& PR R  Survey. The 
operator is Damson Oil 
Corp.

★ A  L A W  W K  
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Texas Department of Public Safety

€XP€RT
GROOMING* BflTHINO

D O G S-ñLLBR6€D S
Specializing in Poodles

Goldei? ®c8tipyr

West HightMoy 80 
Open Mon. - Fri. 9 - 5 

6 2 9 -8 4 9 2  6 2 9 -8 1 9 4

Operated By: 
Lorraine Lester

TC

HOSPITAL REPORT
E a s t la n d

^*emorial Hospital
Cynthia I.angseth
Ralph Cozart
Viola Webb
Viola Phillips
R.V. I.ewis
Gary Studdard
Jim Baird
Susan M. Spruill
I,enorah Alford
Mary Bernice Johnson
W.R. Collins
Virgie Jarrett
Ruth Reeves
Juanita Roberson
Weldon Carroll
Paul Hughes
Avis Miller
Medford Ella
Edward James
Mozelle Martin
Mary Collins
Ola G. Beasley
Neta Fay Parson
(Mrs.) Clyde Armstrong
Alpha Mae Andry
Dicy Spink
Jason Maddox

Oma Underwood 
Pansy I.awrence 
Wiley Cain

G r a h a m
Memorial Hospital

Patients in E.L. Graham 
Memorial Hospital were 
listed as follows:

Oletta Huffman 
Hattie Nix 
Mary Smith 
Siron L. Cook 
Annie Parks 
Vina Blackburn 
Howard Brooks 
Porter Nunley 
Bessie Elam.

R a n g e r
General HMpital

Patients in Ranger General 
Hospital were:
Geneva Thurman 
Earl Ivy 
Sabas Martinez 
Ruby Weekes

PRESCHOOL
DEVELOPMENTAL

SCREENING
for

3, 4, & 5 Year Olds

Educational Bldg. 
First Christian Church 

215 S. Lamar 
Eastland, Texas

A pril 2 5 ,1 9 8 4
9:30 AM -  3:30 PM

Sponsored by Region 14 Education Service Center 
and East End Co-op

T33
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An.ual Contest 
Sat., Apr. 28

The Microplex Photo Club 
will hold their Annual Photo 
Contest at the Best Western 
Confernece Room in the 
Treetop level on 1-20 in 
Eastland. ’The contest will be 
Saturday, April 28.

Entries should be brought 
to the Best Western between 
2:00 and 4:30 on Saturday, 
April 28. I

Entry fee is $1 per print or
slide with no number of en­
tries.

For more information call 
Marti Mitchell at 629-2887, 
Ron Mouser at 4424775, or 
Mildred Raney at 629-2798.

M vouVr shopping for corpol
J & D Carpets *29.w2

UcafwT h P9fw fcidvsfrfid M i Eostiond 629-8401

Lights From The 
Christian World

by
Josophino C levo land

The noblest organ of the 
body is the eye. The eye 
guides us, shows us dangers 
to avoid; indicates paths of 
safety; helds us move about 
in our world. Our eyes are 
the miraculous lamps by 
which we are able to know 
more fully our loved ones, 
our friends, our fellow 
human beings.

Have you noticed that 
some are always looking far, 
far ahead of where they are 
for the joys of life? Greener 
pastures are fa r  out 
somewhere else. A man in a 
rural state owned a little 
farm where he lived happily 
with his wife and children. 
He was told that there were

some wonderful diamonds in 
a distant land. He sold his 
farm, left his family and set 
out to seek the jewels. On 
and on he wandered, never 
finding the diamonds Final­
ly, far from home he died.

Some time after his death, 
the man who purchased the 
farm found in a little brook a 
large, beautiful diamond.

Friend, where are you 
looking’’ Beauty, happiness, 
are at your door You will 
miss them if you are always 
looking far, far away.

“ Eye hath not seen, nor 
ear heard, neither have 
entered into the heart of 
man, the things which God 
hath prepared for them that 
love him." I Cor. 2:9,

EARN $100-8200 A DAY  
PART-’TOIE

Be the first in your area to offer F R E E  color 
analysis and color coded skin care and glamour 
cosmetics. Call Bobbie Broyles at 915-698-1602 
or 698-1358 to learn more about and complete 
training. Investment required for literature, 
products and complete training.
T34

Baker Care Services
24 Hour Nursing

LVNs - Aids - smart 
Home or Hospital

647-3970
Countywidt • ixperiwieed

Sunday, April 22,1984

We Now Make Custom Area Rugs.

Come In and Make Your 

Color Selections and Designs.

TFWo Hovo Corpot, Vinyl I  THo 
fntUliomtm U  Work Gmrant—d

RE-ELECT 
SHERIFF

( JOHNNIE W. MORREN
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DEDICATED TO SERVING 
THE PEOPLE OF EASTLAND COUNTY

I
I

Since assuming office in 1979 
Sheriff Morren has:
• Reduced the crime rate by 46%
• Recovered over $746,000.00 worth of stolen 

property
• Solved over 70% of the crimes committed 

in Eastland County

I
I
I

These accomplishments alone would be enough to re-elect Sheriff Morren. However, 
in addition to the dedication and success he has achieved while holding the office of sheriff 
of Eastland County, Johnnie Morren has also been awarded the Outstanding Lawman 
of the Year Award by the Veterans of Foreign Wars. He was also awarded the Outstand­
ing Lawman of the Year Award by the Eastland Newspapers in 1978, and the Golden Deeds 
Award in 1977 by the Eastland Chamber of Commerce. Sheriff Morren also received the 
Outstanding Leadership Award from the Eastland County Law Enforcement Association 
in 1976, and the Distinguished Service Award from the Eastland Independent School District 
from 1972 to 1978.

SH ERIFF JOHNNIE MORREN. HIS RECORD SPEA KS FOR IT SELF.
fé  Fol. Adv , Johnni« W Mo7 mÏÏÏ\â ^S  
1204 S’ Soamen. Feitiond. Toioi

I

*Most Trusted Name BEIL DRAPERIE! In Interior Design^

1706 W. Commerce

CUSTOM
Hwy, 80 West

O A LLE R Y
SHOWROOM

Eastland 629-1319

B A C|IIIO O M
No Cost! No Obliga­
tion!
For Our V isit To Your 
Home or Office To 
Discuss Interior Treat­
ment, Fab ric, Color, 
Style and Give Cost 
Estim ate.
All At Your Conve­
nience,____________________

Come By & V isit The 
Most Beautiful Home- 
D eco r A cce sso ry  
Showroom in the Big 
Country. Imports and 
the Extra  Ordinary at 
Affordable Prices.

Economy and Variety 
with Help Available on 
ColOT Coordinatimi.

Bedspreads Start at 
$20.fX)

Have Refreshm ents 
While You Shop.

N«w Mam« Dally

OPEN SATURDAY -  BY APPOINTMENT
Prepare For Spring Now with New Decor

at BeH's
"We Bring Beautifui Interiors To Ufa

!ou — Cal Now
u
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C om p P rep a red  Lunch & Learn Thurs.
n  M Interested persons are in- be presented by <

Sunday, April 22,1984

Camp Insp iration  in 
hsld a workday 

raceotly to get the camp 
ready for the family and 
church camps which are 
coming up during the spring 
and summer months.

Workers came from Ball­
inger, Port Worth Northside 
and Ridglea. Abilene, Big 
Spring, Ira, Odessa, Dallas, 
and Inspiration.

Repair work included 
painting, roofing, cleaning 
and plumbing to repair 
water pipes damaged during 
last winter’s freete.

11« new Gazebo, which 
had been built at Ira during 
the winter, was moved to 
Camp Inspiration  and 
erected by the people from 
Ira, who also set the bell.

Work was also done on the 
baseball field, and trees 
were trimmed and trash 
hauled off.

It was reported that the 
day was a tremendous suc­
cess with much work done. 
There was more work than 
there was time for, a 
spokesman added. Plans 
have been made by some 
church groups to return to 
help make the camp ready. 
The camp is rented every 
Saturday, beguining May 5.

Plans have been made for 
Family Camp to be held May 
lt-20, with the theme 
“ Family Alive in the Spirit.”  

Registration will begin at 3

p.m. Friday, May 18. Con­
ference leader and speaker 
will be Dr. Ken Tabor. The 
three day conference will 
end following the noon meal 
on Sunday, May 20.

The summer students 
from Gulf Coast Bible Col­
lege are expected to be at the 
camp May 14.

Interested persons are in­
vited to attend the next 
“ lunch and learn" program 
on Thursday, April 26, from 
12 noon to 1 p.m. in the Texas 
Electric Reddy Room in 
Elastland.

The program will be on 
"Pant Construction for the 
Professional Look.”  The 
sewing demonstration will

be presented by Janet 
Thomas, County Extension 
Agent.

The Eastland County Ex­
tension Service sponsors the 
"lunch and learn”  programs 
which are informal and open 
to the public. Those atten­
ding the noon program are 
urged to bring a sack lunch 
and drinks will be furnished.

Sewing Demonstration 
To Be Tues. In Eastland

H o m e m a k i n g  H i n t s
County Extension Agent

The Extension
Homemaker Club leader 
training program will be on 
“ Quick Sewing Techniques 
and Tricks”  for the profes­
sional look. The program 
will be presented by Janet 
Thomas, County Extension 
Agent on Tuesday, April 24 
at 2 p.m. in the Texas Elec­
tr ic  Reddy Room in 
Eastland.

Construction techniques

will be demonstrated which 
will include everything from 
putting a Jacket lining in by 
machine to sewing on but­
tons with your sewing 
machine. The program will 
also include the latest in sew­
ing notions and aids all for 
the quick methods.

Interested persons are in­
vited to attend the program 
which is free.

AI UollNr Bools 
Udos' A M o n ' *  Stylos 

$ 7 | f s  « 9 4 «

Now AvoBoblo M
B & H TradinB Post

311 N. SMimn 
lostlond 629-2885

Janet Thomas
President Ronald Reagan 

has proclaimed April 23-29, 
1984 as National Consumers 
Week We have emerged 
from a recession on a wave 
of consumer optimism that 
dramatically proves the 
truth of this year’s slogan -  
“ Consumers Mean
Business.”

Consumers mean business 
for stores, companies and 
services. They also mean 
business about having their 
complaints and problems 
resolved.

Even in today’s complex 
marketplace, consumers 
should expect quality pro­
ducts and services at fair 
prices. But when something 
goes wrong, you need to let 
the company know about

IpOOOUS a MlSGkOOMING SAION 
IpMCfdkMg m Grooming
Pooéos I  otkor SmoK Broodŝ  

Oä for AppofaitiMiit 
629-1489

H a K y  n u i «
T F

Guaranteed G u a r a n t e e d

Naii Sculpturing
$3500  x-lone 45.00

0 0Caps 15°“ Tips 15
Cindy P- î 442-4914

BIBLES 
& Psalms 

Bible Book Storo
RELIGIOUS BOOKS

• tlBLKS
•  BOOKS
• CHRISTIAN 

MUSIC

•  G IFTS  
•C H U R C H  

SU PPLIES

X

OLD BIBLES RESTORED
CHURCH SCHOOL 

TEACHING AIDS

442-3752 ,<1
116 WEST 8th STREET

your problem. This is the 
fastest way to get your com­
plaint resolved. It also gives 
the company a chance to 
keep your business and gain 
new customers by learning 
from misUkes. Most com­
panies welcome this oppor- 
tumty.

Handling your own com­
plaint is easy if you take the 
following steps:

•Identify the problem and 
what you believe would be a 
fair settlement. Do you want 
your money back? Would 
you like the product 
repaired? Will an exchange 
do?

•Gather documentation 
regarding your complaint 
Sales receip ts, repa ir 
orders, warranties, cancell­
ed checks, or contracts will 
back up your complaint and 
help the company solve your 
problem.

•Go back to where you 
made the purchase. Contact 
the person who sold you the 
item or performed the ser­
vice. Explain the problem 
and what action you would 
like taken. If that person is 
not helpful, ask for the 
supervisor or manager and 
repeat your complaint. A 
large percentage of con­
sumer problems are resolv­
ed at this level. Chances are 
yours will be too.

•Don’t give up, if you are 
not satis fied  with the 
response. If the company 
operates hattonsUy or the ' 
product is a national brand, 
write a letter to the person 
responsible for consumer 
complaints at the company’s 
headquarters.

•After that, contact an in­
dustry dispute program; the 
Better Business Bureau, or a 
local or state government of­
fice. In Texas, contact: State 
Office, David A. Talbot, Jr., 
Assistant Attorney General 
and Chief; Consumer Pro­
tection Division, Office of At­
torney General, P.O. Box 
12548, Capitol Station, 
Austin, Texas 78711 
(telephone: 512/475-3288).

•Finally, contact a trade 
association or agency of the 
Federal government if your 
complaint has not been 
satisfactorily resolved. Your 
last resort is a small claims 
court or private lawyer.

•A free consumer hand­
book containing information 
about complaint resolution 
and names and addresses of 
public and private organiza­
tions may be obtained by 
writing to: HANDB(X)K, 
Consumer In form ation  
Center, Pueblo, Colorado 
81009.

RECIPE FOR

good salad that you are sure 
to enjoy.

CRUNCHY
CAULIF1X)WER SAIj\D
1 medium head 

cauliflower
1 cup sliced radishes
** cup sliced green onion
1 (8 ounce) can sliced 

water chesnuts, drained
*4 cup commercial sour 

cream
cup mayonnaise

2 tablespoons caraway 
seeds

1 (0.37-ounce) package 
buttermilk salad dressing 
mix.

Wash the cauliflower, and 
break in to flowerets. Com­
bine cauliflower and next 3 
ingredients in a medium 
mixing bowl; toss gently. 
Stir together remaining in­
gred ien ts ; pour over 
vegetables, and stir well. 
Spoon into serving bowl; 
cover and chill before serv­
ing. Yield: 6 to 8 servings.

[EasterBonanza
All Nike Athletic ¡^[lOCS

Vs

P re-E aster Sale

'V

Large Group of

Sportswear
&

Dresses
Spring & Summer

V4 O F F

\^tU e4U €î  20 629-2472

40ÇÎ?OFF
©avid & Quetta’»

Iijteretate 20 629-8030
4%̂
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Matching Knit Collars
•Choose a mat'.hing collar to add the 

tinishing-louch »Coordinated to go with 
the lersey stripes and solids •3 '/ j"x1 4"

THE WEEK;
Fresh salads made from 

the garden produce are very 
delicious. If you have an 
abundant supply of radishes 
from your garden, here’s a

Yard 
Save 26% 
Unbleached Muslin
•  100% Cotton »Excellent lor 

home decorating or quilt 
backing »Natural »Machine 
wash and dry »38' Wide 

»Reg 1 27 yard

y

Yard
Seersucker
»65% Forirel* polyester 

35% cotton »Stripes and 
plaids »Spring and summer 
colors »Machine wash and 
dry »45 Wide
Ôftret* isaifademark 

0» F'be» ir»du8tfies »nc 
a$t^S‘diafyO'Ce>ar'ese Ccporaiof'

•mate te*
PAINT H4T4TP 
AND i t l O n i HI It VI I I'lMNI t- TIM INI.

( I  l t d  A ll 
[ f  I4LVAIID
PHI H PI IN II Ht T HU II

Save 23%
Paint Hoop & 
Blotter
•One 7 inch paint hoop and 

blotter tor ball (x>int painting 
•No 1930 »Reg 1 13

8 7 *

3 b 2 ^  Yard 
Knit Jersey 
Stripes and Solids
»50% Polyester. 50% cotton 
•Choose from bold, bright stripes 

and matching solids »Great lor 
the active sportswear look 

• Machine wash and dry 
»60 " Wide

OfCOftATC 4 IMMOIOIN teM

Airtf 
%inO

rrSFORTREL

I Í

Is v ti

Save 19%
Vogart® Ball Point 
Paint Tube
»1 Liquid ounce »Assorted 

colors »Ideal lor decorating 
clothing, labrics. stamped 
goods, leather and all crafts 

•Quick drying, washable 
and dry cleanable 

•Reg 1 07

8 6 *

The Eastland area is beinc considered 
lor the location of a new Lutheran

congregation (ALC).
If you are interested in. 

anyway in this ministry, 
please send your name, 

P y  address and telephone 
number to:

1 .4 3

Eastland Outreach Ministries | 
R t2 B ox l9 8  

Cisco, Tx. 76437 
orCaU

442-3042, 442-1422, 6294224 TSé

Save 1 8°/o  
Stencil Decor * 
Stencil Paints
•Water base »ideal tor hard 

suriace and labnc sienciimg 
•Will not lade or wash out ol 

labnc when set properly 
•Quick d'y concentrated 
»2 Ounce »Reg i 76

1̂ ' . : »  • l i t z i

n ••A *

3 .8 4
Yd.

1% Inch Wtd., Reg 97c

One Inch 
Stencil Brush
•Ideal tor use m stencil 

crafts
2 v « . $ i

For H i

Eeru
Aaaortod 
Widths IRog 7«c 

Save Up To 34% 
Ruffled Cluny Lace
•Ideal for trim on apparel 

and crafts

I Save 00%
Stencil Pillow Kits
•Do stenciling and 
candlewicking in one 
kit »Kit contains die- 
cut acetate stencil, 
two 16x16” squares of] 
100% cotton muslin, 
stencil dye paint, 
quality stencil brush, | 
pattern & complete 
instructions (kit includes 
ruffling, piping & 
candlewick thread 
where applicable)

*R«g. S»M ^

4.97

U S T U N D April 23-25, 1984 I ,  » B p .n »
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Holly Form
Whole 

Grade A

PEPSI &

FRYERS
DR. PEPPER

All Family Graupe

East Highway 80 Eastland 
7 A.M. - 10 P.M. SEVEN DAYS 

Prices Effective Through 
Tuesday, April 24, 1984

lb.
2 Liter

DOUBLE COUPONS 7 DAYS
W E WI LL  D O U B L E  O N L Y  O N E  LIKE C O U P O N ,  A L L  A D D I T I O N A L  LIKE C O U P O N S  WI LL  BE R E D E E M E D  A T  F A C E  V A L U E .  Y O U  M U S T  P U R C H A S E  

P R O D U C T S  IN SIZE S PEC IF IED O N  C O U P O N S .  THIS O F F E R  A P P L I E S  O N L Y  T O  M A N U F A C T U R E R ' S  ( C E N T S  O F F )  C O U P O N S  & E X C L U D E S  (FREE C O U P O N S )  , 
C I G A R E T T E S  O R  T O B A C C O  C O U P O N S  R E F U N D  C E R T I F I C A T E S ,  S UP ER D U P E R  O R  R E T A I L  F O O D S  C O U P O N S ,  C O U P O N  V A L U E  C A N N O T  E X C E E D  V A L U E  O F T H E  ITEM

G O O D  F OR A L I M I T E D  T I M E  O N L Y .

Califomia 

Sweet & Juicy

Good Volue

i;,,

NAVAL
Sliced

i

ORANGES ■mm m m . BACON
■piM

iySww.
5 lb. Bag

I). Pfcg-

„ >  -J-
’ ' -

Contadina •»A.»

'tí-

A Q U A  FRESH TOMATO
ÍTOOTHPASTK

r a ? J s A ü Ç t

á

SAUCE
6 for

8 ox.

16 Piece
BUCKET of

Crispy Golden Brown

FRIED

BAKERY
M#'"

'X...
6 Petite Cinnamon Rolls

\ BORDEN'S Hi
NOVELTIES

CHICKEN
Popsicles, Fudgesicles, 
Niftee & Dreamstick

« S . 12 Pack

Topped with A Creomy Idng

CINNAMON
ROLLS

M .2 8
BUY ONE GETi

ONE

'j>



Green Thum bers Attend Meet
state Rep. Jim Parker told 

more than 120 Green Thumb 
older workers attending a 
meeting in Dublin on March 
29 that the Texas I.«gislature 
is headed for a special ses­
sion probably around June 
11, and would feature some 
heated discussions of tax 
proposals.

Farm ers Union Green 
Thumb employs 1.02Ö per­
sons aged 5Ö and over in 
public service jobs across 
the state. The program is 
funded by the U.S. Dept, of 

‘ Labor through Title V of the 
Older Americans Act.

Mike Moeller, president of 
Texas Farmers Union, told 
the Green Thumbers that 
Fanners Union was very 
proud to have worked with 
the Johnson Administration 
in the mid-60's to create an 
older worker program for 
rural areas.

“ A study by Farmers 
Union showed that younger 
people were leaving rural 
areas and taking jobs along 
with them," Moeller said. 
"Green Thumb was and is an 
attempt to provide work for 
the older people who form

the backbone of rural 
America.”

The fast approaching 
storm season was the focus 
of a presentation by Bob 
Stalnaker, a meterologist 
with the National Weather 
Service, which has continued 
to provide weather alerts 
and information in the face 
of possible budget cuts.

Stalnaker gave some tips 
for surviving severe storms 
and tornadoes:

-Keep windows closed and 
stay away from windows, 
doors, and outside walls. 
Find a place in the interior of 
youi home that has as many 
walls as possible between 
you and the approaching tor­
nado, which normally comes 
from the southwest.

-In public buildings seek 
out designated shelter areas 
and stay on lower floors. 
Leave cars and mobile 
homes, even if anchored, for 
sturdy shelter as soon as the 
tornado alert is issued.

-In open areas, find a 
depression or ditch, lie 
down, and cover your head. 
Most tornado fatalities are

caused by flying debris.
Green Thumbers from 

Cisco attending the meeting 
hosted by the Dublin Senior 
Center were Jo Phillips, An­
nie Rendall, Leora Been, 
Nila Jones, Elsie Notgrass

and Ruth Cartee, Senior 
Center Director, Those at­
tending from Eastland were 
J.O. Ebnore, Ruth Kendrick 
and Viola Dennis. Green 
Thumb Director Diane Par­
rish and Dublin'Mayor Jack 
Pratt also addressed the 
group.

CJC, Community Provide  

Local Nursing Training

Sunday, April 22,1984

W atson Upholstary & D rapts
Rt. 1 Ranger 647-1005

In Bifsinnss In ia s th n d  County
Since 1968

Drapes Noesyboid Upbobteiy
Mhii-IMs Cm ft Ffekap

Cartdas Wood Raffhdaihhig
fteftspreads Lampahadet

Charles &  Hallie Brooks 
Honored On Fiftieth

Now Open
QUALITY T.V. SALES & SERVICE 

Authorized Q uasar Dealer 
► Televisions #  M icrowave Ovens

Full-line Television Repair 
SPECIAL12 ' Quosar; ONLY *69”

H u a ^ a r
603 W. Sodosa“ '  '  P*' 629-8043

Robert Webb, M anager t if
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In honour of their Fiftieth 
Wedding Anniversary, Mr. 
and Mrs. Charles F. Brooks 
of Ranger will be fetted on 
April 21, 1964 from one until 
four in the afternoon, 
poolside at the Best Western 
in Elastland. All friends and 
relatives are invited to at­
tend.

Hosts for the occasion will 
be their sons and daughters, 
Donald and Kay Brooks, of 
Ranger, Texas, Ann Baker 
of Eastland, Texas, E>on and 
Jessie Simmons of Eastland, 
Texas, Rowena Lassiter of 
Ranger, Texas, Lewis and 
Gail Brooks of Round Rock, 
Texas, Junior and Billie 
Justice of Seagoville, Texas, 
Alton and Jackie Young of 
K<

Mr. Brooks retired in 1974 
from Texas Lightweight and 
Aggregate Co of Elastland, 
Texas after 25 years ser­
vice. He also served 2 years 
in World War Two.

Mrs. Brooks, the former 
Hallie 0. Phelps, was a cook 
in restaurants around the 
Elastland County Area and is 
a former seamstress.

Mr. and Mrs. Charles F. 
Brooks reside at 214 Cherry 
Street in Ranger, where they 
have been residents for the 
past several years.

Cisco Junior College’ s 
vocational nursing program 
in Abilene is a prime exam­
ple of how a school and com­
munity can work together to 
provide education and skill­
ed training.

The LVN program, located 
in CJC ’ s fa c ilit ie s  in 
Westgate Shopping Center, 
draws on health care institu­
tions throughout the city to 
allow students to gain 
valuable clinical experience.

After gaining classroom 
experience, the students put 
their knowledge to work at 
West Texas Medical Center, 
Dyess AFB Hospital, the 
Abilene State School, 
Abilene Emergency Medical 
Service, home health agen­
cies, the regional dialysis 
center, the Rehab Center 
and "various other agen­
cies," said director Donna 
Burleson.

The vocational nursing 
program was one of the first 
programs offered at CJC’s 
Abilene campus when it 
opened in 1972 and it has pro­
ved to be one of the most en­
during.

The program began with 
22 students in one class and 
has grown to 55 students in 
two full-time courses. Full­
time courses begin at the end 
of February and the end of 
August.

The school also offers a 
part-tim e program . 
Registration for the next 
part-time session begins 
April 30. Classes also start 
on that date.

Classes in the full-time 
program are held Monday 
through Friday each week 
for the equivalent of 12 mmi- 
ths. Part-time classes are 
held in the evening for 19 
months.

After completing the pro­
gram, students are awarded
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To mak0 your shopping iprtt tht 
bsW ever
BtauiifuUy appomttd room 
ovtriookmg an atnum 
Luxurious suites ¡Prices on request/ 
Indoor swimming
Children 's wading pool
iim,

10
II

12
13

14

'ine-hok putting green 
7. SkufPaboard 
9. Ping pong and pool tables 
9- Oame Room with exciting video 

games
Exercise Room
Take off that extra pourui or just 
relax in our sauna 
Relaxing whirlpool 
The Library with rich paneling and 
stained glaise windows, fantastic 
seafood, fine cuts of beef, and flambe 
cooking
Sidewalk Cafe Priday night chicken 
fned steak and fried chicken buffet 
for only S4.95 per person 
Saturday night Sidewalk Cafe 
Mexican buffet with live manachi 
band only $6 95 per person 

16. Kiva Club-A great fun spot ¡in 
.Wichita Palls a private chib with 
memberships available/
Enjoy oysters on the half shell and 
shrimp on ice Saturday nights only in 
the Kiva Club ¡in Wichita Palls a 
private ckib with membershgis 
available/
Bn/oy our woodbuming fireplace 
Shop m our unique gift shop 
People watch from one of our decks 
Enjoy watching your smalt children 
play m their special play area

15

17

18.
19.
20. 
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All The Above 
For Only

«45
per night

FunUy room me. Fnday. SMardey md Sundiy 
nifhu only Cai SI7 TWaoOO Wclkita Palla or 
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Texas, Dwayne and 
Cathreen Bullock of 
Elastland, Texas, and Arrie 
Jane Brooks of Ranger, 
Texas.

Also helping host the occa­
sion with be their grand­
ch ildren  and g rea t­
grandchildren.

Mr. and Mrs. Brooks were 
married on April 22, 1934 in 
Aspermont, Texas.

A -1 M obile H om es
A -l i»No, 1 
New or Uaed 

We Take 
Trade-Ins.

f  '

Ask for 
Jim Sayre

N .lO th -  
Winten Freeway 
Look for the Sign

1050 N.Oack 915-695-3270 T35

RANGER JUNIOR COLLEGE 
presents Neil Simon's:

a certificate of completion, 
Mrs. Burleson said. Then 
they must pass the state 
licensing exam in order to 
become a licen*vd voca­
tional nurse.

To enroll in the LVN 
course, a student must have 
a high school diploma or 
equivalent. Prospective 
students must also pass a 
pre-entrance exam at CJC.

Ms. Burleson, who ha.< 
been director since the pro 
gram began, said most of thi 
students are female bui 
“ sometimes we have a fairly 
large number of males."

Students range in age from 
those a few years out of high 
school to older persons. One 
woman who recently finish­
ed the course was 65 years of 
age, Mrs. Burleson said.

Mrs. Burleson said that 
she believes “ there will 
always be a need”  for LVNs, 
although some health care 
professionals predict voca­
tional nursing will someday 
be phased out.

Vocational nursing pro­
vides one of the “ most 
econom ical”  means of 
health care.

Currently six instructors 
including Ms. Burleson 
teach courses at CJC. Ms. 
Burleson, who is from Iowa 
o r ig in a lly , re ce ived  a 
bachelor’ s degree from 
Angelo State University. She 
also is a graduate of a 
diploma nursing program 
and is a registered nurse.

t h e ; PO T T IN G  SHED
442-4249 1502 Park D r.- Ciac«

GraanhouM 
Traat ft Shrubs 

Badding Plants
Open 8 a.rn. - 6 p.m, Mon.-Sot,

Garden Center 

Gift Plants 

Hanging Baskets

K4

Sanring Iha Fort Worth

WHh A FmIU pio 
Off OMoM Chonieoli

P.O.Box 132 Strawn,Tx. 76475
8 1 7 /6 7 2 -5 3 1 9

Yards In Stiswn, Midland« aed JMf Laka

COMPLETE AUTO 
SERVICE

...qualified mechanic on 
duty
...Transmission repair 
...air conditioner ser­
vice
...Lubrication-polish-G- 
ulf tires
...Tire Distributor 
ROAD S E R V IC E  
PICKUP ft DELIVERY 
Int. 20 at Carbon Hwy. 

«29-8894
R U B E N ’ S IN ­
TERSTATE GULF TC

FARM EQUH’MENT - FURNITURE  
A U C T I O N

THURS., APR IL 2« - 1:3« P.M.
Lester Reed Farm

From Rising Star follow Hwy. 36 East for 3^ miles to 
Farm.
Due to ill health Mr. ft Mrs. Reed are moving & will sell the 
following by Public Auction.

EQUn>MENT
G-VI M«IIm  LP Cm  Tracts (UaBw to &4M) w/cab, doal byd., ritra gaad (as 
1 M-li M* Jeka Deere Hay BaBer; Mallae 14 IL Taadcm; MeUae M-M Grato 
Drill »/Mg galvaalied bax 4 lealed beartage; Jaba Deere Medel tt idf- 
grapeUed Cewbtoe w/14ft. beadcr; Jaba Deere U dlik Oae-Way; M It ilagk 
axle Stock TraBcr Traaer; trailer iMaalcd gartabic Welder «I eyi. WUreaato 
eaftoe; Gchl partahle grladrrmlirr (gaad); byd. cyliader w/beeee; IN gal 
grigaat taak; IN gal lael atorage taak aa itaad; PU bed trailer; W Feed eta- 
ltoaaragaao/gaadMaMtorairaaa(aeedialherregalra|; lew aotoaiallr bag 
walerere; ago. Haiedileelgaeto;lg.lgttx Shi. welded wire beg gaaelli; gige 
rack lar LWB PU; 4M lb. ereeg leader aa wbecia; IN lb. baby pig lee^ ; 
H tN  lb. raaad beg leaden; aeed barb wire; whedbarrew; prapaae filler bear; 
wire raefcx; t-W ft aew S la. rbaaael Iraa; aeed n  It awalag ter mobile heme; 
•bag baill rear rack far aietor kaam; I barrel hay rack feeden; U-f It eteel 
tal'e.

FURNJTURE
Calertc M la. gae raage (Bear aewt; elder GErcIrIg.; older gaeraage; Sgaaleb 
aak t gc. vtayl Uvtog roam ealte; Early Amerkaa brawa plaid eala; Ig. blax- 
Ivac wet ar tUy vacuum dcaaer; loldlag table; mlxc. chain; gHaret; H bed; 
ktod ilie bed w/matt, igrtoge, trame 4 gadded beadbaard; healer; wall mir- 
rar; gae meat emekrr; backet ear ical; W sacke el raiUag plaeler 4 filler; 110 
valt relrig. a/c; late tí aUic.

CONSIGNMENTS OF FARM ITEMS WELCOME! 
Henry R. Storey 

ft
> .  ..  Associates

Brownwood, Texas 
TXS 0154)005 

For Info call 915446-3956

PUBLIC AUCTION
Saturday, April 28, 1984

10:30 A.M.
320 East Msin Street — Rsnger, Texas 

Oneida Halbrooks, Owner

Saturday-April 28 - 8-00 p.m. 
Sunday -April 29 - 3 :00  p.m.
Auditorium in RJC Library Bldg. 

$1.00-Adults
.50-Students/Senior citizens 

Ticket Information: 647-3234

1 9 8 0  Otdtmobii« 8 8  (DiweeO 
1 9 7 9  Ford F 1 5 0  Supwrcftb Pickup 
14 Piwctl Wickftr Living Room Suit« 
B«droom Suit« (2 P>«c«)
M«gnus Organ 
Platform Chair 
S w iv t i Chair 
Whirlpoot Wathar/OryiH 
Oimrig Room Tabt« w /4 ch«ira 
(2 ) O««rborn« WatarCoofora 
Sat of Kayttona Chma 
<41 Daarborna Haatars 
Aaaortrriant Picturas and Lamps 
Stngar Saw ing Machirv« 
Bookshatvas 
Moovar Vaccum  Ctaanar

Plua Many Mora Hama 
T«>o Numaroua To Ltall

(4 ) Foidir>g Chaire 
Sasre Conair Maasaga 
Saars Exarc itar Mastagar 
Lawn Furrutura w/Umbralla 
Hamrr.ock 
Trundle Bad Frame 
Antique Scales
Black ft D acksf Lawn Mower (alaciric)
ft Piece Sat of Ironetona Oishas
<3 ) Laddara
1 Large Sofa
(2 ) Garden Tiltars
(2 i Law n Mowers
Misc Hand Toole
E ieclric  Fence Chergar

FOOD WIL

Gentry Auction Company
TXS-12403B5 
Jeckie  0  Gentry 

Roma 3 »OX It .  iti?) M7 1308 
RANOCa. TIMAt 7«470

T34
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Osco Cemetery 

Assoc. Plans 

Annual Meet

^  .a..

The Annual Meeting of the 
Gsco Cemetery Association 
will be held Thursday, April 
26 at 7:00 p.m. in the Corral 
Room of t ^  Laguna Hotel.

Financial reports and a 
progress report of cemetery 
w oit performed during the 
past year will be made at 
this meeting, according to an 
announcement made by 
Association officers.

Election of officers for the 
year of 19M will be held.

All Association members 
and persons interested in the 
operation and upkeep of the 
Oakwood Cemetery are in­
vited.

East Cisco

Baptist Group 

Will Perform

THE ABOVE architect’s drawing shows the retirement 
village that tiie Hendrick Medical Development Corporation

{dans to hoUd near WyUe, sooth of AbOeoe. The village will 
have IM townhooses and apartments complete with variooa 
facilities in a security area.

KELLI AND CHERIE GARRETT

Carrett-SuMett Are W ed
In April 14 Ceremony

Mr. and Mrs. Kelli Garrett 
are making their home in 
Cisco after their April 14th 
wedding. The ceremony was 
in the Mangum Baptist 
Church in Eastland with 
L.A. (Whoop) Sublett, great 
uncle of the bride, of­
ficiating.

The bride was given in 
marriage by her father. She 
is the former C ^ rie  Sublett, 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Jim Sublett of Elastland. She 
is the granddaughter of Mrs. 
Ann Sublett of Cisco.

The groom’s parents are 
Mr. and Mrs. Bobby Garrett 
uf C ^ o . His grandparents 
are Mr. and Mrs. Neal 
Moore of Cisco.

The maid of honor was 
Laura Morton, and the 
bridesmaids were Lisa 
Sublett and Steplianie 
Sublett, all sisters of the 
bride.

The best man was Willard

Collins, brother-in-law of the 
groom. The groomsmen 
were James Sublett, brother 
of the bride, and Bill Dool.

Traditional wedding music 
was provided by Flo Clark 
and Angie Gower sang “ You 
Ught Up My Life.’ ’

The reception was held in 
the fellowship hall with spr­
ing colors as the theme. 
Cookie Sellers served the 
bride’s cake and Teresa 
Griffith served the punch. 
Vicki Collins, sister of the 
groom, served the groom’s 
cake.

'The rehearsal dinner was 
hosted Friday night by the 
groom’ s parents in the 
church fellowship hall.

A singing group from The 
East Cisco Baptist Church 
will perform at the Nimrod 
Neighbors Progressive Gub 
on Monday, April 23. The 
program starts at 7:00 p.m., 
and will last about 45 
minutes.

Some of the entertainers 
are, Tim Hull, son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Harvey Hull, who will 
be singing and playing his 
guitar.

Kendall Anderson son of 
Mr. and Mrs. A1 Anderson, 
will also be singing.

Everyone is invited and 
refreshments will be served.

Retirement Village To Be Built By Hendrick

Band And Belles 
Plan Revue

I l lt C it C o P r t t t
Sunday,

A p r U  22 .19 8 4

The Cisco Junior College 
W rangler Band and 
Wrangler Belles will present 
their annual “ Big Country 
Revue’ ’ , Friday, May 4 at 
7:30 p.m. in the Harrell Fine 
Arts auditorium.

The Revue will include in­
strumental music by both 
the Wrangler Concert Band 
and the Stage Band, dancing 
by the Wrangler Belles and 
the Nicki Harle Dancers, 
vocal soloists, the CJC 
Singers, Steven Zell at the 
organ, skits and novelty 
acts, and country western 
and rock music by the CJC 
special ensemble. Admission 
is free and open to the public.

PRESIDENT Michael Waters, left above, 
outlined details of the Hendrick Medical 
Development Corporation’s retirement village 
at Wylie at ground breaking ceremooies 
Wednesday. Shown with him is Gamer Altom, a 
marileting specialist assigned to the project 
Mr. Altom form eiiy lived in Cisco fm* many 
years. -Staff Photo.

HAMBURGERS tlT 
FRIES 39<
FINGER PIZZA M»

Now Serving Potto ond Submorine Sondwidiet
Fountoin Drinks

Pizza Mode to Your Order
Open 11 o.m. to 11 p.m. Seven Days

for nii O afiv^ of Pino... Call 442*4163
Homburger & Pizzo Foctory
805 Conrad Hilton Avonuo Cisco

Plans for the construction 
of 150 townhouses and 
cluster apartments on a 
43-acre site in Wylie, south of 
Abilene, were announced 
Wedncs^y by officials of 
the Hendrick M edica l 
Development Corporation. A 
large crowd of Abilene 
‘Civic leaders turned out fi 
the 10 a.m. event.

Ground breaking 
ceremonies climaxed ihe 
program. Michael Waters, 
president of the development 
corporation, outlined plans 
for the project, which will 
cost an estim ated

c e n r f i a

$14,000,000. Work will begin 
im m ed ia te ly  on two 
townhouses and a sales of­
fice with completion due 
about Nov. 1.

The project expects to be 
fa r  enough along for 
resi^nU Jto tegin inoving in

during the fall of 1966. The 
43-acre development, part of 
113 acrs ow n^ by the cor­
poration there, will include 
townhouses and apartments 
of one and two bedrooms and 
efficiency apartments, a 
20,000 square foot conunons 
building with dining 
facilities, a chapel, a barber- 
beauty shop, a country store, 
library, arts and crafts area, 
ice cream parlor, recreation 
area, guest rooms, ad­
ministrative offices and a 
clock tower. A lake of some 
12 acres will be located in the 
center of the project.

Mr. Water said the Hen­
drick Hospital, part of the 
corporation, opiened Sept. 16, 
1924 and that the develop­
ment organixaiton started in 
1977. The organization is af­
filiated with the Baptist Con­
vention of Texas, he added.

’The corporation’s assets 
include several satelite 
hospitals, including the E.L. 
Gr^iam Menoorial Hoapital

Progreooive Qub 
n a n s  M eeting M<m.

O M M i o M t P h o l v

Quofity • Snoptbots 
Comeras I  SuppRosj 

Fims-AR sizos 
And of Course 

Fine Photography 
Is Our Business.

conoN's
STUDIO

The Nimrod Neighbors 
Progressive (Tub will have a 
meeting with recreational 
fun on Monday, April 23 at 
7:00 p.m. at the Gub House.

The public is invited and 
refreshments will be saved.

John Hagan 

WUl Preach 

At Corinth
Corinth Baptist Giurch 

w ill have John Hagan 
preaching Sunday morning 
and evening, April 22. He is 
the minister of the youth at 
First Baptist Church in 
Dublin, Texas.

'The son of Mr. and Mrs. 
Benny Hagan of Cisco, he is 
m arried to Leslie , the 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Gerald Winnett of Cisco.

* * * * * * * * * * *  * * * * * * * * * * * * * * *

SIG H T-N -SO UND  T V
“ Quality Experience and Service’ ’

36 Years Experience

Satellite Sales &  Service

E S T A T E  S A L E
SATURDAY, APRIL 28 

9:00 AM .
111 N. Connellee St.

Eastland, Texas

CMsple* N It DHuc 
Syilrai starti at

1995*®
 ̂ Plus 
Installation

MTI
EcUpae I

100% Fiaaaciiig Available 

F C C  Licenued Tech nician  
(817) 442^131 (817) 559-8441
505 Conrad Hilton Av*. E. WoHi*r ^

Cisco. Tx. irockonridu*, Tx.

Washer Dryer
Furniture Gas Heaters
Antiques Collectibles
Luggage Small Appliances

Cookware Dishes
Glassware Linens

Antique Couch Dining Rm. Suite
Love Seat Yard Furniture

Chairs Tables
Mirrors T34 Electric Fans

Cisco Cemetery Association 

Annual Meeting 

Thursday, April 26, 7 P.M. 
Corral Room Laguna Hotel 
All association members and 

persons interested in 

Cisco Cemetery Association 

invited. p.34

inC îsco.
Gamer Altom, formerly 

administrator of the Gsco 
hoapital, is a marketing

sperialiat with the Hendrick 
cerporatiaa and ia working 
on the new raUnment home 
project.

Cheer Leaders 
Named At CHS

Qieer leaders for the 
1966-85 school year at (Tiaco 
High School were elected by 
the student body last Thurs­
day morning liter try-outs 
during an assembly hour.

Dana C alile was chosen 
as head varsity cheer leader. 
Others elected were Lauma

G age, Lynn P ittm an , 
Jeanine R eich , Les lie  
Covert, and Brenda Ayala 
with Sampty Slpe as the 
altemate.

Chosen as junior varsity 
cheer leaders were (3aisty 
Smith, Leigh Caliarman, 
Kerry Can^bell and Lori 
Cagle.

Officers Elected 
For Rotary Club

Cisco Writer’s 
Qub To Meet 
In Reich Home

The Cisco Writers Gub’s 
meeting for Tuasday, May 1, 
will be at the Ernest Reich 
home, south of Cisco. Time is 
7:00 p.m.

Members and visitors are 
requested to bring a favorite 
covered dish tor the dinner 
and a manuscript they are 
working on for the reading.

Mike Turner, principal of 
Cisco High School, has been 
elected president of the 
Cisco RoUry Gub for the 
fiscal year beginning July 1. 
He w ill succeed A llen 
Mastert.'

Other newly elected of­
ficers are the Rev. Milo Stef­
fen, pastor of the First Chris­
tian Giurch, vice présidant; 
James (Litton, treasurer; 
and, B ill Reynolds, 
secretary.

Gois Purvis, academic 
dean at Ĉ isco Junior (College, 
was the speaker at the dub’s

Thuraday luncheon at the 
(Colony Reataurant. He told 
about the coUege program 
and its growing student body 
over the past lew years.

M r. Pu ru taasU d  that 
mdre AHUM  IBBthts ark 
enrolled in the CJC program 
than fitxn aqy otha com­
munity. Abilene has some 
900 students in tilt program, 
including many in the 
tecfanicalvocational classes 
at the Abilene campus.

M oran News
By Mrs. Luke Huskey

Bobby Laird b  

In West Texas 

Medical Center

Mr. and Mrs. Ronnie 
La tim er of F la g s ta ff, 
Arixona and Mr. and Mrs. 
Joe Burda of Irving are 
visiting Mr. and Mrs. Monk 
Offield.

Thompson attended the Day 
Family reunion in Lufkin, 
over the week end.

Elma May Huskey spent 
the weekend with her sister- 
in-law, Mrs. Ekldie L. Smith, 
in Jacksboro.

Mrs. Etta Terry of Austin 
visited with friends in 
Moran, last Saturday.

*
*
»
*
*
*
»
*
»
0

Alvin Huskey III ot Big 
Spring visited with his 
mother, Mrs. Alvin Huskey, 
last Tuesday.

Dark Star .* 
Sat Com

Mr. and Mrs. Charlie 
Hagemann attended the 
Moore family reunion at 
Lake Brownwood, last 
weekend.

Mr. and Mrs. Bert Booth of 
Temple spent the week end 
with his mother, Mrs. J.W. 
Booth.

OFFICERS ELECTED 
Moran Chapter, No. 561, 

Order of the Eastern Star 
elected o ffiem  for the ensu­
ing year at the regular 
meeting on Monday night, 
April 9. Mrs. Gertrude 
Jones, Worthy Patron and 
Jim Howard, Worthy 
Patron, presided over the 
meeting. Those elected were 
Mrs. Bryant Edwards, Wor­
thy Matron, George Lane, 
Worthy Patron; Mrs. George 
Lane, Associate Matron; 
Jim Howard, Associate 
Patron; Mrs. Reba Ĉ annon, 
Secretary, Mrs. Elma May 
Huskey, Treasurer; Mrs. 
C.D. Forbes, Conductress 
and Mrs. (Gertrude Jones, 
Associate Conductress. 
Other officers will be ap­
pointed.

Bobby Laird, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. William Laird, of 
Cisco, is in West Texas 
Medical Center, Room 243, 
in Abilene for back surgery. 
He is expected to be in there 
for six weeks. He will then 
begin re-cooperating at 
home.

He is allowed visiton.

o r Ì

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Dennis 
spent the week end in Sweet­
water with their daughter, 
Mrs. Robert Ringhoffer and 
Mr. Ringhoffer.

Mr. and Mrs. Walter Mc­
Collum of Breckenridge 
were greeting friends in 
Moran, Sunday.

Menus for the Primary 
and bnermediate Schools for 
the week of April 25-27 are as 
follows:

Monday: No School.
Tuesday: No School.
Wednesday: Braakfast- 

O real, juice, milk. Lunch- 
hamburger, trench fries, let­
tuce & pidde, fruit, milk.

Thursday: Breakfast-cin­
namon toast, juice, miBi. 
Lund>- chicken fried steak, 
whipped potatoes, green 
beans, roll, cake, milk.

Friday: Breakfast-donut, 
juice, milk. Lunch- fish, tar­
tar sauce, french fries, pork 
n beans, K-careaL roD miik.

MUSICAL
Remember the Moran 

Country Musical on Friday 
n i^ ,  April 27, at the Moran 
Community Center. 
Everyone is welcome, ad­
mission is frto. All area 
musicians are Invited to at­
tend. A concession stand will 
be open at 6, with the pro­
gram to start about 7. (Tonne 
and enjoy an evening of 
music and foUowship.

Mrs. Giarlie D. Harbor of 
Ckipperas (knre visltod with 
her parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Charley Hagemann, last 
weekend.

Mr. and Mrs. Robert

RECEIVES 40 YEAR PEN
Jack Dennis received his 

40 year pen, last week, for 
having worked for the Post 
(Xfice Dept, for 40 years. Mr. 
Dennis started working for 
the Post Office Dept, in I960 
as a substitute Rural car­
rier. From Feb. 1962 to Juno 
1962, he worked for the Gvil 
Service in Abilene. He was in 
the Army from June 3,1962 
until Jan. 16, 1966.

Mr. Doutis bacame Poatal 
Gerk on Fab. 12, 1966. In 
Feb. 1967, he bacamt Rural 
Route Carrier. He worked at 
the Breckonrk^ Post Office 
from Sept. 1161 until Nov. U, 
1961. He rotaraed to Monn 
to carry the mall on Route 1 
on Nov. 16, II66 and is still 
carrying ths mail on Route 1. 
Ho was Post Master la 
Moran from 1M7 nnttlUi?.

Menus for JiYSr. High 
SdMKds for the wwk of April 
25-27 are as follows:

Monday: NoSdwot. 
Tuesday: NoSdwoL

Wadnesday: Broakfaat- 
Ceroal, juico, milk, tnneh- 
handiurgor,tronchfrioa,lat- 
tncc è  pidde, fhdt, mOk or 
tea. Snack Bar- burrtteoa, 
com dog, naehM, tana fid i

Thuraday: Breakfasl dn- 
namon tesai, Juloo, rafk. 
Lunch- chidan firtad dnrit, 
wMppod notatoaa, graan 
basM, ro l, n A  or 
tea. Snack B a r -  Ham- 
hurgar, barVqna, hot dog, 
ddUbmi.

Priday:
Juica, Lasdh-fU i, tar^ter saaca, hunch frisa, psik 
a basM, K-Owsal, raB, n A  or tea. Bai 
qna. hot dsf, chOI I 
pio.

■ i
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Freeze Dam aged Roads Including

Cisco-Nimrod Hwy. To Be Repaired
BROWNWOOD, • The 

State Highway and Public 
Transportation Commission 
on April 11 allocated $45 
million to repair more than 
2,300 miles of roadways bad­
ly damaged by the severe 
Texas winter.

In issuing orders to repair

freeze-damaged highways in 
all 24 highway districts, the 
commission directed that 
the money be used to provide 
protective coatings for road­
ways almost certain to 
disintegrate com pletely 
under another w inter’s 
stress

Brag Corner

Jeffory, 1; Ixiri, 2; and lusa, 8, are the 
children of Tom and Joann Knight of Olden. 
Grandparents are Mr and Mrs H.C. Fox of 
Olden Paternal grandparents are Mr. and 
Mrs. 1..K. Knight of las  Cruces, New Mexico. 
Great-grandparents are Mr. and Mrs. B.A. 
Highsmith of Ranger

The unusually severe 
damage wrought by last 
winter’s storms forced the 
commission to allocate 
money for the preservation 
project, an action it had 
hoped to forego this year, 
since funds are spare.

Faced with cash-flow pro­
blems, the commission 
elected last year to skip the 
annual Safety and 
Rehabilitation Program  
which costs $100 million to 
$150 million and includes 
funds to repair winter 
damage. The commission 
had hoped to omit the pro­
gram again this year but 
those hopes were dashed by 
one of the most severe Texas 
winters on record.

With freeze-dam aged 
roadways tn all 24 highway 
districts, the commission 
felt it would be more cost- 
effective to repair badly 
damaged highways, rather 
than later face more costly 
programs requiring com­
plete rebuilding.

Approximately 260 sec­
tions and U.S. highways, 
totaling 2,328 miles, are in­
cluded in the freeze-damage

C O N S T R U a iO N  H AU LIN G
(Good Tor Sol)

Sond A Rood Bote,
Dozer Work, Bockhoo, Groding Etc.

Gdi Kirby Welding
Leroy Kirby 817-442-3721

r«“F R E E ” C O L O R  A N A LY SIS
Valued at $35 to $95. Stop costly 

cfHtmetic and wardrobe errors forever. 
We will analyze your wardrobe and 

cosmetic colon* FREE.
Call Bobbie Broyles at 915-698-1602 

or 698-13.58 for more information, T34

program.
The highways that sustain­

ed the most freeze damage 
in the Brownwood District, 
accord ing to D istrict 
Engineer Ijiwrence Schulz, 
are in Lampassas, Mc­
Culloch, San Saba, and Mills 
Counties, but repairs are 
also needed in Comanche, 
Coleman, Eastland, and 
Stephens Counties.

Schulz said that plans are 
complete for repair of ap­
proximately 100 miles of 
freeze damaged highways in 
District 23 at an estimated 
cost of $1,750,000. He hopes to 
let contracts in May for all 
the repairs in district.

In Lampasas County, 
fabric underseal, seal coat, 
and partial asphalt overlay 
will strengthen approx­
imately ten mile of US IM 
east of lampasas, from Loop 
257, east ot near I.ampasas 
River. A seal coat will pro­
vide a moisture barrier on 
approximately six miles of 
US 281, from the Coryell 
County line, south to 
^'reeman Branch, while the

intersections os US 281 and 
US 183 on the north side oi 
l,ampasas will receive a 
fabric underseal and asphalt 
overlay.

In Coleman County, a 
freeze-damaged six miles of 
US 84 from the Taylor Coun­
ty line into the Jim Ned 
Creek will require a protec­
tive asphalt seal coat

A 22-mile section of the 
State Highway 36 in Coman­
che County, from the AT&SF 
Railroad Overpass in Com­
anche, southeast to the 
Hamilton County line, and 
seven miles of SH 206 in 
Eastland County, from IH-20 
west of Cisco, south to FM 
2526 near Nimrod, will both 
receive seal coats.

US 87, from its intersection 
with US 238, west of Brady, 
to the Concho county line, a 
total of approximately 14 
miles, will be reinforced 
with a fabric underseal and 
seal coat.

Approximately nine miles 
of US 84 in Mills County, 
from 0.4 miles north of 
Mullin, east to intersection 
of US 183, near the city limits 
of Goldthwaite, and eleven 
miles of US 190 in San Saba 
County, from 25. miles west 
of San Saba, west to FM 45, 
will receive seal coats.

In Stephens County, a seal 
coat will also be added to 
protect 12 miles of US 180 
east of Breckenridge, from 
SH 67 to Ixx>p 252, east of 
Caddo.

Playday
The Grant Town Riding 

Club will be having a 
Jackpot Playday, Sunday, 
April 29, at 1:30 p.m. in 
Mingus. The rain date will be 
the following Sunday. A gift 
certificate will be presented 
to the High Point Con­
testants at the end of the 
September Playday. Points 
will be carried over from 
each playday. There will be 
four classes: Pee Wee, 
Junior, Intermediate and 
Senior. Entry Fee will be $3 
per event with $2 going to the 
jackpot and $1 to the club. 
There will be a concession 
stand open for your conve­
nience.

i B arbara Garrett Fund

Sale Every Day At 
Eastland Direct F actory

O u t l e ^ l o M e H g n i g S a l w

Itome 
629-2117

Double Wide« & Single Wide« 
Mobile Home Insurance

FHA V A &  
Convential

TF ' inancing

A fund has been establish­
ed for Barbara Garrett at 
Eastland National Bank. Ms. 
Garrett was seriously in­
jured in an automobile acci­
dent April 1, and has been a 
patient in Hendrick Medical 
Center since that time. She is 
unconscious in Intensive 
Care Unit. ,

Anyone wishing to con­
tribute to the fund may con­
tact anyone in the new ac­
counts department at the

bank.
Ms. Garrett is the former 

daughter-in-law of Mable 
Garrett of Eastland, and she 
has three daughters. Shelly 
Archer of Eastland, and 
Tammy Hoops and Lisa Gar­
rett of Morenci, Az. She is 
manager of the Maverick 
Apartments and owner of 
B’s Maintneace of Eastland.

K ING  INSURANCE AG ENCY R EAL ESTATE
207 MAIN RANGER Phone: 647-1171

3 Bdrm, LR, 1 bath, kitchen cabinets, carpeted, .some 
paneling, garage & storage, corner lot-$14,500

3 Bdrm., 2 bath, large C Q ID ' fireplace, just out of city 
limits on 10 ac. Good b _____ -

NICE 3 BR, den, living room, dining area, riew carpet, in- 
sulatisd. 2 car garage and new patio. All on 7 plus lots, 
close in. tJS.ooo

2 Bdrm., LR, dining room, carpet, paneled, kitchen with 
Magic Chef range, 30x50 Stone shop bldg. 3/4 acre, some 
equity, assumable loan _
'n iREE  BDK., 1 bath, combined dining area and kitchen, 
onpet, panelled, chain link fenced yard on 5 lots. $20,000. 
LAND-near Desdemona, 78 acres fenced, lots of water, 
pasture & cultiv^on._____
RANGER- L.R. 2 Bdrm. Kitchen 1 Bath 2 storage Room, 
ellar, all on 3 lotsJ12,000
LAKE PR O PE R ITL  3 br, 1 bath, living room, built in kit­
chen, paneled, wood vented stove, grocery store
building, gas static ̂ iT^ifiinow bathes. 585 ft. of lake 
front, staff, city a j^  Ua^water, all on 7.42 acres.
4 trailer hook up. Urge shop bldg. $57,500.00

VERY NICE mobile home on ac. - 2 BR, 2 bath. Extra 
kitchen added. Large shop bldg. Front porch, cemented 
patio, fruit trees ii grapes. Irrigation system, storm 
cellar-Good bnv

RANGER- 2 Story, 3 Bdrm., Den, L.R. CH&A, kitchen 
Built-ins- 2 car separate Garage Beautiful Country Living 
on 9 ac. 4 miles E of Eastland on Lake Rd.
Cisco Commercial 10 unit Move! with 2 optional office - 
$49,000.
VERY NICE 2 story, 3 bdrm., 2 bath, knotty pine kitchen 
cabineU, built in diahwasher and oven, central heat, 
refrigerated air conditioners, ceiling fans, carport and 
garage, storm windows, 100 z 200 lot, good location.

3 BR - 2 bath, L.R., kithcen built-ins Garage, good loca- 
Uon. $25.000, .

STRAWtH • Neat 2 br., W ge bath, living room, dinirig 
room, kitchen, utility rom, carpet, paneled and In- 
suUted, asbestos cUd. $12,000 Owner will consider flhan- 
cing.
2 BR combined LR k dining, 1 Bath, 2 walk in closeta, 
carpeted, drapes, 2 window a/c 1 evap. cooler 220 volU, 
new plumbing, garage, fenced yard, good location, 
$28,500

M n. O p a le .  King 
M7-1S19

LeeRosM ll
M7-1383

Don Adair 
•29-2848
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Possum Kingdom  Bass

Tournam ent April 28
’The Banks of the Brazos 

Pioneer Club will be hosting 
their Second Annual Bass 
Tournament at Possum 
Kingdom Lake. The event 
will be a benefit with pro­
ceeds donated to Hope, Inc., 
of Mineral Wells. This newly 
formed organization offers 
shelter and counseling to 
battered wives and their

Games Day  

At Breck.

children.
’The tournament will be 

held on Saturday, April 28th 
at the south D&D public 
ramp. Participants may 
register from 4 to 7 a.m. at 
that location.

Cash prizes will be award­
ed to the first four places for 
the largest three fish str­
inger. Other valuable prizes 
will be given for places 5 
through 25. Entry fee is $18 
plus $2 for big bass calcuta.

For additional information 
contact Bill Scott or Brad 
Cohlmeyer at 817/325-7851.

Advertisins Pays!

^ l e !
Long-lasting, good looking Rad Wing 

■■ noocts ara mad« for funPacos pull-on------------------
Of work. Itou can dapsnd on them for 

^  thakindofhaai-huggin'.aasywsann 
m that makaa long, hard days 

saem shortar Pick a pair of 
Pocos and te«l fit

Styl« No. 1177 •5999

R e d W ln g s '^ f
HEIDENHEIMER'S

Your f^amily Store In Cisco

The B reckenridge 
Women’s Forum will have 
an open games day Tuesday, 
April 24, at 10 a.m. in the 
W om an’s Forum in 
Breckenridge.

Men and women are in­
vited to attend. Reservations 
may be made by calling Mrs. 
Leo Draper at 559-6660. 
Lunch and games will be $4.

Sue's Fabrics
426 Mdi 

fihrict, Ntttms, 
Notioiit

kn A M  S«wÌR|

OwiMr: Sm  Alsiip

O n l u n ^
21 647-1302

EASTCOINC 112 RaOnaA Ave.
Bfll GrlffHMrakaiwPnB. Baaica, Bm .

Bits 
o f i

Buddy.• • •

It’s always easy to see 
both sides of an issue we 
are not particularly con­
cerned about.

Why can’t life’s big pro­
blems come when we are 
twenty and know 
everything?

For AN Your 
Insuronco Needs, 

See
Aaron Insurance

Agency 
629-8533 

108 S. Seomon 
Eostlond

RANGER
MEADOWBROOK ADDITION. 5 Bdr.,
3 Bath, fireplace and basement with 
CH/A.
MEADOWBROf* ADDITION, Brick 3 
Bdr., 2 Bath, Fenced backyard, CH/A 
OAKHILL SUBDIVISION, Like New, 
Brick 3 Bdr., 2 Bath, one car garage, 
energy efficient.
OAKHILL SUBDIVISION, Brick, 3 
Bdr., 2 Bath, one car garage, energy ef­
ficient CH/A.
NEW BRICK HOME, 3 Bdr., 2 Bath, 
kitchen with built-ins, 2 car garage 
located on 3.9 acres.
PINE STREET, Large 2 Bdr. 1 bath. 
Greenhouse.
HODGES OAK PARK ADDITION, 3 
Bdr., 2 bath, fenced backyard, 
fireplace, on comer lot.
ENERGY EFFICTENT, 2 Bdr., 2 Bath. 
CH/A.
YOUNG ADDITION, Large Frame 3 
Bdr., I Bath, den, fenced backyard. 
BRECKENRIDGE HIGHWAY, Brick, 
3 Bdr. 11/2 Bath, 1 car carport, CH/A. 
ASSUMABLE, FHA LOAN, Large 2 
Bdr., 1 Bath, large den with fireplace, 
p r ic^  to sell.
NICE HOME, 3 Bdr., 1 Bath, on approx­
imately 2 acres.
OWNER FINANCE, Large Frame, 3 
Bdr. 1 Bath, on comer lot.
MOBILE HOME, Large 2 Bdr. 2 Bath, 
fenced yard on 2 lots, affordable. 
B R E C K E N R ID G E  H IG H W A Y, 
Beautiful Brick Home, 3 Bdr., 2 Bath, 
CH/A.
’TR.WIS STREET, Energy Efficient, 3 
Bdr., 2 Bath, c o r iir  lot with CH/A.

MORE LISTINGS AVAILABLE -  WE 
BUILD NEW HOMES
Century 21 Mortgage Corporation

Spercent Down

EASTLAND
COMPI.E’TELY REMODELED. 3 Bdr.,
1 bath, fenced backyard, FHA Apprais­
ed.
IN EASTLAND, Good location, brick, 3 
Bdr., 2 Bath, large living area with 
fireplace, large lot, privacy fence. 
r E IIO I^ L E D , OMw  B r t t K T i ^ M  
Bdr. All new Inside, Insulated windows, 
much more.
VERY ATTRACTIVE, Bridi, in better- 
neighborhood, 3 Bdr., 2 Bath, nice kit­
chen with buUt-ins, privacy fence, 
CH/A, 2 car garage.
CORNER LOT. 3 Bdr., large living area 
with fireplace, fenced yard.
BASSETT STREET, Brick. 4 Bdr., 2 
Bath, built-in kitchen, beautiful 
backyard, corral, shed for animals. 
CISCO
VERY NICE, Brick Home, 3 Bdr. 1 3/4 
Baths, FHA Assumable loan, call today 
for more information.
RANGER
Large Commercial Warehouse, ac- 
cessable to railroad.
CLOSE TO GORMAN, 160 Acres, 1/2 
minerals, mostly improved, tank, 8 
wells, 7 with pumps.
BETWEEN CISCO AND EASTLAND, 
166 Acres, corrals, bam, city water, 
electricity, tanks, some coastal, fenced, 
cross fenced.
92.26 Arres, Live Oak and Post Oak, 1 
small tank, lots of game, owner 
finance, no minerals.
260 Acres, Wooded, 3 tonks, has old 
shad' on property.
OUTSIDE CITY LIMITS, 3 Acres with 2 
Bdr., 1 Bath Home, 2 bams.
OLDEN, 2 Acres with unfinished new 3 
Bdr., 2 Bath Home.
RANGER, Large Frame, 2 Bdr., 1 bath, 
ceiling fans, CH/A on 7.41 acres.

Shirley Griffith 647-1635 Donna McDorxjId 647-1291

Larry Armstrong 629-1683 Kenneth G rice 647-5127

Put Number 1 to work for you.
<S and

© 1IW4 Century 21 Real E.sUte (V>rp(>ralH>n as trustee for the NAK 
’• —trademarks of Century 21 Real Estate Corporatiun Kuual Housintt OmCentury 21 Real listate Corporatiun Cqual Housinn O|i|ionunity tL  

EACH OmCE IS INDEPENDENTLY OWNED AND OPERATED.

IB
REALTOR

James W. Ratliff Realtor-Broker
111 E. Main St. Ranger, Texas 

Office 647-1260 Home Phone 647-1667

HOMES RANGER
Two story Colonial home with three 
bedrooms, two baths, living room, dining 
room, utility room, very nice kitchen and 
breakfast room. Wood burning fireplace and 
a woodburning stove, insulated. ’This home is 
on one acre of land. Other land back of this 
with barn and pens also for sale. FHA financ­
ing available.

Home on approx. 5 acres of land with three 
bedrooms, two baths, utility room, kitchen, 
fruit trees, large garden plot. $20,000.

Two acres of land with three bedrooms, one 
bath, central heat and air. Very nice kitchen 
with dishwasher, range, three car garage 
with cellar entrance in garage, several pecan 
trees, some pens and bams.

Brick three bedrooms, two baths, central heat 
and air, living room, dining room, very nice 
kitchen with dishwasher, cook-top, wall oven. 
WiU FHA finance $47,500.

Very attractive three bedroom, two full bath 
home. Kitchen, dining room, living room, 
fenced backyard with storage buildi^, cen­
tral heat and air, washer, dryer, refrigerator, 
range. Carport and storags room. All new 
plumbing, new roof, drapes and curtains. Will 
FHA.

New brick home with central heat and air, 
three bedrooms, two baths, dishwasher, 
range, attached garage. Will sell worth the 
money, assumable loan.

Three bedroom 1 1/2 baths, dining room kit­
chen, living room, carport with storage room, 
fen c^  backyard. Very reasonable at $12,500.

Two story home with two bedrooms one bath 
upstairs, two bedrooms bath, kitchen, dining 
room, utility room down stairs. This is a weU 
kept home.
BUSINESS PROPER’TY RANGER 
Two story brick building with apartment 
upstairs, place for business downstairs. 
$25,000.

Three bedrooms, one and half baths, utility 
room, kitchen, living room. Paneled walls. 
’This house has five lots with it. $30,000.

Two lots on Main Street next to above proper­
ty, $8,000.

’Three bedrooms, one bath, dining room, liv­
ing room, utility room. This home is on 1/2 
acre just out of Ranger.

.On comer lot, two bedroom, one bath, living 
room, dining room, utility room, kitchen with 
lots of cabinets, fenced backyard with cellar 
knd storage building. $22,500.

12 lots on old Hwy .80 east in Ranger. Make 
good building site or pipe yard. $10,000. 
LAKE LEON
16 lots 100x200 Just off the lake. Owner will 
finance.
Lake house with two bedrooms, two baths, 
deeded lot, guest house with bunk beds, all 
furniture goes with this hours.
OUT OF GORMAN
196 acres in Comanche County, 1/2 in Coastal 
and cultivation, 1/2 in native pasture.

4
6
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Oil Belt News
D r i l l i n g  B i t s
Kichey & Co. of Ft. Worth 

has revealed plans to drill 
four developmental wells in 
a 40-acre lease in Fastland 
County’s Snow Field.

With projected total depth 
of 4,000 feet, the No. 1 B.L. 
Hunter is located four miles 
northeast of Eastland in the 
S.J. Kobinson Survey, A-423.

The No. 1 C.V Norton is 
aimed at 3,950 feet total 
depth. Location is four miles 
northeast of Eastland in the 
B E. Tanner Survey, A-1201.

The No. 1 M. Harrell and 
No 1 M Harrell “ A”  are 
aimed at 4,200 feet total 
depth. Drillsites are seven 
miles north of Eastland m 
the H&TCRR Survey, A-304.

Two 2,750-ft. developmen­
tal wells are planned by 
Clyde Petroleum Inc. of 
BreckenndKc at a drilliste 
two miles northeast of

Pioneer, P'.astland County. 
The location is in a 1731-acre 
lease in the Eastland 
Regular Field.

The No. 807 North Pioneer 
Unit is located in the ETRR 
Survey, Sec. 44, Blk. 2.

The No 1612 North 
Pioneer Unit is located in the 
C.L. Lewis Survey.

North Ridge Corp. of Dun­
canville has filed for permit 
to d rill three 4,000-ft. 
developmental wells four 
miles north of Eastland. 
Ixications are in a 160-acre 
lease in the Eastland 
Regular Field, H&TCRR 
Survey, A-752 & A-299, The 
wells are designated as the 
Nos. 3 & 4 L.S. Ross and No. 4 
R.O. Morton. ,

A new gas producer has 
been brought on line in Palo 
Pinto County’s J.V.T. Field,

WANT TO BUY:
«Gardner Donver DiBng Rig 

1*Mt con Drfl 2,000 ■ 2,500 foot wHh 
5-indi (Mi pipe.

Cal
442-2669 (Days) 
442-3647 (Nights)

Lone Star Title 
& Abstract Co. 

Joe B. Koonce, Mgr.
101 W . Main

E a s t l a n d ,  T e x a s  7 6 4 4 8  
(8 1 7 ) 6 2 9 > 2 6 8 3

BIG CAT FOR SALE
D-9G Dozer

in Good Shopo A Runs Good. Pash Bloda

Priced Reosonably for Quick Sole. 
Coll: 442-9979

442-4569 ^

SUPER, SHALLOW DRILLING RIG
No. 8 DAVEY Rig FOR SALE wHh Extondod 
Derrick A hydr. Pul Down Moontod on 
1966 Mack truck wHk lurga Cummingt 

diesel motor. Most hondfag oqokpaioat und 
bond tools. Wel-mukitainod A very dean 
rig. Ready to DrB A Priced to Sei. Mutt 
See to Approdato. For Appointment Col: 

442 9979(Dayt) 442-4569(Nigkft) tfc

EQUIPMENT FOR SALE
1966 Caterpillar Dozer D4DJ 

Direct Start & Hydraulic. |14,500.

1961 D4 Dozer. Direct Start & Hydraulic. |12,S00. 

Forklift - LUts 30,000 lbs. asking $9,000.

Loader - Asking $12,000.

70 D-5 Dozer, Good Shape, asking $22,500. 

Clark ISO Forklift. Good Condition.

Michigan 75 Ftont-End Loader 
1 yard 4  bucket, new engine, good rubber.

Col 442-9979 (Doyt) or 442-4569 (nightt) tfc

[ASTLAND 
DRIILING 

INC
I17/629-IS12 

24 Hoar Nnmbor

3 Rotary Rass
DrMiig dtpifc fram 150T to 600(r 
Al Rigt Rodb Egoippad wHk 24 hr. 
ontwtrkig Mrvka plw phono patch.

Gory Snopp, Vlca Pietldiat A OparoHont 
Mgr.

Rot. Phoao IT7/647-3416 
23 Trt. OMMd Expariiaca

with Diamond Shamrock Ex­
ploration of Amarillo as the 
operator.

Ix)cated four miles east of 
Palo Pinto, the well is in a 
176-acre lease in the T&PRR 
Survey. It is designated as 
the No. 2-36 Parish.

On a 3/16 choke, it flowed 
215,000 CF per day. It was 
rated at 3,400,000 CFD on ab­
solute open flow.

The well bottomed at 4,350 
feet and will produce from a 
perforated interval in the 
.Strawn Formation, 2,018 to 
2,352 feet into the hole.

A 4,700-ft. wildcat well is 
planned by Thomas 
Hydrocarbons Inc. of 
Weatherford at a drillsite 
four miles west of Palo Pin­
to. The location is in a 
420-acre lease in the T&PRR 
Survey. Well’s designation is 
the No. 1 Million.

Dallas production Inc. of 
Dallas has filed for permit to 
drill the No. 3 Calvin, A 
4,350-ft. wildcat well two 
miles south of Graford. 
liOcation is in a 160-acre 
lease in Palo Pinto County’s 
TE&L Survey.

At a location 14 miles nor­
thwest of Palo Pinto, Kadane 
Oil Co. of Wichita Falls has 
finaled a new gas producer 
in Palo Pinto County’s 
B.R.A. Field

llie  well is designated as 
the No. 9 B.R.A., flowing at 
the rate of 1,358,000 CF per 
day on a l'«-in. choke. The 
absolute open flow rating 
came in at 2,000,000 CFD.

I/Kation is in a 2,149-acre 
lease in the Fridela Garza 
Survey. Bottomed at 4,520 
feet, the well will produce 
from perforations 4,379 to 
4,387 feet into the hole.

! The Palo Pinto Regular 
Field gained a new gas pro­
ducer when W illiam s 
Petroleum  Co. of 
Burkburnett completed the 
No,> i  .BRA,, live- miles nor­
theast of Brad.

The well indicated ability 
to flow at the rate of 224,000 
CF per day on a one-inch 
choke. It was rated at 300,000 
CFD on absolute open flow.

The well was taken to a 
4,070-ft. bottom and will pro­
duce from perforations 2,719 
to 2,850 feet into the hole.

'The operation is in a 
423-acre lease in the J.T. 
W esl^ Survey.

A 4,500-ft. wildcat well is 
planned by Raw Energy 
Corp. of Weatherford at a 
drillsite one mile north of 
Brad, Palo Pinto County. 
The location is in a 182-acre 
lease in the T&PRR Survey. 
Well's designation is the No. 
1 Brad Townsite.

A wildcat gas prodcuer 
has been brought on line in 
Palo Pinto County, with 
Sunbelt Exploration Inc. of 
Ft Worth as the operator.

Located four m iles 
southwest of Mineral Wells, 
the w ell is in a 167-acre lease 
in the Dennis Mahoney 
SuR'ey. It is designated as

----- W A h tW ftU V i ■
Marginal, shallow pro­
duction (1500’ or less) 
with acreage fo r 

development. Call: 
44^^669 (Days) or 

442-3647 (Nights) p-31tfc

Snow 
Oil Plaza

Pip * & Supply

Drilling Corp.

Won Service

OH (817) 62*8521

Undo Nelson
(0)7) 629 0123

the No. W.I. Dunaway.
On a 7/8 choke, it flowed 

616,000 CF gas per day. It 
was rated at 775,000 CFD on 
absolute open flow.

The well bottomed at 4,450 
feet and will produce from a 
set of perforations 2.208 to 
2,214 feet into the hole.

Raw Energy Corp. of 
Weatherford has filed first 
production figures on a 
wildcat oil well. The No. 1 
Schmitz showed potential to 
pump 20 barrels of oil and 
75,01)0 CF gas per day.

The operator has 235 acres 
leased, with drillsite in Palo 
Pinto County’ s T&PRR 
Survey, one mile northeast 
of Brad.

The well went to a 4,050-ft. 
bottom, and top of pay zone 
was logged at 3,844 feet.

T V .
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I n t r o  Se r v ic s s ,  I nc
P.O. Box S28, Cisco, Ti. 7(437

We Offer Marketing and Locater Services to Sellers and Buyers of: Production, 
Equipment, Companies and Other Commodities of Modest to Large Values.

Although Oriented Towards Oil-Field Service, We Have Access to All Markets. 
Mineral Leasing and Other Services Are Available. — ______ , ,

BUY OF THE WEEK:
1969 Sanderson-Cyclone 36R 

Mounted on 1969 Ford Tandem 

Truck. 4x6 Oil Well Pump. 

1,000 ft. 2 7/8” Failing Pipe. 

(Nearly New)

GOOD SHALLOW RIG

ITEM S FOR SALE IN CLU D E:
2 Drilling Rigs -  (i) 5,500’ & (i) 6,500’. 

Both in Good Condition.
2 Pulling Units - ’74 IH Truck w7 Wilson 

Draw Works & Ingersoll Rand Power 
Tongs. (Nice Looking & A Good Buy.)

Mack Truck w/double winch, derrick 
type, single-double. Fully tooled. V-6 Detroit 
motor. 4200’ or more. Foster Hydraulics

Fob Morb Information •• Call Today
Tim p o b a b t  Ph o n e  Sc m b e r ; 442-W68 ‘B a ts) ob 442-3M7 iSichtsì

PAT MAYNARD REAL ESTATE
629-8568 EASTLAND INT. 20 E. NORTH SIDE 442-1880 CISCO

Homos: Eastland, CoriMNi,
And Oonmm

In Eastland, a lot, good for mobile home 
$3,500.

Reasonable p r ic^  lots in the exclusive 
OakhoUow addition: $5,000. to $5,500. New 
homes, custom built. C:all for appointment.

In Eastland, 2 lots, one on comer, $7,000 for 
both or sell separately.

We have a real nice 3 bedroom, 2 bath. 
Mobile home, like new. $14,500.

A 1 year old 2 bed, 1 bath, mobile home, 
assumable loan, furnished. $15,500.

3 bedroom, 1 bath frame home, particially 
remodeled, owner may finance.

A perfrect starter home, this 2 bedroom, 
has been remodeled, real nice.

Within walking distance to downtown, doc­
tors and hospital. A 2 bedroom, 1 bath home. 
$26,000.

A large 2 bedroom home in good location, 
with a nearly new (20x60) garage and shop. 
$38,500.

2 bedroom home, could be 3, with two small 
rent houses included. Would make good in­
vestment property, all for $34,500.' ”

2 bedroom, 1 bath home, formal dining 
area, CH/CA, carpeted, nice modem cabinets 
with dishwasher. $35,000.

A large 3 bed, 2 bath older home. Owner will 
finance $35,000.

Has been remodeled, this 3 bedroom home, 
carpeted, paneled, some built-ins, CH/CA and 
fenced back yard. $39,500.

On comer lot, this nice 3 bedroom, 2 bath, 
frame home. Carpeted, central heat and air, 
only $36,500.

Closed in, a 3 bedroom, one bath, carpeted, 
central heat and air, greenhouse and swimm­
ing pool.$41,000.

2 bedroom, 1 bath home on 2'z lots, 
carpeted, paneled, greenhouse, and fruit 
trees. $40,000.

A new 2 bedroom, 2 bath home. Carpeted, 
fireplace, built-ins. Extra large master 
bedroom. $50,000.

Like new! 3 bedroom, IV« bath brick home 
with carpet and many extras. A good starter 
home. Only $51,000.

In a nice area, a 4 bedroom, frame and 
brick home, built-ins, central heat and air, 
and fenced yard. $52,500.

Priced to sell, a nice, 3 bedroom, 1̂ 4 bath 
brick home in exclusive area. Custom drapes, 
firep la ce  and a la rge area fo r a 
workshop.$59,500.

A large 2 bedroom home on 24 lots, has 
been elegantly remodeled. See to appreciate. 
$55,000.

An attractive 3 bedroom, 14 bath brick 
home with approx. 2200 sq. ft., two living 
areas, each with fireplace, breakfast area, 
ceiling fans, built-ins, CH/CA, large corner 
lot. $82,500.

Located in Hillcrest area, a 3 bedroom, 2 
bath home, approx. 2000 sq. ft., nice lot, above 
ground swimming pool. All for $65,000.

'This extra nice 4 bedroom home on 3 lots is 
like being in the country. A swimming pool in­
cluded. $90,000.

Prestigious 2-story rock home on one of 
Eastland’s finest streets. This in an excep­
tional home with approx. 5,000 sq. ft. and has 
all the extras including CH/CA, all built-ins, 
intercom system, 2 car garage with electric 
door opener, fenced yard and more. Definite­
ly a quality place.

|Qtco Homtt and Loti
Outside of town, residential lots in new sub­

division, restricted to brick homes. Starting 
at 2,000. ,

4 lots, residential, will sell all or separately. 
$2,500 each. Located near some nice brick 
homes.

4 residentail lots, all for just $6,000.
Nice 2 bedroom, 1 bath home. New carpet, 

large rooms. Nice trees and shrubbery. 
$20,000. Owner financing at 10%.

A nice 3 bedroom, 1 bath home CH/CA, 
carpet, large rooms, also has a small apart­
ment and storage building. Situated on 2 lots.

3 lots with approx. 20 pecan trees. Fenced 
with water well. $10,000.

4 bedroom, 14 bath brick home, fenced 
backyard, CH/CA, garage, comer lot, all for 
$48,000.

Large 2-story with 5 bedrooms, 2 baths, den, 
separate dining and breakfast rooms. 
liOcated on 2 big corner lots. Also nice roomy 
apartment attached. Beautiful landscape 
yard, fenced, and variety of fruit trees. 
$48,500.

Assumable loan, large 4 bedroom, 3 bath 
brick home, carpet, drapes, CH/CA, fenced 
backyard, double caroport with storage.

4 bedroom, 2 bath brick with CH/CA, some 
built-ins, fire place, large master bedroom, 
carport and storage building, all on large cor­
ner lot.

A beautiful 3 bedroom, 2 bath that has been 
elegantly remodeled. See to appreciate. 
$75,000.

A 2 or 3 bedroom frame home, with 14 
bath, numerous kitchen cabinets, formal din­
ing and detached garage with apart- 
ment.$26,000.

Near school, a 3 bedroom, 1 bath home that 
has been remodeled. Wood burning heater, 
fenced yard, and comer lot.

A 2 bedroom, 1 bath home, could be 3. 
Detached garage, fenced yard, 2 lots.

Small Acreage With Homes
A bargain! A 3 bed. 1®4 bath on approx. 2 

acres. $37,500.
5.3 acres near I jike I.,eon with a 2 bedroom 

mobile home (14x70) with special house type 
features, storage building and citv water. 
$33,000.

In Gorman, 2 bedroom, 1 bath on 1 acre, 
storage, bam, .shop, water well, storm cellar, 
fruit trees. $37,500.

In Olden, 1.5 acres with a nice 3 bedroom 
home, carpeted, panpled, CH/CA, small barn. 
$66,000.

26 acres with a 3 bedroom remodeled home. 
Close in to Eastland. $65,000.

Approx. 48 acres with large 2 bedroom, 2 
bath, mobile home. Water well, stock tank, 
bam and some minerals.

Like new! A 2 bedroom, 2 bath, approx. 2500 
sq. ft. home, with library, fireplace and water 
well, all on 2 acres with partial minerals.

2 bedroom, 2 bath, stone home on 2 acres. 
Water well, fireplace and some minerals. 
$85,000.

Nice 3 bedroom, 1̂ 4 bath stone and brick 
home on 4.38 acres. Carpeted, CH/CA, 
fireplace, bookshelves, screened porch, and 
many other extras in this 2150 sq. ft. home. 
$83,000.

Close in to Eastlaad, a new 3 bedroom, 2 
bath home on 10 acres, outbuildings, trees, 
very nice. $160,000.

Very pretty place, a large 4 bedroom, 24 
bath home on approx. 10 acres. I,ocated South 
of Cisco. 2 irrigation wells, good fences, big 
shop and barn. $130,000.

A beautiful 5 acres, close in to Eastland, 
with a 3 bedroom, 2 bath, approx. 1700 sq. ft., 
brick home. Built-ins, fireplace, ceiling fans 
in all rooms. $93,000.

Forms ond Rondief
80 acres near Carbon on FM 2526. 60 acres 

in cultivation some minerals. $600 per acre.
80 acres on Hwy. 183, Near Romney. A 

remodeled 2 bedroom home, bam, pens, 
water well, coastal and minerals. $80,000.

71 acres in Pioneer area. New fences, near­
ly all in bush and trees. Mobile home hook-up. 
$650 per acre.

2 acres close in to Eastland. Would make a 
pretty homesite. $13,500.

We have some small tructs of land, 20 to .30 ^  
acres, $800. per acre, $2,000 to $2,500 down. 
Owner financed.

40 acres of FM 2526 out of Carbon, nearly all | 
in love grass, some minerals, $900 per acre.

40 acres located south of Cisco on Hwy. 183, ■ 
native pasture with scattered pecan trees,] 
one well and tank. $42,000.

Near Elastland and I.ake I.«on, 49.5 wooded I 
acres with six tanks and spring, on FM 2214, | 
good place to hunt and fish, assumable loan 
$55,000.

120 acres with a 3 bedroom home, close in to j 
Cisco. Good hunting, all wooded. $56,000.

160 acres off Hwy. 183 eight miles south of 
Cisco, 100 acres cultivation, remainder trees. 
$600 per acre.

120 acres south of Cisco near 206 and 569, 2 
bedroom 14 bath brick home, hay bam, cor­
rals, storage buildings, 2 irrigation wells and 
pipe, 11 pecan trees, 4  minerals. $115,500.

106 acres east of Cross Plains, 90 acres 
cultivation, bam, corrals, stock tank and 
water well. $72,000.

255.5 acres near Union Center, 190 acres | 
cultivation, bam, grain tank, good fences. 
$650 per acre.

299 acres near Union Center, six pastures, | 
.some in coastal. Minerals on part, will owner | 
flMuicing with 30% down $750 per acre.

320 acres located between Carbtm and Gor-1 
man. Some cultivation but mo.stly wooded. 
Good fences and hunting, some minerals in­
cluded. $500. per acre. Owner financed at 9%.

640 acres approx. 17 miles northwe.>t of 
Breckenridge with 2 bedroom, 1 bath frame 
house, 175 acres cultivation with remainder in 
pasture. Some minerals with leasing rights. 
$538. per acre.

Gose in to Eastland, 1213 acres with good 
farm land. Barns, corrals, multi-cro.ss fences, 
good hunting and fishing, .3500 pecan trees, 2 
miles off river. Will run 1 animal unit to each 
5 acres with no extra feeding $750. per acre.

Commercial
IxKated near downtown, a large 2 story, 

50x100 building. Only $.36,500.
Located near downtown, an older building 

that would make a good location for a| 
busine.ss. $35,000

In Eastland, a new metal building, 2400 .sq. 
ft. with dock area. $28,000.

For commercial use only. 1 to 5 acres with 
1-20 frontage.

Located on Main Street, a 10,000 sq. ft. 
building. Ideal location for a business. Extra 
lots go with this one. $135,000 and owner will 
finance with good terms.

WE BUILD NEW HOMES ON VOUR LOT OR 
OURS.
WE HAVE OTHER HOME, LAND AND 
COMMERQAL USTINGS.

WE APPREGATE YOUR BUSINESS!

P A T M A YN A R D

álMOAS

W AYNE CHANDLER 
A S S O O A TI 

734-2712

A N N  W ILLIAMS
A s s o c u n

442-1110

O N D Y E E O S n R
A S S O C U n

A29419S

U T B A U T
A s m u n

«29-23M
ASMCIATE
4294104
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Traile Hurtles Hurting 

Texas Agriculture
Texab agriculture depends 

tieavUy on export markets, 
but prospects currently are 
dim

"A  tiood portion of all the 
major crops i^rown in Texas- 
-cotton, grain sorghum, 
uheat, rice and soybeans- 
Koes into overseas 
markets,” points out Dr 
Carl Anderson, economist 
vith the Texas Agricultural 
Extension Service, Texas 
\ iM  University System. 
That’s why the climate for 

•‘ xports has such a big im- 
. • t on this s ta te ’ s 
agncultural as well as total
f  ■ : tl' ■’

U nfortunately, says 
Andf; ion, export prospects 
■re aher bleak for a 

;mmt:v. of reasons: the 
strong dollar abroad which 
riake:i U S. farm  com- 
n .c iitics  cost more to 

gn buyers, protectionist

dollar
exports

trade policies of foreign 
countries.

The strong 
discourages U S. 
and encourages imports, ex­
plains the economist The 
dollar’s value has increased 
largely because of high in­
terest rates, low inflation 
rates and a record budget 
deficit.

P ro tection is t trade 
policies practiced by major 
trading countries have a 
marked effect on U.S. ex­
ports, adds Anderson. For 
example, the European 
Economic Community has a 
system of import levies and 
export subsidies to protect 
their farmers.

Foreign producers, with 
considerable support from 
their governments, are 
pushing to export more 
agricultural products. F'or 
instance, China has stepped

up cotton production 
substantially to increase ex­
ports of cotton textiles, notes 
the economist.

The developing countries 
of Asia and South America 
boast the most potential 
customers for American 
farm commodities, Ander­
son points out. But they lack 
money and credit to make 
major purchases

Many of these interna­
tional trade hurdles can be 
resolved, says Anderson, but 
it will take a cooperative ef­
fort by farm organizations 
and agribusinesses and 
positive government action.

“ Meanwhile, with exports 
decreasing, farmers must 
cut back on production to 
keep commodity supplies at 
reasonable levels,”  he con­
tends. “ This means taking 
acres out of production 
either by low prices or by 
mandatory production con­
trols.”

iSpotllghtft &  
S id e lig h ts

Sunday, April 22,1984

Julia Worthy

^l€*loii Growers Urged 

Í a Attend April Meeting

Time-Location 

Announced For 
Ominiodities

Vi : \ m Ion and
can ' upc growers in 
Kastl.and and I'omanche 
ronn'.ie.s !■ ' urged to attend

/I ue ;.uii 
lias iiighf 
■ I I'on 

auaitoriuiii
,ii

meeting Tues- 
April 24 at the 
High School 

The program 
/ 10 pm. an-

I- I.’ .Marquis (lordon, 
• iml iiunty Extension

lAti'n.smn Service

specialist. Dr. Jesse Cocke 
and Dr Chip I,ee w ill discuss 
several topics. The topics 
will include inse<’t manage­
ment, use of bees for Pollina­
tion, weed control, diseases 
and their prevention, 
adapted varieties, .soil fer­
tility  and irrigation of 
melons

Jim Farley of Dela '̂on will 
discuss the formation of the 
DeLeon area fa rm ers ’ 
market.

J & $ PHONE SERVICE
Telephone h ste le fio n  & lep d r
U teniion  Phones or Complete 

New Nome Wireing.
Key Systems for Home or Business. 

Telephones & A l Equipment Avaioble. 
Worronty Work with Low Prices. 

4 4 2 -1 S 3 9  d ic e  ^

Central Texas Oppor­
tunities, Inc has announced 
the time and locations for the 
distrubution of commodities 
as follow s :

Tuesday, April 24, 1984
Gorman -1 p.m. - 4 p.m. - 

Senior Citizens Center.
Ranger - 9 a m. - 3 p.m. 

Senior Citizens Center.
Carbon - 8 a m. - 11 a.m. - 

Granny’s Store.
Wedne.sday April 25, 1984
Eastland -1 p m. - 4 p.m. - 

Senior Citizens Center.
Rising Star 8 a.m. - 5 p.m. - 

City Hall.
This month the applica­

tions will be re-certified. If 
you pick-up commodities for 
a 'shut in”  please bring with 
your a signed note authoriz­
ing you to receive the com­
modities and to re-certify 
them Also if you have extra 
sacks please bring them with 
you. We will be receiving 
flour, cornmeal, honey, 
cheese and butter.

G WYEAR

Take Good 
Care Of 
Ybur Car At 
Goodyear

G U A R A N T E E D
TRANSMISSION
MAINTENANCE

s e r v i c e  n o t .tvA ilA b l«  (o r H o n d a  
or M e r c e d e s  R e n /

• Mt’p liH 't' t lijic l p .m  
ij.ish t* ! .in d  filte r on 
v i 'h ic le s  so  e q u ip p e t

W a rrd nied  9 0  days or 4 0 0 0  m iles, 
w h ic h e v e r co m e s  first

SAIE ENOS SATURDAY, APRIL 21

LUBE. OIL CHANGE 
& FILTER

mI
I

• In c lu d » u p  lo  liv e  q u a rts  oil • S p e c ia l 
d ie se l oil and tiller type  m ay result in e «tra
c t ia r i i '  .

G U A R A N T EED
12 MONTH TUNE-UP

E le c tro n ic  Ignition System s

^ 3 4
8-Cv(

38 4 2
6-cvi

• ^ lici engine ,»n.Hvse5i Jdiufitmcnts jnd p«(M
If fi'.icrmctt'-. wilhiii i>'Ai
• {’h'i K cfi.cgifiQ '<'.it!ii>q cnginc »slpms in̂ t̂.ill new
lliitjs Set fimi'Kj • HhiiirliH wh»>f»‘ T i
cH.iigt '* v'»'i v.i’ r . m-. Atv

W .irranl«>d 12 F u l l  M o n th s

Mira

G U A R A N T E E D ’
AIR CONDITIONING 

SERVICE
Includes perlormance 
ind lr,iK lest

f'lllS t'E‘0''
Warranted 90 days or 4.000 miles, 

whichever com es first.

GOODYEAR“40” 
BATTERY

39
tnstaMed Groufi 
S ues  ?4 24F

Cradit card convaaianca tor 
aulomotivt noods Pick up an 
appiicatioa now at your ntarby 
Goodyoar rttarior

tv S '*pt CjM d/I- '"A ’T Jt p.l . •C't'Q ft4 i Mii*:5 • fni(- • ■ .r'PiptvA Aheivv** ( III ' *»»•

Goodyear Tires And 
Auto Service For More 
Good Years In Your Car

POLITICKING
The political pot has been 

pulled from the back burner 
to come to a boil, and all 
sorts of real and imaginary 
issues are heating up.

Until recent years there 
was only the Democratic 
primary for Texas voters. 
Now there is also the 
Republican, but so often 
there is no slate of local of­
ficers.

If you vote, “ My party, 
right or wrong,”  you have no 
problem. If you vote the 
Democratic ticket because 
you inherited your daddy’s 
politics along with his 
religion and you will not 
depart from his ways, you 
have no problem-not about 
how you are going to vote, 
anyway.

Of late years, “ getting out 
the vote,”  is very important. 
All the papers, posters, and 
bulletin boards say so. The 
one that irritates me to the 
point of four-letter words is, 
“ Vote the way you please, 
but please vote.”

In my mind that says the 
urger has not spent enough 
time researching the can­
didates to give you reasons 
to vote for his selection, but 
you should vote, even for the 
wrong person, just because 
you ca n ....if you 
remembered to register, of 
course.

This adds to my view-with- 
alarm state of mind about 
politics. It has existed since I 
became suspicious of how 
much influence the media 
has on public consciousness.

Facts can be reported ac­
curately, but they can be 
biased at the same time. For 
instance; “ Candidate Doe 
served on the Liquor Control 
Board at the same time he 
had two cases of septicemia 
ui his office.”

Oh, Wow! Two cases! That 
sounds pretty damning if you 
didn’t happen to get a couple 

; of heel blisters infected when 
you were twelve and the doc­
tor scared you out of your 
wits when he told you that 
you had septicemia.

A recent column by a 
feminist with the initials 
“ B.F.”  brought on this rash 
of political nattering.

I have nothing against the 
feminine gender. Since I quit 
trying to kiss my elbow so I 
could turn into a boy. I ’ve 
even been happy to be a 
woman....most of the time.

No, I do not 
likediscrimination at the 
pay-check level, and I think 
there are few areas where it 
does not exist.

I do not likeknowing that 
an out-of-sync motor has a 
better chance of getting fix­
ed if Walton takes it for 
repairs than if I do.

However, I do not believe 
equality can be legislated. 
Somehow, I cannot get ex­
cited about the “ right”  to an 
abortion on demand. If we 
are going legalistic on the 
matter, abortions probably 
should be mandatory in 
cases of rape and incest or as 
a therapeutic measure when 
damage to the embryo is 
reasonably certain. 'Those 
abortions I can tolerate 
because I believe such a 
child would face a punishing 
existence s/he wouldn’ t 
deserve.

Your ideas of what 
“ equality”  should include 
may differ from mine. I 
grew up believing I should 
pay the pipe if I danced. 
There are a lot of us out here 
who do believe that-men 
and women.

As far as equality goes, 
plenty of men get the short 
end of the stick, too. Why 
shouln’t a man cry? Grief

1 ^  SALE ENOS SATURDAY, APRIL 28
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servicf and (Cl fOui c# f  lUa
öe ifQuifefl »tu 'fcomrrpnöeci paM? ly ^hicd ite  noi
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AUTO SERVICE CENTERS
Owned And Operated By The Qoodyoar Tire A Rubber Company

Everisto Jimeiiez . . . .  ^
aa______  i l 5  I .  M a m  629-2662

7j3^5 Sot.

w ill buy m inerals, 
royalty, overridet and 
producing wells. P.O. 
Box l i l t s ,  Midland, 
Texas 79702 or 
tlS4n-«19L p47

home. Our land. Our desires. 
Our goals. Our respon­
sibilities.

When it comes to voting, I 
expect to mark my ballot. 
But is will not be with any 
firm conviction that my vote 
has much effect on equality, 
morals or love. I think these 
things have to be lived, not 
legislated.

Pre-Test Set At 
e je  For August 
LVN Program

Pre-testing for the Cisco 
Junior College August, 1984 
Licensed Vocational Nursing 
program in Cisco will be held 
Monday, April 30 at 9:00 
a m . in the nursing 
classroom located in the 
Vocational I building on the 
Cisco campus.

Prospective students must 
be at least 17 years of age 
and must be in good physical 
and mental health. Students 
must be high school 
graduates or have suc­
cessfully taken the GED ex­
amination establishing high 
school equivalency

For full information, in­
terested persons (male or 
female) may contact Gerald 
Bint, Vocational Dean at 
(817 ) 442-2567.

Ladie8 Golf 
Set Apr. 26

The Cisco Country Club 
Ladies’ Golf Association will 
hold its annual one day tour­
nament on Thursday, April 
26th. Registration will begin 
at 8:00 a.m. with shotgun 
start at 9:00. Coffee and rolls 
w ill  be served  during 
reglstnition.

• Entry fee is $25.00 which 
includes cart rental and lun­
cheon. Handicaps will be us­
ed for pairing purposes only. 
Mulligans will not be sold.

Ladies entering the tour­
nament should send their en­
try and handicap no later 
than Tuesday, April 24 to 
either of the following:

Mary Ann Perry, 1404 
Primrose, Cisco, Texas 76437 
(817-442-1446 after 5:00).

Letha Stafford, Route 3 
Cisco, Texas 76437 
(817-442-2484).

Game Day

Depend On Us

W e’re  h ere  to help. W h eth er 
h a ’W n iiyou r prescrip tions fllleLl 
a c c u ra te ly  c r  lo o k in g  lo r  ad ­
v ic e  on  over-th e-cou n ter m ed i­
c ines, y o u r  p h a rm a c is t Is qu a li­
fied  to  ass ist you. Call o r  com e 
In  fo r  a ll y o u r  h ea lth  needs.

Eastland

Central
Drug

6 2 M U 1

FLASH+'
WE’RE WORKING 

HARD TO MEET YOUR 
EMERGENCY 

PARTS NEEDS

Set Friday, May 4
The next game day at l.one 

Cedar Country Club will be 
Friday, May 4, beginning at 
10 a.m. All sorts of games 
will be played and prizes 
awarded in each game.

Lunch will be served at 
noon and play resumed. A 
.surprise awaits a lucky per­
son. Fee will be $4 and 
everyone is invited to attend.

We re dedicated to helping you avoid costly 
equipment downtime. That’s why we always 
maintain a large parts inventory. But for those 
times when you have a machine down and 
the parts you need aren’t on hand, we put the 
FLA SH -PLU S system to work. This computer­
ized system locates the part at the nearest 
parts depot, places the order and initiates 
same-day shipment by the quickest carrier. 
With FLA SH -PLU S on the job, you’ll be back 
in the field with minimum delay.

DELMA JOHNSON
203 NEEDHAM STREET 

COLEMAN, TX 
915-625-2126
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Money
doesn’t care who spends it.

Why isn’t “ our”  used more 
often? Our children. Our

KINCAID REAL ESTATE
629-1781100 S. Seaman 

Eastland, Texas 76448

RESIDENTIAL COM M ERCIAL
Located in Olden, Brick 3 bedroom 2 
bath 1800 sq. ft. Home on 1 acre, $49,900. 
Owner Finance.

Excellent Commercial Building located 
on Ave D. in Cisco. Approx 8000 sq. ft., 
plenty of parking. $90,000.

Remodeled frame home located in Car­
bon, 8 acres, 3 bedrooms, 1 bath, good 
tank and fencing, $55,000. ACREAGE
Frame 3 bedroom, 2 bath, 1900 sq. ft. 
fenced yard and storage. Assumable 
V.A. Loan and some owner financing, 
$ 4 9 , 5 0 0 .

5 Acre Tract located in Olden, water 
and gravel road to land, Owner 
Finance, $10,000.

Bank Repo. 2 bedroom 1 bath 950 sq. ft. 
almost Brand New appliances $35,000.

Veterans - Let Kincaid Real Estate find 
you your land on the Veterans I.and 
Board Program.

5 Acres & 1750 sq. ft. Frame home 3 
bedroom. 2 bath, in Morton Valley. 
Owner's I’ inance, $59,500.

226 Acres, 10 miles N. of Cisco, 100% of 
minerals on liM) acres. 80 acres in 
cultivation, $25,000 Down and owner 
finance at $600/acre.

Eastland lots 
63’xl45’, black 
utilities.$4,500.

in Colony 
top roads.

Addition 
All city

1043 Acres, 9 tanks, good hunting in 
Jack County, $425/acre.

Robert M. Kincoid 
(Broker)

Gay Kincoid 
(817) 629-1804

$

YOU
AUTO
KNOW

OOOOO
IN THE 

INTEREST OF 
SERVING 

THIS AREA,
JIM

CALDWELL
BRINGS YOU 

THESE
IMPORTANT

MONEY-SAVING
ARTICLES:

Mr. Fix
CLEAN Fl'RNACF. FILI ER.S

The efiicieiu y of your w arm 
air heating system depends on 
whether or not air can flow 
through the system. The mort- 
the air flow is restricted, the 
less efficient the heating 
system is. With less warm air 
flowing into the system, the 
house doesn't get as warm as 
it should, so you turn up the 
thermostat — thereby using 
more fuel without getting 
more heat.

The air filters m your fur 
nace are 1-in. thick fiber mats 
through which the cold air 
must flow as it moves into the 
furnace. Any dust m the ;»ir is 
deposited on the filters before 
the air passes into the furnace 
As dust builds up after a lew 
weeks, the amount ol air (low­
ing through tlie filter is cut 
down. The only remedy is lo 
clean or replace llie filters 
regularly. The lrei|iiency ol 
change depends on your 
home. Some, especially those 
with a number of small 
children or with j>cls. tend lo 
be dii.slier than others 

In very dusty homes, the 
filters should be cleaned or 
changed every 60 days to 
maintain the heating efficien­
cy and to keep fuel costs low. 
In moderately dusty homes, 
the filters should be clianged 
or cleaned every 90 days 

In homes with a mild dust 
problem, filters probalily need 
to be changed only once, in 
the middle of the sea.son 

If you have an eU'clrosUitk 
or electronic filtering system. 
clean it more often than you 
would standard filters — every 
30 days. Follow the instruc­
tions on the unit, since each 
type is cleaned in a diderent 
manner.
TO REPLACE STANDARD 
FILTERS
1. Purchase filters (as many 

as required for your unit) 
of the correct size To be 
sure of the size, remove 
an old filter and measure 
it.
Remove the access panel 
in the .side of the furnace, 
usually by turning a lock­
ing screw % turn. Keacli 
in and lift filters out of the 
frames in which th<‘y rest. 
The blower should be 
turned off as you do ttiis. 
Fit the new tillers into the 
frames. If you have 
washable filters, you can 
hose them clc-an, alk)wmg 
the water to run through 
the mesh and carry the 
dirt out They can be 
reinserted immediately. 
Close the access door and 
turn the blower on. 

• 'F i x l lF a s t "  Encyclopaed ia 
B fllan n ica , Inc.. 425 N M ichigan. 
Chicago, IL  60611

2.

3.

4.

r - i-
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ATTEND THE CHURCH OF YO UR  CHOICE • • • •

The follnwinc firms, recognizing the importa*'«*r religion 

plays in our community, make this church page possible
each Sunday.

This past week it was my 
privilege to travel to Strat­
ford, Texas and conduct a 
(iospel Meetinj>.

While there, I had the op­
portunity to have lunch with

a wonderful family that 
farmed 6,600 acres of land. 
The farm was truly a sight to
.see.

After lunch a horse was 
.saddled for me and for about

Jhm  Oteo P rtt i Sunday, 
April 22,1984

We’re glad V
>

you asked! K :
with Clifford Chambers

'  r -  i
Cisco Funeral Home _I_A

HELPFUL GROUPS FOR WIDOWS/WIDOWERS
Widows and widowers encounter many new problems. 

Many difficulties have been overcome already by others. 
That's why national and local groups have been formed to 
held the newly widowed.

THEOS, a national, non-denominational group which takes 
its name from its purpose: They Help Each Other Spiritually. 
THEOS helps the young and middle-aged, the recently 
bereaved who need to work through the grief process with 
help from others.

Parents Without Partners is another useful group for 
widows and widowers, having some 500 chapters in the 
United States and Canada. They are concerned with interests 
and welfare of single parents AND their children.
American Association of Retired Persons is a very large, 
organized national group with many personal benefits to 
members over 55.

These groups should a ll be considered by 
widows/widowers as they get ready to re-enter social life. 
For more information, stop in or phone us about them. 

CISCO FUNERAL HOME
203 West 7th Street 817-442-1503

Owned and Operated by the Chambers family.

two hours I rode over part of 
that farm.

As 1 was riding and the 
beauty stretched out before 
me, I could not help but to 
think, “ How can there be 
some who believe there is no 
God."

The prophet Isaiah  
declares of God, “ Who hath 
measured the waters in the 
hollow of his hand, and 
meted out heaven with the 
span, and comprehended the 
dust of the earth in a 
measure, and weighed the 
mountains in scales, and the 
hills in a balance” . (Isaiah 
40:12)

So the next time you have 
opportunity to visit the sea, 
know and understand that 
God knows to the ounce the 
amount of water contained 
therein! The next time you 
have opportunity to gaze at a 
star filled sky, stand in awe 
of the fact that our God 
knows the exact number of 
■tars that are there! Or the 
next time you have oppor­
tunity to visit the great ex­
panse of West Texas, and 
maybe a 6,600 acre farm, be 
impressed with the fact that 
our God does not only know 
the particles of dust contain­
ed in that 6,600 acre farm, 
but of the entire earth!

Truly we need to listen to 
God as He says, "To  whom 
then will ye liken me, or 
shall I be equal? Lift up your 
eyes on high, and behold who 
hath created these things, 
that bringeth out their host 
by number: he calleth them 
all by names by the 
greatness of his might, for 
that he is strong in power; 
not one faileth". (Isaiah 
40:25-26)

May we never be mislead 
by ungodly people who ques­
tion the existence of our 
great God.

by the

;g r £a t e r  m o u n t a in  t o p !
PENTECOSTAL CHURCH

to attend ...
-A- A  '*Bible-Preaching’‘ Church |

if A  "Friendly Church"
★  A  "Spirit'FUled"

Church
it A  Church Where 

Christ Is Cxaulted 
As "The Mighty 

God"
it A  Church 

Where 
Miracles 
Happen I

« 10 M ilst South of C isco on Hwy. 183
«lohn C. Jones 

Pastor

REDEEMER LUTHERAN 
CHURCH

Easter “ Sonrise" Service 
begins at 7:15 a.m. Pastor 
Crockett's message is entitl­
ed “ After The Cross • Our 
Pilgrimage Continues!”  bas­
ed on Luke 24:13-35. Our 
Easter Breakfast in the 
Parish Hall at 8:15 a.m. is 
sponsored by A.L.L. Branch 
1920. All are invited to par­
ticipate. At 9:30 a.m. our 
Sunday School Films shown 
in the Parish Hall: “ The 
Very First Easter”  and 
“ The Lord’s Ascension” , all 
are invited. Our Second 
Easter Service will begin at 
10:30 a.m. Pastor Crockett’s 
m essage is en titled  
“ Perpetual Easter Joy!”  
based on Isaiah 53:8-12.

He was a young private 
like many other soldiers of

Senior Citizens 
Nutrition Mem

Each day we read articles 
that indicate the type of 
foods we eat are involved in 
preventing various kinds of 
diseases, and considerable 
in form ation  is being 
gathered showing that this 
certainly might be true in 
prevention of cancer.

The Illinois Division of the 
American Cancer Society 
became the first state divi­
sion to announce that cancer 
prevention through dietary 
changes would be a major 
part of its educational cam­
paign. This question is: 
Specifically what foods 
should we eat?

Research shows that foods 
rich in vitamin A tend to 
fight the development of 
tumors in many parts of the 
body. This includes, of 
course, fruits and vegetables 
which are deep green, 
orange and yellow. Also 
vitamin C seems to help with 
stomach cancer conditions. 
Once again, fruits, citrus 
fruits, are helpful, while 
broccoli, brussel sprouts, 
asparagus, cau liflow er, 
green peppers, peas, 
raspberries and strawber­
ries are selected foods. 
Remember, whole grain 
foods that are high in fiber 
are cancer-inh ib itors, 
however, the researchers 
cannot explain the reason 
why this is true.

The theme that we are 
becoming more and more in­
volved in diet control is true, 
and that is the reason at the 
Senior Center carefully 
selected foods are properly 
prepared to have proper 
nutrition.

Programs for the week 
w ere : Janet Thomas 
presented an interesting and 
very helpful talk on nutri­
tion, entitled, “ Eating a 
balanced diet” ; Star Bright 
band played; Rev. Cecil 
Deadman and Mrs. Joy 
Deadman presented an 
Easter program; the Senior 
Citizen band and choir enter­
tained. AARP enjoyed a 
covered dish dinner and pro­
gram.

The menus for the coming 
week are:

Monday-- Oven fried  
fish/tartar sauce, french 
fries, mixed vegetables, 
chocolate cake, bread, but­
ter and drink.

Wednesday- Chicken fried 
steak, cream gravy, whip­
ped potatoes, green beans, 
purple plum cobbler, bread, 
butter and drink.

Friday- Meatloaf/cheese, 
corn o'brien, blackeyed 
peas, tossed salad/ca- 
rrots/dressing. chocolate 
pudding, bread, butter and 
drink.

T if i'
Si •

his day. But his officers 
claimed he was involved 
with a radical leader who 
was working against the 
government. The man he 
followed is Christ, who was 
calling the soldier to new 
life. “ As the seed is planted 
in the ground and dies with 
Christ by faith before he can 
come forth as a new redeem­
ed creature,”  says Dr. 
Oswald Hoffmann, Lutheran 
Hour speaker. Hear his 
message and the stirring 
drama “ The Soldier”  Sun­
day at 6:30 a.m. on radio sta­
tion KRBC in Abilene.

Tuesday, The Sunday 
School staR will meet in the 
Parish Hall at 7:30 p.m.

Wednesday, The Care 
Center Worship will be at 
10:30 a.m.

Thursday, Jesus Friends 
will meet in the Parish Hall 
at 9:45 a.m. and 2:45 p.m.

C t n i r d i  D i r e c t o i y
11

IG BRANCH BAPTIST 
CHURCH

Joha Hagaa, Pastor
M iles S. of Cisco 

183-FoU«w Sigas
Sunday School 10:00 a.m. 
Morning Service 11:00 a.m. 
Sunday Evening 6:30 p.m. 
Wednesday 7:00 p.m.

CALVARY 
BAPTIST CHURCH 

Hev. Ronnie Shackelford 
Pastor

18th and Ave. D
Sunday School 9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship 11:00 a.m. 
Training Union 8:00 pjn. 
Evening Worship 7:00 p.m. 
Wednesday Prayer Meeting 
7:30 p.m.

FAITH BAPTIST CHURCH 
TOO West Uth 

J. Doyle Roberts, Pastor
Sunday School 10:00 a.m. 
Worship Service 11:00 a.m. 
Evening Worship 7:00 p.m. 
Wednesday Evening Wor­
ship 7:30 pjn.

NEW LIFE 
TABERNACLE 
307 W. 17th S t 

Rev. Timothy Gray
Morning Worship 10:00 a.m. 
Evening Worship 7:00 p.m. 
Wednesday Bible Study 7:30 
p.m.
Family Night: Friday Night- 
7:30 p.m.

G R E A TE R  M O U NTAIN  
TO P U N ITE D  PE N E T- 

COSTAL CHURCH 
Hwy. 113, I I  miles South of 

Cisco
P.O. Boa 281 Cisco, Texas 

Pastor John C. Jones 
Phone 843-3829 Sunday

Sunday School 10:00 a.m. 
Morning Worship 11:00 a.m. 
Evangelistic Services 7:00 
p.m.
Wednesday Bible Study 7:30 
p.m.

CORINTH BAPTIST 
CHURCH

Cisco-Eastland Highway
Sunday School 10:00 a.m. 
Morning Service 11:00 a.m. 
Sunday Training Union 5:30 
p.m.
Sunday Evening Service 6:30 
p.m.
Wednesday Night 6:30 p.m.

FIRST ASSEMBLY OFG(M) 
Rev. Jackie Stowe 

387 W. 7th S t 
Phone 44MM1 

Sunday School 9:45 a.m. 
Morning WorWiip M:4b a.m. 
Sunday N i ^  8:00 p jn . 
Wednesday Night 7:00 pan.

CATHOUC CHURCHES 
Rev. James Miller

St. Francis, Eastland, 6:30 
p.m. Saturday.
St. Rita, Ranger, 9:45 a.m. 
Sunday
St. John Strawn, 8:00 a.m., 
Sunday
Holy Rosary, Cisco, 11:30 
a.m.Sunday

M ARANATH A B A PT IS T  
CHURCH 

Indepeadeut 
Fnwhuneatal 

Pastor M.H. Jones 
Highway 88 West of Eastiaad 
Sunday School 10:00 aan. 
Prayer Services 6:00 p.m. 
Wednesday Services 7:30 
p.m.

REVIVAL TABERNACLE 
Attention

Special Announcement
Sunday at 1 p.m. on KERC 
Radio, Special preaching, 
annointed singing. 
Deliverance for both soul 
and body all in the name of 
Jesus! Special prayer for the 
sick!

FIRST UNITED 
METHODIST CHURCH 

Rev. Frank Williams, Pastor
Sunday School 9:45 a.m. 
Worship Service 10:50 a.m. 
Evening Worship 6:00 p.m. 
U.M. Women Tuesday 9:30 
a.m.

GREATER ST. MARK 
BAPTIST CHURCH 

Rev. J.C. MlUs, Pastor
Sunday School 9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship 11:00 a.m. 
Evening Worship 6:00 p.m. 
Wednesday Prayer Service 
7:00 p.m.

FOURTH STREET 
CHURCH OF CHRIST 

Sunday 10:30 a.m. 
Evening 5:00 p.m.

FIRST PRE SBYTE RIAN  
CHURCH 

500 W. 6th St.
Rev. William C. Weeks 

Pastor
Sunday School 9:45 a.m. 
Morning Service 11:00 a.m.

WESLEY UNITED 
METHODIST CHURCH 

Rev. Frank Williams, Pastar 
Avc. A

Morning W en^p 9:00 a.m. 
Church School 10:00 a.m. 
Family Night 4th Thursday 
each month.
A d m in is tra tive  Board 
Meeting: 1st Monday Night 
E^ch Month.

CHURCH OF 
THE NAZARENE 
W. 10th and Ave. N 

Rev. C.L. Reneau, Pastor
Sunday School 9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship 10:45 a.m. 
Evening Worship 6:30 p.m. 
Wednesday Prayer Meeting 
7:30 p.m.

n R S T  BAPTIST CHURCH 
Rev. Buddy Sipe 

Sunday School 9:30 a.m. 
Morning Worship 10:50 a.m. 
Church Training 6:00 p.m. 
Evening Worship 7:00 p.m. 
W ednesday: M id-W eek 
Prayer Meeting 7:00 p.m.

CHURCH OF GOD 
Seventh Day 

Romney Community 
South of Cisco

Worship: 11:00 a.m. Satur­
day
Telephone 442-3962

THE LANDMARK 
AP08TOUC 

409 W. 11th street 
Rev. Jay Williams, Pastor

Thursday Night 7:30 pjn. 
Saturday Night Youth Ser­
vice 7:30 p.m.
Sunday Morning at 10:00 
a.m.
Sunday Night at 7:00 p.m. 
442m77

n R ST  EVANGELICAL 
METHODIST CHURCH 

Rev. John W, Clinton, Pastor 
Highway 80 West 

Across From Hospital 
Sunday School 10:00 a.m. 
Morning Worship 11:00 a.m. 
Evening Worship 7:00 p.m. 
Wednesday Hour of Power In 
Prayer 7:30 p.m.

EAST CISCO 
BAPTIST CHURCH 
Rev. Cecil Deadman 

588 E. 11th
Sunday School 9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship 10:50 a.m. 
Training Union 5:30 p.m. 
Evening W or^ p  6:30 p.m. 
M id-W eek S erv ices : 
Wednesday 7:00 p.m.

CISCO CHURCH 
OF CHRIST 

Jim Hatcher, Mfnlster 
1-20 North Access Road at 

Ave. N
Sunday Bible Classes 9:30 
a.m.
Worship Service 10:30 a.m. 
Evening Services 6:30 p.m. 
Wednesday, Mid-Week Ser­
vice 7:30 p.m.
Ladies 10:00 a.m. Tuesday

IN SP IR ATIO N  CHURCH 
OF GOD

Rev. Larry Smith 
Camp Inspirattea-Box 167 

Eastland, Texas 
Sunday School 9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship 10:45 a.m. 
Evening Worship 7:00 p.m. 
Wednesday Service 7:00 
p.m.

CHURCH OF JESUS 
CHRIST OF LATTER DAY 

SAINTS
Opening Exercises 9:30 a.m. 
Primary 9:30-11:10 a.m. 
Priesthood 9:30-10:20 a.m. 
Relief Society 9:30-10:20 
a.m.
Sunday School 10:30-11:10 
a.m.
Sacram ent S erv ic e : 
11:20-12:30

HOLY TR IN ITY 
EPISCOPAL CHURCH 

S. Seaman 
E^astland, Texas 

The Rev. John A. Holmes 
Holy Communion 11:00 a.m.

PLEASANT HILL BAPTIST 
CHURCH

Pleasant Hill Community 
8 miles South of Cisco 
A.G. Purvis, Pastor

Sunday School 10:00 a.m. 
Morning Worship 11:00 a.m. 
Evening Service 5:30 o.m.

BIBLE BAPTIST CHURCH 
Fundamental 

Ave. E. at 17th St.
Rev. Larry Sowels 

Sunday School 10:00 a.m. 
Morning Service 11:00 a.m. 
Evening Service 6:00 p.m. 
Wednesday Worship Service 
7:30 p.m.

REDEEMER LUTHERAN 
CHURCH

Rev. Dell J. Crockett, Pastor 
Ave. D and East Uth

Sunday School 9:30 a.m. 
Worship Service 10:30 a.m.

Jr.,

M IT C H E LL  B A P T IS T  
CHURCH

Joe Phllpott, Pastor
Sunday School 10:00 a.m. 
Preaching 10:45 a.m.
.Sunday Night 7:00 p.m. 
Prayer Service Wednesday 
1:00 p.m.

P R IM IT IV E  B A P T IS T  
CHURCH

James E. Robertson 
Minister

Services 2nd Sunday 
month
Singing 10:% a.m.
Preaching 11:00 a.m.

each

ASSEMBLY OF YAHWEH 
(7th day)

Worship - 11:00 a.m. Satur­
day
Welcome! Only ten minutes 
south of Cisco on U.S. 
Highway 183

FA ITH  CH APE L FU LL  
GOSPEL CHURCH 

388 West Uth 
Rev. James Harris 

9:45 a.m. Sunday 
7:00 pjn. Sunday 
7:30 p.m. Wednoday

FIRST CHRISTIAN 
CHURCH

Mile Steffen, Minister
Church School 9:40 a.m. 
Morning Worship 10:50 a.m. 
BiMeShidy6:%pni.

WORD FAITHOF LIFE 
CENTER

Corner of East 7th k  Ave. A 
Sunday Morning 10:00 a.m. 
Sunday Evening 7:00 p.m. 
Thursday Evening 7:00 p.m.

GOSPEL ASSBMBI^ 
1888 Ave. A. and Bast W h

Bible Thaoing Subject To 
Quastiofl ' j M  Children’s 
Church Sunday 3:38 p.m. 
WonMp Servloe Tburaday 
Saturday 7:38 p.m.
Special Muffc t  Singtag A ll 
S ^ c e s



MEMORIAL GIFTS 
honor the late Carlton 
Holder of our town have 
started something new -  the 
Conrad Hilton Memorial 
Park and Community Center 
Endowment Fund. This was 
announced Friday by Mr 
Dick Woolley, president of 
the First National Bank and 
member of a conunittee that 
is completing plans for the 
Mobley Hilton’s restoration.

The committee announced 
recently that they expect to 
create an endowment fund 
for the perpetual care of the 
Mobley Hilton, restoration of 
which has been underwritten 
by the Conrad Hilton F'oun- 
dation with a 1.2 million 
dollar grant

Two checks as memorials 
to the late Mr Holder were 
received by the committee 
and the endowment fund was 
started. Mr. Woolley said 
•'We re sure that Mr Holder, 
a long-time good citizen of 
our town, would be pleased 
to be so honored,” ,said Mr. 
Woolley

THE BLUEBONNETS are 
beautiful but not as plentiful 
as la.st year That’s the 
report of .Mrs. l/)is Whitaker 
of our town who accom­
panied her si.ster on a trip 
last weekend down south to 
look at the wild flowers . 
.And Mrs. Thelma Bosworth 
and .Mrs. Bill Qualls Howell 
are back from a tour with 
friends from San Angelo to 
look at wild flowers and 
things of mtere.st to the south 
and west More and more 
wild flowers are beginning to 
show their faces, including 
primro.ses along the roads of 
our area.

£ | ^ a t t i ja r ie s .....|

Services For 
Robert Cone 

Are Monday
Robert A. Cone died of a 

ina.ssive heart attack at the 
Bay Shores Hospital in 
Pasadena, Texas on April 14, 
19M.

He was born near Cisco, 
Texas April 12,1920, the only 
sun of the late Arthur and 
Ethel Cone He attended 
Cisco Public Schools and 
was named all district guard 
while playing football with 
the 1938 Cisco High School 
Ixiboes

Bob joined the U S. Navy 
in 1940 He retired as a Chief 
Commissary Steward after 
twenty years of active duty. 
Much of this time was spent 
aboard the U.S.S. Idaho and 
the U.S.S Dealy He retired 
from military service in New 
Orleans, Louisana and 
became associated with Gulf 
Janitorial Service. In 1969 he 
moved to Pasadena, Texas 
and organized Cone, Inc., 
which he operated with his 
sons.

He was a member of the 
St Pius Catholic Church; the 
Fleet Reserve; the U.S.S. 
Idaho Association. Building 
S erv ices  Contractor's 
Association, International; 
Southwest Building Service 
Contractors Association; 
past m em ber of the 
Pasadena Chamber of Com­
m erce; and held his 
membership in the Masonic 
l,odge in Cisco.

Rosary was read for him 
by Senior Father Don 
Neumann of St. Pius Church 
at 7:00 p.m. Sunday, and 
funeral services were held 
April 16th at the Pasadena 
Funeral Chapel. A mass will 
be held Easter Sunday. April 
22nd. Interment was at 
Wooldawn Cemetery in 
Houston following militari 
graveside services 

Robert is survived by his 
widow, Pricilla (Pat) Men- 
diola Cone, who he married 
at Agana, Guam; his sons. 
Tipton Robert, Richard 
Craig, and Mark Louis of 
Houston and William Ray­
mond of Dallas; nine grand­
children, Melanie, Eric. 
Matthew, Natalie, Erin, 
Beck, Scott, Ryan, and 
Mark; four sisters. Mrs. 
Earl Cotten, Abilene, Texas; 
Mrs. E.H. Rosser, Duncan, 
Oklahoma; Mrs. L.J. Nelms, 
Bridgeport; and Mrs. Der- 
ward Morris of Cisco. His 
nephews, Robert, Steve, 
Phillip, and Joe Wayne 
Nelms and Mike and Monte 
M orris , were a ll pall 
bearers.

OUR SCOUTS report that 
the Roy Westfalls are plann­
ing a trip to England this 
summer. His old WWII divi­
sion is having a reunion and 
England is Mrs. RW’s native 
land ...  And we hear that the 
Sutton Crofts are planning a 
European tour before long 

Dr. S.W. Reynolds of Fort 
Worth, a former Methodist 
district superintendent, will 
be in the pulpit at the First 
United Methodist and 
Wesley Methodist Churches 
on Easter Sunday. Rev. 
Frank Williams, the pastor,
IS recovering from an illness 
and Dr Reynolds is filling in 
for him

WENT OVER to Wylie, 
south of Abilene, on Wednes­
day to attend a ground 
breaking ceremony for the 
Hendrick Medical Develop­
ment Corporation’s planned 
150-unit village for senior 
citizens And it was a nice af­
fair. indeed There’s a report 
on the project elsewhere in 
The Press

Mr. .Michael Waters, presi­
dent of the corporation, told 
us that they hope to have an 
announcement soon regar­
ding a new facility adjacent 
to E l. Graham Memorial 
Hospital which Hendrick 
operates here under a long­
term lease

Mr Waters, by the way. 
was born in Cisco His dad. 
Rev. Cooper Waters, was 
pastor of the FTrst Baptist 
(Tiurch here at the time . 
Saw Garner and Mary Altom 
at the ceremony. Mr. GA is 
an official of the corporation 
a.ssigned to the village pro­
ject The Altoms live in a 
new and attractive home 
near the Wylie site 

Also met up with the Rev. 
Jesse Cassle. Abilene 
mini.ster who is a former 
pastor of the First Baptist 
Church in Cusco He reports 
that all’s well at their home. 
Their son Tim. graduate of 
Cisco High School, was 
elected Lions Club district 
governor in Wichita Falls a 
couple of weeks ago. He will 
succeed Archie Chamness of 
Cisco at the coming conven­
tion of Lions International. 
H e  U  a Jacksboro  banker. 
The Cassle's daughter, Kim, 
is married and lives with her 
husband at Monahans 

Another former Ciscoan at 
the ceremony was Dr. Elwin 
Skiles, former president of 
Hardin-Simmons University 

Dick Woolley, president 
of the First National Bank in 
Cisco, was in Abilene at noon 
Wednesday for a meeting of 
the Hendrick M edica l 
Development Corporation 
board, of which he is a direc­
tor

OUR SCOUTS report that 
the striped bass, planted in 
I.ake Cisco a couple of years 
ago, are approaching 
"keeper” size and are biting 
these days . . Glad to see
Mr Howard Thompson, who 
runs the used car and farm 
machinery place out on the 
highway, back on the job 
part-time after a stay in the 
local hospital

THE OWEN Kings of our 
town became grandparents 
for the 4th time on April 10th 
when a nine pound, one 
ounce girl was born to their 
daughter, Mrs. J.W. iGayi 
Clark at Arlington. The little 
lady was named Lindsay 
Nicole. She has a brother, 
Bobby, 3.

Mrs. King spent the past 
week in Arlington and was 
expected home this 
weekend. Grandfather Owen 
reports.

The King’s other daughter. 
Mrs. John L. i Peggy i 
McGaughey of Nacogdoches 
in East Texas has a boy and 
a girl, too.

KILLING RED or fire ants 
isn’t a real big deal, accor­
ding to one of our scouts. 
Here's what you do:

Locate the ant’s den or 
hill. Take a shovel and push 
It into the ground around the 
hill -  about a foot across 
each way. Then, using the 
same shovel, carefully take 
the foot square area out, 
leaving a square hole about 
five or SIX inches deep. F'ill 
this with water Put the 
square piece of earth that 
you lifted out back into the 
hole Tamp it down good.

If the ants reappear, do the 
.same again. You won’t have 
to do it more than two or 
three times, according to the 
report

HOPE YOU FIND a lot of 
colorful and tasty Ea.ster 
Eggs.

Mrs. Owens On 

Lions Program
Mrs. George Owens, who 

retired recently as director 
of the Wrangler Belles drill 
team at Cisco Junior Col­
lege, played the piano and 
sang as the entertainment 
feature at the weekly lun­
cheon of the Cisco Ijons Club 
last Wednesday noon at the 
Colony Re.staurant 

Winston Heidenheimer 
served as program chair­
man and presented Mrs. 
Owens.

Secretary Jasper Cook, 
who has been named zone 
chairman for area Uons 
Club during the new club 
year that begins July 1, 
reported on attending a con­
ference of new district 
leaders with Governor-elect 
Tim Cassle.

AAR P Hear Lindley &  Band

NOTICE OF MEETING OF 
THE GOVERNING BODY 

OF CITY OF CISCO
Notice is hereby given that 

a regular meeting of the 
governing body of the City of 
Cisco w ill be held on the 24th 
day of .April 1984. at 7:00 
p.m ., in the Council 
Chambers at which time the 
following subjects will be 
discussed, to wit 
CALL TO ORDER 
INVOCATION
PRESENTATION Retire­
ment Serv'ce Award to Jesse 
H. Reynolds. Jr

O f legal notices .
ORDINANCE SO. 0-84-7
AN ORDINANCE AMEN­

DING SECTION 6 OF THE 
PEDDLERS ORDINANCE 
OF THE CITY OF CISCO. 
TEXAS REVISING THE 
IT IN E R A N T  VENDOR 
P E R M IT  FE E . AND 
CREATING AN EXCEP­
TION.

BE IT ORDAINED by the 
City Council of the City of 
Cisco, Texas, that Section 6 
of the City’s Peddlers Or­
dinance be amended to read 
as follows:

Section 6: That a license 
permit fee for an itinerant 
merchant or itinerant ven­
dor shall be as follows:

a. One Day Permit $5.00.
b. Seven Day

Permit $10.00.
c. 30-Day Permit $20.00.
d. Annual Permit $75.00.
The license fees establish­

ed in this section shall not 
apply to merchants or ven­
dors of locally home-grown 
agricu ltu ra l fru its and 
vegetab les which were 
grown and produced by the 
itinerant merchant or ven­
dor.

PASSED AND APPROV­
ED on first reading this 27th 
day of March. 1984.

PASSED AND APPROV­
ED on second reading this 
10th day of April, 1984.

CITY OF CISCO 
By Eris Ritchie, 

Mayor
ATTEST;

Ginger Johnson, 
City Secretary 

APPROVED AS TO FORM : 
W.B. Wright, Jr., 

City Attorney

SHOP & SAVE AT 
THE SIDELINES

S02 Conrad Hilton Avanua 
CISCO , TEXAS 76437 

(817) 442-4173

AU SWIMWEAR 25% OFF
PONY APPAREL 20% OFF

ALL PONT A I  A n

CONVERSE SHOES 15/o O ff
ALL OTHER _

MERCHANDISE OFF
Thru April P*33

A budget-priced Coleman® Horiion"* 
air conditioner can keep you from  
being robbed by high u tility  bills.
There’s a thief in your backyard  
in the form of your old inefficient 
air conditioner. It robs you every  
month through your utility bills.
A budget-priced Colem an Horizon 
air conditioner can stop the energy 
thief cold. Call 
your Colem an  
Dealer today.

REWARD YOURSELF!
The Horizon is a budget-priced 
Coieman air conditioner with 
SEER ratings over 8 5 You 
can't find a more efficient air 
conditioner for the price

Ludi
HEAT1NO A AIR CONOfTIONINO

ABC Electric
1208 Avt. F. 

Qteú 442-4421

MINUTES:
ITEM I: Regular meeting 

of April 10. 1984 
ITEM II: Emergency call­

ed meeting of April 12.1984 
REPORTS:

ITEM 1: Financial report 
for February. 1964.

ITEM II: City .Manager 
report.
ULI) BUSINESS;

ITEM 1: Discussion of the 
City Government s role in 
the .Mobley Hotel/Communi- 
ty Center Project.

ITEM 11: Discussion of 
Proposed Community 
Development Block Grant 
Application for 1984-85.

ITEM 111: Discussion of 
Policies. Priorities, and Fun­
ding Methods for Street Pav­
ing.

ITE.M IV: Discussion of 
Installation of Curb and Gut­
ter along Front Street.

ITEM V: Discussion of 
Development of a Contract 
Agreem ent fo r  Street 
Grading.

ITEM VI: Consider Pro­
posals and Consider Ap­
proval of I^ase/Purchase 
Agreement for Acquisition of 
Road Maintainer through 
Revenue Sharing.
NEW BUSINESS:

ITEM I: Presentation and 
Discussion of Economic 
Development Block Grant 
Program.

ITEM II: Set Bid Date for 
Sale of Surplus Equipment:

a. Police car - 1978 Dodge
b. Pickup Truck - 1972 

Ford
c. *4-ton Chassis & Cab - 

1968 Chevrolet
d. Track leader - (Cater­

pillar Model 93S
e. Road Grader - Allis- 

Chalmers Model DD
ITEM III: Consider Ap­

proval of Resolution of the

By Lela Latch Lloyd
"By far the best program 

we have had In many mon­
ths”  and "One of the most 
powerful presentations I 
have ever seen in a chalk 
talk”  were a few of the com­
ments concerning the pro­
gram which Louise Allison 
chaired for AARP at the 
Senior Center on April 19 at 6 
p.m.

More than 80 members 
and guests feasted from the 
home-cooked food as the 
group fellow sh ipped 
together. Four represen­
tatives from the newly 
organized Albany chapter 
joined the festivities. Mary 
Carey of Willow. Ala.ska. 
w as the visitor from greatest 
distance.

Mr. and Mrs. Dixon

City Council of the City of 
Cisco. Texas supporting in­
creased State Highway Fun­
ding. Passage of the Pothole 
Bill and Increased Highway 
Charges.

ITEM IV; Citizen-Council 
Discussion.

ITEM V: Executive Ses­
sion (Pending Litigation).

I. the undersigned authori­
ty, do hereby certify that the 
above Notice of Meeting of 
the governing body of the Ci­
ty of Cisco is a true and cor­
rect copy of said Notice and 
that I posted said Notice on 
the bulletin board in the City 
Hall of Cisco, and said 
Notice was posted on April 
20,1984, at 10:00 a.m. o'clock 
and remained so posted con­
tinuously for at least three 
days im m ediately pro- 
ced ing the date of said 
meeting.

Dated this, the 20th day of 
April, 1984.

a i Y  OF CISCO 
By Ginger Johnson 

City Secretary

Holy Week with his chalk 
drawings of the last day of 
C r is t ’s life. With His carry­
ing the cross up the hill and 
His hanging on the cross bet­
ween the two malefactors. 
The drawings were done to 
appropriate background 
music. Special lights gave 
multiple views following 
their completion. As a grand 
finale to his program. Mr. 
Undley sang an Easter solo 
with the lights still focused 
on the Man on the Cross.

President O.T. Killion 
presided as each chairman 
L in d ley . Lake Leon, 
nnv<i'nii'i1 ;i graphic story of

gave reports on his commit­
tee work. All were commen­
dable but Jack Roberson 
with his total of 179 paid 
members drew most ap­
plause. That number sur­
passes all previous count in 
Cisco’s AARP history.

Directed by Annie Sublett 
and accompanied on the 
piano by Gerald Parks, the 
Senior Citizen Band drew 
many encores with their 
after-dinner music. In full 
uniform, this band, now 
numbering more than 50, ad­
ded their red, white and blue 
special flavor for the even­
ing.

The Osco Press Sunday, 
April 22,1984

SIPnC TANK NEED CLEANING?
Sandtrape Also

Coll LEWIS SEPTIC TANK SERVia
442-23S1 A ftw  5 442-4392 I I  3 P JM .

.-----1 ■

(Sunrise) Service 7:15 o.m. 
Eoster Breokfost 8:15 a.m. 
Sundoy School Films 9:30 a.m.

Second Easter Service 10:30 o.m.
Redeemer Lutheran Church

1 7 0 9 A V O .  D. Gsco

Join Us For Lunch

W e A re Serving:

Chicken &  Dressing

Baked Ham

W aldorf Salad  

Candied Yam s 

Seasoned English Peas

Pineapple Sunshine Cake

Everyone 

Come Out to the

I W HITE ELEPHANT
and Have 

Lunch with Us.
Open 24 Hours 1-20 & US 80 Cisco

All Children Under 12 will 
Receive a FREE EASTER EGG


