
Death toll climbs as heat wave continues
DALLAS (AP) — At least 21 

are known dead and countless 
others have been treated or 
hospitalized in what one health 
official said could be the most 
deadly heat wave ever to hit 
the Dallas-Fort Worth Metro- 
plex

Officials at Dallas' Parkland 
Hospital said 4wo more per­
sons, a 68-year-old woman and 
a 77-year-old man. died in Mon­
day’s 102-degree heat, raising 
the city's total to 14 since July 
7

Nearby Fort Worth has 
recorded seven H-jring the 
same period However, no such 
deaths were reported Monday

At least 16 persons have been 
admitted to Dallas and Fort 
Worth hospitals Four were list­
ed in critical condition Monday 
night

Other cities around the 
stricken area reported isolated 
cases of heat exhaustion, but no 
fatalities

It was a different story in

Dallas Monday as heat victims 
continued to check in at hospi 
tal emergency rooms, some 
still suffering from the city's 
record-high of 107 Saturday 
Monday was the 16th straight 
day that Dallas-Fort Worth 
thermometers went past the 
100-degree mark

National Weather Service fig 
ures Monday showed 26 of 39 
Texas cities and towns that 
were checked with tempera 
tures of 100 or above Wichita

Falls and Childress tied for the 
day's igh at 107

We've been watching very 
closely and keeping in touch 
with the hospitals and we re 
thinking it's going to be the 
worst we ve ever seen if things 
continue the way they're go 
ing. ' said Dallas County Health 
Director Dr Allen Fain 

Tony Badger, an investigator 
with the Dallas County Medical 
Examiner s Office, said. The 
heat seems to be hitting mostly

the older folks I ve never seen 
anything like it before ’

At least ten of the victims 
were over 65 Nine of Dallas 
deaths occurred between Satur 
day and .Monday The others 
died within the last two weeks

Sunday s fatalities were all at 
least 76-years-old. including an 
85-year-old man and his 76- 
year-old wife Police said their 
daughter found them in sepa­
rate bedrooms in their un air 
conditioned apartment

These are people who get 
sneaked up on Fain said 

The elderly are highly vulner 
able right now and they should 
be watched closely by family 
members

Four died in Fort Worth the 
same day Doctors at Peter 
Smith Hospital listed cause of 
the deaths as heat stroke 

Health officials are at a loss 
to explain why the deaths ap­
pear to be concentrated in the 
densely-populated Metroolex

People in the rural areas 
are better acclimated to the 
heat suggested state Deputy 
Health Commissiorver Dr Play 
mond Moore Most Texas 
ranchers and farmers can tol 
erate an awful lot of heat 

Dr Moore said city dwellers 
appear to suffer more because* 
they are used to air-condi 
tioning

P’orecasters declined to make 
any guesses on how long the 
heat wave would last Dick p]l

der, a meteorologist with the 
National Weather Service said 
the ovenlike condition is 
created by hoi winds blowing 
north from Northern Mexico

Usually, the summer winds 
are more off the (lulf. but the 
position of a high pressure 
ridge ov-er Texas has brought 
in southwesterly winds from 
Mexico, he .vnd One«* that 
hot air gets over here it s hard 
for another system to break 
through
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Vance assists in peace meeting 
of Egypt, Israel foreign heads

By MARCUS ELIASON 
Associated Press Writer

LONDON (AP) -  With Sec­
retary of State Cyrus Vance on 
hand to nudge them along, the 
foreign ministers of Israel and 
Egypt are meeting for two days 
in an attempt to get the stalled 
peace negotiations between 
their governments going again 

A top U S official said the 
talks between Moshe Dayan of 
Israel and Mohammed Ibrahim

Kamel of P^gypt at l^eds 
Castle 45 miles southeast of 
London were 'exploratory. " to 
try to stake out ground that is 
common to both the Israeli and 
Egyptian positions Me .said no 
breakthroughs are expi'cted 

However. U S officials said 
Vance would urge P̂ gypt to 
spell out security guarantees 
for Israel, particularly against 
the use of the W'est Bank of the 
Jordan River as a base for Pal­

estinian attacks on Israel The 
American idea is that this 
would put new pressure on Is­
raeli Prime Minister Men- 
achem Begin to relinquish the 
West Bank and the Gaza Strip 

The Americans said the 
Egyptians appear to have 
grown more understanding 
of the Israeli obsession with se­
curity and the fear of the West 
Bank under hostile leaders 
within cannon shot of Tel Aviv

One U S official said Vance 
hoped to set up an accelerated 
negotiating schedule with fol 
low-up talks between Dayan 
and Kamel possibly beginning 
next week These might be held 
at P̂ l Arish, on the Mediterra­
nean coast of Sinai

'Our hope." .said Vance on 
his arrival, Monday from the 
Bonn summiit conference, "is 
that new momentum can be 
given to the peace process by

Oklahoma City officers seek 
beat-up station wagon in murders

OKLAHOMA CITY lA P i- A  
nationwide all-points bulletin is 
out for a beat-up green station 
wagon seen speeding with its 
lights out from a shopping cen 
ter where six restaurant work 
ers were later found slam 

Police spokesman Tom Mun 
dy said the bulletin was issued 
in reaction to reports that a 
1970-73 wood-paneled Oldsmo- 
bile was seen leaving the park­
ing lot of the Southern Hills 
Shopping Centrr late Sunday 
Police refused to say who had 
seen the station wagon or to 
discuss any other possible 
clues

We ll have to keep those 
things to ourselves for prose­
cution in the case, for evi 
dence, " Detectivi Sgt Jim 
Woodie said Monday 

Mike Click, 25, manager of 
the Sirloin Stockade Restau 
rant, found the six victims -— 
each shot in the head — in a 
walk-in food cooler at about 11 
p m Sunday

Click had gone to the steak 
house because supervisors in 
the chain restaurant's home of­

fice were disturbed when em­
ployees did not call in nightly 
cash totals and could not be 
reached by telephone

Five male workers were dead 
when police arriyed. Mundy 
said

The sixth victim. Tern Horst. 
16. of Oklahoma City, was rush 
ed to Oklahoma Children's Me­
morial Hospital suffering from 
gunshot wounds to the head and 
chest

Mundy said she never re­
gained con.se lousness and died 
at 12 15 am  Monday before 
doctors could get her to an op 
crating room

A friend of .Miss Horst. Car 
los Joyce, told police he arrived 
at the restaurant to meet her at 
10 30 p m but the employees 
were not finished working Ac­
cording to Monday. Joyce went 
back to his car and drove 
around for half an hour arriv­
ing back at the restaurant just 
as Click drove up 

The other victims were iden­
tified as assistant manager 
I-ouis Zacharias. 40 Isaac 
Freeman, 56. a janitor, Antho 
ny Teu. 17, David Saizman. 16, 
all from Oklahoma City, and 
David Lindsay. 17, of Moore, an 
Oklahoma Citv suburb

Carter says US 
will use less oil

By FRANK ( OR.MIER 
Associated Press Writer

WASHINGTON lAP) -  Pres 
ident Carter is home from the 
Bonn economic summit meet­
ing. where he promised to re­
duce U S oil consumption .Now

Proposal could lower 
local tax for schools

Property owners in the 
Pam pa Independent School 
D is tr ic t could find their 
property taxes for school 
operations reduced if a proposal 
m a d e  by tw o  s t a t e  
representatives becomes law

Gov Dolph Briscoe said 
Monday that he is very 
interested in a proposal put forth 
by Representatives Jim Nugent 
of Kerrvill and Lynn Nabers of 
Brown wood

The proposal would dedicate

Business
valuations
considered

The Board of Equalization 
met this morning in the county 
court room to consider the 
valuation of the industrial roll

Representatives of various 
business, that had been notified 
about the new valuation on their 
business were present for the 
meeting Itie business people 
had a chance to go over this new 
valuation with members of an 
appraisal firm

The commissioners were on 
han<W to settle any dispute 
between the businesses and the 
appraisal firm

After all business' complete 
t h e i r  v a l u a t i o n ,  th e  
commissioners will meet as a 
Board of- Equaliiation. later 
today. to settle any deputes, and 
render derisiona on the disputed 
valuations

one-fourth of the revenue from 
the state's general sales and use 
tax to reduce school ad valorem 
taxes throughout the state, the 
governor explained

la m  extremely interested in 
any proposal which could result 
in a lowering of property taxes 
and particularly those levied by 
our Texas school districts, 
Briscoe said

Nugent and Nabers explained 
that to be eligible to receive 
additional state funds, under 
their proposal, a school district 
must reduce the ad valorem 
taxes it levies for maintenance 
and operation purposes by $200 
for each $220 it will receive 

The maximum amount by 
which a sc'hool district would 
have to reduce its taxes would 
be 50 percent ITie new" state 
money, the two House members 
said, would be distributed to 
school districts on a per average 
daily attendance basis with the 
1978 share being $220 per ADA 

P re lim in a ry  s ta tis t ic s , 
according to the governor's 
staff, show the proposal, if

approved, would reduce Pampa 
school taxes by 26 percent with 
an additional $78.965 in state 
money being received 

In McLean the tax reduction 
would be IS percent with $5.667 
in state money and Lefors would 
receive $3.sn with an eight 
percent tax reduction 

There would be no tax 
reductions or additional state 
money for the Alanreed or 
Grandview-Hopkins schooL. the 
guveiiKir's office reported

he faces the difficult task of 
getting Congress to help him 
make good on that vow 

After two days of meetings 
with the leaders of six other 
major, non-communist industn 
a I nations in Bonn, West Cfer 
many. Carter told reporters 

Each one of us was cautious 
not to promise things we could 
not subsequently deliver 

Carter will have no trouble 
fulfilling one part of his prom­
ise. raising U S oil prices, but 
the other part — a cutback m 
U S oil imports — may be a lot 
tougher to achieve 

The president said in Bonn 
that to help dampen oil con­
sumption by Americans, he 
would increase the price of do­
mestically produced oil — now 
an average of $8 99 a barrel — 
to the world market level 
about $13 50 a barrel, by the 
end of 1980

Actually. Carter can achieve 
that goal, and sooner than 
promised, by dang nothing 

Under legislation Congress 
passed after the 1973-74 Arab 
oil embargo, price controls on 
domestic oil automatically will 
expire in May 1979. and prices 
would rise to world levels The 
result would be a seven-cent 
boost in retail gasoline prices 

But in curbing oil imports, 
the president will have a fight 
on his hands, no matter how he 
goes about it

Carter's proposal to reduce 
consumption by imposing a tax 
on domestic crude oil. thus 
making it competitive in price 
with imported oil. is in deep 
trouble in Congress 

Observers say that in an elec­
tion year, and with Proposition 
13 pressures mounting among 
the voters against higher taxes, 
it would take a miracle to get a 
crude oil tax through Congress 

The same pressures would 
work against any attempt by 
Carter to achie'’e the u m e  re­
sults by imposing a <|uoU or 
fee on oil imports, which he 
can do without permission from 
Congress

Click guessed that more than 
$1.000 had been stolen from the 
restaurant s safe, basing his es­
timate on a normal Sunday 
take of $1,000 to $2,000

Laboratory tests Monday de­
termined two pistols were used 
m the slayings and at least nine 
shots were fired in the cooler 
Mundy said, indicating at least 
two assailants were involved

"This IS the most horrendous 
crime in the Oklahoma City- 
area since I ve been a police of 
ficer. ' Chief Tom Heggy said 
"Uve talked to officers who 

have been on the force 20 to 25 
years and it's the worst they've 
seen It was a shock to walk 
into that cooler and see those 
five victims. "

Police said the victims were 
slain between 10 30 p m and 11 
p m

the discussion which will b(* 
taking place, and that we can 
see further direct negotiations 
between the piarties "

Egyptian President Anwar 
Sadat suspended the negotia­
tions between Dayan and Ka 
mel in January before they 
really got started, because of a 
deadlock over the future of the 
West Bank and Gaza, which Is­
rael captured in the 1967 war. 
and the 1 1 million f^alestinians 
living there The deadliKk con­
tinues

Egypt wants Israel to return 
the West Bank to Jordanian 
rule and the Gaza Strip to 
Egyptian rule After five years, 
the Palestinians in the two 
areas would be allowed to 
choose their own destiny

Begin refuses to surrender 
the territories, which he consid­
ers historically part of Israel 
He ha,s offered to give them ci­
vilian autonomy under Israeli 
military guard And he refu.ses 
to allow Palestinian statehood 
even after five years

A U S official said the two 
sides are agreed that they want 
peace and that there should be 
a five-year transitional period 
Israel also is prepared to re­
turn the rest of Sinai to Egypt 
although so far it refuses to dis­
mantle the Jewish settlements 
which have been established 
there

Complicating the situation is 
a deep split in the Israeli cabi­
net and the unrelenting pres­
sure of militant Arabs on Sadat 
to abandon the peace initiative 
he launched by visiting Jerusa­
lem eight months ago

Equal rights extension 
clears first big hurdle

By Vi. DAI,E NELSON 
Associated Press Writer

WASHINGTON lAP) -  A 
proposal to extend the deadline 
for ratification of the Equal 
Rights Amendment cleared its 
first hurdle in the Hoase 
Judiciary Committee today by 
a vote of 23-8

Before an overflow audience 
of ERA supporters and oppo­
nents. the committee turned 
aside a move by Rep Harold 
Volkmer, D M o. that would 
have required the extension to 
get a two-thirds vote if it reach­
es the House floor

Supporters were confident of 
securing committee approval 
by a close vote later in the day 
for an extension of three years 
and three months, scaled down 
from the seven-year extension 
originally sought

Rep Robert McClory of Il­
linois. the committee's ranking 
Republican, led off the opposi­
tion to the extension McClory, 
who voted for the ERA when it 
was originally approved by the 
House, said the extension would 
do "more harm than good ” to 
the prospects of ratification

G)unly school 
board to meet

A called session of the Gray 
County school board will be held 
at 9 a m Friday in the county 
courthouse ' annex on East 
Frederic

Rena Belle Anderson, cowity 
school superintendent, said 
items to be considered by the 
board include office and travel 
expenses
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A l t e r n a t e  p o w e r
When electricity came to the Panhandle, many of the windmills which dotted the 
landscape were replaced with electric motors as the power lines criss-crossed the 
land. But, with higher costs for electric energy, the 'old faithful " seen mainly in 
use to provide stock water on ranches may become popular as a source of less 
expensive water. The power lines and the windmill are keeping company at South 
Hobart and McCullough streets. (Pampa News photo by Ron Ennis)

He sa)d he believed ratifica­
tion could be secured by next 
March 22, when the original 
seven-year period expires The 
measure is designed to guaran­
tee equal protection of the law 
regardless of sex

McClory predicted the Illinas 
legislature would ratify the 
ERA at a special session in No­
vember. although it has refused 
to do so in the past He said 
this would give impetus to oth­
er states to follow suit

If the ERA does not make it 
by the dead.me, he said. Con­
gress should start the process 
over again and this time sub­
mit the measure for ratification 
by state conventions — the oth 
er alternative outlined in the 
Constitution

Thirty-five state legislatures 
have approved the ERA, al 
though four of them — in Ne­
braska. Idaho, Tennessee and 
Kentucky — later rescinded ap­
proval Kentucky's rescission 
action was vetoed by the acting 
g o v e r n o r  Thirty-eight, or 
three-fourths of the states, 
must approve the measure for 
ratification ^

Rep Thomas Railsback. R- 
III . said he would offer an 
amendment providing that 
state legislatures that have al­
ready ratified the measure 
could withdraw their approval 
during the extension period 
Congress has not yet indicated 
whether rescission actions are 
legal

Railsback. who also voted for 
the ERA when it passed Con­
gress. said his amendment was 
needed to "assure the Ameri­
can people that their Con­
stitution is not being latfairly 
altered "

The new deadline under the 
compromise 39-month extension 
would be June 22. 1962

Justice orders abortion 
clinic records given court

By RICHARD CARELLI 
Associated Press Writer 

WASHINGTON (APi -  Su 
preme Court Justice William J 
Brennan Jr has ordered Texas 
abortion clinics to surrender 
patients medical records to a 
state judge, providing the 
patients names are deleted 
from the documents 

Brennan's order came Mon 
day from his summer home in 
Massachusetts

Reproductive Services Inc . a 
Dallas-based firm that operates 
a group of abortion clinics, had 
asked that it be allowed to 
withhold the medical informa 
lion pending a formal appeal to 
the full Supreme Court 

Reproductive Services had 
a rg u ^  that an order issued 
last month by Judge Dee 
Brown Walker of Dallas has the 
effect of invading its patients 
privacy rights

The controversy stems from 
a May IS lawsuit filed against 
the firm by a Dallas woman. 
Claudia I>ott She sued for $15 
million for mjiries allegedly 
suffered in an abortion she un­
derwent last September

.Mrs Lat suffered a per 
forated uterus and was ho.spi 
talized briefly after her abor­
tion

Her lawsuit, now pending he 
fore Judge Walker, sc*eks 
records of five patients other 
than herself who are not par 
ties to the lawsuit In addition 
It seeks medical records of all 
other patients at Reproductive 
Services clinics who had any 
major or serious complications 
and records of all patients who 
received certain types of medi 
cation

The firm's emergency re­
quest seeking to set aside 
Judge Browns order was 
turned down by Justice William 
H Rehnquist on June 30 and 
Reproductive Services then 
turned to Brennan

In a two-page order Brennan 
said in essence that the firm s 
fears were unfounded

The question sought to be 
raised by (Reproductive Serv 
icesi — whether the names of 
abortion patients can be obtain 
ed by discovery for use in a

civil suit against a perscH*. or 
clinic perlormmg abortions — 
IS a serious one. Brennan 
said

However this ussue is not 
presented here F'irsi the order 
of the trial court did in fact 
provide that the names of the 
patients could be deleted 
Brennan said

Second tht slate of Tr\av 
has represented in its re 
sponse that it is prepared to 
enter into a protective order 
which will ensure the privaev 
of all patients at (Reproductive 
Services I clinics he said

Brennan refused to postpone 
the effect of Judge Brown s or 
der o n  the express condition 
that the parties agree to a pro­
tective order ensuring the 
privacy of patients

The Supreme Court ruled in 
1973 that women have a con 
stitutional right grounded in 
their right to privacv to have 
abortioas free from government 
interference during the first 
two trimesters of their preg 
nanev

T o r y ’s News

■ TI» only froettem which 
d ts e r m  the name, it that of 
p a n i ia t  our own food in our 
own way. lo  long as we do not 
attempt to dqrive othen of 
theiraer im pedettwiriflarUto 
o h ta in it“

-John  Stuart Mill
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EVER STRIVING FOR TOR O ' TEXAS 
TO  BE AN  EVEN BEHER PIACE TO  LIVM

Let Peace Begin With AAe
TBit n«w «pap«r it dedicated to furnithing information to owr reoderi m  that 

they can better promote and pre«erve their own freedom and encourage other« to 
tee it« bleising. For only when man under«tand« freedom and i« free to control 
himself aitd all he possesses can he deveic p to his utmost capabilities.

We believe that all men are equally endowed by their Creator, artd not by a 
government, with the right to take moral action to preserve their life and property 
of«d secure more f r e e d ^  ond keep it for themselves ortd others.

To discharge this responsibility, free men, to the best of their ability, must 
understand and apply to daily living the great moral guide expressed in the 
Coveting Commandment.

(Address all communications to The Pampo News, 403 W. Atchison, P.O. 
Drawer 2198, Pampa, Texas 79065. Letters to the editor should be signed and 
names will be withheld upon request.

(Permission is hereby granted to reproduce in whole or in part any editorials 
originated by The News and appearing in these columns, providing proper credit 
is given.)
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One by one
Socialists gam ground by taking over 

voluntary private organizations one by one 
For instance, years ago they succeeded in 
doing away with competition with the 
government post office by making 
government roads and canals not available 
for the private post offices, such as the 
Overland Express, the Pony Express, and 
Wells Fargo This way they eliminated 
private competition with their post office 
The poor service that we get from the post 
office is the result of this eliminated 
private competition with their post office

Another step the socialists took was to 
start tax-supported government schools 
which forced everyone who supported 
private schools, either church related or 
otherwise, to pay taxes towards the 
government schools before they could 
contribute or pay towards voluntary 
schools

As a result of this, the government 
schools have dominated the primary and 
secondary educational fields for years and 
the lack of reading, writing and arithmetic 
abilities among the graduates of these 
schools has become a national scandal

Other instances in which the socialists 
have controlled private organizations are 
when they have insisted that such 
organizations as the telephone companies, 
the light companies, and the radio and TV 
stations have government franchises 
before they are permitted to operate These 
government regulations have eliminated 
competition in many instances, and. while 
businesses operated in these fields are 
nominally private, they are so under the 
thumb of government control that they are 
not really examples of free enterprise

The socialists regulated the railroad 
industry to such an extent that they have 
practically regulated private passenger 
trains out of business and taken over that 
area with direct government operation, 
which is run so poorly that it must be 
subsidized to the tune of millions and

After thought
Contrary to popular opinion, a Supreme 

Court decision is not the law of the land, but 
merely the law of the case 

That means that the Allan Bakke opinion 
decides the fate of Allan Bakke. but offers 
no certitude for anyone else 

In fact, the benefit to Bakke is 
questionable llie would-be doctor was 34 
years old when he sued He was 38 when the 
judicial mill ceased to grind. He will be 41 
by the time he gets that piece of paper on

the wall that proves him to be a 
p ra c titio n e r  of the healing arts. 
Procedurally. the litigation confirms that 
the ballgame got lost in an argument with 
the umpires

Substantially, the court reached a Mount 
Everest of obscurity. The opinion 
resembles a profit-md-loss statement 
without a bottom line. The sum of it seems 
to be. you can discriminate a little bK but 
don't discriminate too much

Phony ‘reform ’ bill
A rose, they say. by any other name 

would still be a rose, but a bill in Congress 
labeled “reform" could be just about 
anything

The most recent bill headed with the 
"reform " tag was the one that the senate 
has been wrangling with for the past six 
weeks It was called th e '' labor law reform 
bill" but wasn't so much reform as it was 
special-privilege legislation

The bill brought on a filibuster that 
brought on six votes of cloture, which is 
nothing nMre than a vote on whether or not 
to shut off debate The senate could never 
agree to do that, so the bill finally was sent 
back to committee for revision. Just what 
changes will be made and whether or not 
the opponents of the bill will Find them 
palatable enough to withhold debate is yet 
to be seen It is rather doubtful It is 
doubtful, in fact, that the bill will ever 
come out of committee again this year If it 
doesn't, that would be good It is a bad bill 
and bad bills can never be papered over 
with purple profe and good-intended 
Btickum.

This was a significant defeat for union 
officiala. probably the nwat significant 
since the attempt to repeal section 14(b) 
(right-to-work law) in IMB

Union officials had pulled out all the 
stops to try to get this “reform" legislation 
passed. 'They had cashed in all their 
political I.O.U.s in an effort to assure the 
passage of this legislation. But they ran out 
of gas before they got to the finish line.

The senate voted "no date certain” for a 
return of the bill, using the term “if and 
when" to describe its dim chances of being 
resurrected in this session, frith numerous 
appropriations bills taking priority

Out in California, the voters turned out in 
droves to pass Proposition 13 which put the 
hatchet to taxes. It is obvious that they 
mean business ^  that this mood is 
prevalent all over the country.

It also is obvious that the so-called labor 
reform bill was aimed at right-to-work 
states, most of which are located in the 
South. The unions want to get a foothold 
down here, and they wanted to do that with 
leverage from the labor bill.

JudginI from other sections of the 
country that have welcomed unions with 
open arms — and now are suffering as a 
result of that — the wave of unionism in the 
south might tend to dribble down to a little 
ripple as it reaches the shores of old 
Siiwanee

ByTOMWICKBIl
NEW YORK -  In 1171, Jkn McOufBe 

won oile of the four seats from Nortii 
Carolina's ad Senate » s tric t, flidaiiii« 
third in an at-large race, just a  thousand 
votes behind the lender. But when Senator 
McDuffie sought réélection last hlay. he ' 
came in fifth. 4,000 votes behhtd the top 
man, and loot his seat.

In 107B, you see, Jtan McDuffie promised 
to support the Equal RigMs Amendment. 
But once in the State Senate, he cast the 
crucial single vote that DEFEATED the 
ERA, after it had passed the House. So in 
1971, ERA supporters helped unseat him. 
That's politics.

And that kind of give-and-take and play 
of forces in our fluid American political life 
is an excellent reason why Congress should 
vote to extend the time limit for passage of 
the ERA. That would be politics, too - not a

question of how you play the game, but of 
who wins.

As was pointed out in a  recent letter to 
The New York Tiroes by Rep. Eisabeth 
Htritsnum, the principal sponsor of the 
extension resolution, and othir proponents, 
there's no real tradition or custom • much 
l e u  a constitutional or statu tory  
requirement - for a time limh for passage 
of a Constitutional Amendment . The ftrst 18 
amendnients,* including the Bill of Rights 
■nd the' monumental Fourteenth, had no 
such limit. The original seven-year 
limitation on passage of the ERA w u  not 
part of the antemhnent itself, but a section 
of the legislation by which Congreu 

.proposed it to the states; so there’s no 
fundamental reason why Congress cannot 
change its collective mind and choose to 
extend the period, u  it extends countless 
other programs and processes.

And It’s nonesenu  to call such an 
extension for the ERA "unfair” : M the 
time Unlit was. arbitrary, so would be 
extension, and one is no more and no 1̂ , .  
unfair than the other. To those who say 
extension would be like changing the rules 
of baseball in the eighth inning because one 
team is behind, an equaUy dubious analogy 
should be eked - that many a manager has 
stalled for time^ hoping for rain to end the 
game in the eighth inning while his team 
was ahead. That’s  baseball AND politics.

Besides, an extension would provide as 
much time for rescissions — of which there 
already have been three by states that had 
passed the ERA — as for ratifications. 
Whether rescissions are legal ultimately 
will be up to Congress, which decides 
whether or not the necessary three-fourths 
of the states have ratified an amendment; 
but if an extension should result in

r r .

millions of dollars
Socialists invaded the medical area with 

Medicare. Medicaid and other forms of 
socialistic medicine

Now these socialists are active in 
regulating the manufacture of automobiles 
by using the excuse that fuel is in short 
supply ; they ignore the fact that the reason 
it is in short supply is the socialistic 
regulations which have existed for years 
upon petroleum products.

The socialists first caused a shortage of 
petroleum products by controlling the 
price, then they used this shortage as an 
excuse to impose regulations upon the 
automobile manufacturers which are 
causing these automobile manufacturers a 
multiplicity of problems in trying to 
produce smaller cars which would use less 
f uel When these smaller cars proved not to 
be as safe as larger cars, socialists then 
attacked the automobile manufacturers for 
producing “unsafe" cars which are a direct 
result of the socialistic regulations the 
socialists thennselves imposed They ignore 
the physical fact that in collisions the 
heavier, larger cars tend to sustain less 
damage than the lighter,, smaller cars. In 
their hatred of private ownership of 
businesses, socialists ignore the laws of 
physics

Thus, one by one. socialists are gradually 
gaining more and more government 
control over former free enterprise 
companies, and in doing so they blame free 
enterprise for the problems which their 
socialistic measures have caused.

Many private enterprisers fail to 
understand the dangers to themselves 
when socialists make inroads upon another 
field than that in which they are directly 
engaged They fail to protest socialistic 
inroads except when directly concerning 
their own enterprise Sometimes they even 
fail to protest then. Private enterprisers 
should defend all private enterprise from 
socialistic inroads, but few do

^ a u l  IHarveu

Is yours a four-star church?

The fact that I bring something to your 
attention does not necessarily indicate 
approval.

You and I have learned to understand one 
another — and when something really 
matters we .just say so; I in these' 
commentaries and you in your response.

Today I am intrigued by something I am 
not yet prepared to endorse: a “rating for 
churches."

Frequently you select a movie or a meal 
b a s e d  on s o m e b o d y  e l s e 's  
recommendation. Most every newspaper 
has a theater critic you have learned to 
trust. Similarly, you and I frequently follow 
the lead of some professional sampler of 
restaurants

It can be argued that knowing a 
restaurant reviewer may be dropping in 
tends to motivate all restaurateurs to seek 
after excellence

What I'm leading up to is: What would 
you think about a "church critic” 7

I mean a person who visits various 
churches and rates each church service 
with one to four stars.

There is such a critic in Cleveland and he 
may be the first of many.

George Plagenz is 53. a graduate of 
Harvard Divinity School, now religion 
editor of the Clevdand Press. ,

Since February he has been dropping in 
unannounced on church services in that 
city and subsequently reviewing the 
service in Monday’s paper.

He may evaluate the “interest and 
impact of the sermon.” He may chastise 
the congregation. Recently he wrote that a 
certain Lutheran congregation made him 
feel "as though he had arrived uninvited at 
a very private club.”

Of a Catholic priest's sermon. Plagenz 
wrote that it was “too bland."

Understandably, he has outraged many 
worshipers who consider his intrusion 
sacrilege.

Plagenz confided to the Wall Street 
Journal his self-imposed standards of 
measure.

In each church or synagogue he visits he 
,  seeks to evaluate how the service 

im presses him — music, sermon, 
atmosphere. How the congregation reacts.

And why are the people who are not there 
— not there?

Churches are rated with stars from none 
to 12. Plagenz says, “The worship service 
is the basic evangelical tool of the churches 
to get people to come to the Lord—yet a lot 
of people get so little out of ineptly handled 
church services that they stay home, 
perhaps to watch a more inspiring religious 
program on TV."

So far only two churches have rated "12 
stars" in Plagenz’ judgment. One is a black 
s to re f ro n t church where he was 
“personally prayed for three times”

The other was a Baptist church where, he 
says, the hymns were sung with gusto and 
th e  p reach e r ‘‘blasted lilylivered 
clergymen who deny heaven and hell and 
never talk about the blood of Christ."

And even those who are unwilling to 
delegate this much influence to any one 
church visitor must concede that our 
churches are visited by “unofficial critics” 
every week. Perhaps it would be helpful to 
leam why some never come back.

More spinoff
By BUTLER D. SHAFFER

There have been at least two major 
byproducts of California voters' approval 
of Proposition 13: (1) governments have 
been put on notice that there is a limit to the 
amount of fleecing taxpeyers will tolerate. 
The traditional political practice of "never 
mind the costs, we'll just raise taxes next 
year” will not be so easy to continue. (2) 
P e o p le  a r e  r e d is c o v e r in g  th e  
m arkert-place as an alternative to 
government services. In Los Angeles, a 
private group has offered to take over the 
o p era tio n  of a government-owned 
museum; the San Marino public schools 
have gone ahead with plans for sununer 
school — on a fee basis of |60 per student;  ̂
private citizens are voluteering to work' 
with local polidriii programs aimed at 
crime prevention^jrivate businesses have 
undertaken pro^Fttris to absorb laid-off 
government employees into their work 
force; and a backer of Proposition 13 has 
even run a newspaper ad encouraging 
other people to voluntarily support 
( t h r o u g h  c o n tr ib u t io n s )  th o se  
governmental services they «rish to keep.

Thus, while a number of opponents of 
Proposition 13 have clucked about the 
decline in “pdblic-spirited" activity, and 
the loss of a “sense of community,’’ it 
seems to me that just the opposite is true. 
Proposition 13 has caused people to spend 
more of their time, energy, and money in 
direct support of programs they favor, 
instead of just sitting b a c k ^  expecting 
other taxpayers to fund their preferences. 
Who knoers, we may see a return to the old 
notion that charity is a personal matter, 
where one person helps another, instead of 
a n  im p e rs o n a l ,  b u re a u c ra tiz e d , 
computerised, “give«veryane4-nuihber’' 
scheme designed to permanently expiott 
the poor for the benefit of those who seek 
power. In time, perhaps people may come 
to reclaim "society’' itself from the 
clutches of government, and return it to ; 
where it belong: in the hm ds of the people.

I am reminded of a joke 1 heard years 
ago about the miaeionary who had bem

captured by cannibals in New Guinea. As 
he sat cooking in the pot. the cannibals 
would occasionally jab a knife into one of 
his veins and drain off some of his blood 
into a cup At long last he stood erect and 
shouted "enough! It's not so much that I 
mind being your main course, but I'm tired 
of being stuck for the drinks! ”

This story seems an appropriate analogy 
to the p l i ^  of American taxpayers and 
their current revolt. Of course, there will 
be some like Sentor George McGovern 
who. in perfect "new-think” reasoning, will 
accuse the overdrained taxpayers of 
"taking from the needy.” In other words, 
“get back in the pot, missionary, and stop 
being selfish; some of these cannibals 
haven’t eaten for two days! Have you no 
compassion for those who are hungry?” 
Richard Nixon’s greatest contribution to 
history may prove to be his having kept this 
Black Hilb-buffoon from inflicting his “tq> 
is down, black is whhe, 2 plus 2 is 6” 
qientality on an entire nation for eight 
years.

Meanwhile ADemocratic (3ongresaman 
from California chastised voters for 
seeking “to avoid their responsibilities.” 
and National Urban League president Vern 
Jordan characterized the taxpayer’s revolt 
as a "w aronthepoor .” Jordan went so far 
as to call the passage of Proposition 13 a 
“ triumph of the politics of setftthness.’’ But 
if those who are tired of having close to 40 
percent of their income siphoned-off and 
given to others are considered “selfiah,” 
what adjective should be attached to those 
who have made a career out of living off the 
production of others? Is Jordan's remark 
not akin to suggeating that slaves in the 
ante-bellum south were thinking only of 
their “seifish” interests when t h ^  sought 
to escape from slavery? If we were to 
follow his strMge reeuamlng, we would 
have to conclude that a "selfish'’person is 
someone who puU Ms “greedy" interesU 
aheadofours! .

From hare. It doea not appetf likely that 
the taxpayers will be inclined to clim b back 
into the “pot" The statists will continue to

harrangue their heretofore docile victims 
with namecalling, guilt-peddling, and 
inverted descriptions of reality. But in an 
age when honest, hard-working people 
have to go into debt and are Uveatened 
with the loss of their homes because they 
cannot pay the taxes needed to support a 
privileged class of bureaucrats, politicians, 
welfare-recipients, and special interest 
groups. I doubt that taxpayers are likely to 
view themselves as the ‘greedy" ones in 
the equation.

numerous readasions. Congress surely 
would be impressed. That’s a  chance the 
ERA proponents must take.

Beddes, the purpose of the torturous ' 
amendment process provided by the 
Constitution is to make sure thM hasty and 
ill-conceived amendments are not w h W ^  
through by impatient majorities. In this 
instance, extension would serve that sound 
purpose, because of the campaign of 

‘ distortion, intimidation, innuendo, sliutder. 
shabby political maneuver and outrigM 
lies waged by numerous opponents of the 
ERA. many of them - like the John Birch 
Society - veterans of far-right causes back 
to the vilification of Dwight Eisenhower.

In a democratic society, that’s politics, 
too. but to let the ERA die under sudi 
pressures and an arMtrary time limit 
would be the opposite ofr the calm, ^  
thoughtful and .orderly process the 
Constitution prescribes. And that is 
particularly so since the ERA is before 
state legislatures at a time when it must 
bear symbolic identification with rising '  
hysteria against abortion, homosexual 
rights, busing, and other "liberal "  ideas. 
The amendment has become a sort of 
stand-in against which opponents of any of 
thesecan vent thd r opposition to all.

So Congress should provide an extension 
as a legitimate politicisl action to save the 
ERA from  being killed, without 
constitutional justification, by the 
seven-year time limit - NOT by the states. 
Indeed, 35 of the necessary 38 states have 
passed it (the three remaining rescissions 
notwithstanding). In numerous of the 15 
other states, the amendment has been 
bottled up in committee, or otherwise 
sidetracked, rather than finally defeated: 
in Utah, for example, the opposition of the 
Mormon Church has kept it from coming to 
a vote. Again, that's politics.

But the legislative situation in the states 
is such that three additional ratifications 
cannot possiUy be had by the deadline. 
March 22. 1978. Equal-rights marchers 
therefore ought to make this crucial point 
in their Washington demonstrations • that 
Congress, which by two-thirds vote of both 
houses recommend the ERA to the states, 
has the political power to prevent its 
defeat, just as various forces have so far 
had the political power to prevent its 
ratification.

If Congress wants the Equal Rights 
Amendment to pass, that is, it must vote 
for extension; if Congress does not provide 
an extension. Congress will have killed the 
ERA

An arbitrary time period will have been 
allowed to frustarte the intent of the 
Constitution; forces of reaction and untruth 
will have prevailed politically when they 
might have been countered politically. But 
as Jim McDuffie learned, politics won’t 
stop there.

Today in history
By The Associated Press

Today is Tuesday, July 18, the 199th day 
of 1978. There are IM days left in the year.

Today’s highlight in history:
On this date in M A.D., the Great Fire of 

Rome began. The legend is that Emperor 
Nero set the Are and fiddled as the city 
burned.

On this date;
In 1776. New Jersey declared itself 

independent of British authority.
In 1792, the American naval hero. John 

Paul Jones, died in poverty in Paris.
In 1914, th U.S. Army created an aviation 

section within the Signal Corps, and six 
planes were made available for air 
training.

In 1932. the United States and CUmada 
signed a treaty to develop the St. Lawrence 
Seaway.

In 1969. a car driven by Democratic 
S e n a to r  E d w a rd  K ennedy of 
Massachusetts plunged off« bridge into a 
tidal pool on Chtyipaquiddick Island, 
Massachusetts. The body of Mary Jo 
Kopechne was found in the car.

In 1972, the Egyptian government 
ordered a withdrawal of Soviet military 
advisers from Egypt

Ten years ago: Former President 
Dwight Eisenhower ernlcrsed Richard 
Nixon for the Republican presidential 
nomination.

F ive  years ago; The Pentagon 
announced the end of U.S. minesweeping 
operations in North Vietnamese waters, 
and 18 minesweeping ships withdrew.

One year ago: Prim e Minister 
Menachem Begin of Israel arrived in 
Washington for talks he said he hoped 
would produce real peace with the Arabs.

B erry’s World

-  r

T
•  itrnrNtA-iw

"Thiê Urne /ft not reMgonton I’m $olHng 
IV$ NIxon’i  book."

I

» B

« •

i t

♦ ^



ILB
SO
SA

Sale Starts Thursday - -  July 20th
9:30 AJIA.

(W e W ill Be Closed W ednesday, July 19th , To Prepare For This Event)

The Entire Inventories of
The D ixie shop

of Plainview

G ilbert's
of Pampa

Spring & Summer Merchandise 
has been moved to Gilbert's, and is

LESS T H A N
- ,  ■ .

' r

Behrmon's
of Pampa

Dresses
Pants
Je w e lry
Tops
Lingerie
Scarves
Hose.
Blouses
Belts

Pantsuits
Shells
Handbags
Vests
Skirts
Shirts
Sweaters
Shorts

Shop Early 
For Best Selection!

GILBERT’S Please...All Sales 
Final...No refunds; 
No Exchanges; No 

Lay-a-ways. 
Alterations Extra

209 N. Cuyler Downtown Pampa
665-5745

7
8
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On the record

Highland General Hospital
Mwidiyi Adniint—I Chnsty.

B a b y  Boy B ra d fo rd . Laqueta M. McGinley. 900 S.
Canadian Finley

Thomas H Cryer, 1031 N. Elizabeth A. Dyer, Pampa.
Sumer Elsie L.Cartaon. 2223 Charles

Mrs Ruby J. Priest. Leisure Thelma R. Malone. 1428 E 
Lodge • Francis.

Jackie N Woods. Skeilytown. Terry L. Schoonover. Pampa. 
M rs  L in d a  G a r c ia .  G r a ^  L. Bailey. Miami

Spearman Dismissab
Mildred V. Davis. 1042 S. Tammy L. Miller. 213 N.

Faulkner Nelson
Lloyd M Simpson. 1344 E u la  Lovelace. Pam pa

Hamilton. Nursing Center.
Jaaun Allen, Amarillo Johnnie L. Wright. 1120
Patricia L. White. Borger. Duncan.
Bernice H. Beuselinck. 800 N. Jeff E. Tryon. 1021S Dwight. 

Gray Mrs Rosa Deleon. 409 N.
George B. Nichols. 1145 Huff Crest.

Rd Dale Sprinkle. 1228 Williston.
Eddie Mae Sawyer. Lefors. Teresa L. Brown, 914 E.
Wesley E. McOacken. 105 N. Murphy.

Sumner
Ron L.Slusser. 808 Francis. Births
LessieE Holt. 723N Wynne. Mr. A Mrs. Roy Dean
JoeM Keel. 1139S. Banks. Bradford. Canadian a Boy at
Philip E. Fields. 1828 N 1;4I A.M.61bs.9ozs

Mainly about people
The Top O' Texas Order of A ss is ta n t Area D irec to r

Eastern Star will hold it's (Natural Resou’ces) in the
m e e tin g  and  in itia tio n . Navajo Area. Bureau of Indian
Thursday at 7:30 p.m. in the Affairs. Koenig and his wife.
Masonic Hall on West Kentucky

Barbara, have four children: 
Ted S. Koenig, son of Mr. and Casey, 14; Beth. 12; Christy. 10;

Mrs. Charles Koenig of 1105 Robert. 8. They live in Window
G arland, has been named Rock.

Police report
There was a non-injury

8W W. Foster, flaggy accident involving a 1967 Ford
officer on patr^. a i^  told him p .jr ia n e  drivetT by Ronald
that so m em  had brokm the Glenn Mortimer. He was found
front OT one of th w  to be intoxicated and lost control

*?' k J i*  vehicle. Doing so he struck
that he had checked all of the ,  bounced into a
cars and they were properly parked car 1971 Buick.
okay.^ The dam age i ^ s  Mortimer was arrested and
esum ateda approximately|50 charged with driving while

An e m j^ e e  oi Gibsm s intoxicated and unsafe change
Discount Center. 2211 Perryton ofdirectkm
Pky.. r e j ^ e d  the theft of Mrs, Barbra Nell Bush. 431 
m o ^  The employee said a c rest St. reported that a male
male came to thegMpumpsand had struck her in the face
told 1̂  that the manager ^her^ 3
wanted * o ^  him. Aftw suspect and simple assault
checking with the m anger, t ^  charges were filed,
em ployee found that the ^eely reported the
manager had not asked to see kurBiarv of her m o to r's  hone

SdO K a l ^ .  -T hT buiS iS
^  secured sometime b e tw e ^  8

143 had ^ ^ e n  from ( ^  „„ j„ , i6and6:30a.m.on
cash register The case is under j„ ,y  „  someone broke the front 
mvestigatiOT. 1̂333 ^31̂  the .

^  ^  home. The contents of several
i n t e r ^  gowning and ^ooms were disturbed. It was 
Ballard. A 1974 P ^ U acstaU «  hnown at the Ume if
wagw dnven by (Jarlotte 3 jhing had been Ukei.
Cantrell. I ^ m p a ^ a n ^ p s ig n  will betaken at a later
and struck a 1973 Dodge van ^,^3
driven b y ^ d  Ray Taylor. 3 ^od the police
Pampa. There were no injuries. department a n s i ^  52 calls.

Fire report
The Pampa Fire Department grass fire burned 100 acres on

he Vandenburg property 17 
answered a call at 10 40 p.m. A miles northwest of Pampa.

Slock market
«j»ti«dbrWtatltr-E»»i«il>«mp wt fenWhii by W» Pimp*

Con CabalStybataf l»»l~ cStaSoao ^
CWooltrvm ............— DiA .........  *rTborollairbiiWtl«UoM*owlbe range oelty ■>

nHbbi wblcbiaae «enrlOai ^  bave Korr-McCat «'*beonirngodallbetInieolcomijUatioii Ponacy'i JJ**
PrankMaUlt IJH ^  philUpt JIJ
Ky Cam Ufa U'* PHA ............................... ■'*iMihlaiid Pbiatietal IM W'a Soutbwalan P«b. Sanict M‘*S t  W e l t  L i f e  gtandarg Oil of liMbana WS
1 ( H 1 * S Teuco ■'a

Texas weather
By The Associated Press

No relief was in sight today 
for heat-scorched Texans as 
forecasts called for continued 
mostly clear skies and hot tem­
peratures.

Highs today were expected to 
range from about 90 along the 
gulf coast to about 110 in the 
Big Bend area of Southwest 
Texas. The merciry was ex­
pected to reach or pass the 100- 
degree mark across much of 
the Lone Star State.

Some thunderstorm activity 
was reported during the night 
and into the early morning 
hours in the Panhandle, but

INational
By The Associated Press

Heavy thunderstorms moved 
over parts of Nebraska, the Da­
kotas and Minnesota, spawning 
tornadoes in Nebraska and 
South Dakota No injuries were 
reported and there were no re­
ports of major damage.

The s t r o i ^ t  storms today 
were concerttrated in north-cen­
tral Kansas, soidheastem South 
Dakota, southwestern Min­
nesota and northwestern Iowa. 
Locally heavy rain and high 
winds accompanied the storms.

One twister was reported 
near Red Goud. Neb., and the 
other near Wagner. S.D.

Scattered thunderstorms 
were hitting parts of western 
Kansas, eastern Colorado, the 
Texas and Oklahoma pan­
handles. Florida and the s ( ^ -  
em  parts of Georgia and him- 
bama

Isolated thundershowers pla­
gued Ariaona. New Mexico and 
northwestern Montana

BOTH MICHAEL TOWNSEND, right, and his guide 
dog, Wendy, were honored during recent graduation 
ceremonies at Pennsylvania’s Susquehanna Univer­
sity. Townsend, who is blind, received a standing ova­
tion from his classmates upon picking up a diploma in 
communications and theater arts. Wendy, who at­
tended all classes with her master, got a special citation 
from university president J. R. Messerli, left.

WASHINGTON (AP) -  
American Indians are demand­
ing the U S. government stop 
what they describe as a policy 
of genocide, claiming that one 
out of every four Indian women 
was "forcibly sterilized" from 
1971 to 1975.

The Indians were to continue 
their lobbying of various parts 
of the federal government to­
day. including a protest at the 
Supreme Court building, after 
about 1.000 (rf them marched on, 
the Capitol on Monday.

"Genocide has to come to an 
end. Sterilization must stop." 
cried Philip Deer, a leader of 
the Muscogee Nation as he 
spoke at Monday's rally on 
Capitol Hill.

The Indians, many of whom 
marched hundreds, sonw thou­
sands. of miles to Washington, 
also are asking Congress not to 
approve pending legislation 
that they say will take away 
their lands and deprive them of 
control over their own culture, 
education and destinies.

Indians from more than 80 
tribes have joined in the dem­
onstrations that follow the 
"longest walk" — a 3.000-mile

Mouthwash 
could slow 
tooth decay

protest march trom caiitornia 
to Washington. Hundreds of 
other Indians joined the march­
ers here.

"I want the freedom to bring 
children into the world. Free­
dom to walk and go wherever I 
please. Freedom to be who I 
am. Freedom to practice my 
religion." declared Deer.

A position paper issued by 
the Navaho. Sioux and Iroquois 
tribes reiterated the genocide 
theme, saying "the clearcut 
policy of genocide of the last 
century continues in more so­
phisticated forms in this centu­
ry "

According to the tribes. 24 
percent of all American Indian 
women were "forcibly ster­
ilized'* from 1971 to 1975 and 
one out of three Indian children 
today are being placed in non- 
Indian homes by county, state 
and federal agencies.

Spokesmen for the Bureau of 
Indian Affairs were not imme­
diately available for comment 
on the sterilization charge.

The tribes in the position pa­
per also charged that federal 
government policies pit tribe 
against tribe and destroy "the 
traditional governments of our 
people."

Federal jury

elsewhere uniy some low. 
patchy clouds in South Central 
Texas and some haze along the 
coastal plains kept skies from 
being clear from the Red River 
to the Rio Grande and from Te­
xarkana to El Paso.

Early morning temperatures 
were mostly in the 70s and 80s 
with extremes ranging from 71 
at Marfa in Southwest Texas to 
84 at Wichita Falls.

Some early morning readings 
included 74 at Amarillo. 80 at 
Dallas-Fort Worth. 79 at Austin. 
72 at Lufkin. 77 at Corpus 
Christi. 78 at Brownsville. 82 at 
Del Rk). 83 at San Angelo. 82 at 
El Paso and 81 at Lubbock.

%vealh#*r
The west coast states had dry 

weather.
Clear skies east of the Rock­

ies ranged from the southern 
Great Plains through the Ohio 
valley and the lower Mis- 
sisrippi valley and the south 
and central Appalachians.

Early mornmg temperatures 
around the nation raided from 
48 in Lewistown. Mont., to 92 in 
Blythe. CaUf.

Here are some other early 
morning temperatures and con­
ditions from around the nation: 

Eastern U.S.: Atlanta 73. 
clear; Boston 65. partly cloudy: 
Chicago 75. clew. Cincinnati 
63. partly cloudy; Cleveland 54. 
clear; Detroit 62. clew; In­
dianapolis 71. clew. Louisville 
61. clew: Miami 80. partly 
cloudy. NKA HVILLE 'v - .  
EA Orleans 71. hazy; New 

York 71. hazy. Philadelphia 71. 
foggy; Pittsburgh 70. cloudy: 
Washiniiton 73. dew .

WASHINGTON (AP) -  A 
school program that would re­
quire students to use fluoride 
mouthwash once a week could 
cut tooth (tecay by about one 
third, say government scien­
tists.

The National Institute of Den­
tal Research said Monday that 
three years of testing with 
nrore than 70.600 children 
showed that weekly use of a 
fluoride nrKMJthwash can be a 
good substitute for a conunu- 
nity-wide fluoridated water sys­
tem.

Dr. James P. Carlos, associ­
ate director of the institute, 
said about half the population 
lives in communities without 
fluoridated water and "we esti­
mate there are at least 20 mil­
lion children in non-fluoride 
communities who could be 
helped."

Carlos said dental decay now 
affects more than 90 percent of 
children, even though the na­
tion spent more than 810 billion 
in 1977 on dental services.

The three-year project which 
focused on elementary school 
children in 17 communities that 
do not have fluoridated water, 
showed it costs only about 50 
centv per student to supply 
mouthwash, cups and paper 
towels for the 32-week school 
year.

Dr. Ann J. Miller, program 
coordinator for the institute, 
said the costs varied to as high 
as 88.17 per student when paid 
workers, instead of unpaid vol­
unteers. were used to supervise 
the weekly rinse exwcices.

The average reduction in 
tooth decay was 35 percent, the 
scientists said.

Fidl steam ahead in' Legislature 
on state’s tax reform legislation

F M I

AUSTIN, Texas (AP) — It's 
full steam ahead on the Peveto 
"Property Tix Reform Bill of 
1978." even though Gov. Doiph 
Briscoe hasn't submitted it to 
the special legislative session.

Only a handful — probably 
not more than five or six — 
representatives voiced objec­
tion Monday to suspending 
rules so the House Ways and 
Means Committee can open 
hearings on the bill Wednesday.

The contrast was nuuked 
tween that action and Uie suc­
cessful efforts by a House mi­
nority last week to stymie hur­
ry-up action on constitutional 
amendntents sought by Briscoe.

Rep. Wayne Peveto. D-Or-

ange. smilingly told reporters 
that while he had received no 
word from Briscoe, his tax uni­
formity bill—  with a new look 
— was definitely in the gover­
nor's thoughts.

"I do know it is still a subject 
of conversation in the gover­
nor's office." Peveto said 
Asked if he meant positive or 
negative conversation, he said. 
"Positive."

Special sessions can consider 
only subjects submitted by the 
governor One opponent can im­
mediately kill a bill outside the 
call by raising a point of order 
against it in committee or on 
the floor.

Peveto's bill includes some­
thing Briscoe wanted, a 5 per-

cent annual limit on local prop­
erty tax increases, unless gov­
erning bodies can mijpter a 
two-thirds majority for a tax 
hike.

It centralizes property ap­
praisals in each county and 
provides machinery for the 
state to be sure property is ap­
praised equally across the 
state

The House, with nothing set 
for floor action/adjourned until 
Wednesday.

Briscoe's proposals, and 
some thought up by representa­
tives. got their first hearing 
Monday in the Hou^ Con­
stitutional Amendments Com­
mittee.

Young promises to explain 
political prisoner meaning

PARIS (AP) — Ambasssador 
Andrew Young says the timing 
of his remark about U.S. politi­
cal prisoners may have been 
wrong but he'll have more to 
say about "what is a political 
prisoner in the United ^ t e s . "

"I didn't overstate the num­
ber of people." America's first 
black ambassador to the United

Nations said in an interview in 
Geneva with the International 
Herald Tribune. "It was a cas­
ual statement which perhaps 
should not have been made, es­

pecially not at this time, and 
I'm reluctant to discuss it now. 
But 1 assure you that I'll come 
back to the question of what is

Canadian will fight 
High Plains rate hike

Indians demand 
halt of genocide

CANADIAN — In a marathon 
session Monday night, the 
Canadian City Council agreed to 
fight the most recent rate 
increase request from High 
Plains Natural Gas of Canadian.

The gas company was 
r e c e n t l y  g r a n t e d  a 
cost-of-service increase from 
the city after five months of 
negotiating. The company has 
filed for another substantial rate 
hike with the state Railroad 
Commission.

The city is concerned with the 
gas company's action and will 
join 50 other communities in the 
northeast Texas panhandle to 
file M  official p i^est against 
the proposed rate increase, 
during the Railroad Commission 
hearing in September.

It appears that High Plains 
Natural Gas will seek rate 
increases every 45 days or so. 
city officials said. The hike is 
blamed on the company's need 
to pay higher prices on natural 
gas reserves.

Canadian's power plant also 
drew attention. City officials 
told the council the city's power 
plant is running at near peak 
capacity this summer, even with 
the additional power being 
supplied by Southwestern Public 
Service (Amarillo).

City officials explained that 
the city will need to purchase a 
new power plant engine or more

power from another company by 
next summer to meet demands.

The council approved a bid of 
83.760 from G&B Concrete. 
Amarillo, for curb and gutter 
construction for the new Moody 
housing addition.

F ire Chief Bill Hodges, 
appeared before the council to 
report the need for a new city 
fire truck, for the estimated 
price of 842.000.

A representative of the city's 
plum bers association. Jack 
Hamel, stressed the need for a 
new city plumbing code.

The c ity  of C anadian  
purchased a street sweeper for 
836.000 with a two year lease at 
six percent interest. The council 
also agreed to advertize for two 
pick-up trucks for the water and 
light plant.

Concern was voiced over the 
amount of water usage, two 
million gallons per day, from the 
city's wells.

Communications Systems. 
Inc., has made application with 
the Federal Communications 
Commissions for five additional 
television channels on the cable. 
A few of these will be received 
via sattelite.

a political prisoner in the 
United States."

Last week, as the Carter ad­
ministration was severely criti­
cizing the Soviet government 
for putting dissidents Anatoly 
Shcharansky and Alexander 
Ginzburg on trial. Young told 
the French Socialist newspaper 
Le Matin:' "There are hun­
dreds, perhaps thousands of po­
litical prisoners in the United 
States."

Young claimed he was quoted 
out of context, but President 
Carter and Secretary of State 
Cyrus Vance reprimanded him. 
There were also demands in 
Congress for his dismissal and 
an impeachment resolution in 
the House of Representatives 
which was voted down over­
whelmingly.

“1 accepted the rebuke," 
Young told Jonathan Power of 
the Herald Tribune. "I under­
stood that it was upsetting to 
have that remark lifted out of
an interview and left to give 
the impression that I .did not 
understand the significance of 
the Shcharansky trial and that 
I was not in accord with the 
strong feelings that had been 
expressed by President Carter, 
Secretary Vance and others.

“But looked at in its full con­
text, I was trying to address 
the trial of Shcharansky in such 
a way that it was not just an 
anti-Russian comment. Re­
member, I was communicating 
to a leftist French newspaper 
whose readership would tend to 
discredit any critique made by 
the Americans on the grounds 
that we are just'playing domes­
tic politics or that this is just 
another chapter in the cold war 
rhetoric.

His plan to exempt the first
810.000 of a home's assessed 
value from school taxes — and 
twice that for the elderly — 
with state replacement of the 
lost revenue ran into trouble.

The sponsor. Rep Tim Von 
Dohlen. D-Goliad. told the com­
mittee he had doubts whether 
all 65-year-olds should get a
820.000 homestead exemption 
He also said basing the ex­
emption on assessed — rather 
than market — value might re­
sult in too big a loss of local 
school revenue.

Von Dohlen. committee chair­
man. also said he wondered 
about replacing revenue school 
districts would lose from taxing 
agricultural land on its produc­
tivity rather than its market 
value, as Briscoe has proposed

He said the be^ thing might 
be to gather infoirnation on the 
tax losses but Have the Legisla­
ture use its best judgment as to 
how big a burden of reimburs­
ing school districts the state 
budget can stand

Von Dohlen said he hoped the 
committee could mark up a 
proposed constitutional amend­
ment today and get a House 
floor vote as early as Thurs­
day.
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Man jum ps to 
death from hotel

continues work
MIDLAND. Texas (AP) — A 

federal grand jury investigating 
the death of Ector County Jail 
inmate Larry Lozano began its 
second day of wading through 
more than 90 witnesses subpoe­
naed in the probe today.

The panel convened Monday 
at the request of Texas Attor­
ney John Hill, who asked for an 
investigation into possible civil 
rights violations.

GRAPEVINE. Texas (AP) -  
A 19-year-old Laredo num ap­
parently jumped to his death 
Monday after going to the Dal- 
las-Fort Worth Airport for a 
rendezvous with his girlfriend 
which never took place, police 
said.

Gerardo Pro suffered mas­
sive head injuries in the tumble 
from his seventh-floor room at 
an airport hotel.

Pro died en route to a hospi­
tal shortly after the fall, said 
T.N.Shehan. associate director 
of the airport's department of 
public safety

HARVIES
KMONIBt HOW 6000 A 8U K B t 

USO to  TASm  HARVliS STU  DOI
Relish A Harvie with One of Our 
Thick Shakes!

Enjoy:

Horrie Bvrgers- 
mode with 100% 

pure beef
OPEN 11 a.m. to 10 p.m.

Hoivie 
King Kongs 
Super Dogs 
Diet Drinks

Cheeseburger 
Fountain Drinks 
Sundaes
ke Cream Cones

HARVIES BURGERS &  SHAKES
17th at Duncan 665-2502

C L E A R A N C E  S A L E  

on a ll 197S m odel
O i K S K  O M O ilU lCO U N rn

save np to  w ith  trade
-a t -

clay Brothers TV & Appliance
formerly HAWKINS EDDINS APPLIANCES

• KitchenAid • Frigidaire • Tappan O Maytag • Sony O Jenn-Aire
• Magic Chef • Hotpoinl • Thermadoi • Amano # Zenith • Alpine

e WE SERVICE WHAT WE SELL #
854 W Foitar OPEN 8 30 a m to 6 o m. 669-3207
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Advice'

Dear Abby
B yAM faflVaiB w ca

DEAR ABBY: My husband and I hava bean marriad for 
20 3raars, and our problam  is our sax life . W bat's a *W n  
on” for him is definitaly a ”turn ofT  for ma. He in sists on 
talking about other wom an when he’s  m aking love. Iln  
hurt because it ’s  never ME ha is  m aking love to —it ’s 
alw ays a friend, or a stranger, or a m ovie actress.

I d m ’t  w ant anyone e lse , and never have. Oh, sure, I’ve 
w ondered w hat it  would be like w ith  Burt Reynolds, but 
w hat woman hasn’t? I could never talk about other men 
during lovem aking. My husband says fantasizing would 
help us both, and there is  nothing w rong w ith  it. Is he 
right, or am I?

I for those days early in our m arriage when he le t 
me know that he w as glad I w as the girl in h is arm s, and he 
didn’t need all these fantasies. He thinks I ln  square. Is th is 
a common problem?

TURNED OFF IN TORRENCE

D EAR TURNED OFF: Y es, R’s  a very common 
problem . There are no ‘i'a le s” in lovem aU M , save one: 
“W hatever is p leasing to  both parties is  OK.”

Since sex  is  yonr problem , I su ggest that you consult a 
qualified sex  therap bt (th ey u su a ^  work la  team s, a asan 
and a woman to  counsel the couple). M ost u niversities now 
have a human sexuality  program  M their m edical schools. 
Or perhaps your physician or clergym an can reconunend a 
therapist.

DEA R  ABBY: Do you believe in love at first s i^ t?
RHONDA

DEAR RHONDA: 
second look!

N o. But I do believe in taking a

DEAR A fflY : My w ife and I are ordinary MO{de (now  
retired). W e're tr3ring to  g e t along on Social S eew ity , so 
w e m ust draw on our savings, w hii^  of course are lim ited.

W e have four children, all adults and m arried w ith  
children of their ow n, up to  cd lege age.

From tim e to  tim e, in order to h e^  them  out, w e have 
len t our children m oney, in terest-free. They prom ised to  
pay us back in installm ents. A fter tw o a t  three 
installm ents, they quit paying, a lth o u ^  they seem  to  have 
money for pleasure t r ^ ,  expensive hixuries, etc .

‘T h ere is honor am ong th teves,” it  is  said. W hat has 
happened to our Idds? W here have w e failed?

FORGOTTEN IN MANKA’TO

DEA R  FORGOTTEN: D on't assum e that because yonr 
children have not honored their commitnM nts YOU have 
fadled. ’THEY have failed. Yon can lead smne people to  a 
fountain o f in tegrity , but yon ca n t make them  drink from  
R. (P .S . Silence fanpUee agreenM st. Speak up!)

CONFIDENTIAL TO BUBBA IN CHICAGO: Yon m ay 
be able to  dodge yonr responaibQ ities, but you can’t  dodge 
the consequences o f dodging yonr responsibilitie s . Think 
about it.

Ask Dr. Lamb

DEAR DR. LAMB — 
P lease te ll m e what to  do 

«bout lab ile blood pressure. 
My pressure goes from  140 
over M to 200 over 120 in a  
m atter of m inutes. I fee l fine 
one m inute and extrem ely  
nervous the next. The doc­
tors do not seem  to be too 
concerned even  though one 
doctor told m e that m y heart 
had been dam aged som e 
because of the high blood 
p ressu re. He p rescribed  
Inderal.

This condition has w orried  
m e so  m uch I’m  afraid  to  get 
up in the m orning fearing  
that rU  have a  stredee or 
heart attack. This feelin g of 
anxiety has caused  d epres­
sion for which the doctor 
prescribed Sinequan. I have 
taken Inderal and Sinequan  
for over a m onth and I do not 
believe either has helped.

I would appreciate any 
advice that would help  m e 
get m y blood pressure stabi- 
Uzed. I feel that the depres­
sion would subside if m y 
physical condition would 
im prove.

DEAR READER — It is 
perfectly true that blood 
p r e s s u r e  c a n  c h a n g e  
m arkedly in a m atter of 
seconds. Such lab ile blood 
pressure som etim es m akes 
it d ifficu lt for doctors to  be 
certain w hether there is  a 
high Mood pressure problm n 
or not.

In general it is  believed  
that if the blood pressure is  
norm al m ost of the tim e that 
the interm ittent elevated  
readings are of leas im por­
tance. We ca ll such  individu­
a ls vascular hyperreactors. 
Comm only we do not think 
that th is type of Mood p res­
sure has the sam e sign ifi­
cance a s sustained  elevated  
blood pressure in term s of 
causing heart a ttack s or 
strokes. That’s  w hy your 
doctors are le ss w orried.

It’s  en tirely  possib le that 
your blood pressure is  e le ­
vated because you have an  
anxiety depression reaction  
to b e |^  w ith. A nxiety and  
depression go together in 
som e people and the an xiety

Polly's ^ in te rs
ByFilyCtaMr

DEAR POLLY — My P et P eeve is  w ith  those drugM ores
krho piK the price la b d  over the lis t o f in g red ien t in a 
bottle. I like to know iriia t I am  g iv in g  m y fam ily . —

•*"^MAR POLLY — My thum b nail a lw ays tears the thum b 
in rubber g loves I buy to w ear w hile w a n in g  d ish es, wallK  
etc. but I fin idly found a w ay to  stop R. I .a^piace «  

1 tape over m y thum b nail from  the  
h en iM ^ a ijri thpn put on m y rubber

_______ J finaUy
transparent gum m ed  
back to the front of the 
gloves. No m ore tears B.

DEAR POLLY— When hanging a  picture on the w all it to 
ofteA difficutt to find the exact no t the naU is  tofo M I dust
m y index finger w ith colored chalk  duri, proas on t h e ; ^  
at the right ^ c e  and then piR the nail in  fhe o e n tn  M ttie 
markiiM  d w i corrañ<**d> w ith the w ire 0«  the back of the 
picture. —> AOBLLA.

Sweatshirt part of fashion

Keelin Anniversary
Mr. and Mrs. William Thomas Kellin will celebrate their 60th wedding anniver­
sary on August 2. The Keelins are from Corona, N.M., and moved there from 
W haler. They will be honored with a pot-luck luncheon on A u ^ t  5 at the Corona 
Recreation center given by their children. They are parents of four sons, and two 
dai^hters. They have 22 grandchildren and 22 great-grandchildren. Friends are 
invited to attend.

By Lawncuoe B. Lamb, M.D.
In turn m ay cau se a reflex  
rapid rise in your blood 
pressure.

If that is  the ca se , treating  
your an x iety  d ep ression

Hot snacks 
for summer

By AOera C laire 
NEA Food Editor

Grabbing a snack often  
m eans m aking a sandw ich  
of cold cuts. H ow ever, hot 
sandw iches are w elcom e 
even during hot days.

Saucy sau sage ro lls and 
cheesy corned beef rolls are 
easy but d ifferent snacks to  
serve after a sw im  party or 
ball gam e.

Y oungsters w ill lik e these  
sandw iches, too. They m ake 
it easy for Mom to  feed  the 
ball team  som ething differ­
ent. Add m ilk sh akes, rel­
ishes and fresh  fru it for a 
cm nplete, nutritious m eal.

SAUCY SAUSAGE ROLLS 
cans (10 btocults 
each) refrigerated 
buttermilk or country- 
style btacuiit 
tablespoons butter 
or maiiparine, melted 
cup grated Parmesan 
cheese
pound mMd Italian 
aausaga (in caaing), 
cut into 4 equal 
piscaa 
cup wstar 
tabisapoona butter 
or margerirte, 
aoftorwd
cup chopped green 
PW W
cup chopped onion 
can (I oz.) pizza 
aauc#

By Judy Lave

The hooded sw eatsh irt is a  
staple of the A m erican fash­
ion d iet. InitiaUy designed to 
be worn for sporting a ctiv i­
ties, it has found its way into 
everyone’s  everyday ward­
r o b e .  T h e  v e r s a t i l e  
s w e a t s h i r t  h a s  n e v e r  
claim ed to be attractive, but 
it has provided the inspira­
tion for th is good-looking 
sw eater you can  knit your­
self.

Today’s  casual lifesty le  
dem fnds clothes that can  do 
double or even trip le duty, 
and a hooded sw eater fits 
the bill perfectly . It's m ade 
to order for jogging, b icy­
cling, tennis warm ups — a il 
the ^ y s ic a l exercises you 
should be doing. If you’ve  
found it d ifficu lt to get start­
ed, th is coverup is a pretty 
incentive!

The sw eater fills fashion  
and seasonal “ in betw eens.’’ 
Wear it with sk irts, jeam  
and shorts, and over bathing 
suits. It’s  ideal for breezy 
sum m er nights and don’t 
forget to take it along on 
your vacation. You’ll be glad

V»

m ay be m ore im portant than  
treating your blood pres­
sure. It is  a lso  true that 
people can be w orried or 
depressed about physical 
problem s, although I think 
you should be reassured that 
your interm ittent lab ile high  
readings are not .a  m ajor 
m edical problem .

The m edicines you are 
taking are w ell su ited  for 
your type of problem . H ie  
Inderal helps to control the 
effects of the adrenaline 
which to released  a s a resu lt 
of your an xiety. The Sine­
quan to very useful in anxi­
ety  depression  reaction s 
such a s ^  sta te you have.

You should elim inate a ll 
coffee and drinks that have 
any caffein e in them . That 
includes tea , chocolate and 
colas. C affeine in th ese  
beverages has the opposite 
effect of tranquilizers and 
Sineouan. H iere is  no point 
in taking large am ounts of 
m edicines in these com m on 
beverages which tend to  in­
crease your an xiety sta te . 
You could use decaffeinated  
coffee i f  3TOU wiah.

You siw uld develop a  reg­
ular exercise progriun. If 
you haven’t been exercisin g , 
start a d aily w alking pro­
gram  and gradually in­
crease your w alking a ctiv i­
ty. Elxerciae helps to  deplete 
excess adrenaline form ed by 
anxiety and to a  useful w av 
of hel{dng to control both 
anxiety and depression.

I’m  send ing you The 
Health L etter num ber 1 4 , 
Blood P ressure, to g ive you  
m ore inform ation on how  
blood pressure to controlled  
and iriiy you h ave lab ile  
blood pressure and I am  alao 
sending you num ber 10-10, 
D ep ren k »: The U ps ana 
Downs of Life. Other read­
ers who want eith er of th ese  
can send SO cents for eith er  
to m e in care of th is newapa- 
par, P.O. Box 311, S u  Anto­
nio, TX 78222.
(NcwsPAPcn ENTBRpma; asm.)

Heat oven to 3S0 degrees. 
Separate each  can  of dough 
into 10 b iscu its. P lace 5 
biscuits on edge and lightly  
press together. Shape ends 
to form  a loaf. R epeat w ith  
rem aining b iscu its to form  
four rolls.

D ^  rolls in m elted  butter. 
Then in ch eese. P lace on 
ungreased  cook ie sh eet. 
Bake at 350 d egrees for 17-to- 
22 m inutes or until golden  
brown. Co(d sligh tly .

W hile rolls are baking, 
place sau sage and w ater in 
10-inch fry pan. Cover and 
sim m er about 10 m inutes.
Uncover. D rain and fry sau­
sage 4-to-5 m inutes on e a d i 
sk »  or until browned.

S lice rolls in half length­
w ise. S p m d  w ith softened  
butter. P lace 1 p iece of sau­
sage on each roll. D rain a ll 
but 2 tablespoons of dripp­
ings. Saute green  pepper 
and onion in (frippings until 
tender. Add p in a  sauce. 
H est to  boiling.

Spoon about V4 cup of the 
sauce over sau sage on each  
roll. Serve w arm . M akes 4 
sandw iches.

If d esired , sau sage can be 
cut in half lengthw ise before 
placing in roll.

CHEESY CORNED BEEF 
ROLLS

It ounces canned 
corned beef

4 ounces sSced Swiss

1 esn (10 biscuits) re- 
trlgersted bullWmINi 
or country-style 
btocuHs

2 tablespoons finely 
eitopped onion

1 egg, slightly beaten 
H  cup crushed com 

flakes, optlonsi

H eat oven to  400 degrees. 
G rease cookie sh eet. Cut 
corned beef into 10 p ieces, 
each about 3-l>y-l-b)^Vk inch­
es. Cut ch eese into 20 p ieces, 
each about S-by-4k inches.

Separate dough into 10 
biscuits. P ress or roll each  
to a  M nch ovaL P lace one 
slice of ch eese and one slice  
of corned b eef on center of 
each b iscuit. T m  corned  
beef w ith on efrali teaspoon  
onion and another slice  o (|

W rap b isc u it  a r o u n d ' 
covoring co n p lete- 

Seail w ell. D ip ro lls in 
Coat w ith com  flakaa, if  

desired. P lace saam «id e  
down on prepared cookie 

tadOOO (ib a ti. Bake 
lfrto-12 m inutes or until 
goMan brown. Sarva w arm . 
Makaa 10 sandw khaa.

¿^rank's
^ o o d s
638 S. Cuyler 

665-5451

Prices Good 
Thru July 22

Quantity Rights Reserved

DOLD NEMAN

BACON
2 LB. VAC PAK

WE GIVE 
WESTERN 

BLUE STAMPS

OSCAR MAYER BEEF

V A R im
PACK
8 O i ...........................

TYSON
CHICKEN WIENERS
12 Ox..............  .....................

GLADIOLA

FLOUR
5 LB.

to have it on hand when the 
cool days of fa ll arrive.

The only problem  this 
wonderful sw eater p resents 
to one of choice. You m ay 
have a hard tim e deciding  

what color to use. Q ioose 
from  am ong the shades of 
B ear B ran d 's  M achine  
W ashable Spectator yarn. 
You’ll need seven  or eight 
balls, deperiding on your 
size, and a size 6 n eed le, or 
w hatever size you need to 
obtain the gauge.

To receive inatructioru for 
the sporty sw eater, send 50 
cents to Stitchin’ T im e, P.O. 
Box 503, Radio City Station, 
New York. N.Y. 10019. Ask 
for leaflet S503, and don’t  
forget to include your nam e, 
address and zip code.

K N IT  K N A ck s  
D ear R eaders:

Many of you have w ritten  
asking how to put a zipper 
into your handiwork. It isn ’t 
hard, but in volves doing 
som e sim p le handw ork. 
N ever try sew ing a zipper in 
by m achine. ,

If.you  follow  t h ^  d irec-

COUNTRY PRIDE 
GRADE A

FRYERS
LB.................................

tkna, you shouldn’t have 
any problem s. Be sure to 
block and aasgm ble p ieces 
first. This w ill be the perfect 
base from  which to  work. 
The procedure w ill be the 
sam e for w hatever you are 
putting a zipper in. P lace 
open zipper on the knitted  
piece, pin and baste in posi­
tion, allow ing teeth to extend  
a little . With m atching  
thread, hand s t i ^  secu rely ,
using a backstitch. Turn 
over and w hipstitch the
zipper tape to a few  threads 
of the garm ent. This pro­
vides a neat finish for both
sides and a lso  adds a firm ­
ness to the action of the 
zipper on a ll types of clo ­
sures. Keep knitting. Judy 
Love
(NEWSPAPER ENTERPRISE ASSN )

The volcanic erigxin that 
produced the greatest amount 
of lava in recorded history took 
place in Laki. Iceland, in 1783. 
according to the National Geo­
graphic Society The lava 
flowed 35 miles.

OSCAR MAYER Reg. or Beef
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K ED TEA  
M IX  $ 1

4 Oz. ........  I

W ith Sugcw 
g  Lamen
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OnERGENT
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FOLGEIFS
COFFEE
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SWIFT ^
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MINUTE MAID

UM O NADE

BEST M A ID
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12 O i.
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LIQUID
22 Oz.

MRS. GOODCOOKIE
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1 Lb.
FreabnCOOKIES
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Lb. Qtrs

NEST FRESH
LARGE 
EGGS DOZ.
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ICE CREAM
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SHURFRESH

BUTTERMILK
1/2 Ool.

NEOARINES CABBAGE
CalN. ^
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No progress made
✓

on-postal contract

DriUing r e ^ r t

By OWEN ULLMANN ,
AP UtMT Writer

WASHINGTON (AP» -  With 
a poasibie mail strike three 
days off, the U.S. Postal Serv­
ice and three unions are for the 
first time confronting head-on * 
the major obstacles to a new 

‘Contract.
There was no indication, how­

ever, that any progress was 
being made on such key issues 
as wages, job security and 
compulsory overtime.

A source close to the negotia­
tions said the two sides met un­
til late Monday night, dis­
cussing a bitter dispute over a 
no-layoff clause that the unions 
won in 1973 and insist on retain­
ing '»in the new accord. The 
Postal Service wants to elimi­
nate the provision.

But the bargainers did not 
discuss wages, on which their 
remains vast disagreement, 
said the source.

While the two sides had 
stated their positions in initial 
discussions three months ago. 
Monday's session marked the 
first time management and the 
unions had tried to grapple 
with the biggest differences be­
tween them since federal 
mediators entered the picture a 
week ago

Progress was made on sev­
eral minor issues during the 
last week, said the source, who 
asked to remain anonymous.

The current three-year pact 
covering 554.000 workers 'ex­
pires a t midnight Thursday, 
and although postal strikes are 
forbidden by federal law, some 
local union leaders have threat­
ened walkouts if a new agree­
ment is not reached in time.

That happened in 1970, when 
220,000 workers, mainly on the 
East Coast, staged wildcat 
strikes

While negotiators met at a 
Washington hotel, a group 
known as the Public Service 
Research Council, which op-

poses public empioyee»>9tnkes, 
nied suit in fedwal court seek­
ing to have any striking postal 
worker fired.

The P ^ l  Service has re­
peatedly told its employees thok 
a striking worker could be 
fined up to $1,000 and sentenced 
to a year in Jitl. "

The sanctions were not used 
in 1970, however, as part of an 
agreemerk that ended the 
strike.

Meanwhile, the Postal Serv­
ice, updating its strike contin­
gency plans, is considering ask­
ing for federal troops to handle 
the mail, forbidding temporar­
ily some types of mail or re­
quiring people to pick up their 
mail in the event of a strike.

Postal management has re­
portedly proposed a three-year 
contract that included virtually 
no general increase in the first 
year except for a cost-of-living 
adjustnnent. The general in­
crease for the second and third 
years was described by one 
source as “generous.”

However, union sources have 
labeled the offer “ridiculous” 
In that it was less than the 5.5 
percent annual increase Presi­
dent Carter is recommending 
for federal workers this year.

The three postal unions have 
asked for a $1.965 wage in­
crease per worker over two 
years — roughly double what 
the Carter administration hopes 
the talks will produce — plus 
full cost-of-living protection.

Based on a projected annual 
inflation rate of 7 percent, the 
unions' wage demand would 
amount to about a 13 percent 
annual increase from the $15.- 
877 the average postal worker 
now receives.

The administration has made 
the eventual settlement a key 
test of its anti-inflation pro­
gram, which attempts to mod­
erate the large wage gains won 
by unions in recent years.

News watch
WASHINGTON lAPi -  The 

AFL-CIO is urging Congress to 
increase the general tax credit 
from the current $35 per tax­
payer to $150, resulting in an 
overall tax reduction of $11 bil­
lion.

In a letter to the House Ways 
and Means Omimittee, AFL- 
CIO President George Meany 
said the proposal would provide 
the average family of four with 
a reduction of more than $400 
in their income tax bill, with 
most of the reduction benefit- 
ting families earning $30.000 a 
year or less

"You can t tell any more who 
it is that's chartering a boat." 
said broker Pat Moss. “ I've 
had several boats confiscated 
by Customs or the DEA for 
hauling po t" Brokers in the 
Fort Lauderdale area say about 
12 boats from Broward County 
have been confiscated this 
year.

WASHINGTON (AP) -  Su­
preme Court Justice William J. 
Brennan has cleared the way 
for the Texas officials and a 
woman with a malpractice suit 
against an abortion clinic to ob­
tain records of other patients 
who suffered abortion com­
plications. But Brennan said in 
a two-page opinion Monday that 
the privacy of the other 
patients must be protected.

Claudia E. Lott had sued Re­
productive Services Inc., claim­
ing it misrepresented the quali­
ty of care it provided at its 
abortion clinics.

CARSON CITY, Nev. (AP) -  
The skipper of the Nevada 
State Prison's ‘‘SS Neversail,” 
a mock-up boat used in a celes­
tial navigation course he 
taught, is shipping out.

The Parole Board decided 
Monday to parole Richard 
Dunn, who had been serving a 
life term for slaying one man 
and wounding two others in a 
barroom shootout in Las Vegas. 
One board member said Dunn 
had “a strong recommenda­
tion” for parole both from the 
prison and from a psychologist 
as a result of his active role in 
teaching and improving him­
self.

WASHINGTON (AP) -  The 
senator who will preside over 
hearings on President Carter's 
bill revamping the Law En­
forcement Assistance Adminis­
tration says he will submit it to 
"intense scrutiny"

Sen. Joseph Biden Jr., D- 
Del., said “more than slight 
modifications” are needed in 
LEAA <

Biden. one of two senators to 
vote against re-authorization of 
LEAA in 1976. is chairman of 
the Senate Judiciary Com­
mittee's subcommittee on crim- 
ipal laws and procedures.

PITTSBURGH (AP) -  Steel 
[idustry operating costs are go- 

luse the number of 
rail cars is going 

'an  industry spokesman 
" l^ s .  TVimas Church, vice 
president of Bethlehem Steel, 
kipid many producers have been 

ced to idle their mills be- 
’ cars were unavailable. 

The 79-ton gondola cars, 
which carry most scrap metal 
and about half of all finished 
products, numbered 177,000 in 
early 1968 But by this year, 
there were about 132,000 ot the 
long, open cars rolling in the 
United States, a decline of 25 
perceik.

FORT UUDERDALE, Fla 
(AP) — South Florida’s flou­
rishing (frug smuggling busi­
ness may soon daim  a new vic­
tim the region's yacht rental 
industry, ftdccrs say they are 
afraid to rent out boats because 
too ntany wind up impounded 
by the federal Drug Enforce­
ment Administration

WASHINGTON (AP) -  A 
woman w was fired by for­
mer Rep. Otto E. Passman. D- 
La., is asking the Supreme 
Court to review her sex dis­
crimination complaint. Shirley 
Davis, Passman's deputy ad­
ministrative assistant for six 
months in 1974. told the court 
Monday that her case would af­
fect “the constitutional rights 
of thousands of congressional 
employees.”

She said that Passman 
praised her as “a hard worker" 
but said a man was needed be­
cause of the heavy workload.

DAKY 
LUNCH AT:

S o d cA B t
taillySMa.lMMr

Op«n 1 1  «.m. te ♦ p.m. 
W . and Sot. till 10 p.m.

>1«

Indwdas Chaka af Ukad 
Patota ar Franck Mas and 
Stackoda Taast, Tassad 
Oraan Saiod. 
iUKM akort ééS438l

tMaMMWDni:
cxasoN - NOm Oi . WM . h b 
ri« J»r«»aw—w» i-A .u r(it 

irwuM taiK ii.iiacN pooM' 
cxasoN WM PMwMi« ru t -l«MM SiW f  Cmmmn > Mmm

UM N*. i.u ten taW T lihM ai«  n.T.iaoN.pDMr OllAY • Btil • Hiji A
NMhr-CirpMir M* I XM' IB ftffu' f

a.a.MGN poairHALL-WlMcal-Gob OUCMMay-B S Lkaftlto l-IW '(N a«r(W ^(l 
•«  IjJi.J H SMfentfcinn-POMM' HANSPOBD . riMMM Hu I'- CWm - 
PMiWMaCwfaMn AliuMwANe I 
'J91L* * mi' («  wm *( 1« u. I.W.c.a.a Synm-roOM'

HANSPOHD ■ Habi(«N (Upptr 
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A long way from home
When it came to the rodeo, viators came from all around 
to see it. Lars Eliazon, from Stockhom, Sweden, arrived 
in Pampa on Thursday afternoon so he could see a rodeo. 
Eliazon, who works for the Swedish Broadcasting Com­
pany, found out about the rodeo when he checKed in 
with his Washington headquarters. While he was here 
he found out many things about America that were 
quite different from his lifostyle in Sweden.

(Pampa News photo by Pam Turek)
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AUSTIN, Texas (AP) — The 
railroad commission reported 
Monday that major purchasers 
of Texas crude oil want 3,517,- 
436 barrels a day next month, a 
decrease of 4,171 barrels daily 
from July

The commission will meet 
Thursday to set the statewide 
oil allowable for August.

AUSTIN, Texas (AP) -  Lo- 
Vaca Gathering Co. got per­
mission from the railroad com­
mission Monday to sell natural 
gas for approximately 45 days 
to Uvalde Com Processors. Inc.

The company wants the gas 
to operate a  con> dryer two 
miles northeast of Uvalde, the 
commission said.

Lo-Vaca will sell the gas at 
cost, plus 20 cents per thousand 
cubic feet (mef), or about $2.36 
per mef

'  AUSTIN, Texas (AP) -  The 
railroad commission Monday
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canceled the pemnit of a Tyler 
oil operator to drill an explor­
atory well in Henderson County 
because thé well was expected 
to penetrate a formation bear­
ing poisonous hydrogen-sulfide.

The commission said it was 
the first time it had canceled a 
drilling permit because the op­
erator had failed to show how 
he planned to comply with safe­
ty regulations.

The pm nit had been issued 
to Basin Operating (>o.

AUSTIN. Texas (AP) -  The 
railroad commission Monday 
dismissed a request by San An­
tonio for a new hearing on nat­
ural gas nominations.

A hearing examiner told the 
commission a Feb. 5 rule had 
answered San Antonio’s com­
plaints.

The commission said Mayor 
Lila Cockrell of San Antonio 
had complained that over-nomi­
nations by Lo-Vaca Gathering 
Co. had resulted in higher 
prices for the city.
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Salesman embarrassed when 
vehicle breaks down on demo

By GREG THOMPSON 
Asaeciated Preaa Writer

SAN ANTONIO. Texas (AP) 
— Salesman John Lowther was 
a  bit embarraaaed Monday 
when he toofc a group of buyers 
on a final demonstration ride 
and experienced a minor me- 
chanied breakdown in the 
brand new vehicle.

His paaBengers weren’t too 
thrilled about the whole tKing 
either. Lowther, you see, is an 
airplane salesmait

Lowther was forced to tnake 
a skidding emergency landing 
on a foam-covered Kelly Air 
Force Base runway Monday 
afternoon after one of the three 
landing gears jammed on the 
$270,000, twin-engine Piper Na­
vajo.

One of the seven occupants 
was shaken up. but there were 
no injuries, officials said.

Lt. Col. Gifford Bingham of 
Kelly AFB called it a “perfect 
laniUng.” “He did a great job,” 
Bingham said of Lowther.

“This is very embarrassing, 
to say the least,” said the 
shaken Lowther, 31, a represen-^ 
tative of a San Antonio airplane 
dealership.’ "It's embarrassing 
anytime the landing gear gets 
stuck. But this time was par­
ticularly embarrassing.”

Lewther said it was td be a 
final demonstration ride over

Laredo before the sale was 
completed to a Laredo con­
struction company.

“ It was the last flight before 
we sipwd the papers. Before 
we finished the paperwork on 
the sale, they wanted to go up 
for a 15-minute local f l i ^ , ” 
Lowther said.

“One of the three landing 
gears would not come down. 
We tried several different tech­
niques while we circled, but it 
wouldn’t come down.” he 
added.

Lowther circled Laredo for

nearly two hours to burn up 
fuel uxi WM told he could head 
to Kelly AFB, approximately 
140 miles away.

The plane came down on the 
runway covered with the safety 
foam and skidded onto the 
grass. Poised emergency and 
fire vehicles raced to the scene 
in seconds, but the plane didn't 
catch fire. '

Lowther had no immediate 
damage estimate, although it 
did not appear the plane was 
seriously damaged.
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Rene P. Grabóte, M .D.
Wishes to announce 

the opening 
of his practice in

Urology
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All in One. Hygienic Cotton Crotch.

No Visible Panty Lines 
Assorted Shades ^  M M
No. 777
Reg. $1.19 .............................. #  #

A ll Western Straw Hats
I  J ^  Gibson's

/ Di scount 
/ H  OFF Price

*- J

One Gallon 
Reg. $4.67

Everain Swing 'N Spray Snack Pock Puddings

s .  * 1 0 ”
Hunft .. •

Ellis

Pinto Beans
Ruffles

Potato Gips
3 Tube— 50 Foot

SOAKER HOSE
mfi

15 Oz. Cans

4 J 1 Reg. 83* M il 
7 1/2 Oz................... V  k

Reg. $4.69

'l l

1 1/2 Ton

Hydraulic Jack

*112«

COSTUME
JEWELRY

$ ] 1 9
$ p 9

I j p ’

Presto

Cora Poppér
Automotk Buttering 

Rea. $16.99

»13”
Anchor Hockir>g Honoy Gold

3 pc. Gip>Dip Set 
$ ] 9 9

CANDY
Your Choice: 

Mounds
Peanut Butter Bar 
Almond Joy 
Caravelle

BAGGIES
80 Count

W aoeoa
Mgaunmg
Foce
LoRon

Face Lotion

ROSE
MILK
3.7S O i.

69
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Twain: a summer selection

The story of a Good Little Boy
By Harfc T«rste

Once there  was a  good 
Uttte boy by the nam e of 
Jacob Blivem. He a lw ay i 
obeyed his paren ts, no n u t-  

^ te r  how absurd  and unrea­
sonab le  th e ir  d e m a n d s  • 
were; and he alw ays learned 
his book, and never was late 
a t Sabbath-school. He would 
not play hookey, even when 
his sober judgm ent told him  
n  was ttie m ost profitable 
thing he could do. He 
wouldn’t  lie, no n u t te r  how 
convenient it was. The curi­
ous ways tha t tha t Jacob  
bad, surpassed everything. 
He woukm't play m arb les on 
Sunday, he wouldn’t  rob 
birds’ nests, he wouldn’t  
give hot pennies to organ- 
g r in d e rs ’ m o n k ey s; he 
didn’t  seem  to take any 
interest in any kind of ra ­
tional a m u se m e n t. The 
other boys used to try  to 
reason it out and come to an 
understanding of him . but 
they could otuy figure out a 
sort of vague idea th a t he 
was “ afflicted,”  and so they 
took him under their protec­
tion, and never allowed any 
harm  to come to him.

Jacob had a  noble am bi­
tion to be put in a Sunday- 
school book. He wanted to be 
put in with pictures rep re­
senting him gloriously de­
clining to lie to his m other, 
and her weeping for Joy 
about it; and p ictures repre­
senting him  standing on the 
doorstep giving a penny to a 
poor beggar-woman with six 
children, and telling her to 
spend it freely, but not to  be 
extravagant, because ex­
travagance is a sin; and 
pictures of him m agnani­
mously refusing to tell on the 
bad boy who alw ays lay in 
wait for him around the 
com er as  he cam e from  
school. That was the am bi­
tion of young Jacob  Blivens.

It m ade him  feel a  little 
uncom fortable som etim es 
when he reflected th a t the 
good little boys alw ays died. 
He loved to Uve, you know, 
and this was the m ost un­
pleasant feature  about being 
a Sunday-schoolbook boy. 
He knew it was not healthy 
to be good. He knew it was 
more fatal than consump­
tion to be so supem aturally  
good as the boys in the books 
were; he knew tha t none of 
them had ever been able to 
stand it long, and it pained 
him to think th a t if they put 
him in a  book he wouldn’t  
ever see it, o r even if they 
did get the book out before 
he died it wouldn’t  be popu­
lar without any picture of tils 
funeral in the back p a rt of it. 
It couldn’t  be much of a

/ I

Sunday-school book th a t 
couldn’t  tell about the advice 
he gave to  the com m unity 
when he was dying. So a t  
last, of course, he had to 
m ake up his mind to  do the 
best he could under the c ir­
cum stances — to live right, 
and hang on a s  long a s  he 
could, and have his dy if^  
speech all ready when his 
tim e cam e.

But somehow nothing ever 
turned out with him  the way 
it turned out with the good 
little boys in the books. In his 
case there  was a  screw  loose 
somewhere, and it all hap­
pened Just the other way. 
When he found J im  Blake 
stealing apples, and went 
under the t m  to read  to  him 
about the bad little boy who 
feel out of a  n e i^ b o r ’s  apple 
tree and broke his arm , J^im 
fell out of the tree , too, but 
he fell on h im  and broke his 
arm , and J im  w asn’t  hurt a t 
all. Jacob  couldn’t  under­
stand that. There w asn’t 
anything in the books like it.

And once, when soiqp bad 
boys pushed a  blind m an 
over in the mud, and Jacob 
ran to help him  up and 
receive his blessing, the 
blind naan did not give him 
any blessing a t  all, but 
whacked him  over the head 
with his s tid i and said  he 
would like to catch  him 
shoving him  again, and then 
pretending to  help him  up.

This was not in accordance, 
with rn y  of the bo(du. Jacob 
looked them  all over to  see.

One thing th a t Jacob  
wanted to do was to find a 
lame dog tha t hadn’t  any 
place to stay , and w as hun­
gry and persecuted, and 
Bring him  home and pet him 
and have th a t dog’s  i n ^ r -  
ishable gratitude. And a t 
last he found one and was 
happy; and he brought him 
home and fed him, but when 
he was going to pet him  the 
dog flew a t  him  and tore all 
the clothes off him  except 
those th a t were in front, and 
made a  spectacle of him  that 
was astonishing.

Once, when he was on his 
way to Sunday-school, he 
saw some bad boys starting  
off pleasuring in a sailboat. 
He was filled with conster­
nation, because he knew 
from his reading th a t boys 
who went sailing on Sunday 
invariably got drowned. So 
he ran  out on a ra ft to  warn 
them, but a  log turned with 
him and slid him  into the 
river. A m an got him  out 
pretty soon, and the doctor 

the w ater out of 
1,'bu t he caught cold and 

lay sick abed nine weeks. 
But the OMst unaccountable 
thing about it w as th a t the 
bad boys in the boat had A 
good tim e all day, and  then 
reached home alive and 
well. Jacob  Blivens was per-

p u n ^ ^  
him, but

fectly dumfounded.
When he got well he was a  

Uttle (Uanwraged, but he 
resolved to  keep on trying 
anyhow. He knew th a t so fa r 
his experiences wouldn't do 
to go in a  book, but he hadn’t  
yet reached the allotted 
term  of Ufe for good little 
boys, and he hoped to be able 
to m ake a  record yet if he 
could hold on till m s tim e 
was fully up. If everything 
else failed he had his d)dng 
speech to faU back on.

At last, one day, when he 
was around hunting up bad 
little bora to admMiish, he 
found a  lot of them  in the old 
iron-foundry fixing up a  Ut­
tle Joke on fourteen or fifteen 
dogs, which they had tied 
together in long procession, 
and were going to ornam ent 
with em pty nitroglycerin 
cans m ade fast to their tails. 
Jacob sa t down on one <rf 
those cans (for he never 
minded grease when dutv 
was before him ), and he tome 
hold of the forem ost dog by 
the collar, and turned his 
reproving eye upon wicked 
Tom Jones.

But Just a t  tha t mom ent 
Alderman McWelter, full of 
wrath, stepped in. All the 
bad boys ran  away, but 
Jacob BUvens rose in con­
scious innocence and began 
one of those stately  Uttle 
S u n d a y - s c h o o l - r b o o k  
speeches which always com- 
mehce with “Oh, s ir !” in 
dead opposition to the fact 
that no boy, good or bad, 
ever s ta rts  a  rem ark  with 
“Oh, s ir .”  But the alderm an 
never waited to hear the 
rest. He took Jacob  BUvens 
by the e a r  and turned him  
around, and hit him  a  whack 
in the re a r  with the flat of his 
hand; and in an instant tha t 
good Uttle boy shot out 
through the roof and soared 
away tow ard the sun, with 
the fragm ents oi those fif­
teen dogs stringing a fte r 
him like the tail of a U te. 
And there  w asn’t  a  sign of 
that alderm an or that old 
iron-foundry left on the face 
of the earth ; and, as for 
young Jacob  BUvens, he 
never got a chance to m ake 
his last dying speech a fte r 
aU his trouble fixing it up, 
unless he m ade it to  t t e  
birds.

Thus perished the good 
UtUe boy who did the best he 
could, but didn’t  come out 
according to the books. 
Eveiy boy who ever did as 
he (Ud prospered except 
him. His case is tru ly  
rem arkable. I t wiU probably 
never be accounted for-

(First published in 1870)
(NEWSPAPER ENTERPRISE ASSN.)

Free telephone call can result 
in vacation costs being lowered

By LOUISE (X)OK 
Associated Press Writer

Cutting costs for summer va­
cations doesn’t have to mean 
cutting comers if you are will­
ing to spend a little time ex­
ploring all the available travel 
options

Start saving when you start 
planning Take advantage of 
toll-free telephone numbers. 
Many state travel offices and 
most major transportation and 
lodging companies maintain 
these numbers; check your lo- 
calNelephone directory for spe­
cifics

The Travel Information (Cen­
ter of the United States Travel 
Service also has a toll-free 
number — 800-243-2372 (Con­
necticut residents should call 
800-822-7611.) The center can 
answer questions about specific 
locations and tell you where to 
get more information.

Here are some general sug­
gestions from the travel service

on saving money in three ma­
jor areas; tramportation. ac­
commodations and food 

TRANSPORTA'nON 
Promotional fares and char­

ter flights make airline travel 
cheaper than ever before, but 
you must be prepared to accept 
rigid conditiohs. Fares change 
almost daily, but you can get 
an idea of some of the basics in 
’’How to Get an Air Fare 
Deal.’’ available, at no charge, 
from Consumer Information. 
U.S. Travel Service. U S. De­
partment of Commerce, Wash­
ington. D C . 202X 

If you prefer traveling by 
land, investigate special Am- 
trak and bus fares. Amtrak of­
fers rail passes, family plans 
and discount fares between cer­
tain cities. Trailways and 
Greyhound also have special 
low-cost travel plans available 
Once you have determined 
where and when you want to 
go. ask whether you qualify for

the lower pnees.
ACCOMMODATIONS

According to the U.S. Travel 
Service, more than SO percent 
of ail Americans who vacation 
in this country skip hotel and 
motel rooms and camp out or 
stay with friends while on holi­
day. Many federal and state 
parks have campsites available 
for from SI to IS a night. Cot­
tages and tenU at privately 
owned campgrounds are avail­
able for as little as r  to |17 a 
night.

If nothing but a hotel or mo­
tel will suit your needs, make 
sure you pay only for what you 
want. If you don’t intend to 
swim, pick a motel without a 
pool. If you won’t be eating in 
the fancy restaurant, look for a

place with a simple coffee 
shop. Take advantage of off­
season rates and packages that 
combine a room with sight­
seeing. Look for hotels and mo­
tels which allow children to oc­
cupy their parents’ room at no 
extra charge. Reserve in ad­
vance and ask for minimum- 
rate accomodations. Consider a 
hotel or motel on the outskirts 
of town.

FXX)D
The best way to save money 

on food is to cook your own If 
you don't have the facilities, 
however, or don’t want to cook, 
consider picnics. Clarry a bas­
ket stocked with utensils from 
home and stop along the way 
for sandwich ingredients, etc.

Under Foot
Y by Oil Phettoplace

To realize the difference 
between involvement 

'and commitment, think 
of a breakfast of bacon 
and e m ;  the hen who 
laid tne eggs was in­
volved, but m  pig who 
supplied the bacon is 
committed.... ^

We go on vacation to 
forget our troubles. 
When we arrive at our 

 ̂ destination, we find out 
what else we forgot....

A sign seen recently above a clock in a local store. 
"Shoplifters beware, do not tty to steal this clock; all 
our employees are watching rt.”

Over confidence is that quiet, assured foeling you get 
just before you foil flat on your face....

Your conscience doesn’t keep jrou from doin^ some­
thing wrong; it merely keeps you from eqjoying it... ̂

If you 
now

u etMy saving money, shop the half-price sale 
at Fhetfoplace Shoes, 100 N. Cuyler.

\ s .

HUtRY IN..WE HAVE A 
GOOD SELECTION IN STOCK

MIRROR SALE
Framed or 

l eveled Id g e

WARDEN GLASS

This wasn’t the year for area wheat
With wheat harvest completed 

in the Texas High Plains, nuny 
p r o d u c e r s  and e lev a to r 
operaton are reporting low test 
weight and low yields of wheat. 
In some cases the teitt weights 
are  below 50 pounds, whereas 
normally the test weight ranges 
from 56 to M pounds per bushel.

•There are  a number of 
possible factors involved in the 
low test weight and reduced 
yields, according to Dr Frank 
C. Petr, area agronomist with 
th e  T e x a s  A g ricu ltu ra l 
Extension Service. Hie problem 
may have resulted from a single 
adverse factor but most likely 
the greatest reductions were 
caused by a combination oi 
factors acting on heavily 
stressed wheat plants.

Som e of th e  fa c to rs  
contributing to the poor yields 
and test weights are drought, 
low temperatures in the spring, 
wheat streak mosaic virus and 
possibly yellow dwarf virus, 
septoria and related organisms, 
root rot and cool wet conditions 
in the latter part of the season.

Preliminary observations of 
re se a rc h  plots involving 
different levels of irrigation at 
Bushlaod and Etter indicate 
that severe moisture stress in 
April was probably the major 
factor contributing to the poor 
periormance of wheat in 1978. 
Like the previous year the 
winter and early spring season 
was very dry.

In 1977 rains commenced on 
April 14 while in 1978 the drought 
continued until May 2. about the 
time wheat would normally be 
heading. This additional two 
weeks of stress caused cells to 
die and the leaves were partially 
dessicated. When rain came the 
dead areas of leaves and stem 
provided a means for septoria 
and related organisms to enter

and infect the stressed wheat 

plants.
These soil borne fuiqp art 

favored by cool temperaturet 
arid rainy weather such as 
prevailed in May and early 
June. The iungus enters the 
p lan t causing a brownish 
discolorstiaa of the stem and 
especially the glumes covering 
the seed. The seed becomes 
shrivelled because moisture and 
nutrients are diverted tqr the 
disease organism. There are a 
number of related organisms in 
a com plex  th a t causes 
somewhat similar syn^itoms 
and damage. Some of these 
cause a brownish discoloration 
or black tip on the seed.

To help prevent possible 
p ro b le m s  n ex t se a so n , 
discolored or shrivelled seed 
should not be planted. It is also 
advisable to treat seed with a 
fungicide. It is Ukely that 
sepotria or ghime blotch occurs 
to a limited extent in most years 
but economic losses from the 
disease occur aboitt every 15 
years. It is not considered a 
major disease in this area but. 
re c o rd s  show "epidem ics 
occurred in 1941 «id again in 
1957.

In 1977’there was evidence of 
glume blotch caused by septoria 
or related organisins in the 
wetter-than-normal eastern part 
of the Panhandle e^iecially in 
Gray and Hemphill counties. As 
most fungi causing disease in 
wheat are soil bbene crop 
rotation and clean fallow may 
helpful controls.

There were few reports or 
observed cases of foot or root rot 
in the Panhandle in 1978. Ihis 
disease is caused by a fungus 
that builds up in the soil under 
continuous wheat cropping. It 
mainly affects the root system

A simple funeral for 
an uncomplicated man

EUFAUU. Okla. (AP) — He 
was buried here this weekend 
Except to friends and family, 
he wasn’t anybody special — 
just an ol’ cowboy.

Ranching was the only thing 
Jim Charlie Rice knew to do. 
or wanted to do. It never

brought him anything but hard 
work on somebody else’s land. 
But that was all right, he liked 
it.

Half of. Mexico's population is 
below the age of 17.

and causes a distinettve teimy 
black disooierstion of the lowest 
intemode above ground level 
As the roots decay they are 
unable to absorb moisture, 
consequently, the plant dies 
prem aturely and the- seed 
becomes shrivelled.

There is no varietal resistance 
to root rot. The most effective 
control is to rotate to com. 
sorghum or broadleaf crops for 
a  year or more until the 
population of the disease 
organism in the soil is reduced 
to a low level.

Early in trie season triere was 
a moderate incidence of wheat 
streak  mosaic virus. The 
diseased fields were generally 
planted early and were located 
in the proximity of volunteer 
wheat or row crops infested with 
summer annual grassy weeds 
that harbored the virus-bearing 
mites. Wheat that is fall-infested 
shows severe mosaic symptoms 
and generally fails to produce 
heads, consequently, such fields 
were grazed out or plowed up. It 
is likely that some fields were 
infested with the virus in the 
spring after the feads had 
formed.

In that situation the leaves 
may show some yellowing but 
usually the effect on yield or test 
weight is small. However, with 
the severe drought stress in 
April coupled wifo abnormally 
cold temperatures, the effects of 
the disease could have been 
severe enough to reduce yield 
and test weight. It is also known 
that the septoria or glume blotch 
organisms that are generally 
present in wheat land are better 
able to  infect plants that are 
already stressed by drought, low 
temperatures, virus and insects.

Although there is moderate 
to lerance to wheat streak 
mosaic virus reported in some 
varieties, the recommended 
control measures are to destroy 
all volunteer wheat in the 
proximity before plantii^ wheat 
and to delay planting until frost 
kills summer annual grassy 
weeds that may harbor the 
vector, wheat curl mite, and the 
virus.

When it is impractical to 
control volunteer wheat and 
other host plants it is best to 
leave a buffer zone of about 100 
yards which ran he planted later

in the season after mite 
populations and movement are 
reduced by cold weather.

Barley yellow dwa/f is 
another virus disease that might 
have contributed to reduced 
yields of wheat in a few 
instances. The disease is spread 
by aphids such as the greenbug 
Symptoms in barley include 
yellowing, dwarfing and poor 
head development. In wheat the 
sy m p to m s a re  genera lly  
confined to a yellow flag leaf 
with moderate if any direct 
effect on wheat yield. Combined 
with moisture and temperature 
stress, however, the presence of 
the virus could make the wheat 
p lant more susceptible to 
septoria and other fungus 
organisms capable of causing 
yield and quality losses.

Although low temperatures 
were a factor in the reduction of 
yield and test weight in wheat, 
there probably was little direct 
effect. Some early varieties 
especially fields that were not 
g razed , might have been 
damaged by heavy frosts in 
early April. This was evidenced 
by the white awns and sterile 
tips on the heads.

The temperatures associated 
with the snow on May 2 were not 
low enough to cause pollen or 
ovule damage except in a few 
lim ite d  areas where the 
temperature was below freezing 
for a few hours. Some damage 
resulted from the heavy snow 
load  which caused stem 
breakage of the more developed 
taller varieties.

These are a few plausible 
e n v i r o n m e n t - r e l a t e d  
explanations for the reduced 
yield and quality of Texas High 
Plains wheat. Another is that 
1978 just wasn’t a "wheat year. ’’

P a m p a  s L e rd in g
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Sure cure for the worst 
kind of electric shock:

There are tw o ways to keep cool this 
summer. The big difference between them IS 
operating cost.

The fact Is that air conditioning uses 
four times as much electricity as 
evaporative cooling.

Which means that keeping cool and 
comfortable with evaporative cooling 
saves you s out of every a dollars you’d

spend on electricity for air conditioning.
winch is why we can our coder 

The Miser.
A Miser costs much less to buy and much

less to run than air conditioning.
Even if you have air conditioning, using a 

Miser instead can save you a bundle.
The Miser; It takes the shock out of 

your electric b i.

A l p i n «

E v a p o r a t iv e  c o o in g
It keeps you cool, 

w ithout keeping you broke.

The Miser"'

Clay Brothers TV & Appliance
formerly HAWKINS-EDDINS APPLIANCES

• KitchenAid • Frigidaire • Tappar)
• Magic Chef • Hot point • Thermador

Maytag • Sony 
Amano • Zenith

• Jenn-Aire
e  A lpine

1430 N. Benks é u - i e i i
854 • WE SERVICE WHAI WE SEu • ,669-3207k . ___  *

<• V

more 
Sales 
enee 
Kipb 
other 

He 
eling 
of hu 
Waait 
bills

a c u ì
with
Kapil
hamt
bun.

ThI 
motel 
121 r 
He p 
calls, 
samp 
ance 
year, 
|40,M 
than 
Edwi 
about 

His 
mom 
than 
riddk 
the s 
point! 
poirtb 
ing 
three 

“W 
mak( 
not 
ting,’ 
happ 
the a

l l

OPEN 8 10 a ir  *0 6 D m

. 4 '
M,.m • I),, - nl. •



■ ■ " ' -  ■;" ' ■■ ■■• ' - : ;  i  f e

fhHÉk  NfWS I t .  I«7 « *

} •

Gashogregiilations ' 
penalty to salesmen

By MALCOLM N. CARTER 
AMGwOT r r m  wtmb

LANCASTER, Pa. (AP) >  
With the aparkle in hit eyes 
long spent, the salesm an's eye­
lids hang somshow heavier at 
the end of the day.

Orders will go unaent once 
nwre, put off until tomorrow. 
Sales reports will go unwritten 
«1^  more. And once more, Hy 
Kaplan will go alone to yet an­
other Joyless motel room.

He is S3 years old and a trav­
eling saleanan since 1182, one 
of hundreds holding a march in 
Washingon Tuesday to protest 
bills before Congress that th ^  
say would unwittingly dis­
crim inate against them.

The proposals would raise 
taxes on fud-inefficient ca n  
and remove some deductions 
for business meals derided as 
“three-martini lunches.”

“Why can’t they protect us' 
for a change?” the ^ y -h a ired  
u lesm an  asks. “I feel the 
things they're coming 1 9  with 
are basically hutting the 
middle-income man.”
'  His “fuel-inefficient" l>n  
Chrysler, Kaplan says, is the 
container for his bread and but­
ter — the sample dresses, ITS 
of them this di^, that he hauls 
from one badnrater town to th e' 
next.

“ I bought this car for the 
trunk,” hie relates. “That's the 
way I buy a car — with a tape 
m easure.”

And lunches laced with mar­
tinis? More often than not, ib’s 
a cyp of black coffee sweetened, 
with a sugar substitute and, 
Kaplan mutters, a fast-food 
hamburger bereft of fattening 
bun.

This day begins at 1:30 in a 
motel outside Pittsburgh. The 
1 2 1  room is but one expense. 
He pays for meals, telephone 
calls, gasoline, his car. the 
sam ple dresses, health insur­
ance and Social Security. Last 
year, he says, he made nearly 
140,000 in commiasians on more 
than II milUon worth of Young 
Edwardian (Leases. He netted 
about $18.000.

His first telephone calls this 
morning produce little more 
than the disappointments that 
riddle a salesm an's day. Today 
the m ag is one canceled ap­
pointment after another — ap­
pointments made before leav­
ing home in Lido Beach, N.Y., 
three days earlier.

"When you (hive SOO m iles to 
. m ake appointments and they're 

not there. It's kind of frustra­
ting,” Kaplan says. "And it 
happens a lot. know that 
the salesman is ahráys going to 
com e back to them. Ihey  
know.”

John Harrigan, who owns 11 
stores, is not in any. and not at 
home. Kaplan tries anyway, 
drives into downtown Pitts­
burgh and, crisp in a blue bla^ 
er. strolls into the store. Ap­
praising the racks, he tells the 
manager he's out of a voile 
model that has sold well. Then 
he asks her to call and see if 
Harrigan has surfaced.

Meantime, it's back to the 
phone, hoping he can see the 
owner of a Chambersburg store 
later: "Tell Steve I'U be there. 
He's passed up the line twice 
without even seeing it. I’ll be 
there later.”

After he hangs up. he charms 
a young saleswoman. “Hlya. 
doll.” he says. “See what 1 get 
with this job? All the youi« 
chicks.”

Notwkhstaiidiag jok a  about 
traveliag salesmen, Kaplan 
says Uder, he geU long h ) ^  
nights insteadef such “chicks.” 

His wife has come to accept 
his absences, which started two 
years after he was married, 
Kaplan says. But he addi that 
she has had to be father as well 
as mother to their four chil-. 
dren, now grown.

Kaplan lo p  38,00IMO,00O 
m iles annually, passes whole 
months away from home and 
spends perhaps 2S0 days a year 
in his territfliy, Pemwylvania, 
Maryland. Washington ̂ an d  
southern New Jersey.

On the telephone again, he 
team s yet anothe appointment 
is off.

Harrigan h u  not appeared, 
so Kaplan passes tim e going 
for coffee. He finds a parkkig 
ticket on his car. It will coat 
him $10 .

Whan Harrigan finally surfac­
es, he complains that only the 
sheer polyesters are moving. 
Kaplan placates him, promising 
free samples for the saies- 

'persons who sell the most of his 
line.

Heading east on the turnpike, 
he doesn't wear his seat belt, 
doesn’t turn on the radio and 
d oesn l listen to the CB jabber.

"With the tape deck, with the 
Steve Martin tapes, with all the 
tapes, they don’t mean noth­
in’.” Kaplan says. “You’re still 
sitting there alone.”

He detours to Ligonier, but 
onj^store owner is out of town 
and'a second store is going out 
of business. Kaplan makes for 
Somerset, where the proprietor 
says she’s too busy for him.

More telephone calls, and one 
is good news: An order from 
Altoona is confirmed. But 
Steve, the man he had tried to 
reach in Chambersburg, is un­
happy with Young Edwardian 
sak e and won’t see Kaplan.

“There’s no end to this,’’ 
Kaplan sighs, starting to wilt in 
the heat. “You just keep on go- 
mg.

Enduring snail-paced trailers 
and snarled toll lines, he reach­
es Bedford. K  m iles from Pitts­
burgh, just before 5 p.m. And 
— at 1 ^  r - Dixie Stuff! says 
she’ll look at the line, “if you 
hurry.”

Kaplan Is tranfdrmed. He 
darts outside, wrestles three 
bags of dresses onto a rack and 
struggles back In. One “num­
ber” at a time, he fairly pi­
rouettes before the woman, his 
spiel like the patter of a carniv­
al pitchman. He sees himself as 
a record. “The needle's in the 
groove,” he says. It is like 
being on stage, « id  he is the 
star.

“When the cameras are run­
ning and the lights are on, 
there's no stopping me.” Kapl­
an says. “Su(l(ienly everything 
changes.”

This is his reward. This, and 
the 33 dresses she orders.

In Lancaster by I , he's trav­
eled more than 280 m iles and 
worked 13 hours. He says he 
knows no other life and wishes 
none other.

There'll be no retirement, he 
says. But maybe his wife soon 
will join him on the road. For 
comfort tonight, there's only 

* her call.

For companlonahip. there's 
the TV. It plays on m d on M o 
the night as Hy Kaplan, his 
star now dimmed, siiiks obliv­
ious lido sleep. -

Carter’s organized
» .

labor recruitis nil^
By IT B PIB N M . BROWN t -  

AP BaMnsas WrtMr
NEW YORK (AP) -  H m 

Carter AdnaMatratioa la trying 
to enllM orgsniaad labor Into 
the fight i^dnat Inflatian, but 
the number of rocruBs ao far la 
nU.“

Tho While Houaa haa aaked 
that wiMe aettlementa be held 
to onebalf percent lesa than 
the prevloualy negotiated in- 
cruM e. But last winter the ad­
m inistration agreed to a 31 per­
cent pay taicraaae over three 
years for miners to end a  
lengthy coal strike.

Since then, several building 
trades unions tai the West have 
won large settlem enu. one with 
a 28 percent increase in the 
first year. Retail dcfks In 
Philadelphia settled with a 10 
perornt raise this year. WaM- 
ern pulp and paper worlMrs 
have demanded a 14 percent 
booat. as did fetkral postal 
^ k c r s . Railroad workers 
have been negotiating a rMae 
of 31 percent over three years.

Barry Bosworth. who as di­
rector of the Council on Wage 
and Price StabiUty is a laadar 
of Cartar’a battle a g a M  bi- 
flatk ». admitted last week to 
the House Budget Oanmittee 
that the AdmiaistraUon has 
failed to get laker’s eoopara-

And the worst may be yat to 
com e. H ie powerful TeenMars, 
United Auto Worken and 
United Steelworkers unions will 
negotiate next year. Ih e gov- 

.ernment plans to try to in­
fluence bargaining In these in­
dustries to prevent large wage 
increases. But Bosworth is wor­
ried that those industries be­
lieve they \ easily can raise 
prices to cover higher labor 
coots. In that situatian. Arms 
m ay resist wage demands Mas 
strenuously Uum would com­
panies that must keep prices 
down.

The probiero the White House 
faces is that workers don't 
want to be the ftaet to'give up 
something in the name of the 
war on Inflation. Union leaders 
say thay’re undaf praasure 
from the rank and file to keep 
wages at least even with the 
Consumer Price Index, which 

bean dim bing at an annual 
of about 10  peroont so far 
year. Unions also claim  

It husiniss has not shown 
much rootraM on prico hikas.

H w  fbdaral Bureau of Labor 
Statistics says that during the 
first three memhs of H U the 
average wags IncreoM in ma­
jor barp in in g  « it s . (boss wMh 
at laaat JAIO smpioyeas, ams 
1 . 0  percent far the first year of 
the contracts.
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‘d/scoier the difference

SAVE 36  ̂ ON 
75 G IAD BAGS PLUS 10 FREE

«
BOX

REG.
1.24

Clear bags are perfect for freezing or storing 
foods. Comes with twist closures. Gallon capacity.

SAVE 1.80 ON 
COVERED 

•\C A K E  PAN

4.27

Aluminum pan with exclusive high dome “snap-on” 
styrene cover. Super for baking, taking or storing!

SAVE ON
POLAROID
S X -70H LM

SPECIAL 
PRICE

Tan true-color prints... 
for those special sum­
mer memories! SX-70.

X

ipictlire 
Hangers

SAVE 22* ON 
10 LB. PICTURE 

HANGERS

REG. 23c PKG. Includes 
6 hangers and 6 nails:

■wan MM

Ì

REG.
2.87

STRYPEEZE
PAINT

REMOVER

82
QUART

SAVE 75c. Strips paint 
varnish. Apply with 

brubh. One quart can.

lüCOÛûOÂ̂ I
SAVE O PO N  

MOTORCRAFT 
OIL HLTERS

Fits moat Chryalar and 
Ford products on the 
road today. No. FL-1.

Coronado Center 
Pampa, Texas

WE RESERVE TH E  RIGHT TO  LIMIT Q U AN TITIES. 
REFUNDS CH EER FULLY GIVEN!

►'ry

M
SAVE 71'
ON PUFFS PRINTS

REG.
78c BOX

BOXES 63
Super soft Puffs your nose knows the differ­
ence' New delicate floral design 175 in box

SAVE 22c ON 
MICKEY MOUSE 
QT.-OF-BUBBLES

«

Have a bubbly good time! 
Throw or blow bubbles 
thru the plastic wand.

ÄIART-P:

m '

fantastic
V A L U E S

PER FECT 
FOR 

fEXERCISINQC

SAVE u n  
ON 8)1' 

JUM P ROPE

REG.
2.97

The easy way to get 
in shape! Perfect in­
doors or out! No. 1R.

L.i.

SAVE 2.09 ON 
PLANT STAND 

with WOVEN TOP

REG.
6.97

Super for home or patio! 24" 
high planter will hold up to 
9*/4” pots! Walnut Brown.

ORIGINAL ARTIST TAPES 
'AS SEEN ON TV•« i rv f

TA P ES 3 .9 9 EACH

UP TO 20 SUPER HITS ON A TAPE!
Select from your all-time lavorltea.. country 
weaiern, disco, easy listening or 50's rock & roll! 
A LB U M S ...................................................3.40 EA.

(M»

SAVE ON 
SUPER UGHT 
b BAHERIES

199
Search light power in a 3 
cell flashlight. 3 “D" cell 
batteries incl. No. 3745.

NWOUIIE
R m a a

44>IECE 
VINYL FLOOR 

M AT SET

SPECIAL PRICE 
Claar Vinyl. Fit 
moat intarmadl- 
ata and standard 
aiza cars. VH-4.

SAVE THROUGH SATURDAY! PRICES EFFECTIVE THRU JULY 2 2 , 1 9 7 8
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13 Comadian 
King

14 Dimwit
ISPoatic

Präposition
16 Languor
I I  Yallow fauar 

motqiHto
20 Gan^man
21 Mao____

tung
22 Gardan ptsnt
24Sat
26 Nod
30 Charitv
34 Island off 
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35 Thron (prafix)
36 Garman 
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(comp wd.)

37 S tn n ^  
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30 Frsnch 
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A stro -G roph
My Bernice Bfctie Ot»ol
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July 10,1076
You'll be more on tbe go than 
usual this coming year. Takirtg 
lots of short jaunts and meeting 
all kinds of people should 
provide you with oodles of 
excitement.
CANCER (Jurw 21-Juiy 22) 
VYhat you don't have in your 
head you'd better be prepared 
to have in your feet today. Your 
judgment is questionable and 
steps may have to be retraced. 
Find out to whom you're ro­
mantically suited by sending 
for your copy of Astro<3raph 
Latter. Mail iO cents for each 
and a long, sell-addressed, 
stamped envelope to Astro- 
Graph, P.O. Box 480, Radio Cl^ 
Station, N Y. 10010. Be sure to 
specify birth sign.
LEO (July 23-Aug. 22) Normally 
you're quite capable of han­
dling things for yourself, but 
today it would be wiser to hire 
competent help. You're apt to 
botch the job.
YIRQO (Aug. 23-Sept. 22) This 
is not a day to gamble on 
others to bail you out where 
you have gotten yourself in too 
deep. Tote your own lifejacket. 
LIBRA (Sept. 23-Oct. 23) 
Though your intentions might 
be g ( ^ ,  check with the family 
before you attempt any major 
moves today You could step 
on somebody's feelings. 
SCORPIO (Oct. 24-Nov. 22) 
Back_pfLiijjgoJin^jjoujJdea^

conflicting with thoM of oth­
ers. You have a tenderKy today 
to lock in on the details and you 
could lose the big picture. 
SAGITTARIUS (Nov. 23-Oec. 
21) Associating with high 
rollers today could give you 
delusions of granduer, but 
trying to match them financially 
is foolish.
CAPRICORN (Dec. 22-Jan. 10) 
It's true your thinking is sharp 
today, but to get along witn 
others you may have to bend 
your ideas a little to salve their 
pride.
AQUARIUS (Jan. 20-Feb. 10) 
Plenty of oppodunities will be 
offered you today, but your 
indifference will make It impos­
sible to cash in on th^m. 
PISCES (Feb. 20-March 20) 
Blowing a remark or an action 
by a friend out of proportion 
could cause a serious rift. Take 
time to determine your pal's 
true intentions.
ARIES (March 21-AprH 10) If you 
let your actions speak for them­
selves today the strain won't 
be nearly as great as the pat on 
the back you are trying to give 
yourself.
TAURUS (April 20-May 20) This 
should be a fun day, so Iona as 
you take care to think before 
you speak. If not, you may find 
yourself highly embarrassed 
from a careless remark. 
GEMINI (May 21-June 20) 
Spruce up your surroundings 
as much as you want, but try to 
do so without spending any 
money. Purchases made today 
could be tontorrow's white ele­
phants.
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Rangers blank Orioles
By GORDON BEARD 

AP SfMis Writer
BALTIMORE (AP( -  Steve 

Comer, who was bypaned in 
the ItTt free agent draft and 
went to spring training this 
year as a nonroater ^ayer, 
may never be overlooked 
again.

The 24-year-old Texas rookie 
blanked the Baltimore Orioles 
on four hits through nine in­
nings in his first major league 
start Monday night, in a game 
won by the Rangers 2-0 in 11 
innings.

“He couldn’t have been much 
better, unless it would have 
been a no-hitter,” Texas Man­
ager Billy Hunter said. “ I was 
just hoping we'd get him a run. 
after the way he pitched."

But the Rangers didn’t score 
until Bump Wills rode home on 
a sacrifice fly by Bobby Bonds, 
and Juan Beniquez followed 
with a solo homer off Mike 
Flanagan, who was trying to 
become the first 14-game win­
ner in the major leagues.

Only three Baltimore runners 
re a c M  second base against 
Comer, and the victory went to 
Reggie Cleveland, 3-5, who re­
tired all six batters he faced to 
reverse the 2-1 decision he

dropped in the 12th inning Sun­
day.

Comer, who had never gone 
more than •  13 innings in IS re­
lief appearances, struck out 
seven u ^ le  throwing 113 pitch­
es and footed!.the Orioles 
frequently with his change-up 
delivery.

"He looks like a right-handed 
Sandy Kotrfax out there,” 
Cleveland said of Comer, refer­
ring to his sparkling 0.69 
earned run average, and not 
the physical makeup or pitch­
ing style of Comer.

“ He has a lot of confidence 
and poise for a kid who’s been 
in the game only a couple of 
years.” Ctevelarid said. “He 
throws strikes and gets the ball 
down, and uses all his pitches.”

Comer, signed as an un­
drafted free agent, has not 
allowed an earned run in his 
last 18 innings, and only one in 
his last 31 13 frames. He has 
compiled a 3-2 record in relief.

“ I know I was just a fill-in 
because we had five games in 
four days,” Comer said. “ I 
know I’m going back to the 
bullpen, but 1 now know what I 
can do in a starting role”  
Flanagan, who has lost seven, 
permitted only one runner be­
yond first b a »  until Wills sin­

gled with one out in the 11th, 
stole second and continued to 
third when the throw from 
catcher Rick Dempsey struck 
his left thigh and bounced into 
left field.

Hunter said he had given 
Wills the “steal-if-you-can- 
make-it” sign, which was not 
too risky since Wills has been 
thrown out only four times 32 
steal attempts.

Bbods, who had two of the 
nine Texas hits, then lined his 
sacrifice fly to center. Beniquez 
followed with his third hit. and 
fifth homer of the season.

The Orioles, after going 
through their first 77 games 
without being shut out, have 
now been blanked in three of 
their last 14 outings.

They missed their best 
chance in the seventh when 
Ken Singleton opened with a 
single and Pat Kelly got a bunt 
single when Comer looked for a 
possible force on Singleton be­
fore throwing too late to first.

But Lee May, who has four 
hits in his last 41 times at bat. 
forced Singleton at third on a 
bunt, and Doug DeCinces 
grounded into a double play. 
Rich Dauer, 6-for-17, also hit 
into a twin killing in the sixth.

Sports
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Martin indefinitely 
suspends Jackson

After Monday’s win, Astro 
won’t rely on bull pen feeling

By MICHAEL A. LUTZ 
AP Sports Writer

HOUSTON (AP) -  Houston 
Astros knuckle ball pitcher Joe 
Niekro has teamed not to rely 
on the feeling he gets while 
warming up in the bull pen pri­
or to the start of a game.

Take Monday night for in­
stance. Niekro didn’t think hi.s 
knuckler was all that bed­
eviling before he started pitch­
ing against the Philadelphia 
Phillies.

But after a 11-inning, five-hit 
2-1 victory over the National 
League ^ s t  leaders, Niekro 
had to admit his bull pen feel­
ings were wroi',g once again- 
-and' so did the Phillies.

“ I thought I pitched pretty 
well tonight.” said Niekro, 6-7. 
“The last start against Phillies 
I felt great in the bull pen but 
didn’t have great stuff in the 
game. Tonight was the oppo­
site.”

Niekro singled and scored the 
game’s first run in the fifth in­
ning on a single by Terry Puhl, 
the Astro’s lone 1978 All-Star. 
Niekro faltered in the eighth 
when he allowed Bake McBride 
to single in the tying run.

But the magic returned in the 
final three innings as Niekro 
retired nine of the last 11 Phils 
and watched gleefully in the 
11th as teammate Jose Cruz hit 
Rawly Eastwick’s first pitch of

Baseball

Chlcifo

New Yw t 
St Lm ì i

By 1W Am m M i S Pratt 
ASTWMtBDT

NATIONAL LBAOUI 
BAST

«  L PM. GB
pMt M 17 MS -  

«  41 All m
44 41 MS I
44 4S 47S IH
M M 411
n  M MS M

Sat Praadtee 
ClaclaaaU 
tat Aaftitt 
Sta DItfo 
AUaaU 
Hattlaa

M M SH
a  M W
U  M STS
44 4S 471
45 4S 44S
M «  441

Ltt Aaftita 1 „  
Atlaala M . N t«

CMcaae
----------- ----------jm  Ytrt t .
PWaMrfh S. I m  DNfo 7. M iMNMt 
ClaclaaaU S. Mtautal S 
HttHea L PMIaMpUa I. II kaUMt 
•aa Prtartttt S. m  I wit 7 TatMa;

Oaiatt

> lBtktrU4-4l.
7-41 at CW- 

M l at PtttWwfk 

a M l at Atlaau

Aaatitt i
iCaaMana M l. a 

Nm t Vtrii iKat 
iN M rt  IM I. a 

Maatrtal iDati M  ar May M l at Cki- 
rUiaall (Statar M l. a 

PMItSiMSIt (Laahtri l-Sl at HtatHa 
iRIckarS SSI. a

Saa DItst (Raaaaaaai S-7i at St Latto 
iVackarIck 7-Sl. a WtStttiay'a Gaam 
Sta Praaetoet at eWcaat. 1
Alitala at Maatrtal. I. l-a 

' ClactoaaU at PWliStlpSto. a 
Lat laetiat at PUtokivgli. a 
Hiatoaa at Ila« Yark. a 
Saa Dtoao at SI.Laato a

ASOMCAN LBAOUB 
BAIT

PM. OB

MIhrtakaa
BtHkatra
Na« Yark
Dalrall
ClatatoaS

Batata Cky
CaMarato
Taaaa
OakItaS
Mtoaatata
Cktotfa
Stallia

W L
SI M 
M M  M  SH
IS 41 MS U
47 41 SM 14
IS 44 SH U
a  IS 4S7 NH
U N  MS » H

nsT
IS 41 MS -  
«  41 SH -
M 41 SI7 I
47 4S J l l  IH
a  4S 44S S
a  H  4M s
a SI Ml a

the inning over the rightfield 
fence to end the game.

It was Cruz’ eighth game­
winning hit of the season and 
the scene is beginning to ap­
pear more than coincidence.

“ I concentrate a lot more in 
the tight situations.” Cruz said. 
“ It was a high fast ball. I saw 
it all the way and just jumped 
right in there. It would have 
been a shame not to hit it out.”

Eastwick considered Cruz’ 
habit of swinging at bad pitch­
es.

“The pitch to Cruz was out of 
the strike zone.” Eastwick. the 
loser, said. “He swings at a lot 
of bad pitches.”

Niekro singled to open the 
fifth inning, went to second 
base on Rafael > Landestoy’s 
sacrifice bunt and scored when 
Pull poled a line drive single to 
rightfield.

That stood up until the eighth 
when Phillie’s Ted Sizemore ted 
(rff with a single, and pinch- 
runner Bud Harrelson stole sec­
ond and scored on McBide’s 
single.

“ I didn’t get tired. I felt I 
could have gone two or three 
more innings.” Niekro said.

Philadelphia Manager Danny 
Ozark gave Niekro proper cred­
it.

“Joe made some pretty good 
pitches,” Ozark said. “Whit the 
ball well tonight, but we just 
seemed to be hitting at some­

body all night. We had a couple 
of good chances, but the pick- 
offs really hurt us.”

NEW YORK (AP) -  Reggie 
Jackson says he is being placed 
in the position of “greedy mon­
eymaker against the poor little 
street fighter” after his in­
definite suspension without pay 
for bunting when he was or­
dered to swing away by Man­
ager Billy Martin.

“He doesn’t want me around 
here, he should be happy now,” 
said a calm Jackson viiien noti­
fied of Martin’s decision to sus­
pend him. “Billy hasn’t spoken 
to me for a year and a half so 
why should he talk to me now? 
Why should he tell me? Why 
should I talk to him?”

Jackson was batting after 
Thurman Munson singled with 
none out in the 10th inning of a 
5-5 game that Kansas City 
eventually won 9-7 in 11 in­
nings. Third base coach Dick 
Howser relayed the bunt sign 
from Martin to Jackson on the 
first pitch from Kansas City's 
AI Hrabosky.

"The bunt was on, on the 
first pitch.” Martin explained 
in his terse, hand-written note 
that he read to newsmen after 
a 30-minute private discussion 
with Yankees General Manager 
Cedric Tallis. “It was then tak-

Full practice Saturday
THOUSAND OAKS, Calif 

(AP) — Rookies and nine sec­
ond-year players retimed to 
two-a-day practices at the Dal­
las (Towboys training camp 
Monday.

Just prior to their afternoon 
session. Coach Tom Landry 
spent an hour overseeing a 
workout by a dozen key veter­
ans who reported voluntarily 
Sunday

The group included quarter­
backs Roger Staubach and 
Danny White who put the club’s 
corps of returning receivers 
and running hacks through 
passing drills.

Fullback Robert Newhouse 
also checked in Monday 'and 
underwent a pre-training physi­
cal. All remaining veterans are 
expected to report Thursday 
evening with the first actual 
full-squad practice set for Sat­
urday.

The annual Cowboys-San 
Diego Chargers rookies scrim­
mage at the Chargers camp in 
Irving. Calif., is scheduled for 
Wednesday.

Second-year tackle Jim Eid- 
son may be forced to miss 
Wednesday’s scrimmage The

second-round draft choice two 
years ago missed all of last 
season with a knee injury fol­
lowing a promising rookie sea­
son in 19^. Eidson suffered a 
jammed neck in Monday's 
workout and had to leave the 
afternoon practice.

The Cowboys waived four 
free agent rookies Monday in­
cluding defensive backs Tim 
Abney, Lincoln. Mo., and Rus­
sell Swilley, Denver University.

Lemons picked 
senior coach

DALLAS (AP)—Abe Lemons 
of the University of Texas is 
the runaway selection as senior 
college coach of the winter by 
the Texas Sports Writers Asso­
ciation.

Lemons’ Longhorns won the 
NIT basketball tournament 
after finishing as co-champions 
in the Southwest Conferece. 
Lemons received 66 first-place 
votes and 435 points in the pref­
erential balloting.

Guy Lewis, basketball coach 
at the University of Houston, 
was second with 281 points.

i r c s t o n e VACATION

PolytstBr/Fibtrglofs BtItBd 
DELUXE CH/UMPION

D O U B L E  B E L T E D I
Deluxe Champion 

r

T n a i  t  BAMMTt I. It M toa 
BmNmi 1. MkMMU L  M tatoMi 
Rm m m  CRjp t. Nm> Y«rt 7. II M ü l l  
MUvtotoM «, C W «ai I 
D M n « 4. C iB iM i  L  a  katofi 
OeàlwML T irwAi  IOtTAlHM j, tMBli 11M n> 0a m
T tia i i n n  M l m  M tU m tn  

iM cOrtBwM I, A
CMcaaa iWaaB M l M HMwAAkto IAa- 

■AtolAt M l. A
CIavaIaaA iH aIU BMI Al CAlWtoAto 

lAAAt 7-41. A
DAtTAB iRaam m  4-41 Al OaU aaB ILIAB-

M  1-71. A
T i r M  (l.iAHAmii M il Al iMMIt 

lAkfe44t M l. A
B A ljt lAM AA tckA<AltB  

t i A A l B A r ' l  
Oaama

DA4TAB Al OaU aaB. A

Na«  VATk Al MBanaMa. a 
T tiA i Al Kaaaaa CKjr. A 
CIaaaIaaB M CABkralA. A 
T in a ia  ai I n i i Ii . a

Jim  Brown, now a movie 
tU r, carried the ball a Nfinrd 
2,359 times (hrinf his National 
Football Laafue career.

A 7B -I3 Any SitA I ìa7a«I Any SitA liilAd Any SiiA litTAd

^24
7*7 »1.71

$30
S7S-l4 7fT »I.A1 
C7S-I4 TtT. SI .*7 
171-14 7*1 *3 1«

*34
F7B-14 FtT $2.M 
CPB-MFfT 11.47 
F7R.IB FtT 
O n -iS F iT  n

»40
H7*-I4rf1 »1.70 
H7S-I17*1 »3.3* 
J7S-I1 7*1 »1 *4 
17»-IS T il »3.0*

REDUCED PRKES
Steal B eM

RdM  VIWliHewolls

M ONROE
GRIPPERS

» 5 4 5

n  7S-14 n  70-14

$44
FtT »71

»47
9» » »

H* 70-14 08 70-1$

»53
fV1 »37

»50
9tf » M

a  70-it LR 70-1$

»58
F» »4S

»62
m  »6 S

SUPER
SPORT

TO

OfO ’ 1 
OTO ( TO I« 
ÍTO <6 GTU 8 TO IS 
OTO »•> 
HTQ »S

PfK9
ÏWU

CM 13 14
CM IS NSO

06013 (6014 860 1406014 H60 14 140 14 860 IV 060 IS 
M601S 160 IS

a n d  RV TIRES

i T t r * « f o n *
^ t r a n s p o r t -

AH wM lira «vRti strong nylon cord body

TUtITYPE

i Q  6iaaaWs j  t

: ElttTMNNM

8 701» e»o 16
7 001» 
70016

5Q 16

•»MOB
ZB.St
M.MSk.TB

TUBIL'SS
T i s i r7 00 14 

6 701» 31.16

MUMCNW

hju
1 Pv6«lt

UNE.-
OLft
niTER

<tin Aiilimwiltv«' |triai «6di inbri- 4 1*1«- triKir rm'iMhaHmH. ilrain i»M •mI (ind nrW up I»» h*»’ ipiurt« <»f oil. filun inntnll a ni-w P'lnvtom- ihI hhrr. CnM an
■iimiaUBaL«

BRAKE 
OVERNAUL
$59«

Í Any drum typa 
Amr C68

«Wr inataH im-l(«ry |»n*-Rrv«̂NfH Inmt ami« and TtelurM
npriitda

4̂ 4 rvbuild all nh4«*l 4 vlinii*T«. irauHiitv driiniH. ir|Mi4k Inte»« 
brarifiaie

A If nrwdlrd. mna wbia l • wItndiTB
- l i e * *

FRONT END 
AUGNMENT

1 »10“
Umbs Aeeiaaw Cw

a\AVTI ai't « aairf. «amfa r and lia- in l4i manufiMlur«̂  a t»nf»nal
Nffaattii'alN'n

A No 4*atra tN4rt Uw rar« wilh fari4*rv a*r 4*r t4»n»»on ham.
A l'aria i-«lra. if madrd

t a«N> a —"  CM 
•AA ItotoAW CaTW tl— In

imnmre
mM MOUMTWM 08 TOUt 
riMSTOM net ruecHASi

I M N  Bn t  A M M I«  
0p66 fUmmérn/ Nipm PHday 

l*9«Nl«y MfiB

en off via verbal instructions 
by the third base coach The 
manager’s orders were just dis­
regarded. He bunted in de­
fiance of a verbal order to hit ”
, In attempting to bunt. Jack- 
son eventually popped to the 
catcher on a two-strike count. 
He was then told by “one of 
Billy’s coaches.” Gene Michael, 
that his services were no longer 
needed during the game.

’’Reggie Jackson is sus­
pended without pay effective 
this moment for deliberately 
disregarding the manager's in­
structions,” read Martin’s 
statement

Jackson. 32. spoke of the play 
in the Yankees’ Ipcker room 
following the game but before 
Martin’s announcement of the 
suspension.

“ 1 wanted to get him home 
the best way I could.” said 
Jackson of Munson “ If I get it 
down. I’m a hero. If not. I'm a 
bum.

“ I’ve got a man. Lou Pi- 
niella, hitting .320 behind me 
and we’ve got a good chance to 
score and win if I move the 
man up”

After learning of the suspen­
sion. Jackson mentioned that 
he'd told Munson he would bunt 
if Munson got on base.

“When I was on deck. I told 
Thurm, 'If you get on I'll bunt 
you over ’ He said, ‘Don’t get 
carried away” ’

Jackson then turned his focus 
to his recurrent problems with 
Martin ever since the All-Star 
outfielder signed a 83 million 
contract with the club as a free 
agent after the 1976 season

“I can’t win no matter what I 
do." said Jackson, who is bat­
ting .266. with 14 homers and 51 
RBI this season and last year 
was the hero of the Yankees’ 
World Series triumph over the 
Dodgers with three home runs 
in the sixth and deciding game 
“ I come off as a big. greedy 
moneymaker. I'm not going to 
file a suit or a grievance.

“ I’ve been saying ‘Yes, sir’ 
ever since I came here. I’m not 
going to fight this.” he added in 
a tone that made it seem he 
expected Martin’s decision. 
“ I’ve never had the summer 
off. I’m tired and I’m down. 
Maybe I’ll take the 9 a m 
flight to California”

Against Plainview

Caprock wins first game
Texas Panhandle Capro(4 

came up from behind in the 
bottom of the seventh inning 
to defeat Plainview 4-3 in the 
opening nigM of the West 
Texas State Babe Ruth 
Baseball tournament at the 
Pampa Optimist Boys Qub 
Monday night 

John Wataon of Stinnett hit 
a grounds to center field 
and John Kaplan of Borger 
blasted a base hit between 
left and center field to bring 
in the tying and winiung runs 
for the elated Caprock team, 
which also includes players

from  Pam pa, Phillips. 
Skellytown and Panhandle.

.W atson  and Gregory 
Fleming of Borger pitched 
fo r Caprock, which is 
coached by James Davis. 
Jo e  W atson and Kim 
Maning Jackie Edwards 
pitched for Plainview. which 
is coached by Charles Tue. 
Sam Dunn and Ron Kaiser

A tie was established early 
in the game when each team 
scored a run in the first 
inning. Larry Williams of 
Plainview was sent to home 
by a single from teammate

*'Doc responds tò  call, 
saves Oriole fan’s life

By GORDON BEARD 
AP Sports Writer

BATTIMORE (AP) -  Base­
ball pitchers strive to record 
saves, but only when George 
“ Doc" Medich is involved are 
human lives a | stake

The Texas hurler, a first year 
resident at Allegheny Geiieral 
Hospital in Pittsburgh, saved 
the life of an apparent heart at­
tack victim in the stands of Me­
morial Stadium Monday night 
about an hour before the 
Rangers were to play the Balti­
more C)rioles.

Germain Languth. 61. of 
Pasadena, Md., had no detec­
table heartbeat or pulse by the 
time Medich responded to a 
public address announcement 
for a doctor and rushed from 
right field to a box behind third 
base.

But after Medich directed the 
emergency treatment. Languth 
was admitted to nearby Union 
Memorial Hospital with stable 
vital signs. Although he was 
listed in serious condition in the 
coronary care unit. Languth 
was deKribed as “alert, and 
well aware of what’s happening 
around him”

Medich. who said he has been 
involved in 25 such cases since 
starting hiS medical training, 
gave mouth-to-mouth resuscita­
tion and external heart mas­
sage. and then attached tubes 
and lines for the administering 
of medication and electrical 
shock

The 29-year-old Medich con­
ducted a rare interview in the 
Texas clubhouse during the 
game to describe his part in 
the drama, and again was be- 
seiged by newsmen as he ate a 
postgame snack.

In response to a question. 
Medich conceded his actions 
probably saved Languth’s life 
but added modestly: “ I was

trained, and I was in the right 
spot at the right time “

"Yes, I guess I saved him,” 
Medich said “Anytime some­
body’s lying there without a 
heartbeat and pulse . .without 
aid, there’s a good chance he 
would have died”

Medich. involved in a similar 
incident in the stands of Phila­
delphia’s Veterans Stadium in 
1976. when the victim died after 
receiving emergency aid. said 
fellow pitcher Dock Ellis had 
mentioned while they were run­
ning in the outfield that some­
one had suffered a heart attack 
in the stands.

“ I didn’t do anything at the 
time." Medich said, "but when 
I heard the announcement for 
help, it was obvious that they 
hadn’t gotten a doctor yet”

A paramedic team, the sta­
dium nurse and city police 
were eventually involved in the 
rescue, and life-saving proce­
dures were already underway 
when Medich arrived.

“ But things were kind of dis­
organized when I got there.” 
Medich said, “and I kind of 
took over. I started giving or­
ders. and people started follow­
ing them.

"There was no spontaneous 
movetnent and no palpable 
pulse," Medich said. “He was 
not getting enough oxygen."

"You can’t afford to make 
mistakes, you can’t afford de­
lays.” Medich said of the treat­
ment. “You have little control 
of the situation because you’re 
not sure of the extent of the at­
tack. You just hope you’re 
lucky."

Medich wasn’t scheduled to 
pitch Monday, and he wasn’t 
certain he could have after 
such an incident.

“ It’s tough to concentrate on 
baseball after something like 
that," he said.

Randy Urtegon, while John 
K aplan, did likewise t o , 
George Hearon of Borger for 
Caprock

The two teams then held 
each other at bay, allowing 
no more runs until the top of 
the fourth Then C a p r ^  
Pitcher Gregory Fleming 
walked Gaiy Stiir with the 
bases loaded, sending in 
Jackie Edwards to score 
Follow ing th a t L arry  
Williams knocked the ball 
out to center field and Bobby 
Reyes ran from third to 
home, scoring a third run for 
Plainview

After that mning, however 
Plainview’s luck ran out as 
Caprock began to play 
catch-up ball. John Watson 
blasted a pitch clear over the 
left field fence in the fifth 
inning, adjusting the score to 
Plainview 3. taprock 2 
From then on it was merely 
a matter of time as Fleming 
struck out four batters in the 
sixth and seventh innings, 
keeping the score from 
changing until the game's 
sudden, exciting conclusion 
in the last inning

In an earlier game. 
Monday night Wichita Falls 
outplayed Lubbock to win 
5-3 Mark Tidwell. Kerry 
Hardgrove and Scott Smith 
all hit homers for Wichita 
Falls The winning pitcher 
was Ricky Ledford

T o u rn a m e n t a c tio n  
continues tonight at the 
Optimist Gub as Wichita 
Falls plays Eagle Pass at 6 
and  Texas Panhandle 
Caprock takes on Eastern 
Panhandle at 8 30

Connors back 
in top form
WASHINGTON (AP) -  Jim­

my Connors, after a week of 
licking hiZ wounds and prac­
ticing serves with his mother, 
is back in action and winning 
again.

Connors, the top seed, blasted 
past Australian John Marks 6-1. 
6-3 Monday in the opeiung 
round of the 8175.000 Washing­
ton Star Irkemational men’s 
tennis tournament

“ I served like a schmuck 10 
days ago.” Connors said, still 
smarting from his straight-set 
loss to Bjorn Borg in the Wim­
bledon finals

Connors would not say what 
tips his mother. Gloria, a for­
mer teaching pro. gave him to 
help his serve. “That’s between 
her and me. It only affects me 
anyway, so there’s no point in 
Ulkins about it.” he said
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By WAL1ER R. MEANS 
APSpedM CermynM eM

WASHINGTON (AP) -  Now 
it turns out that we’re winnil^( 
the ntoral eqihvalent of war. 
President Caiter suddenly is 
satisfied with the progress Con­
gress is making on his energy

That's a rather abrupt 
change in the attitude of a 
president who less than a 
month ago said that the United 
States was being embarrassed 
and weakened for lack of pas­

sage of his energy measure.
Years ago. then-Sen. O orge 

D. Aiken suggested that the 
way to end U.S. involvement in 
the .conflict in South Vietnam 
would be to declare a victory 
and get out. His advice went 
unheeded.

Carter seems to have adopted 
a somewhat similar position on 
energy, apparently to convince 
skeptical allies at the economic 
summit conference in Bonn 
that the United States really is 
doing somiething about the
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Many Italian doctors

Accountantcomputesbills
on basis of value of gold

CHICAGO (AP) — Like most 
Americans. Josiah Bailey, a 
certified public accountant, 
worries about inflation So he 
began a new billing system 
April 1 He now charges his 
clients 0.2723 troy ounces of 
gold for an hour's work

Of course, the Morehead City, 
N.C., businessman still collects 
his fees in dollars. The differ­
ence is that they're dollars 
pegged to the price of gold.

Since early April, gold prices 
have fluctuated between 1167.30 
and I1K.60 an ounce. Accord­
ingly, Bailey's hourly rate 
slumped to $45.56 on April 24, 
then gradually increas^ to a 
peak $50.81 in mid-June.

But despite the fluctuations. 
Bailey is perfectly satisfied 
with his system “When the 
price went down to $170 an 
ounce. I even sent a letter to my 
clients suggesting they take ad­
vantage of the decline,” he 
chuckled.

Bailey says that's “my way 
of coping with inflation. I think 
that gold will retain its pur­
chasing power better than pa­
per currencies ”

Bailey is among ihe first to 
take advantage of a federal law 
that last October restored the 
legality of receiving gold as 
payment for goods or services. 
Specifically, it makes contracts 
denominated in gold, or cur­
rencies linked to gold's price, 
enforceable in court.

But in a larger sense, the 56- 
y e a r-old businessman ex­
emplifies what some experts 
describe as a subtle shift in 
public sentiment that puts more 
emphasis on the monetary role 
of gold.

The dominant trend, begun 
when the United States and oth­
e r nations suspended the gold 
standard at the oiAbreak of 
World War I, has been a lessen­
ing of the historical tie between 
gold and money.

Indeed, the U.S. Treasury's 
long-term policy is to diminish 
or completely abondon the use 
of gold as a money standard.

Inherent restraints imposed 
by gold on government spend­
ing "are too severe. They im­
ply a discipline at a time whin 
the old notions of balanced 
budgets, of paying when you 
buy, have gone out the win-

d 0 w , explained Martin 
McAuley, foreign exchange ad­
ministrator at C^tinental Bank 
in Chicago, v “The idea of re­
monetizing gold is not political­
ly palatable. It would not only 
disrupt the economy, but the 
work habits and standard of 
living of the man on the 
street," he said 

Specialists also cite a poten­
tial threat to the dollar's pre­
mier status in the international 
monetary structure. “ If a di­
rect link were revived between 
gold and world currencies, it 
could result in a transfer of 
economic power from the 
United States to the principal 
gold-producing nations, namely 
South Africa and the Soviet Un­
ion.'” said Howard Levine, a 
metals analyst for ACLI Inter­
national Commodities Inc. -

Nevertheless. economists 
identify a growing preference 
for gold among individuals both 
in this country and abroad 
They explain the phenomenon 
in a nutshell — an inflation rate 
that has eaten away a sizable 
chunk of what paper nxxiey 
can buy.

ROME.(AP) — Lorella, 19 
years old and unmarried, just 
didn’t want a baby. So, like 
several thousand other Italian 
women in recent weeks, she 
had an abortion — free, legal 
and no longer punishable as a 
crim e against the “purity of 
the Italian race.”

On June 6, a new law super­
seding an old Fascist-era stat­
ute went into effect permitting 
abortion for the first time in 
Italy, whose dominant Roman 
Catholic Church considers it 
tantamount to murder.

Passed in Parliament by 
Communist, Socialist and mod­
erate parties over the opposi­
tion of the ruling church-backed 
Christian Dennocrats. the law 
allows a woman over 18 to seek 
abortion for physical,' econom­
ic, social or psychological rea­
sons during the first 90 days of 
pregnancy.

Official figures say 425 wom­
en in the Rome region of Lazio 
had abortions during the first 
month the law was in effect. In 
the Piedmont region of north 
Italy there were 500 abortions, 
and in the Milan area there 
were 794, despite a boycott by 
63 percent of the doctors.

Lorella became pregnant in 
April and considered going to 
London for an abortion rather 
than use an Italian “mam- 
mona” — a backstreet abor­
tionist who may charge $500 for 
the work and do it in unsanita­
ry conditions.
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When the law passed, she de­
cided to use it and went to a 
family planning group for the 
necessary medical certificate. 
Even if a doctor had decided 
her case didn't meet the stated 
requirements, the final decision 
would have been left to her 
after a seven-day wait.

Certificate in hand, she took 
a blood test at a neighborhood 
clinic and went to Rome's Po- 
liclinico Hospital, the crowded 
university center whose walls 
are plastered with slogans — in 
red with the (Communist ham­
mer and sickle — denouncing 
doctors who have declared 
themselves "conscientious ob­
jectors" and refused tô perform 
abortions.

Many nurses have refused, 
too, and in the Policlinico fe­
minist groups have taken their 
places, helping out in the 11-bed 
abortion ward.

After a three-week wait for a 
bed, Lorella had her abortion in 
the first week of July.

A big problem for those want­
ing abortions is that the church 
urges doctors and nurses to 
sign up as objectors — they 
must do this to avoid having to 
perform the operation — and 
warns that anyone connected 
with an abortion faces ex- 
communication.

In the Rome area, 76 percent 
of obstetricians and gynecolog­
ists have registered as objec­
tors, the local health office 
said. A cook in one hospital re­
portedly is refusing \U> feed 
women in for abortionB.

Hundreds of women in 
Trieste recently occupied the 
regional health office com­
plaining that women cannot get 
abortions or have to face long 
waiting lists because only one 
doctor in that city of 200,000 is 
willing to perform the oper­
ation. In Nuoro, Sardinia, ang­
ry women marched through the 
central square complaining that 
not one doctor was available.

Senate
unique
forum
By DONALD M. ROTHBERG 

Associated Press Writer 
WASHINGTON (AP) -  The 

floor of the United States Sen­
ate is one of the few forums 
where a person can carry on a 
conversation with someone who 
isn't there and not be led away 
in a straitjacket.

If the dixigressional Record 
can be b e l i e f  — and would 
the record mislead us — Sen 
Gary Hart had a nice chat the 
other day with Sens. Alan 
Cranston. DCalif., and William 
Hathaway, D-Maine. Unfortu­
nately, neither Cranston nor 
Hathaway was present.

“ I thank my good friend, the 
assistant majority leader, for 
his kind comments and his sup­
port of this bill,” said Hart, ac­
cording to the Congressional 
Record transcript of the debate 
on legislation dealing with mili­
tary  construction projects.

Half a page later, the Colora­
do Democrat turned to Hath­
away, who m  elsewha*e. and 
said, "I assure the senator 
from Maine that I share his 
concern regarding base clo- 
iu re t and realignments.”

Did other senators shake 
their heads and murmur about 
poor Gary Hart Ukkig leave of 
his senses? Not at ail. Hart had 
simply submitted the whole dia­
logue with Cranston and Hath­
away to the derk for Inclusion 
in the record. « 

Congress recently decided the 
record should net mislead and 
black dots mark material 
which was aubmittdd but not 
actually read. The statements 
by Cranston and Hathaway 
were so designated But since 
Hart was on the floor, his re­
sponses w ve  not marked.

George WasMngUti’s army of 
11,000 men arrived In Valley 
Forge on Doc. II, 1777, after a 

|ll-ffiUe march from the out- I skirts of PMlad|l|ihis.

problem. "  *"• « w scm w  xrdeU Lamm. lseiS4S.
Fifteen months after he pro- ^  state Senate” — has -----------------------------------------

posed his energy plan. Carter
still is waiting for Congress to *• *™enws for life. -----------------------------------------
enact it. Aikki. D-Paris. probably h u  a d d it io n s , r b m o d e u n q . r M

HotM and Senate negotiators ■••’«•dy been honored u  much 
have approved portions of the ■* *"y Texas legislator. His etUmalM. GaaeBrttv«. StS-ISTT. 
program for flnal votes. So ^ r t r ^ h w  hungin the Senate muns  coNSTBUtn'iON - assj- 
Carter will get part of what he *«** ifTS. tiaw, Daaeiias, paiaiini, m Um

ht Monday, the resolution nam- RemoiitUBS aaO r tp a ^  laaarad.
But the oil tax that was a ** dean emeritus cited -------- -------------------------------

central feature of the original ** ^  senator with the, don  ^A M S

u  s u y  sulJed. uinuaice.
Again and again. Carter has "This is the most important r

exhorted CoiSess to set on thing you will see during this „ CAPiNTtY
With it. He threatened to act on session, said call sst-swi
his own by posting new tariffs '"'ho In- —
on imported oil. and the Senate tr^ u c e d  the resolution. ELEC. CONTRACT.'
voted to forbid it. That June 27 [t wm  coeponsored by the «i/« .
vote was the last siimificant ®"tire Senate. HOUSLEY ELEIrt'RIC. Wlriag Mvoie was me lasi signuicani k^kku.! k» atavaa, drjrara, rcmo4cUa|, raak
congressional action on energy, A**in. TZ, is iwooied by rhw- , dentiai.comnitrciai. Can M  Till, 
and the White House- said it arthritis and is giving ■ ■■■"-
showed that (kxigress was try- “P his f ^  row center seat be- GENERAL SERVICE 
ing to duck the problem. cause p w  health. .......

But before he weitt to Bonn He has been in the Legisla- H J a n C  SHAVIR MPAM 
on Thursday. Carter declared since 1933 and the Senate n Tm»“ *’'
that "we are making good ^  iRcredibly. he has ___*!“ !!
progress.” on the bUl and on “hsent only 2V9 days in a n e e d s  Handy Man? Call sis-m ti
curbing oil imports’ legislative career that »rist-Tsis. _____________

He wasn't pleased in Houston Purp<*T^y ranks/him second A P M C p  A | D C p A ID
on June 23. "We have con- !" length of legisl^ive service K C rM IH
sumed ever-increasing amounts States. e l e c t r ic  r a zo r  r e p a ir
of oil and gas at prices well be- — f h e  resolution noted that Ai- Paru. n«w a u i ^  r a i m  M  talc.
low their replacement costs.” i»«rMc"<«/on*lKric?*iu^^^
he said then. "We are the only plishments include the 1949 Gil- ms sen
industrial nation without an mer-Aikin laws that committed 
energy plan. ^® ŝ ®*® its present massive INSULATION

Nor was he so patient on program of aid to public — — —
April 20, the first anniversary »®h®ols- . . .  ^*15fw^2fl,***alii!2!i?^
of his'call for urgent action on c ^ u th o r ^  bills creating -----------^ -----------------------
energy. “We have wasted 12 the tw c h »  retirement system FRONTIER MSUlATiON 
months of precious time,” he *he Commission on Higher r>«
said on that occasion. Education, which was the pred- mvsu«

Now he is accentuating the e®**8or of the Texas (College - ' ■
positive. "My prediction is that Coordinating Board. PAINTING
Congress will act successfully .. ' —
on our energy plan ^ o r e  they CARD OF THANKS p a in t in o 'a n d X o r a t in o
adj^ourn this year.” he said. ----------------------------------------------  ro ok  s p r a y in g , ms-ssm

Carter had to have some ex- O.K. OAYIOR
nianatinn  nf tka ai*... WISH lo thank Mir Bclghbon. INTERIOR. EXTERIOR palaUBa,planation of the energy situ- fhcBda aBdaByonewholBaBywiy Spray AcOBiUcal CelllBg, M$-ll A
ation, and the lack of Final ac- acted in love aad sympathy durlBg Paul SIcwart.
linn fnr orilinal alliaH laaHare in the reccBt lots o( our Beloved O.K. ---------------------------------------------non lor cnucai aiiiea leaoers in o.yior, b il l  FORMAN-Paiatiaa aad re-
Bonn. The Family Of modellBg, furallure reilaithiBg,

Yet if he chose to blame it all o k . Gayior c ab iw t work. ms-4MS, im  t .
on Congress, he could have _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _ _  - - i ” ;-------------------------------
bought more trouble there, at a  P E R C O N A L  „ ••
time when he needs House and PrerEstimatcs ̂
Senate votes to get what re- r e n t  o u r  steames carpet clean- -----
mains of his oraffram oassed *"• '»•chine. One Hour Martials- HOUSE PAINTING, Insidemains 01 nis p r o p ^  lag, IM? N Hobart. Call M »-nil »W« Mud and tape. Paul Cala,

So he pointed to what has tor inlormaUon and appolBtmeBt. M4-SSM.
been done, after complaining ---------------------------------- -̂-----
t  ^  a l c o h o l ic s  a n o n y m o u s  and
for months about what remains ai-Anon meets Monday, Friday I  ________ ____________^ ________
undone. p.m. «4Stk w^Brown, MS-«M._ INTERIOR, EXTERIOR, Profea-

But that answer to an imm^ gAY^meti^sTlT^irariais“
diate problem may post a dl- supplies, and deliveries. Call
lemma another day. when and ESTsiW Consultant. ---------------------------------------------
If the White House decides that ----------- -̂-------------------------------  o a. DENNIS, Complete PalaUng
it must turn up the pressure on a l c o h o l ic  a n o n y m o u s  and ‘»‘»rior • ••••nor. r ^II Ilium lurn up ui« pressure on aI-Abob, Tuesday and Saturdays, I  «Blshlng. acoustic celUngs, resi-
Longress agaui. ».m, yj? W. Browning. Mk-tsn, denUal or commercial spraying.

OU-1S41. Turning P dnt Group. MP-M41.

Settlement p e h  CONTRo i

reached in  -----r e a c i i c u  m  n m m j  TERNun-FfST comtroi
_  Also Tree Spraying. Taylor Spraying

G M  c a s e  n o t  r e s p o n s ib l e  Service. MS-MNl

By FRED GOOD ALL AS OF Ihis date. July II. 1177, I. RADIO AND TEL
a . . ^ . « ^  i » _  1W-1* _  Ro»*W D. Ellloh, win be respoBsl- s s ik .

“® '*«“ * ®*('®f “••» “ ®»c .................... — —CHICAGO (AP) — General incurred by me. DON'S T.V. Swrvin
Motors Corp. n ay  be forced to ^  *="‘®“
pay up to $13.3 million in cash ' ***
rebates to nearly 97,000 owners 
of Oldsmobiles with Chevrolet 
engines under a court settle­
ment reached between the com­
pany and several state attor­
neys general.

“ It'S undoubtedly the largest 
consumer protection settlement 
in the histary of the country,”
Illinois Attorney General Wil­
liam J. Scott said Monday after 
U.S. District Court Judge 
Frank J. McGarr approved the 
nationwide settlement which 
makes 66,782 persons in 46 
states eligible for a $200 rebate 
and a transferrable warranty 
on the engine.

The warranty, which provides 
a 36-mcnth extension to the 
original warranty customers re­
ceived when purchasing their 
automobiles, is also worth 
about $200, Scott said.

T h e  settlement, which 
McGarr called “fair and rea­
sonable” culminiRes a year­
long legal battle to force Gener­
al Motors to compensate cus­
tomers who signed purchase or­
ders for Oldamobiles with 
Chevrolet engines by April 10,
1977. The buyvs had no reason 
to believe thiey would not have 
OMsmobile ei^jines.

The engine switch was dis­
covered in Illinois last year 
when a mechanic, who tried to 
change the fan belt and oil fil­
ter on a 1977 OMsmobile, found 
he did not have the proper 
parts to perform the work.

A lawsuit was filed in Illinois 
on March II, 1977 and eventual­
ly a number of suits filed na­
tionwide were consolidated into 
the Illinois case.

" I ’m extremely pleased with 
the settlement.’' Scott said.
"Not only because we were 
able to take on onihe largest 
conglomerates and win, but 
also because we were able to 
bring together a number of 
state attorneys general” to per­
form a public asrvice jointly.
" I t was the only way feasible 
way to pursue the case.”

NOTICES FOR RENT
CnrUn MbUm i Cninr T.V.'s

PAMPA LODGE No. MS. A.F. A 
A.M. ThnrtSajr, Jnly tSĵ StnOjr and 
Practica on Certificala Eiam. Via- 
Itara wdcoma. All mambara nrgad 
to attend.

4M S. Cuylar MS-lMf

RENT A TV-cnIor-Black and wMte. 
or Starno. By weak ar month. 
Purchaaa plan avallabla. SM-lSSl.

A TTEN TIO N  DAILY Oklahoma 
SnbacrlbaraI Gone on vacatlan ba-
twaan July IS thru July 11. Any 
problama contact lira. Ray 
•SS-7171 orMS-SSll. Thank Yon. W.
Hughea.

CLAY BROTHERS TV SALES 
AND SERVICE 

All Branda Rapalrad 
M4 W. Faalar MS-11S7 

Formerly Hawklna-Eddlna

LODGE NO. n i l .  Monday and 
Tuaaday July 17 and II JMudy and 
Practice on Cartincata Exam. Via-

Magnavox Catar TV’a and Staraoa
lOWRIYMUSIC C8NTM

Coronado Canter IM -lllI
llora wolcoma. All mambara urged 
to attend. ROOHNG

LOST AND FOUND
LOST: COCKER Spaniel puppy, I

------- ^■^\\¡ ■ ■

INDUSTRIAI ROOFMO CO. 
Roof Problama? MMSM

waaka old, aolld olack. Strayed 
from IIM bock Eaat. Frederic, 
Friday Call MMSll. Reward.

LOST: WHITE Samoyad Huakay, 
Tuaaday in ISM block of Wllllaton. 
Raward. Call Peg, MS-ISIS.

ROOFING AND Repair. Ovar IS 
yaara axMrlanca lacnily. Far pro- 
faaalonaT raaulU call IN-ISM.

BUSINESS OPP.
SEWING

FOR SALB: In Bargar, Cactua Matal 
aad Trailer Park, tt trallar apacea 
aad • 11 unlt matal. Haa good 
buainaaaS I I  per cant dawn. 
17MS11. Owaar wanUag ta raUra.

COMPLETE SERVICE CaaUr far 
all makaa af macklnaa. Singer 
Salea and Service, 114 N. Cnylar. 
Phone: m-lMS.

WE RBNTaawl^ macklnaa. Mnaar

EXCELLENT OPPORTUNITY 
In a thrlviag ladapaadant Faxt Feed

Salea A Service. 114 N. CnyT 
4U-USS.

n a thrlviag ladaaaadant Faxt Feed 
Diiva-ln (acatad an a buay high­
way. TMa btMlaaaa, haadllng hlgb

..................  irlaty
I I  yai

catad an 4 lata with a beautiful 1

of I
quality of wide variety of (alt 
fooda, hat t ' * -tripled In I  yaara. La-

ANNS ALTERATIONS. SIS N. 
Habart.hMaa'a aad Ladlaa altara- 
ttaaa. Quality werk, raaaaaaMy 

rlead. 0 ^  Taaaday-Satnrday..r SSa.i :Mp.m. Phone MAdniT:
bedroam Mablle Homo New hard 
aurfaca drtvaa, ataraga buildlag. 
Will taka approxImaMy IM.MS (a 
bandia thia aala but make an axcal- 
laat tax abaKar far a warking eaa-

ria allawlag one ta haM dowa other 
all time amplaymant. Phaaa 
MI-M17 (ar appaiatiaaal.

MARY GRANGE la aawlag far 
wanma aad ehUdrea at Aaa'a AH-
aratloaa. CaU M M TII ar M M W  
(homo) and aak (ar Mary.

UPHOLSTERY

MAT mnATION 
OWN YOUR awa baalaaaa. Part ar

UPHOLSTERING IN Pampa. St 
■  ̂ Fabrics

full UxM. Exceatlanal laconw ap- 
portuaiUaa. Call far appolatnMat, 
MS-TITS l;M  p.m. lo l:8 l p.m.

yaara. Qaod aalacUoa a( . 
and vInyU. Bab Jawall. SSS-Sttl.

BEAUTYSHOPS
IT IL L  A Super buy at |7MS

paiat latida tad new I7M CFM
caolar at raa(. C»m* by ar call 
NS-MM.

PAMPA COLLEGE OF 
HAIRDRESSING 

IIS N. Habart MS-SUI

UNDER NEW Mtaa

BUS. SERVICES

ttgamai
try Haute Beauty Sbap, 
Frederic. Opaa Tuetday'

¡ament. Cana- 
I4SS B.

Satarday. Sa.m.-I p.m. SIbSNl ar 
SW-MN.

GOOD BACKHOB werk at a price 
yen caa alfard. Traacblag aad
email PVC pipe laying. Leak ra- 
palra, aleefaaclag andatackpand
laniM  Call P aad M DitcHng. 
M A ^

SITUATIONS
RELIABLE MAN ta b m w  lawaa, 

Call Mika, at SIS-IMl.

Author Leon Uris has besn 
prssentcd with an award by the 
Eire Society of Boston in honor 
of Ms noval, "THnRy."

APPL REPAIR
WILL DO Sawtag aad aHarallana.

~ ' wcaR

C U R TS  WASNIR SIRVId 
Sarvica and Paru, avtr IS yaara U 

Pampa. RaaaMra. CataUaa, Ms* 
talara Oar Spaclailty.

Itti Neal Rd. SM 4MI

Carnal^

waakaadt, SSI-SSS4 between S; J  
aadl:SS.

aa by IIM Varava Driva ar t 
-IMS after I  M aad

DEPENDABLE LADY wRI Mva let- 
lag cara la chlldraa danna
aamuMT aad aS year.

tba
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HELP WANTED
PAMPA NEWgCarriart: Earajraar 

ava aMaav. Raataa ara avallaUa, I 
aaaU a{ lU Â  gckaoi aad aait a (, 
Habart A g ^  aav M t-m i. i

HOUSEHOLD MUSICAL INST. HOMES FOR SALE REC. VEHICLES
' J . Rwff PwmNwta

I JIM'S STEAK Heata. Jim Baaaaj, 
agw taking aaglicatiaaa (or kitebaa. 
haig aad «aitraatca. Aggiy ia ger- 
aoa batvaaa I  a.m.-lS g.ia. aad 1 
g.m.-} g.m.

l u i  H. Habart dSS-IM '

WMOHTÎ SUtNITURf 
NfW ANDURfO 

MACDONALD PlUMIMG > 
t u s .  Caylar MMS21

Jaaa Ocadwaw burnitura
MU N. Habart M t-m iDISTRIBUTOR NEEDED. W a ig b t__ ___________________________

laaa grMram and akin cara pra- 
daeta. (Tall Caranada Inn Matal,, 
Wadnaaday t-t g.m. for John or' 
Penny Lamona. ' •

OOT SOME niEC TUNE? 
START YOUR OWN BUSINESS • 

Start aalling Avon. Ba yovrown boaa
■Thi ■ 

ey«
taMa aaU dW'SItl

Sat ro a r  own haara. ‘fha harder yoa 
Of«, the DMra yoa'll earn . Por da.

TRUCK DRIVERS naedod for local 
mud corogany. Call M M III.

* H^LP WANTED to drive ice cream 
cart. 4 to S boura gar day or act your 
own boura. Drlvara iiscenac re-

-  qu 
a Ml

uirad. For more information call 
it-l7U or MMM2.

ICE
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WANTED: MATURE woman in vic­
inity of Woodrow Wllaon Elemen­
tary  to care  for I  children. 
Monday-Friday I a.m.-S g.m. 
MSMSd.

THREE LADIES with car, IS# part 
time, |1M full time. Pamga and 
turroundlng towna. For interview 
call Stanley Home Product!, 
MI-IMI.

EXPERIENCED OFFICE clerk. I
a.m .-l g.m. weekdava and l-l-  . .  -------

md

• .ISI.'M |g.lU. «MW «-a
Saturday!. Light bookkeeping re- 
Qulred, muattvpe accurately. Send 
full reanrae with reference! to Box 
111 care of Pamga Newa.

'  I  FULL time collection! elerka. Sal­
ary ll.7t-SS.lS  a hour, commen- 
auratlve to experience. Contact 
Peraoanel Department, Highland

IN. HeGeneral Hoap 11141
Pampa, Tx. TtMS. Highland Gen­
eral Hoagiial ia an Equal Oppor­
tunity Employer.

JOHNSON
HOME PURNISHMGS 

Curtla Mathea Televialona 
4M S. Cuylar Nt-SMI

CHARUrS 
EumHurw B Carpwt 

TIm  Com pany To Havo In Yowr

1M4 N BankT* Mt-4U1

KIRBY SAUS AND SERVICE
t i l  S. Cuyler 

N t-tlM  or MS-MN

FOR NEW k  USED TV’a and ap­
pliance!, reaaonably priced.
Cloy Brothora TV B Applianca . 

Call d tS -SM T ^ 
Formerly Hawklna-Eddina

WHIRLPOOL SIDE by aide 
re frigera to r-free ie r with ice 
m aker, t4SI.M ; Seara 
refrigerator-freexer with ice 
maker and cold water diipenaer, 
IS7S.M; Seara drop in electric 
stove with aelf clean oven, IMO.M; 
Sears diahwaaher, tllS.M. All in 
excellent condition; all ia white. 
Mt-N7d before ll:M andaft«rS:N .

44 INCH Whirlpool electric range, 
white, good condition, tS4. Call 
Mt-41St.

FOR SALE: All cedar cloaet, $144. 
Also car radio, l i t .  Call 444-4414.

7 PIECE antique dining aet. 174.1414 
Hamilton. 444-4144.

FRIGIDAIRE 14" stacked copper- 
tone washer and dryer. I44-SS44.

FOR SALE: BroybUI Early Ameri­
can sofa, 440. Rocking chair, t i t .
Good condition. 444-I7N.

ANTIQUES

PROOF READER. To read proofs 
and take proofs and tearaheeta to 
advertisers. Must have car. Apply 
at Pampa Newa.

ENGINE TRAINEES and logging 
trainees. Apply at Pro Data Sur­
veys, Borger Hl-Way.

LANDSCAPING
DAVIS TREE SERVICE PRUN- 

' ING, TRIMMING AND RE­
MOVAL. FREE ESTIMATES 
FEEDING AND SPRAYING. J.R. 
DAVIS, 44S-S4M.

Pax, Evergreens, rosebushes, gar­
den suppfles, fertiliser, trees.

BUTlf R NURSSRY 
Perryton Hi-Way A 7tth 

M4-4MI

BLDG. SUPPLIES
Hotisiwn Lumbar Co. j

414 W. Foster M4M41

WhNo Housa Lumbar Co.
141 S. Ballard M4-S1I1

Fom pa Lumbar Co.
INI S. Hobart 44S-S7I1

PLASTIC PIPE k  FITTINGS ' 
B U ILO e rS  FlUMBINO 

SUPPLY CO.
its  S. Cuyler MM711 

Your Plastic Pipe Headquarters

TMnW  LUMBiR COMPANY
Complete Line of Building 

Materials. Price Road M4-S144

^ C H .  A TOOLS
PORK UFT FOR LEASE

By the hour or day. Rough terrain, 
four wheel drive, up to twr 

. footbvertical extension

ANTW-A-DEN 
MI-2114 or 444-1441

APPRAISER POR Eatates- 
antiques, jew eln  and coHectiUea. 
Call 174-44SS after 4:14 p.m. 
Borger.

MISCEUANEOUS
MAGNETIC SIGNS. Screen Paint­

ing. Bumper Stickers, etc. Custom 
Service Phone Mt-4141.

REPOSSESSED KIRBY. Guaran­
teed. Save |1M. Call 444-4141.

FOR SALE: Marble Vanity Topa-IM 
inch, 4 14 inch, 1 new Nutone 
Vent-a-Hood 1 new exterior de­
corative doers. Call 4MSS74.

GARAGE SALE: Unique items from 
Old Mexico and lots ol miscellane­
ous. Today Ull 7? White Deer Dip­
per Barber Shop

USED LUMBER, pipe, tin, and iron 
for sale. Come to 714 N. Banks.

MAXI MAID Dcaning Service. All 
your house cleaning needs. Call 
444-M71 before 4 a.m., after 1 p.m.

DIGGING DITCHES with machine 
that will fit through backyard 
gates. Call MMStl.

14 INCH and 11 inch color Sony TV’s. 
Excellent condition. See at Pampa

Sony 1 
! at Pa

Mobile Park. No. 14 after 4 g.m'.

ESTATE AND Oarage Sale: With a 
little of everything. Tires, else 
14-14, Chevrolet pickup c a ^ e r  
special. Tuesday afternoon. Wed-

onr wheel drive, up to twenty six
....................... • Call
MM474 or 4M-1S1S.

FOR SALE: “ Factory 14 foot goose 
neck stock trailer, 1 axles, Miche- 
lin tires, metal canopy In excellent 
condition. Foster Whaley. M4-11S1.

I4M JOHN Deer Diesel 144 Doser,
' and Triple axel trailer. Good condi­

tion. Sa.m .-lp.m ., 444-1411, after! 
p.m., 444-4441.

FOR SALE; 1474, 1444 Series A In­
ternationa backboe. V-14 Ditch- 
witch. TM  ditcher. Call 444-4MI

GOOD TO EAT
CHOICE GRAIN feed freeser beef. 

Half beef. Clint and Son Custom 
Processing and Slaughtering. 
444-7411 White Deer.

GUNS
OUNS, AMMUNITION 
RROAOINO SUPPUES

Best selection In town at 144 S. 
Cuyler. Fraci's Inc. Phone : 44V1441

JBJ OUN SERVICE !
Your total Handgun Store! Smith Al 

Wesson • Colt • Rugar • o thers!. 
Polieo A Personal defease items! | 
4SI S. Dwight. 444-4174.

nesday 4:M. 111! Sirroco.

AD SPECIALTIES can help your 
business - pens, calendars, signs, 
etc. Call Dale Vespestad. 444-n4S.

YARD SALE: Sewing machine, 
books, clothes, odds and ends. 414 
N. Nelson Tueaday-Friday.

FURNITURE, TOOLS, guns,
, freeser, refrigerator, stove, anti­

ques, clothes. 417 Harrab, Miami, 
4S4-4MI.

BACKYARD SALE: 1M4E. Harves­
ter. 4:14 a.m . sharp, Tuesday

LOWRSY MUSIC CRmiR
Lowrey Organa and Pianos 

Magnavox Color TVs and Stereos 
Coronado Center 444-1111

Nww B Used Band Inatfumnnla 
Ranted Purchoan Plan 

Taralwy M usk Cwmoony 
m w  Cuyler 444-1141

UPRIGHT PIANO. Good coadlUon. 
tlM . Call M4M74.

PETS A SUPPLIES
K-4 ACRES Profeaoiooal Grooming 

liad Boarding Betty Osborne. 1044 
Farley. 444-7141.

PROFESSIONAL POODLE and 
Schnausers grooming. Toy stud 
service available. Platinum silver, 
rad agricot, and Mack. Susie Reed, 
444-4144.

PROFESSIONAL GROOMING, 
Pam pered Poodle Parlor, all 
breeos. 411 W. Foster. Call 
444-1414

LOVELY MINIATURE~SchnanseT 
guppies, AKC, |44 and |7S. The 
Aquarium 1114 Alcock. 444-llH.

POODLE GROOMING. Annie Au- 
fill, 1144 S. Finley. M4-4404.

FOR SALE: AKC Cocker Spaniel 
Puppies. 474. Call 444-1441

OFFICE STORE EQ.
RENT TYPEWRITERS, adding 

machines, calculators. Photo­
copies 14 cents each. New and used 
furniture..

Tri^H y Offka Supply, Inc.
I l l  W rin g s  mill M4-4444.

W ANT TO BUY
NEEDED: PASTURE for M4 light 

yearlings. Also need someone to 
swathe and bale 144 acres of Sun-

■ dan. Call 444-4104 after 4 p.m., or 
444-17M before 4 p m.

FURNISHED APTS.
GOOD ROOMS, $1 up, |I 4  week 

Davis Hotel, 114H W. Foster, 
Clean, Quiet, 444-4114.

FURN. HOUSES
A WELL Furnished 1 bedroom 

house. No Pets. Call 644-1704. In­
quire 414 N. Starkweather.

UNFURN. HOUSES

1 BEDROOM, 1 bath. $144 month, 1 
year lease. 1144 deposit. 464-7411.

VERY NICE, clean, 1 bedroom. 4146 
a month. Deposit required. 
444-4744. No Singles.

1 BEDROOM, carpeted , fenced 
yard, near grade school. $174 de-

K>sit required, $114 monthly rent.
eferences required. Call Day - 

M4-U71, after 4 p.m., 444-1104.

RENT, SALE, TRADE

HAVE 1 bedroom home on tk acre of 
land south of Amarillo. Want to 
trade for house of equal sise in 
Pampa. Call 444-4111. ask for Don 
or m-44M, Amarillo.

BUS. RENTAL
NEW OFFICES for rent on Amarillo 

Highway. Air conditioned and car­
peted. Call 444-1441.

piano
cellaneous. You'll be surprised. COMPLETELY REMODELED, 1 

--------- - ------------------------------  bM rooms.Ukbatlia.l patios, 1 car

HOMES FOR SALE
WJM. LANC RRALTY 

717 W. Foster St. 
444-1441 or 444-4444

Malcom Dwnaon RwaKor 
“ Member of MLS” 

444-4414 Res. 444M41
Wednesday. Edison records, sport- “ Member of MLS”
ing equipment, good clothing, toys, 444-4414 Res. 444M41
piano music, Mke, furniture, mis- --------------------------------------— —

OARAGE SALE: ItU  N. Zimmers 
Monday, Tuesday aad Wednesday.

USED LUMBER for sale. Ixl4's and 
lx4'a. A-1 condHion. 444-7447.

FOR SALE: 1474 Honda MT144,1$44 
miles, and also upright ptano. Call 
444-1444 after 4 p.m.

ORANGE RUG about 11 x 11. Q o^  
condition. Make offer. Need to, 
move. 1444 N. Wells.

OARAGE SALE: Thursday, 4:44-7 
Maternity clotiMa. baby clothes.

Krta crib, 1 baby swings, toys and 
a of other goodies. i M  Chrlst-

drive, 1 car garage, brick. 1144 N. 
Sumner. CalT444-Mll.

PRICE REDUCED: 1 Bedrooms. 1 
bath, utility room, carpet, fenced 
yard, attached garage. For ap­
pointment call 444-7S11.

FOR SALE by Builder: New 1 bed­
room, l$k baths, family, room with, 
fireplace, dining room, private 
court yard off Master Bedroom,! 
utility room, douMagarage, comer, 
let, nice location. To see call 
444-1444 or 44^1141 tor appoint-, 
ment. '

IVFrs NHDiD
74 and 3-11 

SMfIs 
A P P L Y

nwo Nwraing Cantor
1321 W. Kontuchy

NEW HOMES
' Mowiog vñrii IvwfvtMng 1 
fof O ' Toma M M of», liH.

669-3542
669-6587

PROHTABU
DEALERSHIP

W M i Workhs largost 
Mcmiifootwrar of 

Stoewn Cioonor« i  
Protowro Wwohort.

C M ,

806-359-9303

OTT SHEWMAKER REALTOR 
Listings D erired -lll 8. Ballard.

Off 444-ini. Res. .44t-4$41

1 BEDROOM, 1 baths, good locatioa 
In White Deer CaU (M l U k tlU

FORSALE: 1 bedroom fsame house, 
handy man's special. You save by 
fixing it up yourself. 444-llWi.

DUPLEX: GOOD income, ta r ­
nished, six rooms, paneled, new 
roof, new copper gas lines. 444-1444 
after 4 g.m.

BRICK THREE bedroom, living 
room, family room, 1 and Ak baths,

Iarage, fenced, corner lot, 
14-1114.

IN MOBEETIE Texas: $ bedroom 
house. 1 baths, large den, living 
room, single car garage, large 
storm  cellar, fruit trees. Call 
414-4444 or after 7 p.m. call 
444-1171.

NEW, LESS than one year old. 1 bed­
room brick. 1 bath, large den with

draped. Beautifully decorated 
Privacy fence, established lawn 
las grill. In nice location. 444-4441

woodburning fireplace, fully 
ed.

ivacy fence, established la: 
g* -
for appointment.

HOME FOR Sale or Rent . 144 Ishom.

PRICE T. SMITH, INC.
Builders

ATTRACTIVE, 1 year old, energy 
efficient home. I bedroom, central 
air and heat, double car garage. 
1444 Sirroco. 444-4714.

FOR SALE By Owner: 1 year old 
brick home 1 bedrooms, 1 full 
baths. Fencedyard. Phone441-4711 
or come by 447 S. Grimes, White 
Deer, Texas.

BY OWNER: Over 1144 square feet 
of living area in this 4 bedroom, 1 
bath home. Living room with firep­
lace, large den. covered patio, cen-

. tral heat and air, double garage 
with opener, central humidifier. 
Call 444-4444 for an appointment.

NEW LUBBOCK Ready-built, 1 bed­
room, 1444 square feet. 4 months 
old, I4k baths, utility room, bed­
rooms and living room carpeted. 
Dining area. Central heal and re­
frigerated air. Corner lot in Lefors. 
Could be moved to new location. 
For Appointment call 414-1344.

NEWLY REMODELED 1 bedroom 
house. Fenced yard, excellent con­
dition. 1144 E Foster. Call 444-4444

FOR SALE: By Owner. 1 bedroom 
bouse, utility room, garage, new 
ipes, carpet, roof. $11.444. Call

7117.

EQUITY BUY-lbedroom. Uk bath, 
double garage.
Christine $44-4741

ge. dining room, t i l l

SOME REAL good rent property, 
close In. Paying off extra well. 
NICE. Also approximately 440' 
front on Highway 44. Lasca Patrick 

late. Call 44Real Estate. I  444-4441.

1714 ASPEN, Over 1144 square foot, 4 
bedrooms, brick, choice location, 
large double garage, central heat 
and air, water softner, humidifier 
144 f&ot lot, extra nice storage 
building, sprinkler system; large 
den-woodburning fireplace, 1^ 
baths, patio, storm windows, large 
concrete slab in back for extra 
parking 444-7144.

1 BEDROOM house for sale. Partly 
furnished. 411 N. Warren. Call 
444-1444.

NEW HOUSE under construction, 
north of town. Over 1444 suare feet, 
1 bedrooms, 1 baths, fireplace and 
beamed ceiling. Formal dining 
room, extra large master bedroom 
and garage with opener. Central 
heat and air. Call 444-7411.

GREAT BUY. 1 bedroom brick, 1 car

Sarage. opener, refrigerated air, 
en with built ins, 1 fullbatha, elec­

tric kitchen, fenced yard. 144 x 114. 
Large above ground pool, best part 
of town, near all 1 schools. 1411 
square feet living area. Call 
444-4444 for appointment.

FOR SALE: 1 bedroom house close 
to downtown and shopping center. 
Fireplace, centra! heat and air, 
fence, with garage and apartment 
for added Income. New plumbing 
and wiring and some redecorating. 
Buy equity and assume loan. Call 
444-1414

V

COMMERCIAL
OFFICE SPACE

For rent in the Hughes Building. 
Contact Tom Devaney, 444-1441.

OFFICE SUITE availaMe. Pioneer 
Offices. 117 N. Ballard, Direct in­
quiries to F.L. Stone. 444-4114 or 
444-4744.

RccreatSoalVebtele Center 
1414 Alcock 444-3144

tUfs Custom Campers
FOR THE best quality and price 

come la Bills for Toppers, cam­
pers, trailers, mini-meter bornes, 
fuel tasks. Service and repair 
444-4114, 414 S. Hobart.

“ RENTALS’’. Motor homes and 
travel tra ile r. Graves Motor 
Homes, 174-lMl, Borger, TX.

II FOOT Shasta travel trailer. Stove, 
oven. Ice box Seeps 4-4. $444 Call 
444-1141.

FOR SALE: Shasta Trailer, 14' 1471 
model. Call 444-1174

DUNE BUGGY Has VW engine with 
11 volt heavy duty IHwqiator. 744 
Doucette after 4:44.

REAL NICE: 1474 GMC Mobile 
traveler motor home, power and 
air, cruise control, CB, i7,444 orig­
inal miles. $4444. Take pickup, 
economy vehicle in trade 414 S. 
Wilcox. 444-lin

FOR SALE: 17 foot camper trailer. 
Self Contained. 444-1444.

TRAILER PARKS
MOBILE HOME space for rent Call 

444-4411

TRAILER PARK and 1 bedroom 
house for sale in Wheeler. Call 
$14-4444 or after 7 p.m. call 
444-1171.

MOBILE HOMES
TO BE Moved: 1474 three bedroom, 

two bath, $1444 equity take over 
payments of $177.47 Call 444-7111.

COME TO A-l for the best buys. 
We're open till $14 p.m. weekdays 
so you can avoid mid-day heal. A-l 
Mobile Homes. 4144 Amarillo 
Boulevard East. Amarillo. 
174-4143.

144$ 11 X 44 Victor mobile home, new 
carpet, refrigerator, water heater, 
and air conditioner. Call 4$4-$414.

FOR SALE; Nice 1477 Ks(4. mobile 
-home, 1 bedrooms. 1 full baths, 
central h*'at and air conditioning. 
Call (444 ) 444-4747. .

147$ SLIGHTLY used 4x15 Pvrk 
Model Mobile Home Many extras. 
See Ms. McDaniel. Clay Trailer 
Park, Hi-Way 44 North.

FOR SALE 1474 Westchester, 1 
bedroom. t>k bath. 12 x 44. 711 
Naida. 44kl774

14x74' LeBaron. 1 bedroom. 2 bath, 
equity and payments ol $14$ a 
month; in Lefors. Call $14-2374

AUTOS FOR SALE
WE PAY cash for nice pickups.

JONAS AUTO SALES 
211$ Alcock 444-4NI

CULBERSON-STOWEBS
Chevrolet Inc.

444 N Hobart 445-1444

Pampa Chrysler-Plymouth 
Dodgw, Inc.

I l l  W Wilks 445-5744

C.L FARMER AUTO CO.
Kleen Kar Korner 

413 W Foster 444-2131 .

JIM McBROOM MOTORS
447 W Foster 444-2134

Bill M. Derr 
"The Man Who Corea"

BAB AUTO CO.
447 wTFoster 444-2314

HAROLD BARREn FORD CO.
"Before You Buy Give Us A Try" 

741 W Brown 444-4444

Panhandle Motor Co.
445 W Foster 444-4N1

Marcum
Pontiac. Buick. GMC A Toyota 

413 W. Foster 444-1471

BIU ALLISON AUTO SALES 
Late Model Used Cars 

444 W. Foster. 444-1442

TOM ROSE MOTORS
141 E. Foster 444-1111 

CADILLAC-OLDSMOBILE

CariNi 2-Oiv SidM

Stock No. |.17t

$ 3 4 9 9 0 0 1

MARCUM  
T O Y O T A

• 3 3  W. Foator

DEMONSTRATOR

T978 Clirytl«r Ntw Yorkvr Brougham. 
TIm  latt of th« full sin Chrytlars. This 
Domo is just lik« n«w. Sov«. W* also 
Jiov« a lorgjs saloction of now onos.

PAMPA-CHRYSLER 
PLYM OUT^DODGEr N K .

•31 W. WMki ' PN. éSS-S7éS

DEMONSTRATOR
1978 Dodg« Magnum 2 Door Luxury, At Woli Ab 
tho Sporty Look. You will Bo Tho Confor of At­
traction. This Boauty Hot Loss Than 5,000Milos.

PAMPA-CHRYSLER 
PLYMOUTH-DODGE, IN C

•31 W. WKKS PN. ééS-S7éS

NEW HOMES
Storting in the

$W%.

UTIIMDER$,MC
M3.44S1 6U.3S70

The Weight 
Loss Program 

Nobody 
Believes!

O Oeed NutrMen 
O Ne Brwos 
O Dfinli MHhshehis 
O Na Obnmitks 
O Meney bock guewantee 
O Substantial weight 

and inch lees

It Cam MapQon To You
^nrw Yv levr m  siwoo

up ta 30 peunds in the fkat 
menlh. What con yeu lese by 
leebing btle HT Only semethbig
C 've wswited te lews ter e leng, 

I  time. Distributars else

AUTOS FOR SALE

WE RENT Irallers and tew bers.
C.C. Mood Ueod Corn 

111 E. Brown

EWINO MOTOR CO.
434 N. Hobnrt 441-1144

FOR FULL details abeut tbe ntw 
Omni er Heriala tee Harold Star- 
buck Pampa Cbrysler Plymouth 
Dodge. 144-4744.

1474 DATSUN 714, foer door, air, ei- 
eelleat coadilieo, low mileage. 
444-4641 er 444-4111 after 4 p m.

FOR SALE: 1471 Buick Electri tU  
Lijpited, 1 door bard top, fully 
equipped, excellent condition 
$1444. ¡ i t t  at 1114 Lea ar call 
444-4411.

FOR SALE: 1444 Chevrolet Impala 
Custom 1 door hard top. good coo- 
dltion. 1444. See at 1111 Lea or call 
444-Mll.

FOR SALE: 1471 Grand Prix, needs 
minor motor work. 11140 Call 
444-1444

PAMSA NIW S Tueodoy, Juty IB, l«FB 13

tery. new AM-FM, 4 track radio.
1M4 MUwTANG, good tires, new bat­

tery. new AM-FM, 4 track radio. 
44.444 original miles; extremely 
good shape. Good dependible car 
144 Anne 444-4447

1474 MONTE Carlo, 444 Super Sport. 
4 mag wheels, with good tires, Hol­
ley Carburator, Headers. Priced
to Sell 444-4417 144 Anne.

1474 MONTE Carlo, power steering, 
brakes, air and factory AM-tap« 
Call 444-M74 after 7 p m

1444 IMPALA, for tale. Runt but 
needs repairs. 444-4411. Miami.

1978 LTD FORD Landau, 1 door, 
loaded, warranty. 444-1442

LOCAL OWNER: 1472 4 door Buick 
Low mileage. Call 444-4421

1473 PONTIAC Grand Ville. full 
power and cruise control 441.400 
miles 41700 Call 644-2110 after 4 
p.m.

FORSALE 1072 Buick 47,000 miles 
Clean. lOM N Wells

1074 Z24 Camaro, low mileage, call 
444-7414 after 4 :14 p m See at 1404 
N. Faulkner.

1474 MAZDA RX-1, brand new en­
gine. clutch, and tires. 14,444 miles, 
excellent shape. 444-4474.

FOR SALE: 1472 Grand Torino 
Sport, good condition, fantastic 
school or work car 444-2437.

TRUCKS FOR SALE
FOR SALE; 1441 E144 van. automa­

tic and air. partly cutlomitcd. 
444-W72 after 4 p.m

1472 CHEVY % ton pickup. 1304 
Hamilton Call 444-4442

CJ7 1477 Jeep 44404 12,444 actual 
miles, air, power steering, hard­
top. automatic 104-323-4441. Cana­
dian.

1444 DODGE, Vk ton pickup. Runs 
good. 444-4114.

1471 F244, XLT Ford pickup with It 
foot cabover, self contained 
camper. Phone 444-1141

MOTORCYCLES
MEERS CYCLES

IM4 Alcock 444-1241

1474 HARLEY-Davidson Sportster 
1004 cc. one month old, perfect 
condition. tlMO Call 444-2444 after 
4 p.m.____________

¡B

inmiiKiifisoaiitsI
669-6854

Offset

m M l b s m j r n
Velma lewter ............M9-9tOS
Joe Hunter .............. 460-7MS
Cloudinc Boick OM . .665-B075 
KathwfiiM SuHbis ....64S-B019
Oail Sanders.............MS-2021
Oenevo Michael ........ 609-0231
LyleOlbcen .............. 009-2958
Mildrwd Scott ...........009-7MI
Joyce WlNiomt ......... 009-07M
O khToylar .................. 604-9400
Roynetta Eatp .........009-9272
Ebner BoMi ORI ....... 005-B07S
David Hunter ...........005-2903
Mordelle Hunter ORI __ Breker

MM try Harder'ta mdjMMbStfk 
euiier fir eunCBenta

MLS

ilfc'

Nood Room?
1 bedrooms, large den, 14(i baths, 
I car garage, large work shop at­
tached to home. Equity and as­
sume loan of 1141 per month. 
MLS SSI.

Call Today
$14,444. 444 N. Somerville. 1 bed­
room, clean, neat, aad good cen­
tral lecalion. Won't last. MLS 
tu .
Mobil home let, 114 S. Some­
rville, Make an offer. Lake 
Meredith nMblle home lot, near 
water and loading ramp, also 
camper lot. Good selection 
ReautifnI country home, IS 
acres, water well, barns, corrals. 
$N,1M OR
114 front foet on Hobart. $1S,$44. 
Invest today for tomorrow, 
i m  Prairie Drive, M7S4 1 bed-

STOPI STOPI STOP!
S bedroom, I katb, $ year eld 
brick heme. Den't pass this up. 
Excellent condition. $14,444. 
Whitt Doer OE.
WMtwShod .............. MS-2039
Mary Howaid ............00S-SIB7
JonM Ihed ................OOS-2039
Wumvw FttOmon i . .  .00S-S0S7
MMySmdofs ............009-3071
Bub Hartan ................MS 404B

YOU CAN GET 
FRIGIDAIRE

BARTS AND SERVICE 
At 66S-BB94

OR COME BY B44 W. FOSTER
WIUIAMS REFRIGERATION

OJ. WMtame Ovwsui

MOTORqYCLES

I47S HONDA, street, lew mileage 
$444. Have gas edger and 4-berse
rototlller Call 4 4 4 ^

NEW 1474 Honda MR 144. Good 
shape, must sell. Call 444 1444 any­
time.

1474 KAWASAKI 744, farnng. 7504 
miles 41144 Might take trade in 
424 N. Dwight alter 4 pm.

1471 HONDA, 144CL in good condi­
tion Call 444-4114.

1471 HONDA. 174 Twin, electric 
s ta rt, runs good, make offer. 
444-4414

1474 MODEL Kawasaki IN. street, 
legal $274 00 704 Doucette after 
4M  '

FOR SALE: 1474 Kawasaki. 12» 
Darby Call M4-4142

1477 YAMAHA TY-244 Trials 2 
months old Escellent condition 
CallM4-4774 after 4 M

TIRES AND ACC.
Firestone Stores 

120 N Gray M4-I41I 
Computerise spin balance

OGDEN «  SON
Expert Electronic wheel balancing 

401 W Foster MS4444

PARTS AND ACC.
PAMPA GARAGE 0 Salvage. Isle 

model parts for you. Motors, star­
ters. transmissions., brake drums, 
wheels Body part's of all kinds 
Member of 2 Hot Lines. 411 Huff 
Call M5 4431

BOATS AND ACC.
OGDEN k  SON

SOI W Foster 444-4444

BOAT COVERS. Nylon or Canvas 
Pampa Tent 0 Awning. 117 E. 
Brown N5-I44I

BOATS AND ACC.

FOR SALE: I t ' Raysoa Craft Boat, 
powertd with high performanco 
Chryiler eegiacwittr lest thaa N 
bewrs on eaginc. 4 buckcl scats, di­
rect drive with velvet touch traas- 
mission with in. ou t and reverse 
Caa be seen at iWt Garlaad or call 
M4-41N

It FOOTGiastroa. walk through Ilf 
Johnson, power tilt, tra ile r 
42M5 N Downtown Manne. Ml S 
Cuyler.

It FOOT Bass boat with depth fia 
der. fool operated trolling motor. 2 
sis gallon gas tanks. 1 batteries 
live well 44 horse motor M4-41M

1477 14 Foot boat with ^vinrude 
drive on tra ile r  All like new 
Phone M4-1I4I

SCRAP METAL
BEST PRICES FOR SCRAP 
C C Matheny Tire Salvage 
t i t  W Foster M4-424I

JOE.

Bobbie Nisbet ORI ..  M9-2333
Owen Bowers ............ M9-3990
Dorothy Joffroy ORI . .M9-24R4
Jorry Pepo ..................MS-BRIO
Neva Weeks .............. 009-2100
Ruth McBride ............MS-I9SR
Joe Fischer ................M9-9S04

Four Sedrooms
If you need lots of room - this is 
tbe one!! Large 4 bedroom. 1A< 
baths, den with woodburning 
fireplace and the owner has just 
installed new steel siding Excel­
lent location close to schools and 
shopping MLS 234

New Listing
Three bedroom home located in 
Jarvis-Sone Addition Large !iv 
ing room and dining area , central 
heat, window unit air con­
ditioner. attached garage and in 
very good condition throughout 
MLS 344

New Listing
Modest 2 bedroom frame home 
on East Francis in a quiet neigh­
borhood and convenient to shop­
ping. Perfect for a small family 
Call about this one today MLS 
344

Norma VhnI
realty

Sandra Gist 6RI ........ M9-0200
Bonnie Schoub GRI ..MS-1309 
Nina Spoonemore . . .MS-2S20 
Irvine Mitchell ORt ..  .MS-4534 
O.G. Trimble GRI . . M9-3222
Mike Word ................ M9-M13
Veri Hapamon GRI . .MS-3190 
Mary Clybum ............ 009-79S9

i

DEMONSTRATOR

1978 Chrysler New Port, 2 door with St. 
Regis Package Loaded, only 6,000 miles. 
A  lot of car, at a lot of savings

PAMPA-CHRYSLER 
PLYMOUTH-DODGE, INC.

821 W. Wilks PH. 665-5765

Christine
IN  foot corner lot. lovely yard 
with garden area and lots of 
trees Brick, nice carpeting, cut- 
tom drapes, living room, dining 
room. 1^ baths, kitchen with 
new dishwasher, separate utility 
room, double garage. Electric 
range, refrigerator, washer, and 
dryer included. Excellent copdi- 
Uon 144.440 MLS 347

East Francis
Large 2 bedroom home with liv­
ing room, dining area, and sepa­
ra te  den Kitchen is freshly

Sainted and has new carpeting 
teel siding, corner lot, aad 2 

double garages 4II.4M MLS 112
Holly Lane

Brick 3 bedroom home with 1 lull 
baths Formal living room, den 
with woodhurniag fireplace, 
electric built ins in the kitchen, 
and large utility room Electric

garage door opener and storage 
uildTng 144.444 MLS 144

For Extra
Frofestional Service 

Call

0 1  I M I S

WILLIAMS
nfALT0P<i

Judi Edwards ORI . .  .MS-3M7
EiieVantifw .............. 009-7B70
$«he KeoRy O R I........ OOS-1449
Je Davie ....................MS-IS10
Matpa FoHowell ........ MS-SOM
FwyeWoHon........ ...OOS-4413
171-A Hughes BM« . .009-2S33

New Listing
This home has a lot of room and 
potential for a family 4 bed­
rooms. and 2 baths Plumbing 
and hot water heater are recently 
installed Workshop areas In­
vestigate now MLS 345

Ea*t Francis
An older home lor only lll.OM 3 
bedrooms. IAi baths, drapes, 
stove, washer and dryer convey 
with tbe sale Wall furnace heat 
MLS 113

Price Reduced
On this home in the Austin School 
D istrict Near the proposed 
shopping mall Relatively new 
plumbing, roof, cabinet top. and 
sink Central heat and air instal­
led about 3 years ago. 3 bed­
rooms. attached garage See 
now t24.4M MLS 114.

FOR I  BEYONDA
sKvia I coNTua

CAU

I I t A ^ E T T A
REALTORS

Fwy Bourn ................ 009-3B09
Norma Shackle ford ORI -S-434S 
Melbo Musgravi , . .  .M9-0292 
At ShockMord ORI . .005-4345 
Macy kse Oenatl ORI 009-9B37 
309N. Fiwet ............ M5-IB19

DEMONSTRATOR
1978 CHRYSLER LeBaron Medallion 
with '7-Bar^' Roof. This small luxury 
Chrysler has got it all. Just 4,900 
miles, biq savings.

PAM PA-CHRYSUR  
PLYMOUTH-DODGE, INC.

•31 W. WNIb é4S-S7éS



M y  I t ,  1«7t PAMPA M W S

'i^c' "■ V Soybean crop prediction several w e ^ s away
By DON KENDALL 
-  A P P n W H ie r

WA8H1NG1X)N (AP) -  
Parm ert and the oilaeed in- 
duatry will have to wait a few 
weeks for the government's of- 
flcitl eitiinatc of the 1171 soy­
bean crop, but indications are 
now that it will be another 
whopper.

The Agriculture Department 
is scheduled to issue another 
crop report Aug. 10, which wilt 
include the agency’s first 1178 
estimate of soybean production 
as well as first estimates for 
cotton and some other craps. 
The report also will include up­
dated figures for wtieat, corn 
and other craps that already 
have been estimated by USDA.

LTV stock 
trading is 
suspended

DALLAS (AP) — At the re­
quest of both companies, the 
New York Stock Exdiange 
Monday suspended trading in 
the securities of the LTV Corp. 
and Lykes Corp. Also included 
were LTV subsidiaryjpnes 9 . 
Laugh-Un Steel O p. and Lykes' 
Yongstown Sheet and Tube Co.

T h e  Justice Department 
recently issued a favorable an­
titrust ruling on the proposed 
LTV-Lykes merger announced 
in November 1977.

In a statement released here 
today, LTV said the trading 
suspension was requested be­
cause of developments in the 
previously-announced private 
investigation by the Securities 
and Exchange Commission 
(SEC) into recent LTV and 
Jones A Laughlin Steel finan­
cial statements.

Lykes Vice Chairman Chester 
H. Ferguson said he did not be­
lieve that the developments in 
the investigation would prevent 
the parties from continuing to 
prepare for the merger. He 
added that facts would have to 
be reviewed by the board of di­
rectors when they became 
available.

The investigation, announced 
by LTV in November 1977, re­
lates to various aspects of JAL 
Steel's accounting for in­
ventories in 1975 and 1976 and 
how such inventory accounting 
affected earnings of JAL Steel 
and of LTV for the years in­
volved.

JAL Steel has for many years 
used a “last in, first out” 
(LIFO) method of accounting 
for inventories.

A mosquito can drink its 
weight in blood at a single 
meal. The itch on the human 
skin is planted when the mos­
quito's saliva enters the bile.

Meanwhile, department offi­
cials, farmers and the industry 
wre Mill analysing a new report 
issued last week which outlines 
som e of the supply and demand 
poasibilities for soybeans in the 
year ahead.

_ Several factors are involved 
in thki year's soybean pictura, 
including a continued brisk ex­
port demand for U.S. beans, 
caused in part by a much 
sm aller crap in Brasil,- the 
leading compeUtor in the world 
oilseed market.

The late planting of corn this 
spring, cauMd by wet weather 
in prime midwestern produc­
tion areas, which also account 
for most of the soybeans, 
caused many farmers to switch 
some land to soybeans because 
t h o s e ^  be planted later than 
c o r n . '^  rediKtion in cotton 
acreage also has boosted soy­
bean acreages in some parts of 
the South.

In all, farmera planted a 
record M.3 million acres of soy­
beans this year, an increase of 
about five million acres from 
1977. Thus, depoxling on the 
weather this summer, officials 
expect that this year’s soybean 
harvest will range between 1.7 
billion and 1.9 billion bushels. 
The 1977 soybean harvest was a 
record 1.72 billion bushels.

Despite the possibility of an­
other record harvest, soybean 
prices at the farm are nqt ex­
pected to tumble sharply in the 
1978-79 marketing year, which 
will begin Sept. 1. According to 
the report, bean prices are like­
ly to average about 86 a bushel 
over the entire 12-month mar­
keting year, compared with 
85.80 a bushel now estimated 
for the current season.

Department experts qualify 
that projection, however, by 
adding that the 1978<Top price 
average could be in a range of 
85 to |7  a bushel.

“At the same time, world 
output of high-protein meals as 
well as oils and fats may ex­
pand in 1978-79, including the
1978 Indian peanut crop, the So­
viet sunflower seed crop, the
1979 South American soybean 
crops and oilseed craps in the 
People’s República of China,” 
the report said.

Soybeans normally Xre proc­
essed by crushing them into 
high-protein meal used primar­
ily in livestock feed mixtures 
and into vegetable oil for usé in 
many food products. Whole 
beans, meal and oil also are 
prominent export items.

Exports of soybeans cur­
rently are projected at about 
730 million bushels in 1978-79, 
up from the record of 700 mil­
lion estimated for this year. 
Crushings are projected at 975 
million bushels against 935 mil­
lion in 1977-78, the report said. 
Seed, feed and “residual'' use 
will account for anothej* 75 mil-
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lion bushels, up from SO million 
this season.
Thus, total soybean use in the 
next marketing year is ex­
pected to be almost -1.8 billion 

• bushels, up from less than 1.7 
bUlion in 1977-78.

The carryover supply from 
previous crops Is expected to 
be 125 million bushels this Sept. 
1, up from 103 million a year 
ago. If the supply and use turn 
out according to current projec­
tions, the soybean reserve on 
Sept. 1, 1979, could be about 145 
million bushels, the report said.

WASHINGTON (AP) -  The

Agriculture Department, said 
today that on Uie surface the 
Soviet Union had a record year 
for agricultural production in 
1977 but that it is “not being 
hailed as such” by Moscow’s 
leaders.

Last year's value of Soviet^ 
farm output was announced at* 
123.6 billion rubles, topping the 
previous high of 122 billion rub­
les in 1973, the departmeiK 
said. A ruble is equal to about 
81.40 in U.S. currency at the of­
ficial Soviet exchange rate.

The analysis was in a weekly 
issue of “Foreign Agriculture”

published by the department’s 
Foreign Agricultural Service. It 
was baaed on a report from 
AUn W. Trick,. U S. agricul­
tural attache in Moscow, the 
agency said.

“ However, such generalized 
measures db not reflect how 
good diets were in relation to 
expectations, especially for 
high-demand items like meats 
and fresh fruits and vegetables, 
whose supplies were in­
adequate.” the report said.

Also, the Soviet grain crop — 
although large in comparison 
with most past years — was

disappointing, the report said. 
It tobried 195J million metric 
tons, short of the goal of about 
213 million tons, the report 
said. A metric ton is 2,205 
pounds.

WASHINGTON (AP) -  The 
-recent plague of locusts that 
has s w ^  across parts of East 
Africa is a reminder that much 
of the world is in constknt jeop­
ardy because of the voracious 
insect, the Agriculture Depart­
ment said today.

“The desert locust can be a 
serious threat to the food sup­
ply in as imich as a fifth of the

world's land, the department's 
Foreign Agricultural Service 
said;

Weighing an average of about 
two grams, locusts eat the 
equal of their weight each day. 
At that rate. 200 or 300 locusts 
can eat about a pound of food a 
day, the agency said. A ton of 
locusts consume as much as 250

people eat daily.
Last nranth, reports were 

made that 43 swarms were 
spotted in Ethiopia and 17 in
Somalia, each swarm covering 
10 to 40 square miles.

Each square mile of locusts

can eat about 14 tons of vegeta- 
rion. the agency said.

Among certain peoples it 
a ma n ' s  s h a d o w  f e l l

grounds for divorce if 
h is  m o t h e r - i n - l a w .
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Introducing
the solution.

Everybody knows the problem. Ordinary low tar 
cigarettes can’t deliver the full measure of satisfaction 
that’s the very reason you smoke.
Now Camel Lights has the solution. With a 
richer-tasting Camel blend. Specially formulated for 
low tar filter smoking. Ju st 9 mg. tar. The result: a 
rich, rewarding, truly satisfying taste.
What’s in a name? Satisfaction, if the name is

Camel. All the flavor and satisfac- 
tion that's been missing in your low 
tar cigarette. With a name like 

' Camel Lights, you know exactly
what to expect.

j f e S '  Try one pack. The
\ solution could be in

your hands.
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New
Camel Lights

9 mg.‘'t8r’',0.8 mg. nicotina sv. per cigarette by FTC nwthod


