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Cantata Scheduled Tra c k s te rs  E n t e r  M eet

y  d a l t o a
NOT LONG ago I had occasion 

to gel on the oval track up at the 
high school. Now I w asn't 
running, you understand; I was 
just walking along the track 
toward a reviewing stand which 
had been set up. As I gazed 
down the track and my eye 
followed it on around the curve 
and back to where I was, I asked 
one of my companions, a school 
administrator who is supposed to 
know all sorts of things, if this 
wasn't longer than 440 yards.

He assured me it has been 
measured to the inch and is 
exactly 440 yards. Contemplat­
ing the awesome task of running 
around that oval, I was con­
vinced that 440 yards is a whole 
heck of a lot further than it was 
when I was in high school. And I 
begin to have a great respect for 
these youngsters who run it in 
SO or even 60 seconds. I couldn't 
make it around that track in 60 
seconds if Godzilla were after 
me.

I'm aware that a lot of people 
my age and older are running or 
jogging regularly, running a 
mile every day and all that sort 
of thing, to keep in good 
physical condition. And I admire 
them, even if I don't want to 
join them. I like to take some 
exercise, but running isn't for 
me.

• • • • •

THE APRIL issue of Reader's 
Digest has an article (by author 
Vance Packard) which suggests 
that we may be on the way to 
becoming a nation of illiterates. 
Figures from the scholastic 
aptitude tests (SAT) taken an­
nually by more than a million 
high school students show that 
average scores have been drop­
ping with a seven per cent 
decline in 10 years.

A more extensive study of 
writing ability is now underway, 
and first samplings of about 
100,000 Americans showed that 
by age 13, "only the best of 
students could handle the basic 
conventions of writing." By age 
17. only about half could "pul 
together simple sentences and 
express simple ideas in general, 
imprecise language."

There are still some of us 
around, though, who write 
gooder than most.

THE SAGE OF SUDAN says 
the most sensible thing to do 
until the doctor comes is to go 
out an borrow some nibney. .

Mr. and Mrs. Dan Drennon 
are the parents of a daughter, 
Chzndra Denise, bom March 
15 at the West Texas Hospital 
In Lubbock at 1 li43  and weighed 
tlx pouitds, two ounces.

Grandparents are Mr. and Mrs. 
Ei^ene Stanley of Sudan and 
ivir. and Mrs. Cun Drennon of

"NoCreatcr Love" by John W. 
Peterson, a taoed  cantata will 
be staged Sunday night at First 
Baptist Chitfch at 7tOO p .m . 
The pastor. Rev. Eddie Free* 
man. Issues an Invitation to

REED ANNOUNCES FOR 
MAYOR CANDIDACY
Arnold Reed nat authorized 

The Sudan Beacon News to an­
nounce Ills candidacy for Mayor 
of the City of Sudask

I, Arnold Reed, announce my 
candidacy for the office of 
Mayor of the City of Sudan. I

have appreciated serving 
your mayor for the past tlx 
years and will appreciate your 
support and vote In the upcom­
ing clection| I have been a 
resident of Sudan since 194S 
where I have owned and ope­
rated the Shamrock Station 
since that tim e. My wife, 
Edith and I, have three ch il­
dren, Susan of Lubbock, and 
Frank and Carey.

/s/Amold Reed 
Pd. PoU Adv.

the public to attend.
The cantata will be presented 

bty a combined choir of membeit 
of First United Methodist Chirch 
and First Baptist ChuKh. Planlijl 
will be G rade Evlnswlth Tom ­
my C au at the organ. Tommy 
Evins will serve as director.

Featured soloists will be local 
musicians In the presentation, 
one of the most dramatic and 
unforgettable ever presented.

BASEBALL ASSOCIATION 
TO ) t n  TONIGHT APR.A

An organizational meeting of 
the Sudan Baseball Association 
w ill be held Thursday night at 
BiOO p. m. at the Community 
Center.

All parents of boys from Pee 
Wee, Little League, junior and 

SenlorBabe Ruth age, arc urged 
to attend this meeting. Plans 
for the upcoming season will be 
made Including election of of­
ficers and scheduling work days 
to prepare the field and con- 
ccHlon stand for operation.

Your attendance will be ap- 
preclated.

Shower Honors 
Mrs. Davis

A pink and blue shower hon­
oring Mrs. Robin Davis was held 
Saturday, March 30 in the home 
of Mrs. Billy CItetter.

A white linen cloth covered 
the serving table which was 
decorated with a spring multi­
colored floral arrangement.ak ‘
Silver and crystal appointments 
were used to serve coffee, cof­
fee cake, and spiced tea with 
Tanya Chester and TuTu King 
presiding.

The hostesses' gift was a lUgh 
chair.

Out-of-town guests Included 
Mrs. Mary Davis and Mrs. Y. B. 
Porter, both of Muleshoc; Mrs.

Ralls.
The Drentiont have anothci 

daughter, Stephanie Dyaane.

*  *  *  *

Mr. and Mrs. Danny Beau­
champ of Astoria, Oregon are 
parents of a girl, Arin M ichelle, 
bora Friday, March 29 aisd 
weighing six pounds and five 
oimces.

Grandparanu arc Mr. and Mn.
B. A. Beauchamp Jr. and Mr. 
and Mrs. jack  Malone of A a- 
napoliSj Md.

(3reat-grandparcnts are Mrs. 
Bessie Myers of Muleshoe and 
Ivir. and Mrs. Ben Beauchamp 
of % u d a n .T b e  couph  have 
two tons, Sean and Todd.

S e n i o n & t n o n d  

J  WiOt Supper
The senior class of S.toan High 

School were honored with a 
"chuckwagm)" banquet Thurs­
day, March 28 at the First 
United Methodist Churclu

The "blessing" was given by 
the pastor. Rev. Aubrey White, 
who also served as master of 
ceremony and alto gave the 
"howdy podner". Debra Ed­
wards gave the "cowhand re- 
sponseP Mike Dunagan, a ju ­
nior student atT exasT ech , pro­
vided the entertainment "rust­
lin'rhythm ". He tang and a c ­
companied tiimself on the gui­
tar and also played the harmon­
ica and guitar at the same time. 
Hit roommate, Rann Turett, a 
sophomore student at Tech from 
Idalou, was also a guest.

The menu consisted of "rlb- 
stlcker chicken, wild west 
beans, tater salad, gratin' 
trough, soindough bread, old 
tod fried pie, and cactusju lce".

The food was served in 
tin plates and fruit jars.

Tablet were placed in Die form 
of a wagon wheel for the "round 
up". They were laid with cloths 
of red bandana print with denim 
place mats and red bandana 
napkins. Programs were red 
felt hats. Kerosene lamps also 
decorated the tablet.

The fellowship lu ll was dec­
orated in the western motif with 
a hltchin' post at entrance, a 
ja il ,  campfire and cowboy and 
tumble weeds, corral, etc.

Servers were Pam Walker, 
Becky Stanley, Ann Nix and 
Gaylene Rogers.

"So long y 'a ll"  was given by 
Susan Black.

Joyce Lance of Lubbock; and 
Mrs. Elaine Faratr and Jenni­
fer of Brownfield.

H o s te s s e s  were Metdamet 
Waymon Bellas, E. C. Mln- 
yard, Eugene Edwards, Billy 
Chester, Eddie Wilson, Corley 
Baker, Darwin Reid, Calvin 
Vernon, Dick West, Tommy 
Kln|.

THE COMMBSIONIRS Court In 
Bailey, Parmer, Cochran and 
Lamb Counties have purchased 
a new Bookmobile for their rural 
famiUes. The Bookmobile was 
delivered to Muleshoe, Thurs­
day, February 28, 1974. All 
books md equipment luve been 
transferred to it and it Is now 
making the scheduled stops In

the fow oubukses. The Librari­
ans, Lorene Sooter and Ruby 
Henderson, hope everyone will 
come to see the interior of the 
bookmobile. It has more room 
and it very pretty, f 

The Bookmobile ‘̂ maket its 
schedule stops every three weeks 
and hat books for adults and 
children.

A mayor and two d ty  council- 
men will be elected Saturday 
for tlie City of Sudan, as well 
at two trustees to the Sudan In­
dependent School District.

Polls will open at City Hall 
at 8i(X) a. m. for the d ty  e le c ­
tions and will close at 7s00 
p. m. Nolan Parrish will serve 
at presiding judge.

Arnold Reed It seeking re- 
election to the mayor's post 
with Charles Burnett hit op­
ponent. Hoyt Robertson, Tom ­
my Most and incumbent F. M. 
Smith are running for the two 
coundlmen posts with terms of 
Smith and Paul Provence ex­
piring.

The School Trustee Election 
will be held at Sudan Commun­
ity Center from 8i00 a. m. to

BAND C. NCERT AND 
AUCTION APRIL 9
The Sudan Hornet Stage Band 

will present a concert Tuesday 
-night, April 9 , at 7i30 p. m. 
.In the high school auditorium. 
Tliere will be no admission 
charge.
* In conjundion with the con­
cert, a cake and pie auction 

' will be Iteld with proceeds to* 
be used to send the band to the 
marching conust In Corpus 
Chrlstl the first weekend of 
May. All bandparenu arc be­
ing asked to donate cakes and 
pies, or If they prefer, SS. 00, 
for this cause. Cards will be 
mailed to each band parent.

7 i00p .m . Presiding Judge will 
be Margaret Smith. Seeking 
the two placet on the school 
board arc incumbent Guy Wal­
den and Kenneth Vincent and 
Wayne Swart. Byron Lynn did 
not seek re-election.

• • e «
Regarding Senate BUI 193 on 

disabled voten, the Secretary 
of State Mark W. White, Jr. 
itat stated that disabled voters 
may obtains certificau  of per­
manent disability signed by a 
duly licensed physician and send 
it to the registrar, the Lamb 
County Tax Assessor-Collector, 
and the ssccessary notation will 
be added to the list of registered 
voters. Then the disabled voter 
maybe issued an absentee bal­
lot for voting In all elections 
held on or after the 31st day 
after the date on which the reg­
istrar received it. .

The blank certificates for per­
manent disability may be ob- 
uined from Herbert Dunn, 
Lamb County Tax Asaesaor- 
Collector, aisdthe signed forms 
filed with Mr. Dunn.

The Sudan boys varsity track 
u am  will participate Thursday 

. In the Class A District Meet at 
Spring lake -Earth.

The Sudan FUgh School varsity 
track students canted a total of 
37 points In Division II of the 
Denver City Track Meat Satur­
day. Placing In varlotu events 
were the followingi 

M ile—1st, Luther Robinson, 
4iM  for 10 points.

120 H. Hurdles—2nd, Richard

Tamplln, 16. 7 for 8 points.
330 L Hurdles-3rd, Richard 

Tamplln, 43 .6  for 6 points. 

P olaV aull-4ih , Mitch Chei- 
tor, 10' (or 4 points! ®»h, MaA 
Hanna, 9*6" for 1 point. '  

lOOYd. Dash—Sth, Mike Rob­
inson, 10.6 for 2 points.

220Yd. Dash—Sth, Mike Rob­
inson, 24. 4 (or 2 points.

Sprint Relay—Sth, Tamplln, 
Haima, Terry Graves, Robin­
son, 4S.B (or 4 points.

STUDENTS NAMED 
TO DONOR ROLL

ELECTIONS TO RE 
HELD SATURDAY

Students named to the third 
nine weeks honor roll at Sudan 
schools has been released by 
Principal Dale Read. To 
achieve this honor, a student 
must maintain a 90 average 
with no grade below 80.

S E N I O R S
Susan Black, Tommy Seymore,

WAYNE SWART SEEKS 
SCHOOL BOARD PLACE

Wayrsc Swart, a caodldate for 
school board trustee of the Su­
dan Irsdcpcisdcnt School Dis­
trict, has stated that he will do 
hit best if elected to this po­
sition.

Swart is a farmer and has re­
sided in the Sudan school dlt- 
trlct20ycart. He and hlswlfe, 
Wanda, have thcee children, 
Rogerwhols a student at A C C ,, 
Terry and Kathy, both studenas

In the local schooL 
Swart also stated, "A ll votes 

and support will be appred- 
aied ."  Wayne Swart

Pd. PoL Adv.

C o r r e c t i o n !  The late 
Baylest Brown was the brother 
of Mrs. Gilbert Marten iiutcad 
of Mrs. W. C. Marten at print­
ed In last week's paper.

Mr. and Mrs. Arnold Reed 
Carey and Frank were in Ldb- 
bock Sunday to visit their 
dai^hter and titter, Susan.

^ • C M O O I .

Monday, April 8 —Chicken 
with noodle casserole, EngUth
peas, rolls, butter, milk, syrup 
cups.

" Tuesday — Hamburgers, on- 
iotu, pickles, potato chips, 
orasige Juice, cookies, milk.

Wednesday—Brow  a beans, 
macaroni-tomatoes, corameal 
muffin, peanut butter cookie, 
sliced peaches.

Thursday — P ina, blackeye
peat, pickle stick, banana pud­
ding, milk.

Friday—Steak fingers/cauup, 
green beam, steamed rice, 
rolls, milk, butter, je lly  cups.

The Rev. Mrs. HamI House 
of Estelllne was a Sudan visitor 
Motsday aisd Tuesday.

Jr. Class Play 
S e t  Friday

The Junior clast of Sudan High 
School it presenting a Donald 
Pate play, "Tliey Run In Our 
Family". The three act play 
will begin at 7i30 p. m. April 
$ in the Sudan High School 

Auditorium. Admission it $1. SO 
for adults and $. 7S for students.

The cast Includes Rex Baccut, 
Nclda Carpenter, Craig Harpei, 
DoylenePoe, AimaSmith, Bob­
by Phillips, Evelyn Caldwell, 
Mitch Chester, Ricliard Tamp- 
lin, Theresa Stanford, Mary 
Griffith,MaryAnnBellar, Phyl­
lis Ray, Mary Jo Williams, Da- 
vidAills,TracyBowlIng, Luther 
Robinson, Debbie Hall, Cheryll 
Harvey and Carroll Legg.

STUDENTS 
IN Ull EVENTS

Sudan High Scliool students 
participated in UIL literary 
events at Vega Wedisetday but 
results were not in at press time.

Events and students are as fol­
lows!

Informative .  Speaking—Boyi 
Bobby Phillips! Girli Nelda 
Carpenter,

Persuasive Speaking—Connie 
Ham.

Poetry Interpretation — Kim 
Fisher, boy; Mary MartisMZ, 
girl; Francine Noles, alternate.

Prose Reading—Kim Fisher, 
boy; Raylene Poe, girl; Anna 
Smith, alternate.

Oral Reading—Cay Hedges; 
Norma Salazar, alternate.

One Act Play (When the Fire 
Dies)—Cast of five; 3S minutes 
long; directed by Tommy Evins.

Ready Writing—Susan Black 
Sfseryl Black.

Spelling awl Plain W riting- 
Norma Salazar, Raylene Poe, 
Gaylene Rogers.

Number ^etsse—Susan Black, 
Daryl Roberts, Rax Baccus; 
Sheryl Black, alternate.

Science—Susan Black, Rex 
Baccut, Mark Lane; Norma Sal­
azar, alternate.

Slide Rule—Mary Griffith, 
Bobby Phillips, Rax Baccus;

Vicki Gardner, Don Noles, Kim 
Fisher, Debbie Ritchie. 

l U N I O R S
Phyllis Ray, Carroll Legg, 

Bobby Phillips, Rex Baccus, 
Mary Griffith, Craig Harper, 
Debbie HalL

S O P H O M O R E S  
Rutty Core, Mark Lane, Phil 

Kent, Larry Bellar, Francine 
Noles, Brian May, Lisa Harper, 
Chyral ^Phillips, Larisa West, 
Gaylene Rogen, Cindy Mots, 
Shelley Hargrove.

Sheryl Black, Mary Martinet, 
Cary Ham, Terry Swart, Norma 
Salazar, Randy Core.

E IG H T H  G R A D E  
Jody Vernon, Gloria Kessler, 

Steve Ritchie, Dcnnli Harvey, 
Donald Doty, Roy Don Dudg- 
eqn, Bert Byerley, Barry Wise­
man, Darren Provence.

School
Activities

Spring break will be held the 
week following Easter Sumlay, 
April IS through 19 with classes 
resuming on Monday, April 22.

JuniOfClassPlav Friday. April 
S at 7i30 p. m.

Varsity girls won second in dis­
trict at Farwell last week In
volleybalL

Jr. Sr. Banquet, April 27. 
Cfteerleadert tryouts Apr! 124.

The district track meet lor 
varsity andJV boys will be held 
at Springlake-Earth on April 4 
with April S at the alternate 
date.

The eighth grade clast ban- 
qsiet will be held in the school 
cafeteria April 6.

A band concert and auction it 
scheduled (or Tuesday April 
9, 7i30 p. m. ^

The F. F. A. annual awards 
banquet hat been set for Mon­
day, Apri l s,  7 :30p .m.

An F. F. A. livestock judging 
contest will be held April I at 
Abilene with dairy judging and 
livestock judging contests at 
Canyon April 6.

The F. K  A. state convention 
will be held April 2S-27at Dal-

Phyllis Ray, alternate.
Typewriting—SfseryT Black, 

Cindy Moss, Larisa West, Tern 
Osester, alternate.

Slsortharsd-Phyllis Ray, Con- 
. nle Ham.

'T REV RUN FAMILY’ -  JR. CLASS PLAY.-FRIDAY-7:30P.M.
H IG H  SCHOO L A U D IT O R IU M A D M IS S IO N — A D U L T S — $ 1 .5 0  S T U D EN T S — 75 <
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C H R I S T I A N F E L L O W S H I P  C E N T E R
us I S  A L I V  E T O D A Y

WHEN SOMEONE BECOMES A  C H R IS T IA N HE BECOMES A
BRAND NEW PERSON I N S I D E . 2 COR. 5 ; 1 7

SAT. APR IL 6 GUEST SPEAKER;
7 : 3 0  p . m. WALTER AXTELL THE LA Y  W ITNESS
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SUNDAY 5 :3 0 - 6 :0 0  P .M .
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Personals
Sunday dinner gueiU in the 

t sm iE a f  Ml".": Ri4»y M ince were 
Rev. and Mn. Franklin Swan- 
nerof Plainview. He was guest 
speaker of the First Baptist 
Church for both services Sun­
day. During the afternoon they 
attended the fiftieth anniversary 
service at the First Baptist 
Church in Amhent.

L  B. Hobbs returned to his 
home in Plains after visiting 
here for about ten days with his 
daughter, Mr. aixJ Mrs. Clen 
Cardwell and girls.

Mr. and Mrs. Randy Humph­
reys who recently moved to 
Tulia were in Sudan Thursday 
to get their boys, Chip and 
Trent who have been visiting 
with their grandparents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Bill Curry and Mr. 
and Mrs. John Humphreys.

Mr. and Mrs. Joe Burt Mark­
ham retunsed home by plaise 
from a three weeks visit in Bat­
tle Creek, Mich, with their 
daughter, Mr. and Mrs. Jack 
Tyson. They spent the past 
weekend in Amarillo visiting 
their son, Mr. and Mrs. Bonner 
Markham.

Mr. and Mrs. C. C. Ritchie 
and Steve visited in Clovis Sun­
day afternoon with her brother, 
Mr. and Mrs. Paul Corley and 
family.

Among those from Sudan at- 

Unding the high school district 
tournament for Clast A schools

Thursday were Mrs. Billy Han­
na, Mrs. Billy Chester and Mrs. 
Barbara Flowers.
Jim  Bob Hargrove and bit dad 

and brother-in-law, Jim  Har- 
grove of Lubbock and Dale 
Newsom of Needmore, and 
Wayne Doty fished at Amlstad 
from Friday through Monday.

Creg Harper and Donald Doty 
attended the Harlem Globetrot-* 
ters game Thursday night In 
Lubbock with Mrs. Wayne Doty 
taking them.

Miss Alice Harris was also in 
Lubbock Thwsday night to see

BEAUTY
that 

uplifts

!• *111

HAMMONS 
FUNERAL HOME

M 5 - 5 1 2 1  
503 E .  5 th  

L I T T L E F I E L D .  T E X A S

U 6AI Nona
THE STATE OF TEXAS 

TO: RICHARD FLOYD SHRI- 
NER, III, and to all whom it 
may concern. Respondent 

CREETINCt
YOU ARE HEREBY COM­

MANDED to appear and answer 
before the Honorable District 
Court, lS4th Judicial District, 
Lamb County, Texas, at the 
Courthouse of said county In 
Littlefield, Texas, at or before- 
10 o 'clock A. M. of the Mon­
day next after the expiration of 
20 days from the date of service 
of this citation, then and there 
to answer the petition of Susanne 
Huiuinger and Charles Brent 
Hunsinger, Petitioners, filed in 
said Court on the 20th day of 
March, 1974, against Richard 
Floyd ShAner, m . Respondent, 
and said suit being number 7S63 
on the docket of said Court, 
and entitled "In the Interest of 
a Child", the nature of which 
suit is a request to termirute 
the parent-child reUtioaship. 
Said child was bom on the 16th 
day of January, 1969, in Cor­
dell, Washita County, Okla­
homa.

The Court hat authority In 
this suit b* enter any judgment 
ordccreu In the child's interest 
which will be binding upon you, 
including the termination of 
the parent-child relationship 
and appointment of a conser­
vator with authority to consent 
to the child's adoption, 

bsued and given under my 
hand and seal of said Court at 
Littlefield, Texas, this the 20th 
day of March, 1974.
/s/Rav Lvim Britt_____________

Ray Lynn Britt, Clerk of 
the District Coiwt of Lamb 
County, Texas 

(SEAL)

the Harlem Clobetiotters.d
Mr. and Mrs. Jinks Dent re­

turned home recently from 
Houstoq where he went for a 

„ipedlcal check-up and got a 
good report. During the past 
weekend , they visited in Friona 
in the home of Mr. and Mrs. 
J. V. Bouldin, and on Monday 
attended the SOth wedding an- 
nivenary celebration for his 
cousin, Mr. and Mrs. L  H. 
Dent in Earth.

Mrs. Jeff Lynsky of Lubbock 
1s visiting in the home of her 
parenu, Mr. and Mrs. Bud Pro­
vence. The Lynskys are In the 
process of moving to Maple 
where he will be engaged in 
farming.

Mrs. Bob (Marty) Edwards and 
Marianne of Lubbock visited last 
week in the home of their sis­
ter and aunt, Mrs. Mary Lee 
Cowart and children. Marianne 
remained here until Saturday 
when Mrs. Cowart and children 
took her back to Lubbock.

Mr. and Mrs. D. A. Coldiron 
and Mrs. Danny(Tuye) Rhoades 
and Courtney visited in Cuy- 
mon, Okla. during the week­
end in the home of his parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. U. A. Coldiron, 
and in the home of their ton and

NEW
OR

USED
CARS

Boccis Chavrelef
SUDAN,TEXAS  

Box 356 Phono 227-3S0f
IF YOU DON’T KNOW 

CARS
KNOW YOUR DEALER

Feoders Grain, |pc
DAILY BUYERS FOB 
CATTLE FEED ERS  

Fodorsl
Storage Llcente 3-445 

We Can Uae Your Grain 
Have 6emi-Llft -  Location 

SUDAN LIVESTOCK  
«

FEEDING COMPAI4Y 
Phone 227-S311 Sudan

DOIPN BRISCOE PROMISED 
10  RESTORE INTE6RIIY 

TO TEXAS PO im C S.
H E K EP TTN E PROM ISE.

L E T S  K EEP  
O O VER H O R  BRISCOE

J t  IK  N . .-aw u-'vs l» e * e i  \ IK  I  «MT4I««  Mei»a#a* I * I ■ I I llBP ■ I «
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A RN O LD  R EED

Y O U R  V O T E  A P P R E C I A T E O
F O R

ARNOLD REED
FOR

MAYOR
Of City of Sudan

V O T E  A P R I L  6. 1 97 4 •
( P o l .  A d v . P a id  fo t* b y M ayor A r n o ld  R eed) 
( P u b . b y Sudan Beacon N e w s , S u d a n , T e x a s )

family, Mr. and Mrs, Charles 
Rhoades and Cara.

Joe Price, lon-ln-Uw of the 
J . C. Withrows, was rtcogniatd 
at Wayland College as being

the highest honor student there 
in Mathematics. He is a May 
candidate for graduation. Ha 
and his wife, Cynthia, and aon 
reside at Olton.

N? 249

OFFIC IAL-
BALLOT

Vote le t itio  cond:dat«s of your 
chotea by pkicine on "X "  In tiw 
sq«M)«s bmlda Itia nomas of liw  
oandidoMs of your cheics.

CITY OF SUI
FORMitYOR
Vot* For

□  CHARLES BURNEH

□  ARNOLD REED |R^lw%>n|

□
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OTY OF SUDAN

m c n o N
Stgnolura To Ba 

Ravarsa Sida.

Mr. and Mrs. Cary Kelly of 
DaUas met her parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Dick West and Jana 
ar»d James at Lake Biownwood

TOPS K 3 H  MEETS
TOPS 634 met Monday for a 

regular meeting in the Com­
munity Center.

The meeting opened with the 
group singing the TOPS tong. 
Roll call was answered with 
weight gained or lost and a lots 
of six pounds was recorded. 
Kathy Gatewood was queen of 
the week.
'T h e  meeting closed with the 
members repeating the TOPS 
Pladge in unlaon.

Coif News
The boys golf team of SHS 

placed fourth in district after 
the final round of play at Vega 
Monday aftenoofl. Faswell 
won the Clau A district title.

Don Notes o f  Sudan had the 
fourth best Individual score aft­
er the two rounds which was 170. 
and Kyle Martin was sixth best 
wiUt 178. Mike Yell of Vega 
had the best score with 166.

Other members of thc'Siaian 
golf team were Roby Lynn, 
Curtis Chester, Rocky Cowart 
and Craig Pickett.

FOR COMMISSIONER
Vo4* For Two 

ERTSON

MOSS

(TH (Roolection)

D e lu x e  Cafe
l^ ^ e r e  P /e a S iu re

* \ .A  *ir!.
tfoorti 5 ajD. -  9p.m . Every Day 
MS. AND MSS. S. A. BDSDETT

PWONISr-TOTl

ORDER YOUR 
EASTER FLOWERS NOW

TO ASSURE YOU BEAUTIFUL EASTER L I L I E S — WE GROW OUR OWN

CORSAOES FOR RANQUETS
PLACE YOUR EASTER ORDER EARE?

A T  T H E

RISHOP DR06
(VALDA BISHOPeOWNER)

CALL 227-6 811 ( d r u g  s j o r e )

OR 227-5661 ( r e s i d e n c e )

F O R  A L L  F L O R A L  N E E D S
EASTER-B ANQ U ETS-M O THER'S DAY

n m C R A LS -C O R S A G E S -C U T  FLO W ER S -P O T P LA N T S

CHISHOLM’S FLORAL
L i n i E F I E L D e  TEX .

(SERVING SUDAN AREA SINCE 1936)

M
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Peraonah
Mr. aad Mn. Maitla Maxwell 

atteaded iIm 1. H. Dent Coktea 
Wedding Celebcmtlaa Sunday 
aflenaooB at Earth. While there 
they alao vlalted in the home 
of Mr. and Mra. Fteddle Clay­
ton.

Evelyn Milam mtimaed home 
to Sherman Satiaday after ipend* 
li^  a weeh with her parenta, 
Mr, and Mrt. John Milam.

John WlUlami wai In Quaaah 
Friday and Satioday on bual- 
nesa and to vlilt hli pareitta, 
Mr. and Mra. J. A. WlUlama 
and with hliwifc'a parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Charlie Lowe.

Mr. and Mrs. John Williams 
and family were In Lubbock 
Saturday visiting la the home 
of Mr. and Mrs. D. D. Adams 
to visit with Mr. and Mrs. Bill 
Adams and glrb of Crapevine.

Beverly Ann Carter of Ft. 
Sumner, N. M. , a Texas Tech 
student, visited In the home of 
Mr. and Mrs. Martin Maxwell 
Monday.

Mrs. Eugene Stanley recent­
ly visited In Lubbock with Mr. 
and Mrs. Dan Drennon and in­
fant daughter, Chauadra Denise.

Mr. and Mrs. Doyle Terrell 
ofTruth or Consequences, N. M. 
visited In Sudan last week.

Mr. and Mrs. Arnold Beckett 
went to Midland Thursday to 
visit their son, Mr. and Mrs. 
James Beckett and family. 
They returned home Sunday.

Mrs. B. A. Beauchamp Jr.

FOR SALE
DELUXE CAFE

M A IN  S T R E E T  S U D A N , T E X A S  \

M U S T  Q U I T  
D U E  T O  H E A L T H

\

CONTACT

R . A .  B U R D E T T  
Phone-806-227-46 71

enplaned Saturday for Astoria, 
Ore. to visit her son and fam i­
ly, Mr. and Mrs. Danny Beau­
champ. She plam to return 
home next weak.

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Kuykendall 
aisd Len of Tllden are visiting 
with her parents, Mr. and Mrt. 
R. B. Knox, Mr. and Mrs. Jim ­
my Knox and Mr. and Mrs. 
Chester Knox and Curtis Wayne 
and her grandmother, Mrs. 
Daisy Ford.

Mrs. Pat Brownd and children 
of Lamesa are visiting with her 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. J. B. 
Harper and Mr. and Mrs. Cayle

O u r  M r v ic M  rg- 

inforc* foith thot 

alone can soHen 

sorrow and iron- 

K e n d  the weight 

o f bereavem ent. 

Rely on us.

PHONE 2 4 6 -3 3 5 1 
AMHERST .E X A S

Brownd and family.
Mrs. Donny Weaver and Infant 

of Dallas are visiting her par­
ents, Mr. and Mrs. Henry 
TampUn and the Weaver family.

Visitors last week in the home 
of Mr. aixl Mn. Dee Willing­
ham were friends htom Morton, 
Mrs. Amy Bedell, Dutch El­
liott, Roxanne Bedell, Dorothy 
Bedell, Edith Linden and C er- 
aldiiM Wiggins.

Visiting during the weekend 
in the home of Mr. and Mrs. 
J. C. Wells were their children, 
Linda Wells of Denver, Colo. , 
Robert Wells of Amarillo, Mrs. 
Claude Patton of Lubbock, Mrs.

N o .

BALLOT
VUf tm m  nWMMn el rtm Wlln If iImIw  

■i r  hi Mm lemw hWSi Iht mmm W th* 
SiSeUi n rew Wwu.

Uats;

No(*i Vol*? AflUe

VOTE FOR

HOYT ROBERTSON
F O R

CITY COUNCIIMAN
OF SUDAN

YOUR V O T E  F O R  M E

IN T H E  C I T Y  E L E C T I O N

S A T U R D A Y ,  A P R I L  6 , 1 9 7 4

W I L L  B E  A P P R E C I A T E D

( P o l .  A d v . P a id  f o r  b y H o y t R o b e r t s o n — P u b . by Sudan Beacon N e w s , S u d a n , T e x a s )

sed on

FOR SCHOOL TRUi
SUDAN School DIstr

D - CUY WALDEN

908

WAYNE SWART

Q  KENNETH V lN O | ^

D -  
□ -  
□ -  
□ -

model COMBINATION REPAIR
UNIT REPAIR, REBUILD,

CONSTRUCT EQUIPMENT AND MACHINERY 
MODEL F-275

Without Built-in Charger.
This unit IS the same as 
the one above, except for 
the Charger. However, the 
Charger unit can be added 
in the future when 
required

1 & 2 HP TWIN CYL. 20-GAL.
• J  te  M.S CRM DIael. 4.9 te  S.6 CRM Free Air At liB /llg

PORT. COMPRESMRS
PtI. Cemplete WHti Deyten C ^  AAetew

Wayne Williford, Rita and Rote 
ofAbemathy, Mn. C lennChct- 
ter and Mn. Wayne Doty and 
children, aitd Kenneth Wells.

Mr. andMn. Jack Engram re­
turned home Friday from Tem ­
ple where she went through the 
medical clin ic there. She was 
admitted to Methodist Hospital 
In Lubbock Saturday.

Weekend visiton In the home 
of Mr. and Mrs. D. W. Wil­
liamson wraathcM son, Mr. and 
Mrs. Har^ W ^lamson and 
Chris of Lubbock.

Mrs. Vanessa Kelly of Lubbock 
vlalted during the weekend with 
her parents, Mr. and Mn. Eu­
gene Stanley, and with her unc­
le, Mr. and Mn. J . D. Stanley

'̂ G /V E YOUR ^  
FAM ILY A TR EAT

l i c e  c R € f l m

SttDMM DMIBY B E E ^ ^
MR. AND MRS. JAMES NIX

NEW OWNERS & M GRS.

PHONE 2 2 7 -3 8 9 2

C O H P L E T E  L I N E  FO R N E Y  W ELDERS 

ROCKW ELL POWER T O O L S , D R I L L S , G R IN D E R S  

C O M P LETE L I N E  W ELD IN G  EQ U IP M EN T

sac AUTO SUPPLY
P g M I  M » -  * f W  -  4 9 0 A B

If We Were Bocrowing
WE'D TAKE DEAD AIM ON 

THE BANK WITH THE 
MOST TO OFFER CLIENTS
Neetl a loan for any jfood reason? Come, 
lei's talk it over.

Tha First Natioaol Baak O f Sadoa
Member Federal Deposit

All Deposits Insured Up To end Including $20,000.00
Dependable Benkbio Servlw Mm 

,  OLDEST EANK IN LAME COUIfnr

qnd other relatives.
Blake Lacewell of Hale Cen­

ter is visiting in the home of 
Mr. end Mrt. Pete Lance.

Mr. and Mn. Clen Cardwell 
visited In Lubbock Sunday with 
his parents, Mr. and Mn. Hal 
CardwelL

David Doty of Midland arrived 
home Thursday night for a visit 
with his parents and other rela­

tives. He returned to his home 
in Midland Monday night.

Mn. Jerry Etheridge and Kay 
Lynn of Dimmitt visited nver 
the weekend with her parents, 
Mr. and Mn. Gilbert Church­
man and Scott.

Mr. and Mn. Bob Drake were 
in Tulla Saturday to visit his 
brother, Mr. and Mn. L  H. 
Drake.

*
THINGS TO 

LOOK FOR 
IN A 

WATER 
NEATER

.»ii

4 *»*!

L'

NO Huf NffOfO
sracc SAVING
COMAltTE INSTAUATIONr  ^ OCrfNOABLE

✓ LOW WAT(N MEATfnAATI
SEAviCl WHEN NEEDED
FINANCING IF wanted

These you ^  in an Electric Water Heater!

mstlIBKtric
PKMir
C A U  U S ...!
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FOR SALE-K I rby V » c u u m  
CIcancn, service ami parti at 
Clarke's Dry Coodi. j  7 .»'«<

TRUCK SEATS
EXCH AN GE  

15 MINUTE SERVICE

McCormick's
Upholstery

CHARLES POWELL 
Own«r

227 Phalpi Ave. 
Phone 385-4555

LITTLEFIELD , TEXAS

t Pool oooiog
Cos^iooU pwnfMd vtUi a 
MUIX-PUMP A trootad with 
boctotio A OMyniM to li- 
quldlM aoUdo A tooMooidrs 
tor bottor (Aoinoeo* I>Uvto( 
vats draloodoad Uqaldi hool- 
od to yoar d l^ onj pit 
Crotao piU (kwtaod A troot- 
od. MoIImooo pttx dralaod.

PAom tn ~ H V  or r»-M e? 
ELMER DA're

We Sell 
Service 

Install 
Finance 

And
Guarantee
ELECTRIC
WATER

HEATERS

Phone 227-3871

PoM cd-n 
Cfltewfcir—1

The Sudan Beacon News is au- 
thoriied to annouiKe the follow • 
inR candidates for election to 
the office listed directly under 
iheir names, subject to the ac • 
tionol the Democratic Primary 
in l.amh County, Texas, May 
4, 1974.

a • * • * * *

BILL ANGEL
Candidate for election as 

L^mb County Judge

HUBERT DYKES 
Cindidaie for Re-ejection tot 

County Commissioner 
Lamb County PrectncI No. 4

EUGENE YOUNG 
C.inJidate for Election 

Commissioner 
Precinet 4 Lamb County

MARY BETH WILLEY 
Candidate for re-election 

County Clerk

C. T. (TRUITT) SIDES 
C.indidate (Of re-election as 

County JudRe

KATHRYN DAY 
Candidate for Election 

County Clerk

LUCY MORELAND 
Can.fidate for Re-Election 

County Treasurer

BETTY ANNE HALL 
Candidate for Election for 

County Clerk

RAY LYNN BRITT 
Candidate for re-election 

District Clerk

HARVEY FLOYD 
Democrat Candidate for 

Texas Houic of Representatives 
74th Diftrict

CHARLES BURNETT 
Candidate for etection 

Mayor of Sudan

THOMAS MOSS 
"Tommy "

For Election to City CouiKil 
Sudan. Texas

TORE VEREEN
Candidate for Re-Election as 

Justice of Peace

SUDAN
ELEVATORS

SUDAN,TEXAS
FOR ALL YOUR SEED  
AND GRAIN NEEDS

WE HANDLE ALL 
GRADES OF GRAIN -  AT. 
A NOMINAL DISCOUNT

J .  H .  V in c e n t
AND

K e n n e th
V in c e n t

Otener and Managar

SUDAir BEACON NEWS
Published Each Thursday At 

SUDAN, TEXAS 79371
Aifcl enietesl .1* ^'cond class mail matter at the post office 
I I I  Stwian. Tex.is, June 2t>, 1924. iinsirr the Act of Congress 
isl M.irsh 3. 1870

' j .  W. HOUSI DALTON WOOD
Publisher Etfitor

SUBSCRIPTION RATES
Lsmh County ......................................................... $3. 50 per year
Elsewhere. . ............................................................$4. UU per year

CLASSIFIED RATES
S i  p e t wssrsl. I list-insert is’n 3* per word lor subsequent in - 
ss-rltssn. m inim um  charge i l  0 0  per first insertion, cards Of 
lh.ink> $ 1 .0 0  e a ch .

DISPUW  RATES U|s«n rtqiie I
Tfse sK 'aJllne Is’i afl sOps is Tiw>slay iKX>n

1974 ----------------------------------------
»RESS ASSOCIATION

FANNIE B. ROGERS 
Candidate for County Treasurer 

Lamb County

akeMome
n Addition to Money-Saving Values, W e Give You 

unn Bros. Stam ps as an E X T R A  B O N U S !
D O U B L E  O N  T U E S D A Y  A N D  W E D N E S D A Y  

P R IC E S  GOOD F -R ID A Y . A P R IL  5 THROUGH W ED NESD AY. A P R IL  10 -

CARROTS L B . B.AG

TROPHY

STRAWBERRIES
3 FOR

S A L T IN E S

CRACKERS » ]
3 FOR 1

A LP O

DOG FOOD I I
6 1 / 2  CAN 5 FO R  |

G EBHARDTS JUMBO

TAMALES
S H U R FIN E  LA R G E  R IP E

OLIVES CAN 4 9 ^

WAGNERS B R E A K FA S T

DRIHK 51
3 FO R 1

S H U R F IN E  EV A P O R A T ED

M ILK * 1
A CANS 1

B R IG H T  & E A R L Y  ORANGE

JUICE $ 1
l ê  O Z .  CAN 3 FO R  |

L I Q U I D  D E T E R G E N T

WISK 5169
64 O Z .  S I Z E  1

FR ES H  S T A LK

CELERY EACH

SQUASH

UBBAGE
BANANAS

L B .

PANTY

HOSE 3 P A IR

L I Q U I D  32 O Z .  S I Z E

PEPSODENT TOOTH

BRUSHES »<29t
PEPSODENT TOOTH

PASTE FAMILY S IZE

S M A R I C O N T E M P O R A R YŴ<3 )Ĉ WIND
AT AN UNUSUAL 
LOW  PR IC E

AN
EXCePTlONAL 

VALUE 
ONPHNE

S T A N J E S S
F l l ^ 390

W I T M  l A C N  | > 0 0  F V K K A S I  

Cwppwe your w l wdh dramWK

P EY T O N S  B O N E LE S S  HONEAT D IP P E D

HAMS
D E L  NO RTE

BACOH ■? L B .

P EY TO N S

ERAHKS 12 OZ.

P EY T O N S

BOLOGNA 12 O Z .

A I

7

T a d M C fN ti
•RfAD

I ^ - n - S a F i e
( S T 0 R E H O U R ^ ? 3 ^ U r ^ ? 0 ^ j ! ^ O N § A ^ H R W  SATURDAY

WE A C C EP T USOA FOOD STAMPS
W l CASH ^AVROU ONflCKt AND M U  MONIY O flO lM  
OOURLIBTAM M  Af A  OAV TUttOAVt A W IO N nO AVt


