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, "Out of the mouths of babes"— 
Peggy, small daughter of Mr: and 
Mrs. Money Wilkenson, says, 
"Daddy grunts everytime he sets 
down, arid he grunts every time 
he gets up. He is getting old." 

Times have changed. Many 
young men of today seem to have 
gray beards, while .many of the 
older men of yesteryear sported 

,beards in their natural colors. 
Shaving permits have been go-

ing like hot cakes for the past 
week. Many of the fellows had 
rather pay five dollars than to 
go without the comforts of a 
shave for six weeks. After wear-
ing a beard for two weeks we 
don't blame them. In order to 
stage a successful Old Settlers 
Reunion money in large amounts 
will be needed and the men with 
beards will alSo, through some 
ruse, be called on to help foot the 
bill. 
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City Ordinance 
Zones Truck 
Parking In City 

Elsewhere in this issue of the 
News is a legal notice calling at-
tention to the zoning of certain 
streets in the city of Dimmitt' for 
the parking of various types of 
trucks, trailers, etc. No truck 
parking signs have been placed 
on the city streets traversed by 
State Highways, in cooperation 
with the State Highway traffic 
rules. All other streets in the 
city are available for truck park-
ing. In announcing the necessity 
of zoning the city streets for 
truck parking, city officials de-
clared that the action was neces-
sary in order to meet with the 
State Highway Department's 
safety regulations program. 

July Clearance Sale 
Elsewhere in this issue of the 

News is a formal announcement 
of Ma.nning's July Clearance 
Sale. Some items in their store 
have been reduced one-half or 
more of the retail price. 

JESS BURCH 

Local Boy Gains 
Nighest Honors In 
Baptist R. A.'s 

Jess Burch, son of Mr. and Mrs. 
J. E. Burch of Dimmitt, was re-
cently honored at the District 
Nine Plains Baptist Assembly 
Recognition Service of the Royal 
Ambassadors. Jess attained the 
highest possible rank ' in Royal' 
Ambassador work, the rank of 
'Ambassador Plenipotentiary. 

Royal Ambassador work was 
started in 1908 by Womens Mis-
sionary Union, Auxiliary to the 
Southern Baptist Convention. 
There are about 9,000 Royal Am-
bassadors Chapters in the South- 
ern Baptist Convention. There is 
a growing number of R. A.'s on 
the foreign fields. 

The Order of Royal Ambassa-
dors provides a ranking system 
with individual recognition. An R. 
A. may advance through Page, 
Squire, Knight, Ambassador, Am-
bassador Extrodinary, and Am-
bassador Plentipotentiary. 

The work which Jess has com-
pleted is of interest to every boy. 
A Royal Ambassador, to com-
plete the rank of a page, must 
know the Commission and decla-
ration of the Order, the 'Royal 
Ambassador Hymn, and Watch-
word, take part on program four 
times, tell two missionary stories 
and memorize six scriptures that 
show man's need of the gospel. 

To attain the rank of a squire, 
an R. A. must locate Baptist 
State Headquarters, name the 
secretaries and give the work of 
each, be able to memorize five 
scripture passages which give the 
message of Christ to a lost world, 
tell life stories of three mission-
ary, memorize the hymn "Jesus 
Shall Reign" and attend 75 per 
cent of the meetings since becom-
ing a Page. 

To attain the rank of a Knight, 
an R. A. must know Southern 
Baptist Convention boards, secre-
taries and headquarters of each. 
Memorize seven scriptures telling 
of a Christian's rules of life, read 
a mission study book, name the 
missionaries of today and locate 
their fields and give nature of 
their work. Write or tell the 
life of one Baptist Missionary 
autobiography he has read and 
attend 75 per cent of the meet-
ings since becoming a Knight. 

An R. A. who attains the rank 
of Ambassador must memorize 
scriptures which point out an 
Ambassador's duties and select 
and tell three incidents in the 
life of Christ that show His mis-
sionary zeal; give a talk on Paul's 
missionary journeys; give an in-
telligent answer to the question 
"What does it mean to me to be 
a Christian?" Write the story of 
your favorite missionary; give an 
outline of Baptist beliefs; give 
types of work done on foreign 
fields; train a boy to become a 
Page and attend 75 per cent of 
the meetings since becoming a 
Knight. 

Newly Organized 
Civic Orchestra 
Pans Meeting 

The Dimmitt Civic Orchestra, 
now in the process of being or-
ganized, will have its first meet-
ing and rehearsal on Tuesday 
evening July 18th at 8:00 p. m. 
in the piano studio in the rear of 
the High School. Many persons 
have been contacted and have 
promised to attend, and it is es-1 
timated that a possible twenty to 
twenty-five may be present. This 
is enough to make a good begin-
ning, and it is hoped that as re-
hearsals continue, more persons 
will be induced to attend. A list 
of those present will be printed 
in your next News. We should 
like to make this organization a 
huge success, and with t veryone's 
assistance it can be done. So, we 
ask you to help us publicize our 
meetings, help us to draw new 
members into the group, and if 
you have any ability whatsoever, 
won't you please come and join 
us? 

At present we have abaft ten 
or twelve string players and we 
can use as many more. No mat-
ter how little you may be able to 
contribute it will be greatly ap-
preciated. There will be problems 
of course, but that is the reason 
for this first meeting, and no 
problem is devoid of solution. 

At this time we are going to 
issue a call for some of the other 
instruments so necessary to an 
orchestra. We need a lot of Clari-
nets, and instruments such as 
French Horn, Trumpet or Cornet, 
Saxaphone, Flute, Oboe, Drums, 
etc. We are soliciting the assist-
ance of everyone • who plays an 
instrument, so won't you please 
attend the first meeting. Don't 
say, "Let George do it". George 
probably doesn't play. 

Whether you are a student 
musician or an adult, we shall 
expect a large attendance Tues-
day evening and who knows, per-
haps you will really enjoy your 
self. 

—Roy Dewolfe 

Town Hall Officials 
Met Thursday Night 

Manabers of the Dimmitt_ ,Town 
Hall Board of Directors and 
Executive Board met Thursday 
night of last week in the County 
Court Room in the courthouse 
for the purpose of discussing 
plans for the further promotion 
of the membership drive of the 
organization. Joe Bailes, presi-
dent of the organization, presided 
and Miss Jo Wesson, treasurer, 
gave a report on the result of the 
finance drive up to that date. Ac-
cording to the treasurers report 
approximately $700.00 had been 
subscribed in \memberships. The 
minimum budget for the season's 
entertainment program will be 
approximately $1800. 

All officials of the organization 
were given the names of prospec-
tive members to contact by the 
president, and encouraged to con-
tinue• the program with renewed 
zeal in order that the minimum 
quota might be raised as soon as 
possible. Everyone is earnestly 
urged to subscribe to a member-
ship, in the organization that the 
series of educational and highly 
entertaining programs may be 
brought to Dimmitt. 

Four top flight entertainment 
programs have been contracted 
and are recommended to be the 
finest entertainment available. 

Memberships may be secured 
from Joe Bailes at Kirkpatrick 
Sales Company; Jo Wesson at the 
First State Bank; B. M. Nelson 
at the Castro County . News Of-
fice, or from any of the other of-
ficials of the organization. 

Charges for the seasons pro-
gram are: Dual memberships 
$10.00; Singles $6.00 and students 
$2.40. 	• 

In addition to the four local 
programs members of the Dim- 
mitt Town Hall are eligible to at- 
tend Town Hall programs in 
other towns having Town 'Hall 
organizations. Those nearest to 
Dimmitt are Tulia, Plainview and 
Amarillo. 

T. A. Singer, Dimmitt's ex-
ponent of soil fertilization and 
soil conservation practices, was 
awarded a fine new .hat Tuesday 
at the regular meeting of the 
Dimmitt Lions Club. Presenta-
tion of the hat was made by Mr. 
Barber Eubangs in behalf of the 
Castro County Soil Conservation 
District. Eubanks is a member of 
the County Committee and it was 
through that committee that, 
Singer was selected to be the re-
cipient of the special award. In 
making the presentation Eubanks 
pointed out that the County com-
mittee desired to pay special 
recognition to some business man 
of the county that had done out-
standing work in encouraging 
fertilization and soil conserva-
tion, and that Singer was the 
unanimous choice. 

Canvass of the Lions Club re-
vealed that interest in a trip 
through the farming areas of 
Colorado was sufficient to in-
struct the County Agent to noti-
fy the proper parties that a dele-
gation of farmers and business 
men from this area would make 
a tour through that state to 
study their diversified farming 
practices. All persons interested 
in making the trip are requested 
to contact Raymond King, Coun-
ty Agriculture Agent, or John 
McFarland, manager of the Cas-
tro County Chamber of Com-
merce. Tentative plans are for 
the group to leaVe Dimmitt about 
August 15. 

Revival Meeting 
Assembly of God 
Church 'Begins Sun. 

An old fashion revival meeting 
will begin Sunday at the Dimmitt 
Assembly of God Church accord-
ing to an announcement this 
week by the pastor, Rev. E. H. 
McMillan. The revival services 
will be conducted by Rev. Terry 
L. Smith of Eloy, Arizona. The 
meeting will be held just south 
of the courthouse at the site of 
the new home of the church. Ser-
vices will begin each evening at 
8:00 o'clock. 

E. A. McCollum and T. E. Har-
rison made a business trip to 
Amarillo Tuesday. 

Plains Memorial 
Hospital News 
Patients in hospital: 

Mr. R. L. English 
Mrs. A. D. Barden 
Mrs. G. B. Neill , 
Mr. Louie Bruening 
Mrs. Carlos Calvert 

Patients dismissed since last re- 
port: 

Mrs. Deroy Cates 
Mrs. J. F. Pierce 
Mrs. Clyde Truelock and baby 

boy 
Mrs. Merton Powell 

girl 
David Hays 
Doris Lee Singer 
Mrs. Esther Bomer 

and baby 

NEW ARRIVAL 
Mr. and Mrs. C. H. Lane of 

Borger are proud parents of a 
son, Cah;in Edward, born June 16 
Mr. Lane is the son of Mr. and.  
Mrs. Herman Lane of Dimrhitt. 

State Organizes 
YDC Branch For 
Child Delinquents 

Mr. Luke E. Robinson, field 
representative for the State 
Youth Development Council, of 
Lubbock, was here Wednesday to 
confer with County Judge Bob 
Estes and other officials on the 
juvenile problems of the com-
munity and to explain programs 
of the Y. D. C. The Y. D. C. is a 
a new state department created 
by the 51st Legislature. 

The purpose of the organiza-
tion, according to Mr. Robinson, 
is to develop the state's most im-
portant resource, its youth. A 
two world purpose is set up for 
the organization. It administers 
state juvenile training schools 
and it assists every community in 
the state in organizing a well 
rounded developmental program 
designed to prevent juvenile de-
linquency. The success of the 
state YDC depends upon the 
strength of the youth programs 
in each community in Texas. 

The local community is the key 
city in the state YDC program. 
The State Council recognizes the 
importance of recreation in the 
proper development of the child, 
and have provided a recreation 
consultant, Mr. Earl Meadows, 
former olympic pole vault 
champion who is available to 
every community in the state of 
Texas to assist them in organiz-, 
ing a sound recreational program. 

Mr. Robinson will be in Dim-
mitt at a convenient date in the 
near future, to speak to one or 
more local civic iorganizations, 
giving details of the state youth 
program, and how it can help 
Castro County with respect to 
juvenile delinquent problems. 

Miss Pat Carpenter of Weslaco 
is here for a visit with her sis-
ters, Mrs. Jimmie George and 
Mrs. James Autry and families. 

Small Farms In Castro 
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Hrs. W. R. Si on 
Died Thursday 
In Levelland 

T. A. Singer Gets 
Hat F146 Soil 
Conservation Dis, 

Mrs. W. R. Simon of Level-
land died at 8 o'clock, today, 
Thursday morning. 

Funeral services will be Fri-
day afternoon at 2 o'clock in the 
First Baptist Chuech in Level-
land. . 

She was the wife of W. R. 
Simon, former Manager of Will-
son and Son Lumber  Company 
here. 

While in Dimmi: Mrs. Simon 
was connected WI 	the Castro 
County H 611 c  Demonstration 
Agency. Her "tol•til'.. !!ante as the 
result of an einess lasting 
several months. 	• 

In her immedia e family Mrs. 
Simon is survived' 4 her mother, 
Mrs. Hart, her husband, one son, 
Charles Ray, and '.wo daughters,. 
Mrs. Ralph Mathi: of Levelland 
and Mrs. W. A. Stringerfellow of 
Lubbock. She was also survived 
by two sisters •and one brother. 

Mr. and Mrs. Simon and family 
moved to Levelland from Dim-' 
mitt in August of 1947 where he 
had an interest in o Simon-Gar-
rett Lumber Comp,:!ny. 

Interment will U made in a 
Lubbock Cemetery Funeral Services 

Held Monday For 
Mrs. Ann Holland Dimmitt Lost To 

Lazbuddy Last 
Sunday Evening 

The Dimmitt Red Raiders 
bowed to Lazbuddy last Sunday to 
the tune of 11-3. The 6-inning 
game, called because of rain, was 
played in Lazbuddy before a large 
crowd. 

The Dimmitt clt 13 will play 
Bovina Sunday at the local field. 

Funeral services for Mrs. Sallie 
Ann Holland, 80 years old, were 
conducted at the Church of 
Christ in Dimmitt Monday after-
noon at 4 o'clock with Bob Wear, 
minister of Hereford Church of 
Christ officiating. 

Interment was in Dimmitt 
Cemetery, under the direction of 
Gilliland Funeral Home of Here-
ford. 

Mrs. Holland died Sunday 
afternoon at the home of a 
daughter, Mrs. A. L. Glenn, Dim-
mitt. She was born in Kentucky 
on Feb. 18, 1870. 

Surviving are her husband, B. 
F. Holland, Dimmitt; two sons, B. 
B. Holland, address unknown, and 
L. F. Holland, Golden; three 
daughters, Mrs. R. E. Paschall, 
Austin, Mrs. A. V. Dennis, 
Compton, Cal., and Airs. Glenn; 
16 grandchildren and 10 great-
grandchildren. 

Sunday School Class 
Has Party Tuesday 

A Party for the Wesleyan Sun-
day School Clas  
Church was he 
Mr. and Mrs. 

f the Methodist 
h; the home of 
, -,,i'.',..,,id 'Wilson 

Tuesday night. Games were di-
rected by Mrs. John Blaine. 

During the busine 	meeting. 
the.  following officers vere elect-
ed: President, Thoma Harrison; 
Vice President, Mrs. V •gil Lamb; 
Sec-Treasurer, Mrs. BillGraham, 
Jr.; Worship Chairman, Wyonona 
Herring; Community Service 
Chairman, Mrs. Jimmy George; 
World Friendship Chairman, Mrs. 
Johnny Gibson; Recreation Chair-
man, Mrs. Thomas Harrison. 

Refreshment of freezer ice 
cream and cake were served to: 
Johneen Bice, Wanda Gollehon, 
Wynona and Virgil Herring, Anne 
Sheffy, Joe Harrison, Maxine 
Smith, Joanne Thompson, Mr. 
and Mrs. Thomas Harrison, Mr. 
and Mrs. Virgel Lamb. 

Thelma Graham, Jr., Mrs. John 
Blaine, Bro. and Mrs. Lee Stan-
ford, the teacher, Mrs. 0. K. 
Howe and the hosts, Mr. and 
Mrs. Raymond Wilson. 

Ample housing facilities at the 
Fair Grounds are available for 
use of the Old Settlers Associa-
tion, and with proper planning 
this should be one of the most 
successful reunions or homecom-
ings in the history of West Texas. 
Plans are for the program for 
the day are being made and any-
one who has a good idea that 
would lend to the success of th. . 
affair should contact some offic-
ial of the Chamber of C9mmerce. 
Talk of a free barbecue is going 
the rounds, the possibility of 
having an outstanding speaker is 
being considered, and naturally 
prizes for the person, or persons, 
coming the longest distance,-  the 
oldest person in attendance, the 
best 'set of whiskers and the 
ugliest (or something to that ef-
fect) whiskers, will probably be 
offered. 
' The coming celebration on 
August 12 has been referred to as 
Dimmitt Birthday Celebration. A 
number of people have pointed 
out that designating the celebra-
tion in that manner is in error as 
the affair is a county wide deal 
commerating the anniversary of 
the organizing of the county. It is 
proposed to make the celebration 
an annual affair in which all 
present and former residents of 
the county are invited to partici-
pate, with invitations being ex-
tended to the old timers of our 
neighboring counties. Naturally 
all residents of the county are go-
irig to be, called on and expected 
to help make the annual cele-
bration a success. We would sug-
gest the idea of calling the af-
fair Castro County Homecoming 
or something similar. If you have 
an idea along this line let us 
have is and it will be mentioned 
in this column which to date has 
a total of three readers occasion-
ally. 

Accident Victim 
improving .After 
Narrow Escape 

Robert Ballard, 17 year old son 
of Mr. and.  Mrs. C. G. Ballard, is 
reported as definitely improving 
at the Northwest Texas Hospital 
in Amarillo where he has been re-
ceiving treatment for the past 
two weeks for an injury sustain-
ed in a donkey baseball game at 
the 	Dimmitt Rodeo • grounds. 
-Young Ballard, who graduated 
from Dimmitt High School this 
year, received a broken collar 
bone when he was thrown from 
the donkey he was riding in the 
game. First report was that the 
broken collar bone pier6ed an 
artery. According to' a repOrt by 
his father however, that report 
was in error as later medical 
examination revealed. Shock from 
the fall was •believed to have 
caused a blood clot in the artery, 
which required surgery to cor-
rect. Extent of permanent injury 
from the unfortunate occurance 
has not, or cannot, be determined 
at this time. Doctors at North-
west Texas Hospital have told 
Robert that he will be allowed to 
return home the first of next 
week. 

Supt. R. S. Vestal 
Returns Following 
Surgery In Dallas 

Supt. R. S. Vestal has returned 
home from Dallas where he 
underwent surgery Thursday of 
last week. The first operation 
was, performed in Dallas about 
3 .weeks ago for the removal of a 
deep-seated growth in his throat. 
The second operation was for the 
removal of other glands that 
might have possibly been af-
fected. Doctors declared the oper-
ations were succesful and that 
Supt. Vestal should not suffer 
any ill effects from the painful 
experience. 

116ys [Im.Oement • 
Moving Into 
Hew Building 

General rains over Castro 
County during recent weeks have 
resulted in from four to eight 
or nine inches of moisture. The 
News doesn't have a Weather 
Bureau and can't always give a 
comprehensive report during a 
wet season, as it is all but im-
possible to get reports from all 
sections of the county. Many 
times the reports are confusing—
two inches of rain west of town, 
one inch in town, .50 east of 
town, while Hart is still harvest-
ing wheat in sunny balmy weath-
er. Speaking of Hart, the lakes 
all have lots of water in that 
area, and row crops are looking 
good in that section as well as 
in the rest of the county. 

4-H Club Boys 
Hold Play-Day 

A play day for all 4-H club 
boys of Castro Cotinty will be 
held at the Dimmitt High School 
Thursday, July 20th. Registration 
will start at 9:30 and last until 
10:00. Recreation will include 
swimming, games, and a picture 
show showing the development of 
livestock feeding during the past 
50 years. 

Each club member is to gring 
a picnic lunch and this will be 
spread during the noon hour. 

Parents of 4-H Club members 
are urged to at`..arfd the Play-
Day. 

Laying of the tile floor in the 
showroom and office department 
of the new Hays Implement Com-
pany building was completed 
Tuesday. With the laying of the 
tile flooring the building con-
tractors completed their work 
and turned the building over to 
the company for occupancy. 
Work of moving the parts depart-
ment, stock, furniture and fix-
tures into the new building is 
now underway, and according to 
the management it is hoped that 
the moving operations can be 
completed this week. The shop 
equipment was moved into the 
new building about two weeks 
ago. Many of the latest types of 
shop equipment have already 
been purchased and installed by 
the company. All supplies and 
equipment in the old shop build-
ing were a complete loss in the 
fife which destroyed the former 
mechanical department of the 
firm. 

The managers, Charlie and Jim 
Hays, declared that every effort 
would be made by their firm to 
take care of the needs of the 
customers of the establishment 
during the time they are engaged 
in moving and arranging the 
large parts supply, and that they 
would make special effort to care 
for emergency -requests made on 
them before the moving project 
is completed. 

for the - development of strong 
bonds of comradery among the 
whiskered gentry of the com-
munity. 

J. 0. Ayers, the local photo-
grapher, has been making pic-
tures of the long whiskered boys 
of the community. These pictures 
will appear in subsequent issues 
of the News just to show what 
some of the men of the com-
munity will do to advertise a 
civic project. It is doubtful 
whether he will get all of the 
whiskered boys to pose, and prob-
ably ably miss some of them too. 

When I get off in another town 
with my brushy face I don't mind 
for people to look at me like I 
was a freak, but sort of hate for 
them to reach for their pocket-
book like they were going to do-
nate. 

After attaining the rank of 
Ambassador, an R. A. has to com-
plete 68 projects which he may 
choose from the designated 34 to 
become Ambassador Plenipoten-
tiary. 

Jess chose the following: trace 
the history of his own church; 
picked out falsehoolds in' tobacco 
ads; collected stamps from five 
different countries where South-
ern Baptists have mission work; 
wrote a biographical sketch of 
the missionary for whom the 
chapter is named; made a chart 
showing in color flags of 30 na-
tions, picked out 20 missionary 
verses in the Old Testiment, 
made a chart showing distribu-
tion through church treasure of 
gifts for a three months period; 
sketched lives of two men prom-
inent in the United States, who 
were born in other countries. 
Read three Mission Study books, 
wrote a poem which was accepted 
for publication in the R. A. 
magazine, "Ambassador Life." 
Secured five subscriptions to this 
magazine; corresponded with R. 
A. Chapters in' three countries, 
explained and demonstrated five 
games, each from a different 
country. Collect and displayed 
coins from four countries in 
which Southern Baptist have mis-
sion work; helped conduct a va-
catation Bible School for Neg-
roes, interviewed personally 3 
missionaries; gave a demonstra-
tion showing the value of R. A. 
work to the work of the local 
church. He also read one issue of 
the Commission and Home maga-
zines and reported articles of in-
terest to his chapter. 

Each year District Nine, which 
is composed of 176 churches, 
sends an R. A. to the Young 
Mens' Mission Conference at 
Ridgecrest, North Carolina. Jess 
was the unanimous choice this 
year to represent District Nine. 
He plans to leave for Ridgecrest 
with other Texas R. A.'s on Aug-
ust 1 in order to attend the con-
ference August 3 to 12. 

Charlie Hays, Jr., is due for a 
nervous breakdown. Not long ago 
it was the twins. Now it is the 
problem of operating a business 
while moving into a new build-
ing. We can sympathize with him 
on the moving problem, but we 
have fallen a little short of being 
the father of twins. 

Fellowship Class 
Has Party Monday 

The Fellowship Class of the 
Dimmitt Methodist Church en-
joyed a picnic supper Monday 
evening at the D. Neumayer 
farm north of town. About fifty 
members of the class were pres-
ent for the bounteous feast and 
to enjoy the games directed by 
Mrs. John Blaine. 

Construction Underway On 
Assembly of God Church 

Construction .was started this 
week on the new Assembly of 
God Church building one block 
south from the southeast corner 
of the courthouse skuare. The 
building, a frame and stucco 
structure, will 35x50 feet, and 
will include classrooms and sanct-
uary. Rev. E. H.McMillan, pas-
tor, is in charge of the construc-
tion project. 

Film On Livestock 
Feeding To Be Shown 

A film' showing the progress 
made in livestock feeding during 
the past 50 years will be shown 
at the High School Auditorium 
in Dimmitt Thursday night, July 
20th at 8:30 p. m. 

The film will be shown by Dr. 
J. B. Johnson livestock specialist 
and Dr. Johnson will also discuss 
feeding problems with those at-
tending the meetings. 

All farmers, especially dairy-
men and swinemen, 4-H and F. F. 
A. boys and veterans are invited 
and urged to attend the showing 
of this film. 

The film will be shown free to 
the public. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ernest Skipworth 
and sons, Robert and David of El 
Paso are here for a visit in the 
home of his parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
J. W. Skipworth. 

The City of Dimmitt still has 
funds to cooperate in several 
blocks of paving. There are a 
number of blocks in Dimmitt that 
still need to be paved, and would 
be of great benefit to the resi-
dents. Preparation for any imme-
diate paving project should be 
made now in order that the 
streets adjacent to the new school 
building site might also be paved. 
If you are interested in the pav-
ing of any particular street see 
a member of the City Commission 
now and make necessary ar-
rangements to get the project 
started. 

Mrs. 0. K. Howe and,  Mrs. Ray 
Bearden are enrolled in 'summer 
school at West Texas State. They 
are taking a course in Elemen-
tary Education. 

Whiskers may result in a num-
ber of divorce cases and other 
martial disturbances in Dimmitt 
before the present advertising 
campaign comes to an end, but on 
the other hand prospects are good 

Ray Baylets Buys 
Interest In James 
Shoe Repair Shop 

Mr. Ray Baylets recently pur-
chased an interest in the James 
Shoe Repair Shop in Dimmitt. 
Mr. Baylet and family moved to 
Dimmitt from Avondale, Arizona 
in November and since that time 
he has been employed by the 
local shoe repair establishment. 
Mrs. Baylets is the daughter of 
Mrs. Mary- Wood. 



4111.11INIMINIMIN 

Scut. Tao foot to she Ioth. 
Sports Afield 

Some fanciers of the Weimar-
aner insist that it is nothing 
less than a miracle dog, able to 
do everything done by other 
breeds—only much better. On 
the other hand, critics of the 
Weimaraner say that even the 
best examples of the breed are 
no more than. ordinary perform-
ers in the field. 

If anyone is in a position to 
explain the general confusion 
concerning the true merits of the 
Weimaraner, Clarence Schukei of 
Waterloo, Iowa, is the man. He 
has imported, bred and hunted 
over the "gray ghosts." Here is 
what he N‘Tites about them: 

"What has created all of this 
confusion is that the Weimar-
aner has been terrifically over-
sold in this country. It always 
has been a grand hunting dog. 
But it has had too many fanci-
ful build-ups. Buyers have ex-
pected impossible miracles, then 
been dissapointed. 

"There is another serious sit-
uation. The Weimaraner's af-
fectionate nature and . beautiful 
appearance have attracted many 
people who have no intention at 
all of hunting the dog. They sim-
ply want one for a pet. As a re-
sult, this fine hunting dog has 
been degenerating into a mere 
bench-show exhibit. Sportsmen 
must now make every effort to 
keep the Weimaraner where it 
belongs—hunting in the field. 

"We Weimaraner fanciers have 
no quarrel with other breeds. 
Our dogs will simply do what the 
other breeds do when properly 
trained—but more of it. When 
you take a dog that will locate 
and point upland game birds and 
retrieve them; sit in a duck 
blind and retrieve migratory 
birds from water—then you have 
a combination that many dogs 
cannot equal. 

"The Weimaraner is an all-
around hunting dog—something 
that can't be said about other 
breeds. It will trail, point, re-
trieve, and has speeds that equals 
the average English pointers." 

So we see that the Weimar-
aner is neither a miracle nor a 
fraud—but a fine dog in the 
field when trained. And in. the 
field is where they rightfully be-
long—not as a part of a living 
room decor. 

Judge.  W. N. Stokes 
Asks for Re-election 

about the size of the State of 
Ohio. 
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Drs. Hyden & Bray 

OPTOMETRISTS 

802-3-4 Barfield Bldg. 

Amarillo, Texas 	Phone 7723 
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In another column of this issue 
appears the announcement of 
Judge W. N. Stokes for re-elect-
ion as Associate Justice of the 
Court of Civil Appeals of this 
supreme judicial district. The 
court is located at Amarillo. 
Judge Stokes is well known in 
this section of the state. He en-
joyed a successful law practice at 
Vernon for a number of years. He 
was appointed by the Governor as 
District Judge of the Forty-
sixth Judicial District, composed 
of Wilbarger, Hardeman and 
Foard counties, and served in 
that capacity for eight years 
when he was appointed by the 
Governor to his present position 
on the Court of Civil Appeals. 
He has been a member of that 
court during the last thirteen 
years, having been twice elected 
since his appointment by the 
Governor. In addition to his ser-
vice as judge on the courts, he 
was appointed by the Governor 
in 1940 as a member of the Texas 
Civil Judicial Council and has 
served in that capacity for ten 
years in addition to his duties as 
a member of the appeals court. 
The duties of the Council are to 
make constant 'study of the laws 
and court system of the state 
and submit recommendations an-
nually to the Governor, the Leg- 
islature and the Supreme Court 
as to such c.hanges in the laws as, 
ill its judgment, should be made. 

The Court of Civil Appeals is 
composed of Chief Justice, E. L. 
Pitts, Associate Justice, James G. 
Lumpkin and Judge Stokes. It 
has appellate jurisdiction in civil 
cases arising in forty-six North-
west Texas counties, an area 
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Also SCORES with everyone 
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If you want to make a hit with 
your telephone party line neigh-
bors, just do this: 

1. Use the llne sharingly. 

2. Space your calls reasonably. 

3. Be mre to hang up the receiver 
carefully after calling. 

This cooperation is team play 
that will help bring better 
telephone service to everyone. 

,21  1 
2 a 2  II II II 

,  3 M I3 

	451 

 

6  

GRANT 

9 9 • 9 • 
6 4- 8 

7 
CV. 

, 	
3 

1./ 11 
1 1 11 	 

I. 
11 11 

a Ii 

le 	 
3 4  

6 

• 
3 a • 

	:1 • 7 7 

CLEVELAND 
la  12 13 

:a; 	 

L7 
2 

Il If 3 

_A 
_±11 a • 

6  
8 

4 
6 	 6 

• 
8 a 1  

7 

West Texas 
Telephone Co. 
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RICHMOND HALES 

LIVF:TOCK AkTr7dNEZ:i 

FARM SALES 

Rt. 4, Box 480, Amarillo 

or Phone 499W, Canyon 

BUSINESS GUI r CITY OF 
DIMMITT 

George Washington was born in 
Virginia, at that time a British 
Colony. 

• 

MirgkZer7,0 	gor„...•05r?I•ml 
POLITICAL 
Announcements 

The News is authorized to an-
nounce the candidacy of the fol-
lowing persons for the offices in- 
dicated, subject to the action of 
the Democratic Primaries: 

For Congressman, 18th District: 
LEROY (Pete) LaMASTER 

Perryton 
For District Judge-64th Judicial 
District: 

ROBT. (BOB) KIRK 
E. A. BIILS 

5fp 
	PIW 

Pat Patterson Kimbell Elevators Co. 

COMPLaEf  STOCK OF 

DAIRY & POULTRY 

SHAMROCK 

GASOLINE 
Licenised Electrician DR. MILTON C. ADAMS 

See us for 
AIR CONDITIONERS — LIGHT FIXTURES 

WIRING MATERIALS 
GENERAL REPAIR SERVICE 

Free Estimates on all Types of Electrical 
Jobs—Industrial or Domestic 

at Willson & Son Lumber Co. 

Phone 74 

OPTOMETRIST 

OFFICE HOURS-8:30 to 5:00 p. m. 

Hereford, Texas 

140 West Third Street 

FEEDS 
Dimmitt Consumers, Inc. 

Phone 126 	Dimmitt, Tex. Phone 70 
For District Attorney: 

JOE SHARP (Re-election) 
For County Judge: 

ROBERT ESTES (Re-election) 
For Sheriff: 

1\1 H. (HOUF TON) FOWLKES 
E. D. (Peck) WYER 

For District and County Clerk: 
MRS. OLA MURPHY (Re-elec- 

tion) 
For County Treasurer: 

FAYE E. HOLLAND 
(Reelection) 

Res. 299 Phone 37 MIS 

1 Commercial and Industrial 

Wiring 

Y 0 U 

Actually Pay Less 
F R 

MORE 
A T 

Froehner's Variety 
Store 

5c to $1.00 and up 

DIMMITT LAUNDRY WHITES 

Super Deluxe Tires 

Champion AC SPark 

Plugs — — — —Frams 

UNKLE HANK SEZ KEEP CLEAN— 

Neal Cooper Electric 

Company 
LIVE LONGER 

SOME. OF THE Mos-r 
BEAU11FUL WOMEN 
ARE HOMELY 1-0 LOOK 

Phone 202 
1 block east of Courthouse 

on Highway 86 

Dimmitt, Texas 

Phone 134 	Box 229 For Commissioner, Pre. 1: 
E. I. McLAIN (Re-election) 

For Commissioner, Precinct 2: 
OTIS ENGLISH (Re-election) 

For Commissioner, Pre. 3: 
ROY BELL (Re-election) 

J. G. (Jay) DAVIS, JR. 
For Commissioner, Precinct 4: 

JOE G. BICHSEL 
JOHN STORK (Re-election) 

For County Attorney: 
NORMAN C. STAFFORD 

Whites Auto Store 

Join the Farm Bureau 
Serving Your County 

and 

Working for 
Agriculture 

Take advantage of the 
Service Programs 

Being Offered. 
See your community Direc-
tor or E. L. Ivey, Sec.-Treas. 

COMPLETE AUTOMOTIVE 

REPAIR SERVICE 

Northside Garage 
on Highway 51 North 

Operated by— 

Slim Hargrove 

Ayers Studio DR. R. P. TANDY 

CHIROPRACTOR 

Rawlings Bldg. 	Dimmitt 

Dimmiti, Texas 	Phone Y55 

2 mi. west on Hospital road For Representative 120th District 
HAROLD M. LaFONT 
H. J. BLANCHARD, Sudan 	.14.1•••/.1 

The beauty about KIRKPATRICK'S is that 

not only do we offer auto repair service, 

but we have the beautiful, modern Pontiac 

cars our customers have been wanting, in 

all colors and body styles. See us for the 

automotive achievement that cannot be ex-

celled. 

11— 

FRIGIDAIRE 
SALES and SERVICE 

Complete line of domestic 
and, commercial Refrigera- 
tion Service. 
For ;mediate service Ph. 131 

Good Used Refrigerators 
Electric and Gas 

Dimmitt Motor Co. 

OUR SERVICE IS PROMPT 

OUR PRICES ARE RIGHT 

Consult Us Before You Build 

K & K Construction 
Company 

Woodrow & Claude 

Killingsworth 

Job Phone 155 	Res. 40 

Dimmitt, Texas 

We Have Purchased 300 
Old Model New Radiators 

Closing out as low as 
$15.00 Exchange 

STOVALL-BOOHER 
Radiator Sales & Service 

Auto Salvage & 
Sales Co. 

FOR SALE—All steel stock 

rack for pickup. 100F 
LODGE 159 

Meets each 
Tuesday Night 

7:30 o'clock 

Good tires & tubes. A good 
line of used parts. Let Me 
buy your batteries. 

Dr. James L. Cross 

VETERINARIAN 
111111•1113 1131INIMINK 	 

Office at Musick Produce 

Phone 99 

Night Phone 79-J 

TULIA, 	 TEXAS 

CHARLES CHESTER 
SHOES 

The Style Leadership Line 
Is America's GREATEST.. 

SHOE VALUE From Factory 
To You. 

SEE ME FOR PRICES AND 
OTHER DETAILS OF THIS 
FINE TINE OF SHOES. 

P. C. (Pug) Daniels 

Am still in the— For The— 

BEST COFFEE 

visit the 

Bob Cat Inn 
first door east Rio Theatre 

Mom and Pop Jowell 

WE SERVE ONLY THE— 
FINEST FOOD 

t• 
CABINET BUSINESS 
And here to stay. So if it is 
made of wood we can make 
it. 	Also have one of 
the best Sink Rims on the 
market. 

WATCH & JEWELRY 

REPAIR SERVICE 

Watches, Bands and other 
Gift Items in stock 

McCormack Jewelry 
Mrs Ocie McCormack 

SALES 	 WHOLE SALE 

BUTANE- PROPANE APPLIANCES 6 EQUIPMENT ( 

SERVICE 	 PHONE 66 	 RETAIL 

I

COMPLETE 

Radiator Service 

Castro Motor Co. 

— Come To See Me — 

T. L. WELCH 

— 

I  
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corsage of red roses. 
Others attending the wedding 

party were: Mrs. Kenneth Jack-
son, Patsy Rae Hardy, Howard 
Cook, all of Dimmitt, LaRae 
Gilkerson and 	B. Garvin of 
Silverton. 

The bride is a graduate of 
Dimmitt High School with the 
class of 1950. The groom also at-
tended school at Dimmitt and 
served in the U. S. Army. He is 
a brother of Mrs. Hazel Merritt 
who is a faculty member of the 
history department of Dimmitt 
High School. 

After a short trip to Colorado 
Springs, the couple will be at 
home in Dimmitt where Mr. 
Merritt is engaged in farming. 

CLEO NEWS Brock,Merritt 
Vows Exchanged 

wonder just how deep we are 
getting in this time. It is some-
thing we will have to accept with 
as much love in our hearts as 
possible, since there seems to be 
nothing else we can do. 

Crops in our community are 
really looking pretty since all 
these nice rains and farmers are 
•working early and late to try to 
keep ahead of the weeds. 

Mr. and Mrs. Lilburn Arnold 
and girls and Mr. and Mrs. Bub 
Drennan and daughter of Hart 
went to the outdoor theatre in 
Hereford Saturday night. The 
Arnolds were Sunday dinner 
guests of the Drennans. 

Earl Greathouse and Bill 
Stevenson were Sunday guests of 
Albert Sinclair at Bethel. 

Mrs. Fannie Shive and Onita 
and Mrs. J. D. Burch of Dimmitt makes us 

rillo to visit an uncle. Mrs. 
Hesly returned home with Mrs. 
Dodd for several days visit. 

Sunday afternoon guests of Mr. 
and Mrs. Lester  Dowell and 
family were, Mr. and Mrs. Louis 
Dowell of Clovis, N. M., Mrs. 
R. E: Pittard and Mrs. George 
Lusk of Coleman, Mrs. Dick 
Greathouse and Elouise. 

Mrs. Elvis Burch is spending 
the week at the Baptist Camp 
near Floydada. 

Mrs. A. A. Dodd and sister, 
Mrs. Sadie Hesly visited a cousin 
in Plainview Tuesday of last 
week. 

Guests in the Lilburn Arnold 
home Friday night was Lilburn's 
war buddy, Mr. and Mrs. WIley 
Baker and two small daughters 
of Muleshoe. 

Speaking of War 

Arthur Campbell of Crosbyton, 
and Mr. and Mrs. Donald Wins-
dor of Wichita Falls. 

Mr. and Mrs. Bob Hembree and 
children of Hale Center visited 
his parents, Mr. and Mrs. Bill 
Hembree Sunday. 

Mr. and Mrs. G. B. Duncan 
went to Hereford Sunday to meet 
their grandaughter, Ann Cum-
mins, who has been visiting at 
Hobbs, N. M. 

Mrs. Summers and children of 
Lockney were here Friday visit-
ing her grandaughter, Debra, in 
the home of Mr. and Mrs. Ross 
Summers. 

Mr. and Mrs. E. C. Waren, 
Margaret and Laura of Kermit 
and Mrs. Sadie Hesly were week 
end guests of their sister, Mrs. 
A. A. Dodd and Mr. Dodd on 
Sunday. They all went to Ama. 

them. They all went to Plain-
view Tuesday to visit Charles 
Houtchens, who is working at 
Wood Funeral Home. Mrs. Stal-
lings returned to Canyon Wednes-
day. 

Mr. and Mrs. Odell Arnold and 
Donnie visited Mr. and Mrs. Li1-. 
burn Arnold and girls Tuesday 
night. 

Elouise Greathouse spent Sun-
day night with Velma Walthall. 

Mr. and Mrs. Raymon Preston 
and children were Wednesday 
evening guests of Mr. and Mrs. 
Melvin Summers. 

Mr. and Mrs. Euless Waggoner 
and family left Wednesday on a 
vacation trip to New Mexico. 

Guests of Mr. and Mrs. Ross 
Summers last Friday were Mr. 
and Mrs. Elmer Summers and 
two daughters, and Mr. and Mrs. 

Mrs. Sadie Heslys of 'Baird is 
visiting her twin sister, Mrs. A. 
A. Dodd. 

Mrs. W. C. Copeland, Mrs. 
Fowlkes, Grandma Nash and 
Mrs. Wilmer Cook visited in the 
Ezell Sadler home of Sunnyside 
Sunday afternoon. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ray Smith 
visited in the home of her daught-.  
er, Mr. and Mrs. Leland Aiton 
of Plainview Sunday. 

Mrs. J. T. Greathouse is hodie 
again after spending the winter,  
at Brady, Texas. 

Mr. and Mrs. H. H. Houtchens 
visited her mother, Mrs. Fannie 
Stallings of Canyon Monday. Mrs. 
.Stallings returned home with 

Mona Brock, daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Earl Brock of Dimmitt 
became the bride of Glen Merritt 
in an impressive single ring cere-
mony in the parsonage with Rev. 
Storm officiating, Pastor of First 
Baptist Church, .Clovis, New 
Mexico, July 7 at 9:15 p. m. 
o'clock. 

Mona Simmons of Dimmitt 
served as maid-of-honor, and 
Kenneth Jackson also of Dimmitt 
was best man. 

The bride was, attired in a 
wine suit 'with beige accesories 
and a gardenia corsage. 

The maid-of-honor wore a grey 
suit with red compliments and a 

IT'S A PLEASURE TO SHOP IN DIMMITT 

visited Mrs. J. T. Greathouse last 
Thursday. Wilson Latimer 

Motors 
PLACE NUMBER CoN2 M System 

Grocery 
Northside 

Service Station 
Hays 

Implement 
Co. 

Super Market 
S. T. CURTIS VENETIAN BLINDS 

FLEXALUM and WOOD—All Colors 

CUSTOM MADE 	— 	INSTALLED 

— Ask For Free Estimate — 

GEORGE BLANTON 
LOCAL DISTRIBUTOR 	 Phone 

Staple & Fancy 
Dodge & Plymouth 

Allis Chalmers 

Sales & Service 

Phone 150 

A Modern Store 

Conoco 

Gas & Oils 

Dunlop 

Tires & Tubes 

6110:2tri.es International-Harvester 

Farm Machinery In A Modern Town Friendly Service 

	1•111Mie 	 

Dimmitt Motor Co, 224 Magnolia Dimmitt 
Food Bank 

City Drug Kirkpatrick 
Sales Co. Service Station Chevrolet 

—0— 

Frigidaire 

—0— 

Goodrich Tires 

Magnolia 

Gas & Oils 

A Complete 

Drug Service 

Sundries Gifts 
Bargains 

Wholesale & Retail 

rn 
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A Castro County 

Institution 

For 20 Years 

Slaughtering 

and 

Curing 

Home Owned & Operated 

Used Tractors & Equipment on. 

1-1947 A-C Combine 

1-1939 Ford (Reconditioned) - 

1-1944 Massey-Harris 101 Jr. 

3-Row Lister, 2-Row Planter & Cultivator 

1-9 ft. One-way (Good) on rubber 

1-9 ft One-way (Good) on steel 

1 Jeoffroy 13 ft. (Good) 

THE ABOVE IS JUST A FEW OF THE MANY 

BARGAINS THAT WE HAVE ON HAND 

Sheffy Hardware Dimmitt 
Parts & Supply 

Castro County 
Grain Co. 

Higginbotham 

Bartlett Co. 
Wright's 
Furniture Your Best Means 

OF Economy Is 

Had By Buying 

Your Hardware 

And Appliances 

In Dimmitt 

• Wholesale 

Phone 307 

Automotive & Tractor 

Supplies 

Quality Furniture 

At 

Reasonable Prices 

Complete Elevator 

Service 

Purina Feeds 

Building 

Material For 

Every Purpose 

Ain't It The Truth y Chester Xi/Jock 
Dimmitt 

Elevator Co. 
0
0 

 o 
0  Castro Cleaners 

Phone 279 

HADLEY HAMMERHEAD Ye 
FINALLY RECEIVED HIS 	/ 
BUILD-IT-YOURSELF KITCHEN 
CABINET- DIRECT FROM 
THAT GIGANTIC MAIL 

ORDER HOUSE- 

O- 

WILL YOU NEED THIS, 
RADLEY ? IT WOULD 
MAKE A LOVELY 
BREADWARD- 

o
o 

0 
00 
0 
• 

Serving A Growing 

Area 

With a Friendly 

Elevator Service 

ILN 0 

HM-M-M, LET'S SEE'" IT 
SAYS °FOLLOW THESE SIMPLE 

INSTRUCTIONS 1. TAKE PANEL 'Ai 
AND LAY PARALLEL TO SECTION V. 
2. ASSEMBLE BOARD 'C.  PERPENDICULAR 

TO SIDE, 'D., IF SLOT A TOP FITS 
SLOT 'D'-. 

0 ( 
0 0 
o 

Prompt & Efficient 

Service on All of 

Your Tailoring Needs BEARDEN TRACTOR CO. m 

a 
73 
rn 

CA 

O 
0 

Your Ford Tractor Dealer 

Phone 75 Dimmitt 
GOSH, MYRT- THAT ISN'T WHAT 
IT LOOKED LIKE IN THE PICTURE-
IS IT < AND THEY F6200T TO 
SEND TN' HANDLES, SCREWS, N' 

HINGES Too- 

OH! I KNEW IT I KNEIN 
YOU SHOULD NEVER HAVE LOOKED 

IN THAT CATALOG JUST LOOK AT 
MY KITCHEN-. WHAT A MESS' 

HADLEY HAMMERHEAD, IM SURE 
YOU COULD HAVE BOUGHT ME A 
BETTER CABINET THAN THAT - 
AND WITHOUT ALL THIS FUSS 

RIGHT HERE IN 

, 

I 

, 
I 

WILL 

HOLM 

Arrive 
Leave 
3:05 

The 
Childress, 

Round 
8:15 
6:35; 
hours 

Chisholm 

Dimmitt 
p. m.; 

short 

trip 
spend 
or to 

Th6 

SERVE 

TRAIL 

in Dimmitt 

Vernon, 

in Lubbock, 

Ft. 

direct 

to 

CHANGE 

at 

BUS 

HOTEL 

Worth, 

AS 

at 

EFFECTIVE 

8:15 
6:35 

IN 

COACHES. 

BUS 

a. 
7:10 

ANNOUNCING 

SCHEDULE 
p. 
m., 
p. 

m. 

COFFEE 

m. 

STATION 

LOCATION 

JULY 

STATION 

from 
arrive 

Inc.. 

in 
Wichita 

6th 

SHOP 

IN 

Wichita 

6:35. 

OF 

FOR 

8:15 

and 

in Dimmitt 

DIMMITT 

Dimmitt 

Falls 

CHIS- 

Falls at  

Amarillo, 
Dallas. 

at 
at 

a. m.; 5 

Inc. 

route 	to 	Tulia, 	Lubbock, 
Wichita Falls, Fort Worth 

3 hours 
Lubbock, 

Lubbock or Amarillo, leave 
in Amarillo be back 

leave Dimmitt at 
return to Dimmitt at 

RAY 

Trails 
GRIMES, 

Coaches, 
Mgr. 

Dimmitt First 

State 

Bank 

"Where Friends Meet—

And Prices Talk" 

Specials Everyday 

At The 

Cashway 

5.1.1CCATC EATuCt 

Willson & Son 
Lumber Co. 

Snipes Shop C. & S. 
Equipment Co. 

Earl's 
Hardware & Supply 

Dimmitt Wheat 
Growers, Inc. 

Ladies Ready-to-Wear 

Gent's Furnishings 

Dry Cleaning 

• Rendering A 

Repair & Shop 

Service Unexcelled 

Anywhere Phone 9 

Serving This 

Growing Area 

With a Complete 

Building Service 

John Deere 

Farm Equipment 

Household 

Appliances 

Growing With 

The 

Dimmitt Area 

me 	 	'.11.1111EIMONIMI 	-41.2=31.1=1...11 

Cooper Implement In Dimmitt It's 

Manning's M. & K. Cleaners 
Implement 

Comp ny Trimble 

Barber and 

Beauty Shop 

Phone 125 MM Farm 

Machinery 

"An Implement 

For Every Purpose" 

Your Complete 

Department Store Your Friendly 

CASE 

Dealer 

24 Hour Service 

Phone 94 

Dimmitt Drug Auto Salvage 
& Sales Co. 

Joe Cowen 
Agency 

Real Estate 

Loans 

Insurance 

Trade In Dimmit 

Harrison Ins. 
Agency 

West Texas 
Telephone Co. 

Registered Pharmacist 

Fresh Stock 

Of 

Drugs and 

Drug Sundries 

Used Automobile 
Parts of all Kinds 

Serving 

A Prosperous 

City and Rural 

Area 

Complete Insurance Used Automobiles 

Coverage Sell Us Your Wrecks 

•	  

IT'S A PLEASURE TO SHOP IN DIVIMITt 
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SMALL HOUSE FOR RENT 

207-B South 9th 

Marsallis Cooler 
	

Venetian Shades 

Nicest In Town 

FRANKLIN LATIMER 
Phone 150 or 84 

and Tuesday. Tuesday. 
Mrs. Carl Byrd of Santa Fe, 

N. M., and twin boys are spend-, 
ing several days in the home of 
her parents, Mr. and Mrs. Ira 
Brown. 

Mr. and Mrs. J. C. Williams 
were Sunday dinner guests of Mr. 
and Mrs. Merlin Kaul and family 
in the Westway Community. 

Callers in the Hary Rothwell 
home Sunday afternoon were Mr. 
and Mrs. Hermon Phillips of 
Happy, and Mr. and 'Mrs. P. 0. 
Goodwin and children of Dimmitt. 

We were very happy to have 
M. and Ms. B. J. Bannan of 
Dimmitt at Sunday School Sun-
day morning. 

We surely appreciate all the 
nice rains we are having. 

Mr. and Mrs. Harry Rothwell 
and Dale were calling in the Moss 
Howell home Sunday evening. 

Mr. and Mrs. Walter Cox and 
visiting relatives were visiting 
other relatives in Plainview late 
Sunday evening. 

Candidates Agree Not To Hand 
Out Cards At Polls 

The two candidates for the of-
fice of Judge of the 64th Judic-
ial District, E. A. Bills, and 
Robert (Bob) Kirk have agreed 
between themselves that neither 
will have workers handing out 
cards, or working for them, at 
any of the polls on election day. 
They have each reserved the 
right to personally hand out 
cards for themselves at such 
places as they see proper to do 
so on that day. They are thus 
doing their part to avoil some 
of the confusion usually attend-
ant at the polls on election day. 

Bridal Shower Honors 
Grace Louise Lust 

THE SCHAFER 
ONEWAY PLOW 

Plows Deeper As It Pulls Easier 

Check These Features-- , 
— Timken Roller Bearing throughout. Protected from dirt 

and dust with permanent seals. 

— 26" disc blades, high alloy steel. 

— 4" concavity discs. 

— Made in the following sizes: 4 ft., 6 ft., 8 ft., 12 ft., 14 ft., 
and 18 ft. 

— No rear or side levers. Raise disc out of ground with a 
screw system. A 10-year-old child can easily raise a 14 ft. 
plow. 

— All electric welded frame. Made from drill stem . . 
strongest pipe for weight there is. 

— Can be converted to hydralic or electric lift in place of 
screw. 

— Easily set to plow all kinds of ground. 

— Easy to set for any cut within plow range. 

— Lubricate disc and wheel bearings but once a season. 

— Plows any depth from 0" to 10". 

— Easily adjustable for road travel. 

• 

DIMMITT IMPLEMENT CO. 

A. J. Harris & Sons 

Lumbermen 

Hart, Texas 

• • 

SON 
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NOW YOU CAN 0 
A BIG NEW DODGE 

FOR MUCH LESS THAN YOU THINK! 
YES, 5 minutes behind the wheel of today's big Dodge is all 
it takes to prove you could pay $1,000 more and still not• 
get all Dodge gives you! 
New Dodge models are rolling off the production lines in 
record-breaking volume, and we can assure you early de-
livery on your favorite model. 
So why put off enjoying Dodge extra room and riding com-
fort, the flashing performance of the big "Get-Away” Engine, 
the smoothness of Fluid Drive! Your present car will probably 
more than cover the down payment . . . and terms are easy. 

Yes, you could pay $1,000 more and not get all Dodge 
room, ease of handling and famous dependability! 
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er, and the hostess, Mrs. Wraith-
all. 

Mrs. Alta Gladman is visiting 
her sister at Los Gatos, Calif. 

News Want Ads tiet Results 

Jessie Glass Circle Meets 

The Jessis Glass Circle of the 
First Baptist Church met Mon-. 
day after at 4 o'clock in the home 
of Mrs. E. T. Walthall for Bible 
Study with seven members pres-
ent. Mrs. Ramey presided over 
the business session, and com- 
munity missions were assigned. 
Mrs. C. A. Hance led in prayer. 

BETHEL NEWS 
The Bible lesson was taught by 
Grace Strother, Bible teacher. 
Mrs. Ramey dismissed with pray-
er. Refreshments were served to 
Mesdames: R. S. Vestal, Ina 
Hackleman, Edwin Ramey, C. A. 
Hance, R. B. Strother, Sam Coop- 

THE LAW AND YOU 
by Robt. (bob) Kirk 

County Attorney 

Lamb County,TexAs 

  

They Read 

and 

Were Healed 

Mrs. B. E. Sinclair and Ivan Earl 
and Mr. and Mrs. Billy Brook 
Sinclair and girls. 

Mrs. E. R. Rothweil of Dim-
mitt and Mike Bates of Plain-
view spent ThUrsday night in the 
Harry Rothwell home. 

Mr. and M-rs. Carrol Howell of 
Muleshoe spent Sunday with his 
brother and family, Mr. and Mrs. 
Moss Howell. 

Mr. Bill Dempsey of Collins 
Co. spent the week end with Mr. 
and Mrs. J. A. Bagwell. 

Mrs. Jennings and Mrs. Homer 
Terrell of Tulia were visiting in 
the Jim Givan home Wednesday 
morning. 

Mr. and Mrs. J. C. Williams 
visited her sister and family, Mr. 
and Mrs. E. C. Fullingim at 
Tucumcari, N. M., last Monday 

Carolyn Bagwell with a num-
ber of other girls from Dimmitt 
are spending a .week at Girl 
Scout Camp at Lubbock. 

Harry Rothwell visited his sis-
ter and family, Mr. and Mrs. 
Virgil Nowell, Jaqueta and Der-
rell, near Muleshoe Friday after-
noon. 

Mrs. A. W. Murry, Doris and 
Charles of Seymour spent the 
week end in the home of their 
daughter and sister and family, 
Mr. and iMrs. Walter Cox and 
Mary Ann, and sister Jeanette 
Murry who is spending the sum-
mer here. Sunday visitors were 
Mr. and Yrs. Emmitt Coleman 
and children of Happy, Mr. and 

While full provision ig made in 
Christian Science for specific 
treatment for the sick, many 
people have been healed simply 
through reading literature 
available at Christian Science 
Reading Rooms. 

The Bible, "Science and 
Health with Key to the Scrip-
tures" by Mary Baker Eddy—
containing the complete expla-
nation of Christian Science —
and other similarly helpful 
Christian Science literature 
may be read, borrowed, or pur-
chased at 

CHRISTIAN SCIENCE 
READING ROMI 

9th and Austin Street 
Plainview, Texas 

3:00 to 5:00 Tues. and Fri. 

DO YOU KNOW why you need 
a contract when dealing with an 
honest man than with a dis-
honest man? 

Two men who are honest need 
a contract to help them rememb-
er exactly what they agreed to 
do. In making an agreement both 
intend to do exactly as they 
agreed. Some months after the 
agreement, without a contract to 
refer to, one might remember an 
item one way, and the other 
might remember it differently. 
Each believing he is right will 
stand steadfastly' by his position, 
and will not change his views 
without a lawsuit. Whereas, if 
they had a contrW, they could 
refer to it, ;AIM—one seeing that 
he remembered the item incor-
rectly would admit it and would 
do as he agreed to do. 

A dishonest man, will do only 
what he is forced to do. Thus he 
will take his contract and study 
it, and see if he can find any 
loophole to keep from doing what 
he agreed to do, or some way to 
try to bind the other party to 
something not agreed upon. 

FOR FURTHER INFORMA-
TION ON THIS SUBJECT, SEE 
YOUR LOCAL ATTORNEY. 

 

I 
Irtefters Weisesse 

Information concerning fret 
public lectures, church navies*, 
and other Christian Science ac-
tivities also available. 
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M. W. LEMONS BURIAL 
ASSOCIATION 

Operated in Connection with 
M. W. LEMONS 
FUNERAL HOME 

Write For 
Complete Information 

Plainview, Texas 	Phone 6 
Wiminsimmommigrommin 

Mr. and Mrs. Wesley Fox and 
baby were here Sunday for a 
visit with Mrs. Etta Brashears. 

Mrs. Faye Holland and son, R. 
E., visited her sister, Mrs. Nora., 
mae Newsom at Albuquerque, N. 
M., this week. Mrs. Newsom's 
son and wife had arrived there 
from Guam where he had been 
the past year. He will now be 
stationed in Florida. 

Square, Flagg, and Bethel en-
joyed the occasion. 

News Want Ads Get Results 

PRESTON 

SMITH 
VETERAN LEGISLATOR FOR 

LT. GOVERNOR 
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He's The Man 

These Counties 

For LaMaster 	 Other 
Hansford 

	

2373 	
Hemphill 
Lipscomb 
Ochiltree 

Roberts 

That's how the counties voted 
dates. Your vote and influence 

(Political Adv. Paid by LaMaster 

- 

LeROY 

Tune in to 
night, July 
hear LeRoy 

' form 	and 
minute news 
gressional 
of your choice, 
you will want 
he has to 

For The 

Voted: 

3 candidates 

where they 
would be greatly 

for Congress 

KGNC 

outline 
bring 

of 
Race. 

to 
say. 

Job 

know all 

LaMASTER 

for  

21, 9:30-9:45, 

653 

appreciated. 

Friday 
to 

his plat- 
you 	last 
the 	Con-

Regardless 
he is sure 
hear what 

combined 

i 

4 candi- 

Club) 

Drs. Wood & Armistead 

OPTOMETRISTS 

406 LFD Drive 	Littlefield 

Phone 328 

A briday shower was given in 
honor of Grace Louise Lust at 
the Bethel Church Friday after-
noon. With Mrs. Jim Givan and 
Mary Elizabeth as hostesses with 
a number of Bethel ladies as-
sisting. The beautiful boquets of 
flowers were furnished by local 
and Dimmitt ladies. The color 
scheme of green and white was 
carried out thru the house. The 
fifty guests were served cake and 
punch upon arrival. After a very 
clever program, arranged by Mrs. 
Melton Richardson of Dimmitt, 
everyone viewed the many and 
useful gifts which were on dis-
play. Ladies from Hereford, Sum-
merfield, Tulia, Dimmitt, Big 

Insure-- 

EFFICIENT and ECONOMICAL 

FARM OPERATION WITH 
F-7;77(ARERAY  
v... 

LUBBOCK BUSINESS MAN 
AGE 38 

• BORN ON A WILLIAMSON 
COUNTY FARM, THE SEV-
ENTH CHILD IN A FAMILY 
OF 13. 

• FARMED IN CENTRAL AND 
WEST TEXAS. 

• WORKED HIS WAY 
, THROUGH HIGH SCHOOL 

AND COLLEGE. 
• MARRIED AND FATHER OF 

TWO CHILDREN. 
A SUCCESSFUL WEST TEXAS 

BUSINESS MAN 

BUTANE and PROPANE 

Prompt and Courteous Delivery Service 

LET US EQUIP YOUR TRACTORS AND 
COMMERCIAL ENGINES WITH 

ENSIGN CARBUREATORS 
They Cut Your Operation Costs To A Minimum 

We Invite You To Visit Our Store And Inspect 
Our Stock Of 

ROPER RANGES 
---A N D--- 

COLEMAN WATER HEATERS 
N•Aretreft"a""0104/1811•11dIA•Amill 

BLANTON BUTANE INC 
DIMMITT, TEXAS LATIMER MOTORS 

 

Our West Texas Burial Plan 
Pays Cash 

Gililland 

Funeral Home 

131 East 2nd. Street 
HEREFORD, TEXAS 

Matt Gililland 
Marlin Gililland 

 

   

Custom Spraying 
Gardens, Yards 

Livestoc, etc. 

 

   

Home Grown 
Cut Flowers 

 

   

SEMIS FLORIST 
PHONE 154 

 

PHONE 150 



STOCK CAR 
OUTPERFORMS 
131 OTHER CARS 
IN 2118-MILE 
PAN-AMERICAN 
ROAD-TEST! 

The "Rocket 88" proves it's really great! Oldsmobile's 
spectacular action star sweeps first place honors in one of 
the longest, most hazardous durability tests on record-
2,178 miles over the new Pan-American Highway! Here's 
undisputed evidence--utunistakable proof—of the peak 
performance and remarkable endurance built into the 
"Rocket" Oldsmobile. Try the thrilling "Rocket" ride 
yourself—make your date with a "Rocket 8" today! 

rixlc. als x< ts.,)%,soNts<0.c 44Atti,yPft' 

Hershel McGriff, Portland, Oregon, flashes a winning smilo 	cars entered, but only 53 finished the rugged run. And three 

after piloting his "88" to victoryi 132 American and foreign 	of the first ten and six of the first twenty were Otdsrnobiles1 

00 8 

1 Jacuzzi Jet Pump, Deep Well Type, Multi-Stage, 
Special Price 	 $238.50 

1 Red Jacket Deep Well Pump, Complete with Motor - Tank -

Pressure Gauge - Cut Off - Check Valve and Nippier. 
Sale Price 	 $198.00 

A. J. HARRIS and SONS, Lumbermen 
Hart, Texas 

SEE US ABOUT WOOD GRAIN PAPER 
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tion furnished good grazing dur-
ing the past winter ior 
calves for 94 days and for 88 
cows and 30 calves for 21 days. 

A 22-acre oat pasture at the 
Brazos River Field Labratory of 
the Texas Agricultural Experi-
ment Station near College Sta- 

committees. This group acts be-
tween sessions of legislature to 
collect material on questions 
most likely to appear at following 
:neetirvt,s. 

Smith will be released from his 
duties the . first of Jul__, and will 
return to the West Tcxas state 
faculty next fall. In his absence 
Dr. Roberts will act as college 
representative in the one-week 
courses being offered this sum-
mer. The courses are conducted 
by instructors from other loca-
tions all over the United States. 

During the past two years, 
Smith has been executive secre-
tary of the Texas Council on 
Teacher Education. This is a vol-
untary group and is not con-
nected in any was with the legis-
lature. However, many of the 
same questions will be discussed 
in the legislative group. Some of 
these are certification of teach-
ers, elementary education, and 
special services f o r schools 
throughout the state. 

An ex-student of West Texas 
Texas State, Smith returned to 
WT in his teaching capacity last 

"If We Can't Fix It; Throw It Away" 

fall. He received his Bachelor of 
Science degree from WT and his 
Masters of Arts degree from Tex- 
as Technological 	College, Lub- 
bock. Originally from Groom, he 
spent the year preceding his year 
of teaching at WT in Austin 
working on his doctorate at the 
University of Texas. While there 
he served his first term as sec-
retar to the Texas Council of 
Teacher Education. 

Smith was public school prin-
cipal and superintendent at White 
Deer for many years. 

to srortsmen without 
the permission of the owner. 

For the benefit of persons liv-
ing on the Gulf Coast and for 
those planning to visit that area, 
no license is required for sports 
fishing in salt water. Commerc-
ial fishermen have to be licensed, 
as usual, for operating in salt 
water. 

Higher Education To Be 
Studied in Texas 

Canyon, Tex., June 30 (WTNS) 
Emmett D. Smith, associate pro-
fessor of education, has been ap-
pointed head of a sub-committee 
to study teacher education in 
Texas. This committee is part of 
a larger one headed by John 
Mosley, a Texan who has been in 
Washington, D. C. for the past 
several years. Created by the re-
cent Texas legislature, the com-
mittee is set up to study the 
status of higher education in Tex-
as. 

Only a group to act as a fact 
finding board, it was not created 
to propose any legislation of any 
sort. Rather, it was formed to 
assimulate data to present the 
legislature, should the question of 
higher education come up in the 
next meeting of the legislature 
next January. The committee is 
made up of other members of 
colleges and university facul-
ties in Texas. 

An interim group, 17 members 
of legislature head the smaller 

Your mechanical troubles are 
our business. We are prepared 
to keep your farm machinery 
running effeciently. See us for 

any kind of repair work. 

WENCH TRUCK WORK 

OF ALL KINDS 

REUBENS WELDING AND 
MACHINE SHOP 

Unless the soil where corn was 
planted this spring was supplied 
with plenty of nitrogen, yields 
will be low. The situation can be 
corrected through the use of a 
nitrate fertilizer applied now as 
a side dressing. Two hundred 
pounds per acre of ammonium 
nitrate or 300 pounds of sulphate 
of ammonia will balance the 200 
to 300 pounds of 4-12-4 or 5-10-5 
that was applied before the corn 
was planted. 

gigiS 1- 10311 	 I 44 

Southedge HD Club 
The Southedge H. D. Club met 

June 28 in the home of Mrs. Nor-
man Ellis. The roll  call was 
answered with "MY Favorite 
color of Glove." 

Mrs. Alice Armstrong led the  
group with a very interesting 
game. After the business meet-
ing, Mrs. Burl Hamilton was to 
give a demonstration on "Glove 
Making" but the material failed 
to return and instead, Mrs. Ham= 
ilton gave a very interesting 
book review on "The Big Eye" by 
Max Ehrlick, this was enjoyed by 
all and very interesting. Since the 
Big Square Club has organized, 
this club has lost five members 
to it. 

The next meeting will be in the 
home of Mrs. Gardner Sand-
erson on July 14. All members 
are urged to attend, as this will 
be the first time our new agent, 
Mrs. Vann will attend. 

Those present were Mesdames 
Truman Lawe, Orlie Armstrong, 
Charlie WaictLfforest Collins, 
Noble Atnistroa -155.ul Chance, 
Marvin Sanders, J. D. Phelps„ 
Harley Hamilton, Gardnerer, 
Sanderson, Grady Pillow, Nor-
man Ellis, M. G. Keller, Edward 
Jones, Billy Sal Estes, Irvin Ott, 
J. Wise, Herman Word, and one 
visitor, Mrs. Clarance Lightfoot 
of Earth. 

We are very happy Mr. and 
Mrs. Billy Sal Estes are back in 
our community. 

Reporter 

Laundry Pick-up Station 

Flagg HD Club 
Has Meeting June 29 

Flagg H. D. Club met in the 
home of Mrs. Melvin Settle, June 
29. Roll call was answered with 
"What I Would do if I Were 
President of My Club." 

It was voted to send a gift to 
Mrs. Guy Barker who is in an 
Amarillo HoSpital. 

A combination Birthday and 
Stork shower were given to Mrs. 
Buck Brandon. 

Refreshments were served to 
thirteen club members and the 
following visitors, Mrs. George 
Bradford, Mrs. Earl Lust, Mrs. 
Bob Sheffy, Miss Caroline Husk-
ey and Cora Combs. 

Miss Huskey and Miss Combs 
are sister and niece of Mrs. Bran-
don. 

See 	stikel. Mrs. W. J. Largent, Jr., from 
Merckal visited over the week 
end with Mr. and Mrs. John 
Nichols. 

FOR DIMMITT 

Leave your laundry at the Castro Cleaners 
for prompt and efficient laundry service. 
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Tulia Steam Laundry 
rxIGHT THE 

NEW LOW 

PRICES 

Now the famous Gas Refriger-

ator brings you new beauty, new 

convenience ... at new low prices. 

See the new 1950 model Servels 

at your dealer's today. You'll be 

delighted with the many modern 

Servel features and the beauty it 

will add to your kitchen. And . • . 

Servels are being sold at new low 

prices. 

Russel A. Moran QUICK-CHANGE 

INTERIOR Attorney at Law 
5.eiureJL 

QUKK-CHANGE INTERIOR 

..LV! 	1. 1111 	I 
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New .Fish3ng Law 
Explained Again 

AUSTIN, Reported misunder-
standing of the statewide fishing 
law prompted the Executive Sec-
retary of the Game, Fish and 
Oyster Commission to restate 
some of the principal provisions 
Saturday. 

The law, passed by the last 
regular legislative session to re-
place many conflicting local sta-
tues, permits persons to fish with-
out a license in their home coun-
ties and to fish in streams sepa-
rating t h e county of their 
esidence and adjacent counties 

unless they use artificial bait. 
Fresh water fishermen who use 
artificial bait are required to 
have a license regardless of 
where they fish. 

The act also permits Texans 
to fish in counties adjoining 
their home counties without a 
license unless they use artificial 
bait or use live bait. Licenses 
are required of persons fishing 
for commercial purpose regard-
less of where tb4ifish. 

There also ha/been some mis-
understanding,  about the trespas-
sing law which was amended by 
the last regular legislative ses-
sion. The new changes, according 
to the Executive,  Secretary, stipu-
late that game wardens now have 
the authority to make arrests for 
trespassing, and also provides for -
an increased increased penalty for viola- 

t No change has been made in 
the primary provision of the min.-
inal trespass law. Parsons still 
need the permission of owners to 
enter property that is enclosed, 
when they desire to hunt or fish. 
Land that is not enclosed is 
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li your watch could talk, it would say: 

* Don't bang mo around! 
N') 

* Wind mo regularly! 

* Don't open mo upl 

* Don't wear me when washing, Announces the opening of an office for 
* Repair my broken crystal! 

LONG-LIFE 

DESIGN 
* I need cleaning and oiling,tool to this  

AUTHORIZED 

BULOVA 
DISTRIBUTOR or this  

i n 90 

1 5e0C)rld5 

 

formerly occupied by Southwestern Public 

2Pat7;44 
Service Co. 

rril;ree Jewelry 
See how quick and 
easy it is to store 
a giant turkey! Or 
to cool a whole case 
of coke fora party. 

HELPING BUILT) WEST TEXAS SINCE 1927 
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The average bucketful weighs 
29 pounds. Wash day takes 

between 12 and 20 buckets, 
scrubbing and cleaning about 
the .same amount. 	Routine 
kitchen work demands about 
200 pounds of water every day. 

Water can be very heavy 
. . . if you have to pump and 
carry every drop you use. But 
running water—delivered by 
a Dempster Water System—
makes light work 
of all your chores. 

See us today for com-
plete information about de-
pendable Dempster Wilier 
Systems. 

SEE YOUR NEAREST OLDSMOBILE DEALER 

STALCUP MOTOR CO. 
PHONE 290 	 DIMMITT, TEXAS 



Card of Thanks 
With hearts full of gratitude 

and love we wish to express our 
appreciation to the many friends 
and neighbors who came to our 
assistance during the illness and 
death of our beloved wife and 
mother. 

We especially wish to thank 
those who came and planted the 
row crop. Also the ones who,  
stood by with encouragement' 
and assistance during the long 
nights. To those who provided 
medical care and to those who 
sent the lovely flowers and 
nourishing food we say may God 
bless all of you. 

Mr. B. F. Holland 
Mr. and Mrs. A. L. Glenn and 

daughter, Dona Lee Robertson. 
Mr. and Mrs. L. F. Holland and 

family. 
Mr. and Mrs. R. E. Paschall 

and family 
Mr. and Mrs. A. V. Dennis and 

family. 
FOR SALE— Residential lot 

Dimmitt, 50x150 ft. good loca-
tion, on pavement. • 
tfc 	 Trellis Summers 

WANTED—Work of any kind by 
boy 16. 16 months experience in 
Grade A Dairy, some tractor ex-. 
perience. Inquire at James Shoe 
ltptfc 	 Shop 

CUSTOM PLOWING—Let me do 
your custom plowing and plant-
ing. 
4tp 	 Deroy Cates 

STAYED—Dark brown Jer-
sey milk cow, dehorned. Strayed 
from our farm west of Dimmitt 
during latter part of June. 
tfc 	 Bearden Bros. 

Wanted:. Custom hay baling—
Located 61,11 miles south on high-
way 51 and 1 mile west. 
8tc 	 E. B. Brock 

Rt. 1 Dimmitt 

Kirkpatrick Sales Company in-
vites comparison of SERVICE, 
PRODUCT QUALITY and 
PRICE. 

Mr. and Mrs. Arlie Dean of 
Nara Visa, N. M., were Dimmitt 
visitors Thursday. They were en-
route to Levelland due to the ill-
nessof her sister, Mrs. W. R. 
Simon. 

Growing children need vitamin-
packed food for between-meal 
snacks. Old-fashioned Oatmeal Cook- 
ies contain molasses rich in iron 
and the oatmeal is loaded with Vi-
tamin B,. Cream 1/2  cup shortening 
and 1 cup sugar together. Add 2 
tsps. vanilla and 2 eggs, one at a 
time beating well after each addi-
tion, Add 1 tbsp. molasses and 2 
tsps. soda which has been dissolved 
in 1 tbsp, water. Sift 1 cup flour, 1 
tap. cinnamon, 1 tsp. salt and add 
to mixture. Stir in 2 cups oatmeal, 
1 cup raisins, 1/2  cup chopped wal-
nuts. Drop from a teaspoon on un-
greased aluminum cookie sheet. 
Bake in preheated gas oven at 
375°F. Yields 4 doz. cookies. 

* * • 
There's much more fatigue in dry-

ing than washing clothes because 
of the 45 lbs. of wet wash to be 
carried out to the line, hung to dry 
later taken in and sprinkled for 
ironing. .A gas dryer automatically 
eliminates all this back-breaking 
drudgery. 
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Mr. and Mrs. R. T. Tubbs of 
Lubbock and Mrs. R. S. Barrett 
of Sulphur Springs, Texas, were 
here recently for a visit in the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. L. H. Lane. 

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Pools of Dal-
las were visitors in the home of 
Mr. and Mrs. Joe Cowen Satur-
day. 

Mr. and Mrs. Sam Maynard 
and children, Mr. and Mrs. Frank 
Henderson enjoyed a picnic 4th 
of July at Buffalo Lake. 

Mr. and Mrs. Ray Bearden and 
Yvonne visited in Amarillo Sun-
day. 

FOR BETTER BAKING 
Mrs. J. B. Birdwell returned 

to her home at Lubbock after a 
visit with her sister, Mrs. E. B. 
Wright and family. 

Milton Traylor of Kansas City, 
Mo., is here for a visit with his 
grandmother, Mrs. J. A. Cox. 

Lucy Smith W. M. S. Meets 
For Bible Study 

The Lucy Smith Circle met 
July 10 at 4 p. m. in the home of 
Mrs. J. H. Alldredge with 8 mem-
bers present. Mrs. Frank Hender-
son presided. 

"Stand Up for Jesus" was sung 
by the group. Community Mis-
sions assignments were given out 
by Mrs. Sam Maynard. Mrs. Ray 
Balch led in opening prayer. Mrs. 
Alldredge gave the devotional. 
The minutes of the least meet-
ing were read by Mrs. Maynard 
Prayers by Mrs. J. W. Bill and 
Mrs. Henderson. The Bible lesson 
was taught by the teacher, Mrs. 
Leland Smith. Mrs. Claud John-
son dismissed in prayer. Delicious 
refreshments were served to Ma-
dames: Frank Henderson, Sam 
Maynard, Leland Smith, J. W. 
Bell, R. M. Wallow, Claud John-
son, Ray Balch and Miss Zoe 
Balch, by the hostess Mrs. J. H. 
Alldredge. 

BIG SQUARE NEWS 
Big Square 

Guests in the Irvin Ott home 
Saturday and Sunday were Mr. 
and Mrs. Lendon Scarbrougher 
and Carolyn of Amarillo, Donald 
Weigon and Lavita Davis of Mil-
ler and children of Roswell, N. 
M., Mr. Glen Davis, and Mr. and 
Mrs. Ed Clark of Muleshoe. 

Miss Bonnie Smith of Roswell, 
New Mexico is spending the week 
with Irvaleen Ott. 

The Big Square Sunday School 
went to Lubbock to McKinzey 
Park Sunday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Andy Behrends 
and Mary were shopping in Plain-
view Tuesday. 

Mr. Herman Ward underwent 
surgery in Lubbock last week. He 
is reported as doing "fair". 

Mrs. John Davis isvisiting her 
mother in Rongling, Okla. this 
week. 

,•••,,,c,  
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Tulia Picnic 
Boosters Here 
Wednesday 

A large delegation of boosters 
from Tulia were here Wednesday 
advertising the annual Swisher 
County Picnic and Rodeo which 
will be held in Tulia Saturday, 
Sunday and Monday. The picnic 
or old settlers reunion will be 
held in Tuba Monday with the 
rodeo being the feature attrac-
tion on the first two days of the 
celebration. The booster group 
visited many totems in this area 
inviting their neighbors to at-
tend their annual celebration. 

FOR SALE—All wool Ax-
minister rug, Norge gas range, 
ABC washing machine, blonde 
coffee table and end table. Mrs. 
Johnny Goodwin 	Phone 173 

Mr. and Mrs. Martin Fulcher 
made a business trip to Lubbock 
Monday. 

FOR SALE, 612 ft. Electric Re-
frigerator with new unit, $75.00. 
31tf c 	 J. E. White 

Phone 328 

FOR SALE—Ford tractor star-
ter and stepup gear. 
31tfc 	 George Burch 

FOR SALE—H. International 
Tractor with 2-row cultivator and 
Case side-delivery rake. 
tfc-22 	Northside Garage 

FOR SALE — Leather hand-
tooled belts, ideal for gift items 
for all occasions, with or without 
name. See 
tfc.-10 	Hoyt Kenmore 

or phone 250 on week ends. 

FOR SALE—Firestone Tractor 
Tires and Tubes for all model 
tractors. 
tfc. 	Bearden Tractor Co. 

FOR SALE—Big six cylinder 
M-M irrigation motor, first class 
condition. Also 1000 gal. Butane 
tank, bargain. 
tfc-27 	Hi-Way Garage 

James Burnam 

FOR SALE-1948 Model K-5 In-
ternational truck with grain bed. 
tic 	Hays Implement Co. 

WANTED—Outside home appli-
ance salesman. For particularss 
apply at 
tic 	Castro County News Office 

SEE US—For all size Tractor 
Tires. Priced right. 
tic 	C. & S. Equipment Co. 

SUBSCRIPTIONS WANTED—
Mail your "new" and "renewal" 
magazine and Newspaper sub-
scriptions to a shut-in; Marshall 
Deaton, Box 5, Black, Texas, 

FOUND: Pair of brown oxford 
shoes, about size 8. Found on 
Hart highway. May be seen in 
News Office. 

FOR RENT—Furnished apart- 
ments. Inquire at 
tfc-16 Cooper Implement Co. 

FOR SALE— 1948 Model K-7 
Trailer truck. 
tic 	Hays Implement Co. 

WILL TRADE one 6-room 
Duplex home, located in nice 
residential section of Dimmitt, 
for 80 or 160 acres of land. 
35-4tp 	 Velma Moore 

TENDER, FLAKY BISCUITS 

Harvest Queen Mill & Elevator Co. Mr. and Mrs. E. A. McCollum 
are here from Landon, Texas for 
a visit with. friends. 

FOR SALE: Early Tramp Wheat 
Seed. $2.25 per bushel. 
35-3p 	 Paul Langford 
11 miles west, 4 south of Dimmitt 

PLAINVIEW, TEXAS 

00101exveeRize„AdE  , 
Fryers for sale, 21/2  to 3 lbs. 

Phone 44 	J. L. Wilkinson 
35-12tp 

Poets of Texas 
A complete list of Texas poets 

is wanted for the BIBLIOGRA-
PHY being compiled by the 
Poetry. Society of Texas. All 
poets in the state who have not 
been listed please send names and 
information about your work to 
David R. Russell, 2945 Stanford, 
Dallas 5, Texas. 

REFRIGERATOR- 
Refigerator Service—We ren-

der a complete electric refriger-
ator repair service. 
tfc. 	Dimmitt Motor Co. 

And you will buy 
THE INDEPENDENT 

UNBREAKABLE ONE-WAY 
PLOW 

FOR SALE—Several good used 
old Regular Farmall Tractors—
cheap. 
tfc Hays Implement Co. 

WE HAVE FOR SALE 
Nice selection of started chicks 

from two to six weeks old, and 
will have plenty of nice fryers for 
the netxt three or four weeks. 

LITTLEFIELD HATCHERY 
Star Rt. 2, Phone 909F22, Little- 
field, Texas. 	One and one 
holf miles North of Littlefield on 
Highway 51. 	 3tc 

Reporter 

Mr. and. Mrs. R. T. Tubb of 
Lubbock, and Mrs. R. S. Barrett 
of Sulphur Springs, Texas were 
here recently for a visit in the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. T. H. Lane. 

• 
Mrs. I. M. Walker of Los 

Gheos, California, arrived here 
recently for an extended visit in 
the home of her son, Mr. Roy De-
Wolfe and family. WANTED—About twenty head of 

cattle to put on grass. 
tfc 	 Frank A. Schulte 

Nazareth, Texas 

Cooper Implement Co. 

FOUND 
WHITEFACE 2-YEAR OLD 

STEER. Weight about 750 lbs. 
Underbit in left ear. Has been on 
my place for about 20 months. 
Owner may regain possession by 
showing affidavit; paying for 
pasturage and' this ad. 
35- tp 	 E. B. Wright 

Edith Oliver Circle 
The Edith Oliver Circle of the 

First Baptist Church met with 
Mrs. Loyce Young for the month,-
ly Bible study, Monday, July 10. 
Mrs. Nina McLain opened with 
prayer and took reports on com-
munity missions. Mrs. Paul Poe 
led our Bible study. Refreshments 
were served to Mrs. Paul Poe, 
Mrs. Nina McLain, Mrs. R. E. 
Hendricks, Mrs. Sam Long, Mrs. 
Helen Kirby, Mrs. June McBray-
er, Mrs. Frances Frayer and Mrs. 
Burl Ervin. 

THEY'RE OFF! BIGGEST TRUCK 
ECONOMY RUN EVER LAUNCHED! 

Kirkpatrick Sales Company is 
Dimmitt's only complete fuel 
dealer. 

STRAYED — near Bethel one 
Whiteface steer, wt. 550 to 600 
pounds, brandede Laez F on left 
hip. 	A. J. Kemp 	2tp 

FOR SALE-1948 Model KBS-6 
Trailer truck. 
tfc 	Hays Implement Co. 

WESSON SPECIAL 

FOR SALE—Two F-20 Farmall 
tractors, good condition. 
tfc 	Hays Implement Co. THOUSANDS of FORD.  TRUCKS START 

NATIONWIDE FORD ECONOMY RUN! SEWING MACHINES 
Sales, repairs, conversions—

complete rebuilding s e r v i c e. 
Guaranteed work. 
4p.51 	 J. D. Owen 

Manning Dry Goods, Dimmitt. 

960 ACRE WHEAT FARM: All 
fine level clean land in cultiva-
tion. 200 acres in feed, balance 
plowed for wheat. An extra 
choice wheat farm. 
Per acre 	  $60.00 

COVERS EVERY FORD TRUCK MODEL Hi 
EVERY TRUCK-USING VOCATION! 

The most realistic economy study in truck history 
is now under way. Thousands of Ford Truck-
users will keep complete day-to-day records of 
load4 hauled, miles travelled, fuel consumed 
total repairs and maintenance for a six-mon'h 
period. 

WANTED—Clean Rags. 
tic 	 Castro I‘Iotor Co. 

One-half 
balance 

could be 
ms. 

$45.00 

960 ACRE RANCH: 
section in cultivation, 
good land in grass that 
farmed. Extra good ter 
Price per acre 	 

Expert Radiator Service. 
tfc 	Castro Motor Co. DRAMATIC DEMONSTRATION THAT FORD 

IS AMERICA'S NO. 1 TRUCK VALUE: 

The Ford Economy Run will demonstrate 
for everyone to see what Ford owners 
have known right along. Ford Trucks do 
more per dollar—in your business, in any 
business. See us today! Choose from over 
175 Ford Economy Truck models! 

160 ACRE FARM: New 4 room 
house, 8" irrigation will in shal-
low water, all fine level land in 
cultivation and irrigation. All 
planted to feed. Rent goes to 
purchaser. 
Price per acre 	 $160.00 

20 ACRE FARM: 5 room home. 
Good electric irrigation well. A 
fine location close in. A hot" 
bargain. See us for price. 

OTHER GOOD BUYS in farms 
and ranches. 

FARM LOANS: A John Hancock 
Loan Service no stocks to buy, 
no commission to pay, free liberal 
and prompt apprasials. Loans for 
Making improvements to your 
farm, buying land, or for refl., 
nancing your present loan, setting 
your payment up another year, 
and in making your payment 
smaller. 

NATIO 

RADIATOR SERVICE — We 
are equipped to render a com-
plete radiator service on all 
makes of cars. All new equip-
ment, experienced workmen. New 
and used radiators for sale, also 
first line batteries for all makes 
motors at cheapest prices, with 
liberal allowance for trade in. 
tfs 	Smitty's Radiator Shop 

Ford 145-h.p. F-8 Big Job shown has a G.T.W. rating of 
"9,000 lbs. Over 175 Ford Truck models to choose from! 
Exclusive choice of V-8 or Six-cylinder truck engines! 

DIMMITT'S ENTRY 
IN THE FORD TRUCK ECONOMY RUN 
Mr. Buddy Calhoun of Dimmitt Lumber 
Co. has registered his Model F-8 Ford 
Tractor Trailer Truck in the Ford Truck 
Economy Run. Watch for it! The orange 
and black identification emblem shown 
at right will identify it. 

FOR SALE: Used sewing ma-
chine, National two spool, In 
good condition, priced to sell. 
Call 207 	Mrs. Bradley Fulfer 

33-tic LEST YOU FORGET—James' 
Shoe Shop renders an efficient 
and prompt service on all types of 
repair work at reasonable prices. 
Work guaranteed. Cavalier Pol-
ishes and Cardat Leather Goods 
and supplies. 
tfc 	 James Shoe Shop 

FOR SALE— A Registered 
Hampshire male hog. For sale or 
trade. 

• • • 
Children's treat: Skewer bananas 

on wooden sticks, dip in melted 
semi-sweet o'r milk chocolate. Freeze 
in cube compartment of your gas 
refrigerator. 	— 

• • * 
There are 5,000;000 working wives 

who have families to cook for. Many 
of them prepare oven meals ahead 
of time, set the clock control on 
their gas ranges so they'll be free 
to do other household tasks while 
the meal cooks without watching. 

• * • 
A pastry brush is a handy kitchen 

accessory. For example, when mak-
ing a gelatin dish, brush the mold, 
with salad oil so that when set, the 
gelatin slips out easily. 

FOR SALE: One office desk, 
Two office chairs, One typewrit-
er. See Mrs. B. D. Woodlee 
32-2c 	 Phone 11 

FOR RENT—Two bed rooms, 
with or without board. 
tfs 	Mrs. E. R. Rothwell 

In the long run, too—Ford Trucking Costs Less Because— 

FORD TRUCKS LAST LONGER 
Using latest registration data on 6,592,000 trucks, life insurance experts prove Ford Trucks last longer 	r.c.A_ 

WESSON REAL ESTATE 
716 W. 1st St. 	Phone 944 

Hereford, Texas 

BUY NOW — Tractor Tires 
15-30, Special Prices. 
tfc 	C. & S. Equipment Co. 4tp 

J. G. Glenn 
Ratite 2 

FOR RENT — Nice little two 
roof cabin, 4 blocks east of Court-
house, right close to Old Man 
Jordan. 	J. C. Senter 	tfc 

Man 34 wants correspondence, 
Marriage is object. 

Toots Graves 
901 SW 1st. St. 

Tulia, Texas 
Apartment for rent. Contact 

tfc' 	 J. O. Seale 

Castro Motor Co. 
NOTICE—Northside Trading 

Lot, on Highway 51 north, is now 
accumulating farm machinery, 
cars, trucks or what have you. 
We will purchase your equipment 
or sell it on commission. 
31-tfc 	 L. B. Blocker 

If Kirkpatrick Sales Company 
sells it, it's the BEST product 

available at the right price. 

RAY BEARDEN 
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Do you need a farm loan for putting down 

an irrigation well, making improvements to 

your farm, to buy more land, or to refinance 

your present loan? 

40,000 Families Mc  :A By Disa3;els d le ChAes, 	Sunny 
Shows—Floods, Tornadoes Cause Greatest Loss 

MINNESOTA 
• 3,536 

NORTH DAKOTA 
•4,801 erY 

97/ 

SOUTH 
DAKOTA 

• 16 
IOWA 
• 1,726  gc  

NEBRASKA 
• 1,535 

C OLORADO 
•850 MISSOURI 

• 5,993 

NEW MEXICO 
• 12 

• ESTIMATED FAtbIlLIES 

AFFECTED BY DISASTERS 

DURING FIRST 6 MONTHS 1950 

TORNADOES 

FLOODS 

DWELLING FIRES 

OTHER FIRES 

TRANSPORTATION 
ACCIDENTS 

STORMS 

Floods, tornadoes, storms, fires, and other disasters this year have struck an estimated 40,000 families in 
15 of the 16 states comprising the American Red Cross Midwestern Area, shown by the above map. Red 
Cross officials in charge of aiding disaster victims in the area report a number of disaster operations con-
tinuing into the second half of 1950. Largest continuing operations are in the North Dakota-Western 
Minnesota flood area, where Red Cross has provided continuous assistance since the end of March, with 
operations complicated by recurring floods and blizzards. 

Smith, Ark. is visiting relatives 
here at present. 

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Litsch, Mr 
and Mrs. Frank Annen, and Sis-
ter Thomasine made a trip to 
Carlsbad Caverns last week. 

Frank and Bud Leinen made a 
trip to Dallas recently. 

Irene and Regina Brockman 
entertained the Girls' Softball 
Team with a wiener roast and 
watermelon feast Thursday. A 
good time was had by all. 

Sister Alvera left for Fort 
Smith, after spending several 
weeks at the home of her par-
ents, Mr. and Mrs. Frank Schulte. 

Mr. and Mrs. Henry Wilhelm 
entertained with a dinner Sun-
day. 

Visitors, at the Phillip Acker 
home Sunday were Mr. and Mrs. 
Tom Britten and daughter from 
Groom and the Henry Kuper 
family from Summerfield. 

Mr. and Mrs. Joe Szaloy were 
dinner guests of the Robert Huse-
man's Sunday. Others included 
Sister Generosa, Mr. and Mrs. 
Frank Huseman and children and 
Mr. and Mrs. Jack Litsch. 

Mr. and Mrs. Wm. Hochstein, 
Sr. returned from their trip. They 
attended the wedding of their 
daughter, Rita to F. J. Edwards 
of Houston, which took place in 
St. Ann's Church, Houston on 
July 4th. After the wedding the 
Hockstein's left for Galveston, 
where they enjoyed fishing and 
water sports. 

Lavern Wilhelm left for a trip 
to Detroit and Kentucky on 
Saturday. Joe Warren made a 
trip to St. Louis. 

The Val Acker family enter-
tained with a card party Sun-
day night. 

Lobo Jean Stork gave a party 
at the home of her parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. John Stork Sunday 
evening, honoring her sister, 
Viola, on her 21st. birthday. 

Card of Thanks 
We wish to take this means of 

expressing our heartfelt thanks 
to our many kind friends and 
neighbors for the many acts of 
kndness and expressions of sym-
pathy following the death of our 
brother and uncle. Your kindness 
shall never be forgotten. 

Bud Trout 
J. M. (Milt) Trout 
Lee Duncan 
Cooper and Bob Trout 

Hear the Facts—State Repr 

J. Blake Timmons 

c. 

PLACE NUMBER ONE 

GROCERY 
SPECIALS 

C0009 9•00 • . 	1g9acl  • • 
Brer Rabbit 

S,YRUP 

Hawaiian Crushed 	 No. 2 can 

PINEAPPLE • • . ••.• • • • 	2k 
in extra heavy syrup 

No. 2 can, 2 for 

TOMATOES 0 • • • 0 • 0 0 • 0 21r 

No. 300 can, 3 for 

PORK AND BEANS ...... 25c 

Altavene Clark for Congress 
IPAIO POLITICAL AOV. 

News Want Ads Get Immediate Results 

You should see us about our John Hancock 

Farm Loan Service. A service of fair deal-

ing, free liberal and prompt appraisals, no 

stock to buy, no commissions to pay, low 

interest rates and small annual payments. 

Wesson Real Estate 
Phone 944 716 W. 1st. St. 

Hereford, Texas 

KIRKS 

Dimmitt 

Boost 

Distributor 

Your 

See 

AUTOMATIC 

By Using 

Them 

for Castro 

Consumers, 

Cattle 

At 

Profit 

County 

OILER 

Inc. 

BORDERLINE NEWS 
Mr. and Mrs. Clifford Beavers 

were visiting relatives in Plain-
view over the week-end. 

Mrs. B. B. Sinclair was a 
Saturday caller of the Houston 
Lusts. 

Mr. Gale Hainey was in Ama-
rillo Saturday on business. 

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Flynt and 
son and Ronald Brown were in 
Tulia and Canyon on business 
Thursday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Rural Brown of 
Oklahoma is visiting in the U. 
C. White home this week. Mr. 
and Mrs. Glenn James and fami-
ly visited with them there Mon-
day evening. 

Mrs. Embry Finley of Happy 
returned to her home Thursday 
after a few days visit in the 
home of her daughter, Mrs. Jack 
Flynt. 

Mr. and Mrs. Charles Cowan 
had as week-end guests, her par-
ents, Mr. and Mrs. R. N. Kyzer 
of Littlefielok. They all spent 
Saturday niglit-at- Buffalo Lake 
catching several fish. 

Mr. and Mrs. Chris Clark and 
family were in Hereford Sunday 
attending a baseball game with 
Vega. Hereford won with a 5 to 
4 score. 

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Flynt and 
son and Ronald Brown attended 
the Tower Drive Inn in Hereford 
Thursday evening. 

Mr. and Mrs. Houston Lust and 
family, Mr. and Mrs. B. B. Sin-
clair and family and Mr. John 
Brown enjoyed an ice cream 
supper with Mr. and Mrs. Glenn 
James and family Thursday even-
ing. 

Mr. and Mrs. E. W, Flynt of 
Tulia were Tuesday dinner guests 
of the Jack Flynts. During the 
afternoon, the E. W. Flynts and 
Jack went to Muleshoe for busi-
ness. 

Work and weeds are keeping' 
most everyone out here on his 
toes. One thinks he's almost 
caught up and "bingo" another 
weed patch! However, I suppose 
weeds designate good moisture 
and moisture certainly helps in 
making corps—whoever heard of 
something for nothing anyway. 

Mr. and Mrs. Glenn James and 
family and Mr. and Mrs. B. B. 
Sinclair and family were together 
Sunday. 

Several in this community have 
been victims of a little touch of 
flu. It seems it only lasts a day 
or so and you're over it—but 
brother—that day or so. 

Talks 

For $10,000 down, Immediate possession of fine farm, 

balance at 4+% interest. 2 row crop goes. 

FARM LOANS 	 F. H. A. LOANS 

INSURANCE OF ALL KINDS 

Tonite Nazareth News 
(Thursday) Mr. and Mrs. Earl Backus and 

children, and Mr. and Mrs. Law-
rence Acker and children return-
ed from a trip to New Mexico 
and Colorado. 

Raphael Birkenfeld and Ber-
nard Snyder from Indiana are 
visiting relatives here. 

The Nazareth Baseball team 
played Canyon on the home field 
Sunday, and the score ended in 
16-5 in favor of Canyon. 

The Girls' Softball team played 
the Amarillo girls at Amarillo 
Sunday, and won with a score of 
15-3. 

Tuesday night a dance, spon-
sored by the Girls' Softball Team 
was held in the Nazareth gym. 
Music was furnished by Lee Nic-
hols of Clovis, and a large crowd 
attended. 

Sister Thomasine from Ft. 

6:45 p. m. 

KAMQ Joe Cowen 
Agency 

1010 on dial 
	

J. Blake 
Timmons 

G. I. Legislator 

For Congress, 18th Dis. 
P. 0. Box 100 Dimmitt, Texas 	Phone 195 

FOR COMPLETE 

INSURANCE COVERAGE 

—SEE— 

Harrison Insurance Agency 
HAIL — FIRE — TORNADO — AUTOMOBILE 

INSURANCE 

C. S. Equipment Co. 
Is your tire headquarters in Dimmitt. We feature many 

saving prices in our genuine B. F. Goodrich tire line. We can 

fit tires to your car, truck, tractor, or farm implements. See 

us for the best tire values. 

DO YOU NEED 
a tractor, combine, plow, mower, rake, and other farm 

machinery. We feature the best in farm equipment. For un-

excelled results use the long-life, economical John Deere 

line. We have the machine you need. 

C. & S. EQUIPMENT COMPANY 

r. 
4 e Clark Altave 

Mortons 	 pt. 

SALAD DRESSING .0. • . 2k 
qt: 	 450 

Candidate for Congress, July 22nd, Democratic Primary 

Listen: Fresh 
BEEF . OVER RADIO STATION 

lb. 

. 45c • • 0 9 0 • • 

1440 K.C. 
AMARILLO KFDA 

Sugar Cured 
	

lb. 

JOWELS O 0 C. 0 • • 0 • • • .• 27c 
Doily Through July 22 

MON., WED. AND FRI. 

7:05 A.M. 
TUES. AND THUR. 

1:05 P.M. 

C. 

Complete Line of 

FRESH FRUITS & VEGETABLES 
GMC Trucks John Deere 

STATION KGNC 
710 K.C., AMARILLO 

FRI., JUL. 21, 6:30 P.M. 
FRI., JUL. 21, 8:30 P.M. 

- 

There is no Substitute for Experience--Vote for Krause 

Wilson Super Market Plus a complete line of hardward, and appliances 
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numbers by 185 Less elbow grease is required mer enrollment 
to do the house cleaning chores students. 
today because science has come 

Rent it 	buy it - sell it 

Through a News -Want Ad 

to the rescue. High on the list 
of modern aids for the home-
maker are the detergents. They 
make it possible for the home-
cleaning job to be done with less 
effort and with more speed and 
effectiveness. 

4INED-11111. .111r0.-411111.-4 
•/ 	• .•00  • .00' • 	' 

of For Prompt Deliver y 

11) 
1.0 
1.6 

Lamb County Seeking 
Underground Water 
Reservoirs 

LITTLEFIELD, June 29, (Spe-
cial)—Petitions from Lamb 
Jaunty voters seeking designa-
tion of underground water reser-
vizi& by the State Board of Water 
Engineers are on their way to the 
Board. 

Members of the Lamb County 
Water Conservation Association 
ItIo•nday gave the petitions, with 
250 signatures, to Lamb County 
Clerk Joel Thomson for record- 
ing here. Then they will be for-
%warded to the State Board of 
Water Engineers. 

Time can be saved and incon-
venience avoided if complete plans 
for the entire farmstead are 
worked out before new buildings 
are constructed. New buildings, 
including houses, should be placed 
in a suitable location with refer-
ence to their use and to existing 
buildings. 

W. C. Fortenberry, Monroe 
ginner and president of the High 
Plains association, will speak at 
the Swisher County meeting in 
Tuna Thursday, June 29. The 
meeting is called for 8:30 p. m. 
in the courthouse, Clyde Brad-
ford of Happy, president of the 
Swisher County Water Users 
Association, announced. 

Hale County farmers, who re-
cently indicated a desire to form 
a district, will meet at 8 p. m. 
July 10 in the Plainview city audi 
torium, Mayor Charles Schuler, 
Jr., of Petersberg announced. 

Meanwhile, the High Plains 
Water Conservation and Users 
Association reported indications 
that two other counties would 
follow the course of action al-
ready taken by Lamb, Hockley 
and Dallam Counties. 

County-wide meetings of irri-
gated farmers ' and other well 
users are set in Hale and Swish-
er counties. In each case, farmers 
will be asked if they want to 
learn boundaries of proposed dis- 
tricts in their area. After 
the boundaries are settled on:  
they can petition for an election 
creating a district. This is the 
procedure authorized by House 
Bill 162, enacted by the 51st Tex-
as Legislature. 

Emma Easter visited last week 
with her son and grandson in 
Portales, New Mexico. 

FLOWERS 

For All Occasions 

Call 

,DIMMITT DRUG STORED/  
/.0 

Phone 4 

Representing 

TPLAINVIEW FLORAL CO .T 

1107 Broadway 	0*/  

Plainview, Texas 	ql 

Douglas Damron Is Attending 
Summer School at WTSC 

Canyon, Tex., July 6 (W'I'NS) 
Dougla-s Damron, senior, is in-
cluded in the record enrollment 
of the first semester of summer 
school at West Texas State Col-
lege in Canyon. The record mark 
of 1196 exceeds all other sum- ".116 • ..41■." 

CASTRO COUNTY GRAIN CO. 

Amarillo rzt Show 
WM Open July 16 

The first AMARILLO GIFT 
SHOW, sponsored by the Market 
Committee of the Amarillo 
Chamber of Commerce, will be 
held at the Tri-State Fair 
Grounds July 16 and 17. 

Gift and holiday merchandise 
will be featured and offer re-
tailers an opportunity to select 
and secure delivery' of Christmas 
goods before the holiday rush. 
Over 250 top lines will be on dis-
play. 

Complimentary bus service will 
be furnished from downtown. 
hotels to the Fair Grounds both 
days 'of the Gift Show. There is 
also ample parking space for 
your automobile. 

Merchants attending the show 
are cordially invited to be the 
luncheon guests of the Chamber 
of Commerce on both July 16 and 
17. Lunch will be served. in the 
Automobile Building from 11 a. 
m. to 2 p. m. 

E. A. BILLS 
Endorsed For 

District Judge 

64th 

JUDICIAL DISTRICT 

\ 

Those qualifications which are essential to a competent 

presiding judge of a trial court — judicial temperament, knowledge of the law, 

integrity, dignity, actual trial experience in trial courts and in courts of appeal 

—are so plainly evident in Judge E. A. Bills of Littlefield, candidate for the 

office of District Judge of the 64th Judicial District, that our neighbors to the 

south of us have seen fit to recognize those qualities in unsolicited public 

print. 

Judge Bills, who has lived and practiced law in Little-

field and this district for 26 years, has all the necessary qualities to make and 

is making an outstanding trial judge. His qualificationb as recognized by the 

bar and citizens of this district and our neighbors to the south merit his 

election to a first full term in office. Judge Bills was appointed by the Govern-

or upon C. D. Russell's resignation as of January first this year, the Governor 

making such appointment upon recommendations of citizens of this district. 'You know you're driving something 
zspedal when you command the extra 
:Dower, the luxurious smoothness and 
Lihe effortless ease of a Pontiac Silver 
'streak Straight Eight. And how easy it 
its to command with Hydra-Matic Drive! 
No clutch pedal, no constant shifting—
just set a lever, relax and go! 

Pontiac is the lowest-priced car in 
_America offering the perfect perform-
;ante combination of straight-eight 
vrtwer and Hydra-Matic Drive. Come 
nn and see how easily and economically 
•,;3u can enjoy traveling first class. 

*Optional on all models at extra cost. 

• On the basis of recognized and acknowledged ability to 

handle this office, Judge Bill's candidacy is presented to you for your consid-

eration. 

Dollar for Dollar 
you can't beat a 

This presentation of Judge Bills' candidacy is submitted on his behalf by friends and supporters ONTIAlt 
KIRKPATRICK SALES CO. 

Many women sent very nice 
gifts but were unable to attend. 

NOTICE 
Notice is hereby given that on 

the 5th day of July, 1950, the 
City Commission of the City of 
Dimmitt, Texas, duly passed an 
ordinance, numbered 99, cap-
tioned as follows: 

" AN ORDINANCE (3.1F THE 
CITY OF DIMMITT, TEXAS, 
PROHIBITING THE PARKING 
OF TRUCK TRACTORS, 
TRUCK TRAILERS, SEMI-
TRAILERS, POLE - TRAILERS 
AND HOUSE-TRAILERS 0 N 
CERTAIN STREETS OF THE 
CITY OF DIMMITT, TEXAS; 
PROVIDING THAT ALL VE-
HICLES UPON CERTAIN 
STREETS SHALL PARK AT 
AN ANGLE TO THE CURB; 
PROVIDING FOR THE EREC-
TION OF SIGNS UPON CER-
TAIN STREETS PROHIBITING 
TRUCKS AND TRAILERS 
FROM PARKING THEREON; 
PROVIDING FOR A PENALTY; 
PROVIDING FOR INCIDEN-
TIAL MATFERS A N D DE-
CLARING AN EMERGENCY." 

Said ordinance shall take ef-
fect the 27th day of July, 1950. 

J. W. Skipworth 
Secretary, City of Dimmitt, 
Texas 	 2tc 

Mrs. Lena Powell Is 
Honoree At Pink And 
Blue Shower Friday 

Mrs . Lena Dale Powell was 
honored with a Pink and Blue 
Shower on Friday, June 30, in 
the home of Mrs. H. C. W5nnett. 
Hostesses were June Belknap, 
Mary Raper, Margie Wolfe, and 
Virgie Moulton. 

Those enjoying the occasion 
were Mesdames W. P. Stone, Lu-
la Hardin, Otis Hasting, H. H. 
Houtchens, Fred Waggoner, John 
McFarland, J. R. Hutcheson, Ray 
Adams, Walt Belknap, Homer 
Bartlett, Tracy Turk, Penny Gray 
R. H. Gammell, P. M. Adams, 
Ulys Davis, Charlie Byrnes, E. D. 
Newton, Sam Raper, Roy Smith, 
J. G. Snipes, Vera Patton, Ed 
Waggoner, Andy Lowrance, Bill 
Jowell, LaVona Carruth, E. R. 
Waggoner, Sam Cooper, A. C. 
Grant, J. R. White, Woodie 
George, Lloyd Kiljough, Euless 
Waggoner, and'Idiss Loris Glover 
and Rebecca Winnett; the honor-
ee, Mrs. Powell, and the hostess. 

Plenty of Money for 

Conservative 

LOANS 
on building or remodel- 

ing city residences and 
business property. 

Monthly Payments 

SWAIN 
BURKETT 

AND MIX YOU 

Veet Vedt 
LAYING RATION 

Making your hens produce more eggs 
from your home-grown grain is one 
of our most important jobs. Your 
grain, ground and mixed with Purina 
Chowdor, makes a ration that's bal-
anced with proteins, minerals and 
vitamins — gives a balanced diet that 
adds up to kits of eggs. Bring in your 
grain — let us grind it and make a 
real laying ration. 

Sealiteed ei.Lea 
PURINA 

CHOWDER 
Modern Equipment" 

at 

Box M — Tulia,• Texas 
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COMINGS, GOINGS AND DOINGS 

News About People 
By LONNIE HUDKINS 

Journal Staff Writer 
ON THE LEGAL FRONT: Lubbock attorneys have been most 

complimentary of 64th District Judge E. A. Bills, Littlefield jurist 
who exchanged benches last week with 99th District Judge G. V. 
Pardue and tried several cases here. Pooled statements: He has ad-
mirable judicial temperament, quietly maintains courtroom decorum, 
reflects in prompt and unbiased rulings his knowledge of the law 
and procedure and, in general, is a worthy successor to the 64th 
district's veteran presiding judge, C. D. Russell, resigned. Judge Bills 
became widely known for his general practice of law over more than 
two decades before his appointment to succeed Judge Russell. 
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WE ARE EQUIPPED TO RENDER 

Disc Grinding 
SERVICE AT YOUR FARM 

We have purchased portable disc grinding equipment and 

can grind your disc without removing them from the plow. 

See us for this prompt and efficietit service. 

WE ARE LOCAL DISTRIBUTORS FOR 

ARK VALLEY 

ONE WAY PLOWS 
• 

. 'SEE US FOR YOUR 

GODEVIL KNIVES 
516 X 3+ in. 	 4 ft. long 

GENERAL BLACKSMITHING WELDING 

EARL'S HARDWARE & SUPPLY 
We Weld Anything But a Broken Heart or the Break of Day 

• 

America's Lowest-Priced 
Straight Eight 

gives you extra smoothness,  extra power 

Lowest-Priced Car with 
GM llydra-Matie Drive* 

°Ives you effortless  driving convenience 

• 

erfeet Performance Combinadon! 

The Most ileautiful Thing on Wheels 

... 



• 

• 

Model L-150, 142-inch wheelbase, VII-
foot stake body, 9000 pounds GVW—
one of 87 different basic Internatiozral 
models, each all new, all proved. v- 

I WINKS 
All new, a!! *Weed- He_,J; 7-121 y Engineered: grove,  you money 

INTERNATIONAL 
et 

We wish to extend our thanks and 
the Dimmitt Trade Territory for Mae 
Grand Opening Saturday, July 8th. 
appreciation to the business firms of 
come. 

appreciation to everyone in 
fine reception given 0 u r 
We also wish to express our 
Dimmitt for their warm wer 
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where they joined Mr: and Mrs. 
I Miss Judy Dawson of Big Vann, Co. HD Agent gave a dern- 

Cecil Crum for a trip {o Winona, 
Kansas. They returned on Satur- 
day. 

Mr. and Mrs. W. H. Futrell and 
Lois Carrol and Mr. and Mrs. 
Ralph Futrell and Bruce went to 
Dalhart on Thursday for, a visit 

Mr. and Mrs. Eldon Saul ;ran 
drtuffhter, Elaine of Miami arta 
Jessie •Edgar Stanford of Miura 

1 
 and Dorothy Sue Stanford of 
Amarillo and Glenn Bullock off 
Lubbock and Mr. and Mrs. (Vil 
Nash and son, Jimmy of Arnarit& 
lo were guests in the home- oft 
Rev. and Mrs. Lee Stanford ..1 
week end. 

onstration on Frozen Le.5sots. 
The hostess served refreshments 
to Mrs. Vann and 8 members. 

We have been having lots of 
rain since the last report varying 
from 1 inch to between 3 and 4. 
Hail has been reported in,  a few 
places but the row crop is too 
small to be seriously damaged. 

Mr.: and Mrs. Clarence Psi-m.13EO 
. visited in Muleshoe Sundhy; News Want Ads (let Results 

Spring spent Monday in the W. 
A. Hawkins, Sr. home. 

Burrus McRee has returned 
from a week's visit in the home 
of his aunt at Portales. 

Hart Club met on Tuesday 
afternoon July 4th in the home 
of Mrs. Percy Hart. Mrs. Hubert 
Maples led the games. Mrs. W. 
R. Reid, president, presided at 
the business meeting. Mrs. Robin 

this week in the home of Mr. and • 
Mrs. Robert Brooks. 

Patso Bauman is employed 
part time in the office of the 
Bennett-Thompson Butane Co. 

The children of Mr. and Mrs. 
Fred Hamm honored their moth-
er with a birthday party in their 
home on Friday evening. Guests 
were Mr. and Mrs. Winston 
Hamm and children of Corpus 
Christi, Mr. and Mrs. A. J. 
Smith, Mr. and Mrs. T. U. Smith, 
Mr. and Mrs. Percy Hart and Joe 
Percy, Mr. and Mrs. Bill Wood 
and children of Hart and Miss 
Evelyn Coleman of Dimmitt. Ice 
cream and cake were served. 

Mrs. Glen Drake returned on 
Tuesday afternoon from Olton 
Hospital where she underwent an 
appendectomy on Friday night. 
Her mother, Mrs. J. L. Oler has 
been staying with her part of the 
time at Olton. 

Mrs. Elmer Scott, Mrs. Roy 
Pyeatt and Miss Dorothy Beard- 
en left on Monday morning with 
a group of G. A.'s for Ceta Glen 
encampment for a 3 day outing. 

Messers and Mesdames Rodney 
Smith, Edward Bennett and W. 
A. Hawkins, Jr., were in Tulia on 
Monday night to attend a Legion 
meeting. 

Fishing at Buffalo Lake during 
the wet weather were Jack 
Smitherman, Glen Rhodes, V. E. 

with the senior Futrell's brother. 
Mr. and Mrs. W. A. Hawkins, 

Jr., and W. A. III visited Friday 
thru Sunday with the Ford fami-
ly in Canyon and Mr. and Mrs. 
Hank Bruce in Spearman. 

Mrs. Lucille Wall and children 
of Canyon are here fora visit in  
the home of Mr. and Mrs. Roy 
Wall and are attending the re-
vival at the school house. 

Mr. and Mrs. M. F. McRee and 
children and Mrs. Temple Rogers 
and Mr. and Mrs. Gus Hawkins 
were in Clovis SundaY to attend 
the 20th wedding anniversary of 
Mr. and Mrs. McRee. They were 
honored with a dinner in the 
home of a sister of Mrs. McRee. 

Mr. and Mrs. Wayne West of 
Amarillo visited Sunday evening 
in the home of Mr. and Mrs. M. 
F. McRee. 

Charles Clark visited home 
folks in Big Spring during the 
wet weather. He also0visited his 
brother, George, at Mo Ranch 
near Kerrville. 

Mrs. W. F. priffin of Tulia, 
Mrs. Ray Clarkk,*-nd NancY and 

Bearden and Mr. and 'Mrs. D. N. 
Gamblin. 

Reverend Elbert J. Keith of Af• 
ton has been called to the pastor-
ate of the local Baptist Church. 
He will move his wife and two 
children here this week The Bap-
tist are announcing an open 
house at the parsonage from 3 
to 5 p. m. Sunday, July 16th. All 
people of the community are in-
vited to attend. 

Mr. and Mrs. Percy Hart gave 
a pot luck supper at their home 
on Monday night as a farewell 
honor to Mr. and Mrs. Ray B. 
Jones who are moving this week 
to Junction, Texas, to make their 
home. Guests were Mr. and Mrs. 
T. R. Davis and Peggy, Mr. and 
Mrs. Sam Swopes and Truman, 
Mr. 'and Mrs. Bill Wood, Nina 
Ruth and Bill Don, Luther Davis 
and Mr. and Mrs. Cecil Ray 
Jbnes. 

Mr. and Mrs. Winifred Taylor 
are announcing the arrival of a 
son in the Lamesa Hospital on 
Monday evening, July 3rd. 

Visitors on Thursday evening 
in the home of Mr. and Mrs. Bill 
Wood and family were his mother 
and brother, Mrs. J. D. Wood and 
Bob of Groom and his Uncle, Mr. 
and Mrs. C. C. Driskell of San 
Angelo. 

Mr. and Mrs. Gus Hawkins 
went to Dimmitt on Wednesday 

Miss Rubye Mae Annen of 
Nazareth is spending some time 
with her cousins, Patsi and An-
toinette Bauman. 

Mr. Clark of the vegetable 
cannery of Plainview, attended to 
business in Hart on Friday. 

Part of the Senior Class of '38 
went to Rouidoso, New Mexico, 
for a short outing over the week 
end. Those making the trip were 
Misses Patsi Smitherman, 
Jeanne Sharp and Mildred Pat- 
terson, Mrs. Louise Jones and 
husband, Cecil Ray Jones, W. H. 
Felder, Easton Wall and Leland 
Hacker. Buster Hacker and Billie 
Kline were the other members of 
the class • but did not make the 
trip. 
- Mr. and Mrs. Homer Hill 
spent the week end in Ft. Worth 
attending to business. 

Mr. and Mrs. Jack Smitherman 
and Rue spent Sunday visiting 
his parents, Mr. and Mrs. P, M. 
Smitherman in Floydada. 

Mrs. C. C. Rice and daughter 
of Littlefield, Miss Florine Rice, 
are visiting in the home of their 
son, John Rice and family. 

Mrs. I. M. Wester of Carlsbad, 
N. Mex., and Mr. and Mrs. Robert 
Dennis of California- 	are visiting 

SAMPLC BALLOT 
I AM A DEMOCRAT AND PLEDGE MYSELF TO SUPPORT THE NOMINEE OF THIS PRIMARY. 

NEW 	trucks with 
heavy-duty STAMINA in every part For GOVERNOR: 

Allan Shivers of Jefferson County 
Mrs. Benita Louise Marek Lawrence of Washington County 

Charles B. Hutchinson of Dallas County 
Wellington Abbey, Jr., of Harris County 
Gene S. Porter of Harris County 
J. M. Wren of Harris County 
Caso March of McLennan County 

For LIEUTENANT GOVERNOR: 

Pierce P. Brooks of Dallas County 
Ben Ramsey of San Augustine County 
Peyton Elliott Womack of Travis County 
Fred Red Harris of Dallas County 
Preston E. Smith of Lubbock County 
Virgil E. Arnold of Harris County 
Roger Q. Evans of Grayson County 
W. 0. Reed of Dallas County 
Cyclone Davis, Jr., of Dallas County 

G. C. Morris of Hunt County 
Kyle Vick of McLennan County 
R. B. McAshan of Kerr County 

a 
There's a brand new kind of comfort in mighty easy to handle, too! Call or con  

these International Trucks — and they're in for a demonstration, soon. 

CONGRESSION- 

Hays Implement Company 

For TREASURER: 
Jesse James of Travis County 

For COMMISSIONER OF AGRICULTURE: 

John C. White of Wichita County 
Tom Fairey of Travis County 
Charlie McLellan of Colorado County 
J. E. McDonald of Travis County 

For REPRESENTATIVE IN CONGRESS 18th 
AL DISTRICT OF TEXAS: 

Altavene Clark of Potter County 
J. Blake Timmons 'of Potter County 
Walter Rogers of Gray County 
LeRoy LaMaster of Ochiltree County 

For ASSOCIATE JUSTICE OF THE COURT OF CIVIL AP-
PEALS 7th SUPREME JUDICIAL DIST. 

Herbert C. Martin of Lamb County 
W. N. Stokes of Wilbarger County 

For REPRESENTATIVE OF THE 120th 
DISTRICT OF TEXAS 

Harold M. LaFont of Hale County 
H. J. Blanchard of Floyd County 

For DISTICICT JUDGE 64th JUDICIAL DISTRICT: 

E. A. Bills of Lamb County 
Robt. Kirk of Lamb County 

For DISTRICT ATTORNEY 64th JUDICIAL DISTRICT: 

Joe Sharp of Hale County 

For MEMBER STATE BOARD OF EDUCATION: 

A. R. Bivens of Potter County 

For COUNTY JUDGE AND EX-OFFICIO COUNTY SCHOOL 

SUPERINTENDENT: 

Robert Estes 

For SHERIFF, TAX ASSESSOR AND COLLECTOR: 

E. D. Wyer 
M. H. Fowlkes 

For DISTRICT AND COUNTY CLERK: 

Mrs. Ola Murphy 

For COUNTY TREASURER: 

Faye E. Holland 

For COUNTY ATTORNEY: 

REPRESENTATIVE 

For COUNTY COMMISSIONER PRECINCT NO. 1: 

E. I. McLain 

For COUNTY COMMISSIONER PRECINCT NO. 2: 

Otis English 

For COUNTY COMMISSIONER PRECINCT NO. 3: 

Roy Bell 
John G. Davis, Jr. 

For COUNTY COMMISSIONER PRECINCT NO. 4: 

Joe G. Bichsel 
John C. Stork 

For COUNTY DEMOCRATIC CHAIRMAN: 

For ATTORNEY GENERAL: 
Price Daniel of Liberty County 

For ASSOCIATE JUSTICE OF SUPREME COURT (Place 1) 

Will Wilson of Dallas County 
Fagan Dickson of Bexar County 
Walter L. Wray of Dallas County 

For ASSOCIATE JUSTICE OF SUPREME COURT (Place 2) 

Robert W. Calvert of Hill County 
Hicks Harvey of Cass County 
Alfred M. Scott of Travis County 

For ASSOCIATE JUSTICE SUPREME COURT (Place 3) 

Meade F. Griffin of Hale County 
Robt. B. Keenan of Gregg County 
Matt Davis of Upshur County 
Geo. W. Harwood of Dallas County 

For JUDGE OF COURT OF CRIMINAL APPEALS: 

G. H. (Hobert) Nelson of Lubbock County 
James Hill Letts of Harris County 
Robert L. (Bob) Lattimore of Dallas County 
David Wuntch of Smith County 
Cecil Storey of Gregg County 
W. A. Morrison of Milam County 
Joel W. Cook of Harris County 
William E. Myres of Tarrant County 

For RAILROAD COMMISSIONER: 
William J. Murray, Jr. of Harris County 

For COMPTROLLER OF PUBLIC ACCOUNTS: 

Robert S. Calvert of Travis County 
Clifford E. Butler of Harris County 

For COMMISSIONER OF GENERAL LAND OFFICE: 

James L. Allred of Tarrant County 
Bascom Giles of Travis County 

For PRECINCT CHAIRMAN: 

Compliments Of 

Hays Implement Company 
• 

AN APOLOGY 

We wish to beg our customers to bear with us during the next several days while we are busy 

moving into our new location. We will take care of your needs to the best of our ability, and 

invite you to call on us for any services we can possibly render. 



because of his outstanding ap-
pearance and performance of 
duty in his Battery. 

Corporal Calhoun is assigned 
to "B" Battery, of the 77th 
Field Artillery Battalion, First 
Calvary Division stationed at 
Camp Drew, Koizumi, Honshu, 
Japan. Hii present job in his unit 
is Chief of the Wire Section. 

News Want Ads Get Results 

• 
Don't Wait Until Our 
Community Is Attacked 

by 

ROBERVE11111 
Elect 

Insure Now — be certain that when 
DREAD DISEASE strikes, the heavy 
expense of treatment is covered by 
our Insurance. 

Pays up to 

$5,000.00 Each Person 
Covers 

POLIO • SPINAL MENINGITIS • 
DIPHTHERIA • SCARLET FEVER 

smanpox • LEUKEMIA • 
ENCEPHALITIS • TETANUS 

Pays for 
H'spital Services— 

Room, Board, Attendants, Apparatus, 
Medicines. 

Medical Services— 
Doctor (M. D. or Osteopath) 

Nursing Service— 
Registered Graduate Nurses, 3 a day at 
S10.00 per day each. 

Ilmbulance Service— 
:25.00 each Hospital Confinement. 

Iron Lung— 
Or similar mechanical apparatus. 

Blood Transfusions— 
All usual and customary charges. 

Drugs and Medicines— 
Pays all Drug and Medicine Bills. 

Transportation— 
Automobile, Railroad or Aircraft to Hos-
pital; Patient and Attendant. Special 
Plane when necessary. 

Braces and Crutches— 
as needed. 

g
Written In 

forhAnkro Lift I...sou...a cc•traxv 

Capital and Surplus Over $2.000.000.00 

The People's 

Candidate 

alter 
Rogers 
for Congress 

Hear "the facts about this important 
election; hear the man who is obligated 
to no groups, who is free to represent 
ail the people. Listen to the 

ROGERS ROUND TABLE 
MiNC, Friday Night, July 14-7 to 7:30 

Let's elect a capable and experienced 
man —a man with a platform 

To The 

FUPRE 
O Texas 

PLACE 1 
A Staunch Texan 

To Protect Your Rights! 

iraegrLy ' Afp:L'217 
CounzsTe * E:c:or:ence 

• fLAGG KEW'S 
A picnic dinner at the park was S  

enjoyed Sunday after church by 
!Mi. and Mrs. Bill Booker, Mr. 
and Mrs. Cecil Ginn, Mr. and 

111,1rs. Sid Sheffy, Mr. and Mrs. 
Vernon Simmons, Mrs. Dorothy 
Wren Rothwell and daukhters, 
J. C. Newton, Don and Tommy 
Sbeffy, with Mrs. Otto Gililland 
and children, Mr. and Mrs. Lindy 
Scarbrough and Carolyn as honor 
guests. 

Mrs. Otto Gililland and chil- 

Candidate for 

LT. GOVERNOR 
Has the Experience! 

A Blacktop Road 
To Every Farm Home • 

BEN PANSEV 

Is What Counts 

—11328111 

Castro Motor C 
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approved sources will aid in pre-
venting a number of communic-
able diseases." 

National statistics, Dr. Cox ,as-
serted, show good reason for op-. 
timism in most cases of polio. 
According to the figures, from 40 
to 60 per cent of all victims re-
cover completely and can do any-
thing they choose. 

From 25 to 40 per cent re-
cover with only minor disability, 
and can, within very wide limits, 
lead perfectly normal lives. Fron-
15 to 20 per cent are more 
severely handicapped, and 5 to 10 
per cent terminate fatally. 

"It goes to show that polio is 
actually a minor cause of illness, 
and an even less significant cause 
of death, when compared to 
tain other communicable dis-
eases," the health officer con-
cluded. 

First Methodist Church 
The morning worship service of 

the First Methodist Church will 
be at 10:50 a. m. and the sub-
ject of the pastor's sermon will 
be "God and Company Builders". 
Other services of the day will in-
clude Sunday School at 9:45 a. 
m. with an interesting class for 
each member of the family. 
Methodist .Youth Fellowship 
Groups at 7:1_5,- p. m. Juniors at 
7:15 p. m. The evening worship 
service at 8:15 p. m. when the 
young people's group make up the 
choir and furnish the special mu-
sic. At the service the Amarillo 
District Supt. Dr. Earl G. Ham-
lett will preach and conduct our 
first quarterly conference. We 
urge every member of the church 
to attend. 

WITH THE EIGHTH U. S. 
ARMY IN KOIZUMI, JAPAN — 
Corporal Edward P. Calhoun, son 
of Mr. Robert L. Calhoun, of 
Dimmitt has been chosen as the 
"Battery Soldier of the Week" 

News VICEI'd ids Get Immediate Results 

1901 - 1949 Forty eight years of service 

E. BLACK COMPANY 
FURNITURE 

ELECTRIC REFRIGERATORS — ELECTRIC RANGES 

GAS RANGES 

We deliver to your home 

Hereford, Texas Phone 14 

LUBBOCK, July 13 (Special) 
With petitions circulating 
throughout the country, Lubbock 
farmers are moving to form an 
underground water conservation 
district under House Bill 162. 

They took the action July 6 at 
a meeting addressed by W. 0. 
Fortenberry,, New Deal ginner 
and president of the Lubbock and 
High Plains water associations; 
L. A. Howard, Lubbock lawyer; 
A. P. Dugan, Jr., Littlefield law-
yer; . and .Raymond Lee Johnson, 
Plainview representative of the 
West Texas Chamber of Com-
merce. 

Fortenbe:ry told the farmers 
that the High Plains Water Con-, 
servation and Users Association, 
which steered House Bill 162 
through the 51st Legislature, 
"can't represent you again in 
Austin if you don't make this 
law work." 

The conservation district law 
was substituted for legislation 
seeking control of water. The 
p7esent law guarantees private 
ownership and provides for a 
conservation program carried out 
by local, independent water dis-
tricts. 

"This is our own program, we 
asked for it, and we must mako 
it work or take the consequences," 
FortenberrY declared. 

Polio in Texas 

Dorothy Morris of Dalhart has 
been visiting with her friend 
Waymon and Mr. and Mrs. Jess 
Birchfield the past week end. 

Tommye Sheffy is visiting her 
friend, Carolyn Scarbrough in 
Amarillo this week. 

Mrs. Ed Wilson, Sr. has re-
turned from a visit with her son 
and family in Midland. Mrs. J. B. 
Wilson is recovering from a seri-
ous injury received in a car 
wreck. 

J. C. Knox and grandson, Ken-
ny Knox of Kerrville visited his 
daughter, Mrs. Sid Sheffy and 
family; on his way to visit in 
California. 

Lelda Thompson has been visit-
ing relatives and friends in Ver-
non the past week. Her parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Andy Thompson 
will meet her there and go on to 
the Scottish Rites Hospital in 
Dallas for Lelda's check-up. 

DISTRICT JUDGE 
64-t1h JUDICIAL DISTRICT 

Pailey,Castro, //a/e,/aini?Parmo-,-Saher- 
ekteit vote et- bre/hi-4rue gPiOectated 

Ad. 
WILL 

WILSON 
(i),Ng FOR ONE 
40U PERSON 

ANNUAL 
PREMIUM 

ONLY 

$ 1 0 FOR A 
FAMILY GROUP 

Policies written in Houston and losses 
paid by Cravens, Dorgan & Company, 
Insurance Managers for Nearly 50 Years 

• 
More Protection at a Reasonable 

Price 

Harrison 
Insurance Agency 

COMPLETE INSURANCE 
COVERAGE 

Phone No. 3 

Dimmitt, Texas 
4 

Free Removal 
Of Cattle, Hog, Sheep 

Horse Carcasses 

Dimmitt Consumers, Inc. 
FLOYD REYNOLDS, Mgr. 

Phone 126 
	

Dimmitt, Texas 

PLAININEW RENDERING CO. 
Call Collect 1444, Plainview, for prompt service 

A dollar goes a long way in a '50 Ford! 
For you get big-car comfort, quiet, and 
quality at an economy cost. Yes, in 
Ford you get the big-car roadability, 
the road-hugging smoothness you'd  
expect only in the costliest cars. And 
Ford's rugged, sound-conditioned "Life-
guard" Body brings you safety and 
silence usually found only in cars selling 
for hundreds more. Yes, Ford is 
America's best quality buy! 

Ho •k • 
a dollar 
for a long 
ride • 

6.00-16 
PLUS TAX 
AND YOUR 
OLD TIRE 

Sn',UE ENDS 
JULY 29 

FIRST LOW COST TIRE WITH 
ALL THESE HIGH QUALITY FEATURES 

• Fully Guaranteed • Center "Safety Zone" 
Tread • 7 Full Tread Ribs 0 Zig-Zag Anti-
Skid Tread Design 0. Buttress-Built Shoulders 
• Wide, Flat Tread • "Rythmic-Flexing Cords" 

Judge 1V.3 Stokes 

N AW 7957 
DitillANCE 

TMES 

dren of Eldorado, Okla., have • 
been visiting the Vernon Sim- 	etitions mons the past week. 

Bobby Ballard fs much better 
after a serious injury; suffered in 
the donkey ball game— his collar 
bone was broken and the bone 
severed an artery. The Ballard 
family from Frederick have been 
visiting with him. Bob is in 
Northwest Hospital in Amarillo. 
, Mrs. Melvin Settle was hostess 
to the Flagg Club last Thursday. 
A birthday shower was given to 
Mrs. Buck Brandon. The Club 
will meet with Mrs. Vernon 
Simmons Thursday with the 
home agent attending. 

Mr. and Mrs. Jess Birchfield 
visited his uncle in Elk City, 
Okla. last week. 

Mr. and Mrs. Stanley Climbs 
and children visited last week 
with her relatives near Paris, 
Texas.. 

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Booker were 
hosts to the Jim Alredge's Mon-
day with a fish fry supper. 

Mrs. Calvin Heiskell and son, 
Larry and sister Tommye Tim-
mons visited last week with their 
mother, Mrs. Timmons in Dal-
hart. 

AUSTIN, July 13. State Health 
Officer Geo. W. Cox has turned 
the bright light of optimism on 
the heretofore dark picture of 
polio in Texas. 

Observing that the state's 1,000 
cases of polio since the year's be-. 
ginning has occured among a 
population of 712 million people, 
the health official Thursday de-
plored "the attitude of hysteria 
that polio creates in a communi-
ty." 

That didn't mean people should 
not be concerned, the doctor 
commented, for a case of illness 
in any form is good reason for a 
great concern. 

"I'm talking about the fear 
that keeps a person or a whole 
community from thinking 
straight. Of course each case of 
polio is an individual tragedy for 
the family involved, but whole-
sale public panic simply is not 
justified." 

He doesn't want to encourage 
complacency either, the state 
health officer said, adding: 

"Every clear-thinking effort 
must be made to keep every 
home, every community, every 
vacation camp consistently clean 
and sanitary. Briefly, elimination 
of fly and insect breeding places, 
personal cleanliness, and getting 
milk, water and food from safe, 

rive the new 
UP TO 

6 months to pay 

Candidate For Re-
Election as Associate 
Justice of the Court of 
Civil Appeals, Seventh 
Supreme Judicial Dis-
trict. 

Judge Stokes has been an 
associate justice on the court 
during the last thirteen years. 
Before becoming a member of 
the court, he was a District 
Judge and practiced law in all 
the courts. He submits his sea-
soned experience and training 
as qualifications which justify 
the people re-electing him for 
the ensuing six-year term. 

His candidacy is subject to 
the pending Democratic pri-
mary election, and your favor-
ably consideration will be ap-
preciated by him. 

‘' ;}',id Political Adv.) 

Tires Mounted Without Charge 

FREE! 68-PAGE TRAVELOG Prepared by RAND-McNALLY AND CO. 
Stop In — Get Yours Today — N othing To Buy — No Obligation 

Only Ford offers you a V-8 that 
combines such a low purchase 
price, such economy of oper-
ation, and so much get-up-and-
go! And, you'll find Ford's fa-
mous V-8 power plant brings you 
quiet that lives up to its econ-
omy and quality ... for it's engi-
neered to whisper while it works! 

„:ithe future bull la 
There's a 	in your future 

C. & S. EQU!PMENT CO. 
C 

JOHN DEERE SALES & SERVICE 

K HMI/A I 	%AI lem% 



The efficient job it does retaining the nutritional value of all foods. 

Keeping intact the wonderful taste appeal of meats, fruits, vegetables 

p . . providing facilities for your family's favorite desserts or frozen salaams  

Add to this the convenience of your electric borne freezer. 

A year 'round storehouse for such seasonal delights 

as strawberries, corn-on-the-cob, fish and 

other game. Fact is, you can buy in 

quantity ... at low summer-market prices! 

Yes, this practical combination affords twice as much 

convenience ... when they're BOTH electric. 

Electricity makes your food dollars go 

far—very far indeed. Low cost, dependable 

electric service makes it so. 

-,:••••••rrwir.j: 

SOUTHWESTERN 

PUBLIC SERVICE 
COMPANY 

211 YEARS OF GOOD CITIZENSHIP AND PUBLIC SERVICE 
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ceremony. She also played the 
wedding march from "Lohen-
grin" and Mendelssohn's wed-
ding march. 

Miss Dolores Lasnick of Louis-
ville, Colorado, college roommate 
of the bride, was maid of honor. 
She wore a floor length dress 
of white marquisette over apple 
green taffeta made similar to 
that worn by the bride. She car-
ried a colonial designed hand 
bouquet of yellow carnations. 

Joe Lyons served as best man 

Sowell-Frye 
Vows Read 

baskets were used in the floral 
decor at the altar. Rev. Russell 
Wingert, pastor of the First 
Presbyterian Church, read the 
double ring ceremony in the 
presence of close friends and 
relatives. 

Mrs. Glenn Snyder was organ-
ist and played a prelude of 
wedding music including "Indian 
Love Call," "Ah, Sweet Mystery 
of Life," and "Because," with 
"Ave Maria" • played as soft 
musical background for the News Want Ads Get Results 

White tapers in seven branch-
ed candelbra gave illumination 
for the wedding of Miss Verna 
Jeareen Sowell, daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. Charles R. Sowell, and 
Charles William Frye Sunday af-
ternoon at the Hereford Mettho-
dist Church. White Gladioli in tall 

Charter No. 178 

BANK'S 
OFFICIAL STATEMENT OF FINANCIAL CONDITION 

OF THE 

FIRST STATE BANK 
OF DIMMITT 

at Dimmitt, Texas, at the close of business on the 30th day of 
June, 1950, pursuant to call made by the Banking Commissioner 
of Texas in accordance with the Banking Laws of the State. 

RESOURCES 

64th district. lie has been engag-
ed in the pra6tice of law for 20 
years in Littlefield. 

Michael Bates of Plainview is 
visiting his Grandmother, Mrs. E. 
R. Rothwell and other relatives 
this week. 

Mr. B. L. Dimpsey of Wiley 
is here for a visit with his brother 
J. W. Dimpsey and family. 

• • 

SupS 	$ 796,879.28 Loans and discounts, including overdrafts 
United States Government Obligations, 

direct and guaranteed 	  812,164.18 its 
Obligations of states and political subdivisions 	 24,700.00 

• 
Cash, balances due from other banks, including 

reserve balances, and cash items in process 
of collection (including exchanges for 
clearing house) 	  1,068,356.49 

Banking house, or leasehold improvements 	 6,925.00 
Furniture, fixtures, and equipment  	4,095.00 
Other assets  	2,700.00 

Total Resources 	  $2,715,819.95  

j 

To First Elective Term 

SUPREME 
COU T 

PLACE 3 

Yo for or O 

LIABILITIES AND CAPITAL ACCOUNTS 

Common Capital Stock 	  $ 50,000.00 
Surplus: Certified $50,000.00  	$ 50,000.00 
Undivided profits  	51,280.0 
Demand deposits of individuals, 

partnerships and corporations 	  2,399,640.5 
Public funds (Inc. U. S. Govt., states 

and political subdivisions) 	  164,89143 
Total all deposits 	 $2,564,539.95 

Total Liabilities and Capital Accounts 	 $2,715,819.S5 

STATE OF TEXAS, County of Castro: I, Jo Wesson, being 
cashier of the above named bank, do solemnly swear 
that the foregoing statement of condition is true to the best a 
my knowledge and belief. 	 Jo Wesson 

There'll be a smile in every mile . .. when you OIL-PLATE 
your engine with new Conoco am:  Motor Oil! 

Proved by 50,000-Mile Road Test! In a 50,000-mile road test, 
engines lubricated with Conoco Super Motor Oil showed 
an amazing economy of operation. Average gasoline mile-
age for the last 5,000 miles of the test-run was actually 
99.77% as good as for the first 5,000. This means that new 
Conoco Super Motor Oil — with proper crankcase drains 
and regular care — can keep new-car gasoline mileage . . . 
new-car power and performance . . . year after year! 

and candles were lighted by the' 
ushers, who were Robert Barclay 
and Ralph Fullwood. 

The bride was accompanied to 
the altar by her father, who gave 
her in marriage. Her gown was 
of white chantilly lace over brid-
al satin made with high round 
neck line, tight fitting bodice 
and long pointed sleeves. Her 
full skirt was floor length and 
the finger-tip veil of illusion was 
held in place with puffs of il-
lusion and white flowers. She 
wore an heirloom gold bracelet, 
which had belonged to her 
grandmother Woods, and a pearl 
necklace. The Wedding Bouquet 
was fahioned of white gar-
denias and stephanotis showered 
yip.' white satin streamers. 

The bride's mother wore a 
navy sheer with rose-pink car-
nation corsage. Wynogene Sow-
ell, sister of the bride, and Doro-
thy Denton of San Antonio as-
sisted the guests in registering 
as they entered the church. 

Following the wedding, Mr. and 
Mrs. Sowell were hosts at their 
home, 410 Twenty-five Mile 
Avenue, at a reception hono'ring 
the bridal couple. The bride's ta-
ble was laid with a lace cloth and 
centered with a wedding scene 
arranged on a mirror reflector. 
Miss Barbara Burney poured 
punch and Mrs. P. Singleter-
ry of Texico, N. 11.-, aunt of the 
bride, served the tiered wedding 
cake. 

When the couple left on a 
short wedding trip to Santa Fe 
and other New Mexico points, 
the bride was wearing a white 
linen suit with all-white acces-
sories. Her corsage was of pink 
carnations. 

Both Mr. and Mrs. Frye are 
graduates of Hereford High 
School. Mrs. Frye attended the 
University of Colorado for 21A.,  
years. Mr. Frye attended Spar-
tan School of Aeronautics at 
Tulsa, Oklahoma, and Colorado 
A&M College at Fort Collins. 

Mr. Frye is the son of Carl 
Frye, well-known farmer and 
rancher of Castro and Deaf 
Smith Counties. The couple will 
live on the Frye farm 14 miles 
north of Dimmitt. 

Saturday evening, June 24, 
the couple was honored at a re-
hearsal party given at the home 
of Mr. and Mrs. Carl Frye. Mem-
bers of the two families and of 
the wedding party attended. 

The groom attended Dimmitt 
schools until 1946. 

Subscribed and sworn to before me this 7th day of July, 195:._ 

(SEAL) 	Salvatore Di Cuffa 
Notary Public, Castro County, Texas 

CORRECT—ATTEST: G. I. Clingingsmith, Ruby McLean: 
Helen McLean—DIRECTORS 

Come in and 
let me tell you about 

50,000 miles 
no Wear!" 

• A hard working lawyer 
of wide experience. 
• Native of West Texas 
(born in Callahan County 
in 1894). 
• Worked w a y through 
College. Graduated from 
University of Texas Law 
School and admitted to Bar 
in 1917. 
• Served in World War I 
and World War II. Chief 
Prosecution Section War 
Crimes, Wiesbaden, Ger-
many, 1945. 
• Engaged in general 
practice of law at Plain-
view from 1920 until ap-
pointed to Supreme Court 
by Governor Jester in 1949. 
• County Judge of Hale 
County 1923-1926. District 
Attorney 64th Judicial Dis-
trict 1927-1934, retiring 
voluntarily. 

01" CONTINENTAL OIL COMPANY 

      

      

  

	

GLENN RATCLIFF 	Phone
tii  

W 

	

CONOCO HOLESALE 	3 

  

      

      

Announces for Office 
Of Associate Justice 

Herbert C. Martin, Littlefield 
lawyer, has announced for the of-
fice of Associate Justice of the 
Panhandle area, which is the 
seventh supreme judicial dis-
trict. 

Mr. Martin is49 years old and 
married. Born ilLe coleman, he 
graduated from Lubbock High 
School and attended the law 
school of the University of Texas. 
He is a Democrat and was at one 
time District Attorney of the 

• ' • 

.0$ riv h 
the facts... 

Step into a POWER aW Chevrolet 
and enjoy the big driving thrill of the day 

. . . smooth, effortless, no-shift driving at lowest cost! Twice as convenient 

for you and your budget! 

Your electric refrigerator, for example. 
Come in! Sit in a Powerglide Chevrolet and drive home 
these facts. Here's finest no-shift driving at lowest cost; 
for all you have to do in ordinary driving is: Set the 
lever in "DRIVE" position—press on the accelerator—and 
glide along smoothly, silently, at any desired speed—with-
out clutch pedal or gearshifting! Remember—Chevrolet is 
the only low-priced car with Powerglide Automatic Trans-
mission and 105-h.p. Valve-in-Head Engine—the only low-
priced car offering the no-shift driving results listed behvg!- 

No Clutch Pedal-.. 

No Work to Driving! 
• 

Smoother Powerflow 

at All Speeds! 
• 

Levels Hills— 

Multiplies Thrills! *Conti:nation of Potosralido datomatti 
Tran.riniAtion and 10.5-11.p. Engine op-
tional on I)* Luae scuttle of tains coot 

So Much Simpler— 

So Much Safer! 

• 
FuIi Chevrolet Thrift 

in Over-all Driving! 
• 

Cuts Driver Fatigue— 

Increases Car Life! 

Com* 	drive a CItitvrotet ... and you'll 
•understand why it's 

FIRST . . . and FINEST 

... AT LOWEST COST! 

Come is ... drive a Chevrolet ... and yoe'll 
understand why it's 

AMERICA'S BEST SELLER 

DIMMITT MOTOR COMPATIRY S  BEST BUYI  
Frigidaire Goodrich Tires Chevrolet 

DIMMITT, TEXAS 
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15 MONTHS GUARANTEED SERVICE 
Lee Super Deluxe Tires at KIRKPATRICK SALES CO. 

       

       

Mr' WI"  
ADD YEARS OF LIFE TO 
BARNS, SILOS, ROOFS, 
AND FENCES WITH 

ROOF AND BARN PAINT/ 

WILLSON & SON LUMBER CO. 

3 	
our, WIDE ETWDECAIT. 

Shopping Hours Monday Through Satur,:ay 7:30 to 5:30 

See Us For Chrysler Airtemp Heating and Cooling Units 

WILLSON & SON LUMBER COMPANY 
	 ocgrab 74 • DIMMITT, TEXAS  	
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200 DRESSES 
One Lot 

+ Price 
One Lot 

1-3 Off 
All Sizes 

Group of 

LADIES SUITS 

-1 Price 
One Lot Skirts 

Crepe 
Lenins 
Cottons 

Price 2  

Piece Goods 
CLOSE OUT 
On One Lot 
Of Sheers. 
Voils, Swiss 

Bemberg 
Eyelets 

Priced To Sell 

One Group Of 

LADIES GLOVES 
All Colors 

$1.00 

MENS DRESS SHIRTS 

+ Price 
One Lot 

Men & Boys 

SWIM SUITS 

Price 

Novelty 

DRESS BUTTONS 
10c each 

Values Up to $1.00 

One Lot 

BOYS CLOTHES 
Sunsuits 
Rompers 

Boxer Shorts 
1 
2 Price 

DRESS STRAWS 

1-3 Off 
Ladies 
Mens 
Boys & 
Girls 

KEDS SHOES 

1 
2 Price 

Cleo Sewing Club 
Thursday, July 6th, the Cleo 

Sewing Club met with our presi-
dent, Mrs. A. A. Dodd. 

After a business meeting, the 
afternoon was spent in handwork 
and visiting. 

We set July 28th as the time 
for our annual chicken fry. It 
will be with Mr. and Mrs. Lil-
buo Arnold. We want a new 
name for our club so lets think 
real hard for a good one. 

Those present were Mesdames: 
G. B.• Duncan, Will Copeland, 
Bill Hembree, Lilburn Arnold, 
Dick Greathouse, Roy Smith, 
Ross Suninaess-^and grandaughter 
Debra Summers, H. H. Houtc-
hins, a visitor, Mrs. Sadie Hes-
lys of Baird and the hostess, 
Mrs. A. A. Dodd. 

The next meeting will be with 
Mrs. Elvis Burch. 

Reporter 

Mr. and Mrs. Lewis Ellison and 
family returned home Sunday 
from a vacation trip to Trinidad, 
Colo., where they visited her rel-
atives.. 

Mrs. L. H. Stevens visited her 
husband at Denver, Colo., where 
he was receiving medical treat-
ment last week-end. 

Mr. and Mrs. Lee McAfee and 
children, Mr. and Mrs. Sam May-
nard and children enjoyed an out-
ing and fishing Sunday at Dawn 
and Hereford Creek. 

Mr. and Mrs. Sam Maynard 
and Mr. and Mrs. Frank Hender-
son visited Mr. Robert Ballard at 
the Northwest Texas Hospital 
Tuesday. 

Dr. and Mrs. R. C. Russell and 
son, Tommy, were visitors in the 
home of Mr. and Mrs. Joe Cowen 
Saturday. Dr. Russell, a cousin of 
Mrs. Cowen, is teaching in Texas 
Tech this summer. 

News Want Ads Get Result:. 

We Are 

HEADQUARTERS 
FOR — 

Irrigation Supplies 
Among Our Complete Line Of 

Irrigation Suppies You Will Find 

M-M iligiGATION MOTORS 

TUBES 	DAMS 	DAM STOPS 

SHOVELS, Etc. 

SEE US FOR YOUR EVERY IRRIGATION NEED 

WE RENDER A COMPLETE SHOP SERVICE 

FOR YOUR MECHANICAL NEEDS 

Cooper Implement Co. 
M-M FARM MACHINERY 

JUL CLEARANCE SALE 
ALL SAES CASH & FINAL 

NO EXCHANGES NO TRY-ONS ON READY-TO-WEAR 	 OTHER 
STORE WILL BE CLOSED THURSDAY AFTERNOON IN PREPARATION FOR SALE 

DOORS WILL OPEN 9 a. m. FRIDAY, JULY 14 

BARGAINS NOT MENTIONED 

LADIES SHORTS 

-1- Price 
I Table of 

50c Assorted Items 

One Group 

GIRLS SHORTS 
Price  

One Lot 

-1 Price 
One 
1-f 

All Sizes 

One Lot Of 

SHORTY PAJAMAS 
for 

Girls 

$1 
& 

1)0 
Women 

One Lot 
Girls & Ladies 

SWIM SUITS 
Price 

One Group 
Girls Denim 

SPORT SUITS 

-12- Price 
One Lot 

Ladies & Girls 

SANDALS & SHOES 
Broken Sizes 

+ Price 

flotti ITS 

1-3 Off 

Mens Summer 

SUITS 
Style - Mart 

1-3 Off 

MANNING'S DEPT. STORE DIMMITT TEXAS  
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