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Guilty pleas were entered 	  
in 242nd District Court here 
last Thursday by Joe L. Gar-
cia and Martina Garcia of 
Dimmitt, husband and wife, 
who pleaded guilty to felony 
theft (welfare fraud) and were 
each placed on 7-year pro-
bation. 

good Harvest reports ire 
They were charged with 

taking food stamps under 
fraudulent pretenses. In addi-
tion to the probated senten-
ces, each was assessed a fine 
of $175 plus court costs and 
they were ordered to pay res-
titution of $4,735 plus 6 per-
cent interest. 

The couple paid a total of 
$1,500 at the trial last Thurs-
day and agreed to pay out the 
remainder in monthly pay-
ments. 

through of incremental costs 
of acquiring new gas supplies. 

"The Gas Users Associa-
tion was against incremental 
pricing of gas, and we were 
successful in getting agricul-
ture exempted from incre-
mental pricing, through Con-
gressman Mahon's office," 
Riley said. 

Irrigation gas users also 
wanted agricultural gas to be 
granted high-priority status in 
the bill, in case of future 
shortages, but on this issue 
they got only half a loaf. 

"The compromise bill does 
allow for priorities, but names 
the Secretary of Agriculture 
as the person to set the pri-
orities," Riley said. "We 
wanted agriculture to have a 
high priority without it going 
through the Secretary of Ag-
riculture. We're just hoping 
we will get some fairness on 
it." 

In addition to helping ir-
[See GAS BILL, Page 6] 

Natural gas used for agri-
culture in Texas will finally 
come under price regulation if 
a compromise bill now before 
Congress passes. 

The compromise bill, part 
of President Carter's energy 
package, is scheduled to come 
up for a vote in the House of 
Representatives today (Thurs-
day). The Senate already has 
approved the compromise 
measure, which was hammer-
ed out by a joint House-Sen-
ate committee. 

Passage of the measure to-
day "would have special sig-
nificance for our area in that it 
would, at the very least, place 
us under the control of the 
Texas Railroad Commission 
for the pricing of irrigation 
gas," said Ray Joe Riley of 
Sunnyside, a director of the 
Plains Irrigation Gas Users 
Association. 

Also, Riley said, the com-
promise bill would exempt ag-
ricultural users from the pass- 

County Attorney Jimmy 
Davis said, "We hope this is 
a start in turning this food 
stamp fraud situation around. 
The State Welfare Depart-
ment investigators tell us oth-
er people are being investi-
gated in similar cases and 
there will probably be more 
charges coming. We've told 
them to send them on, be-
cause we need to get this 
stopped.- 

Another guilty plea entered 
in Judge Van Stovall's 242nd 
District Court was by Larry 
Paul Pool, 35, who was charg-
ed with second offense driv-
ing while intoxicated. 

He was given a 3-year 
felony probation, fined $250 
and ordered to get counseling 
at the Central Plains Rehabil-
itation Unit in Plainview. 

Bonfire will spark 
Homecoming spirit 

times in this pasture. Alicia Rodriquez, 12, was killed instantly 
when she was thrown from the vehicle, and six of the car's nine 
other passengers were injured. The car's driver, 27-year-old 
Daniel Mata, has been charged with involuntary manslaughter. 

FATAL WRECK SCENE—Dozens of onlookers gather Sunday 
afternoon at the scene of this fatal accident four miles north of 
Nazareth, where this 1965 Pontiac veered off State 168, ripped 
through a fence at the top of an incline and overturned several 

* 

Schulte files 
as write-in in 
Precinct 4 

Girl, 12, dies in Sunday mishap 

Gilbert Schulte of Nazareth 
filed Monday as a write-in 
candidate for Precinct 4 com-
missioner. 

Dimmitt High students will 
set off a big bonfire, also the 
Homecoming weekend activi-
ties at 8 p.m. today (Thurs-
day) on the grounds east of 
the school building. 

All ex-students and other 
area residents are invited for 
the evening of excitement 
which will include crowning of 
the Flame King and Queen. 
The street east of the gym will 
be blocked off to accommo-
date the crowd, according to 
Ralph Smith, who is coordi-
nating activities. 

The public is invited again 
Friday afternoon for the pep 
rally at which the Homecom-
ing Queen will be crowned. 
Chosen from DHS students, 
identity of the royalty is not 
announced until the time of 
coronation. 

ces and a Sheriff's Dept. car 
were needed to bring the acci-
dent victims to Plains Mem-
orial Hospital. A Dennis Fun-
eral Home hearse brought the 
dead girl to Dimmitt. Her 
body was taken to Uvalde 
Monday for funeral services. 

The dead girl's sister, 14-
year-old Esmerelda Rodri-
quez, received a dislocated 
hip, contusions and abrasions 
in the accident. 

They're the daughters of 
Dora Rodriquez, resident of 
the Agricultural Housing Pro-
ject here. Mrs. Rodriquez was 
not in the car; she was visit- 

Each high school class dec-
orated a section of school 
halls. Students dressed dur-
ing the week to emphasize 
different aspects of school 
spirit. 

After the pep rally a bar-
becue supper will be served 
by the school's Future Home-
makers at Richardson Ele-
mentary cafeteria, open to the 
public. Serving hours will be 5 
to 7:30 p.m. 

Climax of the weekend will 
be the Dimmitt-Lockney 
Homecoming game at 8 p.m. 
Friday. It will be followed by 
the Homecoming Dance in 
Richardson Elementary cafe-
teria. 

The DHS Class of 1958 will 
hold its 20-year reunion this 
weekend, attending Friday 
night's game as a group. A 
brunch is planned at 9:30 
a.m. Saturday in the Colonial 
Inn Restaurant. Attendance of 
60 is expected, including 
spouses and children of the 
members. 

The class which won the 
hall decorating contest Tues-
day night will also be an-
nounced at the pep rally, 
which will start at 3:10 p.m. 

He will oppose Alfons (All 
Maurer, who won the Demo-
cratic nomination over four 
other candidates in the May 
primary. 

Schulte, 46, has lived all his 
life in Precinct 4. He and his 
son, Duane, operate farmland 
and grassland near Nazareth 
and Arney. Schulte is a Dem-
ocrat. 

ing friends in Easter when the 
fatal accident occurred. 

Others hospitalized at 
Plains Memorial after the 
Sunday accident were: 

—Dora Alvarez, 23, of Dim-
mitt, contusions and thoracic 
injury: 

—Lorena Alvarez, 2, of 
Ditnmitt, concussion; 

—Ofelia Lopez, 47, of Dim-
mitt, contusions and thoracic 
injury; 

—Alma Lopez, 15, of Dim-
mitt, fractured left clavicle, 
multiple contusions and lac-
erations of the face and scalp; 
and 

Corn and milo harvest is 
nearing completion in Sunny-
side and is in full swing 
everywhere else in the coun-
ty. 

Vegetable harvest is also in 
full swing as lettuce, carrots 
and sugar beets are now 
being delivered to local veg-
etable sheds. 

The wind and rain appar-
ently had little effect on the 
quality of this year's corn. 
The major complaints of farm-
ers are of worm infestation 
and corn borers. 

All yields were reported 
good, and some better than 
last year. Dimmitt Agri In-
dustries, Inc., in Nazareth re-
ported yields ranging from 
4,000 to 10,000 pounds per 
acre. 

Elevator operators said 
farmers are dissatisfied in the 
crop prices so far. J. R. 
Brown at Flagg Grain Co. said 
there was not enough profit to 
offset last year's losses. 

Gene King at Easter Grain 
said farmers in that area were 
halfway through their corn 
harvest and only one-fourth 
into milo, and that it would be 
after frost before they would 
finish their milo harvest. 

Ronnie Truelock at Farmers 
Grain in Hart said that the 
corn harvest in the Hart com-
munity is nine-tenths com-
pleted. The quality is good, 
he said, but corn yields are 
down and the milo yields "are 
not what the farmers would 
like." 

Ten days with good weather 
will be enough to complete 
the harvest at Sunnyside, ac-
cording to a spokesman at 
Sunnyside Grain and Supply. 
In spite of adverse weather 
and insect problems, farmers 
there are generally pleased 
with grain yields this year. 

Albert Maxwell of LaMan-
tia, Cullum and Collier, Inc. 
said lettuce growers are in the 
middle of their harvest right 
now and anticipate being fin-
ished in two weeks if the wea-
ther holds out. Harvest of late 
carrots started about a week 
ago, he said, and should go 

[See HARVESTING, Page 6] 

Bob Lindsey named 

Country Club pro 

Sides, Huseman 
earn Gold Stars 

—Loretta Reyna, 40, of 
Bovine, broken ankle. 

Two other occupants of the 
car, 3-year-old Jerry Reyna of 
Bovina and another of Mrs. 
Alvarez's young daughters, 
were treated and released. 

The car's occupants were 
going to Buffalo Lake for a 
picnic when the fatal accident 
occurred, according to com-
panions who were following in 
another car. 

Mata's Pontiac veered off 
the pavement four miles north 
of Nazarth, crossed a barditch 
and an incline, and ripped 
through a fence into a level 
pasture, where it started over-
turning, according to State 
Trooper Dyrle Maples, who 
investigated. 

The car came to rest on its "I'm running mainly be-
cause so many people have 
asked me to," he said. "I 
would like to serve the people 
of Precinct 4 and the rest of 
the county. If elected, I'll 
strive to do the best I can." 

(See WRECK, Page 6] 

A 12-year-old girl was killed 
and six other persons were 
injured Sunday afternoon 
when a speeding car carrying 
10 persons to a picnic careen-
ed off of State 168 north of 
Nazareth and overturned 2 1/4  
times in a pasture. 

Killed instantly was Alicia 
Rodriquez, who was thrown 
from the 1965 Pontiac as it 
overturned in the pasture. 

The Texas Highway Patrol 
has filed a charge of invol-
untary manslaughter against 
the car's driver, Daniel Mata, 
27, of Dimmitt. The third-
degree felony charge carries a 
sentence of two to 10 years' 
imprisonment upon convic-
tion. 

Mata, who was not injured 
in the accident, is free on 
$7,500 bond pending Grand 
Jury action on the charge. 

Two city-county ambulan- 

Juniors sponsoring 

homecoming dance 
Hobby names Riley 

state tax advisor 
After graduating from Naz-

areth High School, Schulte 
served two years in the US 
Army (anti-aircraft), then 
started his farming operation 
in 1954. He married Dolores 
Huseman in 1956. The Schul-
tes have six children—Duane, 
22; Elaine, 20, a junior at 
Wayland Baptist College; 
Rosemary Kleman, 19; Ka-
ren, 18, a freshman at How-
ard County College; Calvin, 
14; and Rodney, 12. 

parents are Mr. and Mrs. 
Louis Huseman. 

A member of the Bethel 
4-H Club and County 4-H 
Junior Leaders, Kim is a 
junior in Dimmitt High 
School. David attends Naza-
reth High and is in the Naza-
reth 4-H Club for the fourth 
year. 

Both are current presidents 
of their clubs, have taken part 
in a number of 4-H projects, 
attended the summer electric 
camp and other inter-club 
events. Kim served as a page 
at the district meeting of 
Texas Home Demonstration 
Association this year. David 
was a state winner in mech- 

[See 4-H AWARDS, Page 10] 

Kim Sides and Dav Huse-
man are the 1978 Gold Star 
4-H girl and boy in Castro 
County, both holding the title 
as the second in their re-
spective families. 

Gold Star awards were pre-
sented by County Judge Wel-
don Bradley at the annual 
County 4-H Awards banquet 
in the Richardson Elementary 
School Saturday. The county 
winners and their parents will 
be recognized at the district 
Gold Star program Nov. 20 at 
Lubbock. 

Kim is the daughter of Mr. 
and Mrs. George Sides. Her 
sister Cinde was the County 
Gold Star girl three years ago. 
Huseman's brother Paul held 
the boy's title last year. Their 

Ray Joe Riley of Sunnyside 
has been appointed by Lt. 
Gov. Bill Hobby to the State 
Property Tax Study Commit-
tee Advisory Committee to 
the Texas Legislative Council. 

Six other Texans have been 
named to the advisory com-
mittee, which will study the 
equity, assessment and ap-
praisal practices relating to ad 
valorem taxes on tangible and 
intangible properties. 

The Junior Class of Dim-
mitt High School will sponsor 
the Homecoming dance Fri-
day following the Bobcat-
Lockney game, the final 
scheduled school event of the 
annual DHS Homecoming 
weekend. 

Not only students and exes, 
but any others who wish to 
attend the dance in Richard-
son Elementary cafeteria are 
invited. Admission will be $2 
a person. 

Music will be presented by 
an Amarillo disc jockey, Frank 
Garrett of Tumbleweed Tal-
ents. 

Angelo State; and Kent, who 
is employed by Hill Feed 
Lots. 

The Lindseys are charter 
members of the Castro Coun-
ty Country Club. 

"I would like to see all 
members utilize the fine facil-
ities we have here," Lindsey 
said. "The golf course is in 
great shape and we intend to 
keep it that way. 

"We would especially like 
to see our younger members 
utilize the course." 

Lindsey also stated that 
lessons will start next spring. 

[Readings recorded at 7 
a.m. daily for the preceding 
24 hours.] 

Hi Lo 
Thursday 	 87 	46 
Friday 	  67 	37 
Saturday 	 71 	36 
Sunday 	 80 52 
Monday 	 82 52 
Tuesday 	 81 	45 
Wednesday 	84 45 
October Moisture .. .. 	0 
1978 Moisture 	 12.76 

KDHN RADIO 
US Weather Observer 

Bob Lindsey was appointed 
as full-time golf pro Oct. 1 by 
the Castro County Country 
Club Board of Directors. 

Lindsey will fill the vacancy 
recently left by the resigna-
tion of former pro Joe Ziegler. 

Lindsey will continue to 
operate his local real estate 
business, Lindsey Real Es-
tate. 

Lindsey and his wife Doris 
have resided in Dimmitt since 
1955. They have four child-
ren, Dr. Robert Lindsey Jr. of 
Plainview; Jeff, a junior at 
DHS; Kim, a sophomore at 

Put them all 
together, they spell . 

nights a week on the signs, with an average of 25 to 30 of the club's 68 members 
showing up for each work session. Behind the sign panels, from left, are Raynell 
Fagan, Ima Herrera, Joe Raper, Judy Lumpkin, Valerie Broadstreet, Ricky 
Rickerd, Bobby Harvey, Angela Ross, Lisa Polivoda and Kim Weatherford. 

Dimmitt High School's Art Club is teaming with the Chamber of Commerce to 
produce two huge black-and-white "welcome" signs to be placed at highway 
entrances to the city. The students, supervised by Art Club Sponsor Sue 

• Broderson and a different set of parents each night, have been working two 



ham spent the weekend in 
Amarillo with three other sis-
ters. They planned to go to 
the Dinner Theatre and talk 
and talk. 

Bill and Katy Graham of 
McLean came down for Sun-
day dinner with their daugh-
ter Mary and Kent Gabel, his 
mother Rachel and Perry and 
Kim Graham. Billie and Kim 
were birthday people. 

Charlie E. Armstrong took 
his mules to Ruidoso last 
weekend and he will show 
them this coming weekend. 
They are fun animals I hear 
tell. 

Mrs. Ted Sheffy was host-
ess to the needlepoint girls 
with a salad luncheon Thurs-
day. Her guests were Nancy 
Hays from Hereford, Shirley 
Stephens, Esta Vandiver, Ca-
role Dyer, Sue Merritt and 
Myrtle Lois Moran. 

* 
Dr. Bob Bradford and wife 

Paula bought a house in Or-
ange, where he will be with a 
mental health clinic. The land 
agent was George Snapka, the 
son of E. G. Snapka, whose 
family had a store in Flagg 
probably 40 years ago. Bill 
was another son of the E. G. 
Snapkas. 

Juan and Corinna Montalbo 
went to Levelland last week-
end to visit folks and to attend 
a baby shower for Mrs. Al-
fonso Mendosa, a relative. 

Leora Calhoun spent last 
week in Clovis visiting her 
daughter Bobbie Chester and 
her daughters Diane and Con-
nie Rogers and Leora's great 
grands, Susanne Fitzgerald 
and Pam Cox. 

WRESTUNC 

WITH 

OUR 

FEARS 

Our fears seem as big and as terrible as this alligator sometimes, don't they? 
Fear about this thing and that can paralyze us and prevent us from' doing our 

daily work. 
Many of our fears are real. A great many of our fears, however, are unfounded 

— a result of thinking and worrying about ourselves. Sir John Denham phrased 
it this way: 

"My fears are causeless and ungrounded, 
Fantastic dreams and melancholy fumes." 
There is only one thing that will dispel fear of this type. We must do something 

to get out of ourselves. That means loving and helping others. 
The Bible puts it so well in I John 4:18. "There is no fear in love; but perfect 

love casteth out fear; because fear bath torment. He that feareth is not made 
perfect in love." 

The Church is God's Agency designed to help you. We invite you to attend this 
week. 

_a 

FIRST UNITED METHODIST 
CHURCH 

Howard Oulett, Pastor 
110 S.W. Third 

Phone 647-4106 or 647-4107 
Sunday— 
Sunday School 	 9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship 	10:45 a.m. 
MYF, Jr. Hi & Sr. Hi 	 5:30 p.m. 
'Evening Worship 	6.30 p.m. 
Wednesday— 
General Meeting 
WSCS 	 9.30 a.m. 
Choir 	  7:30 p.m.  

FIRST BAPTIST CHURCH 
1201 Western Circle Drive 
Rev. John Street, Pastor 

Sunday— 
Sunday School 	 9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship 	11:00 a.m. 
Training Union 	6.00 p.m. 
Evening Worship 	7.00 p.m. 

rednesday—
• 

rayer Meeting 	 7:30 p.m. 
Choir Rehearsal 	810 p.m. 

ASSEMBLY OF GOD CHURCH 
Gary Cook, Pastor 

302 S.E. 2nd 
• Sunday— 

Sunday School 	 9:45 a.m.  
Morning Worship 	11:00 a.m. 
Christ Ambassadors and 
Children's Church 	 6:00 p.m. 

Evangelistic Service 	 7:00 p.m. 
Wednesday— 

' -Week Service 	 8:00 p.m. 

CHURCH OF CHRIST 
[Northsidel 

Third and Nelsen Streets 
Leonard Tittle, Minister 

Phone 847-5284 
Sunday— 
Bible Study 	 9:30 a.m. 
Morning Worship ....10:30 a.m.  
Evening Worship 	6.00 p.m 
Wednesday— 
Ladies Class 	 2.00 p.m. 
Mid-Week Service 	 8:00 p.m. 
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STILL JUST AS 
BEAUTIFUL! 

BUT GUESS WHO WAS 
50 YESTERDAY 

(Oct 1 1 ) 

HAYS IMPLEMENT 	CASTRO COUNTY NEWS 	HIGGINBOTHAM-BARTLETT CO. 

GOODPASTURE, INC. 
[Dimmitt Plant] 
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SEALE FLORIST 
Ph. 647-3554 

DIMMITT '66' INC. 
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Shisfifyls CIS  

Men are coming home from Navy, Peace Corps 
ing to get the corn cut before 
more rains come. Most of the 
fields are finished. Then the 
maize, then cotton, then the 
farmers will plow the land 

-ready for next year. 

By MYRTLE SHEFFY Tuggle served fruit punch and 
home baked cookies from a 
table covered with lace trim-
med linen. The centerpiece 
was of fall flowers. Mary 
Cluck, Opha Burks and Dalia 
Gregory helped with the serv-
ing. Showing the gifts and as-
sisting with other hostess du-
ties were Mildred Bradford, 
Daisy Langford, Katy Wright, 
Shirley Wise, Lois Wales, 
Doris Lust, Joy Jones, Dor-
othy Sheffy, Billie Gwen Da-
vis and Kathryn Birdwell. 

Penetha Armstrong was in 
Marlin near Waco last week 
visiting her sister. Penetha is 
a regular worker at the Senior 
Citizens Center. Do remem-
ber to go to the social time 
Tuesday evenings at 7 p.m. 
Games of 42, 84, bridge, 
whatever you like, with a re-
freshment and visiting time. 

Northwest. They made a stop 
in Las Vegas, on through 
Nevada to Utah. A stop in 
Colorado, report the aspens a 
lovely gold color, at their peak 
last week. 

Flora Stanford went to Al-
buquerque for a few days visit 
with her son Paul and Betty. 

Viola and B. M. Nelson 
went to Albuquerque Friday 
for a weekend visit with Mary 
and Herb Burnham and their 
three sons. They saw that big 
show of a hundred colorful 
balloons go up over the city. 
These are the huge Army 
type, not toys. 

Curtis and Marie Tate went 
to Moorly for the Kay family 
reunion and a visit with her 
mother, sister and other kin 
folks. 

Kenneth and Ruth Jackson 
went to Conchas last weekend 
to winterize the little house 
near the lake. Think Ben and 
Bernice keep their house 
ready for cold weather. Many 
people go to that Lake, the 
Gene Smiths, the DiCuffas. 

* 

PROPER FUELS 

DR. JAMES E. 

WOHLGEMUTH 

OPTOMETRIST 

300 West Bedford 

Ph. 647-4464, Dimmitt, TX 

1 

AND 

Janet Stanford will write 
the Chatter next week for me, 
so please call your news to 
Janet at 647-4227 before 10 
a.m. Monday.  

Lottie Bearden is home 
from a month's visit in Pueb-
lo, Colo. with her kin Vada 
and Andrew Bolton. They 
made a tour of the mountains 
and report the fall foliage 
quite colorful. 

* 

Last Tuesday night the Te-
xas Tech and WTSU women's 
softball teams played here in 
Dimmitt at the field west of 
town, with Tech winning the 
first night 14 to 10. The 
second night the WTSU girls 
came in first 26 to 2. Debbie 
Murdock plays with West 
Texas. After the game Mrs. 
Bobby Murdock served sup-
per to 30 people, the umpires, 
coaches and WT's team. 

The week before the Mur-
docks went to Denton to see 
the WT girls play. Brad 
marched here with the Bobcat 
Band, then flew down to see 
Debbie play. He also visited 
his friend Kyle Yates and 
mom Dee and the other boys. 

Art and Eula Jeans Kasherl  
will celebrate their 25th wed-
ding anniversary Oct. 19 with 
a reception in their home at 
503 SW 4th St. The Kashers 
have two children Michael 
and Kathy, and her sister 
Virgie and Fred Moulton will 
help with host and hostess 
duties. Art is a dispatcher at 
the sheriff's office and they 
spent five years in Alaska, 
where he was with the Fed-
eral Aviation Administration. 
You are invited to the re- 

EFFICIENT SERVICE 
Makes for 

MORE PROFITABLE 
FARMING 
Ihat's where we come in when you need 

• PROPANE • DIESEL 
• GAPLINE 

OR 

ARCO OILS AND GREASES 
Including Arco Graphite, highly recommended 

for more efficient engine operation. 

ception. 

Virginia Gilbreath was host-
ess at a dessert and bridge 
party Thursday. She served 
that very good fresh coconut 
cake and coffee to Ceal Car-
lile, Maxine Tidwell, Betty 
Huckabay, Jeanie Miller, Ani-
ta Morris, Dorothy Elder, 
Reba Touchstone and Edna 
Riley. 

Ina Cleavinger was hostess 
to the Thursday bridge play-
ing friends. She served des-
sert to Dorothy Gilbreath, 
Ruth Jackson, Shirley Wise, 
Mona Merritt, Polly Simpson, 
Mildred Bradford, Carolyn 
Jones, Jo Eddie Riley and 
Martha Dannevik. 

Mrs. Dan Shipley was host-
ess at a salad and dessert 
luncheon Friday to that group 
of bridge players. They were 
Bobbie Damron, Josie Brad-
ford, Bernice Hill, Billie 
Cluck, Myrtle Sheffy, Carolyn 
Copeland, Betty Renfro, Cle-
tha George, Opal Beardon, 
who won high score, and 
Retta Cluck, a close second. 

The Shipleys live on Clovis 
Road between Kenneth Heard 
and Ronnie Parker. Several 
new houses are being build on 
Sunset Circle west of the high 
school. 

* 

Mrs. Dean Smithson, the 
former Benita Cox Noble of 
Lubbock, was the honor guest 
at a party and bridal shower 
Saturday afternoon in the 
home of Mrs. Jim Cleavinger. 
Mrs. Rayphard Smithson was 
in the receiving line to greet 
the guests. Linda Roberts was 
at the guest book. Janet 

Mr. and Mrs. Clyde Vick, 
her brother Clarence and Lee 
Norris went to Battle Creek, 
Mich. last week to visit her 
parents Mr. and Mrs. John 
Norris. This weekend Johnny 
Vick and his sister Rita went 
north to see Mr. Norris, and 
Saturday Clara and Clyde 
went to Amarillo to visit Janie 
and little granddaughter. 

Geneva Dennis and her 
sister Zoe Garvin from Gra- 

Several ladies spent a few 
days at Angel Fire, N.M. 
staying in the Gregory house, 
mostly to see the beautiful fall 
colors of the trees. Several 
went to Taos for the art shows 
and made the antique shops..  
Going were Ellen Gregory, 
Janice Bell, Evie Paxton and 
baby, Valeria Millsap Davis, 
Becky Killingsworth, Bonnie 
Koeninger and Mollie Scott. 

Polly Bell is home from a 
two week visit with her sister 
Mary Blair and Mr. B. at 
Missoula, Mont. She reports 
the foliage and scenery fan-
tastically beautiful. They 
made several tours of the 
area. Polly's dad had a small 
ranch in that area many years 
ago. 

Everyone is very busy try- 

VARDELL FUELS 
Call 647-3174 For Farm Delivery 

East Highway 86 
- 	- 

IGLESIA DEtHRISTO 
EA.ei ad r.E. Third 	 

Evanoefista — Miguel Zuniga 
Sunday— 
Bible Study 	10:00 a.m. 
Morning Worship....11:00 a.m. 
Evening Worship 	6.00 p.m. 
Wednesday— 
Bible Classes for all... 7:30 p.m. 

PIIIMERA IGLESIA 
BAtiTISTA MEXICANA 

300 N.E. 7th 
Pastor Van E. Hughes 
Secretaria Sara Salinas 

Tesorero Gabriel Montle) 
Domingo: 
Estudios Biblicos.... 10:00 a.m., 
El Sermon 	 11:00 a.m. 
Miercoles: 
Instruccion Biblica.... 8:00 p.m4 

BIENVENIDOS A TODOS! 

PATRUELL- 

ERO 

* 

* Friday & Saturday * 

CARLILE 
Jheatze 	WHILE the 1978 cotton 

Dirnrni , Te;a: * crop will be down in the US, ft 

* ***AC*** 	up slightly over last year. 
foreign production should be 

The Church is God's appointed agency in this world for spreading the knowledge of His love 

for man and of His demand for man to respond to that love by loving his neighbor. Without 

this grounding in the love of God, no government or society or way of life will long 

persevere and the freedoms which we hold so dear will inevitably perish. Therefore, even 

from a selfish point of view, one should support the Church for the sake of the welfare 

of himself and his family. Beyond that, however, every person should uphold and par-

ticipate in the Church because it tells the truth about man's life, death and destiny; the 

truth which alone will set him free to live as a child of God. 
Colemon Adv. Ser. 

The National Eagle Scout 
Association in the South 
Plains Council of the Boy 
Scouts of America has an-
nounced the beginning of an 
Eagle Scout Round-Up. This 
program is designed to en-
courage all Eagle Scouts re-
gardless of their age or oc-
cupation to join the National 
Eagle Scout Association 
(MESA). 

Formed in 1972, NESA 
plans to identify and involve 
Eagle Scouts in a meaningful 
fellowship that will enhance 
the program of the Boy Scouts 
of America. 

NESA provides all Eagle 
Scouts with the opportunity to 
continue active involvement 
with Scouting while main-
taining and initiating friend-
ship and experiences through 
the Scouting program. The 
association is for Eagle Scouts 
of all ages, and local chapters 
are being established in Scout 
Councils across the United 
States. 

It is estimated that there 
are nearly 500,000 living 
Eagle Scouts in the United 
States today, according to 
Council Chairman Rick Pal-
mer. 

For more information about 
the Eagle Scout Round-Up 
and the National Association, 
Eagle Scouts are encouraged 
to call the South Plains Coun-
cil at 747-2631, or visit the 
NESA booth at the 1978 
Scout-O-Rama Nov. 11 at the.. 
Lubbock Memorial Civic Cen-
ter. 

Eagle Scouts 
being listed 
in Roundup 

We were chatting with Jan-
et Broadstreet Sunday and 
she tells us that her husband 
Dale Broadstreet and his bro-
ther Curtis will be home from 
a long stint in the Navy next 
week. The boys have been 
gone two years and have 
stopped off in the Philippines, 
on to Australia, back to Hong 
Kong and across to Hawaii. 
The parents Laura and Harold 
Broadstreet haven't seen 
them in seven months. The 
boys will have 30 days in 
Dimmitt, be released from the 
Navy in January maybe. Dale 
and Janet have a two-year-old 
son named Christopher Joe. 

Larry Gamble is home for a 
while to see granddad Glover 
Frazier, grandmother Mary 
Lou and his dad G. B. Frazier. 
His mom Sally is in Plainview. 
Larry has been with the Peace 
Corps in South America. 

The Beta Sigma Phi ladies 
were hostesses at a Harvest 
Hoedown Saturday evening at 
the Expo Building. A'llan 
Bradley was chairman of the 
committee on decorations. 
Jan Baca is president of the 
club and 350 people came. 
Among whom were Donna 
and Mike Bruegel from Am-
arillo, Sheri Bruegel from San 
Marcos and Teresa from Den-
ton. Many from out of town 
such as James and Poppy 
Head from Hereford, Jerri 
Butler from Lubbock, Gene 
and Sharri Bradley from near 
Friona. Others there and 
guests of Carl and Gail Brue-
gel were Sherri Fowler from 
San Marcos, Elvin and Jana 
Jackson and Mr. and Mrs. 
Tommy Chapman from Child-
ress. The music makers were 
Country Good Times from 
Lubbock. 

Did you hear that Charles 
and Jill McLean are the par-
ents of a new baby girl? She 
came Oct. 5, her name is 
Summer Lynn. Grandparents 
are Bob and Helen McLean 
and Chet and Helen Braa-` 
fladt, great grand is Mrs. Gal-
loup who lives at South Hills 
Manor. 

Ralph and Amy Glover and 
Joe and Dugan Butler are 
home from a good trip to the 

* Phone 641-3239 * 
;* For Starting Time * 

* Thursday * 

'LEE STREET 
BAPTIST CHURCH 

Ronnie Travis, Pastor 
Phony 647-2300 

Sunday- 
Sunday School 	 9:45 a.rn, 
Morning Worship 	11:00 a.m. 
Training Union 	6. 00 p.m. 
Evening Worship 	TOO p.m. 
Wednesday— 
Mid-Week Services 	 8:00 p.m. 

CHURCH-OF GOD 
OF PROPHECY 

Meeting in City Hall ' 
Community Room 

Donald Price, Pastor 
Phone 647-3403 

Sunday— 
Sunday School 	 10:00 a.m, 
Morning Worship....11:00 a.m:.  
Children's Church.... 5:3Q p.m. 
Evangelist Service.... 6:00 p.M. 

CHURCH OF THE NAZARENE 
5th andHalsell 

, 	Rev. Delbert Fish, Pastor_ _ _ 
Phone 647-2661 

Sunday—_ _ 
unday School 	 10:00 a.m. 

Morning Worship 	,_11:00 a.m. 
Evening Worship.:t_:_. 6:00 p.m,' 
Wednesday Service... 7:00 p.m. 

PRESBYTERIAN CHURCH 
Western Circle Drive 

Rev. Ed Manning, Minister 
Sunday— 
Church School 	10:00 a.m. 
Common Worship... 11:00 a.m. 

LA IGLESIA DE DIOS 
DEL PRIMOJENITO 

East Helsel! St. 
Pastor, Gustavo Ornelas 

Sunday School 	 10:00 a.m 
Sermon 	  11:00 a.m 
Lord's Supper and 

Feet Washing 	 11:30 a.m 
Evening Worship 	710 p.m 
Wednesday Services . 7:30 p.m 

FIRST CHRISTIAN CHURCH 
600 Western Drive 

Roy E. Barringer, Minister 
Phone 647-5478 

Sunday— 
Bible Study 	 9:45 a.m.  
Morning Worship and 

Lord's Supper 	 10:45 a.m 
Evening Worship 	6- 00 p.m .  
Wednesday— 
Bible Study 	710 p.m 

MACEDONIA BAPTIST 
CHURCH 

412 North East Street 
Sunday— 
Sunday School 	 9:45 a.m. 
Morning Worship 	11:00 a.m. 
Training Union 	6.00 p.m. 
Evening Worship 	TOO p.m. 
Monday W.M.0 	 4:30 p.m. 
Tuesday Brotherhood 	 7:55 p.m. 
Wednesday— 
Prayer Meeting 	 7:30 p.m. 
Sanctuary Choir 	 Friday 

IMMACULATE CONCEPTION 
CATHOLIC CHURCH 

Rev. Raphael Chen, Pastor 
1001 W. Halsell — Ph. 647-4219 
Sunday— 
Mass in English 	TOO a.rn. 
Mass in Spanish 	 10:30 a.m 
ljteliglon Classes 	9.30 a.m. 
Monday, Tuesday & Saturday— 
Mass 	  7:00 a.m.  
Holy Days— 
Mass in English 	TOO a.m. 
Mass in Spanish 	8.00  p.m .  
Confessions— 
Friday 	• 	TOO to 8:00 p.m.  
Baptism by Appointment 

SUNNYSIDE BAPTIST 
CHURCH 

Raymond Jones, Pastor 
Sunday— 
Sunday School 	 10:00 a.m. 
Morning Worship....11:00 a.m. 
Training Union 	6.00 p.m. 
Evening Worship 	7. 00 p.m. 
Wednesday— 
Prayer Servioe 	 7:30 p.m. 

MISSION PENTECOSTES 
404 N.E. 8th St. 

• Sunday School 	 10:00 a.m. 
Sunday Evangelistic.. 7:00 p.m. 
Wed. Prayer Service.. 8:00 p.m. 
Friday Bible Study.... 8:00 p.m. 

CHURCH OF CHRIST 
S.W. 4th at Bedford 
Dale Wells, Minister 

Sunday— 
Bible Study 	 9:30 a.m. 
Morning Worship ....10:30 a.m. 
Evening Worship 	6.00 p.m. 
Wednesday— 
Bible Class for all 	7.30 p.m. 

NEW HOPE MEMORIAL 
BAPTIST CHURCH 

Rev. James Alexander, Pastor 
Sunday School 	 10:00 a.m. 
Morning Worship 	 .11:00 a.m. 
Evening Worship 	7.30 p.m. 
Wednesday— 
Mid-Wk Services... 7:30 p.m. 

Nailed Throes!. the Cooperation of the tonal Ministerial Association and 'Sponsored by tin Undersigned halividesis end Business institutions 

DIMMITT EQUIPMENT CO. 
DIMMITT TV CABLE 

I 	DENNIS FLORAL & GIFTS 
Across From the Hnenitql 
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CORN Green Giant Golden  

$1 00  3 for 16 oz PORK & BEANS  Van Camps 

20 oz.  57c 

22 oz. 67c 
gallon 79C 

3 for$II N  

32 oz. 85C 

32 oz. 99C 

Del Monte 

Perky 

Creme Pies 
4 count 

12 oz. 

MinUte Maid 

97C 

Corn on 
the Cob 

Birdseye 
4 count 

79C 

25 lb. $499  DOG FOOD  Friskies Beef or Sauce Cubes 

Pilsbury 

CAKE MIX 
Layer  Cake 	59c 

FROSTING 
Ready to Spread 	9c 

16 oz. 99  

CASCADE  Dishwashing Detergent 

HUNGRY JACK  Instant Potatoes 

BATHROOM TISSUE 

PINE SOL.  Disinfectant  

FLOUR  Gladiola 

LICORICE.  Sathers Assorted Colors 

PARKAY  Soft Margarine 

FLOUR  Gladiola 

COOKIES  Marshmallow, Sathers 

INSTANT TEA  White  Swan  

ANTI FREEZE  Prestone 

UNDERWOOD  Devhd  Ham 

SHORTENING  White Swan  

FURNITURE POLISH Woodcraft  

BUBBLE BATH and SHAMPOO  VaRi.Pak  

Zee Nice-n-Soft 

214 oz. 3 
for 

$1 OO 

25 lb. Bag. $349 

5 lb. Bag 79c 

3 pk $lw  „  

2$100  pkgs 

4-Roll 79C  

42.z. $129 

28 oz. $139 

gallon $329 

16 oz. 69C 

16 OZ. 89C 

3 oz. 9 59  

35 oz. $1 19  

32 oz. 99 

CHILI 

HAMS  Boneless  

SAUSAGE 

BACON 

$399 
10 oz. 

Owens 	1 lb. Roll 

DIMMITT 
SUPER MARKET 

Mini Half Farmland 

$3.00 VALUE 
ONLY $239 

Individually Wrapped Bars 

BAMA FRUIT DRINKS 	 10 oz. 4 f
or$1 00  

14 oz $1 43  

TURKEY and GRAVY .. Sliced j"nle °S  1 " 

CHEDDAR CHEESE  Longhorn Salad Black  $1 69 

TURKEY BOLOGNA  Plantation Beauty 1 lb. pk99 

NESCAFE 
Instant Coffee 

109 Belsher Street, Dimmitt 	Store Hours: 7 a.m. 'HI 9 p.m. 

We Give Double Gunn Bros. Stamps On Tuesdays And Wednesdays. 

SPECIALS GOOD OCT. 12 THRU OCT. 18, 1978 

Farmland 

Owens Country 

TUNA 
Carnation 

61/2  oz. can 

73` 
2 ih Phg   $279  

1 Phg$ 49  

FOLGER'S 

COFFEE 

1 lb. size 

17 oz 

AJAX  Window Cleaner 

PURINA  Country Blend Cat Food 

ORANGE DRINK  hden's Rich Ready  

GRAPE JELLY  Rama  

STRAWBERRY JAM.  Bama  

CRACKER JACKS 	 8 Bozos sP° 
SUPER SUDS 	 40  oz. Box 69C NEW 

kilger's 
FLAKED COFFEE 

FOR AUTOMATIC 
GRIP c  

13 oz. 

$229  

MAKERS 

kulgerS 
,111.1 

Onion Ringers 
Oro Ida 

7 oz. Box 

37C, 
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SHOP / 
COMPAJA.1.. 

•• • • • •••• ••••• •• ••••• 

REPAIR OF ALL brands of 
major appliances. Dimmitt Ap-
pliance Center, Jim Hrabal. 
647-5690. 	 8-7-tfd 

ON THE FARM tractor and 
combine air conditioner repair 
and service. JIM'S FARM Ai' 
SERVICE, call 647-5310 or!  
647-3127. 	 8-20-tfC 

.USED SINGER MACHINE for 
$54.95, vacuum cleaner $29.95. 
Call 647-2552 before 8 a.m. or 
after 4 p.m. 	 8-41-tfc  

WANTED- Horseshoeing and 
trimming, 647-5227 	8-39-tfc 

ARE ROACHES and termites 
your unwanted guests? Call 
Plains Pest Control, Amarillo, 
PCI456PTL, 355-4341. 8-11-tfc 

CRANTEL'S GRoOMING SA-
LON, 210 W. 5th, 364-2048. 
Hereford. 	 8-35-tfc 

FULKERSON'S DISK ROLL-
ING, efficient, courteous ser-
vice, Robert T. Fulkerson, 806-
995-4689, 719 N. Donley, Tulia 
79088. 	 8-32-tfc 

RENTAL color TVs. Kittrell 
Electronics. 	 8-51-tfd 

HOUSE INSULATION. Call 
Air-Tite Insulation Co. or se 
Robert Daniel, 647-2372. 

8-16-tfC 

DEADLINES 
Display and Classified Advertising 	 Tuesday Noon 
Agriculture, Business & Industry News 	Monday, 10 A.M. 
Sports, Society, Church News 	  Monday Noon 
Community Correspondence 	 Monday Noon 
Personal Items 	  Monday, 5 P.M. 
General News, City and County 	 Tuesday Noon 

•••• •••• • ••••••••••• • ••• ••• •• •• •• • • • • • • •• •• 
- 

• •• • • •••••• •• •• •• • • • •• • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • 
'LEGAL NOTICES 

tlefield, Texas, and said child: 
NANCY RUTH ABEYTA was 
born on August 20, 1971 at 
Denver, Colorado. 

The Court has authority in 
this suit to enter any judg-
ment or decree in the child-
ren's interest which will be 
binding upon you and each of 
you, including, but not nec-
essarily limited to, the ter-
mination of the parent-child 
relationship, the determina-
tion of paternity, and the ap-
pointment of a conservator 
..with authority to consent to 
the children's adoption. 

Issued and given under my 
hand and seal of said Court at 
Dimmitt, Texas, this 6 day of 
October, 1978. 

-s- ZONELL MAPLES 
Clerk of the 64th District 
Court of Castro County, 

Texas 
By: JOY JONES 

Deputy 
15-2-1tc 

Your chances 
of dying 
from a heart attack 
or stroke are 50-50. 

fi American Heart Association 

NOTICE BY PUBLICATION 
TO: SAN JUAN HERNAN-
DEZ and GEORGE CARLOS 
ABEYTA, Respondents, 
GREETINGS: 

YOU ARE HEREBY COM-
MANDED to appear and an-
swer before the Honorable 
64th District Court, Castro 
County, Texas, at the Court-
house of said county in Dim-
mitt, Texas, at or before 10 
o'clock A.M. of the Monday 
next after the expiration of 20 
days from the date of service 
of citation, then and there to 
answer the petition of 
THOMAS EVERETT PAR-
SON, JR., and CHLOE RUTH 
PARSON, Petitioners, filed in 
said Court on the 28th day of 
September, 1978, against 
IRENE GONZALES, SAN 
JUAN HERNANDEZ and 
GEORGE CARLOS ABEYTA, 
Respondents, and said suit 
being number 4651 on the 
docket of said Court, and en-
titled ''In the Interest of 
NANCY RUTH ABEYTA and 
ALBERT ABRAN ABEYTA, 
children," the nature of which 
suit is a request to terminate 
the parent-child relationship 
of both of the natural parents 
of each named child and for 
the adoption of both of said 
children by the Petitioners in 
that suit. Said child: ALBERT 
ABRAN ABEYTA was born 
on December 3, 1975, in Lit- 

.140 •• ••• •• • OOOOO • •••411i 

14-CARD OF THANKS 
•••••••••••••••••••• 

CARD OF THANKS 
I would like to thank the 

doctors of Dimmitt, the Plains 
Memorial Hospital, all person-
nel and all generous persons 
who helped our son, we are 
very grateful. 

MR. & MRS. EMILIO 
SANDOVAL 

•14-2-1tp 

Irrigation Pipe 
Concrete or Plastic 

Underground 
Pipe Repair 
BACK HOE WORK 

945-2535 Day 
Nazareth, Texas 79063 

•• ••• ••••• • ••••••• ••• 

FOR SALE: MF 4-row 40-in. 
corn head with Corn Savers. 
Also 1967 GMC truck, V-6, and 
all-steel grain lid for 20-ft. 
tandem truck. 289-5870, Here- 
ford. 	 5-51-tfc 

P.V.C. PLASTIC PIPE, center, 
pivots, steel buildings, grain 
storage bins, augers. Western 
Ag Sales Co. 647-3188. Dim-i 
mitt. 	 5-15-tfC 

FOR SALE: Miller Offset; 
Discs. For free demonstration; 
contact Farmer's Supply Co.' 
647-3350. 	 5-41-tfC 

WE REPAIR all makes of fencen 
chargers. Dimmitt Consumers 
Electric Shop, NE 3rd & Etterj 

5-16-tfc 

FOR SALE 
333 Acres, 3 wells, all in 
cultivation. Close to Dim-
mitt. Possession on clos-
ing, priced to sell; 500 
Acres, excellent land, 10 
small wells, all in cultiva-
tion, 3-bedroom house. 

GLENN R. LESTER 
REAL ESTATE 
P.O. Box 1713, 

Plainview, TX 79072 
Ph. 806-296-2567 

Home 806-293-3742 

• ••••• ••• ••• ••••• •••• 

8-SERVICES 
••••••••••••••••••••• 

EAD STOCK removal, 7-daii  
eek service. Please call soot 

possible. Hereford BinPro-
?ducts. Phone 364-09511. 8-3-tfc. 

McKNIGHT SEWING CEN: 
TER, 226 N. Main, Hereford. 
Ph. 364-4051. (Singer Author-
ized Dealer). For full sales and 
service, parts, labor, new and 
used machines and vacuum 
cleaners. Dimmitt number to 
'call 647-2552 before 8 a.m. or 
after 4 p.m. 	 8-41-tfc 

CARPET CLEANING-Profes-
sional service at reasonable 
prices. 24-hour service. Free 
insurance claim estimates. 
Modern Carpet Center, 647- 
3452 or 296-9209. 	8-41-tfc 

CARPET CLEANING - AlsO 
windows washed, floors refin-' 
ished. Prices competitive, un-
conditional guarantee. Dimmitt 
Janitorial Service, Warren 
Finch. 647-4558. 	8-24-tfc 

HAVE HESTON 30A Stack-
hand, want to stack corn or 
milo stubble on shares or all for 
you. Call L. H. Wilhelm, 945- 
2211. 	 8-2-tfc 

CARPENTRY, remodeling, re-
pairs, sheetrocking, taping, 
panelling, painting, mobile 
home leveling, skirting, an-
choring. Work reasonable: 
Sandy Parsons, 647-4553. 

8-15-tfc 

WALLPAPER HANGING. Ref-
erences. Reasonable rates. Call 
Jimmie Middleton, 258-7715 or 
Jean Collier, 258-7396, Here-
ford, or 647-4375, Dimmitt 

8-42-tfc 

COMPARE RATES AND,  
SERVICE. STATE FARM IN-
SURANCE COMPANIES may, 
SAVE you $$$$. Kent Birdwell 
Insurance, 116 E. Jones St.i 
647-3427, Dimmitt, Texas. 

8-24-tfc' 

LET US make you an estimate 
on Targonal bath and kitchen 
floors and walls. TROY KIRBY, 
647-5351. 	 8-37-tfc 
SEE YOUR independent in-
surance agent for complete in-
surance service. Ivey Agency; 
210 W. Bedford, 647-3518. 

8-6-tfc 
•	 

CUSTOM COMBINING, Corn 
or Milo, 2 Massey Fergusons, 
Robert Copeland, 30c wet wt.1  
Afton, 806-689-2611. Call after 
4:30 weekdays or all day week- 
ends. 	 8-1-2tp 
••••••••••••••••••••4 

9-HELP WANTED 
•••••••••••••4••••••. 
MECHANICS: Diesel Engine 
and Construction Machinery. 
Top Wages and Benefits. Talk 
to Service Manager. West Tex-
as Equipment Company - Your 
Caterpillar Dealer. Amarillo 
806-335-1511; Lubbock 806-745- 
4495. 	 9-1-5tc 

HELP WANTED 
Need 1 Feed 
Truck Driver 

KEMP FARMS 
Ph. 647-5566 

Nights 647-3496 

•••••••••••••••••••••4 

9-HELP WANTED 
v••••••••••• • ••••••••4 

HELP WANTED: Taking Ap-
plications for Welder, Mechan-
ic and Parts Department. Ex-
perience Necessary. Excellent'  
Benefits. Oswalt Division, Box 
551, Hereford, Texas 79045. 
Equal Opportunity Employer- 
Male/Female. 	9-52-4tc 

WANTED: Man to work in 
yard. Call 647-2549. 	9-2-4tx 
• •• •• • •• •••••• •• ••••• 

10-WANTED, MISC. 
••••••••••••••••••••• 

GRAZING WANTED: Stalks 
and wheat. Call 647-4309 day 
or night. 	 10-52-2tc 

NEED GRAZING pasture, corn 
or wheat. Charles McLean or 
Carl Lee Kemp. Call 647-4407 
or 647-5201. 	10-51-tfc 
••••••••••••••••••• 414 

13-LOST & FOUND 
••••••••••••••••••••• 
LOST: White Peekapoo dog, 
wearing tags, answers to 
"Sortie." Reward offered. Ph. 
647-2194 or after 5 call 647- 
5344. 	 13-1-tfc 

STRAYED: Four mixed breed 
steers, branded Ni on right 
rib, about 450 pounds, prob-
ably southwest of Nazareth. 
945-2655. 	 13-2-4tc 

i••••••••••••••••••••I 

15-LEGAL NOTICES 
••••• ••••• •••• •• • ••41# 

NOTICE 
The Dimmitt Independent 

School District will accept 
sealed bids on the below 
listed vehicles until 4:00 
P.M., Thursday, October 26, 
1978. 

1 - 1961 International Pick-
up 

1 - 1964 Dodge Pickup 
2 - 1968 54-passenger Chev-

rolet school buses 
Bids should be submitted to 

the Superintendent of Schools 
at 608 W. Halsell during reg-
ular office hours. 

The above listed vehicles 
may be seen for inspection at 
the Dimmitt I.S.D. Transpor-
tation Center on Farm Road 
3215 between the hours of 
9:00 A.M. and 5:00 P.M. Mr. 
Morris Gowdy can be con-
tacted concerning these ve-
hicles by telephoning 647-
4607. 

The D.I.S.D. reserves the 
right to accept or reject any or 
all bids. 	 15-2-2tc 

••••••••••••••••••••• 
THE PLACE to find the right 
flowers, hanging baskets and 
gifts. Dennis Floral & Gifts,j 
409 NW 4th, Ph. 647-3197. 	I 

3-44-tfc 

FOR SALE: Centurk Wheat 
Seed. Robert Huseman, 945- 
2655. 	 3-51-4tc 

JEWELED Christmas kits, ta-
ble cloths, tree skirts, orna-
ments, panels, over 30 Christ-
mas stockings to select from. 
New Rumplstiltskin rug pat-
terns. Large selections of latch 
hook rugs and kits. Dan's of 
Canyon. 	 3-52-4tc 

MOBILE HOME, 14x74 feet; 
good condition. Call 647-3264. 

3-33-tfe 
THERMOPHORE (the auto-,  
matic moist heat pack) by 
Battle Creek now available at! 
Parsons Drug. 	3-9-tfcl  

HOMEMADE' -GIFTS 
occasions-bridal showers, ba-
by showers. Quilts and baby 
quilts. Senior Citizens Center, 
Jones and SW Third, 647-2654.. 

3-39-tfc 

WoOD, CHAIN LINK, 
INDUSTRIAL AND BARB- 

WIRE FENCES 

QUALITY 
CONSTRUCTION 

COMPETITIVE PRICES 

SANDERS 
FENCING CO. 

647-2477 

STORAGE 
SPACES 

FOR RENT 
DIMMITT STORAGE 

& RENTAL 
Box 729 	647-3447, 

ulTics 

Justice Real Estate 
115 West Bedford 

647.4101 	 Night 647-5512 

Nome Listings 

1010 Grant - 2 bedroom, 2 bath, fireplace, large utility. Everything 

just like new. 

606 NW Seventh -- 3 bedrooms, 1 bath, large utility room, large 

storage area, carport, fenced yard. 

202 NW Twelfth - Three-bedroom/brick home, one large bath, fenced 
yard, one-car garage. 

Farm Listings 

160 ACRES - southwest of Easter. Good six-inch well. 

160 ACRES-Northeast Castro County. Dryland with four-inch 
domestic well. 

GOOD LOCATION-581 acres southeast of Dimmitt, with two 

three-bedroom homes. Three 8-inch wells, two return systems, app. 

two miles of underground tile. 9,000,000-lb. capacity elevator with 

dryer on separate 3.2-acre tract. On separate 16.8-acre tract: luxury 

home with approximately 5,000 sq. ft.-four bedrooms, three baths, 

basement, large double garage, sprinkler system, many other custom 

extras. Also 60x100 highly improved shop, 3-BR mobile home, five 

separate livestock barns, four cattle pens and other improvements. 

340 ACRES-Near Arney. Dryland. 

1140 ACRES-Northwest of Bovina. Six wells, nice three-bedroom 
home. 

Pol - Barn's 
'0" Factor 

A square deal 
that lasts. 

Steel throughout! Steel col-
umns and framing. Deep con-
figuration 80,000 psi steel 
panels. It all makes a Quonset 
the most durable farm build-
ing you'll find. Let's visit. 

OIJONSIET 
Lock what's happened to the hut.  

WESTERN AG 
SALES CO., INC. 

647-3188 

*****************1 
* "Whether you rent, or * 4(  
* whether you buy, You 

* 	

* 
* pay for the home that * 
4(  you occupy." 	 4( 

The Castro Count g News , 
'647-3123 	 P.O. BOX 67, DIMMITT, TEXAS 79027  

Published each Thursday in Dimmitt, Texas, by the News Pub-
lishing Co., 108 W. Bedford, Second Class Postage Paid at Dimmitt, 
'Texas. Publication Number 092980  

Member of the Texas Press Association, West Texas Press Assoc-
iation, Panhandle Press Association and National Newspaper Assoc.  

All real estate advertised in • New Listing! Prime Lo- 
cation. 3 BDR. Brick 

•••••••••••••• • •• ••• 

3-FOR SALE, MISC. 
••••••••••••••••••••• 

FASHION TWO TWENTY 
COSMETICS, Lorena Cates, 
407 NW 3rd, 647-4210. 

3-2-26tp 

FIR SALE 14x70 Don Austin 
Mobile home. Excellent condi-
tion Marvin Schulte 945-2588 or 
627-4286. 	 3-42-tfc 

SUBSCRIPTION RATES 
School Year, $5.50 	Six Months, $4.50 One Year, $7.00 DISABLED person's equip-

ment: 1 wheel chair, 2 com-
mode chairs, 1 cane. Call 647- 
3194. 	 3-42-tfc 

FOR SALE: Sweet Potatoes, $6 
per box; Red Potatoes, $4.75 
per cwt.; Russet Potatoes, 
$5.50 per cwt.; White Potatoes, 
$3.75 per cwt. Smith Potato 
inc., Hart, TX 79043, Ph. 938- 
2166. 	 3-2-2tc 
•• •••• ••• •••• •• •• • •• • 

4-HOUSEHOLD GOODS 
•••••••0••••••••••••• 
FOR SALE: Console stereo & 2 
table-top speakers. A set of 
Colliers Encyclopedia, 2 years 
old. Call 647-2520 after 5 p.m. 

4-47-tfc 
••• •••• • •• •••••• •• •404 

New Listing! Well locat-
ed, nice 3 BDR. Brick 
home. All purpose 
room. Family Room and 
Living Room. 

3 BDR. Brick Two Story 
home, well located. All 
purpose room with 2 Car 
Garage. Fenced back 
yard. 

Home, 	Car Garage. 
13/4 	reic back- 
yard.

•

Feet, with e 
storage building. 

••••••••••••••••••••+ 

6-AUTOMOTIVE 
••••••••••..••.•••••. 

1977 DATSUN pickup, King 
cab, 5-speed, 45-gal. auxiliary 
tank, Michelin tires. $3850. 
647-4620 after 7 p.m. 

6-51-tfc 

FOR SALE: 1973 Thunderbird, 
2-door, 647-3392. 	6-51-tfc 

GLASS 
Large stock of flat glass for 
combine and tractor cabs, etc. 
'Wholesale and retail on L-O-F, 
Pittsburgh and Carlite wind-
Shield glass. Installed right and 
weather-tight. See Gene at 
,Dimmitt Upholstery & Garage,; 
214 N. Broadway, 647-2534. 

6-5249 

FOR SALE: 1972 GTO, Make 
offer. 647-2572 after 5 p.m. 

6-1-2tc 

FOR SALE: 1977 Ford 150 
Custom Pickup, power and air, 
13,000 miles. Call collect 806- 
257-3804. 	 6-2-tfc 

3 BDR.. 2 Full Baths, 
1,750 Sq. Feet. Has 
been repainted inside 
and outside. Kitchen ap-
pliances stay! Reduced 
price! 

1975 DODGE motor home. 
1959 one-ton Chevy van. 647- 
5496. 	 6-2-tfc 

• • • pa 	 it 

1-REAL ESTATE, 
• • 

 

HOMES & LAND 
4140_11••• ••_•••••••.06••••• 

PUBLISHER'S NOTICE: 

this newspaper is subject to the 
Federal Fair Housing Act of 
1968 which makes it illegal to 
advertise "any preference, 
limitation, or discrimination 
based on race, color, religion, 
sex, or national origin, or an 
intention to make any such pre-
ference, limitation, or discrim-
ination." 
This newspaper will not know-
ingly accept any advertising for 
real estate which is in violation 
of the law. Our readers are 
informed that dwellings adver-
tising in this newspaper are 
available on an equal oppor- 
tunity basis. 	1-28-tfc 

FOR SALE: Large 3-bedroom, 
2-bath, den, newly-redecorat-
ed. Fenced, trees. 104 NW 5th. 
647-4507. 	 1-47-tfc 

FOR SALE. To be moved, a 
bedroom and bath with double 
garage. Call 938-2256. 1-20-tfc 

FOR SALE: 200 acres bottom, 
rolling land, 2 barns, 2 ponds, 
2 wells. Will divide in 100 acre 
tracts. S1000.00 an acre. Tel-
ephone 501-743-1652. 1-52-tfc 

FOR SALE: 3 bedroom, 2 bath 
home; large yard, storage 
building. Call Max Keating at 
647-5219 or 647-4115. 	1-2-21p 
••••• •••• •••••••• • •• 

2-FOR RENT 

I••••••••••••••••••••1 5-FARM EQUIPMENT 
8-SERVICES 

3 BDR Brick Home, 2 
Car Garage Family 
Room with beamed ceil-
ing, less than 3 years 
old. 

3 BDRS., 2 Baths, 2 Car 
Garage, 	Basement, 
Fenced backyard, Cor-
ner lot. Very Nice! Only 
$26,500! 

••••••••••••••••••••• 
FOR RENT: 2-bedroom apart- 
ment. Ph. 647-3690. 	2-2-tfc 

TRAILER SPACE for rent. Call 
Brenda Andrews, 647-2650 or 
647-5463. 	 2-18-tfc1 

APARTMENT for rent, Coun-
try Arms Apartments, 111 NW 
11th, 647-3318. 	2-23-tfci 

Extra nice 2 BDR., 
Modern Kitchen. Cen-
tral Heat. Fenced back 
yard with sprinkler sys-
tem and storage build-
ing. 

MAN to man: "For years I 
saved for a rainy day. Then I 
met a girl who wiped it out in 
one monsoon." 

* Privacy of Country and 
4(  convenience of City. 3 
• BDR. brick home, 2 Car 
* • Garage, Basement, 13/4  
i( baths. Central Air. Lo- 
* • Gated on 6 Acre tract. 

FARMS 

* 330 Acres, 5 wells, lo- 
* Gated northeast of Dim- * 
• mitt. Has been in same * 
* family for 30 years. 	4( 

GEORGE 
* 	REAL ESTATE 

HWY. 385 South 	; 
• Jimmie R. George * 

Broker 
Office 647-4174 	* 

* Danny Rice, 647-3552 
* Dub George, 647-4469 * 
***************** 

TO BUY 
OR SELL REAL 

PROPERTY 
CONTACT 
L.C. LEE 

REAL ESTATE 
719 W. Lee St. 

Ph. 806-647-2244 or 
806-647-2171 

CLEMENT C. Moore wrote 
"A Visit from St. Nicholas" 
as a Christmas gift to his 
children in 1822. 

FOR every 17 cigarette 
smokers in the US there are 4 
pipe smokers. 

Excellent location for 
small shop or offices 
with living quarters at-
tached, 2122 sq. ft. com-
bined, fenced backyard, 
commercial zone, 103 
NW 4th St. 
Attractive 3-bedroom 
brick home, single at-
tached garage, fenced 
yard, storage building, 
located near schools, at 
a price you can't afford 
to miss! 

LET US SHOW YOU 
If you are considering 
selling your home, 
please contact us. We 
have inquiries and a 
good market. 

Call HUCK ABA Y 

ABSTRACT, 

647-3519. 

NEED experienced truck 
drivers 25 or older for cattle 
hauling operation. Contact 
manager at Area 806-276-5667 
or 276-5668. 	9-49-tfc 

LVN WANTED at South HillS 
Manor Nursing Home. Contact 
Joyce Adrian, director of nur- 
ses. 647-3117. 	9-49-tfc 

FIRST BAPTIST Church is 
seeking applications for cus-
todian. Apply in person at 1201 
Circle Drive between 8 a.m. 
and 5 p.m. 	 9-2-tfc 

COWSERT 
REAL ESTATE 

Jack R. Cowsert - Broker 	E. B. Noble - Salesman 
P.O. Box 992 

106 W. Bedford 
Dimmitt, Texas 

Phone 647-3650 
Night 647-2474 

RESIDENTIAL, INDUSTRIAL 

& FARMS FARM LOANS 
We Need Listings on Farm & City Property 

FOR SALE: 
2 bedroom home, nice fenced in back yard, carport, 
newly redecorated. New roof. 
SOLD, Seller & Buyer happy.  

3 bedroom older home, built back when good lumber 
was common. been kept in good shape. Large 
combination living and dining room, well insulated, 
storm windows and doors. Solid comfortable home. 

Commercial property in Hart. Has trailer hook-ups. 
Good investment in largest little City in the country. 

60 acres near city of Dimmitt. Ideal for dividing into 
ranchette tracts, near schools. Outside city limits. 

Residential lots in Dimmitt. 

975 Acres. Perfect land with 7 wells, all connected 
with underground pipe. 1 mile to pavement. 3 
bedroom, 2 bath home and workshop. $700 per acre. 
29% down, owner will carry balance over 20 years at 
8  0/0.  

2 Large Industrial sites in Dimmitt. 

For Rent: 
Office Space in downtown Dimmitt. 

144 •••• ••• ••••••••• •• • 

3- FOR SALE, MISC. 

HUCKABA Y 

Offers Complete 

Real Estate Service: 

New Homes 

/Pre-Owned Homes 

/Custom Contracting 

("Loans 

/Farm Land 

/Abstracts 

1./ Title Insurance 

/Hazard Insurance 

Huckabay 

Abstract Co. 

647-3519 Business 

647-3356 Home 

105 E. Bedford 

Dimmitt 



Ask me about' 
Life Insurance 
foravour way 

bving 
 

I offer bfe programs designed for 
today's farrobes the marred woman. 
homeowners, high income people 

students, young adults, and childr.en 

too Call me for detatk 

"Kent Birdwell, Agent 
116 E. Jones St., 
Dimmitt, Texas 
Phone 647-3427 

State Farm life 
Insurance Company 
Home Office 
Bioomington Hoofs 
	• 

A TIMELY REMINDER TO... 

CITY OF DIMMITT 

TAXPAYERS 

PAY YOUR CITY TAXES NOW AND 

RECEIVE THE FOLLOWING DISCOUNTS 

IF PAID IN: 

OCTOBER 3% 
NOVEMBER 2% 
DECEMBER 1% 

GARNETT HOLLAND 
TAX COLLECTOR OF DIMMITT 

.1111===m110•1111resi 

Rigkaitthelatt, 

O ° 
Men's Suede Front 

SWEATER 
Reg. val to 53000  Now$221

3 

Ball fringe
O  

I 

N 

TRIM 
Compare at Slm to s2w yd 

Now 5 yds for $11 13  

BLANKETS 	Ladies 

PANTIE 	$413  (for full or twin size beds) 	 6 pr. for 

Reg. slm 

Men's Dress 

SOCKS 
val. to '125  pr 

Now 6 pr for$413  
3 for $1300  

Men 8 Boys 

Blue 8 White Athletic 

SHOES 
Reg. 51099 Now $813  pr.  

Boys Munsingwear 

BRIEFS Now $173  
Your choice of TRANSFER 

only 53`  with purchase of 
any T-Shirt from Anthony's 

ahanqi. 
—C-11 as sh THOP  • C 0_ 
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latter to the salitor Suiesysido,  

Service honors GAs Out-of-state observer comments on Demo meet 
By TEENY BOWDEN 

conduct himself more profes-
sionally or business-like than 
Mr. Lemons did at that meet-
ing. 

was Mr. Wiley's not even out 
of common courtesy, offering 
Mr. Lemons a chair. 

Last but not least, I would 
like to state that I worked in 
and for the Municipal and 
Superior Courts of the third 

KENNETH DELLIS 
Retired Deputy Marshal 

San Diego, Calif. 

night. Rev. Raymond Jones 
officiated. The couple will 
make their home in Dimmitt. 

Herman Lilley. a former 
resident of the community, 
passed away in Temple 
Thursday morning. Funeral 
services were held in Cross 
Plains Saturday afternoon. He 
was a cousin of Roy Lilley of 
Dimmitt and Johnnie B. Lil-
ley, and attended Sunnyside 
School. 

Vic McRee of Amarillo. a 
former resident of the com-
munity, passed away Wed-
nesday in Amarillo. 

Tom Parson attended the 
funeral services for John 
Thomas in Calvary Church in 
Friona Wednesday afternoon. 

largest city of California for 16 
years. So therefore, I know 
the basic rules of an open 
meeting or courtroom pro-
cedure, and they are basically 
the same. 

I have never seen anyone 

* 

TECHNICIAN TRAINEE—
Chris Book, a graduate of 
Nazareth High School, has 
enrolled at Spartan School of 
Aeronautics in Tulsa for train-
ing as an aviation mainte-
nance technician. He is learn-
ing theory and practical ap-
plication of technical repair on 
all types of aircraft and on 
graduation will be qualified to 
apply to the Federal Aviation 
Administration for a mechanic 
certificate with airframe and 
powerplant ratings. Qualified 
applicants may earn an as-
sociate degree in applied sci-
ence. 

A Girls in Action recog-
nition service was presented 
in the Sunday night worship 
service. The auditorium was 
decorated with GA emblems, 
a world globe above uplifted 
hinds, greenery and white 
fondles. Mrs Gale Sadler 
provided the piano music. 
Two congregational hymns 
were sung, the pastor read 
the Scripture, Mrs. E. R. 
Sadler led the opening prayer. 
Mrs. Hershel Wilson, GA di-
rector, had charge of the 
program and Hershel Wilson 
brought the special music. 
Shannon Ott and Melody Sad-
ler were the candle lighters. 
Mrs. Terry Guy gave the ex-
planation of mission adven-
tures. Mrs. Lonnie Wilson 
presented collars and badges 
to Sharon Bradley, Chanin 
Ross and Cinnamon Cox. 
Mrs. Carl Dean Carson pre-
sented collars and badges to 
the older GAs, Kay Owens, 
Stacy Sadler and Anne Guy. A 
reception followed in fellow-
ship hall where the girls' work 
was on display. Several from 
Springlake attended. 

Brent Lilley and Rhonda 
Laurent of Dimmitt were mar-
ried in a double ring cere-
mony in Lee Street Baptist 
Church in Dimmitt Saturday 

Dear Editor: 
This is an unsolicited letter 

of an eyewitness observer of 
the County Democratic Party 
meeting at Dimmitt regarding 
the Lemons-Davis controver- 
sy. 

It was very apparent at the 
beginning that the Demo 
chairman was mad. Disre-
garding the facts as to resi-
dence or attorney eligibility, I 
would like to address my re-
marks to the meeting itself. 

It seemed odd that when 
Mr. (Jack) Miller was speak-
ing either at the request of 
the chairman (Mr. Wiley). or 
in answer to any one ques-
tion, he could and did explain 
the ramifications of the El-
ection Code. On the other 
hand, Mr. Lemons, also an 
attorney, could only speak if 
someone yielded the floor, 
which was done. Accordingly, 
he was repeatedly reminded 
that his points should be ar-
gued before a judge. 

It was also obvious to this 
observer that Mr. Wiley's 
knowledge of the Election 
Code casts some doubt, but it 
was certainly obvious that he 
knows nothing about, or 
chooses to ignore, parliamen-
tary procedure. 

I think the most disheart-
ening point of the meeting 

Hamilton, Mo. visited Mon-
day through Friday with her 
aunt, Mrs. Irving King. 

Mrs. Cecil Curtis visited in 
Petersburg with her parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. E. M. Steph-
ens Friday and Saturday. 

The Baptist Women met at 
the church Tuesday morning 
for the prayer program with 
Mrs. Roy Phelan in charge. 

Baptist Young Women met 
at the church Tuesday af-
ternoon after school for their 
mission program. The Mis-
sion Friends also met during 
this time. 

The Sunnyside Uppits had 
charge of the worship service 
in the Kingswood United 
Methodist Church in Amarillo 
last Sunday night. Those par-
ticipating were Mr. and Mrs. 
Cliff Brown and Lynn, Mrs. 
David Sadler, Rhonda and 
Tammy Ross, Susan Sadler, 
Ray Lynn Owens, Carrie and 
Stacy Sadler, and Ginny and 
Anne Guy. Amend° Bellesia 
of Italy, American Field Ser-
vice exchange student from 
Dimmitt, was a guest of Su-
san Sadler. 

* Jerri Clark 
has reserve 
champ sheep 

WTSU student 

Mrs. Raymond Jones, Mrs. 
Hershel Wilson, Mrs. Bruce 
Bridges, Erin and Robin, 
Mrs. Carl Dean Carson and 
Deakon, Mrs. L. B. Bowden, 
Mrs. Roy Phelan, Mrs. E. R. 
Sadler, Mrs. Milburn Hay-
don, Mrs. Thomas Parson, 
Mrs. David Sadler and Mrs. 
Cliff Brown attended the 
Llanos Altos Associational 
Annual WMU meeting in Am-
herst Thursday. Rev. Ray-
mond Jones and Hershel Wil-
son joined their wives at 
dinner and stayed to hear the 
missionary, Mildred Crabtree 
of Nigeria, speak in the af-
ternoon program. She is the 
new missionary in residence 
at Wayland in Plainview. 

Mrs. Ray Axtell of Earth 
was honored by the birthday 
club with a party in her home 
Tuesday afternoon. Those 
present were Mrs. J. E. Shi-
rey of Earth and Mrs. Lloyd 
Blanton, Mrs. Floyd Ivey, 
Mrs. Cecil Curtis and Mrs. R. 
V. Bills of the community. 
They played 42 and Mrs. Ax-
tell was the winner. 

Mr. and Mrs. L. B. Bowden 
and Mrs. Ed Thompson vis-
ited the Grand Canyon and 
the Oak Creek Canyon in 
Arizona last Sunday, and the 
Painted Desert and the Pet-
rified Forest on their way 
home Monday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Gene Dice of 

receives cap 
• 

Susan Wise, a junior nurs-
ing student from Dimmitt, re-
ceived her cap recently along 
with 109 nursing students of 
West Texas State University. 

They completed their uni-
forms in a convocation cere-
mony where women students 
received caps, and the male 
students received bars. 

The nursing cap signifies 
the completion of the first 
level of nursing school at 
WTSU. Upon completion of 
nursing school, the students 
will receive bars for the caps 
to signify graduation. 

Rev. and Mrs. Raymond 
Jones, Mrs. Cliff Brown and 
Mrs. Gene Ross and Chanin 
attended the Llanos Altos As-
sociational Youth Rally at Ok-
lahoma Lane Monday night 
with Tammy and Rhonda 
Ross, Lynn Brown, Ray Lynn 
Owens, Glenda Crow, Carrie 
Sadler and Byron Smith of 
Springlake. They brought 
home the attendance banner 
again. 

Mark Lindsey of Plainview 
spent last Thursday through 
Wednesday with his grand-
mother Mrs. Euless Waggon-
er while his parents, Dr. and 
Mrs. Robert Lindsey, made a 
trip to Seattle to a dental 
convention. 

Mrs. Thomas Parson spent 
Thursday night in Amarillo at 
St. Anthony's Hospital with 
Vicente Lopez who underwent 
surgery Thursday. He was 
dismissed Friday and she 
brought him home with her to 
spend a few days. Rosie, Joe, 
Israel and Mary Ann Lopez 
spent Saturday night and Sun-
day with them. 

Paula Sue and Karen Ivey 
of Dalhart spent last weekend 
with Mr. and Mrs. Floyd Ivey` 
and Mr. and Mrs. Mokey Ivey 
south of Dimmitt. 

Mr. and Mrs. Winston 
Waggoner made a trip to 
Houston over the weekend. 
Quint stayed with his grand-
mother, Mrs. Euless Wag-
goner. Holly and Gay stayed 
with Mrs. Winston Waggon-
er's cousins, Mr. and Mrs. 
Steve Clary, who are teaching 
school this year at Nazareth. 

Mr. and Mrs. John Gil-
breath were with Punk Gil-
breath Wednesday morning 
when he underwent open 
heart surgery in St. Anthony's 
Hospital. He is making a nice 
recovery and was expecting to 
be dismissed Sunday. 

Mr. and Mrs. Cliff Brown 
and Lynn met Mr. and Mrs. 
Lee Brown of Goldsmith in 
Lubbock Saturday and visited 
with Mr, and Mrs. E. R. 
Brown and Mrs. Jim Bob 
Swinney. Lee and Gale came 
home with them to spend a 
few days. 

Mr. and Mrs. Thomas Par-
son attended the church ser-
vices in Temple Baptist 
Church, Hereford, Sunday 
night to see their grand-
daughter, Laura Parson, bap-
tized. 

Jerri Ka Clark of Dimmitt 
showed both the reserve 
champion ram and reserve 
champion ewe in the South-
down division of the Junior 
Breeding Sheep Show at the 
Texas State Fair in Dallas last 
weekend. She is a member of 
the Dimmitt Future Farmers 
of America. 

Her class placings at Dallas 
included first and third on 
spring ewe lambs, second on 
spring ram lambs, third on 
flock, fourth and seventh on 
yearling ewes. 

Later this fall .Jerri Ka 
will be an exhibitor at this 
year's North American Inter-
national Livestock Exposition, 
scheduled Nov. 4-18 in Louis-
ville, Ky. She has entered 
Southdown sheep in the com-
petition and joins nearly 
12,000 other quality livestock 
entries in 1978 show activi-
ties. 

She will compete for prem-
iums and awards which total 
nearly $225,000. The North 
American International Live-
stock Exposition now ranks 
among the largest shows of its 
kind in the world. 

What's cooking 
at the schools 

Here are the lunch menus 
for Dimmitt Schools for the 
week of Oct. 16-20. 

MONDAY — Barbecued 
wieners, creamed potatoes, 
green beans, fruit, rolls, buts 
ter and milk. 

TUESDAY — Hamburger, 
pork and beans, lettuce, on-
ion, pickles, carrot cake and 
milk. 

WEDNESDAY — Beef 
stew, pineapple slice, cinna-
mon rolls, cornbread, crackers 
and milk. 

THURSDAY — Chicken pot 
pie, cabbage salad, gelatin 
and milk. 

FRIDAY — Tacos, Mexican 
beans, tossed salad, fruit cob-
bler and milk. 

647-3123 For Printing 

THIS IS 
SAM KILLOUGH 

ASKING YOU, 
the people of Castro County, to support 
me as your candidate in the upcoming 
election for Castro County Judge. I, Sam 
Killough, will be a write-in candidate, 
running on the Republican Ballot. 

If elected, I will be working for low 
taxation. I will do my best to work for all 
the people of our county, giving special 
attention to our young people and in 
helping to keep our county a clean and 
good place to live. 

THANK YOU FOR YOUR SUPPORT 

SAM KILLOUGH 
Political Adv. paid for by Sam Killough 

Prissy Boothe, campaign treasurer 
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lightful salad from our salad bar. 	Pay only 
$2.88 for the second Conductor - 

444  
Monday thru Saturday 11 A.M. to 10 P.M. 	I 

• 
West Hlway 60 
3647740 

Hereford. Texas 	Breakfast 
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Feast 
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to our menu we offer: 

1/2  PR CE 
order: 

The BRAKEMAN, $7.25 
Also try our 12 oz. Ribeye. 	It is also served 
with piping hot bread, a baked potato or with 
french fries, and a delightful salad from our 
salad bar. An unusually good steak. 	Pay 
only $3.65 for the second Brakeman, 

1  RAILROAD ciosim Try our Sunday Buffet I I A.M. to 2 P.M. 
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6 to 10:30 A.M. 	

655.7701 

Canyon, Texas 
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$28 million cut asked 
in DISD evaluations 

Swifts top Canyon JV; 
will meet Valley Friday 

By PATRICIA KERN 

At Monday night's Dimmitt 
School Board meeting, DISD 
Business Manager Gene King 
reported that an appeal on 
behalf of the Dimmitt schools 
has been filed with the State 
Tax Assessment Practices 
Board asking for a $28 million 
reduction in the valuations 
assigned to the district by the 
state hoard. 

King pointed out that many 
of the figures assigned to 
Dimmitt were considerably 
out of line with what was 
assigned to similar districts in 
the area, and at times did not 
even correlate with other fig-
ures assigned to Dimmitt. 

In other action, the school 
board approved, by a vote of 
four to two, a lease agreement 
with Stan Byrnes Ford for a 
pickup to be used by high 
school teacher Ed Standlee for 
vocational agriculture busi-
ness. 

In the past, the school had 
paid Standlee $100 per month 
for him to use his own pickup 
until it would register 60,000 
miles. Larry Gray was under a 
similar arrangement, and may 
also opt to lease. 

The lease agreement would 
allow up to 25,000 miles per 
calendar year, with the teach-
er reimbursing the school for 
any amount of the lease over 
the present amount being 
paid. The vehicle would be 
leased in the name of the 
school, but the teacher would 
reimburse the school for the 
cost of insurance coverage. 
Daily upkeep and mainte-
nance would be the teacher's 
responsibility, along with any 
glass or body damage not 
covered by insurance. 

The board approved a form 
to be used for evaluating the 

With 1:30 remaining, Acker:::: 
free-kicked to Canyon's 39 
yard line. Bryan Huseman 
sacked QB Johnson for a 13-,1 
yard loss on the next play tc 
give the Swifts their 7-2 w4 
as the clock ran out. 

Nazareth takes on statel 
ranked Valley Friday night 
and Coach Eddie Hooper sayt 
the outcome may have a big. 
part in determining the dis4 
trict champions. Valley was 
picked earlier this season to; 
win, with the Swifts picked tof, 
come in second. 

"We've watched films of), 
them (Valley) and nobody has:: 
passed very much against 
them so far," said Coacko 
Hooper. "We're working °a?* 
our passing game, but we'll 
have to eliminate penalties!, 
and mistakes to beat therrir 
Friday. 

"We're also going to need 
to get our injured people baclQ 
for the game,-  he added. 

Chris Hatla (quarterbacking, 
for Jimmy Huseman since he, 
was sidelined in the opening;: 
game with a shoulder sepa 
ration) suffered head injurie 
and was taken to the hospital: 
at halftime of Friday's game'.. 
with Canyon. Dwayne Acker;

. 
 

hurt his leg, and Neal 
helm reinjured his ankle inl; 
practice Monday, but De-Z, 
wayne Heck has come back 
off the knee injury he sufferect.  
in the Hart-Nazareth game. 

The Nazareth-Valley show 
down is slated for 8 p.m. at' 
Patriot Stadium, and will bei 
the first district game for both., 
teams. 

Canyon to six yards, and Nor-
man Gerber blocked a fourth-
down punt attempt, which 
Jeff Schmucker recovered on 
the 6-yard line. Bryan Huse-
man took the ball into the end 
zone from four yards out for 
the only touchdown of the 
game. 

Each team had its share of 
penalties, and neither team 
threatened again until late in 
the third quarter. The Swifts 
took the ball all the way to the 
1-yard line, but were stopped 
on a fourth-down play. 

Canyon took over as the 
buzzer sounded, and drove all 
the way to the Swift 6-yard 
line (aided by facemasking 
and an 18-yard pass inter-
ference penalty) before Naz-
areth took over late in the 
fourth. 

The Swifts moved the ball 
out to the 10-yard line, and 
rather than chance a blocked 
punt or a tie game by giving 
the Eagles good field position, 
Dwayne Acker took a safety 
as he kept the ball in the end 
zone on the fourth-down snap, 
giving Canyon two points. 

last Thursday night in the local lodge hall. 
Seated in background are Charles Myers, 
district executive, and Carl Moore, master of 
Castro Lodge 879. 

ANNIVERSARY SPEAKER—Thurman Ben-
son, grand master of the Grand Lodge of 
Texas, pays tribute to Castro Masonic Lodge 
879 during its 75th anniversary observance 

performance of the superin-
tendent, similar to the forms 
used for evaluating teachers. 
The board also agreed to fill 
out the form in regard to 
Supt. Robert Ryan, with the 
results to be reviewed in ex-
ecutive session in January, at, 
the time of renewal of his 
contract. 

In following the recommen-
dation of the high school Stu-
dent Senate, the board ap-
proved the presentation of 
sweaters for underclassmen, 
and leather-bound dictiona-
ries for seniors, in recognition 
of the newly instituted scho-
lastic awards. 

The sweaters will be gray 
with a purple stripe bordered 
by white on each sleeve, and 
with a torch symbol in purple 
on a white background. An 
award may be received each 
year a student qualifies. 

The awards will be pre-
sented to the top 10 in 
scholastic ranking in each 
class, provided that they also 
have at least a 90 average. 

Ryan said he contacted UIL 
officials who said such awards 
would not be against any UIL 
policy. 

The board also formally 
wrote into board policy the 
procedure which has been 
used in the past in deter-
mining the valedictorian and 
salutatorian of graduating 
classes. 

Acceptance of the addition 
to the shop building was 
granted by the board, al-
though there is some finish 
work to be done which was 
not included in the contract. 

Mrs. Evie Froehner report-
ed to the board on her study 
of the results of standardized 
tests taken by Dimmitt pupils. 

Nazareth's Swifts hiked 
their season record to 4-1 
Friday night as they edged 
Canyon JV in their last non-
district game, 7-2. 

The Swifts held the Eagles 
on a fourth-down play in the 
opening series after Canyon 
drove to Nazareth's 23-yard 
line. The Swifts then took the 
ball to their own 45-yard line, 
where they were also forced 
to punt. 

Johnnie Nicholes (who pick-
ed up 106 yards in 26 carries 
for Canyon during the game) 
grabbed a 22-yard pass from 
quarterback Byron Johnson 
the next play, and Johnson 
followed with a keeper, pick-
ing up an additional 26 yards. 
Nicholes picked up 12 yards 
on the next two plays, but 
fumbled the ball on his next 
carry and the Swifts recovered 
on their own 21. 

Nazareth picked up two 
first downs, but was forced to 
punt from the Canyon 44 with 
3:50 left in the half. 

The Swift defense held Masonic Lodge observes 
75th birthday Thursday 	Veals, back in game, 

wins week's honors surance. They notified the 
sheriff, who ordered the body 
exhumed. A Hereford doctor 
called in to conduct the autop-
sy pronounced the body to be 
"roast beef, boys," and the 
attempted fraud was uncov-
ered. The farmer—who was 
not a Mason, as it turned 
out—was later captured and 
sentenced to 15 years. 

Dennis Veals returned to 
the Bobcat lineup Friday 
against Tulia after being out 
since the first game due to leg 
injuries and earned the Ama-
rillo Globe-News Area Class 
AA honor as Player of the 
Week. 

Highway rebuilding 
around halfway mark 

GAME AT A GLANCE 
Nazareth 	 Canyon: 
10 	First Downs 	13- 
101 	Rushing Yardage 134 
34 	Passing Yardage 	57 
135 	Total Offense 	191: 
7/3 Passes Att/Comp 10/a 
0 	Interceptions by 	0' 
0 	Fumbles Lost 
5/58 Penalties/Yards 

Veals is a senior tailback 
and doubles as a safety on 
defense, while Bossett plays 
both offensive and defensive 
halfback. 

Coach Jerry Vance said 
Veals and Bossett contributed 
equally in the 19-7 upset over 
Tulia. 

Veals exploded for 201 
yards on 30 carries and ram-
bled for three touchdowns. 
The 185-pounder's efforts in 
that 19-7 upset over Tulia 
earned him the honor. 

Veals and Bossett were 
both members of Dimmitt's 
state-qualifying sprint relay 
team last season. 

2' 
4/36 

More about: 

Gas bill ... 

Veals was pushed for this 
week's award by teammate 
Larry Bossett. 

Veals suffered a pulled leg 
muscle in Dimmitt's opening 
game against Floydada, which 
the Bobcats lost 7-6. The Bob-
cats then dropped two more 
games before Veals returned 
to the lineup Friday. Score by Quarters: 

Nazareth 	0 7 0 
Canyon JV 	0 0 0 

0 — 7. 
2—Z 

• 

small talk 
on both the highways through 
Dimmitt. 

Asked whether the work 
will be done by this time next 
year, he said "I hope we'll be 
out by Christmas except for 
the riding surface which we'll 
put on next summer when the 
heat will make a better job of 
it. Nov. 1 is the last date we 
could apply finish topping." 

To another question, "Why 
wasn't the project started 
earlier?" he said "They start-
ed May 30, the month the 
contract was let. That was as 
soon as they could start, con-
sidering the time required to 
get the necessary state 
forms." 

from 
south hills manor 

By BRICK AUTRY 
Librarian 

lodge hall," Ramey said. 
"We met there about 10 
year, until IT burned down." 

Local Masons then held 
their meetings in churches 
until they could build a lodge 
hall on the second floor of a 
warehouse. But a wino broke 
into the warehouse one night 
to sleep, set it afire acci-
dentally, and the Masons lost 
that lodge hall, too, to flames. 

"Later, the bank provided 
space for us on the second 
floor of its building until the 
lodge bought the present 
hall," Ramey said. 

At the urging of visiting 
Masons, Ramey also told how 
the Castro Lodge came to 
bury a whiteface calf with 
Masonic honors in 1918. 

A farmer south of town had 
burned the calf in his house in 
an attempted insurance fraud 
and everyone assumed the 
dead body was his. The 
"dead" man's wife claimed 
he had been a Mason. Al-
though the local lodge could 
find no record of his mem-
bership, they deferred to the 
grieving widow and conducted 
the burial rites. 

But local Masons became 
suspicious when the "dead" 
man's wife asked them to 
help her collect $50,000 in in- 

i. 

Mike Smotherman wants to 
be featured in this column, 
too. Not too much that I can 
say about him here except 
that he's a nice big kid. As a 
matter of fact, he's bigger 
than I am. But his feet are 
temporarily too big and he 
lurches into things a lot. He 
says that he plays football at 
school. He must be a guard. 

Nuggets 

Youts answered the query, 
"Couldn't the traffic light be 
reset to give more time to 
east-west traffic, since that's 
the heaviest?" He said, "I've 
parked at the courthouse 
square and watched it at 
different times of day, and 
there's not as much difference 
in east-west and north-south 
traffic as you'd think." 

from the 
Senior Citizens' Cent 

Another 	question 	was 
whether it would be practical 
to sprinkle the streets to keep 
the powdery dust down and 
out of the stores. Jackson re-
plied that he thinks it will be 
possible to get the contractor 
to do that, "although it may 
be hard to do because there's 
a lot of traffic around that 
intersection.' ' 

By RUTH COLEMAN 

[Continued from Page 1) 
rigation gas users, the com-
promise bill would also bring 
the price of gas for agri-
cultural industries in this area 
under regulation. 

The measure defines ag-
ricultural use of gas as "ag-
ricultural production, natural 
fiber production, natural fiber 
processing, food processing, 
food quality maintenance, ir-
rigation pumping, crop dry-
ing, or as a process fuel or 
feedstock in the production of 
fertilizer, agricultural chem-
icals, animal feed or food." 

A unique provision of the 
bill calls for the price of ag-
ricultural gas to be regulated 
by the state if the state has a 
regulatory agency, and by the 
federal government if the 
state does not. 

So if the Texas Railroad 
Commission becomes the ag-
ency to regulate the price of 
intrastate gas for agricultural 
use, farmers in this area will 
have a voice before the com-
mission in the Plains Irri-
gation Gas Users Association, 
whose president is Wade 
Mills of Castro County. 

"This would give us a little 
closer representation on the 
issue," Riley said. 

Many Castro County farm-
ers have been to Washington 
during the past year to testify 
on proposed natural-gas legis-
lation, especially on pricing 
and priority. 

"Under the 

Masons and their wives 
from three states gathered in 
Dimmitt last Thursday night 
to help Castro Lodge 879 ob-
serve its 75th anniversary. 

On hand were representa-
tives of the Grand Lodges of 
Texas, Oklahoma and New 
Mexico, as well as visitors 
from other lodges in the Pan-
handle. 

The Order of the Eastern 
Star served the anniversary 
banquet in the lodge hall, 
which was followed by an 
open meeting attended by a 
standing-room-only audience 
of Masons, wives, guests and 
visitors. 

Main speaker at the meet-
ing was Grand Master Thur-
man Benson of the Grand 
Lodge of Texas, who paid 
tribute to those who establish-
ed the Castro Lodge in 1903. 

"A successful and mean-
ingful lodge is in a constant 
process of sowing, reaping 
and revitalization," Benson 
said. "All the work, energy 
and heartaches that have 
gone into the making of the 
Castro Lodge have been worth 
it. Would Dimmitt be the city 
it is if its people did not live 
by the principles of freema-
sonry?" 

Other speakers were Carl 
Moore, master of the local 
lodge, who gave the welcome; 
Ira Brown, lodge secretary, 
who read the lodge's oldest 
existing set of minutes (June 
27, 1903), in which members 
adopted bylaws and elected 
officers; and Edwin "Goose" 
Ramey, lodge treasurer, who 
recounted the history of Cas-
tro Lodge 879. 

Ramey recalled how fires 
plagued the local lodge in its 
earlier years. 

After organizing in 1903, 
Ramey said, the lodge met in 
the original courthouse its 
first few years until the court-
house burned. The fire des-
troyed all of the lodge's pos-
sessions except one minute 
book, he said. 

"Grandpa Slover built a 
drug store where the phone 
office now is, and included a 

More about: 
NHS will sell 
holiday greens 

Lost and Found: child's 
wool coat, beige plaid, very 
small, left in the library two 
weeks ago this Friday. Come 
to library to pick up. 

I am often asked why I 
write such odd things in this 
column which should be re-
served for library activities. 
Well, you know, I like to 
include material which is bril-
liant, witty and sometimes 
provocative. I am also very 
vain. Now what do you think 
of that? 

I also try to pass on some 
tidbits here and there which 
patrons will find useful when 
using the library. For ex-
ample, I have to explain what 
sundry things are for. One 
poor student needed to know 
what Granger's Index to Pa 
etry was for and I had to tell 
him that it had nothing to 
do with the price of poetry on 
the stock exchange. 

For those of you wondering 
about library activities, this 
list has been prepared for 
you. Harvesting ... 

unregulated 
system, our irrigation gas has 
been costing us more and 
more, and we've wondered 
about the justification for the 
high prices," Riley said. "It 
appears that the exemption of 
agriculture from incremental 
pricing, and the regulation of 
irrigation gas prices, will be 
helpful." 

Passage of the compromise 
bill by the House today would 
be "at least a partial victory 
for farmers in our area," 
Riley said, "although there 
are parts of it we don't like. It 
appears that the compromise 
is about the best we could 
obtain for the best interests of 
all concerned.- 

1. Texas Panhandle Library 
System started a new fiscal 
year this past month. 

2. The system coordinator 
will visit us soon and prepare 
a new profile on Rhoads Lib-
rary. 

3. Rhoads Library will host 
a workshop for area librar-
ians. Librarians from Tulia, 
Hereford, Friona, Canyon and 
Dalhart will be our guests. 

Well, we guess the Pen-
ningtons are well into their 
religious crusade in Chile. We 
do hope they have a suc-
cessful campaign and our 
thoughts and prayers are with 
them. 

Thursday night is enter-
tainment night at the Senior 
Citizens Center and Connie 
Ivey is in charge of the pro-
gram. We will have ice cream 
and cake. 

On Saturday, Oct. 21, Mr. 
and Mrs. Gerald Broadstreet 
will have a showing of their 
jewelry. Everyone is invited, 
between 2 and 5. 

We are very proud of our 
kitchen and the kitchen com-
mittee is really working to get 
everything in place. 

Come play games with us 
on Tuesday nights, and visit 
any time. 

The G.A.s from the Frio 
Baptist Church came Monday 
evening and sang for the res-
idents. They had made Hal-
loween decorations for each 
door. Thanks to Karen Pzick, 
Carla Frye, Sharla Richards,, 
Andrea Wall, Kandi Spark-
man, Debbie Hathaway, Tre-
na 'rims and their leaders 
Suzy Wall, Patsy Sparkman 
and Francis Hathaway. 

Alma Umberson was born 
March 10, 1900 in Gormon. 
Her parents were Mr. and 
Mrs. Charles Reynolds. She 
had three brothers and three 
sisters. 

Alma's family moved GO 
Floyd County in 1918 and 
lived in the Sunset commun-
ity. In 1919 Alma married 
Ercel Umberson. They had 
one son, Dee. They moved to 
Castro County in 1921 and 
Mr. Umberson farmed. He 
passed away in 1965. 

Alma was one of the first 
residents of South Hills Ma-
nor. She keeps very busy and 
loves all types of handwork; 
She is a member of the First 
United Methodist Church: 
She enjoys visiting, so come 
by and spend some time 
visiting Alma. 

Hershel Wilson enterta. :ed 
the residents Saturday night, 
and Sunday the Rough Rid-
ers, a group of young people 
from Nazareth, provided en;  
tertainment. Derrel Musick 
and Nita Hall came out Surf;  
day evening to entertain. 

We would like to thank 
everyone who helped make 
our porch sale a success. 

In the hospital this week 
from South Hills Manor i's 
Gladys Justice. 

Dimmitt's downtown high-
way rebuilding is "coming 
along just about on schedule" 
even though the time seems 
long to residents, Dimmitt 
Lions Club members were 
told TueSday by Teddy Jack-
son, chief inspector for the 
Texas Department of High-
ways and Transportation. 

As of Oct. 1, Jackson said, 
the contractor had used up 43 
percent of his time on this job 
and it was 40 percent com-
pleted. He explained that the 
contractor is not charged for 
rain-out time. 

Jackson also said that after 
the first 10 inches of pave-
ment and old base are torn 
out, they have to plow six 
inches deeper for watering 
and consistent compaction 
"and this is when we hit the 
water lines." He said the 
water lines under the high-
ways were not laid deeply 
enough originally. 

Mayor Elmer Youts com-
mented that "Our biggest 
problem has been to sit and 
wait for the streets to dry out 
after rains." 

He said the city had first 
contacted the Highway De-
partment 'about two and a 
half years ago, when Hwy. 86 
was coming apart west of 
town. They said they didn't 
have funds then—all state 
highway funds for repair and 
construction were frozen for a 
couple of years, but they 
would reseal it. They said it 
really needed rebuilding, not 
more resealing. 

"Later, Hwy. 385 began to 
come apart,-  the mayor con-
tinued. "About that time the 
district highway engineer call-
ed and said he thought he 
might get the money to re-
build here, and wanted to 
know if the city wanted the 
work done. After consulting 
with the two city commis-
sioners, I told them to go 
ahead with it—we were 
ready." 

Answering questions, Jack-
son said the contractor will lay 
41/2  inches of black base and 
1 1/2  inches of riding surface 

The National Honor Society 
of Dimmitt High School will 
sell Christmas greenery Tues-
day, Oct. 17, starting at 4:30 
p.m. 

Anyone interested in buy-
ing greenery who is not con-
tacted may notify any NHS 
member or call 647-4539. Pro-
ceeds of the sale will be used 
for NHS projects of this school 
year. 

Too Late to Classify 
NEEDED: Year round farmer. 
647-5321. 	 9-2-tfc 

You are cordially invited to attend 

the Grand Opening of 

JEANNIE'S SHOES 

5406 Slide Road 

Plains Plaza Shopping Center 

Lubbock, Texas 

October 12, 13, & 14 
Open 10 a. m. to 6 p, m. 

DOC'S HEALTH CENTER will be closed soon if more 
of you people do not come for treatments. 
Check your feet, pinch all 10 of your toes, top and 
bottom, hard with your thumb and first finger, in the 
middle. You will probably find tender places on the 
underside and at the bottom of the toes. Also check 
the sides and bottom of your feet. If your feet are not 
okay, your body is not either. 
And what you eat and drink has a lot to do with the 
condition your body is in. It will not take but 5 minutes 
to drive out from Dimmitt and about 30 minutes to find 
out where the trouble is and have a treatment. 
CALL 647-2222 for an appointment. 

[Continued from Page 1] 

on until around Christmas. 
Maxwell said quality and 

production is good and local 
fields are yielding around 600 
cartons of lettuce per acre and 
eight to 10 tons of carrots to 
the acre. 

Prices are down but this 
could be attributed to the 
over-production of lettuce in 
the west, Maxwell said. Also, 
the demand on carrots is low 
due to carrots being shipped 
in from Michigan, California 
and Canada. 

Calvin Jones of Holly Sugar 
in Hereford said sugarbeet 
harvest started on Oct. 5 and 
deliveries are good. Holly 
Sugar anticipates completion 
near the end of November. 

The yield of about 20 tons 
to the acre is lower than was 
anticipated, Jones said. 

KEEP 
JIMMY DAVIS 

FOR 

COUNTY ATTORNEY 
Pd. Pol. Adv. by Jimmy Davis for County 
Attorney Committee, Robert McLean, Treasurer. 

Owned and Operated by John and Sylvia Ortiz, 
Formerly of Dimmitt IN MOST cases, employed 

wives contribute 20 to 40 
percent of the family income. 

More about: 

Fatal wreck ... 
[Continued from Page 1J 

left side more than 180 feet 
from the fence. The car was 
out of control approximately 
one-fourth of a mile, Maples 
reported. 

Scattered around the car at 
the gruesome accident scene 
were dressed chickens, a bag 
of charcoal briquets, plates, 
cooking pots, soft-drink bot-
tles, bread and other picnic 
supplies, along with the car's 
sprirgs, mirror, spare tire, 
deck speakers, tape cartridges 
and tools. 

A motorist who said Mata 
ran him off the road shortly 
before the accident told Map-
les that he had chased Mata's 
car at speeds up to 90 and 95 
mph in an attempt to get his 
license number. 

Mrs. Reyna, who is preg-
nant, "told me she had de-
manded that Mata slow down 
or else stop the cadand let her 
out," Maples said, "but she 
said he told her he was going 
to pass everybody on the 
road. 

A blood-alcohol test at the 
hospital after the accident 
indicated Matz was intoxicat-
ed, Maples said. 

Two other persons were in-
jured in a car-truck collision 
shortly after noon Tuesday at 
the intersection of Hwy. 194 
and First Street in Hart. 

A 1973 Buick sedan driven 
by Margarita Rodriquez of 
Hart and a 1968 Dodge truck 
hauling animal hides, driven 
by James Bussey of Plain-
view, were involved. 

State Trooper Dyrle Maples 
said Mrs. Rodriquez' vehicle 
was entering the highway 
from First St., and she failed 
to see the oncoming east-
bound truck, which hit the 
right side of the Buick. Both 
vehicles were totaled. 

Both drivers were taken to 
Plains Memorial Hospital. 
Mrs. Rodriquez reportedly 
had leg and back injuries and 
Bussey had neck injuries. 



andra 
Savings 
Center 

In Bearden Shopping Center 	Phone 647-315$ 

Mon. Thru Sat 9 a.m. to 7:30 p.m. 

SPECIALS GOOD OCTOBER 11 THRU 17 

ARRID 
EXTRA DRY 

$209  14 0. spray 
DOW OVEN 
CLEANER 

SOFT CARE 
ex- DIAPERS 

$C29 
Reg. 9739 	al doz. 

HUNTING 
VEST 

1°55 $499  Reg 197 

STADIUM 
SEATS Reg sr$549  

SIGNAL 
MOUTHWASH 
$1°17 

PANASONIC 
FM-AM DIGITAL 
CLOCK RADIO 

Reg IV 

$2997  

VOUR 
PICK 

SATURDAY ONLY!' 
PRESTO DOUBLE 

BURGER II 
Little Griddle $1 5"  

While Supply Last!! 

House of Name Brands 

FITTED 
CRIB SHEETS 
) 	Reg  sr 

$2"  

7 

9 

Rely on 

CHAULKIN 
WALLS COMPOUND 

INSULATED 
	

by DAP 
COVERALLS 3 fors' 00 

Reg. $329' 

$2297 	ULTRA MAX 
swo savin„ 	SHAMPOO 

SUNBEAM 
ELECTRIC 
S!71181LLLET 

$2997  

	 TRAINING 
PANTS 

For The Tots 
Reg. 79` 57C 

TOG-A-LOGS 

20% OFF 
POTTING SOIL 

40 lb. bog 

$259 

Thursday, October 12 19713 
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SIGN HERE—County Judge Weldon Bradley uses the fender 
of the county fire truck to sign the proclamation designating 
Oct. 8-14 as Fire Prevention Week here. Witnessing the 
signing, from left, are Gale Sadler, president of the Castro 

County Farm Bureau, which sponsors a fireman annually at the 
state firemen's school; Farm Bureau Secretary Richard 
Connell; Assistant Fire Marshal Charles Littlejohn [in cab[, and 
Fire Marshal Guy Waldrop. 

FULL 
PROTECTION 

INTERNATIONAL 
FILTER ELEMENTS 

Time to change your filter elements' Insist on 
genuine IH filters for full protection Only IH ele-
ments have all these features: 

• Resin-impregnated acid-resistant filtering mate-
rial... removes abrasives as small as 39 mil-
lionths of an inch. 

• Larger filter area—up to 12 feet of paper in each 
element. 

• Rugged center core to withstand high pressure 
See us for oil filters, fuel filters, hydraulic filters, and 
air filters for all your International equipment. 

Aim 

Hays Implement Co. 
Hwy. 38S & Fenn Rood 3215 

National Fire Prevention 
Week, Oct. 8-14, proclaimed 
in Castro County by County 
Judge Weldon Bradley, calls 
public attention to the year-
around aim of volunteer fire 
departments in Dimmitt, Naz-
ar?th and Hart—to keep fires 
from starting. 

The proclamation and the 
annual banquet of the Dim-
mitt Volunteer Fire Depart-
ment are observances of the 
week in this city. Fire Chief 
Gene Kern at Nazareth com-
mented, "We don't have any 
special program for Fire Pre-
vention Week; we try to pre-
vent 'em all the time." 

In his proclamation, Judge 
Bradley said, "The United 
States has the worst fire 
record of any industrialized 
nation. Hundreds of thous-
ands of fires rage each year, 
killing about 8,800 persons, 
causing damage in excess of 
$11 billion, leaving thousands 
homeless or jobless." 

He mentioned the 347 fire 
deaths in Texas during 1977, 
with 24 of them on farms or 
ranches. Residential fires in 

1"""'-'11--` 
I CASTRO 
I CO-OP GIN 

I 
U 

Dimmitt, Texas I 
I 

NM In MEN NMI NM NM I.  

I 
U 
I 
I 

714 S. Hwy. 38S 

I 	Ph. 647-3546 
allsoute-cleartout 

oF all '78s! 
Here's our complete listing of 1978 models 

still in stock. We've got to close them out to 

make way for the '79s. This is the once-a-year 

sale you've been waiting for! Come and look, 

test-drive, compare--while the supply lasts! 

Two-Door Models 
Stock No. 	Model 

C21A — MALIBU LANDAU 	  
C38A — MONTE CARLO 	  
C40A — MONTE CARLO 	  
C35A — MONTE CARLO 	  
C34A — MONTE CARLO 	  
C39A — CAPRICE CLASSIC COUPE 	  

List Price 
	Close-Out Price 

6791.54 	$5750 
7011.90 	$5931 
7035.90 	$5950 
6921.90 	$5862 
7864.90 	$6842 
8416.95 	$7191 

Pickups 
T47A — 4-WHEEL DRIVE PICKUP 	  

Four-Door Models 
8634.50 	Save $$$ 

C41A — IMPALA 4-DOOR 	  
7096.95 	$5967 

C33A — IMPALA 4-DOOR 	  7119.95 	$6010 
C31A — IMPALA 4-DOOR 	  7119.95 	$6010 
C27A — CAPRICE 4-DOOR 	  

8943.50 	$7298 

$6208 
$8000 

Save $$$ on 
Demonstrator Pickups and Company Cars! 

MALIBU CLASSIC 4-DOOR 
Only 3 595 miles 

CAPRICE CLASSIC STATION WAGON 
6,755 miles 

CAPRICE CLASSIC COUPE 
Only 1,216 miles 

CUSTOM DELUXE PICKUP 
8,116 miles 

SILVERADO DIESEL PICKUP 
Only 3,885 miles 

EL CAMINO CLASSIC 

5,415 miles 

IMPALA 4-DOOR [Driver Training Car] 
6,547 miles 

Reeve-Fleming Chevrolet 
385.194 Intersection 	 6474111 

Station Wagons 
	  7178.78 

9333.55 

C36A — MALIBU CLASSIC 
C10A — CAPRICE CLASSIC 	  

OPEN 24 
HOURS 

ALLSUP4S 
CONVENIENCE STORES 

PRICES GOOD 
OCT. 12-15, 1978 

&mum Specittio Daily ad Rapt Feado 
ALLSUP'S 

ICE CREAM 
1/2  GALS 1 29 

CTN. 
OSCAR MAYER JUMBO 

WEINERS 
BORDEN'S 

BUTTERMILK 
10.99c 
PKG. 

1/2  GAL.7.9c  
CTN. 

cZ7 

PARK°  

MARGARINE 

PARKAY 

QTRS. 
1 LB. 39c 

BORDEN'S 

Cottage Cheese 

1219 CTN. 

FOR SNACK TIME 

Bar-B-Que 
Set 

69C 
DETERGENT 

CHEER 
GIANT S 1 39 
SIZE  

AFTER SCHOOL TREATS 

ii Novelties 

	2FOR25 C  
Del Monte 

TOMATO 
SAUCE 
iforsr°  

BORDEN'S 

(range Juice 
0 69c 

OT.  
SIZE 

KLEENEX 
TISSUE 

2 for$1® 

DR. PEPPER 
Diet & Reg. 

6 pk. 

32 oz. $1 59  plus deposit 

CHICKEN OF THE SEA 

TUNA 
6'/2 oz.6g 

CAN 

Cracker Jacks 
,oz Si 00 

BOXES 	111 
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National Fire Prevention Week 

'Better to prevent fire than fight it' 

Thursday, October 12, 1978 

Classified Ads Get Results—Phone 647-3123 

amount monthly for its share 
of the protection, and helps 
pay the firemen's retirement 
fund. Some county-owned 
equipment is also used and 
the county pays for upkeep 
and fuel for that equipment. 

The fire station on West 

the nation claim an estimated 
6,200 lives yearly, most of 
them between hours of 9 p.m. 
and 6 a.m. 

Safety practices in the 
home to prevent fires are 
emphasized in the proclama-
tion, with "Learn not to 
burn" as the slogan. 

Four practices are recom-
mended: Have a smoke de-
tector, have every family 
member learn an escape plan 
in case of night fire, make 
sure every member knows 
how to turn in a fire alarm 
and how to use portable ex-
tinguishers, rehearse how to 
"stop, drop and roll" to 
smother a blaze if skin, hair 
or clothing catches fire. 

The National Fire Protec-
tion Association, which spon-
sors Fire Prevention Week, 
reports three times as many 
deaths from smoke inhalation 
as from burns, and urges use 
of smoke detectors in homes 
and businesses. 

Fire impartments in Castro 
County all operate with vol-
unteers, who give their time 
not only to answer fire calls 
but for training in handling 
various kinds of blazes and in 
life saving techniques. 

Dimmitt's VFD has only 
one paid fireman, Charles 
Littlejohn, in addition to Fire 
Marshal Guy Waldrop. The 
other 27 members are volun-
teers, Dimmitt residents who 
represent a variety of occu-
pations. 

They answered a total of 68 
calls the past year, 23 of them 
inside the city limits. Castro 
County pays a contracted  

Bedford is owned by the City 
of Dimmitt. Equipment con-
sists of seven vehicles in-
cluding three pumper units, a 
large tanker truck and backup 
tanker, a rescue unit vehicle 
and the chief's station wagon. 

The firemen's banquet is 
scheduled at 7:30 p.m. today 
(Thursday) at the fire station. 
Firemen, their wives and 
guests including city and 
county officials will attend. 
The Fireman of the Year is 
recognized at each banquet, 
and awards will be made to 
those who answered the most 
calls and attended the most 
drill sessions during the year. 

Twenty volunteers make up 
the Hart VFD, with Frank 
Barnes as chief. It responded 
to approximately 30 calls the 
past year in the town of Hart 
and surrounding areas. 

The Hart fire station houses 
the department's four ve-
hicles, three pumpers and a 
tanker. 

Nazareth firemen have their 
own building and equipment, 
for which they have raised 
money by sponsoring num-
erous .community entertain-
ments. Eight volunteer fire-
men regularly attend meet, 
ings, and others respond to 
fire calls, Kern said. 

Their equipment includes a 
500-gallon pumper, a coun-
ty-owned truck, a 66-gallon 
mini-pumper, an emergency 
van with generator, auxiliary 
pump and other emergency 
equipment. The department 
serves the rural area in its 
part of the county as well as 
Nazareth. 

Firemen from all three de-
partments attend the Texas 
Firemen's Training School at 
A&M University each sum-
mer. State and local Farm 
Bureaus sponsor the training 
school, and also pay $75 to 
fire departments for fighting 
each rural fire on property 
insured by the Farm Bureau 
Insurance Companies. 

School menus 
at Nazareth 

MONDAY — Smorgasbord, 
tossed salad, English peas, 
hot buttered bread, chocolate 
cake, milk. 

TUESDAY — Chili dogs, 
pork and beans, carrot sticks, 
pear halves, milk. 

WEDNESDAY — Hot tur-
key sandwich, cranberry 
sauce, green beans, tossed 
salad, peanut butter chews, 
milk. 

THURSDAY — Frito pie, 
coin, coleslaw, hot buttered 
bread, red velvet cake, milk. 

FRIDAY — Batter-fried 
fish, tartar sauce, macaroni 
and cheese, broccoli-rice cas-
serole, hot rolls, butter, jelly, 
peach slices, milk. 

Greenware • • bisque 
Firing 	• 	Supplies 

THE FUN SHOP 

Ceramics & Gifts 

Betty Rickert 
Dwaine Wall 
200 W. Helsel! 

Classified Ads Get Results— Phone 6474123 
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REBATE PROGRAM: Join with us and Zenith in this exciting 
double celebration by taking full advantage of the big Zenith 
60th Anniversary Customer Rebate Program. You'll save 
significant dollars on selected Zenith SYSTEM 3 TV models 
. . . up to S60.00 depending on the set purchased. Here's how 
the program works. Just buy any one of the qualifying models, 
fill out the money-back coupon from your Zenith dealer and 
send the coupon back to Zenith with your owner's registration 
card as your proof of purchase. You'll get a check direct 
from Zenith. Program starts Sept. 4 and ends Nov. 1, 1978. 

Featuring 
1979 

THE BEST ZENITH EVER! 

PICTURE TUBE 
The sharpest Zenith 

picture ever! 

TRI-FOCUS TRIPLE-PLUS 
CHASSIS 

Designed to be the most 
reliable Zenith ever! 

COLOR SENTRY 
Zenith's most 

sophisticated, automatic 
picture control system! 

The IVES • K2544M 
Early American Styled 
Console. Maple wood-
grained finish applied to 
genuine Maple wood 
veneers on top and 
ends. Gallery of select 
hardwood solids. Front 
and base of simulated 
wood. Casters. 

Get our great 
	price PLUS you get 

* */ up to $110" * * * * * * * * * * 

ZENITH... 
America's No.1 TV.. 

year after year! 
* Quality Service Dept. 

* Easy Terms Available 	
/ 

from Zenith 
C0)0 14/1" 

103 E Bedford 

KITTRELL ELECTRONICS.. 

50e  
11111 CHIBRATION I 	I 

3ru"  Zenitlis 60% Amiletsary! 

-11001enitti

moissoossoessessm 
Zs 20 1000 Color Tv! 

‘P' 

with IC CASH RfilliTES 
up to ION  "meet from blab to 1111! 

IP% 
The ROSSINI 

K2548E 
Mediterranean 

Styled Console. 
Genuine Oak wood 
veneers on top and 

ends. Front and 
base of simulated 

wood. Antique Oak 
color finish. Casters. 

The HAYDN 
K2512W 

Table TV featuring 
American Walnut 

wood-grain 
finish applied to 

durable wood 
products. sou 

Rebate 

?...P" SYSTEM 3 
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pies Hof r 

Community vote slated 

ACCORDING to legend, 
those who kiss the Blarney 
Stone will be endowed with 
great powers of persuasion. 

THERE are more species of 
insects on earth than any 
other living thing. By CHARLEY E. HILL 

County Executive Director 

Photograhpy by 

MARGIE HUGHES 

WEDDINGS AND 

ALL OCCASIONS 

KRESS, TEXAS 

Box 484 	Phone 684-2535 

dive  
of race, color, religion, sex or 
national origin. 

THOUGHT: It doesn't mat-
ter whether you win or lose —
until you lose 

Committee Election—The 
ASC election of community 
committeemen will be held 
on Dec. 4. Ballots will be 
mailed to eligible voters about 
10 days before the election. 

Any person who is of legal 
voting age and has an interest 
in a farm as owner, tenant, or 
sharecropper, or is not of 
legal voting age but super-
vises and conducts the farm-
ing operations on an entire 
farm, is eligible to vote in the 
election. Both husband and 
wife are eligible to vote. 

Important dates to remem-
ber regarding the election 
are: 

Oct. 5 — Begin nomina-
tions by petition. 

Oct 30 — Last day for 
nominations by petition. 

Nov. 24 — Ballots mailed to 
eligible voters. 

Dec. 4 — Last day to return 
voted ballots. 

Dec. 6 — Ballots counted at 
Castro County ASCS office. 

Dec. 13 — County conven-
tion at Castro County ASCS 
office. 

Jan. 1 — New committee 
members and alternates take 
office. 

Participation in ASC elec-
tions and ASCS programs is 
open to all farmers regardless 

647-3123 For Printing 

Vote For 

Weldon Bradley 
For a 

Second Term 
I would like to take this means of asking for your 

vote and support. 
In presiding over the Commissioners' Court and 

handling all County Court cases, all Probates, and all 
commitments, I feel I have been fair. I will continue to 
do so if elected your County Judge for another term. 

I will consider any problem that might arise and will 
act according to the law and to the best interest of all 
concerned. 

As a taxpayer, I definitely believe that taxes should 
be held to a minimum. 

After serving as your County Judge for four years, I 
feel I can do a better job in the future. 

I am a Democrat. 
(Paid for by Weldon Bradley) 

topping to the street that runs from the schoolgrounds west 
past the church and American Legion hall to State 168. Also 
paved was an east-west residential street on the north edge of 
the city. 

Nazareth 
BUILDING 

MATERIALS 

CAPABLE- 
DEPENDABLE 

Phone 938-2183 
Hart and Tula 

Hills Manor with guitar music 
and singing Sunday after-
noon. 

Many friends from Naza-
reth attended the funeral of 
Coach Hooper's father in 01-
ton Friday afternoon. 

AUCTIONEERS — LIQUIDATORS 

APPRAISERS — SALES MANAGEMENT 

REAL ESTATE 

M&A AUCTIONEERS, INC. 

MEADE MICHAEL 
	

DEAN SANDERS 
353-5898 
	

938-2217 
Amarillo 
	

Hart 

DARROLL ADAMS 
499-3558 

Umbarger 

ica Day. 
The official theme of this 

year's observance is "Evan-
gelization and Ministry by 
Sharing and Caring" through 
which Catholic Daughters can 
proclaim the Gospel, share 
the Good News and become 
true evangelizers. 

The late Holy Father Pope 
Paul VI proclaimed 1978 as 
the Year of Evangelization. 
Evangelization has been in-
cluded as a vital part of the 
community segment of the 
Catholic Daughters' Heart 
Speaks to Heart program. 

Proclaiming the Gospel is 
not merely a service, but 
rather a joy rendered to the 
Christian community and the 
whole of humanity; therefore 
Mayor John Slavik proclaims 
Sunday, Oct. 15 as "Catholic 
Daughters of America Day" 
in Nazareth for Court Arch-
bishop Gerken #1368. 

The Catholic Daughters of 
Nazareth are observing this 
day with a Mass of Reception 
for new members at 6:30 p.m. 
followed by a supper for the 
members and their husbands 
or friends. The Court is also 
celebrating the 34th birthday 
of their organization and hon- 

oring the 25-year members. 

Mr. and Mrs. Wert Hoel-
ting of Redondo Beach, Calif. 
are here visiting families and 
friends. On Sunday evening 
the California visitors and the 
Wert Albrachts of Hereford, 
the Ed Hoeltings, the Ab 
Hoeltings, Ella Hoelting, the 
Greg Hoeltings, the Francis 
Wilhelms and the Ed Ra-
maekers of Nazareth enjoyed 
supper and the evening with 
Dora Albracht. 

Congratulations to Herbie 
and Joyce Wethington of Du-
mas on the birth of a son. 
Mrs. Marie Venhaus is in 
Dumas with the Wethingtons 
caring for her new grandson. 

Mrs. Ethel Schmucker and 
Mrs. Gin Huseman spent 
Tuesday and Wednesday in 
Levelland at the Amarillo 
DCCW Convention. They 
were delegates of the Christ-
ian Mothers Society. 

Mr. and Mrs. Jerome 
Brockman spent Sunday in 
Plainview. They were part of 
a screening committee to pick 
prospective candidates for the 
new Deacon program Oct. 
28-29. 

Calvin and Kathy (Brock-
man) Yarborough attended 
the funeral of Calvin's moth-
er, Velma in Elk City, Okla. 
on Sunday. 

* 
Mr. and Mrs. Robert Huse-

man and Father Stanley at-
tended the Plainview Knights 
of Columbus Third Annual 
Columbus celebration Sunday 
evening. They enjoyed a Mex-
ican supper and the Plainview 
drama class furnished the en-
tertainment. 

Mr. and Mrs. Clarence 
Schulte and Agnes Brockman 
enjoyed Sunday dinner with 
the Phil Brockman family in 
Lazbuddie. 

The Nazareth Swift Band 
garage sale was a great suc-
cess in Dimmitt Saturday. 
This will help the band go to 
El Paso. 

The Nazareth CYO enter-
tained the residents of South MR. FARMER 
Hart woman's 
mother dies 

Funeral services for Jannie 
Mabel Clark, 78, of Plainview, 
mother of Vera Alford of 
Hart, were conducted Friday 
at a Plainview memorial chap-
el by Rev. Doug Metzgar, As-
sembly of God pastor, and 
burial was in Plainview Mem-
orial Park. 

Mrs. Clark, a native of Ada. 
Okla., died last Wednesday. 
Her husband, E. E. Clark, 
died in 1975. 

Survivors include four 
daughters, Mrs. Paul Deaver 
of Lubbock, Mrs. Norman 
Gallow and Mrs. Earl Troxell 
of Albuquerque, and Mrs. 
Alford; two sons, Erving of 
Plainview and R. G. of 
Hodge, La.; a sister, 22 
grandchildren, 43 great-
grandchildren, and eight 
great-great-grandchildren. We Are Also Calling To Let You Know 

That We Appreciate Your Patronage 

During Harvest Seasons 
Now Leasing 

WEST TEXAS 

MINI-STORAGE 

Lock it & Leave it 

647.3427 or 

296-6372 

Only $979  

ED HARRIS 
LUMBER CO. 

Tent Off ice Of Traff lc Safety 

PERSONAL PHONE CALL ® 
To Let You Know That We Are 

Anxious to Handle Your Corn, Milo and 

Soy Beans This 

Our Elevators And Facilities Are In Readiness 
To Give You The Type Of Service You Expect 

And Are Entitled To 

HARVEST SEASON 

Please Consider This As A 

By VIRGIE GERBER 

Sunday, Oct. 15 has been 
designated by the National 
Board of the Catholic Daugh-
ters of America as National 
Catholic Daughters of Amer- 

NAZARETH STREETS received more than 2,000 feet of 
sealcoat last week when the Jake Diel Dirt & Paving Co. of 
Hereford applied P 2 inches of hot-mix topping to two 
east-west streets in a 515,000 project. Here, workers apply 

National CDA Day to be observed 

W&C GRAIN, Inc. 
East Bedford 

Garner Ball, Mgr. 

407). CD CD 



Hesston Beet Harvesting 
Equipment 

 

-/ Direct Type Models 496/496W & 6 
Tank Type Model 565 

...and Beet Top Defoliators 
Models 34 & 65 

8.67% 
PLUS DAILY COMPOUNDING 

ON THE NEW 

6 Month 
SAVINGS CERTIFICATE 

Minimum Deposit $10,000°° 

Earn A High Rate on a Short Term 

Basis. And Get More For Your Money 

Federal Regulations Require a Penalty for Early Withdrawal 

Central Plains Savings 

Association 
3134frivig_htoner 

111 NE 2nd St. 	DIMMITT, TEXAS 	647-2118 
OTHER OFFICES 

TULIA, PLAINVIEW, HALECENTER, & SILVERTON 
	•MMENIMIMIMMINI, 

John Hill will be the first governor in the 
history of Texas who takes office with 
eight years of valuable experience in the 
executive branch of 
state government. His 
two years as Secretary 
of State and six years 
as Attorney General 
are unprecedented 
among Texas gov-
ernors. This experi-
ence will give Texans a 
governor ready to take charge on the first 
day in office — a governor who knows 
how to bring efficient management to the 
job of the state's chief executive. 

* * t * * * * * * * * * ***** * * * * * ****** 

GOVERNOR 
Palo for by John Mil Campaign Funo. Lowell Lebermann, Treasurer ,  
1035 Brown E14dg Austin. Texas 78701 Te1optvone 15121 478-6489 

Monday 
Noon — Kiwanis at Co-

lonial Inn Restaurant 
6:30 p.m. — Tops Club at 

Library 
7:00 p.m. — Adult Basic 

Education Classes at high 
school 

7 p.m. — Young Homemak-
ers (first half of CPR course) 
at Homemaking Dept. high 
school 

7:30 p.m. — Dimmitt 
Schools Choir Concert at High 
School Auditorium 

Tuesday 
5 p.m. — Sundowners HDC 

at courthouse 
Noon — Lions Club at Co-

lonial Inn Restaurant 
7:30 p.m. — Senior Citizens 

Game Night at Senior Citizens 
Bldg. 

7:30 p.m. — 100F at Odd 
Fellows Hall 

8 p.m. — Booster Club at 
high school cafeteria 

Wednesday 
6:30 a.m. — Toastmasters 

Club at Colonial Inn Restau- 
rant 

Thursday 
9:30 a.m. — Town & Coun- 

try Home Demonstration Club 
at courthouse assembly room. 

4 p.m. — Hart Home Dem- 
onstration Club in home of 
Mrs. Vic Nelson. 

7 p.m. — Genealogical So-
ciety at library. 

7:30 p.m. — Fireman of the 
Year Supper at Fire Station. 

7:30 p.m. — United Lions 
at Ann's Steakhouse. 

10 - 12 noon — Social Se-
curity Representative at 
Courthouse 

7:30 p.m. — Rebekahs at 
IOOF Hall 

7:30 p.m. — DHS Home-
coming Bonfire at High 
School 

Friday 
Noon — Rotary Club at 

Colonial Inn Restaurant 
1:30 - 2:30 p.m. — Pre-

school Story Hour at Library 
3 p.m. — Pep Rally, High 

School Gym 
5 - 7 — FHA Barbecue at 

Elementary School Cafeteria 
1958 Class Reunion, start-

ing at the pep rally and con-
tinuing after game, at Coun-
try Club 

8 — Dimmitt vs. Lockney, 
Bobcat Stadium 

Saturday 
10 a.m. — Class of 1958 

Brunch at Colonial Inn Res- 
taurant 
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Owls top Horns, 12-0 
in 'battle of wounded' 

 

• • 	KIM SIDES, 4-H GOLD STAR GIRL 
. . . Accepts award from Judge Weldon Bradley 

Mor• about:, 

DAVID HUSEMAN ACCEPTS 4-H GOLD STAR BOY AWARD 
. . . Seated at left is Kylene Behrends, awards banquet emcee 

 

Sides. Huseman win top 4-H awards ... 

effective all night on offense 
as it suffered eight turnovers, 
five interceptions and three 
fumbles, and generated less 
than 75 yards all night. Sil-
verton, with the exception of 
one 44-yard run, had less than 
100 yards. 

The Longhorns received the 

By MONTY UPTON 

Two teams of the "walking 
wounded" met in Silverton 
Friday night, and the Hart 
Longhorns dropped a tough 
defensive game, 0-12. 

Suffering from injuries to 
key personnel, Hart was in- 

Kiwanis plans hunters 
permit sale, breakfast 

In conjunction with the an-
nual Pheasant Hunters Break- 
fast held by Dimmitt Kiwanis 
Club on the first morning of 
the season this year, club 
members voted at their Mon-
day lunch to accept the pro-
posal of Carl Bruegel that the 
club sell permits for hunting 
on Bruegel land. 

Such permits have been 
sold the past few years, he 
explained, and the proceeds 
given to an area organization. 

Kiwanians planned to sell 
the permits, place placards at 
the hunting areas indicating 
that hunting is limited to 
those with permits, and with 
the help of Key Club mem-
bers police the land during 
hunting season. 

Cost of the permit will also 
include the breakfast, but 
hunters who plan to seek the 
pheasant in other locations 
are also invited to the break-
fast, as usual. 

Trent Armstrong, • Debbie 
Dennis and the sponsor, Ed 
Hickman, were present from 
the Dimmitt High Key Club, 
which is sponsored by the Ki-
wanis Club. 

Hickman reported comple-
tion in one day of the project 
to purchase a new scoreboard 
for Bobcat Stadium, through 
cooperation of local business-
es which purchased the ad-
vertising spaces. 

He said the board has been 
ordered and the club hopes to 
have it in use before the 
present grid season closes. 

Key Clubbers here are join-
ing in an area project to aid 
the Texas and Oklahoma As-
sociation for Retarded Citi-
zens, by running in a 2500 
mile relay for contributions of 
Si per mile. Dimmitt mem-
bers plan to run 250 miles and 
are seeking donations. 

A local service project 
which the club is starting, 
Hickman said, is cleanup 
work at the homes of resi-
dents who are not able to 
clean their own yards. 

Four-year attendance pins 
were presented by Past Pres-
ident Bob Crozier to two 
members who were not pres- 

ent to receive them at the 
annual Kiwanis banquet last 
week. Jimmy Davis earned 
his pin with attendance at 
Lubbock, his former home, 
and in Dimmitt since he 
moved here last year. Floy 
Driver also had a perfect at-
tendance record. 

Gene King, who was in-
stalled at the banquet as pres-
ident, conducted the meeting. (Continued from Page 1] 

anics and hand skills in 1977. 
Bethel and Happy Helpers 

4-H Clubs were presented 
certificates with blue seal and 
Nazareth Club a red seal cer-
tificate, recognizing their ac-
complishments as clubs. Jim 
McNey, assistant County Ex-
tension Agent, gave these 

son of Dimmitt gave the 4-H anne Crozier of Dimmitt was 
prayer as a benediction. Le-  the pianist. 

preciation by Wendy Bruegel 
and Laurie Sides of Bethel 
Club. 

Catherine Hochstein, with 
16 years of leadership at 
Nazareth, Mary Behrends of 
Happy Helpers 4-H and Wil-
liam Hochstein of Nazareth 
with 10 years each had the 
longest records of service. 
Sue Boozer of Bethel received 
a five-year certificate. 

Highlight of the program 
was a slide show and nar-
ration by KaKa Bruegel and 
Kim Sides, both of Bethel, on 
their trip to Washington, D.C. 
for the Citizenship Short 
Course, which is open to out-
standing 4-H'ers. They went 
to Mount Vernon, Monticello, 
Old Williamsburg and other 
historic spots in the area. 

Kylene Behrends of Happy 
Helpers Club presided for the 
program. After the invocation 
by Bobby Crozier of the Dim-
mitt Club, Laura Downing of 
Happy Helpers welcomed 
guests who included county 
officials. Steven Bagley of 
Dimmitt led the 4-H Motto 
and Pledge. 

David Huseman introduced 
guests. Cleve Keating of 
Bethel voiced appreciation to 
parents, Rodney Hunter of 
Dimmitt to leaders and Randy 
Huseman of Nazareth to 
friends of 4-H. Shane Smith- 

awards. 
Pins designating number of 

years' membership in 4-H 
were presented to the mem-
bers, and 4-H medals went to 
those who completed and re-
ported on projects. Dennis 
Huseman, president, and 
Beth Odom, vice-president of 
the Junior Leaders, presented 
the medals. 

Adult leaders received 
awards for their services also, 
and all the nearly 40 leaders 
were given certificates of op- 

Nazareth nips 
Dimmitt 7-B 
and ties 8-B 

Nazareth's seventh graders 
defeated Dimmitt 7-B boys, 
14-6, last week at Nazareth. 

Nazareth jumped to an im-
mediate 6-0 lead by scoring 
on the opening kickoff. Dim-
mitt's only score came on a 
60-yard run in the second 
quarter by Richie Neel. 

In the third quarter Naz-
areth added a TD and a two-
point conversion to take a 14-6 
victory. 

Dimmitt coach John Thom-
as cited Sammy Mendez and 
Roy Sanchez as defensive 
standouts for Dimmitt. 

In the 8-B game, Dimmitt 
and Nazareth fought to an 8-8 
tie. Dimmitt scored in the 
second quarter on a 41-yard 
run by Ruben Casas. Johnny 
Lopez hit Gene Wait with a 
pass for the two-point con-
version to give Dimmitt an 
8-0 lead. 

Nazareth came back quick-
ly, returning the ensuing kick-
off 70 yards for a TD, then ran 
the two-point conversion to tie 
the game. The rest of the 
game was a standoff. 

On defense for Dimmitt, 
Coach Thomas mentioned 
Justin Smith and John Col-
lins. Johnny Lopez was 6 for 8 
in passing, and Ruben Casas 
caught four passes in addition 
to making his long TD run. 
Thomas also cited the entire 
offensive line for its blocking. 

Funeral held 
for father of 
Coach Hooper 

The funeral of Carl W. 
Hooper of Olton, father of 
Eddie Hooper of Nazareth, 
was conducted Friday at the 
First Baptist Church of Olton 
and burial was in the Olton 
Cemetery. 

Rev. John Lewis of Waco, 
retired minister, and Dr. 
Travis Hart, pastor of the 
church, officiated for the fun-
eral. 

Mr. Hooper, a longtime 01-
ton resident and a retired 
farmer, died Wednesday. He 
married LeaBelle Hancock at 
Lubbock in 1939, and she sur-
vives him. 

Also surviving are two 
sons, Eddie, a coach and 
teacher in Nazareth schools, 
and Burney Day of Avalon; a 
brother, Jack of Hale Center, 
and three grandchildren. 

South Nazareth Farm Store, Inc. 
Exclusive Hesston Dealer for Castro County 

2 miles south of Nazareth on FM 168 
TOP‘Orsi.60%,42".-42-.44".0•14.0%,6•042+xdr‘A 

John Hill sets record 
with service as Secretary 
of State, Attorney General 

STATISTICS 
Hart 	 Silverton 
5 	First downs 	8 
54 	Rushing Yardage 	138 
9 	Passing Yardage 	0 
63 	Total Offense 	138 
11/1 Passes Att/Comp 7/0 
0 	Interceptions by 	5 
3 	Fumbles Lost 	2 
4/36.5 Punts/Avg. 5/31.8 
12/ 101 Penalties/Yds. 9/50 

HOSPITAL NEWS 
PATIENTS IN HOSPITAL: 

Lorina Alvarez 
Dora Alvarez 
Mary Correa 
Filomena Garcia 
Arlene Holbrooks 
Ed Irlbeck 
Gladys May Justice 
Alma Lopez 
Ofelia Lopez 
Carolyn McDonald 
Mamie McLain 
Jill McLean 
Felis Nino 
Margie Reyes 
Loretta Reyna 
Esmeraldo Rodriquez 
Jennie E. Staton 

PATIENTS DISMISSED: 
Ruble Lee Doman 
Bud Norvell 
Ester Noble 
Leola Haberer 
Felicita Salinas 
Elida Ruiz 
Hope Robles 
Ronnie Gfeller 
Juan Guerra 
Viola Love 
Karla Nolen 
Max Sandoval 
Chris Hatla 
Wayne E. Grant 
Balerio Ochoa 
Noramae Newsom 
J. W. Smith 

opening kick but, with new 
folks starting at unfamiliar 
positions as they tried to re- 
group after numerous inju-
ries, they failed to move the 
ball. Freshman Melvin Wash- 
ington at fullback, Nathan In-
gram at halfback and Isaias 
Ponce and Jesse Gonzales al-
ternating at slotback made up 
an almost entirely new back-
field for regular QB Ricky 
Rowland. 

In the line, Chad Black was 
new at tight end, Benny 
McLain had been switched to 
left tackle, newcomer Joe Por- 
tillo filled in at inside guard, 
Marlin Marble pulled in to 
right guard, Kelly Jones 
shifted to right tackle and 
Steven Brantley ran at split 
end. Besides Rowland, center 
Scott Jones was about the 
only person still in the posi-
tion he had started at all year, 
and he had a broken thumb 
that was heavily padded. 

Neither team earned a first 
down until less than a minute 
remained in the second, when 
Rowland was able to complete 
a nine-yarder to Black. Two 
plays later Ingram earned an-
other one on a nine-yard run. 
However, the drive ended on 
the fourth play of the second 
quarter as Rowland's pass 
was picked off. 

The Owls could not move 
either under pressure from 
defensive linemen K. Jones, 
Roy Martinez, Danny Rod-
riquez, Marble, Gonzales and 
Black. The tough secondary of 
Ponce, Rowland, Brantley and 
monster man Daniel Higgins 
kept the Owls from complet 
ing a pass all night. 

Both teams gave up the ball 
twice with the Owls' third 
possession of the quarter end-
ing as Rowland recovered a 
fumble at the Horns' 32. 
However, Hart was victimized 
by an interception on the 
series and the Owls had the 
ball at the Horn 43. QB Mark 
Brown lost a yard on the first 
play but the second play saw 
him drop back for a pass. 
Finding his receivers covered, 
he tucked the ball in and ran 
for it. Breaking away, he went 
44 yards for the only offensive 
TD of the game. A PAT run 
fell short. 

Hart suffered another in-
terception to end its next 
series, and time ran out on 
the Owls with the score 0-6. 

The second half was almost 
a repeat of the first as neither 
team sustained a drive. The 
Owls did use Horn penalties 
to move to the Hart 29, but 
could go no further. 

The fourth quarter saw four 
more Hart turnovers to end 
any hope of driving the ball. 
The last of these, a pass in-
terception by Mark Brown at 
safety, was returned 30 yards 
for the final TD with 1:29 left 
in the game. Brown's at-
tempted PAT run following a 
high snap fell short. 

Giving freshman QB Derek 
Rich some game experience, 
the Horns ran the ball long 
enough to give the Owls one 
more play before the gun. 

The Horns stand at 2-3 for 
the year and are open this 
week before starting district 
play with Homecoming 
against Bovina Oct. 20. By 
that time, look for vast im-
provement if old injuries are 
healed and young players 
have jelled in new positions. 

Score by Quarters: 
Hart 	0 0 0 0— 0 
Silverton 	0 6 0 6-12 
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October 13-13, 1978 • 
Hale County Agricultural Center 	• 

Plainview, Texas 	 • 
Friday and Saturday, 
10:00 a.m. to 9 p.m. 

Sunday, 12:00 p.m. to 5:00 p.m. 
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FEATURING THE WORKS OF 
100 OF THE FINEST 

ARTISTS AND CRAFTSMEN 
FROM TEXAS. NEW MEXICO 
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It Safe 
...EverywhereYou Go! 
Carelessness has no boundaries. No one can predict when or where the 
next tragic fire will happen. That's why it's important that we all do our 
jobs and practice fire prevention in every way. Make it your business to 
look for fire hazards...in the home, on your property and where you 
work! Fix any faulty wiring... immediately; empty trash regularly... avoid 
buildups; keep heating and cooking equipment in top repair; store old 
oily rags in metal containers. Make sure you and everyone in your family 
knows what to do in a fire emergency...before it happens. Play it 
smart... be fire safe! 

The Castro County News 
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Dancers add VETERAN'S 
to arthritis 	SERVICES 
fund drive 

BY BEDFORD W. SMITH 
County Service Officer 

SALAD A LA BLACKTOP—Lettuce was scattered down a 

section of Hwy. 385 five miles north of Dimmitt Saturday 
morning, when a tandem truck carrying a load of the crated 
vegetables lost a crate as it passed a pickup. When the truck 
pulled back into its lane, the remainder of the load fell and 
most of the boxes broke open. About 30 boxes were lost, ac-
cording to Deputy Sheriff David Dalton, who with Chief Deputy 
Boots Crews of the Castro County Sheriff's Department 
witnessed the accident as they drove a short distance behind 
the truck. 

Frank Alvarado 
KEEPING THE SPIRIT UP at Hart High School's games this 
year are [from left) head cheerleader Stacy Averitt, a senior; 
junior Lori Barnes; freshman Teresa Mapp; sophomore B. J. 

Brantley; freshman Suzahn 
Kittrell. 

Rowland; and junior Theresa 
IIIHS Annual Staff Photo] 

County grants easement, 

discusses pickup specs 

242nd court 
grand jury 
indicts six White House 

are open to 
The Castro County Com-

missioners' Court voted Mon-
day to accept the resignation 
of election judge Lon Wood-
burn, granted an easement to 
Solon Clements, and discuss-
ed specifications for four new 
pickups with two local car 
dealers. 

The court also voted to 
follow the recommendation of 
the County Democratic Party 
in naming Ronnie Parker as 
Woodburn's successor in Vot-
ing Precinct 3. 

Clements asked for the 
easement so that he could run 
a water line under a county 
road east of Dimmitt. Clem-
ents also mentioned that he 
would be willing to grant 

in army exercise 
Spec. 4 Santos Alvarado, 

son of Frank Alvarado of 
Hart, is participating with 
other American and allied 
troops in Reforger '78, 
NATO's largest yearly exer-
cise, held in Germany. 

More than 11,000 soldiers 
were flown to Germany and 
some 37,000 tons of equip-
ment and supplies have been 
shipped from the US for the 
massive exercise. 

Reforger (Return of Forces 
to Germany) results from a 
1967 agreement between the 
US, United Kingdom and 
West Germany. The US 
agreed to return stateside-
based forces to Germany each 
year for exercises. 

Alvarado is regularly as-
signed as a radar operator 
with the 333rd Field Artillery 
in Hanau, Germany. 

I've been in San Antonio 
attending the 31st statewide 
annual Veteran Services Con-
ference this week. It is spon-
sored by the Texas Veteran 
Affairs Commission, the VA, 
American Legion, DAV, Am-
vets, VFW, World War I 
Veterans, etc. for all interest-
ed persons. 

Also we attended the Coun-
ty Veteran Officers Associa-
tion of which we are Chaplain. 
Our office will be open again 
on Oct. 18. 

The following is a news 
release from the Waco Re-
gional office of the VA. 

The Veterans Administra-
tion's basic booklet on vet-
erans' benefits has been re-
corded on cassette tapes for 
use by the blind. The tapes 
are the work of the Blinded 
Veterans Association (BVA). 

Two cassettes cover VA 
benefits for former service-
men and women, and their 
dependents or survivors. 

They are available to blind 
veterans on request by writ-
ing the Association at 1735 
DeSales St., N.W., Washing-
ton, D.C. 20036, or by calling 
(202) 347-4010. 

Sets of the cassettes have 
been sent to VA counselors 
who work with the blind and 
were also distributed to Blind-
ed Veterans Association mem-
bers at their recent conven-
tion. 

The booklet from which the 
tapes were made, "Federal 
Benefits for Veterans and 
Dependents," can be pur-
chased from the Superinten-
dent of Documents, US Gov-
ernment Printing Office, 
Washington, D.C. 20402, or 
the Consumer Information 
Center, Department 0297, 
Pueblo, Colo. 81009. The 
price is $1. 

The Dimmitt Promenaders 
were recognized as being 
fourth top selling club by 
selling 295 tickets for the fifth 
annual Arthritis Foundation 
Hoedown Saturday night in 
the Activities Center at West 
Texas State University. 

The theme of this year's 
hoedown was "Dance So That 
Others May Walk." Round 
dancers and 21 squares from 
all over the Panhandle at-
tended and raised over $6,500 
for the Arthritis Foundation. 

Each ticket sold represent-
ed a chance at winning one of 
the prizes donated by area 
merchants. Bill Harman won 
third prize, donated by Col-
berts. 

He in turn auctioned the 
gift certificate for $35 to go to 
the Arthritis Foundation. Car-
olyn Harman received a 
smoke alarm for being third in 
high ticket sales. She sold 170 
tickets. 

Callers for this dance were 
Sid Perkins, Roy Johnson, 
Billy Foster and Sammy Par-
sley. The round dance caller 
was Mickey Grimm. 

Dimmitt Promenaders of-
ficers expressed appreciation 
to everyone who made a do-
nation to the Arthritis Foun-
dation. 

Fellowships 
applicants 
ment leaders, journalists and 
others related to government. 

For additional information 
or an application send a post-
card with name and address 
to the President's Commis-
sion of White House Fellow-
ships, 1900 E Street NW, 
Room 1308, Washington, 
D.C. 20415 or call (202) 653-
6263. Requests for applica-
tions must be postmarked no 
later than Nov. 15. 

County group 
goes to hear 
GOP candidate 

Reagan speech Amarillo recently to hear Bill 

A carload of Castro County 
residents accompanied Jim 
Killingsworth to a lunch in 

Choirs will 

Water meeting 

set at Lubbock 
will promote 

Baker's race 

give concert 
for public 

NHS girls 
place in 
long runs 

easements to the county for 
the extension of several paved 
county roads. 

The commissioners of Pre-
cincts 2 and 3, Ed Wilson and 
Anna Margaret Moss, re-
quested heavy-duty, half-ton 
pickups, equipped with auto-
matic transmissions, power 
steering and brakes, radio 
and air conditioner, grille 
guard and rear bumper with a 
trailer hitch, and spare tire. 

Precinct 4 Commissioner 
Jerry Wilhelm requested 
more of a "no frills" model 
heavy-duty half-ton, with a 
six-cylinder engine and four-
speed transmission, grille 
guard and rear bumper with 
trailer hitch and spare tire. 

The fourth pickup, for use 
of the Extension Agent's of-
fice, is to be a heavy-duty, 
3/4 -ton model with crew cab, 
automatic transmission, po-
wer brakes and steering, ra-
dio and air conditioning. 

Trade-ins were offered on 
every pickup except the one 
for Precinct 3. 

In other business, the com-
missioners: 

—Approved a $3,580.45 bill 
for Precinct 1 to West Texas 
Equipment Co. for repairs of 
two road graders. 

—Accepted the monthly re-
port from Justice of the Peace 
Marshall Young, and acknow-
ledged in the minutes a letter 
from the JP Training Center 
at San Marcos. The letter 
noted that Young had recently 
completed a 20-hour course 
there, and reminded the com-
mission that any new JP's are 
required to complete a 40-
hour course their first year in 
office and a 20-hour course 
each year following. 

Six indictments were re-
turned by the first grand jury 
impaneled in the new 242nd 
District Court here last Thurs-
day. The six persons charged 
will be arraigned Oct. 18 
before Judge Van Stovall, and 
trial dates will be set at that 
time. 

A felony indictment of fail-
ure to stop and render aid was 
returned against Gabriel Gon-
zales, 27, of Dimmitt in con-
nection with an accident near 
the city park July 23. 

Eloisa R. Garcia of Here-
ford was indicted on a count 
of felony theft in connection 
with an Aug. 26 shoplifting 
incident at The Company 
Store in Hart. 

Billy Chance, 18, was in-
dicted for forgery in connec-
tion with checks passed on a 
forged signature of Tony Lup-
ton last May. 

Three of the indictments 
were for driving while intox-
icated. Named in them were 
Walter Carrol Morgan, 42, of 
Hereford, on a charge dated 
Aug. 19; Stephen Ralph Ad-
ams, 24, Hereford, on a 
charge dated Sept. 16; Pegro 
Garcia Jr., 25, Dimmitt; ar-
rested July 24. 

'Texas 'stars' 

Intercity club 

Clements speak in his cam-
paign as Republican nominee 
for governor. Killingsworth is 
Clements' campaign chairman 
in this county. 

The candidate, giving his 
views on education, energy 
and agriculture, pledged to 
"work with Texas farmers as 
governor, pursuing leadership 
in overseas marketing of our 
crops, enforcing import grade 
standards by vigorous inspec-
tion at entry points." He said 
government subsidies and 
loans are only short-term so-
lutions to farm problems. 

Support of Rep. Bill Clay-
ton's plan to import water 
from the Arkansas watershed 
to West Texas *was voiced by 
Clements, who said negotia-
tions should be pushed on 
that project. 

The speaker said there is no 
quick solution to problems of 
education in Texas, which 
cannot be cured by "pouring 
money into the educational 
system." 

He emphasized the reality 
of the energy crisis, and said 
he favors freeing oil and gas 
producers to produce, also 
promoting development of 
nuclear energy and use of 
coal. 

The President's Commis-
sion on White House Fellow-
ships is seeking highly quali-
fied candidates for its 1979-80 
competition. Fourteen to 19 
positions are open for this 
extraordinary but highly com-
petitive opportunity. 

President Lyndon B. John-
son established the program 
in 1964 to give outstanding 
younger Americans firsthand 
experience in the process of 
governing the nation. 

The White House Fellow-
ship program is a non-parti-
san effort to draw in a few of 
the brightest and most prom-
ising people from all over the 
country to work at a unique 
level in the federal govern-
ment for a year. 

Presidents Nixon, Ford and 
Carter have continued the 
program and President Carter 
has removed the specific age 
limitations. The program is 
now open to all those who are 
early in their careers. 

Fellows have been chosen 
from a wide variety of careers 
and professions including law, 
medicine, teaching, state and 
local government and the 
arts. 

The Fellows serve for one 
year, usually as a special 
assistant to the vice-presi-
dent, a member of the pres-
ident's cabinet or a presi-
dential assistant. The Fellows 
may be involved in the de-
velopment of special pro-
grams, assist in speech writ-
ing, engage in interdepart-
mental task forces, or do 
other tasks assigned by their 
principals. 

The knowledge that each 
Fellow gains in his work as-
signment is shared with the 
others during the year-long 
educational program which is 
conducted in addition to the 
work assignments and pro-
vides the Fellows an oppor-
tunity to meet with govern- 

Bill and Martha Dannevik 
of Dimmitt will be among the 
host couples at a fund-raising 
dinner Tuesday night to honor 
Jim Baker, Republican can-
didate for attorney general of 
Texas, in The Inn of Amarillo. 

Ronald Reagan will be the 
featured speaker at the dinner 
which will start at 8 p.m. Gov. 
Reagan and Baker share be-
lief in the conservative GOP 
principles of free enterprise, 
fiscal responsibility and in-
dividual freedoms. 

Also attending from Dim-
mitt will be Mr. and Mrs. Jim 
Killingsworth and Mr. and 
Mrs. Woodrow Killingsworth. 

Mayor and Mrs. Jerry 
Hodge of Amarillo, State Sen. 
and Mrs. Bob Price, Mr. and 
Mrs. Jim Brandon and others 
will also serve as hosts on 
behalf of Baker. 

A 600-pound beef, a cus-
tom-made pearl handled knife 
and a painting are among the 
items to be auctioned to ben-
efit Baker's campaign. 

Anyone interested in tickets 
to the dinner and preceding 
auction may call Bill Danne-
vik, E47-4475, or Deanne 
Clark, 647-3241 or 647-5535. 

EGG grade does not affect 
the egg's food value. Lower 
grades are as high in nu-
trients as top grades. 

The directors of Water Inc. 
have selected Lubbock as the 
site of the organization's 12th 
Annual Membership Meeting 
in 1979, appointed commit-
tees to plan the meeting and 
to nominate individuals for 
the director-at-large positions 
that will be filled at the an-
nual session. 

Named to the annual meet-
ing committee were Russell 
Bean, Frank Gray, Clem Bo-
verle, A. C. Verner, Jim Ed 
Waller, Terry Stark and 
Wayne Board, all of Lubbock. 

Assigned to the nominating 
committee were Hoyt Pattison 
of Clovis, Bruce Bigler of 
Plainview, Bob Clark of Sem-
inole, Felix Ryals of White 
Deer, E. H. Aderton of Ama-
rillo, Joe D. Unfred of New 
Home and Russell Bean of 
Lubbock. 

Water Inc., is a non-profit 
organization dedicated to se-
curing an adequate supply of 
supplemental water for the 
High Plains of West Texas 
and Eastern New Mexico 
through importation. 

Gayle Book, Nazareth's 
state qualifier in the cross-
country run last year, placed 
eighth in the Pampa Invita-
tional Cross-Country Meet 
Saturday with a time of 13:27 
minutes in the two-mile run. 

Also in the field were the 
Class AAAA defending state 
champion from Amarillo High 
School and the AAA state 
champion from Amarillo Tas-
cosa. 

Miss Book's time Saturday 
was three seconds faster than 
the time which earned her 
18th place in the state Class 
AA-A-B cross-country meet 
last year. 

Other Nazareth runners in 
Saturday's meet at Pampa 
were Evey Wilhelm, who 
came in 28th; Lea Ann Huse-
man, 33rd; Loretta Book, 
38th, and Germaine Pohl-
meier, 41st. 

The Nazareth team will 
compete in invitational meets 
at Hereford Saturday, Oct. 21 
in Brownfield and Oct. 28 at 
Amarillo. 

AUSTIN, Texas (Spl.) —
The University of Texas has 
one of the largest un-
dergraduate programs in 
astronomy in the nation. 

About one-third of UT 
Austin's more than 30,000 un-
dergraduates will take at 
least one astronomy course 
during their four years on 
campus. In 1977, a total of 4,-
200 registered for astronomy 
courses. 

Additionally, over the next 
10 years, the Astronomy 
Department will be a 
research participant in a 
NASA project to orbit and 
operate a 100-inch telescope in 
space. A vital element in the 
research will be UT's 
McDonald Observatory, 
located in the Davis Moun-
tains of West Texas. 

visit planned 
by Rotarians 

Choirs from Dimmitt High 
School and Junior High will 
appear in fall concert at 7:30 
p.m. 'Monday, a program in 
the high school auditorium 
with the public invited at no 
admission cost. 

The hour-long program will 
feature the 22-voice DHS 
Singers and the Junior High 
Choir of 60 voices, both di-
rected by Doug Henry. Faun 
Welker is piano accompanist 
for the high school group, 
Dwight Joiner for junior high 
choristers. 

Folk dancing will be a part 
of some numbers by the 
junior high group. DHS Sing-
ers will accompany them-
selves in some songs with 
bongos and other rhythm in-
struments, Henry said. 

Folk songs and spirituals 
will be the principal selections 
by the younger students. 
High school singers will add 
some popular tunes and a 
classical hymn, Handel's 
"Sun of Life." 

County included 

in aid program 

to save energy 

National tests 
are offered 

for DHS sophs 

Dimmitt Rotarians and their 
wives will attend the Lubbock 
Rotary Club's annual intercity 
meeting today (Thursday) in 
Lubbock Memorial Civic Cen-
ter. 

The dinner is planned as an 
occasion for Rotarians of the 
district to meet for informal 
fellowship. Entertainment will 
be by the Dunbar-Struggs 
Rock Ensemble directed by 
Mike Cantwell. 

On Monday Dimmitt High 
School will give the National 
Education Development Test 
to sophomores in the school, 
says D. H. Koeninger, school 
counselor 

This program is concerned 
with individual educational 
development, especially with 
the students' ability to use 
what they have learned. The 
results of the test help de-
termine how students are per-
forming in important study 
areas. 

Each student will receive a 
booklet which describes the 
test and gives sample ques-
tions from the NEDT. The test 
is optional to the student at a 
cost of S2.45, which is the cost 
of servicing. 

About a month after the 
test is given, the results will 
be discussed with the student 
who will be given a handbook 
to take home. The handbook 
will contain their scores and 
material for information. 

Sophomore students who 
have any desire to go to a 
four-year college should be 
encouraged to take this test, 
Koeninger said, as it can be a 
practice test for the SAT or 
ACT test required for college 
entrance. 

The- Texas Department of 
Community Affairs (TDCA) 
announced that the Texas 
Panhandle Community Action 
Corporation agency has been 
awarded a $53,260 contract 
under the Weatherization As-
sistance for Low-Income Per-
sons program for eligible per-
sons residing in 26 counties 
including Castro. 

Funding for this 12-month 
contract which began Sept. 1 
is made available through 
TDCA's Economic Opportu-
nity Division by the US De-
partment of Energy. 

Through this contract, 
homes of elderly and handi-
capped low-income persons 
will be improved through the 
use of storm windows, caulk-
ing, insulation and wall re-
pairs so that energy consump-
tion is reduced and high en-
ergy costs to the home dwell-
er are lessened. 

Additional information on 
the contract may be obtained 
by contacting the Economic 
Opportunity Division of the 
Texas Department of Com-
munity Affairs, Box 13166, 
Capitol 	Station, 	Austin, 
78711, (512) 475-6601. 

Week's schedule 
DIM M ITT 

FRIDAY—Bobcats 	vs. 
Lockney, here (Homecoming). 

TUESDAY-7-B and 8-B at 
Nazareth, 4 p.m.; 7-A and 8-A 
vs. Littlefield at 4 p.m., here. 

NEXT Tr IURSDAY — Fresh-
men at Littlefield, 5 p.m.; 
Junior Varsity at Littlefield, 7 
p.m. 

HART 
TODAY—Junior 	teams 

open. 
FRIDAY—Longhorns open. 
NEXT THURSDAY-7th 

and 8th at Bovina, 5 p.m.; 
Junior Varsity at Bovina, 7 
p.m. 

NAZARETH 
FRIDAY—Swifts at Valley, 

7:30 p.m. 
TUESDAY-7th and 8th vs. 

Dimmitt, here, 4 p.m. 

are Fire Chief H. M. Morrison, Clarence Wood, J. A. Rials, Ben Reyes Jr., Pat 

Patterson, Bill Conyers, Lynn West, Randy Small, Jackie D. Powers and Jerry 
McGuire. Dirnmitt's fire marshal is Guy Waldrop. The firemen and their wives 
will observe National Fire Prevention Week with their "Fireman of the Year" 
Banquet tonight (Thursday) at the station. 

WHEN FIRE THREATENS your life or property, these are the men who might 
save both. Members of the Dimmitt Volunteer Fire Dept. pose for the picture 
that will appear on the 1979 Fire Dept. calendar. Kneeling, from left, are 
Assistant Fire Marshal Charles Littlejohn, Francis Acker, Donnie Shive, 
Tommy Cleavinger, Randy Griffitt and Kenneth Hollums. Standing, from left, 



Kent Birdwell, Agent 
116 E. Jones St. 
Phone 647-3427 

Like a good neighbor, 
State Farm is there. 

State Farm Insurance C.ompanfes 
Home Offices. Bloomington, Illinois 

.FOR INSURANCE CALL 

11. 	 4 

M. C. ADAMS, O.D. 
OPTOMETRIST 

335 Miles Ave. 364-2255 
Drawer 353 

Office hours: 
Monday thru Friday 

8:30 — 12:00 
1:30 — 5:00 

HEREFORD, TEXAS 

1ELECT \  

Jimmy 
Davis 

01/111111111100■■•• fteammennui  

Castro County 
Attorney 

Pd. Pol. Adv. by Jimmy Davis for County 
Attorney Committee, Robert McLean, Treasurer. 
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WRITE IN 
M.L. Simpson Jr. 

County Judge 
General Election Nov. 7 

(Political advertisement paid for by Friends of 
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Bobcats run fast and wide in 19-7 victory 
High quality hay can be 

produced in the fall with good 
moisture and plenty of fertili-
zer. 

By JIMMIE CHAPMAN 

Dimmitt's Bobcats unleash-
ed Dennis Veals and Larry 
Bossett on the Tulia Hornets 
Friday night and came away 
with a 19-7 victory, spoiling 
Tulia's Homecoming and get-
ting the Bobcats their first 
victory of the season after 
three setbacks. 

Veals accounted for all 
three of the Bobcat scores on 
hard-earned blasts off tackle 
and speedy slants to the out-
side. He gained 201 yards on 
30 carries, while Bossett add-

only eight ed 95 yards on 
carries. 

Penalties took away a lot of 
the other gains by Veals, Bos- 

play of the game. If Tulia had 
scored, it could have gone 
ahead with only four minutes 
to play. 

Dimmitt came out of the 
game with no serious injuries, 
according to Coach Jerry 
Vance. 

The Bobcats are in for a 
rough time this Friday when 
they entertain the Lockney 
Longhorns in the Homecom-
ing game. Lockney has de-
feated Littlefield and Seymour 
the past two weeks and will 
not forget that the Bobcats 
upset them last year to ruin 
their homecoming. This will 
be the last non-conference 
game before the Cats host the 
Littlefield Wildcats in the dis-
trict opener Oct. 20. Littlefield 
is the defending bi-district 
champion. 

sett and Randy Roberts as 
flags were flying like it was 
May Day. Dimmitt drew 110 
yards on 11 penalties. 

The Bobcats got on the 
scoreboard first with a little 
less than five minutes left in 
the first quarter after Roberts 
recovered a Tulia pitchout on 
the Tulia 33-yard line to set 
up Dimmitt's first good field 
position. Dimmitt had had the 
ball only once before, and had 
failed to make a first down. 

After Roberts' recovery, he 
smashed for two yards before 
Veals set sail for 19 yards to 
put the Cats at the Tulia 12. 
Roberts rammed it to the 
6-yard line and from there 
Veals went over left tackle for 
the score. Tony Gonzales 
booted the extra point and the 
Cats were ahead, 7-0. 

The Hornets mounted a 
drive that took them from 
their own 33-yard line to the 
Dimmitt 29 before Danny Or-
tiz recovered a fumble to stop 
the push just before the first 
quarter came to a close. 
Danny and his brother, Gus, 
played an outstanding defen-
sive game for the Bobcats in 
the trenches. 

The Bobcats got the ball 

again early in the second 
quarter on their own 13-yard 
line after a 50-yard punt by 
Kirk Thompson, and from 
there they controlled the ball 
for all but 31/2  minutes of the 
period and ended up with 
another TD, after overcoming 
several penalties. 

The Bobcats first penetrat-
ed when Quarterback Jack 
Stewart hit Bossett with a 
pass that carried to the 16-
yard line. Roberts gained four 
on the first try and then went 
in for an apparent score, but 
it was called back and the 
Cats were penalized 15 for 
holding. Then they drew two 
more penalties before Tulia 
got the ball at the Hornet 18-
yard line on fourth down. 

But Tulia ran only one play 
before monster-man Tim Fe-
well intercepted a pass at the 
Tulia 26-yard line. 

Veals wasted no time as he 
ran off right tackle on a 16-
yard scoring scamper. The 
kick for the extra point was no 
good, and Dimmitt led 13-0. 

The Bobcats almost scored 
again before the half after 
they took over at their own 39-
yard line. With Stewart pass-
ing and Veals running, the 
Cats moved the ball to the 
Tulia 5 before time ran out 
with the Cats ahead 13-0. 

Tulia got good field position 
in the third quarter when it 
held the Cats at their own 27-
yard line and forced a punt. 
Stewart, who had punted 
twice in the first half for 47 
and 57 yards respectively, got 
off a punt that was hard to 
believe. It sailed high, the 
wind caught it and dropped it 
about 15 yards downfield, 
then it took a Tulia bounce 
and ended up on Dimmitt's 
26-yard line for a minus one: 
yard measurement. 

Dimmitt's defense stifled 
the Hornets, however, and 

* 
GAME AT A GLANCE 

Dimmitt 	 Tulia 
20 	First Downs 	14 
327 	Rushing Yardage 143 
55 	Passing Yardage 	57 
382 	Total Offense 	200 
4/10 	Passing 	5/14 
11/110 Penalties/Yards 5/55 

the Dimmitt 14. Three plays 
later, Alex Gutierrez ran it in 
from three yards out and the 
Hornets were back in the 
game, 13-7, after Albert Ber-
nal kicked the extra point. 

Tulia held the Cats after the 
ensuing kickoff and got the 
ball on its own 11-yard line, 
where Stewart booted it dead. 
With Monty Jones and Kevin 
Crooks running the ball and 
Ronnie Fox passing, the Hor-
nets moved deep into Bobcat 
territory and were in position 
to go ahead when, with 4:14 
left, Bossett stepped in front 
of receiver Kirk Thompson in 
the end zone and with one 
hand took the ball away for a 
crucial interception. (Three 
plays earlier, Veals had in-
tercepted, but the penalty bug 
gave it back to the Hornets.) 

The ball was spotted at the 
Dimmitt 20 and, with Veals 
carrying practically every 
play, the Cats marched 80 
yards for the clincher. Veals 
went around right end for 30 
yards and the score with only 
13 seconds left on the clock. 
The kick was no good, but the 
Cats had scored their first win 
of the season, 19-7. 

Dimmitt's defense held the 
Hornets in check the whole 
game except for the two long 
drives, one resulting in a TD 
and the other ending with 
Bossett's interception in the 
end zone. Bossett's steal turn-
ed out to be the defensive 

THIRD TIME AROUND—Bobcat tailback Dennis Veals races 
30 yards for his third touchdown with 13 seconds left in the 
Dimmitt-Tulia game Friday night. The speedy tailback scored 
three TD's and rolled up 201 yards on 30 carries as the Bobcats 
ruined the Hornets' homecoming, 19-7. 

* 
the Bobcats took over and 
controlled the ball the rest of 
the period except for the final 
four plays, when Tulia stop-
ped Veals on the Hornet four-
yard line, taking over on 
downs. 

WTSU to host 

softball event 

for women 

From here the Hornets set 
sail on a 96-yard march that 
gave them their only score. A 
Ronnie Cox to Timm Bliss 
pass that was good for 27 
yards was the key play of the 
drive, and it moved the ball to 

Win and tie are racked up 
by DMS 7-A and 8-A teams 

0 	Fumbles Lost 2 
2 	Interceptions 0 
4/34 	Punts/Average 3/39 

Score by Quarters: 
Tulia 	0 	0 	0 0— 7 
Dimmitt 	7 	6 	0 6-19 

less serious," said Coach 
Durham. 

Dimmitt's offensive stand-
outs were Robb and Furmin 
Gonzales. On defense, "our 
entire unit played extremely 
well," Durham said. He sin-
gled out Joe Martinez. David 
°gas, Shan Powell as defen-
sive standouts. 

647.3123 For Printing 

West Texas State Univer-
sity women's athletics depart-
ment will be host for a fast-
pitch softball tournament this 
weekend in Southeast Park, 
34th and Osage at Amarillo, 
sponsored by the Texas As-
sociation of Intercollegiate 
Athletics for Women. 

Preliminary games will 
start at 9:30 a.m. Friday and 
finals are scheduled Saturday. 
Seven university teams in-
cluding the 1977 state 
champs, Texas Women's Un-
iversity of Denton, are en-
tered. 

Debbie Murdock, Dimmitt 
student at WTSU, is a mem-
ber of the women's softball 
team there. 

Scoring Plays: 
D— Dennis Veals, 6 run (Tony 

Gonzales kick) 
D—Veals, 26 run (kick failed) 
T— Alex Gutierrez, 3 run (Al- 

bert Bernal kick) 
D—Veals, 30 run (kick failed) 

• 

BILLCLEMENTS 
WILL CUT TAXES 
AND GOVERNMENT 
SPENDING 

PUZZLED BY ALL YOU HEAR ABOUT 

HEATING & COOLING EFFICIENCY? 

GET THE WHOLE PICTURE ... 

 

CALL US 

SPS 
SOUTHWESTERN PUBLIC SERVICE 

909-3 

Dimmitt Middle School's 
7-A defeated Tulia there 22-6 
in a weekend grid clash, while 
the 8-A boys held Tulia to a 
scoreless tie. 

Tulia kept the ball almost 
the entire first quarter, and 
went ahead on a 12-yard run 
with 40 seconds left in the 
quarter. In the second quar-
ter, with 30 seconds left, Scott 
Simpson and Mark Bruegel 
tackled Tulia's quarterback in 
the end zone for a safety to 
make the half score 6-2. 

In the second half, on an 
opening kickoff by Dimmitt, 
Frank Garcia recovered a 
fumble at midfield. Dimmitt 
then marched 50 yards, with 
Bruegel scoring the TD on an 
18-yard run to put Dimmitt 
ahead for the first time, 8-6. 

In the fourth quarter, Roy 
Tijerina tackled Tulia's punter 
twice, to set up Dimmitt's last 
two TDs. Tim Kenworthy ran 
the ball in from a yard out to 
put Dimmitt out front 14-6, 
capping a 35-yard drive. 
Bruegel scored the extra 
points on a run to make it 
16-6. 

Texas was built by men with the vision to look ahead 
and the grit to get things done. Bill Clements is the man 
to keep this tradition alive for the future of Thxas. 

Bill Clements will bring a strong, fresh and tough 
approach to our government in Austin. He is a 
businessman, not a politician. 

Bill Clements started with nothing and built a 
successful, worldwide company with hard work and the 
skill to manage men and money. And now Bill Clements 
wants to preserve the future of our state and he wants 
the working people of Texas to have the same oppor-
tunities he had. 

With his proposed "Taxpayers' Bill of 
Rights," Bill Clements is committed to 
protecting Texans from excessive taxa-
tion and runaway government spend-
ing. He is pledged to cutting taxes and 
returning that money directly to the 
taxpayers. 

As former Chairman of the Southern 
Methodist University Board of Gover-
nors, Bill Clements knows how to make 
education in Thxas the best in the Nation. 
He's for discipline in the classroom 
and "back to basics" quality education. 

As the son and grandson of farmers, 
Bill Clements knows the frustrations 
that an indifferent government can 
cause people who make their living off 
the land. He will use the strength of the 
State Government to fight burdensome 
Federal restrictions. 

"I believe that 
Texas has always 
had more promise 
than problems, 

but the balance is 
more delicate each 
year. We need to get 
to work now." 

With just two minutes left 
after Tijerina's second sack of 
the punter Simpson carried 
the ball in for a TD to make it 
22-6. 

Cited by Coach Shott Miller 
as outstanding on offense 
were Frank Wortham, Ramon 
Enriquez, Scott Nelson and 
Richard Sauceda. Defensive 
standouts were Hal Gilbreath, 
Brad Holcomb and Hilbert 
Dominguez. 

The 8-A in tying Tulia suf-
fered injuries, including a 
broken collarbone by quarter-
back Tommy Gibson. 

Coach Jerry Durham said 
that this was the toughest ball 
game the 8-A team has had 
this year, "with some real 
hard hitting." 

In the first half Dimmitt 
stayed in the hole and stop-
ped Tulia twice inside the 10-
yard line with goal-line 
stands. 

In the second half Dimmitt 
started moving the ball, but 
Gibson received his injury in 
the third quarter. Ray Owen 
and Lonnie Robb finished the 
game at the QB post. It was a 
new experience for Robb, who 
had never quarterbacked be-
fore, "but he did a real good 
job for us," Coach Durham 
said. 

Dimmitt' drove inside Tu-
lia's 20 once in the second 
half, but drew a 15-yard pen-
alty and couldn't overcome it. 

Also injured in the game 
was Max Sandoval, with a 
muscle bruise; "and we had a 
lot of other bruises that were 

BILL CLEMENTS 
A GREAT GOVERNOR 
FOR TEXAS 

Paid political advertisement by the Bill Clements for Governor Campaign Committee, ibm B Rhodes, Treasurer, 1901 N. Akard, Dallas, Thxas. 
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CO-OP MONTH 
IT'S PEOPLE HELPING PEOPLE! . .. People Working 

WHAT IS A COOPERATIVE? Together . .. Accomplishing Common Goals Through 
Cooperatives—Member Owned Business. 

• COOPERATIVES Raise The Standard Of 	. . . . 
lower Costs Of living. 

 

 

 

• him A Cooperative Does Make A Difference. 
Cooperative People Are Partners, Sharing Responsibilities and Benefits. 

Working For Their Own And The County's Well Being. 

WE'RE PROUD TO DO BUSINESS THE COOPERATIVE WAY! 

This Special Recognition Is Sponsored By The 
Following Area Cooperatives 

O 

Vi\Nt; 
Milt frit. 

• 

doW6100Ww ,. 

47116* 

Diaustift Agri thuluabtioa 

Dismal Cuomo 

Caabta Ca-Op Gin 
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Hush Puppies 
Classy Casuals 

...more comfortable 
than feet! A great comfort 

shoe with the classic styling to make you feel at ease 

wherever you go. Lightweight, yet durable. 

this Hush Puppies' casual is priced just right, 522.99 

Diamond Shamrock 

• Drip Oil • Motor Oil 

• Diesel 
	

• Gasoline 

FOR THE MOST ECONOMICAL 
FARM AND RANCH FUELS' 

YOU CAN DEPEND ON 

We also stock a full line of 

Amalie Motor Oil 
See Us for Your 

LP Gas and Butane 
Carburator 

Installation and Repair 

Chem-Tex Farm Supply 
Hwy. 86 East 	 647-3551 

Family 
Insurance 

(—blur family insurance plans 
%.,„„,/ cover every member of 
the family. We offer policies 
that will grow with the needs 
of your family. Consult us . 

No Obligation 

LPLAINS 
or DIMAI fr 	 .._,rautawee A1'61- 

113 E. Bedford 	647.3176 
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Dimmitt Business and Industrial Rtuitw 
WE ARE EQUIPPED 

AND HAVE THE 

SKILLED PERSONNEL 

To Render A 

COMPLETE 

PLUMBING 

SERVICE 
(residential, commercial, industrial) 

Give us a call for 

prompt and efficient service 

DIMMITT WELDING 
& ELECTRIC 

Harvest your corn, don't 
leave it on the ground 
Corn is an expensive crop to raise and it 
is too valuable a commodity to leave on 
the ground. 

With a CORN SAVER working with your 
Corn Header, most down corn can be 
salvaged and marketed as you harvest 
your standing corn. 

We will be happy to tell you about advantages of 

having a CORN SAVER available when you harvest 
your corn. Ask us about CORN SAVER construction 
and operation details. 

CORN SAVER 
MANUFACTURING CO. INC 

Highway 385 North 	647-2489 or 647.2217 

* Castro County Farmers 

Are Efficient Producers 

* We Are Efficient 

Grain Handlers 

* Let's Get Together 

Bring us your 

*CORN *MILO 

* SOYBEANS 
Whether you sell or put your grain in government loan 

we have ample storage. 
We always pay the highest market price. 

BRUEGEL & SONS ELEVATORS 

Talk to the 
Farm Bureau Insurance 
"24-Hour Agent" 

a 	u your fire Insurance policy! 
With a Farm Bureau Fire Insurance policy. you know • 
your Farm Bureau Insurance "24-Hour Agent" is working ,  
for you round-the-clock, ready with advice or assist-
ance when you need him, any hour of the day or night. 

The Farm Bureau Insurance "24-Hour Agent"... ' 
round-the-clock service, for that 
good feeling of security. 

Farm Bureau Insurance 
JACK W. FLYNT, C.L.U. 

Agency Manager 
304 N. Broadway 647-3420 
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BIG ON ALL YOUR 

VITAMIN SALE TO 
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PARSONS REXALL 
107 E. Bedford 

S, 	  

DRUG 
647-3392

# 

Harvest Checklist: 

Truck Tarps 

Tie-Downs 

Grain Scoops 

Nylon Trucker Ropes 

Plastic Coverings 

Quality Tools 

There's no better bargain 

than the BEST' 

Higginbotham-Bartlett Co. 
109 N. Broadway 	 647-3161 

you 
Drovice the pro Clem 

EARLY SANTAS SAVE DURING OUR 

• 

alil A61 

Tanciscan 
This stripper lets you strip 

cotton in the comfort of a 

Sound-Gard body 
IffIg7=ffelETEMESI=4„, 

we 
suoc t ne solution 

Medical expenses can pop up just when your 
finances are lowest. Should you need extra cash In a 
hurry to pay those bills, see us. We'll arrange a 

loan with convenient terms. 

The First State Bank  
of Dimmitt 	647.4151 

PORTABLE STEREO . . 8-track with AM/FM stereo 

radio 	  $89.95 

ANIMAL RADIOS . . . Raccoon, mouse, dog 	 $14.95 

T.V. SCOREBAORD . . Full-color electronic game 

for four players 	  $39.95 

C. B. RADIO . . 40-channel mobile unit. Regular 

price $149.95, now only 	  $89.00 

JANSEN CAR SPEAKERS . . Best auto sound ever! 

Triaxials $119.95 	 Coaxials $79.95 

USE OUR LAYAWAY PLAN 

IN-STORE FINANCING AVAILABLE 

IiILLINGSWORTH 
Builders Supply 

S. Hwy. 385 	 647-3141 

20% OFF 
ON SELECTED OPEN STOCK! 
Add whatever pieces yOu like from a large group 

of selected Open Stock at 20% off. 

?mow Rexati Mug 

Stop in soon and get complete 

information on the John Deere 283 
Stripper—the stripper that makes 
harvesting more comfortable. 

	JOHN DEERE 

C & S EQUIPMENT CO. 
301 SE 2nd 	 647-3324 
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'79 Ford Lariat Pickup 

4,544111,09 IA= ala 

.644. • 	 'A•S• !,,,S4•1991.,  • ,• • • -••• • • • • • • 

'79 Thunderbird—a whole new way to fly. 4E* FORD 
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Irene's Ideas  

Shoulders in style 
PMH Auxiliary 

members go 
to area meet By IRENE KEATING 

NEW PLEDGES of Dimmitt's Alpha Epsilon 
Tau chapter of Beta Sigma Phi sorority are 
(from left] Janet Justice, Karen Sheffy, June 
Sutton, Carlee Warren and Jackie Byrnes. 

The chapter conducted its annual pledge 
ritual last Wednesday evening in Rhoads 
Memorial Library 

MRS. JIM HARRIS 
. . The former Cindy Tevis 

AC classes likely for spring term Tevis-Harris wed 
in Lubbock church 

with the shape being a thin-
ner version. Many interfacing 
companies provide informa-
tion for making shoulder 
pads. 

For a set-in sleeve, the 
armhole seamline of the gar-
ment is traced between front 
and back armhole notches. 
The width along the shoulder 
seam and number of padding 
layers needed depends on the 
garment, figure and look in-
tended. 

Before sewing any shoulder 
pad into a garment along 
armhole and shoulder seam 
allowances, first pin the 
shoulder pad in place and try 
the garment on. Placement, 
size or amount of padding is 
easiest altered at that time.'  

Figure-wise, exaggerated 
shoulders usually have a 
shortening and broadening ef-
fect on the figure but can also 
balance a heavy hipline. 
Slight to moderate padding 
often makes garments fit bet-
ter, maintain their shape 
longer and even correct some 
fitting problems such as slop-
ing shoulders. 

Coordinating Board. 
Regular tuition will be 

charged for the classes, to be 
taught by instructors from 
AC, and regular credit will be 
given. Half a dozen different 
subjects were listed on the 
survey forms which prospec-
tive students were asked to 
complete in the survey. 

Classifieds Get Results 

A GOOD protective coating 
for galvanzied window 
screens is a mixture of two 
parts boiling linseed oil and 
one part turpentine. 

Three members of Plains 
Memorial Hospital Auxiliary 
represented the organization 
at the annual area meeting of 
Texas Association of Hospital 
Auxiliaries last week at the 
Psychiatric Pavilion in Ama-
rillo. 

Reta Welch, Birdie Neill 
and Carolyn Copeland went 
from Dimmitt for a luncheon 
and a session where the state 
president, Mrs. Philip Clifton 
of Houston, was the speaker. 
She has been a hospital vol-
unteer since 1965 and has 
over 6,000 hours of service to 
her credit. 

She discussed the 1978-79 
theme for the state, "Let Us 
Rise up with Wings of Eagles 
to Meet the Challenge of 
Change." Mrs. Clifton chose 
the eagle as the TAHA sym-
bol because it is the symbol of 
America, "bold, strong and 
ever-present," she described 
the bird which inhabits all 
parts of Texas. 

"The eagle covers the state 
just as the TAHS does," she 
told members. 

Dr. Winfred Moore, pastor 
of Amarillo's First Baptist 
Church, was the noon speak-
er. Music was by a group 
from Amarillo High School. 

The days are shorter and 
cooler now as fall is here. Our 
thoughts turn to clothes for 
fall and winter. Whether you 
are buying clothes or sewing 
them, you'll want to consider 
the current style. 

Fashions focus on the 
shoulder this season. From 
the popular shoulder draw-
strings, tucks, embroidery 
and other detailing currently 
popular, fashion is adding an 
exaggerated shape with 
shoulder pads. 

The look ranges from the 
more extreme "football" ef-
fect to a slight shoulder mod-
ification. Besides pads in jack-
ets and coats, women will see 
them also in blouses and 
dresses. 

Considered a basic home-
sewing notion, shoulder pads 
were primarily used in outer-
wear and suit jackets or blaz-
ers. However, in line with an 
increased fashion emphasis, 
notion companies are expand-
ing shoulder pad varieties and 
quantities. 

Some of the types available 
include blouse pads, iron-ons, 
press-on/peel-offs, heavy de-
signer weights and covered 
pads. Some companies dis-
tinguish between shoulder 
pads and shoulder shapes 

Classes likely to be offered 
here by Amarillo College in 
the spring semester are Real 
Estate, Math, Biology and Ac-
counting, which were request-
ed by most of the prospective 
students who responded to a 
survey. 

Dowden Koeninger, Dim-
mitt High School counselor 
who directed the survey, said 
Tuesday the college is being 

informed of the results and if 
it decides there is enough 
demand for the courses they 
will probably be started in 
January. 

Amarillo College has in-
dicated its willingness to 
teach any of the college-
level courses in Dimmitt for 
which there is enough de-
mand, if approval can be ob-
tained from the Texas College 

Cindy Tevis and Jim Harris 
were wed in a double ring, 
formal ceremony Saturday in 
Hodges Chapel of the First 
Christian Church in Lubbock. 

Officiating for the ceremony 
at an altar decorated with 
candelabra and greenery was 
Gene Wisdom of the United 
Methodist Church, Vega. The 
bride is the daughter of Betty 
Tevis of Dallas. The groom is 
the son of Mrs. Bill_ Clark of 
Dimmitt. 

WIN A NEW FORD LARIAT 
Maid of honor was Cathy 

Tevis, sister of the bride, and 
bridesmaids were Mary Tevis 
of Dallas, another sister, and 
Susie Hughes of Lubbock. 

Best man was Blake Chris-
tie of El Toro, Calif. Grooms-
men were Mike Farmer and 
Brad Williams, both of Lub-
bock. Candlelighters and ush-
ers were Kyle Short and Steve 
Williams, both of Lubbock. 
`•••• e• • •• ••• i• •••••••• 
• 
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Organist was Sandy Gowens. 
Given in marriage by her 

brother, Tom Tevis, the bride 
wore a floor length gown of 
heavy white chiania with long 
sleeves and high neck, trim-
med at neck, sleeves and hem 
with linen flowers and leaves. 

Her veil was also trimmed 
with linen flowers and leaves 
on a satin band. Her flowers 
were arranged in a nosegay 
on lace background, of white 
roses and baby breath. The 
attendants were dressed in 
floor length burgundy blous-
ons, with split sleeves, with a 
single rose at the shoulder 
and they carried nosegays on 
lace of pink and burgundy 
carnations and baby breath. 

Following the ceremony a 
reception was held in the 
parlor of the First Christian 
Church. 

The bride and groom will 
be in New Mexico for their 
honeymoon. The bride's trav-
eling attire was a blouson 
street length dress in beige, 
brown and tan with shoes to 
match. 

After the honeymoon the 
newlyweds will be at home at 
6302 Elgin in Lubbock. 

The bride is a graduate of 
Coronado High School in Lub-
bock and is now employed at 
the US Post Office in Lub-
bock. The groom is a graduate 
of Monterrey High School and 
is also employed at the US 
Post Office in Lubbock. 

S  :• Assortment of Cloths,: 
: • Draped and Tailored 
• • Also specializing 	in: • 
• 
• 	Birthday Cakes & Candy* 
• Supplies 
• • Owners: Johnnie Battey .•

• 

• Martha Lytal : 
• • • 51 5 Star St., 	• 

: • Hereford 	• 

Sign up in your Ford Dealer's Rodeo Sweepstakes 
...and see all the new Fords for '79...today! 

• FRONTIER AIRLINES 364-6711 • 
• 
• • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • 2  ND PRIZE: FOUR-DAY TRIP FOR TWO,VIA 

FRONTIER AIRLINES-TO MAZATLAN, MEXICO! 

December 1st, at the National Finals Rodeo, you could win this new Ford Lariat Pickup—
in your Ford Dealer's big Rodeo Sweepstakes. Win the Lariat or—a 4-day trip for two, via 
Frontier Airlines, to romantic Mexico. Nothing to buy, no obligation. Just stop in and drop 
your name in the hat. Entries close November 25; so come in for a close look at the new 

Fords for '79, and sign up in the Rodeo Sweepstakes 
at your participating Ford Dealer. Do it now! 

• 
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cone 

From a 

Fighting Bobcat 

With Hair 

to a 

Deal-Making Man 

Without! 

The all-new Ford LTD for '79—
a new American Road Car. 

A whole new breed of Mustang for '79. 

• 

Pinto 

A new look inside and out for '79. 

Fairmont—the most successful new 
car ever introduced in America. *Based on first year sales of new car nameplates. 

OFFICIAL SWEEPSTAKES RULES 
1. To enter the Sweepstakes: on an official 
entry blank, or on a 3 x 5" piece of paper, 
print your name, address, and phone number. 
Deposit your entry at any participating Ford 
dealership by the close of business November 
25, 1978. *
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night trip including accommodations, for two 
persons, to Mazatlan, Mexico, via Frontier Air-
lines. All other trip expenses are the respon-
sibility of the winner. Payment of any Federal, 
state and local taxes imposed on the winner 
are the responsibility of the winner. Prizes 
are non-transferable and non-redeemable. No 
substitutions will be allowed. 2. The prizes. Two prizes will be awarded. 

First prize will be a 1979 Ford Lariat pickup 
truck. Second prize will be a four-day, three- 

ti 

determined by random drawing from among 
entries submitted. Your chances of winning 
depend on the total number of entries. The 
winners will be notified as soon as possible 
following the drawing, and not later than 
30 days following the close of the Sweep-
stakes on November 25, 1978. All entries be-
come the property of the sponsoring organiza-
tion and none will be returned. By entering the 
Sweepstakes, entrant agrees to the use of his 3. Determination of winners. Winners will be 3 

name and likeness for advertising and promo-
tion purposes without compensation. 

4. Eligibility. Sweepstakes open to licensed 
drivers only. Sweepstakes not open to em-
ployees and immediate families of Ford Motor 
Company, Ford dealerships, their advertising 
agencies, or the Judging organization. Sweep-
stakes void where prohibited or restricted by 
law or regulation. 

SEE ALL THE NEW FORDS FOR'79...NOW! Bittliulay, 
OKLAHOMA/TEXAS PANHANDLE 

FORD DEALERS.  

Skuti3 
STAN BYRNES FORD, Inc. From your 'devoted employees' 

647-2115 ***** 803 N. Broadway 



OUT OF TOWN 

Ni-Plain 
aad leas Association 

CURRENT SAVINGS RATES 
PASSBOOK SAVINGS -"Date-In-Date-Out" - No Minimum 	5.25% Yield 5.39% 

CERTIFICATES OF DEPOSIT  
Three Months - $1,000.00 minimum 
One Year - $1,000.00 minimum 

	 S.7S% Yield 5.92% 
	 6.50% Yield 6.72% 

Thirty Months - $1,000.00 minimum 	 6.75% Yield 6.98% 
Four Years - $1,000.00 minimum 	 J.50% Yield 7.79% 
Six Years - $1,000.00 	 7.7S% Yield 8.06% 
Eight Years - $1,000.00 	 8.00% Yield 8.33% 

MONEY MARKET CERTIFICATE - $10,000,00 minimum - 6 months (182 days) 

Current Rate 	8.672 Effective 10-12-78 

NEGOTIABLE RATE CERTIFICATES - $100,000.00 Minimum 
Term and Rate are negotiable - Ask us about these. 

IRA AND KEOGH PLANS ARE AVAILABLE FOR YOUR RETIREMENT FUNDS 

Interest on all accounts paid from date of deposit to date of withdrawal 
end compounded daily. 

Any account holder making an early withdrawal from a Certificate of Deposit will 
receive on the amount withdrawn the passbook rate then being paid, and in 
ADDITION, the account holder will pay a penalty of 90 days interest or interest 
from date of issuance or renewal of the Certificate of Deposit, whichever is less 

CONVERSION OF PRESENT CERTIFICATES - Above penalty clause applies. 

HEREFORD & DIMMITT 647-2189 
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0,1  HON 

anniversary! 

(Compiled from the Commun-
ity Birthday Calendars of the 
County Home Demonstration 
Council and the Nazareth 
American Legion Auxiliary.1 

rfaira 	 • :.:2:0-Nznila 
(Compiled from the commun-
ity Birthday Calendars of the 
County Home Demonstration 
Council and the Nazareth 
American Legion Auxiliary.] , 

• 4 

at 
OCT. 17 — Tommy and 

Paula Portwood. 
OCT. 18 — Frank and Josie 

Sharp. 
OCT. 19 — Mr. and Mrs. 

Walter Schilling. 

Month's titles 

given in Tops 

MR. AND MRS. SAM SWOPES 
. . . To celebrate Golden Wedding 

Anniversary party set 
MRS. DOUGLAS SANFORD 

. . . Nee Elaine Acker 

ENGAGEMENT of Judy Kathleen Hall and Gregory Mark 
Hammons, both students at West Texas State University, was 
announced at a recent barbecue in the home of her parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Charles M. Hall of Lubbock. Hammons, formerly 
of Dimmitt, is the son of Mrs. Pat Hammons, now of 
Canyon. The marriage is planned for Dec. 23. Miss Hall is a 
member of Zeta Tau Alpha sorority at WTSU, and Hammons' 
fraternity is Phi Delta Theta. She graduated from Monterrey 
High School and he from Canyon High. Miss Acker weds 

Douglas Sanford Holiday bazaar date 
is fixed by Auxiliary 

ren, Mrs. Jones and the late 
Truman Swopes. Their grand-
children are Gregory and 
Kristi Swopes of Chelsea, 
Okla., Dan and Charles 
Jones. 

Daughter of the late J. C. 
and Daisy McLain, who came 
to Castro County in 1904 and 
homesteaded south of Hart, 
Mrs. Swopes is a member of a 
pioneer family in the area. 
Swopes came to Olton in 1925 
with his mother and others in 
the family after the death of 
his father. Charlie Swopes. 

The Dimmitt Tops Club met 
at Rhoads Memorial Library 
Monday and recorded 41 1/4  
pounds lost in the month of 
September. 

Three new members joined, 
Inez Battles, Carmen Catano 
and Dorothy Ellis. 

A tie was announced be-
tween Emily Clingingsmith 
and Janice Bell for Angel of 
the Month title. 

Janice Bell was Tops of the 
Month, Dale Wells and Del-
bert Smotherman tied for 
Male Tops and Mandy Ra-
mirez was Kops of the Month. 

Cindy Backus was Kops of 
the Week, Dale Wells Tops of 
the Week with a 3 1/2  pound 
weight loss, Carmen Catano 
Tops of the Week lost 3'2 
pounds. 

This week 26 weighed in 
with a weight loss of 23 
pounds. 

OCT. 12 — Birdie Rister, 
Rena Standlee, Jake Isaacs, 
Kelly Schilling, Analeen Ven-
haus Lane, CoUeen Gerber, 
Marie Brockman, Calvin 
Schulte. 

OCT. 13 — Kerri Collins, 
Ed Ray, Danny Underwood, 
Paula Fish, Tommy Stanton, 
Ed Standlee, Ryan Hoelting, 
Kathy Maurer. Troy .Johnson, 
Ramona Heiman. 

OCT. 14 — Brenda Bruton, 
Sonccia Tischler, Jon Ray, 
Tomi Poteet, Ricky Backus, 
Sam Albrecht, Bill Mumme. 

OCT. 15 — Shirley Burnett, 
Margaret Kuntz, June Sutton,• 
Paul Johnson, Ann Hays, Lo-
rena Cates, Ralph Smith, Re-
nee Cluck, Amy Wardlow, 
Scott Brockman, Fred Ball, 
Keith Hoelting, Gene Hub-
bard, Todd Hill. 

OCT. 16 — Sandy Baker, 
Stanley Byrnes, Cindy Kelly, 
Jeanette Annen, Albert Ger-
ber, Wayne Backus, Bruce 
Backus, Charles Birkenfeld, 
Lisa Pohlmeier, Marvin 
Schmucker. 

OCT. 17 — Kylene Collins, 
David Behrends, Margo 
Boyd, Patty Montes, Russell 
Acker, Ruth Backus. 

OCT. 18 — Butch Holcomb, 
Janet Justice, Sam Rutkow-
ski, Sharon Birkenfeld. 

OCT. 19 — Gene Ivey, 
Doricell 	Davis, 	Shirley 
Thompson, Wade Hoelting, 
Daniel Braddock, Zac Hatla. 

and tea were served to the 
new members and 34 others. 

Program guest was a rep-
resentative from Catholic 
Family Services of Amarillo, 
who explained the services 
offered by that group in coun-
seling, foster home placement 
and adoption. 

OVER 200 million tons of 
dirt and rock were dug up to 
create the 50-mile long Pan-
ama Canal. 

IN January, 1919, a tank 
containing two million gallons 
of molasses exploded in Bos-
ton. Fifty people were injured 
and 21 were killed, many of 
whom actually drowned in 
molasses. 

Mr. and Mrs. Sam Swopes 
of Vinita, Okla., will return to 
their former hometown, Hart, 
.10 celebrate their 50th wed-
ding anniversary at a recep-
tion Oct. 22. Calling hours 
during the Sunday afternoon 
will be from 2 to 5 o'clock. 

Hosts will be the Swopes' 
daughter and her family. 
Louise and Cecil Ray Jones, 
Charles and Dan, at their 
home three miles south of 
Hart on Hwy. 168 and 1'4 mile 
east. Friends and relatives are 
invited. 

Retired farmers and ranch-
ers, the Swopes lived five 
miles south of Hart until 1960, 

• when they moved to Vinita. 
They were married Oct. 17. 
1928 at Olton and Mrs. 

• Swopes is the former Nell 
McLain. 

The couple had two child- 

THE Empire State Building 
is 102 stories high, can hold 
80,000 people, and has seven 
miles of elevator shafts. NAZARETH 

DITCHING 
SERVICE 

Underground Irrigation 
• and Pipe Repair 

KELVIN KLEMAN 
945-2550 Days 
945-2535 Nights 945-2228  

Date for the annual holiday 
bazaar of Plains Memorial 
Hospital Auxiliary was set for 
Dec. 1 as plans were launched 
in a business meeting at the 
hospital last Wednesday. 

Members also made plans 
for their participation in the 
County Health Fair held here 
Oct. 11. 

Orientation for six new 
members also gave the other 
Pink Ladies an opportunity to 
review their knowledge of the 
auxiliary's aims and pro 
grams. 

This fall's recruits are 
Joyce Davis, Sandy Baker. 
Penetha Armstrong, Myrtle 
Behrends, Nora Newsom and 
Betty Cartwright. 

They were the honorees at 
a recent brunch in the club-
room at Rhoads Memorial 
Library. On the hostess com-
mittee were Carolyn Watts, 
Nell Newton and Bea Hardy. 

Fresh fruit, muffins, coffee 

A daughter, born Saturday 
afternoon in a Lubbock hos-
pital to Mr. and Mrs. Keith 
Jones of that city, has been 
named Allyson Suzanne. She 
weighed 5 pounds, 121/2  oun-
ces at birth. The mother is the 
former Angela Spinhirne of 
Dimmitt, and grandparents 
are the Walter Spinhirnes. 

TAX DISCOUNT 
TAX PAYERS 

OF 

cloth appliqued in satin dove-
and-bell design. The wedding 

.cake, square and three-tiered, 
was topped with white sugar 
bells and flanked by pink 
roses. 

For the trip to Taos, Santa 
Fe and other New Mexico 
points the bride traveled in a 
two-piece azure qiana dress. 

She has been a student at 
West Texas State University 
after graduation from Naza-
reth High School. 

The bridegroom graduated 
from WTSU this year with a 

'degree in international rela-
tions. He completed high 
school studies in Cooper High 
at Abilene. A second lieu-
tenant in the US Army, he 
was based at Fort Knox, Ky. 
before the overseas assign-
ment. 

His parents were hosts for 
the wedding rehearsal dinner-
Priclay at a Nazareth restau-
rant. The table was decorated 
with a double ring cake set 
between candles in the pink 
shades used at the wedding. 

CASTRO COUNTY 
TAKE 

ADVANTAGE 
OF YOUR 

DISCOUNT 
3% If Paid During October 
2% If Paid During November 

1% if Paid During December 

This Discount Is on All State 
And County Taxes Collected 
By The County Tax Collector 

KENT BIRDWELL 
Tax Assessor And Collector 

Castro County, Texas 
* **AL )4c******************** 

Elaine Acker, wearing her 
mother's wedding gown, ex-
changed marriage vows with 
Douglas Sanford Saturday and 
the couple began a honey-
moon that will take them by 
Nov. 1 to Kitzengen, Ger-
many, their home while he is 
stationed there in US Army 
service. 

The bride is the daughter of 
Mr. and Mrs. David V. Acker 
of Amarillo, former Nazareth 
residents, and the groom's 
parents are Mr. and Mrs. 
Calvin Sanford of Abilene. 

The nuptial mass was con-
ducted by Rev. Stanley Croc-
chiola in Holy Family Catholic 
Church at Nazareth, at mid-
afternoon Saturday. Mr. Ack-
er gave his daughter in mar-
riage. 

Matron of honor was her 
sister, Agnes Taylor of Lub-
bock, and bridesmaids were 
another sister, Debora Mayes 
pf Amarillo, and Cindy 
Schacher of Waco. 

Kent DeVries of Amarillo 
acted as best man. Bernard 
Acker of Amarillo and Craig 
Sanford of Abilene, brothers 
of the couple, were grooms-
men. Stephen Acker of Ama-
rillo and Scott Sanford of Abi-
lene, also brothers, and Ken 
Taylor of Amarillo ushered 
guests to the pews. 

Caroline Evers of Hereford, 
organist, played the marches 
and accompanied the vocal 
soloist, Larry Kuper of Ama-
rillo, as he sang "We've Only 
Just Begun," "Like a Seal on 
Your Heart." "Follow Me," 
"A Bridal Vow" and "Whith-
er Thou Goest." 

Silk flowers, made from 
bridesmaids' dresses from 
Mrs. Mays' wedding, banked 
the church altars. Pink and 
green were the colors stressed 
in silk blossoms of gladiolas 
and iris. 

After the wedding vows 
were repeated, the couple 
lighted the unity candle at the 
altar. 

The bride's gown which her 
mother wore 25 years ago was 
styled with molded bodice, 
natural 	waistline, 	fitted 
sleeves pointed at the wrists, 
and circular tulle yoke giving 
an off-shoulder effect below a 
wedding-ring neckline. 

A hoop added bouffancy to 
the gathered skirt, trimmed 
with rows of Irish lace, which 
shaped into a lace-bordered 
circular train. Her tiered il-
lusion veil, held by a coronet 
of petals and seed pearls, 
flowed over the long train. 

In her costume were tradi-
tional luck symbols including 
her mother's opal heart pen-
dant as "something borrow-
ed." 

Her attendants wore sheer 
organza flocked with pink and 
white daisies over pastel 
green. Floor-length circular 
skirts were attached to fitted 
bodices with portrait neckline 
and attached flowing capes. 
Wide belts of the fabric cross-
ed in front and tied in back 
bows. Their flowers were cas-
cades of pink carnations. 

The wedding luncheon in 
Nazareth Community Hall fol-
lowed the ceremony. Sherri 
Acker registered guests at a 
table centered with a pink 
candle in a ring of wedding 
bells and white dove figu-
rines. Susan Sanford, LaDon-
na Brockman, Patricia Ewing 
and Kim Jones served the 
lunch. 

A bouquet of crystal pink 
gladiolas and sweet peas or-
namented the bride's table, 
which was laid with a lace 



DIMMITT 
EQUIPMENT CO. 

(formerly Webb-Mears 
Engine) 

°King Offset Discs 
°Briggs & Stratton 
Sales & Service 
°Allis-Chalmers 

Phone 647-2573 
P.O. Box 576 

•	 

Building 

Material for 

Every purpose 

HIGGINBOTHAM 
BARTLETT CO. 

4 

CABLE TV 

:BETTER PICTURE, 
MORE STATIdNSI 

A Cable hook-up 

makes TV pictures 

clearer, gives a 

wider choice of 

shows, more fun! 

j DIMMITT 
TV CABLE CO. 
NO INSTALLATION; 

CHARGE 

Phone 647-2364 
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THE demand for cotton in 
the US continues under pres-
sure while the export market 
for US cotton should remain 
strong. 
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Children's hospital fund 
drive needs volunteers 

Halloween Carnival 
booths are available 

Insurance man 
is appointed 

J. C. Chambers, an insur-
ance executive from Lubbock, 
was elected to the board of 
directors of Southwestern 
Public Service Company at 
the regular board meeting in 
Amarillo. 

Chambers is a graduate of 
Texas Tech University and 
attended Lubbock High 
School. He is a partner in 
Insurance Associates, receiv-
ed his CLU designation in 
1965 and is a life and quali-
fying member, Million Dollar 
Round Table. He is president 
of the Massachusetts Mutual 
Agent's Association. 

Active in civic affair, Cham-
bers is a director of the Texas 
Tech Foundation, vice-presi-
dent of the Red Raider Club, 
a member of the executive 
committee of the Methodist 
Hospital and a member of the 
President's Advisory Board of 
Lubbock Christian College. 

Chambers is also a director 
of the Briarcroft Savings and 
Loan Association and the First 
National Bank in Lubbock. 

Wells, 702 W. Grant, 647-
4435 or 647-3342. 

"Saving children's lives is 
the most vital work in the 
world," Dale Wells, chairman 
for the St. Jude Children's 
Research Hospital door-to-
door march, said today, ask-
ing that residents of Dimmitt 
volunteer their time and en-
ergy toward that goal. 

"We're looking for people 
who are willing to contribute a 
little of their time to help us 
help children live," Wells 
said. 

NOW'S YOUR CREDIT 
Halloween Carnival plan-

ning time is here again, and 
the Dimmitt Noon Lions Club 
is asking that operators begin 
now to make reservations for 
booth space. These booths, 
for various amusement fea-
tures and sale of refresh-
ments, are available to local 
organizations without charge. 

Reservations for booth 
space may be made by con-
tacting Doyle Hoover, carnival 
chairman, at 647-4302 or 647-
3135. 

The admission charge is the 
Lions Clubs only source of 
funds from the carnival. So 
even booth operators are re-
quired to pay the small ad-
mission during open hours for 
the carnival. 

Admission charge to the 
carnival building, LaMantia, 
Cullum and Collier, Inc., 
sheds will be 50 cents for 

adults and 25 cents for stu-
dents or a pair of discarded 
eyeglasses. 

Carnival hours will be from 
6 to 10 p.m. 

A costume contest will be 
held at 8 p.m. in a designated 
booth, for children up to 10 
years of age. Awards will be 
presented to the winners. 

The building will be open to 
allow organizations to con-
struct and set up their booths 
as follows: Saturday, Oct. 28, 
2-6 p.m.; Sunday, 2-6 p.m.; 
Monday 2-6 p.m.; Tuesday 9 
a.m.-5 p.m. 

It is announced that there 
will be no activities inside the 
building which will cause 
smoke. Also no electrical 
equipment other than record 
players and public address 
systems will be permitted, to 
avoid problems with the 
building's wiring system. 

We'll be happy to answer 
your questions on the 
importance of a good 

credit record. 
all us or stop in for a 
personal interview. 

THE CREDIT BUREAU 
On 

Wall Street 
By Bob Hill 

116 W. Bedford 

Volunteers are needed to 
help conduct a march Oct. 24 
to raise funds to support the 
world-famous research center 
in its battle against catas-
trophic childhood diseases. 

At St. Jude's, in Memphis, 
Tenn., children suffering from 
leukemia, Hodgkin's Disease 
and other forms of cancer are 
treated completely free of 
charge. The results of re-
search conducted there are 
shared with doctors and scien-
tists all over the world. 

Founded 16 years ago by 
entertainer Danny Thomas, 
St. Jude's is a non-sectarian 
research hospital which has 
made great strides in the 
battle against diseases that 
strike helpless children every-
where. 

"But as long as children 
are still dying," Wells said, 
"St. Jude Children's Hospital 
must keep fighting. We need 
your help." 

Those who will volunteer to 
help with the door-to-door 
march are asked to contact 

FARMER'S 
SUPPLY CO. 
THE FINEST IN 

A.G. Edwards tijSQns;In 

ment-quality diamonds have 
doubled or tripled in price in 
the past five years. The high-
est-quality white diamonds 
have jumped 100% in the past 
12 months. 

Colored gems, such as ru-
bies, emeralds, sapphires, 
fine opals, fine jade, and cat's 
eyes have appreciated also, 
but they have uneven price 
patterns, due largely to a lack 
of grading and quality stan-
dards. Rubies, at a price of 
$1,000 to $4,000 per carat for 
average quality are rising 
sharply in value. 

The Third World nations 
may have a lot to do with the 
price of precious stones in the 
future. There has been a 
diamond strike in Sierra Le-
one. The gemstone, tsavorite, 
found in Kenya, should move 
higher in price for the same 
reasons. Brazil, a source of 
amethyst, topaz tourmaline 
and other gems has also im-
posed stricter controls. 

Warning! You can get con-
ned out of a sizeable amount 
of money by buying diamonds 
or other gems. The big play 
today is in diamonds. Unfor-
tunately, these and other 
gems are being sold to US 
investors by over 200 self-
styled gem investment com-
panies, with an estimated 
volume of $300 million a year. 

Complaints by doctors, law-
yers and business executives 
are increasing. It seems they 
have succumed to fast-buck 
sellers using direct mail, tel-
ephone calls and "seminars" 
to peddle their merchandise. 

Despite all of the crooked 
deals, there is a favorable 
field for gem investment. 
Since the price of gems is tied 
to inflation, there is the ele-
ment of risk. If the dollar 
weakens, the price of gems 
goes higher. It is a case of 
careful buying through rep-
utable dealers and an expec-
tation of a reasonable profit 
with reasonable safety. Try to 
make a killing and greed 
could eat your lunch. 

In 1972 a retail jeweler 
would pay a New York gem 
supplier $1,775 for a 1-carat 
VVS (very, very slightly flaw-
ed) high-grade diamond. The 
same investment quality stone 
today would cost the retailer 
over $7,650. Most imvest- 

Minneapolis-Moans 

ENGINE AND MAGNETO 

REPAIR 

By Ace Reid COW POKES 

Here's Hart's 
school menu 

MONDAY - Breakfast: 
Biscuits, sausage, jelly, hot 
chocolate. Lunch: Salisbury 
steak, creamed potatoes, but-

.tered corn, hot rolls, cake, 
milk. 

TUESDAY - Breakfast: 
Hot cereal, buttered toast, 
juice, milk. Lunch: Barbecued 
beef on homemade bun, cole-
slaw, ranch style beans, but-
tered rice, milk. 

WEDNESDAY - Break-
fast: Cinnamon toast, fruit, 
milk. Lunch: Beef stew, corn-
bread,. tossed salad, apricots, 
peanut butter cake, milk. 

THURSDAY - Breakfast: 
Cold cereal, fruit, milk. 
Lunch: Cheeseburger on 
homemade bun, pinto beans, 
peaches, milk. 

FRIDAY - Breakfast: 
Buttered toast, jelly, juice, 
milk. Lunch: Steak fingers, 
yeast rolls, whipped potatoes, 
green beans, apricot cobbler, 
milk. 
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\ 

HAYS 

IMPLEMENT 

CO. 

OVERSEEDING pastures 
with winter grasses (sodseed-
ing) can provide for additional 
fall, winter and early spring 
grazing. 

-44 

International-Harvester THE HANGING Gardens of 
Babylon were not hanging 
gardens, but gardens on bal-
conies or terraces. 
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Farm Machinery 

State Banv No  178  Form 64p (St*te) .6-771 PUBLISHER'S COPY 

Consolidated Report of Condition of " 	 St_a_t.a. Hank o.f. Dinaaitt 	  

of 	Dirlmitt 	in the State of . T.exas 	and Domestic Subsidiaries at the close of 

business on . Sept.emb.er 34 	, mAnr 	 /0,0 
0 AGE RE rD Lantz completes 

naval recruit 

training course 

BALANCE SHEET 	 ASSETS Sch. Item Col. 

1. Cash and due from banks 	  C 7 
2. U.S. Treasury securities 	  B 1 E 	 
3. Obligations of other U.S. Government agencies and corporations 	 B 2 E 	 
4. Obligations of States and political subdivisions 	  B 3 E 	 
5. Other bonds, notes, and debentures 	  B 4 E 	 
6. Corporate 	stock 

7 Trading account securities 

8.  Federal funds sold and securities purchased under agreements to resell 4 	 
9.  a. Loans, Total (excluding unearned income) 	  

b. Less: Reserve for possible loan losses 

c. Loans, Net 

A 10 	 

Mil. Thou. 

_883  
4947  

1 

2 

3 

4 

5 

6 

7 

8 

9a 

b 

C 

10 

11 

12 

13 

14 

15 

16 

"Maw no wonder we don't have no money . . . 
you spend everthing subscribin' to 

`Better Homes and Garden'." 

MI 
11402  

-o- Navy Seaman Recruit Jef-
fery G. Lantz, son of John and 
Carol Lantz of Dimmitt, has 
completed recruit training at 
the Naval Training Center, 
Great Lakes, Ill. 

During the eight-week 
training cycle, he studied gen-
eral military subjects design-
ed to prepare him for further 
academic and on-the-job 
training in one of the Navy's 
85 basic occupational fields. 

Included in his studies were 
seamanship, close-order drill, 
Naval history and first aid. 
Personnel who complete this 
course of instruction are eli-
gible for three hours of col-
lege credit in physical educa-
tion and hygiene. 

- n- 
1 5 0 

21 71)4 
2L1.5 

21459 
gAg 	gaeradry 10.  

11. Bank premises, furniture and fixtures, and other assets representing bank premises 	  
12. Real estate owned other than bank premises 

13. Investments in unconsolidated subsidiaries and associated companies 
14. Customers' liability to this bank on acceptances outstanding 	  

15. Other assets   G 	7 	  
16. TOTAL ASSETS (sum of items 1 thru 15) 	  

LIABILITIES Sch. Item Col. 

17. Demand deposits of individuals, partnerships, and corporations   F 	if 	A 	  
18. Time and savings deposits of individuals, partnerships, and corporations 	F 	if 	f3+C 	 

19. Deposits of United States Government 	  F 	2 	A+B+C 
20. Deposits of States and political subdivisions 	 „ 	  F 	3 	A+B+C 
21. Deposits of foreign governments and official institutions 	  F 	4 	A+B+C 
22. Deposits of commercial banks 	 ....... . ....... 	 5+6 	A+B+C 
23. Certified and officers' checks   F 	7 	A 	 
24.  

Direct lease financing -0- 
1160 

n- 
1)- 
-o- 

786 
--3.5087  

17 

18 

19 

20 

21 

22 

23 

24 

a 

b 

25 

26 

27 

28 

29 

30 

31 

MEMBER Of FEDERAL DEPOSIT INSURANCE CORPORATION 

TOTAL DEPOSITS (sum of items 17 thru 23) 

a. Total demand deposits 

b. Total time and savings deposits 

25. Federal funds purchased and securities sold under agreements to repurchase 

26. Other liabilities for borrowed money 

27. Mortgage indebtedness ... 

28. Acceptances executed by or for account of this bank and outstanding ... 
29. Other liabilities 

30. TOTAL LIABILITIES (excluding subordinated notes and debentures) 
31. Subordinated notes and debentures 

15 535 
16 178 

F 	8 	A 

	  F 	8 	B+C 

E 	4 	 n- 
OFFICERS 

BOB McLEAN 
President 

o- 
CONDENSED STATEMENT 

THE FIRST STATE BANK OF DIMMITT 
DIMMITT, TEXAS 

MEMBER FEDERAL DEPOSIT INSURANCE CORPORATION 

.••••• 

0- 
424 H 	9 

JAMES R. HORTON 
Executive Vice President 

EDD C. McLEROY 
Vice President 

SALVATORE DiCUFFA 
Senior Vice President 

ROBERT B. McLEAN 
Vice President & Cashier 

MAXINE CHILDERS 
Vice President & 
Assistant Trust Officer 

32 13.7 
o _ 

EQUITY CAPITAL 
o _ -0- 32 (Par value) 32. Preferred stock 	 a. No shares outstanding 

33. Common stock   a. No. shares authorized 

b. No. shares outstanding 

127,500 
1 275 127,500 33 

34 

35 

36 

37 

38 

(Par value) 
AT THE CLOSE OF BUSINESS, SEPTEMBER 29, 1978 1 275 34. Surplus 

35. Undivided profits 

36. Reserve for contingencies and other capital reserves 

400 
-o RESOURCES 

........ 

2 950 $3,882,878.27 

4,947,462.91 

1,402,344.90 

210,000.00 

1,250,000.00 

21,704,341.39  

1,158,935.35 

776,074.35 

Cash and Due from Banks 

U. S. Treasury Securities __________ 	 

Obligations of States and Political Subdivisions - 	 

Other Securities 

37. TOTAL EQUITY CAPITAL (sum of items 32 thru 36) 
38. TOTAL LIABILITIES AND EQUITY CAPITAL (sum of items 30, 31, and 37)  

MEMORANDA 

LINDA FITZGEARLD 
Assistant Vice President 

GEORGIE WALL 
Assistant Cashier 

PETE GARZA 
Assistant Cashier 

0 8 / 35 

1. Average for 30 calendar days ending with call date:  

a. Cash and due from banks (corresponds to item 1 above) 

b. Federal funds sold and securities purchased under agreements to resell (corresponds to item 8 above) 

c. Total loans (corresponds to item 9a above) 

d. Time deposits of $100,000 or more (corresponds to Memoranda items 3a plus 3b below) 

e. Total deposits (corresponds to item 24 above) 	. 	.. 	... 

f. Federal funds purchased and securities sold under agreements to repurchase (corresponds to item 25 above) 

g. Other liabilities for borrowed money (corresponds to item 26 above)  

Federal Funds Sold 

Loans and Discounts 	 

Bank Premises, Furniture and Fixtures 

Other Assets 	  

DORIS HOLLAND 
Assistant Cashier 

PAT MORGAN 
Assistant Cashier 

- $35,332,027.17 TOTAL RESOURCES 	  
2. Standby letters of credit outstanding (as of call date) 

3. Time deposits of $100,000 or more (as of call date): 

a. Time certificates of deposit in denominations of $100,000 or more . 

	b. Other time deposits in amounts of $100.000 or more_ 	 
Vt-Cre-  Pre s 	. 

James R. Horton, Executive  of the above-named b 
is true and correct, to the beet of my knowledge and belief.  

DIRECTORS 

BOB McLEAN 

EMILY CLINGINGSM1TH 

MARY ALICE DICUFFA 

HELEN McLEAN 
MARGIE WIGGS 

SALVATORE DiCUFFA 
RICHARD M. WIGGS 

ROBERT B. McLEAN 
ROXANNE McLEAN 

CHARLES McLEAN 

JILL McLEAN 
WILSON DiCUFFA 

RUBYE MAE HALLFORD 

LIABILITIES 

Deposits ...._ 	 $31,713,468.55 

Other Liabilities 	 423,622.36 

TOTAL LIABILITIES 	...... 	 -____-_ $32,137,090.9 1  

..... 	• • 	....... 	......... 

.............. 

CAPITAL Correct-Attest: 

$1,275,000.00  

1,275,000.00 

399,578.92 

246,367.34 

$3,194,936.26  

Capital Stock 	 

Certified Surplus 

Undivided Profits ....... -._____________________ ..... 

Reserves 

TOTAL CAPITAL 	  

TOTAL LIABILITIES AND CAPITAL 	  $35,332,027. 17  

Directors. 

County of 	caStrQ State of 	Texas 	  
................ 	day of 

, at: 

Sworn to and eubscribed before me this 	 (MAKE MARK FOR 
NOTARY'S SEAL) and I hereby certify that I am not an officer or director o this b 

My commission expires ./0 - 	, 19...2.. 	 , Notary Public. 
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Be at Bobcat Stadium Friday night at 8 

VARSITY 
Sept. 8 	Dimmitt 6, Floydada 7 
Sept. 15 	Dimmitt 21, Slaton 26 
Sept. 22 	Dimmitt 0, Tahoka 36 
Sept. 29 
Oct. 6 	Dimmitt 19. Tulia 7 
Oct. 13 	LOCK NEY, Here 	  
Oct. 20 	LITTLEFIELD', Here 	  
Oct. 27 	OLTON', There 	  
Nov. 3 	MORTON*, There 	  
Nov. 10 	MULESHOE', Here 	  
Nov. 17 	FRIONA", Here 	  

'District Game 

Sept. 7 	Dimmitt 6, Nazareth 44 
Sept. 14 	Dimmitt 26,. Friona 20 
Sept. 21 	Dimmitt 26, Plainview 20 
Sept. 28 	Dimmitt 20, Olton 33 
Oct. 5 	Dimmitt 12, Tulia 30 
Oct. 12 	OPEN 
Oct. 19 	LITTLEFIELD, 7 p.m. 	  
Oct. 26 	OLTON, 7 p.m. 	  
Nov. 2 	HEREFORD. 7 p.m 	  
Nov. 9 	MULESHOE, 7 p.m 	 
Nov. 16 	FRIONA, 7 p.m. 	  

Sept. 7 	Dimmitt 14. Hart JV 6 
Sept. 14 Dimmitt 10, Friona 8 
Sept. 21 

Sept. 28 Dimmitt 14, Olton 6 
Oct. 5 	Dimmitt 0, Tulia 2 
Oct. 12 	OPEN 
Oct. 19 	LITTLEFIELD 	  
Oct. 26 	OLTON 	  
Nov. 2 	MORTON 	  
Nov. 9 	MULESHOE 	  
Nov. 16 	FRIONA 	  

Sept. 14 	7th, Dimmitt 20, Friona 0; 8th D. 28, F. 0 
Sept. 21 	7th D. 42, Plainview 0; 8th D. 36, Ply. 0 
Sept. 28 	OPEN 
Oct. 5 	7-A, D. 22, Tulia 
Oct. 12 	OPEN 
Oct. 17 	LITTLEFIELD 	  
Oct. 26 	OLTON 	  
Nov. 2 	MORTON 	  
Nov. 9 	MULESHOE 	  
Nov. 16 	FRIONA 	  

(All First Games Start at 

NAZARETH, 4 p.m 
NAZARETH, 5 p.m 	  
MULESHOE 	  
FRIONA 	  

HENRY OGAS 
Senior End 

SUPPORT THE BOOSTERS WHO SUPPORT OUR SCHOOLS, TEAMS AND COMMUNITY! 
The North Gin, Inc. 

Corn Saver Mfg. Co., Inc. 
C&S Equipment Co. 

Higginbotham-Bartlett Co. 
LaMantia, Cullum, Collier & Co. 

of Dimmitt, Inc. 

Nelson Drilling & Pump Service 
Jackson Ditching Service 

Production Credit Association 
Dimmitt Consumers, Inc. 

Dimmitt TV Cable Co. 
Dimmitt Super Market 

Bruegel & Sons Elevators 
Stan Byrnes Ford, Inc. 

Coleman Pharmacy 
Colonial Inn Restaurant 
Dimmitt Equipment Co. 

Hays Implement Co. 

Ann's Steak House 
Castro Co-op Gin, Inc. 

Harman's Department Store 
Tidwell Spraying Service 
Reeve-Fleming Chevrolet 

Dimmitt Agri Industries, Inc. 
Castro County Grain Co. 

Parsons Rexall Drug 
Dimmitt Feed Yards 

Big T Pump Co. 
Dimmitt Safety Lane 

Don Hargrove, Contractor 
Chem-Tex Farm Supply 

The Village Shop 
The Craig Agency 

Farmers Supply Co. 
Flagg Grain Co. 

C.R. Anthony Co. 

First State Bank 
Seale Florist 

Western Auto 
W&C Grain, Inc. 

George Real Estate 
J&R Paint & Body Shop 
AAA Flying Service, Inc. 

Hance Gulf Service 
George's Exxon Station 

Hi-Plains Savings & Loan 
Justice Real Estate, Inc. 

Dimmitt Motor Co. 
Vardell Fuels 

Cluck Fertilizer 
Dimco Industries, Inc. 

Dimmitt Appliance Center 
Dimmitt Car Wash 

Dimmitt Printing Co. 
Dimmitt Welding & Electric 

Flagg Gin Co., Inc. 
Carlile Theater 

Ivey Insurance & Real Estate 
Jerry's Automotive & Machine 

Nellie Janes 
Ruskin Racquet Club, Inc. 
Les Clary, Southland Life 

Wilson Real Estate 
Wright's Auto Center 

Five Point Gin 
Dimmitt 66, Inc. 

Dairy Queen 
A&H Supply 

Pizza Hut 
Cobb's 
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d4etiaiti 5" SNACKING 

SOUP CUPS / 

99C 
 

MR. COFFEE II 
10 cup BOXED 

ENVELOPES 

FIRESIDE COOKIES 
$1999  

MR.COFFEE' Chocolate, Vanilla and Peanutbutter 

Cremes 

3 .99c 

4 for99c 
SUPERLECTRIC 

PORTABLE HEATERS 

EKCO METAL 
PAPER TOWEL 
HOLDER 

99C 

$1488  COCA COLA 
in lightweight plastic 

bottles 

67.6 oz. 

igt 000.,,r4  

3 pc. 
Measuring scoops, 

Cereal bowl, Juice \ 
strainer & ice cube 
trays 99c 

3 for  

STACKABLE 
TRAYMATES 

99C. 

QUAKER STATE 
MOTOR OIL 

Eliminates wasted 
drawer space 2 for 99C 

WASH CLOTHS TG&Y LATEX 
asst. colors 	

ll  WALL PAINT  

327 

gal. 	+4,  

HOUSE PAINT 

BIC & CRICKET 
LIGHTERS 

far$100  

T J3r 
FABRIC SHOPS 

341kt. -411F,A7 

$497  gal. 
THIS WEEK'S Fabric 

aLcr Featuring: 
Favorite Fabrics 
for Fall Fashions 

2 for$1°° 
SCOTT 
PAPER TOWELS 

53c  per roll 	TG&Y 
FACIAL TISSUE 

2 for 88` 

POSTER 
BOARD 

4 for$1 

Polyester 

Doubleknit 
SHOP EARLY 

Now is the time 

to get those 

toys in Lay Away 

for Christmas 

WRAP UP VZ.Jcp.  TiRDFi?BE;with
er d

w%derfil 

Assorted 100% polyester doublednits 58/60" 
wide, lets you make carefree, affordable outfits. 
Mix and match with almost everything. A huge 
selection of colors and patterns. 

COSMETIC PUFFS 
300 ct. 

Reg. $157  

$1 27,  

2 $1 w 

WET LOOK 
PLANTER 

99` 

TIDE LAUNDRY 
DETERGENT 

BLANK TAPE 
CASSETTES 

Mini Bouquet 
Floral Dress Prints 

44/45" wide - 50% polyester 50% 
Avril machine wash, worm tumble dry. 

3 pk. 99C 

Butterfly 
Lining 

2,r).75Toiel7.1.°C1tYre:sT 

Reg. 1.39 Yd. 

DRIP DRY HANGER 0 	Just Calico 

Dress Prints 

49 oz. 
100% Cotton, 44/ 5" wide For 	ar,c 
comfortable outfits 

$ 1 

set of 6 

2 for$1°°/  

30 wt. 

limit 6 

112 S. Bdwy. 	 Dimmitt, Texas 	 Phone 6474440 

Store Hours: Mon.-Fri. 8:30 a.m. to 8:00 p.m. 	Sat. 8:30 a.m. to 9:00 p.m. 

SPECIALS GOOD THRU SATURDAY OCT. 21, 1978 
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