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Winning: Weekly Newspaper

Our sister newspapers In the 
county seat are having trouble 
with the law. It seems that the 
backshop crew, when they go 
for coffee twice a day, have been 
in the habit of pitching coins 
at a crack in the sidewalk to 
see who pays for the drinks.

Well, they got caught Monday 
morning. Coleman Police Chief 
Raymond Graves was on stake­
out In front of the newspaper of­
fice, operating on a tip that 
gambling was going on there­
abouts. After observing the wild 
gambling, as the printers tossed 
their coins at the line, he order­
ed such scandalous and illegal 
proceedings to stop forthwith. 
Can’t have gambling going on In 
Coleman, he said.

We feel good, knowing that 
the morals of Coleman are being 
so well protected.

—0—
Speaking of gambling, if Chief 

Graves wants to arrest gamblers, 
he should put every farmer in 
the County in jail. If farming 
Isn’t the biggest gamble around, 
we don’t know what is. Makes 
Las Vegas look like a church 
social.

—0—
We are considering holding a 

stock reduction sale at our ken­
nels. We have had three litters 
of beagle puppies since June 1 
(we haven’t had them personal­
ly, you understand, but some of 
our female beagles did). In fact, 
we were selling a puppy a week 
ago last Monday, to some people 
from San Antonio, and congra­
tulating ourselves on reducing 
our puppy population by one, 
when we happened to notice that 
another female beagle was hav­
ing four more puppies while we 
were selling the one.

This makes it very difficult 
to keep up on the Inventory.

We wonder if there is a con' 
nection between tile and bea­
gles. A couple of months ago, 
we sold one of our pups to the 
Bob Marklands, and Bob, as you 
know, is connected with the 
Santa Anna Tile Company. And 
now we have sold one of these 
new pups to Bill Baker, from 
San Angelo, who is connected 
with the Monarch Tile Company 
in that city.

There was a loud explosion In 
the back room over at Phillips 
Drug the other day. Doc Barker 
came staggering out, singed and 
smoked, with his glasses shat­
tered and his jacket in shreds.

“Please, lady,” he said to his 
customer, “Have Doctor Henner 
write out that prescription again. 
And this time, tell him to print 
It.”

Well, we don’t have any more 
to report this week on the who- 
Is-the-oldest - person - llving-ln - 
Sbnta-Anna-Now-who-was-bom 
-here controversy. Our under­
cover agent hasn’t been able to 
get the lady who now claims the 
title to reveal her actual age 
yet.

We are still working on it. May 
call in James Bond before Its 
over.

Kenneth Mlnyard, who spends 
some of his time around the of­
fice here, officially claims to be 
the oldest native of Georgia now 
living in Santa Anna.

According to a study recently 
completed by a psychologLsit, 
newspaper workers have the 
highest level of anxiety of any 
profession tested. Before he 
got around to checking on the 
members of the press, the high­
est anxiety levels he found had 
belonged to Navy frogfmen and 
student pilots.

The only thing we don’t un 
derstand is why it took a phy- 
chologist to figure that out. Any­
one could have discovered this 
fact by dropping by a newspaper 
office while the staff was trying 
to get out the paper, and the 
press had broken down, and the 
Linotype machine had jammed, 
and six salesmen were trying 
to see the publisher, and 12 cred­
itors were doing likewise, and 
four and a half advertisers were 
wanting to change the copy in 
their ads after they were already 
made up, and a lady couldn’t un­
derstand why the story about the 
engagement of her great grand­
niece seven times removed 
couldn’t be given the place of 
honor on the front page, and 
the paper dn which the news­
paper is printed hadn't arrived 
and the trucking company 
couldn’t locate it, and a frog 
had Jumped in the barrel of 
printing ink and couldn't be re­
moved.

Anxious? Who, us?

We saw Smokey Moseley, from 
Plggly Wiggly, coming out of the 
bank the other day with a paper 
sack under his arm. Guess with 
prices the way they have been 
the last few weeks, they have to 
keep the meat in the bank vault 
nowadays.
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Two Local Physicians Leave This 
Week For Colorado Surgery Study

Two of Santa Anna’s three 
medical doctors are leaving this 
week, and by coincidence, both 
are going to the same Colorado 
hospital.

Both Dr, R. W. McMullen, who 
has been on the staff of Santa 
Anna Hospital, and Dr. John 
Murrell, who has operated Cen­
tral Medical Clinic here, are go­
ing to Cltolorado State Hospital,

Construction Lag* 
Causes Tile Layoff

The Santa Anna Tile Plant has 
temporarily laid off “ 10 or 11 
men” according to Roy Home, 
manager.

The layoff is a temporary 
reaction to a slump In construc­
tion, which is reflected In a 
smaller demand for building 
tile, Horne said. The University 
of Texas Bureau of Business Re­
search reports that building au­
thorizations in the state dropped 
13 percent last month, to the 
second lowest level for any 
month In the last year.

“This is a temporary layoff, 
such as we have in this business 
from time to time,” Horne said, 
“And we will offer these em­
ployees their jobs back when 
business picks up, if they havn’t 
already found other employ­
ment.”

Horne also pointed out that 
Imports are hurting the tile 
industry in the United States. 
Due to lower labor costs, Ja­
panese tile can be produced and 
imported Into this country at 
such a low price as to deprive 
the domestic manufacturers of a 
large part of their market. Im­
port duties on this building ma­
terial has fallen more than 50 
percent over the past few years, 
allowing the cheaply produced 
foreign tile to imdersell the tile 
made in this country. Efforts of 
the industry to have import du­
ties raised to their previous 
level, allowing domestic produ­
cers to operate on a more com­
petitive basis, have so far been 
imsuccessful. Home said.

where they will be serving resi­
dencies in surgery.

Dr. McMullen, who has been 
associated with the Santa Anna 
Hospital since January of 1960, 
left this week for Pueblo, Colo­
rado, to begin the surgical resi­
dency, accompanied by Mrs. 
McMidlen, and their children, 
Ronnie, Denny, and Jerry.

Dr. McMullen served three 
years In China and four years 
in the Congo, as a medical mis­
sionary, barely escaping each 
time when Communists took 
over the country, a spokesman 
for Santa Anna Hospital told 
The News.

Dr. Charles Henner, medical 
head of Santa Anna Hospital, 
has been working for the past 
year to assist Dr. McMullen in 
obtaining a residency of this 
tiype, which is required of a 
doctor to advance in any of the 
specialized fields of medicine. Dr. 
Henner said that although he 
hated losing Dr. McMullen from 
the staff of Santa Anna Hospi­
tal, he was glad that he had re­
ceived the opportunity for this 
very important advanced train­
ing.

Dr. Murrell, who came to 
Santa Anna in December of 
1960, was first associated with 
Santa Anna Hospital and then 
opened the (Central Medical 
Clinic in February of 1962. He 
will leave for Pueblo, Colorado, 
on Thursday. MSrs. Murrell and 
the three Murrell children, Tony, 
18, Tommy, 16, and Kenny, 10, 
will remain in Santa Anna until 
Tony completes the summer 
term at Howard Payne College, 
in Brownwood.

Progress is being made in 
obtaining a doctor to fill the 
vacancy on the staff of Santa 
Anna Hospitl, but nothing defi­
nite has been decided at this 
time, according to a spokesman 
for the Hosptal.

Mr. and Mrs. Wayne Watson 
and children, Donnie, David, and 
Gary, and Mirs. Chick Watson of 
Irving, were visitors in the W. E. 
Vanderford h<xne Saturday 
night.

Operation Headstart Gets Underway 
Here With 30 New Students Enrolled

Operation Headstart got off to 
a successful start here this week, 
with 25 preschoolers enrolled 
the first day. By Thursday, the 
total had grown to 30.

Purpose of the four week pro­
middle of the morning, lunch is

Local Masons Install 
New Officers Recently

Thursday, June 24, was install­
ation date for Santa Anna’s 
Mountain Lodge number 661, 
AF&AM.

The joint installation cere­
mony took place in Coleman, and 
included Atoka, Gouldbusk, and 
Voss Masonic chapters as well as 
those from Santa Anna and 
Coleman.

Local officers installed include: 
James Martin, worshipful mas­
ter; Paul Pembroke, senior war­
den; Floyd Smith, junior war­
den; Ben Vinson, treasurer; D. 
H. Moore, secretary; H. A. Bur­
den, senior deacon; Jake Mc- 
CTreary, junior deacon; Cullen 
Perry, chaplain; Roy West, sen­
ior steward; J. T. Avants, junior 
steward; and Roy Bledsoe, tiler.

Winners Announced 
In Store Contest

Winners in the contest spon­
sored by the Ladies Shop, of 
Santa Anna, during their recent 
sale, were announced this week

First place winner was Margie 
Martin, who took home the bed­
room suite. Other winners, in or­
der, were: Eva Nell Benge (din­
ette set), Lawanda Horner 
(rocker), Linda Homer ($25.00 
gift certificate), Janet Gray 
($20.00 gift certificate), Billie 
Guthrie (table lamp). Ruby 
Pritchard ($10.00 gift certifí­
cate), Mrs. Cladence Smith $7.50 
(gift certificate), Mrs. Denny 
Densman ($5.00 gift certificate), 
and Amelia DeLeon (three pair 
of dress hose).

gram is to prepare children who 
will be starting school for the 
first time this fall. Originally 
developed nationally as a pro­
gram for underprivileged child­
ren, Operation Headstart was 
adapted by local school officials 
of the Santa Anna Independent 
School TTistrict as a program for 
all children, to prepare them 
for the start of their academic 
career.

Taught by Mrs. Martha Perry 
and Mrs. B. A. Parker, the pro­
gram in Santa Anna uses three 
rooms in the Santa Anna Ele­
mentary School. One of these 
is designated as the work room, 
where the children paint, color, 
and begin to be initiât^ into 
the mysteries of reading and 
numbers. The play room con­
tains material of all types for 
fun, and the music room is used 
for the musical portion of the 
program.

There is a milk break in the 
served at noon, and more milk is

Two More Streets 
Now Being Paved

Two more blocks of Santa An­
na’s city streets are in the pro­
cess of being paved this week. 
The 200 block of Avenue C being 
paved, continuing the pavement 
on Avenue C, which pavement 
begins near the baseball field 
and continues for three blocks 
until it reaches the block being 
paved.

Also getting the hardtop treat 
ment this week is one block of 
Banister Street immediately east 
of the housing project in south­
east Santa Anna.

Santa Anna is widely recog­
nized as having the highest per 
centage of paved streets of smy 
city in Texas, bar none. This 
week’s additions to the paved 
streets of the city is calculated 
to keep the Moimtain City in the 
lead.

Attend church regularly.

served in the afternoon.
In addition to the regular acti­

vities, tours and field trips are 
being planned for the students.

Operation Headstart is sche­
duled to last four weeks here, 
winding up on Friday, July 23.

Most Businesses To 
Close On Monday

Most businesses in Santa Anna 
plan to be closed on Monday, 
July 5, in recognition of Inde­
pendence Day, July 4, which 
comes on Svinday this year.

Most retail stores, and civic, 
utility, and business offices will 
be closed Monday. Among those 
that informed The News that 
they will be closed Monday are 
the City offices, the Chamber of 
Commerce office, Santa Anna 
National Bank, Bailey Lumber 
Company, G&E Hardware, White 
Variety Store, the Ladies Shop, 
Hosch Grocery, Hosch Furniture 
Store, The Santa Anna News, 
Santa Anna insurance Agency, 
West Texas Utilities, Colemsin 
County Telephone Coop>erative, 
Ooleman Gas Company, Moore 
Mercantile, Western Auto Store, 
Bobby’s Beauty Salon, Sam Col­
lier Insurance Agency, and Plg­
gly Wiggly.

All of the service stations in 
Santa Anna plan to stay open 
Monday, as do both the Clo­
ver Grill and the Steak House. 
Harvey Grocery, Brown’s Gro­
cery and Williams Grocery will 
also be open Monday.

Phillips Drug Store will be 
open until noon on Monday.

Mail will be placed in the 
Post Office boxes in Santa Anna 
Post Office, but windows will not 
be open Monday, nor will there 
be route delivery that day.

Santa Anna Clinic will be 
closed Sunday, but will be open 
as usual on Monday.

TV CABLE PROGRESSES
Progress is being made toward 

placing in operation the new 
television cable service for Santa 
Anna.

Two antennae, which went 
astray between the time they 
were ordered and the time they 
were supposed to have arrived, 
have finally been installed on 
the tower atop the western por­
tion of Santa Anna Mountain.

Next step in the process of

CABLE TELEVISION is fast be­
coming a reality here, as Max 
Eubank makes an adjustment 
on the antenna tower, which will 
be about 110 feet high when ex­
tended. In the photo on the 
right is the culprit that caused 
the delay, one of two antennae 
that went astray in shipment. 
Note the grid that elimates all 
unwanted signals.

furnishing Santa Anna viewers 
with clear. Interference-free 
ttelevlsion reception is the instal­
lation of amplifiers and other 
transmission equipment needed 
to insure a uniform signal to 
all sets in town. It is expected 
that connection of subscribers 
will begin in about one week.

Community antenna television 
cable service provides one very 
high antenna, with necessary 
filtering and amplifying equip­
ment, needed to obtain an ex­
cellent television picture, with­
out interference, “snow’ ’, fad­
ing, and other troubles that 
plague television reception in 
fringe areas. Because of the 
expense involved, m(*)b indi­
vidual home television viewers 
could not afford to install re­
ceiving apparatus required to ob­
tain such results. But with a

community antenna system, with 
many subscribers paying a small 
amount for the service, one in­
stallation can be built that will 
provide this typ>e of high quality 
signal to the sets of all users. 
These community systems are 
installed in localities in which 
distance from transmitting faci­
lities, or geographical features, 
prevent reception of a strong 
signal with conventional anten­
na systems. Santa Anna suffers 
from both problems, being locat­
ed quite some distance from the 
nearest transmitters, and being 
below Santa Anna Mountain, 
which blocks off the signal from 
these transmitters to a large 
extent.

Santa Anna will be the only 
city of its size in Texas with its 
own community television cable 
system.

Contractors are preparing the 
system for the connection of in­
dividual subscribers at the pre­
sent time. This Involves instal­
ling .small amplifiers at various 
locations around town, and ad­
justing these amplifiers so that 
all the sets served receive a 
strong, well modulated signal.

When these preparations are 
complete, individual subscribers 
will be coiuiected. Max Eubank, 
who is installing the system, es­
timates that it will take about 
two weeks to hook up everyone 
now subscribing to the system.

The initial reception on the 
community antenna system will 
be on three channels, channel 8 
(San Angelo), channel 9 (Abi­
lene), and channel 12 (Sweet­
water). This will provide viewers 
with reception from all three na­
tional television networks.

Possibilities, still in the fu­
ture, include reception of other 
channels, and the addition of 
facilities for FM radio reception. 
FM radio signals have about 
the same carrying ability as do 
television signals, and an an­
tenna system is needed for this 
typ>e of interference-free radio 
reception.

Eubank says that about 40 
subscribers have already signed 
up for the new service, with 
quite a few more expected as 
soon as the system is ready to 
go.

The community antenna pro­
vides both color and black and 
white reception, Eubank said.

Any persons Interested in sub­
scribing to the new television 
service can contact Eubank at 
Post Office Box 162, Santa Anna, 
or call him at FI 8-3413.
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Rockwood News
B7 MRS. JOHN C. HUNTER

Orchids to Mr. Parker and the 
staff of the Santa Anna News 
for first place award In Texas 
State Newspaper competition.

Recent guests with Mi-s. A. L. 
Crutcher were Mrs. Mena Shu- 
ford on Wednesday afternoon, 
Mrs. Joe A. Hodges and children 
of Coleman Friday morning, and 
Mrs. J. A. Hunter Sunday morn­
ing.

Mrs. BUI Rehm took her dad, 
N. J. Buttry to San Antonio last 
Wednesday for an eye checkup. 
Boss Estes accompanied them.

Mr. and Mrs. WendeU Rehm of 
Snyder visited Friday night to 
Simday with Mrs. Rehm and Mr. 
Buttry.

Visiting Sunday morning with 
Mrs. Kate Mcllvain were Oral 
McGiU and Billy of Houston and 
Miss Carol3m Wllliauns of Pstssa- 
dena and Donald WUliams of 
Brownwood.

Mrs. Rodney Dean is with her 
father at Medical Arts Hospi­
tal in Brownwood. He suffered 
a severe heart attack recently. 
Mr. Dean, Beth, Roddy, Linda 
and Rocky spent Saturday night 
at Brownwood Lake at the Dean 
and Stepheixson family reunion 
and visited Sunday at the hospi­
tal with Mr. Fellers, who is im­
proving.

Special Pre-Rodeo

HORSE SALE
Saturday, July 10,1965

Double C Riding Club Arena 
Coleman —  7:30 p.m.

TO SALE: Grade And 
Registered Horses

Parade Horses 
Roping Horses 
Barrel! Horses 
Bucking Horses 
Ranch Horses

Welcome Consignments

$1.00 PO 5% COMMISSION

COLONEL JAMES ALLEN & 
ASSOCIATES

Route 2 Santa Anna, Texas
Telephone Fireside 8-3104

SCOTTIE STAMPS 
Low Food Prices

Round Carton - Gandy’s Best

ICE CREAM Vi gal. 690
BISCUITS, Dotties 4 cans 290
Golden Brand

MARGARINE solid Ib. 19 ^
Gandy’s

BUTTERMILK Vz gal. 39e
Decker’s Quality, Sliced

BACON Ib. 690
California Long White

POTATOES 8Ib.bag 79 0
Fresh, Large, Firm

TOMATOES Ib. 19 ^
star Kist, Chunk, Light

TUNA 2 cans 69^
Libby’s 303 Can

CORN 2 for
Libby’s

VIENNA SAUSAGE Scans 59^
Fresh, Lean

HAMBURGER lb. 390
Decker’s All Meat

FRANKS lb. 490
Double Scottie Stamps Every Wednesday

We Will Be Closed All Day Monday, July 5th

Hosch Grocery

Mr. and Mrs. Edwin Fowler of 
Coleman visited Friday after­
noon with Mrs. Rosa BeUe HeU- 
man. Mrs. Fowler of Coleman 
visited Monday.

Mr. and Mrs. Junior Brusen- 
han and children were visiting in 
Brownwood Father’s Day with 
her parents, Mr. and Mrs. R. 
W. Emerson and met Loretta 
Broadway, who had been visiting 
relatives in Jacksonville.

Mr. and Mrs. Brusenhan, Judy 
and Jodie were again visiting 
in Brownwood on Tuesday of last 
week.

Miss Mary Broadway and Miss 
Judy Counts of Fort Worth 
visited Monday to Thursday with 
her family, the Brusenhans.

Judy Brusenhan spent Fri­
day night with Serena Bryan.

Sunday dinner guest in the 
Brusenhan home were Mr. and 
Mrs. Frank Brusenhan of Eden 
and grandson, Mike Spiser of 
San Antonio, Mrs. Mary Brusen­
han and Joe McCreary.

Monday guest with the Bru­
senhans were Mrs. Bill Polk and 
Candy of Salt Gap and two 
granddaughters, Linda and Jan 
Atkinson of San Antonio.

Guests Sunday with Mr. and 
Mrs. J. A. Hunter were Mr. and 
Mrs. J. W. Himter of Coleman 
and Mr. and Mrs. Tommy Briscoe 
and children of Waldrip Friday 
evening; Mr. and Mrs. Don Hun­
ter of Brownwood Saturday. 
They all visited Saturday even­
ing with Mr. and Mrs. J. W. Hun­
ter for ice creami and cake. The 
J. A. Hunters visited with Mr. 
and Mrs. James Hunter and Jim­
my at Coleman Sunday. Jimmy 
spent Monday night with his 
grandparents.

Mr. and Mrs. R. J. Deal were 
Friday supper guests with Mr.

and Mrs. C. A. Poe in Abilene. 
Other guests were Mr. and Mrs. 
Johnny R. Deal and Mr. and 
Mrs. Gene Deal, Mr. and Mrs. 
Johnny Deal are moving to Den­
ver, Colorado. They also visited 
Mrs. W. R. McMinn.

Mr. and Mrs. Deal were in 
Fort Stockton Sunday and Mon­
day visiting Mr. and Mrs. Rolan 
Deal and children. Patsy had 
been in a hospital with an in­
fected foot and the recent storm 
had damaged Rolan’s crop and 
blown outbuildings away.

Visiting briefly in the Deal 
home Sunday morning were Leo 
Deal of Brownwood, Mr. and 
Mrs. W. F. Deal of Gouldbusk 
and Mr. and Mrs. Jeff McSpad- 
den of Odessa.

Elon Cheatham and son, Wal­
ton, of San Antonio visited Fri­
day to Sunday with Mr. and Mrs. 
Claud Box.

Mrs. Claud Box, Cemetery As­
sociation secretary, reports with 
appreciation the following con­
tributions: Mrs. Bruce Snod­
grass, $5.00; Mrs. Gussle Wise, 
$5.00; Mrs. Bill Polk, $4.00; John 
X. Steward, $5.00; ]Mrs. Mena 
Shuford, $5.00; Mrs. Nettie 
Blackwell, $6.00; Mrs. Bird White, 
$3.00; T. A. Hodges, $5.00; Evan 
Wise, $5.00.

Mr. and Mrs. Roger Dudley of 
Ozona visited Thursday to Satur­
day with Mr. and Mrs. M. A. 
Richardson. Mr. and Mrs. G. 
B. Ph?nlx and Cindy of Crane 
and Mr. and Mrs. Ronald Cooper 
of Snyder visited Friday and 
they all attended the Richard- 
son-Lowrance wedding in Cole­
man. Mr. and Mrs. R. A. Milli­
gan visited the Richardsons Sun­
day afternoon.

Saturday afternoon Mrs. L. L. 
Bryan visited Mr. nd Mrs. Leffel

Estes and family. Bill 
Santa Anna and Mr. and Mrs. 
Boss Estes were Saturday guests. 
Mr. and Mrs. Cecil Day and boys 
of Coleman were Saturday sup­
per guests. _   ̂  ,

Mr and ^rs. Matt Estes and 
Geneva visited Mrs. Alex Conner 
in Santa Anna Sunday after­
noon.

Mrs. John Kemp or Santa 
Anna and Mrs. John Huriter 
spent Friday night and Saturday 
with Mrs. Letrlce Benedict and 
Miss Eimice Coffee in Temple. 
Visiting with Mrs. Uless 
and Mrs. Ora Caldwell at the 
Memorial Hospital and wlto ^ y  
Stafford at the Medical Arts 
Hospital enroute home. TOey 
also visited with Lee McMU- 
lan at the V. A. Hospital in 
Temple. Mrs. W. M. Holland of 
Talpa spent Monday with Mrs. 
John Hunter.

Mrs. Donald R. Hunter, a re­
cent bride, will be honored with 
a miscellaneous shower at the 
Community Center, Saturday, 
July 3, at 2:30 p.m. Hostesses are 
Mrs. Lester Bryan, Mrs. Jack 
McSwane, Mrs. Curtis Bryan, 
Mrs. John Hunter, Mrs. Joe Wise, 
Mrs. Bert Fowler.

Mr. and Mrs. Miller Box, Mrs. 
Doyle Stanford and Julie of 
Fort Worth spent the week­
end at their home here.

Mr. and Mrs. Bill Mueller and 
children of San Antonio spent 
the weekend with Mr. and Mrs. 
Evan Wise.

Evan Wise and Polley Wise left 
Sunday for the coast, fishing. 
Mrs. Evan Wise will visit their 
daughters and families in San 
Antonio.

Mr. and Mrs. Talmadge Cald­
well and son of Houston spent

Saturday and Sunday wth Ray 
Caldwell. Mrs. Caldwell remained 
for a longer visit.

Mr. and Mrs. Jessie Eckles and 
Dawn and Mrs. Gussie Wise of 
San Angelo spent Saturday with 
Mr. and Mrs. Jim Rutherford and 
children.

Randy Estes of Abilene spent 
the week with Mr. and Mrs. Matt 
Estes, who took him home Wed­
nesday and spent the night.

Mr. and Mrs. Pat Patterson 
and children of Irving spent the 
weekend with Mr. and Mrs. Bill 
Steward.

Mrs. Rosa Belle Heilman was 
Sunday dinner guest with Mr. 
and Mrs. Bert Fowler and fam­
ily.

Mrs. Lee Miller, Mrs. Clarence 
Davenport and Mrs. Betty Hob­
son and children of Coleman 
visited with Linnie Box Sunday 
afternoon.

Mr. and Mrs. Hilton Wise left 
Sunday for Austin to visit Mr. 
and Mrs. Joe Riley, then to Ft. 
Forth to visit daughters and 

' families.

 ̂ Mrs. Lon Gray gave the book 
! report for the Mission Study, 
titled: “Go Home and Tell,” and 
Mrs. Henry Smith conducted the 
business session when the Wo- 

' man’s Missionary Society met 
' at the Rockwood Baptist Church 
¡Monday afternoon.
I The regular social will be held 
at the Community Center, Mon­
day, July 5, at 2:30 p.m. Hos­
tesses are Mrs. Evan Wise and 
Mrs. Bill Steward.

1 Members present were Mrs. 
Gray, Mrs. Smith, Mrs. A. L. 
King, Mrs. Bill Bryan and Mrs. 
Matt Estes.

Attend church regularly.

WHO B A T S  F I R S T  ? ?

THE CHURCH POR ALL
ALL POR THE CHURCH

The Churdi ia the greateat factor 
on earth for the building o f charao* 
ter and good dtizenahip. It ia a ttore- 
houae of apiritual values. Without a 
strong Churdi, neither democracy 
nor civilization can survive. There 
are four sound reasons why every 
person should attend services regu> 
larly and support the Church. They 
are: (1 ) For his own sake. (2 ) For 
his children’s sake. (3 ) For the sake 
of his community and nation. (4 ) 
For the sake of the Church itself, 
whidi needs his moral and material 
support. Plan to go to church regu> 
larly and read your Bible daily.

Part of playing any game ia to learn how to settle the inevitable aigu- 
ments. In a league in whidi nobody has a coin to toss, this ia the time- 
honored method foi'^getting I2ie game started without a squabble.

But there are other games tO be played, ih other leagues. Life for each 
of us brings many occasions for conflict And they don’t all yield to simple 
techniques like twirling a bat around one’s shoulders with just a couple 
of fingers.

Earnest Christians believe that our faith can point men to the right 
attitude and action in times of stress.

That’s why, as we face the conflicts of life, we always hope the other 
fellow will behave like a Christian. And he’s hoping as much o f us.

Why not meet him in Church next Sunday? That’s where right attitudes 
often begin.

Copyright 196S Ktitttr AdvortUng Sonnet, Ine., Strxuhurg, Va.
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9:33^1
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Saturday 
I Timothy 

6:3-10

Bob Turner’s
310 Commercial Coleman

W ylie’s Flowers
For All Your Floral Needs

R. T. Caperton 
Chevrolet-Cadillac

1400 Commercial Coleman

Phillips Drug Store
Your Hometown Druggist

Coleman Butane 
Gas Company

Gerald Swann, Owner

Santa Anna 
Cooperative Gin

For A Better Santa Anna

Rio Poco Kennels
Home Of All-Round Beagles

McKee Cleaners
Where Cleaning Is An Art

Hosch Funeral Home
Santa Anna

Santa Anna 
Medical Center

And Ranger Park Inn

Clark Auto Parts 
Supply

108 East Pecan Coleman

Radio Station KSTA
Serving Coleman County At 

1000 On The Dial

Mountaineer 
Recreation Center

Santa Anna

Coleman Gas 
Company

Serv’ing Coleman County

Santa Anna 
Lumber Company

For All Your Lumber Needs

Santa Anna 
Insurance Agency

Insurance
In All Its Branches

Poco, Incorporated
Helping To Build 

Santa Anna

Coleman County 
State Bank

Full Service Banking
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Shields News
By MRS. E. S. JONES

Sunday, Larry Moore, minis­
ter of the Church of Christ was 
guest of Mr. and Mrs. Doyle Ep- 
pler and Dwight.

Visitors Sunday with Mr, and 
Mrs. Bert Fowler were Mr. and 
Mrs. John McClelland of New 
Braunfels, and Mrs. Rosa Hell- 
man of Rockwood.

Mr. and Mrs. Dock Skelton and 
Mr. and Mrs. Varrell McClain 
and girls attended the McClain 
family reimion at Riverside Park, 
Brownwood, on Sunday.

Mrs. A. D. Eppler and Mrs. E. 
S. Jones were in Coleman Mon­
day and visited with Mr. and 
Mrs. Roy Bledsoe.

Visitors during the week with 
Mr. and Mrs. Bill Price were Miss 
Alma Hardin of Dallas, Mr. and 
Mrs. Earl Woodard of Cache, 
Oklahoma, and Mr. and Mrs. 
Audie Woodard of Bakersfield. 
California.

Carol Ann Scarborough of 
Enid, Oklahoma, was a visitor for 
Simday School at the Baptist 
Church.

Mr. and Mrs. G. C. McDonald 
visited in Santa Anna with Mr. 
and Mrs. Cecil Stovall on Thurs­

day.
Mr. and Mrs. Howard Bivins 

and Joe Lynn of Clearfield, Utah, 
visited during the week in the 
Otis Bivins home.

Mr. and Mrs. Aubrey Scar­
borough were in Brownwood 
Sunday to see Leonard Williams, 
a patient in Medical Arts Hospi­
tal and Leonard is improving.

Leta McClure who is attend­
ing San Angelo State College 
spent the weekend with home 
folks.

Mrs. Lee Tatum of Santa Anna 
spent several days last week with 
W. T. Stewardson and family.

Mrs. Otis Bivins and Mrs. 
i Duane Bivins were business visi­
tors in Abilene on Monday.

Mr. Gus Hines of Marshall, 
Texas, visited during the past 
week with Mr. and Mrs. Bert 
Turney.

Mr. Oscar Lovelady spent Wed­
nesday and Thursday in the Bert 
Turney home and visited also 
with Mr. Hines.

Mr. Zack Bible and daughter, 
Mrs. Willie (Juanita) Branch of

9 8 ^ T a b le
An assortment Of Materials 

Regularly Priced $1.98 per yd And Up

One Table Lace W as $1.29 
Red Carpet Special 79c A  yd.

OTHER LACES REDUCED  
ACCORDINGLY

ESTELLES LADIES SHOP

Houston spent the weekend in 
their home here and attended 
the Bible family reunion at Bra­
dy Park Sunday. Mr. Bible has 
been in Houston several weeks 
and has had medical care while 
there. Mrs. Bible has also had 
medical care, but was unable to 
come home. Juanita returned to 
Houston Sunday afternoon, but 
Mr. Bible remained in his home 
here.

Mr. and Mrs. Rex Turney and 
children, Mark and Becky, of 
Santa Anna were Sunday dinner 
guests with his parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Bert Turney. Becky was 
Just returning home following 
two weeks visit with her grand­
parents, Mr. and Mrs. Alfred 
Bible in Killeen.

Mr. Dave Shields of Cross 
Plains and Calvin Shields spent 
Sunday afternoon with their 
brother, Sammie Shields.

Mr. and Mrs.'Darwin Lovelady 
and Randel were shopping in 
Brownwood Saturday afternoon 
and visited with Mrs. Audry Pal- 
vado.

Mr. and Mrs. Hilary Ruther­
ford and children of Coleman 
sp>ent Saturday with Tom Ruth­
erford and Lynda.

Mr. and Mrs. Aaron Avants 
were in Christoval Sunday at­
tending the Aavnt reunion. They 
reported all Aaron Avants’ fam­
ily present and all Mrs. Mary 
Avants’ children, grandchildren 
and in laws, unless one grand­
son in law was not present. They 
reported a nice day, lots of food 
and people.

Mr. and Mrs. Forrest Deal of 
Mozellc and Mrs. Deal’s sister, 
Mr. and Mrs. Jeff McSpadden of 
Odessa, visited briefly with Sam­
mie Shields Sunday morning, 
and also went to the Whon Ce­
metery.

Mr. Fred Shields did some aw­
fully good work last week in the 
Whon Cemetiery. It is in real 
good condition now.

Mr. Oscar Lovelady visited in 
Santa Anna with Guy and Alta 
Lovelady Simday.

Mr. and Mrs. Greham Fitzpat­
rick were in Eden Thursday af­
ternoon attending memorial ser­

vices for Mrs. Fitzparick’s aunt, 
a sister of Mr. Snowden. Our 
sympathy to the bereaved.

Mr. and Mrs. Floyd Morris vis­
ited in Brownwood Saturday af­
ternoon with Mr. and Mrs. 
Johnie James and boys. A son, 
Darrell Ray James, will be leav­
ing this next week for his in­
duction into the Service for his 
country. This will be the second 
call from this family in about 
a three weeks period of time. ’The 
oldest James boy is now station­
ed at Ft. Polk, Louisiana.

Mrs. Dai’win Lovelady and son, 
Randel visited in the Thomas 
Switzer home ’Thursday p.m.

Mr. and Mrs. Joe Floyd Morris 
of Early, Mr. and Mrs. John Da­
vid Morris of Coleman were 
weekend guests in the home of 
the boy’s parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Floyd Morris and Jamie Lee.

Neil and Don Fitzpatrick have 
been active in rodeo parades 
during the past week. Both Ball­
inger and possibly Winter’s 
rodeos.

and Mrs. Hollis Keller and family 
of Cross Cut.

Steve and Phil Henderson of 
San Angelo are visiting .several 
weeks with their uncle, Hllburn 
Henderson, and Mrs. Hender­
son. Mr. and Mrs. Roy Hender­
son and girls of Hobbs, New Mex­
ico, and Mrs. Rosa Henderson 
spent Wednesday with the Hll­
burn Hendersons. Mr. and Mrs. 
Curtis Collins of the Leedy com­
munity were Sunday afternoon 
visitors.

Janice Martin and Sherrie 
Mclver attended G. A. Camp 
at Brownwood Lake last week.

Mr. and Mrs. W. A. Bolton of 
Dallas were Sunday dinner 
guests of her parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Robert Stearns. Mrs. Ray 
Wells and children of Coleman 
were Sunday afternoon visitors.

Mr. and Mrs. Elmer Woods 
and daughter, Jo Anna, of 
Brownwood were Saturday night 
visitors with Mr. and Mrs. Jack 
Dockery and John.

Mr. and Mrs. G. K. Stearns, 
Mr. and Mrs. John Haynes and

Trickham News
By Mrs. J. E. York 

Telephone DU2-3336

There will be a miscellaneous 
shower honoring Mr. and Mrs. 
Otis Wade Stephens at the Com­
munity Center, FYiday after­
noon at 3 p.m. All friends and 
relatives of the couple are in­
vited.

Little Mike James, son of Mr. 
and Mrs. Grady James of Fort 
Worth, is spending this week 
with his grandparents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Eugene James, while his 
parents and older brother are 
vacationing in California. Miss 
Sherril James is visiting at home 
with her parents and brother 
for a couple of weeks before go­
ing to Houston where she will 
be employed.

Recent visitors with Mr. and 
Mrs. Felton Martin and child­
ren were Mr. and Mrs. John 
Crawford of Goldthwaite, Mr. 
George Cox of Bryds and Mr.

Mr. and Mrs. H. B. Dockery were 
visitors in the Fred Haynes home 
during the weekend. Mr. Frank 
Wallace of Garland came after 
Mrs. Wallace and children who 
had spent last week here visiting 
her parents and brother. ’They 
returned to their home on Sun­
day.

Miss Jane Vaughan of San 
Antonio is spending this week 
with her uncle, Mr. and Mrs.

I Bill Vaughn.
I Debbie, Freddie and Billy Wal­
lace of Garland visited Satur- 
iday with Nikki York. ’The group 
i enjoyed games and a picnic, 
j Mr. and Mrs. Felton Martin 
:and children visited Sunday af­
ternoon with Mr. and Mrs. Ar­
thur Durtkchi at Brownwood 
Lake and enjoyed boating and 
skiing.

Mr. and Mrs. Doyle Mclver and 
son of Mansfield spent Sunday 
and Monday with his parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Grady Mclver. Mrs. 
Keetie Haynes of Santa Anna 
visited with them on Sunday.

Layaway Now For School
“DICKIES” Boy’s Sizes . . . .  $1.99 a pr.
“LEVIS” Boy’s S izes...............$2.98 a pr.

See The New Colors In Levis

Still Have Plenty Of Swim Suits

MOORE MERCANTH.E

TIME TO PAINT 
WE HAVE IT ! !
JONES B U IR  

SHERWIN-WILLIAMS 
STERLING PAINTS

Paints And Building Supplies For All 
Those Building And Repairing Jobs

Bailey Lumber 
Company

Phone FI 8-3891
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ODLV FIVE m TERRS!

Only five weekly newspapers of its size in all of Texas won first place awards in the Texas 
Press Association annual competition, and one of those five was THE SANTA ANNA NEWS. 
Competing against the largest number of entries, and against some of the finest newspapers 
in the state, THE NEWS was selected as first place award winner in the Column Writing com­
petition. And THE NEWS tied for first place in the General Excellence award contest.

Readers of THE SANTA ANNA NEWS know it contains a wealth of information, entertain­
ment, and news each week. Advertisers are fast discovering that THE NEWS delivers real 
readership for their advertising, delivers real results that pay off in more customers, more 
sales.

Put Your Money On A Winner

Santa Anna News
Coleman County’s Award Winning Newspaper
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CLASSIFIED ADVERTISING

CLASSIFIED ADVERTISING RATES
First Insertion — Per W ord___________________________4c
Each Additional Insertion — Per W ord________________ 2c

MINIMUM CHARGE — 50c PER WEEK 
COPY DEADUNE — 10:00 A. M. WEDNESDAYS

to suit YOU. Geo. D. Rhone 
Co., Coleman, Texas. 48tic.

FOR SALE: Several used TVs in 
good condition. Geo. D. Rhone 
Co., Coleman, Texas. 48tfc.

FOR SALE: Used Furniture and 
Antiques. W. M. Morgan, OOic 
South Houston, phone FI8- 
3802. 25tfc.

FOR SALE: Good used air con­
ditioners. Gray Mercantile 
Company of Texas, Coleman.

FOR SALE OR TRADE
FOR SALE: Good used refriger-

ators, automatic w a s h e r s, 
wringer washers, clothes dry­
ers and gas cook stoves. Terms

FOR SALE: 1955 Chevrolet that 
has been many a mile since 
it was put on market. Good 
engine, bad transmission, fair 
tires, clean Inside and out ex­
cept one fender. Will let It 
go for a measley $165.00. Ken

Be sure you are gettingr a quality roof by a reliable and 
qualified roofer. You are sure if you have a

15 YEAR BONDED ROOF
BY

SMITH ROOFING CO.
See Our ad In Your Phone Directorj'^

Call 643-4314 Collect Brownwood Free Estimates

Commercial and Residential Roofing 
All Types of Siding and Insulation

RED H O T 
and ROLLING!

NOVA SPORT COUPE

R. T . Copertoli Chevrolet-Cadilloc
1400 Commercial Ave. —  Phone 625-4145 —  Coleman, Texas
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There Is NO Question. . .
. . . about prompt service on loans (personal, business, car or home) when 

you need them . . . sound financial advice when you want it . . . references 
whenever required . . . when you make a banking connection with a FULL- 
SERVICTE bank like ours.

YOUR FRIENDLY

Santa Anna National Bank

Minyard, Santa Anna News, 
FI 8-3545 or 8-3453. ^

FOR SALE: Used Easy Spindryer 
wa.shlng machine. CTheap. 
Hosch Furniture Co.

F^r” saLE: Two litters of Beagle 
puppies sired by Williamson’s 
Sullmo Rocky, one of the great 
These pups are reasonably priced 
shwo Beagles in the US today, 
and carry the strongest guaran- 
kennels In the country. For a 
tee of good health made by any 
puppy you can be proud of, 
contact Rio Poco Kennels, 
FI8-3545, Santa Anna._________
FOR SALE: Second hand 8pc 

dining room suite. Hosch Fur­
niture Co.

FOR SALE: Ford 6 pickup truck. 
John Bray FI 8-3496. 25-26-27C

REAL ESTATE
FOR SALE: 168 acre farm. Con­
tact L. J. Clark or Jerry Clark.

22tfc

WANTED-TO BUY
WANTED: Live cottontail rab­

bits, uninjured and unharmed. 
Will pay from 50 cents to one 
dollar per rabbit, depending 
on size and condition. Con­
tact Bob Parker, Rio Poco 
Kennels, FI8-3545.

MISCELLANEOUS
IF YOU ARE thinking about 

Improving your home ask us 
for free estimates on the fol­
lowing: Insulation to make 
your home easier to heat and 
cool; all types of siding in­
cluding the new plastic, in­
sulated, asbestos and alum­
inum in lovely colors and 
quality roofing to top it all. 
Call 643-4314 Collect. Smith

Roofing Company, Brown 
Wood.

Marketing, P.O. Box 14049, st 
51tfc. Louis, Missouri 63178.

WHEN YOU THINK of p i f f l ­
ing, mixing and pelleting, 
think of Hollingsworth F e^  
Mill, Coleman, Texas SOtfe.

BEAGLES: Third most popular 
breed of dog In the US. Texas 
largest, bestknown producer of 
all-round beagles, for pets, hunt­
ing, show, and field trial. Cham­
pion stud service. Topbred pup­
pies avaUable. Rio Poco Kennels, 
FI8-3545, Post Office Box 697, 
Santa Anna.

BUSINESS OPPORTUNITIES
OPPORTUNITY

For a future with a well known 
Midwest Manufacturing Flrmi. 
We are now offering exclusive 
distributorships for a patented 
product. No competition. Factory 
trained personnel will assist you 
In setting up a tried and proven 
advertising and merchandising 
program. 100% mark up. Invest­
ment guaranteed. Minimum In­
vestment $1,000. Maximum $14,- 
000. All replies confidential. For 
information write Director of

CARD OF THANKS
I wish to thank my many 

friends for the cards, flowers 
gifts and visits to me while I was 
in the hospital at Temple and 
Coleman recently. Your thought­
fulness was very much appre­
ciated.

Mrs. L. O. Garrett 26p

We wish to express our deepest 
appreciation to our many friends 
for the shower at Rockwood, and 
to all others for contributions, 
food, and other kindnesses shown 
at the death of our loved one, 
and the loss of our home. May 
God bless each of you.

Mrs. L. L. Bryan and Ken­
neth. 26c

Dr. and Mrs. R. W. McMullen 
wish to thank their friends, for 
their friendship and patronage. 
We regret to say goodby, but Dr. 
McMullen is going to Colorado, 
to take post graduate training 
in surgery.

Dr. and Mrs. R. W. M)c- 
Mullen. 26p

STUDENT EMPLOYMENT DIRECTORY
The students with ads in this 

section are looking for summer 
emploj'ment. If you have any 
kind of work that these young 
people can do, please contact 
them. They will appreciate it, 
you will get a good worker, and 
you will help build a good future 
citizen. If you have any jobs for 
students open, call F18-3545, and 
'THE NEWS will run a classified 
ad stating your needs without 
charge to you.
SOPHOMORE GIRL, 15 years 
old, exjjerienced as waitress.

seeking any type of work such as 
babysitting, hospital work, clerk­
ing, etc. Willing to learn. Con­
tact Rita Kendon, 301 South 
Banister Street, F18-3661.
WORK WAN-TED: Would like to 
work as dishwasher, yardwork, 
grocery boy, or anything along 
that line. Contact Jimmy D. 
Bailey, 302 Crockett Street.
WANTED: Any kind of work. 
Yard work to farm work. Seven­
teen years old, has car, willing 
and dependable. Joe Rutherford, 
F18-3459.

— lij:zJ f= Jr= jr= jfr= u r= Jr= J r= Jr= Jr= J i= = ir= ir= Jr= :J r= ir= ip = ii

I
For A Lush Green Lawn 

See These Scotts Products

0
0

0

Member FDIC and Federal Reserve Bank of Dallas

0
0

0
0
0
00
0
0
0

0

0
0

00

Amazing Weed Control. This Scotts 
Product Will Rid Your Lawn Of 16 
Common Lawn Weeds.
2500
5000

Sq. Ft..................................$2.95
Sq. Ft..................................$5.75

Special on “Clout” by Scotts
Fertilizes Your Lawn And Controls 

Crabgrass All In One Application
i l l

SPECIAL NOW Reg. Now
2500 Sq. Ft. $3.95 $2.95
5000 Sq. Ft. $6.95 $4.95

Free Loan Of Spreader With The Purchase Of
Fertilizer

Scotts Haze Rose Protectant 
Effective In The Control of “Black Leaf Spots”

4 lb. Bag $3.95 —  Refill Cans $1.45
Applicator Reg. $14.95, Now $6.95 with Purchase of 

HAZE PROTECTANT

' S c o f m

75
Years In 

Xoleman J. E. Stevens Co.

W e Give And Redeem Gold Bond Stamps 
Member True Hardeware Stores

ÈSUC. -v-rf



Use the News want ads. They
get resTilts.

iß-
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USE
MiriED
CAS

I Clean and Safe

I Best For Heating

I  Higher BTU RatUig

I  Best For Cooking

i  Approved By 
Architects

S No Muss

S No Fuss

PHONE 625-2925 
Night Pho. 625-2849

Obituaries
BROWN

John S. Brown, 84, of Santa 
Anna, passed away Wednesday, 
June 23, in Santa Anna. Funeral 
services were held Friday, June 
25, at Stevens Memorial Chapel,

with Rev. Paul Smith, of Concho 
Baptist Church, Coleman, offic­
iating.

Burial was in Santa Anna 
Cemetery with Stevens Funeral 
Home in charge.

Survivors Include a son, Geo­
rge Ellis Brown, of Abilene; four 
daughters, Mrs. Dora Dyer, of

Coleman, Mrs. Velma Dyer, Dal­
las, Mrs. f ’annie Vestal, Abilene, 
and Mrs. Ella Mae Hinze, Imper­
ial, California; 17 grandchildren, 
and 30 great grandchildren.

4th Of July Special
Regardless of your 
need, we are always 
ready and equipped 
to serve you 24 hours 
a day.

Drop in today and 
fill up. W ith 10 gal­
lons or more get a 
6 bottle carton of 
cold drinks for only 
15 cents plus deposit 
on bottles.

TRUCK HARBOR
Cecil Williams —  Owner

Prompt Delivery

Coleman
Butane Gas Co.

m u m  k
CLEARANCE SALE

Summer Suits And Dresses

STORE WIDE SALE

SQVYRES
Sam Squyres, 74, died Friday, 

June 25, in a Coleman hospital. 
Funeral services were held Sat­
urday, June 26, in Stevens Mem­
orial Chapel, with Rev. Jack 
Skelton, of Voss Baptist Church, 
officiating.

Squyres, a retired farmer, was 
bom in Helena, Texas, and was 
married in Santa Anna, moving 
to Gouldbusk in 1908.

Survivors include his wife; 
four brothers. Rev. C. W. Squy­
res, of Lawton, Oklahoma, J. O. 
Squyres, Fort Worth, and John 
Squyres and J. E. Squirres, both 
of San Diego, California; four 
sisters, Mrs. Allle Garrett, Day- 
ton, Texas, Mrs. Annie Utz, San 
Angielo, Mrs. Stanley Graves, 
Brownwood, and Mrs. Boyd Hop­
kins, Victoria; two sons, J. T. 
Squyres and Samuel Squyres, of 
Santa Anna; five daughters, Mrs. 
ILela Brown, Stacy, Texas, Mrs. 
Faye Wheeler, Fisk, Mrs. Neva 
Howard, Coleman, Mrs. Kather­
ine Sparks, San Angelo, and 
Mrs. Wilma Sldoner, Fort Worth; 
20 grandchildren, and 15 great 
grandchildren.

James Allen Wins At 
Bangs Rodeo Recently

James Allen, of Santa Anna, 
swept honors in steer roping at 
the annual rodeo in Bangs, Sat­
urday, June 26. Allen also took 
first place in the jackpot calf 
roping, and he beat Don Davis of 
View, Texas, in the matched rop­
ing competition.

The weekend of July 4 (Friday, 
July 2 through Sunday, July 4) 
will see Allen again competing 
in matched roping, this time at 
the May, Texas rodeo, competing 
against George Spiller, of Brady.

Mr. and Mrs. Winston Al­
dridge, Vaden and Varlyn of 
Kermit, are visiting his parents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Warren Aldridge. 
They all attended the Aldridge 
reunion at the Coleman Lake

Saturday night and Sunday.

Debra Aldridge of Kermit is 
visiting with her grandparents, 
Mr. and Mrs. Warren Aildiidge, 
this week.

PHONE FI8-3545

Santa Anna News

Hundreds Of 
Dresses

20 To 50%  
Off

A in o ^esRVics

Now Through 
July 17 Only

Peter Pan Bras
Drip Dry Batiste 

White A-B-C, 32-36
Regular $3.50 

Now Only $2.59

All Items Below 
1/2 Price

Summer Hats
One Lot 
Lingerie

Bags

«S"

No! No! That’s Not The W ay To Clear 
A Clogged Gas Line!

One {'li 'i; ~ure: Nothing like this can happen here! 
Evers'lhinr n'^out a car, our men know how to do 
RIGHT. Th ir experience and skill add up to the kind 
t»f servicing and maintenance that will keep your car 

oiling smoothly, safely, and economically. Try us, see 
for yourself!

W c Give SCOTTIE STAMPS

Burden Mobil Station

One Lot 
Bras
All

Jewelry
All

Belts
One Lot Skirts 
And Culottes

510 Wallis Ave. riione FT S-3191

Sturges & Gibbs
Coleman 

Ladies Shop

Due to an error in last week’s 
paper, the time for the Smlth- 
Castleberry wedding was listed 
as 8:30 p.m. on July 4. The time 
should have been 8:30 ajn. on 
July 4, in the First Baptist 
Church.

Horse Auction Set For 
July 10 In Coleman

A special pre-rodeo horse sale 
Is planned for Saturday, July 10, 
at the Double C Riding Club a- 
rena, in Coleman, beginning at 
7:30 p.m.

James Allen, of Scuita Anna, 
will be the auctioneer, and con- 
slgiunents of all types of horses 
are invited.

GREEN REUNION PLANNED
The descendento of the late 

Willis and Mary E. Green will 
meet on Sunday, July 4, 1965, at 
the Coleman City Park, for their 
annual reunion. All relatives and 
friends of the family are invited 
to attend. Basket lunch will be 
served at 12:30 p.m., allowing 
tdme for those who wish to do so 
to attend church services in 
the morning.

TIRES ARB 
GUARANTEED 

at
RUDOLPBra 

Coleman, Texas

IRM I ■ ! »

DRY CmiNC
W e Invite Your 
Patronage And 
Assure You Of 

Satisfaction.

M c K e e
CLEANERS

P n oU cC

Disease Loss!

VACCIKES
and SUPPLIES

C A T T L E .  S H E E P
HORSES. HOGS •■.J POULTRY

H Serve T<•m ~VySnrr»ÌÈf.

Owl Drug Store
812 Commercial Avv\ 

Coleman, Texas

PICK UP and DEUVERI
M ONDAY— W ED NESD AY— FRID AY  
From Your Home or McKee Cleaners 

For Home Pick Up —  CaU CoUect
Coleman 625-4121

COLEMAN STEAM LAUNDRY

■u' .

Especially on
J U L Y  4thI

' I
Let us never forget how long sought, how' 
dearly bought, the first Independence Day 
was . . .  nor the freedom and opportunities
that it has afforded us, one and alll

(

In observance of Independence Day, our bank will 
not transact business on Monday, July 5th.

Coleman County 
State Bank

Member FDIC 118 West Pecan, Coleman

S H V a U f

Mariljm Ciob

lb. 79e
Decker’s Quality

BACON lb. 69e
Decker’s All Meat

WIENERS lb. 49e
Bits Of Sea

TUNA 5 for $1.00
Ritz

CRACKERS 8-oz. 29e
Libby

VIENNA SAUSAGE 5 for $1.00
Large White

EGGS doz. 39o
Honey Cup

MELLORINE 3 for 09o
Morton’s Frozen Cream Or Fruit

PIES 3 for $1.00
Texan

SALT 2 boxes 19e
• -----  HOME GROWN MEATS ------•

W e give Key Stamps. DOUBLE Stamps 
on Wednesday with Purchase of $3.00 or 
More.
Fresh Beans, Tomatoes, Potatoes, Okra, Cantaloupes, and 
Watermelons.

Fresh Load From The VaUey Every Tuesday And Friday

Williams Food Store
MEMBER INDEPENDENT GROCERS, INC.

1-^  ̂ -----  —- ■ V
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EDITORIAL

Two Thirds Gone
This week, Santa Anna lost two of its three physicians. Our 

city has been blessed with an abundance of excellent medical 
doctors during the past few years, although many residents 
remember that it was not too long ago when the city had none.

The fact that two thirds of our medical practioners are leav­
ing points out a fact that communities sometimes tend to over­
look until it is too late. And that is the fact that every city needs 
adequate medical facilities. Although we realize that both of 
the doctors who are leaving are doing so in order to better prepare 
themselves for their profession, it is still with a slight sense of 
shock that we realize that within one week Santa Anna has 
come to the point where it is only one doctor away from being a 
doctorless town.

Although Dr. Charles Henner has no intentions of leaving 
Santa Anna, despite some rather foolish rumors that have been 
circulated to the contrary, still we must realize that a doctor, 
like all of us, must go where opportunity and need is greatest.

Santa Anna has been offered one of the greatest gifts any 
city our size could receive, in the proposed Santa Anna Medical 
Center. Many cities, much larger than ours, would pay great 
amounts to obtain a facility Uke this. Brownwood and Coleman 
are both trying to increase their hospital facilities, obtaining the 
funds required through donations and increased taxation. Yet 
Santa Anna is being offered such a tremendous asset at no coat 
to the city or its people.

In fact, construction would now be imderway on a modern 
hospital for our city were it not for the obstructionist tactics of 
a few diehards, who would rather satisfy their own petty dislikes 
than see our city Improved, and for the lethargy and lack of ini­
tiative of a great many of us, who seem to take the attitude that 
it is okay for someone else to do something to improve Santa 
Anna, as long as we ourselves do not have to put out any effort.

It is time, we think, that all of us who are interested in 
building a better Santa Anna in which to live and work and raise 
our families, get behind the people who are working toward this 
goal, give them our active support, and refute the small minority 
that’ would like to see Santa Anna wither up and die.

A GooiJ Example Of Private Enterprise
Max Eubank is nearing completion of the first stage of his 

community television cable installation. As a story elsewhere in 
this issue of The News tells, his organization will begin hooking 
up subscribers within a few days.

The enterprse and initiative shown in creating this new 
facility for Santa Anna is to be commended. There were two 
goals, two reasons for risking money, time, and effort in establish­
ing this system: (1) To make a profit; and (2) To help improve 
Santa Anna. We think, of these two reasons, number (2) was 
probably the strongest. Eubank cannot hope to recoup his in­
vestment for qxiite some time, and he is running a risk of never 
making it back. But he went ahead because he felt that this 
community television cable system would be an asset to the 
city of Santa Anna and its people.

The News wants to congratulate Eubank on bringing this 
Improvement to Santa Anna, and to urge all the people of our 
community to support this worthwhile venture.

Working for the Government, Instead of his Customers

THE 
FAMILY 
LAWYER

“HARRY SHOT ME!”
Watchers of TV westerns know 

the scene by heart. Old Ed, the 
victim of a shooting, lies near 
death. The sheriff bends over to 
catch his last words. Ed gasps:

“Harry shot me!”
On TV, that usually settles 

the identity of the killer. But 
in real life, if Harry were charg­
ed with murder, would a state­
ment like Ed’s be valid in court?

There are arguments both 
ways. The main problem is that 
Ed’s accusation, when repeated 
later by the sheriff, Ls mere 
hearsay—that is, secondhand 
evidence. And the law has good 
reasons to be wary of hearsay.

For one thing, Ed’s charge was 
not made under oath. For ano­
ther, he is no longer available 
for crossexamination by the per­
son he has accused. For another, 
a man in his death throes might 
not be calm enough or rational 
enough to make a dependable 
declaration on any subject.

Yet there are also good rea­
sons for accepting the evidence. 
As a practical matter, it may 
offer the best possible chance of 
bringing a killer to justice. Fur­
thermore, the very nearness of 
death is likely to induce the 
victim to be truthful. In the 
words of a dying Shakespearean

“What in the world should 
make me now deceive.

Since I must lose the use of 
all deceit?”

Balancing these conflicting 
considerations, the law generally 
does accept a deathbed accusa­
tion as evidence—but only imder 
careful safeguards.

FIVE YEARS AGO
’The Vernon Camirt)ell Oln, on 

Bowie Avenue, was completely 
destroyed by late night fire here 
about 1:30 am. Friday, reports 
The News for June 24, 1960. Loss 
was estimated at more than 
$40,000

Outgoing Lions Club president 
Kenneth Bowker turned the 
reins over to the incoming prexy, 
Elgean Harris at the meeting 
this week.

Mrs. J. J. Oregg is recuperating 
following a fall that resulted in 
two broken ribs.
TEN YEARS AGO

More than 350 persons turned 
out for the dedication of the new 
Northside Church of Christ last 
Sunday, according to the paper 
for July 1, 1955.

D. H. Williams has gone into 
the earthmovlng buslnes in Cole­
man County, according to a story 
and an advertisement in this 
week’s paper.

Mr. and Mrs. Coy Brooke and 
Brownie returned this week from 
a sightseeing trip through New 
Mexico and Colorado.
TWENTY YEARS AGO

Marine Corps Corporal Clovis 
Wells, son of Mr. and Mrs. Geo­
rge Wells, of Santa Anna, died 
as a result of woimds received 
in the battle for Okinawa, the 
paper for June 29, 1945 reports.

Staff Sergeant W. C. Burden 
returned to Pueblo, Colorado, 
following a visit with his parents 
here.

First Leiutenant Henry W. 
Klngsbery returned to Lubbock 
Army Air Field this week, where 
he is undergoing special weather 
training.

Sergeant Willie McCrary, of 
Santa Anna, goes to Fort Sam

Houston for reassignment this 
week.
TWENTY FIVE YEARS AGO

As the clouds of war gather 
over Europe, more and more 
Americans are enlisting in the 
military services. The News for 
June 28, 1940 reports that 14 
young men from thte area en­
listed in the Army in a period 
of two days, at the Brownwood 
recruiting office.

The newest scletlflc discovery, 
nylon hose for women, have been 
declared “an imqualified suc­
cess” according to the paper.

The annual reunion of former 
Texas Rangers, held in Santa 
Anna, is in progress this week, 
with 27 exRangers registered so 
far.
THIRTY YEARS AGO

W. G. Godwin, vocational ag­
riculture teacher at Santa Ana 
High School, was married rec­
ently in Wichita Falls, reports 
the paper for June 28, 1935.

Leon Weaver, of Santa Anna, 
was Injured In an auto-train 
collision near Coleman. The car 
was demolished.

Mrs. E. F. Rutherford was fat­
ally burned at the home of her 
daughter, Mrs. Tony Rehm, near 
Rockwood. The Are followed an 
explosion occurlng when Mrs. 
Rutherford used kerosene to 
light a wood cooking stove. 
FORTY YEARS AGO

The First State Bank , of San­
ta Anna, will convert to a nat­
ional bank, according to the lead 
story In the paper for June 26. 
1925.

D. J. Johnson, president of the 
Santa Anna Lions criub, is on his 
way to Cedar Point, Ohio, for 
the international Lions Club 
Convention.

For example, it is necessary 
tliat the victim not only be near 
death but be aware of it. If he 
still has hope of surviving, he 
might not be sufficiently moti­
vated to tell the truth.

But it all hope has fled, his 
words may be heard in court. 
In fact, if he is too far gone to 
speak, even gestures alone may 
serve. In one case, a dying wo­
man’s squeeze of the hand, in 
response to a question, helped to 
send her slayer to jail. In ano­
ther case, a nod of the head was 
held enough.

Of course, the principle works 
both ways. A victim’s dying 
words may be used in court not 
only to prove that the defendant 
is the killer but also to prove 
that he is not. As with all rules 
of law, what may convict the 
guilty may also free the inno­
cent.

A public service feature of the 
American Bar Association and 
the State Bar of Texas. Written 
by Will Bernard.

Happy Birthday
“Happy Birthday” to all who 

have birthdays diuing the next 
week. Below are listed the birth­
days we have for this week.
JULY 1

Mrs. Leon Phillips 
Gilbert (Bubba) Jones 
Karen McCluskey

JULY 3
William Rutherford 
E. F. Talley 
Mrs. Billy Joe Harvey 
Rodger Jackson, Rockville, Md.

JULY 4
W. R. Mulroy
Sam H. Collier
Mrs. Vernon Penny
Dale Hicks
Clyde Parker
Mary Ann Collins
Katie Lee Collins
Mrs. R. C. Rainey, Lubbock

JULY 5
Dan Tlndol

JULY 6
Leland Thompson 
Mrs. Leffel Estes 
Mrs. Bob Nixon, Valera

JULY 7
Mrs. Roscoe Hosch 
Mrs. Lois Henderson, San An­

gelo
Would you like your name to 

be published on your birthday? 
If so, please be sure to let us 
know when it is. Next week we 
will publish the names of those 
having birthdays between July 
8 and July 14.

PERSONALS

Mr. and Mrs. Bruce Medley and 
children of Houston were Sun­
day dinner guests of her aunt, 
Mr. and Mrs. O. R. Boenicke. Rev. 
Crawford of Fort Worth and 
Cullen Perry of Santa Anna were 
afternoon visitors. Other recent 
visitors were Mr. and Mrs. Lige 
Lancaster and Mrs. Russle 
James.

Mr. and Mrs. Walter Stacy 
visited Sunday afternoon with 
Mrs. Zona Stacy in the Twilight 
Nursing home at Bangs and 
found her feeling pretty good 
and liking her new home. Mr. 
and Mrs. Stacy attended church 
services at Brooksmlth Sunday 
night.

The Joe Englands of Jackson­
ville, North Carolina, are visiting 
with relatives here in Santa 
Anna this week. They state that 
it is the first time in six years 
that they have visited here.

Simday guests in the home of 
Mrs. R. B. Archer were her son, 
Billy, of the Buffalo commimity; 
her daughter and son In law, Mr. 
and Mrs. H. A. Williams, of Abi­
lene; and her daughter, Mrs. 
Peyton Dick, of San Angelo, who 
will be staying here for several 
days.

DID YOU 
KNOW TH.\T:

In Otiobcr 1941, Ihe Trxat For- 
« (  Service, In coo|>erailoii with llic 
Tevai Poreiiry AMotlatlon, the 
Southern Pine Atroclallon, ami the 
F.art Texa« riiamtier of f'.ommerte, 
iiiaii.<t><raU'(l the Tree Farm .S^irm 
in Te.xai. It I* part of a national 
projert »|>oiieore«l by the American 
Forrjt rrmlmie Indiisirin to rec- 
ogiiire forcil l.iiiiloKnrrs who arc 
following good forcitry praiticet.

Two of the three redistricting 
plans passed by the last legis­
lature soon will come under 
courtroom attacks.

In a legislative redistricting 
case in Houston, motions will be 
filed asking that the new plan 
for dividing Texas into 150 dis­
tricts for the State House of 
representatives be declared un­
constitutional.

State Republican Chairman 
Peter O’Donnell, Jr., has an­
nounced that the Harris County 
plaintiffs in the Congressional 
redlsitaictinig case, headed by 
George Bush, will drop out of 
active roles in the case because 
that county was treated fairly 
in the redistricting plan.

But the Republicans plan to 
bring in new plaintiffs from 
Dallas, Bexar, Tarrant, Midland, 
Ector, Jefferson, Orange, and 
Brazoria Counties to try to con­
vince the three judge Federal 
court in Houston that the new 
law violates several apportion­
ment principles.

On legislative redistricting, 
state Representatives Jake John­
son, of San Antonio, and Robert 
C. Eckhardt, of Houston, who 
joined in the suit which led to 
present reapportionment proce­
dures being declared unconsti­
tutional, will ask the court to 
say that the new plan violates 
the US Constitution, too.

Main attack is expected to be 
purely on the question of 
whether countywide districts 
with more than one legislator 
serve to discriminate against 
minority racial and political 
groups.

No attack is expected on the 
plan passed to divide the Texas 
State Senate into 31 new dis­
tricts.
AUTO RATES GO UP

A State Insurance Board pub­
lic hearing confirmed the earlier 
warning that auto insurance 
rates will go up an average of 
some 13.4 percent on August 1.

Actually, new rates for pro- 
pierty damage, liability, and col­
lision lines carried by most 
motorists will be increa.sed more 
than 20 percent in most areas.

A rising toll from traffic acci­
dents is blamed for the hike.

Insured drivers p>aid $404,000,- 
000 in premiums last year a- 
gainst $198,000,000 settled by 
companies on claims. Another 
$16,000,000 in payouts is pending. 
Board decides premiums should 
go up when more than 63 cents 
of the premium dollar goes to 
pay claims and adjustment 
costs.
GOVERNOR’S VETOES

Just before the veto deadline. 
Governor Connally vetoed the 
bill which would have allowed 
banks, savings and loans asso­
ciations, and others, to charge 
up to 17 percent interest on 
certain tsrpes of loans.

“No evidence was presented to 
the Legislature to justify these 
specific rates, either on ,'the 
basis of reasonableness or need,” 
the Governor said in his veto 
message. He said he also was con­
cerned about a provision of the 
bill which would have let lenders 
require borrowers to purchase 
or provide insurance as security 
for a loan. That provision, he 
noted, would not have limited in 
any way “the number or types 
of insurance coverages which 
(could have been) required.”

Connally vetoed a total of 40 
bills passed by the 59th Legis­
lature. Among them were:

Insecticide bill which would 
have afircted both commercial 
insecticide applicators and farm­
ers a^d ,ri

itiave flrttihor-Jbe

MJenard, Runhells,

Bills cr^ lx^ N oi^ 'east Texas 
State College, at Texarkana, and 
Permian State College, at Odessa. 
JULY,4 TOLL 
WARffpf|(» T^SVED

Homer G arr^n, Department 
of Public Safety Director, esti­
mates that thirty one persons 
will die In Texas traffic acci­
dents during the three day July 
4 holiday.

DPS maximum enforce­
ment with additional personnel 
from other uniformed services to 
augment the regiilar Highway 
Patrol.

“Operation Motoncld®’’. a DPS- 
dlrected coordinated effort
among state agencies to reduce 
traffic accidents, will focus pub­
lic attention on added dangers 
of holiday travel.
COURTS SPEAK

State Supreme Court affirmed 
Appeals finding 

that the two year old law which 
placed bonded liquor exporters 
along the Mexico border under 
state regulation is unconstltu- 
tional.

In two separate opinions— 
from Harris and Matagorda 
counties—court held that holders 
of hurricane Insurance policies 
which specifically excluded wa­
ter damage coverage could not 
collect for flood water damages 
to their home from the Septem­
ber 11, 1961, Hurricane Carla.

UT LANDS LEASED
University of Texas leased 

47,014 acres of land for $10,106,- 
000 at the fiftieth public auction 
of oil and gas leases.

Active bids were drawn on 
159 of 167 tracts offered. All 
leases were made for five year 
terms and a one sixth royalty on 
mineral production. Highest and 
second highest bids—$260,000 
and $225,000—were on 320 acre 
tracts in Ward County.

Receipts from auction will 
swell the Permanent University 
Fund to over $442,000, Land 
Commissioner Jerry Sadler said. 
SHORT SNORTS

A proposed pulp and paper 
mill (Owens-Illinois, Inc.) re­
ceived a permit from Texas 
Water Pollution Control Board 
to discharge a maximum of 
48,000,000 gallons of treated in­
dustrial waste dally into the Sa­
bine River five miles north of 
Orange.

Governor Connally is recruit­
ing membership for two vital 
new education groups—the 18 
member Coordinating Board, 
Texas Colleges and Universities, 
and the 15 member Governor’s 
Committee on Public School 
Education.

Six more Neighborhood Youth 
Corps job projects have been 
approved in Paducah, Rusk, 
Mercedes, Port Isabel, Hebbron- 
ville, and Goliad.

1966 license plates for an esti­
mated 6,000,000 vehicles already 
are in production at Huntsville 
State Prison shops in 33 differ­
ent types of plates plus new 
“pres* îge” tags.

Secretary of State Crawford 
Martin has granted a charter 
to Texas Oil Producers Market­
ing Association, Inc., a nonprofit 
corporation to purchase and re­
sell crude oil, believed to be first 
of its kind in industry.

Land Ctommissioner Jerry Sad­
ler has cancelled a seismograph 
permit issued to Geophysical 
Services and Pan American Pe- 
ti-oleum after two of their ex­
plosive containers washed up on 
a Mustang Island beach.

Attorney General Carr has 
announced recovery of $3,800 
judgment from a Dallas man 
who allegedly drilled and operat­
ed a slant oil well in Gregg 
County.

Trinity Valley Savings and 
Loan Association, Cleveland, has 
filed application for charter and 
Savings and Loan Department 
set a hearing for August 26.

State Teachers Colleges Board 
of Regents Ls accepting applica­
tions for presidency of Sul Ross 
State College, Alpine, following 
death o f Dr. Bryan Wildenthal.

BlUi 
Ized 
Coloi 
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McCuU 
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M EDITATIOM
The World's AAosf Widely Used 

Devotional Guide

O  n e  UFPtR ROOM NASHVXU TtNNtSSa

Read John 16:7-14
'The Spirit also helpeth our in­

firmities-----the Spirit itaelf
maketh intercession for ns. 
Romans 8:26

J«sus said. “ Ask and ft shall 
ven you.” ,W)b and others, 

nterests and of otiiers, 
ctin. jjrpperly be thé objects of 
opr prayers.

Prayer means looking to Gtod 
in thought and with, heart and 
soul. To pray well It Is necessary 
also to allow ourselves to be 
guided by the Holy Spirit. Scrip­
ture tells us that the Spirit Him­
self "comes to the aid of our 
weakness.”

Prayer that is not heartfelt 
cannot be an expression of faith 
and degenerates in interest and 
effectiveness. Even in prayer 
made with faith, we must al­
ways rely upon Jesus’ merits, be­
lieving'. that He “pleads our 
cause.”

Christians know that he who 
lives a life of prayer is in direct 
communion with God, that He 
^ a k s  more to us than we speak 
to Him.

Paul tells us not to grow tired 
In praying
PRAYER

Our Father, we thank You for 
Your Infinite goodness every 
time we prostrate ourselves be­
fore the thone of Your grace. 
We come to You to Invoke Your 
mercy and pardon. We ask In the 
name and for the love of (Jhrlst 
Jesus, our Lord. Amen.
THOUGHT FOR THE DAY

We express reverence for God 
through humbleness In Sis 
presence.

Enrico Caputo 
Italian Edition 

(Italy)



TIBES ARE ALWAYS 
A BARGAIN 

at
RUDOLPH’S 

Coleman, Texas

DR. M. O. SOWELL 
CHIROPRACTOR
Phone 625-4824 

615 Commercial, Coleman
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SPORTS
Page 7 sunfish and cat time for growth 

and spawning for small fish as 
food for bass.

Rockenbaugh urges all land- 
owners needing fish for stock­

ing ponds to make their requests 
in time for fall delivery. He also 
states that those having already 
placed requests will receive fish 
for planting beginning this fall.

ORDERS DUE NOW

Available For Stocking Ponds This Fall 
Bass, Catfish And Sunfish Fingerlings

Fish, flngerllngs for stocking 
farm ponds and flood prevention 
structures, will be available this

Weah McCulloch, Sec.-Treas. 
Settle McCulloch, Mgr.

Standard 
Abstract Co.

City & County Maps For Sale 
495 Bank Bldg. Coleman

fall, according to an announce­
ment from the Burnet hatchery 
of the Fish and Wildlife 
Service, T. O. Rockenbaugh, local 
soil conservation service work 
unit conservationist, states.

A new method of stocking is 
being initiated which provides 
better balance and growth of 
fish, George Johnson, Hatchery 
manager, points out. The order 
of stocking fish calls for placing 
channel cat and sunfish during 
the fall season, ajid bass during 
ihe spring. This order gives the

PRESCRIPTIONS
Owl Drug Store

“Where Friends Meet” 
Telephone 625-4514

312 Commercial Ave. Coleman
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RED CARPET DAYS 
JU LY7AND 8

H.ANES M EN’S KN IT  
Sport Shirts, Short Sleeves 

REGULAR $2.98 
Red Carpet Days 
Only $1.00 Each

H ANES BOY’S 
KN IT SHIRTS 

1 Short Sleeve & Muscle 
Regular $2.00 

Red Carpet Days $1.00

LEE WESTERNERS 
Men’s Sizes

Combed Cotton and Corded 
White (Desert Tan) 
Regular Price $4.98 
Red Carpet Days 

Only $3.98 Pair

JUST IN TIME FOR 
THE RODEO

“Texas” Boots, A  Complete 
Line In Boys’ Boots And In 
All Sizes. Priced A t a Low 

$7.95 And Up

Bob Turner’s

PICK YOUR 
GIRDLES AND

AT ONCE-A-YEAR

ETAL-LIGHT 
BRAS IN LYCRA BY

LIMITED! \TIMEONLY!
SAVINGS TO 25%

i.' •
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miracle
Coolrcĵ

[ Dtrlitoa t l  in i'»»!« Labft t o r ii.

2415 Vine St.
Termite &  

Pest Control
Ph. 642-9515 

Brownwood, Texas

I T ’ S A F A C T
oxuc lorics fEAiuu rosi « tUi

THE PtRST PMMWAOr 
SCMOOLM THE UNITED STATES 
TO GRANT OiaOMASYTAd

THEPHIUDElPiMCaUGi 
OF PHARMACym

l626 tM

sirns of the past

“THE GOOD OLD DAPS?” 
A physical check-up, made 

while you’re well, can keep 
you that way! See your doc­
tor. See us for medicines.

Phillips Drag
WE GIVE S.&H. 
GREEN STAMPS

SANTA AN N A  
JAYCEES

Directors Meetiny Toniyht 
Thursday, 1:30 pjn. 
Lions Club BnUdinf

Cole-Anna
Drive-In Theatre

I Coleman, Texas
THURSDAY - FBIDAT 

SATURDAY 
JULY 1-2-3 
The Beatles

GO GO M AN IA

cuff Richard, Walter Slezak
SWINGERS
PARADISE

SUNDAY - MONDAY 
TUESDAY - WEDNESDAY 

JULY 4-5-6-1 
Elvis Presley

TICKLE ME

O A K
Drive-In Theatre

Coleman, Texas
FRIDAY - SATURDAY 

JULY 1-2
THE M AN FROM 

BUTTON W ILLOW
Walt Disney’s

A  TIGER W ALK S

SUNDAY - MONDAY
JULY 4-5

FATHER GOOSE

DIG THAT  
URANIUM

w i i © © e .v
i

JEsduBT

FRYERS GRADE A U > .  . 2 9
Gooch Boneless Fully Cooked - CannedPICNICS 3lb.Can 1,98 Fresh PorkLIVER lb. .19
Extra LeanCutlets lb. ,59 Decker’sFRANKS Pkg. ,45
Shank End

HAMS
303 Size Our Darling 

Cream Or Golden

. 4 5
303 Kimbell’s Pie

;iTl
L/ream ur ixomen

CORN .19 CHERRIES 2for

2V2 Western Gold

PORK & BEANS
2 for .3 9

303 Size Kimbell’s Bartlett

PEAR HALVES
8 lb. Bag

2 for uPOTATOES
2V2 Hunt’s, Halves Or SlicedPEACHES Y2 Del MonteJ5 TUNA
LAKE HAMILTON
12-oz. Frozen
Orange Juice
LAKE HAMII.TON 
6-oz. Frozen
Orange Juice

V2 Gallon Borden

BUTTERMILK
V2 Gallon Borden

Grape, Orange, Lemonade & Punch

FRUIT DRINK

COOKIES
11-OB. Sunshine
Yum Yums 49c
l-lb. Supreme
Honeygrahams 39c
1'4-oz. Nabisco
Vanilla W afers 29c

• :íMellorine V2 Gallon

Piggly Wiggly Will Be Closed All Day Monday July 5 th

M  GREEN SIAMPSAT l i i M i M B r

Xi


