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PARKER’S PEERIiESS PRE­
DICTIONS AND PROGNOSTI­
CATIONS: Well, we can’t put it 
o ff any longer. The time has 
come for us to make our predic­
tions concerning the upcoming 
election. This is not something 
we can avoid—it is a law of na­
ture, or something, that colum­
nists always have to make pre­
dictions. About ail sorts of 
things, such as—in addition to 
elections—football games, the 
World Series, how much it will 
rain during the next month, 
how much it will not rain dur­
ing the next month (much safer 
in this part of the coimtry), et 
cetera, et cetera.

Therefore, we plunge right in 
and predict, after our own Gal­
lop Poll (so-called because we 
took it at a dead run), that the 
following candidates on the 
local ballot will be elected, may­
be: Ruel C. Walker, Robert W. 
Hamilton, K. K. Woodley, Clyde 
Orlssom, Ben Ramsey, Dorsey B. 
Hardeman, Ben Barnes, Joe B. 
Dlbrell, Glenn R. Lewis, Gordon 
Griffin, Jr., Royal Hart, Wallace 
Dingus, John Skelton, and W. J. 
(John) Smith.

Boy! We’re glad that chore is 
over.

Speaking of politics, which 
has not been very safe to do 
lately, what with all the high 
and hard feeling abounding, we 
came across the following clas­
sified ad in the weekly “Eldora­
do (Texas) Success” : “TO RE­
PUBLICANS: You know in your 
HEAD he’s WRONG.’’ We offer 
this without comment, pro or 
con, because we think its funny, 
whether you are Republican or 
Democrat. Too bad so many 
people lose their sense of humor 
when it comes to politics.

We have decided that the 
most interesting part o f the El­
dorado paper is the classified 
section. Here is another exam­
ple from the same issue: “I do 

y' not have, have never had, nor 
do I ever intend to have, a 
moustache. Rex N. Enochs.”

That is plain enough, we 
guess, but we wonder why Mr. 
Enochs found it necessary to 
publish his lack of facial adorn­
ment, past, present, or future?

Another ad, from the same 
section, offers an imfumlshed 
house for rent that has been 
“ resently painted Inside.” That 

f. we can understand. We resent 
it too when we have to paint our 
house, inside or outside.

Mark Turney, seven year old 
son of Mr. and Mrs. Rex Turney, 
of Santa Anna, is obviously 
noticing the political excitement 
aroimd him, and he has very 
definite opinions—the validity 
of which may be open to ques­
tion. Mark is a Johnson man, 
and when his 11 year old sister 
expressed a preference for 
Barry Goldwater, Mark retort­
ed: "If you vote for Goldwater, 
he’ll make you go to school 
every day and take away your 
old age assistance!”

Going to school every day is 
bad enough, but doing it with­
out benefit of old age assistance 
is unthinkable.

The airways have been filled, 
of late, with the orations of 
hopeful candidates. Reminds us 
of our favorite political speech. 
Davy CJrockett was elected to 
the US House of Representa­
tives from his local district, and 
he made a good Congressman 
too, laboring long and hard in 
Washington while many of his 
fellow legislatures were out cam­
paigning during the next elec­
tion. Crockett’s opponent car­
ried on his campaign by buying 
barrels of whiskey and ladling 
out free drinks. Come election- 
time, Crockett’s opponent won 
by a slender m a r^ . After the 
ballots were counted and the re­
sults announced, the two candi­
dates were asked to give their 
conunents. Crockett’s opponent 
moimted the stump and spk>uted 

i a flowery speech about the 
hard-fought but fair campaign, 
the absence of hard feelings, 
the American way, and the need 
for all factions to work together 
now that the people had expres­
sed their choice.

’Then Crockett was asked to 
make a speech, conceeding the 
victory. He climbed up on the 
stump, looked in disgust at the 
crowd around him, and made 

\ the classic political speech of all 
time. Crockett’s entire speech: 
“You all can go to Hell, I ’m go­
ing to Texas.” And he did.
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Local Voters Go To Polls Tuesday, November 3
1964 Santa Anna Christmas Program 
Begins; Color TV To Be Given Away
’The annual Santa Anna 

Christmas program Is now un­
derway, with 37 businesses par­
ticipating.

Some lucky shoppers in Santa 
Anna will have very fine Christ­
mases Indeed, with the mer­
chants of Santa Anna playing 
the part of Santa Claus. Begin­
ning recently and continuing 
through December 24, participa­
ting merchants will give shop­
pers cme ticket for each $1.00 of 
merchandise purchased. This 
ticket, properly filled in. Is de­
posited In containers provided 
for that pvurpose in each store.

Voter Must Have 
Registration To 
Vote In Election

To vote In the national elec­
tion November 3, citizens must 
fall into one o f four classes: 
They must hold valid poll tax 
receipts; they must be over 60 
years of age; they must have 
registered to vote in national 
elections prior to the deadline 
for reglsWatlon, which was 
March 6 this year; or they must 
be 21 this year and hold a valid 
exemption certificate, this cer­
tificate being obtain^ at least 
one month before the date of 
the election.

Due to the passage of the 
Constitutional amendment ban­
ning the poll tax as a require­
ment for voting, jjersons wishing 
to vote in national elections 
need only register (poll taxes 
are still required for voting for 
state offices, such as governor, 
lieutenant governor, and so 
forth). However, this registra­
tion must have been completed 
by a prescribed time, which in 
Texas was March 6.

No person who has not regis­
tered to vote In national elec­
tions will be allowed to vote for 
national offices November 3.

Any person holding a valid 
I>oll tax receipt can vote for 
both state and national offices, 
since the poll tax is considered 
registration.

Any person residing In Cole­
man County who has passed the 
60th birthday may vote in both 
state and national elections 
without registration or poll tax, 
requiring only proof of age and 
place of residence (a drivers 
license fulfills both require­
ments).

Anyone turning 21 this year 
may vote In both state and na­
tional races without registration 
or payment of poll tax, but that 
person must have obtained a 
certificate of exemption at leAst 
30 days prior to the date of the 
election. If the person turned 21 
the day before the election, he 
must stlU have obtained the ex­
emption certificate 30 days pre­
vious.

December 24, a grand drawing 
will be held, with first prize be­
ing a $550 color televiision set, 
which can be seen in the win­
dow of Santa Anna’s Western 
Auto Associate Store. Second 
prize will be a 16-lnch portable 
black-and-white television set, 
and third and fourth prizes are 
a set of Coming Ware cooking 
utensils ,and a 52 p^ece set of 
American Dinnerware china, 
both sets of dishes valued at $40.

Friday, December 4 is the date 
for the annual Christmas par­
ade, featuring bands, floats, 
Santa Claus, candy gifts, and 
lots of excitement. This is also 
the date of the regular Lions 
C!lub pancake supper.

In addition to all orga-ulzed 
projects, each store in Santa 
Anna will present a complete 
line of Christmas gifts and 
materials, featuring low prices 
with friendly hometown service.

And you might win that color 
television set!

Plalloween Carnival
The Junior class of Santa An­

na Hi^h School will sponsor a 
Halloween carnival on Saturday, 
October 31, at the Santa Anna 
High School gymnasium.

The carnival Is scheduled to 
begin at 5:30 p.m., and every­
one is invited.

National Races To 
Interest Here, Local

Draw  Greatest 
Contests Lacking

Residents of Coleman Cotmty 
will go to the polls next ’Tues­
day, November 3, to choose the 
naticmal administration which 
will lead the coimtry for the 
next four years. In addition, a 
number of contested state 
races, notably those for United 
States Senator and for (Con­
gressman at Large, are attract­
ing a large amount of interest.

Coleman County voters will 
cast their ballots in 19 boxes, as 
follws: Boxes 1 East and 1 West, 
Coleman; box 2, Santa Anna; 
box 3, ’Trlckham; box 5, Talpa; 
box 6, Glen Cove; box 7, Novice; 
box 8, Silver Valley; box 9, Bur­
kett; box H, Rockwood; box 12, 
Echo; box 14, Valera; box 16, 
Gouldbusk; box 17, Voss; box 18, 
Leaday; box 19, Shield; box 20, 
Fisk; box 22, Whon; and box 24, 
Bowen.

Leroy V. Stockard will be elec­
tion judge in Santa Anna. Other 
judges in the Santa Anna trade 
area include Bill Bond at 
Tricl̂ hsim, Bert Fowler at Rock- 
wood, K. R. Nixon at Valera, 
Dennis Winfrey at Gouldbusk, 
R. A. Milligan at Shield, AUlne 
Rutherford at Whon, and R. A. 
Powell at Fisk.

Santa Anna voters will cast 
their ballots In the empty store 
west of the Hartman Plumbing

Fire Department Makes Calls During 
Past Week In Santa Anna, Rockwood

Hand punches at the 
office.

News

“THIS IS THE WAY IT HAPPENED” says Wendell Bailey, 
holding the defective muffler that led to the fire that seriously 
damaged the grader he was driving. Looking on is Berl Armstrong, 
inspector on the housing project where Bailey was working.

’The Santa Anna Volunteer 
Fire Department made a couple 
of calls during the past week. On 
Wednesday, October 21, a motor 
grader being used on the gov­
ernment housing project con­
struction was being driven be­
hind the Densman Welding 
Shop, on Wallis Avenue, to have 
a muffler replaced. Just as the 
msdntalner was pulling in be­
hind the shop, a spark from the

County 4-H Club Members Bring Back 
Honors From State Fair Lamb Show

Coleman County 4-H club 
members placed well In Junior 
lamb c(»npetltion at tlie State 
Fair of Texas, in Dallas, Wed­
nesday, October 21.

Among those placing were 
Nancy Taylor, Mozelle, first in 
Dorset purebred, fourth In 
Hampshire purebred; Bobbie 
West, Coleman, fourth In Dorset 
crossbred, twenty first In Hamp­
shire crossbred; Gilbert Jones, 
Santa Axma, sixth in Correidale, 
forty fourth In Hampshire 
crossbred; Eddie Jones, Santa

Pedmettos along the Rio 
Caused the Spanish discoverers 
to name the river “Rio de las 
Palmas.”

Stapling machines at the 
News Office.

Anna, tenth in Hampshire cross, 
thirty third in Suffolk cross­
bred; Darlyne Jones, Santa An­
na, eleven^ In Dorset purebred, 
twenty second in Suffolk cross­
bred; Wade Jones, Santa Anna, 
seventeenth In Dorset crossbred; 
Vicky Brown, Coleman, twenty 
seventh in fine wool, forty sec­
ond in uatnii^lre crossbred; 
Gary Clevenger, Mozelle, fortieth 
In Suffolk croashred, thirteenth 
in fine wool; Jgn Hass, Mozelle, 
thirtieth In Htunpshire cross­
bred; Louis Hans, Mozelle, twen­
ty first in Dorset crossbred; Kay 
Craft, C!oleman, third in Suf­
folk purebred; Boyd Hightower, 
Coleman, secoiid in Shropshire; 
and Jackie Hightower, seventh 
in Suffolk crpssbred.

mufflerless exhaust Ignited the 
fuel tank. ’The grader suffered 
serious damage. Also damaged 
were the power and telephone 
lines overhead, and an automo­
bile that was parked nearby. 
’The fire was extinguished by 
the Santa Anna Volunteer Fire 
Department.

Tuesday night, October 27, the 
Fire Department was called to 
Rockwood, to battle a blaze In 
the Billy Mclntlre home. The 
MeIntires wakened about 2:00 
aun. to find the house filled 
with smoke. Six men with two 
trucks responded to the call, 
but the fire was too far advan­
ced by the time they arrived, 
and the home was dertroyed.

Pipe Cleaners Meet 
Trouble, Off Schedule

The water pipe cleaning op­
erations in Santa Anna have hit 
some snags, literally and figura­
tively, slowing down the sche­
dule. Mechanical troubles have 
cropped up to such an extent 
that the contractors liave been 
unable to follow an announced 
schedule. Therefore, homeown­
ers are warned In person that 
their water will be cut off the 
following day.

’The contractors are still work­
ing the southeast portion of the 
city, In ward 3, at presstime.

S¿ Ellectric Ctompany office, on 
Wallis Avenue in downtown 
Santa Anna.

Polling places will be open at 
8:00 a.m. and will remain open 
until 7:00 pm . All voters must 
have a valid paid poll tax re­
ceipt, must have an exemption 
certificate showing they are re­
gistered to vote In the national 
races (they cannot vote for 
state or local offices), must have 
passed their sixtieth birthday 
before January 1, 1963 (no ex­
emption certificate required), or 
must have turned 21 during 19- 
64 and must have an exemption 
certificate dated at least 30 days 
prior to the date of the election.

All voting In (loleman County 
will be by paper ballot. Under 
state law, voters must mark out 
all persons or proposition they 
wish to vote against, leaving 
only the person or the proposi­
tion for which they wish to vote. 
Failure to mark out all other 
candidates for any given of­
fice—that is leaving two or more 
candidates unscratched— ŵUI 
Invalidate the ballot for that 
race. In voting on the proposed 
amendments to the Texas con­
stitution, the voter may either 
scratch out the entire wording 
of the amendment listed after 
either FOR or AGAINST, or he 
may scratch only the word FOR 
or the word AGAINST, with the 
other, unscratched, proposition 
receiving his vote.

In the 1962 gubernatorial 
election, 2,840 votes were cast In 
Coleman Coimty. It Is expected 
that national races always bring 
out more voters than strictly 
state races, so the total num­
ber of voters casting ballots In 
the 1964 election Is expected to 
top the 1962 total.

The race for the highest office 
In the land always draws the 
greatest interest, and the great­
est amount o f emotion. The 
race this year has been marked 
by a great deal of invective and 
high feeling on both sides. ’The 
Republicans, spilt after the 
hard-fought preconvention and 
convention battles ,and fight­
ing to regain the White House 
after a four year absence, have 
as their standardbearer Senator 
Barry Goldwater, of Arizona, 
son of a pioneer Arizona family 
a n d  th e  world-recognized 
spokesman for the conservative 
movement in the United States. 
Running with Goldwater is Re­
presentative William Miller, for­
mer national chejrman of the 
Republican Party.

On the Democratic side of the 
ballot will be incumbent Presi­
dent Lyndon Johnson, whose 
rise from Hill Country ranch to 
schoolteacher to Congressman 
to Senator to Vice President to 
President is well known. Run­
ning with the President Is Sena­
tor Hubert Humphrey, of Min­
nesota, considered a leader of 
the liberal point of view.

National polls show Johnson- 
Humphrey leading Ck>ldwater- 
MiUer. However, certain other 
polls, such as a national survey 
of weekly and small dally news­
papers, Indicates the race will be 
much closer, with some polls 
showing Goldwater In front by 
a slight margin.

Closest race in the state pits 
Incumbent US Senator Ralph 
Yarborough against Houston oil 
company executive George 
Bush. The race is considered a 
tossup at the present time. 
Senator Yarborough, identified 
with the liberal wing of the 
Democratic Party, Is bucking re­
volt In his own party. Including 
the personal and political em- 
nlty of Governor John Connally. 
Buki, son of former US Sena­
tor Prescott Bush, of New 
Hampshire, Is running on the 
conservative platform.

The only other statewide race 
involving national office mat­
ches incumbent US Congress­

man at Large Joe Pool, of Dal­
las, against Republican Bill 
Hayes, of Temple. Hayes, GOP 
candidate for lieutenant gover­
nor in 1962, is a former state 
legislator from Connecticut.

(Aleman County voters wUl 
have another race for national 
office to ballot in, that sending 
Incumbent US Congressman O. 
C. Fisher, Democrat, up against 
challenger Harry Claypool, Re­
publican, with the 21st Congres­
sional District seat at stake.

Texas voters will also ballot 
on three proposed amendments 
to the state constitution. These 
three measures would remove 
the authority of the state legis­
lature to transfer up to one per­
cent of the state permanent 
school fund to the operating 
fund each year; would set up 
requirements concerning en­
actment of laws relating to con­
servation and reclamation dist­
ricts; and would widen the 
coverage of elderly persons un­
der state medical assistance 
programs.

The Ck>leman County bsdlot 
contains the following races and 
candidates: President and Vice 
President: Lyndon B. Johnson 
and Hubert H. Humphrey, Dem­
ocratic; Barry M. Goldwater 
and William E. Miller, Republi­
can; Joseph B. Lightbum and 
Theodore C. Billings, Constitu­
tion Party. United States Sena­
tor: Ralph W. Yarborough,
Democratic; George Bush, Re­
publican; Jack Carswell, Con­
stitution. C o n g r e s s m a n  at 
Large: Joe Pool, Democratic; 
Bill Hayes, Republican; W. A. 
(Bill) Johnson, Constitution. US 
Representative, 21st Congres­
sional District: O. C. Fisher, 
Democratic; Harry Claypool,
Republican.

Governor: John B. Connally, 
Democratic; Jack Crichton, Re­
publican; John C. Williams,
Constitution. Lieutenant Gover­
nor: Preston Smith, Democra­
tic; Horace Houston, Republi­
can; Joseph M. Rummler, Con­
stitution. Attorney General:
Waggoner Carr, Democratic; 
John Trice, Republican. Com­
missioner of Agriculture: John 
C. White, Democratic; John B. 
Armstrong, Republican; Derek 
C. Bownds, Constitution. Com­
missioner of General Land Of­
fice: Jerry Sadler, Democratic; 
John A. Matthews, Republican. 
Comptroller of Public Accounts: 
Robert S. Calvert, Democratic; 
Dallas Calmes, Jr., Republican; 
David R. Clark, Constitution. 
State Treasurer: Jesse James, 
Democratic; Fred S. Neumann, 
Republican; Bert Ellis, Consti­
tution. Railroad Commissioner 
(Full Term); Ben Ramsey, 
Democratic. Railroad Commis­
sioner (Unexpired Term): Jim 
C. Langdon, Democratic; Don 
Flanagan, Republican. Associate 
Justice Supreme Court, Place 1: 
Jack Pope, Democratic; T. E. 
Kennerly, Republican. Associate 
Justice, Supreme Court, Place 2: 
Ruel C. Walker, Democratic. 
Associate Justice, S u p r e m e  
Court, Place 3: Robert W. Ham­
ilton, Democratic. Judge, Court 
of Criminal Appeals: K. K. 
Woodley, Democratic. Chief Jus­
tice, Court of Civil Appeals, 11th 
Supreme Judicial District: Clyde 
Grissom, Democratic.

State Senator, 25th District: 
Dorsey Hardeman, Democratic. 
State Representative, 64th Dist­
rict: Ben Barnes, Democratic. 
Judge, 35th District Court: Joe 
B. Dlbrell, Democratic. Judge, 
119th District Court: Glenn R. 
Lewis, Democratic. District At­
torney, 35th District: Gordon 
Griffin, Jr., Democratic. District 
Attorney, ll9th District: Royal 
Hart, Democratic. County At­
torney: Wallace E. Dingus,
Democratic. Tax Assessor and 
Collector: John Skelton, Demo­
cratic. Sheri f f : W. J. (John) 
Smith, Democratic.

. tMt* t-i*.
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Jones Blair Paints
Sherwin-Williams Paints
Brushes
Rollers
Pans
Thlnners
Varnishes
Air Conditioner Paint 
Sand Paper 
Hand Sanders 
Table Legs 
Chum Dashers 
Caster Cups 
House Numbers 
No Hunting Signs 
For Rent Signs 
Horse Shoes 
Buggy Washers 
Trash Cans 
Waste Baskets 
Plastic Dish Pans 
Fishing Tackle 
Fishing License 
Hunting License 
Brushes — Any Kind 
Pet Brushes 
Iron Board Covers 
Vacuum Cleaner Bags 
Hand Axe 
Chopping Axe 
Cedar Axe 
Shovels 
Hoes 
Rakes
Electrical Supplies 
Light Bulbs 
Flash Lights 
Batteries 
Friction Tape 
Electrical Tape 
Masking Tape 
Bath Room Heaters 
Room Heaters 
W’all Heaters 
Heater Hose 
Copper Connections 
Rubber Hose 
Rheam Water Heaters 
Day & Night Heaters 
Building Supplies 
Lumber
Doors
Windows
Roofing
Felt
Barb Wire 
1035 Sheep Wire 
And Many More
Bob Garrett 
Mgr.

Trickham News
By Mrs. J. E. York 

Telephone DC2-3S36

Rain recorded here Monday 
measured an even one inch.

Rev. James Gilbert and fam­
ily of Denton spent the weekend 
with Mr. and Mrs. O. J. Martin. 
Saturday morning the group 
went to Sonora, where they 
went through the caverns. Rev. 
Gilbert preached here Simday 
morning, then he and his family 
returned to their home in the 
afternoon.

Friends here were saddened 
to learn of the tragic car acci­
dent Saturday that took the life 
of Miss Delma Martin of Brown- 
wood. Delma’s parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. A. J. Martin, a brother, Mr. 
J. H. Martin and a sister, Mrs. 
Russie James, live at Trickham 
and certainly have our sym- 
I>athy.

Mr. and Mrs. Grady Mclver 
spent the weekend with their 
children, Mr. and Mrs. Doyne 
Mclver and baby of Mansfield, 
and Rev. and Mrs. Bruce Homell 
of Alvarado. Saturday night 
they all attended the football 
game at Fort Worth between 
TCU and McMurry College.

Mr. and Mrs. Walter Stacy 
went to Bangs last Wednesday 
and took Mrs. Beula Kingston 
out for a drive. They visited Mrs. 
Zona Stacy in the afternoon, 
then Mr. and Mrs. Stacy took 
Aunt Beula back to the rest 
home. We were real glad to hear 
she is now able to be out and a 
round some.

Mrs. Russie James visited last 
Wednesday night with Mr. and 
Mrs. O. R. Boenicke.

Rev. James Ford of Santa An­
na, Mr. and Mrs. A1 Caviness of 
Coleman, Mr. and Mrs. Eugene 
James, Mrs. Etta Gardner of 
Abilene, Mrs. Zona Stacy and 
Mrs. Tavy Ford visited Friday 
night with Mr. and Mrs. Walter 
Stacy. The group enjoyed sing 
ing and visiting.

Mr. and Mrs. O. A. Boenicke 
were Friday night bedtime visi­
tors with Mr. and Mrs. Marvln 
Whltley.

Mr. and Mrs. Rob Shel field of 
Brookesmith visited Wednesday 
with Mrs. Zona Stacy.

Bill Vaughn and Tinker Doc­
kery returned home during the 
weekend from Colorado after 
hunting there several days.

KNOW OUR 
TEACHERS

ta Anna.
Gray says he likes the envi­

ronment of the smaller city, 
having come from one himself, 
he likes Santa Anna, is im­
pressed by the quality of the 
band facilities and the response 
shown by local people to the 
band and its activities, and 
hopes to stay in Santa Anna for 
a long time.

Shields News
By MRS. E. S. JONES

FRED A. GRAY

If you can’t have the best of 
everything, make the best of 
everything yon have.

Melvin Lamb 
Asst. Mgr. 

Phone FI8-3S919

Piòtect

Disease Loss!

V A C C I N E S
and S U P P L IE S
for C A T T L E , S H E E P
H O R S E S . H O G S .» d  P O U L T R Y
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Owl Drug Store
312 Commercial 

Coleman, Texas

“Since I was in the eighth 
gn^de, it is the only thing I 
have wanted to do.” This is the 
answer Fred Gray, new Santa 
Anna band director gives when 
asked why he became a music 
teacher.

A school band director in 
Gray’s hometown of Gorman 
was the inspiration for the new 
Santa Anna head musician.

A graduate of McMurry, Gray 
came to Santa Anna, his first 
fulltime teaching Job, with high 
recommendations. He ended his 
college schooling with a ’ll 
grade point average, out of a 
possible 3.0. He was a member 
of Kappa Delta Pi national ed­
ucation honor society, and was 
elected most valuable member 
of the McMurry band during his 
final semester in the Abilene 
college.

Gray is single at the present 
time, but this status is due to 
chtinge in January, when he will 
marry Janet Louise Ivey, cur­
rently a student in the Univer­
sity of Arizona.

Discipline and finding time to 
do all the many things that 
need to be done are the two 
problems the new teacher finds 
most pressing. Band directors 
have demands on their time not 
shared by their colleagxies in 
other lines of teaching, such as 
repairing broken instruments 
and preparing the routine for 
the halftime show at next 
week's football game.

Gray currently teaches three 
groups, a fourth grade music 
cla^, a Junior high school band, 
and the senior high band.

He is a member of the Metho­
dist Church, and has recently 
been named teacher of one of 
the Sunday school classes at 
First Mlethodist Church of San-

Members of the Vancfe family 
visiting with the Stewardson’s 
and attending the funeral of 
Miss Delma Martin at Trickham 
Sunday afternoon were: Mr.
and Mrs. Cliff Comior of Cole­
man, Mr. and Mrs. Clyde Vance 
of Amarillo, Kenneth Vance of 
Roswell, New Mexico, Mr. and 
Mrs. Grady Davis of Valley Mills 
and Mr. and Mrs. W, T. Stew- 
ardson and Theola . Sincere 
sympathy to the bereaved fam­
ily.

This area received a good 
rain Sunday night from one 
inch to one and eight-tenths of 
an inch.

Mr. and Mrs. David Zirkle, 
Dwight and Donnie of Austin, 
spent the weekend with Mrs. 
Lillian Lewellen.

Mrs. Tommy Watson and 
Mitzi of Evant and Mrs. O. H. 
Watson of Cross Roads Commu­
nity visited Sunday with Mrs. E. 
S. Jones.

Sandra Fowler of Austin visi­
ted Sunday with homefolks.

Mr. and Mrs. A. D. Elppler vi­
sited through the weekend in 
Garland with their daughter, 
Georgia, and attended the fun 
eral of a nephew, Edmond Keith 
Wilson, Oil Monday afternoon.

Mrs. M. F. Self of Coleman 
and Mrs. Leonard Williams were 
visitors when the Quilting Club 
met Tuesday afternoon. Mrs. 
Bert Fowler was hostess. Her 
quilt, pieced by her aunt, Mrs. 
Nadine Bynum, of San Antonio, 
a former resident of our com­
munity. Since the election Nov­
ember 3 will be held at the Com­
munity Center, the Quilting 
Club has postponed their meet­
ing until November 17.

Mr. and Mrs. Travis Cobb of 
Stephenville were supper guests 
of Mr. and Mrs. G. E. McIXmald 
on Monday.

Mr. and Mrs. Grady Williams 
were home last week. They have 
been combining in the Hale 
Center vicinity several months.

Karen Jones, a student at 
Commercial Business College, 
spent the weekend with her par­
ents, Mr. and Mrs. Elton Jones.
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Mountaineer 
Back Of The Week

§
Game of 

OCTOBER 23, 1964
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This Recognition of Out­
standing Mountaineer Play­
ers Sponsored Every Week By

I
G

Ì
G

Santa Anna Tile Co. Eugene Davenport ^
dxWSfLKÍiS)

W E I
&

s u p p l ì
CO.

Double Top 
Value Stamps 
Every Wednes­
day With $3.00 
Purchase or 
More.

Brown’ s Grocery
MEMBER INDEPENDENT GROCERS, INC.

Priceo Ch)od Friday and Saturday, October 30-31
GOOCH’S RIDER — 1 Lb. Pkg. I 10 LB. BAG •

BACON 3 for 1.00 SUGAR
LIMIT 1

DOTTIES — LIMIT 10

BISCUITS l O  cans

89e
PACIFIC GOLD — Large No. 2Vt Can

PEACHES. 4  for 1 .0 0 -
GOLDEN ~  Lb. Pkg.

OLEO
WHITE MEDIUM

2  for 2 9 (  ElRiS 3  dozen 1 .0 0
SO-SOFT — Pint BotUe

HanilLotíon
— Reg. $1.00 Value

3 9 c
MORTON’S — Cream or Fruit

PIES each 2 9 c  [
KIMBELL'S — 300 Cun

CHIU 4 9 c
TOKAY

GRAPES pound 1 0 c
4 UB. POLY BAG

APPLES 3 9 c
1 LBl cello  b a g

CARROTS 1 0 c
Home Baked Pies By Mrs. Tom Rushing

LEFT OVER

BRAND NEW
1964’s

FOR THE WISE SHOPPERS
Brand New 64

Plymouth Savoy
4-door sedans. We have two of these left 
in stock, both are sixes and have auto­
matic transmissions.

Brand New 64

Dodge 330
2-door equipped with standard trans­
mission and economical six cylinder 
engines.

Brand New 64

Rambler Classic
4-door. Has standard transmission, 
whitewall tires, and a six cylinder en­
gine.

Brand New 64

Plymouth Savoy
2-door, standard transmission and six 
cylinder engine.

Brand New 64

Dodge 330
4-door, automatic transmission and the 
six engine.

Brand New 64

V8, fastbwk hardtop. See and drive this 
fully equipped sports special.

ÍÍSü-í'J^jS^j^cylbider cars
ym  xet ^tween IS^O m n e í^ g r ito ;

M  f Ä i s e T * ”’

Taylor Niotor Co.
Home of The 50.000 Mile or 5 Year Warranty

ï*î'
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Bdltor:
Since Santa Anna was my 

birthplace, and where I grew up 
and graduated from school In 
1923,1 still take The Santa Anna 
News to maintain some contact 
with the pe<^le I have known 
there.

I have lust read srour editorial 
In the October 23 Issue which 
came today, and I was very 
much interested in what you 
had to say about "A Tale of Two 
Cities." I agree wholeheartedly 
with your {»-oposal. With an in­
dustrial foundation, fully organ­
ised and with the petóle of 
Santa Anna fully aware o f what 
It can do, and wxtridng harmon-

iously together, there is no 
doubt that Santa Anna can 
grow and prosper.

I am a graduate engineer and 
have been travelling here in 
Texas (mostly East Texas) for 
the past 34 years. I have watch­
ed the attuatlon happen many 
times In these years, as out­
lined In your editorial. Where 
there is an organized effort on 
the part o f people In a ccanmu- 
nlty and Insight into what they 
can do, these cities and towns 
have grown and prospered.

You now have an excellent 
and permanent water supply, 
and this is extremely important 
to any company or organization 
interested in locating a plant or 
business In a community. You 
have excellent power supply, a 
good climate, and a good loca­
tion within the state of Texas. 
With an organized effort pro­

perly directed, there is no doubt 
that aanta Anna can grow ipid 
prosper In the future, far bet­
ter than It ever has In the past 

I hope that your editorial will 
arouse Interest and su i^ rt In 
the local people of Santa Anna 
so that an enthusiastic organi­
zation can be started in the 
direction of future growth of 
Santa Anna.

Very truly yours,
H. L. Land

I P l R O C t l R I E S S

Editor:
I wish to take this opporttm- 

ity to thank my many friends 
in the Santa Anna area for the 
many wonderful cards and let­
ters I've received, ejqieclally to 
Brother and Mrs. James Ford, 
the Assembly of Qod Church for 
their many wonderful prayers 
and contributions made In my 
behalf. To Vernon and Emma 
Penney, John and Eddie Wells 
for their contributions, to all 
my blood donors in Santa Anna,

Ood bless you for your sacrifice. 
To Dr. Henner for his wondertiil 
work, to Cheater and Mildred 
Galloway and Pauline Eubanks 
lor their wonderful gifts. For 
each of these 111 always have a 
special place In my heart for 
them. son-in-law, Melvin
Avants, for his many hoiu*s 
spent In my behalf getting 
things ready for the operation.

To my w(Hiderful friends all 
over Coleman County who have 
asked repeatedly of my condi­
tion. It is slightly Improving 
with each day. Qod bless you 
all, keep you safely. May he add

Attend church regularly.

Pro­
ducts

BROWN'S GROCERY 
HARVEY GROCERY 

WILLIAMS FOOD STORE

—NAS MADE US A GREAT NATION. 
WE, TOO, REALIZE THE IMPORTANCE 

OF KEEPING ABREAST WITH TIME.

c

Want Your 
Vote COUKTED?

You must mark your ballot properly,  to hove it countedi 
Stratch the nomes of oil condidotes you do not wont to vote for.

*.4

HOW TO MARK 
YOUR BAUOT:

I Do not touch the ballot 
■ with your pencil except to 

scratch the name of •  candi­
date or party you want to vote 
«Kioinst.

2 To vote for a REPUBUCAN, 
e you must mark out both the 

Democratic ond Constitution 
forty candidates.

1
3k v:

^  To voto o STRAIGHT PARTY 
W b t ic k et , you mua mark out 
tha antira eohtmru for tha othor

-■
two partías.

k  ■ ' Æ To SPUT your vota, you
^ B  must mark out th« nomt*

f e . of ol¡ candidatos you do NOT
fi-;
fík:

wont to VOÌB for.

5 Erasures void ballots. If 
e you moke o mistake, <■ 

new ballot from the election 
■udge.

DEM OC lARTY REPUBLICAN PARTY CO N Sm

F o r  P fM id M t w>d 
V k .  P rw W w it BARKT M. QOLDWATUtwnxiAU B. unxxx

Wet U. a  Smatar 
OXOROX BUSH

For CoBcrMomoii.At4.orn 
BD XllAYXS

For rniiirrM

jAacaacHTON
For liliM tnnt OonraorHORACB Housrmr 
For Attoor Attonor u on

jomtrtacM
For CniMnlrUnorr oS 

Aerkulture
JOHM B. AHMSTHOWO

For CtonmlMénnrr of 
O m u k I Load OtSeo 
JOHN A. MATTHXWS

For Comptr^lor o(
FoMk Aceoual*
DALLAS CALMXA J it

For Stato Traawror 
FRXD a  NXUMAMN

Far Balhoad (
(FaO Tam )

FarllaikBad((Uaaâ rad Tam) 
D O N nAN AO AN

For AMedale Jndee 
Sawono CowL Flam t Trx.KXNNXÍLT

For Araodato Joatko 
Sopraao Oaart, Flan i

Wat A im lito Jadli 
■aptoaM Ooart, 1

Wm CoatttI

Í Praaident

ITY

BintN 40S

At-Larga
3HNSON

U4AMS

Fori

ForlUU
(Ua

j  Jootioa 
I Coaart, Flaea I

M ARK YO U R BALLOT PROPERLY. Uove only th# ncuiMt of thoM con-
didotBS whom you want to ibcbív«  your vot*. MARK OUT ALL OTHER NAMES.
MAKE YOUR CONSERVATIVE VOTE COUNT!

The Nein, Santo Anna, Texas, Oeteher 29,1M4 Page t
his blessing to you all, for each 
o f you, reward you for your 
works.

Roger Craig, Jr.
John Sealy Hospital 
Ward 6-A 
Galveston, Texas

TIRES ARE 
GUARANTEED 

at
RUDOLPH'S 

Coleman, Texas

HOOVER
CONVERTIBLE

If Bwafs, 
os It Sweeps, 
as It Claans 

Attachments 
Available

$59.95

HOOVER
St«om/Ory Iron

The only Iren with o 
steintest steel seleplett. 

Glides eo sier. Stein  
_ond stretch resistent.

only

$16.95

HOOVER
CONSTEUATtON 

The canister that 
o ffers m ore of 

what you wont 
In o cleaner.

$39.95

HOOVER
fOUSNM-SCRUBBER 
G ives yeur fleers 
thet hendrubbed 
leek. Abo scrubs 

the floor.

$29.95

Hosch Furniture
Santa Anna

closed u p ... and
the
kitchen’s
soot free 

Flameless
Electric
Cooking 
is all it could be

During the winter months when the house 
is closed up, a flamelcss elcftric range is almost 
a necessity. Only an elcftric range can prevent 
the ugly, oily film on windows, walls, cabi- 
ncts...cvcrything in the kitchen and adjacent 
room s, because there’s no com buftion. Since 
heat is delivered dircftly by mctal-to-mctal 
contaft with the bottom  o f  the utensils, you 
don't have to dean soot from pots and pans. 
There’s no doubt about it...electric cooking 
is dean, accurate, faft, and by putting the heat 
into the food, not into the a ir ...y ou  don ’t 
have to  pay for dissipated heat.

Visit an elcftric appliance dealer soon and 
bring hom e an elcftric range so you, too, can 
have a bright and shiny kitchen.

HUH WHUNO -  An axtra for 
WTU cutfoman. If you tra a 
cuatamar of WTU ên i pur- 
choM yeur flam alau afoctrk 
range from a focal appUatfca 
daalar. WTU wtH ImtiH tlM 
wiring at no «haiga to you.

for F F l ia iD A I R B  
StuAtU opplioncot

West lexas Utilities
Compmip m invrafor

owned company 1
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EDITORIAL

Vote!
Oet-out-tlie-vote campaigns have been a part of national 

elections for a great many years. Of late, however, something new 
and eminently worthwhile has been added. More and more of 
these campaigns stress that it is the duty of the voter to seriously 
and thoroughly study the issues and evaluate the candidate before 
entering the polling booth.

An uninformed vote is worse than no vote at all. The policies 
and principles that are adopted now, with the consent of the 
electorate, are those which will do much to determine this na­
tion’s future. They will, in many instances, profoundly affect the 
lives and opportunities of our children and our children’s chil­
dren. It cannot too often be repeated that an informed people is 
the first essential to the perpetuation of our institutions and our 
freedoms.

By all means, vote — the fact that so many million qualified 
Americans commonly stay away from the polls has long been a 
national disgrace. But, above all, really know what and who you 
are voting for.

Concerning Privilege And Honor
Your country soon requires a response from you as one of its 

citizens. The business of city, county, state and nation is your 
business. Are you going to shrug off your duty and leave it up to 
the other stockholders? Do you find the candidates unappealing? 
Does the noise of charges and countercharges annoy you? Are the 
issues too complex to clarify? Will you remain a “don’t know” or 
“undecided” until after election day? Resist the Inclination to let 
this one go by! Vote your convictions, and urge your neighbor to 
do so.

In doing this, every citizen should extend his powers of dis­
crimination beyond the name-calling and vituperation that so 
often becloud the issues. Senator Mundt of South Dakota recent­
ly became one of the first to call upon the national candidates to 
put an end to the diatribe and dirt being thrown about. Such a 
low level campaign, he said, would “Insult the intelligence of the 
American voters.” The Senator asked party leaders to help re­
store some degree of decency and dignity to the contest for presi­
dent and vice president.

All the candidates, he said, are “honest, able, dedicated, high­
ly trained, patriotic individuals, not crooks, vote-thieves, dopes, 
dupes, trigger happy or war-mongers.” A madness must have 
overtaken them, he added, to cause them to apply cheap and dirty 
language to each other such as “raving, ranting demagogus” and 
“crook.” If Senator Mundt’s advice is heeded, he will have done 
a tremendous service to his country. Everyone of us should Join 
him in calling for restraint in the political oratory.

FIVE YEARS AGO 
According to The News for 

October 30, 1959, about 316 per­
sons registered for Homecoming 
the preceedlng Saturday.

The Wristen service station 
was robbed Sunday, with $30 be­
ing taken from a cigarette ma­
chine.

Twin sisters, Mrs. Jennie 
Whetstone and Mrs. Nannie MU- 
ler, of Santa Anna, celebrated 
their 85 birthdays Sunday.

Maybe history won’t repeat it­
self, but in 1959 this week, 
Ooldthwaite topped the Moun­
taineers by a 38-0 score.
TEN TEARS AGO 

Wes Wise, of Santa Anna, won 
reserve grand champion with 
his Southdown lamb at the 
State Fair of Texas lamb show 
during the past week, according 
to a photo and story on the 
fra it page of the paper for 
October 29, 1954.

Hot issue in Coleman County 
concerns the candidacy for 
County Treasurer of Mrs. Char­
lotte Burney. Mr. Burney was 
the nominee of the Democratic 
Party, but he died of a heart at­
tack prior to election. The name 
of the man who was runnerup 
to Burney in the primary was 
placed on the ballot in his place, 
although strong public opinion 
seemed to favor allowing Mrs. 
Burney to be the candidate in 
place of her late husband. 
TWENTY YEARS AGO 

Technical Sergeant 'Wyndell 
A. Rowe, scm of Mr .and Mrs. 
Pierre Rowe, of Santa Anna, re­
ceived a commendation for “ex­
ceptionally m ^torlous conduct” 
in Italy recently.

The national Section was 
days away, and political ads 
urging the re-election of Frank-

W ' t
*  i
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" I  N E E D  Y O U R  h e l p ! " '  m A

ĥ s the La w

lln Roosevelt, or the election of 
Thomas Dewey, were all around.

Due to the shortage of coach­
es, and the transportation prob­
lems, Santa Anna High School 
had no football team during 
the 1944 season.
TWENTY FIVE YEARS AGO

A temporary chamber of 
commerce for Santa Anna was 
organized last week, reports The 
News for November 3, 1939.

The Cross Plains and Mozelle 
football game was postponed 
due to the death of a Cross 
Plains player from a “blood 
stream infection” resulting 
from an infected boll on his 
arm.

The Densman Welding Shop 
has an advertisement in the 
paper this week, offering horse- 
^loeing among other services.

Workmen remodeling the 
Walker Inman home found a 
family of mice in the walls who 
had constructed their nest of 
well-chewed-up dollar bills. 
THIRTY YEARS AGO

Mrs. Tom Brayn, of Rockwood, 
gave a surprise anniversary 
supper for her father and 
mother, Mr. and Mrs. J. D. 
Whetstone, says The News for 
November 2, 1934.

A horse, mule, and pony show 
is being held in Santa Anna this 
week in connection with Trades 
Day.

Phillips Drug Store advertises 
RCA and Crosley radios.
FORTY YEARS AGO

“Underwear Has Much To Do 
With Your Comfort” announces 
an ad in The News for October 
31, 1924, promoting the union 
suits for sale by R. P. Crum St 
Son (medium weight, knee 
length, no sleeves. Ideal for win­
ter wear, for ladles, $1.25: chil­
drens sixes, $1.00).

THE PIRACY PRINCIPLE
The colorful pirate of old cap­

tured your imagination but not 
that of the shipowners or the 
governments that lost their car­
goes and treasures.

Pirates were “enemies of 
mankind.” 'Their acts became 
crimes against that government 
as well as against the “ law of 
nations.” A government would 
try to catch and to pimish them 
no matter how and where the 
piracy took place.

Prom these early days, a rule 
of intemation law called “the 
piracy principle” came into be­
ing, as to crimes against man­
kind. Any nation might seize 
and punish such a person. He 
did not need to be one of its 
citizens. The crimes could be 
committed inside or outside its 
territory. Jurisdiction is uw ld- 
wlde.

Nations often pimlsh their 
own people for crimes beyond 
their borders. Nations can pun­
ish aUens for crimes within 
their borders. They can punish 
aliens for crimes committed 
against that coimtry when they 
later come into that country. A 
nation can also punish an alien 
for piracy under international 
law.

What about war crimes done 
on orders of superiors? The 
World War II allies have de­
clared that certain Nazi leaders 
committed punishable crimes a- 
galnst nations.

Now and then some nations 
may allow a court to try a per­
son “in absentia.” Such trials 
without the accused present 
were once popular, but little 
comes from such trials, and 
they are not as highly regarded 
as trials in which a person has 
a fair chance to defend him­
self.

MISTAKE AND FRAUD
When you get the short end 

of a deal you may feel Inclined

to claim mistake or fraud to get 
out of the contract.

But courts are not inclined to 
correct your business mistakes 
unless they also find serious in­
justices. For to charge the other 
party with fraud is serious since 
fraud Is a crime as well as a civil 
cause of action.

Our courts, therefore, demand 
more proof than i;sual in civil 
cases where one sues to get out 
of a contract on the grounds of 
fraud.

Suppose Smith and Black a- 
gree to do something in clear 
language, but Smith does not 
grasp the terms of a plain con­
tract. This failure of Smith will 
not void the contract and our 
courts will enforce its terms.

But suppose instead Black 
well knew that Smith had made 
a mistake, and he still didn’t ex­
plain it to Smith. Then if this 
can be proved. Black may have 
trouble enforcing his contract.

Both parties often make 
a mistake which may void the 
deal. In one case Raffles a- 
greed to buy and Smith to sell 
goods arriving on a ship named 
the “Peerless.” But it just so 
happened that two steamers 
had the same name. Raffles and 
Smith h£ui in mind different 
steamers. No contract. Why?

(This newsfeature, prepared 
by the State Bar of Texas, is 
written to inform — not to ad­
vise. No person should ever ap­
ply or Interpret any law with­
out the aid of an attorney who 
is fully advised concerning the 
facts involved, because a slight 
variance in facts may change 
the application of the law.)

Happy Birthday
“H a i^  Birthday” to all who 

have birthdays during the next 
week. Below are listed the birth­
days we have this week.
OCTOBER 30

Dock Wallace 
Mrs. O. M. Jackson 
Mrs. Billy N. Wbods,

Monahans
OCTOBER 31

Mrs. F. Q. Blount 
NOVEMBER 3 

BUI McClellan 
NOVEMBER 4 

Leffel Estes 
Mrs. C. E. McCarreU 
Jackie Mobley 
Mrs. B. A. Parker 
Cathrlne Barrett Markland 
Ann AUsobrook

NOVEMBER 5 
Jackie DUlingham
Would you lUce for your name 

to be published on your birth­
day? If so, please be sure to let 
us know when it is. Next week 
we wUl publish names of those 
having birthdays between Nov­
ember 6th and November 12th.

COnON REPORT
Sample receipts increased 

slicd t̂ly at the Agricultural 
Marketing Service — Cotton 
Classing Office in Abilene. For 
the week ending October 23, 
1964, 13,680 samples were class­
ed. Total bales classed for the 
harvest season reached 53,289 
compared to 173,082 at the cor­
responding date last year. Dur­
ing the 1963-1964 cotton harvest 
the Abilene office classed 401,000 
samples and the estimated total 
for the 1964-1965 season is 
250,000 bales. Drouth conditions 
have reduced throughout the 
classing area.

Grades continued to improve 
as new bolls opened and early 
opened cotton improved in color 
after two weeks of sunshine. 
Grade percentages for District 2 
(Coleman, Runnels, TiayliM’, No­
lan, MitcheU, Scurry, Fisher, 
Jones, Stonewall, Kent and 
Dickens Counties) w »e : 12 per­
cent, middling; two percent, 
strict low middling;; one per­
cent, low mMllng; three per­
cent, strict middling light spot­
ted; 39 percent, middling light 
spotted;; 20 percent, strict low 
middling light spotted; three 
percent, low middling light 
spotted; three percent, middling 
Qiotted; 13 strict low middling 
spotted; three percent, low mid­
dling spotted; and one percent 
below grade. Three percent of 
the samples were reduced in 
grade due to bark and one per­
cent due to grass.

A slight decrease was noted 
in staple lengths Percentages 
were: nine percent, 13/16; 44 
percent, 7/8; 37 percent, 29/32; 
nine perent, 15/16; and one per­
cent 31/32 or longer. Nineteen 
percent was 15/16 and longer 
the previous wedc.

Mike readings continued to 
increase. Ninety nine percent of 
the samples miked 3.5 and high­
er’, 11 percent miked 5.0 and a- 
bove. Hie most desirable mike 
readings are 3.3 through 5.1.

This is the final week of the 
voter roundup.

Tuesday, some 3,000,000 voters 
will reveal what they think a- 
bout the candidates who have 
been wooing them with prom­
ises, charges, warnings and 
countercharges.

Central attentlwx naturally 
has gone to the Presidential 
race in which Texan Lyndon B. 
Johnstm has been fending o ff 
attacks from Arizona Senator 
Barry Goldwater.

But the US Senate rase, in 
which Republican George Bush 
of Houston is trying to oust 
senator Ralph Yarborough, has 
gained much attention.

The two Presidential candi­
dates have made strong en­
dorsements In the Senate race. 
Jedmson has urged Yarbor­
ough’s election and Goldwater 
has urged Texans to support 
Bush.
SALT WATER

'Trial is scheduled to begin on 
November 2 in a lawsuit brought 
by Superior OU Company to 
determine whether the Railroad 
Commission or the Water Pollu­
tion Control Board has jurisdic­
tion over the disposal of salt 
water produced with oil and gas.

But the lawyer for both state 
agencies. Attorney General 
Waggoner Carr, has stepped out 
of the case. Carr said there ap­
pears to be a “conflict of inter­
est” between the two state 
agencies, so he advised them to 
use their own staff lawyers if 
they want to be represented in 
the trial.

Attorney General’s Depart­
ment will take part in the trial 
only to see that all evidence is 
fully developed.

In an informal opinion. First 
Attorney General Hawthorne 
Phillips wrote that the Water 
Pollution Control Board does 
not have the authority to re­
quire oil operators to get permits 
for use of ppen saltwater dispos­
al pits.

A special study committee of 
the House of Representatives 
will meet on October 30 to de­
cide whether to recommend leg­
islation. Bills giving control of 
pits to the Board, the Commis­
sion, and to both, will be pro­
posed to the committee.
CORPUS CHRIS'n FIRST

Corpus Chrlstl became the 
first metropolitan area in the 
nation to complete a compre­
hensive transportation plan in 
compliance with the Federal Aid 
Highway Act of 1962.

Study was conducted by Texas 
Highway Department in cooper­
ation with the City o f Corpus 
Christ!, Neuces County, and the 
Bureau of Public Roads. It pin­
points present and foreseeable 
traffic problems in the area sind 
provides a basis for development 
of highway routes, city streets 
tmd county roads serving the 
Gulf coast city over the next 20 
years. Nineteen similar plans are 
due to be developed in 22 Ttexas 
urban areas over 50,000 popula­
tion this year.
CROPS PROGRESS

Clear, open weatha- helped to 
move along the harvest In the 
cotto nfarmlng region of the 
blacklands of Texas, the US De­
partment of Agriculture reports.

USDA says clear weather also 
aided farmers to push sorghum 
combining and the planting of 
small grain. Lack of topwrii 
moisture slowed growth of grass 
and some grains, but ranges and 
pastures remained in good con­
dition over most of Texas. 
WORKMEN’S COMP RATES UP

After a puUic hearing, work­
men’s compensation rates prob­
ably will go up an average of 2.3 
percent, effective Decemb^ i, 
says the State Board of Insur­
ance.

Indicated change« by groups 
are: manufacturing, up 4.4 per­
cent; contracting, up 3.8; oil 
down 0.9; all other, up 1.4 per­
cent.
WATER STORAGE INCREASES

Texas Water Commission re­
ports that the month o f Sept- 
emb«r brought better than nor­
mal rainfall in most areas. Con­
servation storage in major re­
servoirs increased 2,800,000 acre 
feet, to 8,400 acre feet. Storage 
at the end of September was 71 
percent of potential capacity

Seventeen of the 18 stations 
over Texas reported above-aver­
age rain. Weather Bureau sta­
tion at Brownsville was the lone 
exception. There, near normal 
fall was recorded.
MENTAL HEALTH

A mental health plan, drafted 
by a 110-member cmunlttet ap­
pointed by Governor John Con- 
nally, is of vital Importance to 
every Texan. So says Committee

Chairman Judge C. L. Aber­
nathy of Plainvlew.

Reason Is that every person— 
Texan or not—has, at one time 
or another, been a “troubled 
person." Committee defines 
“ troubled” as anything from a 
translnt Inability to make a 
necessary decision to a severe 
psychosis.”

One segment of the committee 
is called the “Services to Troub­
led People” task force. It has 
written recommendations for 
state and community services to 
troubled people. All recommen­
dations by all committees will be 
in the spotlight as suggested 
legislation during the 1965 Leg­
islature.

Committee reports that there 
is an almost endless supply of 
services to meet some fragment 
of the needs of the troubled. 
These Include pastoral counse­
lors, medical doctors, social 
workers, and psychoolglsts. 
Scxne community information 
centers must bt set up so 
troubled people can find out 
where to go for the help they 
need WHEN they need it. 
SHORT SNORTS 

Parks and Wildlife Commis­
sion Director J. Weldon Watson 
will inspect a 27,000 acre tract in 
Franklin Mountain area, north 
of El Paso, which city officials 
want converted into a state 
park .... Gtovemor Connally or­
dered flags over state buildings 
flown at half staff in tribute to 
the late President Herbert 
H oover....... Bay Study Commit­
tee of the State Legislature held 
hearings Friday and Saturday in 
FYeeport on recreational uses of
Texas bays........ New officers of
the County Auditors Association 
of Texas, elected during confer­
ence In Austin are: Pecos Coun­
ty Auditor Gilbert Ray, presi­
dent; John E. Thigpen of Falls 
Coimty, first vice president; 
Weldon S. Horton of Travis 
County ,second vice president; 
and Hudson Caro of Galveston
County, secretary-treasurer___
A controversy over ouster and 
rehirlng o f the school superin­
tendent at Eagle Pass will be re­
sumed before State Education 
Commissioner J. W. Edgar here 
on November 23-24.

t o M E D ITA TIO Ndoy**
f rom

The World's Most Widely Used 
Devotional Guide

- C l K i M t p e r R M n i -
O  TNI UPKR ROOM NASHVKU TINNISSIf

Read Acts 5:29-42.
I am reminded of your sincere 
faith, a faith that dwelt first in 
your grandmother, Lois, and in 
your mother, Eunice, and now, I 
am sure dwells in you. (II Tim­
othy 1:5 RSV)

It Is most difficult but neces­
sary that we should guide our 
loved ones — husband, or wife, 
or child — into the Christian 
faith.

My grandmother was the wife 
of a government officer in Hok­
kaido over fifthy years ago. She 
heard one day a sermon deliver­
ed by the founder of Doshisha 
Uhlversity. She bought a Bible 
and learned to read it by the 
help o f two friends. Her husband 
persecuted her severely by 
bektings, but she did not give up 
reading the Bible every day. 
Her earnest faith won her three 
daughters to Christ. The eldest 
Khrl and the next one were 
married to evangelists for 
Christ, and from the eldest I 
was bom.

My mother, udio brought me 
up in earnest prairer, is not here 
on earth now. Whenever I think 
of her, I feel her heartfelt faith 
Is a source of my power to live 
and work for Christian evange­
lism In Japan.
PRAYER

O heavenly Father, I thank 
^ e e  for nurturing mankind 
from generation to generation. 
I beseech Thee, O Lord, make 
me as a man who does not only 
receive the abundant gifts of 
Jesus, but shares them with his 
friends and descendants as well. 
^  the name of Jesus, I pray. 
Amen.
t h o u g h t  f o r  th e  d a y

more than repays us for 
the price we pay for foUowlng 
Christ.

—Norimichl Ebizawa 
(Japan)
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Rockwood News
By MRS. JOHN C. HTINUBft

M3r. and Mrs. John X. Steward 
spent Saturday night at Brady 
with Mr. and Mrs. Douglas A- 
vants, Lynn and Douglas Jr. 
They all spent Sunday at Rock- 
springs with Mr. and Mrs. Alfred 
Steward.

Sharon and Leslie McCreary 
of Coleman spent Saturday 
night and Sunday with Mr. and 
Mra Aubrey McSwaln.

Mr. and Mrs. O. B. Phenlx and 
Cindy of Crane were weekend 
guests with Mr. and Mrs. M. A. 
Richardson. Mï. and Mra S. e . 
Richardson and Miss Settle vi­
sited Saturday afternoon.

Eddie Joe and Ellen Hodges of
Coleman spent the weekend
with their grandmother, Mrs. A. ^ ______ ________ _____________
X. Crutcher. Mr. and Mrs. Hod- Mrs. Tony Rehm. Mr. and Mrs.

fM came fbr thttn Sunday evan« 
Ing. other callers were Mrs. Bern 
Estes, Mr. and Mrs. Drury Estes 
and Mrs. Lester Bryan.

Albert Brown, minister of the 
Santa Anna Northslde Church 
of Christ, preached at the 
Rockwood Church Sunday af­
ternoon. He was accompanied 
by Mrs. Brown.

Rocky and Dena Rutherford 
o f Coleman visited Thursday to 
Sunday with their grandpar­
ents, Mr. and Mrs. Sherman 
Heilman. Mr. and Mrs. Ruther­
ford, Mr. and Mrs. John Ful- 
brlght and D. L. and Dan Fogar­
ty were Sunday dlimer guests.

Mrs. R. L. Steward was dis­
missed from the Santa Anna 
Hospital Friday.

Wade Rehm, a student at 
A&M, Misses Mary Rehm of 
Denton and Vita Rehm and 
Kelly Roblcheaux o f Fort Worth 
spent the weekend with Mr. and

Financial Statement Of 
Santa Anna Independent School District 

For 1963-1964
Balance on Hand
State and Coimty Available

Transportation __________
Special Fund ____________
Interest and Sinking Fund
Tax Fund _______________
Lunchroom F u n d ________
Student Activity F u n ds__
Athletic Fund ___________

TOTALS 

Receipts 1M3-1964
State Sources_________________  $ 115,794.24
County Sources_______________  446.42
Local Sources, All Funds______  90,202.76
Loans, Buses _________________  8,542.00
Sale of Property______________  ̂ 3,427.00
Incoming Transfers___________ * 28.25

Sept. 1, 1963 Ang. 31, 1964
$ 20.73 $ 466.15
. (-11,379.99) (-8,169 97)

558.15 368.19
40.25 102.35

5,843.71 8,709.71
1.20 .33

2,832.12 2,002.13
1,140.48 1,096.76

148.82 34.77

$ (-794A3) $ 4,610.42

TOTAL RECEIPTS I 218,440.67

Cash Available 1963-1964 (Receipts
and Balances) ------------------  $ 217,646.14

Disbursements
Administration _______________  $ 12,213.76
Instruction ____________________  114,909.76
Health Services_______________  1,693.41
Pupil Transportation __________  22,458.57
Operation of P lan t_____________  9,774.91
Maintenance of P lan t__________  3,170.61
Fixed Charges_________________  2,698.17
Food Services _________________  15,518.49
Student Body A ctivities________  9,749.58
Community Services__________  60.00
Capital O utlay_________________  1,458.84
Debt Service___________________  16,898.25
Prior Year Payables Liquidated 2,431.37

YEARS DISBURSEMENTS........ $ 213,035.72

Tax Rate, 1963-1964 .....................$ 1.85
Assessed Valuation ___________  $3,903,680.00
Area of D istrict___________  308 Sq. Miles
Bonded Indebtedness,

Sept. 1, 1963 ________ _____ $ 197,000.00
Sept. 1, 1964 ................. .......... $ 193,000.00

Assets, August 31, 1964
Cash In Bank, All Funds______ $ 12,780.39
Fixed Assets, Appraised V alue__  375,669.44

TOTAL ASSETS S 388,449.83

Non Funded Debt - Short Term Loans - Aug. 31, 1964
Receiptes 1963-1964, All Funds........ ................ 218,440,67
Underwood Corporation for Typewriters___ $ 570.00
Santa Anna National Bank, School Bus Note . 4,042.00

TOTAL NON FUNDED DEBT 1,612.00

Recapitulation
Balances Sept. 1, 1963, All Funds___________  (-794.53)
Receipts 1963-1964, All Funds............................  218,440.67

Cash Available, Receipts & Balances _______  217,646.14
Disbursements 1963-1964 ___________________  213,035.72

HALANCE8, SEPT. 1, 1964 -  ALL FUNDS $ 4,610.42

Jim Rutherford and children 
were also Sunday dinner guests.

Weekend guests with Mr. and 
Mrs. Evan Wise were Mr. and 
Mrs. Eddie Vallcek, Terri and 
Mike and Mr. and Mrs. BUI 
Mueller, Stony, Pam and Lance 
of San Antonio. Mr. and Mrs. Joe 
Wise, Joe Ed, Korky, Mark and 
Hank joined the gpnup Satur­
day afternoon and enjoyed ice 
cream and cake, marking 
Stony’s ninth birthday anniver­
sary.

Mr. and Mrs. James Thornton, 
Paula and Denise of Alamogar- 
do, New Mexico and Miss Peggy 
Mclntlre and Gary Perkins of 
Austin, Barbara Mclntlre of 
AbUene, Billy Matt Mclntlre of 
Brownwood and Mr. and Mrs. J. 
H. Thornton of Fort Worth 
spent the weekend with Mr. and 
Mrs. Billy Mclntlre and famUy.

Mr. and Mrs. Matt Estes spent 
Thursday and Friday at MUlsap 
with Mrs. Flora Thomas. Mr. 
and Mrs. James Thornton and 
chUdren joined them there. 
Saturday Miss Peggy, Linda and 
Judy tmd Billy Matt Mclntlre 
visited with Mr. and Mrs. Estes.

Mr. and Mrs. Ray ChiUlns of 
Qouldbusk visited with Mr. and 
Mrs. Leffel Estes and Geneva 
Saturday evening. Mr. and Mrs. 
James Estes and children were 
Simday dinner guests. The Es­
tes’ visited In Ck>leman Sunday 
afternoon with Mr. and Mrs. 
Taylor Boatright

Mrs. Lee MUler was transfer­
red to Hendricks Hospital In 
AbUene after she suffered a 
broken hip and is very ill.

Visiting Saturday evening In 
the home of Mr. and Mrs. Fox 
Johnson was Nikki Johnson and 
Sunday Mr. and Mrs. Marc\is 
Johnson visited.

Mr. and Mrs. Claud Box spent 
Saturday to Monday at Eastland 
with Mr. and Mrs. MarshaU 
Campbell and Pat.

Weekend guests with Mr. and' 
Mrs. Sam Estes were S. H. and 
KeUy Estes of Sweetwater and 
Mr. and Mrs. Joe Fred Estes and 
Steve of Abilene. Mrs. Rosa Belle 
Heilman was a Simday dinner 
guest.

Don Hunter spent Saturday 
with his parents, Mr. and Mrs. 
J. A. Hunter. He was accom­
panied by Omar Nashif of Tai- 
bah, Israel. Both are students at 
Howard Payne CoUege in 
Brownwood.

Mr. and Mrs. Hunter visited 
Simday in Colemsm with Mr. 
and Mrs. James Hunter and 
Jimmy,

Mr. and Mrs. A. L. King were 
In Santa Anna last Thursday to 
attend funeral services for Mrs. 
Fred Turner. Mrs. Oran Nix and 
Mr. and Mrs. Hop Ashmore of 
Fort Stockton were also among 
those present. Mr. and Mrs. Fe­
lix Murr of Junction attended 
the funeral and visited in the 
King home later.

Mr. and Mrs. King visited in 
Brownwood Sunday afternoon 
with Mr. and Mrs. Linton Oakes 
and girls. Mr. and Mrs. Llge 
Lancaster of ’Trlcklvam and Mrs. 
Nita Williamson were also 
guests. Enroute home they visi­
ted Mr. and Mrs. Carl Ashmore 
in Santa Anna. Monday after­
noon the Kings visited in Cole­
man with Mrs. J. H. Livingston 
and Mr. and Mrs. Willie King.

Mr. and Mrs. Bert Turney of 
Whon spent Thursday with the 
John Hunters. Mr. and Mrs. W. 
D. Whittenburg of Lohn visited 
in the afternoon. The Turneys 
and ’Thomas Switzer were sup­
per guests.

R. J. Deal was in Abilene Sat­
urday night and Sunday visiting 
his chlldrrai. Mrs. Deal returned 
home Tuesday from Baytown, 
where she has been visiting with

Ur. and Urs. Robert Perry aiui 
Gregg and the new baby girl, 
bom  Mmiday, October 19, 
weighing eight pounds.

Mrs. Curtis Bryan was In San 
Angelo Monday with the Cole­
man delegation to welcome Mrs. 
Lyndon Johnson. A cake, baked 
and decorated by Mrs. Bryan, 
depicting the Democratic plat­
form, was presented to Mrs. 
Johnson.

Mr. and Mrs. BUI Bryan and 
their hunting party returned 
from Pagosa Springs, Colorado, 
Saturday, after a two weeks 
hunting, with BUI getting a 12 
point elk.

PERSONALS
Mr. and Mrs. Donald Hosch 

and Darla, of Bethany, Okla­
homa, visited over the weekend 
with Mr. and Mrs. Roscoe Hosch.

Over the weekend, Mrs. Jim 
Kallsek visited her parents, Mr. 
and Mrs. Ed Spencer, two and 
one half days.

COME SEE
The All-New Chevrolets 

Ahd Cadillacs In
Our All-New Building I'lii

^CHEVROLET

R . T . Caperton Chevrolet-Cadiltttc
114 Bm I CoU«g« —  PhoM 625-4145 CoIcbuui, Texas

GOOD VISIO N  IS 
V ITA L TO YOU

Sunday gpeete in  the Bryan
home ]were Mr. and Mrs. Jerry
McAlister and Dee Dee of 
Coleman, the Rev. Donnie Mel­
ton, Mr. and Mrs. Henry Smith, 
Mr. and Mrs. HUton Wise and 
Lon Gray.

AUTOMATIC 
CAR WASH

5 Min.
Open Day & Nigrht

On Needham Street West 
o f T. L. Sparkman’s Wash- 
A-Matic

C!oleman, Texas
ALL BUSINESS 
APPRECIATED
T. L. Sparkman, 

Owner and Operator

BOOT AND 
SADDLE SHOP

Boot Making 
Shoe Repairing 
Saddle Making 
Saddle Repairs

In Our New 
Location

217 Commercial
Coleman, Texas

Regular check-ups make 
sure you’re not neglecting 
eye defects you may be 
unaware of. Don’t delay 
. . .  make an appointment 
with us, soon.

Dr. E.H. Henning Jr 
Optometrist

117 Commercial 
Avenue

f Coleman, Texas 
Phone 625-2228

OFFICE HOURS 
9:00 A. M. to 5:00 P. M. 

Saturdays — 9 to 12

HUNTER9
Get Your Hunting Insurance

Wherever the trails take you on your 
trip this season, protect yourself and 
your loved ones with hunters In­
surance. Big coverage at modest 
cost. Come by and let us taUor your 
hunting coverage to fit your needs.

Santa Anna Insurance Agency
INSURANCE IN ALL ITS BRANCHES 

BILLIE and MONTIE GU’THRIE 
PHONE FI8-3881

VOTE FOR THE 
TEXAN WHO LEADS 

THE FREE WORLD!
For the past eleven months, for the first time in our history, a native son has led 
our nation and the free world. And every Texan can take pride that President Johnson 
has met the awesome burdens of the office with courage, wisdom and restraint.

m  ISSUE TUESDA Y IS S M P IE: WHO CAN BEST LEAD 
OUR NATION IN  A TIME O F CHALLENGE AND PERIL?

To which man do you feel most comfortable entrusting the security and well being 
of yourself and your children for fhe next four years—

A  man who wants to turn back the clock of achievement .  .  a man who has worked 
consistently against progressive measures in the S e n a t e . . .  a man virtually untested 
in a time o f crisis?

O r  •  man who has dedicated his entire life to pubDc servke  . . .  who has demonstrated, 
under rive administrations, progressive leadership in working fo r i  bette r way o f life 
fo r all Americans. A  man who has proved his courage under fire  . . .  has demonstrated 
his unwavering strength to  meet any aggressor with firmness, yet resfreint?

p m io m  JOHNSON h a s  p r o v id ed  r es p o n s ib le .
lEADERSHIP FOR M ORE THAN A QUARTER O F A  CENTURY

For ih m s t  three decades. President Johnson has been a pillar o f strength fo r Texas 
M i tim natioR. As Congressman, as Senator, as M ajority Leader, as Vice Fre sM e n t, 
i i i  l l «  IS Chief E xe c itiv e , he has w ritten a proud record of prepress.

M K T  TEXAN INIESHIBIT LYNDON XIHNSON m ER S  7MF 
EXPERIENCE, TItt PATIB K E, THE INISDCUA, AND T K  
STADILITY K E D B ID Y  THE HATHN! A M  TIN  ER B  

________ WORLD IN  im E  CRITICAL TUEESI

i f t t m o i i t m i u w m i m N i n *

m iTIXAH ’ IB J
(PiMl M . M  by T « m  D w e em tk  Cimamultt»*, Hmator M tL » » , Ckmlmmui)
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Mozelle 4>H Clubbers Hold Regular 
Monthly Meetings For October Last Week

The Mozelle Junior and senior 
4-H Clubs met Monday, October

Goes To Alaska
Technical Sergeant James M. 

Drew, son of Mrs. F. D. And»'> 
son of Bangs, has arrived for 
duty at Reese AFB, after a tour 
of service In Alaska.

Sergeant Drew, a fire pro­
tection supervisor, is assigned 
to an Air Training Command 
(ATC) imit at Reese. His or­
ganization supports the ATC 
mission o f training airmen and 
officers In the diverse skills re­
quired by the naticm’s aerospace 
force.

The sergesmt, whose wife, Rebe, 
is the daughter of Mr. and Mrs. 
Earnest Burney of Taft, has a 
total of 18 years in the service.

19, at the Mozelle school.
Miss Roberta Watters, Assist­

ant County Home Demonstra­
tion Agent, presented a program 
on “money management” at 
both meetings. The senior group 
discussed entries in the upcom­
ing Mozelle Stock Show, sche­
duled for December.

Next meeting was set Monday, 
November 16, at the Mozelle 
school study halL 

Those attending included 
Bobby Livingston, Franclne Mc­
Clure, Gary McClure, Marcus 
Seals, Fredye Slmonton, Curtis 
Skelton, Debra Sparks, Carolyn 
Stoup, Connie Stoup, Caroline 
Throgmorton, Charlene Thoma­
son, Rusty Thweat, Becky Wat­
son, and Beverly Wilson. 

Attending the junior meeting

W WE’VE 
BEEN 
ROBBED e

What a senseless loss: to lose your import­
ant papers, valuable jewelry, family keep­
sakes... valuables that so easily cou ld  be 
safeguarded against theft, misplacement, 
fire, flood, prying eyes...and for only a few 
cents a week. W hy risk delay? Rent a safe 
deposit box here today!

FULL-SERVICE BANKING
Savings •  Checking •  Business Loans #  Auto Loans 
Personal, Farm & Home Loans •  Financial Counsel

Coleman County 
State Bank

Member FDIC 118 West Pecan, Coleman

speem
GOOCH’S — SHORT SHANK

PICNIC pound 2 5 o
CENTER CUT

PORK CHOPS pound 5 5 o
GOOCH’S THICK SUCED

BACON 2 lb. pkg. 8 9 e
FRESH

PORK LIVER pound 1 5 o
HOME MADE PURE PORK

SAUSAGE pound 5 9 o
PRESTONE

ANTIFREEZE gallon 1 .6 9
SUNSHINE KRI8PV
CRACKERS lb. box 29c
BEEF
CUTLETS pound 55c
WOLF — NO. 309 SIZE CAN
Tamales eaeh 29c
WIMJ)* — NO. 393 SIZE CAN
CHILI 2 cans 69c

CRISCO 3 lb. can 6 9 c
BOBOENS INSTANT
Sweet Potatoes carton 29c
DEUCIODS 1 ,
APPIES " pound 10c

HOME MADE PIES
BT MBS. TOM BUSHING

Harvey’s Grocery
MEMBER INDEPENDENT GROCERS, INC. 

PHONE FI8-S6S2

were Debra Cervenka, Gary 
Clevenger, Marlene Harding, 
Troy Harding,' Jan Hass, Louis 
Hass, Ginger Rogers, Deborah 
Stephenson, Kay Stoup, Dana 
Taylor, Keith Thomason, Davey 
Thweat, and Barry Wilson. 
Parents attending included Mrs. 
R. V. Rogers, Mrs. Babb Taylor, 
Mrs. R. C. Sparks, Mrs. Arthur 
Doose and Mrs. W. L. Livingston.

The Miozelle junior 4-H club 
will also hold its next meeting 
(m Monday, November 16, at 
7:30 p.m. at the school.

Ra3miond Clark In 
College ‘Who»s Who’

Raymond Clark, a junior 
mathematics major from Santa 
Anna, has been named to 
"Who’s Who Among Students in 
American Universities and Col­
leges,” at Tarleton State College.

Clark U a 1962 'grathtate of 
Santa Anna High SchpoL An 
active student at Tarleton, he 
serves on the Student Council, 
and as a member of the Men’s 
Dormitory Counselors organiza­
tion.

Selection to “Who’s Who” of­
fers recognition of exceptional 
achievement and outstanding 
effort on the pairt of the indi­
vidual student. A basis of scho­
larship, participation andylead- 
ership in academic and extra­
curricular activities, citizenship 
and service to the school and 
promise of future usefulness is 
used in the selection of stu­
dents to be honored nationally 
in “Who’s Who” .

County Young GOP’s 
Hold Initial Meeting

The Coleman Coimty Young 
Republicans Club was organized 
Thursday night, October 22, in 
Conger’s Club Room in Cole­
man. The club got o ff to a fine 
start with twenty two present 
for the initial meeting.

Tommy Stewardson acted as 
temporary chairman. The busi­
ness consisted of adopting a 
constitution, electing officers 
and chairmen, setting dues, and 
deciding on future meetings.

Officers elected Thursday 
night include Jimmy Lawrence, 
president; Jan Larson, vice 
president; Celeste Dunn, secre­
tary; and Carol Wilson, trea­
surer. Area chairmen are Susarj. 
Kemper, membership; Anthony 
Strawn, campaign; and Carlle 
Hargett, publicity.

The club was organized in the 
midst of the Presidential cam­
paign, but it will continue to 
function throughout the yeax. 
All Coleman County young 
people through college age who 
are Republicans or are inter­
ested in the Republican candi­
dates are invited to attend the 
next meeting on Monday, Octo­
ber 26, at 7:00 p.m. at the Re­
publican Headquarters, in Cole­
man, Lawrence said.

^ r O N E T IIK E  IN E M L A N n  
A C H ES  ANp (M lie  WICRE 
R ELIEV ED  0 7  T H E  APPUCSnON 
O F* JMCy M T T R *  FROM A S T M »  

RAYnSHN.
. . .  slfM  of tkie PMt

“THE OOM> OLD DAtS'T* 
A physical dieck*im,)jpMle 

vdiiie you’re well, ca n ' kfe|ep 
you that way! 8eé your dóe- 
tor. See us for medicines.

Phillips Drag
WB GIVE S.ftH. 
GREEN STAMPS

BOB TURNER’ S SEVENTH
ANNIVERSARY S A IE

FR I., O a ,  3 0  THRU S A T ., N O V . 7
Win One of the Following “Black & Decker Home W ork 
Shop Portable Power Tools. A 11 You Have To Do Is Re­
gister -  DaUy, If You Like -  At Bob Turner’s. No Obliga­
tion -  No Purchase Necessary -  You Do Not Have To Be 
Present To Win.

Register, Any Time During Bob’s Anniversary Sale 
Friday, October 30 Thru Saturday, November 7

First Prize: “Black & Decker” Inch
Portable Power Skill Saw

Second Prize: “Black & Decker” 3/8 Inch
Portable Electric Drill

Third Prize: “Black & Decker”
Portable Electric Saber Saw
Fourth Prize: “Black & Decker”

Portable Electric Sander

This Is The Seventh Anniversary Celebration Sale
At Bob Turner’s

Here Are Some of The Bargains To Be Found 
At Bob Turner’s, During Anniversary Sale:

A Table of Beautiful Western Shirts - Men’s Sizes
Resrular $4.95 Sellers - Now Only $3.95 

(during* this sale only)

Mens Work Socks - White or Random Color 
Selling 4 Pair for $1.00

Heavy Rubberized Men’s Work Type Rain Coats
Only $5.95

Two-Piece Rubberized Rain Suits - Regularly $8.95 
For This Sale — $7.95 Per Suit

Heavy Duty - Lined - American Made - Rubber Knee  ̂
Boots - or 4 Buckle Overshoes — Take Your Choice

Only $5.75 A Pair ? * ,
9 -t

Free Balloons for the Kids — When Accompanied ^
By An Adult.

Prizes Are Given In Cooperation With The 
“Cedar-Crest” Shoe Company.

Names Will Be Drawn and Winners Announced,
At 5dX) pjn., Saturday, November 7

c<n' j  ■ 
1

Cedar-Crest Insulated 
Hunting Boot

lUfvlarty |UJ5

For This Sale 
" Only $12.25 pr.

(^ar-C rest Wellington 
f i Boots

, e, SwMs-w Blaek — Tan «. - v»»
Regnlarly gfjg . „ n A

F o r 'n , U i S a l ¿  '
Only $8.95 pr. ^

BOB TURNER ARHY STORE
319 Commercial Avenue Coleman, Texas 625-47M

>
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S O C I A L  N O T E S
First Baptist Church Class Holds 
Meeting With Mrs. Dovie Chapman

i f ? ;  *“  ‘ » 1 «  0 1 .»  n » n b « .tess In her home Tuesday, Oct­
ober 27, when the T.EXu Class of 
the First Baptist Church met. 
A covered dish luncheon was
Santa Anna Days At 
GOP Headquarters

Friday and Saturday of this 
week have been designated San­
ta Anna days at the Republican 
Headquarters In Coleman, which 
Is In the old Coulson Drug loca­
tion.

Serving as hosts and hostesses 
for the two days will be Santa 
Anna people, imder the chair­
manship of Mrs. C. D. Bruce.

All Santa Anna citizens are 
invited to stop In for coffee and 
cookies during the two days, or 
at any time they may be In 
Coleman, Mrs. Bruce said.

M d two associate member», with 
two more members coming by 
In the afternoon.

The meeting was called to or­
der by Mrs. Byrd Arnold. The 
opening prayer was v(rtced by 
Mrs. Carrie Th(»nas. The devo- 
votlonal, titled “The Study of 
Moses the Great Leader,” was 
given by Mrs. Emzy Brown. The 
social hour and games followed.

HEARING AID CLINIC 
at

SANTA ANNA
1 Can Help You With Your 

HEARING PROBLEM
• Fitting

(New Aids)
•  Service 

(Cleaning &
Repairing of 
All Makes)

•  Batteries 
(20%
Discount)

Robert C. 
Wortley

And New

MAICO
All in the Ear Aid 

Hearing Giasses 
Behind the Ear Aids 

on the Body Aids
Come in for free consultation 
between 9 a.m. and l l  a.m. 

Friday, October 30 to 
White’s Variety Store 

or Call
r PI8-S472-- j

For Home Appointment
MAICO Hearing Aid 

Service
305 B. N. Fisk 

Brown wood, Texas 
Phone MIS-4184

HospHnl Notes
ADMITTED

Mrs. Mary Sue Bleeker, Bangs 
W. Jack Wester, Coleman 
M!t8. C. E. Qasslot, Coleman 
Harry M. Law, Fort Worth 
James V. Tatum, Coleman 
Mrs. Daniel SUler, city 
Mrs. Maurice Rendon, city 
Mrs. E. D. Day, Coleman 
Mrs. H. M. Powers, city 
Mrs. C. M. Cox, Brownwood 
Mrs. Billy G. Lowe, Coleman 
Ben L. Davis, Coleman 
John Buse, city 
Mrs. J. Turney Smith, city 
Mrs. R. Leon Day, Coleman 
Miss Hannah Kimbrough, city 
Mrs. W. W. Bartlett, city 
Mrs. G. F. Morris, Coleman 
Mrs. Louella Conway, Coleman

DISMISSED
Mrs. Cecil Torrez, Brownwood 
James D. Quinn, Coleman 
Mrs. Byrd Williams, Coleman 
Mrs. Maple Adams, Brown- 

wood
Mrs. R. L. (Bob) Steward, 

Rockwood
Mrs. Sameul S. Winger, city, 

deceased
Mrs. Dora Ann White, city 
Silas S. Baker, city 
Mrs. Jim O. Owens, city, de­

ceased
Homer Burden, city 
J. B. Creek, Coleman 
Mrs. Wm. A. Sutherland, May 
Mrs. W. M. Morgan, city 
Raymond DeLeon, city 
Sandra Kay Felty, city 
Mrs. Mary Sue Bleeker, Bangs 
W. Jack Wester, Coleman • 
Mrs. C. K Gasslot, Coleman 
Harry M. Law, Port Worth 
James V. Tatum, Coleman 
Mrs. Daniel Siller, city 
Mrs. Maurice Rendon, city 
Mrs. H. M. Powers, city 
Mrs. Billy G. Lowe, Coleman

Steak -  T-Bone lb. 59e
Seven Steak lb. 49e
Hamburger 3 lbs. 1.00
CAMPBELL — MIX or MATCH

SOUP 2 for 33e
FIRESIDE

CRACKERS Ib. box 19c
DEL MONTE — SIZE 303

PEACHES 3 for 79c
ARROW

PINTO BEANS 2 lbs. 25c
RAVE

Toilet Tissu^. 4 roll pkg. 25c
GIANT SIZE

TIDE , each 09c
PINE^SOL 15 oz. size 46c

A

LEMONSr 3for10c
Í LB. BAG 1
Oranges or Grapefruit 59c
q LB. BAG
Delicious Applo3 .. 49c

Williams Food Store
MEMBER INDEPENDENT GROCERS, INC.

Local Boy Scout 
Froop To Be 
Reorganized

An organizational and re­
chartering meeting for a Santa 
Anna Boy Scout troop will be 
held, Thursday, October 2», at 
the Lions Club Building. Meeting 
time will be 7:15 pm.

BUI WorreU, District Scout 
Executive from Sweetwater, wlU 
be In Santa Anna to help con­
duct the meeting.

All boys between the ages of 
eight and 18, who are Interested 
In Scouting are urged to attend 
this meeting, bringing one or 
both parents If possible. WhUe 
the purpose of the meeting Is to 
orgsmize the Boy Scout troop, a 
spokesman said, boys In the Cub 
Scout age group (eight to 11) 
wUl be helped in joining a Cub 
unit.

Information may be obtained 
by calling Albert Brown, FI8- 
3410, or Bob Parker, Pn8-3545.

SDA Pathfinders To 
Gather Food For 
Needy Saturday

Seventh-Day A d v e n t i s t  
youngsters, ages 6 to 16, of San­
ta Anna, will offer a treat 
rather than the usual trick early 
Saturday evening. Members of 
the local Pathfinder Club, 
Church youth organization 
somewhat similar to Boy Scouts, 
will be calling at your home 
offering the chance of donating 
canned goods for Thanksgiving 
and Christmas baskets to be 
prepared for the needy of the 
community.

The evening’s activities will be 
tmder the leadership of the club 
directors, Mr. and Mrs. Frank 
TUlUer and Mrs. Grant Boat­
wright. Mr. Tulller repots that 
twenty five to thirty youngsters 
are expcted to take part in the 
community service project.

According to the local Ad­
ventist welfare director, Mrs. 
Viola Salisbury, many needy 
families will have happier holi­
days because of the generous re­
sponse of Santa Anna citizens 
when the children appear at 
their door.

Mrs. S. S. Winger 
Passes Away Here

Leah May Winger, 65, pasised 
away In the Santa Anna Hospi­
tal, Thursday, October 22. She 
had been In falling health for 
several years.

She was bom Novembr 28, 
1898, In Sharon, Pennsylvania, 
the daughter of Jacob P. and 
EUizabeth Jones. She is survived 
by her husband, Samuel S. Win­
ger, of Santa Anna; a sister-in- 
law, and a brother-in-law, Wil­
liam Parker, of Santa Anna. She 
waa also smwived by two 
brothers, Morgan Jones, of 
LinesvUle, Pennsylvania; and 
John Jones, of Fowler, Ohio. Al­
so surviving are a number of 
nieces and nephews in Ohio and 
Pennsylvania.

Mr. and Mrs. Winger came to 
Santa Anna five and one half 
years ago and have lived here 
since. Two nieces and one 
nephew attended the funeral. 
Including Mr. and Mrs. Jay 
Dixon, of Greenville, Pennsyl­
vania and Mrs. Norma Bums, of 
Hubbard, Ohio.

Burial was in Santa Anna 
Cemetery following services 
conducted by Rev. Ray R. Os­
borne, minister of the Seventh- 
Day Adventist Church, ol Santa 
Anna. Hosch Funeral Home 
handled arrangements.

Cattlemen Hold 
District Meeting

There will be an important 
district meeting of the Texas 
Sheep and Goat Raisers’ Asso­
ciation on Thursday, November 
5, at the Central High School 
cafeteria, in San Angelo, Texas. 
District 4, which consists of 
Coke, Coleman, Concho, Nolan, 
Rhnnels, and Tom G re«i coun­
ties, will meet to elect directors 
to serve their district for the 
coming year.

A barbecue dinner will be ser­
ved at 7:00 pun. to all members 
and their guests at $1 per per­
son. Following the barbecue, an 
address will be given by Henry 
Batjer, Jr., on estate planning. 
There will also be a report by 
Association officers which will■ jU. f._____________________________

include a discussion on the beef 
futures market.

All ranchers In the above

coimtles are urged to attend sut 
several matters of Importance 
will be discussed.

Specials
Coffee -  Folger’s 1 Ib. 7 5 c
Biscuits -  Kimbell’s 3 cans 25c
KIMBELL’S — 18 OZ. GLASS

Preserves 3 fo r  1.00
CHOCOLATE COVERED

CHERRIES 10 oz. box 49c
Corn -  Our Darling 303 can 19c
Bisquick V -k Ib. box 49c
HUNT’S — Large 2V4 Can

PEACHES 25c
Cake Mix -  Kimbell’s 4 for 1.00
Cream Pies -  Morton’s 3 for 1.00
PATIO BEEF

Enchilada Dinners each 49c
BEEF -  Chuck Roast Ib. 3 9 c
CHILI -  Decker’s I Ib. block 5 9 c
Beef -  Round Steak Ib. 79c
GANDY’S — Vx GALLON

Mellorine 3 for 1.00
Hosch Grocery

9li*r

 ̂ YOU MAY VOTE  ̂
AS YOU PLEASE

ON
NOVEMBER 3RD!

n e re  is  no le g a l requirem ent—no m o ra l o b lig atio u

'5'

r-

%

Regardless of how you have ever v o t e d. .  •
Or in which primory you v o t ed. . .
Or whether or not you v ot ed. . .
Or how your poll tax receipt was stamped. . .

YOU CAN VOTE FOR ANY CANDIDATE
OF ANY PARTY

ON THE NOVEMBER 3RD BALLOT

*1’
U >'■

-.•n

★

Governor Doniel, while Attorney General^ wrote cm opinion on tho^ 
question of party loyalty in which he said, "The courts of Texas hove answered 
this question by holding that the pledge token at the time of voting..inihe primaiy - 
election DOES NOT create o legal obligation." * >

Governor Daniel repeated that opinion by saying that the pittdge" 
on the primary ballot does not obligate anyone "legally or morally" to vote for 
the Democratic ticket in the general election.

(Pol. Ad Paid By Coleman County Republican Committee) ★
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CLASSIFIED ADVERTISING
CLASSIFIED ADVERTISING RATES

First Insertion — Per W ord___________________________4e
Bach Additional Insertion — Per W ord________________ 2c

MINIMUM CHARGE — Sflc PER WEEK 
COPT DEADLINE — 10:00 A. M. WEDNESDAYS

F O R  S A L E  OR T R A D E
POR SALE: Good used relrlger- 

atan, automatic w a s h e r s ,  
wilnger washers, clothes dry- 
vn and gas cook stoves. Terms 
to suit YOU. Qeo. D. Rhone 
Co., Coleman, Texas. 48tfc.

POR SALE: Several nice lots. 
Nice location on pavement. M. 
L. (Rat) Guthrie. 34tfc.

POR SALE: Used Furniture and 
Antiques. W. M. Morgan, 602 
South Houston, phone FI8- 
3802. 25tfc.

POR SALE: Several used TVs In 
good condition. Geo. D. Rhone 
Co., Coleman. Texas. 48tfc. 

SINGER ZIG ZAG 
SELECT-O-MATIC 

Buttonholes, sews on buttons, 
embroiders, fancy, patterns, ect. 
Need party with good credit to 
assume paimients of $7.75, or 
$68.48 cash. Still under guaran­
tee. Write Department 11, in 
care o f The Santa Anna News, 
Post Office Box 697, Santa An­
na, Texas. 39tfc.

FOR SALE: Lovely Maple bed­
room suite, box springs, and 
mattress, kitchen range, din­
ette set, cooking utensils, and 
other small Items. S. S. Win­
ger, 808 Avenue A. Phone FI8- 
3371. 44c.

FOR SALE: One round 42-inch 
dining table in good condition, 
one slightly used Hardwick, 
thirty inch gas range with 
tour burners and large oven. 
Phone DU2-3262. 43c.

W A N T E D - T O  B U Y
WANTED: All kinds of sacks, 

burlap or cotton feed bags. 
Top market prices. Coleman 
Bag 8e Burlap Co., phone FI8- 
3604, Santa Anna. 4tfc

M I S C E L L A N E O U S
IF YOU ARE thinking about 

Improving your home ask us 
for free estimates on the fol­
lowing: Insulation to make 
your home easier to heat and 
cool; all types of siding in­
cluding the new plastic. In­
sulated, asbestos and alum­
inum in lovely colors and 
quality roofing to top it all.
Call MI5-8596 Collect. Smith 
Roofing Company, Brown- 
Wood. 51tfc.

WHEN YOU THINK of grind­
ing, mixing and pelleting, 
think of Hollingsworth Feed 
Mill, Coleman. Texas SOtfc.

UPHOLSTERING
Shirley Upholstering Co.

1504 North Nueces, Coleman

SPECIAL NOTICES
r e g ist e r e d  SHETLAND Stud 

ready for service. Arthur 
Talley. Phone FI8-3130 or 
FI8-3354. 40tfc.

C A R D  O F  T H A N K S
I want to express my deepest 

thanks to aU of the staff of Doc­
tors and Nurses who were so 
good to my wife while she was 
confined in the hospital; and a

m \ u
S E R V I C E
STATION

“Give Me Three Gallons of Gas,
Tm Running: Away From Home!”

We definitely do not approve of this young fellow’s inten­
tions, but must say he knows exactly where to come for the 
best gas and service. Right now we’ll give him enough gas 
to get him home in time for dinner! Hope he’ll remember 
us when he grows up and come back then!

We Give S.&H. Green Stamps

Burden Mobil Station
510 Wallis Ave. Phone FI 8-3191

sp ecia l'th an k s'to ‘ Dr. MuircU 
and to all the wonderful friends 
and neighbors that sent floral 
offerings and food, and to those 
that were so idee to my sister, 
Mrs. Parker and to me at the 
time of our loved ones passing.

Samuel S. Winger. 44c.

We want to express our sin­
cere appreciation to our friends 
for all expressions of sympathy 
during the Illness and death of 
our loved one, Vernon Campbell. 

Mrs. Vernon Campbell and 
family,

Mr. and Mrs. Billy Campbell.

tAiM

Whon News
By MRS. TOM RUTHERFORD

S I T U A T I O N S  W A N T E D
POSITION DESIRED: Business 

college graduate desires secre­
tarial or bookkeeping position. 
Fifteen years experience, can 
furnish references. Phone 
DU2-3262. 44c.

L E G A L  N O T I C E S
LEGAL NOTICE 

NOTICE OF SALE OF
COUNTY REAL PROPERTY 

AT PUBLIC AUCTION 
TO ALL INTERESTED PER­
SONS;

I, Thomas Wrlsten, County 
Commissioner of Precinct 2 of 
Coleman County, ’Texas, do 
hereby give notice of the sale of 
the County’s undivided Interest 
in real property to be held on 
November 2, 1964, at 10 AA4., on 
the Court House steps of the 
CToleman County Court House 
In Coleman, ’Texas. Sold pro­
perty subject to sale shall be 
the County’s undivided' Interest 
in that certain 20.9 acre tract 
of land known as Ranger Park 
out of H. T. St B. RR. Co. Sur­
vey 58,. Abstract 1615 In Cole­
man County, Texas, and being 
fully described in deed of re­
cord in Volume 405, page 200 of 
the Deed Records of Coleman 
Coimty, Texas, to which refer­
ence Is heremade for all pur­
poses; SAVE and EXCEPT 
therefrom, for public roadway 
purposes, a strip of land 50 feet 
in width along the entire East 
side thereof and a strip o f land 
50 feet In width and 242 feet 
In length on the North side 
thereof commencing at the 
Northeast comer thereof.

This notice is given pursuant 
to Article 1577 of Vernon’s Civil 
Statutes of the State of Texas, 
and the undersigned reserves 
the right to reject any and all 
bids.

Done by order of the Commis­
sioners' Court of Coleman Coun­
ty, Texas, this the 7th day of 
October, A. D., 1964.

S/THOMAS WRISTEN,
Commissioner of Precinct 2 

42 -43 -44C .

We received a nice rain Sun­
day afternoon and Sunday 
night, ranging near one inch all 
over the community.

Mr. and Mrs. Floyd Morris and 
son, Jamie Lee, spent from Fri­
day to Sunday afterauoon with 
relatives In Mansfield, Grand 
Prairie and Dallas, reporting a 
wonderful trip.

Mr. and Mrs. Darwin Lovelady 
and Randel were Sunday after­
noon visitors with Mr. and Mrs. 
Thomas Switzer and children.

Lynda Rutherford spent Sat­
urday night with Mr. and M!rs. 
Hilary Rutherford and children 
in Coleman.

Mark Turney of Santa Anna 
spent the weekend with his 
grandparents, Mr. and Mrs. 
Bert Turney.

Mr. and Mrs. John David Mor­
ris of Coleman spent Sunday 
night with his parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. Floyd Morris and Jamie 
Lee. Mr. and Mrs. Joe Floyd 
Morris of Brownwood visited the 
group Sunday afternoon.

Mr. and Mrs. Elec Cooper and 
Ronnie of Rockwood visited with 
Mr. and Mrs. Darwin Lovelady 
and Randel and Oscar Lovelady 
Sunday night.

Mr. and Mrs. Hilary Ruther­
ford and children. Rocky and 
Dena, of Coleman were Sunday 
guests in the Tom Rutherford 
home.

Mk*. and Mrs. Johnie James of 
Brownwood were visitors with 
Mr. smd Mrs. Floyd Morris Mon­
day,

Nell Fitzpatrick visited with 
Rsindel Lovelady Saturday af­
ternoon.

Recent visitors in the Thomas 
Switzer home were Mr. and Mrs. 
J. D. Loyd and Paula of Brady 
and Mr. and Mrs. Wayne Town­
send and children of Abilene.

Mrs. Floyd Morris visited with 
Mr. and Mrs. Dennis Kelley in 
Santa Anna ITiursday after­
noon.

Randel Lovelady spent Wed­
nesday night with Jimmy Ben­
ton of near Santa Anna.

Cheryl Fitzpatrick of Abilene 
spent the weekend with home- 
folks here and visited her 
grandparents, Mr. smd Mrs. 
Snowden of Lohn, Saturday and 
Saturday night.

Cleveland News
By Mrs. Sid Blanton

Mr. and Mrs. R. W. Cupp« at­
tended a CB meeting at Crews

Light Wrecker Service
24 Hours a Day

WALLACE COLLINS, Jr., GARAGE
Guaranteed Used Cars

Mountaineer 
Lineman Of The 

Week
Game of

OCTOBER 23, 1964 
Thb Recognition of Out­
standing Mountaineer Play­
ers Sponsored Every Week By

Santa Anna 
Insurance Asrency

r̂ asP qgy  qc^cs^^ap
Nelson Perry

i t u n m u m m u n t r n i m i i r

m íTOHIBJ
i t t t s m m i a i s a r f u m u m á ^

BaturtlaT. night.
Mrs. John Pony and Mm. Sid 

Blanton left Sunday morning to 
visit relatives In Baytown and 
Houston. Mrs. Perry was getting 
acquainted with a new grand­
daughter, Rae Ann Perry, Infant 
daughter of Mr. and Mrs. Robert 
Perry. Mrs. Blanton visited In 
H ou ^ n  with her mother, Mrs. 
Rose Genz and sistera, Mt. and 
Mrs. Otto Mendell and Mr. and 
Mrs. Jimmy Dietz. They return­
ed home on Tuesday.

Mrs. Jewell Clifton is also get­
ting acquainted with a new 
granddaughter bom  to Mr. and 
Mrs. Leon Day of Coleman.

Tammy Blanton and Susan 
Brooke sp>ent Friday with Mrs. 
R. W. Cupps.

Mn. 3tmA Powem >nd Mm.
Ruby -Ubward visited in Brown- 
wood with Ida Mae Day Satur­
day.

Mrs. Jimmy SchuUe and chil­
dren sp>ent the weekend with 
Mr. and Mrs. Casey Herring, 
Pam and Dale. Mm. Peggy Sikes 
and children visited Sunday af­
ternoon.

Mr. and Mrs. Darrel Cupps 
and children visited Sunday in 
Coleman with Mr. and Mm. Ed­
ward Leonard and family.

Mr. and Mrs. Vernon Penny 
visited In Waco Sunday with his 
sister.

Mrs. Kenneth Sikes and chil­
dren of Brownwood visited her 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. C. W. 
Fleming Sunday^____________ __

(PM. ká. Pali by Pelean a Geaatj DwaewaHc CeauaMlee)

Tax Notice
Save 3 %  On Taxes

All state and County Taxes Paid in Oct­
ober Are Subject to A 3% Discount.

Pay Your Taxes Now and Take Ad­
vantage of This Saving.

IN SANTA ANNA
I Will Be At The Santa Anna National 
Bank All Day Thursday, October 29, To 
Collect Taxes. You Are Invited To Take 
Advantage Of This Opportunity To Get 
Your 1963 Taxes Paid. Poll Taxes Are 
Now Payable, and You May Wish To Get 
Your Poll Tax Also.

John Skelton
County Tax Assessor-Collector

tr
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Vote Early
for

Grand Opening
of

Bailey Lumber 
Company

Saturday, October 31 
-  Entertainment -

Beatles -  Clown -  Music 
Coffee and Cold Drinks

Bailey Lumber
and

Supply Co.
Phone FI8-3891



US Tile Industry Now Facing S e S s  
Threat Unless Government Takes Step^

A $25,000,000 a year Texas In- tariffs on glazed ceramic wall 
jgtry faces serious trouble if tile are reduced during the cur-

_____________- l-A rkf TTO 4.____ a -  __ .7
dustry

k

Expert Service
— WITH

PREMIER
PRODUCTS

Good Year Tires
We Appreciate 
Your Patronage

McCRARY
Premier Station

rent US trade negotiations in 
Geneva, an Industry spokesman 
said here today, Friday.

Dr. Horace J. DePodwin, for­
mer economic consultant to the 
Federal government on tariff 
matters, told aides to Governor 
John Connally that further tar­
iff cuts "would place a severe 
burden on the competitive posi­
tion of our industry, eliminate

Weah McCulloch, Sec.-Treaa. 
Bettle McCulloch, Mgr.

Standard
Abstract Co.

City & County Maps For Sale 
405 Bank Bldg. Colraran

THE '6 S 's  ARE HERE

Let Us Help You Put One 
In Your Garage Today

YOUR FRIENDLY

Santa Anna National Bank
Member FDIC and Federal Reserve Bank of Dallas

N O W l
Big travel bargain 

for cities along Santa Fé
It’s Chico Bargain Fare time again 
on the Santa Fe-^through April 
3 0 ,196S.

For example, a regular round-trip 
ticket coating $100 will be aold at 
the off-season bargain fare of $80,̂  
Round trips costing $76 now will 
be only $d), and rimilar redactions 
will apply for round-trip tickets 
from all stations except for local 
trips within the State of California.

No matter where you travel on 
Santa Fe trains, round-trip bargain 
fares will save you approximately 
20%. Tickets on sale every day with 
a return limit o f 30 days. Yes, bar­
gain fares apply for both round-trip 
coach and first-class tickets.

Now you can leave the car at 
home and save money traveling by 
Santa Fe.

T See the Santa Fe Agent in your 
home town for complete Information

S a n ta  F e

1

jota of tUe woiiceis and force 
some tUe manufacturers out of 
business.’’

Texas tile manufacturers are 
asking the Governor to contact 
President Johnson and Gover­
nor Christian Herter, special 
assistant to the President on 
trade negotiations, urging that 
glazed wall tile be reserved 
from further tariff negotiations.

Under the provisions of the 
Trade Expansion Act of 1962 It 
is possible for the US to reserve 
products from tariff bargaining. 
Unless glazed wall tile is thus 
reserved, the manufacturers 
said, present tariffs could be cut 
as much as 50 percent In the 
trade sessions.

As the result of Increased Im­
ports, Texas manufacturers are 
receiving a shrinking share of 
a rapidly growing US Maiicet for 
ceramic tile, Dr. DePodwin told 
state officials. During the past 
six years the market for wall 
tile in this country has in­
creased 57 percent, while the 
Texas manufacturers share of

the market has. dna ŝed iwr* 
cent. This drop In the market 
share came In spite of a 56 per­
cent increase in productivity In 
Texas plants.

A recent economic study of 
the Industiy reveals that the 
total economic benefit to Texas 
is approximately $25,000,000 a 
year, the economist said, pro­
viding a UvUhood for more than
1.000 workers.

Ceramic tile manufacturing 
plants are located In Santa An­
na, Dallas, San Antonio, San 
Angelo, Palestine, Fort Worth 
and Marshall.

Dr. DePodwin said about 25 
percent of the glazed wall tile 
now used in the United States Is 
imported, but If the present 
trend continues, this will in­
crease to 60 percent by 1970. Im­
ports- o f ceramic mosaic floor 
tile already have reached the 60 
percent level, he said, and dam­
age to that branch of the cera­
mics Industry has been so severe 
that floor tile already has been 
reserved from tariff negotia­
tions.

Dr. DePodwin said the present 
US tariff obviously is no barrier 
to foreign producers, who have 
been taking an ever-lncreaslng 
share of the US market. In the 
first six months of 1964, he said, 
ceramic tile imports Increased 34 
percent, to a record level of
64.324.000 square feet. He said 
tile imports were increasing 
three and one half times as fast 
as overall US imports.

California Is one of the lead­
ing turkey-producing states In 
the nation.

CIVIL D EFENSE . 
A P P R O V ED  

F A L LO U T  SHELTER

$5.00 up
No Qrarge for Children Under 18 

24-Hour Coffoo Shop 
Rodio-Telovision 

Completely Air Conditioned 
FREE INSID E P A R K IN G

HOTEL
] ^ u i l } l a n b

Commercc-Murpliy-MQln Str««l< 
T«l«phene; Rlvanld* 2-6431 

Dallas, Taxas

Tbe Newi, Sant» Anna, Tex>a October X9, UM4 Ragot

YOUR Vote Counts!
V-DAY IS TUESDAY!

. . . VOTE!

TIRES ARE ALWAYS 
A BARGAIN 

at
RUDOLPH’S 

Coleman, Texas

Kenneth Wise Steak House
Formerly Ranch House

Open 6 a. m. to 12 p. m. Daily 

Charcoal Steaks Lots of Parking
407 Fisk (Across from City HaU) Brownwood, Texas

aa

é
5 ?

?e

Now Associated With 
Coleman Monument Works 

Dan Fogarty
Sales Manager

ColemaH Monument Works
DAY PHONE 625-5352 NIGHT PHONE 625-2719 ^

W. A. (Bill) Finlay §
and ^

3  Dan Fogarty — Owners |
À 1301 East 9th St. Coleman, Texas i

^

§ Ì.

§

PRESCRIPTIONS
___  i

O w l Drus Store
“Where Friends Meet” 

Telephone 625-4514
312 Commercial Ave. Coleman

USE
BOiriED
CAS

.Clean and Safe 
Best For Heating 

Higlmr BTU Rattag 

Beat Fm: Cooking

Approved By 
Architects

No Mass 

No Foss

PHONE 625-2925 
Night Pho. 625-2849

Prompt Delivery

Coleman
Butane Gas Co.

ibliiii ................. ...

I am deeply grateful for 
your continued 

confidence and support. 
I hope that I may have 

your vote for re-election 
on November 3rd 

to continue
the important progress 

that we are making 
together.

RE ELECT GOVERNOR JOHNmmiY
FOR A  GREATER TEXA8I

NtUkal ad paid lar by CosaaMy far Gavamor Campalft CamwHt>a, 
Marrlll Caanally. Cbalrman ^
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Goldthwaite
EAGLES

SANTA ANNA fflGH SCHOOL
FOOTBALL SCHEDULE

September 4 : Santa Anna 12, Baird 45 
September 11 : Santo Anna 0, Croes Plains IS

At Goldthwaite SANTA ANNA 
JUNIOR HIGH SCHOOL 
FOOTBALL SCHEDULE

September 18: Santo Anna 0, Oyde 27 
September 26: Santo Anna 0, Bangs 20 
October 2 : Santo Anna 6, Bronte 28 
October 9: Santo Anna 0, Dublin 50

Game Time 8d)0 Septmber 15: Santo Anna 0, Blanket 18 
September 22: Santa Anna 0, Early 0 
Sept. 29: Santo Anna 6, Cross Plains 14 
October 6 : Santo Anna 14, Bangs 6

October 16: Santo Anna 0, Burnet 48 £ w n A ^ % i O A October 13: Santo Anna 6, Goldthwaite 8
October 23: Santa Anna 0, Marble Falls 40 iriO dV UCT. oU October 20: Santo Anna 0, Rising Star 30
October 30: Goldthwaite, there* October 27: Open

November 6: Open 
November 13: Early, here* 
* District Game

1964 November 3 : Open

------ • -------

SUPPORT
THE

MOUNTAINEERS
G&E Hardware & Appliance

HARDWARE HEADQUARTERS IN SANTA ANNA

West Texas Utilities Company
SUPPORTING THE FIGHTING MOUNTAINEERS

Santa Anna Hospital
ALL THE WAY, MOUNTAINEERS!

Western Auto Associate Store
SPORTS SUPPLIES AT WESTERN AUTO

Speck’s Barber Shop
CLIP 'EM, MOUNTAINEERS

R. T. Caperton Chevrolet-Cadillac
CHEVROLET and CADILI.AC in COLEMAN COUNTY

Fairy Williams Barber Shop
BACKING THE MOUNTAINEERS

Coleman County Telephone Co-op., Inc.
OWNED BY THOSE WE SERVE

Central Medical Clinic
SUPPORT YOUR TEAM

Santa Anna Co>op Gin
SUPPORTING THE MOUNTAINEERS

Coleman County State Bank
THE FRIENDY COLEMAN COUNTY BANK

Cliff & Ruth GriU
STOP BT AFTER THE GAME

Mrs. J. R. Gipson, Florist
FOR YOUR GAME CORSAGE

The Man’s Shop
EVERYTHING FOR MEN AND BOYS

Radio Station KSTA
PLAT-BT-PLAT EVERY SATURDAY MORNING

The Ladies Shop
BEHIND THE MOUNTAINEERS

Coleman Gas Company
SERVING COLEMAN AND SANTA ANNA

Taylor Motor Company 
HOME OP THE 50,000 MILE or 5 YEAR WARRANTY

Burden Mobil Service Station
ALL THE WAY WITH THE MOUNTAINEERS

McKee’s Cleaners
WHERE CLEANING IS AN ART

Santa Anna Silica Sand Company
WITH THE MOUNTAINEERS ALL THE W AY

Phillips Drug: store
WIN WITH THE MOUNTAINEERS

First Methodist Church
THE CHURCH OF THE OPEN DOOR

McCrary Premier Station 
YOUR FRIENDLY PREMIER DEALER

Baker’s Gulf Service Station
HOME OF THAT “GOOD GULF”

Santa Anna Quarterback Club
BACKING THE MOUNTAINEERS ALL THE WAY

Coleman Butane Gas Company 
SERVING THE SANTA ANNA AREA

Santa Anna National Bank
YOUR FRIENDLY HOMETOWN BANK

Homer Humble Service Station
GO TO THE GAME WITH ENCO

Coleman County Electric Cooperative, Inc.
OWNED BY THOSE WE SERVE
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SPORTS
Mustangs Try To Run Up Big Score; 
Beat Mountaineers 40-0 Here Friday
Facliig a Marble Falls Mus­

tang team that came to town 
with the stated intention of 
running up as high a score as 
possible, the Santa Anna 
Mountaineers put up a good, if 
outmanned, f i^ t  and kept the 
score considerably below that 
being aimed for by the visitors.

One of three teams, along 
with Ooldthwaite and Burnet, 
given a chance at the District 
9A crown, the Mustangs failed 
to match the scoring total run 
up against the Moimtaineers the 
week before by the Bulldogs of 
Burnet.

Santa Anna kicked o ff to be­
gin festivities, and the Mustangs 
promptly marched 75 yards for 
the touchdown, picking up four 
first downs in the process. The 
score was marked up on a 15 
yard Jaunt by halfback Donald 
Thompson. Another halfback, 
George Nelson, kicked the extra 
point Nelson, 155 pounds, was a 
bother to the Mountaineers all, 
ending up with a total of 16 
points to his personal credit

The touchdown ended scoring 
for the first quarter. An ex­
change of fumbles on consecu­
tive plays, and a trading of 
punts took up most of the time 
remaining in the period, suid the 
clock ran out with Marble Palls 
in possession on its own 37 yard 
line.

Pour first downs later, the 
Mustangs had their second tally, 
this one coming on a five yard 
scamper by Henry Wllkse, and 
Nelson added the one-p<rtnter. 
Wilkes was the vlctlmi of some 
bad luck later in the quarter. 
The 160 pound fullback ran 56 
yards for a touchdown, only to 
have it called back on a penalty. 
On the second play following 
the penalty, Wilkes went over 
frcxn the Santa Anna 47, and 
saw that nm called back by an­
other penalty. This apparently 
winded Wilkes, and the Mus­
tangs sectmd score of the period 
was made by Nelson six plays 
later fr<Mn the Santa Anna

seven yard line. An attempt for 
the two point conversion, on a 
run, failed when the hnH got 
loose in the Marble Palls back- 
field.

In the second half, both teams 
battled without score imtil 2:57 
In the third quarto*, when the 
Mustangs pushed over frtMn the 
home team’s 36 yard line. Nel­
son carried for the score, then 
kicked the extra point, to wrap 
up scoring for the period.

The Mountaineers got their 
passing game going in this 
quarter, completing three of five 
aerials attempted, but the total 
passing yardage gained on these 
three successful tosses was two 
yards.

In the final period, apparently 
trying to run up the score, the 
Mustangs unveiled a passing at­
tack to go with their ground 
game, completing four of nine.

The period opened with Mar 
ble Falls in possession of the 
pigskin on the Santa Anna 40 
yard line. A ground play carried 
to the 34, and then quarterback 
Ellie Foster unleashed a pass to 
end Roy Myers for the score. 
Nelson kicked the extra point 
again, of course, and the score 
stood at 34 for the Mustangs 
and 0 for the Mountaineers.

The last two times in the 
game that the Santa Annans 
held the ball they fumbled it, 
and lost it, on the first play 
from scrimmage. The second 
time Uals happened, the Marble 
Fallers fell on it on the Moun­
taineer 35. Two plays carried to 
the Mountaineer 15, but a pen­
alty and headsup defensive play 
by Santa Anna moved the visi­
tors back to the 34 yard line. On 
the last play of the game, the 
Ellie Foster to Roy Myers combo 
clicked again on a pass-run 
play, with zero seconds showing 
on the scoreboard clock as My­
ers ambled over the double 
stripe for the score. 'DTdng to 
add two more points, the Mus­
tangs went for the pass, it was 
incomplete, and the final score

stood at 40-0.
The Mustangs ground out 18 

first downs, compared with four 
for the local team. Santa Anna 
tried nine passes, completed 
four, for a total of eight yards, 
while Marble Falls was gaining 
133 yards on five completions in 
10 tries. Santa Anna punted 
seven times, averaging 27 yards 
per kick, and Marble Falls kick­
ed three times for a 33 yard 
average. The Mountaineers lost 
the ball three times on fumbles 
while recovering a pair of Mus­
tang mlscues. Neither team; lost 
the ball on a pass interception. 
Marble Falls was penalized 10 
times for a total of 110 yards, 
while the Mountaineers were 
drawing 55 yards mi seven 
Judgements. Santa Anna gained 
43 yards on the ground, while 
the Mustangs were racing for 
291 yards.

The game in a phrase: Walt 
till next year (or the year after).

Ricks of
the Week

Three straight weeks picking 
all the games right. We won’t 
even comment for fear of Jinx­
ing our lucky streak, which has 
run our season percentage to 
.733. However, a couple of tough 
choices this week may bring an 
end to the perfect string. Jinx 
or no Jinx.
Burnet at Marble Falls: In the
preseason predictions. Marble 
Falls was ranked second in Dist­
rict 9A, with Burnet third, A- 
gainst a common opponent, 
Santa Anna, the Mustangs scor­
ed 40 points while the Bulldogs 
tallied 48. In a mild upset, we 
pick Burnet.
Early at Rochelle: Bangs is the 
common opponent in this non- 
district clash, and the compari­
son helps little. Bangs beat both 
Early and Rochelle by Identical 
6-9 scores. Early is Involved in 
a losing streak, and we think it 
will continue. Rochelle by about 
two TD’s.
Santa Anna at Goldthwaitc: 
There is always a chance. But 
not m\u5h of one, we are afraid. 
Ooldthwaite.

Mrs. James Owens 
Dies Here Thursday

Mrs. James O. Owen, 75, died 
in Santa Anim Hospital, Thurs­
day, October 22.

Bom in Bell County, Mrs. 
Owen had resided in Santa An­
na for more than 50 years. She 
is survived by her husband, who 
she married in 1007; two sons, 
C. R. (Ray) Owen, Santa Anna, 
and Othar B. Owen, Coleman; 
one daughter, Mrs. Madie 
James, Santa Axma; 10 grand- ( 
children and 15 great grand­
children.

Funeral services were held in 
the chapel of Hosch Funeral 
Home, with Rev. Raymond 
Gary, minister of Northside 
Baptist Church, and Rev. Ray­
mond Jones, of First Baptist 
Church, In charge. Burial was 
in Santa Anna Cemetery.

■riM News, 8anU AxoRt Tax—, Oetabw » ,  1N4 Paga U

Rev. James Ford and family 
of Santa Anna were dbmer 
guests with his parents, Mr. and 
Mrs. M. A. Ford Sunday. Mrs. 
Jimmy Lancaster and children 
of Blanket spent the afternoon 
with them.

Certainlyf simple 

honesty is not 

too much to 

demand of men 

in government^ ^

VOTE FOR BARRY

GOLDWATER
iN Y0ÜR HEART, YOU KNOW HE'S RIGHT
Politk»l «d paid for by Qoldwat.r For Pr*sid.nt CommittM, Tad Smith, chairman.

J. D. Howard, Jr., returned to 
his home in Mldklff after 
spending several days with his 
parents, Mr. and Mrs. J. D. 
Howard.

A ccesso ries  —

that work “hand-ln-glove” to make that new en­
semble one that will be “remembered” . . .

Our line includes all that is beautiful. . .  and 
unusual.
LAY AWAY NOW FOR CHRISTMAS. . .  whether it’s to be
a festive new outfit for yourself, or a memorable gift for some 
one special. . .

AT

E s t e l l e * s  j C a d i e s  S h o p
304 Commercial — Phone 625-4928
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s t m t  C LA U S  S A V S :
SHOP SANTA ANNA

Get Hometown Service, Top Quality, and Rock-Bottom P r i c e s ,  
Plus a Chance at Fabulous Prizes -

1st Prize -  21 Inch Color TV ($550 Value) ^ 
2nd Prize -1 6  Inch Portable TV ($150 Value)  ̂

★  3rd Prize -  58 Piece, 8 Place American
Dinnerware Dishes ($40 Value)

4th Prize -  Coming Ware Set ($40 Value)
Tickets Available With Purchase of $1.00 or More From Any Participa­
ting Merchant Drawing Thursday, December 24.
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SPONSORED BY THESE PAtmCIPATING MERCHANTS

0

Phinipe Drug 
Brown’s Grocery 
Harvey’s Grocery 
Williams Fruit Stand 
Modem Way Laundry 
The Santa Anna News 
EUu^idge Texaco Station 
Santa Anna Lumber Company 
Santa Anna Insurance Agency

Ladies Shop 
G&E Hardware 
Moore’s Mercantile 
Linnie’s Beauty Shop 
Coleman Gas Company 
Santa Anna Liona Club 
Weotam Auto Associate 

■t Texas Utilities Company

Clover Grill 
Truck Harbor 
Hosdi Brothers 
MeKee Cleaners 
L. A. Welch Garage 
White’s Variety Store 
MeCrary’a Premier Station 
C. F. CampbeD Golf SUtion 
Coleman County Telephone Co-op

Piggly Wiggly 
Rider’s Garage 
Baker’s Golf StaUon 
Santa Anna Co-op Gin 
Burden’s Mobil Station 
Talley’s Sinclair Station 
Homar’s  Humble Statimi 
Santa Anna Tile Company 
Santa Anna National Bank 
Santa Anna Silica Sand Company
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SANTA ANNA 
mGH SCHOOL 
HONOR ROLL

FIRST SIX WEEKS 
HONOR ROLL

SENIORS: I^mda Rutherford, 
"Velda CuUins, Karen McCluskey, 
Ruth Ann Walker, Lawanda 
Homer, Nelson Perry, Barbara 
Baucom and Bobbie Neill.

JUNIORS; Eugene Davenport, 
Gary Rider, Warren Wallace, 
Pamela Garrett, Stanley Mc- 
Swane, Lois Simmons, Anita El­
lis, and Linda Mclntire.

SOPHOMORES: Jean Robi-
nett, Beth Irick, Leanna Poliock, 
Norma Jo Eubank and Marguer­
itte Homer,

FRESHMEN: Carolyn Rowe.

Annual growth in Texas na­
tional forests is estimated to be 
300,000,000 board feet.

£ nco
Sign of Happy 

Motoring
Complete One- 

Stop Service
CRUSHED OR 

BLOCK ICE

Homer Humble 
Service Station

WE GIVE S ^ .  
GREEN STAMPS

Cole-Anna
Drive-In Theatre

Coleman. Texas

THURSDAY - FRIDAY 
AND SATURDAY

OCTOKR 29-30-31
ALFRED HIITCHCOCK

“MARNIE”

LETICIA ROMAN in

“The Evil Eye”

O A K
Drive-In Theatre

Coleman, Texas

THURSDAY - FRIDAY 
AND SATURDAY

OCTOBER 29-30-31
FRANK SINATRA in

“Robin and The 
7 Hoods”

“For Those Who 
Think Young”

R a n c h o
Downtown Theatre

Coleman, Taxas

SATURDAY 
OCTOBER SI 

10:45 PM.
HAIXOWEEN

MIDNIGHT
SHOWrv

BORIS KARLOFF in

“Corridors of Mood”
DONnr MISS IT!

Delicious or Rome Beauty

APPLES
Patio — 12 Oz. — Beef
Enchilada Dinner

lb.

each 5 9 o
m i

Young Tender

Turkey Hens

34« LB.
9-12  Lb. Average

CRISCO 
3 lbs. 0 9 c  

H unt-N o. 2^2 Can
PEACHES 25c

TOMATOES
12  ̂ LB.

LEn U C E 
1 5 ^  HEAD

A V <’■

• •• • • ■ - ^  tmm • •

“Trick or Treat”
CANDY 160 Pieces

HersheyBars 
Mr. Goodbar 

Peanut Butter Logs 
Hershey Krackel

i.

Gooch Thick Sliced
BACON
CLUB
STEAK

«•
>2 lb. box 98c

Lean and Meaty
BEEF BIBS "  "S ' " pound 29c
GOOCH
SAUSAGE 2 lb. bag 8 9 c

SEVEN
STEAK
ARM
ROAST
CHUCK
ROAST

pound 49c
pound 49c
pound 39c

FRESH GROUND
BEEF

LOIN or T-BONE
STEAK pound 79c

pound 3 9 e  I LEG 0 ’ LAMB

10 0 %  For The Mountaineers


