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Pierce Walker 	 Jane Seitz 

Mobeetie Parade Winners Named 

Wheeler Co. 4-H 

d Bake Show Is Held 
Clover Kids Michaela Bailey, 

Madalyn Brdecko, Morgan 
Brdecko and Don Butler and 4-
Her's Payton Austin, Ilene Butler, 
and Matthew Flowers participated 
in the Wheat Bread Workshop. 
The youth learned how to activate 
yeast with warm water, how to 
measure and mix the ingredients, 
how to knead the dough and the 
process for rising. The youth used 
a Conventional Whole Wheat 
Bread Recipe which is available at 
the Extension Office. Ar 	Payton Austin son of Liz and 
Joe Austin of Wheeler received 
1st place in the 4-H Wheeler 
County Bake Show and Mathew 
Flowers son of Patti and Cletis 
Flowers of Shamrock received 2nd 
place. The youth made whole 
wheat bread and were judged by 
the breads appearance, color, 
moisture content, texture, light-
ness, flavor, and nutrition content. 
Congratulationson a job well-done! 

Payton Austin will represent 
Wheeler County 4-H in the District 
Bake Show September 13 at the 

6 the Tri-State Fair. Best of Luck to 
Payton!! 

Thriftway and Hyland's Phar-
macy donated prizes for the 
Wheeler County Bake Show. They 
continue to show their support for 
the youth of our community. 

 

ti 

 

DO IT THIS WAY: The Wheeler County 4-H Bake Show and Project 
was held — in Wheeler. County Extension Agent Karen Tellman is 
shown here assisting the youngsters with their project. Pictured are (I. 
to r.) Don Butler, Matthew Flowers, Payton Austin, Karen Tellman, 
Michaela Bailey, Ilene Butler, Morgan Brdecko and Madalyn Brdecko. 

Mr. and Mrs. Richard Griesman 

OLD SETTLERS GATHER AT MOBEETIE Mobeetie Ex-Students Gather 
1CW

WC HI TAFT 

LEDITOR 
By Louis C. Sias 

We had a nice coolerday for the 
Old Mobeetie Settlers Reunion on 
Monday, in fact it was too cool for 
some. 

- cwe — 
There was rain in some parts of 

the area. The measurement for 
Wheeler was 0.26. The tempera-
ture has been in the middle 50's for 
the. mornings. 

Patriotic 
Ceremony 

A Patriotic Ceremony will be 
held Thursday, September 11, 
2003, at the Wheeler I.S.D. 
flagpole at 8:48 a.m. 

Everyone is invited to attend 
this short celebration of Ameri-
can pride and encouraged to 
wear Red, White and Blue. 

Mobeetie fifty-second Old Set-
tlers Reunion was held Labor Day 
with 532 in attendance. Announcer 
was Chuck Hogan. Several old 
timers furnished music. Visiting 
was held in the morning following 
the registration. Paul Hathaway 
auctioned off the cakes and pies 
for the Fort Elliott Booster Club. 

Rewards of Oldest Man present 
went to Pierce Walker. The Oldest 
Woman Present was Jane Seitz. 
The Oldest resident born and still 
in the county went to Pierce Walker. 
The one traveling the fareast dis-
tinct were Mr. and Mrs. Richard 
Griesman of Grand Island Ne-
braska who came forward. Later 
one from Florida came up. New 
officers for next year are Jackie 
Don May-President; Ernest 
Lancaster-Vice President; and 
Secretary and Treasurer Bill 
Ridgway. 

Fun Night, Benefit 
Auction ForA.Tipps 

There will be a Fun Night and 
Benefit Auction at Wheeler City 
Park on Saturday, September 13, 
at 6:00 p. m. This event is to raise 
funds to help defray the expenses 
of a KIDNEY TRANSPLANT for 
ADAM TI PPS. Adam is the son of 
Becky Tipps and Terry Tipps and 
the grandson of Dick and Ruth 
Irvine, and Dean & Georgia Tipps. 

Hamburgers will be served from 
6:00 p.m. to 7:00 and will be fol-
lowed by homemade ice cream. 
Musical entertainment will follow 
the mealtime. 

The auction will follow at 7:30 
p.m. Friends and neighbors are 
encouraged to bring auction items. 
Also, pledges of hunting, fishing, 
wildlife watching trips, Bed & 
Breakfast stays, baseball and foot-
ball trips, etc., will be welcomed 
and are being taken by individu-
als, listed below with telephone 
numbers and area towns of con-
tact. Area residents are urged to 
contact someone on this list to 
pledge items. A super 3-5 days 
fishing trip to Lake Texhoma, pro-
vided by M/M James Verden and 
M/M Billy Wiggins will go to the 
holder of the lucky $10.00 dona-
tion ticket to be drawn during the 
auction. Tickets are available from 
any of the area contacts listed 
below. 

Adam Tipps Kidney Fund ac-
counts are currently set up at 
Wheeler Banking Center and First 
State Bank of Mobeetie for cash 
donations. For those who wish to 
make donations through their 
church, the Methodist churches in 
Wheeler and Allison are also com-
mitted to taking these. 

Remember to bring lawn chairs 
for this fun evening. Auction items 
need to be at the park by 6:00 p.m. 
Saturday, Sept. 13. 

M/M James Verden-Wheeler-
826-5965 (Primary Contact & Or-
ganizer) 

M/M Richard Meadows-Briscoe-
323-9253 

M/M Hiram Begert-Allison-375-
2346 

M/M Thomas Helton-Wheeler-
826-5853 

MIM Rick Carstensen-Wheeler-
826-3079 

M/M David Hefley-Briscoe-375-
2553 

M/M Larry Elmore-Allison-375-
2413 

M/M Jay Godwin-Canadian-
323-6213 

M/M Charles Kuntz-Wheeler-
826-3630 

Mickey Mitchell-Shamrock-256-
3631 

Schedule Change 
The Wheeler Junior High 

football game originally sched-
uled for here on September 4 
will be played at Claude. 

The annual Mobeetie parade 
was held August 30 with opening 
prayer by Thomas Helton. Joe 
Shelton presented the American 
flag on horseback. Pam Jones 
sung the National Anthem. 

Judges for the parade were 
Margaret Dorman, Ann Jones and 
Thomas Helton. Paul Hathaway 
announced the parade. The pa-
rade opens with the DARE Sheriff 
pickup. 

Wanda Estes was the parade 
organizer. The Mobeetie Fire truck 
number 41 was the first to follow 
the DARE pickup. Next was Joe 
Shelton with the American Flag 
and Jackie Don May with the Texas 
Flag. The Old Settlers float was 
next. The class of 1953 was in a 
convertible. 

Winners first place in antique 
cars the convertible owned by Carl 
Alexander and Bobby Galmor. 

Vickie Goldsmith won first in the 
skaters division. 

Jayton Childress won first in the 
tricycles. 

In the bike divisions first place 
went to Tiffany Hovey, second 
place went to Daniel Hovey, third 
place went to J. W. Goldsmith. and 
fourth place to ,Roland Newman. 

A birthday party was given in 
honor of Estelle Orr on her 100th 
birthday, August 23, 2003, by her 
children, Chuck, Louise, Robert 
and Geniva Hogan and the McLean 
Care Center, at McLean, Texas. 

The room was decorated with 
red helium filled balloons and two 
foil Happy Birthday balloons. The 
individual tables were laid with red 
tablescloths, a bud vase with red 
arid white rose buds, resting on a 

CITY OF MOBEETIE 
NOTICE 

The City of Mobeetie will hold 
a public meeting prior to the 
regular meeting Monday Sep-
tember 8, 2003 at 7:00 P.M. at 
the Mobeetie City Hall, 301 S 
Wheeler to adopt 2003-2004 

Budget and set Tax Rate. 

In the non-commercial division 
first place went to Fort Elliott CISD 
Junior High C heerleaders and foot-
ball teams, second place was the 
Fort Elliott CISD High School Foot-
ball team. Third place went to the 
class of 1963 and fourth place 
went to Clay White on Jet Ski. 

4 Wheelers first place went to 
Debbie and Shelby Wallis and 
second went to Kasley and 
McKaylee Swift. 

Go Cart division winner was first 
place Sarah Horn and Payton May, 
and second went to Hide Town 
Trading with Dawson Clark and 
Taylor and Haley Sparks. 

In the Commercial Division First 
place went to Mobeetie Post Of-
fice. 

Horses Division first place went 
to Kory McLaughlin, second place 
went to Gatlin Duncan, third place 
to Veronica Hungate, and fourth to 
Lamari Lancaster. 

In the Buggy and Wagon Divi-
sion first place with a stagecoach 
went to Silver Mesa Ranch and 
second place with a buggy went to 
Rocking S Ranch. 

All the children up to fifth grade 
got a ribbon for participating in the 
parade. 

white doily. Estelle was wearing a 
red floral dress with red booties. A 
small corsage of red and white 
rose buds rested on her shoulder. 

Refreshments of Birthday Cake 
decorated with red roses having 
"Happy 100th Birthday Estelle", 
strawberry punch, nuts and mints 
were served by members of the 
Care Center and her many friends. 
The napkins were red with silver 
print having the same inscription. 
The serving table was laid with an 
ecru lace cloth over a cream table-
cloth. A bouquet of red roses and 
other lovely flowers served as the 
centerpiece. Two pretty banners 
graced the walls with the same 
inscription. Bookmarks were given 
to those attending with a red rose 
and the same inscription tied with 
red and silver ribbon and a portion 
of her favorite scripture, Psalms 
23. These were made by Geniva, 

(Continued Page 6) 

The Mobeetie ex-students met 
August 30 at the Fort Elliott CISD 
Mobeetie Campus. Registration 
began at 10:00 a m. Visiting was 
held all day till the program began 
at 4:00 p. m. Louise Bailey Presi-
dent called the meeting to order 
and welcomed everyone. She an-
nounced the decoration were to 
honor the troops. The room was 
decorated in red, white and blue 
flags and etc. Also yellow ribbons 
were used. Pledge to the Ameri- 
can flag was given. Names of the 
deceased since the last reunion 
were read and Hugh Jeffus led in 
prayer in remembrance of these. 
Betty Haines secretary read the 
minutes from the last reunion and 
they stood approved as read. 
Maurita Stribling gave the treasur-
ers report and it stood approved 
as given. 

Classes ending in 3 were hon-
ored. There was one from the class 
1933, which was Lillie Ford from 
California. She gave a talk about 
the class. Augusta Brown gave a 
talk about the class of 1943. Class 
of 1953 had 5 present that gradu-
ated and 4 more that was in the 
class and moved or dropped out 
before graduation. Waylon 
Newman gave a talk for the class. 
Those present were Waylon 
Newman, Vondell Wallis, Sandra 
Barker Hold, Lavada Hogan Helton 
and Carl Alexander. Those that 
went to school with them were 
Lanier Mote, Martha Abbott Futch, 
Bill Thomas and Larry Beck. Zana 
Corse Jones had done a book 
about the class in honor of her 
mother Aline Walker Corse and 
presented a copy of it to each one 
of those in the class present. The 
class also visited Gary Morris and 
presented him one also he was in 
their class when he had to drop out 
due to the polio. The class of 1963 
had 3 present. Toney Dickey gave 
a talk about his class. The class of 
1973 had 1 present, which was 
Kent Wallis, and he talked about 
the class. There was none present 
from the class of 1983. 

Ex-teachers present were 
Charlsey Scribner and Jerry 
Swans. 

Henry Lane of St. Thomas North 
Dakota won the Gary Morris Fight-
ing Hornet Award for traveling the 
farthest to attend. He came 1365 
miles. 

Pierce Walker won the plaque 
for the oldest student in atten-
dance. He is 95. 

Joe VanZandt president of the 
Old Mobeetie Texas Association 
presented Augusta Brown with a 
plaque for making the quilt to be 
given away by the association to 
raise funds to restore the old grade 
school building. He also presented 
the Totty Quilting Club with a 
plaque for quilting the quilt. The 
quilt will be given away December 
4. The quilt has the grade school 
building on it. 

The nomination committee with 
Bernice Hefley given their report 
suggested President Louise Mat-
thew Bailey, as president, Ruth 
Morris Tucker as Vice President, 
Patricia Trimble Corse as secre-
tary and Maurita Laman Stribling 

Cheyenne Pioneer 
Days September 6 

The Sixth Annual Pioneer Day 
is coming! Granny's Arts and Crafts 
Show has joined us this year on 

(Continued Page 6) 

Clothing Giveaway 
Wheeler Church of Christ will 

hold their annual clothing give-
away on Saturday, Septem-
ber 27, 2003. Please contact 
Judy Woollard or Debbie 
Finsterwald with your dona-
tions of clean clothing. Great 
need for children's clothing. 

Augusta Brown 
. .. received plaque for quilt 

Pierce Walker 
. .. Oldest Student 

as treasurer. There were no nomi-
nations from the floor and these 
were elected. 

Ashley Jones drew the winning 
name for the quilt, which was Rosa 
Brewer of Pampa. 

There were 212 in attendance. 
Bernice Hefley and J. W. Turner 
took care of the door prize draw-
ings. Winners were Larry Thomas, 
Joy Haynes, Gary Rowell, Pierce 
Walker, Virginia Mixon, Johnny 
Reynolds, Jeanette Spencer, Mary 
Carter, Jimmy Walker, MelbaSeitz, 
Joyce McIntire, Carola Alexander, 
Betty Haines, Clyde Patton, Doyce 
Watson, Sidney Lynch, Vondell 
Wallis, Toney Dickey, Jackie 
Wallis, Jean Jeffus, Jack Hefley, 
Granville Gilstrap, Wanda Stringer, 
Sylvia Pringle, Carol Ann Scribner, 
Doyle Grimes, Peggy Shelton, 011ie 
Brown, Kimberly Morgan, Kathy 
Hogan, Arica Lancaster, Omega 
Levitt, Larry Shugart, Matt Sims 
Jr., Alta Hogan, Nelda Lancaster 
and Louise Bailey. 

The group sung Happy Birthday 
to Hugh Bailey who turned 85. 
Everyone was invited to attend 
Hugh's birthday party to be held at 
the First Baptist Church fellowship 
Hall from 7 to 9. The meal was 
enjoyed by all. Steve Walker ca-
tered it. 

Hospital Notes 
Assisted Livina  

Verne Lohberger 
Gladys Pannell 
Glen Elmore 
Odra Christopher 
Audie Sivage 
Ruth Ledbetter 

New Admissions  
8/24 	Beckey Zybach 
8/28 	Lela Pride 
8/29 	Glen Turvaville 
Dismissals  
8/25 	Wayne Benefield 
8/26 	Jerry Mounce 
8/28 	Beckey 
9/2 	Lela Pride 

- cwe — 
The cooler weather is certainly 

being enjoyed by most. 
— cwe — 

A 'Fun Night and Benefit Auc-
tion' has been set for Saturday, 
September 13, to benefit Adam 
Tipps, who recently underwent a 
kidney transplant. 

— cwe — 
le 

	

	The '03 Mustangs will officially 
kick off the football season Friday 
night with a game against West 
Texas there. Good Luck, Mus-
tangs! 

— cwe — 
The Ft. Elliott Cougars will open 

their season with a game against 
Hedley on Thursday evening at 
Briscoe. Go Cougars! 

— cwe — 
The Lady-Cougars have been 

playing volleyball. Good Luck! 
- cwe — 

We went to OKC over the week- 
* end and then went to Hinton for 

dinner Sunday with the 
Meriwethers. We came home early 
Monday and I did some work on 
the football page. 

- cwe — 
We have a new business in 

Wheeler. Sibyl Clark has opened 
Sweetwater Creek Gallery and 
Studio on Oklahoma St. She will 
have art work for sale and will have 
her classes there. 

(Continued Page 6) 

Rosa Brewer and Louise Bailey 

Birthday Party For Estelle Orr, Aug. 23 

Lillie Ford, Class of '33, and Henry Lane 
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With the recent Ten 

Conmandments Monument 
controversy, it is difficult to come 
up with the right solution, but I 
think it is more important that 
we actually know what the Ten 
Commandments say, than to 
be concerned about a piece of 
stone. The Ten Command-
ments arefound in Exodus 20:1-
17: 

And God spoke all these 
words: "I am the Lord your God, 
who brought you out of Egypt, 
out of the land of slavery. You 
shall have noother gods before 
me. You shaft not make foryour-
self an idol in the form of any-
thing in heaven above or on the 
earth beneath or in the waters 
below. You shall not bow down 
to them or worship them; for I, 
the Lord your God, am a jeal-
ous God, punishing the chil-
dren for the sin of the fathers to 
the third and fourth generation 
of those who hate me, but show-
ing love to thousands who love 
me and keep my command-
ments. You shall not misuse 
the name of the Lord your God, 
for the Lord will not hold anyone 
guiltless who misuses his name. 
Remember the Sabbath day by 

keeping it holy. Six days you 
shall labor and do all your work, 
but the seventh day is a Sab-
bath to the Lord your God. On it 
you shall not do any work, nei-
ther you, nor your son or daugh-
ter, nor your manservant or 
maidservant, nor your animals, 
nor the alien within your gates. 
For in six days the Lord made . 
the heavens and the earth, the 
sea, and all that is in them, but 
he rested on the seventh day. 
Therefore the Lord blessed the 
Sabbath day and made it holy. 
Honor your father and your 
mother, so that you may live 
long in the land the Lord your 
God is giving you. You shall not 
murder. You shall not commit 
adultery. You shall not steal. 
You shall not give false testi-
mony against your neighbor. 
You shall not covet your 
neighbors house. You shall not 
covet your neighbor's wife, or 
his maidservant or maidservant, 
his ox or donkey, or anything 
that belongs to your neighbor." 

Know and live the Command-
ments, regardless of whether or 
not a monument stands in some 
other slate's Judicial building. 

Shawn D. Johnson 

An Invitation: You are cordially in-
vited to attend any of the weekly 
services of the Wheeler Church of 
Christ which meets at 1001 S. Alan 
Bean Blvd, in Wheeler, Texas 

Services: 
Sunday Bible Study .. . 10:00 A.M. 
Sunday Morning Worship 10:55 A.M. 
Sunday Night Worship .... 6:00 P.M 
Wednesday Bible Study ... 7:00 P.M. 

•	 

Remember the Old Mobeetie 
Texas Association will have their 
regular monthly meetings Thurs-
day September 4 at 7:00 in the 
Lodge Building. 

Densel and Fern Reed and Dale 
and Melba Corroran visited Tues-
day night with Pauline Barnes in 
Wheeler. 

The grandson of S. I. 
Lund egreen was kicked by a horse 
and taken to Parkview Hospital 
where Life Star took him to Ama-
rillo. He was kicked in the head. He 
is 3 years old. He is okay and was 
able to attend the Parade on Sat-
urday. 

Melba Corcoran took Lorene 
Rector to Pampa Wednesday to 
visit with Addie Callan. Lorene and 
Addle have known each other since 
they were about 13 years old. They 
went out to Kentucky Fried Chicken 
for lunch. There they met Audrey 
Seitz and LaNell Riggs and had 
lunch together. Eura Riley and 
Hannah Fay Chapman came in 
and they got to visit with them for a 
few minutes. Eura and Addle went 
to grade school at the Sweetwater 
School just east of Wheeler and 
north close to the Sweetwater 
Creek. They all had a nice visit and 
then went shopping at Wal-Mart 
before coming home. 

Bill and Dutch Elliott went home 
Wednesday to attend the first birth-
day party for their great-grand-
daughter on Thursday. 

Scott Neighbors went to Altus to 
visit his mother Fredda Neighbors 
and grandmother Ruth Fox. He 
also had a doctor's appointment 
on Wednesday. 

Arthur Don and Willene Burke 
went to Amarillo Wednesday. Don 
had two doctors' appointments. 
Don was put in the VA hospital for 
some treatments. At news time 
Don was still in the hospital and 
scheduled for surgery on Tues-
day. Remember him in your 
prayers 

Bill and Patsy Caswell went to 
Amarillo Wednesday for Bill's doc-
tor appointment. After Bill had lots 
of lab workthey went to the VA and 
stayed with Don and Willene until 
he was entered into the hospital. 
Bill will get his reports later this 
week. Remember him in your 
prayer& 

Those quilting Thursday at the 
Tony Quilting Club was hostess 
Augusta Brown, Sidney Lynch, 
Jane Seitz, Audrey Seitz, Elaine 
Martin, Betty Rogers, Bobbie 
Ehmann and Melba Corcoran. 
Those coming by to visit were Ines 
Loveday of Tyler, Nelda Lancaster 
of Pampa and Ora Swans of Mount 
Vernon. Augusta's quilt was fin-
ished and Audrey's started. Au-
gusta was a nine-patch quilt. 
Audrey's is a double wedding ring. 

Ora Swans of Mount Vernon, 
Ines Loveday of Tyler and Nelda 
Lancaster of Pampa visited their 
Aunt Estelle Hodges Thursday. 

Bob and Jerry Meller and 

BY C.ELLULAPONI 
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D.L. and Coleen Rector of Ama-
rillo visited Saturday with his 
mother Lorene Rector. They also 
visited again on Monday and at-
tended the Old Settlers. 

Virginia Mixon spent the week-
end with her motherOrville Green-
house. Sunday afternoon they 
picked Lorene Rector up and went 
riding around. They also visited 
with Danny and Betty Rogers. 

Gary and Marilyn Grimes of 
Amarillo brought Doyle and Bulah 
Grimestrom Guymon to the School 
Reunion. They also visited with 
Marion and Ethel Grimes. 

LaRue Pierce and Wanda 
Stringer spent the weekend in 
LaRue's house in Mobeetie and 
attended the School Reunion and 
the Old Settlers. 

Leola Stuart went to Shamrock 
Wednesday to visit with Bulah 
Stuart. 

Leola Stuart visited Saturday 
with Jerry and Cheryl Richardson, 
Tyler and Katie and Eddie and 
Amy Richardson. 

Sunday Leola Stuart went to 
Erick and visited with Ivy 
Richardson others there were 
Susie Gifford, Charmagne, 
Phoebe, and Chris of Odessa, 
Marsha Richardson, William 
Billingsley and Mike and Rhonda 
Richardson all of Erick. 

OLD JAIL 

USEUM NEWS 
The Mobeetie Jail Museum has 

been getting the grounds ready for 
the weekend events. Nathan 
Lancaster and Tommy Corcoran 
got the grounds mowed. Bill Elliott 
worked some on the grounds. Dale 
Corcoran kept the water going on 
the grass. Melba Corcoran worked 
on the archives. Dutch Elliott 
worked on the obits. 

Louise Hogan served as docent 
on Thursday. 

Jimmy Hill served as docent on 
Saturday. 

The men got the new doors put 
on the Jail House. The camp- 

Malachi 3:10: Prove me now 
herewith, saith the Lord of hosts, it 
I will not open you the windows of 
heaven, and pour you out a bless-
ing, that there shall not be room 
enough to receive it. 

Happy Birthday to Ed Riley, 
Rodney 	Weatherly, • Bob 

7 Frankenbery, Tina Alvey Tabor, 
Nova Stippel, Mac Purcell and 
Ashlee Mixon on Sept. 8; Lilly 
Sumpter Harwell, Bev Fenwick, 
Davy Gilmer, Eilene Luttrell, 
Hayden Duncan, Aimee Helton 
and LaDena Taylor on Sept. 7; 
Maxey Herd, Howard Loyd, David 
Gilmer, Bob Swift, Mary Ruth Fryar, 
Mike Bailey, Bulah Grimes and 
Carrie Daniels on Sept. 9; Kyle 
Zybach, Wayne Zybach, Steve 
Horton, Kim Goad, Kara Emmert 
on Sept. 10; Penny Hilburn and 
Evelyn Heare on Sept. 9; Rachel 
Montgomery, Megan Keelin, 
Brenda Wood, Andrew Hampton, 
Lee Hibler and Linda Daugherty 
on Sept. 11; Darrell Gaines, Bruce 
Mize, Wanda Hefley and Gail 
Knight on Sept. 12; John Jones, 
Patty Bradstreet, Roberta Ware, 
Sharon Zamora, Mique 
Snelgrooes, Roseanna Verden, 
Janette Umsted, Jenny Walker, 
Vera Murphy, Gayla Hathaway and 
Steven McAlpine on Sept. 13. 

Happy Anniversary to Jack and 
Pat Morgan on Sept, 19 and Cliff 
and Dorothy Walker on Sept. 13. 
God Bless you. 

First Sunday Singing will be 
Sunday, Sept. 7 at Allison Baptist 
Church at 6:00 p.m. Everyone in-
vited to come sing and worship the 
Lord and fellowship together. 

Ladies' Day Out will be Thurs-
day, Sept. 4, at 11:30 at Maxeys. 
Everyone invited. Ladies, that is, 
to come eat together. Sometimes 
a program. Dutch. 

Sincere sympathy to family and 
friends of Ralph McLaughlin of 
Laketon in his death. 

Lots of people out to Cowboy 
Oasis Friday night. J. W. Lane 
sang and Cody Dupont, Morgan 
Lane and Jimmy Lane helped with 
the music. Sounded good! Good 
to see everyone. 

Best wishes to Cheyenne 
Laverty and Marco Moncada from 
Honduras in their marriage at 
Grace Baptist Church in Decatur 
Saturday, Aug. 30, 2003. Grandpa 
Aaron Laverty officiated at the ser-
vice. Bride's attendants were 
Shelby Laverty and Caaron 
Laverty; groomsmen were Danny 
Laverty and Casey Laverty. They 
are making their home in Denton. 
God Bless you! Grandma 
Claudette Laverty also and 
Russell, Kem and Jessica at-
tended. 

Bob and Gena Zybach got 4.2 
inches rain Friday night. Feel good. 
So Bob is itching to get the wheat 
sowed. Fields are plowed and fer-
tilized and ready, but may wait till 
some volunteer wheat comes up. 

Bob and Gena Zybach went to 
Ray and Sue Giddens 50th Anni-
versary party Sunday. Glenn 
Elmore was able to be out to it. 
Good crowd, nice party. Bob and 
Gena are looking after Steve and 
Joys cattle while they are gone to 
Dallas. 

Kyle Goldsmith has been real 
sick with a viral infection and then 
pneumonia. They spent most of 
last week with Tamra's folks at 
Vega so could go back and forth to 
Amarillo to the doctor and they 
could keep Kalee. They came 
home to Wheeler Friday. Kyle is 
feeling much better and was able 
to be out to church Sunday. We 
surely missed them. Still some 
congestion. Keep praying for Kyle, 
our youth minister. 
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Say hello no matter where in the country you live. 

RESIDENTIAL 
PHONE SERVICE 

MOBEETIE 
MEWS 

By: Melba Corcoran 

Michael visited Wednesday night 
with Jane Seitz, and David and 
Melba Seitz. 

Our sympathy goes out to the 
family of Texas Miller Patton. 

Our sympathy also goes out to 
the family of Edith Levitt. 

Our sympathy goes out to the 
family of Ralph McLaughlin of 
Laketon. 
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(This Ad furnished by 
Charles Kuntz, C.P.A.) 

Lic. #TACLB021672E 

Old Time Gospel Music 

On KPDR, 90.5 
... In Wheeler 

Sundays 6 a.m. to 8 a.m. 

Mae Bailey and granddaughter 
Jean McAlpine, Bailey and Taylor 
shopped in Amarillo. Then Mae 
took them out to lunch for Jean's 
birthday dinner. 

Hugh and Mae Bailey, Richard 
and Donna Kay Dickey and Steven 
McAlpine, Steve, Bailey and Tay-
lor spent the weekend at Altus 
Lake. The Lake was really low. 

Carl and Mary Alexander of 
Colorado spent the weekend with 
Jack and Bernice Hefley. 

A truck driver slipped and fell 
from his truck at Clark's Welding 
Service while unloading pipe. He 
was taken to the hospital and x-
rayed and it just looks like he was 
only bruised. He had landed on his 
ribs on part of the truck. 

The Hogan family had a get 
together at the Museum Camp-
grounds. Those attending were 
Lynn and Carolyn Hogan of Albu-
querque NM, Calvin and Wilma 
Hogan of Murchison, TX, Randy 
and Kathy Hogan and Jill Ungever 
of Kingswood, TX, Glen and 
Martha Hogan of Pampa, Bob and 
Lavada Helton of Marble Falls, TX 
and Ed and Charlotte Hogan of 
Pampa, and James and Alta Hogan 
of Sunray. 

OnTX.I.NneC:dubsoSC flterocifor  su  

ro Ata.mr-raorr)nyug1T(CHERS trademark. Airl°d(igunh-tss 	trve‘-ki  
:A 	rEl rule,  

Donald "Bud" Williams 
Highway 592 
Allison, TX 79003 

(806) 375-2326 

Cellular One's Residential Phone Service gives you 
a larger local calling area for just $14.99 a month 
and nationwide long distance for just ior a minute. 

And if you sign up now, you'll get basic service 
with voice mail free for one month. 

Clint DeArmond (806) 662-0035 
Gruver 	Panhandle 	Sanford 
Spearman 	Stinnett 	White Deer 

Communication Connection (806) 274-9444 
Sanford 

Perryton Office Supply (806) 435-4812 
Gruver Canadian Spearman 

LeRoy Cox (806) 662-0036  
Canadian Clarendon Groom tutors 
McLean Miami Mobeetie Shamrock Wheeler 

Bill and Barbara Thomas, Larry 
and Laurie Thomas, Omega Levitt, 
and James and Alta Hogan. 

Bill Elliott served as docent on 
Sunday. 

Monday Bill Ridgway, Jimmy Hill 
and Dale Corcoran served as do-
cent. Maurita Stribling, Louise 
Hogan, Melba Parnell, Dutch 
Elliott, Frances Dickey worked at 
the registration table and selling 
quilt tickets. Bobbye Hill, Tonya 
Finsterwald and Brandon 
Finsterwald worked the Museum 
Store booth. Melba Corcoran 
worked on the archives awhile in 
the afternoon. 

Justin Tolley is the 6-year-
old son of Jim and Tonya 
Tolley of Fritch, TX and the 
grandson of Phyllis Kinnard 
of Fritch. 

For all your . . 
Insurance Needs, See 

Eastern Panhandle 
Insur. Agency, Inc. 
117 W. Texas St.—Wheeler 

806/826-3573 
'Auto *Home @Life *Health 

*Commercial •Bonds 

FREE ESTIMATES 

INSURANCE CLAIMS 	OWNER: BOB McCAIN 

117 W. OKLAHOMA = BOX 65 - WHEELER, TX 79096 

PHONE: 806/826-3433 - 

McCAIKS AUTO BODY 
24 HR. WRECKER SERVICE 

local Reinewiihnios 

THE WI—IEELER TIMES., 
PAGE 2-Thursday, September 4, 2003 

• "Wheeler, town ot rncndAy and pat 

SHELTON TWINS: Three sets of Shelton twins turned up at the reunion 
this year. The girls are great-granddaughters of Hugh and Mae Bailey. 
They are five years old, Brooke and Brenda Hughes and they're 
identical. The boys are great-grandsons of Joe Shelton and Nancy 
Shelton. They are four years old, Garrett and Jarrett Childress and they 
are identical. The boy and girl are great-grandchildren of the late Joe 
and Pauline Wolfe. They are three years old Shawn and Amy Wolfe. 

grounds have lots of campers:-
Some camping there is Mr. Clark 
that is on a job here and the brother 
of Greg. J. F. Cook and son Eddie 
and Joyce Cook 'arecamping. J. F. 
was an ex-student also. Some of 
the _other ex-students are-.1. W. 
Turner of Matador, Jerry and Ora 
Swans of Mount Vernon, Jimmy 
and Jeanette Spencer and Arthur 
Seitzof Amarillo, George and Marie 
Kilcrease, Bill and Dutch Elliott, 
Nathan and Nelda Lancaster of 
Pampa, Wendell and Dee Seitz of 
Turkey, Calvin and Wilma Hogan 
of Murchison, Bob and Laveta 
Helton of Mineral Wells and Aaron 
and Arica Lancaster of Mobeetie, 

Larry and Jannet Gatlin and 
Logan had Rick and Mary Gatlin 
from Woodward and Katrina Cox 
were all at Dan and Kay Gatlins 
Saturday night. They were expect-
ing Linda and Marvin Cox and Bill 
and Tim and Daphne Cox for Sun-
day dinner. Linda's family spent 
Saturday night at the family farm 
east of Wheeler. Think it belongs 
to Sonny and Geraldine Pride. Best 
wishes to all! 

Saturday Dean and Georgia 
Tipps and Jimmy and Tammy 
Maddox and Amber and Dwight 
Tipps went to Amarillo and helped 
Terry and Sam move to Panhandle. 
They are happy to be there. Tipps 
have also been putting up lots of 
good corn and blackeyed peas. 

Kay Luttrell took Addie Swift to 
the Old Settlers Reunion at 
Mobeetie Monday. They enjoyed 
the music and the visiting and food. 
Fat and Wanda also went. 

Dub and Mary Swift visited Addle 
Swift last Sunday. Addie is doing 
much better now and likes to go 
places. I'm glad she can go. 

Ft. Elliott girls varsity and JV 
volleyball tournament will be Sat-
urday at Briscoe. Teams expected 
are Fritch JV, Childress JV and 
Varsity, Perryton JV, San Jacinto 
JV, WT High Varsity, Holy Cross 
and Rockets. 	 __ J_ 

(Continued Page 4) 
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head Resources, Inc., 7-29-03, 
Sec. 24, Camp County School 
Land. 
MD-D. Vernon Camp to Arrow-
head Resources, Inc., 7-29-03, 
Sec. 19, Camp County School 
Land. 
MD-D. Vernon Camp to Arrow-
head Resources, Inc., 7-29-03, 
Sec. 27, Camp County School 
Land. 
MD- William R. Barton to Arrow-
head Resources, Inc., 7-29-03, 
Sec. 26, Camp County School 
Land. 
MD-William R. Barton to Arrow-
head Resources, Inc., 7-29-03, 
Sec. 24, Camp County School 
Land. 
MD-William R. Barton to Arrow-
head Resources, Inc., 7-29-03, 
Sec. 22, Camp County School 
Land. 
MD-Norman K. Stewart to Ar-
rowhead Resources, Inc., 7-29-
03, Sec. 19, Camp County School 
Land. 
MD-Norman K. Stewart to Ar-
rowhead Resources, Inc., 7-29-
03, Sec. 24, Camp County School 
Land. 
MD-Norman K. Stewart to Ar-
rowhead Resources, Inc., 7-29-
03, Sec. 26, Camp County School 
Land. 
MD-Norman K. Stewart to Ar-
rowhead Resources, Inc., 7-29-
03, Sec. 27, Camp County School 
Land. 
MD-Tom Rose to Arrowhead 
Resources, Inc., 7-31-03, Sec. 19, 
Camp County School Land. 
MD-Tom Rose to Arrowhead 
Resources, Inc., 7-31-03, Sec. 22, 
Camp County School Land. 
MD-Tom E. Rose to Arrowhead 
Resources, Inc., 7-31-03, Sec. 24, 
Camp County School Land. 
MD-Tom Rose to Arrowhead 
Resources, Inc., 7-31-03, Sec. 26, 
Camp County School Land. 
MD-Tom E. Rose to Arrowhead 
Resources, Inc., 7-31-03, Sec. 27, 
Camp County School Land. 
MD-Nancy Burton to Arrowhead 
Resources, Inc., 7-31-03, Sec. 19, 
Camp County School Land. 
MD-Nancy Burton to Arrowhead 
Resources, Inc., 8-11-03, Sec. 24, 
Camp County School Land. 
MD-Nancy Burton to Arrowhead 
Resources, Inc., 8-11-03, Sec. 26, 
Camp County School Land. 
MD-Nancy Burton to Arrowhead 
Resources, Inc., 8-11-03, Sec. 27, 
Camp County School Land. 
AUGUST 28, 2003 
OL-Ida Mae Goad to Texhoma 
Land Consultants, Inc., 7-17-03, 
SW 1/4 Sec. 15, Blk. A-4, H&GN 
Ry. Company Survey. 
OL-Charles W. Darter, Jr., et al 
to Texhoma Land Consultants, 
Inc., 7-29-03, SW 1/4 Sec. 38, Blk. 
A-4, H&GN Ry. Company Survey. 
MODIFICATION OL-Lynda Beth 
Banger to Bravo Natural Re-
sources Inc., 8-8-03, W 1/2 W 1/2 
E 1/2; W 1/2 Sec. 2, Blk, A-3, 
H&GN Ry. Company Survey. 
MODIFICATION OL-Miller Fam-
ily Trust to Bravo Natural Re-
sources Inc., 8-8-03, W 1/2 W 1/2 
E 1/2; W 1/2 Sec. 2, Blk. A-3, 
H&GN Ry. Company Survey 
MODIFICATION OL-James Tho-
mas Miller to Bravo Natural Re-
sources Inc., 8-8-03, W 1/2 W 1/2 
E 1/2; W 1/2 Sec. 2, Blk. A-3, 
H&GN Ry. Company Survey. 
MODIFICATION OL-Texas 
LaJean Patton to Bravo Natural 
Resources Inc., 8-8-03, W 1/2 W 
1/2 E 1/2; W 1/2 Sec. 2, Blk. A-3, 
H&GN Ry. Company Survey. 
MODIFICATION OL-Ray Kelly 
Miller to Bravo Natural Resources 
Inc., 8-8-03, W 1/2 W 1/2 E 1/2; W 
1/2 Sec. 2, Blk. A-3, H&GN Ry. 
Company Survey. 
AFF.-Bill Phelpsto Stella M. Por-
ter, et al, 8-21-03, NW 1/4 Sec. 21, 
Blk. A-3, H&GN Ry. Company Sur-
vey. 

News, Views, Commentary 

On KPDR, 90.5 
... In Wheeler 

Weekdays 6:20 a.m. to 7 a.m. 

Canadian Laundry and Dry 
Cleaners, 1-800-766-6532 or mo-
bile 662-6353. We have linens for 
parties, banquets and special oc-
casions, napkins and banquet tops. 
We specialize in Dry Cleaning and 
Starched Jeans. 	 nn 

20 Quality Beef Machine 2 yr. old 
bulls. LBW, Performance proven, 
reasonable, raised on grass and 
protein cubes-no grain. Joe 
VanZandt 806-845-2101. 	tin 

OVERLOOKED-1102 Okla-
homa. Must See inside to appreci-
ate this large 2 bedroom, 1 bath. 
Large lot, 1 car garage, storm win-
dows, cellar. Reduced to $20,000. 
For information-Real Estate & 
Rental. Christina Hadaway 806- 
323-8613. 	 8/15nn 

Certified Nurse Aides Needed. 
6-2, 2-10 shifts. Shift dill. pay. Will 
train. Full benefit package. See 
Kay Beck, RN, DNS, Wheeler Care 
Center. 	 6/5-9/4c 

CITY OF MOBEETIE 
NOTICE 

The City of Mobeetie will hold a 
Public Meeting prior to the regular 
meeting Monday September 8, 
2003 at 7:00 P.M. at the Mobeetie 
City Hall, 301 S. Wheeler to adopt 
2003-2004 Budget and Set Tax 
Rate. 	 9/4c 

Edward Abraham Memorial 
Home has positions open for RNs, 
LVNs, and an Activities Assistant. 
Benefits include paid holidays, va-
cation and health insurance allow-
ance. Apply at 803 Birch Street or 
323-6453. 	 8/28-9/4c 

D&R Transport is now taking ap-
plications for the day shift and the 
nights shift. Must have a Class A 
CDL and pass a drug test. 806- 
323-6161. 	 7/24rtn 

OH & Gas 
NEWS 

(New Location, Completion and 
Plugging Report made possible 
by Oil & Gas Reporting Service, 
3930 Beaver St., Vernon, TX 
76384,. Doris Harrison, Phone: 
940/552-6644.) 
-Week Ending August 28, 2003 
Intentions to Drill  
HEMPHILL (BUFFALO WALLOW 
Granite Wash) Peak Operating of 
Texas, L.L.C., #4053 Barker, 467' 
from North & West line, Sec. 53,M-
1,H&GN, PD 12100'. 
HEMPHILL (SOUTH HIGGINS 
Morrow) Peak Operating of Texas, 
L.L.C., #2049 Newcomer, 467' 
from North & West line, Sec. 
49,42,H&TC , PD 12610'. 
HEMPHILL (WILDCAT & BUF-
FALO WALLOW Granite Wash) 
Patina Oil & Gas Corp., #1212P 
Carr '12', 2600' from South & 467' 
from West line, Sec. 12,4,AB&M, 
PD 12000'. 
HEMPHILL (WILDCAT & BUF-
FALO WALLOW Granite Wash) 
Patina Oil & Gas Corp., #1309P 
Carr 113', 1980' f rom South & 467' 
from East line, Sec. 13,4,AB&M, 

It pays to Advertise 
in 

The Wheeler Times 
Classified: 

Cash-$4.00 for first 20 words 
Charge-$6.00 for first 20 words 

150 for each  additional  word 

Open Rate: $2.50 Per Col. In. 
Card of Thanks: $5.00 

s"c"FRAUD Brokerage 
DON'T BE 

EMBARRASSED! 
Proud is not your fault! 

Advice to purchase a large position or heavy high-tech or 
telecommunications concentrations may be red flags. Did 
you or a loved one lose money with Smith Barney, Merrill 
Lynch, UBS Warberg/Paine Webber, Bear Steams, Credit 
Susse, Goldman Sachs, Lehman Brothers, J.P. Morgan, 
Fenner and Smith, Cibgn>up Global, U S. Bancorp Piper 
Jaffrey or other brokerage houses on stocks such as 
WorldCom, Global Crossing, Quest, XO Mostar, level 3, 
24(7, Infospace Tyco, Synopsis, Pricefine 8 Others? 
You may be able to recover. Claims may be handled 
with no out-of-packet expense. Come visit us or Call for 
free consultation and professional insight. 'Let's get 
your money back.' 

NOT CIERtiFiCO By THE TEXAS Boom OF LEGAL SPECKLIZATCH 

T. Michael 
Kennedy, P.C. 

Trial Lawyer & Counselor 
IRVING, TX 

1-877-65 FRAUD 
www.st oek Ira t exa s.com 

CFI is now Hiring 
COMPANY * OWNER OPERATORS 
SINGLES AND TEAMS 
Loads with miles available immediately! 
Ask about our spouse-training program 

Call 800-CA-DRIVE 

I FREE ADMISSION* 

TexSCAN Week of 
August 31, 2003 

BUSINESS OPPORTU-
NITIES 

America's #1 Ski & Golf Resort • Sat, Sept. 20 
Divorce Forces Sale 

Enjoy 270° panoramic views of the ski slopes 
and Vail Valley from this gated home at the top of 
the mountain, next to Spraddle Creek. Details include 
hardwoods, flagstone, tumbled stone, granite, custom 
maple cabinetry and top-of- 	„ :set: 
the-line appliances. 

• 4 Bedrooms 	• Heated 3-Car Garage & Driveway 	*AUCTION 	COMPANY 
• 4 Full. 2 Half Baths • 3,000 Bottle Wine Cellar 	 Call for ha color brochure: 

• 3 Fireplaces 	• Jacuzzi Spa 	• Office 	800-552-8120 • 6,486 Sq. Ft. 	• 1,400 Sq. EL Heated flagstone Patios 

• Guest Apartment • Ski Storage Room • Butler's Pantry www. -E-A.co 
704-529.0026 • www.GreatEstatesAuction.com • Gob Kendall LA091366.11 

Gibes& EMateS 
.1> 

AUCTION Vail CO 

MUSTANGS ARE S1 
CH 1.101014S 

, 
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P.O.,Box.„108d' 	.4 ' tt  
Wheeler,' Texas 790-96 
Phone:  806/826-3123 

Entered as  second-class  matter DeceMber 18, 1933, at the Post Office at 
Wheeler, Texas 79096, under the act March 3, 1879. 

Postmaster: Send Address changes to The Wheeler 
Times, P.O. Box 1080, Wheeler, TX 79096-1080 

LoUis C. Stag, Owner & Publisher 
' SUBSCRIPTION RATES: 

yheeler County ..$18.00 Outside County ..$20.00 

THE 

BUSINESS DIRECTORY 
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LEASE AMEND./REVIVOR 
AGREE.-Joseph 	Ray 
Witherspoon to Newfield Explora-
tion Mid-Continent Inc., 7-24-03, 
Pts. NE 1/4; W 1/2 Sec. 49, Blk. M-
1, H&GN Ry. Company Survey. 
POA-JSH Company to Dawn 
Bagnetto, 1-3-00. 
DT-Joe Curtis Duncan, et ux to 
Amarillo National Bank, 8-20-03, 
10 acs. out of 80 acs. S 1/2 Sec. 
45, Blk. A-5, H&GN Ry. Company 
Survey. 
ASSIGN.-Jackfork Land, Inc. to 
Chesapeake EP Corporation, 8-5-
03, SW 1/4 Sec. 3, E 1/2 Sec. 31, 
Blk. R.E., Roberts & Eddleman 
Survey. 
ASSIGN.-David E. Winegeart, et 
ux to Wildcat Cement Co., 8-19-
03, W 1/2 SE 1/4 Sec. 42, Blk. 24, 
H&GN Ry. Company Survey. 
ASSIGN.-David E. Winegeart, et 
ux to Wildcat Cement Co., 8-19-
03, NW 1/4 SE 1/4 NE 1/4 Sec. 50, 
Blk. 24, H&GN Ry. Company Sur- 
vey. 
AUGUST 27, 2003 
MIN. ASSIGN.-Kathy Meek to 
Big Barrier LLC, 8-25-03, Sec. 60, 
Blk. M-1, H&GN Ry. Company 
Survey, and Sec. 7, Blk. R.E., 
Roberts & Eddleman Survey. 
MIN. ASSIGN.-Kathy Meek to 
Red Bed Properties LLC, 8-25-03, 
See Instrument. 
MIN. ASSIGN.-Kathy Meek to 
Sun Barrier LLC, 8-25-03, Sec. 
60, Blk. M-1, H&GN Ry. Company 
Survey, and Sec. 7, Blk. R.E., 
Roberts & Eddleman Survey. 
MIN. ASSIGN.-Kathy Meek to 
Howard Mills LLC, 8-25-03, Sec. 
60, Blk. M-1, H&GN Ry. Company 
Survey, and Sec. 7, Blk. R.E., 
Roberts & Eddleman Survey. 
DEED ASSIGN.-Kathy Meek to 
Deer Trail Land LLC, 8-25-03, S 1/ 
2 Sec. 59, Blk. A-8, H&GN Ry. 
Company Survey. Surface Only. 
EXT. OL-Harbaugh Revocable 
Trust to Brigham Oil & Gas LP, 7-
29-03, S 1/2 SE 1/4 Sec. 96, Blk. 
13, H&GN Ry. Company Survey. 
POA-Lorene Jenkins to Linda 
Warrick, 6-11-03. 
MD-Lorene Jenkins to Linda 
Warrick, 8-26-03, See Instrument. 
PARTIAL RDT-Bank of Okla-
homa National Association to 
Nielson & Associates, Inc., 8-4-
03, See Instrument. 
ASSIGN.-Nielson & Associates 
Inc. to Newfield Exploration Mid-
Continent Inc., 8-30-03, See In-
strument. 
LEASE-Thelma Louise Reed Hall 
to Centerpoint Energy Field Ser-
vices Inc., 7-18-03, NW 1/4 Sec. 
31, Blk. A-3, H&GN Ry. Company 
Survey. 
DT-John A. Vance, et al to 
Perryton National Bank, 3-8-00, 
Sec. 96, Blk. A-5, H&GN Ry. Com-
pany Survey. 
MD-Harry Wofford Estate Trust 
to Arrowhead Resources Inc., 8-7-
03, SE 1/4 Sec. 9, Blk. L, J. M. 
Lindsey. 
MD-Harry Wofford Estate Trust 
to Arrowhead Resources, Inc., 8-
7-03, E 1/2 E 1/2 Sec. 3, Blk. 2, 
Brooks & Burleson Survey. 
MD-Steven R. Russell to Arrow-
head Resources, Inc., 7-30-03, 
Sec. 27, Camp County School 
Land. 
MD-Steven R. Russell to Arrow-
head Resources, Inc., 7-30-03, 
Sec. 22, Camp County School 
Land. 
MD-Steven R. Russell to Arrow-
head Resources, Inc., 7-30-03, 
Sec. 24, Camp County School 
Land. 
MD-D. Vernon Camp to Arrow-
head Resources, Inc., 7-29-03, 
Sec. 26, Camp County School 
Land. 
MD-D. Vernon Camp to Arrow- 
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Wheeler County 
COURT RECORDS 

 

List of Instruments filed In the 
Wheeler County Clerk's Office 
from August 25,2003- August 
28, 2003. 
AUGUST 25, 2003 
DVL-Robert Allan Spurr and 
Dolores Watson Spurr Revocable 
.Living Trust, et alto Barry Bedwell, 
et ux, 8-15-03, NW 1/4 Sec. 34, 
Bk. A-4, H&GN Fly. Company Sur-
vey. 
DT-Barry Bedwell, et ux to Ama-
rillo National Bank, 8-22-03, NW 

1/4 Sec. 34, Blk. A-4, H&GN Ry. 
Company Survey. 
R DT-National Bank of Com-
merce to Sharwyn Watson, 8-20-
03, Lots 1 and 2, Blk. 64, WSSA, 
Shamrock. 
MD-Robert M. Daniels, et ux to 
Robert M. Daniels Revocable 
Trust, 8-1-03, See Instrument. 
AFF.-W. H. Brian Jr. to W. H. 
Brian, et ux, 8-22-03, N 1/2 Sec. 3. 
Blk. R.E., Roberts & Eddleman 
Survey. 
C/C FINAL ACCOUNTING-Irene 
Burgess to The Public, 8-18-03, 
See Instrument. 
QCD-Thelma Dudley to William 
H. Pritchett, 6-13-03, NW 1/4 Sec. 
47, Blk. 24, H&GN Ry. Company 
Survey. 
AMEND. RATIFICATION AS-
SIGN. AGREE.-Kerr-McGee Oil 
& Gas Onshore LP, et al to Kaiser-
Francis Oil Company, et al, 8-12-
03, Sec. 99, Blk. A-5, H&GN Ry. 
Company Survey. 
AFF. NOTICE INSTALLATION-
Fleetwood Home Ctr. to Lewis 
Newman, et ux, 7-8-03, See In-
strument. 
AUGUST 26, 2003 
DVL-Marci Jo Wright Payne to 
Keith Rose, et ux, 8-21-03, 79.5' x 
170' SE 1/4 Sec. 60, Blk. A-B, 
H&GN Ry. Company Survey. 
DT-Keith Rose, et ux to 
Whisperwood Mortgage LLC, 8-
21-03, 79.5' x 170' SE 1/4 Sec. 60, 
Blk. A-8, H&GN Ry. Company Sur-
vey. 
TDT-Whisperwood Mortgage 

- LLC to Washington Mutual Bank, 
:FA, 8-21-03, 79.5' x 170' SE 1/4 
Sec. 60, Blk. A-8, H&GN Ry. Com-
pany Survey. 

-LEASE AMEND./REVIVOR 
:AGREE.-John 0. Bullington to 
Newfield Exploration Mid-Conti-

- nent Inc., 7-24-03, Pts. NE 1/4; W 
:1/2 Sec. 49, Blk. M-1, H&GN Ry. 
- Company Survey. 
LEASE AMEND./REVIVOR 
AGREE.-Thomas 	David 

:Witherspoon to Newfield Explora-
-tion Mid-Continent Inc., 7-24-03, 
• Pts. NE 1/4; W 1/2 Sec. 49, Blk. M-
:1, H&GN Ry. Company Survey. 
'LEASE AMEND./REVIVOR 
• AGREE.-Sarah Mead Bullington 
:to Newfield Exploration Mid-Con-
:tinent Inc., 7-24-03, Pts. NE 1/4; W 
-1/2 Sec. 49, Blk. M-1, H&GN Ry. 
Company Survey. 
LEASE AMEND./REVIVOR 
AGREE.-Jill Bullington to 
Newfield Exploration Mid-Conti-
nent Inc., 7-24-03, Pts. NE 1/4; W 
1/2 Sec. 49, Blk. M-1, H&GN Ry. 
Company Survey. 
LEASE AMEND./REVIVOR 
AGREE.-Michael 	Ray 
Witherspoon to Newfield Explora-
tion Mid-Continent Inc., 7-24-03, 
Pts. NE 1/4; W 1/2 Sec. 49, Blk. M-
1, H&GN Ry. Company Survey. 
LEASE AMEND./REVIVOR 
AGREE.-William 	Orville 
Witherspoon to Newfield Explora-
tion Mid-Continent Inc., 7-24-03, 
Pts. NE 1/4; W 1/2 Sec. 49, Blk. M-
1, H&GN Ry. Company Survey. 
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PD 12000'. 
HEMPHILL (WILDCAT & BUF-
FALO WALLOW Granite Wash) 
Patina Oil & Gas Corp., Carr '55', 
Sec. 55,M-1,H&GN, PD 12000', 
for the following wells: 
#5503P, 467' from North & 1513' 
from West line of Sec. #5504P, 
467' from North & West line of Sec. 
HEMPHILL (WILDCAT & BUF-
FALO WALLOW Granite Wash) 
Patina Oil & Gas Corp., #7009P 
Meek '70', 1980' from South & 467' 
from East line, Sec. 70,M-1,H&GN, 
PD 12000'. 
HEMPHILL (WILDCAT & S.W. 
CANADIAN Granite Wash) 
Samson Lone Star, L.P., Isaacs, 
Sec. 208,C,G&MMB&A, PD 
10800', for the following wells: 
#7208, 1720' from South & 2640' 
from East line of Sec. #8208, 2000' 

OFF. 806/352-7891 
RES. 806/352-3204 

Stiles  &citing er Slit* 
For all of your . . . 

Heating & Air service needs. 
Residential and Commercial Certified 

keep it cold for you 
(unless you want it  hot)  

Home # 826-5654 Cell # 886-5371 
License # TACLA023244C 

HEALTH 

53 ACRES, 5-DEER county, exot-
ics, hogs,  turkey,  electricity, SW of 
Rocksprings. $1722/down,  $338/mo.  
Ranch Enterprises, 1-800-876-9720, 
texasranchland com 

FREE INFO! 20 to 50 acres. Heart 
of Hill Country. Gorgeous oaks, 
beautiful views. Excellent for horses. 
Starting at $4,700/acre. Free call. 
Michaels/ Inland Management, 
1-866-937-2624, Ext. 726. 

September 5-7 
Make it a memory! DRIVERS WANTED 

warranty. American made - honest 1-888-320-5424. 
value. Call Daniel Boone Log 
Homes, 1-888-443-4140. 

FINANCIAL SERVICES 
HELP WANTED 

0 D Mjkfl 
Post, Texas 

www.oldmilltradedays.com 
*With I Paid Admission. I 

FREE 3-ROOM DIRECTV 
DRIVERS - LOW COST CDL System including installation! 
Training available. Lodging and Subscribe to "NFL-Sunday 
transportation provided. Tuition Ticket" get 4 months FREE 
reimbursement. Ask about our programming. Access 225+ 
experienced driver $500 sign-on TV channels. Digital quality 

bonus. OTR, Dedicated and picture/sound. Limited time 
Regional Freight. Swift Transpor- offer. 1-800-264-3458. 
tation, 1-800-231-5209. 

FOR SALE 

COME TO COLORADO. 35-320 
acres with electricity. 80 miles south 
of Pikes Peak region. River valley tall 
cottonwoods cool mountain air from 
$34,900. Owner financing. Call 1-866-
630-7357, wvnv.ghostrivemuich.com. 

Statewide Ad 	$400 
330 Neirspapers,13Atiniai Circulation 

North Region Only 	$175 
115 Newspapers, 465,000 Circulation 

South Region Only 	$175 
107 Newspapers, 518,000 Cimila lion 

West Region Only 	$175 
108 Newspapers, 31 ,000 (Imitation 

Run Your Ad TexSCANI: 

MAILING ADDRESS 
BOX 7473 

AMARILLO, TEXAS 79109 

tY 

lz 

AUTO GLASS INSTALLATION, 
BODY REPAIR & 

24-Hr. WRECKER SERVICE 

CROSS 
CAR CENTER 

Phone: 826-5515 
WHEELER, TEXAS 

from North & 2540' from West line 
of Sec. #9208, 660' from North & 
2500' from West line of Sec. 
HEMPHILL (WILDCAT & S.E. 
Douglas) Devon Louisiana Corp., 
#3036 Humphreys, 660' from North 
& West line, Sec. 36,1,G&M, PD 
7500'. 
Applications to Plug-Back  
HEMPHILL (WILDCAT& TEXFEL 
Douglas) Upland Resources, Inc., 
#1 Nancy, 660' from South & 990' 
from East line, Sec. 23,42,H&TC, 
PD 7500'. 
Oil Well Completion  
ROBERTS (COURSON RANCH 
Upper Morrow) Range Production 
Co., #1150 S. Courson Ranch PA- 
2, Sec. 150,C,G&M, spud 5-3-03, 
drlg. compl 5-19-03, tested 8-4- 
3, flowed 5 bbl. 
of 42 gray. oil + no water thru 4/64" 
choke on 24 hour test, GOR 5000, 
TD 9250', PBTD 8950' -- 
GRAY (N.E. HOOVER 
Ellenburger) Newfield Exploration 
Mid Continent, #7 Ruth '23', Sec. 
23,3,I&ON, spud 6-21-03, drlg. 
compl 7-23-03, tested 7-30-03, 
potential 15422 MCF, TD 
9162' -- 
GRAY (WEST PANHANDLE) 
Gruy Petroleum Mgmt. Co., #3 
Beasley 'B', Sec. 25,R, A.S. Jor-
dan, 
spud 3-3-03, drlg. compl 3-7-03, 
tested 4-7-03, potential 700 MCF. 
TD 2577' -- 
GRAY (WEST PANHANDLE) 
Gruy Petroleum Mgmt. Co., #3 
Moore, Sec. 2,30,H&GN, spud 2-
26-03, drig. compl 2-28-03, tested 
3-27-03, potential 1900 MCF, TD 
2478' -- 
HEMPHILL (BUFFALO WALLOW 
Granite Wash) Dominion Okla-
homa Texas E&P, Inc., #16 Meek 
'67', Sec. 67,M-1,H&GN, spud 6-
11-03, drlg. compl 6-22-03, tested 
8-5-03, potential 5646 MCF, TD 
11714', PBTD 11523' --
HEMPHILL (HEMPHILL Granite 
Wash) Samson Lone Star Ltd. 
Partnership, #2 Hobart Ranch '20', 
Sec. 20,A-1,H&GN, spud 6-15-03, 
drlg. compi 7-2-03, tested 8-8-03, 
TD 11500" 
PBTD 11428' -- 
ROBERTS (ST. CLAIR Granite 
Wash) Cordillera Energy Partners, 
L.L.C., #1226 McMordie, Sec. 
26,A-1,D&SE, spud 2- 4-03, drlg. 
compl 3-8-03, tested 4-17-03, po-
tential 1704 
MCF, TD 10341', PBTD 10250' --
Plugged Wells  
GRAY (PANHANDLE) Sukay Oil 
& Gas, Inc., #2 Chapman 'A' Unit, 
Sec. 52,25,H&GN, spud 11-23-
80, plugged 6-26-03, TD 3121' (oil) 

GRAY (PANHANDLE) Sukay Oil 
& Gas, Inc., Kretzmeier, Sec. 
124,3,I&GN, for thefollowing wells: 
#I, spud 11-4-80, plugged 6-18-
03, TD 3400' (oil) -- 
#2, spud 11-12-80, plugged 6-23-
03, TD 3400' (injection) -- 
HEMPHILL (ALPAR Tonkawa) BP 
America Production Co., #3079 
Forgey, Sec. 79,41,H&TC, spud 
11-14-75, plugged 5-13-03 , TD 
8500' (gas) -- Form tin Gulf Oil 
Corp. 
HEMPHILL (BUFFALO WALLOW 
Granite Wash) BP America Pro-
duction Co_ •, #1055 Blasdel- . 

(Continued Page 5r 
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R. C. 'BOB' CALLAN 
OIL, GAS AND MINERAL LFASES 

TOMMY YOWELL 
OIL, GAS AND MINERAL LEASES 

Phone: 806-674-9757 
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DRIVERS - START AT 34 cents/ NEED A COMPUTER? Bad 
mile. Guaranteed home time. Pay credit? Bankruptcy OK. No credit 
on delivery. Dedicated available. check. Guaranteed approval, check-
Owner/Operators welcome. USA ing account - home phone requited 
Truck, 1-800-237-4642. 	 1-800-504-3980, www.pc4sure.com  

DRIVERS - WE HAVE what  you  WOLFF TANNING BEDS - Afford-
need! Fleets to fit your needs and able - Convenient. Tan at home. Pay- 

CAPPUCCINO 	ITALIAN experience les-el.Ask about our expe-  menu  from $25/month. FREE Color 
COFFEE company expanding. rienced driver $500 sign-on bonus. catalog,  Call  today, 1_800.711.0158. 
Distributors wanted. High profit CDL training available. Tuition 
potential. Anyone can do this. reimbursement. 1-866-333-8801, 

www.swifttrans.com 	 VIAGRA  -LOWEST  PRICE refills. Expresso Italia, call 1-800- 	  
NEW MEXICO MOUNTAINS. 813-6625. Investment required.  OWNER OPERATORS- UP to  Guaranteed. $3.60 per 100mg. Why  140 Acres - Only $49,900.  Gor- pay more?We have the answer. Vioxx, LOG HOME DEALERS wanted! $1.50 a mile for tractors and 

Celebrex, Lipitor, more. Prescription  genus  grasslands, mature tree cover, 
Great earning potential, excellent $1.12 for straight trucks. Sign-on 

6,300' elevation. Mountain views, Buyers Group, 1-866-887-7283. profi ts. Protected territory, lifetime bonus. Tri-State Expedited, call year-round roads. Perfect for horse 
lovers. Adjacent to national forest. 

AVON CALLING! Need extra Excellent financing. Call today. 
This won't last. NM Land and $$CASHS$ - IMMEDIATE CASH money? Work part/full time from 

home.  Earn up to 50%. Call for $10 Ranches, 1-866-350-5263. for structured settlements, annuities, 
realestate mows, private mortgage note& starter kit. 1-800-211-0502 (1SR).  TROPHY WHITETAIL 100 AC , DRIVER - COVENANT 

TRANSPORT. Teams, Teams, aeeidenteases• andt'arleeParuts.1  SALES - SALES MANAGERS -  $44,900 (5 deer limit). 1st class 
Teams. We need teams for the G. Wentworth, 1-800-794-7310. 	_One of the highest paid jobs in Amer- Texas whitetail area. This 100 
long haul. Owner/Operators, $$CASH  NOW$$  for the Note, ica. Highly successful national corn- acres is an ideal habitat. Tree 
experienced drivers,  solos, Owner Corryback, Deed of That you pany. Will train. We provide appoint-covered  hills and draws. Private, 
teams and graduate students. carry. We pay top dollar. Call NoteNa- ments. Call Don, 1-800-322-4103, but with good access. You'll love 
Call 	1 -888 -MORE 	PAY  Lion  toll free, 1-877-596-7889. 	  donburk@vericommcorp.com 	it! Will finance. Call Texas Land 

Offer Good Sept 5-7 Only. I  I -888-667-37 29). 	 525,000 CASH GRANTS! All Texas 	REAL ESTATE 	
& Ranches, 1-866-899-5263. 

DRIVERS 	- 	DRIVING residentscan qualify. Use your money 
ABSOLUTE STEAL! S  Acres - SCHOOL Graduates, we need for school, business,personal bills,etc. • 
$19 900. Sacrifice  priceon beautiful you today!  Tuition reimbursement.  Don't miss out. Call 1-800-363-5222, 
North' Texas hill country property. 

Up to 37 cents/mile. Guaranteed Ext. 014 -American Grant Services. 
Perfect getaway, retirement or  horse 

home time. Pay on delivery. USA 
set-up. Access to 600 acre private park. 

	

Truck, 1-800-237-4642. 	 Financing. Texas Land & Ranches, 
Call now, 1-866-516-4868. 

To Order: Call This Newspaper, 
or call Texas Press Service at 

1.800.749.4793 Today! 
NOTICE: While most advertisers are reputable, we cannot guarantee products or services advertised. We urge readers to use caution and when in doubt, contact 
the Texas Attorney General at 1-800-621-0508 or the Federal Trade Commission at 1-877-FTC-HELP. The FTC web site is www.ftc.gov/bizop 

Extend your advertising reach with TexSCAN, your Statewide Classified Ad Network. 



Rita Pearson plays the piano for 
the Rotary luncheons at Canadian 
each Tuesday. She does a good 
job. 

Willa Fillingim came through 
knee surgery just fine Tuesday at 
Northwest Texas Hospital. Keep 
praying for her. Laurel was with 
her. Willa has had some pain. Hope 
you are soon o.k., Willa. She felt 
real sick when I talked to her Fri-
day. 

WHEELER 
MH114111  

  

Gilmer there. Texas Miller Patton 
was Bobby's stepmom. Think he 
came for the funeral. 

Nice to visit with Doretta Moore 
at the Post Office. She and Gary 
and Jill Lister planned to go to 
Amarillo and meet Doretta's sis-
ter, Oleta Levitt, who was coming 
in for her mother-in-law's funeral. 
Edith Levitt's funeral at Allison. 
Doretta hoped Oleta would stay 
several days with her. 

So nice to see Estelle (Aderholt) 
and Herman Topper from Borger 
at Hyland's. It's not fair—Estelle 
can't be a lot younger than me, but 
she looked so beautiful. We've 
known each other most of our lives. 
Fine people. 

Nice to visit with Sue and Robert 
Mayfield at Cowboy Oasis. They 
had Michael and Breanna, their 
grandkids from Oklahoma City for 
over a month this summer. They 
were going Friday, Aug. 29, to 
bring them for a visit over the long 
weekend. They also planned to go 
to Dumas and help Sue's mom 
and visit with her. 

So good to visit with Lorene 
Rector and Orville Greenhouse at 
Thriftway Friday. Such lovely la-
dies. 

Carol Clawson's sister, Clara 
Anderson, has had colon cancer 
and chemo treatments. Sounds 
like she may be in remission. 
Nearly through with her chemo 
and no signs of cancer. The spot 
on her liver is thought to be a 
benign cyst. Praise the Lord! and 
keep praying. Clara is with adaugh-
ter at Abilene. She was living in 
Wheeler for awhile. She and 
brother, Jessie, stayed with us one 
summer a few weeks and helped. 

Nice to visit with Dale Clawson 
at Soto's Friday. He and Tony have 
been real busy. They had to re-
place a cement loading dock at the 
Cheyenne, Oklahoma, Thriftway 
and other things. 

Doyle and Bulah Grimes spent 
Friday night in Amarillo with Gary 
and Marilyn Grimes. Saturday they 

drove down to Wheeler and ate 
lunch at Mel's Diner. They also 
visited Martha Meek, Willis and 
Verna Fillingim and Marion Grimes. 
They also attended the Mobeetie 
Ex-Student festivities and supper. 
Gary was a student at Mobeetie. 
So good to see them all. Glad 
Bulah is getting around better. 
Think she had three steroids shots 
at three week intervals and has a 
back brace that she wears day 
and night. It has really helped her 
back. So good to see them all. 

Jeff Kelly, thanks for the fine 
watermellon. You are sweet, too. 

Nice to see Oleta Levitt with 
Doretta Moore at Soto's Friday. 
Oleta was here for Edith Levitt's 
funeral, her mother-in-law. Doretta 
is enjoying having her visit her. 

Willa Fillingim has been having 
a real rough time and may be 
moving soon to BSA from North-
west Texas Hospital. Some who 
have visited her are Ed and Laurel 
Hershman, Salta Dawson, Jodie 
Striley, Lajo Crownover and Londa 
Crownover. Willa had knee re-
placement surgery Aug. 26. 

Dallas and Krystal Fillingim were 
weekend visitors to Ken and 
Lindsey Criswell and Blain. Rita 
Pearson also spent Friday night 
with them. She was coming from 
Angel Fire. She planned to shop 
some in Amarillo Saturday before 
she went home. David Pearson 
also came up Saturday. They 
shopped some and ate lunch with 
Rita's brother, Joe Lackey at Furrs. 

Coming Friday night to visit Lou 
Dean Douthit were Mark and 
Stephanie Bowman, Megan 
Edmunds and Sherry Dean 
Bradshaw, all from Arlington for 
the weekend. They also visited 
Aunts Beverly Lewis and Butch 
Moore in Wheeler. Other Sunday 
visitors at Lou Dean's were Debbie 
and Bob Kinnaman and Cory 
Kinnaman and Zane and Zoey. 

Dallas and Krystal Fillingim ate 
lunch Saturday at Ruby Tequilla 
with Lindsey Criswell and Blain. 

PABLO ENERGY 
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Bob 8 Evangeline Wills 

Rick S Judy Woollard 
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Dallas also got to see several 
friends while in town: Bart Wyatt 
from White Deer, Clay Henderson, 
Kirk and Brandi Self and Kaylee 
from Amarillo, Tabb Hathaway and 
Charlie Blaylock. So good to see 
everyone. They left Sunday to go 
back to Wichita Falls and to 
Windthorst to visit Krystal's family. 
Dallas planned to go hunting with 
Krystal's dad, Melvin Berend and 
the three brother-in-laws. Krystal 
was going to help with the 2 a.m. 
and 2 p.m. milking on Labor Day. 

Joyce Perkins had a houseful of 
company over the holidays and 

included Becky and Warren Shirley 
and Colton from Caldwell, Tex. 
and son, Jeremy Brown from Lub-
bock, Chelsea Deger from Denton 
and her mom, Tina Deger from Ft. 
Worth, and Dave and Terrie Seitz 
and Emily and Kaylie from Wylie, 
near Dallas and Dewayne and 
Debbie Ford and Andy and Chris 
and Amber Ford and Taylor, all 
from Canadian. 

Nice to have Ed and Laurel 
Hershman join us for supper at 
Maxeys Saturday night and a good 
visit. 

Good to see Tommy Puryear at 
(Continued Page 6) 

0 West Texas Gas Co. 
500 South Mobeetie 

Wheeler, Texas 79096 wig 
Ruth Wiley 
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CHARLES F. KUNTZ 
CERTIFIED PUBLIC ACCOUNTANT 

111 W. Texas 	1-800-313-5516 
P.O. Box 489 	 121 N. Main 

Wheeler, TX 79096 	 Shamrock, TX 79079 
806/826-5516 	 806/256-3790 

WIRWS Jennings Plumbing, Heating 
ti Air Conditioning-4ialau 0 Dclez 

HONEY INN MOTEL 

Danny, Ravonda, Josh S Nick Hardcastle 

James, Belinda, Kyle S Brad Masters 

Gail 8 Sally Ledbetter 

The Shear Delight 
i-cpciltwo Thmtu @ Dimwit 

Dan, Gail, Lauren S Landon (#50) Sams 

Leo 8 Sylvia Shuler 

H. 8 R. BLOCK Mai OGRBD C3DTGIT 
Plicacds liNepg3VTO 

Lewis, Jennie, Jeff B Tom Britt 

Betty Hennard 

Wheeler Lumber Co. 

8COAM • 5:30 P.M. —Mon. thru-Sai. 

fPhOrld: eta + sz: ' '.44 2e S. M44. 
< 	( 
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Inc 
Furnitvir, AO* 	Hardware , 

POOL Qlffs 

WRIGHT FUNERAL HOME 
91I@ME1AQ WTHITIT 

David 8 Paula Britt 

CROSS CAR CENTER 4424. 
BODY REPAIR & AUTO GLASS INSTALLATION 

Intersection 83 & 152—Wheeler—Phone: 806/826-5515 
David & Kathleen Cross 

GREENBELT ELECTRIC 
COOPERATIVE, INC. 

708 10th 	Wellington, TX 
447-2536 

Serving  the Rural Area of Armstrong, Childress, Wheeler, 
Collingsworth, Donley, Gray, Hemphill, Randall & Roberts 

GO MUSTANGS! 

First to Finish . . . 
Built to Last 
Ow Front since 1970 

COW E & L ENTERPRISES 

Ed Hershman 	 17839 Co. Rd. 15A 
Laurel Hershman 	 403 Red River 
Business: 806/826-3251 — Home: 806/826-3246 — Wheeler, Texas 

Head Coach: Jim Verden 
Assistant Coaches: Cory Lynch, Kenny Rutherford 
Managers: Heather Hampton, Amanda Bond, Katlyn Rutherford, 
Stefan Tucker, Zach Verden 
Superintendent: Daymun White 
Principal: Doug Rives 
Band Director: Buzz Dirickson 
Cheerleaders: Samantha Chapman, Sue Hernandez, Lindsey 
Lewis, Katie Richardson, Yuri Soto, Brentney Taylor 
Mascot: Amanda Retana 
Cheerleader Sponsor: Sindy Chapman, Cheryl Richardson 

Bobby, Shelly, Chris S Kylie Schubert 

Rita Smith, Shelley, Don S Taylor Hudgins 
Rick Heiburg 

Elva Wood 

JONES FUELS 
Miry, @luilaRbg9  ifleigg Ifeag 

Rodney, Greta, Craig S Rachel Bass 

Hibler Implement Co., 11192 IPa 
Joannle, Doug, Cooper & Rhaelee Adams—Michael, Brandi, Zachary & Layton 

Ronny, Sherri, Tracy S Paige Jones 

Larry, Carol 8 Jason Porton 

MONDAY, September 8, 2003 — 
FRIDAY, September 12, 2003 
MONDAY 
Breakfast: Cold Cereal, Buttered 
Toast, Jelly, Juice, Milk 
Lunch: Stromboli, French Fries, 
Lettuce Salad, Peaches, No Bake 
Cookies, Milk 
TUESDAY 
Breakfast: Biscuit and Gravy, 
Scrambled Eggs, Jelly or Honey, 
Juice, Milk 
Lunch: Nacho's, Cheese, Let-
tuce Salad, Pinto Beans, Tortilla 
Chips, Pears, Milk 
WEDNESDAY 
Breakfast: Cold Cereal or Pan-
cake Pup, Buttered Toast, Jelly or 
Pancake Syrup, Juice, Milk 
Lunch: Chicken Nuggets, Gravy, 
Green Beans, Mashed Potatoes, 
Hot Rolls, Mandrain Oranges, Milk 
THURSDAY 
Breakfast: Biscuit and Gravy, 
Sausage Patty, Jelly or Honey, 
Juice, Milk 
Lunch: Pizza Casserole, Lettuce 
Salad, Pickle Spears, Pineapple, 
Milk 
FRIDAY 
Breakfast: Cold Cereal, Cinna-
mon Toast, Juice, Milk 
Lunch: Baked Potatoe, Chopped 
Ham, Grated Cheese, Squash, 
Broccoli, Sliced Bread, Milk 
(Menu subject to change) 

Sincere sympathy to family and 
friends of Texas Miller Patton, 61, 
of Montague in her death. She 
was the daughter of Rex and Vir-
ginia Miller of Allison and grew up 
there. She was married to Sammy 
Patton. 

Nice to talk to Jackie Cummings. 
She is doing well since her sur-
gery, but will have to have some 
treatments. Keep praying for this 
sweet lady. We miss her at church. 

Nice to visit with Ann Killingworth 
at Thriftway Thursday. She has 
been working to get her house 
ready at 902 S. Main in Wheeler. 
She is ready for business. that will 
be a nice addition to Wheeler. Best 
wishes! Ann is a good cook, too, 
and Jerry and Michael will be help-
ing some where needed. Or if your 
house gets crowded, leave the 
guests and go to Ann's. 

Had a good visit with Beth and 
Jim Alvey at Hastys' Thursday for 
supper. Glad they can take time to 
play some golf and have fun. Time 
rushes by. Also good to see Mary 
Kay Tallant and son, Bobby Don 
Patton, there. Bobby works at 
Dallas as a consultant in business. 
Also good to see David and Linda 

WHEELER 
PLUMBING 

511 S. Cheyenne 
New Construction 

Remodel 

Repair 

Sewer Service 

Septic Systems 

Site Evaluations 

Phone: 826-5907 
MAX McQUEEN 

P.O. Box 754 Wheeler, TX 

c 	 WELCOME TO 
FIRST UNITED METHODIST CHURCH 

8TH AT MAIN - P.C. BOX 89 - WHEELER, TX 79096 
CHURCH (806)  826-3114 - PARSONAGE (806) 826-3079 

Sunday School'. 	 9:45 alm. 
Ricky Carstensen, Morning  Worship 	 11:00 a.m. 

Pastor 	Old Fashioned Hymn Singing  
Sunday 	 5:30 p.m. 

7:00 p.m. 

MARSHALL'S 

HEATING & AIR CONDITIONING 
WHEELER, TX—PHONE: 664-5395—CELL: 662-7876 

TRANI" 
NOW DOING 

AIR DUCT CLEANING 
It's !lard To Stop A Trane —24 Hour Emergency Service— 

LICENSED & INSURED 
License No. TACLB022710E 

Mark Marshall, Owner 

Jimmy 8 Marie Adams 8 Family 

Charlie Brown 

Wheeler Shell— Corner Deli 
IL aga:Do WOrfirPortgas. @@uaQ@Co 

Community Evening  Praise Service (180 Youth Center) 

TURNER TRANSPORTATION 

3-H CATTLE CO. 	1:(giugnn Lue-ion 

130b9 
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WHEELER 
MUSTANGS 

2003 WHEELER MUSTANGS 
No. Name Ht. Wt. Yr. Pos. 
9 James Chapman 6-3 180 Sr. QB-DB 
10 Joe Don Glassey 5-8 160 Sr. WR-DB 
22 Brenton Goerend 6-0 180 Sr. WR-DB 
88 Brad Masters 6-3 200 Sr. TE-DE 
39 Josh Miller 5-10 195 Sr. RB-LB 
55 Dallas Owens 5-10 185 Sr. 0B-LB 
60 Joe Sales 5-10 220 Sr. C-LB 
70 Blaine Rutherford 6-0 190 Sr. T-DT 
15 Hector Emiliano 5-10 130 Jr. WR-DB 
50 Landon Sams 6-0 165 Jr. T-DE 
17 Josh Britt 6-1 180 So. RB-LB 
54 Josh Couch 6-2 200 So. TE-DT 
32 Tanner Collins 5-10 175 So. RB-DB 
61 Justin Lee 6-0 275 So. T-DT 
75 Derek Murray 6-1 200 So. G-DT 

130  Fr. 12 Samuel Hillhouse 5-8 WR-DB 
52 Chucky Rivera 5-9 160 Fr. G-LB 
64 Ricky Salas 5-9 180 Fr. G-LB 
66 Jared McArthur 5-9 130 Fr. C-LB 
62 Garrett Hampton 6-1 280 Fr. T-DT 
35 Cole Hathaway 5-6 160 Fr. RB-DB 
16 Mikel Tucker 5-10 180 Fr. TE-DE 
69 Randy Trevino 5-10 160 Fr. T-DE 

Dave S Mary Britt, BC9E139 	lbeo 

Phyllis Kinnard 8 Family 

Dudley S Velda Miller 

Doris Salon 
Darn o Damoilll Deinnoa, Ewe, 11 

F 

JOE DON GLASSEY 
inn — Senior 

PeVri ct< Waiketal, "ha. Zeage, & Waffle Weat4 Mow, 
On Call 24 Hours a Day • 826-5581 • Wheeler, Texas 
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THRIF T wAy 
SUPERMARKET 

Rig E. MK1TRE12 =MEM 'TT E4XAS 

(Wertington c5t ate BW4 

Wellington, TOW 	Wheeler • Memphis • Childress *Canadian 	Lori, 
(14/Gift% Banking  Centez 

405 Alan L. Bean Blvd.• P.O. Box 1040. Wheeler, Texas 79096 
Phone: 826-5566 Member: FDJ.C. 

tv A ri3r- Ln Chevrolet-Buick 
Olds 8 Pontiac, Inc. 

South Hwy. 83 Wheeler, Texas 

in. INFEST TEXAS 
lEtkonuu  	)PoWo 

u)  Tv  
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Claudine's Beauty Shop 
1E17E7 Tflandbmg naugiGnsgcS 

Eastern Panhandle Insurance Agency 

Thurman 8 Lanie Rives 
-3:7@tica @Qmrfillrig IGIttorfl w@ to 

MARSHALL DISCOUNT AUTO 
liereolE nogI® ale rele3111 _PARTC, Razga, MGEOM3G29  Ra818i.  h,  atawou name 

Pius Sr 	(Len, mammal, 	lincgoOom 
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24 HR. WRECKER SERVICE 

117 W. Okla.-Wheeler-806/826-3433 
INSURANCE CLAIMS 
OWNER: BOB McCAIN 

WHEELER MUSTANGS 
2003 FOOTBALL SCHEDULE 

Aug. 22 Gruver Scrimmage Here TBA 
Aug. 28 Vega Scrimmage There TBA 
Sept. 	5 West Texas There 7:30 
Sept. 12 Canadian There 7:30 
Sept. 19 Paducah (HC) Here 7:30 
Sept. 26 Sunray There 7:30 
Oct. 	3 Stratford Here 7:30 
Oct. 10 'Claude Here 7:30 
Oct. 17 'Shamrock Here 7:30 
Oct. 24 'Memphis There 7:30 
Oct. 31 'Wellington Here 7:30 
Nov. 6 *Clarendon There 7:30 

District Games 

WHEELER I. V. 8 IR. HIGH 

it 

Sept. 	4 
Sept. 11 
Sept. 18 
Sept. 25 
Oct. 2 
Oct. 9 
Oct. 16 
Oct. 23 
Oct. 30 

2003 FOOTBALL SCHEDULE 
Claude Here 	5:00 
Shamrock 	Here 
Memphis 	There 
Wellington 	Here 
Clarendon 	There 
Claude There 	5:00 
Shamrock 	There 
Memphis 	Here 
Wellington 	There 

5:00 
5:00 
5:00 
5:00 

5:00 
5:00 
5:00 

Sseetagettet 624 9ailan & Sea& 
115 West Oklahoma 	Wheeler, Texas 

Sibyl Clark 

Hanitah Fae Chapman 
R3Moic] ling[ De)oloc5 god giemaeina] 

WIN STATE! Buster, Debbie 8 Jennifer 
apal warieogo D ETGOTo Uflexittig 

The General Store 
Tgicybal DigAgi Duarum 

2003 WEST TEXAS COMANCHES 
Pos. 	CL 
QB/DB 	Jr. 
WR/DB 	Jr. 
QB/DE 	Jr. 
WR/DB 	Sr. 
RB/DB 	Sr. 
RB/LB 	So. 
RB/DB 	Jr. 
WR/DB 	Sr. 
RB/DB 	Sr. 
RB/LB 	So. 
OLJDT 	Jr. 
OLJDE 	Sr. 
OL/LB 	Jr. 
OLJDE 	Sr. 
OL/DT 	Sr. 
OL/DL 	Jr. 
OLJDT 	Sr. 
OLJLB 	Jr. 
OLJDE 	Sr. 
OLJDT 	Jr. 
TE/LB 	Sr. 

Coaches: David Caffey, David Wright, Ernest Wilson, Jay Belcher, 
Kelly Cowan, Trent Wilson 
Superintendent: Rob Dwight 
Principal: Margaret Parsons 
Cheerleaders: Dani Beagle, Brooke Bernard, Brandi Kemmel, 
Kali Leamon, Amy Luginbyhl, Lindsey Mannon, Kaycee McBrayer, 
Randi Reed 

# Name Wt. 
4 Tyler Caffey 165 
5 Sean Orr 140 
8 Stephen Little 160 
11 Josh Gipson 150 
16 ChrisConteras 140 
27 Seth Shields 160 
30 Paul Conteras 135 
32 Cory Whitfield 140 
34 Casey White 145 
42 EmManuel Juarez 160 
50 Michael Warren 170 
54 Casey Maxwell 180 
55 Michael Cruz 165 
58 Ryan Phelps 160 
62 Jesus Ramirez 230 
66 Chris Shipley 210 
67 Ricky Treon 240 
68 Justin O'Gorman 200 
73 Kyle Lemon 190 
78 John Stevens 220 
84 Cody Leinen 155 

Scott 8 Janell Dunnam s Aaron, -slagitIC 
&Ha D (flocippu Nlanocup TleAl 1 Ogee) DRIDIJIETI) 

MOORE 
18961* INSURANCE AGENCY  

Home-Auto-Farm-Life- Todd Moore, Agent 
111 W. 2nd St. 	 1-800-687-3730 
Shamrock, TX 79079 	 Fax (806) 256-8919 

(806) 256-8911 

Heritage Feeders, L.P. 
"The Cattleman's Feedlot" 

806/826-5591 

Mobeetie & Wheeler 
Established 1905 	Member: F.D.I.C. 

WHEELER FLOWER S GIFT SHOP 

R. a M. Car Wash 
Robert, Marla, Spencer & Mitchell Ford 

SPEEDI-MART ceotroomflaDoca @Ow° 
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LLISOM  
NEWS 

By Juanita Boydston ;  

Gary and Julie Boydston's chil-
dren and grandchildren were visit-
ing them this weekend. Arnie and 
Doug Purcell of Oklahoma City, 
Oklahoma; Greg and Tiffany, 
Gavin and Keli of Amarillo and Tori 
and Hannah of Stinnett. 

Roma and Billy Brown were in 
Elk City, Oklahoma on business 
Thursday. They did some shop-
ping and Roma got a haircut. 

Sunday guests of Peggy Chan-
dler were Bridget Weatherly and 
children Hagen and Audra of 
Wheeler and Sue Chandler. 

Just a reminder about your 
dishes from funerals. Mary said 
they could be picked up at the 
Baptist Church. Contact Mary or 
anyone from the Baptist Church. 
ThankYou I!! 

Troy and Lona Jones was glad 
to have their daughter, Connie 
Carpenter of Lovington, New 
Mexico with them this weekend. 

MEALS on 
WHEELS 

    

  

FN 
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MONDAY, September 8, 2003 - 
FRIDAY, September 12, 2003 
MONDAY: Pinto Beans W/Ham, 
Fried Potatoes, Stewed Tomatoes, 
Cornbread/Butter, Fruit Cocktail 
TUESDAY: Barbecue Beef On 
Bun, Baked Beans, Coleslaw, 
Apple Crisp 
WEDNESDAY: Enchiladas/ 
Sauce, Spanish Rice, Tossed 
Salad/Dressing, Cornbread/Mar-
garine, Pineapple Upside Down 
Cake 
THURSDAY: Fried Veal Patty, 
Baked Potato, Gravy, Mixed Veg-
etables, Plum Cobbler 
FRIDAY: Fried Catfish, Spinach, 
Au Gratin Potatoes, Bread/Mar-
garine, Gingerbread/Topping 

Sunday dinner guests of Troy 
and Lona Jones were their daugh-
ter, Connie Carpenter of Lovington, 
New Mexico, Bill and Kay 
Donaldson of Allison, Lee and 
Sharon Hall of Amarillo and Harold 
and Katherine Jones of Wheeler 
and Nona Jones. 

RetaGrayson attended Ray and 
Sue Giddens' 50th Wedding Anni-
versary at the Allison School. Reta 
was among many that attended 
the anniversary. 

Opal and Juanita Boydston 
shopped in Wheeler Friday and 
visited Roma and Billy Brown Fri-
day night and played a game of 
Spinners. 

Sunday dinner guests of Pearl 
Harrison were Henry and Dora 

Old Time Gospel Music 
On KPDR, 90.5 

... In Wheeler 
Sundays 6 a.m. to B a.m. 

Canadian Supply 
Redi-Mix 

for all your Concrete 

Needs! 

Jerry Smith, Owner 

806-323-5379 

Lea Dupont of Muskogee, Okla-
homa; Sue Martin of Jones, Okla-
homa; Pastor McDaniel; Eddy 
Walker; Kim Thompson and chil-
dren, Kimber, Brittany and Chase; 
H.B. and Cheryl and daughter 
Sabrina. 

Pearl Harrison journeyed to Elk 
City, Oklahoma Thursday to have 
her hair fixed by her daughter, 
Vivian Wallace. 

Vivian and Pearl Harrison vis-
ited Ruby Wallace who is in the 
Bell Nursing Home in Elk City, 
Oklahoma. They also visited 
Evelyn White in the Elk City hospi-
tal. She is a member of the United 
Pentecostal Church in Elk City, 
Oklahoma. 

SaRita Green was dinner guest 
with her Grandma, Opal Boydston 
and Aunt Juanita Boydston. 

Stephanie Walker and girls vis-
ited in Jimmy and Vivian's home 
Friday evening while Pearl was 
there. Pearl came back to Allison 
Friday afternoon. 

Weekend guest of Nadine 
Reynolds were Wayne and Debbie 
Reynolds of Amarillo and they had 
two grandchildren with them; Vickie 
and William Lay and Kylie of 
Bushland; Gary and Linda Hall of 
Pampa; Heather Boydston of Can-
yon; Greg and Tiffany, and chil-
dren Gavin, Keli of Amarillo and 
Tori and Hannah Boydston of 
Stinnett; and Bennie and Debbie 
Boydston. 

Lee and Sharon Hall were in 
Allisonthis weekend visiting friends 
and relatives. 

Visitors in the home of Curtis 
and Lillian Boydston were Opal  

and Juanita Boydston and Forrest 
and Betty Boydston. They had a 
nice visit and played the game 
Spinners. 

Our community was saddened 
to hear of the death of Texas Miller 
Patton. She had a large crowd in 
attendance at her funeral. 

Allison Community was blessed 
with a three and half inch rain 
Friday night which was very much 
appreciated. 

Visiting Edna May on Thursday 
were Dean and Linda Lieb. • As 
usual she brought food and left 
vegetables and meat in Edna's 
ref ridgerator and freezer. 

Opal and Juanita Boydston with 
a host of other friends and rela-
tives attended the funeral of Edith 
Levitt Saturday evening at two. 
Everyone had an opportunity to 
say something about Edith that 
they remembered about her. Sev-
eral did and it was a good service. 

Friday afternoon, Harold and 
Elena Walker came out to mow 
Edna's lawn. 

Opal and Juanita Boydston vis-
ited with Forrest and Betty 
Boydston in their home Saturday 
night. 

Sunday afternoon guest of Edna 
May were John and Tina Matiski 
and children from Missouri and 
Leslie and Betty Newsom from 
Odessa, Texas. Edna enjoyed their 
visit very much. 

After church Sunday nightthose 
visiting with Louise Boydston were 
Chuck and Kim Thompson and 
theirchildren, Kimber, Brittany and 
Chase of Amarillo; Amie and Doug 
Purcell of Oklahoma City, Okla-
homa; Forrest and Betty Boydston 
of San Clemente, California; 
Debbie Boydston and children, 
Heather and Jason; Tori and 
Hannah Boydston of Stinnett; Tif-
fany Kitchens of Amarillo; Jarrod 
Haning of Wheeler; Cheryl Dupont 
and daughter Sabrina; Sue Martin 
of Jones, Oklahoma; Pearl 
Harrison and Opal and Juanita 
Boydston. 

Court 	(from Page 3) 
T 	- 

Wheeler Sec. 55,M-1,H&GN, spud 
11.12-75, plugged 6-2-03, TD 
11840' (gas) -- Form 1 in Diamond 
Shamrock 
HEMPHILL (N.W. CANADIAN 

Lower Morrow) BP America Pro-
duction Co., #1 Arthur Webb 'A', 
M.H. Ragsdale Survey, spud 2-7-
74, Plugged 3-24-03, TD 12398' 
(gas) -- Form 1 in Diamond Sham-
rock 
HEMPHILL (S.E. CANADIAN Dou-
glas) BP America Production Co., 
#2 Cleveland '84', Sec. 84, 
41,H&TC, spud 7-7-81, plugged 
6-20-03, TD 8008' (gas) -- Form 1 
in HNG Oil 
HEMPHILL (CAST Upper Morrow) 
BP America Production Co., #1 
Newton, Sec. 180,41,H&TC, 
spud 7-24-01, plugged 5-20-03, 
TD 11500' (gas) -- Form 1 in Amoco 
Production 
HEMPHILL (N.W. MENDOTA 
Lower Douglas) BP America Pro-
duction Co., #101 John C. Isaacs, 
Jr, et al 'F, Sec. 1,--,D&SE, spud 
10-27-74, plugged 3-17-03, TD 
13089' (oil) -- Form 1 in Diamond 
Shamrock 
HEMPHILL (N.W. MENDOTA 
Lower Douglas) BP America Pro-
duction Co., #1 T.D. Wiggins 'B', 

Louise Boydston has beautiful 
new carpet throughout her house. 
It is really nice. She invited Opal 
and Juanita and Forrest and Betty 
to see it after church Sunday. We 
enjoyed viewing the carpet and a 
snack as well. 

Forrest and Betty Boydston 
treated his mother, Opal and sis-
ter, Juanita to a great meal at 
Maxey's in Wheeler Sunday after 
church.  

Sec. 54,1,I&GN, spud 2-2-82, 
plugged 3-31-03, TD 7550' 
Form 1 in Exxon Corp. 
HEMPHILL (WASHITA CREEK 
Morrow) ConocoPhillips Co., #4 
Bowers 	'B', 	Sec. 
256,C,G&MMB&A, 
spud 1-27-02, plugged 5-8-03, TD 
16200' (gas) -- Form 1 in Phillips 
Petroleum 
HEMPHILL (WASHITA CREEK 
Penn) BP America Production Co., 
#2 A. Bowers, et al 'H', Sec. 
255,C,G&MMB&A, spud 8-10-69, 
plugged 6-16-03, TD 13750' (gas) 
-- Form 1 in Gulf Oil 
ROBERTS (WILDCAT) Brighton 
Energy, L.L.C., #1 State of Texas, 
Sec. 152,42,H&TC, spud 3-30-03, 
plugged 6-27-03, TD 11336' (gas) 

ROBERTS (N.W. MENDOTA Up-
per Morrow) Unit Petroleum Co., 
#1 Vollmert 'C', Sec. 10,--, BS&F, 
spud in 1965, plugged 7-11-03, 
TD 11123' (gas) -- 
WHEELER (CONCANNON Gran-
ite Wash) Ridgeling Well salvage, 
#1 McAllister Unit, Sec, 3, L, J.M. 
Lindsey, spud unknown, plugged 
8-15-03, TD 11630' (oil) -- Form 
1-11 in Amarex 
WHEELER (PANHANDLE) 
Vernon Davenport, M.S. Bills, Soc. 
46,13,H&GN (oil) -- for the follow-
ing wells: 
#4, spud unknown, plugged 6-20-
03, TD 2205' -- Form 1 in Texaco, 
Inc. 
#5, spud unknown, plugged 7-8-
03, TD 2214' -- 
#7, spud unknown, plugged 6-13-
03, TD 2346' -- 
#8, spud unknown, plugged 6-25-
03, TO 2238' -- Form 1 in Texaco, 
Inc. 
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MOORE 
INSURANCE AGENCY la 

Todd Moore, Agent 
111 W .2nd St. 	 1-800-687-3730 
Shamrock, TX 79079 	 Fax (806) 256-8919 

(806) 256-8911 

Jay, Karen, Tyler 8 Lindsey Lewis 

WALLACE TAX SERVICE 
al@flE\GIID el RIMEL\ Gi 0E3665 

SOTO FAMILY RESTAURANT 
VD@ E. ®1130E)Iail]t:i 	026-3[1&) 

[10 	 FR--  Pharmacy 
I 	_  

110 West Texas Street 	Wheeler, Texas 

Dwayne S Bobbie Sue Baker 

Sandra Christner 

ARROW WATER WELL INC. 
Douusy D [3e2CD2ei Monscau9  Ttim@cas, Cen'Oci DOO 
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P.O. Box 1279 
Wheeler, Texas 79096 

       

       

Bill S VonEva Robertson 

MAXEY'S STEAKHOUSE 

L 

	

Gary, Karen S Dee Alston 
Dr. Louie Mendiola, M.D., P.A. 

®80B839 wituBigale 	Cluamtloup L300113Sy Q E3CreGEIBEWT IMOCIDOMOBEtil 

MEL'S  DINER, MGgl [pro Egt-
boo Eil?3Cfp/61.i = Moo C &owdfl ROGGR Ow 2aQg 

FIRST AG CREDIT FCA 
DR. MIKE SMITH 

mop Botanw @ lepagT @o3t219  DGED 1 EEUB01011 Ifi(D2/g 

Adrian Risner 

Gary and Becky Hardcastle 
Todd, Mindy, Bailey, Reagan & Presley Brashears - Marcus. Heather, Justin & Houston Hardcastle 

Stiles 5enting 8r. diir  Residential & Commercial Certified 
till keep it cold for you (unless you want 1 hot) 

For all your Heating and Air service needs. Cell: 886-5371 	Lic.STACLA023244C 

WHEELER N URSING 

& 	R ElABI ITA FION 

1000 S. Kiowa•Wheeler, Texas•806/826-3505 
-argiert-,an•Sr•trars r 	',nett 
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"Wheeler. town of Incndship and pride 

Jr 	GS PLUMBING;"11EATINW 
& AIR (*ITKINING 

LARRY JENNINGS, Owner 

"AFlush . . . Is 
Better -Than a 
Full House ! ! ! SALES & _SERVICE 

TX# TACLI3017641E 

Licensed, Insured & Bonded 

(806) 826-3153 
Licensed Septic Systems, & Site 
Evaluations 

WHEELER COMMUNITY 
CHURCH 

Rev. Alberta and Pat Helton 
806-323-9849 or 826-5607 

P.O. Box 544 

Wheeler, TX 79096 

1/3 mi. N. Hwy. 83 
	

John 14: 6: "Jesus saith unto him, 
Thursdays-7:00 P.M. 	I am the way, the truth and the life; 

—WELCOME— 	no man corneth unto the Father but by me. 

It 

Keep your arm 
and your leg. 

Activate a local plan of $29.99 or more, and pick any three: 
50% more anytime minutes 

Unlimited nights and weekends 
Unlimited mobile-to-mobile 

Free incoming calls 
Unlimited long distance 

\ DOBSON 
CELLULAR SYSTEMS 

1 .800.882.4 1 54 	www.dobsoncellular. cons 

BORGER CANADIAN PAMPA PAMNANDU Talk to Me vnreless WELSKITON 
Otm Calm Dobai Caw Daiwa Caddy In b CornTaIN. ire. 1806) 6484600 lacked Conruncarcos 

2131 Penron Fttwit 905 N. Ceder 311 Man St 1806) 5374537 (806) 44M004 
(806) 273-5656 (806) 323-6227 1806) 665-0500 Link Cossulring 

PERRYTON 1806) 4354200 %OMER 
HyTech Cornmatemicns Baker City Drug Farmers 4-lament Dolman Ceara (red) Laid ilartionoers 
(806) 274-7452 (806) 323 9135 1806)665-8046 918 S. Man SWARMS (806) 8265850 

1806) 4342090 Wee CPenciet 
WI Services ORWER Pampa Communes ms (606) 33411CA Ware Chewdet 
(8061 2732092 Ce.tver Fad. Inc. (606) 6651663 Ace CarmercfaI Rade 1806) 826-3026 

1806) 7112431 1806) 4351131 SPEARMAN 
818 Sales 
True Value Hardware 
1806) 6543762 

Promotion Is nand on local plaru S29.Sft and hither. Mobile to mobile calla* n pallet* In the features area (*toe carting another Cellvtar One 
customer. Minute otters are valid for six months with • new, are-year agreement oe for lee with a new, twoyear contract For life ia deemed as 
for es long as the customer Siff" on the are rate plan chosen at the tare of activation. 150% rrIntrtes. nationwide long distance, unlimited 
Incoming calls and free nigM rand weekend minutes ara available In the features area only. Nita and weekend minutes are awaliable from 8:00 
PM - 6:51. AM weekdays end an weekend long. New actNatIons ere contingent ixon vet meek, end annual agreements. Alrltrne 1.1 Wad in one 

Increment. Long drawee, roaming, taxes, wmturges and other terms and coreations miry spay. See store for more &tags. Available at 
participating locations only. Landed time otter. 62003 Dobson Cellukir Systems_ September TK2 
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Your source for the freshest 
,PRODUCE • MEAT • DAIRY 

WHEELER COUNTY'S EXCLUSIVE 
SOURCE FOR PLAINS & SHURFINE  PRODUCTS. 

4' 

THRIFTWAY SUPERMARKET 
300 EAST OKLAHOMA 

WHEELER 
826-5944 PHONE 826-3345 FAX 

MARKET MARKET SQUARE THRIFTWAY 
205 EAST THIRD 

SHAMROCK 
256-2481 PHONE 256-5060 FAX 

Ft. Elliott High School 
Football 2003 

Lefors-McLean (Scrim) 
Guthrie (Scrim) 
Hedley 
Northside" 
Silverton 
'Miami 
'Higgins 
'McLean 
*Lefors 
*Groom 
'Samnorwood 
Follett 

" Homecoming 
*District 

Ft. Elliott Junior High 
Football 2003 

Follett 
Silverton 
Miami 
Higgins 
McLean 
Lefors 
Groom 

McLean 
	

5:00 
H 
	

6:00 
H 
	

7:30 
H 
	

7:30 
T 
	

7:30 
7:30 

T 
	

7:30 
7:30 

T 
	

7:30 
7:30 

T 
	

7:30 
H 
	

7:30 

T 

H 
T 
H 
T 

5:00 
5:00 
5:00 
5:00 
5:00 
5:00 
5:00 

Aug. 22 
Aug. 28 
Sept. 4 
Sept. 12 
Sept. 19 
Sept. 26 
Oct. 3 
Oct. 10 
Oct. 17 
Oct. 24 
Oct. 31 
Nov. 7 

Sept. 11 
Sept. 19 
Sept. 25 
Oct. 2 
Oct. 9 
Oct. 16 
Oct. 23 

Lady Cougars 
2003 Volleyball 

Opponent 	 Pl. Time Teams 
Scr. West Texas High Stinnett 5:00 JV-V 
Fritch & Borger Briscoe 5:00 JV-V 
Perryton & Childress Briscoe 5:00 JV-V 
Borger JV Tourney Borger TBA Var. 
Pampa & San Jacinto Pampa 5:00 JV-V 
Ft. Elliott Tourney Briscoe TBA JV-V 
Childress Childress 5:00 JV-V 
Northside Briscoe 5:00 Var. 
Fritch & Borger Fritch 5:00 JV-V 
Chillicothe* Chillicothe 5:00 JV-V 
Paducah & Rockets Briscoe JV-V 
Perryton & Caprock Perryton 2:00 JV-V 
Memphis' Memphis 5:00 JV-V 
Chillicothe Briscoe 5:00 JV-V 
Paducah Briscoe 5:00 JV-V 
Memphis & Trinity Briscoe 5:00 JV-V 

Date 
Aug. 5 
Aug. 19 
Aug. 26 
Aug. 29 
Sept. 2 
Sept. 6 
Sept. 9 
Sept. 12 
Sept. 16 
Sept. 23 
Sept. 30 
Oct. 4 
Oct. 7 
Oct. 14 
Oct. 21 
Oct. 28 

Country 	(from Page 4) 

Thriftway. He had rotor-cuff sur-
gery July 30 and has done great. 
Said he could hardly wait to have 
the other one done. Gary Grimes 
had also had surgery on his shoul-
der about 2 1/2 weeks ago, but not 
real good yet, but not as much pain 
as before surgery.... 

Jason Hink is home from South 
Carolina. He haS been training to 
be a Border Patrol officer and will 
be going soon to Arizona for more 
training. He has been visiting Bob 
and Linda Hink and Janette and 
James Umsted and Brendan and 
Landry and Janice Kemp and 
Kade. They all went to Foss Lake 
over the weekend. Irene Rogers 
also got to see him. 

James and Marti Ogle visited 
Dorothy Ogle Sunday. Also there 
were Shellie and Jeremy Johnson 
and Tanner. AU doing o.k. 

Thanks, Ft. Elliott and Gay 
Purcell for all the ball schedules. 
Next Saturday, Sept. 6, will be a 
volleyball tournament at Ft. Elliott 
in Briscoe. Teams scheduled are 
Fritch JV, Childress JV and Var-
sity, Perryton JV, San Jacinto JV, 
WT High Varsity, Holy Cross. 
Rockets and Ft. Elliott. 

We had a real good singing at 
Wheeler Baptist Church Sunday 
night, Some singing were Weldon 
Simmons, Haley and Taylor 
Sparks, Kaylee Marion, Claudia 
Marion, Ann Killingsworth and 
Delores Simmons. Leona Coates 
read some funnies from the internet 
and some soul searching ques-
tions. Martha Meek played the 
harmonica. All was good. Then 
had lots of delicious homemade 
ice cream and cookies. Very good. 
Thanks to each, who participated. 
Weldon also led congregational 
songs. 

Grandson Clint Newman has a 
new job at Bank of America in  

Carrolton. He starts Tuesday, Sept. 
2, and will be a teller and computer 
operator. His two buddies from 
high school that he lives with also 
work there. We are proud of you, 
Clint; always have been. God 
bless! Clint and his mom, Mary 
went shopping for more appropri-
ate bank clothes. Baggy jeans and 
t-shirts don't cut it. 

Visiting Shirley Jolly Monday 
(Earl needed to go golfing) for a  

family get together were Vickey 
Nelson, Jimmy Nelson, Keri 
Koelzer, Danny and Ashlee and 
Amy and Hay lee, Cathy and Frank 
Hooper from Perryton, Brad 
Harrison and Wendy from Ama-
rillo, Myron and Becky Jolly, DeAnn 
and Jerry Foshee and Brenda 
Martin from Elk City. 

Danielle Nelson went camping 
and fishing in Colorado with  

grandpa Tom Swigart and Jake. 
Jake was also going to do some 
elk hunting over the weekend In 
the mountains. 

Met a nice couple at Hasty's, 
George and Hazel Davis, who live 
on Elm Creek, south of Shamrock, 
but aren't related to other Devises. 
Pray for Hazel, who has been ill. 

Casey Tipps has been helping 
take care of Willa Fillingim's crit-
ters, while she is in the hospital 
with knee surgery. 

David and Phyllis Hefley enjoyed 
having all their family home for the 
weekend and included Kristi Hefley 
from Lubbock and Darren and 
Chalone Hefley and Dawson and 
Loganfrom Tulle. David and Phyllis 
and Kristi went to Ray and Sue 
Giddens 50th Anniversary celebra-
tion at Allison School Sunday af-
ternoon. Ray was a brother to Car' 
Giddens, Phyllis' dad. 

Sincere sympathy to family and 
friends of Mary Grice who passed 
away at Oklahoma City. Mary Beth 
Guy of Ponca City is a daughter 
and friend to Irene Rogers of 
Wheeler. 

Irene Rogers' sister, Mabel 
Adams of Pampa has an artery 
that is stopped up and will have to 
have a valve replaced in her heart 
at Amarillo soon. Remember her 
in your prayers. 

Sunday many friends and rela-
tives gathered at the homeof Ken-
neth and Glenda Wischkaemper 
in Shamrock to celebrate Vaughn 
Lister's 80th birthday (Glenda's 
dad). Vaughn hasn't been well. 
Pray for him. I remember Vaughn 
in college at W.T. Fine fellow. He 
and wife Alice (Austin) are some 
better. There were over 70 people 
there. Had a pretty decorated John 
Deere Cake. God bless you every-
one! It was every nice party. Happy 
80th birthday, Vaughn. 

Laurel and Ed Hershman went 
to Amarilo Sunday after Sunday 
School (they both taught classes) 
and visited Willa Fillingim. She has 
been pretty sick; the replaced knee 
is doing fine, but she has been 
throwing up a lot. Keep praying for 
her. 

Loyd Anderson who used to 
work for Vaughn Lister even came 
from Waco to celebrate his birth-
day. Vaughn really enjoyed see-
ing him and all the others. 

Did you see Wes and Cindy 
Bradstreet'sgrandson, Miles Keith, 
in the Happiness Booklet for Aug. 
30 to Sept 5? Such a cute picture 
of a cute little boy. 

So nice to have Mark Meek join 
us for lunch at Maxeys Saturday 
and a good visit. Mark had 3 1/2 to 
5 inches of rain Friday night in 
different places. Wow! (we are still 
proud of our 1/4 inch of rain.) The 
lake on our home place was very 
low. The rain helped a bunch. We 
enjoyed seeing Markgrow up f rom 
a baby to a fine man. The Chuck 
Hartline's had over four inches of 
rain. Wonderful! Mark had been 
working water gaps. 

Nice to see Frances Hefley with 
James and Charlotte Hefley from 
McLean and Holly and Matt 
Williamson at Maxeys Saturday 
night. Also Marvin and Linda Cox 
and Bill Cox and Tim and Daphne 
Cox. Also there Mack and Patty 
Ann Shields and Amanda from 
Amarillo with Don and Bonnie Hall 
from Quail. Good to see Jennifer 
Maddox and Lake Ledford there 
and visit a little. 

So nice to have Bro. John 
Denton interim pastor at Wheeler 
Baptist, and his wife Eulis join us 
for lunch at Maxeys Sunday and a 
good visit. Lovely people, a great 
preacher. We are proud to have 
them at First Baptist Wheeler. 

Great to have granddaughter, 
Lindsey, and Ken Criswell and 
Blain visit us and eat lunch at 
Maxeys with us Tuesday. Always 
so good to seethem. Blain is crawl-
ing everywhere now. He is so sweet 
and lovable, but I may be preju-
diced, but surely not. The Criswells 
spent a few days with Rita and 
David Pearson. Blain sure likes 
Grandpa David and Grandma Rita. 
Ken works weekend nights on 
Ospreys. 

All of Bevard and Diane Dukes 
family came Friday afternoon for 
the weekend. They included Tracy 
and Andrea Auldridge and Tanner 
and Tysen, Deidre and John Paul 
Harris and Logan, Carissa and 
Britt McCarter and friends Noah 
and Jana Hall. They all went down 
to Foss Lake Friday. They had 
rented a cabin. Wasn't quite big 
enough for all, so Bevard and Diane 
slept in a tent. They found out in 
the night that it wasn't water proof 
and moved to a spot on the porch, 
which helped some. Saturday they 
did some water skiing, tubing, float- 

ing. The temperature dropped 
drastically and began raining about 
3:30 p.m. Saturday. So they went 
home and ate supper at Maxeys. 
Sunday they all went to Allison 
Church of Christ. After lunch ev-
eryone went home. They did have 
a fun time together, In spite or rain 
and cold. 

We enjoyed seeing Fort Elliott 
girls play volleyball at Briscoe Tues-
day night against Childress and 
Perryton. Fort Elliott varsity girls 
playing were Holly McCurley, 
Tamera Hefley, Andrea Hathaway, 
Sarah Beth Zybach, Alicia Reis 
and Shealee Coulter. They de-
feated Perryton and Childress. 

Cheyenne ( from Pagel) 

Pioneer Day and will be held in the 
School Lounge. All the other ac-
tivities will be held in the Chey-
enne City Park on Saturday, Sep-
tember 6, between 9 a.m. and 4 
p.m. The Masonic Lodge will con- 

Chat 
	

(from Page 1) 

Can you believe it, Barbara? It 
was 44 years ago today. Happy 
Anniversary. 

— cwe — 
We had six for cards Monday 

evening. It was a good night for 
Leroy, Dwight and I. We won all 
three games, according to the 
score. Rhonda, Barbara and Bob 
claimed a win on the last game on 
a technicality—you get a different 
story, depending on which team 
members you ask. 

Birthday 	(from Page 1) 

hergranddaughter, and herdaugh-
ter, Louise. The registration book 
had a matching rose and inscrip-
tion. Forty-seven guests and 
friends were registered plus the 
residents of the Care Center along 
with the employees. Many photo-
graphs were taken and a good 
time was enjoyed by all. Estelle 
received a special birthday card 
from President Bush and Laura. 
Mrs. Orr received many othercards 
which she appreciated, and they 
were placed in a gold basket deco-
rated with gold ribbon and two red 
rose buds. 

CARD OF THANKS 
I want to thank everyone that 

had a part in helping me celebrate 
my 90th Birthday. The party was 
above and beyond anything I ex-
pected. Friends are a blessing from 
God. Thank You! 

Vea Fillingim 

KELTON MENU  
THURSDAY, September 8, 2003 
— FRIDAY, September 12, 2003 
MONDAY 
Breakfast: Cereal, Toast, Juice, 
Milk 
Lunch: Ham, Mashed Potatoes, 
Gravy, Green Beans, Hot Rolls, 
Fruit, Milk 
TUESDAY 
Breakfast: Biscuits, Peanut But-
ter, Syrup, Juice, Milk 
Lunch: Chicken Spaghetti, Corn, 
Salad, Toast, Fruit, Milk 
WEDNESDAY 
Breakfast: French Toast Sticks, 
Juice, Milk 
Lunch: Hamburger Casserole, 
Mashed Potatoes, Brown Gravy, 
Biscuits, Pudding, Milk 
THURSDAY 
Breakfast: Eggs, Sausage, Bis-
cuits, Jelly, Juice, Milk 
Lunch: Hamburgers, Cheese, 

' French Fries, Lettuce, Tomatoes, 
Pickles, Onions, Strawberries, Ice 
Cream, Milk 
FRIDAY 
Breakfast: Do-nuts, Toast, Juice, 
Milk 
Lunch: Hot Dogs, Cheese, Carrot 
& Celery Sticks, Tator Tots, Pears, 

, Milk 
! Menu is subject to change. 

Good playing! Perryton defeated 
Childress. Good Concessionp. 
New volleyball rules: No matter 
who serves the ball, the team who 
failed to get the ball back across 
the net loses a point to the other 
side. And it takes 25 points to win 
a game instead of 15. Or that is 
how it was played. 

On the J.V. girls team were 
Chrystal Selby, Laura Lohberger, 
Vanessa Huff, Andria Keelin, 
Randilyn Barr, Glory Hartsfield 
Sarah Moon and Chynna Atherton. 
They played good, but lost to 
Childress and Perryton. 

"God be with you till we meet 
again." 

duct the Auction of day Hunts on 
private land, which will begins 
12:30 in the Park Pavilion followed 
at 1:30 by the Masonic Donation 
Auction. The lists may be mailed 
upon request at 580-497-3318. 
They have several OU and OSU 
Football Tickets on the auction 
block this year, even two for the 
OU-OSU Bedlam Game. The pio-
neering activities will be enjoyed 
by young and old and the addition 
of new people doing new crafts wil: 
make this part even more interest-
ing. The Hand-crank Ice Cream 
Freezer will be in full swing. We 
have added some new contests. 
Checkers Tournament, Hammer 
the Nail Contest, Free Throw Con-
test, Sack Race, Pioneer Shooter, 
Turtle Race, Box Hockey and other 
contests to the day's events. These 
are in addition to the Antique Car 
Show, Quilt Show, Petting Zoo, 
Buckin' Bull, Book signing with 
Author Pat Chalfant, Covered 
Wagon Rides, Flea Market Booths, 
etc. At 5:00 the square dancers 
will be entertaining, followed by 
free hot dogs and a Back to School 
Street Dance with the Washita 
River Boys from 7-10. 

" CARD OF THANKS 
The family of Sammy and Texas 
Patton wish to express our deep-
est gratitude for the kindness and 
considerations the communities 
have shown for our families during 
our time of grief. 

The Family of 
Texas Miller Patton 
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Starting Friday, Sept. 5: 

"American Wedding" 
Rated: R 

Showtime: 
Fri.thru Thurs. 	 7:00 
Sunday Matinee 	 2:00 

P.M. 
P.M. 
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