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Dake a Morgan 
To Pled e Vows 

James Dake of Gorman announce the marriage of his 
daughter, Marladcan to Malcome Morgan. son of Mr. and 
Mrs. Kenneth Morgan of De Leon. 

Vows will read at 7:00 p.m. June 7, 1980 in St. Jo Baptist 

Church in De Leon. 
All friends and relatives are invited to attend. 

—GP— 

DOCTORS' CLINIC 
FIRST ANNIVERSARY 

DEMOCRATIC PARTY PRIMARY ELECTION 
( ELECTION PRIMARIA DEL PARTIDO DEMOCRATIC° ) 

(CONDADO DE) EASTLAND COUNTY, TEXAS 
JUNE 7, 1980 	(7 DE JUNO DE 1980) 

INSTRUCTION NOTE: 
(NOTA DE INSTRUCCION) 

Vote fur the candidate of your choice i ' each race by placing an "X" in the square beside 
the candidate's name. (Vote poi 	candidate de su preforencia pica cede candidata r 
marcando con one -X -  el cuadre al ludo del nombre del candidates.) 
I am a Democrat and pledge myself to support the nominee of this primary.  
(Yo toy Democrats y comprom•to mi apoyo a el candidato nombrado de este primari•. 

For Associate Jusiice, Supreme Court, Pace I 
( Para Jun Asociado, Corte Suprema Lugar Nurn. I ) 

fl James P. (Jim) \Naliace 

L_I 	John C. Phillips 

For Judge, Court of Criminal Appeals, Place 2 
(Para Jun, Corte de Apelaciones Criminales, Lugar 
Num. 2) 

—GP— 

Visiting Sunday with Mrs. 
Ruby Bennett was her grand-
son, Mr. and Mrs. Joe Lynn 
Bennett, Terry and Latricia 
of Abilene. 

Gorman Lodge 716 
A F&A M stated meet-

ings 2nd Tuesday of. 
every month at 8:00 

p. m. Members urged to at-
tend. Visitors welcome. 

isc  Tip (craittatit rogrrps 
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LIONS CLUB SOFTBALL 
REVIVAL TOURNEY SET JUNE 6-7-8 
JUNE 16-22 

CMC SET 

at the baseball field. This is a 
double elimination tourna-
ment sponsored by the Lions 
Club and sanctioned by the 
Texas Softball Association 
using only official softball 
rules and regulations and 
using only official softball 
association umpires in call- 
ing the games. 

There will be a one hour 

Local and area fans are in for 
a real treat with action 
beginning on Friday at 6 p. 
m. with the Bad Company 
team from Stephenville tak-
ing on the Gorman team. A 

complete list of teams will 
appear elsewhere in this 
issue and a complete bracket 
showing the second round 
games, etc. will be displayed 

The Gorman Lions (tub 
are sponsoring a Slow Pitch 
Softball Tournarnent at the 
local baseball field on Friday, 
Saturday and Sunday, June 
6-7-8, which will feature 
four or five of the top slow 
pitch teams in the entire area 
as well as a team from 
Gorman and numerous other 
teams from the area who are 
outstanding. 

St' v. Bad Co. 

The Gorman Congrega-
tional Methodist Church will 
hold a Revival Meeting from 
June 16 through June 22 with 
Rev. Sammie Mitchell of 
Oklahoma serving as evan-
gelist. Pat Cornwell will be 
the song leader with Joyce 
Dennis. Lisa Cornwell. and 
Richard Dennis as the in-
strumentalists. There will be 

time limit on all games 
except the trophy games 
(games 28-29-30-31) which 
will have no time limits. 

There will be no admission 
charges for the games, but 
the Lions Club will have 
plenty of goodies for the 
fans to munch on while 
enjoying the games. They 
will have cold drinks, ham-
burgers that are fresh off the 
grill, nachos, snow cones, 
chips. dill pickles and candy 
available at all times during 
the games. So enjoy the ball 
games and some delicious 
food and at the same time 
support the Lions Club who 
do so many civic projects for 
the community and area. 

The Gorman Baseball will 
also benefit from this tourney 
as the Lions CLub is donating 
funds for the use of the field. 

Lions Club members will 
be taking care of the score-
cards and will be manning 
the concession stands at all 
games. 

The baseball field is locat-
ed on the Desdemona High-
way about a mile from town 
and there will be plenty of 
parking room with stands for 
the fans and trash barrels 
will be available for the folks 
to use to help keep the park 
clean, 

So, "Take Me Out To the 
Ball Game".... 

—GP— 

LET CHILDREN 
REMEMBER 
• Let all children remember, 
if ever they are weary of 
laboring for their parents or 
helping around the house, 
that Christ labored for His 
parents; if impatient of their 
commands, that Ch r i s t 
cheerfully obeyed; if reluc-
tant to provide for their 
parents, that Christ forgot 
Himself and provided for His 
mother amid the agonies of 
the crucifixion. The affec-
tionate language of this div-
ine example to every child is. 
Go thou and do likewise. 

special music each night G1 Fri. 6 p.m. 
featuring many talented Gorman  

PRESS POINTS 
JOE BENNETT, Publisher 

—J-- 
Wasn't it just awful how 

those poor ole Cubans were 
being treated down in Ar-
kansas. They just had to riot 
being treated so bad. After 
all, we did take them in when 
they fled their great country 
and were feeding and hous-
ing them and otherwise tend-
ing to their needs. 1 say if it is 
so terrible in our country 
then they should be returned 
to their own country where 
things arc so great. This 
bunch of no goods were set 
up in our country to make the 
U. S. look bad. I bet old 
Castro really enjoyed seeing 
his stooges rioting just as he 
ordered them to do. Now I 
think that his bunch of punks 
who are causing all the 
troubles should not be allow-
ed to stay in our country. 

I don't think it will be so 
easy to get them out though 
now that we have taken them 
in. It seems that we don't 
have the right to just toss 
them out even though they 
came here on their own. 
Guess this is another case of 
their civil rights being violat-
ed. If we cannot rid our 
society of these bums who 
come to our country, then I 
say our laws should be 
changed. If they are not 
citizens of the United States. 
then they don't have any 
right to put us and our 
country down. So I think we 
should say bon voyage to 
those causing all the trouble. 

—J— 
The Lions Club's Annual 

Slow Pitch Baseball Tourney 
will be held here starting on 
Friday evening at 6 and 
continuing all day Saturday 
and Saturday night. with the 
final games being played os 
Sunday. At the time of this 
writing 14 teams had been 
secured for the tourney and 2 
more were expected to come 
also. 

This was such a great 
event last year that the Lions 
decided to hold it again this 
year. There will be no admis-
sion charge and there will be 
lots and lots of great slow 
pitch baseball teams enter-
ed. Some of the best teams in 
this part of the country will 
be participating in the event. 
So come on out and enjoy the 
action and also eat some of 
the numerous goodies that 
the Lions will be selling at 

&the concession stands. All 
proceeds will go to worth- 
while local civic projects. 

—J— ' 
We enjoyed a visit this 

week from Mavis Base of 
Wyoming. He and his family 
plan to move back to Mon-
tana soon. They will return to 
Missoula where they lived 
before going to Wyoming. 
We wish them the best on 
their return to Montana. I 
kidded him about keepimg 
his eye on Mt. Saint Helens. 

—J— 
Just a word here about 

everyone being on the look• 
out for our children who arc 
out of school now and riding 
their bicycles and walking 
about on the streets of our 
community. Be extra alert for 
these youngsters and protect 
them from harm. After all. 
they are our most important 
asset you know and deserve 
our courtesy and love. Thank 
the Lord for the great bunch 
of youth we have in our 
community. 

—J— 
And remember to smile - - 

because God Loves You! 
—G P— 

CORRECTION 
We regret that the names 

of Audra Schuman and Lon-
nie Bennett were omitted as 
candlelighters in the wedd-
ing article of Joetta Bennett 
and James Schuman, and 
also that the names of James 
Thomas and Lonnie Bennett 
were not listed as ushers. 

G9 
Sat. 

8 a . m . De Leon .2 

NC ADMISSION 

TIME LIMIT - ONE HOUR 
musicians from the local 
area. 

The pastor. Rev. M. F. 
Dennis. and his congregation 
extend a special warm wel-
come for all to come and be 
with them each evening at 

7:30 p.m. 
—GP— 

G2 Fri. 7 p,m, 
Eastland G2I 

Sat 
8p.m. FireFighters B' rid 

G3 Fri. 8 p.m. 
De Leon =1 610 

Sat 
9 a . m. 

FBC SET 
BIBLE 
SCHOOL 

Li pan 

G4 Fri. 9 p.m. 
Proctor 

G27 

Sun 
1p.m.. 

TRCC (Ranger) 

G5 Fri. 10 p.m 
Wrecking Crew 611 

Sat 
10a.m. Wild Bunch Vacation Bible School will 

be held at First Baptist 
Church June 9 through June 
13. Classes will be from 8:30 
to 11:30 a.m. daily. 

There will be Bible study, 
crafts, recreation and refres-
ments for ages 3 through 6th 

grade. 
A parade will be held 

Saturday June 7 at 10:30 
a.m. followed with a picnic at 
Frank Gray Memorial Park. 

All children of the area arc 
invited to attend. Be sure to 
bring a sack lunch for the 

Saturday picnic. 
—GP— 

GORMAN ROPING CLUB 
TO MEET THURSDAY NILE 

The Gorman Riding and 
Roping Club will meet Thurs-
day, June 5 at 8:30 p.m. at 
the arena on Desdemona 
Hwy. 

All members and prospec-
tive members are urge to 
attend. 

—GP— 
Anthony Anderson of 

Cransfills Gap is visiting this 
week with his grandparents 
Mr. and Mrs. Frank Rhymes. 

G6 Fri. 11p.m. 
F B C (Ranger)  G22 

Sat 
9p.m. 

G30 

Sun 
4p.m. 

Gordon 

G7 Fri. 12p.m. 
UCC(B'wood) G12 

Sat 
11a.m. Desdemona 

A Lunch' Saturday marked 
the first anniversary of the 
opening of Doctors' Clinic. 
The event was hosted by Drs. 
Limneo and Nimfa Agulia 
who have been in the clinic 
one year. 

The luncheon catered by 
Mac Epplens of Abilene was 
held in the newely decorated 
clinic from 11:30 a.m. to 1:30 
p.m. Clinic personel assisted 
with the celebration. 

The doctors came to Gor-
man from Whitney and have 
served the community with 
excellent medical care and 
the community has grown to 
love them and respect their 
medical skills. 

have offices in Doctors Cli-
nic in Blackwell Hospital 
which they have recently 
re-decorated. 

Approximately 65 area 
doctors, nurses, clinic techni-
cians and other guests at-
tended the celebration. 

The doctors stated they 
have enjoyed their associ-
ation and practice in Gorman 
and look forward to the 
future of medical service for 
the community.. 

The Agulias have recently 
purchased a beautiful new 
home in Gorman. 

--GP— 
CARD OF THANKS 

I wish to express my 
thanks for the cards, flowers, 
phone calls, and prayers 
during my stay in De Leon 
Hospital. Your , j friendship 
and concern was greatly 
appreciated. 

Nath McMullen 

G8 Sat. 1 a.m. 
Dublin 

G31 

Sun 
5p.m, 

SEE COMPLETE BRACKET AT BALL FIELD 

Loser 3rdJ 

If 1st Loss 

LOOK WHO'S NEW 
Mr. andd Mrs. Joe Fields 

of Leggett and formerly of 
Eastland announce the arri-
val of their new baby daugh-
ter, Lisa JoAnn, on Sunday 
May 18, 1980. She was born 
in the Lufkin hospital at 2:35 

p.m. and weighed 7 pounds 
and 21/2  ounces. 

She was welcomed by a 
brother. Michael, 9 and sis- 
ter Caylea,5. 	Paternal 
grandparents are Mr. and 
Mrs. James V. Fields of Rt. 1 
Gorman and Mr. and Mrs. 

Buster Johnson of Carbon 
are the great-grandparents. 

Maternal grandparents are 
Mr. and Mrs. Bill Carlton of 
Odessa and Mr. and Mrs. 
Jim Hogan of Carbon are the 
great-grandparents. 

JAMES JAY APPOINTED 
REPRESENTATIVE FOR 
LIFE AND HEALTH 

The Travelers is pleased to 
announce that James Jay has 
been appointed as the repre-
sentative for Life and Health 
Products in Gorman. 

Since his appointment 
earlier this year, James has 
already qualified for the 1980 
"100" Club and was one of 
the top ten agents qualifying 
for an annual 	Campaign 
sponsored by the Fort Worth 
office. Jay placed 4th. 

—GP— 

Mr. and Mrs. Mavis Baze 
of Casper, Wyoming are 
visiting this week with his 
brother, Mr. and Mrs. Gray-
don Baze. 

    

The doctors have been 
associated with Small Hos-
pital Associates. and as of 
May 1. this association was 
terminated and they are now 
operating on their own and 

REV. DWAINE JAMES 
RE—APPOINTED TO 
LOCAL METHODIST POSTS 

Rev. Dwaine James was 
re-appointed pastor for the 
Gorman First United Meth-
odist. Desdemona and Han-
nibal Methodist Churches. 
Rev. James has served as 
pastor of the churches for, the 
past year. 

The appointment was 
made Wednesday, June 4 at 
the Central Texas Confer-
ence in Fort Worth. 

United Methodist Bishop 
W. McFerrin Stowe, resident 
bishop of the denomination 
of the Dallas-Fort Worth 
arca. announced the pastoral 
appointments for the local 
churches in the 24-county 
region of Central Texas Wed-
nesday, June 4 at the closing 
of the conference held at 
Texas Wesleyan College. 

—GP— 

We invite you to the 
services at First B a p t is t 
Church on the next Lord's 
Day. 

Sermon topics next Sun-
day: 

Morning service: Romans 
3:21-26; What in the Devil 
Have We Been Doing? 

EVENING SERVICE: Isa-
iah 28:16.22; Short Beds and 
Narrow Covers 

We invite all children-• 
ages 3 through 6th grade to 
Vacation Bible School--June 
9-13. 

—GP - 

CARD OF THANKS 
We wish to express our 

thanks to all who called, and 
sent flowers at the time of 
passing of our Daddy. 
Bennie L. Northcutt. 

Homer and Jerry Underwood 
R. L., and Dorthy Stone 
Keith, and Gail Wells, 

and Chilrcn 
—GP-- 

FLOSSIE UNDERWOOD 
UNDERGOES HIP 
SURGERY 

RUN-OFF ELECTION SET JUNE 1 
Kenneth Eaves went into the 
run-off race for Eastland 
County Sheriff. 

One the -sate Level: James 
P. (Jim) Wallace and John C. 
Phillips are in a run-off for 
Associate Justice Supreme 
Court, Place 1. 

W. T. Phillips and Mike 
McCormick seek Judge, 

Court of Criminal Appeals 
Place 2. 

tom Davis and Edith Ro-
berts seek Judge, Court of 
Criminal Appeals, Pace 3. 

The Democratic Primary 
Run-Off election will be held 
Saturday June 7 at the Fire 
Hall. Polls will open at 7:00 
a.m. and close at 7:00 p.m. 

There are three stages 
judges and the county sheriff 
race to be decided by voters 
in Eastland County. 

Johnnie W. Morren and 

New Homes In Gorman These are important off-
ices to be filled and everyone 
is urged to vote Saturday 
May 7. 

SAMPLE BALLOT 
CARD OF THANKS 

It is with humble hearts, 
we express our deepest ap-
preciation and thanks to all 
the kindness shown to our 
family in the loss of our loved 
one. Edward. A special 
thanks to our friends in 
Gorman, Eastland, and Den-
ton for the flowers, cards, 
and food. Your helpfulness 
and comforting expressions 
of sympathy will be remem-
bered. 

May God be gracious to 
each of you. 

The Family of 
Murl and Lilia Pittman 

NEW HOME BEING BUILT: The new home is Mr. and Mrs. 
Ed Bagwell's home being built on the Desdemona Hwy. The 
house is being built by Senkel Construction Co. 

Flossie Underwood under-
went hip surgery Tuesday. 
She is recovering nicely and 
is in the Harris Hospital in 
Fort Worth. Get Well wishes 
may be sent to her at the 
hospital. 

Gorman Chamber of Com-
merce will meet Thursday 
June 12 at 9:00 a.m. in City 
Hall. 

City Commission will meet 
Thursday June 5 at 8:00 p.m. 
at the City Hall. 

I 	W. T. Phillips 
Mike McCormick 

NEWLY COMPLETED HOME: The Home of Mr. and Mrs. 
Doug Rainey is shown after finishing touches were made on 
their nea home on the Desdemona Hwy. Their was built by 
Senkel Construction Co. F 

Gorman Primitive Baptist 
Church will meet Saturday 
June 7 at 7:30 p.m.. and 
Sunday June 8 at 10:30 a.m. 

TELEPHONE NUMBER 
FOR 
	

• 
AMBULANCE SERVICE 

734.2297 For Judge, Court of Criminal Appeals, Place 3 
( Para Jun, Corte de Apelaciones Criminales, Lugar 
Num. 3) 

j  Torn Davis 
Edith Roberts 

Church of Christ at Rucker 
urges all Church of Christ 
people to meet with them 
each Sunday at 10:30 a. m. 

Charles Marsh of Arlington 

preaches every 2nd Sundry 
and Johnny Snow of Abilene 
preaches every 4th Sunday. 

Gorman Chapter 443 
J.E.S. meets the 1st 
Monday each month 

at 7:30 P. M. 

For Sheriff 
(Para Sherife) 

7 Kenneth Eaves 
11,  Johnnie W. Morren 

NEARING COMPLETION: The horn.; of E.G. and Betty Sue 
Henderson is nearing completion. The house is located on the 
Desdemona Hwy. 

Girls Scouts junior and Ca-
dettes will meet each Tues• 
day at 3:45 p.m. at the First 
united Methodist Church in 
Fellowship Hall. 



SURETY BONDED 

INSURED 

STATE OF TEXAS 
LICENSE NO. 871 

it  GENERAL PEST CONTROL 
a 

Chemical Weed Control 

GRAHAM 
549•0667 

AAA Exterminating Co. 
FREE INSPECTION AND ESTIMATES 

JERRY KING 

STEPHENVILLE 
965-3047 

RANGER 
647-1858 

Services for Bennie L. 
Northcutt, 83, of 3002 Cott- 
age Street, 	Brownwood, 
Texas was at 2:30 P.M. 
Thursday May 29. 1980 at 
Morelock Funeral Home with 
Rev. R. J. Elkins officiating. 
Burial was in Oakview Ceme-
tery, Comanche. Texas. 

Mr. Northcutt died at 2:00 
a.m. Wednesday May 28, 

1980 in a local nursing home. 
He was born November 21. 

1896 in Comanche. and was a 
retired city employee. He 
was a Baptist. and had lived 
21 years in Brownwood. and 
was formerly of Desdemona. 
Texas. He married Rebecca 
Maggie Nelms at Comanche. 
Texas January 24. 1920. His 
wife died September 26. 
1979. 

HOUSE REPAIRS 
NO JOB TOO SMALL 

ALL WORK GUARANTEED 

Jay Williams 
Call 89 m 2 405 

PUBLIC NOTICE 
Texas Electric Service Company, in ac-

cordance with the rules of the Public Util-
ity Commission of Texas, hereby gives no-
tice of its intent to implement new rate 
schedules for electric service in areas 
served by the company, effective June 19, 
1980, or as soon thereafter as permitted by 
law. 

The new schedules will result in a 17.7 
percent increase in the adjusted gross rev-
enue of the company. 

A complete copy of the new rate sched-
ules is on file with the Public Utility Com-
mission at Austin, Texas, and with each 
affected municipality. Copies also are 
available for inspection in each of the com-
pany's public business offices. 

TEXAS ELECTRIC SERVICE COMPANY 

• • 

• 

P  ARE YOU PLANNING TO 
AIR CONDITION YOUR HOME? 

TRI-CITY AIR 
CONDITIONING 

& HEATING 
QUALITY SERVICE - ALL MAKES 

Commericial And Residential 
Lennox Dealer 	629-8694 CONGRESS, 17th 

DISTRICT 
Charles Steaholm 

COUNTY SHERIFF 
Kenneth N. Eaves 
Johnnie W. Morren 

STATE SENATE, 22ND 
'DISTRICT: 
Bob Glasgow 

DR. 
CLAY 

SALYER 
Chiropractor 
445-22015 

200 E. Blackjack 
Dublin, Texas 

Illommall111111011111111•11111R 

WELCOME 
TO SERVICES 

of the 
GORMAN 

CHURCH OF 
CHRIST 

ODELL CARTER, Minister 
SCHEDULE OF SERVICES 

BIBLE CLASS 	  10:00 A.M. 
MORNING WORSHIP 	  10:45 A.M. 
EVENING WORSHIP 	  6:00 P.M. 
THURSDAY LADIES CLASS 	 10:00 A.M. 
WEDNESDAY EVENING 	  7:00 P.M. 

Want Ads 
GORMAN PROGRESS, JUNE 5, 1980 

B. L. Northcutt Laid To Rest Thursday 
Northcutt of Overton; 	a 
granddaughter Mrs. 	Gail 
Wells of Tomball, Texas and 
two great-grandchildren. 

-GP- 

Mrs. Tommy Clark, Jeff-
rey and Melissa of Fort 
Worth are spending this 
week with her grandmother, 
Mrs. Roy Parker while, 
Tommy is in St. Louis, 
Missouri on business. 

54? look /fir/5 M 1 The WA 1 l Alir 
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George Lindley Laid 

To Rest Tuesday Mr. and Mrs. Sandy Sand-
ers of Dallas were Memorial 
Day visitors with her parents 
Mr. and Mrs. L. D. Holliday. 
The Hollidays were in Dallas 
on Tuesday of last week to 
visit their daughter and for 
the check up of L.D.'s at the 
VA Hospital. 

FOR SALE: Approximately 
3000 bales of hay. Ten cents 
a bale. Call 734-2887. 

Survivors include his wife; 
three sisters, Sadie Russell 
of Gorman. and Zonia Ayers 
and Fannie Wortham, both 
of Alabama; and a number of 
nieces and nephews. 

Nephews were pall-
bearers. 

--GP- 

NEWS 
Mrs. R. C. Snider has 

returned from a visit with her 
son, Rev. and Mrs. J. B. 
Hamilton in Garland. Visit-
ing last with Mrs. Snider 
were Mr. and Mrs. Charles 
Bickford of Houston. Jewel 
Snider and Ina Mae Tarrance 
of Gorman. 

Dinner guests of Mr. and 
Mrs. Ralph Hudson and 
Patricia Saturday night was 
her nephew Gary Ragland of 
Hardin Simmons University, 
Abilene and Mr. and Mrs. 
Alvin Lasater of Kokomo, 
Estelle Craddock and Lorena 
Clark and Brend Carter. 

FOR SALE: French provin-
cial sofa and Farmall A 
model, one row tractor with 
tools. Rex Kinser, Kokomo 
Hwy. 734-2769. 	1-6-5 C. 

TO GIVE AWAY: Five darl-
ing part Siamese kittens. Call 
734-2456. 

George Dewey Lindley, 82, 
of Gorman died at 2:10 a.m. 
Monday June 2, 1980 in a 
local nursing home. Services 
were at 2 p.m. Tuesday at 
the Higginbotham Funeral 
Home Chapel. 

Johnny Snow, Church of 
Christ minister of Abilene, 
officiated. Burial was in Oli-
ver Springs Cemetery. 

Born April. 1898, in De 
Leon, he was a retired oil 
field worker and farmer. He 
was a member of the Church 
of Christ. He married Pearl 
Atchison July 8. 1920, in De 
Leon. 

STEER VALIDATION 
Dates for the steer valida-

tion have been set for June 
24 and June 25, 1980. 

On June 24, tagging will 
be held for Eastland steers at 
8:00 a.m. at Jim Moylan's 
place, and at 11:00 a.m. for 
Carbon and Gorman steers at 
Durwood Burgess's place. 

Cisco steers will be tagged 
on June 25 at 8:00 a.m. at 
the High School F.F. A. 
Barn. and Rising Star steers 
will be tagged at 11:00 a.m. 
at Payton Scott's place. 

For additional information 
on the steer validation, con-
tact the County Ex-tension 
Office at 629-1093. 

-GP-- 

FOR SALE: 5 foot Coffee 
Table with enclosed storage 
space at both ends. $25. Call 
Joe Bennett at 734-2410. 

• KOMONDOR PUPS FOR 
SALE: Coyotes can be elimi-
nated. Run sheep and goats, 
the easy way. Get a guard 
dog. Pups out of working 
parents. Neal Garner. Route 
2, Clifton, Texas 76634, 
Phone (817) 597-2276.3.6.5c 

• 

WATCH OUT! 
Don't get caught in the 

trap of thinking you are 
getting something for noth-
ing!! We are offering a 2 
bdrm front kitchen mobile 
home with wood siding, full 
energy pkg. and other op-
tions delivered with air con-
ditioning for $12,750. This 
No Gimmick price only offers 
savings. ART'S MOBILE 
HOMES, INC., 377 Plaza, 
Granbury, 573-4551 or Metro 
572-1574. 

gmilhe 

Custom Car Stereo 
(Directly Behind Jody's Pizza) 

ANNOUNCES 

FOR SALF BY OWNER: 
Small 2 bdrm. house; car-
peted, paneled; 3 pecan trees 
on lot. Phone 734-2695 after 
4:00 p.m. 	4-17 FNC. 

FOR SALE: 14 x 74 ft. 
Mobile Home, 3 bdrm.. 2 
bath. To be moved. Call 
Doug Rainey, 734-2617. 

3.6-5 C. 

HAY BAILING AND HAUL-
ING. Call R. C. Harrington, 
734-2150 	5.29 FNC. 

Survivors include two 
daughters Mrs. Jerry Under-
wood of Gorman, and Mrs. 
Dorthy Stone of Brownwood; 
three sisters, Mrs. Pearl 
Kullenberg of Austin, Mrs. 
Eva Northcutt of De Leon, 
and Mrs. Elizabeth Williams 
of Dallas; one brother Lyman 

FOR SALE: Hereford bulls. 
good blood line. Ready for 
service. Bob Huddleston, 
Phone 893-2382. 6-5-22 P. 

-V 

Any Complete Car Stereo Unit Bought 
HELP WANTED: LVN for 
11:00 to 7:00 shift at Lawn-
dale Home for Senior Citi-
zens in Gorman. Apply in 
person. 	1-5-15 FNC. 

This Month Will Be Installed FREE Of 

Charge. 

1. Complete Unit Incl. 2. Installations Done 
Tape Deck With 
Speakers. 

Mon., Tues. & Wed. - 
WANTED: Custom Hay Bal- 
ing in and around Gorman 
area. Stan Clark. Phone 
734-2598. 	13-6-26 P. 

Ph. 629-2015 

GARAGE SALE 
Several family or closet 

cleaning and getting ready 
for a BIG SALE, Thursday, 
Friday and Saturday, June 
4,5,6th at 707 S. Lamar, De 
Leon. We have lots of 
clothes of todays fashion, 
such as jeans, tops, dresses, 
sandles, swim suits, halters, 
shorts and etc. We also have 
dishes, books, childrens 
clothes, clothes for boys and 
men. Don't miss it. 

TWO FAMILY GARAGE 
SALE. Thursday, Friday and 
Saturday at the former home 
of Carl Bohannon now the 
Mary Clark house. Dr. Pep- 
per uniforms, 	children's 
clothes, large size women's 
clothes, furniture and many 
misc. items. 	1-6-5 C. 

Political 
Calendar ROOFING DONE BY AN- 

EXPERT. Honest, depend- 
able. All work guaranteed. 
Call 639-2546. 	4-6-12 P. 

Like to try a new hobby using 
Artex decorator tube paints? 
(lig embr.) Rose 442-1962 or 
write 1107 Ave. F. Cisco, 
Texas 76437. 	2-6-5 C. 

CUSTOM HAY BAILING, 
SQUARE OR ROUND 
BALES. Tommy Broom, 734- 
2842. 	 8-8-24 P. 

The following have au-
thorized this newspaper to 
'announce that they will be a 
candidate for election in the 
1980 Primary Elections: 
STATE REPRESENTATIVE 
DISTRICT 54 

Joe Hanna 

WANTED PLUMBING AND 
PAINTING OF ALL KINDS: 
Inside and out. No job to big 
or too small. See Jim Sum-
mers in the rock house 
directly behind the bank (the 
former First Baptist Parson- 
age). 	 S-22 FNC. 

EASTLAND COUNTY PRE-
CINCT NO. 3, an Equal Op-
portunity Employer, is taking 
application for help to do 
general road and bridge 
work. Experience as a heavy 
machine operator is requir-
ed. Application forms are 
available at Rising Star with 
L. T. Owen. 	2-6-5 C. 

R&R CARPET CLEANING 
Have your carpets pro-

fessionally cleaned. 
We move furniture 
$25.00 First Room 

$35.00 Living and Dining 
combination 

$15.00 Each additional room 
$7.00 Hall and Bathroom 

$5.00 per room Scotch Guard 
CALL COLLECT 

RANDALL ROGERS 
Office 629.1121 or 

Home 647.1211 
4-7 FNC. 

FOR SALE: Three bedroom 
home. carpeted, den and 
laundry room, carport. well 
and storm cellar. 423 Lexing-
ton. Sid Mason home, Gor-
man. Can be seen any time 
734-2050. 	5-8 FNC. 

NOTICE OF 
EQUALIZATION 

BOARD HEARINGS 
JUNE 20, 1980 

In obedience to an order of the Board of Equal-
ization regularly convened and setting; you are 
hereby notified that a Public Hearing will be 
held June 20, 1980 in the School Tax Office at 
11:00 A.M. 

If you have evidence that you wish to submit as 
to the market value of your property for tax-
able purposes, you are hereby notified of your 
opportunity to appear before the Board of 
Equalization on this date. 

The Board at said time, from the evidence now 
before it and such additional information as 
may be presented to it, will finally fis, de-
termine, and equalize the value of your prop-
erty for taxable purposes for the current year 

Done by order of the Board of Equalization of 
Gorman Independent School District, located in 
Comanche and Eastland Counties, Texas (at Gor-
man, Texas) this May 29, 1980. 

McMASTER'S 
FABRIC 

DESDEMONA, TEXAS - PHONE 758-2584 

Fabrics of All 
Kinds 

Priced Right 
Open 8:00 a.m. to 2:00 p.m. 

Monday thru Saturday 

FOR SALE: 1970 Oldsmo-
bile. tape deck and AM/FM 
stereo. Loaded. Good con-
dition. Reasonably priced. 
Sunny Kellog 734-2347. 

WANTED: 7-3 R.N. and also 
to circulate in surgery 11-7 
R.N. Iwo nights a week. 
Contact Ada Collins. R.N. 
D.O.N. Blackwell Memorial 
Hospital, Gorman. Texas 
734-2294. 	1-24 FNC. 

NEED EXTRA 
STORAGE SPACE? 

RENT IT 
STORAGE BUILDINGS NOW AVAILABLE 

FOR RENT 

Inquire at 
Gorman Pharmacy 

734-2859 	 Gorman, Texas 

jpi 	 FOR SALE: 1978 Grand Prix. 
Low mileage. call nights. 
734-2335. 	5-8 FNC. 

FOR SALE IN GORMAN: 3 
bedroom home. 2 lots. new 
hot wafer heater. 	new 
plumbing. and new electrical 

icing. Call Eastland 629- 
2142. 	 12-27-FNC 

FOR *SALE: New four and 
two drawer filing cabinets.  
Priced right. Gorman Pro-
gress. 734-2410 LOUISE RANKIN 

Tax Assessor-Collector 
Gorman Independent School District 

r  MINI 11111 INN 	VIII IMO OMB MO IMO a IMO IMO 	III' MIS MIMI IMMO 1111 IMO OM III' Can You Afford 
The Damage? 
No one is ever prepared 
for a tragic fire, but 
you can be financially 
safeguarded. Talk to us! 

GORMAN 

II
INSURANCE 

AGENCY 
Man' JEFF? 
734-2312 

THE GORMAN PROGRESS 
Entered as 2nd Class Mail at 
the Post Office in Gorman. 
Texas 76454 Under the Act of 
March 3. 1878. Published on 
Thursday at Gorman. East-
land County. Texas 7b454. 

Publication No. 222780 
Second Class Postage Paid at 
Gorman. Texas 76454. 
Joe Bennett. Publisher 
Estelle Craddock. Editor 
Lonnie Bennett. Photograph-
er and Printer 

SUBSCRIPTION RATES 
Eastland and Comanche 
Counties - $5.00 per year 
All other subscriptions - 

$7.00 per year 
Display Rate-$1. per col. inch 

Classified Advertisement 
7 cents per word 

Minimum Charge - $1.40 
Card of Thanks - $1.50 

COGBURN REALTY 

HEY KIDS!! 
Come To 

VACATION BIBLE SCHOOL 
at 

First Baptist Church 
JUNE 9TH Thru 13TH 	I 
8:30 to 11:30 a m. 

I 

I 
I 
I 
I 
I 
I 

I 

Refreshments, Bible Study, 
Fun Activities, Crafts. 

All Children, age 3 thru the Ninth Grade. 
Preparation Day and Parade 
Saturday, June 7-10:30 a. m. 

Picnic at Bass Lake 
after the parade. 

I 	(Bring a sack lunch) 

Stephen's 
Studio 

DIRECT COLOR 
PORTRAITS 

PHOTOGRAPHY WORK 

Open Tuesday through 
Saturday 

105 S. Patrick 	445-3765 

893.6666 	 De Leon, Texas 76444 

320 a. with 60 A. Coastal, 4 tanks, small creek. Lots of 
timber, deer and other wild game, 2 producing oil 
wells, 1/4 minerals S350an acre. 

120 A., 25 A. Costal, about 15 A. in Timber and balance 
in Love Grass. 1 good tank. good deer country. Road on 
two sides. $425 per Acre. Assume about $27000, 7% 

note. 

82 A., 23 A. in peanuts. 4 irrigation wells, pumps and 
pipes all go. 40 A. timber. 5.580 per acre. 29% down. 

Small acreage tracks from $750 to $800 per Acre, near 
town. 

We NEED Listings 

I 
I 

I 
I 

I 
I 

I 
I 
I 

I 
I 

I 
I 
I 
I 
I 

See Display of Monuments 

across from Football Stadium 

MONUMENTS 
Riley-Gardner Memorial-Hamilton 

Era Maupin, Agent 
P O. Box 848 	Gorman Imnassesemanamenearomadan 0 	 



(DOWNTOWN) GORMAN, TEXAS 
OPEN THURSDAY THRU SATURDAY 9 A.M. To 6 P.M. 

Jolene Gilliland. Owner 	 Phone 734-2840 

FATHER'S DAY SPECIAL 
"e7).M./AtAte,M17-Mrn e .E.t.A7ArniAtrAi 

$199.10 Value SALE PRICE 

T AND L BOOTS 
	

$99.00 

Reg. $64.95 SALE PRICE 

Morgan Miller BOOTS 	$49.95 
APJA P.4 	 003 MA3 AM-43,3V.W.F.W. ?Pt? 

Larry Mahan 	SALE PRICE 

Eel BOOTS 
	

$119.00 

    

ACME 

WORK BOOTS 

 

PAIR 

$29.95 

 

1.17).")PAAWm.rzz.pi., 1).47,0_,.M)A7/7).r  

 

ACME STEEL TOE 

WORK BOOTS 

 

PAIR 

$39.95 

FEATHER HAT BANDS $5.95 to $14.95 

TERRY 
ROBES 
$22.95 

VOTE 

FOR 

SHERIFF 

W. MORREN JOHNNIE 

VAN HEUSEN 

Dress Shirts 
$11 to $16.50 

PAJAMAS 
$7.95 To 
$14.50 

L INEN I ZED 

100% 	BILLFOLDS 
Cotton 	$7 to $12.50 

DEPARTMENT STORE 
GOWAN, TEXAS 764.4 

SENIOR 
CITIZENS  

ti  

1 

gether. That was progress. 
Then in 1908 dad bought a 
riding cultivator. In 1911 I 
was promoted to a four plow 
walking cultivator. Used it in 
stumpy ground. Then I soon 
learned to where I could beat 
anyone cleaning a cot-tom 
patch. I really enjoyed it. 

In our school days you 
could go somewhere to sing-
ing, church or parties on 
Friday. Saturday and Sunday 
night. Thought other nights 
were for studying. When the 
teachers assigned work for 
you to bring in. you brought 
it in. At night dad would ask 
you if you had your lessons 
up for next day. if not get 
busy now. Thought in those 

days no radio or TV. 
Thought we received Star 

Telegram and I always kept 
up fairly well on all the 
worlds main news. I've seen 
lots of news and changes in 
my life time. There has been 
more changes in my life time 
than has happened in all 
History. Radio, T,V.. jets, 
planes, tanks, Nuclear sub-
marines. Space travel to the 
Moon,space travel to Venus, 
Mammouth Tractors, Large 
Combines. Freezers. Won-
der Medicines. Automatic 
washers, dryers and many 
more. Jackie Grice could not 
wear his hat for a week after 
that new son was born. That 
son is already BOSS. 

Yesterday morning Jack 
Mauney came by and visited 
a s hile. He said since Luke 
finished his mechanic course 

/ 	 / 	 / 

KENNETH R. WELCH 
IS SELECTED 
VAMOOSA's teacher of year 

Kenneth R. Welch. of 
Sasakwa Oklahoma, elemen-
tary Social Studies teacher, 
has been named Vamoosa's 
Teacher of the Year. 

Welch is the boys baseball 
and basketball coach and 
athletic coach from all boys 
third through the eighth 
grades. 

He has taught and coached 
in the Vamoosa school for 
eight years having previously 
taught and coached two 
years in Boynton. 

In addition to teaching and 
coaching he has been a 4-H 
club leader for six years and 
a substitute school bus dri-
ver. 

Welch received his BS 
Degree in Education from 
Northeastern State Univer- 

Well, we are still having 
those wonderful showers. 
We are so thankful for them. 
1 know from experience that 
you can make something on 
the farm with lots of rain and 
you can make a complete 

sity, Tahleguah, and a mas-
ters degree from East Cen-
tral State University, Ada. 

He and his wife Ann live 
on Route 1, Sasakwa, and 
have two children, a son 
Chris a seventh grade stu-
dent and daughter Julie. an 

eighth grader in Vamoosa 
School. 

Welch is a member of the 
Oklahoma Education Associ-
ation, National Education 
Association, a member of the 
Konawa Church of Christ. 
and a Sunday School teacher. 

The member of the Ok• 
lahoma National Guard said 
of teaching, "the greatest 
responsibility to the teaching 
profession is to create a 
classroom 	environment 
which will enable each stu-
dent to develop to his or her 
fullest capabilities in learn-
ing and living the kind of life 
which will be a credit to his 
or her self, parents. com-
munity, state and nation." 

Kenneth is a graduate of 
Gorman High School and son 
of Mr. and Mrs. O.E. 

"Shorty" Welch of Gorman.  

failure when the rain does 
not come. I have experi- 
enced both of them. 

I wonder why Carter wants 
to put a 10 cent tax on 
gasoline. He knows or 
should know that the working 
people must have gas to go to 
work. There is no way a 
working man can 'support a 
family and at the same time 
make payments on a home, 
unless he is drawing a very 
large salary. He wants that 
extra money to balance the 
budget he claims. 

If he is wanting to save 
billions in gasoline and ener-
gy. just stop busing school 
children for integration on- 
ly. Let the Trustees of each 
School District decide the 
way they want the school 
controlled. Not some 2x4 
Bigoted Federal Judge. It is 
none of those Judges busi-

ness. 
I want to comment on the 

farming conditon when I was 
a youngster when we moved 
to the farm north of Kokomo. 

All planting was with a 
walking planter. The fur-
rows were laid off with a 
Georgia Stock. Cultivated 
with a George Stock, three 
times to each middle or a 
double shovel, twice to a 
middle. In 1907 my dad and 
a neighbor. Aught Knox 
bought a riding planter to- 

	•IIIIIN111•1111=M1111IMMINIMPWIIIIIIMMIPM:  

he was playing dominoes 
again. Jack carried his 
lawnmower down for Luke to 

fix. 	He said there was 
nothing wrong with it. He 
had a new spark plug and 
handed to Luke and wanted 

him to check the plug and put 
it in the mower. Luke took 
the plug and got his pliers 
and told Jack that a bent 
piece of steel on the bottom 
of the plug had to come off. 
Jack stops him and said for 
him to put it in the mower. 
Luke turned the mower up 
and could not find a place for 
the plug. He turned the 
mower up and saw the 
starter cord and said that it 

as an electric mower. Jack 

New 
TIES 

By Sweet 

$5 to 
$8.50 

showed him where the plug 
went. So Luke started to spit 
some tobacco juice (Bull of 
the Wood) in the plug. Jack 
told him to put it in there 
with no juice. Jack told him 
to hold the plug after it was 
connected and he would pull 
the cord. It started and so 
did Luke. He swallowed his 
tobacco and started on his 
Sunday Sermon. Jack cried 
Luke said he was qualified to 
work on copters. planes and 
Cats (Tom Cats). 

Our deepest sympa-
thy goes out to the families of 
Dick Foster. Mrs. Cleo 
Alsabrooke. Mrs. Pittman. 

There are others though I 
have forgotten their names. 

GORMAN PROGRESS, JUNE 5, 1980 
Mrs. Ray Rodgers and 

Tammy were weekend visi-
tors in Comfort with her 
daughter. Mr. and Mrs. D. 
L. Clark and granddaughter, 
Mr. and Mrs. Keith Jung, 
Cara, Laray and new grand-
son Corby Lee. Mrs. Rodgers 
and the Clarks visited in Del 
Rio and at Lake Hemstead. 

Mrs. Gladys Lucke visited 
last week with her son, Mr. 
and Mrs. Oscar Lucke and 
Ray Earl of Abilene, and 
attended the graduation 
exercises Ray Earl at Cooper 
High School on May 29. 	— 

"He gives only the worthless gold who gives from a sense 
of duty." 
	

James Russell Lowell 

VAN HEUSEN SHORT SLEEVE 

Sport and Western 
SHIRTS 

$7.95 to $20.00 

WELLCO 
MEN'S 

HOUSE 
SHOES 
$8.95 

To 
$12.95 

Alen's JEWELRY 
CHAINS - ID BRACELETS -
MONEY CLIPS - KEY RINGS 

AND COLLAR CLIPS 

$4.00 To $6.00 

It is very important that everyone vote in this elecnon on June 7, 

1980 to decide who will be Sheriff of Eastland County. 

I respectfully ask that you vote to keep me as your Sheriff for a full 
four year term. 	

Thank You, 

(Pd. Pol. Adv.) 
	 SHERIFF 	 174'-'"--' 

4 	 

BIG 	BOOTS k 

 

11,4, 

LARGE 
SELECT ION 

VAN HEUSEN-WRANGLER 
AND CAMPUS 

Knit 
Shirts 

$6 to $20 

MEN'S 3 PIECE 

Curlee S'aits 
GOOD SUMMER COLORS 

$155 to $182 

Red Label 
T-SHIRTS 
& BRIEFS 

Hanes 
Tonk or T style tops 

and br,efs of cool,  
combed cotton 
Easy•corel 

Briefs - 3-$5.99 
T-Shirts- 3-$6.99 
A-Shirts--3-$5.99 

The old must die and the 
young too die. It will be five 
weeks tomorrow since I have 
played dominoes. So I have 
really been posted unless 
someone is with me. The 
days are not getting any 
shorter either. These damp 
days sure helps my aching 
joints. When? Look up. 
Smile. We must all try that. 
Though at times when I try 
to read I forget at times. So 
discouraging. 

THE RAMBLER 
REPORTER 

Father's Day... 
now's the time 

to tell him 
he's extra-special! 

ACTION SLACKS p4N4TELIA 
By LEVI 

and$22.50 

MR 0P SLACKS 
B: 3  

$20 to 

Cold Toe SOCKS-$3.00 pair 

..01111..1111. AR." AM, IreS ....Mr.],  a. • ILrull•-•.1., 	 • - 
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Although the first trains were not built ti the 800s, 
tracks were laid in the 1500s. They helped horses 
draw heavier loads than they could on ordinary roads. 

Eastland Plans 
Two Wildcats 

Eastland County has gained sites for two 
wildcats. 

Deeper of the pair is Allibaba Energy Rer-
sources Inc., Arlington, No. 1 Moran-Torch. 
slated for 3,900 feet. 

It will be drilled two miles northeast of 
Eastland on a 100-acre lease, 

Site is 3.30 feet from the south and east lines 
of W. Lyman Survey,

— 
 A-361. 

— 
Other test is No. 1 R. C. Browning Estate 

which will be drilled by Cherry Petroleum Co., 
Lubbock. 

The plumed 3.700-foot venture is located one 
mile south of Pioneer on a 183-acre lease. 

Site is 487 feet from the south and 660 feet 
from the west lines of S. A. Briggs Survey, A-
351 

— — — 
Halley Oil Co. from Brookhaven, Miss., filed 

application to reener to 3,000 feet No. 1 Butler, 
abandoned regular field project two mies 
southwest of Rising Star. 

Location is on a 77-acre lease, spotting 2,240 
feet from the north and 990 feet from the west 
lines of Section 1, ETRR Survey. 

It was plugged in February 1978, as Joe B. 
CogdeLl No. 1 Butler. 

vow 

LIONS CLUB SLOW- PITCH 
BASEBALL TOURNAMENT 

FRIDAY 
SATURDAY 

SUNDAY 
••••••••••••••••• 

NO ADMISSION 
1•••••••••••••••• 

CONCESSIONS WILL BE 

OPEN DURING ALL GAMES 

We're doing it. We're driving 	01111101~11011011.0011~1•1111111 less, planning trips more wisely, 	TION/Miiiiii///11111111111111/ 
keeping our cars in tune 

wmp.~.0.• 
SPLASH DAY 

SATURDAY 
1:00 P.M. 

we're taking the simple but 	Deli Iht Dad! necessary steps to save 
gasoline ... and 

money.  

Things like: 
Driving at a 
moderate speed and a steady pace. 
35 to 45 miles per hour is the most efficient 
driving speed (no more than 55 on the 
highway). Paying closer attention to the 
traffic flow can help you avoid unnecessary 
acceleration or sudden braking. 

Following easy steps like these really 
can help reduce your gasoline bills. 
So keep up the good work! 

UM! BY LITRE 
ITALL AIDS UR

, 
 

..•••••Goon 

Legal Assistance 
FREE INITIAL CONSULTATION 

$50 TRAFFIC TICKETS 
$100 HABEAS CORPUS (BONDS) 
$150 LICENSE SUSPENSIONS 
$200 DWI & POSSESSION (Simple) 

(817) 442-1402 
By Appointment Only 
Other Civil and Criminal Fees 

Quoted After Consultation 

C. S. BOOSE & ASSOCIATES, ATTORNEYS 

C4R41/EICE 
WATCHES 

and 
WATCH 11  
BANDS 

FROM $19.95 

MOATS 
and 

AFTER SAVE 
SETS 

Say It Special With 
Hallmarkss  
Cards 

GORMAN 
PHARMACY 
George Simmons, Pharmacist 

734-2859 	 GORMAN 

KEEP IT UP 
ERI 

Dan Howard 
Laid To Rest 
Thursday 

HAMLIN — Dan S. Ho-
ward, 88, of Hamlin died at 8 
a.m. Wednesday May 28, 
1980 at an Abilene Nursing 
Home. Graveside services 
were at 4 p.m. Thursday at 
Hamlin Memorial Cemetery, 
directed by Foster Funeral 
Home. 

The Rev. Marshall Ste-
wart, pastor of Church of the.  
Nazarene, officiated. 

Born July 27, 1891, in 
Desdemona, he married Ada 
Tidwell March 10, 1913, in 
Desdemona. He worked in a 
hardware store all his life. 
He was a Baptist. 

His wife died December 
30, 1962. 

Survivors include three 
daughters, Waynette Davis 
and Ada Jane Johnson, both 
of Abilene, and Mrs. Cecil 
(Imogene) Ragland of Color-
ado City; two grandsons, 
Dan Davis and Max Ragland; 
a granddaughter, 	Susan 
Munden; and four great• 
grand-children. 

We the concerned 
citizens of Ranger take 
this opportunity to 
publicly acknowledge 
our sincere thanks and 
gratitude to our 
Eastland County 
Sheriff, Johnnie Mor-
ren, for the loyal sup-
port he has shown our 
city. 

We especially ap-
preciate the personal 
interest our sheriff has 
shown concerning the 
problems of our young 
people by being 
available for consula-
tion. Johnnie's ability 
to relate with people of 
all ages is an excep-
tional quality that we 
sincerely admire. 

Johnnie's provision 
of loyal and efficient 
deputies that maintain 
and abide by his 
policies are definately 
an asset to the citizens 
of Ranger. 

Johnnie's efforts to 
assist and work with 
our city patrolmen or 
other law official when 
necessary has reduced 
the crime rate con-
siderably in Ranger. 
Recently, for the first 
time in several years, 
all our law officers are 
working together, 
relating well and 
through cooperation 
have accomplished 
outstanding progress 
that is deserving of our 
gratitude 	and 
honorable mention. 
Our sheriff's standards 
toward mor efficient 
law enforcement is 
making a giant step 
toward the safety of 
our homes, personal 
property and providing 
us with the opportunity 
of a better Ranger that 
we can be proud of. 

Thank you Johnnie 
for a job well done and 
we wish you the best in 
the coming election on 
becoming our County 
Sheriff for the next 
term. 
(Paid for by friends 
and citizens of Ranger, 
Texas) 
Edith Veal 
Mrs. Calvin Ainsworth 
Calvin Ainsworth 
H.O. Woods, Sr. 
Una Woods 
Ronnie Ainsworth 
E. Vasquez, Jr. 
Sherri Ainsworth 
Peggy Bearden 

Jack Bearden 
Milton Monroe 

HOSPITAL 1101E 
Patients listed in Blackwell 

Memorial Hospital on Wed-
nesday were: 
Mrs. Jimmie Mosley 
Mrs. Jimmie Mosley G'man 
Mrs. Mattie Faglie Gorman 
Mrs. Ima Burleson Gorman 
J. D. Rodgers 	Gorman 
Willie Barrett 	Gorman 

Patients Dismissed May 
28: 
Dorenda Rodgers Gorman 
Larry Majors Desdemona 

Dismissed May 30 
Marilyn Warren Gorman 
Mary Choate 	Gorman 

Dismissed May 31 
Rose Tubbs 	De Leon 

Dismissed June 2 
Mary Emerson 	Gorman 
Fred Cocker 	Gorman 

Dismissed June 3 
Lonnie Grumbles Gorman 

—GP — 
Frozen carrots and broccoli 
are increasing in popularity. 
According to a U.S. Dept. 
of Agriculture report, we 
ate 21 percent and 16 
percent more of each 
between 1970 and 1977. 

c. 7iffg 

"Geyser" is a word that 
comes to us from the 
Icelandic ko.su, meaning 
"to rush furiously." 

Douglas Blakney 
Mary L.Blakney 
Norman Randle 
Pinkie Randle 
Mrs. Randall Rogers 
Daisy Pounds 
Marlinda Jiminez 
Benny Moseley 
Creida Mosley 
Sarrah Nash 
Chris Spadon 
Jean Ainsworth 
Billy Ainsworth 
Gilbert Nail 
Trudy Nail 
Kenneth B. O'Niell 
Mrs. Agnes Rushing 
Smokey Vinson 
Paul Riffle, Jr. 
Lynn Koenig 
J.W. Ward 
W.B. Ward 
Charles Speights 
Dorothy Miller 
Barbara White 
Wanda Erwin 
Fred Erwin 
Steven Schooling 
Dany Erwin 
Mel Kincaid 
R.W. Myers 
Adam D. Lopez 
C.E. (Bill) Harper 
Pauline Harper 
Charles L. White 
Debbie Vinson 
Perry Short 
Elvira Short 
Mr. Darrell Wheat 
Mrs. Darrell Wheat 
John Casey 
Burnice Needham 
Nell Needham 
R.L. Stuard 
Nancy Vinson 
John Vasquez 
Rita Vasquez 
Larry Huston 
Mrs. Larry Huston 
Leann Anderson 
Gary Harton 
Steve D. Benifiel 
Richard Fenter 
Elaine Wesley 
Nathan Kidd 
Chuck Koake 
Pat Lewis 
Una Duncan 
C.D. Isabell 
Niel Martin 
Barbara King 
Dorothy Carr 
Jacquline Bush 
Arie Sharp 
Bobby Justice 
Donna Justice 
Mable Roberson 

Alex Roberson 
David Rogers 
Janet Rogers 
Homer Langford 
Audie Moore 
Diane Polk 
Mae Isabell 
Lela Nail 
Nancy Hernandez 
Mrs. Vasquez 
Red Jones 

A111191pAqffiE1111 
Four 4-H members from 

Eastland County have been 
selected to go to the State 4-H 
Congress. The Congress will 
be held on the Texas Tech 
University Campus at Lub-
bock on July 15-18. 

The theme of this year's 
congress is "The Growing 
Scene--4-H 	and 
Agriculture." The program 
is designed to interest and in-
form 9-H members about the 
major steps in transforming 
agricultural commodities in-
to consumer products. 
Delegates to congress will 
tour a denim plant, see a 
fashion show, visit a feed 
mill, and a cotton gin. To 
highlight 	congress, 
delegates will see the play, 
"Texas" and visit Palo Duro 
Canyon. 

4-H'ers attending congress 
from the county are: Truet 
Hart from Eastland 4-H; 
Caye Little from Gorman 
9-H: Amy Weekes from 
Ranger 4-H: and Phil 

Osborne from Gorman 4-H. 
Sponsors for the 4-H 

members to attend are: 
TESCO; Eastland National 
Bank; Birdsong Peanut; 
Eastland County Newspaper 
Company, Brown Feed Store 
at Gorman; Ranger Sav-
ings; the First National 
Bank of Gorman; and the 
Eastland County Adult 
Leader's Association. 

Six Eastland County 
residents journeyed to Com-
anche County to judge the De 
Leon 4-H Fashion Revue, 
Monday, May 12. Leaders 
serving as judges for the 
Fashion Revue were Carolyn 
Little, Pat Caraway, and 
Aletha Burgess. Also atten-
ding were Charla Little, 
Angela Burgess and Exten-
sion Agent, Donna White. 

There were about fifteen 
entries in the Fashion 
Revue. Eastland County 
leaders were impressed by 
the quality of work exhibited 
by the De Leon 4-H'ers. 
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DUBLIN ZERO LOCKER 
Dublin, Texas 76446 

Phone 817-445-2424 

Custom Slaughter And 
Processing 

CHOICE FED REEF 
FOR SALE 

WHOLE - HALVES • QUARTERS 

Jerry Westmoreland, Manager ''ndc- -4-c c--3-4  

FOR QUALITY ROOFING & 
THE BEST IN REMODELING 

OF ALL KINDS 
ALL WORK POSITIVELY GUARANTEED 

Free ESTIMATE - Call 

ADEN ELMORE 
Carbon 	 Eastland 
629-2226 	629-8913 

ks 

% RACQUET CLUB 
EASTLAND, TEXAS 

PHONE (817) 629-8218 
LOCATED ON 1-20, ACROSS FROM THE 
RAMADA INN. 

SPECIAL RATES FOR GROUPS 
Church, Birthdays, Jaycees, etc. 

HOURS - 

Monday Thru Friday 
Saturday and Sunday 

ADULTS, PER HOUR  

Singles 	$2.75 
Cut Throat 	$2.50 
Doubles 	$2.25 
Saturday and Sunday Special 

$2.00 for any game. 

ADVANCE FOR YOUR CONVENIENCE, 

RESERVATIONS SHOULD BE MADE.  

4:00a.m.-10:00p.m. 
2:00p.m.-10:00p.m. 

CHILDREN, PER HOUR  
Ages 8 - 12 years 

$2.25 

.P.A.P.L.U-45 a JW.133.11.10.1AJWAYMADJA.P.W)MA33APJA.0. 

HIGGINBOTHAM'S 
18 FRIENDLY LOCATIONS TO SERVE YOU 

734-2227 - GORMAN 

6 PIECE 
LIVINGROOM GROUP 

Only $499.95 

COUCH & CHAIR 
By Belmar 
Reg $599.95 

Sale $419.95 

See our 
Large Selection of 

ZENITH & 
PHILCO TV's 

Color and Black/White  

save 
on bedrooms OFF 

20% 

OVY 

MANY STYLES 
)ktigtet;',. 

ircarrar, 

Contemporary, 
Mediterranean, 
traditional. c jai 

ELECT 

KENNETH NEIL EAVES 

SHERIFF 

Wherever I have campaigned I have found citizens 

filled with pride in Eastland County. Everyone wants 

the very best for the county. 

On June 7 you will be electing a Sheriff to a four year term. I urge you to study 

both candidates' carefully and vote for the man who will best serve you, the 

citizens, and the office. 
Sincerely, 

Kenneth N. Eaves 

(Paid political advertisemillth 
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SCHOOL HILL NEWS 
By Oma Lee Riddell 

KOKOMO NEWS 
Tay Zelda Jordan. 

Roger, Connie Melani and 
Wade Armstrong of High• 
land were visiting on Thurs-
day night with J. C. and 
Patsy noon and family. 

Jay and Rob Proctor of 
Premont arrived at the home 
of their grandparents. Blake 
and Deliliah Morrison on 
Friday to spend the summer. 
They will also visit with their 
Grandmother Proctor of Lin-
gleville. 

Lawndale 
News 
By Jettie Daniels 

birthday cake falls down 
from the weight of the 
candles; You son tells you 
that he wishes Anita Bryant 
would tend to her own busi-
ness; You want to hang up 
your clothes that you wore 
home from the party and you 
can't find them; You put both 
contac lenses in the same 
eye; and your twin sister 
forgets your birthday. 

—GP— 

Soil treatment 
COLLEGE STATION —

Sooner or later, nearly all Texas 
homes are subject to the 
heartbreak of termites and the 
agony of their teeth. 

Texas MiNI University sci-
entists say the only known 
method of preventing subterra-
nean termites is a chemical soil 
treatment during construction. 

A one-time application dur-
ing construction might run up 
to 5200, while homes already 
built could require as much as 
18 cents a square foot to re-
ceive the treatment. 

RJC NURSLING SCHOOL 
NOW TAKING 
APPLICATIONS 

Ranger Junior College Vo-
cational Nursing Department 
is now taking applications for 
the 1980-81 class, which be-
gins September 8.1980. The 
program is fully accredited 
by the Vocational Nurse Li-
censing Board of Texas, and 
is a twleve nonth, 52 week 
program with 18 weeks of 
classroom followed by clini-
cal experience in Ranger 
General and De Leon Hospi-
tals. During the year, several 
field trips are planned in-
cluding a trip to San Antonio 
to Brook Army Burned Cen-
ter and Brook Air Force Base 
Medical Center. Enrollment 
in class is limited to 15 and 
selection of students is based 
on personal interviews, per-
sonal references and results 
of pre-entrance exam. Per-
sons interested in making 
applications should contact: 
Pat Morgan R.N. 
Director of Nursing Ed. 
Ranger Junior College 
817-647-3234 Ext. 47 

Dr. Beryl McKinnerney 
Dean Voc-Tech 
Ranger Junior College 
817-647.3234 Ext. 35 

Visitors with us last Wed-
nesday were Tommy and 
Jane Musick of Lingleville. 
Jack Blackwell of Ranger, 
Gene, Jeane, Will and Niki 
Grimshaw of Howard Com-
munity, Lexie and Ricky 
Hogg. 

Cindy and Danny Decker 
of Higland were visiting one 
day recently with J. C. and 
Patsy Moon and Becky. 

Rodger, Joan and Stacy 
Elston of Lingleville were 
visiting the other day with 
Ralph and Aline Elston. 

Wanda Patterson of Gor-
man has been visiting some 
this week with Brad, Terri 
and Jennifer Moon. 
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Our Bingo Winners last 
Tuesday were:Clara Collins, 
No. 1-Myrna Winters,No. 2 
Bessie Rhodes, No. 3, Beu-
lah De Guire, No. 4 . 

Black Out Winner was 
Bessie Rhodes. Their prizes 
were fruit, which they all 
enjoy very much. 

Thanks to Velma Carr for 
helping us. Thanks to all our 
singers who came out on 
Thursday nights, we do ap-
preciate you very much. Our 
residents enjoy these Thur-
day night singings a great 
deal and with out so many 
good people this would not 
be possible:Thanks a million. 

Also thanks to the many 
lovely people who attend and 
bring the Church Service's 
each Sunday. 

Don't forget to look for the 
date of our Family Night. 

—GP — 
"La Marseillaise," the 
French national anthem, was 
written during the French 
Revolution in response to a 
remark that French soldiers 
had no spirited marching 
song. 
"No one can build his 
security upon the noble-
ness of another person." 

Willa Cather 

Wish to say thanks to all 
the visitors that came our 
way this past week, you've 
made our residents much 
happier by your visits. Hope 
you'll come our way again 
real soon. 

We hope that each of you 
had a very nice week. 

We are planning another 
Family Night in the near 
future, so hope each of you 
will honor us with your 
presence. 

Watch for futher word 
concerning this event. 

We need scraps of mate-
rial, wood and other things 
for our residents to have 
something to do. All items 
and ideas are very welcome. 

We wish to express our 
gratitude to Bro. Joe O'Neal 
for so graciously bringing our 
Bible Study on Wednesdays. 
he is unable to be with us 
now, but we wish for him the 
very best. 

night. 
Mr. and Mrs. P.T. Brown 

and Gary Brown of Lake 
Jackson, Mr. and Mrs. Byron 
Laminack of Lake Jackson, 
Mr. and Mrs. Glen Lam-
inack, Janet and David of 
Emory. Mr. and Mrs. Joe 
Pillow, Brian, Darren, Dana 
and Melinda of Joshua. Mrs. 
Virdia Mae Norris, Fort 
Worth. Mr. and Mrs. Jack 
norris of Fort Worth, Mr. 
and Mrs. Calvin 	Smith, 
Tonja, Tracy and Tiffany of 
Fort Worth, Donald Eaves of 
Austin, Mr. and Mrs. Neal 
Eaves of Carbon and Mr. and 
Mrs. Kenneth Eaves, Laura, 
Jean and Cary of Cisco all 
visited with their mother and 
grandmother, Mrs. Erma 
Eaves at Gorman and all 
attended the Eaves 	and 
Rutherford wedding. 

Others from Kokomo at-
tending the wedding were 
Mr. and Mrs. Glenn Jordan, 
Mr. and Mrs. Vernon Fields, 
Mrs. Oren Webb. Mrs. J.L. 
Morrow. Mr. and Mrs. J.C. 
Clearman and Kami Jo Leo-
nard, Mr. and Mrs. Claude 
Fuller and Mr. and Mrs. Bill 
Brown. 

Mr. and Mrs. J.C. Clear-
man and Kami Jo visited on 
Sunday night in Lawn with 
Mr. and Mrs. Jamie Clear-
man and family. 

Mrs. Albert Hendricks at-
tended an Avon Meeting in 
Cisco on Wednesday and 
then visited in Clyde with 
Mrs. Roy Buchanan and 
Kelly and Yancy. 

Lee and Jean Jernigan of 
Proctor Lake have visited 
recently with Ricky and Lexie 
Hogg. 

You know it's going to be a 
rotten day when you; Wake 
up face down on the pave-
ment; Put your bra on back-
ward and it fits better; You 
call suicide prevention and 
they put you one hold; Your 

It has seemed almost like 
March weather in June with 
the high winds that we've 
had. It has been very hot and 
humid and a cool rain shower 
would be welcome. 

Visitors at the Kokomo 
Baptist Church on Sunday 
morning were Mrs. Neal 
Gilbert and Glenn of Hobbs, 
N.M. and Mrs. Rex Rhodes 
of Arlington. 

Mr. and Mrs. Wallace 
McClennan and Mr. and 
Mrs. Bill Mowell of Fort.  
Worth were visiting on Tues-
day with cousins, Mrs. Odis 
Rodgers, Mr. and Mrs. Cul-
len Rodgers and with and 
aunt, Mrs. Mary Timmons. 

Mr. and Mrs. J.L. Morrow 
isited from Tuesday until 
unday in Levelland with 
r. and Mrs. Willis Morrow, 

Mr. and Mrs. Lynn Campbell 
and Alma Lee Creager. Mr. 
and Mrs. Larry Morrow and 
Lance, Layne and Lenny 
visited from Wednesday un• 
til Friday in Levelland and 
they all were supper guests 
of Mrs. Leonard Blakney and 
Mike in Lubbock on Wed-
nesday night and attended 
Mike's graduation from Cor-
onado High School. Mike 
arrived here on Saturday for 
a visit with the Larry Mor- 
rows. 	Mike will attend 
Tarleton State University this 
fall. 

Mr. and Mrs. David Por-
ter, Scarlett and Amanda of 
San Angelo were recent visi-

tors with the Oren Webbs. 
Mr. and Mrs. 	Cullen 

Rodgers visited in Houston 
from Thrusday until Satur- 

day with their daughter and 
family, Mr. and Mrs. Benny 
Chupp, Leslie and Pam. 
They attended Lesli's gradu-
ation from Alief-Hasting 
High School. Leslie gradua-
ted with honors and received 
a scholarship and will attend 
the University of Texas this 
fall. Our congratulations to 

Leslie. 
Mr. and Mrs. Neal Gilbert 

and Glenn of Hobbs, N.M. 
visited from Friday until 
Monday with her mother, 
Mrs. Odis Rodgers. Mr. and 
Mrs. Bob Rodgers, Kevin, 
Jason and Corby of Brown-
wood spent Sunday night and 
Monday with them. Others 
visiting during the weekend 
were Mr. and Mrs. John 
Rodgers and Jonna of Car-
bon and Mr. and Mrs. Mike 
Rodgers of Proctor. 

Mr. and Mrs. C.R. 
Graham of Monahans, Mrs. 
Pat Tuxhorn, Cassie and 
Katy of Christoval and Mrs. 
Vonita Monroe of Gorman 
were visiting with Mrs. Es-
ther Graham during the 
weekend and attended the 
wedding of Mark Eaves and 
Kaycce Rutherford in Rising 
Star on Sunday night. 

Also attending the wedd-
ing of Mark and Kaycee and 
visiting with Mr. and Mrs. 
D.F. Eaves and Mark were 
Gene Aube of Mesquite, 
David Green of Plano, Kris 
Brown of Stephenville. John 
Carbin of Wichita Falls. John 
and Carrie Miears of De Leon 
and Deliah Eaves of Step-
henville. Kaycee Rutherford 
visited with them on Friday 

Mrs. Ben Rollins and Mrs. 
Glenn Jordan were visiting 
with Mr. and Mrs. Clifford 
Nelson on Friday afternoon. 
Joe Barnett was also a visitor 
in the Nelson home. Jim 
Jordon visited with the Nel-
sons on Sunday. 
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Mr. and Mrs. Jimmy Nel-
son. Tena, Travis and Teresa 
spent the weekend with the 

'Clifford Nelsons, returning 
to Fort Worth on Sunday 
afternoon for a visit with her 
brother and family. 

Mrs. Clifford Nelson is 
undergoing medical test in 
Hendricks Medical Center at 
Abilene this week. 

Claude Fuller is 	also 
undergoing medical tests at 
Hendricks Medical Center. 

We wish them both speedy 
returns home. 

Mr. and Mrs. Roy Buch-
anan, Kelly and Yancy of 
Clyde spent the weekend 
with Mr. and Mrs. Albert 
Hendricks. Kelly and Yancy 
remained for an extended 
visit with their grandparents. 

Kirby and Nell Ball and 
son Eric of North Carolina, 
Rollo, Louisa and Sherry 
Tinkler of Abilene, Lowell 
and Mildred Burleson and 
two grandchildren. Casey 
and Amy of Sweetwater, Joe 
and Lisa Foster of Gorman 
and Juanita Files of Gorman 
were visitors with Henry and 

• Oza Scitern during the week-
end andd on Monday. 

Jim Jordan, Mrs. Glenn 
Jordan. Mr. and Mrs. Jimmy 
Little and James were visit-
ing with Mrs. Vern Garrett 
on Thursday to help her 
celebrate her birthday. Mr. 
and Mrs. Jim Bennett of 
Lake Leon honored Mrs. 
Garrett with a belated birth-
day dinner on Friday at their 
home. 

Mr. and Mrs. Vernon 
Fields and Lindell spent Sun-
day at Carbon with Mr. and 
Mrs. Buster Johnson. 

Mrs. John Lasater of De 
Leon visited on Sunday with 
Mrs. Vern Garrett. 

Mrs. Bill Brown will be the 
hostess when the Kokomo 
Extension Homemakers Club 
meets on Monday, June 9 at 
2:00 p.m. Visitors are wel-
come. 

RicQuETBALL  AMERICAS 
FASTEST GROWING 
FUN SPORT 
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FOOD PRESERVATION 
WORKSHOPS SCHEDULED 

The Eastland County Ex-
tension Service will be spon-
soring a Home Food Pre-
servation Workshop on Wed-
nesday, June 11th from 2:00 
to 4:00 p.m. and again on 
Thursday. June 12 from 6:30 
to 8:30 p.m. The workshop 
sessions will be held in the 
Texas Electric Reddy Room 
in Eastland. 

The Food Preservation 
Workshop is for young and 
old alike. 

If you've never canned and 
want to learn, plan to attend. 
ly you've canned for years, 
come and refresh your me-
mory on recommended pro-
cedures. 

The workshop is free and 
everyone is invited to attend. 

Information presented will 
include canning. freezing, 
pickling, jams and jellies. 

Free publications on food 
preservation will also be 
available. 



MEAT Specials 
` GROUND BEEF 

POUND 

$i" 
STEAK Zci;:d lb• $1" 
STEAK Girone POUN: 2.99 
ROASTiazi' w 11,9  
ROAST G:h:Cci:1  lb. $139  

if GERMAN "
$4 4IGnZ GOOC 

SAUSAGE • la" 
TOMATOES 4°9 

FLORIDA 

TO 

  

M ATOES 

  

HUNT'S WHOLE 

NO. 300 SIZE 2 FOP  9 9° 

Krafts 

Miracle Whip 

qt. $1 29 
.", 

Miracle 
Whip 

e FRENCH 
FRIES 

2 20 OZ. 990 
POUND 

390 
KEEBLER'S 

Rich'n Chips 
13 OUNCE 99c  

tAITE HOUSE ONE JUICE 
32 Oz. 89C 

HUNT'S 

2 
Fruit Cocktail 

303 CANS 99c 

SUNKIST NAVEL 

ORANGES POUND 29 
BELL PEPPERS LARGE PODSEACH 19 C 

CANTALOUPES TEXAS  LB. 29e 

ALL TYPES OF GARDEN ACCESSORIES 

I 	WE RESERVE THE RIGHT 

f(ill  

TO LIMIT QUANITY 
PRICES GOOD THURSDAY THRU SATURDAY 

Grocery & Market 
PRICES GOOD THURSDAY THRU SATURDAY 

PHONE 734-2316 	, GORMAN 

- NOTICE - 
Has our present "Appointed Sheriff" ran 

our "County" short of personel to maintain the 
"Sheriff's Office"? 

Recently it was stated in the "Ranger 
Times" by the "Sheriff" that he has assigned 
(Deputy Gene Millican) to the Ranger, Lake 
Leon, and Desdemona area. 

What about our "Cities" southeast and 
southwest of our "County" Gorman, Carbon, 
Rising Star? Do these "Cities" not deserve the 
same "Special protection?" Why would this 
"Favoritism" be shown "only" to the area's 
mentioned in the Ranger Times? Why do the 
area's mentioned need "Special Favoritism"? 

How much money will it cost "Tax-payers" 
to contain this "Special Protection" in all 
"Cities"? 

Will this leave (One) Deputy Sheriff to 
"Protect" the rest of the "County"? 

Due to the fact "Ranger" is the only "City" 
that does not pay their (Fairshare) to the 
"Eastland County Dispatch" to preserve pro- 
per 	(Sheriff) 	and 	(Police) 
"Communication's" for our Safety. 

Can Ranger, Lake Leon, Desdemona afford 
"Finance's" to pay extra for the "Special 
Sheriff's Protection"? As this "Special Pro-
tection" will cost extra, as it stand's the extra-
cost for such "Protection" is coming out of our 
"County Budget", the tax-payer's 
"Hip-pocket". 

"The City of Carbon" Finance's does not 
permit them to employ a "Police Officer". 
What provision's has our "Appointed Sheriff" 
made to furnish the "City of Carbon" Special 
Protection? 

As it was point-out in the "Ranger Times" 
that "Gene Millican" only has a good 
"Working Relation" with Ranger, Lake Leon, 
and Desdemona. Was this the reason "why" 
Special Favoritism was shown to these 
Area's? 

Apparently the present "Sheriff" does not 
feel that the "Police Chief" of "Ranger" can 
do his job, for the "Sheriff" to assign him a 
"Special Deputy". 

Lake Leon, Ranger, Desdemona are in no 
worse shape than Carbon, Gorman, and Ris-
ing Star to receive "Special Protection". 

It appears that Ranger, Lake Leon, 
Desdemona would also "Agree" that we all 
pay taxes that we should all have the "Same 
Protection" from any "Sheriff" of "Eastland 
County". 

"Chief Rose" of Ranger was contacted by 
telephone and he contend's that he did not go 
to "Any" Commissioners or any Judge to ap-
prove or authorize any "Special Deputy" to be 
"Assigned" to his "City" as the "Chief" con-
tend's he is "Capable" of transacting "Police 
Affair's" in his "City" without interference 
from the "Sheriff's" department, to run his 
"Police business". The "Chief" contend's he 
never authorized this. The Cities of Lake Leon 
and Desdemona does not contain a "Chief Of 
Police" to verify any story. 

SIGNED TAX PAYER'S 
( Pd. Pol. Ada 

DESDEMONA 
NEWS 

By Vonnie Guthery 

Learn to tighten up 
for energy savings... 

and lower electric bills. 
money. If you have any questions, we'll 
be glad to answer them. 

To find out when and where there's 
going to be an Operation Tighten-Up 
workshop near you — or to set one up 
it your neighborhood—Just call your 
Texas Electric service office. Or ask for 
details on the comment section of your 
next electric bill. 

The way we see it, the more 
you know about 
using energy 	'texas 
efficiently, 
•he better. 	eirvCtle 

Company 
IT R. ARMSTRONG. Manager, PRono 893-2266 

WESSON 011.01.49 
Buttermilk r 1/2 -gal. ctn. Foremost 

Wilson arena. 	 are due on June 13. 
4-H members interested in 

participating in roping or 
	

For further information on 
jumping events, need to the District Horse Show, 
contact the County Extension 

	
contact the County Extension 

Office by June 6. and entries 
	

Office at 629-1093. 

1 

• • 
BARGAINS 

. 

Syr  

F 

''' 

i. 
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OR FATHER'S DAY 
20% Off 

MEN'S 

1 	HUBB4RD 
 PANTS 

AND 
! I 	1 
i j,.., ,  

LEVI'S 
FOR MEN 

MEN'S TUCKED FRONT 

SHIRTS 
SHORT SLEEVE 

SPORT SHIRTS 
PURCHASED 	ESPECIALLY 

FOR 	FATHER'S 	DAY 

	

REGULAR 	0
515.98 	nly 	$10.98 
WHILE SHOPPING FOR DAD - 	- 

CHECK 	OUR 	SPECIALS 	ON 
BOBBY BROOKS 

SPORTSWEAR 
FOR 	JUNIORS 

25% OFF 
TRISSE SEPARATES 

MISSES 	SIZES 

2S% OFF 
Summer fabrics 
Greatly Reduced 

W. 

125 

DEPT. 
N. 

DE 

H. SMITH 

Texas 

LEON, TEXAS 

STORE 
893-2135 

Attendance was down at 
	

Flora Singleton. 

First Baptist on Sunday with 
	

Mr. and Mrs. L.E. Single. 

47 in Sunday School. Special 
	

ton Jr. are new grand-par- 

music was brought by Helen 
	ents in town as Mrs. and 

Collum with Karen Creed at 
	

Mrs. Darrell Morgan o f 

piano and another special by 
	

Grandbury are proud parents 

Leon and Juarice White and of a new daughter, Jessica 
daughter Mayna of Azle. 	born Saturday May 24. 

Also Bibles were presented 
	

Weighed 7 lbs. Grandma 

to the seniors of our church. 	Peggy spent a few days to 

They are John T. Buckley 
	

help spoil the baby. 

and Steve Tucker. 	Larry 
	

Dorthy Roberts and Jeff 

Galley of Ranger High. 	visited Sunday eve in Cross 

Several visitors attended. 
	Plains with Sherri and Emily 

Mr. and Mrs. Elbert Lind- 
	

Horan and Mr. and Mrs. Ken 

ley visited in Grand Prairie 
	

Horan and children. 

on Friday with Mrs. Effie 
	

Visiting with Pug and Von-
Lewis and in Garland with nie Guthery over the w e e k-
Mr. and Mrs. Carl Lindley end were Bernard, Ann and 
and on Saturday in Spring- 

	Brad Keith. Tami and David 

town with Mrs. Joyce Unde- 
	

Griffith of Odessa. Leon and 
wood. Also visited Sunday in Juarice White and Mayna of 
Lawndale rest home at Gor- 

	Azle. 

man with Oscar Carr and 
	

Vacation Bible School pa- 

Mrs. and Mrs. Forrest 
	

rade will be Saturday morn- 

Brown. 	 ing the 7th at 10:00 a.m. 

Virginia Leonard of Gor- 
	

Make plans to be in it. Bible 
man visited the week-end School will begin at First 
with Uncle Escar and Aunt Baptist Church on Monday. 

Concerned about the rising cost of 
energy? Well. there's something you 
can do to help keep utility bills 
under control. 

Learn how to tighten up your home 
to save energy and lower bills by at-
tending a FREE Operation Tighten-Up 
workshop. 

These one-hour sessions will show 
you how to use energy wisely. You'll 
learn the most economical ways to 
run your heating and cooling system, 
how insulation works, where to caulk 
and weather-strip for the most effi-
cient results. And then, how to tell if 
you're really saving energy ... and 

RICHBURG • STACY 
REUNION HELD SUNDAY 

Seventy-three members of 
the late Mrs. Betty Richburg 
Stacy Family met Sunday 
June 1st in the lovely country 
home of Mr. and Mrs. Clif-
ford Moore for their annual 
Family Reunion. 

A Committee was formed 
to plan next years reunion 
they are : Beth White, Vickie 
Campbell, Terry Treadway. 
Brenda Boyd, Connie Moore 
and Becki Wright. 

Those attending were: Mr. 
and Mrs. Lane Campbell. 
David. Kim and Mary; Mr. 

June 9-13 from 8:30-11:30 
a.m. for pre-school- 6 t h 
grade and 7th-12th grade 
7:00-9:00 p.m. 

Jack and Mary Williams 
and Shana of Kermit. Aunt 

Red Seaton of Marshall 
visited recently with Jerry 
and Pat Buckley and family. 
Also attended the graduation 
of John T. Buckley. 

Melinda Buckley and Aunt 
RED Seaton of Marshall 
attended graduation Friday 
night in Graham of David 
Buckley son of Mr. and Mrs. 
James Buckley.  

& Mrs. Earnest Weaver; Mr. 
and Mrs. Orville Treadway: 
Mr. and Mrs. Windell Tread-
way. Angela and Allison; 
Mr. and Mrs. W. M. Boyd. 
Paula and Sherri; Mr. and 
Mrs. Frank Moore. Darrell: 
Mr. and Mrs. Travis Moore. 
Sandy, Clifford and Brandy: 
Mr. and Mrs. Fulton Moore. 
Dean; Mr. Velton Moore; 
Connie Moore; Mr. and Mrs. 
Ray Sue, Stacy. Misty, Curtis 
and Christi, and Buddy Jo; 
Mr. and Mrs. Lyndon Ship-
man; Mr. and Mrs. Jimmy 
Guthery and Nicholas; Mrs. 
Eva Wright; Frankie Stacy: 
Georgia Stacy: Mr. Buddy 
Stacy; Mr. and Mrs. Lonnie 
Capers; Mr. and Mrs. Gray-
don Baze and Mellissa: Mr. 
and Mrs. Albert White; Mr. 
and Mrs. Quinten Wright 
and Keri; Beth White, Bar-
bie and Kathy; Charles 
White; Steve Keith; Mr. and 
Mrs. Eddie White, Crystal: 
Mr. and Mrs. Clifford Moore 
and Mr. and Mrs. John 
Sutton. 

—GP— 
Line the shelves of a 
medicine cabinet with 
strips of blotting paper. 
This will absorb spills 
and prevent bottles from 
sliding off the shelves. 
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DISTRICT HORSE SHOW 	and June 27 with the Qualify- 

	

The District 8 4•H Horse 
	ing Events. 

	

Show has been set for June 
	

The show will be in Brown- 

	

26 with Invitational Events, 	wood. Texas at the Earl Q. 
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