
City committee to go to Austin

lSo 'K iS  Ccunt7 Llbrary
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Negotiations proceed with Mission Cable
Final negotiations in the 

re-franchise agreement between 
the City of Spearman and Mission 
Cable Company have been 
scheduled for Feb. 20 * 21 in 
Austin, Tx. Spearman's negotia­
ting team will fly to Austin at that 
time.

This was the outcome of Thurs­
day’ s meeting in Austin between 
Jack Hopper, PhD., whom Spear 
man appointed to prepare the new 
franchise ordinance, and Jack Mor­
gan, Mission Cable's chief execu 
tive officer. Spearman's negotia­
ting team for this project is 
comprised of Mayor Bob Pearson, 
Mayor Pro-Tem Burl Buchanan, 
Alderman Mike Cudd, and City 
Manager Jim Murray.

City Manager Jim Murray told 
the Spearman Reporter that yester 
day’ s meeting in Austin resulted in 
several agreements on franchise 
contract items, but that other items 
are still being negotiated. He 
anticipates that the Austin meeting 
later this month could finalize the 
agreement. This agreement would 
then be brought before the City 
Council at its regular session on 
Tuesday, Feb. 28 for approval, 
disapproval, or tabling for further 
study.

“ My highest priority with fran 
chising Mission Cable is that we 
proceed in an expeditious manner 
and it come to a close as quickly as 
possible,”  said Mayor Bob Pear 
son. “ The most important reason 
for regulations is to establish 
certain standards w’nch are to be

met."
Spearman Cable Manager Terry 

Porter, representing the views of 
its owner, who lives in Fresno. 
Calif., commented, “ These nego­
tiations would not be so drawn out 
if Spearman didn't have 18 pages 
of demands in its franchise pro­
posal.”  Porter said he has been 
present at other Panhandle towns' 
cable franchise negotiations and 
found them to be more easily and 
rapidly accomplished than Spear­
man's have been.

Pearson said in defense of the 
proposed contract, “ Spearman did 
not have any powers in the 
franchise ordinance that enabled it 
to check into complaints in the 
past. If the franchising process will 
ensure that our citizens have a 
good quality signal, governmental 
access capabilities and expansion 
of service capabilities, then that 
process is a necessary one.”

Both men agree that the sale of 
Spearman Cable's franchise to 
Mission Cable is desirable for all 
concerned, from townspeople to 
Spearman Cable's employees.

Murray explained to the Spear­
man Reporter that cities have no 
control over what channels a cable 
company puts on locally or on the 
cable company's rates. This is 
because laws under the Federal 
Communications Act have dis 
allowed this. Most cable systems 
were freed from municipal rate 
regulation two ye:*rs ago.

“ The cable companies every­
where are charging what the local

market will bear,”  Murray said. 
“ Our citizens’ main concern about 
the transfer to Mission is how 
much their rate will go up and the 
quality of the signal. They also 
want to know how many and which 
channels will be available. Mission 
has the right to decide these 
things, but their owner has prom­
ised to be sensitive to our needs 
and values here in Spearman.”

Mission owner O'Neal promised 
at the public meeting in December 
to increase Spearman's capacity to 
35 channels when/if his company 
has the new franchise. This is one 
of the items under negotiation in 
the proposed re-franchise agree­
ment.

When asked what could happen 
if Mission and the City of Spear­
man do not come to an agreement 
and the sale does not go through, 
Porter said, “ Spearman Cable was 
automatically renewed by the City 
Council in 1985 and that agreement 
is good through 1995. Even if 
Spearman Cable keeps the fran­
chise, channels will be added. We 
have a 21-channel capacity here 
now. What would be changed is the 
time frame. Mission would have 
already put three new channels on 
by now if the agreement were in 
effect.”

Summary of City of Spearman - Mission 

Cable negotiations to date ,
DOT. 1988 - Mission Cable and 
Spearman Cable agree to a sale of 
'he Spearman and Shamrock 
systems to Mission Cable.

NOV. 15, 1988 Mission Cable and 
Spearman Cable's representatives 
approach the City Council about 
transferring the franchise 
ordinance. The City of Spearman 
decides to seek expert advice on 
this transfer.

NOV. 29, 1988 - The city employs 
Don Butler, an attorney, and Jack 
Hopper, a Ph. D. in economics, 
both of Austin, Tx., for legal advice 
and consulting service with respect 
to the proposed transfer.

DEC. 13, 1988 - A public hearing is 
conducted in Spearman at the City

Hall, during which Jay O'Neal, 
Mission Cable's president, and Dr. 
Hopper answer citizens' questions. 
(Earlier this day, Dr. Hopper 
advises the City Council to prepare 
a new franchise ordinance in order 
to ensure quality of service, 
governmental access capabilities 
and provide compliance with the 
Cable Communication Policy Act of 
1984.)

At the meeting’s conclusion, 
Pearson instructs Hopper to pro­
ceed with a new franchise ordi­
nance, and appoints the city's 
negotiating committee.

DEC. 27, 1988 - Dr. Hopper 
prepares and sends a draft copy of 
the franchise ordinance to the City. 
(The negotiating committee

reviews and revises the draft 
during the next two weeks.)

JAN. 16, 1989 - Mission Cable 
reviews the proposed ordinance. *

FEB. 2, 1989 - Mission Cable 
responds with its own version of 
the ordinance.

FEB. 9, 1989 - Morgan of Mission 
Cable and Dr. Hopper meet in 
Austin to negotiate the proposed 
ordinance, agreeing on some
items.

FEB. 20-21 • This is the meeting 
date scheduled for the final 
negotiations on the franchise 
ordinance. The meeting will take 
place in Austin and Spearman's 
negotiating team will be present.
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The teen radio program, 

"Weekend Wipeout," which Gary 
Ellsworth hosted as disc jockey on 
Radio Station KRDF for over two 
years, was taken off the air at the 
end of November last year.

The Hansford Plainsman re­
cently investigated the reasons for 
“ Weekend Wipeout”  's removal 
from KRDF's programming. Sta­
tion manager and co-owner George 
Young explained ;hat cost factors 
were the only reasons for the 
program's demise.

" I  took a long hard look at the 
program after having it on the air 
for six months." said George. " I  
knew then that it was losing 
money. I knew before then, but I 
took a harder look at it after six 
months.”  He further explained 
that he kept the show on the air for 
four additional months but 
“ couldn't find a way to make it 
work.”

The costs involved for the pro­
gram included employee wages, 
employer-paid insurance, and pur­
chasing of records. KRDF has a 
country-western format and the 
"Weekend Wipeout”  show was 
rock music, so the records had to 
be purchased for it. “ For the 
amount we used of this type of 
music, we couldn't get a regular 
supply service. This meant we had 
to pay retail prices for these

records," Young commented.
Young emphasized that there 

were no listener complaints about 
the program and he himself was 
pleased with Gary Ellsworth's per 
formanre. “ I would have kept it on 
the air even if it had just broken 
even,”  Young said. “ But I am a 
businessman and the main purpose 
of the radio station is to make 
money, first and foremost.”

The Hansford Plainsman was 
prompted to make this inquiry by 
two local parents of teenagers. 
These parents said their teens miss 
the “ Weekend Wipeout" program 
and there is some confusion about 
why it is no longer offered. The two 
parents also commented that the 
show “ kept our kids at home on the 
weekend.”

Lynxettes to play in Bi-district championships
Next Thursday night, Feb. 16, 

the Spearman varsity Lynxettes 
will play in the bi-district game for 
1-2A. They will play against Cana­
dian or Stratford, depending upon 
who won the Friday night, Feb. 11 
game between Stratford and Cana­
dian. (results unavailable at press­
time)

If Canadian won, the girls will 
play Canadian at Perryton. If 
Stratford won, another game would 
be played for playoffs between

PDRA meeting announced
The Palo Duro River Authority 

will meet in regular session on 
Tuesday Feb. 14 at 2 p.m. in the 
meeting room of the PDRA located 
at 511 S.W. 11th, in Spearman. 
The meeting will be open to the 
public.

On the agenda for the meeting 
will be the reading of the minutes

of the last meeting; treasgrer's 
report; payment of claims! and 
oath of office for reappointed koard 
member; and easement for Maxus 
Exploration Company.

Following regular businen, a 
general discussion of the plam 
project will be the focui of 
attention.

these Spearman students entered the PTA Reflec­
tions contest with literary, art, or music talents. Top 
haw are [l-r] Derek George. Dawn Loomis, Lena 
Parhour, I anna Brock. Kasey Dunnlhoo. Jennifer

Bchnell; [middle row] Becky Porter, Texana Ciybum 
Kathryn Murphy, Ashley Brown, Jordan Brock, Dit 
Kirk; [front row] Brandon Clyburn, Erin Boxwell
parcy McGee and Chelsea Nollner.

Stratford and Canadian. If Strat­
ford won that playoff game, the 
Lynxettes would play Stratford at 
Pampa next Thursday night.

Ringing phones 
call reporters 
to action

The telephone rings ail day long 
in the Hanaford Plainsman's office. 
It's a wonder sometimes that 
Marlene Davis, the bookkeeper/ 
receptionist, can find a spare 
moment to add two and two 
together because of all the time she 
spends fielding phone calls. There 
are a dozen times a day she hangs 
up the receiver only to have the 
telephone ring again before she 
can pick up a pencil.

People call to take out or renew 
subscriptions, which always makes 
us happy. People call to place ads, 
which make us absolutely ecstatic.
A few people call to make a 
complaint, which, while not send­
ing us into handsprings of joy, we 
are nevertheless anxious to 
address and redress, if necessary.

Most importantly, in many ways, 
people also call to ask questions. 
This can prove to be the most 
satisfying call of all, because it 
reminds us of our main function, 
which is to keep the public in-„< 
formed. These callers send us 
scurrying to check times and dates 
of events, or to begin investiga­
tions into rumors, controversies, or 
problems.
Not all of the work we do to 

respond to these calls turns into an 
article published in an edition of 
our newspaper. Some of the 
rumors go up in a puff of smoke 
when we start looking for facta, for 
example. Other story projects do 
not work out for lack of news­
worthiness or inadequate interest 
on the part of those involved. In 
spite of these “ deadends," we are 
eager to pursue all the leads our 
readers give us.

This is how some of our best 
stories begin: Marlene picks up the 
jangling phone and says in her 
cheery voice, “ Spearman Reporter. 
How can I help you?" and the voice

Londee Bradley puts another one in for the Lynxettes against 
Panhandle.

photo courtesy o f  Anthony Wilkerson
on the other end begins, "Can you 
find out for m e..." This week alone 
we tracked down information on
several subjects about which local 
people questioned us. One of these 
resulted in the article about 
KRDF’ s te£n radio program which 
appears in this issue of the 
Haaaford Plainsman.

We urge our subscribers and all 
Hansford County residents to think 
of our office as a big combination 
suggestion box/information center

which depends on reader input for 
its lifeblood. Not every question or 
suggestion will evolve into print, 
nut we always welcome the oppor­
tunity to seek information on the 
public's behalf. The public and the 
newspaper keep each other 
informed!

To phone in suggestions, com­
ments, or leads to stories, call 
659-3434, between 8 a.m. and 5 
p.m. Monday through Friday.
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A PHARMACIST DISCUSSES OVER-THE-COUNTER MEDICATIONS
EDITOR1 S NOTE: The Hansford 
Health Shell ie published two to 
(our times per month in the 
Hansford Plainsman and the 
Gruver Statesman. Readers are 
invited to submit general informa­
tion questions to the newspapers 
on health-related topics, such ss 
dentistry, nutrition, and physical 
fitness. Each question will be 
answered in this column by a 
Hansford County health pro- 

V  fessional.
Questions may be submitted in 

writing to The Hansford Plainsman 
Gruver Statesman, c /o  Box 458, 
Spearman, Texas 79081. Writers' 
names will be printed unless 
otherwise indicated.

QUESTION: What are over-the- 
counter medicines?

ANSWER: An over-the-counter 
medicine is one which you can buy 
without a prescription, a medical 
doctor's drug and dosage order. 
The Federal Drug Administration 
(FDA) determines what can and 
cannot be sold without a prescrip­
tion. The basis for making a drug 
available by prescription only is 
primarily safety. For example, any 
medicine with codeine in it in the 
state of Texas cannot be obtained 
without a prescription due to 
codeine’s dangerously addictive 
properties. Some prescription 
drugs become available over-the- 
counter after a time. Examples of 
these are Bendryl 25mg and 
Ibuprofen 200mg. Some antihisti- 
mine preparations are being re­
leased from their prescription-only 
status to over-the-counter avail­
ability. In these cases, the drug's 
safety has been demonstrated and

sometimes its strength has been 
reduced for over-the-counter sale.

QUESTION: What are some guide­
lines for specific uses of over the- 
counter drugs?

ANSWER: The over-the-counter 
drugs can be divided into several 
groups, based on the medical 
symptoms they treat.

For coughs of a simple, non­
productive nature, expectorant 
preparations are recommended, 
such as Robitussin or Guaifenesin. 
The cough reflex is a necessary 
one, so you don’ t want to “ quiet”  
it entirely. A.H. Robbins Co. has a 
formula called Robitussin DM 
which acts as an expectorant and 
yet soothes a cough at the same 
time.

For sinus and allergy problems, 
antihistimines are helpful. Bene- 
dryl is commonly used to help dry 
runny noses in children. It also sets 
as a mild sleep-inducer, (a side 
effect) There are some ineffective 
sinus preparations on the market, 
so talk to your pharmacist or doctor 
before buying one!

Some antihistimine prepara­
tions, with other added ingre­
dients, have some unfortunate side 
effects, such as raising the blood 
pressure, so a person who is 
already being treated for blood 
pressure problems should always 
consult a doctor, or pharmacist 
before taking sinus medications.

Some sinus medications contain 
phenylpropanolamine, a chemical 
also used in appetite suppressants.
I don't encourage the use of sinus 
products containing this chemical 
because it causes stimulation of the 
Central Nervous System and in

1004 LINN
SOLD, but you are invited to inspect 
from 8:00 a.m. to 6:00 p.m. 
weekdays. We'll rebuild as desired.

For a large home try this:

4 bedrooms & large office (or 5 Bdrs.) 
Game, family, country kitchen 
Living area (heated): 2801 sq. ft.
Under roof area: 3542 sq. ft.

Cost (lot not included) TOTAL *99,000.°*
LIVING AREA 35.34 per sq. ft.
UNDER ROOF 27.95 per sq. ft.

If you can beat this, buy it. I* not. call:

D.R. CERVIN 352-4601 (Amarillo) 
(from 7 a.m. to midnight)

■ m m n j u n u -

many people this leads to jitters or 
“ hyperness,”  especially in 
children.

Nose sprays are also available 
for relief of sinus congestion. 
Neo-synephrine is the Granddaddy 
of these, but Afrin, a relative 
newcomer to the market, has 
enjoyed great success. It works for 
12 hours; however, using too much 
can cause a headache, so follow the 
instructions for dosage. Normal 
saline sprays or drops are growing 
in popularity for nasal congestion.

For pain ol a general natnre, 
over-the-counter drugs include the 
ibuprophens, such as Mediprin, 
Advil, Nuprin, etc (brand names), 
the acetominophens, such as Tyle­
nol, and aspirin. Ibuprofen is now 
available in 200 milligram pills 
without a prescription. It is easier 
on the stomach than aspirin. For a 
headache. Extra-Strength Tylenol 
in caplet form is what I recommend 
for adults.

■< Tylenol and Panadol are the pain 
relivers most used for children, 
because aspirin should not be 
given to them. Children treated 
with aspirin for fever have an 
increased risk of developing Reye's 
Syndrome, which is a disease 
causing inflammation of the liver 
following a viral infection. Reye's 
Syndrome can be fatal without 
medical care.

A new use for low-dose or 
“ baby”  aspirin has developed in 
recent years. Adults are taking it 
not for pain but for their hearts. 
Aspirin has been shown to reduce 
the risk of myocardical infarction 
(heart attack) and stroke in those at 
risk for stroke.

For excessive stomach acid,
there are many kinds of non 
prescription antacids. I think it is a 
good idea for people to stay away 
from those containing aluminum, 
because the body stores aluminum 
instead of getting rid of it. Th4 
aluminum compounds in some of 
these products acts as an absorber 
and neutralixer of acid, but there 
are others which are equally 
effective which do not contain 
aluminum, such as Riopan.

Eye problems should always e 
treated by a doctor. Pharmacists' 
over-the-counter products for the 
eye are limited to those which 
remove redness, such as Visine.

Ear problems are also best 
treated by a physician. Pharma­
cists are now limited to selling 
over-the-counter products which 
soften ear wax, such as Debrox and 
ERO. Years ago, we could sell pain 
relievers for the ear without a 
prescription. Preparations contain-

tg Antipyrine and Benzocaine 
ould kill the pain and 
ignore the problem causing it 

instead of getting the problem 
taken care of professionally. This 
often led to complications of the 
original problem.

QUESTION: Is there any new 
direction of the over-the-counter 
medications?

ANSWER: There is currently a 
renewed interest in the medicinal 
properties of herbs. The trend is to 
assist the body in its own natural 
healing ability. Many herbs can

D&MTravel Service
We are proud to announce our 5th Anniversary. 
We opened on Valentine's Day 1984.

We are inviting old and new customers to come 
in and see us at our same location.

Dale Wofford 
Mae Wofford, CTC

Pittman - Shieldknight Building 659-5233

treat problems without risking 
unwanted side effects. Pharmacists 
definitely need more schooling in 
the field of herbal medicine.

There are many other over-the- 
counter items of value to aid our 
problems of health needs. We are 
always happy to assist the 
customer in any manner.

ORVIL BRU M M ET. R, fh.. has been a 
registered oharmaost at Spearman Rexall Drug 
since 1962, He is a Class o» 49 graduate ol 
* 2 2 "  High School After receiving his 
Bachelor of Business Administration degree 
hwthamajor in accounting! in 1964 from Texas 
State, Brummet completed his Bachelor of 
Science in pharmacy at Southwestern Uni­
versity s  School of Pharmacy in Weatherford, 
Ok., in 1968. In this seme year, he passed the 
Texas and Oklahoma State Boards of Pharmacy 
end has been lioensed by both states to this 
day.
__8'ummet'a first pharmacy position upon the
completion of his professional training was at 
Satan 's Rexall Drug Store. In 1961, he 
returned to Perryton to open a new drugstore. 
Modern Drug, He came to Spearman in 1962 to 
work for Spearman Rexall's owner. Bruoe 
Sheets Brummet bcxight the store from Sheets 
in 1966.

When asked his favorite aspect of his 
pharmacy career, Brummet replied, " I t 's  
certainly not the paperworkl" He explained 
that "third party pay" insurance plans and 
welfare and medicare programs have created 
mountains of new forms for pharmacists. 
Brummet much prefers working with people to 
paper

Brummet and his wife Colene. who manages 
the store with him, have a son and daughter 
Their son Terril is a systems analyst for 
Halliburton in Duncan, Ok. and their daughter 
Dalynn is a registered pharmacist in Mission, 
Ks. who is currently studying to be a 
chiropractor. The Brummets have three 
grandchildren.
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Obituary
Eunice Stafford

Eunice Stafford, 86, died Sun­
day, Feb. 5 in Enid, Okla.

Services were held Wednesday, 
Ffeb. 8 at Ladusau-Evans Funeral 
Home Chapel with Rev. Virgil 
9vift officiating. Burial was at 
Memorial Park Cemetery in Enid.

She was born June 26, 1902 in 
Houston, Tx. She married Mr. 
Oval Stafford in 1926 at Gaines- 
wlle, Tx. The couple moved to Enid 
n 1947. She was preceeded in 
death by her husband in 1980.

Survivors include two sons: O.C. 
(Pete) Stafford of Spearman and 
TFavis Stafford of Wichita, Kan.; 
two daughters, Mrs. Rachel New­
man of Nash. Okla.; Mrs. Arvilla 
Morrison of Enid, two sisters, Mrs. 
hice Stafford of Woodward, Okla., 
and Mrs. Vea Lack of Wynnewood, 
Okla.; and 24 grandchildren.

Edward till Rorex

Edward Lill Rorex, 66, died at 
his home in Freeport, la .. Thurs­
day, Feb. 2.

A memorial service was held at 
First United Methodist Church in 
FFeeport Sunday, Feb. 5, with the 
pastor, the Reverend James E. 
McCullar, officiating. Freeport 
FVineral Home was in charge of 
WTangements. Burial was in Pan­
handle, Tx., beside his parents, 
Ibesday, Feb. 7.

Edward was born Sept. 17, 1922, 
the fifth of eight children born to 
Joe and Lydia Lill Rorex at their 
home in Panhandle. Hia father and 
Ms mother were reared in pioneer 
homes there. Schooling was at 
Ihnhandle from first grade to 
senior year when he graduated as 
Shlutrforian.

Following two years at Texas 
Itch.he was instructor in primary 
lighttraining for U.S. Air Force at 
AvonjPark, Fla., followed by two 
yearaof active duty, during WWn. 
Afteavard he graduated from the 
Uhivjrsity of Texas with a BBA 
degrje in accounting.

1961 he obtained a Texas CPA 
Osrtficate, and in 1961 he opened 
aC« tified Public Accountant office 
w*»i l he operated until the time of 
Ha eath.

F »• survived by Josephine 
H»ix Bird of Robert Lee, Tx.: 
IoiRe Rorex Holt and husband!
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Q.C., of Spearman, and their 
daughter, Anita Eisenhauer and 
husband, Gene, of Corpus Christ:, 
Ik.; Frank Rorex and wife, Colum- 
ba, of Lubbock, Tx., and their 
daughters. Dona Grace Howe and 
lydia Diana Spradlin; Alice Rorex 
Waidhofer and husband, Joe, of 
Stockton, Calif., their son, Karl 
Waidhofer. of Berkely, Calif., and 
(kughter, Elaine Waidhofer, of 
Stockton; Robert Rorex and wife, 
%bil of Lubbock, their sons, Glenn 
Fforex of Dallas, and Don Rorex of 
Lubbock; Dr. Eugene Rorex and 
wife, Bron, of Las Cruces, N.M., 
their son, Allen Rorex, of Las 
Ouces, daughter, Pamela Bertoni, 
<f Ascuncion, Paraguay, daughter, 
Karen Namaki, of San Jose, Calif., 
daughter, Laura Fernandez, of Las 
Cruces, and son, Mike Fernandez, 
cf Las Cruces; and Evelyn Rorex 
Atkinson and husband, Atmar, of 
Backport, Tx.

Pallbearers were George Eisen­
hauer, Calvin Collier, Ferdie Kibo- 
deaux, Thad Davis, Ralph David, 
Q.C. Farmer, Mark Powell and 
Jhck Dingle. Honorary pallbearers 
were J.E. Yancey, Cotton Nixon, 
members of Elks Lodge No. 2200 
and members of Lions Club of 
FFeeport.

Dear Popo,
You're the greatest grand­

father ever. I know I don't tellj 
you much, but ILoveYou j

M Carolyn

HAPPY VALENTINES DAY
Mother and Dad 

(Roscoe and Marguerite Nelson)
Love,

Charles, Joanne, and Cayla

(This is a copy of a Valentine 
Roscoe received when he was a 
little boy: circa 1926)

9.95 % ■
R U R A L  R E A L  E S T A T E

1 0 . 2 0 % '
R U R A L  R E S ID E N C E

Rates effective August J, 1988

H LONG-TERM FINANCING UP TO 35 YEARS
■  PRE-PAYMENT WITHOUT PENALTY
■  ONE POINT CLOSING FEE
■  FUNDS HELD ACCOUNTS AVAILABLE
■  FIXED RATE LOAN PLANS ALSO AVAILABLE

We are strongly committed to real estate lending in Texas.

F E D E R A L
I A M B .B A N K  A S S O C IA T IO N S

OF TEXAS Offices located Throuibrmi th,

High Plains Federal Land Bank Association 
506 S. Main Perryton, Texas 79070

Phone 435-4319 rn,
•  Annual percemagt m o  range from 10-06% to  10.42% cWndlna . ,

Serving Lipscomb, Ochiltree and

BREAST CANCER DETECTION UNIT
available to area women!

THURSDAY, FEBRUARY 23 1989 
HANSFORD HOSPITAL

SPEARM AN, TEXAS

Cali 659-2535 for appointment
According to the American Cancer Socle- 

ty, one out of ten women will develop 
(breast cancer sometime in her lifetime I is

-------------------------- "currently estimated me' "  *
that over 37,000 women die each year as a result of breast cancer

Ninety percent of breast cancers ore diagnosed by women or their ■ ■ «-
UmPc^ ,He Women who are d i^ n o se d  with a lump
*  °  50 P *rc#nt f,v*  y*ar survival rote. A  woman who is dioPQnos9«Hen°u9h- f°  

breast cancer by mammography, before a lump can be felt, has a ? ™  havm9
vtval rote and a 90% 10 year survival rate. (The cos t is on ly  »§« •  ) ° v® year sur­

A  mammogram can detect a concer this sm all,♦ even before it can be felt
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WE GIVE S&H GREEN SEALS 
EVERYDAY • one seal issued for every ss

-  » _____  _  .  _  EXCLU D IN G

& n  DOUBLE SEALS 
ON WEDNESDAY U r a n u s ®

SAVINGS
N PRICES GOOD THRU FEB. 18 IN PERRYTON ONLY. DOUBLE COUPONS UP TO AND INCLUDING $ 1 .0 0  ON THURSDAY

KRAFT
MIRACLE

W HIP
REG. OR LIGHT

TEXSUN
GRAPEFRUIT

JUICE
46 OZ.

6-16 OZ.
NON RETURNABLE

JIF
PEANUT
BUTTER

SMOOTH OR CRUNCHY

UNITED 
HAMBURGER 

BUNS 
o r  CONEYS

CAMPBELL’S 
PORK a n d  BEANS

16 OZ.
OR

RANCHERO BEANS 
— 15 O Z .^

KELLOGG’S
CORN

FLAKES

DUNCAN HINES
LAYER

CAKE MIX
. ASST.

VELVEETA 
SHELLS 

AND CHfcESE 
DINNERS

COMET
LONG GRAIN RICE

KEEBLER
CLUB CRACKERS

REG. OR LOW SALT OZ

LUCKY LEAF
CHERRY PIE FILLING

REG. OR LITE 20 TO 21 OZ.

POTTERS 
WHOLE HOG
PORK

SA U SAG E
MILE OR HOT

UNITED TRU TEND! 
OR USD A CHOICE 
SUPERVALU PAK 

BONELESS 
SHOULDER 

ROAST

SUPER VALU PAK 
EXTRA LEAN 

GROUND BEEF
$ | 7 8REG. PAK LBBUY ONE 

GET ONE
l b  FR EE!!!

COUNTRY SKILLET 
FARM RAISED

W H O L E  $  
C A T F IS H LB

SINGLE

UNITED TRU TENDR 
OR USDA CHOICE 
SUPER VALU PAK 

BONELESS 
FAMILY STEAK

UNITED TRU TENDR 
OR USDA CHOICE 
SUPER VALU PAK
BONELESS 

ARM ROAST
CHOKE

EXTRA LEAN

CHILI MEAT
COARSE GROUND

SINGLE 
PAK .

SINGLE
PAK

NO SALES TO DEALERS • QUANTITY RIGHTS RESERVED 
^WIC CARDS ACCEPTED • FOOD STAMPS WELCOME ^

NECTARINES
OR

PEACHES
RED

P L U M S

MINUTE RAID
ORANGE JJICE

10 OZ. TO 12 Oi OR
GRAPEFPUIT

JUICE

SHEDD’S
COUNTRY

CROCK
MARGARINE

PLAINS
BUTTERMILK

Va GAL.
GOLDEN FRIES

#  1 o r  CRINKLES
^  EL CHARR1TO “  ”

BURRITOS A ?  I
ASST. 4 OZ. *  FQR

PLAINS
HOMO MILK

CHEER
DETERGENT

*2 OFF LABEL

BOUNTY
TOWELS

ASST. JUMBO ROLL

PERT PLUS 
SHAMPOO

îr.IMVSSPKtAPJK

FRO/fN CONCINTC

)
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Fund set up at 

Gruver bank for

accident victim

THE HANSFORD PLAINSMAN

Doc Blakely's GTE ■ seven

Residents of Hansford County 
have set up a Lee Bort Hospital 
Fund at the Gruver State Bank in 
Gruver. Lee Bort, 15-year-old son 
of Bob Bort, was injured in an 
automobile accident last Saturday 
on the Gruver Highway. The fund 
has been established to help pay 
for his hospital stay.

Bort is currently in intensive care 
at Northwest Texas Hospital in 
Amarillo. He is stabilized but still 
has many problems to overcome. 
Friends of the family have asked 
others for prayers and cards in his 
behalf.

Pokin' 
Fun

Read my lips

companies join 
to make one

How can we balance the budget 
with politicians who are unbal­
anced?

George Bush keeps saying, “ No 
new taxes,”  and the Democrats 
keep saying, “ We don't read lips.”

One thing we had better learn to 
read is walls and the handwriting 
on them. “ Give me your tired, 
give me your poor, give me your 
huddled masses yearning to be 
taxed.”

We either have to have higher 
taxes, higher revenues, or higher
IQ’s.

If you don’ t know what I’ m 
talking about, your taxes are going 
up first.

Perish the thought that govern­
ment expenditures should be ''a l­
tered." That's an old veterinai]jan 
term used in reference to cats.'

Besides, it seldom works to 
everybody’ s satisfaction, especially 
the cats. It just shifts their area of 
interest and they become “ fat 
cats.”

Well, the fat cats in government 
are working on it. A 50% 
increase in their salaries is a

HAPPY VALENTINE'S DAY 
DAD & MOM

From the Davis Gang 

Love, Curtis, Marlene,

wonderful start and it makes sense. 
If the country is going in the hole, 
what’ s 50% of nothing?

It’ s a great incentive. Sort of like 
promising your son-in-law a re­
bate if he will just stick to the job 
and handle his own offspring.

So if we are to have no new 
taxes, where will the money come 
from? Read my lips. Old taxes.

From old taxpayers.
For old George.
An increase in an old tax is not a 

new tax is it? Nobody can deny 
that a foal develops into a race­
horse and gallops down the track 
with lots of suckers betting on him.

The experts say the oia taxes to 
watch are the so called sin taxes. 
Gambling, liquor, and cigarettes. 
That idea was thought up in the 
smoke-filled saloons down at the 
government racetrack.

Imagine this. The government 
pays farmers a subsidy to grow 
tobacco, pays the surgeon general 
to tell us not to smoke it, then 
wants to cleanse it of sin by taxing 
the hell out of it.

No wonder all those drunken 
jockeys had their growth stunted.

Then there is the value added 
tax, VAT for short. That stands 
for the VAT that will hold the 
money raised by it; and the 
gasoline added tax, GAT, which 
represents the instrument held to 
our head. In government jargon, 
it's all basic added deviation or 
BAD.

The only hope for the govern­
ment to get out of this mess 
gracefully is for George to receive a 
letter from Ed McMahon that says, 
“ Congratulations. You may have 
already won Japan.”

GTE’ s seven domestic telephone 
companies, recently reorganized 
operationally into a single, nation­
wide telephone unit, will be called 
GTE Telephone Operations, 
according to an announcement 
today by Kent B. Foster, president, 
GTE telephone operations group. 
This change is effective im­
mediately. •

The seven companies to be 
identified as GTE Telephone Oper­
ations are:

GTE California Incorporated, 
GTE Northwest Incorporated, and 
GTE Hawaiian Tel (to be identified 
as GTE Telephone Operations- 
West Area);

GTE Florida Incorporated, and 
GTE South Incorporated (to be 
identified as GTE Telephone 
Operations-South Area);

GTE North Incorporated (to be 
identified as GTE Telephone 
Operations-North Area);

GTE Southwest Incorporated (to 
be identified as GTE Telephone 
Operations-Southwest Area).

Foster noted that the changes 
reflect the company’s recent re­
organization, its new nationwide 
sales and service coverage, 
changes in the business environ­
ment, advances in technology and 
the broad range of new products 
and services offered by the 
company.

In addition to the newly- 
consolidated General Office head­
quarters and the four Operating 
Areas, the overall GTE Telephone 
Operations Group is comprised of 
British Columbia Telephone, Que­
bec Telephone, CodeTel (in the 
Dominican Republic), and GTE 
Data Services. These companies 
will retain their existing names.

THANK YOU

Brian, Brett, & 
Chad

The gravity of the moon is about 
one sixth that of earth.

We can never adequately 
thank so many wonderful people 
who have prayed, visited us, 
sent cards, called, brought food 
anj been so concerned about 
Bruce.

Thanks to Dr. Behney, and all 
of the personnel in the Hansford 
Hospital and Manor.

A “ Special Thanks" to Carol 
Dunnahoo, therapist, and the 
many men who have given Bruce 
'walking therapy’ twice a day for 
several weeks.

M ay God Bless You All 
Bruce and Freda Sheets
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THE COMPETITION LEFT OUT
THE MOST IMPORTANT PART.

From the outside, the latest competitive combine looks new 
and improved.

In fact, with its bigger, centered cab and engine in the back, it 
looks a lot like the combine we introduced over ten years 
ago.

But look inside, and you'll see they left out the most 
important part: the rotary threshing and separating system.

The CaseQi Axial Flow combine is.designed to hold onto more 
of your crop than a conventional machine like theirs. Much 
more. Our patented multi-pass threshing and separating system 
sees to that. It moves your harvest from header to grain tank with

unmatched efficiency. And minimal loss.
The Axial Flow system is easier on your ctjps, too, thanks to the 

simple, repetitive action of the Axial Flow ^ngle rotor. And that 
gets you top dollar for every bushel.

The Axial Flow combine. It’ s one more sfning example of what 
happens when you engineer a machine fbm the ground up to 
deliver the best quality in harvesting equirnent and, the highest 
possible return on investment.

So why invest in a combine that gfes you some of the 
advantages of the Case EH Axial Flow-witiout the most important 
one? See your Case EH dealer and take icloser look at an Axial 
Flow combine soon.

Five Star Equipment I B
H o y .  15  W . S p ea rm a n  R f f l  M M
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Shawn Cook was trying to block this shot and will go up for the rebound 
•gainst Panhandle. The Lynx took the victory in the game.

photo courtesy o f Anthony Wilkerson

Two SHS students
gain trip to Austin

Last week at the UIL Band 
Contest, two Spearman high school 
students gained a first division in 
class one solo contest. April 
Graham and Jennifer Reimer will 
now be qualified to go to state band 
contest in Austin the first weekend 
in June.

Reimer plays the trumpet and 
Graham plays the drums. The pair 
were also members of the Panhan­
dle Honor Band who performed at 
Panhandle State University last 
month. Team wins

Southwest Airlines
first place

offer lower fares
in Dumas

Southwest Airlines will offer 
late-night flyers the advantage of 
even lower fares when it begins 
“ Night Flight" fares of just $29 
one-way between Dallas and Hous­
ton, Amarillo, Austin, San Anton­
io, Tulsa, or Midland/Odessa. 
Beginning Feb. 8, this $29 one-way 
fare is the lowest unrestricted fare 
between Dallas and these six cities 
on all flights scheduled at 9 p.m. or 
later or before 6 a.m.

“ Our ‘ Night Flight’ fares are an 
extension of Southwest's tradi­
tional low-fare philosophy," noted 
Don Valentine, Southwest's vice 
president-marketing, “ and our 
customers are the beneficiaries. 
Southwest continues to police air 
fares and look for ways that its 
travelers can take advantage of 
travel bargains during off-peak 
flights."

The women's basketball team 
from Spearman sponsored by 
Gillaspie Motor Co. won their first 
game. The team played Contel of 
Dumas at the Dumas YMCA on 
Feb. 9. They won 55-26. Leading 
the scorers was Janet Walser with 
19, Andrea Mires and Jenni Morris 
with 11 each, Karla Flowers with 5, 
Cissy Gibson with 4, Ten Cagle 
with 3 and Judith Schaefer with 2.

The womens next game is Thurs­
day, Feb. 16 at 8:15 against 
Stinnett. The game will be played 
at the Dumas YMCA.

While the “ Night Flight" fares 
are totally unrestricted, reserva­
tions are suggested. The new 
“ Night Flight”  fares are available 
through travel agents or by calling 
Southwest Airlines directly.

BABY SHOWER 
You Are Cordially Invited 

To A Baby Shower 
Honoring

Emily Dawn 

daughter of

M ark and Leann Hood 

Saturday Feb. 18th

“ Night Flight" fares represent a 
savings of about 60 percent off the 
regular peak fares between Dallas 
and these cities.

2:30 - 4:30 p.m. 

Denise Harbour’ s home

HAVE YOUR 
HEARING TESTED 

BY A PROFESSIONALLY 
TRAINED BELTONE 

HEARING AID 
SPECIALIST TODAY!

Come To: • ■ - 
Hansford Manor 
707 S. Roland 
Spearman, Texas

FREE
HEARING

TESTS

Charlene Bjalock

Thursday 
Feb. 16 
10:00 a.m. to 
12:00 noon

Better Hearing Through Professional Care
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For Sole
FOR SALE: 35 foot Country Air 5th 
wheel trailer like new; 1984 Ford 
350 Dooley pickup with a 90 gallon 
tank and Owens trailer 5th wheel 
hookup; 18 foot four horse trailer 
with a 5th wheel hookup, 4 stalls 
and new tires.
416 W. 13th - Spearman 659-3301 
S14 ltp RTNC

HOUSE FOR SALE: 3 bedroom,
1 3/4 bath, 727 Cotter. 659-3801.
SI 4 RTNC

HOME FOR SALE: 3 bedroom, 2 
bath, 1001 Barkley. Call Jim 
Shirley at 659-5565 or 659-3214. 
S13S rtn

Bull Sale: Panhandle State Uni­
versity, 37th Annua) Performance 
Tested Bull Sale, Sat. Feb. 25, 1989 
1:00 p.m., England Activity Bldg. 
University Farm, Goodwell, OK, 
Selling 90 Bulls - The Top 65 
Percent on Test, Box 266, Good 
well. OK 73939 Ph. 405-349-2611 
Ext. 262, 349 2514 

G18 4tc 
S14S - 7tc

USED AUTO PARTS FOR SALE:
Located 4 miles west of Hooker, 
Ok. on highway 54. Muss Cat Auto 
Salvage. (405)652-2400.
SlO-rtn

FORSAIE: 1982 1/2 ton Chevrolet 
Silverado pickup. Call 659-2743 or 
659-2664.
S15S 2tp

FOR SALE: 1973 Green Briar 
Trailer. 14 x80, 3 bedroom, 2 bath. 
659 2176 after 5. $7,000.
S15S 4tp

FOR SALE OR LEASE: Office 
building for sale or lease. Owner 
will finance. Call 659-5051 before 5 
p.m. and 659-2719 after 5 p.m. 
S05s-rtn

QUAIL, PHEASANT, CHUKAR,
and HUNGARIAN PARTRIDGE. 
Booking orders for 1989, for price 
list cal) or write B & J Gamebirds, 
P.O. Box 158, McLean. TX 79057. 
(806) 779-3160 
S15S 2tc

MOBILE HOME MOVES AND
SET-UPS. Specializing in double- 
wides. 1-800 441-1687 
S13S (Sun only) 8tc

FOR SALE:3 bedroom, 2 bath 
home 1 mile south of Spearman, 
2200 sq. ft. on 2 acres with barn 
and corrals. Call 659-5162 for 
appointment. 
slls-5tp-sun. only

FOR SALE: 1976 Lancer Double­
wide. 28 feet x 80 feet. Full carpet, 
3 Bedroom, 2 full baths, rock 
fireplace, central air and heat. 
$22,500. 435 2344.
S12S 4tp SUN ONLY
B S S S S S S S S S S S S S S S  
[  V  NOTICE

Wallace Monument Co. 
Monuments, Curbing,

Grave Covers 
Local Representative 

LEONARD JAMESON 
Spearman, Texas

Miscellaneous

necessity
never made 

a good bargain.
Save Water Now.
TEXAS WATER DEVHjOPBKVT BOARD
PO Box 13231, Capitol Station 

Austin, Texas 78711

MITCHELL GARAGE DOOR 
REPAIR A INSTALLATION: Res­
idential and commercial. Also Will 
install electric openers. Exper­
ienced. Call after 5 p.m. 323-8210 
or 435-3033. slO-rtn

Music Ed. Graduate would like to 
teach piano lessons. Please call 
659-2774 or 659 3434.
S12-rtn f

GRANTS TREE SERVICE
Working all over the Panhandle 
area. We do trimming, pruning, 
topping, spraying, and handi 
man services. We have a lift ' 1 
truck. Phone 381-9345 after 6 
S15 2tc

GOVERNM ENT HOM ES

From $1.00 (U-Hepair) delin­
quent tax properties and repo's. 
For current lists call 1-800­
242-4944 Ext. 5199 also open 
evenings.

_S15 4tc
Mitiiiiiiaiiiiiiiiiiiiaiiiiiiiiiiiioiiiitiiiiiiiaiiii

CONTACT ME ABOUT THE 
VITAL 18 LIQUID DIET PLAN.
THIS IS A PURE, WHOLE FOOD. 
CALL 659-2189 TODAY.
S13S (Sun only) 3tp

For Rent

FOR RENT: Apartment for rent for 
single person. Call 659 2764.
S15 C RTN

Help Wanted

"ATTENTION HIRING! Govern 
ment jobs - your area. Many 
immediate openings without wait­
ing list or test. $17,840 • $69,485. 
Call 1-602-838 8885, EXT R4514." 
S15S 4tp

PUBLIC NOTICE

Panhandle Telephone Co­
operative, Inc., in accordance with 
the rules of the Public Utility 
Commission of Texas, hereby gives 
notice that on December 5, 1988, 
the Cooperative filed an Applica­
tion to Amend its Certificate of 
Convenience and Necessity to 
extend its Hardesty Exchange Ser­
vice Area in Hansford County, 
Texas, southward approximately 
nine miles to include an uncertified 
and unserved area of approximate­
ly 59 square miles. The area being 
requested to be certified for tele­
phone service to the Cooperative 
adjoins the telephone service boun­
dary of GTE Southwest Incor­
porated on the East and South and 
the telephone service area of 
Southwestern Bell Telephone Com­
pany on the West. The rates and 
regulations for local exchange ser­
vice in the new service area will be 
those presently approved by the 
PUC for the Hardesty Exchange. 
These changes may affect resi­
dents in this new service area.

The Commission has assigned 
this matter to Docket 8452. Persons 
with questions or who desire more 
information about the required 
change are encouraged to contact 
the Cooperative at (405) 338-2556 
or at 603 S. Main St. (P.O. Box 
1188), Guymon, Oklahoma 73942. 
A complete copy of the filing is 
available at the offices of the 
Cooperative.

Persons who wish to intervene or 
otherwise participate in these pro­
ceedings should notify the Com­
mission within two weeks from the 
date of this publication, but, in any 
event, as soon as possible. A 
request to intervene, participate or 
for further information should be 
mailed to the Public Utility Com­
mission of Texas. 7800 Shoal Creek 
Boulevard, Suite 400N, Austin, 
Texas 78757. Further information 
may also be obtained by calling the 
Public Utility Commission, Public 
Information Office at (512) 
458 0223, (512) 458 0227 or (512) 
458-0221 teletypewriter for the 
deaf.
Panhandle Telephone Cooperative, 

Inc.
S15S-2tc-SUN only

HHiunmmmiaMinimiiti

Dear Scott,
Happy Valentine’ s sweetie!

I Love You 
, Hillery

k
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Count on the 
Classifieds 

to Do the Job
NOTICE TO BIDDERS

Sealed bids for insurance 
coverage as listed below will be 
received by the City of Spearman, 
Texas, at the office of the City 
Manager up until 2:00 p.ip., April 
4, 1989, and then publicly opened 
and read. The City is seeking bids 
on the following insurance 
coverage: General liability, Auto 
Liability, Casualty Insurance, 
Public Officials Liability, and 
Umbrella Policy.

The City reserves the right to 
reject any or all bids, to waive 
informalities, and to accept the bid 
deemed to be the most advan­
tageous to the City. All bids 
received after the closing hour will 
be returned unopened.

All bids shall be sealed and 
marked on the outer envelope 
‘ ‘ Insurance Bid.”

Specifications and bidding 
documents may be secured from 
the office of the City Manager, 
P.O. Box 37, Spearman, Texas 
79081.
S15S 2tc Sun only

JR. HIGH ELEMENTARY MENU 
FEBRUARY 13 FEBRUARY 17

MONDAY
BUBRITOS 

PINTO BEANS 
COLESLAW 

MONKEY BREAD 
MILK 

TUESDAY 
FRIED CHICKEN 

MASHED POTATOES/GRAVY 
MIXED VEGETABLES 

BREAD SLICE 
PURPLE PLUMS 

MILK
WEDNESDAY

LASAGNA
SEASONED GREEN BEANS 

CARROT STICKS 
BREAD STICKS 
MIXED FRUIT 

MILK
THURSDAY

HAMBURGERS
FRIES

LETTUCE/TOMATO 
PICKLE/ONION 

COOKIE 
MILK 

FRIDAY 
CORNDOGS 

MACARONI CHEESE 
BLACK EYED PEAS 

FRESH APPLE WEDGES 
CAKE 
MILK

HIGH SCHOOL MENU 
FEBRUARY 13 FEBRUARY 17

MONDAY
BURRITOS 

PINTO BEANS 
SALAD BAR 

MONKEY BREAD 
MILK 

TUESDAY 
FRIED CHICKEN 

MASHED POTATOES/GRAVY 
SALAD BAR 

BREAD SLICE 
MILK

WEDNESDAY
LASAGNA

SEASONED GREEN BEANS 
SALAD BAR 

BREAD STICK 
FRUIT 
MILK

THURSDAY
HAMBURGERS 

FRIES 
SALAD BAR 

COOKIE 
MILK 

FRIDAY 
CORNDOGS 

MACARONI CHEESE 
SALAD BAR 

FRESH APPLE WEDGE 
CAKE 
MILK

PAGE ->

These students will have their entrants in the PTA 
Reflections district competition, [top. l-r] Regan 
Box well. Pat Hunter. Trey Porter; [front] Tina

Baumgardner, Tom Kirk, John Holt; not pictured are 
Ben Queener and | ason Sutterfield.

r HAPPY VALENTINE'S DAY 
MOM

We love you,
Curtis, Marlene, Brian, , 

Brett & Chad

► THANK YOU <
j <
* I am grateful for the cards, <
* letters, prayers, and gifts that 1 <
* received during my recent <
* illness. <
’ Times like these make a (
 ̂person appreciate anew the < 
i importance and love of
( family and friends.
( The employees of Hickerson’ s f 
(Jewelers did a great job oft
► taking the reins so my family <
, could be with me. I appreciate 
>ourcustomers continued support*
► during this time.

► H. C. Hickerson 4

1 C l a s s i f i e d _ A S ^

E A S T _ _ _

highly VISIBLE

D
T?

Hansford Countys 
Marketplace

... the classified section of the 

Hansford Plainsman
Reach your potential with an 
inexpensive, cost effective 

classified ad ...

Coll 659-3434 Today I

S L A S S IF IE D S
INEXPENSIVE PROFITABLE

i

loiimtittmai
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County extension 
office offers 
‘'Spring Fling"

The “ Center”  of attention! 
That's what mature adults 55 and 
over will be at the Texas 4-H 
Center on Lake Brownwood when 
hundreds will enthusiastically par­
ticipate in the Ninth Annual Spring 
Fling during April and May, says 
Karen Babitzke, Hansford County 
Extension Agent - H.E.

Sponsored by the Texas Agricul­
tural Extension Service, five con­
secutive weeks are offered from 
which men and women alike may 
choose:

THE HANSFOin PLAINSMAN SUNDAY, FEBRUARY It, 118*

Among the Neighbors

Spring Fling I 
Spring Fling II 
Spring Fling in 
Spring Fling IV 
Spring Fling I

April 4 
April II 
April 18 
April 25 
May 2

7
14
21
28

5

Featured educational programs 
and activities offer a wide variety of 
topics to fulfill highest expecta­
tions of all who attend. Topics 
include exploring insurance op­
tions, cooking demonstrations, new 
tax laws, floriculture, and more. 
Energizing and relaxing recrea­
tional opportunities will stimulate 
enthusiasm while all will welcome 
great fellowship and new friends.

Learning Centers will offer 
“ hands-on”  experience in a variety 
of areas such as oil painting, wind 
chime making, needlecrafts, anti­
que restoration, country crafts, 
collectibles, and more.

Boat rides, guided nature tours, 
and fishing on Lake Brownwood 
add popularity to your stay. Swim­
ming in the olympic-sized pool, 
lighted tennis courts, horseshoes, 
billiards, volleyball, shuffleborad, 
dominoes, and card and table 
games round out the event.

A special theme of “ Spring 
Hound up”  will provide a festive 
atmosphere to the newly expanded 
facilities. Thursday night’ s theme 
party will feature “ The Wild, Wild 
West” ! Call your
county Extension office today at 
659 2030 or 733 2901.

Weddirig Shower

honoring

Shannon Rylant Owens 

Sat. Feb. 18, 2 • 3:30 p.m.

Family Life Center

Union Church 

Given by Hostesses

Gift Selections at Sacks

by HFIF.N FISHER .

Coming to brighten the home of 
Mark and Leann Hood is Emily 
Dawn, a daughter. She arrived via 
Northwest Texas Hospital in Ama­
rillo on Feb 5, weighing 6 pounds.
3 ounces.

She is the first grandchild of 
Hoyt and Frances Biles of Spear­
man, Her other grandfather is 
William Hood of Lubbock. Great 
grandmothers are Myrtle Whitley 
of Kenton, Okla. and Susan Camp­
bell, Lorenzo.

Graveside services were held in 
Panhandle for Edward Lill Rorex, 
66, Monday. He was the brother of 
Louise Holt, and cousin of Louis 
Lemons. In addition of Mr. and 
Mrs. O.C. Holt and Mr. and Mrs. 
Louis Lemons, Mr. and Mrs. Nolan 
Holt attended the services.

Sympathy is extended to them.

Haley and Boyd Rice are 
announcing the arrival of a son on 
Feb. 5. Tarin Candler weighed 7 
pounds 15Vi ounces and was 20 ’A 
inches long when he arrived at the 
Memorial hospital in Perryton.

Grandparents are A.D. and Sha­
ron Reed, Spearman, and Sonny 
and Gloria Rice, Brenham. Great 
grandparents are T.C. and Lou 
Harvey, Spearman; Dale and Vir­
ginia Rice, Crockett; and Z. 
Candler Smith, Brenham.

3Vi year old brother, Tatum, is 
hoping to begin training him 
immediately for his future role in 
Tatum and Tarin, Team Ropers!

All those residents having birth­
days in January were honored at 
the monthly party at Hansford 
Manor. They were Pauline John­
son, Mildred Dailey, Myrtel Hen­
derson, Dale Womble and Ora 
Sanders.

Musical entertainment was fur­
nished by a couple from Enid, 
Okla. who were a niece and 
nephew of Juanita Boxford.

The Hospital Ladies' Auxiliary 
served pie and coffee.

On Feb. 14, Valentine's Day, 
Mr. Hansford Manor ar.d Mrs. 
Hansford Manor will be chosen. 
The selections will be made by 
votes from the residents and staff.

New residents of the manor are 
Ward Spivey, Tovera Umphress, 
Pearl Shapley, all of Graver; 
Clarence and Ester Weeks of 
Guymon and Will Douglas of 
Spearman, making a total of 68.

An interesting article in the 
Oklahoma City paper of Feb. 9 
brings the bull moose odyssey up 
to date. Excerpts from the article 
mention that the wandering bull 
moose that has been seen on 
occasion in the Oklahoma and

Texas Panhandles is in deep 
trouble in western Kansas. The 
Kansas Wildlife Officials said the 
big bull is in poor body condition 
and appears to be suffering from 
severe parasite infestation.

The article further states that the 
animal was first observed in South 
Dakota, and since had traveled 
through Nebraska, Kansas, and 
the Oklahoma Panhandle into the 
Texas Panhandle (in the Spearman 
area) and was last seen in Okla- 
home near the Optima Wildlife 
Refuge.

However, the item continues, 
nobody knows where the moose 
came from. It could have migrated 
from Montana, Wyoming, Colo­
rado or perhaps Minnesota. All 
those state have native nioose 
populations.

Kansas officials said the animal 
may be returned to the Kirwin 
National Wildlife Refuge where it 
apparently prospered during the 
summer. The Kansas Wildlife 
Agency said when the moose 
returned to that state in November, 
its health had deteriorated. Vet­
erinarians who recently observed 
the animal hope to capture it, nurse 
it back to health and release it in its 
natural habitat.

These youth had work selected to enter district 
competition in the PTA Reflections contest, primary 
division. Top row [1-r] Jennifer Schnell, Kathryn

Club News
RAINBOWS A RANGLERS 

SQUARE DANCECLUB

Oklahoma cowboy, Murry Beas­
ley, called the Plus Dance, Thurs­
day night - Feb. 9 at the Hansford 
County Barn. Beginners' Lessons 
were from 7 to 8 p.m. prior to the 
Plus Dance. Dancers traveled from 
all over the Panhandle to dance to 
the tunes.

Visitors from Kansas were: 
Maude and Cecil Stewart of Elk­
hart; and Don and Carol Gillespie 
of Liberal. From Oklahoma were 
Lester and Peggy Miller of Good- 
well; and Dean White and Nina 
DePriest of Mooreland. Texans 
included Harry and May Reynolds 
from Dalhart; Shorty and Leola 
Albert of Fritch; Ray and Wilma 
Pershall of Dumas; Jack Clark from 
Booker and from Perryton Ed and 
Lois Merydith, Marvin and Ra- 
Donna Hessel, June Kindy, Violet 
Helker, James and Norma Burris, 
Margaret Swinney, Carolyn Baker, 
Danny Witt, and Landrum 
Osborne.

The members present were Joe 
and Wanda Archer, Cecil and 
Myrna Biggers, Benny and Joyce 
Byers, Danny and Debbie Herring­
ton, Sonny and Marlane Nollner, 
Delbert and Louise Timmons, and 
Johnny and Virginia White.

The group’s next dance will be 
Saturday Feb. 25 with Freddie 
McKee from Amarillo calling.

Celebrate the Love in Your Life
Send a bouquet of flowers to Come by and see all the
this loved one that says “ Be pretty blooming plants and
My Valentine.”  fresh flowers. There are

many to choose from.

Call now for our Valentine Special

65Y-5180
•  •

j Carpenter Family,
Roses are red 
Violets are blue.
If I had a choice 
It would still be 

HAPPY VALENTINE'S you.
Love Carolyn

HELP FOR SMOKERS 
WHO WANT TO QUIT 

1-800-4-CANCER.

Murphy, Ashley Brown; [front] Darcy McGee, Erin 
Boxwell. Chelsea Nollner; not pictured - Janna 
Brock.
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Kids' Stuff &
« « o r f© r s

Lady F a i r |
Final Markdown on Fall & Winter 
Merchandise

Starts Monday, February 13

Up to 70 %  Off
On All Fall & Winter Merchandise

EDITOR’ S NOTE: The following 
poems or stories were written by 
local youth who entered the PTA’a 
Reflections contest and qualified to 
go on to district competition in the 
contest.

The Proud Father And 
His Two Sons 

by Chelsea Nollner

This is the whole life story of a 
proud father snake and his two 
sons, Avocado and Grass. The two 
sons of the father snake got lost 
from their father and they were in a 
big jungle. They could not find 
their father anywhere. Then they 
rode a bus and the two little sons 
came home and Grass, the littlest 
one, could not find his brother. 
"Oh I miss Avocado so much. 
Where is my brother? Poor Avo­
cado, he is probably as scared as I 
am. I better go look for him.”  Then 
he found him, “ A vocado!”  
“ Grass! Yea! I missed you so 
much, thank you I'm so glad you 
found me! We better go look for 
Daddy.”  “ Daddy, cnn we go in the 
lake with baby monster?”  The 
monster baby attacked them in the 
water. “ Help! We better hold our 
breath, I can’ t swim!”  Daddy 
snake asked the mother monster if 
they were going to hurt them. "No, 
but my husband will." "W ell we 
better stay clear of your husband! ”  
“ Exactly!" "B e nice to my two 
sons, I don’ t want you to hurt 
them, they are my only pride and 
friends!" “ Oh! Avocado! save me I 
can't sw im !" Avocado saved 
Grass's life. "Thank you so much, 
I m so glad you saved my life! Well 
yk better be going now." They saw 
the Daddy monster's hat and knew 
he would hurt them, so they went 
■l a cave to get away from him 
cause they were scared of him and 
the littlest snake, Grass, was too 
curious, he slithered out of the cave 
and started hissing at the daddy 
monster. “ Grass! Grass! Oh my 
gosh! Here Avocado, Til grab a 
hold of your tail and you go save 
Grass.”  “ Oh Daddy, you’ ve been 
such a good Daddy to help us, I’ m 
so proud your such a good Daddy.”  
They were so tired of slithering, so 
the daddy snake went out and 
found a horse wagon on top of the 
mountain and they rode home. And 
that was the whole life cycle of the 
three snakes, the proud father and 
Ns two sons.

hop early for best selections!
719 W. 7th Spearman, Texas
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A Proud Experience 
by Regan Boxwell

One day, Jodi Katsapillass dis­
covered that she had a knack for 
writing. She wrote stories and 
poems. She let her thoughts flow 
like water from a faucet. She was 
assigned to compose a paper for a 
writing contest. She thought about 
her topic, “ A Proud Experience." 
At first, she decided to do a story 
about a girl that won a writing 
award. Later, Jodi decided against 
that idea. She wanted more. She 
wanted a story with more depth. 
She finally decided to write about 
Ronald Reagan and how proud he 
was when he became President of 
the United States of America. Also, 
about the struggle he underwent to 
achieve his goal.

When she turned in her paper 
she felt that she could win the 
contest. She felt that all of the 
research had paid off. When the 
results were posted on the bulletin 
boards, she looked at the paper. 
She had won first place! Jodi 
recieved a medal in the auditorium 
in front of the whole school. She 
was known for this the rest of her 
school years. This was a proud 
experience for Jodi Katsapillass.

A Proud Icspereince 
by Janna Brock

One of my proudest icspereinces 
is riding my four-wheeler. When I 
am at my familys barn. That is 
when we ride it. Sometimes when 
we are trying to start it it yousely 
won't start. It is worth waiting for 
grandpa to get the badirey to start 
working because then we have so 
much fun. He yousely gets it 
started then we all jump on. I am 
always the one to get to drive 
first. When I start driving I see lots 
of things. I see things like dirt hills 
and dusty paths. When we were

riding it on Sunday we went all 
around the barn area. Afterthat we 
rode through dusty roads and we 
rode to the airport. Soon we were 
going back to the barn and got in 
the pick-up and went home. I can't 
wait till I ride the four wheeler 
again!

M y Proud Experience-
A Pilgrim Ancestor

dictated by Kathryn Murphy

I am glad to be in America and 
be free. I have a Pilgrim ancestor, 
named Peter Brown and I am 
happy because he wanted to be 
free to make his own choices and to 
worship the way he wanted.

Not everyone has a Pilgrim 
ancestor. They were special be­
cause they were the first ones to be 
free. He was brave for going on the 
M ayflower.

I am glad to be in America and 
the reason I'm here is because of 
my ancestor, Peter Brown.

Carrying the Flag on Veteran's Day 
by Tom B. Kirk

On Veteran’ s Day I 
carried the flag.

I was nervous, proud, and excited.

I wore my Scout uniform to 
the gym.

Stand up straight, Listen to the 
band, and sing the “  Star Spangled 

Banner.”

A Boy Scout tells us to go.
I hold the flag high in the 
air. Walk steady, cross in 
front, put the flag in the 

stand.

Stand at attention.
Salute, Pledge 

Listen to the ceremony.

We folded the flag.
I shook the speakers hand.

Proudly, I went back to class.

Happy Valentine's Day I

DANCE
llncl* Ed's Audio# Phil*
(Old Crawford Imp. Building)

Country & Rock • Old & New 

Saturday, February 18th 8:30 p.m. - 1:00 a.n.,

$5.00 A  Parson - 21 yrs. and op

Concession Available

For more information call: 659-3328
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CALL US FOR A LL YOUR 
COMPUTER NEEDS 

HAVE A NEW ADDRESS m 
307 DAVIS 

PHONE 659-3695 
THE FARM BOREAD 

BUILDING


